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5Oth Anniversary of Regal Ware

As part of its 50th 
anniversary celebration, 
Regal Ware, Inc., will host an 
open house on Saturday, May 
13th at its Kewaskum head­
quarters.

The event will open to the 
public at 10 a m. until 2 p.m. 
The open house will give the 
public the opportunity to tour 
Regal's manufacturing and 
administrative facilities to get 
a first hand look at how prod­
ucts are made.

In addition, visitors will 
have the opportunity to visit 
the Regal hospitality tent to 
enjoy refreshments and view 
a historic display featuring 
products from 1945 to the 
present day. "Our 50th 
Anniversary is an exciting 
time for all of us at Regal. 
We would like to invite

everyone to come help us 
celebrate by taking a tour or 
just enjoying refreshments in 
the hospitality tent,” said 
Regal President Jeff Reigle.

Regal Ware has been an 
integral part of the communi­
ty since 1945 when James O. 
Reigle and a small group of 
investors purchased the 
Kewaskum Utensil Com­
pany. Regal's product line 
began with two stainless steel 
pans being sold door to door. 
It rapidly expanded and with­
in the first ten years grew to 
include an extensive collec­
tion of rangetop cookware, 
coffeemakers and electric 
appliances.

Regal has always concen­
trated on manufacturing 
innovative cookware and 
electrics. They were a pio­

neer in the development of 
nonstick cookware and were 
the first to introduce colored 
cookware. Regal was also the 
first American housewares 
manufacturer to introduce 
breadmakers and continues 
its tradition of innovation 
with its new Royal Diamond 
lifetime warrantied cook­
ware.

Three generations of con­
sistent family leadership and 
the dedication of thousands 
of employees over the past 
50 years has allowed consis­
tent growth. What began with 
one small facility and 47 
employees has grown into a 
truly international operation 
with manufacturing facilities 
in the United States,Canada 
and South America. In its 
three North American loca­

tions, Regal employs over 
1900 people, 850 of those at 
its Kewaskum headquarters.

President and CEO, Jeff 
Reigle credits much of 
Regal's success to the hard 
work and dedication of the 
thousands of Regal employ­
ees over the years. "We have 
a good, reliable work force 
with a low turnover rate. That 
has helped us gain our 
strength in the market. To a 
very large extent. Regal 
Ware has been able to reach 
this level of success because 
of the contributions of our 
employees. Their dedication 
and contributions in the 
future will determine where 
we will be 50 years from 
now," said Reigle.

Family and community 
influences have played an

integral role in the company's 
growth. Consistent family 
leadership has allowed Regal 
to effectively Ilex and nurture 
its growth and production, 
keeping pace with the chang­
ing demands of (he market­
place and staying one step 
ahead of their competitors.

For more information 
about the Regal XVare Open 
House, call (414) 626-8579. 
Regal Ware is located al 201- 
202 Second Street in the vil­
lage of Kewaskum, lake 
highway 45 to Kewaskum, 
go one block East on second 
street.

Regal Ware, Inc. is a 
multi-plant manufacturer of 
quality cookware and port­
able electrics headquartered 
in Kewaskum.

Eckls to Reopen At 
New Location Thursday

Greg and Karen Eckl are 
pleased to announce they will 
be opening Eckl's Main 
Street Inn at their new loca­
tion at 1041 Fond du Lac 
Avenue in Kewaskum tenta­
tively on Thursday, May 11. 
Please watch their sign.

A complete story on the 
newly remodeled restaurant

will be published in next 
week's Statesman.

Casino Night 
Saturday

The Kewaskum Area 
Chamber of Commerce in­
vites you and your friends to 
their Casino Night Party on

Saturday, May 13, at Hon-E- 
Kor Country Club in Kewas­
kum.

The $35 a couple fee 
includes a free drink ticket 
per person, snacks, luncheon, 
and a fun-filled evening of 
gambling with all your 
friends. There will be a vari­
ety of games played and lots 
of raffles available.

The casino opens at 7 p m. 
so don't be late. This is a per­
fect evening out to celebrate 
Mother's Day. You know 
how we women like to gam­
ble! Please call Jane at Hon- 
E-Kor today to make your 
reservations.

Dairy Queen to 
Open Next Week
According to owners Jerry 

and Nancy Mchring, the 
newly erected Dairy Queen 
Restaurant, located on the 
comer of Highway 45 and H, 
in Kewaskum, will be open­

ing next week. The Mehrings 
have asked Village residents 
to watch their large billboard 
sign to find out the exact day.

More information will be 
published in next week's edi­
tion.

I lAppY Mothers DAY



Beechwood Rest Home I PA
G

E ^ 
T

H
U

R
SD

A
Y

, M
A

Y 11, 1995

Continues Traditions

The Beechwood Rest Home facilities.

Ry Sharon Callaway Roznik lercd nurses, I .PNs, and certi-

The Beechwood Rest 
Home has been in existence 
since 1961, when sisters 
Delores Rammer and Vir­
ginia Bcnzschawcl decided to 
follow in their parents foot­
steps and open a home for 
elderly citizens. Their family 
had run a small nursing home 
in Sheboygan Falls in the 
1950 s, and the family tradi­
tion seems to continue to tins 
day.

Now Rammer's children, 
Lee, Scott, Barry and Chris 
Firme have been running the 
shite licensed facility for the 
past 15years, although, as 
Scott points out, they grew 
up at Beechwood Rest Home. 
"We've done everything here 
from cutting the grass to 
working in the kitchen and 
doing the dishes."

The home is divided into 
two separate sections. 
Twenty-six residents live in 
the state licensed Skilled 
Nursing Facility, with RN 
Joan Lippert as the Director 
of Nursing, along with a staff 
of 25, which includes rcgis-

ItllUlllllUillll^^

1ANTALIZER

1st Year in Business!

Saturday, May S3.8 a.m. t0 4 P.m.

Tanning Studio, Inc.
133 Main St., Kewaskum 626-8876

* FRESH CUT FLOWERS FOR ALL TANNING MOMS!

fied nursing assistants.
Activity Director Louise 

Hafermann, along with an 
aide and other volunteers, 
help to keep the resident's 
minds and bodies active, 
even those that are wheel­
chair bound. "Because 
Beechwood is a small nurs­
ing home, the atmosphere 
here is that of one big fami­
ly," Louise remarks. Every­
one cares about each other, 
and life-long friendships are 
formed, even among the staff 
members. She’s been em­
ployed at the home for 19 
years, and organizes a variety 
of activities throughout the 
year.

Exercises are held each 
morning, and include work­
ing the arms and legs, along 
with daily walks for those 
who are able. The residents 
also enjoy music sessions, 
crafts, cards, games, trivia, 
spelling and math, table vol­
leyball, and church services. 
Denominations include 
Catholic, Methodist, Luther­
an, and the United Church of 
Christ. Catholic services are

7 ‘Everyone attending will receive a gift

TDISCOUNTS TFREE PACKAGES
One lucky winner will receive 

a 25 - session tanning package

We also want to give a much deserved THANK YOU 
to our caregivers in the Elder Care Facility (CBRF).

I ana Heimerl Janice Warnecke
C indy Krause Terry Schwab
Sandy Krahn Dorthy Wachuta

We want to thank our entire Nursing Staff for 
pitching in and helping out whenever needed.

Thanks Again from 
The Rammer Family 
Beechwood Rest Home, Inc.

held every Friday, and others 
are done with cassette tapes. 
Once a month, ministers 
come from area churches to 
perform special services.

A resident counsel fund 
collects money through dona­
tions, as well as offering for 
sale a selection of crafts 
made by members of the 
staff, family members of the 
residents, and volunteers, 
with help from the residents 
themselves. The money from 
this fund is used to pay for 
entertainment and buy bingo 
prizes, which is played once 
a month.

Beechwood Rest Home 
welcomes visitors from vari­
ous community organizations 
that come to entertain, such 
as 4-II groups like the Scott 
Pioneers, the Sherman Center 
Pals and the Sherman 
Workers. Twice a year the 
Random Lake High School 
Choir performs musical 
selections, and even the staff 
members volunteer their time 
on their days off to share

Residents at Beechwood Rest Home participate in the morning 
exercise program, led by activity director Louise Hafermann.

their talents. Pets are also 
welcome to come and visit; 
they provide great therapy for 
the residents who enjoy pet­
ting them, and holding the 
smaller animals on their laps.

A part-time social worker 
is also provided, and an 
Occupational and Physical 
Therapist come in from 
Cedar Haven to work with 
individuals. Louise also helps 
out as an O.T. Other employ­
ees serving on the staff 
include a food service super­
visor, a dietary department, 
which provides special diets 
according to need, a consul­
tant dietitian, and the house­
keeping staff.

Administrative assistant 
Scott Rammer has been a 
part of the full time crew for 
the past 12 years. "In 1988, 
an addition was put on the

National Nurses Week
May 7 thru 13

We at the Beechwood Rest Home would like to recog­
nize the following Nurses for their excellent service to us, 
and their loving care of our residents.

BN
Joan Eippert, D.O.N. 
Wendy Kirst 
Mary Brinkman 
Renee' Rodenkirch 
Patti Zima

We also want to recognize our loyal and caring Staff of 
Certified Nurses Aides. Their special day is June 1.

Penny Beaudry 
Shelley Beaudry 
Jane Bell
Sara Beck 
Sharon Fry
Kim Kasseckert 
Chris Bartell 
Anna Schneider

original home, and the skilled 
care unit was moved into the 
new section," he explains. 
The original facility is now a 
CBRF, or Community Based 
Residential Facility, licensed 
by the state. The residential 
area provides assisted living 
arrangements for 13 resi­
dents, offering private or 
shared rooms. A large sitting 
and dining area contains big 
windows, creating a bright 
and cheery atmosphere.

Beechwood Rest Home is 
located on Highway A, in a 
quiet, residential neighbor­
hood, surrounded by spacious 
lawns. The home-like setting 
provides the residents with 
dignity and a chance to 
develop friendships, while 
receiving the quality care that 
they need and deserve.

LBN
Kathy Stein, A.D.O.N.
Carrie Hintz 
Peggy Jablonski 
Mindy Marquardt 
Margaret Ninneman

Ann Steier 
Jenny Stefanich 
Veronica Voigt 
Marion Schacht 
Babs Bock 
Debra Goedde 
Patty Fechter 
Cindy Conway
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Regal Ware Has Played a Major 
Role in Kewaskum’s History

By Sharon Callaway Roznik

This week Regal Ware, 
Inc. will be celebrating their 
50th Annivesary as one of 
the world's leading cookware 
and electrics manufacturers, 
with offices and facilities 
throughout the United States 
and internationally.

President and Chief 
Executive Officer, Jeffrey A. 
Reigle, states that the compa­
ny has worked diligently to 
build an organization with 
the flexibility to meet cus­
tomers' needs and react 
quickly to their changing 
needs in the future. Quality 
products have been the hall­
mark of the company, since 
its creation in 1945, and is 
sought after as a world class 
house wares source.

Specializing in cookware 
and kitchen electrics, Regal 
offers one of the most com­
plete lines under the Regal, 
Club, Kitchen Pro, ProTech 
and Royal Diamond trade 
names, and supports this 
board product line with 
impressive manufacturing 
resources and a well trained 
force. The work environment 
is dedicated to training and 
team development, which 
encourages product change 
and improvement.

The company began oper­
ations in 1945, when James 
O. Reigle and a small group 
of investors purchased the 
Kewaskum Aluminum Com­
pany, which at the time was 
manufacturing shell casings 
for the U.S. military for use 
in World War II. Two weeks 
after the change of ownership 
the war ended, the govern­
ment contract was canceled, 
and the business switched 
back to the cookware end of 
the trade.

In order to understand the 
development behind a world­
wide company such as Regal 
Ware, it’s important to look 
at the history of the alu­
minum cookware industry 
prior to 1945, especially 
since Wisconsin played an 
important role as a center of 
this sector of Commerce. 
Luckily, we have a wealth of 
information available from 
Dean Roe of Kewaskum, 
who finished a master’s thesis 
on the Kewaskum Aluminum 
Company in 1971. Much of 
this article contains the well 
researched information Roe 
included in his thesis, earning 
him a Master of Science in 
teaching history from UW- 
Oshkosh. (Our thanks to Mr. 
Roe for sharing his informa­
tion with us).

Aluminum, or the method 
now used to separate alu­
minum from it's oxide was 
developed simultaneously in 
France and Ohio in 1886. 
Martin Hall patented and 
received exclusive rights to 
the process in the United 
States, and by 1888, a factory 
in Pennsylvania was produc­
ing raw aluminum. In 1895,

Joseph Koenig established 
the first Aluminum Manufac­
turing Company in Wiscon­
sin, located in Two Rivers, 
and from there a series of 
events led to the creation of 
many "spin-off businesses, 
or copies of the original com­
pany started by Koenig, most 
often using former employ­
ees.

In 1911, Ben Ziegler of 
West Bend began producing 
aluminum cookware, and 
became highly successful in a 
short period of lime, inspir­
ing Kewaskum native A- 
dolph Rosenheimer to decide 
to enter the aluminum indus­
try. Rosenheimer had been 
enjoying success as owner of 
the village's Malt and Grain 
Company, but on July 1, 
1919, prohibition was put 
into effect by the 18th A- 
mendment, and the produc­
tion of malt ceased.

The Rosenheimer name 
was synonymous with Ke­
waskum, originating when 
Moritz Rosenheimer moved 
to the village in 1874, with 
his brother Adolph following 
in 1876. This family helped 
develop Kewaskum as a mar­
ket and trade center for the 
surrounding farm people, 
with a population of around 
471 village residents and 
1,436 in the township by 
1880. They owned and oper­
ated the largest general store 
in Kewaskum, as well as a 
bank, malting house, cream­
ery, insurance company, 
electric light and heating 
company, and the aluminum 
business.

Adolph, known as a capa­
ble entrepreneur with "ster­
ling qualities of mind and 
character," (who also served 
as the first village president 
after Kewaskum was incor­
porated in 1895) hired two 
assistants away from Zieg­
ler's company by the names 
of Al Hron and Art Manthei, 
rented a building in Kewas­

Shefond
Convenience Stores

ADlVtSKMCV SMflOHlOH M

- Giving Great People 
- Great Service'

890 Fond du Lac Ave. (Hwy. 45) 
Kewaskum 626*4463

NOW OPEN 
24 Hours

* AU YOUR CONVENIENCE NEEDS *
/Open 24 Hours

/Milk Frequent Buyer Club

/Fresh Deli Sandwiches to Go

/Fresh Bakery Daily
/Cookout Needs

/Soda & Snacks

/Lottery Tickets

is remodeling to serve 
you better, and will be
Open: from 5 a.m.
Closing: at 10 p.m.

• until further notice •

kum and began aluminum 
production in 1920. It has 
been said that a rivalry exist­
ed between Ziegler and 
Rosenheimer, who were both 
in the banking and insurance 
business.

In watching the business 
begin to unfold, the editor of 
the Kewaskum Statesman 
had this to say on October 
25, 1919: "No matter where 
you go, everyone is talking of 
the great boom at hand, 
everyone is planning to make 
some improvements, every 
individual means business, 
there is no shirking, Kewas­
kum has started, and it will 
now as it has always done, in 
whatever it undertook in the 
past, 'go the limit', for the cit­
izens of our village absolute­
ly believe, that which is for 
the good, for the welfare and 
promotion of Kewaskum, and 
to the outside world wherever 
the products of our factories 
will be made use of, as well... 
so bright future prospects 
appear for the village, that 
predictions now are (hat 
within the course of a few 
years, the citizens of the vil­
lage and county will look 
upon our little hamlet with 
astonishment at a new Ke­
waskum."

The West Bend newspa­
pers ridiculed the people of 
Kewaskum during this time 
for their "pic in the sky" alti­
tudes, and their attempt to 
develop an aluminum facto­
ry, but the townspeople per­
sisted with (heir optimistic 
outlook.

With an initial workforce 
of about 60 employees, an 
early workman recalled that 
the starting wage was 22 
cents per hour doing inside 
finishing work on the cook­
ing utensils. The company 
was engaged in the sale and 
manufacture of the "Kcwas- 
ko" brand of aluminum cook­
ware until 1942, also adding 
a coppcrware and novelty

line in 1932 to increase sales, 
and the development of stain­
less steel in 1938, in an effort 
to restore profits, after losses 
from the depression and a 
disastrous fire in 1925.

Products were sold 
through mail order houses, 
chain stores, and retail stores. 
Before a utensil was sold, it 
was stamped with the trade­
mark of the company, an 
Indian head. By 1929, the 
company was the eleventh 
largest in U.S. cookware 
sales.

The depression caused the 
company great financial loss­
es, but Rosenheimcr's philos­
ophy at (he time was one of 
keeping as many of their 
employees on the payroll as 
possible, having men paint 
the plant and maintain the 
property. Workers received a 
twelve cent cut in wages, and 
were required to accept one- 
half of their money in script 
issued by the Bank of Ke­
waskum.

Early in 1941, the govern 
ment discontinued the use ol 
aluminum for cookware pro­
duction, as well as stainless

SHEFOND-MOBIL MART 
KEWASKUM LOCATION

steel, reserving the metals for 
war production. The Kewas­
kum Aluminum Company 
received contracts with the 
war department to manufac­
ture brass and steel cartridges 
and mortar rocket cases, and 
also carried on experimental 
research in the development 
of the steel cartridge cases, 
leading the nation in this 
endeavor. In 1944, the com­
pany began to experience 
labor problems over vaca­
tions, overtime, wages and 
shift premiums, and the rise 
of the unions to power 
became a difficult time for 
the business.

Adolph Rosenheimer died 
in 1943, and the two remain

mg brothers, who knew nothing 
of Ihc business, took over the 
plant. As pnxluction on the war 
contracts neared completion, the 
subject of postwar permanency 
was discussed among the stock­
holders. No one knew when the 
government would release the 
use of metals for cookware pro­
duction. The general altitude 
seemed to be, "let's gel out 
while the gelling out is possi- 

(Continued on Page 9)



KEWASKUM UTENSIL (REGAL WARE) 
BASEBALL TEAM

1947 KETTLE MORAINE LEAGUE 
GRAND CHAMPS

Front row, left to right: Mike Gnacinski, Paul Kral, 
Giles Wierrnan, Mgr., Willard Prost, Stan Hodge*, 
?? Wierrnan, Pat Boy. Second row: Wayland Tessar, 
Norman Held, Ralph Marx, Clayton Stautz, Del

Ohlschmidt*. Third row: Jerome Stautz, ?? 
Schloemer*, Harold Marx, Kilian Honeck, Louis 
Bath.

TRUCK MOUNTED 
MOBILE PLANT

CARPET & UPHOLSTERY 
CLEANING SERVICE

Reliability in Professional Cleaning
* * SPECIAL * ★ 
15% Discount 

2 rooms or more
LIMI1ED TIME Off EH

RESIDENTIAL - COMMERCIAL
338-0783

_FREEESTIMATES Call Anytime

PROGNOSIS 
FOR KEWASKUM 
EXPANDED 
MEDICAL 
COVERAGE

[NEW! ACOUSTICAL CEILING CLEANING]

NATIONAL 
NURSING 

HOME WEEK/
May 14-20

Dr. Sison Is Now Affiliated 
With The West Bend Clinic.

Beechwood Rest Home, Inc 
Nursing Home and CBRF 

Skilled and Residential Elder Care
(Village of Beechwood)

N1495 W Hwy. A • Kewaskum, Wl 53040
(414) 626-4258 or (414) 994-4717

Family owned and operated since 1%1

* Visitors Welcome Anytime *

In addition to the continued services of 
Dr. Sison, Kewaskum will benefit from 
the on-premise services of two of the 
West Bend Clinic's Doctors
of Internal Medicine:
• Dr. Gregory Blommel
• Dr. Michael Mosley
Expanded coverage for Kewaskum 

now and in the future.

^M^^ West 
Bend 

▼ ▼▼ Clinic
Professional. Warm. Friendly

West Bind • 170# West Paradise Drive • 334-3451 
Kewaskum • 1(140 f ond du l.ac Avenue .626-4616



Spartz - Mertzig

Tina Marie Spartz and 
John Nicholas Mertzig 
exchanged wedding vows on 
Saturday, November 12, 
1994, during a 2 p.m. cere­
mony at Holy Trinity Cath­
olic Church in Kewaskum. 
Father John Brophy officiat­
ed.

Parents of the couple are
Thomas and Janet Spartz and 
Raymond and Betty Mertzig 
of Kewaskum.

The bride chose Victoria 
Castro of Allenton, as her 
matron of honor. The brides­
maids were Tina Survis of 
Campbellsport, Michelle 
Mann of Milwaukee, Brenda 
Kober of Kewaskum, Rhonda 
Zimdahl of Campbellsport, 
Jennifer Davenport of Mad­
ison, Sarah Hartley of Camp­
bellsport, and Wendy Zim­
dahl of Campbellsport. The 
miniature bride was Angel 
Zimdahl, niece of the groom.

Brian Kober of Port 
Washington served as best 
man. The groomsmen were 
Randy Drchcr of Kewaskum,
Scott Amerling of Kewas­
kum, Brian Spartz of Kewas­
kum, Tim Geidel of West 
Bend, Nicholas Spartz of 
Kewaskum, and Jeremy 
McEwen of Kewaskum.

Ushering duties were 
shared by James Staehler of 
Waukesha, and Norman 
Krueger Jr. of West Bend.

Music was provided by 
organist Anne Mertz, and 
soloist Greta Kuphal, and 
flutist, Crystal Heberer.

A reception followed at 
Skate Country in West Bend.

The bride is a graduate of 
Kewaskum High School and 
UW-Oshkosh and is employ­
ed as an accountant in Mil-

waukee.
The groom is a graduate 

of Kewaskum High School 
and UW Oshkosh and is 
employed at Nova Services.

I hc couple enjoyed a hon­
eymoon trip to Nassau, 
Bahamas and now reside in 
Kewaskum.

M-mi^eebiceN^
Carol E. Williams, town 

of Kewaskum, and Paul J.
Osswald, town of
Kewaskum. Wedding May 6.

Katherine A. Reid, 
Kewaskum, and Daniel J. 
Brath, Kewaskum. Wedding 
April 22.

Miranda L. Deavers, town 
of Scott, Sheboygan county, 
and Glenn W Gessner, West 
Bend. No Wedding date 
given.

Christine L. Buss, 
Kewaskum, and Richard R 
Bannenberg, Kewaskum. 
Wedding May 12.
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Happy 
18th 

Birthday 
MISSY!

Quess 'Who? 
(Little ‘People)
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NELL’S
| DRIVING SCHOOL I

(Attention To All ■
15 Year Old Students |

I
lf you are 15 years of age its time to ■ 
plan your driver education program. I

I
* Sign up for classes for 1995-1996 are currently — 

being taken. |

• Payment is broken down into two payments - t 
the first luring the first day of class.

I
* Class sizes are limited. |

• A phone call will secure your childs spot. I

Phone 923-0663

*.' Cangmtufatums
On Your Fine Showing 
At the State Solo and 

Ensemble Festival
4 - Firsts & 5 - Seconds

Eileen Kohlwey 
Greta Kuphal
Jason Liegl 
Marni Lynn 
Sabrina Maul 
Kevin Pamperin 
Cory Rammer 
Jake Thull 
Lynn Tim 11 
Michelle Thull
Becky Yogerst

KEWASKUM
INDIAN
BOOSTER CLUB

Mappy 25th .Anniversary 
MOM and‘DA‘D

l^^e, Jeremy, Chris and Doug
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KHS Concert in the 
Park Coming Soon

I he Kewaskum High 
School musicians will soon 
be playing and singing in the 
park.

That's right, the yearly 
outdoor concert is just about 
here. All that is needed is a 
little more practice and some 
cooperation with the weather 
man

On Tuesday, May 16, 
Ilie bands and choirs of KHS 
will be set up in the large 
shelter area al River Hill 
Park. These groups will be 
presenting an evening of fun 
music beginning at 6:30 p.m. 
beat tired will be music from

HALL 
AVAILABLE

For Parties, 
Anniversaries, 

Small Weddings 
and Reunions

KEWASKUM
AMERICAN LEGION

Call Lee at
338-1509

Evenings & Weekends LOTTERY LOTTERY LOTTERY

the 20's to die 90's.
They will also be serving 

brats, hamburgers, soda, cof­
lee and more, beginning at 
5:30 p.m. So save this dale 
on your calendar for ihe 
music students al KHS, bring 
your family and friends, 
some money for the food and 
come and enjoy an evening 
in tiie park.

WINNING 
LOTTERY NUMBERS

5

O
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o

3

POWERBALL
Wed., May 3:

15 24 4 2 4 4 (P.B. 3)
Sat., May 6:

2 26-31 3H 43 (P.B. 12)

WIS. VERY OWN 
MEGABUCKS

Wed., May 3:
12 2 1 23 29 4 1 4 4

Sat., May 6:
I H 15 27-37 3H

SUPERCASH
Mav 2 1 14 21 26 28 34

May 4

May 5:
May 6:

I 

3?

Q

m

O

14 21 24 26 29 32

12 13 16 17 19 22

May 7: 2 4 IO 14 1H 35

May H I 1121 25 26 32
Lottery numbers courtesy of 
Shelond Mobil ■ Kewaskum

Women's Club to 
Meet Wednesday

The officers of the 
Kewaskum Women’s Club 
would like to announce a few 
changes for their next meet­
ing dale.

The dale has been 
changed to Wednesday, May 
17, at 6:30 p.m. The final 
get-together of the year will 
be held at the Peace Church.

Items on the agenda for 
the meeting will include a 
picture taken for the 
Centennial l ime Capsul, the 
distribution of the monies to 
various organizations or pro­
jects within the community 
and suggestions for next 
year's activities and pro­
grams.

The Kewaskum Women's 
Club will donate and care for 
three flowering large pots on 
Ihe corner of Highways 45 
adn 28. We hope this will he 
a continuing project in com­
ing years.

If anyone is interested in 
joining Ihe Women's Club, 
you are welcome to attend 
Ihe meeting. After the meet­
ing, the members will social­
ize and have dessert and bev­
erages.

Do you know how to get 
the water in a watermel­
on??? Plant the seed in 
the spring!

Campus 9fates
EVANSTON, IL - Jes­

sica S. Rohrer, a junior from 
Kewaskum, in the College of 
Arts and Sciences at 
Northwestern University, has 
been named to the Dean's 
List for the winter quarter of 
the 1994-95 academic year.

Students on the Dean's 
List have attained a grade 
point average of at least 
3.70/4.0. Northwestern Uni­
versity is one of the nation's 
leading leaching and research 
institutions, with nearly 
17,000 students enrolled in 
12 academic divisions at 
kikefront campuses in Evan­
ston and Chicago.

JERRY'S TV 
and ANTENNA SERVICE

136 E. Main St., Campbellsport - 533-4466
✓ ZENITH / RCA ✓ PANASONIC 

✓ QUANTUM UHF/VHS/FM ANTENNAS
• I Vs *VCRs •Boom Boxes •Tape Recorders

• Camcorders ‘Radios • Cordless Phones 
HOURS:

Tues - Fri. 9 a in to 5 30 p.m ; Saturday 8 a m. to 12 noon CLOSED MONDAYS

* BOB FUCHS J
% * and the *4

THE SINGING MACHINE
entertaining

& Saturday, May 13 ^/ 

9p.m. to 1 a.m.

"‘Anytime is the “Right Time for Prime Time"

PRIME TIME PUB 
Kewaskum

<bo.ro.

n^p l\ US raise moneM ^or L»qH^ 

April q)H — CHau ^
1^ Sub- 1

(p PAtKhes On

PTom die
CArd =X FREE t*" sub.

nd c^ood ujiHa cm^ cAber fitter^.

Expires 5-26-95

KUEHL- John and Carrie 
Kuehl of N 626 Boltonville 
Rd., Random Lake, are the 
proud parents of a baby girl 
born April 29, 1995, at St. 
Joseph's Community 
Hospital, West Bend.

Grandparents of Kierra 
Darilyn are Ivan and Janet 
Kumtow of Random Lake, 
Darlene Kuehl of Campbell­
sport and Great - Grandmoth­
er, Malinda Garbisch, of 
Random Lake.

Kierra will join brother 
Kyle, and twin sister and 
brother, Desiree and Destin.



tytirement fRpceptwn
The Kewaskum School 

Board, Faculty.and Staff 
invite community members

Schmidt Awarded 
Elks Scholarship

Congratulations to Chris­
tine Schmidt, daughter of 
Ralph and Joyce Schmidt of 
221 Clinton Street, Kewas­
kum. Christine has been 
awarded the Fond du Lac 
County Elks Lodge "Senior 
Achievement" scholarship.

Recipients were judged on 
academics, contributions to 
school, community service 
and honors and awards. The 
Fond du Lac Elks will pre­
sent Christine with this schol­
arship at a banquet on May 
11.

to join them in honoring Jan 
Rosenthal and Corinne 
Koepke, who will be retiring 
at the end of the 1994-95 
school year.

A reception will be held 
Thursday, May 25, in the 
library at Kewaskum High 
School from 3:30 - 4:30 p.m. 
A presentation of awards is 
scheduled for 4:00 p.m. Cake 
and coffee will be served.

HONOR
AMERICA’S

Receives Degree
Cora Ramthun of St. 

Kilian, proudly announces 
the graduation of her daugh­
ter, Tammy Lee Schladweil- 
er, from the University of 
Wisconsin-Oshkosh.

Tammy received a bache­
lors degree in science, was on 
the honor roll and made the 
I kan's I ist. She is currently 
employed as an RN at 
Hartford Memorial Hospital, 
and lives in Kewaskum with 
her husband. Tun. and sons. 
Matthew, age seven, and 
Daniel, age four.

Tammy is a 198b graduate 
of Campbellsport High 
School.
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ini shine

will be open on 

MCHMEJCS 'DW 
10 am to 2 pin.

1 mile N. ot Kewaskum al 2S5 Hwy. S

626-4352 1

Let Bar-N Annex do 
the cooking for mom!

MOTHER'S DAY
BUFFET

Serving 11 a.m. -2 p.m.
Featuring ham, pork chop creole, breasted 
chicken, ribs, green bean casserole, eggs 
benedict, sausage, bacon, salads, vegetable 
platter, fresh fruit, desserts, and more.

$8.95 Childrens Prices A vailable

REGULAR MENU 2:30 - 6 P.M.
Free Flower to All Moms!

RESERVATIONS APPRECIATED 533-4332

BAH-ANNEX
Hwy. GGG - New Prospect

(?£. ^adfd

Pub 'N' Restaurant
OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK TO SERVE YOU BETTER!

Food Served 11 a.m. to Closing DAILY

Our Kitchen Will Be Closed on
MOTHER’S DAT

Come Celebrate NATIONAL BLONDE’S DAY 
Mon., May 15th

Featuring Charbroiled Sandwiches, 
Homemade Pizza, and Mexican Cuisine

Doily Specials from 11 am, to 8 p.m.
TUESDAY SPECIAL - (Build your own) Chicken 
Chimichangas, beef or Chicken Fajitas 

THURSDAY SPECIAL - Baby Beef Liver Dinner

FRIDAY HOUSE SPECIALTY
from 4 p.m. to 9 p.m. ^< 

FAMILY STYLE FISH FRY ^ 
Beer Batter Haddock and Broasted Chicken 
Served with Mashed Potatoes, Gravy, Dressing, German Potato 

Salad, Tartar Sauce, Pye Bread and Cole Slaw.

Carry-outs available

533-4541
154 W. Main Street 

Campbellsport 
James Rinas and family

oandpiper Inn
On 

Lake 
Bernice 

533-4471 
W2992 Elmorc Dr. Campbellsport

Mother's Day 
v Sunday Menu

Family Style Sunday 
Chicken Dinner
All-U-Can-Eat

I 1 /2 Off ]
Mom’s Dinner

thru Sunday Muy 14 I'W '

I----------------------------- 1

We '11 be sen ini} from 
11 am 8pm

MAKE YOUR RESERVATIONS NOW!

Enjoy Your

M&lMEflCS •£>%!?

WE WILL BE SERVING OFF OF OUR REGULAR 
DINNER MENU FROM 2 P.M. UNTIL d P.M

$9.25 per person
(Children's prices are also available)

at the Fin 'N Feather
Our New Dining Room is beautiful, and is 

ready to serve you on Mother's Day!
We will be serving brunch from Ham until 2 pm. 
Brunch will IncludQ. the Salad Bar. Choose Soup. 
Boot Noodle Soup. Scrambled Eggs. Homemade 
Apple-Cinnamon French Toast. Homemade 
Quiches, Deop-Frled Chicken, Baked Ham. Country 
Style BBQ Ribs. Shrimp Pasta. Chlckon Primavera. 
Roast Beef In Gravy. Hunter s Stow. Whipped Pota 
toes and Gravy. Dressing, and Hof Buttered Corn
Our Dessert Table Is Included and features such 
goodies as Homemade Chocolate Eclairs. Cream 
Puffs, Apple Kuchen, as well as Tories and Cakos * 
Choice of coffee, juice or milk Is Included

Call 533-4135 and ask for Betty 
to make your reservations.

FIN ’N FEATHER 
SUPPER CLUB

Hwy. SS, New Prospect • Phone 533-4135
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Historical Society 
Milting Tuesday

On Tues, evening May 
16th members and friends of 
the Kewaskum Historical 
Society, will meet at the 
community room at 6 p.m., 
for our annual potluck din­
ner and new membership 
meeting. Anyone wishing to 
become a member, or who 
would like to know more 
about the society is welcome.

At 7 p.m. a member of 
Graff and associates of 
Slinger, will give a short talk 
on the work they do for his­
torical society's. If you have 
any questions or would like 
to become a member, please 
call Jake Schmidt at 338- 
1568 weekdays after 6 p.m..

KHS Activity
Dinner May 17

Please call the high school 
office at 626-2166 by May 
14th for tickets. Tickets can 
be purchased in advance or 
make reservations to hold yur 
ticket at the door.

The Kewaskum High 
School Senior Activity Din­
ner will be held on Wednes­
day, May 17. The cost is 
$4.00 per adult and high 
school seniors are free.

A raffle will be offered 
and a gift will be presented 
for those 1995 graduates who

ABC CLUB
SKAT RESULTS

The winners at skat played 
by the ABC Senior Citizens 
at Beechwood Hall on 
Tuesday, May 2nd were: 
Ralph Laux, 21-1—20 net; 
Francis Gilboy, 12-0 -12 net. SERVING OUR REGULAR UENU

'?'ia,tc&4- an t^e Andie
Mother's Day Buffet

11 am-5pm
Featuring: Broasled Chicken, Baked Ham, Sliced Prime Rib of 
Beef, Real Mashed Potatoes, Sauteed Fresh Mushrooms, Chicken 
Nuggets, French Fried Potatoes, Vegetable, Soup, Salad Bar & 
Dessert Table included.

$8.50 Adults * Children’s prices available
Friday - Prime Rib Sc Seafood Buffet...$7.95 
Saturday fit Sunday Evening - All-U-Can Eat 
Broasted Chicken with Salad Bar...$5.50

I <»r reservation* rail: 535-8445
______ Dlr Hwy. 45 N to F, east 3 miles to Kettle Moraine Lake.

from the

Fireside Restaurant
Serving the following specials 

from 11 am tills pm

Roast Chicken
with dressing $7.50

Fireside Famous
Prime Rib Reg......... $10.75
King Cut.................... $13.75

Wendt's Select 
Steak........................ $9.75
Large Cut............. $13.50

^R™AY BV*£T
Broasted Chicken 
Tenderloin Tips 

Whipped Potatoes: Gravy 
Hot Vegetables: Pinner Rolls 

Complete Soup/Salad Bar 

$7.95 
Childrens Prices Available 

Served 11:30 am. - 4:30 p.m.

(Combo) Wendt's Select 
Steak & Deep Fried

Shrimp $13.75

Regular Menu Also Served
11:30 am - 9:00 p.m

‘fullmenu also available.
Hfservations Appreciatedtill 7 pm

Hwy. 41, Allenton 629-5125
Closing Mother's Day at 8 pm.

The Pony Express Supper Club
Hwy SS 

New Prospect 
Phone 533-4623 for reservations

Wrap mom s gift with 
BEAUT?

For 0ft wrap and 0ft ba0 as beautiful 

she is, see our selection today.

Kewaskum Pharmacy 927 Food du Lac Ave.
Mon.-Fri. H Sal. 0-5; Sun. 0-4 • Pharmacy Houri: Mon.-Fri. 9-5, Sal. 9-1; Closed Sun.

626-4222 C MCMXCIII Cartton Cards

Bavarian Gasfhaus ❖ <

I
^

N3054 Highway 67 & F, Dundee
PHONE 533-8473

fHiappy fMbtfters Pay
from

The Toning Shoppe, Ltd.
The place to build a New You!

Treat Mom with a Gift Certificate for a -
*Body Massage
• Toning Package

• Body Wrap I

203 Main St., Kewaskum
Phone 626-4936

KEWASKUM FLORAL
119 Main St., Kewaskum 

PHONE 626-2941

★ OPEN 10 A M. TO 1 P.M. ON MOTHER'S DAY*

Special Gifts 
for special Bjorns
‘Floral Arrangements 
‘Flowering Plants 
‘Hanging Baskets
‘Centerpieces

Geraniums ‘Cut Flowers 
‘Green Plants

Mother's Day 
BALLOONS

Corsages c"

For Moms of All 
Ages!

Singles or 
Bouquets



Regal Ware
(Continued from Paw 3)

ble."
Several different companies 

contemplated the purchase of 
the Kewaskum Aluminum 
Company, including the 
Katzinger Company, Great 
Lakes Springs Corporation, and 
Reynolds Metals. On May 19, 
1945, a special meeting of the 
company's Board of Directors 
was held to discuss the sale of 
certain assets of the company to 
James O. Reigle, at a price of 
$125,000, for certain fixed 
assets in addition to inventories 
and facilities, and by September, 
after 26 year of operation, the 
company ceased to exist, and 
became the nucleus of the pre­
sent Regal Ware operations.

Reigle and his group of men 
changed the name to the 
Kewaskum Utensil Company, 
and in 1953, to Regal Ware, Inc. 
The firm is today the major 
industry in Kewaskum, employ­
ing approximately 800 individu­
als in it s main offices and plant. 
The resulting influence upon the 
community and the surrounding 
area is one of great magnitude.

After the war, the company 
scrambled to convert their line 
back to producing a consumer 
product, making stainless steel 
sauce pans. The quality cook­
ware became popular with post­
war consumers, and during the

early years, the great demand 
for consumer goods helped cre­
ate an impressive growth record. 
The timing was right, and Regal 
Ware rapidly expanded their 
line to include a wide selection 
of range top cookware, cof­
feemakers and electric appli­
ances. Timely acquisitions as 
well, helped the business adapt 
to changing market conditions.

Regal was a pioneer in the 
development of non-stick cook­
ware (Teflon), dramatically 
changing the way the world 

cooks, and also introduced what 
would become the most popular 
percolator in America, the 
PolyPerk coffee maker. They 
continued to expand their line of 
products that today include 
gourmet cookware sets with 
warranties that range from one 
year to a lifetime (with the new 
Royal Diamond line), coffee 
makers, food processors, bread­
makers, steamers, electric 
knives, meal makers and more.

I he impressive growth of the 
company is attributed to three 
generations of consistent leader­
ship, from it's founder James O. 
Reigle, to his son, James D, 
Reigle, and presently grandson, 
Jeffrey Reigle, along with the 
hard work and dedication of 
thousands of Regal employees 
over the years. 'Die international 
company includes manufactur­
ing facilities in Canada, South 
America and Japan, and is 
actively marketing its products 
in well over 100 countries

around the world.
As they celebrate their 

Golden Anniversary with an 
Open House on Saturday, may 
13, it looks back at the accom­
plishments of its first 50 years 
with a deep sense of pride, as 
well as a commitment to the 
community that helped it 
become one of the world's lead­
ing cookware manufacturers.

Kewaskum Fire and 
Rescue Squad Calls

Monday, May 1 - The 
Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
was dispatched at 12:43 p in. 
in the Village of Kewaskum 
for a female patient who was 
experiencing chest pains. The 
patient was transported to St. 
Joseph Community Hospital,

oiiHjjiral mi Ldionifi. Iwtpm I Win re

mu yoo ir 5011 In Ami mi ’iwrir^iiirw!

lb* I hank \ou lor your parlncrsliip 
wilh our business as well as 

your (ieiliralion Io ihe coni in u n i I \

West Bend.
Monday, May 1 - The 

Kewaskum Fire IXpartment 
responded to a fire call in die 
Town of Kewaskum al 11:28 
p.m. for a tree fire. Firefight­
ers were on the scene for 
approximately one hour.

Wednesday, May 3 - Ihe 
Kewaskum Fire Ikpiuimenl 
was summoned in the Village 
of Kewaskum at 6:51 for a 
gas grill fire. Firefighters 
were on the scene for approx­
imately .30 minutes.

Thursday, May 4 - The 
Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
was dispatched at 12:02 p in. 
in the Village of Kewaskum 
for a female patient experi- 
encing back pain. 'Ilie patient 
was transported to St. Joseph 
Community Hospital. West 
Bend.

Saturday, May 6 - The

Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
responded in the Village of 
Kewaskum for a female 
patient who had fallen. 
Patient was transported to St. 
Joseph Community Hospital, 
West Bend.

Sunday, May 7 - The 
Kewaskum Fire IXpartment 
Jaws of Life and die Rescue 
Squad were summoned al 
12:36 a m. in the Town of 
Farmington lor a motor vehi­
cle accident. A male patient 
was transported to St. Joseph 
Community Hospital for 
injuries received. Ihe Jaws 
were not utilized.

A wft for the entire fami­
ly - a subscription to the 
Kewaskum Statesman, serv­
ing you and your family for 
10(1 years!

Congratulations 
REGAL WARE, INC.

on your 
golden Anniversary 

Thanks for all your support 
throughout the years.

Kewaskum Jaycees

Bbank
(WISCONSIN

Kewaskum I 22S Fond du Lac Avenue, 026-2 17 1
Hartford 700 Grand Avenue, 673-4600

Conffmtu/dtums

REGAL WARE, INC.
on your

50th
Anniversary

In addition to being a major 
employer of the community, 
we thank you for your support 
of community activities.

Kewaskum Kiwanis

We would like to extend our 
Best Wishes 

to
Regal Ware Inc. 

and all it's Employees 
on their

5 Oth Anni vers ary

Office Machines/Computers

Sheboygan, WI
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Letters to 
the Editor

Dear Editor,

THAT'S ENOUGH
As a parent in the Ke­

waskum School District, I 
would like to express my 
concern towards the dis­
sention within our district, 
and to call an end to the lam­
basting between the School 
Board, Administration, 
Teachers and Parents.

One of the most valuable 
examples we can set for the 
students is trust and respect 
for each other. There seems 
to be a great lack of .this 
among many who maintain 
public attention.

It would be a welcome 
change to see our elected 
officials set aside personal 
conflicts, and address the 
agenda without pre-dccision.

As parents we have the 
right to express concern, and 
share in the responsibility of 
enriching education in our 
home.

Teachers have responsi­
bility to our children to main­
tain open communication 
with parents and administra­
tion. They do this when they 
share their ideas, teaching 
techniques and expertise, in a 
professional and objective 
manner.

Administration has the 
responsibility to oversee day 
to day operations, and main­
tain communication with the 
School Board.

Board members have the 
responsibility to find out, 
know and understand, what is 
going on in the district 
through the gathering of 
information from various 
resources. As well as to over­
see all aspects of the system, 
and to objectively look at the 
discrepancies. Most impor­
tant, to educate themselves 
through research not reaction.

Somewhere, in all this 
bureaucracy, is the underly­
ing belief that we wiii main­
tain the highest standard of 
education for our students. 
This bureacratic mess needs

to be resolved right here 
within our district.

As a team of parents, 
teachers, administrators and 
Board Members, we need to 
become pro-active, not reac­
tive.

My intention from here, 
is to personally address the 
board with my concern, at the 
next board meeting. Please 
attend.

Connie Schulist

********

Dear Editor,
I would like to take (his 

opportunity to thank the indi­
viduals who allowed us to 
successfully complete our 
recent bird house projects al 
Kewaskum Elementary 
School.

Thanks Io Dave 
Stradtmann for his time and 
effort. Also, thanks to Dennis 
Zolp, Steve Stachler, Shawn 
Ebert, Jason Brocr, Jamie 
Christian and Aaron Martin 
for taking time off from their 
own projects to help our stu­
dents.

And, finally, a special 
thanks to the Kewaskum 
Elementary School P.T.O. for 
financial assistance and to 
Carol Zoerb and the G/T pro­
gram for their time and 
effort.

Sincerely, 
John Stephani

********
Dear Editor,

The Youth and Family 
Project of Washington Coun­
ty would like to thank Mrs. 
June Gauvin and Holy 
Trinity School for allowing 
us to hold our spring 
Rainbows program at their 
school. We deeply appreciat­
ed the donated space and 
their committment to helping 
area children.

Thank you, 
Joy Breese 
Program Coordinator 
Die Youth ami 
Family Project

CARD OF THANKS
The family of 

MATHILDA STERN
extends a very sincere thank 

you to our relatives and 
friends for your many kind­

nesses and prayers. A special 
thank you to Dr. Looze and 
his staff, Rev. James Bellin 

for his many visits, Rev.
James Eckblad for his beauti­

ful funeral service, the 
Samaritan Home stall,

Horizon Home Care and 
especially Barbara Schmidt. 
A thank you also goes out to 
Ilie donors of memorial and 

floral tributes, Miller Funeral 
I lomc and to anyone who 
showed their respect and 

helped in any way.

Evelyn (Elroy) Uelmen 
Dolores (Gilbert) Petry 
Sylvester (Eleanor) Stem 
Shirley Stern

THANK YOU
We would like to thank all 

who remembered EUGENIA 
KRAUTKRAMER with 
cards and prayers during her 
illness, and those who 
expressed their sympathy 
with Howers, cards, food and 
memorials after her sudden 
death on Easter Sunday. 
Thank you to Pastor 
Robinson, the Kewaskum 
Rescue Squad, and Miller's 
Funeral Home. Special 
thanks to our friends and co­
workers who showed their 
support and concern in so 
many ways. Your kindness 
will never be forgotten.

Don ami Jeanne Jacak 
and Family

Ross and Sandy Krautkramer 
and Family

Sylvia Brabender

^W 
^Mothers 
^ ©Sy

Congratulations 

REGAL WARE. INC.
on the observance of your 

50th Anniversary
your contributions towards thegrowth 

of this community have been an 
inspiration to att of us.

Kewaskum Area Chamber of Commerce

PRAYER OF THE 
BLESSED VIRGIN

(Never known to fail). Oh, 
most beautiful flower of Mt. 
Carmel, fruitful vine, splendor 
of Heaven. Blessed Mother of 
the Son of God, Immaculate 
Virgin, Assist me in my necessi­
ty. Oh Star of the Sea, help me 
and show me here you are my 
Mother. Oh Holy Mary, Mollier 
of God, Queen of Heaven and
Earth, I humbly beseech you 
from the bottom of my heart to 
succor me in my necessity 
(Make request). There are none 
that can withstand your power. 
Oh Mary, conceived without 
sin, pray for us who have 
recourse to thee (three times). 
Holy Mary, 1 place this prayer 
lor your hands (three times). 
Say this prayer for three consec­
utive days and then you must 
publish and it will be granted to 
you.

Thanks you for needed

Congratulations

REGAL WARE, INC.

Thank you for everything you 
have brought to the enrichment 
of this community.

t/mjvkyou
Our sincere thanks to all

our family, relatives, and 
friends for your visits, gifts, 
cards, and prayers, while I 
had back surgery at St. 
Joseph s Hospital. Special 
tlianks to Dr. Schneider and 
Dr. Sison, the nurses on the 
3rd floor and also to Father 
Brophy for his visits and
prayers. Hicy were all really 
appreciated.

Ted Schoofs

VAmerican Heart 
Association 
kHjht'ng Haan t hue an, 

and Stroke

A Call to Arms: 
Check Blood 

Pressure.

The highest speed ever 
attained by a standard pro­
duction car was 217. J mph 
by a Jaguar driven by Martin 
Brundle in Italy in 1992.

Kewaskum 
Statesman

(Birt/ufay 
REGAL 
WARE!
May you have 

many, many more!

Kuehl's 
SUDS & SPIRITS



St. Francis Capital Corporation 
Announces Share Repurchase

St. Francis Capital Cor­
poration (NASDAQ:STFR) 
has announced that it has 
adopted a share repurchase 
program for its Common 
Stock.

John C. Schlosser, Pres­
ident and Chief Executive 
Officer, stated that the repur­
chase program was adopted 
to improve earnings per share 
and return on equity and rep­

resents an attractive invest­
ment option for the Company 
and its shareholders. He 
added that the Company has 
received authorization from 
the Office of Thrift 
Supervision ("OTS") to 
undertake the repurchase pro­
gram.

Schlosser further stated 
that the Corporation plans to 
purchase up to 5% of the out-

standing stock, or approxi­
mately 312.600 shares. It is 
anticipated that, depending 
on market conditions, the 
purchase period which com­
menced May 8, 1995, will 
conclude before March 31, 
1996. The repurchased shares 
will become treasury shares 
and will be used for general 
corporate purposes.

St. Francis Capital 
Corporation, with $1.19 bil­
lion in assets, is the holding
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company of St. Francis Bank. 
F.S.B. and Bank Wisconsin. 
The Company operates 18 
offices in Kenosha. Milwau­
kee. Ozaukee, Washington 
and Waukesha Counties.

They say the secret of 
health is eating onions! 
How are you going to keep 
it a secret?

The minister was whaling 
away with his golf club try­
ing t° Ut t out of the sand 
trap. Finally he lofted his 
ball only to have it go over 
the green into the trap on 
the other side. Red-faced 
and exasperated he turned to 
the other members of the 
foursome.... "Won't one of 
you laymen please say a few 
appropiate words?"

Happy 50th 
Birthday

REGAL WARE, INC.
Kewaskum would not be what it is 
today without your involvement and 
contributions.

Thank You
Kewaskum Junior Womans Club

Congratulations
REGAL WARE, INC.

on your 
50th Anniversary

We sincerely thank you for all 
you have donated to our organi­
zation and the community.

Kewaskum Womans Club

CONGRATULATIONS
REGAL WARE, INC.

On Your 50th Anniversary

Your commitment to this community 
has been one of its finest assets.

We are proud of the positive influence 
you have always shown and welcome 
your relationship with Kewaskum for 
many years to come.

Village of Kewaskum

(^.crngrululations

REGAL WARE, INC.
on your

50th Anniversary

Words cannot express our 
deep appreciation for all 
you have contributed these 
past 50 years.

RECTAL 
WARE, INC

on your 5Oth Anniversary

Henry Timblin Trucking
204 Main Street, Kewaskum

Kewaskum Lions Club
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AMBER HOTEL
Gimpbellsport - 533-8816

AMERAHN
Kewaskum - 626-4031

*AMERICAN FAMILY
INSURANCE mI^HH 1

AUTO HOME BUSINESS HEALTH LIFE 
Randy Gust - Kewaskum - 626-4050

RfBANK
Hi WISCONSIN

Kewaskum - 626-2171

BARTELT 
INSURANCE 
Kewaskum - 626-2070

BIER'S JEWELRY
Kewaskum - 626-2777

BONNE BELLE MOTEL
Kewaskum - 626-8414

C. C. CODY'S
Gimpbellsport - 533-4541

DR. J. DENNIS CONNOR
Kewaskum - 626-2119

^ DAIRYLAND SEED
West Bend - 338-0163

ECKL’S 
MAIN STREET INN

Kewaskum - 626-4328

ENGELHARDT & SONS
Kewaskum - 626-8437

FIN 'N FEATHER 
SUPPER CLUB 
Gimpbellsport - 533-4135

GARY GAVIN PAINTING 
SUNSET ESTATES

Kewaskum - 626-2209

GLACIER INN, LTD.
Kewaskum - 626-2711

HEBERER BROS.
CONSTRUCTION

Kewaskum - 626-2384

CongratuCations
REGAL WARE, INC

(Wc applaud you on the observance of your 50 years of 
accomplishment and are proud andgrateful to have you 
remain a steadfast member of the ^cwasfiim community

HERRIGES OIL, INC.
Kewaskum - 626-2242

KEWASKUM 
CHEVROLET/GEO

Kewaskum - 626-2161

L K HEATING & 
AIR CONDITIONING

Kewaskum - 626-4342

THURSDAY, MAY 11, 1995 PAGE

PROCLAMATION

Im Recognition of 
REGAL WARE, INC

WHE REAS. Regal Ware. Inc. ha# been a vital part of the development of our Village for 
the past five decade#; And

WHEREAS, this Company has manufactured many viable and quality products, to be 
provided to all Americans as well as most nations in the world: and

WHEREAS, in this near of Our Lord One Thousand Nine Hundred. Ninety Five this 
Company. REGAL WARE. INC. celebrates their Fiftieth Anniversary of 
serving and caring for their employees, the area citizens and community; 
and

WHEREAS. Regal Ware. Inc. was and is instrumental in the development of the Village; 
and

WHEREAS. Regal Ware. Inc. has been supportive regarding the expansion of and 
development of the Village parks: and

WHEREAS. Regal Ware. Inc. has been dedicated to the development of the communities 
youth by supporting athletic and academic programs, within both the public 
and private schools; and

WHEREAS, this attitude, sharing and vision for the Kewaskum Area has improved the 
quality of life of its employees, their community and nation.

NOW THEREFORE, we urge all those living within our Village and surrounding area to 
join in observance of Regal Ware. Inc. Golden Anniversary honoring and congratulating 
them for their achievements of the past, present and those of the future.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, we hereunto set our hand and caused the seal of 
the Village of Kewaskum to be affixed this 17th day of April. 1995.

SEAL ____ ______________
Robert H. Wagner. President

ATTEST: ___________________
Daniel S. Schmidt. Administrator

Introduction of Proclamation by Trustee William Kulas
Motion for adoption by Trustee Robert Bei#bicr
Motion for adoption seconded by Trustee Robert Stoltzmann
Roll call vote 7 "AYE" 0 "NAY" o "ABSENT'.

MILLER FURNITURE
Kewaskum - 626-2184

PRIME TIME PUB
Kewaskum - 626-4119

RAIN DANCE 
CAR WASH

Kewaskum - 626-4946

SENTRY FOODS
Kewaskum - 626-8424

SUBWAY
Kewaskum - 626-8180

TAN-TALIZER 
TANNING STUDIO, INC.

Kewaskum - 626-8876

STEPHEN R. VAN ESS, 
D.D.S., S.C.

Kewaskum - 626-8444

HON-E-KOR 
COUNTRY CLUB

Kewaskum - 626-2520

JOYS OF GROOMING
Kewaskum - 626-2506

KEWASKUM 
FAMILY CHIROPRACTIC

Kewaskum - 626-2644

Me DONALD'S TAVERN
Kewaskum - 626-2055

SHEFOND 
CONVENIENCE STORES

Amoco 626-4463 • Mobil 626-4300 
Kewaskum

VIDEO SQUARE
Kewaskum - 626-8880

KEWASKUM 
FROZEN FOODS

Kewaskum - 626- 2181

MILLER FUNERAL HOME
Kewaskum - 626-2185

STROBEL OIL & 
STROBEL PROPANE GAS

Kewaskum - 626-2212

WEST BEND 
SAVINGS BANK

Kewaskum - 626-2166
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PETER NEHRBASS JR.
Peter J. Nehrbass Jr., of 

West Bend and Hiles, 
Wisconsin, died Friday, May 
5, 1995, at the Samaritan 
Home in West Bend at the 
age of 82.

He was born December 
10, 1912, in the Town of 
West Bend, to the late Peter 
and Mary (nee Held) 
Nehrbass, and married 
Dolores "Dolly" Weiss on 
June 1, 1935, in West Bend.

For most of his life, Pete 
was a butcher and sausage 
maker, with his own meat 
market "Nehrbass Market" in 
West Bend from 1961-71.

After retiring in 1971, 
the couple moved to their 
lake home on Pine Lake in 
Hiles until January of this 
year when they returned to 
West Bend.

Survivors include bis 
wife; six children, Janine 
(Richard) Stoffel of Jackson, 
Jerry (Susan) of Campbell­
sport, Janet (Robert) Flasch 
of West Bend, James (Carol) 
of Sun Prairie, Joel (Linda) 
of Kewaskum and Julianne 
(David) Witte of Janesville; 
25 grandchildren; 19 great­
grandchildren; sisters-in-law, 
Julia Nehrbass of Allenton 
and Lillian Nehrbass, Esther 
Boesewetter, Edythe (Char­
les) Zastrow and Lillian 
(Harold) Hartman, all of 
West Bend; brothers-in-law, 
Leslie (Mildred) Weiss of 
Boltonville, Edgar Weiss of 
Kewaskum and Milton (June) 
Weiss of West Bend; and 
many other relatives and 
friends.

Preceding him in death 
were two sisters, Frieda Rode 
and Lola Kletti; two broth­
ers, Lester and Melvin; sis­
ters-in-law and brothers-in- 
law, Arnold Rode, Walter 
Kletti, Lillian (Louis) 
Behling, Ralph Bocsewetter, 
Harold Weiss, Avis (War­
dell) Spenser and Marion 
Weiss.

Funeral services were 
held Tuesday, May 9, at 7:30 
p.m. at Trinity Lutheran 
Church, West Bend. Rev. 
Terry Berg officiated and 
interment was Wednesday at 
9:30 a.m. in Washington 
County Memorial Park, West 
Bend.

Visitation at the church 
only was Tuesday from 4:30 
p.m. until the time of ser­
vices.

The Phillip Home of 
West Bend served the family.

DOROTHY E. BATH
Dorothy E. Bath, nee 

Goretski, of Menomonee 
Falls, formerly of Kewas­
kum, died Monday, May 8, 
1995 at Lindengrove Health 
Care Center in Menomonee 
Falls at the age of 87.

She was bom on February 
9, 1908, in Polonia, Wiscon­
sin to the late Alex and Julie

(nee Elbrant) Goretski and 
married Edward Mehlos in 
1928 in Silver Creek.

In 1947, she married 
Louis L. Bath in Kewaskum 
where she lived until October 
of 1993 when she entered the 
health care center. Her hus­
band Louis passed away in 
1987.

Survivors include a son 
Gerald (Kathleen) Mehlos of 
Menomonee Falls; eight 
grandchildren; seventeen 
great-grandchildren; a step­
son, Lou Bath and wife 
Helen of Waukesha, a son-in- 
law, Richard Edwards and 
his wife, Marilyn of rural 
Campbellsport (Long Lake); 
two sisters, Mary Ann 
Gruber of Kewaskum and 
Helen (Edwin) Voigt of 
Shawano; other relatives and 
friends.

She was preceded in death 
by three daughters, LaVonne 
Mehlos, Darlene Fehring and 
Arlette Edwards; three sisters 
and three brothers.

Funeral services were held 
Wednesday, May 10, at 7:30 
p.m. at the Schmidt Funeral 
Home, West Bend, with a 
Mass of Christian Burial at 8 
p.m. at Holy Angels Church, 
West Bend. Father Jerome

Nursing Assistant - Care Giver
Are you a good cook?

Do you find the elderly to be valuable members of society?
Do you enjoy working with a small group of elderly residents?
Do you want the time to do the little extras for your residents?

Do you enjoy working with professional co-workers?
Do you like working with a management team who recognize your talents?

Position Available at
NEW CASSEL HAUS

Campbellsport, Wl
Call Vai at 533-5411

LET MARGARET A. MCFADDEN 
BUILD YOUR

RETIREMENT FUND 
ON THE ROCK.

Choose tax-advantaged annuities, insurance, municipal bond 
funds and growth funds* that'll keep on working hard for you 
even after the day you stop. Talk to me about it.

Margaret A. McFadden 
626-4638

‘Variable life insurance, variable annuities 
and mutual funds available through Pruco 
Securities Corporation, Newark, NJ, 
a subsidiary of The Prudential.

Get a piece of The Rock?

ThePrudential
C 1 WO Th. Prudent* ln»ur ence Company of Arnica

We proudly present
THE TRIBUTE PROGRAM

It can help you remember all the love 
between the laughter and the tears

Call us or stop by for a free booklet

„ FUNERAL HOME
Kewaskum Phone 626-2185

Rinzel was the presider and 
the burial was Thursday, 
May 11, at 9:30 a.m. at 
Washington County Mem­
orial Park, West Bend.

Visitation was al the 
funeral home on Wednesday 
from 5 p.m. until the time of 
services.

Memorials may be direct­
ed to the Holy Angels School 
Trust Fund.

LEONA SABEL
Leona Sabel, 86, of 615 S. 

Elm Street, Campbellsport, 
formerly of Fond du I.ac, 
died Sunday, May 7, 1995, at 
her home.

She was born on 
September 27, 1908, in St. 
Joe, a daughter of Math and 
Gertrude Steffen Franzen. On 
April 22, 1931, she married 
Clarence Sabel al St. Cloud. 
He died on September 18, 
1991.

She attend St. Joe School. 
Mrs. Sabel and her husband 
farmed in the Town of Eden 
from 1930 to 1955 when they 
moved to Fond du Lac. She 
was employed at St. Agnes 
Hospital for 16 years until 
retiring in 1972. Mrs. Sabel 
was a member of St. Mary's 
Church and its Altar Society, 
and the Golden Agers.

Survivors include one son, 
Leroy and his wife, Rose­
mary of Eden; one daughter, 
Janet Serwe and her husband 
Mathias of Campbellsport; 
13 grandchildren; 24 great­
grandchildren; one great­
great-grandchild; and one sis­
ter, Mary Gerhartz and her

husband Paul.
Two brothers and two sis­

ters preceded her in death.
Funeral services were held 

at 10:30 a.m. Wednesday at 
Twohig Funeral Home in 
Fond du Lac and at 11 a.m. at 
St. Mary's Church. The Rev. 
Rolland Glass officiated and 
burial was in Calvary 
Cemetery.

Visitation at the funeral 
home was from 4 to 8 p.m. 
Tuesday.

REUBEN DREWITZ
Reuben G. Drewilz, 87, 

of 385 Monroe Street, 
Westfield, formerly of 
Dundee, died Monday, May 
8, 1995 at Divine Savior 
Hospital in Portage.

He was bom on May 14, 
1907, in the Town of 
Newton, Marquette County, a 
son of Gustav and Anna 
Lippert Drewitz. In Decem­
ber 1928, he married Edna 
Spindler. She died on August 
28, 1960. On November 11, 
1961, he married Bernice 
Dworschack in Kewaskum.

Mr. Drewitz owned and 
operated Edgewood Pharm­

^odsaw that sfit was tired, and a 
cure was not to be, so Me put Mis 
arms around her and whispered, 

'Come with Me. "

‘With tearful eyes we watched her so 
quickly slip away, although we loved

her dearly we could not make her stay.

Mergolden heart stopped beating, her gentle 
hands to rest, Qodbroke our hearts toprove to us, 

Me only takgs the best.

^ean LJohann May 15,1993

‘Deeply missed by Musband and Children.

MYRON P. BELGER 
Ju^11. 1919‘May 25, 1974

Flying Our 
Flag In 

Remembering 
Our Veterans

ALLEN “BUCK“ WEAVER 
Aug 1. 1920‘May 19. 1989 

DONALD E. DIEDRICH 
NW. 18. 1923 • May 19, 1990 

JAMES A SAEFKE 
April 7, 1943‘May 21, 1992 

LOREN REED COULTER 
Sept 29,1944 ♦ Mey24. 1966

Specializing in pre-need arrangements; irrevocable trusts

acy in Milwaukee for many 
years, and later was a tool 
and die maker at Pick's 
Manufacturing Company in 
West Bend. He was a mem­
ber of Holy Trinity Lutheran 
Church in Dundee and a 
church officer, a member of 
Fond du Lac County Deputy 
Sheriff's Reserve, a water 
safety patrol officer, Town of 
Osceola constable and hunter 
safety instructor.

Survivors include bis 
wife; one daughter, Sue Ann 
Rehberg and her husband 
Dennis of Mequon; two sis- 
ters-in-law; nieces and 
nephews.

Preceding him in death 
were one sister, Lydia Prater; 
and three brothers, Elmer, 
Vilas and Arnold.

Funeral services will be 
held at 2 p.m. Friday at 
Trinity Lutheran Church in 
Dundee. The Rev. John 
Nieman will officiate. Burial 
will be at the church ceme­
tery.

Visitation is at the 
church on Friday from 11 
a.m. to the lime of services.

Twohig Funeral Home 
of Campbellsport is handling 
arrangements.

CLARENCE J. THILL 
Aug. 21, 1896 - May 14. 1968 

ARTHUR C. BUTZLAFF 
Oct. 19. 1894 - May 15, 1970 

GILBERT A. BUECHEL 
My 10. 1922 ♦ May 17. 1966 

KENNETH H. GARBISCH 
Dao. 13, 1923 ► May 19, 1971



KHS Post Prom Party Held
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Post-prom students waiting to see if their names are
Larry AmnwI, right, awards the boom box to win- announced as prize winners.
ner Matt Hammen, left.

Late Saturday night on 
April 22, 1995, 170 Kewas­
kum High School students 
arrived at the Kettle Moraine 
YMCA for the annual Post 
Prom Party.

Activities for the night 
included swimming, basket­
ball, volleyball, racquet ball, 
karaoke, watching movies, 
playing video games and, of 
course, eating.

These events all took 
place between 12 midnight 
and 3 a.m. At 3 all students 
gathered together for the 
drawing of prizes.

Some of the winners were: 
19" Color TV - Jenny Stro­
bel; VCR - Ali Heise; Boom 
Box - Matt Hammen; Super 
Nintendo - Josh Dieringer; 
CD Walkman - Jeff Junk;

Left to right, Tim Breitag, Denis Tarakanov, 
Jarad Clayton and Jered Pankonin singing with 
the karaoke tape.

Walkman - Karl Ankerson; 
Answering Machine - Chad 
Schlagcnhaft; Telephones - 
Kelly Knoebel and Tony 
Seiser.

Each of the students in 
attendance received a prize of 
some type to take home. At 4 
a m. everyone left the YMCA 
and headed for home.

The Student Council 
thanks all in attendance, both 
students and parents alike. 
Plans are already being 
thought about for next year, 
so slay tuned.

THANK YOU
Prayer through application 

to the Holy Spirit. Holy 
Spirit, you who solve all 
problems, light all roads so 
that I can attain my goal. You 
who give me the divine gift 
to forgive and forget all evils

Chaperones Sue McCullough, Patti 
Clayton and Barb Breitag on the karaoke 
machine at the KHS Post Prom Party.

"Help Keep Your Community Environmentally Clean"

Lynn’s Wastepaper Recycling Co., Inc.
Aluminum Can 48c lb. 50c over 100 lb.

We honor any competitors coupons!

Competitive prices paid for copper, brass 
aluminum, lead batteries, cardboard, 

junk automobiles & iron

nd Ave., West Bend • 334-9542
Open Daily 7-5; Sat. 7-Noon

against me and that in all 
instances of my life you are 
with me. I want in this short 
prayer to thank you for all 
things as you confirm once 
again that I never want to be 
separated from you, even and 
in spite of all material illu­
sion. I wish to be with you in 
eternal glory. Thank you for 
your mercy toward me and 
mine. The person must say 
this prayer for three consecu­
tive days. After three days, 
the favor requested will be 
granted even if it may appear 
difficult. This prayer must be 
published immediately after 
the favor is granted.

R.B.

Your Local Window Experts: 

HEBERER BROS. CONSTRUCTION 
9340 Hwy 45 North, Kewaskum • 626-2384

DOUBLE HUNG WINDOWS 
ADD TIMELESS BEAUTY

• Patented R-Core insulation in 
frames means lh< highe st R factor 
and warmer windows.

♦ Durable, fusion-welded sash is 
guaranteed to never separate, leak 
air or water, or require maintenance.

• Lowest air infiltration rating for 
high energy efficiency, less drafts, 
less heat loss.

• Two sash locks are standard on 
windows over 25" wide, and 
ventilation limit locks provide 
added security

• Sashes tilt tn for easy cleaning
• Available in .3 exterior colors and 

3 woodgrain interiors
• Great Lakes Ply-Gem Window

Serving Washington County For Over 20 Years.

TENANTS 
ANYONE?

If you rent, rent some peace of mind. 
American Family's Renter's Insurance will give 

you a new lease on life. Call today and ask 
about our renter's insurance opportunities.

RANDY 
GUST

1040 Fond du Lac Ave 
Kewaskum

Office 
626-4050 American family Insurance Company 

Madison, Wl 53781

AMERICAN FAMILY ■Ennuni, 
AUTO HOMf BUSINFSS HfAlTHUFf
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TOWN OF KEWASKUM 

LIQUOR LICENSE
APPLICATIONS

The following have made 
an application for a Class "B" 
Combination Beer and 
Liquor License for the period 
July 1, 1995, to June 30, 
1996:
Kleinke, Inc., Amerahn 
Lari Kleinke, Agent 
9480 Hwy. 45, Town of 
Kewaskum
Hon-E-Kor Inc.
James Korth, Agent 
1141 Riverview Drive, 
Town of Kewaskum

The above applications 
will be heard and considered 
at a Town Board Meeting, 
Monday, May 15, 1995, 8 
p.m. at the Kewaskum Town 
Hall, 9019 Kettle Moraine 
Drive, Kewaskum, WI.

Barbara L. Wenzlaff, 
Clerk

’Going the 
Extra Mile’

The theme for the fourth 
quarter at Earmington School 
is "Going the Extra Mile." In 
order to raise money for the 
bombing victims in 
Oklahoma City, students will 
be walking and running, "the 
extra mile" in their Phy. Ed, 
classes.

The P.T.O. will pay 50 
cents for each student who 
participates in the "Go The 
Extra Mile" effort with the 
money to be donated to 
Oklahoma City.

In addition, they will pay 
50 cents for any parents who 
participates by walking the 
nature trail on May 17 during 
the school wide program/pic- 
nic.

Students tied ribbons 
on a tree at Farmington 
Elementary School to 
remember the people 
who were hurt or died in 
Oklahoma City.

Before this the stu­
dents discussed violence 
and how even calling 
others names hurts 
them. They also felt that 
everyone needs to be 
kind to others.

The entire school 
stood in silence for one 
minute one week after 
the disaster. This was in 
remembrance of those 
who were hurt and killed 
in the bombing in 
Oklahoma City.

The ribbons were 
placed on the tree by 
Mrs. Domasky’s class. 
One of the victims was 
Peter DeMaster, who 
was a friend of Mrs. 
Domasky’s son when 
they lived in Sheboygan.

CULL US 626-262.

'10‘PLXCEA
CLASSirrEfDJKD?

•Mb arid 6e pleased to advise you.

Shown in the photo, top row on ladder, 
left to right: Kyle Rabuck and Josh Gundrum. 
Standing: Josh Peterson, Alexa Nelson, Matt 
Lueck, Jake Wilson, Monica List, Laura Hass- 
mann.

Research is the Key
. INUI'S BOYMIEt
| M16 NY IIS YUAN TUI IWWt

AMERICAN Coll toll-free
Tsociety I-800-ACS-2345

public SIMPLICITY SIDEWALK SALE
NOTICE Fri., May 12th 

Sat., May 13th 
Sun., May 14th

DOWNTOWN NOW IS THE TIME TO BUY
STORE

REGENT.ni,*1899”
Gear Drive

• 12 5-hp Briggs & Stratton l/C Engine
* Heavy-duty, all-steel body & frame design 

accepts snow thrower, dozer blade____

REGENT only 
$2149

Hydrostatic Drive

• 36" Anti scalp mower
• American made In 

Milwaukee land!

BROADMOOR starting at

$2799-

CORONET,^^

• Amazing 12" turning circle 
• 30" or 34" anti-scalp cut 

(30" model shown)

- or 12 5-hp Briggs & 
Stratton l/C & Kohler Command® 
OHV powered models
• No shift, no clutch hydrostatic 

drive option
NO PAYMENTS TIL 
SEPTEMBER 1995

Complete set-up/assembly onExpert sales assistance
Top-priority, factory-trained service all equipment

• Choice of 14-. 15- or 16-hp Briggs or Kohler 
one- and two-cylinder OHV engines
• 38" or 44" full-floating, axle-mounted 

mowers for the smoothest cut possible

Trade-in allowances***
Pick up and delivery service 
Original equipment 
Simplicity parts

Tennies J^a^^ue will Give You the Service You Want.

\Simplicihf\

HARDWARE
1625 S. Main Street 

West Bend • 334-5891
112 S. 5th Avenue 

West Bend • 338-2316

* Famous "full-floating" Simplicity 
mower for the smoothest cut 
possible (44" or 50 widths)

• Rugged, versatile garden tractor 
design accepts optional snow 
thrower, blade, tiller and other 
attachments

• Powerful 18-hp , Kohler Twin. 
Cylinder OHV engine

• Hydrostatic Drive Transmission

• Choice of Hydrostat'c or Gear drive
•Tough, Wisconsin-made all-steel body 

frame design for long life and multiple 
attachment capability

Bring your truck or trailer these 
machines are set up 

and ready to go...

SOVEREIGN save up to

M050"

Safety/operation instructions 
upon delivery 
On-site demonstrations 
(most models) Outdoor Power 

Equipment
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KEWASKUM 
COMMUNITY SCHOOLS

Monday, May 15 — 
Cheese & sausage pizza, 
tossed salad w/asst. dress­
ings, fruit cocktail, school- 
made bread, milk & a peanut 
butter cookie.

Tuesday, May 16 -- 
Charbroiled chopped beef 
steak/bun, fresh veggies & 
dip, crisp potato wedges, 
milk & frosted raisin bread, 
(or Mr. Rib/bun - U.S. & 
M.S.)

Wednesday, May 17 — 
Hot dog/bun w/lhe works, 
broccoli w/cheese sauce, 
pineapple chunks, milk & a 
chewy brownie. (Mexican 
Salad Bar - H.S. & M.S.)

Thursday, May 18 — 
Zesty Italian spaghetti, crusty 
French bread w/garlic butter, 
green beans, milk and a sugar 
meltaway cookie.

Friday, May 19 — French 
toast sticks & syrup, break­
fast sausages hash brown 
potato tri angle, applesauce, 
milk & a cupcake w/choc.

frosting, (or Italian toasted 
cheese sand. H.S. & M.S.)

HOLY TRINITY 
SCHOOL

Monday, May 15 -- 
Hamburger/bun with the 
works, pineapple, pear half, 
oatmeal bar, milk.

Tuesday, May 16 — 
Turkey cubes over fluffy 
rice, golden corn, cherry cup, 
dinner roll, pumpkin square, 
milk.

Wednesday, May 17 -- 
Hot ham sandwich, mac & 
cheese, buttered carrots, 
blueberry cup, apple slices, 
cherry kuchen, milk.

Thursday, May 18 -- 
Meatballs/meatloaf/gravy, 
whipped potatoes, green 
beans, peach half, dinner 
roll,cookie, milk.

Friday, May 19 - French 
toast, scrambled eggs, bread 
w/butter, apple sauce, orange 
slices, blueberry muffin, 
milk.

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM MENU 

Meadowcreek Apartment 
Complex

Monday, May 15 — 
Spaghetti w/meatballs, Italian 
blend vegs. fruit cocktail, 
Italian bread, marble cake.

Tuesday, May 16 - Apple 
juice, pork chop suey, fluffy 
rice, oriental vegetables, 
wheat bread, chocolate cream 
pic.

Thursday, May 18 — 
Polish sausage, boiled pota­
toes, sauerkraut, rye bread, 
banana.

Ceramics at 10:00 a m. 
every 1st and 3rd Tuesday of 
the month.

SHEEPSHEAD 
WINNNERS

5 handed winners on 
Thursday, May 4th were: 
Butch Schmitt, 78-7-71, 20- 
6--14; Andy Bonlender, 64- 
4-60, 21-2-19; George 
Sommers, 66-7—59, 19-4— 
15; Jerry Darmondy, 57-5- 
52, 19-5-14; Milt Bartelt, 
51-7-44, 18-3-15; Vern 
Schneider, 45-1—44, 12-1 — 
11.

The next 5 handed will be 
Thursday, May 18th and 
Wednesday, May 24th at 
8:00 p.m. Sharp. Cash prizes, 
plus lunch. Schmitt's Never 
Inn.

XYZ CARD RESULTS

The winners at cards 
played by the XYZ Senior 
Citizens at the Municipal 
Building on Wednesday, 
May 3rd were: SKAT: Ken 
Kaschner, 21-2-19 net; Fred 
Klein, 18-4—14 net; Frank 
Sell,Club solo vs 4.

SHEEPSHEAD: Sally 
Reindl, Gilbert Reindl, Lucy 
Weiland and Millie Theisen.

500: Irene Kohl.

One responsibility
teenagers rise to is 
answering the phone

RESOLUTION NO. 95-13

A RESOLUTION SUPPORTING WASHINGTON 
COUNTY S PETITION TO BE RELEASED 

FROM A NON-ATTAINMENT DESIGNATION
BE IT RESOLVED, Recitals:

A. The Clean Air Act of 1990 allows counties which have 
achieved attainment for three consecutive years to be exempt­
ed from a non-attainment designation.
B. The Clean Air Act permits counties reaching attainment to 
petition the Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) for redesig­
nation.
C. Washington County has met federal standards since 1989
D. Washington County Board of Supervisors adopted 
Resolution No. 92-94-95 petitioning the EPA to redesignate 
Washington County.

BE IT RESOLVED, Therefore, the Village Board of the Village of 
Kewaskum, Washington County, Wisconsin do RESOLVE that the Village 
supports the County’s petition to redesignate Washington County as a 
county which has attained compliance.

ADOPTED and APPROVED, this 1st day of May, 1995, by the Kewaskum 
Village Board.

Robert H. Wagner
Village President 

ATTEST:
Daniel S. Schmidt
Admmistrator/Clerk

Introduced by Trustee John Borland
Motion for adoption by Trustee Robert Stoltzmann
Motion for adoption seconded by Trustee William Kulas 
Roll call vote was 7 'Aye' 0 'Nay* 0 ‘Absent*

OTROY-BILT
Mulching Mowers 

FREE'TIL 
FALL!

AUTO CRAFT
•Insurance Work Our Speciality 

•Complete Auto Body Repair 
•Unibody Repair 

•Rental Cars Available 
•Fast Service

•Serving the Area for 16 Years
Conveniently located between West Bend and Kewaskum

338-0379

It’S asc»ea,3S
Black and White

FROM $369.95 Plus FREE Blade
Available now with No Interest*, No Money Down 
and No Payments until September 21, 1995 when 
you qualify for the TROY-BILT’ Easy Pay Plan!
• Mow up to 40% FASTER with no clippings to 

bag, collect or dispose of.
• FREE Fertilizer -

Clippings are mulched 
back into your lawn as 
FREE fertilizer.

• Convenient single 
lever height 
adjustment.

Variety of powered 
and push models.

• Exclusive 7-Year Warranty 
(ask for details)

Second Hand Smoke

KILLS ©1995 Garden Way. Inc
' Important information for qualified customers regarding credit terms After September 21 1995 the APR based or. 
your state of residence is as follows AK 18% on fast $1 000 of balance / 92% on excess AR 7 92% Al CT fl tA 
MA Ml MN N( ND PA RI WA and Wi 18% KS 18 96% on first $ I 000 of balance 14 4% on excess NE 
18 96% on first $500 of balance 18% on excess. SC 16 92% TX 17 64% WV 18% on first $/50 of balance 
12% on excess DC and all other states 18 96 Minimum finance charge is $ 50 for each billing cycle in which a 
finance charge is payable (except for residents of AR CT DC HI ID KY LA MD Nf NM NC ND OR and RI )

Choose a smoke Free Restaurant 
West Bend Has 14-.

• EPA Report, 1992 - 53,000 people die each 
year of second hana smoke.
IIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIHIII
TOBACCOFRET
A " \\lll\(<H>\ tot \/> (<)\l IIU>\U

Your Whitct Outdoor dealer QTROVBILT——
BARTON SMALL ENGINE

335-4462 
llllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllll

1628 M Mam St 
Dave & Sandy Noegel 

i 334-5373
I ROY Illi I • I < IK) • HUSQVARNA 

• I AWNBOY • SNAITLR
DAVID MOKU-MSI- SHINDAIWA - Will I h_______

Your Yard Care Headquarters!
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A Tribute to Coach

4

Holy Trinity Concludes Sports Season 
With Awards Banquet and Dance

Tony Butschlick

Holy Trinity basketball coach 
Tony Butschlick has retired.

1994-95 HOLY TRINITY BOYS A* TEAM
Second Place — 8-2 Record

Row one, left to right - Jarrod Gruber, Eric Wenninger, Shaun Timblin, Jason 
Butschlick, Luke Martin. Row two: Coach Tom Timblin, Jason Gruber, Patrick 
Bohn, Nick Kallmyer, Jesse Boegel, Jason Strobel, Nick Staehler, Chris Boden, 
Coach Tony Butschlick. All Star Players were Jason Butschlick, Shaun Timblin 
and Eric Wenninger.

Ry liaise Martin

No doubt anyone who 
knows Tony Butschlick 
could very easily believe his 
first words as a child must 
have been "basketball."

As surely as the ritual of 
geese flying south every fall, 
Coach Butschlick geared up 
for another exciting year of 
basketball at Holy Trinity 
School and Parish. This ritual 
has been put to rest after 
eighteen dedicated years of 
coaching.

Each year was a new chal­
lenge, as players moved on, 
as players matured from one 
season to the next. Coach 
Butschlick inspired the play­
ers to be the best they could 
be. They may not have been 
the tallest or quickest or the 
most coordinated but if the 
team played as a team, gave 
all they had, they could be 
proud of the outcome, win or 
lose.

Butschlick was honored al 
the Holy Trinity Athletic 
Banquet amid a standing ova­
tion as he humbly praised the 
students and their parents. 
Those in attendance enjoyed 
a bulletin board displaying 
team pictures and highlights 
from over the years. A table 
was adorned with trophies, 
plaques and memorabilia 
from the past eighteen years 
of coaching.

Butschlick graduated from 
Kewaskum High School in 
1970 and was a member of, 
as some would say, the "best 
high school basketball team 
in Kewaskum's history."

He began as a referee at 
Holy Tiinity in 1976 and in 
1977 he joined the coaching 
stiff. His contributions and 
team accomplishments over 
the following years would be 
numerous, all for the players 
and "the love of the game."

During the season of '82- 
'83, his B team boys earned 
the League Championship 
defeating Campbellsport 24- 
23, with a repeat title in '83- 
'84.

Under Coach Butschlick, 
the B team boys savored their 
first tournament champi­
onship game in '83-'84 al St. 
Kilians in Hartford. In an 
intense game, three of the 
team starters fouled out but 
the bench came in to win the 
tournament, 27-26.

The A team boys were 
league champs in '87-'88 with 
a 10-0 record, again in '91- 
'92 with a 10-1 record defeat­
ing St. Marys of Eden and 
finally in ^S-^M with a 10-1 
record defeating SL Marys of 
Barton.

The A team boys won 
their first tournament cham­
pionship in '93-'94 at St. 
Mary's Springs High School 
and earned the championship 
title in '94 '95 at the West 
Bend Early Bird Tournament.

Butschlick leaves Holy 
Trinity with five league 
championships, three tourna­
ment championships and five 
second place teams.

No one can begin to tally 
the hours of practice, the 
number of miles driven to the 
approximately 300 games he 
coached, the anxiety experi­
enced on the bench of the 
close games, the pride in 
winning and the humbleness 
of defeat. Coach Butschlick 
brought a Christian attitude 
to each team, a total commit­
ment to the players and to the 
game.

Coach Butschlick will be 
missed as he moves on. We 
arc thankful for the many 
years of dedication he gave 
Holy Trinity and without a 
doubt we all know his heart 
is as big as a basketball. 
Thanks for the memories. 
Coach!

By Ix>uise Martin

Athletes of Holy Trinity 
Parish and School and their 
families culminated the 
1994-95 sports season with 
the celebration of Mass fol­
lowed by a potluck banquet 
and dance at the Amcrahn in 
Kewaskum.

The event marked the 
final opportunity to recognize 
the athletes and coaches 
involved in the volleyball, 
basketball and cheerleading 
programs at Holy Trinity dur­
ing the 1994-95 season.

Tom Timblin, president­
elect of Holy Trinity Athletic 
Association, served as Master 
of Ceremonies for the awards 
banquet. The coaches shared 
reflective moments of the 
season and presented 
plaques, medals and team 
pictures to their team mem­
bers.

In addition to a team pic­
ture and medal, each eighth 
grade student was awarded a 
walnut plaque with each 
sport and the years in which 
they participated engraved on 
it. Participants in grades five 
through seven received 
medals with a bluc/gold rib­
bon drape and a team picture.

Referees for the season 
were recognized and publicly 
thanked for their participa­
tion in this year's games. 
They were I any Bunkelman, 
Perry Koth, Steve LiegI, 
Gerry Gosa, Chuck Boegel, 
Dean Scheel, Al Wiesner, 
Tom Timblin, Dick Heisdorf, 
Terry Cartwright for basket­
ball and Lynn Gaffke for vol­
leyball.

Holy Trinity Is a member 
of the Kettle Moraine 
Catholic League, one of six 
schools in the conference. 
The "A" team consists of 
seventh and eighth grade stu­
dents while the "B" team is

composed of fifth and sixth 
grade students.

Basketball standings were 
as follows: proudly sporting a 
10-0 season record, the "B" 
team girls earned a first place 
league position under coach 
Gary Bohn and Assistant 
Coach Al Wiesner. All Star 
players Bridget Polzean, 
Emily Rinzel and Lynn 
Wiesner were selected by 
their fellow teammates.

Ihe "A" team girls were 
coached by Dave Kraft and 
Assistant Coach Frank King. 
Although their season was 
not as successful as they 
hoped, all had a good time 
and kept the spirit alive. 
Jenny Kraft, Amy Piwoni 
and Carol Neumann were the 
A Team All Star players.

Under the direction of 
Tom Hcrriges, a Holy Trinity 
alumnus, the "B" Team Boys 
finished second in the league, 
posting a 6-4 season record. 
All Star players were Mark 
Schrauth, Jacob Stoffel and 
Mitch Strobel.

The "A" Team Boys under 
the coaching expertise of 
Tony Butschlick and Tom 
Timblin, finished the season 
with an 8-2 record placing 
second in the league. All Star 
players were Jason Butsch­
lick, Shaun Timblin and Eric 
Wenninger.

Girls volleyball was 
offered in the fall. Jessica 
Gruber coached the sixth 
grade team who took first in 
their division. Grade seven 
also placed first and was 
coached by Cindy Gruber 
and Assistant Coach Lori 
Schoofs. Receiving fourth 
place, the eighth grade team 
was coached by Cindy 
Gruber and Lisa Donath.

Over 70 students partici­
pated in the 94-95 athletic 
program whose success 
depends on many dedicated

coaches, parents and families 
who volunteer their time.

Following the awards pre- 
sentafon, those in attendance 
were entertained by the tunes 
of the Bob Breuer Band.

TOWN OF KEWASKUM 
TOWN BOARD MEETING

MAY 10,1995
The Kewaskum Town 

Board Meeting will attend a 
workshop at the Washington 
County Courthouse, 432 E. 
Washington Avenue, West 
Bend, WI, on Wednesday, 
May 10, 1995, 7-9 p.m. 
Professor Larry Lammers, 
UW-Madison will conduct 
the workshop on Parlimen- 
tary Procedure.

The Town Board will also 
meet at the Town Hall, 9019 
Kettle Moriane Drive, 
Kewaskum, following the 
workshop at 9:30 p.m. On the 
agenda is approval of a reso­
lution to ask the Washington 
County Land Use & Park 
Commission and County 
Board to stop passage of 
adoption of revised chapters 
23, 24 and 25 of the 
Washington County code 
pertaining to shoreland/wet- 
land/floodplain zoning, land 
divisions, and the sanitary 
code.

A complete agenda is 
available from the Clerk 
upon request. Dated this 6th 
day of May, 1995.

Barbara L.Wenzlaff, 
Town Clerk

A Subscription 
to the 

Kewaskum Statesman 
- - a gift that keeps on 

giving all year long! 

Phone 626-2626
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The fifth grade students at Holy Trinity School are anxiously awaiting 
"News About Their News." Their newspapers that is. As a language 
arts activity, the fifth graders wrote to all 50 newspaper companies, 
using their knowledge of business letter writing. They have received 42 
so far and are currently awaiting news from New Mexico, South 
Dakota, Nebraska, Louisiana, Missouri, Pennsylvania, Delaware and 
New Jersey.

State of Wisconsin 
Circuit Court 

Washington County 
PROBATE 

IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF LORAINE V. PUER. 

Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS 

File No. 95-1N-066

An application has been Hied for 

Informal Administration of the estate 

of the above named person, 

Washington County. Wisconsin, 

whose post office address was 1038 

Fond du l ac Avenue, Apt. #207, 

Kewaskum, W1 53040.

IT IS ORDERED THAT: All 

creditors' claims must be filed on or 

before July 25, 1995, or be barred.

BY THE COURT: 

/s/ Kristine M. Deiss 

Probate Registrar 

April 25, 1995 
Atty. Gerald A. Kiefer 

1233 Fond du lac Avenue 

P.O. Box 456 

Kewaskum. W1 53040-0456 

State Bar No.: 1014058 

Publish May 4, 11 A 18

State of Wisconsin 
Circuit Court

W ashington County 
PROBATE

IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF EUGENIA C. 

KRAUTKRAMER. Deceased.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
File No. 95-IN 069

An application has been filed for 
Informal Administration of the estate 

of the above named person. 

Washington County. Wisconsin, 
whose post office address was 9494 

Boltonville Road, Kewaskum, Wl 
53040.

IT IS ORDERED THAT: All 

creditors' claims must be filed on or 

before July 28, 1995, or be barred.

BY THE COURT: 

/s/ Kristine M. Deiss 
Probate Registrar 

April 28, 1995 
Atty. Roger W. McKenna, of 

McKENNA LAW OFFICE 

114 Main St.
P.O. Box 550
Kewaskum. Wl 53040

Publish May 11,18 A 25

BUSINESS DIRECTORY

MB MB w

I uaRMeP;
; jiMi^aina
I Professional Remodeling | 
। Contractors t 

. • FULLY INSURED • : 
533-4445 1

Washed Mason Sand and Gravel Filling 
Crushed Road Gravel • Crushed Stone

J&J Baumhardt 
Aggregates Inc.

W3998 Hwy. 45 • Eden, Wl 53019 
Phone 477-2118 or (Butzke Pit) 533-4912

Owner Loreen Schneider

626-8420
10S 7 Fond Du Lac Ave

> Adults..... $8.00
> Seniors....$7.00 (Tues.AWed.5.75)

> Kids (0upto3yrs.)..... $3.00
(3yrs.upto 6yrs.)$6.00
(6yrs.& up)....... $8.00

Kewaskum 
lues In 10 fl Sat 8 50 4 > Buff ’n Polish (men)...$5.00

Ais 
Taxidermy 

a Art herx Supplies 

♦ Hunt r up A 1 ishmp 
Licenses

a I in In \ Su ppii is
* \u rmh up Win in up 

l it \ Illi Till)

*1 l^H SPK7 \I.IST

Phone 626-207 1

Tired of Mud?
THINK CONCRETE!

BUTCH S CONSTRUCTION
Sidewalks - Patios - Driveways - Garages - 

Pole Buildings - Barnyards - Concrete Sawing - 
SKID LOADER WORK

GERALD (BUTCH) WINNINGHOFF
8412 Hilltop Lane, Kewaskum

334-3186

R. H. Improvements
Specialize pouring 

Driveways • Patios • Sidewalks 

Roofing • Siding • General Carpentry

Russell Herriges 414-338-2129 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin

Serving Your Area

GAS
Service
for

PHILGAS

Home - Farm or Industry
Cylinder & Bulk Deliveries

NO TANK CHARGE
Serving Gas Customers 

for Over 50 Years

BOEHLKE BOTTLED 
GAS CORP.

Plants located at Jackson 
and Random Lake

West Bend 338-8011
Random Lake 944-2229 

TOLL FREE 
1-800-448-3388

JIM SCHAUB J
"for the repair job that's 

been put off for too long"

P.O. Box 177
Kewaskum, Wl 53040

HOME

626-8227

IMPROVEMENT

Cabinetry/Garage Doors/Remodeling 
Siding/Storm Doors/Storm Windows 

Replacement Windows/Decks

TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING

317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport
533-8094

— Auto Service «■

ROGER & DAN’S
AUTO SERVICE

"Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing
Service Station in This Area" ■■■■

„ c 1 UNIROYALHwy. 45 South, Kewaskum

626-2888
24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE <*M-"

KLEMME BROS. WELL DRILLING INC, 
Kewaskum, Wl.

Emergency Pump Service 
Well Inspection & Code Repair 

Pressure Tank Service 
Well Drilling

Well Abandonment

Carl Klemme State License
414-6264592 5935



TOWN OF KEWASKUM 
BOARD OF REVIEW, 

PLAN COMMISSION AND 
TOWN BOARD MEETING

MAY 15,1995

The 1995 Town of 
Kewaskum Board of Review 
will be held Monday, May 
15, 1995, from 4 to 7:30 p.m. 
and from 9 to 10 p.m., at the 
Kewaskum Town Hall, 9019 
Kettle Moraine Drive, 
Kewaskum, WI. The Town 
Board will review the 1995 
Assessment Roll for errors 
and omissions. Objections to 
assessments will be heard by 
the Board or scheduled at a 
later date. An appointment 
may be arranged by calling 
the Town Clerk in advance 
(626-2550).

At 7:30 p.m., the Town 
Board will hold a Public 
Hearing regarding a petition 
to expand a Conditional Use 
Permit for Bryant & Cynthia 
Borland, 9001 Hickory 
Drive, Kewaskum. If 
approved, it will allow 
Borlands to continue using 
their property as a home 
industry to manufacture and 
repair wood products, con­
struct a 54' x 36' addition on 
a pole building, and allow for 
a maximum of two non-fami- 
ly member employees.

Plan Commission will 
meet immediately following 
the Public Hearing, agenda:

1) Plan Commission orga­
nizational meeting; election 
of officers for two-year term.

2) Make recommendation 
to Town Board regarding 
expansion of Conditional Use 
Permit for Bryant & Cynthia 
Borland.

3) Discussion regarding 
hiring planner.

The Town Board will 
meet immediately following 
the Plan Commission 
Meeting, agenda follows:

1) Take action on expan­
sion of Conditional Use 
Permit, Bryant and Cynthia 
Borland.

2) Appearance of Diane 
Horlamus, Washington 
County Humane Society.

3) Second reading and 
take action on Bicycle & 
Pedestrian Trail Resolution 
from Southeastern Wisconsin 
Regional Planning 
Commission.

4) Second reading and 
take action on Ordinance to 
Prohibit Parking of 
Abandoned Vehicles in Road 
Right-of-Way.

5) Take action on 
Resolution to change one 
official posting place from 
the former landfill site to the 
corner of Prospect Drive and 
Badger Road.

6) Take action to approve 
applications for Class "B" 
Combination Beer and 
Liquor Licenses for applica­
tions received from Klcinke, 
Inc. and Hon-E-Kor, Inc.

7) Accept estimates for 
sound system for the I own 
Hall.

8) Payment of bills.
9)Assessor Raymond 

Weinhold resignation effec­
tive 6-1-95.

10) Take action on request 
from Diamond F. 
Corporation to travel on 250' 
of Forcstview Road agree­

ment to replace road if dam­
aged by delivery trucks.

11) Appointment of 
Deputy Clerk.

12) Discussion to reduce 
speed limit on all Town roads 
to 45 m.p.h.

A complete agenda is 
available from the Clerk 
upon request. Dated this 7th 
day of May, 1995.

Barbara L. Wcnzlaff, 
Town Clerk

TOWN OF WAYNE
Town Board Meeting

The monthly town meet­
ing will be held at 8 p.m. 
Wednesday, May 17, at the 
Town Hall, 6030 Hwy. H.

A complete agenda can 
be obtained at the clerk's 
office the day of the meet­
ing.

Orville Kern, Clerk

Notice of Meeting of 
Board of Review

STATE OF WISCONSIN } 
WASHINGTON COUNTS } SS.

VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM I

Public Notice is Hereby Given That the Board of Review for the 
said Village of Kewaskum will meet at the office of the under­
signed, Village Clerk thereof, on the 22nd day of May 1995, at 
10:00 o'clock in the fore noon, for the purpose of reviewing and 
examining the assessment roll of real and personal property in said 
VILLAGE, and all sworn statements and valuations of real and per­
sonal property therein, and of correcting all errors in said roll, 
whether in description of property or otherwise, and to perform 
such other duties imposed by law.

Dated May 1, 1995

Daniel S. Schmidt
Administrator/Clerk

★ NOTICE *
by the

VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM 
OPERATOR’S LICENSES

Wisconsin State Statutes 66.054 (11). Notice is hereby given that 
all Operator’s (bartender's) Licenses shall expire on June 30, 1995. 
Those desiring to renew their Operator's License may do so upon 
application in writing. An Operator’s License may be issued to per­
sons 18 years of age or over, who are of good moral character and 
have met the requirement of the State of Wisconsin.

There shall be upon all premises operated under a Class "A" or 
Class "B" license, at all times, the licensee of some person who 
has an Operator's License and who is responsible

NOTE: If you don’t want your Operator's License to lapse, your 
application must be on file at the Municipal Building by June 13, 
1995 so the Village Board may take action on it June 19, 1995.

TOWN OF KEWASKUM 
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 
ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

Barbara L. Wenzlaff 
Zoning Secretary 
May 1, 1995

* * * NOTICE * * *
There will be an informal open book conducted by 

Bowmar Appraisal, Inc. at the Municipal Building, 
204 First Street on Tuesday, May 16, 1995 from 10:00 
a.m. to noon and 1:00 p.m. to 7:00 p.m. and on 
Wednesday, May 17, 1995 from 1:00 p.m. to 7:00 
p.m. where you can meet individually with one of the 
appraisers.

The OFFICIAL BOARD OF REVIEW will be 
meeting on Monday, May 22,1995, from 10:00 a.m. to 
noon and 1:00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m. at the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street, Kewaskum, Wl 5 3040. For 
an-appointment please call (414) 626-8484.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
5-4-2t Administrator/Clerk Daniel S. Schmidt 

Administrator/Clerk

TOWN OF KEWASKUM 
1995 BOARD OF REVIEW

at the 
KEWASKUM COMMUNITY CENTER 

9019 Kettle Moraine Drive, Kewaskum

Monday, May 15,1995
HOURS: 4 p.m. - 7:30 p.m. 

and ‘9 p.m. -10 p.m.

The assessment roll will be checked for errors 
and omissions.
Specific appointments may be set up for 
appeals.

Barbara L. Wenzlaff 
Town Clerk (626-2550)

‘Plan Commission and Town Board will meet from 7:30 - 9 p.m.

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Town of 
Kewaskum Zoning Board of Appeals will conduct a hear­
ing on the application for appeal filed by Donald L. 
Menzel, 8805 Hwy. B, Kewaskum, WI 53040. The hearing 
will be held at 7 P.M. on Wednesday, May 24, 1995 at the 
Kewaskum Town Hall, 9019 Kettle Moraine Drive, 
Kewaskum. The applicant's property is located in the 
Town of Kewaskum, part of the northeast 1/4 of the north­
east 1/4 described in CSM 694 and Volume 1303 Page 198 
of records. Section 18-12-19, .92 acres. The appeal seeks a 
variance of Section 1.36 (2)(a) and Section 1.38(1). If the 
variance is granted, the applicants will be allowed to con­
struct a garage in the street yard and within the legal set­
back from the center of the highway (legal setback 
requirement, 100 feet). All interested persons wishing to 
comment on the appeal should appear at the Public 
Hearing.

May 4 & 11

Village Board 
Meeting Monday

Public notice is hereby 
given that the next meeting 
of the Village of Kewaskum 
Wisconsin, Village Board is 
scheduled for Monday 
evening, May 15, 1995, at 
8:00 p.m. in the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street.

Phe agendas for the meet­
ing are prepared as of 
Wednesday noon preceding 
the meeting and are available 
at the office of the clerk at 
the Municipal Building on 
Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are 
also posted in the lobby of 
the Kewaskum Post Office 
and the lobby of Bank 
Wisconsin.

FOR SALE
POLICE SQUAD CAR

The Village of Kewaskum is seeking sealed bids: 
1993 Ford, Crown Victoria, four door sedan, with police package, 
light blue, blue cloth bucket seats front, full bench rear, full tinted 
windows, air conditioned, H.D. automatic transmission, 305 cubic 
inch, Over Head Cam, V-8 engine AM/FM stereo radio. Vehicle 
titled April 4, 1993. Radial tires and 78,400 miles. Body in good 
condition. The car may be seen Monday thru Friday, from 8:00 a.m. 
to 4:00 p.m. at the Kewaskum Municipal Building, 204 First St., 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin.
For more information contact Chief Richard L. Knoebel at (414) 
626-2323.

Sealed bids are to be sent to:
Village Administrator 
204 First St., Box 38 

Kewaskum, WI 53040

PLEASE MARK THEM: ‘POLICE SQUAD CAR BID*
Bids are to be in this office by 4:00 p.m., Monday, May 15,1995

The Village reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.
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NOTICE 
by the 

VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM

Notice is hereby served that pursuant to Wise. Stats. 66.96(4) 
that every person is required by law to destroy all noxious 
weeds, as defined in this section, on lands in the muncipality 
which the person owns, occupies or controls.

The term "noxious weeds" as used in this chapter includes the 
following: Canada thistle, leafy spurge and field bindweed (creep­
ing Jenny) and any other such weeds as defined by the governing 
body of any municipality.

By order of the Village President
5^-2t
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THE CLASSIFIED MARKETPLACE
ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE

Rate S2 50 up to 20 words, over 20 words - add 10C per word
Ad Deadline - Noon on Tuesday - Call 626-2626

CLASSIFIED AD POLICY All classified ads must be paid in advance Classified ads phoned in or brought to our office must 
be paid by noon on Tuesday of the week you want the ad published A $3 billing charge will be added The Onk excep­
tion will be for those businesses who have regular running accounts with the Statesman4 
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FOR SALE
RUMMAGE SALE - Four- 
family, May 11,12 & 13, 8 a.m. 
to 4 p.m. Two old dressers, 
one with handkerchief draw­
ers, sink with vanity, rocking 
horse, curtains, lots of clothes 
and miscellaneous items. 9685 
Hwy. S, one mile north of 
Kewaskum.5-11-1p

RUMMAGE A CRAFT SALE - 
- May 12 & 13 - 8:00/5:00, 
N1143 Hwy. V, Campbellsport, 
next to Bartoli’s Greenhouse. 
Furniture, tools and misc., 
unique doll, metal, and wood 
crafts.5-11-1 p

NEIGHBORHOOD GARAGE 
SALES: Fri., May 19, 8-4; 
Sat., May 20, 8-3. Excellent 
quality children's name brand 
clothing, size 0-14; women’s jr. 
size 7 and up; wedding dress; 
(most of the clothes is neatly 
hung on hangers) Sesame 
Street comforter w/matching 
sheets, curtains, valances and 
double traverse rod; king size 
comforter and curtains; Graco 
infant seat, like new, 
bathinette/ dressing table; 
walker, swing; Brownie and 
Girl Scout items, Barbie doll 
house and Barbie items; toys , 
games; antiques; Kirby vac; 
W.B. humidifiers; electric fans; 
new car cassette tape player; 
Home Interiors; x-mas items; 
new country crafts including 
grapevine wreaths; 4’ 8’ w 
patio door; 4’x5’6” casement 
window; 2 girls - like new 20” 
bikes; 13' fiberglass boat w/10 
h.p. motor; air and water filters, 
household misc. and more 
items too numerous to men­
tion. Everything priced to sell! 
If we don’t have it, ask for it! 
8589 & 8654 N. Salisbury, 2 
1/2 miles east of Hwy. 45 on 
Hwy. H, left on Salisbury; 1 1/2 
miles west of Hwy. 144 on 
Hwy. H, right on Salisbury. 
Watch for signs! Rain or 
Shine!5-11-1p

DECORATIVE LANDSCAP­
ING STONE - Call 533- 
5336. 5-11-8pc

FOR SALE - 93 Ford Escort 
GT - excellent condition, air, 
AM-FM cassette stereo, moon 
roof, white in color, 21,000 
miles, $8,800. Phone 338- 
0886.5-11-H

FOR SALE - 1990 Plymouth 
Voyager GL, full loaded. High 
mileage. $5,500.00. Call 626- 
4638.5-11-2p

EXPERIENCED 
SCREEN PRESS OPERATORS

Due to increased business Serigraph Inc. has immediate full-time 
openings for experienced Screen Printing Press Operators. We cur­
rently have multiple openings on 2nd and 3rd shift.

Serigraph is one of the nation's top 100 printing companies. If you 
have been searching for a progressive company that consistently 
experiences tremendous growth and actively facilitates its employ­
ees' professional growth look no further.

We offer a competitive wage and benefits package including profit 
sharing and 401K. Stop in and fill out an application today at:

SERIGRAPH INC
1859 E. DECORAH RD.
WEST BEND,WI 53095

Equal Opportunity Employer M/F/V/H
Serigraph conducts pre-employment drug tests

■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■■•,——*"^B™

FOR SALE - 1989 18 1/2’ 
Regal boat with 175 h.p.
Mercury inboard, excellent 
condition, $9,800.00. Call 533- 
4636. 5-11 -tf

FOR SALE - Box spring, pil­
low top mattress, one frame 
and headboard in excellent 
condition, $125.00 or best 
offer. 626-4712. 5-11-1t

FOR SALE - 1976 Evinrude 
outboard motor, 2 h.p., 
$175.00.626-2485. 5-11-1p

FOR SALE - Wedding dress 
size 12. Call after 6 p.m. 626- 
2096. 5-11-W 
RESIDENTIAL - Building lots 
for sale. Approximately four 
miles north of West Bend. 
Terms: Call 334-7306. 
Broker/Owner.____  9-30 tf

MORAINE CONDOMINIUM, 2 
bedroom handicap unit, 1 1/2 
baths, 1330 sq. ft., 2 car 
garage, great location, 
$71,900. Reilly Realtors, 533- 
4800.3-23-tf

FOR SALE - 80 acres of 
prime deer hunting land in 
northern Wisconsin approxi­
mately 25 miles northwest of 
Antigo in Langlade County 
offer at $35,000.00. JACO 
Development, Broker. 334- 
7306.2-9-tf
FOR SALE - Sears air condi­
tioner, 220 voltage. Call 626- 
4565. 4-13-tf

FOR SALE - Pony cart with 
harness. Make an offer. Call 
626-4402, after 4, 4-27-tf

FOR SALE - 1994 Ford 
Tempo, 1 1,000 miles. Call 
after 5:30. 533-5442. 5-11-11

HELP WANTED
CHILD CARE NEEDED for 6 
and 8 year old, during the 
summer months. Call after 6 
p.m. 626-2096.5-11-1)

HELP WANTED - Part-time 
for outdoor work in wooded 
and open land. Chain saw, 
etc., provided. 312-787-9567 
or 626-4878.5-11-3p

HELP WANTED - Finance 
company looking for reliable 
people who have had some 
office experience and are com­
puter friendly. Full or part-time 
positions in our accounts 
receivable collection depart­
ment. Benefits for full-time. 
Call 334-1037. 5-11-21

HELP WANTED - Dishwasher 
/ kitchen help, McDonald’s 
Tavern. 626-2055, 5-11 -tf

HOUSEKEEPER JANITORS: 
Help us get the schools ready 
for fall classes. Start June 5 
and finish August 25, 1995. 
Excellent salary - $5.80 per 
hour. Applications are avail­
able at the Kewaskum High 
School office.5-11-2t

WANTED - Teen for occa­
sional babysitting. Call Chris at 
338-6275.___ 5-11-1p

HELP WANTED - Farm help 
needed, full-time. Milking A.M., 
chores and fieldwork. Call 994- 
4722.4-20-4p

WAITRESS/BARTENDER 
WANTED - Will train. Call 
533-4471 after 10 a.m. The 
Sandpiper Inn.5-4-1tc 
NURSING ASSISTANTS - 
Part-time, second and third 
shifts. Call St. Joseph's 
Convent, Campbellsport, 533- 
8351.5-4-2t

HELP WANTED - Person for 
summer yard work and lawn 
mowing. Must have your own 
mower. 626-4313. 5-5-tf
ARE YOU LOOKING for a part 
time job? Work from approx. 
6:15 to 9:15 a.m. and 2:15 to 
4:45 p.m. We offer - 
Babysitting availability, Health 
Insurance, Bonus and Paid 
Training. Come join our team. 
Stop by at Johnson School 
Bus, 3618 Hwy. 28 - 
Kewaskum or call for info - 
626-4414, 7:00 a.m. - 3:00 
p.m. 10-20-tf

FOR RENT
FOR RENT - Garage w/open- 
er on Elm Street, Kewaskum. 
$40.00.626-2491. 5-11-tf

EDEN - Deluxe 2 bdr. apart­
ment, all appliances, cable 
ready, washer-dryer, garage. 
$550 per month. Ph. 477-4561 
or 477-4793. _____ 5-11-tf

WANTED TO RENT -- 2-3 
Bedroom home, country pre­
ferred, 2 adults w/dog & cat. 
Extra deposit O.K. Want to 
make Kewaskum area home. 
All equipment to take care of 
large yard. Please call 626- 
8439,5-11-2p

DID YOU 
KNOW

that smoke-free 
restaurants in 
Wisconsin now 
number over 700?

For your 
FREE 
GUIDE 

to these restaurants 
that care about 

the health of 
all of us...

DELUXE TWO BEDROOM 
apartment in Kewaskum. 
Appliances included. Call 626- 
4321 or 626-2653. 1-28-tf

FOR RENT - Office space for 
rent. 1040 Fond du Lac Ave., 
Kew. Call 626-4616. 5-26-tf

RUSTIC TIMBERS ONE, 
TWO A THREE BEDROOM 
APARTMENTS and TOWN­
HOUSES up to 1,500 sq. ft., 
fireplace, appliances, dish­
washer, garage, full size wash­
er & dryer, 1 1/2 baths, huge 
bedrooms, cathedral ceilings 
and ceiling fans, blinds, walk-in 
closets, sound proofing, & 
energy efficient pkg., patio, 
central air, sewer & water,soft 
water included, real oak trim & 
granite stone work. Quiet fami­
ly atmosphere, next to mall 
and bypass. Cleanest and 
most desirable units in 
Washington County. No dogs. 
$450 - $700. 626-8400. 3-16-tf
FOR RENT -- 2+ bedroom 
apartment. Includes stove and 
refrigerator. No Pets. Phone 
626-4929,5-11-2p

FOR RENT — Kewaskum 3 
bedroom upper duplex, sepa­
rate utilities, stove and refriger­
ator attached garage w/open- 
er. No pets. 5575.00. 626- 
2491.______________ 5-11-tf

SERVICES
BICYCLES - Sales and
Service Wally's Bike Shop, 208 
North Ave., Kew. 4-30-tf 
TIRES - There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan's Service. 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 626- 
2888. ___________ 4-30-tf
TOM CLARK’S TREE SER­
VICE and STUMP REMOVAL 
— Free estimates, reasonable 
rates, insured. Phone 626- 
2513. 4-610 10-26

MOM TO DO BABYSITTING - 
- For summer or anytime days. 
My home Hwy. 28 W, non- 
smoker. Call 626-8833. 5-4-2p

Auk fur Ann Enright

Happy Mother's (Day

«E,<\
2395 W. Washington SL, West Bend 

HOME: 692-2607 OFFICE 334-5589

DAZZLING COLONIAl Kewaskum Schools. Auburn 
taxes Tastefully decorating throughout New siding 
trim, shingles, new floor coverings and many more 
iodates designed for a family who enjoys being home 
family room with cozy natural fireplace, formal dining 
room, country kitchen, 4 spacious bedrooms Bargain 
priced at $ 156,900 K01. Cull Ann to ft thn homt

PRICE REDUCED! $154 900 Sunset I stales 1700 sq ft of exciting living Exultant floor plan Great 
room concept, marble faced fireplace, oak cabinets, vaulted scissors ceding. 3 large bedrooms, master 
bath has whirlpool Open stair to basement Many more amenities Call Ann for a showing M6oe

SUNSET ESTATES
Village of Kewaskum’s Newest development 

Single family home sites

PHASE I 76 jr 142 - $22,900
80 x 142 - $23,900 89 * 142 • $24,900

PHASE II
Large beautiful lots Some border proposed pond

$23,900 to $34,900
Call Ann for a plat plan 1300 sq ft minimum

Country Reflect ions Condominiums of Kewaskum
HURRY ONLY 3 UNITS LEFT Taking offers on next building

• Lurury ? bedroom unis, ? baths
•Gas fumace/central air
• Deluxe kitchen with appliances
• In-unfl laundry
• Garages and parking

Beautiful view of Kettle Moraine His
IBM Plaata aah for Ann

Call Collect - ANN ENRIGHT 692-2607

ATTENTION EARLY MORN­
ING RISERS - The Toning 
Shoppe in Kewaskum has new 
summer hours: Mon., Wed., 
and Fri. 5:00 a.m. to 9 p.m.; 
Tues and Thurs., 7 a.m. to 9 
p.m.; Sat. 7 a m. to noon; and 
Sun. Closed. Get in shape for 
the summer. 626-4936. 5-11-11

TUTORING, using a multi-sen­
sory phonetic approach geared 
to dyslexics. Helpful for any­
one with problems in language 
skills. Testing available if 
desired. 533-8038.5-11 -3p

SUMMER TUTORING in 
Reading, Spelling, Writing, 
Phonics, Math. K-4 preferred. 
533-8038.5-11-3p

DRIVEWAYS GRADED - 
Free estimates. Sand, stone, 
red granite, top soil delivered, 
small loads a specialty. A 
GRADE ABOVE, call 334- 
9558. 5-5-4p

MISC.
LOST DOG — German 
Shepherd female, black and 
tan, 1 year to 1 1/2 years old, 
Tasha wearing brown collar. If 
seen or found please call 626- 
4924. Reward. 5-11-1t

HELP WANTED 
Certified Nurses 

Aide
Call for shift availability 
Every other weekend 

5 am-1pm
CONTACT:

Joan Eippert RN-DON
626-4258 or 994-4717
Beechwood Rest Home 

N1495W Hwy. A 
Kewaskum, W1 53040
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Village Board 
Meeting Minutes

Mid-Monthly Meeting 
April 17,1995 
8:00 p.m.

The Village Board of 
Kewaskum, Washington County, 
Wisconsin, met in Mid-Monthly 
Session in the Council Room of 
the Municipal Building, 204 
First Street,

President Robert Wagner 
presided. All Trustee Members 
were present. A quorum was 
present.

The meeting was opened 
with a Moment of Silence and 
Pledge of Allegiance.

On a motion by Trustee 
Robert Stoltzmann, seconded by 
Trustee Robert Beisbier and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the minutes of the April 3, 
1995 meeting were approved as 
printed.

Mr. John Knepel of the 
accounting firm of Conley 
McDonald Certified Public 
Accountants & Consultants was 
present to review and answer 
questions on the latest audit pre­
pared for the Village of 
Kewaskum for year ending 
December 31, 1994. Mr. Knepel 
explained the entire audit and 
financial statements regarding 
the General Fund and Utilities 
audit and associated financial 
statements. The audit revealed 
the Village to be in a healthy 
financial position.

It was further noted that the 
General Fund ended with a posi­
tive balance. The Water Utility 
reflected a rate of return equal to 
a 1.34% and that the Public 
Service Commission had autho­
rized a 6% rate of return. It was 
noted that the Public Service 
Commission had completed their 
finding on an adjustment and the 
Village Board had acted affir­
matively on approving a rate 
adjustment effective for the 2nd 
quarter of 1995 and that the new 
rate of return is 8.25%, The 
Sewer Utility reflected a rate of 
return equal to 3.38%, .62% less 
than last year. It was noted that 
the T1F District and Debt, if all 
goes as currently projected, will 
be paid off approximately four 
years caily. The Village's overall 
debt is at 41% of what the law 
provides.

Trustee David Goeden 
asked Mr. Knepel if he had any 
thoughts regarding impact fees. 
He said they were the rage, but 
advised that if not done correctly 
would be more of a problem. 
One community he deals with 
had to refund the bulk of the 
money collected and that exten­
sive engineering work is needed 
to put together a sound and rea­
sonable fee. He indicated the 
legislation regarding impact fees 
is relatively new and it will take 
a while to see problems re­
solved.

Mr. Knepel thanked the 
staff for their assistance and 
good records. He further indicat­
ed the Administrator and Deputy 
Clerk do an excellent job on 
maintaining good records and 
control over spending, etc.

President Robert Wagner 
thanked Mr. Knepel and also 
thanked the Administrator and 
Staff for continuing to do an out­
standing job.

A public hearing was held 
on the passage of Resolution No. 
95-5, A Resolution Discontin­
uing and Vacating a Portion of 
Highland Avenue, which was 
introduced on March 6, 1995. 
No comments either pro or con 
were heard. On a motion by 
Trustee Charles Waala, second­

ed by Trustee William Kulas and

carried by the majority roll call 
vote, the Board closed the public 
hearing. Roll call vote was 7 
"Aye" 0 "Nay" 0 "Absent."

A public hearing was held 
on the application of the 
Kwaskum Athletic Club, KKCP 
for a Class "B" Fermented Malt 
Beverage License for the period 
commencing April 18, 1995 and 
ending October 17, 1995. On a 
motion by Trustee William 
Kulas, seconded by Trustee 
Robert Beisbier and carried by 
the majority roll call vote, the 
Board closed the public hearing. 
Roll call vote was 7 "Aye" 0 
"Nay" 0 "Absent."

Assistant Fire Chief Mark 
Herriges presented the March, 
1995 monthly report: Fire calls - 
3, Year to dale - 6; Jaws of Life - 
1, Year to date - 7; Rescue calls 
- 16, Year to date —; Training - 
262, Year to date - 610; Extra 
training - 95, Year to date - 
326.15.

Assistant Fire Chief Mark 
Herriges shared information 
regarding the specs and estimat­
ed cost for the proposed new 
tank truck with the Board. 
Further investigation and a refin­
ing of the specs will take place 
and brought back to the Board

Chief of Police Richard L. 
Knoebel, March 1995 monthly 
report: Criminal arrests - 35, 
Criminal investigations - 52; 
Traffic warnings - 144, Traffic 
citations - 34; Adult arrests - 20, 
Juvenile arrests - 24; Property 
stolen - $824, Property recov­
ered • $85; Parking warnings - 
24, Parking tags - 50.

Director of Public Works, 
Jerry Gilles reviewed the follow­
ing with the Board:

I) The annual water sam­
ples required by the DNR are in 
the process of being taken.

2) The hydrant flushing is 
scheduled for Wednesday and 
Thursday of this week.

3) The new roof at the 
KKCP is completed and the 
painting will be accomplished 
soon.

4) The seven replacement 
light poles have been completed 
on Fond du Lac Avenue and the 
southerly new concrete poles 
have been installed on ,Fond du 
Lac Avenue and may be ener­
gized in about a week.

On a motion by Trustee 
Robert Beisbier, seconded by 
Trustee Charles Waala and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board approved the hir­
ing of the DPW and WPC sum­
mer part time employees as list­
ed.

Trustee William Kulas 
reported that the U.S. Flag is 
scheduled to be put up and taken 
down several times within a 
short period of time and he 
would recommend that they be 
flown from May 26 through July 
10. 1995. This would include 
Memorial Day, The Village of 
Kewaskum's Centennial, July 
4th and the Firemen/Legion 
Picnic. On a motion by Trustee 
Charles Waala, seconded by 
Trustee William Kulas and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board directed that Old 
Glory remain flying during the 
period of the aforementioned 
holidays.

Administrator Daniel S. 
Schmidt reviewed the following 
with the Board:

1) Reviewed the building 
permits through March 31, 1995.

2) Reviewed League and 
Taxpayer bulletins.

3) Reminded the Board of 
the Spring cleanup scheduled for 
April 22, 1995.

4) Reviewed Senate Bill 
111 changing the dates for the 
Presidential year elections.

5) Reviewed exposures on 
Old Fond du I^c Road in refer­
ence to the railroad signal

req uest/pe tition.
6) Reminded the Board of 

the Committee, Commission and 
Board appointments for May 1, 
1995.

7) Reviewed the letter 
received from Kemp/Marigold 
Foods, Inc. regarding the closing 
of the Kewaskum plant effective 
June 24,1995.

Chairman of the Park and 
Recreation Committee, Charles 
Waala reviewed the following:

1) Request of the Ke­
waskum Athletic Club to make a 
5 year commitment to Coke so 
as to have an electric scoreboard 
placed on the SW diamond. The 
Committee was in favor of the 
idea but needed a few questions 
answered. Ron Theusch will 
review these questions with 
Coke and report back to the 
Board.

2) The committee recom­
mended providing $1,000 finan­
cial assistance to the Fire 
Department for the RHP volley­
ball court. On a motion by 
Trustee Robert Beisbier, second­
ed by Trustee William Kulas and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board authorized the 
$1,000 volleyball court assis­
tance. It was noted the net would 
remain up during the recreation 
season for everyone to enjoy.

3) The committee recom­
mended the hiring of summer 
part-time employees for the 
Summer Recreation Program. 
On a motion by Trustee Robert 
Stoltzmann, seconded by Trustee 
John Borland and unanimously 
carried by voice vote, the Board 
approved the hiring of the 
Summer part-time recreation 
employees as listed.

Board Representative for 
the Plan Commission, Trustee 
David Goeden informed the 
Board of a Plan Commission 
meeting scheduled for April 26, 
1995 at 7:00 p.m.

Trustee Robert Stoltzmann 
reported that at the last Mid­
Moraine Municipal Association 
legislative Committee Meeting 
they discussed the VALUE pro­
gram. Trustee Stoltzmann 
informed the Board that the 
Village already uses the program 
and realizes substantial savings 
but that the organizers were hop­
ing to make the program easier 
to use for small purchases, etc.

On a motion by Trustee 
Robert Stoltzmann, seconded by 
Trustee John Borland and car­
ried by the majority voice vote, 
the Board authorized the open 
cutting of Edgewood Road for 
the estimated five water and 
sewer laterals due to the DNR 
and Army Corp not allowing the 
extension of both North and 
Forest Avenues. The permission 
to open cut was based on the 
saw cutting of the street, slurry 
back filling with a hot mix 
patch and followed with an 
overall heat patch to blend the 
area. Trustee David Goeden and 
Trustee Charles Waala voting 
"Nay."

On a motion by Trustee 
William Kulas, seconded by 
Trustee Robert Stoltzmann and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board accepted the 
audit report as prepared and pre­
sented for the year ending 
December 31, 1994.

On a motion by Trustee 
Robert Beisbier, seconded by 
Trustee Robert Stoltzmann and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board authorized the 
signing of a three year agree­
ment for accounting/auditing 
service from Conley McDonald 
Certified Public Accountants & 
Consultants. The agreement 
reflects the cost of living 
increase annually. That being 
from 3.8% to 4.2%.

Action was taken on 
Resolution No. 95-11, A

Resolution Regarding Overdrafts 
on Accounts Year Ending 
December 31, 1994 as attached 
hereto:

Action was taken on 
Resolution No. 95-12, A 
Resolution Regarding Surplus 
on Outlay Accounts Year 
Ending December 31, 1994 as 
attached hereto:

Action was taken on 
Resolution No. 95-5, A 
Resolution Discontinuing and 
Vacating A Portion of Highland 
Avenue and as heard at public 
hearing April 17, 1995 as 
attached hereto:

The CSM for RTKM, 
LLC. was not received and was 
tabled.

The Conditional Use Pcr- 
mit/Planned Unit Development 
Agreement for RTKM LLC was 
discussed and it was brought to 
the Board's attention they 
wished to construct the three 
buildings in a timed manner 
which would reflect accomplish­
ing the improvements over a 
period of time versus by occu­
pancy permit issuance. 
Discussion was also held regard­
ing the placement of sidewalk 
and the resurfacing of a portion 
of Stark Street and Highland 
Avenue. Further discussion will 
take place at the Plan Commis­
sion meeting April 26, 1995.

On a motion by Trustee 
Charles Waala, seconded by 
Trustee John Borland and car­
ried by the majority roll call 
vote, the Board authorized the 
issuance of the Class ”B" 
Fermented Malt Beverage 
License for the Kewaskum 
Athletic Club, KKCP, for the 
period commencing April 18, 
1995 and ending October 17, 
1995 upon payment of proper 
fees and as heard at public hear­
ing. Roll call vote was 7 "Aye" 0 
"Nay" 0 "Absent."

On a motion by Trustee 
Robert Beisbier, seconded by 
Trustee Robert Stoltzmann and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board approved the 
appointment of Ronald Theusch 
as the agent for the aforemen­
tioned Class "B."

Review of the Intergovern­
mental Contract to be entered 
into with the Kewaskum School 
District as previously discussed 
with the School Board took 
place. On a motion by Trustee 
David Goeden, seconded by 
Trustee John Borland and car­
ried by the majority voice vote, 
the Board indicated paragraph 5, 
page 2, should reflect the 
Kewaskum School District pay­
ing for 100% of the cost for said 
sidewalk installation. President 
Robert Wagner voting "Nay."

Further discussion pursued 
regarding the width of the side­
walk. The main concern was that 
the ADA requires a 60" wide 
sidewalk at least every 200' for 
wheelchair passing. On a motion 
by Trustee William Kulas, sec­
onded by Trustee Robert 
Stoltzmann and carried by the 
majority voice vote, the Board 
directed that 5 foot wide side­
walks be installed rather than 
four foot wide sidewalks 
because of the ADA rules and 
regulations. It was felt it would 
look better and be easier to 
maintain. Trustee Charles 
Waala, Trustee Robert Beisbier 
and President Robert Wagner 
voted "Nay." The Administrator 
is to have the Contract redrafted 
reflecting the noted changes.

On a motion by Trustee 
John Borland, seconded by 
Trustee William Kulas and car­
ried by the majority voice vote, 
the Board established the posi­
tion of General Maintenance 
Lead Worker within the 
Department of Public Works 
with a job description for said 
position. Trustee David Goeden

and Trustee Charles Waala vot­
ing "Nay."

The Board reviewed the 
pay scheduled as proposed for 
the newly created position. On a 
motion by Trustee William 
Kulas, seconded by Trustee 
Robert Beisbier and defeated by 
the majority voice vote, the 
Board rejected the pay schedule 
as proposed and the matter was 
sent back for further discussion. 
Trustee Charles Waala, Trustee 
David Goeden, Trustee Robert 
Stoltzmann and Trustee John 
Borland voted "Nay."

The union notification and 
posting of the aforementioned 
was tabled because of the lack of 
having a pay schedule.

Administrator Daniel S. 
Schmidt reviewed the recycling 
update report for 1994/1995. It 
was noted that the Village is in 
the third year of curbside recy­
cling and that all is going well. 
The total amount of the recy­
cling grant for 1994 is estimated 
at $17,137.79. It was also pro­
jected that the avoided disposal 
cost savings for 1994 is 
$15,117.68. This is 346.1 tons at 
$43.68 per ton.

The recycling grant for 
1995 is estimated at $17,519.00. 
It was further noted that the 
recycling grant money is sched­
uled to sunset in 1999 and basi­
cally decrease on an annual 
basis.

The contract/agreement that 
the Village of Kewaskum has 
with Hechimovich Sanitary 
Landfill is scheduled to termi­
nate on December 31, 1995. The 
contract/agreement does have an 
extension clause that simplifies 
the process slightly. The Village 
may ask the contractor to submit 
a written proposal for an addi­
tional two year period. This 
request is to be filed prior to 
September 15, 1995 and the con­
tractor has a 30 day response 
time. Then the Village reviews 
the two year extension proposal 
before a formal decision is 
made. On a motion by Trustee 
Charles Waala, seconded by 
Trustee John Borland and unani­
mously carried by voice vote, 
the Board authorized the signing 
and submission of the Final 
Payment Request Form as 
required by the DNR.

On a motion by Trustee 
Robert Beisbier, seconded by 
Trustee Robert Stoltzmann and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board authorized the 
purchasing of fireworks for the 
Centennial Celebration and July 
3rd Celebration from 'Spielbauer 
Fireworks, Green Bay, WI. 
Donations have been very good 
and number 45 to date. The June 
10th display will be the largest 
ever in the Village at a cost of 
$5,400 and the July 3rd display 
will be the second largest ever at 
a cost of $4,300. It was noted 
that Bank Wisconsin donated 
$1,500 and was named the 
Centennial Fireworks Corporate 
sponsor. A thank you will be 
going out to all those who have 
donated money in the local 
newspaper.

Action was taken on a 
Proclamation in recognition of 
the 50th Anniversary of Regal 
Ware, Inc. as attached hereto:

It was mentioned that the 
Postmaster has asked the Village 
President to assist her with the 
planting of a tree in the park for 
Arbor Day. The Board indicated 
a thank you should be sent after 
the planting.

Representative Glen 
Grothman was present and 
addressed the Board. One topic 
was the reformulated gas issue. 
The Board will act on a resolu­
tion regarding the getting 
Washington County out of the

(Continued o n Page 23)

PA
G

E ^i T
H

U
R

SD
A

Y
, M

A
Y 11, 1995



KHS Girls Track Team 
Remains Undefeated

By Melissa Rohrer

Fhe Kewaskum girls 
track team kept their unde­
feated outdoor season alive 
by winning the New Holstein 
Relays last Wednesday.

Kewaskum edged out 
Valders, winning by one 
point (68-67), while host 
New Holstein finished third 
(64), followed by Plymouth 
(56) and Kiel (29). The 
Indians were returning, after 
not participating in the meet 
since 1990.

"It is one of two meets 
my teams have not won until 
now," (the other one being 
the Conference Frosh/Soph 
Meet), "so winning today has 
some special meaning to me 
personally," said Head Coach 
Perry Koth after hearing the 
final results. The closest the 
Indians had come prior to 
Wednesday's meet, was in 
1990 when they finished sec­
ond.

Kewaskum was led by 
the high jumping group of 
Jessica Repovsch (4'10"), her 
personal best; Sarah Bausch 
(4'10"), and Kelly Schreffler 
(5'0") for a total of 14'8". The 
talented trio broke the meet 
record (14'4") which was 
held by five teams, including 
a Kewaskum team of Pam 
Osterbrink, Ingrid Ankcrson, 
and Andrea Heiss (1990).

When asked about his 
jumpers, Koth said, "The 
girls have been improving 
each week. Jessica and Sarah 
are both freshmen and Kelly 
is only a junior, so we are 
going to have some very 
good jumpers for awhile." 
Koth went on to say, "We 
actually have four quality 
high jumpers this year, Jamie 
Gaffke (sophomore) can also 
jump real well, but has been 
out with a sprained ankle. 
Keith Amundson has been 
doing an excellent job for 
years with the jumpers and 
he is showing his stuff again 
this year."

Another place where the 
future looks bright is in the 
shot and discus events. 
Kewaskum took first place in 
both events led by Becky 
Yogerst, Katie Yogcrst and 
Rachel Nysse. "Both Rachel 
and Katie arc sophomores 
and have been throwing very 
well each week," stated Koth, 
"and Becky is solid. I depend 
on her leadership."

Greta Kuphal, Jenny 
Strobel, Erin Stockhausen 
and Jenny Jagielski com­
bined for a first in the 800m 
relay and a second in the 
400m relay. "Our handoffs in

^SANITATION SERVICE^
• SEPTIC TANK

• HOLDING TANK CLEANING
• SEPTIC SYSTEM INSPECTIONS

FOR BUYING OR SELLING A HOME

ELLIE’S SANITATION 
SERVICE

626-4848
(MPRS#273I)

the 400m relay were awful, 
but we still managed a sec­
ond place, so I can't complain 
too much," said Koth about 
his two normal relays. Koth 
added, "Our times are not 
great yet, but we seem to be 
ahead of everyone else, so 1 
guess we will be OK when 
we need to be."

In the 3 x 100m high 
hurdle event, the girls, led by 
state qualifier Mary Yahr, 
along with freshman Joanne 
Thull, and sophomore Jenny 
Keller (who was running the 
hurdles for the first time 
since last year), managed to 
finish second to winner 
Valders. While in the 3 x 
300m low hurdles, Yahr 
along with freshman Carrie 
Wiesner and fellow senior 
Missy Rohrer, again captured 
a second place. Rohrer, who, 
according to coach Koth, has 
not worked on hurdles since 
her freshman year, ran a 
respectable 56, while Wies­
ner and Yahr ran 55 and 54.

In the distance medley, 
Laura Weiss, Greta Kuphal, 
Jenny Jagielski and Marni 
Lynn stole first place from 
New Holstein, who tradition­
ally wins this event. This race 
matched up two of the better 
distance runners in the con­
ference, Marni Lynn of 
Kewaskum and Sheila Kabal 
of New Holstein (both have 
been slate qualifiers).

"When they both 
received the baton along side 
each other, you knew it was 
going to be a great finish!" 
said Koth. Both runners ran
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stride for stride for the first 
500 meters, but then on the 
back stretch Lynn began to 
pull away from Kabat to fin­
ish 15-20 meters ahead.

"Marni knew who she 
was running against and her 
competitiveness took over. 
She worked very hard in 
practice last night so I was 
surprised how strong she 
looked tonight, I didn't 
expect that," said Koth.

According to Koth, 
Jamie Gaffke ran her leg of 
the 1600m relay in a personal 
best lime of 63.1 seconds 
while Julie Froemming ran a 
66.6 despite running with a 
slight muscle pull.

Other places and partici­
pants were: 480m relay 
(Marni Lynn, Missy Rohrer 
and Jenny Immel) fourth; 
Sprint Medley (Mary Yahr, 
Jenny Strobel, Erin Stock­
hausen Carrie Wiesner third; 
Long Jump (Erin Stock­
hausen, Carrie Wiesner and 
Jill Wichtowski) fifth; Triple 
Jump (Nadalie Reindl, Kathy 
Deshole Is and Missy Rohrer) 
fifth; 1600m relay (Julie 
Froemming, Tracy Jacak, 
Jamie Gaffke and Laura 
Weiss) fourth.

"It was a team win. 
Anybody who scored a point 
for us can honestly say that 
they helped win that meet for 
* It doesn't get any better 
th*, that," said coach Koth 
abou ‘he team's victory.
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Wietor Hits Ace

Cy Wietor of Kewaskum last Friday accom­
plished something that most lifetime golfers only 
dream about. While golfing with Clayton Stautz, Bob 
Scannell and J.C. Weinberger at Hon-E-Kor Country 
Club in the morning, Cy hit a hole-in-one on number 
14. He teed off with a number seven iron on the 129 
yard, par 3 hole, and was ecstatic to see it go into the 
hole on the first shot. Congratulations Cy, on achiev­
ing every golfer’s dream!

Village Board
Continued 

contaiment area The State bud­
get was also discussed briefly.

On a motion by Trustee 
John Borland, seconded by 
Trustee Robert Stoltzmann and 
carried by the majority mil call 
vole, to adjourn to closed session 
under Chapter 19.85(1 Xc) of the 
statutes to consider employment,

FREE 
Domino's 

Pizza
TO QUALIFIED APPLICANTS!

Full time 
2nd & 3rd 

shift openings
Interviews held Mon. - Fri. 8am - 2pm.

Sundance Photo
Industrial Drive, Jackson, Wl 53037 

677-2233
Join the Sundance team and be part of the 
4th largest photo finishing plant in America.

compensation and performance 
of public employees over which 
the governmental body has juris­
diction. Roll call vote was 7 
"Aye" 0 "Nay" 0 "Absent."

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator 

Approved 05-01-95 
Pub (KS.) 05 11-95



Indian Girls Lose One, Win 
One, Drop Double Header

By Tom Menger

The Kewaskum Girls 
Varsity fastpitch softball 
team had a busy schedule last, 
week, playing four games in 
as many days.

The girls started off the 
week by traveling to New 
Holstein to face the Huskies. 
Kewaskum gave up four runs 
early, while Huskie pitcher 
Becky Haensgen held the 
Indians hitless through the 
third inning. Tanya Krahn 
collected the Kewaskum's 
first hit, a double in the 
fourth.

After stealing third, 
Krahn scored on a ground 
out. Later in the inning, 
Shelly Williams reached on a 
fielder's choice and scored on 
a base hit by Tiffany 
I .aubach.

New Holstein added a 
run in the bottom of the fifth 
and held Kewaskum score­
less the rest of the way, mak­
ing it a 5-2 Huskie victory. 
Michelle Ihull picked up the 
loss for Kewaskum, striking 
out one, and walking three in 
six innings of work. I .aubach 
and Williams led the Indians 
at the plate, each collecting 
two hits in three at-bats.

At home on Tuesday, 
Kewaskum hammered Elk­
hart Lake, scoring 15 runs in 
just three innings, enroute to 
a 15-5 decision.

Ihe host Indians sent all 
nine batters to the plate in the 
first inning, scoring six limes. 
Tanya Krahn, Debbie Neu­
mann, Misty Luedtke, Mi­
chelle Thull, Molly Cech-

vala, and Stacy Gavin all 
scored in the inning, which 
was highlighted when Gavin 
hit a two-run double.

The Indians chalked up 
another run in the second 
inning, before exploding for 
eight runs in the third. 
Cechvala started the bom­
bardment with a triple, laler 
scoring on a passed ball.

Kewaskum then loaded 
the bases on two errors and a 
single by Kori Ritz, and a 
walk, coupled with an 
Elkhart Lake error gave the 
Indians two more runs. With 
no one out and the bases still 
loaded, Neumann smacked a 
three-run single, making the 
score 13-3 in Kewaskum’s 
favor. The girls weren't done
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scoring yet, adding two more 
runs before the inning was 
over.

Elkhart Lake squeezed in 
two runs in the fourth inning, 
but was shut out in the fifth, 
and Kewaskum picked up the 
win via the ten-run mercy 
rule, 15-5.

After having Wednesday 
off, the Lady Indians headed 
to Kiel for a double header.

"The errors killed us," 
coach Janet Molcbash said of 
her team, which committed 
13 errors in a wild game and 
lost 17-7 in six innings. 
Kewaskum actually led the 
game 3-2 after the first 
inning, but Kiel scored six 
times in the second and never 
looked back.

Tanya Krahn, Debbie 
Neumann and Stacy Gavin 
were the leading hitters for 
Kewaskum, going 3x3, 3x4 
and 2x2 respectively.

The Indians played host 
in the second game, and only 
committed two errors, but the 
result was the same, as they 
dropped the game, 11-4.

Kewaskum, down 2-0 
early, scored twice in the 
third to tie the game, only to 
see Kiel score four times in 
the fourth inning to regain 
the lead.

Kewaskum chipped 
away al the Kiel lead, cutting 
it to just two runs going into 
the seventh inning, but Kiel 
spoiled the comeback by 
scoring five times in the last 
inning.

Shelly Williams (2x3) 
and Kris Hafermann (2x3) 
led Kewaskum at the plate, as 
the Indians record fell to 2-6, 
3-8 overall.

TIMJVKYVU
I would like to thank 

everyone who helped me 
with their prayers, visits, 
flowers, cards, and get well 
wishes while I was a patient 
at St. Joseph's Hospital, and 
while I was recuperating at 
home. Special thanks to 
Father Zens, Father Nick, 
Deacon Horner, Rev. B. 
Hoehner, and Vicar S. Asmus 
for their visits and prayers. 
Special thanks to my family 
for the help they gave me at 
the hospital and at home. 
Thanks to the neighbors for 
always being there to help.

God Bless you All 
Roman Loof
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