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Breakfast on the Dornacker Farm KHS Commencement Held

Ry Sharon Callaway Roznik

The Washington County 
Dairy Promotion Committee 
invites everyone to their 7th 
annual "Breakfast on the Farm", 
hosted this year at Dornacker 
Prairie Acres the homes of Ixo 
and Pat Dornacker, and Ralph 
and Arleen Dornacker, and their 
families.

Join them for an all-you-can 
eat pancake breakfast on 
Saturday, June 12, from 6:30 
a.m. to 11:30 a.m. at 5047 
Cedarview Rd., West Bend, for 
only $3.50 (Children under five 
eat free!)

The farm has been in the 
Dornacker family for 130 years. 
Leo and Ralph's great grandfa­
ther originally started farming 
here in 1863 after coming to the 
United States from Germany. 
Leo and Ralph purchased the 
farm from their parents, George 
and Eleanor, 20 years ago. Their 
parents have been a great help to 
them throughout the years, lend­
ing a helping hand whenever 
needed.

The family owns 240 acres 
and rents an additional 360 
acres. They raise corn, alfalfa, 
soybeans, wheat and oats.The 
crops are used to feed the 230 
head of cattle on the farm. Crops 
not used as feed are sold for 
cash. There are about 100 
Holstein milk cows, 40 steers, 
and 90 replacement heifers on 
the farm. The Dornackers use a 
milking parlor, computerized 
feeding system, and Slurrystore 
as part of their herd manage­
ment.

Leo and Pat were married 
in 1963 and have two sons. Joel 
is married to Patti and has two 
sons, David and Benjamin. Joel 
is employed at Ram Tool, 
Cedarburg as a tool and die

Statesman Photo by Sharon 
maker. Jon works as a semi­
truck driver for Karavan Trailers 
of I lartford.

Ralph and Arleen were 
married in 1973 and live in the 
original farm house. They have 
four children. Lori will be 
attending UW Oshkosh this fall, 
where she will be in her second 
year of college, majoring in psy­
chology and Spanish. Bonnie 
plans to attend Mount Mary 
College in fall and begin her 
studies to become an occupa­
tional therapist. Allen will be a 
freshman in high school and 
enjoys helping on the farm. 
Cindy, the youngest daughter, 
will be 6 years old in fall.

The Dornacker family takes 
pride in helping to produce pure 
and whole some dairy products
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like those you'll be able to enjoy 
at Breakfast on the Fann.

Ralph Dornacker is also 
Supervisor for the town of 
Addison, and Leo is on the 
Planning Commission for the 
town of Addison, as well as 
Vice President of Dairy 
Promotions.

Both brothers enjoy the 
Knight of Columbus, die Lions, 
Farm Bureau, the Moose, the 
Fann union, along with church 
activities. Ralph is a dealer of 
Blaney seed.

Their wives keep the farm 
running with recordkeeping 
abilities - Arleen prognuns the 
production records on her busi­
ness computer, an essential part 
of the milk industry in tenns of

(Continued on Page 2)

The Kewaskum Community 
High School commencement for 
the Senior Class of 1993 was 
held Friday, May 28. The exer­
cise began at 8:00 p.m. with the 
"Pomp and Circumstance'' pro­
cessional by the Kewaskum 
Symphonic Band.

The concert choir sang 
"Wings," followed by die gradu­
ation speaker Jenefer 
VanAssche.

Three students, Carrie 
Fellenz, Julie Mertz and Daniel 
Schulteis, shared the distinction 
of being class valedictorian with 
perfect 4.0 grade points while 
James Rix was the salutatorian.

The farewell address was 
given by international student 
speakers David Antequera 
Garcia, and Eero Partanen, 
Class Resident Tim Lettow pre­
sented the class gift and the 
closing reflections were present­
ed by Melissa LeRoy.

Diplomas were presented 
by School Board Members Neal 
Weare and Ray Engelking.

The graduates chose purple 
and teal as their class colors, the 
rose as the class flower, and 
their song was "Where You 
fining Now."

The graduating class fol­
lows:

Class of 1993
Jennifer M. Albrecht, David 

Antequera Garcia, Thomas 
Donald Bauer, Kate Gertrude 
Berres, Bryan Daniel Beske, 
Chad Michael Bindrich. Ryan 
Victor Boegel, Sarah Elizabeth 
Brath, April Lynn Bruckert, 
Brian J. Bruendl, Eric Paul 
Bude, Douglas James Buechel, 
James Lee Butzlaff, Bekki 
Marie Byers, Loriann Michelle 
Byrnes, Anthony Paul Cardiel, 
Nicole Lynn Cayner, Mike D. 
Clune, Marvin W. Crites, Duane 
F. DeVerney, Scott P. Dietrich, 
Jeffrey Ryan Dirmeier, Scott 
Alan Donath, Karyn Barbara 
Dossinger, Mark J. Dziedzic.

Scott Steven Ebert, Tanya 
Irene Eckes, Bryan Michael 
Ellefson, Lisa Mary Ermer, 
Carrie Ann Fellenz, Derek 
Michael Follmann, Kimberly 
Lee Frank, Jaclyn Sue 
Friedemann, Joseph Paul 
Gayan, Christopher Gregor 
Geidel, Jodi L. Gengler, 
Benjamin D. Giese, Heidi Lynn 
Goetsch, Carol Ann Groskopf, 
Jennifer Lynn Gundrum, Chad 
Joseph Harlow, Erin Ellen 
Heather, Jennifer Joy Heppner, 
Keith David Herman, Cooper S. 
Herning, Rachelle Lynn Hills, 
Thomas F. Hilt, Kevin E. Hinz, 
Patrick Allen Holtz, Rachel Ann 
Howell.

James J. Jaklich, Jason 
William Judnic, Amy Lorraine

Justman, Beth Ann Kempf, 
William Lee Klahn, Nathan 
Aaron Kloske, Jeffrey L. Klug, 
Anthony G. Knoeck, Heather 
Ann Koch. Nancy Anne Koch, 
Bryan J. Koerner, Kevin J. 
Kohn, Jeremy John Korneli, 
Kelly Marie Krahn, Rachelle 
Marie Krahn. Kristin Marie 
Krebs, Dean Ryan Kreis, 
Thomas R. Kuehn, Jr., Joshua 
William Kurtz, Adam James 
Laatsch, Lisa Marie Landvatter, 
Richard Michael Larson. 
Melissa Kay LeRoy. Timothy 
Joseph Lettow, David A. 
Linder.

Melissa Amber Lloyd. 
Nichol Elizabeth-Gabert 
Loomans, Sherry Lyn 
Luterbach, Joshua Michael 
Manchester, Craig A. Martin. 
Georgina Marie Martin, Sheila 
Ann Martin, James Edward 
Marx, Patrick Michael 
McFadden, II, Julie Marie 
Mertz, Jeffrey S. Miller, Renee 
Marion Miske, Mark Joseph 
Morell, Todd Isaac 
Muckerheide, Brett L. Nordby, 
Timothy F. Novotny, Phillip 
John Olmsted, Eero M. 
Partanen, Andrea Lynn 
Pascavis, Jennifer Ann Pesch, 
Lori Ann Pesch, Jason Scott 
Petermann, Staci Marie 
Petushek, Ann Sutherland 
Pfeffer, Michael David Quinlan

Ronnie A. Radtke, David 
James Rahlf, Andrew T. 
Reichert, Kerry James Resch, 
Aaron Robert Rettler, Bradley 
C. Riekkoff, James Matthew 
Rix, William Benjamin Rochon, 
Kevin James Roesel, Charles 
Dale Roos, Kim Marie Sabish, 
Marty Marie Schlice, Yvonne 
Irene Schlice, Matthew J. 
Schlosser, Christa Ixe Schmidt 
Christopher Daniel Schmidt, 
Sandra Ann Schmidt, Dixie Lee 
Ann Schneider, Daniel Robert 
Schulteis, Lynn Marie Seii, 
Jason Allan Sharpec, Courtney 
Nicole Sparks, Debra Ann 
Steger, Jason P. Steier, Jeffrey 
C. Steinert.

Jennifer Marie Stelter, 
Kevin K. Stern, Shelley Lynn 
Sternig, Tara K. Stevens, Jason 
R. Stockinger, Kurt A. Thorn, 
Anastasia Kay Thull, Jennifer 
Leigh Thull, JeanEllcn Turner, 
Jenefer Jean VanAssche, Jeremy 
J. VanAssche, Julie Ann 
Wagner, Carrie Ann Warnecke, 
Bradley A. Weinreich, Shelly 
Anne Wenninger, Shawnee 
Marie Wesenberg, James M. 
Wichtoski, Joy Rene Wilson, 
David Donald Wink, Robyn 
Amy Winninghoff, Ronald J. 
Wolf, Jennifer Lyn Wulff, 
Casey Owens Wunsch, 
Christine Ann Yogerst, Peter R. 
Yogcrst.
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Degnitz Awarded Veterinary 
Nutrition Consultant Certification

Library Celebrates 80th Birthday!

The Kewaskum Public 
Library will be celebrating 80 
years of service Io the communi­
ty with an OPLN HOUSE on 
Eriday, June 4 from 8:00 a m 
until 6:00 p.m. There will be 
displays, refreshments and d<x»r 
prizes, ('hildren may also regis­
ter for the summer library pro­
gram "GO WILD-READ." at 
this lime.

In 1913, the Kewaskum 
Women's Club asked the village 
president for space for a library 
in the Village Hall al 203 Main 
Street. A second floor room was 
convened to a library.

Miss Lilly Schlosser was 
appointed head librarian tem­
porarily on June 3, 1913, with 
members of the Women's Club 
each taking a two-week icon as 
librarian. The first library com­
mittee included Adele 
Gollsleben, Mrs C. Hausman, 
and Edna Schmidt. By January 
of 1914, there were more than 
250 patrons registered at the 
library.

On January 31, 1914, the 
Women's Club voted to hire a 
librarian for $52.00 a year, and 
Miss Gottslcbcn was appointed 
librarian by the library board 
and later hired by the village.

By 1915 there were approx­
imately 500 books and seven 
magazine subscriptions in the 
library's collection.

The village board took the 
responsibility of governing the 
library in January 1916 by 
request from the Women's Club. 
The Women’s Club continued 
their support by having card par­
lies, lecture courses home talent 
plays, etc. In 1922-2.3 they 
redecorated the library. Most of 
their proceeds were given to the 
library in its early years and 
they continued their support 
with generous donations 
through the years.

Miss Gottslcbcn was the 
librarian until 1921. Between 
1922 and 1924, librarians were 
Mrs. E.E. Colvin and Mrs. 
Norton Koerble. In 1923, after 
10 years of operation, the library 
owned 1,244 books and 
received 11 different magazines. 
Kewaskum's population was 
800.

Mrs. Fred (Elsie) Scheif 
was librarian from 1924 until 
1964. In 1950 - 51 a new 
Municipal Building was erected 
at 204-206 First Street, which 
gave the library 1350 square feel 
of space. By that time the col­
lection had grown to more than 
3,000 books and 22 magazine 
subscriptions. The collection 
was transported to its new quar­
ters by a brigade of Girl Scouts 
Kewaskum's population was 
1,192.

Linda Borchert, who 
became a substitute in 1950, 
was appointed full-time librarian 
from 1952 until 1978. 
Evangeline Teeselink, who was 
hired as an assistant in 1969,

took over the position of direc­
tor in 1978.

In 1982, a three-phase 
building program on the 
Municipal Building was started, 
with the library addition com­
pleted in fall of 1985. The 
library increased in size by 
122%, to 2,986 square feet. The 
old furniture, shelves, etc. were 
all cleaned and reused. A new 
check-out desk, card files, mag­
azine shelves, reference area, 
study nx>m were included in the 
addition.

Assistant librarian al that 
lime was Killy Hlavaly.who 
look over as director from 
September, 1987 until October, 
1990. The next director was 
Ortrud Trapp. When she 
resigned in June of 1991, Luci 
Bledsoe became director. In 
August of 1992 when Mrs. 
Bledsoe look a position in 
Johnson Creek, the present 
director, Nancy Bauer was 
hired.

Today the library owns 
more than 14,000 books and 
more than 300 video cassettes. 
We subscribe to 64 magazines 
and 3 newspapers. Last year the 
library circulated more than 
30,000 items to its patrons. 
Children enjoy storyhours dur­
ing the scluxd year, and a spe­
cial reading program during the 
summer. The present staff 
includes director Nancy Bauer 
and library asisstants Kitty 
Hlavaty and Darlene Rohlinger. 
The library is open 34 hours per 
week to serve you! Please stop 
in and see what your library has 
to offer!*--------
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Riding Hood 
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their desire to constantly main­
tain their animals at a high rate 
of milk production.

Pat is the bookkeeper in the 
family, tieing together all the 
aspects of fanning, an organiz­
ing it as efficiently as possible. 
She also makes sure each farm 
book is kept up to date.

Some of the highlights of 
the day include: Live music 
from WTKM - Hartford and 
WBKV - West Bend, along with 
music right on the grounds. 
Don't miss the barn tours, pet­
ting zoo, hayrides, sample 
shack, and some down-home 
squared dancing. Several huge 
tents will be provided. Breakfast 
will be served rain or shine.

Speaking of breakfast, can 
they tempt your appetites with 
pancakes, sweet cream butter, 
maple syrup, sausage, grade A 
cottage cheese, fresh wholesome 
white or chocolate milk, 
Wisconsin applesauce, assorted 
cheeses, and creamy ice cream 
topped with strawberries or 
maple synip.

Tickets are available at the 
farm the day of the breakfast or 
from any Dairy Promotion 
member or by calling Jim 
Stoffel 626-244 3, Betty 
Pamperin 629-5092 or Nancy 
Degnitz 692-2376.

Join Leo, Pat, Ralph and 
Arlene for a sampling of farm 
fresh foods and old-fashioned 
fun the entire family can enjoy.

Named to Kemper 
Executive Council

Carey M. Wolf of INVEST 
Financial Corporation in West 
Bend is one of 1.000 investment 
representatives from across the 
nation to be named to the Kemper 
Executive Council. This ex­
clusive organization provides 
recognition and special sales sup­
port to high-performing invest­
ment representatives selling 
Kemper funds and annuity 

X products.
Wolf became a Kemper Ex­

ecutive Council member in 
January, 1993, and will retain the 
status and benefits for one year. 
Less than .4 percent of all invest­
ment representatives selling 
Kemper products across the 
country qualify for membership 
in the Kemper Executive Council.

Wolf has been in the financial 
services industry for 16 years.

St. Mary’s 
Preschool and Kindergarten

* b Child centered environment
• b Fully certified teachers
t b Developmental approach
* b Whole Language
* b Hands-on Math
• b Christian values

Please call for more information
or to make an appointment to visit:

St. Mary's School 
415 Roosevelt Drive 
West Bend, WI 53095 

(414) 338-5602

Jennifer Degnitz

Jennifer Degnitz a staff 
member at the Kewaskum 
Veterinary Clinic, has been 
awarded the title of Veterinary 
Nutritional Consultant.

Jenny is going to school to 
be a Veterinary Technician at 
Madison Area Technical 
College. She will be graduating 
in May of 1994. This summer 
she's doing an internship at the 
clinic, working with both large 
and small animals.

This certification signifies 
that Ms.Degnitz successfully 
completed an in-depth continu­
ing education program on 
canine and feline nutrition. To 
cam this achievement Jenny had 
to demonstrate profiency and 
knowledge of nutritional-related 
health conditions, client coun­
seling and risk factor manage­
ment of pets.

The curriculum is offered 
to veterinary hospital staff 
through Hill's of Topeka, 
Kansas, a company long recog­
nized for it's innovations in pet

health care and clinical nutri­
tion. The program has been 
designed to enable veterinary 
hospital personnel to remain 
current on the latest and often 
times confusing area of pet 
nutritional needs.

Dog and cat owners are 
encouraged to visit or call the 
Kewaskum Veterinary Clinic 
and discuss their pet's nutritional 
needs with Jenny.

Historical Society to 
Visit Pioneer Village

On Sat., June 5th members 
and friends of the Kewaskum 
Historical Society will visit 
Pioneer Village, on Hwy. I in 
Ozaukee County.

Anyone wishing to go 
should meet in front of the com­
munity room at 11:30 a m., or 
meet us at Pioneer Village at 12 
noon.
If you have any questions or 

would like to become a member, 
please call Jake Schmidt at 338- 
1568, weekdays after 6 p.m.

JERRY’S 
TV
and 

ANTENNA 
SERVICE

AND... NOW FEATURING^ nc/i
Panasonic.

QUANTUM 
UHF/VHF/FM 
ANTENNAS

★ TVs ★VCRs ★Boom Boxes 
★ Tape Recorders ★Camcorders 
★ Radios ★Cordless Phones

136 E. Main St., 
Campbellsport

PHONE 533-4466

- WINTER HOURS •

Tues. - Fri. 9 a.m. to 5:30 p.m 
Saturday 8 a m. to 12 noon 

CLOSED MONDAYS
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Four generations of the Zuehlke family are pictured in the 
above photo (L to R) grandfather Norman Zuehlke, father 
Michael Zuehlke holding his new daughter Heather Rose 
Zuehlke, and great-grandfather Elmer Zuehlke.

Sheriff Warns Homeowners
About Home Repair Schemes

An incident in the Town of Ad­
dison has prompted a warning 
from the Washington County 
Sheriff's Department regarding 
home repair schemes.

The department has in­
vestigated a report from a 
75-year-old woman who stated 
that she was visited by two men 
who offered to seal her asphalt 
driveway for $250. They started 
the job, but once they received 
the money they departed, leaving 
the job uncompleted.

The vehicle involved is thought 
to be a 1973-1980 tan GMC 
pickup truck with an aluminum 
cap. The only description for the 
suspects is that they were 
Hispanic.

The sheriff’s department 
reminds ail homeowners to avoid 
doing business with persons who 
appear uninvited at their house. 
Be particularly careful of people 
who claim to have leftover 
materials from a job that was

McKenna on Catholic 
Social Services Board

Newly elected officers of the 
North Regional Board of Catholic 
Social Services are: President. 
Murlin Winter (Sheboygan), 
Vice-President, Paul Brandl 
(Plymouth), and 
Secretary/Treasurer, Richard 
Liddicoat (Sheboygan).

Cyril Kendrick (Sheboygan), 
was elected a new member of the 
board. Members continuing to 
serve on the board are: Pat Ahern 
(Fond du Lac), Dolores Flader 
(Kohler), Jahn Haupt (Ripon), 
Roger McKenna (Kewaskum), 
Paul Monzel (North Fond du 
Lac), and Rev. Donald Elver­
man. Jean Nemschoff and Stuart 
Warrington (Sheboygan).

A Subscription 
to the 

Kewaskum Statesman 
- a gift that keeps on 
giving all year long! 

Phone 626-2626

completed at a neighbor's home, 
and which is being offered at a 
discount "to avoid having to haul 
it back to the shop."

Older residents are often 
targeted, and should not be 
pressured into making a decision. 
No reputable business person 
would object to waiting for ap­
proval. even if it took a few days.

Typical home improvement 
frauds involve repairs to 
driveways, roofs, chimneys and 
furnaces, and installation of
lightning rods. State law pro­
hibits, among other things, the 
misrepresentation of guarantees, 
materials being used, special pric­
ing, and necessity of repairs.

The appearance of an uninvited 
person, offering to perform home 
improvements as described 
above, warrants an immediate 
call to the sheriff’s department. 
Vehicle license plate and suspect 
description would be helpful.

KEWASKUM 
FROZEN FOOD

118 Forest Ave., Kewaskum 
PHONE 626-2181 OR 1-800-660-2710 

Robert Beisbier, Owner

SPECIAL JUNE 4 815 
BULK HAMBURGER $1.59 lb. 

[While supplies last)
ALSO AVAILABLE AT SAUSAGE PLUS

•STARTING MAY 28 thru LABOR DAY*

PICNIC PAKS
for your camping and picnic needs includes:

•10 award winning skinless wieners
•10 award winning cooked or fresh brats

•10 seasoned patti
Also available at 

Sausage Plus $9.99
SPANFERKEL
Also a Roaster Available

CHEESE 8t SAUSAGE 
TRAYS AVAILABLE
FOR GRADUATION OR ANY PARTY 

Please Call Ahead!

Open Monday-Thursday 8 a.m. to 5:30 p.m.
Friday 8 a.m. to 7 p.m.; Saturday 8 a.m. to 4 p.m.

Wagner Attends 
Mid-Moraine 
Dinner Meeting

On Wednesday, May 19th 
a Mid-Moraine Dinner Meeting 
was held at the Village of 
Belgium Community Center. 
Bob Wagner was elected Vice- 
President of the Mid-Moraine 
Municipal Association 
Executive Board.

Mid-Moraine Municipal 
Assoc, is made up of officials of 
villages and cities in Dodge, 
Ozaukee and Washington 
Counties. The officials would be 
trustees, mayors, presidents 
aldermen, administrators, etc.

The purpose of this associa­
tion is to exchange information 
and reports, discuss problems 
and mutual concerns, and 
review all pertinent legislative 
matters of the Slate of 
Wisconsin. Through personal 
contact and other means, they 
hope to influence slate govern­
ment, county boards and other 
units of government to become 
more responsive to the needs of 
incorporated municipalities.

They will also deal with 
any other matters that are of
common interest to member 
organizations. This is also to 
make some good contacts with 
officials in other (networking) 
municipalities if Kewaskum 
needs help with a problem. This 
will also give the Village of 
Kewaskum high visibility and 
good representation.

Trustee Dave Goeden is on 
the legislative Committee.

SUPPORT

RESEARCH.
It Works Wonders 

y American Heart Association

Farmington First Grader 
Wins Poster Contest

Sarah Karrels and Mrs. Dallmann

Mrs. Henke, art instructor, and 
Mrs. Dallmann. classroom 
teacher, are proud to announce 
that Sarah Karrels, first grader at 
Farmington Elementary School, 
won the Mrs. Wishy Washy 
Poster Contest.

The contest was sponsored by 
the Wright Group, a renowned 
publishing company, that pro­
motes emergent reading. This 
contest was open to Kindergarten 
and First Grade students

X 7 . Cheese of
/ Beechwood
I Cheese( ) The Month

■I --
Juno is Dairy Month

COLBY
Reg. $2.11 lb.

$1.71 lb.
Offer good on 1 1/4, 2 1/2 & 5 lb. packages 

Offer good 6-1-93 thru 6-30-93

Cheddar Curd Day
Saturday, June 5 
Fresh, warm Cheddar curd 

READY FOR SALE AT 12 NOON
While supplies last

$2.19 lb.

10 to 5 Daily - 9 to 5 Saturday - Closed Sunday

BEECHWOOD
CHEESE FACTORY
N1598 W Hwy. A - Route 1 - Adell, Wl 53001

Take Hwy. S to Beechwood, then North 2 blocks on Hwy. A

PHONE 994-9306

throughout the nation.
Sarah was one of only KM) 

students to be chosen as a poster 
winner. Her winning drawing of 
Mrs. Wishy Washy, a storybook 
character, will be used by the 
Wright Group for promotional 
purposes.

Sarah received the following as 
prizes: A Mrs. Wishy Washy Big 
Book with an accompanying lit­
tle book, a lee shirt, a button and 
a poster.
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MEMORIES

The above photos are of the August Wesenberg accident which happened just 
south of the Boltonvilk Cemetery on June 29, 1916. The Wesenbergs resided in 
Kewaskum. August was killed, and his wife seriously injured. This could have been 
one of the first, if not the first fatal auto accidents in this area at that time. Do any 
old-timers remember this accident? Sarah Andre Photos ,Grafton

Music Is the uni­
versal language of 
mankind-poetry 
their universal pas­
time and delight.

—Henry Wadsworth 
Longfellow

KEWASKUM STATESMAN
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Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
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Happy Birthday
SHERI

Your mom sure dresses you funny!

Village of Kewaskum 
★ ★NEWS NOTES* ★

The Village of Kewaskum Zoning Ordinance and Wisconsin Ad­
ministrative Rule Tax 11.10 refer to Rummage/Garage or occasional 
sales. The Village would like to remind everyone that a rum- 
mage/garage sale is an OCCASIONAL sale, which would normally 
be for a period of one (1) or two (2) days, but would not exceed seven 
(7) days. Also, that such an event/sale is only permissable twice in 
any calendar year.

Rummage/garage sale signs are not to exceed eight (8) square feet 
in area and placed on the premise of the sale not to exceed seven (7) 
days twice in any calendar year. Off-premise rummage/garage sale 
signs are prohibited except where the sign and location have been 
approved by the Village Police Department. Rummage/garage sale 
signs shall be removed within 24 hours following the sale.

Everyone’s cooperation is appreciated.

CO^SfJiTULJi'TIO^ 

.. TRAVIS - 
for

* Breaking School High Jump 6’5”
* Taking 1st at Sectionals

* Going on to State
WE'RE SO PROUD OF YOU!

Love, 
Dad , Mom,Tracy & Melissa

Good Luck 
At State

CHRISTA!
100 M High Hurdles
300 M Low Hurdles 
1600 M Relay With 
Weazy, Roar & Yardstick

CONGRATULATIONS 
On Your Graduation!

★ MVP Volleyball and Track
★ US Marine Corp Distinguished Athlete Award

WE LOVE YOU AND ARE SO PROUD!!
Mom and Dad

COtYgn^TULJlTIOJ^
on a Great Track Career at KHS

** ROBYN WINNINGHOFF ★♦
★ Washington County Discus Champion 

1992 & 1993
★Undefeated Eastern Wisconsin 

Discus Champion 1993
★ Pewaukee Invitational Champion 1993 
★ Vanderpan Invitational Champion 

1992 & 1993
★ 1st Place at Regionals 1992 & 1993

★ 1 st Place at Sectionals 1992
w 2nd Place at Sectionals 1993

★ State Track Meet - 3rd place 1992
★ State Track Meet Qualifier -1993

★ 1st Place High Jump - Washington County 
Indoors 1993

Thanks Coach Rizzardi for your support & help

All our Love, 
Dad , Mom, LeeAnn and Marnie
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Prepare for State

Athletes from the 
Kewaskum Special Olympics 
program will be competing June 
10-12 in the Wisconsin Special 
Olympics Summer Games on 
the University of Wisconsin- 
Stevens Point campus. The 
Summer Games feature 1800 
athletes in state championship 
track and field, aquatics, soccer 
and volleyball competition.

Local athletes who will be 
competing include: Brian 
Hanrahan, Lisa Loomis, and 
Justin Petermann.

The Wisconsin Special 
Olympics Summer Games are 
cooperatively sponsored by 
Worzalla, WSPT/WSPO, the 
University of Wisconsin - 
Stevens Point, Sentry Insurance 
Foundation, The Copps 
Corporation and Target Stores. 
Athlete awards have been pur­
chased through a grant from the 
Patrick and Anna Cudahy Fund.

Wisconsin Special

Championship
Olympics provides year-round 
sports training and competition 
for children and adults with 
mental retardation. To get 
involved, please call Karin 
Hawley at (414)241-7786.

The divorce rate might go 
down if instead of marrying 
for better or worse, young 
people would try to marry for 
good.

Peace Church
Youth Choir

*

WHEN YOU 
CANT BREATHE,

CLASSIFIED

Musical Sunday

Please come and share the 
joy of the Peace Church Youth 
Choir as they present Dottie 
Rambo's humorous and uplift­
ing musical, "Down By The 
Creek Bank' on Sun., June 6th 
during the regular 9:30 a m. 
worship service.

In addition to hearing about 
crickets, tadpoles, turtles and 
frogs, you'll Till in the blanks on 
several well-known Bible sto­
ries, learn to multiply as Jesus 
did, hear about an invisible dog 
and learn that you are a very 
special piece in the Lords puz­
zle

The children have worked 
hard on their journey, and invite 
you to join them "Down By The 
Creek Bank".

FIREMEN TO MEET
The regular monthly meeting of 

the Kewaskum Fire Department 
will be held at the fire station on 
Thursday, June 3, at 7:30 p.m.

A Definition:" What is a can­
nibal, Dad?" "Well, if you ate 
your mother and me you'd be 
a cannibal." " Oh, I thought 
that was an orphan."

NOTHING ELSE 
MATTERS.

Ilelp the 
Xmcric.in Lung Xssockition 

fight lung disease.

t
 AMERICAN 
LUNG 
ASSOCIATION

Space contributed b\ the publisher js j public service

^lH/IJ^K you
As of June 1st I will be taking a leave from hair dressing 
at Family Hair Salon. I would like thank all my customers. 

Your patronage was greatly appreciated.

Thank You - Again

PAULA SCHOOFS

THE DEADLINE FOR 
DISPLAY ADS IS 
MONDAY NOON
NEWS COPY MUST BE 
SUBMITTED BY 3 P.M. 

MONDAY PRIOR TO 
PUBLICATION

However, the sooner you bring in your 
copy, the more time we have to devote to 
it and arrange space accordingly.
CLASSIFIED ADS WILL BE ACCEPTED 

UNTIL NOON ON TUESDAY

A 24-Hour Door Slot Is Available 
For Your Convenience

THANK YOU FOR YOUR COOPERATION

KEWASKUM 
STATESMAN

Wisconsin Safety Belt Coalition

SUMMER FUN 
3 0 at

x; VIDEO POST 
DRA WINGS EVERY WEEK! 
★ * New Specials ★ ★ 
★ FREE RENTALS 
★ FREE PRIZES 

and more! 

The Fun Starts 
June 7

— June 7-11 — 
FREE FRISBEE with every new release rental 

FREE NEON PENCIL with every 95c rental

355 Main Street, Kewaskum 
626-8131

HOURS: Mon -Fri. 10 a m. to 9 p.m.;
Sat. 9 a m. to 9 p.m.; Sun. 10 a m. to 6 p.m

■m time to celebrate at jpFathers daY

Miller, 
Miller Lite, 

Genuine Draft 
& Genuine 
Draft Lite 
BEER

24 pack

$11.99

Inglenook 
WINE
1.5 liter

6 FLAVORS

$5.99

COLD
QUARTER

2 BARRELS 8
8 ALWAYS 

I AVAILABLE
--------- COLD---------

U®^

Heaven Hill ,
VODKA

1.75 liter

S 10.49

Wildwood 
SODA 

case cans 

S4.89

Michelob 
Golden 

Draft 
Light 

BEER 
24 pk. cans 

$10.99

SUDS and SPIRITS
355 Main Street, Kewaskum

PHONE 626-4565
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Legionnaires from Robert G Romaine Post 384 march in the annual Memorial 
Day Parade.

Local Girl Scout and Boy Scout troops also were on hand to march in the 
parade.

The Legion Firing Squad salutes the dead.

The marriage vows of 
Wendy Denise Sieracki and 
Ryan Christopher Dehling were 
blessed during an April 17 cere­
mony at United Church of 
Christ, Fillmore.

Parents of the couple are 
Linda Sieracki of 706 Jefferson 
St., West Bend and Terry Guell 
of N2574 Wheel Road, 
Campbellsport, and Milton and 
Roberta Dehling of 926 Route 1, 
State 84, Kewaskum.

Becky Sieracki of West 
Bend, was the maid of honor, 
and bridesmaids included Sandy 
DuPlanty, Sheri Charlton, 
Michelle Henschel and Tara 
Rusher.

Magen Dehling was the

Hower girl, and the ring bearer 
was Dyland Kennworthy.

The best man was Rod 
Rabuck of Fredonia, and Herb 
Donath, Gary Dettmann, Jeff 
Fahney and Paul Kohn, were 
groomsmen.

Ushering duties were 
shared by Robert Piaro and 
David Dehling.

The bride attends Moraine 
Park Technical College, West 
Bend, pursuing an associate 
degree in nursing. She is 
employed with Horizon Home 
Health, Hartford.

Her husband is employed at 
Gehl Co., West Bend.

The newlyweds reside at 
710 Jefferson St., West Bend.

The Memorial Day wreath is placed on the stone honoring 
the area s war dead

A GREAT GIFT 
ANY TIME OF 

THE YEAR! 
A Subscription 

to the 
KEWASKUM 
STATESMAN 

Only $17 
Per Year In-State

The Gift That Keeps Coming 
Every Week of the Year!

To order, phone 626-2626 
WE’LL SEND THE GIFT CARD

Statesman Photos by Andrew Kuehl
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What’s In It for All of Us?

By David IV. Becker 
Branch Manager

“What’s in it for me?’’ That’s 
a commonly asked question... 
and human nature being what it 
is, an understandable one. We 
hear it alot when it comes to 
Social Security, especially from 
younger workers. Benefits paid 
by Social Security are for more 
than just retirement. Social 
Security also pays benefits to 
younger people - disability 
benefits, payments to the spouse 
and children of someone with a 
disability, and survivors benefits 
for the members of a deceased 
worker’s family.

We can also ask: “What’s in it 
for all of us?’’ The answer to that 
question goes well beyond the 
bounds of assessing each 
American’s personal investment 
in the Social Security system. 
When you consider that Social 
Security has brought generations 
of Americans from the brink of 
poverty to a safe plateau of finan­
cial independence, it’s easy to 
understand why it is often regard­
ed as one of the most successful 
of all government programs.

Social Security is a complex 
“social insurance” system that 
embodies elements of group term 
insurance, pension policies, and 
income redistribution. Unlike 
private retirement plans, social 
objectives are an integral part of 
Social Security.

One of those is ensuring that 
workers and their families are 
covered not only in their retire­
ment years but also in the case of 
disability or death. In addition, 
the Social Security benefit for­
mula is weighted in favor of 
workers with lower earnings who 
have less opportunity to save dur­
ing their working years. They 
receive a Social Security benefit
that represents a greater percen­
tage of their average earnings 
than do their higher-salaried 
counterparts.

Some would argue that they 
could realize a greater return on 
their taxes if they were permitted 
to invest their own retirement 
funds. It is reasonable to assume 
that some individuals might invest 
their money profitably, avoid 
crippling disability or early death, 
and generally remain immune to 
ill fortune. These people would 
eventually be able to retire finan­
cially secure. But how does one

RAISE YOUR 
EYE-Q

Average. Close set. Wide set. 
Prominent lids. Hooded lids. 
Oriental. Which eye type 
describes you? Let me show 
you how the right makeup 
application techniques can 
enhance your eyes. Call for a 
free consultation.

To minimize a prominent lid, contour 
below the crease- rather than along it - 
adding emphasis to the upper lashline.

^LMARV KAV
FACE-TO-FACE BEAUTY ADVICE™

WENDI DREHER
Independent Beauty Consultant

626*2428

determine before the fact who 
those fortunate few will be? 
Disability and death are equal op­
portunity occurrences, striking 
men and women of all ages. In 
fact, statistics show that about 42 
percent of ail men and 30 percent 
of women entering the workforce 
today will die or become disabl­
ed before reaching retirement 
age.

One of the advantages of re­
quiring all workers to invest in a 
national pension program like 
Social Security is that the finan­
cial risks associated with life’s 
misfortunes are spread 
throughout the population. In ad­
dition, a broad-based social in­
surance system reduces the im­
pact that inflation and other 
economic setbacks can have on 
individual contributors.

Rather than considering private 
investments as an alternative to 
Social Security, they should be 
regarded as supplements to the 
program... especially since Social 
Security was never intended to lie 
a retiree's only source of income.

So... what's in it for all of us? 
Considering what Social Securi­
ty means to individuals in terms 
of retirement, disability, sur­
vivors, and family benefits and 
what it means to the country in 
terms of a better standard of liv­
ing for many of its citizens, Social 
Security is one of the most impor­
tant and far-reaching investments 
Americans, and America, can 
make.

The bright flowers 
of the prickly pear 
cactus bloom for 
only one day.

FIN-n-FEATHER 
Supper Club in New Prospect 

* NOW OPEN ★ 
SEVEN DAYS A WEEK!

Memorial Day 
thru 

Labor Day

HT Christian 
Women to Hold 
Rummage, Bake Sale

At the May meeting Holy 
Trinity Christian Women elect­
ed new officers. They are 
Vivian Stommel, President; 
Shirley Gruber, Vice President; 
Henrietta Gremminger, 
Secretary; Diane Pesch, 
Treasurer.

The annual Rummage and 
Bake Sale date was set for 
Friday, June 4th, 9 a m. to 7 
p.m. This year there will be two 
separate raffles - a general raf­
fle with many nice prizes donat­
ed by our generous local busi­
ness people and a Quilt Raffle 
of a beautiful blue and white, 
Queen size, hand tied, dacron 
comforter.

Lunch will be available all 
day, including a plate lunch 
(cold ham sandwich, chips & 
pickle), barbecue and cold ham 
sandwiches, delicious home 
made soup and desserts, and 
beverages.

This, in addition to our gen­
erous offering of rummage, 
plants, homemade bakery, bou­
tique, housewares, quills, furni­
ture, books, toys, etc.

A fish bowl is offered for 
the kids enjoyment.

HALL 
AVAILABLE

For Parties, 
Anniversaries, 

Small Weddings 
and Reunions

KEWASKUM 
AMERICAN LEGION

Call Lee at
338-1509

Evenings & Weekends

'National Trails 
Day Hike1

A "National Trails Day 
Hike" will be held at the Lac 
Lawrann Conservancy on Sat., 
June 5, beginning at 10:00 a.m. 
Volunteers of the Conservancy 
will lead the hike, which will 
begin at 300 Schmidt Road, 
West Bend.

All abilities of walkers and 
hikers, including children, are 
welcome. A special wheel chair 
tour will be included. Several 
trails at Lac Lawrann offer vari­
ous views and terrains. The 
tours will last about two hours.

Reservations are required. 
Call the West Bend Parks, 
Recreation & Forestry Dept. - 
335-5080 or Bette Pouros - 334- 
9634. There is no charge.

FDL Bird Club Hosting 
Field Trip to Mauthe Lake

The Wisconsin Society for Or­
nithology will be sponsoring a 
field trip to the Mauthe Dike Area 
of the Kettle Moraine State Forest 
on June 5, 1993. The Owen J. 
Gromme Bird Club of Fond du 
Lac will be hosting the trip.

Anyone interested in attending 
should meet at the Mauthe Lake 
Recreation Area at the first large 
parking area on the main road to 
the beach/picnic area at 6 a m.

Some of the birds expected are 
Red-shouldered and Broad- 
winged Hawks, Pileated 
Woodpecker, Acadian and Alder 
Flycatchers, Ceruean, Black and 
White, and Mourning Warblers. 
Vesper, Henslows and Grasshop­
per Sparrows.

Lunch (bring your own bag 
lunch) will be at the Ice Age 
Center just west of Dundee on 
Hwy. 67. The field trip is free 
and open to the public, and 
children are welcome.

♦ * *

Education i* hanging 
around until you've 
caught on.

—Robert Front

Holy Trinity Christian Women

RUMMAGE and 
BAKE SALE
Friday, June 4

9 a.m. to 7 p.m.

— LUNCH AVAILABLE ALL DAY — 
Including homemade soup, cold ham plate lunch, 
barbecue sandwiches, homemade desserts and 

beverages.

HOLY TRINITY CHURCH HALL

STOCK UP 
ON COLD 
★ SODA 
★ BEER 

and 
★ WINE

COOLERS 
at

Kuehl's 
SUDS and 
SPIRITS 
355 Main St.
Kewaskum 

PHONE 626-4565

RAFFLE 
PRIZES 

featuring 
handmade 

quilt
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KHS Child Development Classes Holds Preschool
Government Day

Darlene Kremer, Marilyn 
Filler and Gloria Rodenkirch of

Daniel Fellenz, Amanda Schmidt, Kimberly Peterman, 
Breann DeLaurier. Michael Gutjahr, Niki Fellenz, Brenda 
Jaycox, Jackie McKee, Danielle Mueller.

Middle row: Bruce Oik, Jacob Theusch, Tyler Swanson, 
Sarah Uhlig, Elizabeth Potter, Nicole Luedtke, Lindsay 
Krautkramer, Rachel Tuszynski, Alonna Beine.

Top row: Stacey Peterman, Chelsea Weare, Brian Her- 
riges, Ashley Cochran, Nathan Behring, Melanie Zellner, 
Jeffrey Paulus, Benjamin Johnson.

Missing from the photo, but attending preschool were 
Kimberly Breger, Candace Kuphal. Samantha Kuphal. 
Nicole Bath, Samantha Markus.

The child development classes of Kewaskum High School 
recently held their three-week preschool for area three and 
four-year-olds. Juniors and seniors from Mrs. Carol Mar­
tin’s child development class directed the activities for the 
children.

Bach day included storytime, circletime, art and music with 
all of the activities planned by the students. A special thank 
you is extended to Shawn Roberts of My Little Friends Day 
Care of Kewaskum, for speaking to the high schixtl students 
and giving them many great ideas to make their “presch(X)l’’ 
a success.

Bottom row, left to right: Tom Paulus, Rebecca Kreil.

Rhinelander School of the Arts 
Celebrates 30th Anniversary

MADISON - The UW- 
Madison School of the Arts will 
celebrate its 3()th anniversary 
during its annual one-week pro­
gram. July 19-23. in 
Rhinelander.

More than 45 beginning to 
advanced workshops will be 
offered for adult students with 
an interest in creative writing, 
drama, dance, photography, the 
visual arts,folk arts and folk 
music.

Featured artists this summer 
include Diane Glancy 
(poetry/fiction); Dave Peterson 
(folk drama); and Muneer 
Bauhadden (clay sculpture).

The school is sponsored by 
the UW-Madison Department of

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 
FOR THE ELDERLY MENU

Meadowcreek Apartment 
Complex

Monday, June 7 - Sliced 
turkey breast w/ gravy, whipped 
sweet potatoes, mixed garden 
vegetables, seven grain bread, 
chocolate pudding.

Tuesday, June 8 -- Orange 
juice, boneless pork loin roast 
w/ gravy, apple raisin dressing, 
green beans, onion rye bread, 
sugar cookies.

Thursday, June 10 — 
Tomato juice, sliced beef w /pea 
pods & soy sauce packs, fluffy 
white rice, June peas, marble rye 
bread, orange sherbet.

Ceramics at 10:00 a.m. 
every 1st and 3rd Tuesday of the 
month.

Continuing Education in the 
Arts, in conjunction with the 
greater Rhinelander community. 
Continuing Education Units 
(CEUs) and Department of 
Public Instruction clock hours 
arc offered for teachers and oth­
ers who want to earn these units 
as evidence of professional 
development.

Scholarships funded by area 
banks, institutions, businesses, 
corporations, and private indi­
viduals are available to help pay 
for tuition to the school. In addi­
tion, scholarships funded by the 
Wisconsin Rural Rehabilitation 
Corporation are available to 
members of family operated 
farms. Eligibility is based on 
Wisconsin residency and finan­
cial need.

For more information con­
tact your area county extension 
office or public library or con­
tact the UW-Madison School of 
the Arts at Rhinelander, 727N 
Lowell Hall, 610 Langdon St., 
Madison. WI 53703, (608) 
3494.

THANK YOU

I want to thank everyone 
for their kindness while I was in 
the hospital and recovering at 
home from the major surgery. A 
special thanks to Dr. Barger and 
Dr Lewis and all the floor staff. 
A special thanks to my family. 
Rev.Hennings for his prayers 
and all my friends, neighbors 
and relatives, who remembered 
me.

This meant a lot to me.
Malinda Kudck

County Junior Fair 
Hooks Now Available

The 1993 Washington County 
Junior Fair Books are now 
available for distribution.

If you ever considered entering 
the competition at the County 
Fair, now is the time to pick up 
a book and fill out an entry form. 
Books are available by calling the 
Fair Office at 335-4485; 
644-5204 or 342-2929 or stopp­
ing in at the Office, located in the 
new Public Agency Center. 333 
E. Washington Street, Suite 1200 
in West Bend. Office hours are 
Monday through Friday, 8 a m. 
to 4:30 p.m.

The Washington County Junior 
Fair has two main divisions: 
Open Class and Junior Class.

The Open Class Division is 
open to any resident of 
Washington County and features 
a special Senior Citizen Division. 
Some of the categories available 
include crafts, horticulture, 
woodwork, foods, clothing, 
home furnishings, livestock and 
knitting and crocheting.

The Junior Class Division is 
open to youth who are members 
of an organized group such as 
4-H. FFA. FHA, Scouts or 
Pioneers.

In order to compete in the 1993 
Washington County Junior Fair, 
all entry forms must be returned 
by June 30.

Echo Farms Dairy Co. of 
New York introduced the 
milk bottle in 1879.

County Separated and 
Divorced Group to Meet

The Washington County 
Separated and Divorced Men and 
Women Support Group meets 
every Friday at Sacred Heart 
Church in Allenton from 7:30 to 
9:30 p.m.

The purpose is to provide a 
group to share ideas, concerns, 
support, fellowship and love from 
a Christian perspective. There are 
guest speakers, panel discussions, 
small group sharing and 
activities.

The group is open to single, 
widows and widowers. Many of 
the topics pertain to single parents 
and other individuals rebuilding 
their lives and relationships.

Upcoming topics are:
June 4 - “Compulsive and Ad­

dictive Behaviors” with Father 
Melvin Low.

June 11 - “A Healing 
Weekend,” a panel discussions 
from New Horizons.

we now lake

Micfowtrves

We w« no-one ^

cardboard.junk automobiles & iron.

LYNN'S Wastepaper Recycling
121 Island Ave.
West Bend • 334-9542
Open daily
7 am-4 pm; Sat. 7 am-Noon

Hometown Realty of West Bend,
Inc. and members of the 
Washington Board of Realtors, 
participated in the Wisconsin 
Realtors Association’s annual 
Realtor and Government Day in 
Madison on May 5, at the Con­
course Hotel.

Along with a briefing on the 
property tax rate freeze proposal, 
over 400 real estate professionals 
from throughout Wisconsin were 
addressed by Governor Tommy 
G. Thompson on the state of 
Wisconsin's economy.

“Realtors from around the 
state met with their legislators and 
discussed the property tax freeze 
and other issues of concern to the 
real estate industry and the state’s 
economy,’’ said Darlene Kremer, 
owner/broker of Hometown 
Realty of West Bend, Inc., 2375 
W. Washington St.. West Bend.

The Wisconsin Realtors 
Association is one of the most 
politically active trade associa­
tions in the state, representing 
over 10.000 members. The
Association is headquartered in 
Madison.

“Hundreds of people express­
ed their concern and support for 
the property tax rate freeze.” 
Kremer said. “We went to 
Madison to impress upon our 
elected officials the need to pro­
mote the American dream of 
home ownership and to protect 
the rights of homeowners in 
Wisconsin,” she added. 
“Realtors expressed their strong 
support for the Governor’s pro­
posal to freeze the property tax 
rate, modify the mediation­
arbitration law and provide man­
date funding to ease the pressure 
on local property taxes.

Realtors attending Government 
Day in Madison were optimistic 
that 1993 would remain a good 
year for Wisconsin home sales.

ALUMINUM 
CANS

On the first and 
third Saturdays 
10 a.m. to 2 p.m. 

SENTRY PARKING LOT 
Kewaskum Mall 

Also buying copper, brass, 
batteries and other aluminum

• ••••••

2nd and 4th Tuesday 
10 a.m. to 1 p.m. 

STRAUB'S in Campbellsport 
MARCOE'S RECYCLING

luminum Cans for Recycling
• Help keep Your Community 

Environmentally clean

RECYCLE NOW!!
Competitive prices paid forcopper, 

brass, aluminum,lead batteries.

LYNN'S
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Valley Bank Employee Recognized

Amy Tritt, Takako Harada, Ross Kuehl, Michael Neumann and Joey McDonald 
(front), busily fold paper cups.

Left to right, Cassie Clausing and Todd Warnecke work intently as Mrs. Harada 
gives instructions. Ann Neumann Photos

Valley Bancorporation an­
nounced the certification of 91 
employees at the Annual Awards 
banquet which were held recent­
ly in La Crosse, Madison, Ap­
pleton and Sheboygan. The cer­
tification program recognizes 
employees who have met am­
bitious educational and ex­
perience requirements. There are 
three levels to the certification 
program; professional, manage­
ment and executive.

The Professional Certification 
Program is designed for all non- 
officer employees and provides a 
basis for encouraging them to fur­
ther their education and to learn 
more about their banking career. 
The Management Certification 
Program, designed for people 
new to the area of general 
management, centers around 
building their supervisory and in­
terpersonal skills. The goal of the 
Executive Certification Program 
is to provide executives with state 
of the art skills in leadership, 
planning, organizing, directing 
and coordinating.

An Executive Certification 
Award was presented to William 
Haskey, Valley Bank, 
Kewaskum, at the American 
Club. Kohler, on Thursday, May 
13.

This Certification Program has 
been developed to encourage pro­
fessionalism throughout Valley 
Bancorporation. This year’s class 
of certified professionals brings

the total to 590 Valley employees 
who have achieved this level of 
distinction.

Peter M. Platten, III, President 
and Chief Executive Officer, 
Valley Bancorporation, stated, 
“We thank our many employees 
for their commitment to continu­
ing education. Their dedication 
enables us to build a strong 
management and employee team 
that will give our customers the 
best, most responsive service 
available. A service organization 
can only be as good as its 
employees, and we believe Valley 
is staffed with the best people in 
the banking industry!”

Valley Bancorporation is the 
third largest bank holding com­
pany headquartered in Wiscon­
sin. Valley, with assets of $4.3 
billion, currently serves Wiscon­
sin through 154 banking offices 
with additional financial services 
companies engaged in insurance, 
trust services, securities, leasing, 
credit card servicing, and bank 
support services. The company’s 
common stock is traded on the 
National Market System under 
the NASDAQ symbol VYBN.

Mrs. Stradtman's kindergarten 
class at Kewaskum Elementary 
School had the pleasure of a visit 
from Takako Harada from 
Koriyamo. Japan, recently.

Mrs. Harada, a teacher from 
Japan, introduced and

KFD Fire and 
Rescue Squad Calls

Tuesday, May 25, 11:03 a m. 
- The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
responded to a call to Neuville 
Chevrolet in Kewaskum, when a 
male patient with a history of 
diabetes was found in an 
automobile non-responsive. He 
was transported to St. Joseph’s 
Hospital in West Bend.

Friday. May 28, 5:30 p.m. - 
The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
and the Kohlsville First 
Responders were summoned to 
Hwy .41, 1 % mile north of Hwy. 
28, when an automobile struck a 
deer and the deer came through 
the windshield of the vehicle. The 
male and female in the car suf­
fered only minor cuts and refus­
ed transport.

Sunday, May 30, 10:05 p.m. - 
The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
unit was dispatched to the Bolton- 
ville Picnic when a female patient 
was found unconscious. She was 
transported to St. Joseph's 
Hospital in West Bend.

Sunday, May 30, 11:47 p.m. - 
The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
was summoned back to the 
Boltonville Picnic when a male 
patient suffered an injury to his 
lower back. He was transported 
to St. Joseph’s Hospital in West 
Bend.

demonstrated the Japanese art of 
“paper folding” to these for­
tunate afternoon kindergarten 
pupils. The children were shown 
how to make a paper cup and 
print their name in Japanese upon

it.
The class would like to thank 

Mrs. Harada and her host fami­
ly, Ann and Roger Neumann, for 
providing such a memorable ex­
perience. It shall not be forgotten.

TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport

533-8094

Choose from the best selection of 
wedding stationery in town. Our 
Carlson Craft line will provide you with 
a wide selection of styles in every price 
range. Stop and see us for your 
complete paper trousseau.

KEWASKUM STATESMAN
Box 98, 250 Main St.
Kewaskum, WI 53040 
PHONE 626-2626

NEW FANE 
SPORTSMAN’S CLUB 

May 26, 1993
W L

Campbellsport
Building Supply 5 I

KM Agency. Inc. 5 I
A to Z Vending 5 I
Callaway & Co. 4 2
Denny’s Quality Meats 4 2
J D Tasha's 3 3
Main Street Tattoo 3 3
Amerahn II 3 3
Amerahn I 3 3
Rain Dance Car Wash 3 3
Shefond Oil 3 3
Kuehl’s Suds & Spirits 3 3
Shlufty s Inn 3 3
Commercial Plumbing 3 3
Lake Bernice Taxidermy 2 4

Prayer to the Holy Spirit
Prayer through application 

to the Holy Spirit. Holy Spirit, 
you who solve all problems, 
light all roads so that I can attain 
my goal. You who give me the 
divine gift to forgive and forget 
all evils against me and that in 
all instances of my life you arc 
with me. I want in this short 
prayer to thank you for all 
things as you confirm once 
again that I never want to be 
separated from you, even and in 
spite of all material illusion. I 
wish to be with you in eternal 
glory. Thank you for your 
mercy toward me and mine.

The person must say this 
prayer for three consecutive 
days. After three days,the favor 
requested will be granted, even 
if it may appear difficult This 
prayer must be published imme­
diately alter the favor is granted.

L. K.
Tecumseh Engine 2 4
Ruby Htg. & Cooling 2 4 
Heberer Bros. Cons. I 5 
Bar-N-Annex I 5 
Cleary Building 1 5

100 Straight - Doug Baumann 
(124x125).

25 Straight - Lonn Roesel. Dennis 
Petermann. Bill Heberer Jr.

24x25 - Brad Seefeldt, Terry 
Maurer, Al Truelove, Bill Heberer. 
Jim Schaub. Jim Butzlaff, Charlie 
Walls, Ira Heberer, Les Gessner, 
Ken Bales, Rich Frank, Henry 
Delcore, Jeff Scannell, Dave Lang.

DUNDEE 
SAND & GRAVEL
G. RAMTHUN 533-4549

• Washed Sand
• Crushed Gravel
• Stone and Lime Chips

Also Gravel and Sand Fill 
Topsoil

General Trucking

Paradise
Trees
Roses

Perennials
Annual Flowers

Potting Soil
Fertilizer 

Decorative Pots I

5381131

a en
Shrubs

Berry Plants
Hardy Mums 

Vegetable Plants
Peat Moss 

Hanging Pots 
Potted Evergreen Seedlings

iursery
Evergreens 
Asparagus 
Geraniums 
Onion Sets

All Potting Needs 
Houseplants

Seed Potatoes

H

Slone and Hark Mukh 
Cocoa Bean Shells
GIFT SHOP OPEN

Oki's Garden S Farm Seeds

Urge Selection 
I awn OHNAMENTS, oral 

FOUNTAINS, INDOO*. OUTDOOR, 
MAZING MOMS. BID BATHS 

RELIGIOUS STATUES

33 EaSt taernit from ^tt Armi Airport)
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JOHN E. PETRI

John E. Petri, of West 
Bend, died Tuesday, May 25, 
1993, at St. Luke's Medical 
Center, Milwaukee, at the age of 
72.

He was bom June 25, 1920, 
in the town of Wayne, to the late 
Wendell and Sophia (nee 
Amcrling) Petri, and married 
Lucille M. Theisen in St. 
Michaels on June 30, 1945.

He served with the U.S. 
Anny during World War II, and 
after his discharge they settled 
in St. Michaels until 1947 when 
they came to West Bend.

He was employed at the 
Gehi Co. for 39 years, retiring in 
1984, after which he worked 
part-time at the St.Vincent de 
Paul store in West Bend, up to 
the time of his death.

Survivors include his wife; 
two children, Kathy (Tom) 
Rynders of New Berlin and 
Steve (Lona) of Bozeman, 
Mont.; a granddaughter, Kelly 
Petri a sister, Ione Honeck of 
Kewaskum; two brothers, Bruce 
(Eileen) and Earl (Martha), both 
of Kewaskum; and other rela­
tives and friends.

Preceding him in death 
were a brother and a sister.

He was a member of the Fr. 
Casper RchrI Council 1964 of 
the Knights of Columbus, the 
Robert O. Romaine Post 384 of 
the American Legion, the 
Hexclbank Club at the Gehl Co. 
and a charter member of the 
Hon-E-Kor Country Club in 
Kewaskum.

Funeral services were held 
Friday, May 28, at 9:30 a.m. at 
the Schmidt Funeral Home, 
West Bend, with a Mass of 
Christian Burial at 10 a.m. at 
Holy Angels Church. Fr. Jerome 
Rinzel was the presider, and 
burial followed in Holy Angels 
Cemetery.

Visitation at the funeral 
home was Thursday after 4 
p.m., with a prayer vigil at 8 
p.m.

Those who wish may give 
memorials to Holy Angels 
School Trust Fund.

NICHOLAS MUMPER

Nicholas C. Mumper, 78, of 
Scenic Drive, Campbellsport, 
died Tuesday, May 25, 1993, at 
Grancare Nursing Center.

He was born July 22, 1914, 
in Omro, a son of George and 
Anna Marx Mumper. On Nov. 
13, 1937, he married Grace L. 
Zupke at Church of Peace in 
Fond du Lac.

Mr. Mumper was a farmer 
until retiring.

Survivors include one 
daughter, Margaret Frank and 
her husband Michael of Lomira; 
one son, Marvin and his wife 
Phyllis of West Bend; seven 
grandchildren; 16 great-grand­
children; one brother, George 
and his wife Irene of Greenfield; 
and one sister, Alice Wick land 
of Janesville

Preceding him in death 
were his wife on Dec. 14, 1985; 
three brothers, Joseph, John and

a twin, Oscar; one great-grand­
son and one daughter-in-law.

Funeral services were held 
at 7:30 p.m. Friday at Twohig 
Funeral Home, Campbellsport. 
The Rev. Martin Koehler offici­
ated. Burial was on Saturday at 
Bethel Cemetery in the Town of 
Byron.

Visitation was from 4 p.m. 
Friday to the time of services at 
the funeral home.

ADELA HARTMANN

Adela C.Hartmann, 93, a 
resident of Clearview Nursing 
Home, formerly of Theresa, 
died Thursday, May 27, 1993. 
She was bom Aug. 14, 1899, at 

St. Kilian, a daughter of Andrew 
and Francis Lehner Bonlender. 
On Nov. 14, 1924, she married 
Ben Hartmann at St. Theresa's 
Catholic Church, Theresa.

She was a member of St. 
Theresa's Catholic Church and 
St. Anne's Sodality of St. 
Theresa.

Survivors include four sons, 
Robert and his wife Jean, and 
Roger and his wife Sung Sun, 
all of Florida, Frank and his 
wife Shirley of Mayville and 
Ralph of Theresa; 13 grandchil­
dren; 23 great-grandchildren; 
and six great-great-grandchil­
dren.

She was preceded in death 
by her husband on July 31, 
1964; four sisters; and three 
brothers.

Funeral services were held 
at 11 a.m. Tuesday at St. 
Theresa's Catholic Church. The 
Rev. Charles Vcrhalen officiat­
ed. Burial was at St. Theresa's 
Memorial Garden, Theresa.

Visitation was scheduled 
from 9 a m. to the hour of ser­
vices at 11 a.m. Tuesday at the 
church.

Kietzer Funeral Home, 
Lomira, handled arrangements.

REBECCA M. GASPARDO

Rebecca M. Gaspardo, 
infant daughter of Richard 
Gaspardo and Chris Filo of 
West Bend, died Thursday, May 
20, 1993, at St. Joseph's 
Community Hospital, West 
Bend.

She was born March 26, 
1993, in West Bend.

Survivors include her par­
ents; maternal grandparents, 
Gerald and Carol Filo of 
Newburg; paternal grandparents, 
Eugene and Pat Gaspardo of 
Kewaskum; maternal great- 
grandparents, Leona Lorge of 
Cedarburg and Paul and Irene 
Filo of Newburg; paternal great- 
grandparents. James Draves Sr. 
of Milwaukee, Florence Bailey 
of California and Adeline 
Gaspardo of Alvin, Wis.; aunts, 
uncles and other relatives.

Funeral services were held 
Monday, May 24, at 8 p.m. at 
the Phillip Funeral Home, West 
Bend. Fr. George R. 
Fleischmann officiated and bur­
ial was in Washington County 
Memorial Park, West Bend, at 
10 a.m. Tuesday.

Visitation at the funeral

home was on Monday from 6 
p.m. until the time of services.

Memorials are appreciated.

MICHAEL J. LIMBACH

Michael J. Limbach, of 
Allenton died Monday, May 31, 
1993, at his residence after a 
lengthy illness at the age of 50.

He was bom Nov. 7, 1942, 
in Milwaukee to Vernon and 
Elizabeth "Betty" (nee Ritger) 
Limbach.

At an early age, the family 
moved to Allenton, where he 
lived up until the time of his 
death.

For over 30 years he 
worked as a mason contractor 
with Limbach Construction of 
Allenton.

He loved the outdoors and 
was an avid hunter and fisher­
man.

On July 6, 1968, he mar­
ried Betty A. Rose at St. Frances 
Cabrini Church, West Bend.

Survivors include his wife; 
three children, Craig and David, 
both of Wayne, and Amy, at 
home; his mother, Betty 
Limbach of Allenton; mother- 
in-law Cecelia Rose of Jackson; 
two brothers Thomas and John 
(Kathleen) both of West Bend; 
one sister Mary Jo Evenson of 
West Bend; other relatives and 
friends.

Preceding him in death was 
his father, Vernon, and his 
father-in-law, Harvey Rose Sr.

A memorial mass will be 
held Wednesday, June 2, at 7 
p.m. at Ss. Peter and Paul 
Church in Ncnno. Rev. Michael 
Wild will be the presider and 
burial of crcmains will be in 
Sacred Heart Cemetery in 
Allenton.

The family will greet rela­
tives and friends at the church 
on Wednesday from 5 p.m. to 7 
p.m. and in the church hall fol­
lowing the service.

Memorials appreciated in 
lieu of flowers. The Schmidt 
Funeral Home of West Bend is 
serving the family.

NELDA H. HABECK
Nelda H. Habeck ( nee 

Kurtz) of West Bend died 
Monday, May 31, 1993, at the 
Samaritan Home at the age of 
75.

She was born March 28, 
1918 in the town of Farmington 
to William and Clara (nee 
Seidcmann) Kurtz and married 
Erwin W. Habeck in 1957 at St. 
John's Evangelical Lutheran 
Church, Newburg.

He preceded her in death on 
Dec. 15, 1966.

She was a grade school 
teacher for 45 years, was a 
member of St. John's 
Evangelical Lutheran Church, 
Newburg, and a 4-H leader for 
many years.

She is survived by a broth­
er, Clarence (Genevieve) Kurtz 
of the town of Farmington; a 
sister, Vera Schall of West 
Bend; a sister-in-law, Elsie 
Hausfeldt of West Bend; nieces, 
nephews; other relatives and 
friends.

She was preceded in death 
by her parents, husband and a 
brother-in-law, Dan Schall.

Funeral services were held 
Wednesday, June 2 at 1 p.m. at 
St. John's Evangelical Lutheran 
Church. Newburg. Rev. Gregory 
L. Bey officiated. Burial fol­
lowed in St. John's Cemetery, 
Newburg.

Visitation was on Tuesday

at the Myrhum Funeral Home 
from 5 to 8 p.m. and Wednesday 
at the church from noon until 
lime of service.

MARLIN SCHNEIDER

Marlin Schneider, 71, for­
merly of Kewaskum, passed 
away on Sunday, May 30, 1993 
at St. Joseph Community 
Hospital in West Bend.

He was born on July 4, 
1921 in Kewaskum the son of 
the late Walter and Vionelda 
(Geidel) Schneider. Mr. 
Schneider served in the U.S. 
Army during WWII. He owned 
and operated the Marlin 
Schneider Tavern in Kewaskum 
for many years retiring in 1977. 
He was a former member of the 
Peace United Church of Christ 
in Kewaskum.

Survivors include a nephew 
Jim Schneider of Campbell­
sport.

He was preceded in death 
by his parents and a brother, 
Ray Schneider.

Graveside services with 
Military Riles will be held at the 
Peace U.C.C. Cemetery in 
Kewaskum at 3:00 p.m. on 
Thursday, June 3, 1993 with 
Rev. James Benin officiating. 
Cremation has taken place. 
There will be no visitation.

Miller Funeral Home 
Kewaskum is serving the fami­
ly

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to thank 

Rev. James Benin, the Women's 
Guild of Peace United Church 
of Christ, pallbearers, extended 
family and friends for the lovely 
memorial service and commu­
nion thereafter of our mother 
and grandmother, Mrs. Elverena 
Wesenberg (nee Becker-Geidel) 
who died on April 28, 1993.

Mrs. Sharon (Wesenberg) Dickey 
Darryl Wesenberg and Carol

Dr & Mrs. Richard and Nancy 
Wesenberg

Richard, Jr. and Katie Wesenberg 
Kristen Wesenberg 
Karen Wesenberg

Lasting 
Memorials
See us for a permanent tribute to your loved 
one.
We'll help you design the perfect monument 
in marble, granite or bronze
- at a cost that takes your budget into con­
sideration. (Duplication of existing markers
is also available.)

1-800-924-4125

IN MEMORY

In loving memory of BEU­
LAH KOCH.

Time passes by and quietly 
steals days and years.

Changes are many and always 
will be, but the love that 
you gave each of us and the 
love we feel for you, will 
last forever.

There isn't a day that has 
passed that something has­
n't reminded us of you.

The warm sunshine, a smiling 
face, a friendly hello 
flowers blooming, and car­
rots in the refrigerator are 
all wonderful thoughts of 
you.

We wish we could see you 
again, but we'll have

To wait until we join you in 
heaven.

We're glad we had as many 
years with you as we did

And each of us is glad you did­
n't have to suffer anymore, 

When God called you home one 
year ago, June 7.

We love and miss you, 
Your family

IN MEMORY

In loving memory of 
RANDY GIESE, who passed 
away twenty years ago, June 3, 
1973:
This month comes to us with 

deep regret
It brings the day we will never 

forget.
His memory still is very dear.
So many times he seems so 

near.
No longer here our lives to 

share,
But in our hearts he is always 

there.
We miss him more each year 
Some day we'll meet where 

there are no tears.

Sadly missed by the family

(lassified ads are a UK, bargain. To 
place yours, call 626-2626.

Visit our large showroom, 
or call for an in-home 

appointment.

WEST BEND 
MONUMENT

25 E. Washington St. 
334-3871 • West Bend

Ast east Side of ths Railroad Tracks

Wally Miller. George Gumm & 
Gary Koenlngs 

Owner Earl Hllgendorf



Fred J. Bury, Executive Director 
Of St. Joseph's Hospital Retires
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Ballonist Visits Holy Trinity
WEST BEND... Keeping St. 
Joseph’s Hospital “fiscally fit” 
had been the major focus of Fred 
J. Bury, the hospital’s executive 
director.

Bury, 57, retired after 26 years 
of service, and concluded his ad­
ministrative duties at the hospital 
on Friday, May 28.

According to Robert T. Rolfs, 
president and chairman of St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital’s 
board, Bury has been a tremen­
dous asset for both the hospital 
and the West Bend community, 
and attributes the financial suc­
cess of the hospital to Bury’s ef­
ficiency and vision.

“Fred and I have had a close 
hospital working relationship for 
more than 25 years. During that 
time, he has served his communi­
ty well and has responded to the 
health care needs of a growing 
population. He has been extreme­
ly cost conscious without sacrific­
ing quality of care.” Rolfs said.

The hospital, which opened its 
doors in 1930. was originally 
owned and operated by the Sisters 
of the Divine Savior.

In 1969, St. Joseph’s Com­
munity Hospital of West Bend. 
Inc., became a separate, not-for- 
profit corporation directed by a 
19-member board. In conjunction 
with this reorganization, Fred 
Bury was appointed as the 
hospital’s first lay administrator.

Under his leadership the

Commencement Exercises Held at 
St. Mary’s Springs High School

Commencement exercises were 
held in Hutter Gymnasium. St. 
Mary’s Springs High School, 255 
County Rd. K. Fond du Lac, at 
2:30 p.m. on Sunday, May 23.

James B. Simon, President of 
the Board of Directors and 
Thomas J. Borek, Principal, 
presented diplomas to the Class 
of 1993.

Class Valedictorian was Joshua 
Fox and Class Salutatonan was 
Earl Martin.

Members of the graduating 
class included: Steffanie Baierl, 
Michael Baranowski, Ivy 
Bateman, Kevin Bencz. Laura 
Berendt, Chad Beres, Chris 
Beres, Peter Boettcher. Jennifer 
Bongert. Sara Braun. Patrick 
Brenner, Karin Broecker. Daniel 
Costello, Christopher Dobyns,

Serving Your Area
PROPANE 
GAS 
Service 
for
Home - Farm or industry
Cylinder & Bulk Deliveries

NO TANK CHARGE
Serving Ges Customers 

for Over 50 Years

BOEHLKE BOTTLED 
GAS CORP.

Plants located at Jackson 
and Random Lake

West Bend 338-8011 
Random Lake 944-2229 

TOLL FREE 
1-800-448-3388

hospital expanded its facilities and 
services many times to meet the 
demands of an ever-growing 
population. He was instrumental 
in the direction and orchestration 
of two major building 
expansions.

The first occurred in 1974, and 
included a $5,500,000 addition to 
the west side of the hospital’s 
campus. The new facility increas­
ed the hospital’s bed capacity 
from 97 to 115 and provided 
necessary space for the incor­
poration of new services such as 
nuclear medicine and special 
radiology procedures.

To meet the needs of outpatient 
care, St. Joseph’s added 47,000 
square feet to the hospital in 
1990.
This $8 million project took more 
than a year to complete and add­
ed a new east and northwest wing 
to the hospital.

Although no additional beds 
were added, a new maternity unit 
was built, complete with rooms 
for labor, delivery, recovery and 
post-partum care (LDRP rooms). 
In addition, every department 
within the hospital was either ex­
panded or remodeled, and many 
were relocated to streamline the 
accessibility needed for outpatient 
services.

Consistent with his philosophy 
of staying “fiscally fit,” Bury 
and the board of directors in­
troduced the Capital Develop­
ment concept to the community in

Jennifer DuBeau, Martin Egan, 
Amy Ellestad, Aaron Everson, 
Jill Feudner, Joshua Fox, Jason 
Gellings, Paul Goebel, Stephen 
Halle, Alan Hietpas, Daniel 
Hillebrand, John Hoeppner, Don 
Horn, Christine Janzen, Carol 
Jones, Anthony Jung, Jonathan 
Kaull, Joseph Keim. Erin King, 
Jessica King, Kason Klumpyan, 
Tammy Krause, Brian Krueger, 
Sarah Kuras, Lisa Lange, 
William Laudolff. Katrina Lind­
berg. Andrea Loehr. Earl Martin, 
Thomas McCormick, Patricia 
McCourt. Brian McCulley. Sara 
Michels, Amy Jo Mickiewicz, 
Stacy Middleton, Gena Miller, 
Heidi Niemeier. Jason Nimmer, 
Tammy Oelke, Michael Olm, 
Lori Petrie. Ryan Plummer. Da­
mian Rach. Aaron Sabel. Joseph 
Sanfelippo, Jeanine Schaeve, 
Amy Schraven, Jill Schroeder, 
Clay Schwartz, Kristin Seeley, 
Nicole Shannon, William 
Sheridan, Lisa Smith. Brian Stef­
fen, Brian Stemper, S. Matthew 
Strachota, Jeffrey Stueber, Daniel 

Thuerwachter, Jennifer Tighe, 
Robin Vermillion, Julie Versluys. 
Erin Weiland, Gregory Wilkum. 
Peter Winkler, Cynthia Wirtz, 
and John Zehren.

~Auto Service

ROGER & DAN’S 
AUTO SERVICE

“Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area"

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum

626-2888 "Jtrl
24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE §®

1977. Annually, this organized 
fund-raising program has provid 
ed dollars to purchase new equip­
ment as well as providing finan­
cial support for physical im­
provements and additions. This 
has allowed a significant reduc­
tion in debt service and has kept 
charges at a minimum.

When asked about ac­
complishments over the past 
quarter century, Bury remains 
humble. He is. however, proud of 
the fact that since the late 1970s 
the hospital has remained virtual­
ly debt free. And. although health 
care costs have increased 
significantly over the past several 
years. St. Joseph’s has continued 
to provide progressive, quality 
care while maintaining the lowest 
average cost per patient discharge 
of hospitals located within 
southeastern Wisconsin.

Bury conveys that St. Joseph's 
has remained financially sound 
because of the effort, knowledge, 
skills and concerns of the entire 
hospital family... the board of 
directors, medical staff, 
employees and volunteers. In ad­
dition, he attributes this success 
to the moral and financial support 
that the community has continual­
ly given to St. Joseph’s.

“The interaction between the 
hospital and community has 
resulted in a good working rela­
tionship. We have continued to 
provide state-of-the-art services, 
and community support has 
enabled us to remain debt free 
through most of the iast 20 years. 
This, in turn, has helped to main­
tain a lower cost for service.” 
Bury said.

Paul Petri Earns 
Professional Honors

Paul D. Petri of Bob Fish 
Pontiac-Cadillac-GMC, Inc., 
West Bend has achieved the 
Master Technician qualification 
level in the 1992 GMC Truck 
“5-Star Performers” Transporta­
tion Technicians Guild program, 
an annual retail truck service 
recognition activity designed to 
improve the performance of 
technicians nationwide.

In conjunction with the 
Transportation Technicians 
Guild, a professional organization 
comprised of 6.000 service 
technicians nationwide. Paul has 
been recognized for achieving 
Guild Master Technician status. 
The program’s status levels are 
based on points accumulated in 
several areas including national 
certification by Automotive Ser­
vice Excellence (ASE), Guild 
Certification, and the successful 
completion of designated training 
courses and bimonthly quizzes.

The high level of performance 
reached by Paul demonstrates the 
commitment and enthusiasm of a 
true professional.

Students from Holy Trinity gathered to see the hot air bal- 
loon, as part of the celebration during their Folk Fair.

Statesman photo hy Andrew Kuehl

Letters to the Editor
Letter to the Editor:

To the 1993 Kewaskum High 
School Graduates:

I want to thank you for 
standing up to the current trend 
to not have prayer at commence­
ment!

God has blessed America 
tremendously and now it seems 
America wants to ban God from 
everything He has given us or 
allowed us to acquire and do.

It used to be "In God We 
Trust" and now it seems that 
people think they are gods and 
only trust themselves. Our 
Constitution does not ban the 
students from praying and I 
commend you for saying you 
want to acknowledge that time 
in that special evening in your 
lives.

Stand up for God and He 
will guide and direct you. Don't 
buckle under the liberals and the 
threats of the ACLU. Someday 
they will be asked the explana­
tion - of the decisions in their 
life as will you and I. God is the 
milker and sustainer of all and, 
please graduates, never forget 
Him. Miike Him number one in 
your lives.

God Bless each one of you. 
I am proud to be an American 
who can still pray and today I 
am proud to be living in the 
Kewaskum School District, 
where our youth of today and 
our men and women of tomor­
row skxxl up against the seem­

All some people want for their 
birthdays is not to be remind­
ed of it.

ing majority that are moving 
away from God and the freedom 
I Ie has given us, to the tactics of 
the liberals who are trying to get 
God out of everything He has 
blessed us with.

Watch Out! When God is 
removed, we shall fall and free­
dom will be gone.

Keep God in your life.

Pat Crass

Small Business 
Counseling

Confused about your new 
business idea? Do you have 
questions about business expan­
sion? Can you use some assis- 
tance in financial, personnel, or 
general management of your 
enterprise?

Call U.W.-Extension for a 
free, confidential counseling 
with Chuck Wise, Area 
Business agent, at 335-5204.

Individual appointments 
will be scheduled for 90 minute 
periods from 9:00 a.m. until 
5:00 p.m. on Tuesday, June 8 
and Monday, June 28. 
Interviews are held at the UW- 
Center, West Bend Campus, 400 
University Drive, West Bend.
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School District Chapter I Bowling Party Held

On Thursday, May 20, over 100 parents and students participated in the Second 
Annual Chapter I Family Night. Chapter I students enjoyed a free game of bowling 
compliments of Chapter I. The local 7 UP company generously donated free soda 
to all participants. The photo on the left shows Linda Gerlach assisting her son 
and Melissa Gerlach, Grade 2, Farmington, prepares to bowl in the photo on the 
right.

State of Wisconsin
Circuit Court
Washington County 
Probate

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

File No. 93-IN-66
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF EL VERENA L. 
WESENBERG.

An application has been 
filed for Informal 
Administration of the estate of 
the above named person, 
Washington County, Wisconsin, 
whose post office address was 
1538 Riverview Drive, 
Kewaskum, WI 53040.

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. Ail creditors claims must 

be filed on or before August 14, 
1993 or be barred;

BY THE COURT: 
Kristine M.Deis 
Probate Registrar 
May 14,1993

Atty. Roger W. McKenna 
McKenna Law Office 
114 Main Street, P.O. Box 550 
Kewaskum, WI 53040-0550 
#1006965

May 20, 27 & June 3

A Message from the Postmaster
Hello Kewaskum Statesman 

readers and how are you all doing 
today? This weekend, my parents 
and some “Fondy” friends are 
driving over to Kewaskum. We 
plan to visit the Post Office, eat 
breakfast and then “shop till we 
drop’’ in Kewaskum. Hope to see 
many of you and introduce you to 
my parents. Onto some Postal 
news.

In this week’s column, I have 
some “tips for properly addressing 
letters.” Did you know that the 
Guiness Book of Records reports 
that the longest personal letter ever 
recorded (based on word count) 
was 1,113,747 words? It took Jac­
queline Jones of Lindale, Texas 
eight months to write the letter, 
sent to her sister, Jean Stewart of 
Springfield, Maine.

The first letter to travel by air in 
the country was written by Presi­
dent George Washington. A Fren­
chman, Jean-Pierrs Blanchard car­
ried it in a balloon from 
Philadelphia to a small clearing in 
the New Jersey woods 15 miles 
away. The date? January 9. 1793.

Thomas Brown, later the gover­
nor of Florida, invented the 
mailbox in 1810. It consisted of a 
series of numbered pigeon-holes 
with glass fronts, enabling the peo­
ple to see whether there was any 
mail for them in their respective 
boxes.

A letter has the power to express 
thoughts and feelings and touch 
those we care about in a way that’s 
more memorable and lasting than 
other forms of communication. 
Keeping alive the art of letter 
writing also helps promote literacy 
in our country. YOU can help the 
Postal Service to speed delivery of 
your letter by making sure it's com­
pletely addressed and that the ad­
dress is legible.

No one likes to have a letter 
returned or misdelivered. Making 
your letters “smart" can help you 
avoid problems with insufficient or 
improper addressing which can 
cause mail to be delayed, 
misdirected or returned.

Studies indicate that 33 percent 
of the mail entering our mailstream 
contain one or more deficiencies. 
We see hundreds of letters every 
day, but unlike a misdialed phone

number, most improperly address­
ed mail still gets delivered to the 
correct party. It is just time con­
suming and expensive for us to 
handle. To help you better unders­
tand proper addressing, I would 
like to recommend the following 
tips:

-As best you can, capitalize 
everything in the address and type 
or print clearly.

—ELIMINATE punctuation in 
your addressing.

—Use common abbreviations 
such as ST, RD, Cir and BLVD.

—Use the two-letter state ab­
breviations found in pamphlets 
available (free of charge) at the 
Post Office or call us at 626-2575 
and we will be more than happy to 
assist you.

-Use the proper zip code. Did 
you know that if you address a let­
ter and erroneously put the wrong 
zip code... it will go to the “er­
roneous zip code" location and will 
cause delay as it will have to be 
corrected manually and reentered 
into the mail stream from that 
location?

—Don’t know the zip code? Call 
us as we will be more than happy 
to assist you. If you are looking one 
up at the Post Office, the first page 
of the “state listing" will tell you 
the zip code or direct you to the 
proper page for a city that has more 
than one zip code.

In addition to the above tips, the 
destination address should appear 
in the middle of the envelope with 
the recipient’s name on the top line. 
The next line should contain the 
recipient’s street address followed 
by the Post Office Box (if ap­

TOWN OF KEWASKUM
ROAD REPAIR BIDS

The Kewaskum Town Board will accept sealed bids for seal 
coating, hot mix and cold mix. Price per ton basis. Contact Town 
Chairman George Allmann (626-4716) for specs.

Bids opened at Town Board Meeting, Monday, June 21, 1993, 
8 p.m., Town Hall, 9019 Kettle Moraine Drive, Kewaskum.

Barbara Wenzlaff, 
Town Clerk

6 3-2t

plicable). If for a multi-unit com­
plex or apartment building, the 
room or apartment number should 
be placed to the right of the street 
address. The bottom line MUST 
show the recipient’s city, state and 
ZIP code. Examples of “smart ad­
dressing" are:
JOHN DOE
1717 WASHINGTON ST PO BOX 1212 
MILWAUKEE WI 53201-1212

JOHN DOE
ABC MOVING COMPANY 
2222 GREEN ST APT 216 
MILWAUKEE WI 53222-1123

As always, we are here to assist 
you in any way with your postal 
questions, suggestions, concerns 
and problems. Delay and/or 
misdelivery of your mail is one 
of my utmost concerns. I may not 
always give you the answer that 
you like, but I will listen and do 
my utmost to give you the best 
possible service that we can. We 
are here to serve YOU... our 
customers!

Until next time... TRY to have 
a good day and a HAPPY 
EVERY DAY!

Your Postmaster, Bonnie

It’s estimated that in 
the year 1650, the pop­
ulation of the world 
was 500 million.

Village Board 
Meeting Monday

Public notice is hereby 
given that the next meeting of 
the Village of Kewaskum, 
Wisconsin, Village Board is 
scheduled for Monday evening, 
June 7, 1993, at 8:00 p.m. in the 
Council Room of the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street.

The agendas for meeting 
are prepared as of Wednesday 
noon preceding the meeting and 
are available at the office of the 
clerk at the Municipal Building 
on Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are 
also posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and 
lobby of the Valley Bank.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

North and South America 
are moving apart at the 
rate of two inches a year.

Town of Kewaskum
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 
For Conditional Use Permit
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a public hearing will be held 

before the Town Board at the Kewaskum Town Hall, 9019 Ket­
tle Moraine Drive, Kewaskum, 7:30 P.M. June 21, 1993, to con­
sider the application of Ronald and Karen Ellefson for the is­
suance of a Conditional Use Permit under the Town Zoning Or­
dinance, Section l .26(3)(y) Granting the permit will allow the 
applicants to start a bed-and-breakfast overnight rental at their 
residence which is located in Section 20, 4134 Ridge Road. 
Town of Kewaskum.

Dated May 28. 1993

Barbara Wenzlaff 
6-3-21 Zoning Secretary

BEECHWOOD 
SPORTSMAN'S CLUB 

May 27, 1993
W L

Beechwood Bunch 6 0
Fillmore Trap 4 2
Hide-Away 4 2
Four Seasons 4 2
Parnell Tavern 316 216
Idlewile Inn 3 3
Enrights Tap3 3
Bar-N-Annex 2!6 3'6
Greg's Tap 2 4
Boar's Nest 2 4
K & D Excavating 1 5
Ike’s Repair 1 5

74x75 - Jeff Schroeter.
49x50 - Ira Heberer.
25 Straight - Rodney Krahn.
24x25 - Mike Rodenkirch. Al Tip- 

pel, Moose. Kevin Lemke, Dick 
Rortvedt, Jeff Scannell. Mike Schleif. 
Dave Koeppe, Lyman Fischer.

HONE-KOR TUESDAY NITE
MEN S LEAGUE - May 25, 1993

Top Teams This Week: 1. Han­
dicappers - 5; 2. Regal Ware 2-5; 3. 
Gruber Toolers - 5; 4. Wild Ones - 
5; 5. Rustic Timbers - 5; 6. Par Nons 
- 5; 7. Clothes Clinic - 5; 8. LR Divot 
Diggers - 4; 9. Sentry Mixers - 3.

Low Gross: 1. Joe Doherty. 35; 2. 
Jim Korth. Bob Roloff and Paul 
Kostelac - 39.

Low Net: 1. Larry McClarran and 
Jim Volesky; 2. Scott Rohlinger. Joe 
Doherty. Jim Korth. Dale Puestow. 
Bob Roloff. Todd Fehlhoffer and 
Paul Kostelac - 33.

Low Team Net: Handicappers - 
137.

Highlights: Jerry Koch and Pete 
Kostelac won the special events.

Joe Doherty had two birdies.
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ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE

Rate: $2.00 up to 20 words; over 20 words - add 10C per word

Call 626-2626 To Place Your Classified
Ad Deadline - Noon on Tuesday

CLASSIFIED AD POLICY
All classified ads must be paid in advance. Classified ads phoned in or brought to our office 
must be paid by noon on Tuesday of the week you want the ad published. The Only excep­
tion will be for those businesses who have regular running accounts with the Statesman

RUMMAGE 5 year old Arabian mare, 
bay, trail ridden. Call after 6:00 
p.m. 626-2570. 
5-6-tf

HUGE MULTI-FAMILY RUM­
MAGE - June 5, 8:00 to 4:00 
p.m. Sleeping bag, baby 
clothes, woman clothes, Jr. 
golf clubs, cross county skis, 
bike, 20", boots, houseware 
items, raft, comic books, toys 
and much much more. 811 
Memorial Dr., Kewaskum.

6-3-1p

5 FAMILY RUMMAGE SALE 
on the corner of Western and 
down Braatz Dr., in 
Kewaskum. Lots of misc. June 
4 & 5 from 7 to 5 p.m. 6-3-1 p

RUMMAGE SALE June 4 & 
5th, 348 3rd St., Kewaskum, 
626-4735, across from high 
school, 8:00 to 4:30. Baseball 
card '82 and older,weight 
bench and extra weights. 2 
refrigerator coolers, 2 
dressers, Sanwa 10 speed 
bike, prom and homecoming 
dresses, wedding dress size 
16 all cleaned. Maternity 
clothes, girls & boys clothes, 
infant to 3 T, teens clothes 3 to 
13. Men's and women' clothes 
all sizes, wooden playpen, like 
new, lots of books, Little Tykes 
toys, Texas Instrument, dish­
washer, 1978 Dodge station 
wagon, womens black stretch 
ski pants size 10 regular like 
new and lots more.

6-3-1p

NEIGHBORHOOD RUM­
MAGE - June 4 & 5 at 1414 
Bilgo Lane, 1444 Parkview, 
366 Third St., 8:00 - 4:00.

6-3-1p

BIG MOVING - RUMMAGE - 
First time, indoors. Swing set, 
good baby items, crib, high 
chair, many toys, wringer 
washer, misc.household some 
clothing, canning jars,col­
lectibles, farm items, hay 
wagon, gravity box, combine, 
misc. horse tack, pony saddle, 
list goes on, something for 
everyone. Boltonville.Hwy., 84 
east 1 1/2 miles to 9060 Hwy. 
84. Fri. & Sat., June 4 & 5, 9-4. 
6-3-1p
CHRISTIAN WOMEN'S RUM­
MAGE and BAKE SALE — 
Fri., June 4, 9 a.m. to 7 p.m. 
1/2 price, 5-7 p.m. Hot lunch, 
homemade desserts & raffle 
available all day. Holy Trinity 
Church Hall, Kewaskum.

5-20-3t

NEED TUPPERWARE - 
Contact Jenny, 626-2750.

5-13-4p
FOR SALE -- Standing Hay - 
Kettle Moraine State Forest 
land. Auction date: June 15, 
1993. For further information 
call 626-2116. 6-3-11

FOR SALE - Standing alfalfa 
hay, 2 row 3 point cultivator 
Fox short hopper blower. 533- 
4167. 6-3-2p

HELP WANTED - Young man 
to mow lawn and do odd jobs. 
Full-time and after school. Call 
533-5028. 5-27-tf
EXCELLENT CHILDCARE - 
In my home. Fenced in back­
yard, playmates. Good refer­
ences.Full-time, one child.Call 
626-8205. 5-27-3p

FOR RENT

HELP WANTED
HELP WANTED - A reliable, 
mature, dependable, friendly 
person delivering forty pound 
parcels in Milwaukee area. 
Repeat customers to be deliv­
ered to weekly, some monthly. 
Work is five days a week. Must 
have excellent driving record, 
and work as your own boss. 
Respond to P.O. Box 98, 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040. 5-13-4p

CHILDCARE NEEDED - 3 
days per week for 8 and 9 year 
old. My home in New Prospect 
or will consider your home. 
Reference required. 533-5143. 
5-6-tf

WAITRESS and kitchen help. 
Eckl's Main Street Inn. 626- 
4328. 4-1-tf

CHILDCARE NEEDED - For 
summer months, afternoon 
only, 12-4 p.m., in Village of 
Kewaskum for 11 year old. 
626-2789 after 4:30. 5-27-2p 
FARM HELP WANTED - 
Experienced person for 
pipeline milking and general 
farm work. $1,800 per month 
starting pay plus benefits (414) 
285-3020. 5-27-2p

FOR SALE
FOR SALE - One Spring 
heifer due end of May, plus 
open heifer. 626-2594. 5-27-2t

FOR SALE - Gray Arab - 
gelding - 12 years old. Goes 
Western or English, has all 
shots, wormed. Call 626-4534.

5-27-2p

DIET MAGIC - Lose up to 30 
pounds in 30 days for $30. 
100% natural, doctor recom­
mended. 1-800-437-4946.

5-20-8p

HELP WANTED - The West 
Bend Cinema is looking for a 
few reliable people for part- 
time workdays evenings and 
weekend hours. Apply at West 
Bend Cinema between 7:00 
p.m. and 9:00 p.m. or call 334- 
5466. 6-3-11

WORK WANTED - I would 
like to do lawn or yardwork on 
the west side of Kewaskum. 
Call 626-2610 ask for Mike. 

6-3-1t
HELP WANTED - Part time 
cleaning lady weekend morn­
ings, maybe week days. 
Mature lady preferred. Call 
626-8414. 6-3-11

HELP WANTED
Housekeeping, part - time 
position , A.M.'s only;
NURSING ASSISTANTS, 
part-time, second shift. Call St. 
Joseph's Convent, Campbell­
sport, 533-8351.

5-27-2t

BRAND NEW two bedroom 
luxury apartments with 
garages. All appliances 
including washer and dryer, no 
pets. 444-2300, 533-4829 or 
626-2765. 12-17-1 p-tf

DELUXE TWO BEDROOM 
apartment in Kewaskum. 
Appliances included. Call 626- 
4321 or 626-2653. 1-28-tf

ONE, TWO AND THREE bed­
room apartments and town­
houses. Rustic Timbers 
Apartments. Phone 334-1395.

TF

FOR RENT - Available in 
Lomira July 1st, luxury two- 
bedroom apartment, has self­
cleaning range, refrigerator, 
washer, dryer, air conditioning, 
attached garage for one car 
with storage. Off street parking 
for second car. $550. Call 923- 
2362. 5-13-4t

SERVICES
SEWING - Light mending, 
sewing, alterations. Call 626- 
4495.

WORK WANTED - Lloyd's 
Home Maintenance. No job 
too small. Repairs, remodel­
ing, carpentry, painting, var­
nishing, wallpapering, wood­
graining, ceramic tile, etc. 
Lloyd M. Ebert. 533-8013.

4-30-tf
PIANO TEACHER - Will give 
piano lessons in my home. 
Experienced, references avail­
able. Lori Schoofs 626-2525.

5-27-4p

MISC.

HAVE CASH BUYER for 
ranch home in Kewaskum. 
Call Wendy Coulter Coldwell 
Banker Spectrum Real Estate 
of WEST BEND at 334-3334 
or 338-3296. 2-4-tf

Call for Free 
Market Analysis

NORB
ROHLlNGER
Eighteen years 
experience in 
meeting people’s 
real estate needs

Residence 
626-2332

334-1700

BICYCLES - Sales and 
Service Wally's Bike Shop, 208 
North Ave., Kewaskum.

4-30-tf

TIRES - There's always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan's Service. 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 626- 
2888. 4-30-tf

RESIDENTIAL - Building lots 
for sale. Approximately four 
miles north of West Bend. 
Terms: Call 334-7306. Licen- 
see/Owner. 4-30 tf

KEN'S HOME IMPROVE­
MENTS, REPAIRS Carpentry 
of all kinds. Work guaranteed. 
Free estimates. Call 335- 
2400. 4-15-tf

NOVENA TO THE 
BLESSED VIRGIN MARY

( Never known to fail). O most 
beautiful flower of Mount Carmel, 
fruitful vine, splendor of Heaven, 
Blessed Mother of the Son of God, 
Immaculate Virgin, assist me in this 
my necessity. O Star of the Sea, 
help me and show me here you are 
my Mother O Holy Mary, Mother 
of God, Queen of Heaven and 
Earth, I humbly beseech you from 
the bottom of my heart to succor me 
in this necessity. There are none that 
can withstand your power. O show 
me herein you are my Mother. O 
Mary, Conceived Without Sin, pray 
for us who have recourse to thee 
(three times). Holy Mary, I place 
this cause in your hands (three 
times). Sweet Mother, I place this 
cause in your hands (three times). 
Holy Spirit, you who solve all prob­
lems, light all roads so that I can 
attain my goal. You gave me the 
divine gift to forgive and forget al) 
evil against me and that in all 
instances in my life you are with 
me. I want in this short prayer to 
thank you for all things as I confirm 
once again that I never want to be 
separated from you or your mercy 
towards me and mine. Amen.

The prayer must be said three 
days, even after the request is grant­
ed, and the favor must be published.

CAMPBELLSPORT SPORTSMAN 
CLUB TUESDAY NITE 

TRAP LEAGUE - May 25
CC’s over Allenton Sportsman

Club 103-102.
Yahr’s over Rochwite Septic 

Systems 104-101.
West Bend Company over Van 

Beek Cycle 110-105.
Dundee Sand and Gravel over 

Hillcrest Inn 114-102.
Moose’s Waterin’ Hole over 

Citizen’s/Weis 107-100.
K.P. Services over Amerahn I 

101-99.
STANDINGS W L
Dundee Sand. Gravel 6 I
Van Beek Cycle 5 2
Yahr’s 5 2
Herrick Construction 4 2
Moose’s Waterin’ Hole 4 3
Amerahn I 3‘A 3Vi
Hillcrest Inn 3W 3'A
Citizens/Weis 3 4
C.C.’s 3 4
West Bend Company 3 4
K.P. Services 3 4
Allenton Sportsman Cluh 2 5
Rochwite’s Septic Sytems 2 5
Amerahn II 1 5

25x25 - Mark Rochwite, Dan 
Trapp.

24x25 - Dave Limbach. Rodney 
Wagner, Mark Larson, Terry Wall, 
Tom Foshag, Darwin Buslaff. Mike 
Kampen. George Moser.

$$ NOTICE $$
Paying 

Immediate 
CASH

TOP DOLLAR for all 
your unwanted 

GOLD, 
DENTAL SILVER, 

DIAMONDS, & OLD 
WATCHES and most 

OLD COINS
CALLAWAY 

& CO.
409 Main St., Kewaskum 

626-4609

Ann 
Enright

HOME: 692-2607

I am now associated with 
REALTY WORLD 

WEST GROVE 
"You’ll get the same great service!” 

Call for a free market evaluation of your home

REALTY WORLD-
2395 W. Washington St., West Bend 

OFFICE 334-5589

OPEN HOUSE SUNDAY , JUNE 6 -1 to 3
DIRECTIONS: Hwy. 45 N to Kewaskum to Old Fond du Lac Rd., right to 
Wildlife Drive 
________________ 1171 WILDLIFE DRIVE _________

Country Reflections Condominiums of Kewaskum
One unit left in Phase I $69,900. Phase II soon to be 

under construction $74,900.

GORGEOUS SUNSETS! 
$124,900. Spacious contemporary bi­
level on end of cul-de-sac. 4 bedrooms, 
oak cabinets & planning desk in 
kitchen, dinette patio door to deck, 
stone fireplace enhances living room, 
huge family room.
#612P. Ask for Ann!

Call Collect • ANN ENRIGHT 692-2607 *Showingsb^Appointment*
1700 E. Washington St.. West Bend

•Luxury 2 bedroom units
• In-Uni laundry
•2 bathrooms
•Deluxe kitchen with appliances
•Garages and parking
•Beautiful view of Kettle Moraine Hills
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YOUR WISCONSIN GOVERNMENT 
Financing Local Education: 
Now a Hot Political Issue

By Wisconsin Taxpayers Alliance

The impact on property taxes 
of financing local education has 
been a continuing political issue 
in Wisconsin. It achieved greater 
political prominence at the 1993 
session of the legislature with 
Governor Tommy G. Thomp­
son’s (R) proposals to provide 
property tax relief.

T he governor has proposed that 
property tax rates for each local 
unit of government, except voca­
tional. technical and adult educa­
tion districts, be frozen at the 
1992 rate. He also seeks changes 
in the binding arbitration law to 
limit annual increases in local

employes'government
compensation.

REACTION TO 
GOVERNOR S PROPOSAL

Based on polling information, 
the general public appears to 
favor the property tax rate freeze. 
Also supporting the concept are 
the Wisconsin Manufacturers and 
Commerce and other business 
organizations. Most organizations 
representing local governments 
either oppose some aspect of the 
governor’s proposal or oppose 
the concept.

Organizations representing 
local government employes, in­
cluding the Wisconsin Education 
Association Council (WEAC) 
representing teachers, oppose the 
property tax freeze. WEAC sug­
gests instead that the state pick up 
65% to 75% of the total costs of 
public education. WEAC has in­
dicated it is willing to discuss 
possible changes in the arbitration 
law if the legislature and gover­
nor are willing to discuss chang­
ing the Wisconsin school finance 
system.

The Wisconsin Association of 
School Boards (WASB) has 
recommended a 4-year 4% limit 
on annual increases in teachers’ 
compensation, compared to the 
6.9% of recent years. WASB 
would not accept cost controls or 
a levy freeze without some 
change in bargaining and arbitra­
tion, and wants state school aids 
to be increased by at least 6% in 
each year of the next biennium.

Within Government. Although 
the Wisconsin Department of 
Public Instruction (DPI) is a state 
agency, it is headed by an elected 
constitutional officer, the 
superintendent of public instruc­
tion. This allows the agency more 
independence than state agencies 
headed by gubernatorial 
appointees.

The department publicly op­
poses the governor's property tax 
rate freeze. It has given local 
school districts information show­
ing the effects of the freeze on 
their districts and has urged them 
to let the public know the effects 
of the freeze. By law, school 
districts must give teachers notice 
of nonrenewal of contract by 
March 15. Some districts have 
given such notices for the 
1993-94 school year anticipating 
that the property tax rate freeze 
proposal will be enacted and their 
districts would not have sufficient 
growth in equalized value to 
finance any rise in expenditures 
if no rate increase is allowed.

In a recently issued memo to

school districts, DPI pointed out 
the dire effects on local education 
if the tax rate freeze is enacted. 
The memo stated, “A levy rate 
freeze and less state resources 
forces Wisconsin schools into the 
same situation as our neighbors... 
salary freezes, layoffs, program 
cutbacks, larger class sizes, 
elimination of essential programs, 
and possible school closings prior 
to the end of the school year.” 
When pressed for the names of 
districts that might close, DPI of­
ficials were reluctant to identify 
any. The memo also said the 
state’s share of local costs had 
declined.

State Budget Director Richard 
Chandler, representing the 
Thompson administration, fired 
back with a letter suggesting the 
DPI memo was misleading and 
engaged in “scare tactics.” Mr. 
Chandler argued that Governor 
Thompson has provided for in­
creased financial support for 
schools. It appears the semantics 
of the disagreement revolves 
around “share” (the percentage 
of school costs paid by state aids) 
and “amount” (the dollars of 
state aids paid). The definition of 
state aids is also an issue.

SCHOOL
FINANCIAL STATISTICS
The table below shows, on a 

statewide basis, local schools 
costs, enrollment and funding 
from 1983 through 1993 and pro­
jections through 1995. Local 
school costs will increase from 
$2,580 billion in 1983 to a pro­
jected $5,829 billion in 1995, or 
126%. During the same period, 
enrollment will rise from 784,830 
to 866,268 or 10%. The cost per 
student will increase from $3,287 
to $6,729 or 105%. The school 
property levy will go from 
$1,374 billion to a projected 
$3.156 billion in 1995, or 130%.

The State’s Share. The con­
tinuing disagreement over how

Napoleon and took three decades to complete. It’s equi­
valent to a 16-story building.

★ NOTICE ★ 
by the 

VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM 
OPERATOR’S LICENSES

Wisconsin State Statutes 66.054 (11). Notice is hereby given 
that all Operator’s (bartender’s) Licenses shall expire on June 
30, 1993. Those desiring to renew their Operator’s License 
may do so upon application in writing. An Operator's License 
may be issued to persons 18 years of age or over, who are 
of good moral character and have met the requirement of the 
State of Wisconsin.
There shall be upon all premises operated under a Class "A" 
or Class "B” license, at all times, the licensee of some per­
son who has an Operator’s License and who is responsible.

NOTE: If you don’t want your Operator’s License to lapse 
your application must be on file at the Municipal Building by 
June 15, 1993, so the Village Board may take action on it 
June 21, 1993.

LOCAL SCHOOL COSTS, ENROLLMENT AND FUNDING 
1982-83 Through 1994-95

Instruction.

Ending 
June 30:

Coste 
(billions)

Enroll­
ment

Cost 
Per 

Pupil

School
Levy 

(billions)

State School Aids
State School Aids A 
Prop. Tax Credits*

Amount 
(billions)

% of
Costs

Amount 
(billions)

% of
Costs

1983 $2,580 784,830 $3,287 $1,374 $1,019 39.5% $1,208 46.8%
1984 2.723 774,646 3,515 1.482 1.054 38.7 1.204 44.2
1985 2.918 767,542 3,802 1.566 1.117 38.3 1.271 43.6
1986 3.155 768,234 4,106 1.583 1.299 41.2 1.463 46.4
1987 3.345 767,819 4,356 1.710 1 358 40.6 1 531 45.8
1988 3.591 772,363 4,649 1.840 1 482 41.3 1.655 46.1
1989 3.848 774,859 4,967 1.990 1.572 40.9 1.745 45.3
1990 4.142 782,905 5,291 2.159 1.693 40.9 1.864 45.0
1991 4.556 797,621 5,712 2.356 1.857 40.8 2.027 44 5
1992 4.882 814,671 5,992 2.568 1.950 39.9 2.443 50.0
1993 Est. 5.292 831,000 6,368 2.844 2.045 38 6 2.568 48.5
1994 2 5.514 848,451 6,498 2.999 2.109 38 2 2.532 45.9
1995 2 5.829 866,268 6,729 3.156 2.212 38.0 2.663 45.7

% Chg.
1983-95 126% 10% 105% 130% 117% — 120% —

’includes lottery and school levy property tax credits.
"Projections.
Source: Legislative Fiscal Bureau and Wisconsin Department of Public

much the state helps to finance 
local education is illustrated by 
the last 4 columns. The columns 
entitled “State School Aids” list 
the state payments that go direct­
ly to school districts. The 
AMOUNT will increase from 
$1,019 billion in 1983 to $2,212 
billion in 1995 or 117%. Since 
the state payments will not rise as 
fast as the costs, the state’s share 
will drop over the period. It 
reached a high of 41.3% in 1988 
and, by 1995, is projected to be 
38%. In effect, both sides are 
right. The state has paid an ever- 
increasing amount of money to 
districts, but the aid payment as 
a percentage of local costs has 
declined.

Property Tax Credits. Adding 
to the confusion is the inclusion 
of state-financed property tax 
credits in the equation. School 
aids are paid directly to a school 
district and are used to finance its 
costs. Property tax credits appear 
on property tax bills and reduce 
the gross property tax owed by a 
taxpayer. Towns, villages and 
cities, which administer the tax, 
are reimbursed for the credit that 
is provided on the bill. Schools do 
not receive any payment.

The last two columns in the 
table show the total of the tax 
credits and state school aids. The 
percentage of state costs was in

Daniel S. Schmidt 
A dministra tor/Clerk

the mid 40’s through 1991, then 
jumped to 50% and is projected 
to drop to 45.7% in 1995. In 
1993, the amount of the school 
levy credit is $319 million. The 
jump in state participation to 50% 
in 1992 occurred when Governor 
Thompson, through the partial 
veto, changed the name of an ex­
isting credit from the general 
government tax credit to the 
school levy tax credit. Neither 
taxpayers nor school districts 
received additional state money, 
but, because of the name change, 
the state could claim it was finan­
cing a greater share of local 
education.

The second credit is the lottery 
property tax credit, $204 million 
in 1993, which applies only to 
owner-occupied residential pro­
perty. It is not a reduction of the 
property tax levy on commercial, 
manufacturing and agricultural 
land. When the 2 property tax 
credits are added to the amount 
of school aids, the state's share is 
projected to be 45.7% in 1995.

Between 1993 and 1994, the 
total amount of state payments,

MEETING NOTICE
The Kewaskum Board of Education Negotiating Commit­

tee and the Kewaskum Auxiliary Personnel Negotiating Com­
mittee will meet to exchange contract proposals for the 
establishment of a successor agreement beginning July 1, 
1993. The meeting will take place on Thursday, June 3,1993 
at 7:00 p.m. in the Kewaskum High School Library. This 
meeting is open to the public._______________________

KEWASKUM WATER UTILITY 
WATER TESTING 

SAFE DRINKING WATER ACT
The Kewaskum Water Utility is currently contracting with state cer­

tified laboratories to have water analysis performed to comply with the 
Safe Drinking Water Act passed by the United States Congress. The 
village is required to have performed 31 Inorganic analyses, 39 Syn­
thetic Organic analyses (Pesticides), and 41 Volatile Organic analyses. 
This is a total of 111 different chemicals and chemical compounds 
to be tested for.

In the past most laboratory tests were done in parts per million, ppm. 
(Same thing in metric is mg/L) Today most all of the tests performed 
are in parts per billion, using people as an example, we would need 
more people in this country. One person in a billion people would equal 
1 part per billion.

So far in 1993 the Water Utility has issued purchase orders for just 
over $3,700.00 to various testing facilities to comply with the water 
quality testing requirements of the Safe Drinking Water Act. This does 
not include staff time or the Lead and Copper testing requirements 
beginning July 1 of this year. This is in addition to the monthly testing 
that the State Laboratory of Hygiene provides to the water utility at 
no charge.

The Safe Drinking Water Act is, and will continue to have a signifi­
cant impact on the municipal water utilities in Wisconsin and the rest 
of the country.

aids and credits, will decrease by 
$36 million as the amount of the 
lottery credit declines. The school 
aids increase of $64 million will 
not be sufficient to offset the 
decreased lottery payment. All of 
these nuances of school finance 
will be further explored when the 
Joint Committee on Finance con­
siders the Governor's budget bill 
(SB 44).

LIGHTEN UP.

High-fat, high-cholesterol foods can 
leave you with a heavy heart.

£ j| American Heart 
V Association

, 199? Amencan Heart Association
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As the weather warms and 

more people venture out to enjoy 
the great outdoors, encounters 
with wildlife also increase. Most 
of these encounters are enjoyable 
for humans and usually don’t 
disrupt the animals for more than 
a few minutes. However, there 
are exceptions that can be very 
disruptive to animals, and not 
very pleasant for people.

ABANDONED?
Early in spring and summer 

people may find young animals 
they think are abandoned or or­
phaned. In almost all cir­
cumstances, that is not the case. 
Many wild animals leave their 
young in hiding for brief periods 
while they search for food. Or the 
animals may have been “spook­
ed" away from its young by the 
human intruder. It's best to leave 
the area quietly to allow the 
parent to return as soon as possi­
ble. If you are sure a young 
animal is orphaned, call your 
local Department of Natural 
Resources office for instructions.

A HELPING HAND
There are a few cases where a 

helping hand really is helpful to 
wildlife. If hatchling birds get 
blown down during a wind storm, 
try to replace the birds and their 
nests as best as you can. You may 
see young birds just after they 
leave the nest (fledglings) and 
think they need assistance. At this 
stage in their development, it is 
normal for these birds to flutter 
along the ground to low shrubs as 
they learn to fly. The best 
assistance you can give fledglings 
is to keep pets away.

You can also help a duck brood 
or turtle get across a busy street. 
And there are other times where 
brief intervention can help 
wildlife. However, don’t try to 
move young animals into your 
home or to another location. It’s 
a myth that a parent won’t take 
back its young once humans have 
touched it. but please don't take 
wild animals out of the wild. If 
you are in doubt about a wild 
animal's need for your interven­
tion, leave it alone.

NATURE'S COURSE
Occasionally you may en­

counter sick or injured wildlife. 
The death rate for many species 
of young wildlife is high, and it's 
normal in the wild to see 50 per­
cent or more of the young die 
within a few weeks of birth. The 
reproductive rates of most species 
have evolved to balance these 
high death rates. There has been 
an increase in sick furbearing 
animals, especially raccoons, 
during the past few years. This is 
probably due to decreasing trap­
ping and hunting of furbearers.

Please do not attempt to handle 
a sick or injured animal and keep 
children and pets away. Wild 
animals can cause injury to peo­
ple. and some wildlife diseases 
can be transmitted to humans.

Unless the animal is a rare or 
endangered species, the best 
course of action is usually 
nature's course. However, if the 
animal appears vicious and 
presents a concern for the safety 
of small children, contact your 
police department or the local 
DNR office for advice and 
assistance. The Department of 
Natural Resources does track 
reports of sick wildlife and will 
investigate unusual occurrences.
RACCOONS IN THE ATTIC

Other encounters with wildlife 
involve animals in places where

they aren’t wanted or shouldn’t 
be. Woodchucks in the garden, 
skunks under the porch, raccoons 
in the attic, and geese on the lawn 
are just a few examples.

Often common sense ap­
proaches can solve these pro­
blems. Preventing access is easier 
than trying to remove an animal 
once it has moved in. Routine 
home maintenance, such as 
repairing holes in the siding, roof 
or foundation should help. It 
helps if chimneys have a grated 
cover and fencing is placed at the 
base of decks and porches. For 
advice or assistance, contact the 
Animal Damage Control office of 
the Department of Agriculture at 
800^33-0688.

Most encounters with wildlife 
are interesting, pleasant ex­
periences when approached with 
respect and common sense.

Co-Ed Volleyball League 
Results of 5-26-93

6:30 Gruber Tool & Die, 
15-13-15-15, Dave's Repair, 8- 
15-5-2.

Dreher Body Shop, 7-4-4-9, 
LK Heating, 15-15-15-15.

7:30 Nolan Game Farm. 6- 
15-15-9, Prime Time Pub I, 15- 
17-4-14.

Schickert Dist., 15-15-15- 
14, Health Hut, 4-12-4-16.

8:30 Prime Time Pub II, 
15-15-15-15, Sentry Foods, 4-2- 
8-10.

STANDINGS
LK Heating 12-0
Gruber Tool 11-1
Prime Time II 9-3
Prime Time I 9-3
Nolan Game Fann 6-6
Schickert Dist. 4-8
Dave's Repair 3-9
Health Hut 2-10
Dreher Body Shop 2-10
Sentry Foods 2-10

Call 
Kewaskum Statesman 

for your 

Advertising Needs 
626-2626

JIM SCHAUB J
“for the repair job that’s 

been put off for too long ’ ’
P O. Box 177 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040

Garages/Garage Doors/Remodeling 
Siding/Storm Doors/Storm Windows 

Decks/Roofing

BUNKELMAN 
BUILDERS INC.

BUILDING QUALITY IS OUR SPECIALTY! 
RESIDENTIAL A COMMERCIAL

Building • Alterations
Additions p

New Construction 
Remodeling

■••7 PROSPECT DR. KEWASKUM

626-25 ir^xr
"PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE. QUALITY 

MA TERIALS AND A TTENTION TO ALL DETAILS. ”

NOW INSTALLED BY FREE Estimate*

HEBERER BROS. CONST.
626 2598 626 2491 626-2903 626-2384 -

118 Hwy. H, West 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040

HON-E-KOR THURSDAY NIGHT 
LADIES GOLF LEAGUE - MAY 27 
Jan Young needed only one par to 

score low gross for the evening. She 
shot a par on hole 4 and bogied 6 
other holes for a gross score of 46. 
Jan also had the low net score of 28.

PARS - Hole 1 - Gwenn Doher­
ty. Judy Volesky; Hole 2 - Sheila 
Hesselman. Carol Laatsch; Hole 3 - 
Cheryl Bales, June Champeny. 
Teresa Dreher. Evie Faehling, Sue 
Goeden, Sharon Jach, Judy Moede. 
Tracey Schaub; Hole 4 - Teresa 
Dreher, Lin Griffin. Evie Jansen. 
Carole Timblin, Jan Young; Hole 5 
- Carol Laatsch. Judy Volesky; Hole 
7 - Gwenn Doherty. Mary Korpinen. 
Mary Kay Roloff, Debbie Timblin; 
Hole 8 - Pat Taylor; Hole 9 - Tam­
my Halfmann.

LOW NET -Jan Young - Score of 
28

SPECIAL EVENT - SCORE 
WITHOUT PUTTS — Class A - Jan 
Young - Score of 29; Class B - 
Gwenn Doherty Score of 36; Class 
C - Pat Taylor - Score of 32; Class 
D - Bridget Nedden - Score of 44.

BLIND BOGIE - Joan Eggers - 
Score of 52.

CHIP-INS - Hole 2 - Carol 
Laatsch; Hole 8 Evie Jansen; Hole 
9 - Jeri Hutchison.

-TEAM STANDINGS- 
WOODS DIVISION

PTS.
Nutter Putters 6
Tee Busters 6
Turf Busters 6
Hazards 6
TNT 5
Par-Tee Pair 5
Bal! Busters 5
Putterfingers 5
Lady Drivers 4
Par Chasers 4
Whiffers 4
Golf Bums 4
A Hit & A Miss
Double Bogies 2
Tee Totalers 0
Driving Force 0

IRONS DIVISION
Tee’d Off 8
Sand Trappers 8
Grass Clippers 8
Woodpeckers 6
Long Shots 6
G G’s 6
Rough Riders 4
T P C 4
Chippers 4
Iron Maidens 2
Me Duffers 2
Swingers 2
Plunkers 2
Swee-Tees 2
Bye Bye Birdies 0
Hot Sand Wedges 0

A great many people have got­
ten into debt by trying to keep 
up with others who already 
were.

HOME

626-8227

IMPROVEMENT

GIRLS WIAA DIVISION 2 TRACK 
Pewaukee Regional

Sheboygan Falls 122; KEWASKUM 
101; Slinger 88; Shorewood 87; Camp­
bellsport 67; Random Lake 50; New 
Berlin West and Pewaukee 33'^; 
Brown Deer 28; St. Francis 12.

Individual Qualifiers - 100 High 
Hurdles - CHRISTA SCHMIDT. 
KEWASKUM 16.47; Robyn Sexton. 
Sheboygan Falls 17.08; MARY 
YAHR, KEWASKUM 17.28.

100 - Maria Gatzke. Sheboygan Falls 
13.36; Sadie Yadgar, Shorewood 
13.37; Ericka Gessay. Pewaukee 
13.41.

1600 - Sue Daggett. Random Lake. 
5:26.0; Cheri Lichtensteiger, Camp­
bellsport 5:38.8; CHRISSY 
NEUMANN. KEWASKUM 5:42.2.

800 Relay - Sheboygan Falls. 1:52.6;
Slinger. 1:58.6; Campbellsport, 
2:01.2.

400 - GINGER WIESNER, 
KEWASKUM 62.59; Kris Kimmler, 
Sheboygan Falls 63.25; Dena Brown, 
Brown Deer 63.82.

400 Relay - Slinger 54.50; 
Sheboygan Falls. 55.10; New Berlin 
West. 56.90.

300 Hurdles - CHRISTA 
SCHMIDT. KEWASKUM 49 887; 
Redd Skudlarczyk. Campbellsport 
52.51; Ivy Schielke. Sheboygan Falls 
53.00.

800 - Jenna Draeger, Shorewood 
2:33.88; Kalk, Sheboygan Falls 
2:34 33; KristenGray. Slinger 2:35.49.

2(X) - Missy Boeldt, Sheboygan Falls 
28.50; Skudlarczyk, Campbellsport 
28.51; Megan Gray, Shorewood 28.60.

3200 - Sue Daggett. Random Lake 
11:35.3; Lindsey Ness, Shorewood 
12:10.3; Sarah Ankerstein. Shorewood 
13:05.3.

1600 Relay - KEWASKUM. 
4:16.88; Sheboygan Falls, 4:19.9; 
Pewaukee, 4:25.9.

High Jump - Kate Tsai. New Berlin 
West 5-01; Sara Lorens, Sheboygan 
Falls 4-11; Missy Kalk, Sheboygan 
Falls, 4-10.

Long Jump - Kenya Moore. 
Shorewood 15-4; Linda Rhone, Brown 
Deer 15-216; Cheyenne Jones, 
Shorewood 14-11'^.

Triple Jump - Tsai. New Berlin West 
33-9; Moore. Shorewood 32-1; Amy 
Davis, Slinger 31-0.

Discus - ROBYN W1NN1NGHOFF. 
KEWASKUM 110-9; Andrea Boeker, 
Slinger 95-888; Steph Klippel. Slinger 

. 92-11.
Shot Put - Trina Rathke, Random

Beautifully Efficient
Custom bay and bow replacement windows 

from Great Lakes’ Window.
No replacement windows lower 
your energy costs more than 
those from Great Lakes. Our bay 
and bow windows feature fusion- 
welding and high-R insulation

All vinyl construction eliminates the need to caulk and paint. 
Highest R factor for warmer windows.
Lowest tested air infiltration to assure added comfort.
Available in solid White, Camel, 
Earthtone and optional Natural and 
Golden Oak Woodgrain finishes.

Lake. 34-11; BETH KEMPF. 
KEWASKUM 34-5M; Klippel. Slinger 
33-9'4.

WIAA BOYS TRACK 
REGIONAL RESULTS

1. Shorewood, 110; 2. Sheboygan
Falls 97; 3. Slinger 94.5; 4.
KEWASKUM 73; 5 Brown Deer 69;
6. Pewaukee 651 7. New Berlin West 
63; 8. Campbellsport 34.5; 9. St. Fran­
cis 13; 10. Random Lake 3.

SECTIONAL QUALIFIERS
400 - I. McNulty. SF. 52.82; 2. 

Eastern. SH. 53.19; 3. McKinney. 
NBW. 55.39

400 Relay - 1. SL. 45.73; 2. SF.
46.0; 3. SH. 47.66.

300 Hurdles - I. Frazier. SH. 42.09;
2. Smejal. SF, 42.77; 3. Cronin, SH. 
43.34.

800 - I. McNulty, SF. 2:03.11; 2. 
Weber. PEW, 2:04.77; 3. Lechner. 
PEW. 2:07.69.

110 Hurdles - 1. Frazier. SH. 15.36;
2. Smejal, SF. 15.64; 3. Cronin. SH. 
15.78.

100 - 1. Zuern, SL, 11.63; 2. 
Renaue. BD. ll;72; 3. Morton. SH, 
11.78.

1600 - 1. Thull, CAMP, 4:45.1; 2.
Noel. SH. 4:46 6. 3. DIRME1ER.
KEW. 4:47.7.

200 - 1. Robbins, SL. 24.3; 2.
Eastern. SH. 24.4; 3. Lange, SL. 24,5.

3200 I. Thull. CAMP, 10:25.7; 2.
Kosmicki, BD, 10:29.88; 3.
McCombem, PEW, 10:32.8.

1600 Relay - 1. SF. 3:35; 2. PEW, 
3:37.3; 3. SL. 3:40.4.

Pole Vault - 1. Becker, SL. 11-6: 2. 
WADE KREIS. KEW, 11-6; 3. Moun­
tjoy. SL. 11-6.

High Jump - 1. JACAK. KEW, 5-11;
2. Koch, NBW. 5-10; 3. Wettengel. 
ST. FRAN. 5-10.

Long Jump - 1. Morton. SH. 20-1;
2. KREIS. KEW, 19-10.5; 3. Jackson, 
SH, 19-9.5

Triple Jump - I. Howard, PEW, 
40-2; 2. Rodriguez, NBW. 40-.5; 3. 
BRUENDL, KEW, 39-4.

Discus - 1. Mathwig. SF. 145-9; 2. 
SCHULTEIS, KEW, 136-6; 3 Wet­
tengel. ST FRAN. 130-7.

Shot Put - I. Novotny. SL. 49-0; 2. 
Mathwig. SF. 48-3; 3. Braun, NBW , 
46-6 5.

A subscription to the Kewaskum 
Statesman - a gift that keeps on 
giving all year long! Phone 
626-2626.

for improved comfort and fuel 
efficiency. Plus Great Lakes 
Windows offer these other 
advantages.

GREAT LAKES* 
WINDOW

Wi
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Jacak Headed to State Track Meet
SETS KHS HIGH JUMP MARK

By Noel Stollenwerk

MAYVILLE - After coming up 
just short in his bid for a berth in 
last year’s State Track Meet. 
Kewaskum’s Travis Jacak was 
not going to let history repeat 
itself here, last Thursday 
afternoon.

The KHS sophomore, who 
finished third in last year's sec­
tional competition, set the school 
record by clearing 6-5 in the high 
jump. That mark was good 
enough to best the competition in 
the WIAA Sectional, thereby ad­
vancing him to this weekend's 
State Meet in LaCrosse.

Jacak was the only Indian boy 
athlete to earn the right to com­
pete in LaCrosse, as several other 
KHS competitors fell just short.

“I was real happy for Travis.” 
KHS coach Jerry Gosa said.

Lady Indians Second in Track Sectionals
KHS QUALIFIES FOR FIVE EVENTS AT STATE

By Noel Stollenwerk

MAYVILLE - With athletes 
qualifying in four events plus a 
relay, the Kewaskum girls track 
team will once again be well- 
represented at this weekend s 
State Track Meet at Memorial 
Stadium in LaCrosse.

The Lady Indians placed se­
cond as a team (49 points), behind 
only East Troy (62). who was the 
lone team to have more qualifiers 
(six) than Kewaskum. To qualify 
for the state meet, an individual 
or relay had to place in the top 
two, or to be among the top eight 
performers in all of the 
sectionals.

Leading the way for the Indians 
was senior Christa Schmidt, who

KHS Bats Are Absent in Twin 
Bill Losses to West Bend East

By Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM - Going into his 
team’s first game of the year, 
Kewaskum baseball coach Doug 
Gonring had lauded the Indians as 
a potential power at the plate.

But after the team was swept in 
a doubleheader by West Bend 
East here, last Tuesday after- 
noon, it was easy to see why the 
Indians came up short in the 4-0 
and 7-5 decisions.

The Indians managed just a 
double by Mark Strobel in the 
third inning of game one for their 
lone hit. and then came back in 
the nightcap to produce just three 
more hits.

Perhaps a big reason for the in­
eptitude at the plate was the fact 
that the Indians were missing 
several regulars, who had to sit 
out because of suspensions or 
other violations.

Junior Doug Buechel was the 
rec ipient of the lack of support in 
the opener, as he went two inn­
ings. giving up a pair of runs. 
Both runs came in the second, as 
a walk and hit batsman helped get 
the West Bend East rally started.

The Indians, meanwhile, were 
inable to put the ball in play.

“Three kids cleared 6-5, but he 
made it on his first attempt. He 
won on (less) misses. He was just 
jumping real well.”

Senior Dan Schulteis finished 
third in the discus (135-11), bare­
ly missing the required top-two 
finish. Other KHS athletes who 
fell short were Wade Kreis (pole 
vault and long jump), Brian 
Bruendl (triple jump) and Jeff 
Dirmeier (1600).

Kreis also barely missed quali­
fying, taking fourth in the long 
jump. The junior had a fine all- 
around afternoon, setting a per­
sonal best in the pole vault (12-0) 
as well, finishing fourth.

“He’s done an excellent job,’’ 
Gosa said of Kreis, who could be 
one of the more valuable athletes 
returning next season.

Bruendl also came through

will participate in three events at 
the State Meet. Schmidt took se­
cond in both the 100 hurdles 
(16.0) and 300 hurdles (47.3), 
both of those times being personal 
bests.

Schmidt also helped the 1600 
relay set a school record (4:08.7) 
in taking second. Other members 
of the unit included Ginger 
Wiesner, Mary Yahr and Missy 
Rohrer.

Wiesner also had a perfect 
afternoon, taking second in her 
only other event, the 400 (60.5). 
The other Indian athlete to earn 
the right to advance was senior 
Robyn Winninghoff. whose toss 
of 111-10 in the discus netted her 
a second.

much less find any holes. 
Kewaskum batters struck out 13 
times in the opener, as Sun pit­
chers Brad Geldnich. Adam 
Wagner and Jeff Baker stymied 
KHS.

In the nightcap, the Indians led 
most of the game, but a three-run 
sixth by the Suns put them ahead 
for good.

Down. 5-4. Geldnich led off 
the inning with a triple off loser 
Todd Muckerheide. Curt 
Schroeder and Ryan Hill follow­
ed with back-to-back doubles to 
give the Suns the lead.

The Indians, despite just the 
three hits, scored three times in 
the opening frame, and then add­
ed single runs in the fourth and 
sixth.

The Suns, meanwhile, 
countered with 12 hits off of 
Muckerheide and KHS starter 
Mark Schlosser.

KEWASKUM
000 000 0 - 0 1 2

WEST BEND EAST
020 200 x - 4 4 0

WEST BEND EAST 
200 02 3 0-7 12 2 

KEWASKUM 
300 101 0 - 5 3 2

with his best jump of the season 
(40-2). while Dirmeier’s 4:46.5 
clocking was one of his better 
efforts.

As a team, the Indians finish­
ed tied for eighth with Union 
Grove (28 points). Elkhorn won 
the meet, scoring 74 points, 15 
ahead of runner-up Sheboygan 
Falls.

“We did much better than in 
the years past,” Gosa said of the 
team effort. “I wish we could 
have gotten Brad (Jackson) and 
Jim (Wichtoski) through to Sec­
tionals.”

Jackson and Wichtoski were 
both expected to advance to the 
Sectionals, but Jackson was 
unable to clear the opening height 
at the Regionals at Pewaukee 
Monday. Wichtoski. meanwhile, 
scratched on all three of his long

Just missing the mark was 
senior Beth Kempf, who fell two 
inches short of her bid in the shot 
put. Also falling short were 
Chrissy Neumann (1600) and 
Mary Yahr (100 hurdles), who 
had both took third in Monday 's 
Regional meet at Pewaukee.

In that meet, the Indians finish­
ed second again, this time being 
beaten by fellow Eastern Wiscon­
sin Conference member 
Sheboygan Falls, 122-101.

GIRLS WIAA DIVISION 2 TRACK 
Mayville Sectional

East Troy 62. KEWASKUM 49. 
Whitewater and North Fond du Lac 47 
(tie). Sheboyfan Falls 4216. Mayville 
40. Shorewood 37. Palmyra-Eagle 35. 
Lake Mills 33. Omro 30. Ripon 25'6. 
Random Lake and Slinger 23 (tie). 
Wautoma 21. New Berlin West and 
Waupun 15 (tie), Berlin and Camp­
bellsport 14 (tie). Big Foot 11. Jeffer­
son 10. Brown Deer 9. Markesan and 
Elkhorn 8 (tie), Horicon and Union 
Grove 5 (tie). Laconia and Pewaukee 
3 (tie), Wilmot I, Ethan Allen and St. 
Francis 0 (tie).

400 - Catherine Sydow, Whitewater.
1:00.4; GINGER
KEWASKUM. 60.5;
Brown Deer. 60.7.

800 Relay - North

WIESNER.
Dena Brown.

Fond du Lac
1:23.O; Lake Mills 1:48.7; Sheboygan 
falls 1:48.7+.

400 Relay - Lake Mills 51.8; North 
Fond du Lac 52.2; Omro 52.6.
300 Low Hurdles - Katie O'Leary. East 
Troy, 47.0; CHRISTA SCHMIDT. 
KEWASKUM. 47.3; Deb Missall. 
Wautoma. 47.8.

800 - Beth O'Leary, East Troy, 
2:21.4; Jeanna Draeger. Shorewood. 
2:24.4; Missy Kalk. Sheboygan Falls.

DON’S 
ELECTRIC 
Electrical Contractor
•Residential Wiring 
•New Construction 
•Remodeling 
•Rewiring 
‘Service Changes 

FREE ESTIMATES
Call 334-7565

jumps.
Jackson, who recently set the 

school record in the pole vault 
(13-5), had to battle windy and 
rainy conditions during his 
jumps. Soon after his attempts 
failed. Meet officials decided to 
postpone the rest of the pole vault 
competition until the next day.

“I was trying to get them to 
postpone it (before Jackson 
jumped),” Gosa said, noting his 
efforts were fruitless. “It was 
blowing and raining like crazy. 
The only consolation that I have 
is that he is a junior and will be 
back next year.”

Jacak will be competing on 
Saturday morning or early after­
noon in his bid to place at State. 
The field events are slated to get 
underway at 10:35 Saturday 
morning.

2:26.$.
200 - Erin Monroe. Lake Mills. 26.9; 

Lisa Kincaid. Palmyra-Eagle. 26.9 + ; 
Ree Skudlarczyk. Campbellsport. 27.4.

3200 - Sue Daggett. Random Lake. 
11:35.1; Lindsey Ness. Shorewood. 
11:54.3; Amy Haines. East Troy, 
12:07.5.

1600 Relay - East Troy 4:07.0; 
KEWASKUM 4:08.7; Mayville 
4:12.9.

100 High Hurdles - Missall. 
Wautoma. 15.7; SCHMIDT. 
KEWASKUM. 16.0; Jenny Mohr. 
Ripon. 16.6.

100 - Kincaid. Palmya-Eagle. 12.7; 
Julie Gierdach. North Fond du Lac. 
12.9; Julie Miller. Omro. 12.9 +

1600 - Daggett. Random Lake. 
5:15.3; Laura Verwiebe. Mayville. 
5:17.8; Haines. East Troy. 5:26.7.

Shot Put - Steph Klippel, Slinger. 
36-9’4; Tara Kuehn. Markesan. 34-8; 
Kim Steger. East Troy, 34-5'4.

High Jump - Jane Price. North Fond 
du Lac. 5-2; Martha Meyer, Waupun. 
5-2; Kate Tsai. New Berlin West. 5-2.

Long Jump - Kincaid, Palmyra- 
Eagle, 17-1; Jenny Schmidt. Mayville. 
16.8; Danielle Bethke. Whitewater. 
16-7'4.

Discus - Becky Blake. Omro. 123-0;
WINNINGHOFF.ROBYN

KEWASKUM. 111-10; Dorothy Con­
ners. Whitewater. 111-8.

Triple Jump - Jamie Price. North 
Fond du Lac, 37-1'6; Bethke. 
Whitewater, 35-4; Stacey Hornicle. 
Whitewater. 35-2'6.

Recycle today for 
tomorrow ^./^

r*
Tired of Mud?

THINK CONCRETE!
BUTCH'S CONSTRUCTION

Sidewalks - Patios - Driveways - Garages - 
Pole Buildings - Barnyards - Concrete Sawing - 

SKID LOADER WORK

GERALD (BUTCH) WINNINGHOFF
8412 Hilltop Lane, Kewaskum

334-3186

BOYS DIVISION 2 
Mayville Sectional

Team Scores - Elkhorn 74. 
Sheboygan Falls 59, Horicon 46. 
Shorewood 45. Mayville 42. Jefferson 
36. Slinger 34. Kewaskum and Union 
Grove 28 (tie). Lake Mills and Berlin 
27 (tie). Waupun 23. Whitewater and 
Palmyra-Eagle 19 (tie). Omro 18. 
Wautoma 17. Campbellsport. Big Foot 
and Ripon 16 (tie). Pewaukee 12. North 
Fond du Lac 9, Brown Deer 8. New 
Berlin West 6. Wilmot 5. St. Francis. 
Ethan Allen I. East Troy. Laconia. 
Markesan and Random Lake 0 (tie).

110 High Hurdles - Bill Otto. 
Elkhorn. 14.7; Dave Heebner. 
Waupun, 14.8; Bryan Frazier. 
Shorewood. 14.8 +.

100 - Brian Krukofsky. Elkhorn. 
10.8; Andy Renz. Jefferson. Charles 
Warren, Palmyra-Eagle, 11.2.

1600 - Remco Wortel. Jefferson. 
4:25.1; Chad Inman. Lake Mills. 
4:27.7; Matt Thull, Campbellsport. 
4:32.4.

400 • Ryan McNulty, Sheboygan 
Falls. 50.2: Damon Eastern. 
Shorewood, 50.8; David Reu. Elkhorn.

300 Hurdles - Dave Heebner. 
Waupun. 40.6; Bill Otto. Elkhorn. 
40.8; Bryan Frazier. Shorewood. 40.9.

800 - Ryan McNulty. Sheboygan 
Falls, 1:57.6; Chad Inman. Lake Mills. 
1:58.4; Mike Beiz. Union Grove. 
1:59.1.

200 - Andy Reinz. Jefferson. 23.1 
Charles Warren. Palmyra-Eagle. 23.4; 
Kevin Murphy. Horicon 23.5.

3200 - Matt Thull. Campbellsport. 
9:56.1; Jason Lokken. Lake Mills. 
10:06.5; Kevin Randall. Berlin. 
10:11.2.

400 Relay - Elkhorn. 43.7; Slinger.
44 .4; Sheboygan Falls, 44.7.

1600 Relay - Sheboygan Falls 3:28.5; 
Horicon 3:29.4; Mayville 3:30.5.

Discus - Jeff Matwig. Sheboygan 
Falls. 155-3; Steve John, Big Foot. 
140-5; Dan Schulteis. Kewaskum. 
135-11.

Triple Jump - Jeff Dempich. 
Whitewater. 43-8; Adam Wagner. 
42-7'6; Travis Rogers. Berlin. 42-7.

Pole Vault - Scott Hein. Horicon. 
13-2; Steve Miylink. Horicon. 12-6; 
Ryan Johnson. Elkhorn. 12-6.

Shot Put - Eric Novotny. Slinger. 
52-1'4; Steve John. Big Foot. 50-8; 
Jason Abbet, Union Grove. 49-9’4.

High Jump - Travis Jacak. 
Kewaskum. 6-5; Matt Howell. Ripon. 
6-5; Chad Messner. Elkhorn. 6-5.

DNR Boating 
Safety Class

The Department of Natural 
Resources Boating Safety Class 
will be held beginning on June 
13th, 1993, at the Ice Age 
Center 1/4 mile west of Dundee 
on Highway 67. The class will 
be held from 6:30 to 8:30 p.m. 
on June 13th, 14th, 15th, and 
17th. On the 16th the class will 
meet at the Long Lake State 
boat landing on the east side of 
Long Lake off of Division 
Road.

The class is open to anyone 
over the age of 11 years. To reg­
ister, leave your name, age and 
phone number at the Mauthe 
Lake Forest Headquarters at 
626-2116. The class will be 
taught by Warden Doug Bilgo 
with the help of others.

The cost is $3.00 per stu­
dent and will be collected the 
first night of the class.

6-3-2t


