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Wagner, Waala First On Spring Ballot

Board Okays Raises for Village Employees
Tim Bunkelman Wins Holy 

Trinity School Geography Bee
By Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM - The 
Kewaskum Village Board last 
Monday night unanimously ap­
proved raises for several non­
union employees, ranging from 
three to four percent.

Village Administrator Dan 
Schmidt, with the village since 
1979. will receive a three percent 
increase in 1993, making his 
salary $43,697. while Police 
Chief Richard Knoebel and 
Public Works Director Jerry 
Gilles will also receive three per­
cent hikes in pay.

The raises bring Knoebel's 
1993 salary to $36,056. while 
Gilles will receive an additional 
hike later in the year to bring his 
total salary to $34,884.

Deputy Clerk/Treasurer Janet 
Knops will receive the highest 
raise, four percent, bringing her 
1993 total to $20,859. The Board 
also approved a 3.5 percent wage 
hike for the village s part-time 
employees.

One More
This week, for the unpteenth 

time, we received an anonymous 
letter from a parent who has a 
child participating in a high 
school sport that we have not. as 
yet. devoted any newspaper 
coverage.

So. for the unpteenth time. I 
will again try to explain why. Our 
neighboring newspaper is a city 
DAILY, and is owned by a large 
corporation. They are also sup­
ported by the advertising of 
DOZENS of stores and 
businesses. They operate with a 
large staff, have the latest in 
technological equipment and can 
afford to send a reporter to near­
ly every sport and community 
function.

The Statesman, on the other 
hand, is a small town weekly, 
privately owned by the third 
generation of the same family. 
The Statesman has two part-time 
reporters and a small office staff. 
There is not enough time or man­
power to cover everything the 
way we would like.

And there is not enough adver­
tising in a small town weekly 
newspaper to warrant the hiring 
of a full-time reporter. (Contrary 
to opinion, subscription prices 
generally cover the cost of 
mailing).

Unfortunately, this means 
some sports and some communi­
ty news will fall by the wayside.

In other matters. Schmidt told 
the Board that the village's tax 
collection was proceeding 
favorably. “We're doing 
well...better than a lot of other 
communities.” Schmidt said, 
noting that Kewaskum has col­
lected more than 32 percent of all 
taxes thus far.

Prior to the meeting, a draw­
ing was held to determine the 
order of the names appearing on 
the spring balloting for three 
trustees spots and the Board 
President.

Robert Wagner, who will 
challenge incumbent Mary 
Krueger's role as Board Presi­
dent. will appear first on the 
ballot ahead of Krueger.

Charles Waala. meanwhile, 
will appear first on the list of 
trustees, with Robert Beisbier se­
cond. and David Goeden third. 
Beisbier and Goeden are the in­
cumbents. with Waala vying for 
the third opening.

In a related matter, the Board

Time,.,
However, there are two solu­
tions... EVERYONE can adver­
tise thus making it economically 
feasible to hire full-time 
reporters. OR everyone can 
solicit parents, neighbors, grand­
parents, students, teachers, club 
secretaries, etc. to write more ar­
ticles about local news and sub­
mit these articles to the Statesman 
for publication.

This seems to be the simplest 
solution. We have NEVER refus­
ed to print any article submitted 
to this newspaper unless it was in 
the nature of a personal vindetta. 
libelous or deemed in bad taste.

So PLEASE, we urge everyone 
to turn in newspaper articles they 
would like to see printed. In our 
opinion, that is the whole 
backbone of a small town week-

THANK 
YOU

We would like to thank our many relatives, 
friends, neighbors and the community who, in 
whatever way, helped us in our time of sorrow.

The Holz & Doering Families

approved an ordinance to amend 
the general election polling hours 
in the village. The polls will now 
open at 7:00 a.m. and will close 
at 8:00 p.m., thus conforming 
with other communities in the 
County.

The Board also briefly discuss­
ed the three proposals for the 
curbside recycling and garbage 
collection services. The proposals 
range from $6.55 to $9.33 a 
month, with the cost for the 
recycling containers extra.

Schmidt notified the Board that 
he and a couple of members from 
the Board will be contacting other 
communities that currently use 
the services, and will go to those 
places to watch the services in 
action.

Schmdit also pointed out that 
the village issued a total of 113 
building permits in 1992. an in­
crease of 14 from the previous 
year, and second most ever. The 
village issued I 14 permits in 
1990.

ly newspaper. You can read, 
and/or hear about President Clin­
ton, the heartbreak of Somalia 
and the articles of Saddam every 
minute of the day.

In a small town newspaper 
(correct me. if I'm wrong) you 
want to read about births, 
engagements, marriages, deaths 
and the accomplishments of your 
friends, neighbors and relatives. 
(Not to mention, the results of an 
occasional pig kissing contest).

So if there is something you 
have been patiently waiting to 
read about amidst these pages and 
are becoming increasingly 
frustrated every week that it is not 
in — we encourage you to take 
matters into your own hands!

Gather information and sit
(Continued on Page 3)

Tim Bunkelman

Tim Bunkelman. son of Jan and 
Larry Bunkelman, Kewaskum, 
an Sth grader at Holy Trinity 
School, won the school-level 
competition of the National 
Geography Bee. The school level 
competition, at which students 
answered oral questions on 
geography, was the first round in 
the fifth annual National 
Geography Bee. which is spon- 
sored by National Geographic 
World, the Society's magazine 
for children, and A mt rack

Tim will now take a written 
test. Up to 100 of the top scorers 
in each state and territory will be 
eligible to compete in their state 
Bee on April 2nd.

The National Geographic 
Society developed the National 
Geography Bec in response to a 
growing concern about the lack of 
geographic knowledge among 
young people in the United 
States. A 1 O-country Gallup 
survey conducted for the Society 
in 1988 and 1989 found that peo­

★ ★ NOTICE ★ *
TO ALL VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM PROPERTY OWNERS

The first installment of 1992 Real Estate property taxes is due 
January 31, 1993. In full payments of 1992 Personal Property taxes 
is due January 31, 1993. The last day to pay taxes IN PERSON 
will be Monday, February I. 1993. The Municipal Building office 
will be open from 7:30 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. If you wish to mail your 
tax payment, it must be postmarked no later than February 1, 1993. 
Please include a self-addressed, postage paid envelope with your pay­
ment if you wish a receipt returned to you.

THE VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM
204 First St. P.O. Box 38
Kewaskum. W1 53040-003 8
(414) 626-8484

ple in the U.S. ages 18 to 24 - the 
youngest group in the survey - 
knew less about geography than 
young people in any of the other 
countries in the survey.

Youth Wrestling 
Program at KHS

The Kewaskum Youth Wrestl­
ing Program will begin on Mon­
day. February I, with sessions 
running from 6 to 7:30 p.m.

The program is open to all first 
through eighth graders and will 
be held at Kewaskum High 
School. For more information, 
call Rick Straub at 626-2178.

t^American Heart
| Association

WE'RE FIGHTING FOR 
YOUR LIFE



Kewaskum Statesman, Thursday, Jan. 28, 1993, Page 2

Limited Edition Prints of 
Dundee Mill Pond Available

Shown above is one of the Limited Edition collec­
tor’s prints of the Dundee Mill Park painted by ar­

St. Matthew’s ‘Night Around The World’ Jan. 30

tist Andy Stoffel.

Ihe snowflakes glistened on 
the upturned faces of the girls as 
they sang those old familiar 
caroles. The lights on the “Love 
Light” tree made a beautiful 
hackdrop to the Pioneer Girls 
Choir from Trinity Lutheran 
Church in Dundee. A perfect en­
ding to a wonderful day at the 
Dundee Mill-Park.

Our olde fashioned Christmas 
party was a success again this 
year. So many people came to 
share in the day. The hot cocoa 
and cider, along with the cookies 
helped Io warm Ihe insides of all' 
w ho joined in on that cold winter 
day. People gathered around the 
old pot bellied stove to comment 
on all the work that has been done 
plus reminisce on days gone by. 
Ihe children told of all their 
wishes to Santa while Mrs. Claus 
and Billy the Brownie were busy 
getting candy canes and helping 
with Ihe smaller ones. Some of 
the people look advantage of the 
display of sweatshirts and hats 
and purchased some last minute 
gifts for loved ones, while others 
walked over to Bohlmans to pur­
chase or to pick up their Mill- 
Park prints.

Besides our thanks to all those 
who joined us that day, a special 
thanks goes to all who purchased 
their “Love Lights” this year. 
These donations really have a big 
effect on what and how many 
projects we can plan on doing this 
year.

Another fund raising project 
we have is the prints of the 1990 
painting of the Mill by Andy Stof­
fel. The Dundee Mill 1990 
Limited Edition Collector Print is 
on display at the Crossroads 
Gallery on Hwy. 45 and 67. 
There are only 300 of these 
Limited Edition prints with 30 ar­

tists’ proofs, each numbered and 
signed by the artist on acid free 
quality paper.

Artist Andy Stoffel, will be 
available at the gallery on Sat., 
Jan. 23rd, from one p.m. to four 
p.m. Pencil and color remarques 
will be available at this time by 
the artist if desired. Stop by and 
view this Line collector print, 
meet the artist and purchase if 
you desire. The Crossroads is of­
fering a 10 percent discount on 
matting and framing on this col­
lector print. These prints are go­
ing fast. For more information, 
please call Monica Lavey, 
533-4750. Mill print Chairper­
son, or Andy Stoffel 533-4211.

A big thank you again to all 
who have helped in the past year 
to make the Mill-Park a little bet­
ter. Without your community 
spirit we would not have been 
able to get as far as we have.

Take a drive out and see the 
Mill-Park in its beautiful winter 
setting.

Submitted by 
Diane Kleinke

Services at
St. Lucas

Services this weekend at St. 
Lucas Lutheran Church. 1417 
Parkview Dr., Kewaskum, are as 
follows: Communion Worship. 
Saturday. Jan. 30, at 7:00 p.m., 
Communion Worship, Sunday, 
Jan. 31, at 8:00 a.m. 10:15 a.m. 
Sunday School and Bible Class at 
9:00 a.m.

Statesman classified ads net the job 
done. To place yours, call 626-2626.

The 7th annual St. Matt’s 
“Night Around The World”, 
sponsored by St. Matthew’s 
Home and School Association, 
will be held in the St. Matthew’s 
school gym in Campbellsport on 
Saturday, January 30th, from 
4:00 to 12:00 p.m.

Each year the menu features 
traditional favorites from various 
countries around the world: brats, 
sauerkraut and potato salad from 
Germany, submarine and hot beef 
sandwiches and fruit salad from 
the USA, eggrolls and fortune 
cookies from the Orient, eclairs 
from France, nachos and cheese 
from Mexico.

The regular menu will be serv­
ed at very reasonable prices from 
4:00 to 9:00 p.m. Pizza and pop­
corn will be served until mid­
night. Beverages served 
throughout the event will be beer, 
wine coolers, NA beer, soda, cof­
fee and milk.

New attractions for the children 
will feature a “pick-a-pocket 
lady” from 4:00 to 7:00 p.m. and 
a clown act from 7:00 to 9:00 
p.m. Junior High students will 
enjoy the popular teen dance star­
ting at 7:00 p.m. in the cafeteria.

A highlight of the evening pro-

St. Lucas Welcomes
Rebecca Sweetman

To Teaching Staff

The opening of the school year 
brought a new resident to 
Kewaskum and a new teacher to 
St. Lucas Lutheran Elementary 
School. Miss Rebecca Sweetman 
was assigned to teach 4th and 5th 
grade and oversee the music pro­
gram in grades first through fifth.

Miss Sweetman is a native of 
Fresno, California where her 
parents, Patricia and Donald, still 
live. Her home church was St. 
Peter in nearby Clovis. Califor­
nia. She attended grade schools in 
the area, including two years at 
Shepherd of the Valley Christian 
Day School. Her high school 
education was completed in 1987 
when she graduated from

mises to be the live auction from 
8:00 to 10:00 p.m. Auction items 
donated by local business include: 
gift certificates from NSP 
Graphics, Straub’s Piggly Wigg­
ly, Ben Franklin, and Shefond 
Mobil Mart, children’s aerobic 
classes and student weight train­
ing certificates from the Health 
Hut, a night’s lodging at the 
Radison in Green Bay from Bank 
One, a front end alignment and a 
lube, oil and filter from Jacak’s 
Auto Body, bowling ball from 
King Pin Lanes, country hassock 
and tiffany lamp from Twohig’s 
Furniture, Toro snow thrower 
from Appliance Plus. $200.00 
excavating discount from Mueller 
Excavating. 25 lbs. pork deal and 
steak for two from Loehr’s Meat 
Service, Holiday Inn package 
from National Exchange Bank, 
and Casio keyboard from Reilly 
Realtors. Beams donated by 
school and parish families in­
clude: tickets to the Fireside, 
wooden quilt rack, child's com­
puter desk, hobby horse, hand­
made first communion dress, oak 
shelf, ceramic items, lottery 
tickets, firewood, gourmet lun­
cheon, antique globe lamp, 
Nicaraguan rocking chair, hand­
made afghans and much, much

Roosevelt Performing Arts 
Magnet High School in Fresno.

She then journeyed to New 
Ulm Minnesota to enroll at Dr. 
Martin Luther College to train for 
the teaching ministry in the 
Wisconsin Evangelical Lutheran 
Synod. After graduation in 1991 
from DMLC with a Bachelor of 
Science Degree in Education, and 
a minor in Music and English, 
she returned to California for one 
year to attend California State 
University of Fresno to further 
study music and voice.

In July of 1992 she was assign­
ed by the Wisconsin Synod Can­
didate Assignment Committee to 
the position here in Kewaskum. 
Her students number 27 active 
youngsters she is enjoying in the 
classroom. She is also the 
organist and senior choir director 
for the parish.

Beckie’s leisure activities in­
clude, of course, playing her 
Baby Grand piano, as well as 
reading, sports, and jewelry mak­
ing - when time permits. Since 
her childhood she has been a fan 
of Star Trek and considers herself 
one of the “trekkers”. She is the 
oldest of the Sweetman children 
and has two brothers, Matthew, 
20. Nathan 15, and one sister, 
Carissa. 13. at home.

We welcome Miss Sweetman 
to Kewaskum and St. Lucas!

more!
Music will be provided from 

10:00 to midnight for your danc­
ing pleasure.

Advance tickets can be pur­
chased at the Health Hut in 
Campbellsport or at the school of­
fice or parish center of St. Mat­
thew’s at a cost of $1.00 (high 
school age and adults) and .50c 
(anyone 8th gr. and under). Ad­
mission at the door on January 
30th will be $2.00 for adults and 
$1.00 for children.

Kewaskum Teachers 
Recognized

The University of Wisconsin - 
Stout in Menomonie, has 
recognized five Kewaskum 
teachers for their “uncommon, 
innovative teaching methods.”

Jan Uhlman, 7th grade teacher 
at Kewaskum Middle School, 
Tim Leader, 5th grade teacher at 
Farmington Elementary, Doris 
Oik, 3rd grade teacher at Farm­
ington Elementary and the 5th 
grade team at Kewaskum 
Elementary School, consisting of 
Peggy Nelson, Erv Uhlman, and 
Jane Lazarevic, have received 
certificates acknowledging their 
nominations illustrating “uncom­
mon, field-leading, student 
benefitting approaches” to 
education.

Carol Zoerb, District Gifted 
and Talented Education Coor­
dinator. nominated these teachers 
to present their ideas at a Profes­
sional Development Institute in 
July. If they are selected to be 
presenters, their ideas will be 
shared with teachers from Min­
nesota, Wisconsin, Iowa, Nor­
thern Illinois, and Michigan.

This marks the first time 
Kewaskum staff have been 
nominated for this program.

Resident Assistant 
At UW-Eau Claire

EAU CLAIRE — Nineteen 
new resident assistants joined the 
University of Wisconsin - Eau 
Claire residence hall staff this 
semester.

A resident assistant is a full- 
time student who serves as a 
counselor, programmer, resource 
person and disciplinarian to the 
students in his or her unit. RAs 
contribute to the intellectual, 
social and cultural development 
of students living in the residence 
halls.

An RA from this area is:
KEWASKUM - Michelle 

Marx, junior, elementary 
education.
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TEAM VIDEO
133 Main St., Kewaskum 626-4723

OVER 150 
NINTENDO 

GAMES .

Kewaskum’s Largest Selection of Movies & Games
TUESDAY & THURSDAY SPECIAL

2 New Releases for $3.00
OFFER ENDS FEB. 28, 1993

a, SOpL so

OPEN Mon.-Thurs. Noon to 8 p m — Fri. Noon to 9 p.m. — Sat. 10 a.m. to 9 p.m. — Sun. 11 am. to 7 p.m
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e 3 KFD Fire and
Rescue Squad Calls

Wednesday, Jan. 20, 2:44 p.m. 
- The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
responded when a patient was 
driven to the Kewaskum Fire 
House when his finger became 
pinched in a chain and was par­
tially amputated. He was 
transported from the Fire House 
to St. Joseph’s Hospital in West 
Bend.

Friday, Jan. 22, 9:15 p.m. - The 
Kewaskum Rescue Squad was 
summoned to Sunburst Ski Hill 
when a female patient fell while 
skiing. She complained of pain in 
her head, neck and thigh. She 
was transported to St. Joseph’s 
Hospital in West Bend.

Friday, Jan. 22, 9:44 p.m. - The 
Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
answered another call to Sun­
burst Ski Hill following a collision 
between two female skiers. Both 
suffered some back pain and one 
also had pain in her neck and 
right leg. They were both 
transported to St. Joseph’s 
Hospital in West Bend.

FIREMEN TO MEET
The regular monthly meeting of 

the Kewaskum Fire Department 
will be held at the fire station on 
Thursday, Feb. 4, at 7:30 p.m.

Want to buy or sell? Try a Statesman 
classified ad. 626-2626.

The leading producers of natural gas are the 
United States, Russia, the Netherlands and Canada
in that order.

KEWASKUM 
FROZEN FOODS

118 Forest Ave., Kewaskum
PHONE 626-2710 or 626-2181 

Robert Beisbier Owner. .

* SPECIAL * * SPECIAL * * SPECIAL * 
Thurs., Fri., & Sat. - Jan. 28. 29 & 30

Country Style

SPARERIBS S 1.29 ib.

c/d FEBRUARY 3-4-5-6
^e BACON SALE
Vacuum Pack $1.59 lb. Bulk SI.49 lb. 

ALSO AVAILABLE AT SAUSAGE PLUS 
IN WEST BEND - FEB. 3, 4, 5, 6 & 7

♦ ★ ★ ^SPECIAL ★ ★ ★ ★
Starting Jan. 15 thru Jan. 30 
BEEF & PORK SALE
BEEF - Halves or Quarters

$1.45 ib
Includes cutting, wrapping and freezing

HOGS - Whole or Halves
$1.04 b

Includes cutting, wrapping, freezing, sausage 
making, curing and smoking, rendering of lard

NO HIDDEN COSTS

Open Monday-Thursday Pam tv 5 30 p m 
Friday 8am to 7 p m Saturday 8am to 4 p m

Tackle a Great Pizza!
On the run with no time to cook? Tackle a great tasting Hot Stuff’ pizza.
SHEFOND Mobil MART SHEFOND AMOCO

259 Fond du Lac Ave 
Campbellsport 

533-8985 HOT STUFF 
PIZZERIA,

890 Fond du Lac Ave 
Kewaskum 
626-4463

Party Pack:
Any 2 Large 

1 Topping Pizzas

i$1i88I Plus TaxPlus Tax

Not valid with 
any other offer 

Valid only at 
participating 

Hot Stuff* locations.

HOT STUFF

Expires 2-7-93

Coke or Pepsi 
12 Pk. A

99S 
with any 

Large Pizza.
Not valid with 

any other offer 
Valid only al 
participating 

Hot Stuff* locations

HOT STUFF

In the Service

$4 Shane Oppermann

SA Shane Oppermann, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Leander Opper­
mann. W907 Auburn Ashford 
Drive, graduated from basic 
training at Recruit Training Com­
mand. Great Lakes, Illinois on 
Nov. 20, 1992.

Shane entered the Navy's 
delayed entry program on Sept. 
30, 1991 while in high school. 
Graduating from Kewaskum 
High School on June 5, 1992 his 
active duty began Sept. 15.

Shane is now stationed at the 
Naval Training Center in Mill­
ington, Tennessee, attending

Aviation Electronic Technician 
school in the advanced electronic 
field.

Navy Seaman Recruit Brett W. 
Prost, son of William E. and Jean 
H. Prost of 329 Braatz. Drive, 
Kewaskum, WI, recently 
graduated from the Basic Enlisted 
Submarine Course.

During the course at the Naval 
Submarine School, Groton, CT. 
students are introduced to the 
basic theory, construction and 
operation of nuclear-powered 
submarines. The course also in­
cludes shipboard organization, 
damage control, submarine safe­
ty and escape procedures.

The 1992 graduate of 
Kewaskum High School joined 
the Navy in July 1992.

One More Time...
(Continued from Pane 1)

down yourself and put that infor­
mation in a few paragraphs and 
bring it in or send it to the 
Statesman, P.O. Box 98. 
Kewaskum. WI 53040. If you 
feel you absolutely cannot do it 
and break out in a cold sweat just 
thinking about it, ask around. 
Nine chances out often that there 
is someone out there who actual­
ly enjoys writing and is probably 
very talented.

All we ask is that your article 
be either written legibly or 
typewritten on 81/: x 11" paper 
and that you include your name 
and phone number in case we 
need to contact you. If you like, 
we can use your byline or you can 
remain anonymous. Our deadline 
is Monday noon.

But please... don't wait for so­
meone else to do it . We are all 
parents and we understand how 
hard our children are working to 
achieve their goals. We definite­
ly want to see all of them reward­
ed for their diligence. Adults, 
too, like to receive an occasional 
pat on the back for a feat well 
done.

In 1993, let's all work together 
to make sure ALL area residents 
receive the recognition they 
deserve. Submit an article about 
the accomplishments of a friend 
or relative. Who knows, you 
might not find it as difficult as 
you imagine. You could possibly 
even enjoy it and may be 
unleashing a talent you never 
realized you had.

And remember, if you ab­
solutely feel you can't do it ... 
just ask. There is ALWAYS so­
meone out there who can.

Kewaskum Juniors 
To Meet
The next meeting of the GFWC 

Kewaskum Junior Woman’s Club 
will be held on Tuesday, Feb. 2, 
at 7:00 p.m. in the Kewaskum 
Municipal Building Community 
Room. Our guest speaker for the 
evening will be Joy Breese who 
will speak on Child Abuse 
Prevention. A short social time 
will follow our speaker and then 
our regular meeting will begin.

Any woman who is interested 
in our program or learning more 
about our community volunteer 
efforts is invited to join us. If you 
would like more information, you 
may call Holly at 626-4893 or 
Terry at 626 4920. We look for­
ward to sharing an evening of 
friendship with you.

$$ NOTICE $$
Paying 

Immediate
CASH

TOP DOLLAR for all 
your unwanted GOLD, 
DENTAL, SILVER, 
DIAMONDS & OLD 
WATCHES and most 
OLD COINS

CALLAWAY 
& CO.

409 Main St., Kewaskum
626-4609



MEMORIES
World War II Servicemen

To display children's artwork without ruining walls with 
tape or tacks, hang a fishnet on a wall and hold pictures 
to it with clothespins.

Primus Hilmes

Roger Reindl

Tiny Terlinden Photos

If you see 
this Dolly, 
on Feb. 3, 
wish her a

HAPPY 
13th

BIRTHDAY!
Love... Mom, Dad & Bradley

Kew
askum Statesm

an, Thursday, Jan. 28, 1993, Page 4

Lloyd Backhaus

William Roehrdanz

Love,

It's a Girl!
AMANDA JOY MILLER 

Congratulations 
Sherry, Stan 

and “Pretty Boy”
Great Grandma and Great Grandpa Steiner
Grandma and Grandpa Seefeldt
Larry Seefeldt
Aunt Cindy, Uncle Gary. Travis & Todd Scheid 
Uncle Gary, Aunt Shelli A Krysten Seefeldt 
Uncle Randy, Barb & Kids

KEWASKUM STATESMAN 
250 Main St., P.O. Box 98 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
Phone 414-626-2626
WEEKLY NEWSPAPER

Volume 97 Number 7
January 28, 1993
(USPS 294-060)

Second Class Postage Paid at 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040
Lana Harbeck Kuehl 

Publisher
SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 
$17.00 a year - in-state 

$20.00 a year - out-of-state 
Single copy - 35c

Please send change of 
address orders to:

KEWASKUM STATESMAN 
250 Main St., P.O. Box 98 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040

active member

if M^ WISCONSIN\\,yA newspaper
Ul ASSOCIATION

MEMBER

Happy 
30th 

SANDRA 
GITTER
January 29th

Happy 
Birthday 

SCHNIBY! 
On Feb. 5th

From Your Favorite Girls 
WE LOVE YOU DAD! 

Mary, Erin & Erica

Sweet at 6. 
Sweeter at 16!

Happy
Sweet 

16 
BECKY!
Love... Mom, Dad, 

Katie & Joe
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e 5 Collaborative Effort Was Needed 
For SUPER I, SUPER II Programs

State Residents Asked to 
Identify ‘Doctor of the Year ’

The need to find new, cost ef­
ficient, and appropriate means of 
helping high risk individuals and 
families lead healthier lives led to 
a collaborative effort by the 
Council on Alcohol and Other 
Drug Abuse, the Youth and 
Family Project, Big Brothers/Big 
Sisters, and Friends of Abused 
Families in bringing the SUPER 
I and II programs to Washington 
County.

SUPER (Substance Use 
Prevention and Education 
Resource) is a primary preven- 
tion/early intervention program 
designed as a parent-child enrich­
ment service. The program for­
mat includes an alcohol and drug 
assessment (youth and family), 
followed by 8 hours of family 
training.

The educational component of 
the program will be facilitated by 
trained representatives from 
social service agencies, juvenile 
justice, law enforcement, youth 
representatives and school per­
sonnel. Basic AODA education, 
parenting, peer refusal skills, 
family relationship development, 
and communication skills will be 
covered. Follow up interviews 
and periodic surveys will monitor 
the need for additional services.

SUPER 1 and II programs were 
developed and have been 
operating successfully in Atlanta. 
Georgia and other areas for 
almost 10 years. The programs 
target such issues as truancy, 
substance abuse, crime and 
delinquency.

One of the major issues facing 
human service providers is to 
eliminate duplication of services 
and at the same time enhance col­
laborative efforts. The collabora­

tion involved with the SUPER 
programs promises to yield a 
more efficient system for all con­
cerned with at risk families. Fun­
ding for this effort was made 
possible by a grant from the 
United Way of Greater 
Milwaukee.

Watch for more information on 
SUPER I and II, or call Rick 
Vrzal, Project Coordinator, at 
338-1181.

Order of the Arrow 
To Meet Feb. 4

Members of the Order of the 
Arrow of the Awase Lodge, 
Glacier Edge District 11 Bay- 
Lakes Council of the Boy Scouts 
of America, will meet Thursday, 
February 4, at 7:30 p.m. in Room 
B-16 of John Long Middle 
School, corner of Fifth and 
Hickory Streets, Grafton. All 
members from Ozaukee County, 
Random Lake and Washington 
County are urged to attend.

Chapter Chief, Mike Hartwig, 
will preside over the selection of 
the OA Election Team. This team 
in turn will visit the district troops 
to conduct the elections of new 
Order of the Arrow members.

Linoleum was invent­
ed about 1860 by 
Frederick Walton of 
England. He found that 
linseed oil, when exnosed 
to air, became a r^uber- 
like material that could be 
used as a floor covering.

MADISON... Do you know a 
doctor who is outstanding, so­
meone who goes beyond the call 
of duty to help those in need? The 
State Medical Society of Wiscon­
sin is asking the residents of 
Wisconsin to help select the 1993 
Physician Citizen of the Year. 
The award, which is presented 
annually, honors physicians for 
outstanding civic, cultural, 
economic, charitable and health 
care services provided to their 
local communities or the state.

To nominate a doctor for the 
award, send the doctor’s name 
and home or office address with 
your own name and address and 
a summary of your reasons for 
believing the physician deserves 
to be Physician-Citizen of the 
Year. Mail your nominations to: 
Commission on Public Informa­
tion, State Medical Society of 
Wisconsin, P.O. Box 1109, 
Madison. WI 53701. Nomination 
must be submitted by the

Night Ski at Riveredge
On Saturday, January 30, from 

5 to 9 p.m. two miles of the ski 
trails at Riveredge Nature Center 
will be lighted by the soft glow of 
lantern light. Join in for this uni­
que winter experience of skiing at 
night.

Always call ahead to confirm 
that trail conditions are suitable 
for skiing. The fee is $4.00.

Call Riveredge at 675-6888 
(local) or 375-2715 (metro) for 
more information.

Riveredge is a non-profit, 350 
acre sanctuary and educational 
organization, providing en­
vironmental programs for all ages 
It is located in Ozaukee County on 
Highway Y, one mile north of 
Newburg between Saukville and 
West Bend.

February 19th deadline to be 
considered.

To be eligible, the doctor must 
be an M .D. or a D O. and must 
reside and practice medicine in 
Wisconsin. Except in unusual cir­
cumstances. his or her services to 
the state or community should be 
uncompensated. Preference will 
be given to current service over 
lifetime service. Previous win­
ners are not eligible. (The 
medical society will notify you if 
your nominee is a previous win­
ner). For more information, call 
1-8OO-362-9O8O.

Adult Classes at
West Bend Gallery

The West Bend Gallery of Fine 
Arts is pleased to announce the 
following classes for adults:

INTRODUCTION TO CLAY 
METHODS will be held on 
Tuesdays and Thursdays. 
February 2 to March 25 (16 ses­
sions) from 1:30 to 3:30 p.m. 
The instructor will be Dr. James 
Albrecht and the fee is $55 for a 
Gallery Friend or $65 to the 
general public.

The class size is limited to six 
students. This class will focus on 
working with a low-fire clay 
body. Demonstration and hands- 
on wheel technique will be in­
cluded as well as hand-building 
methods. This is a good oppor­
tunity for beginners to discover 
their abilities with clay. Supplies 
are included.

BEGINNING AND INTER 
ED1ATE DRAWING STUDIO 
will be held on Wednesdays, 
February 3 to March 10 (six ses­
sions), from 1 to 3 p.m. The in­
structor is Ed Kocher and the fee

is $30 for Gallery Friends and 
$40 for the general public.

The class size is limited to 
twelve students. Students will ap­
proach drawing and composition 
with a variety of media, including 
pastel, charcoal, pencil and col­
ored pencil and ink. Observa­
tional drawing skills will be em­
phasized. Supplies are not 
included.

MATTING AND FRAMING 
WORKSHOP will be held on 
Saturday, February 6, from I to 
4 p.m. The instructor is Bonnie 
Paruch and the fee is $15 for 
Gallery Friends or $20 for the 
general public.

The class size is limited to ten 
students. Learn matting and fram­
ing selection and production tips 
from professional artist/gallery 
owner, Bonnie Paruch. This 
workshop is designed for area ar­
tists who need more information 
about the matting and framing 
presentation of their work for 
commercial galleries and juried 
exhibitions. Participants who 
have their own mat cutting equip­
ment should bring it to this class. 
Most supplies are included.

The West Bend Gallery of Fine 
Arts is located at 300 South 6th 
Avenue in downtown West Bend. 
Normal gallery hours are 
Wednesday through Saturday 
from 10 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. and 
Sunday from 1 to 4:30 p.m. For 
more information, call the gallery 
at 334-9638.

Fifteen years after a 
person quits smoking, 
his or her risk of prema­
ture death from smok­
ing—related disease 
has all but disappeared.

JIM SCHAUB J
“for the repair job that’s 

been put off for too long ’ ’
P.O. Box 177 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040
^ 626-8227
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Schulteis - Squier

An Aug. 7, 1993 wedding is 
being planned by Julia Schulteis, 
Germantown, and Jeffrey Squier, 
Acton, MA.

Parents of the couple are Don 
and Mary Schulteis, Germantown 
and Dale and Joan Squier, 
Kewaskum.

A graduate of Germantown, 
Julia earned her bachelor’s 
degree in Elementary Education 
with a minor in Mathematics 
from U.W. -Oshkosh. She is 
presently employed as a Math

February Family 
Center Programs

"For Parents: Teaching O.K. 
and Unwanted Touch:" will be 
held Friday, February 12, from 
9:30 - 11:00 a m. Be aware and 
learn how to teach your child 
about safe and unsafe touch. It is 
important to teach body parts, use 
the proper terminology and be an 
“askable” parent. Coreen 
Dahlberg, Parent Educator for 
Planned Parenthood will also do 
a skit for the children and parents 
of birth to four-year-olds. Call to 
register: Family Center of 
Washington County, 338-9461.

"All About Time-Outs" will 
be held Thursday, February 25, 
6:30 - 8:00 p.m. Help is on the 
way! Your preschoolers common 
everyday behavior problems can 
be solved — without shouting or 
spanking. The Time Out method 
is regarded by child psychologists
and pediatricians as one of the
most effective means of working 
out behavior problems with kids 
from 2 years. You can replace 
poor behavior with good 
behavior. Nancy Trehey, Fami-
ly Center Assistant Director will 
lead this FREE program. Call to 
register: Family Center of
Washington County. 338-9461.

Birth
KEESE — A daughter, Erin 

Jayne, to Sue and Brendan Keese 
of Whitefish Bay on December 
30. 1992. Grandparents are Carl 
and Arlene Koepke of Kewaskum 
and Julia Wallace of Burlington.

Member National Association of Tax Practitioners

teacher with the Campbellsport 
School District.

Lt. Squier is Director of Patient 
Administrations USAF Clinic, 
Hanscom AFB, MA. Jeffrey 
earned his bachelor’s degree in 
Chemistry and Biology and a 
masters degree in Business Ad­
ministration from 
U.W.-Oshkosh.

St. Mary’s Catholic Church in 
Menomonee Falls will be the set­
ting for the ceremony.

Karshen - Stern
June Sandra Karshen and 

Donald A. Stern are pleased to 
announce their engagement.

Parents of the couple are John 
Severin Karshen and the late Lor­
raine June Karshen; and Arlene 
and Richard Stern of Kewaskum.

A May 22, 1993 wedding is be­
ing planned by the couple.

Riveredge Bird Club 
To Present Program

Join the Riveredge Bird Club 
on Tuesday. February 2 at 7 p.m. 
for a program led by Paul Mat- 
thiae of the Bureau of Endangered 
Resources. The subject of the 
program will be the importance 
of preserving Wisconsin’s 
biodiversity.

For more information, call
Riveredge at 375-2715 (Metro) or
675-6888 (local).

Riveredge Nature Center is a 
non-profit. 350 acre sanctuary 
located at 4458 W. Hawthorne 
Drive, one mile north of
Newburg that provides en­
vironmental education for 
children and adults.

All toothed whales 
swallow their food 
whole.

Volunteer!
Many new volunteer oppor­

tunities have just been listed with 
the Volunteer Center. Some of 
these are fun - some are challeng­
ing! Check the column below and 
see if you are needed. If you don’t 
see a job listed that is right for 
you, call the Volunteer Center: 
they have many not printed here! 
338-8256.

Cook for weekends: (or earlier 
in the week and food will be 
frozen). Food will be for groups 
meetings at a retreat center. This 
help is needed two times a month.

Drivers: Someone to deliver 
meals to homebound elderly on 
Thursdays during the months of 
February and March is urgently 
needed.

Locker Room Helper: Male 
needed every other Thursday 
from 2:00 to 2:30 after swim 
classes.

Advocate for parents of a high 
school student: train to help the 
parents of a high school student 
use some of the services available 
to them. Accompany the parent to 
teacher conferences: be familiar 
with the high school building. 
Your concern now for a teen can 
make a lifelong difference!

Marketing Skills needed: be an 
advisor to a committee which is 
just now forming. Meet with 
them 3 or 4 times to steer them 
in the right direction. This agen­
cy has a good story: it would like 
the public to know about it. This 
is a short assignment suitable for 
someone with Marketing 
experience.

Germantown: Greet new 
residents of Germantown by 
delivering a packet of welcoming 
items. Volunteer will use his/her
own car and mileage will be rein- 
bursed. If you are familiar with 
the Germantown area and are a 
friendly person, this may be right 
for you. This job would be fun to 
do with a friend, too.

Basketball Coaches: Work with 
a youth basketball program on 
Saturday mornings at a West 
Bend agency. Coaches are need­
ed to work with 3rd thru 8th 
grade boys and girls in separate 
programs. The dates are Feb. 13 
thru Apr. 3, from 9:00 a.m. to 
12:00 noon. If you are 
knowledgeable about basketball, 
you can help our youth learn 
these skills and have a good time 
yourself.

Sewing: if you enjoy sewing 
you are needed! A day care center 
for seniors needs sewing straight 
seams, such as making pillows. 
This can be done in your own

(414) 626*8432

INCOME TAX PREPARATION 
(Farm and Individual)

Prompt, Professional Service 

Over 20 Years Experience

GERALD A. KIEFER 
LAW OFFICE

1233 Fond du Lac Avenue 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

home or at the agency.
Special Friend needed For a 10 

year old child. Get to know this 
curious and articulate child while 
sharing her interests in reading, 
shopping and conversation. In­
clude her in your ordinary ac­
tivities in the community. This 
child lives in West Bend and is 
looking for a new friend.

Data Entry — Adults with ex­
perience needed to enter data 
after the Big Brothers/Big Sisters 
bowlathon. Dates are: Feb. 13, 
from 12 noon to 7.00 p.m. and 
Feb. 14, 1993 from 9 a.m. to 6 
p.m. if you can give one or two 
hours or mor to this worthwhile 
program we will be glad to fill 
you in on the details!

Foster Home Provider - Provide 
shelter for a youth in crisis on an 
emergency, short term (72 hours 
max) basis. Child must have own 
bed but can share a room with 
child of same sex. If you like 
helping youth here’s something 
you can do. Working persons will 
be eligibile, of course.

Kewaskum Area Library Aide - 
Volunteer would update vertical 
file, write for free pamphlets, file 
them and update records. Plan on 
one or two days a week at first to 
learn this job, then one or two 
times a month should be suffi­
cient. Monday, Wednesday or 
Friday are available.

Yearbook Organizer - Like to 
cut and paste? Organize articles 
for a year book for an agency 
located in Hubertus. This can be 
done anytime that is convenient 
to the volunteer.

Docent Greet visitors to the art 
gallery and conduct tours of the 
current exhibit. Monthly training 
is provided; times to work are 
flexible. Besides learning some 
new ideas this job offers interac-
ting with a variety of people.

Typist - To type news releases; 
newsletters and other 
miscellaneous items for a West 
Bend agency. This will take one 
morning a week on either Mon­
day, Tuesday, Wednesday or 
Thursday.

Blood Center Hostess - Greet 
blood donors and serve 
refreshments after they are 
through. Volunteer should be 
friendly and enjoy meeting new 
people. Times for this vary and 
there are many time slots 
available.

Mailing Helper - Four times a 
year an agency needs to mail a 
newsletter. Several people could 
make up a regular committee to 
do this small, but necessary task. 
If you have been looking to 
volunteer but have little time, call 
about this!

Attorney Gerald A. Kiefer

KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 
SCHOOLS

Monday, Feb. 1 — Tijuana 
tacos (lean grd. beef, mozzarella 
cheese, lettuce, taco chips & 
sauce), fluffy white rice, cin­
namon, applesauce, milk & lime 
sherbet.

Tuesday, Feb. 2 — Baked fish 
square on a whole wheat bun, 
seasoned green beans, crispy con­
fetti cole slaw, milk and a 
California date nut bread.

Wednesday, Feb. 3 — Chili 
con came, crackers, chilled 
orange or apple slices, rye or 
white bread, milk and an oatmeal 
raisin cookie. (Salad Bar - H.S. 
& M.S.).

Thursday, Feb. 4 — Piled high 
lean roast beef & turkey sub­
marine sandwich w/lettuce, 
tomato & mozzarella cheese, 
oven baked potato wedges, 
peaches, milk and choc, pudding.

Friday, Feb. 5 — Baked 
chicken, whipped potatoes, fresh 
veggies & dill dip, Italian bread, 
milk and cherry jello.

HOLY TRINITY 
SCHOOL

Monday, Feb. 1 — Chicken 
pattie, lettuce, tomatoe/mayo, 
cherry cup, carrot coins, oatmeal 
bar, milk.

Tuesday, Feb. 2 — Spaghet-
ti/meat sauce, buttered peas, pear 
half, bread/butter, cinnamon roll, 
milk.

Wednesday, Feb. 3 — Oven 
baked chicken, whipped potatoes, 
green beans, muffin/butter, milk.

Thursday, Feb. 4 — 
Taco/shell/chips, let- 
tuce/tomatoe/cheese, golden 
corn, peach half, pudding, milk.

Friday, Feb. 5 — Toasted 
cheese, peanut butter sandwich, 
tri-tatars, apple sauce, cookie, 
milk.

Bartlett pears are the most 
popular pears in the 
United States.
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e 7 Violet Schmitz Named 
Local Coordinator

Violet Schmitz

The Wisconsin Technical Col­
lege Ambassador Program, co­
sponsored statewide by the 
Wisconsin Board of Vocational, 
Technical and Adult Education 
and Robert W. Baird & Co. In­
corporated, will be coordinated 
locally by Violet Schmitz., ad­
ministrative secretary II at 
Moraine Park Technical College. 
The announcement was made by 
Lawrence Pasquini, Moraine 
Park's dean of student services.

According to Schmitz, the Am­
bassador Program honors ex­
cellence among vocational- 
technical students at the 
postsecondary level. “The Am­
bassador Program seeks to 
spotlight the role of vocational - 
technical training in our modern

BUILDING QUALITY IS OUB SPECIALTY'
RESIDENTIAL & COMMERCIAL

Building • Alterations
Additions -

New Construction 
Remodeling

••PROFESSIONAL EXPERIENCE. QUALITY
MATERIALS AND ATTENTION TO ALL DETAILS. "

I 8687 PROSPECT DR. 
Lmlaaaaaam

KEWASKUM

626-2511

economy and to emphasize the 
dignity of work,” she said.

Schmitz will work in coopera­
tion with officials of the Moraine 
Park Foundation, the locally 
sponsoring organization, to 
choose a student to represent the 
district in the state event in 
Madison on May 12-13, 1993.

The district finalist will com­
pete with students from the other 
postsecondary vocational- 
technical districts to be the 
Wisconsin Technical College 
Ambassador.

“We make every effort to 
select our most outstanding stu­
dent to represent the district at the 
state event,” said Schmitz. Beth 
Utterback-Klapa, a Moraine Park 
graduate, won the state event last 
year.

Glacier Edge Scout 
Leader Roundtables

Glacier Edge District 1, Bay- 
Lakes Council of the Boy Scouts 
of America, will conduct Round­
tables for all adult personnel of 
their Cub Scout Packs and Boy 
Scout Troops. Thursday, 
February 4, 7:30 p.m. at John 
Long Middle School, corner of 
Fifth and Hickory Streets, 
Grafton.

Participants in the Cub Round- 
table will investigate and examine 
procedures and exhibits for the 
“Weather Observation” theme 
prepared by Commissioner Ann 
Mueller, and her staff in the All- 
Purpose Room. Advancement
and leader recognition
ceremonies will be enacted; Mike 
Smith will involve everyone in 
the participation skit. “It’s All In
Your Mind”; and games, in­
cluding Cub Scout Hockey, will 
be played.

Dave Parkinson will meet with 
Webelos Leaders to discuss the 
Engineer and Handyman Activi­
ty Badges. Helpful ideas and 
techniques will be exchanged.

The Scout Roundtable will con­
vene in the school library, where 
Dennis Grabow. Scoutmaster of 
Troop 839, Grafton, will narrate 
a slide presentation of an excur­
sion to the National North Coun­
try Hiking Trail, at Mellen, Wl, 
east of Cable and south of Lake 
Superior. Two days were spent 
hiking 23 miles of the 65-mile 
trail, using back packs and sleep­
ing in home-made shelters.

Commissioner, Tom Weirz- 
bicki, and Flag Day promoters 
from Kenosha will give details of

Corps in September 1992. ween Saukville and West Bend.rhe parade and campout at

355 Main St., Kewaskum Kuehl’s PHONE 626-4565

SUDS w SPIRITS

Sheriff’s Department Offers New 
“Road Condition Information Line’’

The Washington County 
Sheriffs Department has nstall- 
ed its first phase of a “voice 
mail” system which will allow 
callers to quickly transfer their 
calls to key locations within the 
agency.

One feature of this system is a 
24-hour hotline for road condition 
reports during the winter months. 
The road condition report is ac­
cessed by calling the main phone 
number (335-4378) and following 
the instructions given when the 
call is answered. The report will 
be updated regularly as conditions

In the Service Habitat Healers
Marine Pfc. Kevin M. Tucker, 

son of Doris K. Marceau of 1708 
Mapledale, West Bend, recently 
completed recruit training and 
was promoted to his present rank.

During the training cycle at 
Marine Corps Recruit District, 
San Diego, recruits are taught the 
basics of battlefield survival, in­
troduced to typical military daily 
routine and personal and profes­
sional standards.

All recruits participate in an ac­
tive physical conditioning pro­
gram and gain proficiency in a 
variety of military skills including 
first aid, rille marksmanship and 
close-order drill. Teamwork and 
self-discipline are emphasized 
throughout the cycle.

The 1992 graduate of Camp­
bellsport High School, Camp­
bellsport, joined the Marine

change.
A touch-tone phone is needed 

to access the road report. Since 
some residents do not have such 
phones, the sheriff’s department 
will continue to provide informa­
tion to the local radio stations.

Information on road conditions 
outside the county can be obtain­
ed by calling 1-800-ROAD-WIS, 
a service of the Wisconsin 
Department of Transportation.

The department also reminds 
residents that it does not receive 
information on school closings. 
Local radio stations are the best 
source of that information.

This informal, but informed 
group meets each Tuesday to 

* pursue a variety of activities 
related to managing the habitats 
of Riveredge. Prairie seed collec­
ting, systematic surveys of prairie 
insects, transplanting of 
woodland wildflowers and just 
musing are all within the purview 
of activities of this work-learn 
group.

Anyone who thinks this sounds 
like fun may join in at Riveredge 
Nature Center on Tuesday, 
February 2, from 9 a m. to Noon.

Call Riveredge at 375-2715 
(metro) or 675-6888 (local) for 
more information.

Riveredge is a non-profit, 350 
acre natural sanctuary and 
educational organization, pro­
viding environmental programs 
for all ages It is located in 
Ozaukee County, on Highway Y. 
one mile north of Newburg, bet-

BUNKELMRN 
BUILDERS INC.
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PACE - People with Arthritis Can Exercise 
Is a New Program at St. Josephs

There is a new program entitl­
ed PACE being offered at St. 
Joseph's Community Hospital in 
cooperation with the Arthritis 
Foundation.

Program Description
PACE stands for “People with 

Arthritis Can Exercise.” This is 
an exercise program specifically 
designed for people with arthritis. 
Gentle exercises and activities are 
used to help increase flexibility, 
strength and endurance Benefits 
of this program include a reduc­
tion in pain, stiffness and the 
depression often associated with 
arthritis. There are two levels of 
exercise being offered, both basic

Auditions for ‘Man of La 
Mancha’Feb. 2 at UWWC

West Bend — Professor Brad 
Ford, Director of Theatre at The 
University of Wisconsin Center - 
Washington County, announces 
auditions for the Theatre-on-the- 
Hill’s spring musical, Man of La 
Mancha.

Audiences at the UWWC 
Theatre on the Hill will be able 
to share the delights of 
theatregoers all over the world in 
experiencing Dale Wasserman’s 
musical comedy, Man of La 
Mancha. The play is based on his 
interpretation of a novel which 
has been considered one of the 
great masterpieces of world 
literature for almost 375 years, 
Don Quixote, by Miquel de 
Cervantes.

The story is a sort of dream se­
quences in which Cervantes im­
agines himself to be Don Quix­
ote, accompanied by his faithful 
squire, Sancho, as he endeavors 
unsuccessfully to cure the ills of 
the world. Included are the jousts 
with windmills, his worship of 
the urchin Aldonza, his delusion 
of the golden helmet — a barber’s 
bow| — his final knighthood by 
the local innkeeper and the 
ultimate scene in which he is once 
again Cervantes, on his death­
bed, failing to recall his fantasy.

When it was first presented in 
1965, Man of La Mancha was 
hailed by the N.Y. Daily News 
critic as “The finest and most 
original work in our musical 
theatre.” It ranks with Fiddler on 
the Roof. Hello. Dolly! and My 
Fair Lady as one of the thrilling 
superattractions of the modern 
musical theatre. It has been ac­
claimed in productions all over 
the world. Its song hits 
“Dulcinea” and “The Impossi­
ble Dream” have become 
musical classics. The show so 
overwhelmingly impressed critics 
that it won almost every major 
stage award during its first Broad ­
way season.

Auditions will be held Tues­
day, February 2, from 7-10 p.m. 
at UWWC’s Theatre-on-the-Hill. 
An assortment of male and

The globefish staves off 
predators by gulping a 
large quantity of water, till 
it becomes simply too 
large to be swallowed by 
its enemies.

and advanced, to meet the needs 
of each participant.

Class Structure
The program will be co-led by 

Ken Schiller, O.T.R., Director of 
Rehabilitation Services and Mar­
cia Reth, Physical Therapy 
Technician, Exercise Specialist. 
Both Ken and Marcia have com­
pleted Arthritis Foundation train­
ing and are certified PACE in­
structors. Classes will be held in 
the 4 East Conference Room of 
St. Joseph’s Community Hospital 
on Wednesdays and Fridays from 
10:30 to 11:30 a.m. for six con 
secutive weeks beginning on 
March 3, 1993. Cost of the pro­

female, singing and nonsinging 
roles of varying sizes are 
available. Scripts and audio 
cassettes are available in the 
UWWC Library. For further in­
formation please call Brad Ford 
at 335-5222.

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU 
Meadowcreek Apartment 

Complex
Monday, Feb. I — Salisbury 

steak w/onions and It. gr., mash­
ed potatoes, peas and carrots, 
branatural bread, chilled peach 
slices.

Tuesday. Feb. 2 — Minestrone 
and crackers, veal parmigan, fet- 
tucini, Italian blend vegies, Italian 
bread, pie.

Thursday, Feb. 4 — Boneless 
pork roast w/lt. gravy, whipped 
potatoes, stewed tomatoes, mar­
ble rye bread, sugar cookie.

Ceramics at 10:00 a.m. every 
1st and 3rd Tuesday of the 
month.

^^ LONG LAKE 
W FISHEREE

Sunday, Feb. 7
Sponsored by the Long Lake Fishing Club

★ ★ TICKET PRIZES* ★ 
GRAND PRIZE - 5 HP MERCURY OUTBOARD

1st - Remington 870
Turkey Shotgun

2nd - Half Hog - Loehr’s Meats
3rd - Set of Regal Cookware
4th - Exide Battery
5th - West Bend Can Crusher
6th - 2 Milw. Bucks Tickets
7th - Long Lake Fishing Club 

Jacket
8th - West Bend Elec. Skillet
9th - Miller Mirror
10th - Miller Mirror
11th - 2 Live Lobsters
12-16th - Ice Fishing Packages

Drawing at Millie's Irish Pub - Sunday, Feb 14, 6 p.m.

FISH PRIZES AT 4 P.M. SUNDAY, FEB. 7, 1993
Longest Walleye, Northern, Bass - 1st, $15; 2nd, $10; 3rd, $5
Longest Bluegill, Perch, Crappie - 1st, $15; 2nd, $10, 3rd, $5 

Longest Bullhead - $5
BE SURE TO VOTE IN THE

“BEST LOOKING BULLHEAD” CONTEST

gram is $30.00 per person.
Who Can Participate?
Any adult with arthritis may 

join the PACE program. Par­
ticipants must be able to walk in­
dependently or with an assistive 
device. If in a wheelchair, they 
should be able to transfer to a 
straight-back chair. People who 
have severe joint problems or 
have had joint surgery are en­
couraged to check with their doc­
tor about special precautions.

For more information and to 
register for the program call the 
Rehabilitation Services Depart­
ment at St. Joseph’s Community 
Hospital, 334-8237.

Moraine Symphony 
Chamber Orchestra 
To Perform Friday

The Moraine Symphony 
Chamber Orchestra will perform 
in concert at the UWWC Theatre 
on Friday. January 29. Compos­
ed of musicians from the Moraine 
Symphony, Albert J. “Bud” 
Asch will direct this smaller 
group. Assistant Conductor Greg 
Hughes will also be featured.

They will perform Mozart’s 
“Symphony NO. 29,” “Two 
Gymnopedies” written by Erik 
Satie and arranged by Claude 
Debussy. Also featured will be 
“Ancient Airs and Dances” 
which is freely orchestrated by 
Ottorino Respighi.

Tickets can be reserved by call­
ing 335-5208 or purchased at the 
door. They are $6 for adults, and 
$4 for children and seniors. This 
performance will be at 7:30 p.m.

People are always 
good company when 
they are doing what 
they really enjoy.

Join Spring Tour 
To Washington D.C. 
With WB Gallery

Living across the street from 
the White House for a few days 
and being based within walking 
distance of our nation’s most im­
portant museums may be reason 
enough to be one of 30 guests to 
join the West Bend Gallery of 
Fine Arts spring tour to 
Washington D.C. from April 14 
to 18.

The primary reason of the trip 
is to join other guests from across 
the nation who were invited to a 
private opening reception for the 
exhibition, “Revisiting the White 
City: American Painting and 
Sculpture at the Chicago World's 
Columbian Exposition in 1893.” 
The exhibition will include SUM­
MER AFTERNOON, a Carl von 
Marr painting on display until 
February at the West Bend 
Gallery of Fine Arts.

The escorted tour will include 
a nighttime illumination tour of

St. Bridget’s j

POLKA MASS 
and KIRMES DANCE
^ Sunday, Jan. 31

J S a ik AMERAHN ■ .
Mass at 11 a.m.

; Dance 1 to 5 p.m.
LUNCH AVAILABLE

Music By

JERRY VOELKER ^
$1.00 Advance $2.00 At Door

AMERAHN 
Bar & Hall

Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum

Friday, Jan. 29 - 8:30 to 12:30

SIERRA

Saturday, Jan. 30 - 9 to 1 

THE LARRYS
-ID REQUIRED-

Sunday, January 31 
ST. BRIDGETS POLKA 

MASS and DANCE 
Music By 

JERRY VOELKER 
POLKA MASS AT 11 A.M.
* * LUNCH AVAILABLE* * 

DANCE — 1 TO 5 P.M.
••■■■■•■■■■«■■■■■■■■■«■■■■

PHONE 626-4031

Washington monuments and 
buildings, visits to the Smithso­
nian museums, governmental 
buildings, art museums and 
historical sights, including a day 
at Williamsburg, Virginia.

Since this is over the Easter 
break, it may be a perfect oppor­
tunity to take the family or grand­
children to Washington. Let’s 
hope the famed Washington D.C. 
cherry blossoms bloom in time to 
help usher in a beautiful spring in 
Washington.

Reservations can be made now 
and final payment will be due on 
or before February 26th. For ad- 
ditonal information, call the 
gallery at (414) 334-9638.

The West Bend Gallery' of Fine 
Arts is located at 300 South 6th 
Avenue in downtown West Bend. 
Normal gallery hours are 
Wednesday through Saturday 
from 10 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. and 
Sunday from 1 to 4:30 p.m.

The first ferris wheel was 
erected at the 1893 
Columbian Exposition in 
Chicago.
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Reservations, Purchase Stickers West Bend Gallery

It’s time to start planning for 
the 1993 camping season by mak­
ing reservations for your favorite 
state campground campsite or for 
the Mirror Lake Campground 
Cabin for people with disabilities.

And State Park officials remind 
winter park users that a 1993 park 
admission sticker is now needed 
if you plan on heading to a state 
park to enjoy skiing, ice fishing 
or other winter activities.

“Wisconsin state parks began 
accepting campsite reservations 
on January 4,” said Kimberly 
Eilenfeldt of the Department of 
Natural Resources Bureau of 
Parks and Recreation. “Many of 
the prime campsites at our state 
parks are reserved months in ad­
vance for busy weekends,” she 
said.

More than 35 state park and 
forest campgrounds have camp­
sites that can be reserved. Reser­
vations must be made directly to 
the park at which campers wish 
to reserve a campsite. Reserva­
tions must be made either in per­
son or through the mail on an of-
ficial DNR campsite reservation 
form. All campgrounds also have 
campsites that are available on a 
first come basis.

A special form is required to 
reserve the Cabin Campsite for 
people with disabilities located at 
Mirror Lake State Park, accor­
ding to Anthonette Gilpatrick. 
DNR accessibility specialist. The 
cabin, constructed for use ex­
clusively by people with 
disabilities, features a barrier free
design, lowered counter tops, a 
wheel-on shower, heating and air 
conditioning. An accessible 
fishing pier, observation deck 
overlooking Mirror Lake and hik­
ing trails are located near the 
cabin.

The cabin operates from May 
I through October 31. Reserva­
tion information is detailed on the 
reservation application form.

Reservation forms for campsite 
and the campground cabin are

KC HALL

Monthly 
Friday Night

8MFK
First Friday 

Of Every Month
Serving Starts at 5 p.m.

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC

Hall is also available for 
class reunions, weddings, 
anniversaries and large or 
small part group meetings.
★★★★★*★★★★

KC HALL
3245 Lighthouse Lane

334-9849

available at most park and forest 
offices or by writing to Bureau of 
Parks and Recreation. Wisconsin 
DNR, P.O. Box 7921, Madison. 
WI 53707. There is a $3 camp­
site reservation fee.

State park annual admission 
stickers are also available at state 
park and many other DNR of­
fices. Admission stickers cost $15 
for Wisconsin residents and $24 
for non-residents.

For more information contact 
Kimberly Eilenfeldt at (608) 
264-6035.

Old Settlers' Club
Banquet Feb. 10

The sixth annual revival of the 
“Old Settlers’ Club Banquet” 
will be held on Saturday, Feb. 
20, at the KC Hall, 3245 
Lighthouse Lane, West Bend. 
Social hour will begin at 5 p.m. 
with dinner being served at 6 
p.m. The cost of the dinner is $10 
per person.

The Town of Barton will be 
featured this year with speakers 
and entertainment from the area.

Please have your reservations 
in by Feb. 10. Send check to the 
Washington County Historical 
Society. 432 E. Washington St., 
West Bend, Wl 53095.

Reservations are limited to 
250. For more information call 
335-4678 or 334-2859.

West Bend Cinema
Downtown West Bend 334-5466

Saturday & Sunday Matlneet at 1, 2:45 & 4:30

/ \ Mel Gibson in
^^ FOREVER YOUNG

RaM PG Evenings at 7:15 & 9:20 p m
Z^^Saturday & Sunday Matinees at 1, 3:05 & 5:10

Walt Disney's

ALADDIN
Rated G

Jack Nicholson and Tom Cruise in

A FEW GOOD MEN
Rated R Evenings at 6:45 & 9:15

Saturday & Sunday Matinees at 1:15 & 3:45 p.m.

SUPER SAVER ON MON. & TUES. EVENINGS

Evenings 7 & 8:45

CC’s Annual 
Softball-Football 

DANCE 
Friday, Feb. 5 - k»»7?

at AMERAHN
Featuring

VIC FERRARI
FREE BEER ALL NIGHT! 

$8 Advance $10 At the Door

Tickets Available at Prime Time, CC’s, 
Amerahn or Any CC’s Ball Player

' Meet the 5; F

Genuine Draft
COLD 

PATROL GIRLS! 
* 4 • 0 ,

at

PRIME TIME PUB 
• Kewaskume v #

v Tuesday, Feb. 2*’*
» 8 p.m.

Anytime is the RiRht Time for Prime Time!

Dr. Frank Cassell. Dean of the 
Albert A. Robin Campus/Roose- 
elt University in Chicago will 
present a lecture entitled. “Had 
a Great Time, Wish You Could 
Have Been There,” at 2 p.m. on 
February 7th, at the West Bend 
Gallery of Fine Arts.

The lecture will review the col­
ossal and magnificent 1893 
Chicago Columbian Exposition 
which later inspired the creators 
of Walt Disney World.

The slide lecture will feature 
many of the exposition buildings 
and artifacts that exist today on 
the centennial of the exposition, 
also known as the Magic City. 
The review will include two Carl 
von Marr paintings in the 
gallery’s collection.

The West Bend Gallery of Fine 
Arts is located at 300 South 6th 
Avenue in downtown West Bend. 
Normal gallery hours are 
Wednesday through Saturday 
from 10 a.m. to 4:30 p.m. and 
Sunday from 1 to 4:30 p.m. For 
more information, call the gallery 
at 334-9638.

Millers Welcome
Amanda Joy

Stan and Sherry Miller of 
Jackson, are the proud parents of 
a daughter, Amanda Joy. She was 
born on Friday, Jan. 22, 
weighing 7 lbs., 12 ounces. 
Grandparents are Willy and Irene 
Seefeldt of Kewaskum and Carl 
and Dianne Miller, Cedarburg.

Rural Opportunity Center to
Serve Wisconsin Farm Families
Wisconsin farm families had an 

opportunity to tap into a network 
of informational and human ser­
vices at a new Rural Opportunity 
Center which opened in 
Kewaskum on January 27. Each 
month, the center will feature a 
guest speaker who will address 
current agricultural issues.

Located at the Amerahn Dance 
Hall, the center will be open the 
fourth Wednesday of each month 
from 11:30 a.m. to 1:30 p.m. No 
fees will be charged to par­
ticipants. Lunch will be provid­
ed at no charge.

The Rural Opportunity Center 
is sponsored by local community 
groups and the Wisconsin Depart­
ment of Agriculture, Trade and 
Consumer Protection.

The first guest speaker is Roger 
Williams, a professor in the 
Health and Human Issues Depart­
ment of the University of

The U.S. and Japan are Saudi Arabia's major trad­
ing partners.

Eckl's Main Street Inn 
143 M;iin St., Kewaskum

TAKEOUT 
SPECIALS 

v^* Pound of Fries & 
Pint of Cole Slaw

With Each 12 or 16 Pc. 
BUCKET OF CHICKEN

FREE 
GARLIC BREAD

SPECIALS GOOD 
SUNDAY, JAN. 31 ONLY 

\ 626-4328

Wisconsin-Madison. Williams 
will discuss the complexities of 
intergenerational farming — 
when a son or daughter-in-law 
enters the daily farming opera­
tion, often straining relationships. 
He will also offer insights into 
improving communication within 
the intergenerational farm family.

Future Topics Include
February 24 — Panel discussion 

of farm financial planning and 
relationships with lenders.

March 24 — Rural Voices, a 
drama about farmers’ love of the 
land as well as the struggle and 
hardships associated with family 
farming, will be performed and 
followed by a group discussion.

April 28 — Farm safety and 
rural health. For more informa­
tion. contact the Washington 
County U .W. Extension office at 
335-4477. 644-5204. 342-2929 
ext. 4477

With Each 12, 14 or 16” 
PIZZA TO GO!
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AAA Offers Motorists Tips 
For Driving on Ice and Snow

Winter driving can be very 
hazardous, expecially when the 
roads are wet, snow-covered or 
icy. Knowing how to safely start, 
stop and steer in such conditions 
takes some study at home 
beforehand and then some prac­
tice behind the wheel in a safe, 
secluded area.

To help inform motorists about 
the intricacies of safe winter driv­
ing, Triplc-A offers a free pam­
phlet, “How to Go On Ice and 
Snow.” The pamphlet features 
advice on everything from 
winterizing your vehicle to handl­
ing emergency maneuvers.

The following are some winter 
driving tips found in “How to Go 
On Ice and Snow”:

♦STARTING: To get started in 
a snow-covered driveway or 
parking area, clear a path in front 
of the wheels for several feet 
either by driving forward and 
backward, or. if the snow is too 
deep, by shoveling. Point the 
front wheels straight. Shift to se­
cond gear in a car with a manual 
transmission or to “drive” in a 
vehicle with automatic transmis­
sion. With gentle pressure on the 
accelerator, try easing the vehi­
cle forward without spinning the 
wheels.

If you need more traction, use 
traction mats or spread sand, salt 
or any handy abrasive material in 
front of and in back of the drive 
wheels. Do not let anyone stand 
directly in line with the drive 
wheels, however. The spinning 
wheels may throw an object that 
could cause an injury.

*1 RACKING AND FOL­
LOWING: If you arc driving on 
slippery surfaces and the wheels 
start to spin, let up on the ac­
celerator until traction returns.

When approaching a hill, 
observe how other vehicles are 
reacting. Keep far enough behind 
the vehicle ahead of you so that 
you will not have to show down 
or stop. Increase your speed 
(within reason) at or near the bot­
tom of the hill to give you extra 
momentum to carry you over the 
top. As you reach the hill’s crest, 
slow down. Proceed down the hill 
slowly.

♦STEERING: Hard accelera­
tion or braking, speed too fast for 
conditions or quick, jerky 
movements of the steering wheel 
can cause the vehicle to skid on 
slippery surfaces. To avoid skids, 
anticipate lane changes, slow 
down early, and move the steer­
ing wheel smoothly.

If a skid occurs, don’t panic. 
Don’t brake. Don’t jerk the steer­
ing wheel. Rather, disconnect the 
driving force on the drive wheels 
by either de-clutching in a manual 
shift car or shifting to “neutral” 
in an automatic-shift vehicle. The 
latter procedure is tricky and re­
quires practice. Don't attempt this 
unless you arc certain of finding 
neutral immediately.

Next, maintain or regain direc­
tional control with smooth, 
precise steering movements. If 
the rear wheels skid, steer in the 
direction you want the car to go.

♦BRAKING: Minimize brak­
ing on very slippery roads to 
avoid skidding. Many newer 
vehicles today offer anti-lock

braking systems (ABS) to help 
motorists avoid locking up their 
wheels. Motorists who don’t own 
vehicles with anti-lock brakes 
should practice the technique of 
“threshold” or “squeeze brak­
ing.” Squeeze braking is ac­
complished by applying the 
brakes firmly, to a point just short 
of lock-up, and then easing off the 
brake pedal slightly, if the wheels 
lock. Re-apply the brakes to a 
point just short of lock-up and 
hold. Don't pump the brake 
pedal, just apply steady pressure.

♦STOPPING: Stopping on slip­
pery surfaces requires longer see­
ing, following and stopping 
distances. Focus your attention as 
far ahead as possible (at least 12 
seconds) and increase the follow­
ing distance between your vehi­
cle and the one immediatly in 
front of you.

For a free copy of “How to Go 
On Ice and Snow.” send a self­
addressed. stamped business-size 
envelope to: AAA Wisconsin. 
Public and Government Affairs. 
8030 Excelsior Drive, Madison, 
Wisconsin 53717.

Critically Acclaimed 
Plays at UWWC

The Mixed Blood Theatre 
Company will be bringing two of 
their critically acclaimed plays to 
the University of Wisconsin 
Center Washington County. The 
one-man shows will explore the 
lives of baseball’s great Jackie 
Robinson, and the remarkable 
singer/activist Paul Robeson.

The Mixed Bkxid Theatre 
Company was founded in 1976 in 
Minneapolis, Minnesota. Mixed 
Blood is dedicated to the spirit of 
Dr. Martin Luther King's dream 
and to the concept of “colorblind 
casting.” According to the Ac­
tor’s Equity Association. Mixed 
Blood is the nation’s leading 
employer of minority profes­
sional actors.

Since 1980, they have played to 
over 575,000 people, with per­
formances in eighteen states. In 
1987, Mixed Blood was 
nominated for a Tony Award for 
their contribution to American 
theatre.

Tickets are $6 for adults, $4 for 
seniors and children, and UWWC 
students arc admitted free with a 
Valid ID. Groups of ten or more 
can get advance tickets at a dis­
count rate of $1 off per ticket. For 
further information or to reserve 
tickets call 335-5208. The perfor­
mance will be held on February 
5, 1993 in the University Theatre, 
at 7:30 p.m.

Honor Society Sponsors 
Creative Writing Contest

Delta Kappa Gamma, and 
Honor Society for Women 
Teachers is sponsoring a Creative 
Writing Contest for students of 
Washington County, for grades 
three and over.

The event will be held at Holy 
Angels School in West Bend on 
Feb. 4th at 7:00 p.m.

Sixty-nine students from area 
communities have been named to 
the Dean's List for achieving 
academic honor grades during the 
fall semester at the University of 
Wisconsin Center - Washington 
County.

Included on the list are 55 full- 
time students, enrolled for 12 or 
more credits and 14 part-time 
students, enrolled for at least 3 
credits and having earned a 
minimum of 15 credits at 
UWWC.

Students receiving highest 
honors have achieved a straight 
A average (4.0) while high 
honors students earned a grade­
point average (GPA) of between 
3.99 and 3.75. Honor students 
received GPA’s between 3.74 
and 3.5.

Honor students, grouped by 
communities, and full- or part- 
time status are:

FULL TIME STUDENTS
CAMPBELLSPORT - High 

Honors: Joseph Lepine.
KEWASKUM - High 

Honors: Robin Bechier, Karen 
Junk. Gerald Sese, Andrea 
Waala; Honors: Brenda Camp­
bell. Melissa Kuechler, Dawn 
Maramonte, Amy Redig, Kelly 
Rohlinger, Tracy Ruplinger, 
Tammy Schladweiler, Melissa 
Williams.

WEST BEND - Highest 
Honors: Angelika Behrend. Cyn­
thia Kleinhans, Mary 
Kuehmichel, Jeffrey Neu, Judith 
Rosenthal, Misti Swanson, Jac- 
quelin Trautwein, High Honors: 
Jodi Bergstrom, Sara Ponath, 
Deidre Weittenhiller, Mary Zim- 
dars, Brian Zirbcs: Honors: Lin­
da Anderson. David Barth. 
Heather Clift, Todd Faber, Gay 
Griesbach, Christopher 
Hanrahan, Jason Jagielski, 
Heather Kulcinski, Shawn Lord, 
Monica Martin, Michelle 
Retzlaff. Lora Shimunek, Ann 
Steier, Mary Walker, Scot 
Youmans, Christopher 
Ziegelbauer.

PART-TIME STUDENTS
CAMPBELLSPORT. Highest 

Honors: Sandra Pfotenhauer.
KEWASKUM. High Honors: 

Janet Rammer.
WEST BEND. Highest 

Honors: Kathleen Lauters, Leslie 
Lorbiecki, Cynthia Tennies; High 
Honors: Joanne Kruepke; 
Honors: Deborah Przedpelski, 
Lisa St. Peter.

“Celebrate Families”
Families are a concern of 

everyone. Our society has chang­
ed. and therefore the “traditional 
family” has also changed. To­
day’s families are nuclear, ex­
tended, blended, single parent, 
dual parent, multi-generational, 
biracial and elderly. They all ex­
ist and they are all important.

Agencies, organizations, 
businesses, schools, churches and 
countless concerned others of the 
Greater Washington County Area 
have come together to develop 
and implement a unified approach 
to "Celebrate Families”. A week 
long program. February 7-14, 
1993 is designed to emphasize the 
importance of the family.

Opening kick off is Sunday. 
February 7, 11:00 a.m. at 
Paradise Mall. West Bend. 
Scheduled events incude a Fami-

NEW LAWMAKER... State Representative Mary Panzer signs 
in as a member of the Assembly at the inaugural ceremony 
in Madison earlier this month. Panzer has served the State 
Legislature for twelve years, but with redistricting she now 
represents the 59th Assembly District. Her area includes: 
Adell, Allenton, Belgium, Campbellsport, Cascade, Cedar 
Grove, Fredonia, Kewaskum, Oostburg, Random Lake, 
Theresa, Waldo and West Bend.

Eldercare: Dilemmas & Decisions
When an older family member 

becomes ill and dependent on 
others, family members often 
find themselves thrust into roles 
they are not prepared to assume.

The profound physical, 
psychological, social, and finan­
cial changes brought about by 
chronic illness or impairment can 
affect the entire family.

A once independent person 
may feel helpless. He or she may 
experience anger, confusion and 
fear.

For the caregiver, the pressure 
of a busy schedule can be com­
pounded by feeling inadequate 
about providing care, by feeling 
both love and pity for the older 
adult, and by feeling anger at hav­
ing his or her life consumed by 
the situation.

A series of fact sheets have 
been developed by the UW- 
Extension Service to help 
caregivers. Topics covered in the 
fact sheets include housing ar­
rangements, coping with stress, 
locating community services.

Dependents Must Have 
Identification Number

Social security numbers must be 
shown on your tax returns for all 
dependents claimed that arc age one 
or older by the end of the tax year. 
If the dependent has no social secu­
rity number, one may be obtained 
by filing Form SS-5. “Application 
for a Social Security Card.’’ with 
the nearest Social Security Admin­
istration office.

ly Resource Fair, entertainment, 
contests, speakers and other ex­
citing surprises — plan to attend, 
as we are all in this together. For 
further information please call 
Kandi O'Neal at UW-Extension 
(335-4478).

TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport

533-8094

managing caregiver expenses, 
understanding dementia and 
Alzheimer Disease and nutrition.

To receive a set of these fact 
sheets, sent $2.00 for printing and 
handling to U.W. Extension, 
Joyce Albrecht, Washingtoni 
County Extension Home 
Economist, 333 E. Washington 
Street, Suite 1200, West Bend, 
WI 53095.

MPTC Campus At 
West Bend Offers 
Child Care Courses

Moraine Park Technical Col­
lege’s West Bend campus is of­
fering three child care certifica­
tion courses during the 1993 
Winter/Spring semester.

Introduction to Infant/Toddler 
Child Care, course 307-414-011. 
meets Monday evenings from 
6-8:45 p.m. beginning Feb. 15. 
Cost for this five-week coruse is 
$19.90.

Creative Learning Activities I, 
course number 307-331-004. 
meets Tuesday evenings from 
6:30 - 9:30 p.m. beginning Jan. 
26. This two-credit course can be 
used to meet DHSS entry-level 
requirements for certification or 
can apply the credits toward a 
voctional diploma in Child Care 
Services. Cost for this 16-week 
coruse is $88.80.

Program Director 2, course 
number 307-406-002, meets 
Tuesday evenings from 6:30 - 
9:15 p.m. beginning Feb. 2. Cost 
for this 14-week course is 
$44.50. Early Childhood 1 and 2 
and Program Director 1 are 
prerequisites for this course.

To enroll for any of these 
courses stop by the West Bend 
campus or register by touch tone 
at 334-0909. Hours are 8 a.m. - 
8 p.m. Monday - Thursday and 
8 a.m. - 4 p.m. on Friday.
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Valley Bank Opens in Fond du Lac
The Fond du Lac area official­

ly got a new bank on Monday, 
January 18, when a full-service 
Valley Bank opened for business 
at 845 South Main Street, Suite 
110, Fond du Lac.

The Fond du Lac office is ap­
proximately 1365 square feet, 
with a walk-up window, conve­
nient customer access and park­
ing. The bank lobby will be open 
from 9 a.m. until 4 p.m., five 
days a week. The Walk-Up Win­
dow will be open from 8 a.m. un­
til 6 p.m., five days a week and 
from 9 a.m. until noon on Satur­
day. Customers of the Fond du 
Lac office will be able to transact 
their business at any of 153 
Valley Bank locations in 
Wisconsin.

In discussing the new office 
location. Steven D. Eatough.. 
President, stated, “We are pleas­
ed to be able to offer our bank­
ing services to Fond du Lac and 
the surrounding market. The 
economic growth and vitality of 
this area have shown us that this 
is a community we want to be 
part of.”

A Grand Opening Celebration 
is being planned for mid­
February. It will be open to the 
public and includes special pro­
duct incentives refreshments and 
giveaways.

Daniel F. Timm has been nam­
ed Assistant Vice Presi- 
dent/Branch Manager of the new 
office. Timm has been associated 
with Valley for four years, most 
recently as Assistant Vice Presi­
dent at the Ripon office. Prior to 
joining Valley, he was employed 
at University Bank, Green Bay.

The new Fond du Lac office 
will be a branch of Valley First 
National Bank of Ripon which 
has assets of $63 million. They 
are an affiliate of Bancorporation, 
the third largest bank holding

company headquartered in 
Wisconsin. Valley, has assets of 
$4.3 billion and currently serves 
Wisconsin through 152 banking 
offices with additional financial 
services companies engaged in in­
surance, trust service, securities, 
credit card servicing and bank 
consulting services. The com­
pany’s common stock is traded on 
the National Market System 
under the NASDQ symbol 
VYBN.

WHEDA Housing 
Grants Available

(Madison) The Wisconsin 
Housing and Economic Develop­
ment Authority (WHEDA) has 
announced the availability of 
housing grants totaling $500,000. 
Grants of up to $35,000 will be 
awarded to eligible organizations 
through a statewide competition 
to develop or improve housing 
for persons-in-crisis, including 
homeless persons, disabled or 
mentally ill persons, victims of 
domestic abuse, frail elderly or 
low income eldely persons, and 
others.

‘ WHEDA Grants have been a 
vital resource for hundreds of 
organizations providing housing 
for Wisconsin’s most needy 
citizens.’’ said Governor Tommy 
G. Thompson. “I encourage all 
eligible housing providers to app­
ly for funding.’’

Organizations eligible to 
receive awards include non­
profits. cooperatives, communi­
ty development and redevelop­
ment agencies, housing 
authorities, Native American 
tribal authorities and units of local 
government.

Individual grants of up to 
$35,000 may be used to assist 
projects of any size, and must

benefit residents whose incomes 
are less than 80 percent of the 
county median. Market studies, 
feasibility studies and/or housing- 
related services are not eligible 
for funding.

“In the last decade, WHEDA 
has provided more than $9 
million in housing grants to assist 
nearly 6,400 units and beds of 
housing for Wisconsin 
residents,’’ said Richard J. 
Longabaugh, WHEDA Executive 
Director. “We are pleased to of­
fer this assistance again in 1993. ’’

Grants are funded from 
WHEDA reserves. WHEDA 
does not receive state tax dollars 
to fund its programs and 
operations.

Completed applications must 
be postmarked or delivered to 
WHEDA by Friday, March 19, 
1993. Those organizations in­
terested in competing in the pro­
gram may receive an application 
by calling WHEDA at 
1 -8OO-33-H0USE 
(1-800-334-6873). Awards will 
be made in June 1993.

FIREMEN TO MEET
The regular monthly meeting 

of the Kewaskum Fire Depart­
ment will be held at the fire sta­
tion on Thursday, Feb. 4, at 7:30 
p.m.

Scout/Youth Group 
At Riveredge

Saturday, January 30, is a day 
set aside for youth groups such as 
scouts and 4-H to participate in a 
program with a Riveredge Nature 
Center naturalist.

There are several Saturdays 
that are set aside for such ac­
tivities throughout the Fall, Winter 
and Spring. All groups must

register for a Saturday prior to 
coming.

For more information, call 
Riveredge at 375-2715 (Metro) or 
675-6888 (local).

Riveredge Nature Center, a 
non-profit, 350 acre natural sanc­
tuary and educational organiza­
tion, providing environmental pro­
grams for all ages, is located in 
Ozaukee County, on Highway Y, 
one mile north of Newburg, bet­
ween Saukville and West Bend.

AND AMERITECH MOBILE 
KEEP YOUR TEAM 

IN TOUCH.
Keeping in constant touch 
with your customers 
guarantees you won’t drop 
the ball when you’re out 
on the field. And you can 
make sure you’ll never 
fumble a play—with a 
cellular phone from

^Fw
Tennics Hardware and 

reliable service from 
Ameritech Mobile. Simply 
add Tennics Hardware 

to your team’s roster 
And get ready for a 
winning season

Free $35.00 Activation with each line

Beautifully Efficient
Custom bay and bow replacement windows 

from Great Lakes’ Window.
No replacement windows lower 
your energy costs more than 
those from Great Lakes. Our bay 
and bow windows feature fusion' 
welding and high-R insulation

for improved comfort and fuel 
efficiency. Plus Great Lakes 
Windows offer these other 
advantages.

All vinyl construction eliminates the need to caulk and paint.
Highest R factor for warmer windows.
Lowest tested air infiltration to assure added comfort.
Available in solid White, Camel, 
Earthtone and optional Natural and 
Golden Oak Woodgrain finishes.

GREAT LAKES* 
WINDOW

Motorola Tote Phone

$199.95
INSTANT
REBATE -150.00

<4995
• Full 3 watts 

of power
•30 

memory 
locations

•2 call 
timers

Motorola Portable
(AC 715)

$249.95
INSTANT -icnnrYREBATE -lOU.UU

“9995
simciti i c^n

MOBILE 
COMMUNICATIONS

AUTHORUCO Of AL fR

• Weighs 
only 25 
ounces

•32
memory 
locations

• 3 call 
timers

NOW INSTALLED BY * FREE E”1™’”

HEBERER BROS. CONST.
626-2598 626-2491 626-2903 626-2384

118 Hwy. H, West 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040

New hoe activation required Other restrictions may apply Oller expires Feb. 7.1993 ' Pices alter instant rebate
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Kewaskum Woman’s Club 
Serves the Community

DID YOU KNOW THAT
1. The Kewaskum Woman’s 

Club was organized on January 
14, 1913, with 13 members.

2. The first Club project was 
the organization of the 
Kewaskum Public Library.

3. “A chain of circles” was 
started for the benefit of the 
library.

4 The club sponsored the 
University of Wisconsin Exten­
sion Lyceum Series for serveral 
years.

5. We received a letter from 
Gov. Cox of Ohio thanking the 
Club for its generosity to the 
stricken state.

6. The Club sponsored a “fly 
campaign. ”

7. By January 1914 a librarian 
was appointed for $52.00 a year.

N. One day a year was declared 
“Library Day’.

9. The Club recommended to 
Mr. Simon, High Sch(X)l Prin­
cipal, that fire drills be held in 
school.

10. In Spring 1914 a 
“beautification of backyard” 
contest was sponsored.

II. The Club had “the Gold 
Dust Quartet”.

12. In June 1914 the library 
books were insured by the Club.

13. The meeting day was 
changed from Saturday to 
Wednesday in September 1914.

14. For several years the Club 
held a public supper.

15. On January 6, 1916 The 
Kewaskum Woman’s Club 
presented all title to property and 
funds now held in the Kewaskum 
Public Library to the Village 
Board.

16. In 1917 schixil yard equip- 
'iiient was purchased.

17. War Savings stamps and 
two Liberty Bonds were purchas 
ed by the Club in 1918.

18. A Service Flag was made 
in 1918.

19. The Club adopted for a 
year a French orphan, Yvonne 
Perreau, No. 32936. girl, born 
April I. 1907.

20. Candy sales, apron sales 
and card parties were given an­
nually for raising funds.

21. The Club had the State 
Board of Health show the film, 
“How Life is Begun” to the 
school children in the afternoon 
of May 4. 1920 and the film, 
"The End of the Road” was 
shown in the evening.

22. The school was encourag­
ed to organize the Kewaskum 
Parents-Teachers organization in* 
October 1920.

23. Besides donating to the 
Near East Relief fund in 1920, 
clothing was gathered, boxed 
(8-11 lb. packages) and sent to the 
destitute in Europe for European 
Relief.
24. $250.00 was donated to the 
school board in 1920 towards a 
“sinking fund” for the new 
school building.

25. A piano was purchased for 
the school in 1921.

26. An annual Teachers’ 
Reception was held.

27. White elephant and rum­
mage sales were money-making 
projects.

28. Mr. Giles. State School In­

spector, at the request of the 
Club, inspected the school 
February 16, 1921; the result, 
however, was of little apparent 
value.

29. The Public Library was 
redecorated, cleaned and the win­
dows washed by the Club 
members, besides the usual 
donations.

30. In 1923 the Club helped the 
County Nurse with the Child 
Welfare Clinic.

31. We joined the Federation in 
petitioning our State for removal 
of unsightly billboards.

32. The Kewaskum Woman’s 
Club C(x>k Bixik was printed, 
1000 copies, in 1925.

33. A fund raising carnival was 
held at school in 1925.

34. In 1926 The Club gave 
$280.00 to the High Sch(x>l to use 
in finishing the gym fltxir,

35. Two red-leafed maples 
were planted at school in 1926.

36. In 1934 a discussion was 
held on “Are Strikes Justifiable”.

37. The Club ordered 5 text 
Ixxiks on Citizenship which were 
studied during the 1934 35 year.

38. A studio couch was pur­
chased for the high school from 
Millers Furniture in 1935.

39. The Club helped the Red 
Cross in 1936 to defray expenses 
for dental work for school 
children.

40. A paper was presented in 
1936 on ‘ ‘How Radio has Raised 
Standards of Living.” y

41. The Club took self-teaching 
courses in Practical English and 
Effective Speech during the 
1936-37 year.

42. In 1937 we entered our first 
100 percent subscription to the 
Wisconsin Club- woman 
Magazine.

43. A Club picnic was held for 
the last meeting in 1937.

44. One of the permanent in­
struments for the Kewaskum 
High School band was purchas­
ed in 1937 as well as an oil stove 
for the new Home Economics 
Department.

45. The Girl Scouts and the 
Boy Scouts were organized in 
Kewaskum in 1938 and were sup­
ported by the Club.

46. A movie at the West Bend 
Theater was sponsored for 
several years as a money-making 
project.

47. A flower bed was planted 
and maintained in the Village 
Park for several years.

48. In 1940 a donation of 
$100.00 was made to the 
Kewaskum High Schixil Band.

49. A Defense Bond of 
$750.(X) was purchased in 1941.

50. The Club arranged for a 
Cancer Education movie to be 
shown by the State Departmnt of 
Health in the high school 
auditorium in 1941.

51. Made “Ditty-bags” for the 
service men, filled, packed and 
mailed then in 1942.

52. Received Thank-you letters 
from the following: ' Pvt. 
Sylvester Harter. Pvt. Earl 
Kohler, Pvt. Russell Heisler, Lt. 
L. Rosenheimer, Pvt. Albert 
Hron, Jr., Pvt. Myron Belger. 
Sgt. Ralph Kohn, Pvt. Frances 
Horn, Tech. Jacob Schlosser.

P.F.C. Hermin Kohler, P.F.C. 
Joseph Uelmen, Jr., Sgt. C.E. 
Romaine, Pvt. Sylvester 
Terlinden, Pvt. Claire Horn, 
P.F.C. Franklin Heisler, Capt. 
Frederick Miller, Pvt. Louis 
Bath, Pvt. Walter Werner, Pvt. 
I zander Honeck, Pvt. Ralph 
Marx.

53. The Club made bandages 
for the Red Cross in 1942.

54. In 1943 each member gave 
home-made cookies which were 
delivered to the servicemen at 
Traux Field.

55. Five cases of canned goods 
were sent to European Relief in 
1946.

56. In 1946 the Club subscrib­
ed to “Good Listening” bulletins 
for better radio listening.

57. We met in 1947 in our new 
clubroom in the Insurance 
Building.

58. The 1948 Christmas gifts 
were sent to the Wisconsin 
School for Girls, Oregon.

59. Purchased a set of World 
Bcx)k Encyclopedias for the 
Public Library in 1949.

60. The Club conducted in 
1949 the first audiometer test 
screening of all school children.

61. The 1949 Christmas gifts 
were sent to the Children’s Home 
at Sparta: and the needy families 
in Kewaskum were remembered 
as usual.

62. Clothing was collected and 
sent to Indian Welfare in 1949.

63. An Open House was held 
at the new Public Library.

64. A TV set was donated to 
the Old Folks Home at West 
Bend.

65. During 1949-50 we studied 
“The Question of the Month” on 
the U N. for half-hour before 
each meeting.

66. A series of card parties 
were held in 1950 to benefit the 
library - purchased drapes, world 
globe, etc.

67. Gifts in 1950 were given to 
the D.P.s and the Veterans 
Hospital at Wtxxi.

68. In 1951 we toured the 
Wisconsin Home for Women at 
Taycheedah and sponsored the 
State Mobile Chest X-ray unit.

69. The “Piggy-bank” Basket 
was started as a money-making 
project.

70. $100.00 was donated to 
Korean Relief in 1951.

71. The Club members con­
tributed to the Scout Mother's 
Bake Sale.

72. On August 21, 1951 we 
served a picnic lunch to the 
Veterans of Wtxxi Hospital at 
Mauthe Lake.

73. Thirty metal wastepaper 
baskets were given to the 
Washington County Old Folks 
Home, December 1952.

74. In 1953 we assisted with 
the Blood Bank, with the State 
Mobile Chest X-ray Unit and did 
the audiometer test screening at 
all schools.

75. Donations were made in 
1953 to Radio Free Europe and 
for the reconstruction of Indepen­
dent Hall, Philadelphia.

Tomatoes can sur­
vive what would other­
wise be a killing frost if 
the temperature drop is 
gradual over several 
days.

Obituaries
HAROLD RUPLINGER

Harold A. Ruplinger, 62, of 
Butler, died Tuesday, Jan. 19, 
1993, at St. Joseph’s Hospital in 
Milwaukee.

He was born June 10, 1930, in 
St. Kilian, a son of Joseph and 
Alma Weiland Ruplinger.

He was a former Kewaskum 
resident.

Survivors include two brothers, 
Joseph Jr. and his wife Helen, 
and Raymond and his wife 
Rosemary, all of Allenton; one 
sister, Loraine Weyer and her 
husband Alphonse of Lomira; 
two sisters-in-law; and nieces and 
nephews.

Preceding him in death were 
his parents; and two brothers 
Elmer and Orville.

Memorial services were held at 
7:30 p.m. Friday at St. Kilian 
Catholic Church in St. Kilian.

There was no visitation. .

WISCONSIN BASKETBALL COACHES
ASSOCIATION STATE POLLS

GIRLS BASKETBALL
DI VISON I

(Votes) 
I. Janesville Parker 150
2. Milwaukee Pius XI 138
3. Mil. Washington 128
4. West Allis Hale 124
5. D.C. Schofield 104
6. Wauwatosa East 97
7. Eau Claire Memorial 90
8. Fond du Lac 80
9. Sheboygan North 66
10. Sun Prairie 61

Other Receiving Votes — Eau Claire 
North, Wisconsin Lutheran. West Allis 
Central. LaCrosse Logan. Madison West. 
Menomonee.

DIVISION II
I. Lakeland 149
2. Hayward 141
3. Mosinee 127
4. Jefferson 122
5. Luxemburg-Casco 102
6. Kimberly 99
7. Mil. Lutheran 91
8. Waunakee 72
9. Viroqua 67
10 Brown Deer 62

Other Receiving Votes - Freedom. 
Durand. Verona. Milton. New Berlin 
Eisenhower. Whitnall. Barron

DIVISION III
1. Appleton Xavier 147
2. Colfax 141
3. Clinton 129
4. Oostburg 123
5. Cambridge 110
6. Mount Horeb 100
7. Cuba City 90
8. Coleman 54
9 Thorp 53
10. Lomira 50

Others Receiving Votes - Manawa. 
Bloomer. Baldwin-Woodville, Stanley- 
Boyd. Kettle Moraine Lutheran Spencer. 
Ordfordville. Glenwood City. Prentice, 
Elk Mound. Crivitz, Chilton. Marathon. 
Random Lake.

DIVISON IV
1. Pecatonca 149
2 Randolph 138
3 Highland 127
4. Gilmanton 123
5. Shell Lake . 110
6. Eau Claire Regis 93
7 Bloomington 89
8. Niagra 76
9. Weston 62
10. Turtle Lake 57

Others Receiving Votes - Athens, 
Gilman, Elva-Strum. Deerfield, Green 
Lake. Chippewa Falls McDonnell, 
Marinette Central.

BOYS BASKETBALL POLL 
DIVISION I

I. Sheboygan North 100
2. Oshkosh West 69
3. Mil. Washington 60
4. Arrowhead 53
5. Madison East 43
6. Mil. Tech 42
7. Fond du Lac 31
8. (Tie) Mil. King
Green Bay East 29
10. Sun Prarie 26

Others Receiving Votes - Nicolet.
LaCrosse Central. Mil. Marquette, 
Wausau West. Mil. Juneau. Wisconsin 
Lutheran. Waukesha Catholic Memorial

DIVISION II
1. Rice Lake 97
2 Racine St. Catherine's 89
3. Campbellsport 72

4. Whitewater 71
5. Spooner 46
6. Mayville 44
7. Onalaska 38
8. Lake Genva Badger 25
9. Ladysmith 16
10. (tie) Baraboo
Sturgeon Bay 14

Others Receiving Votes - New Rich­
mond, Madison Edgewood, Ahland, Fox 
Valley Lutheran, Valders. DePere. Two
Rivers, Holman.

DIVISION III
1. Columbus 93
2. Auburndale 89
3. St. Croix Falls 82
4. Dodgeville 58
5. FDL St. Mary’s Springs 56
6. Elkhart Lake . 44
7. Crivitz 43
8. Fennimore 29
9. Cuba City 19
10. Fall Creek 14

Others Receiving Votes - Lakeside 
Lutheran, Marion, Glenwood City, Elk 
Mound, Augusta, Howards Grove, Ket­
tle Moraine Lutheran, LaCrosse Aquinas. 
Omro.

DIVISION IV
1. Cassville 97
2. Racine Lutheran 80
3. Wausaukee 75
4. Randolph 51
5. Necedah 44
6. Kickapoo 31
7. (tie) Spring Valley Iola- 
Scandinavia 29
9. Eleva Strum 27
10. Elmwood 26

Others Receiving Votes - Eau Claire 
Regis, Cornell. Independence, Marshall, 
Marinette Central, Gilmanton, Laone, 
Prairie Du Chien Lutheran, Turtle Lake

CROSSFACE WRESTLING POLL
Division I

I. Merrill 462
2. Wisconsin Rapids 278
3. Middleton 201
4. LaCrosse Central 190
5. Fond du Lac 160
6. Waukesha South 81
7. Sheboygan North 52
8. New London 32
9. Oconomowoc 18
10. Medford 15

Others Receiving Votes - Holmen. 
Kaukauna. Plymouth. Waukesha North

DIVISION II
L Luxemburg-Casco 561
2. Ellsworth 267
3. Coleman 262
4 Baldwin-Woodville 138
5. Lancaster 81
6. East Troy 61
7. Lodi 42
8. (tie) Westfield Campbellsport 41
10. Richland Center 40

Others Receiving Votes - Amery.
Boscobel. Platteville. Tomahawk. 
Whitewater.

DUNDEE 
SAND & GRAVEL
G. RAMTHUN 533-4549

* Washed Sand 
Crushed Gravel 
Stone and Lime Chips

Also Gravel and Sand Fill 
Topsoil

GENERAL TRUCKING

PHILGAS

Serving Your Area 

Propane a 
GAS
Service
for
Home ■ Farm or Industry
Cylinder & Bulk Deliveries

NO TANK CHARGE

Serving Gas Customers 
for Over 50 Years

BOEHLKE BOTTLED 
GAS CORP.

Plants located at Jackson 
and Random Lake

West Bend 338-8011
Random Lake 994-2229

TOLL FREE 
1-800-448 3388
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JANUARY 26, 1968

The 55th Anniversary of the 
founding of the Kewaskum 
Woman's Club was observed on 
Saturday evening when the group 
held its annual Founder’s Day 
dinner for members and husbands 
at the Wigwam Supper Club. 
Mrs. Marshall Boyd and Mrs. 
Earl Buswell were in charge of 
arrangements and in recognition 
of the emerald anniversary, 
presented a corsage in emerald 
green to each member.

Because she ranked first in a 
written homemaking knowledge 
and attitude test given senior girls 
in Kewaskum Community High 
School here December 5. Bonnie 
Sue Kern becomes 1968 Betty 
Crocker Homemaker of Tomor­
row for her school, it has been 
announced.

Marine Corporal David L. 
Flynn, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Flynn of Kewaskum, par­
ticipated in the rescue of 37 Hong 
Kong Chinese sailors from a 
grounded Liberian freighter while 
serving in the Western Pacific 
aboard the attack aircraft carrier 
USS Coral Sea. A foot-high 
silver trophy was presented the 
captain and crew of the Coral Sea 
on behalf of the master and crew 
of the “Loyal Fortunes” which 
ran aground on the Pratas Reef 
170 miles south of Hong Kong. 
On Nov. 6, 1967 The Coral Sea 
was enroute to Hong Kong when 
she received the distress signal 
from the freighter, and lifted the 
crew off the ship by helicopter the 
following morning. Following 
the 24 hour ordeal, the stricken 
freighter’s crew spent the night 
aboard the carrier and returned to 
Hong Kong the following day. 
The Coral Sea is now operating 
with the U.S. Seventh Fleet in the 
Gulf of Tonkin off the coast of 
North Vietnam.

Seaman Apprentice Mark C. 
Belger, USN. 18, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Myron Belger of Route 2, 
Kewaskum, has been graduated 
from nine weeks of navy basic 
training at the Naval Training 
Center at Great Lakes, IL.

The School Board met on Mon­
day, January 15. 1968. People in 
attendance were all members of 
the School Board, except James 
D. Reigle, and the following 
teachers of the negotiating com­
mittee: Howard Zemlicka, Gary 
Gerhartz. Dale Squier, Neil Den­
niston, Joseph Harlow and 
Delores Carr. Harry Oelhafen 
moved to accept rhe contract for 
Miss Diane Thews for the second 
semester as Spanish teacher. 
Seconded by Anne Panzer, 
unanimously carried. Allen 
Tessar moved to accept the con­
tract for Ervin Uhlman, Jr. for 
the second semester in the 
elementary grades. Zona Miske 
seconded, unanimously carried.

A daughter was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Ralph Eisenmann, 
Route 2, Kewaskum, on Thurs­
day. January 18.

50 Years Ago
JANUARY 29, 1943

Rudolph Kolafa of Route 1, 
Kewaskum, proprietor of taverns 
at New Fane and Campbellsport, 
escaped injury shortly after 1 
a.m. on January 25. when he was 
struck by a truck while walking

on Highway 55, a short distance 
north of the Fond du Lac- 
Washington County Line. 
Kolafa's auto had become stalled 
in a snowbank along the highway 
some distance south of the scene 
and he was walking along the 
road to summon help in getting 
the car out. It was snowing at the 
time and vision was very poor 
because of the drifting snow. The 
truck driver was unable to see 
Kolafa until close to him. He 
swerved his truck but the trailer 
struck Kolafa and threw him to 
the ground. Kolafa was brought

to a Kewaskum physician, who 
could find no injuries but reported 
that the mans feet had suffered 
from exposure to the cold. Depu­
ty Sheriff Carl F. Schaefer of this 

village was called to the scene but 
when he arrived Kolafa had 
already been brought here and the 
truck continued on its way.

Seventy-four men of Local 
Board No. 2 of Fond du Lac 
County, comprising the rural sec­
tions, left for Fort Sheridan, Il­
linois January 23. The men were 
inducted the previous Saturday in 
Milwaukee. Included in the group 
were three men from the Town of 
Auburn, namely Harold O. 
Krueger, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Wallace Krueger; Kenneth L. 
Johnson, who operated the Shady 
Grove Tavern north of 
Kewaskum with his sister, and 
Robert S. Wesenberg. Others 
from Campbellsport and vicinity 
were: Angelo Campagna, 
Frederick Mielke, Anton 
Waranius, A. Buslaff and Floyd 
Baumhardt.

Ray Vyvyan, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Leo Vyvyan of this village, 
and a freshman at Marquette 
University, Milwaukee, left last 
Friday for active duty in the U.S. 
Navy. Ray enlisted in the Navy 
on January 2. He was inducted on 
Friday and left immediately for 
the United States Naval Training 
Station at Farragut, Idaho, to 
begin training. Ray’s enlistment 
brings the number of men in ser­
vice from this village alone to 
around the 55 mark.

Bernard E. Hafemann, 20. son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Hafemann of this village, receiv­
ed orders to report for active du­
ty as an aviation cadet in the U.S. 
Army Air Corps this week from 
headquarters of the Sixth Service 
Command in Chicago. He left 
Thursday to begin his training. 
Pvt. Hafemann enlisted as an 
aviation cadet last November 11.

Billy, young son of Dr. and 
Mrs. R.G. Edwards of this 
village, suffered a mild attack of 
probable spinal meningitis. 
Because the disease is contagious 
in one form, the grade rooms of 
his school were ordered closed by 
Dr. Edwards on Friday. 
However, Billy’s attack was not 
of a contagious nature as 
discovered later. The boy was 
removed to St. Joseph's Hospital, 
West Bend, where he is still 
confined.

St. John’s Lutheran Church of 
New Fane was the scene of a 
wedding at 2 p.m. Saturday, Jan. 
23, when Miss Rose Mary 
Capozzo, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Peter Capozzo of Eden, 
became the bride of Harold Kreif, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Albert Kreif 
of New Fane.

JANUARY 26, 1918
Kewaskum’s first fuelless 

Monday was observed with a 
severity that bespoke the utmost 
patrotism and support of the 
government on the part of both 
businessmen and consumers. 
Each place of business excepting 
the meat markets, bakery and 
banks were closed all day. The 
meat markets and bakery were 
opened for business in the morn­
ing but closed at noon and dur­
ing the afternoon our little city 
resembled a place devoid of 
population. No actual hardships 
were experienced although a 
large number of our businessmen 
admit that Monday was a long 
and weary day for them. This, no 
doubt, is attributed to the hustling 
disposition of the average 
businessman and if you take work 
away from him his jovial spirit is 
diminished and life becomes 
burdensome. Nevertheless, Tues­
day found everyone back on the 
job, ambitious, enthusiastic and 
ready to make up any deficiency 
that may have occured through 
Monday’s closing. With the 
observation of Monday as fuelless 
day, the people of the United 
States now have four days of the 
week on which to conserve pro­
ducts directly essential with the 
winning of the war. These days 
are: Monday - Fuelless; Tuesday 
- Meatless; Wednesday - 
Wheatless, and Saturday - 
Porkless. It is hoped that every 
citizen will strictly observe these 
days as designated as it is only by 
united action that a real saving 
can be effected and result in the 
winning of the war.

At a joint meeting of the 
Kewaskum Fire Company and 
Hook and Ladder Company, con­
stituting the Kewaskum Fire 
Department, held at the city hall 
Monday evening, the following 
officers were elected: Chief - 
John F. Schaefer; Assistant Chief 
- Hy. Ramthun; Secretary - Er- 
win. Koch, and Treasurer - 
Charles Groeschel.

The K. of C. War Fund collec­
tion held here during the days 
beginning last Friday and ending 
last Tuesday evening, resulted in 
obtaining the sum of $275.50. 
The contribution in the village 
amounting to $198.50 to which 
members of St. Bridget’s con­
gregation added $77. The work of 
collecting the amount was per­
formed by Joseph Eberle and 
considering the fact that only one 
worker was in the field the 
amounts are certainly gratifying 
and again showed that the people 
of Kewaskum and vicinity are 
ever ready to support the govern­
ment and aid the soldiers, at the 
front and the camps, in providing 
for them not only the necessities 
of life, but also to give them all 
the comforts possible under ex­
isting conditions.

The Junior class of Kewaskum 
High School has elected their of­
ficers which are as follows: Presi­
dent - Florence Groeschel; 
Secretary - Leo Brodzeller, and 
Treasurer - Belinda Belger.

Father Sylvester, son of Mrs. 
Katherine Harter of this village, 
is now a chaplain in the United 
States army, and is now station­
ed at Camp Cody, New Mexico. 
He bears the title of First 
Lieutenant.

West Bend Savings Bank Reports 
Record Sales, Record Earnings

West Bend Savings Bank 
reported record sales and record 
earnings for the 4th quarter of 
1992 and their fiscal year ending 
December 31, 1992. The Bank 
and its affiliated Financial 
Resource Group companies 
reported total sales of 
$140,350,000 and total gross 
revenue for the year of 
$16,623,000 with net after-tax 
profit of $1,109,000. The Bank 
recognized a 15 percent increase 
in net profit over the previous 
year.

The Bank's return on equity 
capital was 12.3 percent for 1992 
and the return on average assets 
for the year was .82 percent. 
Richard A. Larson. Chairman 
and Chief Executive Officer, in­
dicated the Bank increased its 
reserves by 12.3 percent to a new 
record total of $10,132,575 or 
7.23 percent of net worth. 
Because of the excellent 
economic climate in southeastern 
Wisconsin, the Bank only had .24 
percent of its loan portfolio in a 
non-performing status and their 
loan loss reserves amounted to 
141 percent of non-performing 
assets. Larson indicated that no 
loan losses were expected in the 
period ahead.

The Bank's greatest gain was in 
its loan operation where loan 
volume increased 83 percent over 
the 1991 results. Security invest­
ment sales by the Bank's IN­
VEST operation amounted to 
over $5,800,000 and sales from 
its various insurance subsidiary 
operations exceeded $8,135.000 
for the year. The year end total 
assets for the Bank were 
$140,137,871, representing net 
asset growth of 6.8 percent for

-Auto Service ■ ■ ■

ROGER & DAN’S 
AUTO SERVICE

‘"Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area”

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum

626-2888
24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE

■•'«»
UNI,WAL

LOWER ENERGY COSTS!
• Save on energy bills with up to 

12.3 S E E R efficiency and 
94.6% I.C.S. A F.U.E.

• Free estimates with 
NOobligation.

• Full service by trained 
professionals.

Call before the seasonal rush!

TEMPSTAR
Heating and Cooling Products

L.K. HEATING & 
AIR CONDITIONING 

357 Main St., Kewaskum
PHONE 626-4342

the year.
At the Bank's annual meeting 

held January 20th, Joseph J. 
Zadra, E.W. Kannenberg. 
Lawrence W. Hillman and Ray­
mond F. Lipman were re-elected 
to the Board of Directors. Other 
directors are Ronald J. Larson. 
John E. Kasten. Andrew J. 
Gumm. Russell E. Brandt and 
Richard A. L.arson.

On the Track of Wild 
Critters at River edge

Join the fun al Riverdge Nature 
Center on Sunday, January 31, 
from 1:30 to 3 p.m. as par­
ticipants learn to read the stories 
written in the snow by the wild 
creatures of the field and forest. 
Conditions permitting travel will 
be done on snowshoes.

The fee is $3.00 for adults and 
$2.00 for children. Call 
Riveredge Nature Center at 
675-6888 (local) or 375-2715 
(Metro) for more information or 
to register.

Riveredge Nature Center is a 
non-profit, 350 acre natural sanc­
tuary and educational organiza­
tion, providing environmental 
programs for all ages. Il is located 
in Ozaukee County, on Highway 
Y, one mile north of Newburg, 
between Saukville and West 
Bend

ABC CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners at skat played by 

the ABC Senior Citizens at 
Beechwood Hall on Tuesday, 
Jan. 19, were: Ralph Laux, 
17-0—17 net; Marvin Martin, 
20-5—15 net; Francis Gilboy, 
Diamond solo vs 4.



New Study Shows Medical Cost In Wisconsin 
Is Highest in Kenosha, Lowest in West Bend

Dairyland Seed Announces 1992 
Yieldmaster Contest Winner

I he overall cost of medical ser­
vices, procedures and prescrip 
tion drugs in 23 Wisconsin cities 
varies by as much as 30 percent, 
according to a study recently 
completed by Meridian Resource 
Corporation, a Madison based 
health care and employee benefits 
consulting firm.

lopping the list is Kenosha 
which had an overall medical cost 
index of 113, thirteen points 
higher than the average cost in 23 
of Wisconsin’s major cities.

Meridian Resource President 
Roger Formisano. explained the 
index. “For every $100 spent for 
medical services in an average 
Wisconsin city, the price in 
Kenosha is $113. I he lowest cost 
was recorded in West Bend, 
where the price for identical ser 
vices amounts to only $87.” he 
said.

Ranking for the first 21 other 
cities involved in the Meridian 
Resource study and their approx 
imate costs were listed by For­
misano: LaCrosse, $109; 
Wauwatosa and Brookfield, 
$107, Menomonee Falls and 
Milwaukee, $106; Waukesha. 
$105; Racine and Marshfield, 
$104; Madison. $103; Sheboygan 
$101; Fau Claire and Janesville. 
$100; Fond du Lac, $99; West 
Allis and Stevens Point, $98, 
Neenah and Manitowoc, $96,

120

In the Service
Air Force Airman Susan K. 

Boettcher, an apprentice medical 
service specialist, has arrived for 
duty at Yokota Air Base in 
Tokyo.

She is the daughter of Marlene 
R. Boettcher of W2556 Auburn- 
Ashford Drive and Clifford A.

Wausau, $95; Green Bay and Ap 
pieton, $89, and Oshkosh, $88.

Meridian Resource conducted 
the analysis of medical costs us­
ing actual 1992 fees charged by 
Wisconsin Medical service pro­
viders by using available in­
surance of physicians and hospital 
services, dental procedures, 
prescription drugs and chiroprac 
tic services.

After considering all types of 
services in general. Meridian 
Resource researchers selected a 
“market basket’’ of frequently 
performed services. These items 
included office visits, maternity 
procedures, hysterectomy, teeth 
defining, dental fillings and 
crowns, common prescription 
drugs and chiropractic 
adjustment.

In total, 41 services, pro­
cedures and drugs were selected 
to represent medical costs, with 
each item weighted according to 
its relative importance to other 
items, according to Formisano.

He explained how geographic 
cost differences have an impact 
on all insured persons in Wiscon­
sin: “Although a city’s medical 
cost index will not reflect the cost 
differences for any particular pro­
cedure or service, we believe 
these findings are important to 
employers who negotiate for 
medical care services either

Medical Cost Index

Boettcher of 108 N. Cassel St., 
both of Campbellsport.

The airman is a 1989 graduate 
of Campbellsport High School.

XYZ CLUB CARD RESULTS
The winners at cards played by 

the XYZ Senior Citizens at the 
Municipal Building on Wednes­
day. Jan. 20, were: SKAT: Joe

directly or through an insurance 
carrier,’’ said Formisano.

He cautioned that this index 
reflects prices of medical service 
but not the use of those services. 
“To determine total health care 
expenditures in an area, com­
panies must examine and take ac­
tion regarding the cost of medical 
services as well as the frequency 
of use of those services by their 
employees and their families,” 
Formisano explained.

The Meridian Resource 
analysis showed that prescription 
drug prices throughout Wiscon­
sin are very stable. The other four 
components of the market basket, 
however, can vary widely.

Formisano also noted that the 
study also provides new perspec­
tives in controlling health care 
costs across Wisconsin, and even 
across the United States.

“In order to control rising 
health care costs, it is not 
necessary to rush into a radically 
different health care ' delivery 
system as found in Canada or 
Germany. With all other factors 
being equal, savings of 25 percent 
or more could be achieved in 
Kenosha or LaCrosse if their 
costs for medical services were 
similar to costs in Oshkosh or 
West Bend.”

Meridian Resource expects to 
update the medical cost index 
semiannually.

Butschiick, 19-0-19 net; Willy 
Blecher, 19-1 — 18 net; Marvin 
Martin, 11-1 —10 net; Syl 
Schmidt, Diamond solo vs 4; 
Allen Reindl, Diamond turn vs 5.

SHEEPSHEAD: Jan. 13.
Florin Jakubouski and Ted 
Schoofs.

Jan. 20 Martha Kudek, Gertie 
Kaschner, Ruth Eggert, and June 
Kneifl.

Dairyland Seed Co., Inc. an­
nounced that Francis Miesen, of 
Potosi, Wisconsin, has been nam­
ed Dairyland’s 1992 National 
Corn Yieldmaster. Miesen ob­
tained his yield of 242 64 bushels 
per acre with Dairyland’s 
Stealth-Ill I hybrid.

According to Tom Strachota, 
Executive Vice-President, 
“Dairyland products have been 
exhibiting high yields on farms 
due to the tremendous amount of

Candlelight Skiing 
Hiking at Pike 
Lake State Park

Pike Lake State Park will be 
hosting its 5th annual candlelight 
skiing/hiking evening on Satur­
day, February 13,"1993 from 6 
p.m. to 9 p.m. Pike lake person 
nel, along with volunteers, have 
assembled several hundred 
candles out of plastic cups and 
canning wax.

Late in the day on February 13, 
the park crew will groom and 
track the trail surface and 
simultaneously light and place the 
candles at 30 - 40 foot intervals 
on the right side of the trail.

Park rangers will patrol the 
trail on skis during the evening to 
assist the skiers and hikers and to 
relight blown out candles. Pike 
Lake State Park has a warming 
shelter available with 
refreshments, a fireplace and 
electricity so skiers/hikers are en­
couraged to stop in, take a break 
and spend the evening picnicking 
in a festive atmosphere.

Northern Cross Science Foun­
dation will be on hand with their 
telescopes to provide an evening 
of star viewing and telescope use 
instruction (clouds or no clouds).

A state parks admission sticker 
is required for each vehicle enter­
ing the park and will be available 
at the beach entrance gate.

For further information, call 
Pike Lake State Park at 
1-414-644-5248 during regular 
business hours of 8 a.m. to 4:30 
p.nl.

SHEEPSHEAD WINNERS
5 handed winner's on Thurs­

day, Jan. 21st were: Fred Mielke, 
58-6-52, 14-3-11; Vivian 
Bartelt, 58-7-51, 20-4-16; 
Rose Meuiner, 54-12—42, 
17-7—10; Elton Ludwig. 
48-8-40. 20-3-17: Jeanette 
Boudry. 47-8-39. 16-5-11; 
Faye Keller, 45-6-39. 15-5-10; 
Walter Bartelt, 47-9—38, 
20-5-15.

The next 5 handed will be 
Thursday, Feb. 4th and Wednes­
day. Feb. 10th at 8.00 p.m. 
sharp, cash prizes. Schmitt’s 
Never Inn.

time, effort, and resources that 
have been invested in Dairyland’s 
research. We are very proud of 
Mr. Miesen’s results, as it is 
rewarding to see farmers benefit 
from our research efforts. Our 
goal is that future research will 
provide farmers with even higher 
yields.”

For more information on 
Dairyland Seed’s hybrid corn 
lineup, call 1-8OO-236-O163 or 
write P.O. Box 958, West Bend. 
WI 53095.
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Problems With Money? 
Too Much Credit?

You’re not alone. Many 
Washington County families and 
individuals are financially 
overextended due to current 
economic situations,
underemployment, easy access to 
credit, unexpected medical bills 
or lack of basic money manage­
ment skills.

Whatever the reason, there is 
free help available through 
University of Wisconsin 
Extension-Washington County. 
The UW-Extension Home 
Economist or a trained Financial 
Consultant will work with you to 
help you regain control over your 
finances.

Through financial counseling, 
we’ll help you:

-Examine current money 
management practices

Assess current debt levels
-Develop a realistic spending 

plan
-Establish short and long term 

goals
-Establish repayment plans for 

outstanding bills
-Identify ways to stretch finan­

cial resources
-Offer referrals to other 

available resources.
Day. evening and Saturday 

consulting sessions are available. 
All requests for assistance will re­
main confidential.

For more information, write or 
call UW-Extension. 333 E. 
Washington Street. Suite 1200, 
West Bend, WI 53095; or ell 
335-4479, 342-2929. or
644-53095. The UW-Extension 
Office is located in the Public 
Agency Center on the corner of 
Indiana Avenue and Highway 33 
East in West Bend.

The largest living species 
of kangaroo stands seven 
feet tall.

. Announcing...
PHYSICIANS MUTUAL ^ INSURANCE COMPANY
is now serving the Fond du Lac County area with local representatives
Hospitalization •■Cancer • Income Protection • Medicare Supplement

For more information about your current policy or new insurance you may need,
Call: Arlene Hankwitz at 922-6949, 212 N. Main, Fond du Lac

Equal Opportunity Company PMA-261
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Board Meeting

M id - M ont hI y 
Meeting 
January 18, 1993 
8:00 p.m.

The Village Board of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wisconsin, met 
in Mid-Monthly Session in the Coun­
cil Room of the Municipal Building, 
204 First Street.

President Mary Krueger presided 
All Trustee Members were present. 
A quorum was present.

The meeting was opened with a 
Moment of Silence and Pledge of 
Allegiance

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton, seconded by Trustee 
Robert Beisbier and unanimously car­
ried by voice vote, the minutes of the 
January 4, 1993 meeting were ap­
proved as printed.

Fire Chief Mark Groeschel was ab­
sent and no report was given.

Chief of Police Richard L. Knoebel 
shared the December 1992 monthly 
report with the Board as follows:

Criminal arrests - 10, Criminal in­
vestigations - 29, Traffic warnings - 
150, Traffic citations - 27, Adult ar­
rests - 9, Juvenile arrests - 9, Park­
ing warnings - 103, Parking citations 
- 50. Property stolen $65, Property 
recovered - $15.

Director of Public Works, Jerry 
Gilles informed the Board that there 
were two water main breaks, one in 
front of Holy Trinity on Main Street 
and one at 1402 Riverview Drive.

Discussion was held on the possi­
ble advertising for bids regarding the 
purchase of a dump truck to replace 
the 1975 dump truck. It was noted 
that Monroe Equipment would hold 
firm their bid from 1992 on the ac­
cessory equipment, which was the ap­
parent low bid. It was further noted 
that Cooleys would maintain their bid 
with an additional $1,200 dollar in­
crease to cover the increase from a 
1992 model year to a 1993 model 
year.

On a motion by Trustee Gary 
Gavin, seconded by Trustee David 
Goeden and unanimously carried by 
voice vote, the Board authorized the 
purchase of a new dump truck from 
Cooleys (1993 International) and ac­
cessory equipment from Monroe 
Equipment at a cost of approximate­
ly $53,500

On a motion by Trustee Robert 
Wagner, seconded by Trustee Harry 
Roecker and unanimously carried by 
voice vote, the Board approved the 
application for an Operator’s License 
upon proper payment of fees and 
documentation and authorized the of­

♦ ♦ ♦

The reading of all good hooks is like conversation 
with the finest men of past centuries.

—Rene Descartes

TOWN OF KEWASKUM
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 
ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Town of Kewaskum Zon­

ing Board of Appeals will conduct a hearing on the application 
for appeal filed by Gary R. Hetland. N82 W15556 Valley View 
Drive, Menomonee Falls, Wl 53051. The hearing will be held 
at 8:15 P.M., on Monday, February 15, 1993. at the Labor Hall, 
1230 Fond du Lac Avenue, Kewaskum. The applicant's proper­
ty is located in the Town of Kewaskum, pari of the SE-SE describ­
ed in Certified Survey Map 769 and Volume 1083 Page 665 of 
Records. Section 24-12-19. The appeal seeks a variance of Sec­
tion 1 36(2)(b) of the requirements of the Zoning Ordinance, and, 
if granted, will allow the applicant to construct a single family 
residence at a 59 foot setback (required setback is 75 feet).

All interested persons wishing to comment on the appeal 
should appear at the hearing.
Dated January 27, 1993

Barbara Wenzlaff
,.28.21 Zoning Secretary

fice to issue said license as follows:
Werhanowicz, Susan L., 

Kewaskum, Wl.
Note: The Police Department had 

no objections to any of the 
applications.

Administrator Daniel S. Schmidt 
informed the Board that the tax col­
lection process was proceeding well. 
The upcoming Mid-Moraine 
Municipal Association meeting 
scheduled for January 27, 1993 was 
discussed.

Administrator Daniel S. Schmidt 
reviewed with the Board the Record 
of Building Permits for 1992. It was 
noted several new living units have 
been added to the community. The 
number of permits has increaesed by 
14 percent over that of 1991.

The Board reviewed the schedul­
ing of the Informational Meeting to 
discuss USH 45/Fond du I^c Avenue 
resurfacing project for Monday, 
January 25, 1993 at 7:00 p.m in the 
Municipal Building.

The Board was informed that a 
Spring Primary Election will be held 
on February 16. 1993 for the office 
of State Superintendent of Public In­
structions. It was also noted the local 
election inspectors will be meeting on 
Tuesday, January 26, 1993 at 9:00 
am.

On a motion by Trustee Robert 
Wagner, seconded by Trustee David 
Goeden and unanimously carried by 
voice vote, the Board approved the 
five non-represented and part-time 
employees salary/wage adjustments 
as follows for 1993. The Ad 
ministrator and Police Chief receive 
a 3 percent adjustment and the Direc­
tor of Public Works and Library 
Director receive a 3 percent adjust­
ment and consideration of the pro­
gression to the mid-point of their 
grade level in a timely manner. The 
Deputy Clerk/Treasurer receive a 4 
percent adjustment and that the part 
time employees so noted receive a 3.5 
percent adjustment.

Chairman of the Public Services 
Committee. Trustee David Goeden 
reviewed briefly with the Board the 
results in summary of the recycling 
and garbage proposal opening, which 
occurred on Friday, January 15, 1993 
at 3:00 p.m. It was noted further 
review would be taking place and a 
committee meeting would be 
scheduled.

Board Representative for the Plan 
Commission, Trustee Gary Gavin an­
nounced a Plan Commission meeting 
for Tuesday, January 26. 1993 at 
8:00 p.m.

Board Representative for the 
County Wide Library Board, Trustee 
Robert Wagner informed the Board 
that a meeting was held and the boun­
dary matter between Germantown

and Menomonee Falls is still an issue 
It was noted that some continuing 
education money will be made 
available through the County for 
Library related education.

The Board reviewed the proposed 
Capital Improvement Work begin 
proposed for Bonnie Lane, Courtney 
Drive, Edgewood Road and Knights 
Avenue. It was noted that authoriza­
tion to proceed for bids will be 
brought to the Board in February 
The Board also directed the Ad­
ministrator to check into the financ­
ing of the project through the State 
Trust Fund if it appears to maintain 
the lowest interest rates.

Action was taken on Ordinance 
No. 93-1 an Ordinance to Amend 
General Government, regarding 
Elections, Poll Hours as attached 
hereto-

A brief discussion regarding the 
status of the asphalt drive leading to 
the four properties recently annexed 
adjacent to USH 45 and leading to the 
old Town Garage. It was noted the 
Village would have control of the 
drive and it was suggested that the 
Village Board at some point should 
have a meeting with those properties 
abutting said drive.

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton, seconded by Trustee 
David Goeden and carried by the ma­
jority roll call vote, to adjourn to clos­
ed session under Chapter 19.85(l)(c) 
of the statutes to deliberate and 
negotiate the disposition of public 
lands Roll call vote was 7 “Aye,” 
0 “Nay,” 0 "Absent.”

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

Village Board 
Meeting Monday

ORDINANCE NO. 93-1
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND GENERAL GOVERNMENT 

IN THE VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM, WISCONSIN
The Village Board of the Village of Kewaskum, Wisconsin do ordain as 
follows
The Village Board of the Village of Kewaskum, Wisconsin wish to amend
1 08 and ordain as follows
1 08 ELECTIONS: POLL HOURS

The polls at all general elections in the Village of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wisconsin, shall be opened at 7:00 a m and 
closed at 8:00 p m.

This ordinance shall take effect upon passage and publication as provid­
ed by law
PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 18th day of January, 1993, by 
the Kewaskum Village Board

Mary Krueger
Village President

A TTEST:
Daniel S Schmidt
Village Administrator/Clerk
Introduced by Trustee Robert Beisbier
Motion for Adoption by Trustee David Goeden
Motion for Adoption seconded by Trustee Harry Roecker
Roll Call Vote was 7 "Aye" 0 "Nay" 0 "Absent"

MEETING NOTICE
The Kewaskum School Board will meet in a work session for­
mat at 7:00 p.m. on Monday, February 1, 1993 in the district 
office located at 1450 School Street, Kewaskum. The meeting 
is open to the public.

AGENDA
1. District health insurance issues - presentation by Mr. Fred 
Evert, WEAIT Field Representative.
2. Board discussion of site based management issues

Public notice is hereby given 
that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wisconsin, 
Village Board is scheduled for 
Monday evening, Feb 1, 1993, at 
8:00 p.m in the Council Room of 
the Municipal Building, 204 First 
Street

The agendas for meeting are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the clerk 
at the Municipal Building on 
Thursday preceding the meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and lobby 
of the Valley Bank.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

TOWN OF FARMINGTON 
Monthly Town Meeting

The Town Board of the Town 
of Farmington will hold their 
regular monthly meeting on Tues­
day, Feb. 2, at 8 p.m. in the 
Town Hall, 9422 Hwy. 144. 
Kewaskum.

Joanne Oneska, Clerk

TOWN OF KEWASKUM
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 
ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Town of Kewaskum Zon­

ing Board of Appeals will conduct a hearing on the application 
for appeal filed by August and Roger Bilgo, 1314 Parkview Drive, 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040 The hearing will be held at 8:00 P M , 
on Monday, February 15, 1993, at the Labor Hall, 1230 Fond 
du Lac Avenue, Kewaskum The applicant’s property is located 
in the Town of Kewaskum, part of the SW-SE described in 
Volume 775 Page 144 of Records, Section 4-12-19 The appeal 
seeks a variance of Section 1 06(2) of the requirements of the 
Zoning Ordinance, and, if granted, will allow the applicants to 
move an accessory building (garage) to the property on which 
no principal structure exists

All interested persons wishing to comment on the appeal 
should appear at the hearing.
Dated January 27, 1993

Barbara Wenzlaff
1.28-21 Zoning Secretary

Auto Crafty
Insurance Work Our Specialty 

Complete Auto Body Repair 
Unibody Repair 

Rental Cars Available 
Fast Service 

Serving the Area lor 16 Years
Conveniently located between West Bend and Kewaskum

338-0379
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Slow Start Plagues Lady Indians
By Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM Perhaps it was 
the pre-game fish fry that took a 
little extra toll on the Kewaskum 
girls basketball team here, last 
Friday night.

Whatever it was, the Indians 
got off to a slow start in their 
game with Ozaukee here, and 
were never able to catch the War­
riors, who left town with a hard 
fought 49 40 victory over the 
Lady Indians, who dropped their 
second straight non-confere nee 
contest.

“It was just one streak after 
another,” KHS coach Glenn 
Eichstedt said of the game, which 
started out with a 10-0 run by 
Ozaukee.

The Indians were able to battle 
back Io within five, at 12-7, by 
the end of the first quarter. But 
another rally by the Warriors 
gave them a 22-12 cushion mid 
way through the second quarter.

Once again, the Indians were 
able to make a late run in the 
quarter, using their fast breaking 
offense to make it close. 
Kewaskum used an 8-2 run just 
before halftime, to cut the deficit 
to 24-20 at the intermission.

Hampering the Indian effort 
was some good shooting by the 
guests. The Warriors hit several 
open shots from the wing in the 
first half, including six baskets by 
Jodi Dimro, who burned the In­
dian zone defense.

“We don’t normally play a lot

Aupperle Leads Point 
To WSUC Dual Title ‘11,495* ‘13,722*

of zone,” Eichstedt said of the 
switch. “We just didn’t cover her 
(Dimro) very well at all. She shot 
the ball very well.”

It was much of the same 
streakiness in the second half, as 
the Indians could never battle 
back all the way. “We were 
never able to gel over the hump, 
Eichstedt said. “We’d get within 
two or three points, and they’d 
come back and make a run.”

The Warriors ability to hang 
with the Indians on the boards 
also was a factor. Kewaskum out­
rebounded Ozaukee 31 -29, but as 
Eichstedt put it, “Normally that’s 
one of our advantages.”

Robyn Winninghoff played 
well once again for Kewaskum, 
leading the Indians with 15 points 
despite not starting. Ginger 
Wiesner added IO points for 
Kewaskum, which dropped to 8-5 
overall, but remained 5-1 in the 
Eastern Wisconsin Conference.

“To be honest, we kind of 
lacked intensity on defense,” said 
Eichstedt who added, “we’ll have 
that once in awhile. I’m not too 
distraught over it,” especially 
with the game being 
non conference.

“They just took advantage of 
whatever we gave them,” the 
KHS coach went on, noting that 
Ozaukee was 11-15 from the 
charity stripe.

Eichstedt also pointed out that 
he had been absent from school 
a couple of days last week, and

help“that probably didn’t

either,” not being able to coach 
at practice.

The night wasn’t a complete 
disaster, though, as there was a 
good turnout for the pre-game 
Tish fry, which has turned into an 
annual event.

“It worked out nicely,’’ 
Eichstedt said, noting there were 
about 50 patrons for the meal. 
Most stayed around for the game 
as well, which made for a good 
crowd. “It’s always nice to play 
at home on Friday nights.’’

Eichstedt and the Indians will 
get another chance for a big Fri­
day night crowd this week, as the 
Indians will host Chilton in a 
game that will go a long way in 
deciding the Eastern Wisconsin 
Conference title.

Chilton is currently 6-0 in the 
EW and in first place, while the

WINTER SAVINGS
1992 OLDS 

ACHIEVA COUPE
/ Air conditioning
/ Automatic 
/ Aluminum wheels 
/ AM/FM cassette 

Stock #1071 
HUGE SAVINGS

REDUCED TO ‘11,450*

Indians are a game back at 5-1. 
There will be a couple of promo­
tions for the tilt, including 
Elementary School Night, which 
will give free tickets to students 
with a paid adult.

There will also be a demonstra­
tion before the game involving 
the team’s Saturday Slammers 
and Shooters Club, which the In­
dians have been sponsoring on 
Saturday mornings for the past 
couple of years.

OZAUKEE (12-12-14-11) - 
Damerow 14, Buntrock 10, 
Holston 7, Stadler 6, Waskie 5, 
Schommer 5, Bonlander 2. Free 
Throws 1 1 of 21, Fouls - 15.

KEWASKUM (7-13-8-12) - 
Fleischman 2, Sabish 2, Radtke 
4, Winninghoff 15, Wiesner 10, 
Steger 3, Bruendl 4. Free Throws 
- 8 of 15, Fouls - 16.

1992 CHEVY 
LUMINA 4 DOOR
/ Power locks & windows 
/ Power seat 
/ Cruise/tilt
/ AM/FM Bose radio
/ 7,300 miles

Stock #183

A man travels the world 
over in search of what he 
needs and returns home to 
find it. —George Moore

WEEUSni

DON’S 
ELECTRIC 
Electrical Contractor 
‘Residential Wiring 
‘New Construction 
‘ Remodeling 
•Rewiring 
‘Service Changes

FREE ESTIMATES 
Call 334-7565

1993 OLDS 
CIERA S SEDAN
/ 3300 V6 engine 
/ Overdrive transmission 
/ Cruise/tilt
/ AM/FM cassette
/ Rear defogger 
/ Power door locks 
/ Low miles

Stock #2000 ^•V f

By Noel Stollenwerk

LA CROSSE - The unique 
thing about wrestling is that it is 
as much an individual sport as it 
is a team sport. Former 
Kewaskum High School standout 
Dennis Aupperle showed just 
how that combination works at
the Wisconsin State
Conference 
Saturday.

Aupperle, 
UW-Stevens

duals

who is 
Point.

University 
here, last

a senior at 
beat UW

LaCrosse’s Scott Westcott in 
what turned out to be the cham­
pionship match of the dual meet, 
10-2. Aupperle’s win was the 
deciding factor, as the Pointers 
beat LaCrosse 17-15, to win the 
WSUC duals championship.

“We should have beaten them 
worse.” Aupperle said of the 
dual against LaCrosse, which had 
posted an upset the previous week 
at the NCAA Division III Na­
tional Duals in Courtland, New 
York. The Pointers entered the 
tournament as the top seed, but 
were upset by the State Univer­
sity of New York-Albany, and 
subsequently finished fifth.

LaCrosse took advantage of the 
Pointers’ loss in the meet, and 
wound up taking home the Na­
tional dual championship. Aup­
perle said that the LaCrosse 
wrestlers took some pleasure in 
celebrating the title, so “We were 
kind of looking forward to wrest­
ling them on Saturday.”

In order for that to occur, both 
teams would have to win three 
preliminary dual meets, and each 
did quite easily. Stevens Point

beat up on UW Platteville 39-3, 
shut out UW-Oshkosh 46-0, and 
then beat UW-River Falls by a 
36-9 count.

In those matches, Aupperle 
went 3-0, beating Platteville’s 
Jeff Gringler 3-1, pinning 
Oshkosh’s Jay Coonen in 3:23, 
and then handling River Falls’

CHOOSE FROM
CARS

'92 Olds "98” Regency 4 Dr. All 
the “Toys.” 9,180 miles
Stk #141

includes factory rebate

Tom Kiefer 4-1.
Then came LaCrosse 

championship of the 
Things didn't go as well 
peeled for the Pointers,

'92 Olds Toronado Coupe.
Clean, 3,500 miles. SAVE
BIG$$ Stk. #154

$19,900

$16,500
in the 
duals.
as ex- 
whose

'92 Olds Ciera Station Wagon 
V-6, all options, very clean. Stk.

FEATURE SPECIAL

1992 CORSICA 4 DOOR
V 6 engine, automatic, 
cruise, power locks, $» 
stereo.......................... O,77J
Stock #159

#2023A $12,900

ARS & TRUCKS
TRUCKS

‘92 Oldsmobile Bravada All 
wheel drive, all options
Stk. #172 $20,900

134-pounder uncharacteristically 
lost to his foe. “He should have 
never lost,” Aupperle said, 
noting that made the match much 
closer.

With the Pointers trailing 15-14 
heading into the heavyweight 
match, Aupperle made sure the 
championship wouldn't slip out of 
his grasp. Aupperle shut down 
Wescott, who he had beaten in 
the finals of the WSUC con­
ference meet last year, 14-4.

“Hopefully, 1'11 meet him one 
more time,” Aupperle said, 
referring to the WSUC Con­
ference meet to be held in 
mid-February.

The four wins helped Aupperle 
improve his record to 23-8 on the 
year, with eight pins. Aupperle 
leads the Pointers with 80 team 
points this season, and has his eye 
on the Pointer team record of 117 
points.

But first things first, as Aup­
perle and the Pointers travel to 
LaCrosse again this weekend to 
take part in the Wisconsin-Iowa 
duals.

‘92 Olds Ciera 4 Dr. V-6, auto, 
air and more. Stk. #161 $12,900

‘92 Lumina 4 Dr. Euro V-6, all 
options, low miles.
Stk. #195 $12,500

'91 Corsica 4 Door V 6, air, 
automatic, cruise and more
Stk. #128 $7,995

‘89 Dodge Daytona Coupe 
Automatic, air, sporty black.
Stk. #1078A $6,995

'89 Chev. Corsica 4 Dr. V6, auto, 
air, only 27,000 miles.
Stk. #169 $5,900

‘88 Celebrity 4DR. Eurosport 
39,000 miles. Fully equipped, 
V-6. Stk# 211..................... $6,995

‘88 Caprice Station Wagon All 
options, only 48,000 miles.
Stk. #192 $7,995

UNDER $4.0Q0
‘86 Celebrity 4 DR Eurosport 
85,000 miles, nice condition.
Stk. #194A.........................

‘85 Olds Toronado Nice 
condition, all options.
Stk. #118A.........................

$2,500

$3,950

'84 Ford LTD Wagon V 8, 9 
passenger, runs good ... $1,500

'84 Chev S10 Pickup V-6, automatic, 
33,000 miles. Stk. #7016A... $3,000

'83 Chrysler 5th Ave 4 DR V8, 
engine recently replaced, 70,000

92 S-10 Blazer 4X4 Leather 
trim, power moon roof, extra clean, 
10,000miles Stk #14 9. $18,9 00 
92 Astro All Wheel Drive 
Extended Van. 7 pass., only 
11,000 mi. Stk #980... $18,5 00 
92 Chevy S-10 Blazer 4X4 4 Dr.
4.3 V6, low miles, choice of 4 $ 17,900 
'91 Chevy Suburban 4X4 350 
V8, bucket seats. Ready for 
winter! Stk #986........ $20,500
'91 Chevy C1500 Pickup 5 
speed, air and more Check this 
one Stk. #9095A...........$9,3 50
'91 Chev. S10 Pickup Black 
beauty, Torneau cover, 17,000 
miles. Stk #5O27A...........$7,250
'89 Chevy "Hi-Cube” Van A 14’ 
long box ready to work. Very
nice. Stk. #121 $12,900
'89 GMC Safari Van Upscale 
trim, 4.3 V6 and more, 37,900 
miles. Stk. #145............. $11,900
‘88 Chevy 1/2 Ton Silverado V8, 
auto, and much more. Stk.

miles. Stk. #182A $2,500

‘82 AMC Eagle 4X4 Runs good, 
ready for snow!
Stk. 7000€ $1,450

#956A $8,480

Stk. #847A

'87 Olds “98” 4 Dr. Leather 
trim, sharp, maroon.

$6,700

'87 Chevy 1/2 Ton Pickup V8, 
auto, nice condition. Stk. #968 $5,280
‘86 GMC K 3500 4X4 3 50 V8, 4 
soeed, heavy duty,nice shape.
Stk. #131..............................57,250

’CHWARTZBURG
CHEVROLET ♦

Hwy 3 3 "West” • West Bend • Open Mon. thru Fn till 8 00pm; Sat till 4 00pm

CALL TODAY 334-3858 • TOLL FREE 1-800-236-2620



Put Yourself in the m« ACQTFWnt' 
Marketplace, in the Wiftddlt UUd

ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE
RATE: $2.00 up to 20 words; over 20 words ■ add 10c per word

NEW CLASSIFIED AD POLICY
All classified ads must now be paid in advance Classified ads phoned in or brought 
to our office must be paid by noon on Tuesday of the week you want the ad publish­
ed The ONLY exception will be for those businesses who have regular running ac­
counts with the Statesman.
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Win With Catch and Release

FOR SALE — AKC Collies, one- 
year-old sable and white male and 
female, four-year-old tri-color 
female. Outstanding and beautiful 
companions for children, seniors. 
All three have excellent manners 
533-5143.

1-28-1tp

FOR SALE — 1982 Oldsmobile 
wagon, dark blue, excellent con­
dition, air, cruise, stereo, ne 
transmission. Call 533-5143 or 
626-4609 1-28-1tp

FOR SALE — Harrison - welding, 
cutting & heating torch set. 
$150.00. 626-4565 1-14-tf

HELP WANTED — Experienced 
scraper, bulldozer, backhoe 
operators. Also positions for 
sewer and water work. Call 
Mueller Excavating, 533-8666 

1-28-27

HELP WANTED — Reliable full or 
part-time clerk Must work Satur­
days, NO Sundays, some benefits 
available. Apply in person at 
Kewaskum Frozen Foods, 118 
Forest Ave., Kewaskum. 1-21-tf

WANTED — A safe, courteous, 
Van Driver to deliver repeat 
customers in West Bend area and 
Milwaukee. No sales required. 40 
lb product delivery. 1-629-9255 
ask for Bob. 1-21-3p

HELP WANTED — Easy work, 
excellent income for arts, crafts, 
sales. Full or part-time available 
Info. 1-504-646-1700 Dept. 
WI-6960 1-14-4p

HELP WANTED — RN or LPN, 
casual hours, available on all 
shifts. No weekends. Small 26 
bed skilled facility Come and join 
our friendly, professional staff. 
Contact Evelyn Schmidt, D O N., 
Beechwood Rest Home, N1495 
W. Hwy A, Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
626-4258 or 944-4717 7-2-tf

HELP WANTED - Certified 
nurses aides. P M shift with oc­
casional rotation to days and 
nights. Sign on bonus - com­
petitive wages. Come join our pro­
fessional. caring staff. Contact 
Evelyn Schmidt, DON,, Beech­
wood Rest Home, N1495 W. Hwy. 
A, Kewaskum, Wl 53040. 
626-4258 or 944-4717. 5-14-tf

FOR RENT — New two bedroom 
apartment available March 1. All 
new appliances, water and sewer 
included Garage also available 
$475. Phone 626-8760. 1-28-tf

FOR RENT — Kewaskum two- 
bedroom apartment, appliances 
and utilities, furnished. $475 
month, lease, security deposit. No 
pets, no waterbeds. 626-2055.

1-28-tf

FOR RENT — Brand new two 
bedroom luxuryapartments with 
garages All appliances including 
washer and dryer, no pets. 
444-2300, 533-4829 or 626-2765.

12-17-1 p-tf

Age, like distance, 
lends a double 
charm.

FOR RENT — Eden. Deluxe 2 
bedroom apartment. Includes 
garage, all appliances, air condi­
tioner, washer and dryer, cable 
ready. No pets $525 per month 
Phone 477-4561 or 477-4793.

12-31-5t

FOR RENT — Deluxe two 
bedroom apartment in Kewas­
kum. Appliances included Call 
626-4231 or 626-2653 1-28-tf

FOR RENT — One, two and three 
bedroom apartments and 
townhouses. Rustic Timbers 
Apartments Phone 334-1395.

CHILD CARE OFFERED — 
Licensed family daycare. Home 
set on a farm. Meals, snacks, 
structured activities. Nine years 
experience, references, Town of 
Wayne 629-5782 1-28-2tp

KEN’S HOME IMPROVEMENTS, 
REPAIRS — Carpentry of all 
kinds 335-2400 1-7-4tp

SEWING — Light mending, sew­
ing. alterations. Call 626-4495.

FOR BRIDAL SEWING — And 
alterations or light mending or 
clothing alterations, call Shelby at 
533-5061 14 years experience 

1-28 & 2-10

INCOME TAX 
PREPARATION 
Florence Hansen

626-2001 1-7-14tp

HAVE CASH BUYER For ranch 
home in Kewaskum. Call Wendy 
Coulter HOMETOWN REALTY of 
WEST BEND at 338-5656 or 
338-3296 1-14-tf

HAVE BUYERS — For country or 
village homes within 3 miles of 
Kewaskum. If you are thinking of 
selling, call Ann Enright, 
Hometown Realty of West Bend 
338-5656 or 692-2607 collect.

5-21-tf

RESIDENTIAL — Building lots for 
sale Approximately four miles 
north of West Bend. Terms: Call 
334-7306. Licensee/Owner.

4-30-tf

ONE STALL and outside boar­
ding. large pasture Full service, 
references available. Call 
533-5100. 11-5-tf

FIREWOOD FOR SALE - Finest 
quality seasoned red and white 
oak. Cut, split and delivered 
$125. cord. Immediate or later 
delivery. Inspections welcome 
Phone 922-1575. 9-24-tf

WORK WANTED — Lloyd’s 
Home Maintenance. No job too 
small. Repairs, remodeling, 
carpentry, painting, varnishing, 
wallpaper, woodgraining, ceramic 
tile. etc. Lloyd M. Ebert. 533-8013.

4-30-tf

BICYCLES — Sales and Service 
Wally's Bike Shop. 208 North 
Ave., Kewaskum. 4-30-tf

TIRES — There's always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan s Service 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 
626-2888. 4-30-tf

State of Wisconsin
Circuit Court
Washington County
Probate

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

File No. 93-IN 8
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF GRACE M. 
THEUSCH

An application has been filed 
for informal Administration of 
the estate of the above named per­
son, Washington County, 
Wisconsin, whose post office ad­
dress was 128 Elm Street, P.O. 
Box 5 21, Kewaskum, Wl 5 3 040

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
All creditors’ claims must be 

filed on or before April 19, 1993, 
or be barred,

BY THE COURT:
Sue Deppiesse 
Deputy
January 18. 1993

Lee H. Theusch,
Personal Representative 
N2754 Oak Grove Road
Waupun. Wl 53963 9 711

Publish Jan. 21. 28, Feb. 4

WISCONSIN TRAVEL FACTS
World Dairy Expo held in 

Madison each year is aptly 
named: it is indeed the world's 
largest dairy expo!

Fasten women's 
hosiery to the nozzle of 
the vacuum cleaner 
with a rubber band to 
find pins, contact lens­
es and the like lost in 
carpeting.

Instead of Spending 
S$S to Heat Your , 
Old Home 
Winter...

Spend it wisely on a 
new energy efficient 
KIRST BUILT HOME!

Our homes EXCEED re­
quirements for the 
Wisconsin Energy Code 

New shur-dri 
foundation system

HURRY'! WHILE RATES 
ARE DOWN!

KIRST 
BUILDERS

411 Main St. 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040 

626-4392

At the Long Lake Fisheree on 
February 7th. fishermen will 
have a chance to win up to 
$100.00 by participating in a uni­
que catch and release fishing 
event. Any legal gamefish - 
walleye, bass or northern - will 
qualify if they can be placed back 
into the lake with reasonable ex­
pectation for survival.

Fish brought to the main tent 
will be placed in a special holding 
tank to verify their condition. 
Every released fish will give that

Prayer to the 
Holy Spirit

Holy Spirit, you who help 
me see everything and 
you who show me the 

way to reach my goal and 
my Ideal. You who give 

me the Divine Gift to 
forgive and forget the 

wrong that is done to me.
You who knew my 

innermost thoughts and 
desires, I want to thank 

you for everything and to 
confirm once more that I 

never want to be 
separated from you. I 

want to be with you and 
my loved ones In your 
perpetual glory. Amen. 

Thank you (or your love 
for me and my loved 

ones. You must pray this 
prayer 3-consecutlve days 
without asking your wish.

After the 3rd day your 
wish will be granted no 
matter how difficult it 
might be. Promise to 

publish this dialogue as 
soon as your favor has 

been granted.

M.H.M.

PRAYER TO ST. JUDE
THE NEVER FAIL 

NOVENA. May the Sacred Heart 
of Jesus be praised, adored and 
glorified throughout the whole 
world now and forever. Most 
Sacred Heart of Jesus I put my 
trust in you. Holy Mary Mother 
of Jesus, pray for me. St. Theresa 
of the Child of Jesus pray for me. 
St. Jude. Helper of Hopeless 
Cases, pray for me and grant this 
favor I ask. Say this prayer 9 
times a day for 9 days and 
publish.

K.S.

^Hometown PhoneA™E"^
REALTY OF WEST BENO. INC.

2375 W. Washington St. S?^ ll?
338-3656 REALTORS*

Country Reflections Condominiums of Kewaskum
• Luxury 2 bedroom units
•In-Unit laundry
• 2 bathrooms
• Deluxe kitchen with appliances
•Garages and parking
• Beautiful view of Kettle Moraine Hills
•Be among the first for a good selectic o

Call Collect Ann Enright. 692 2607 
♦ SHOWINGS BY APPOINTMENT#

VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM COLONIAL
Village of Kewaskum Colonial Four 
spacious bedrooms, family room with par­
tial open staircase, beautifully decorated 
quality construction Desirable location 
near park <7 5 Call Ann at 692-2607

CALL ANN ABOUT VACANT LAND LISTINGS

fishermen or woman a chance at 
winning extra cash prizes. Fish in 
competition for large fish prizes 
will be measured and photograph 
ed before release.

Check in at the main tent will 
begin at 6:00 a m. Bring your 
coolers or large buckets to 
transfer your catch from hole to 
holding tank.

The Long Lake Fishing Club is 
an environmental and educational 
organization involved in protec­
ting the lake and it’s waters and 
preserving the enjoyment of good 
fishing for the benefit of future 
generations.

Tax Tip for the Self-Employed
In business for yourself? Do 

work on the side? If your net earn­
ings arc $400 or more, you musl 
tile Form 1040 and Schedule SI.. 
For details, call the IRS al 1-800- 
8 ”' <6 F6 and ask lor Public ation 
531. Self f.mplovmcnt Ta\. It s free'

Recycle today for

ALUMINUM 
CANS

On the first,third 
and fifth Saturdays

10 a.m. to 2 p.m.

SENTRY PARKING LOT 
Kewaskum Mall 

Also buying copper, brass, 
batteries and other aluminum

2nd and 4th Tuesday 
10 a.m. to 1 p.m. 

STRAUB'S in Campbellsport 

MARCOES RECYCLING

LANNON STONE home in ex­
cellent condition Large sized 
rooms, expandable, walk-up attic 
Kitchen has oak cabinets and built- 
in counter top range and oven. 
Large backyard. Only $84,900

* REDUCED•LOW TAXES •
4 bedroom Colonial on country acre Large 
family room with natural fireplace flanked 
by bookshelves, formal dining room many 
quality cabinets line the roomy kitchen 
Beautifully landscaped yard #24 Ask for 
Ann Enright. 692-2607
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FT’s Make a Difference 
As Oostburg Beats Indians

Hy Noel Stollenwerk
OOSTBURG The Kewaskum 

girls' basketball team did its best 
to stay with a talented Oostburg 
squad here, last Tuesday night.

The Indians played the Flying 
Dutchmen even in the opening 
eight minutes, but alter that it was 
the hosts who used a big second 
quarter to help pull away from 
Kewaskum to win, 63-43.

The non conference loss drop 
ped the Indians to 84 overall, 
while Oostburg, ranked fourth in 
the latest state poll, improved to 
12-0.

“They are a real quality team, 
probably the best balanced team 
that we'll play all year,” KHS 
coach Glenn Liebstedt said of the 
Flying Dutchmen. “They just 
have a great team.”

The Indians, thus, did well to 
hang with the hosts in the open 
ing quarter. With Robyn Winn 
inghoff and Missy Radtke com­
bining for 13 points in the open 
ing frame, the Indians found 
themselves lied 17 all after the 
high-scoring first period.

“Both teams came out and 
played real good offensive 
basketball,” Eichstedt pointed 
out. "We were just taking it to 
them. It was the best first quarter 
of the year for us.”

But in the second quarter, the 
officials began taking it to the In 
dians, as Oostburg went to the 
free throw line I I times in the 
First half, compared to the Indians 
two attempts. By halftime, the In 
dians had committed 15 fouls 
compared Io Oostburg’s four, and 
trailed the Dutchmen 35-24.

“Both teams were playing 
hard, but the calls just went 
against us.” said Eichstedt. “We 
became loo concerned with the 
officiating, myself included. I felt 
that it just look us out of the 
game, mentally.”

The Indians battled back in the

third quarter, however, twice cut 
ting the deficit to just six. But 
both times Cheri VanStelle con 
netted on three pointers, “and 
that kept us at bay,” Eichstedt 
said.

“She’s such a talented player,” 
Eichstedt said of VanStelle, who 
finished with 14 points. “Both 
her and (Danielle) VandcrPlas are 
very experienced players. They 
know how to control the game.”

VanStelle led the Dutchmen 
with 15 points.

“Bonnie Schlice did a nice job 
bringing us back,” in the third 
quarter, according to Eichstedt. 
Schlice finished with seven 
points, all coming in the third 
period.

Robyn Winmnghoff, mean­
while, turned in another one of 
her steady performances, leading 
all scorers with 17 points. The 
6-3 senior also hauled in 14 
rebounds.

Eichstedt went to his reserves 
in the final period, while 
Oostburg did not. “That allow­
ed them to build up the lead,” the 
KHS boss said, noting the game 
was actually much closer.

“We played tentatively,” 
Eichstedt concluded, noting the 
louis in the first half, “took our 
concentration away.” Still. 
Eichstedt was impressed with the 
Oostburg squad.

"Their depth had a big effect.” 
he said, noting that the Dutchmen 
don’t lose much by going to their 
bench. “There’s a reason they’re 
12-0.”

KEWASKUM (17-7-11-8) 
Winninghoff 17. Wiesner 7. 
Schlice 7, Radtke 4. Sabish 6, 
Fleischman 2. Free Throws - 8 of 
14. Fouls 21.

OOSTBURG (17-18-16-12) - 
VandcrPlas 14. Kappers4. Cline 
12. VanStelle 15. Schiller 4. 
Karstetter 2, Dykstra 3. Leet 9. 
Free Throws 11 of 22, Fouls 
14.

CAMPBELLSPORT 
SNOCOUGARS

January 22-30, 1993
Run by Snowmobile or Car

Stops at:
Amerahn • Ashford Country Inn 

C.C. Cody’s • King Pin Lanes • Boar’s Nest 
Sandpiper Inn • Thiemer’s Sip & Snip 

CC’s Wayne

BRAT & BURGER FRY AT POKER 
CHECK-IN

at 
Boar’s Nest 

January 30, 1993 • 11:00 am til ???

PRIZE MONEY:
1st: $75.00
2nd: $50.00
3rd: $25.00

ORDINANCE NO. 93-1
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE ZONING ORDINANCE OF THE 

TOWN OF WAYNE, WASHINGTON COUNTY, WISCONSIN
THE TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF WAYNE. WASHINGTON COUNTY, WISCONSIN, DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS
Section 1. That the Zoning Ordinance of the Town of Wayne. Washington County. Wisconsin, is amended as follows

I Section 1 20(1) "COMMERCIAL A DISTRICT, Permitted Uses" is repealed and recreated as follows
(1) Permitted Uses

(a) All permitted uses allowed in the Residential A-2 District except community living arrangements
(b) Grocery and supermarkets
(c) Retail hardware stores
(d) Shoe sales or repair
(e) Beauty shops
(f) Barber shops
(g) Drugstores and apothecaries
(h) Meat markets
(i) Bakeries offering no vehicular delivery service
(j) Package liquor stores
(k) Taverns having no outdoor service
(I) Delicatessens
(m) Restaurants or cafes having no outdoor service or having seating for less than 50 people
(n) Professional offices
(o) Cleaners providing no pick-up or delivery service
(p) Men's or women’s apparel shops
(q) Radio, television, and appliance (primarily sales)
(r) Non dwelling uses and structures accessory to the above permitted uses

II Section 1 20(2) “COMMERCIAL A DISTRICT, Conditional Uses", is repealed and recreated as follows
1. Conditional Uses

(a) Restaurants or cafes with outdoor service or having seating for more than 50 people
(b) Hospitals, clinics, general public and quasipublic uses
(c) Service stations (if bounded on at least three sides by a commercial use or district).
(d) Laundromats and laundries having no pick-up or delivery service
(e) Hotels and motels
(f) Kennels
(g) Certain signs under subsection (6)(b)
(h) Flower, candy or gift shops
(i) Dime stores or notions
(j) Other retail establishments similar to the above

III Section 1 21(1) "COMMERCIAL B-1 DISTRICT, Permitted Uses" is repealed and recreated as follows
(a) All permitted uses as allowed in Commercial A District
(b) General offices
(c) Civic and social clubs
(d) Commercial parking lots and structures
(e) Non-dwelling and non-slaes uses and structures accessory to the above permitted uses

IV Section 1 21(2) "COMMERCIAL B-1 DISTRICT, Conditional Uses" is repealed and recreated as follows

(1) Conditional Uses
(a) Drive in theaters
(b) Kennels
(c) Other uses which pertain primarily to the retail sale of goods, services or entertainment

V Section 1 26(3)(v) "CONDITIONAL USES. Allowable Conditional Uses" is repealed and recreated as follows
(v) The following uses are Conditional Uses which shall only be permitted as herein provided
1 Commercial establishments which display, sell, have in their possession for sale, offer for view, publish, disseminate, 

give, lease or otherwise deal in any written or printed matter, pictures, films, sound recordings, machines, mechanical 
devices, models, facsimiles or other material and paraphernalia depicting sexual conduct or nudity and which exclude 
minors by reason of age

2 Commercial establishments which display for viewing any film or pictures depicting sexual conduct or nudity and which 
exclude minors by reason of age

3 Commercial establishments in which any person appears or performs in a manner depicting sexual conduct or involving 
nudity and from which minors are excluded by reason of age

vi. Definitions
1 . As used herein "nudity" means the showing of the human male or female genitals, pubic area or buttocks with less than 

a full opaque covering, or the showing of the female breast with less than a fully opaqued covering of any portion 
thereof below the top of the areola, or the human male genitals in a discernibly turgid state even if completely or opaquely 

covered
2 As used herein "sexual conduct" means acts or simulated acts of masturbation, homosexuality, sexual intercourse 

or physical contact with a person's clothed or unclothed genitals pubic area buttocks, or. f such person is a female, breasts

vii. The above Conditional Uses shall only be permitted in a Commercial B-2 District and only upon the grant of a Conditional 
Use Permit, subject to the following additional provisions

1 No permit shall be granted where the proposed establishment is within 500 feet of any hospital, church, school, funeral 
parlor, restaurant, library, park, museum, playground or any other public or private building or premises likely to be 
utilized by persons under the age of eighteen (18) years

2 No permit shall be granted where the proposed establishment is within 1000 feet of any area zoned residential or 
agricultural in the same or a contiguous town or municipality

3 . The applicant shall furnish the Town detailed information as to the nature of use and activity of the proposed 
establishment.

If the application is for an establishment under paragraph v(1) or v(2) of this Section, the applicant shall furnish represen­
tative samples of the materials to be dealt in If the application is for an establishment under paragraph v(3) of this Section. 
the applicant shall in detail specify the nature of the activity to be engaged in.

4 . The applicant for the permit shall provide the names and addresses of all parlies in interest
5 Advertisements, displays, pictures or other promotional materials shall not be shown or exhibited on the premises in a 

manner which makes them visible to the public from pedestrian ways or other public semi-public areas
6 All points of access into such establishments and all windows or other openings shall be located, constructed, covered 

or screened in a manner which will prevent a view into the interior from any public or semi-public area
7 . In case of a protest signed by 20% or more of the persons of the area within 300 feet of the proposed establishment, the 
grant of such permit shall require a 2/3 vote of the Town Board
8 The Town Board in determining whether to grant a permit hereunder shall, n addition to considerations otherwise 

taken into account when acting on Conditional Use Permits, consider the protection of property values in the affected 
area; the preservation of neighborhoods; the tendency 
of such use to attract an undesirable quantity or quality of transients; the tendency of such use to cause increases in 
crime, especially prostitution and sex-related crimes and the need for policing; the tendency of such use to cause 
increases in noise, traffic and other factors interfering with the quiet and peaceful enjoyment of the neighborhood; the 

tendency of such use to encourage residents and businesses to move elsewhere, the protetion of minors from such materials and 
activities; any other factor created by the type of use being considered; and the health, safety and general welfare of the 
community.

viii. It is declared to be the purpose and intent of this subsection to protect the public health, safety, welfare and morals of the 
community, to promote the stability of property values, and impose restrictions upon those activities which pander to gross 
sexuality in a manner that would detract from the neighborhood and adversely affect the property values, increase 
crime and violence and be repugnant to the morals of the community In recognition of the protection afforded to the 
citizens under the 1st and 14th Amendments, it is not the intent to inhibit freedom of speech or the press, but rather to 
restrict the location of defined materials and activities consistent with the Town's interest in the present and future 
character of its community development

Sponsored by the Campbellsport Sno Cougars 
Call 533-4978 or 533-5177 for information

Section 2. The Plan Commission of the Town of Wayne recommended the adoption of this Ordinance at a meeting held on 
the 16th day of December. 1992.

Section 3 Pursuant to and in accordance with the Laws of the State of Wisconsin, the Town Board of Supervisors held a 
public hearing on this Ordinance on the 22nd day of January. 1993

Section 4 If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this Ordinance is for any reason held invalid 
or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such portion shall be deemed a separate distinct and independent 
provision and such holding shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions hereof.

Section 5. This Ordinance shall take effect upon publishing as provided by law

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Town Board of the Town of Wayne. Washington County, Wisconsin. 25th day of January. 1993

ATTEST:
Orville Kern, Clerk

Carl Hohlweck
Mark Strobel
Leonard Peter

Chairman 
Supervisor 
Supervisor
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Indian Wrestlers Capture Waupun Invitational Team Title

Shown above is the Kewaskum High School wrestling team with their 
first place team trophy won with 182.0 points at the Waupun Tourna­
ment on January 16th. Front row, left to right: Assistant Coach Kevin 
Chambers, Troy Maertz, Jake Gundrum, Jake Thull, Mark Dziedzic,

Tyler Dieringer, Coach John Nell. Back row: Tim Gundrum, Todd 
Muckerheide, Mark Morell, Chad Muckerheide, Josh Kurtz, Rich Far- 
chione, Brad Jackson and Corey Rammer.

Indian Grapplers Beaten by Falcons
By Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM - One couldn’t 
blame the Kewaskum wrestling 
team for being a bit tired. 
Heading into their match with 
Sheboygan Falls last Thursday 
night, the Indians had participated 
in four dual meets and two tour­
naments, all within a 13-day 
period, and all it should be noted, 
against some stiff competition.

So it wasn't all that unexpected 
that the Indians were a bit slug­
gish against the Falcons, who 
entered the meet with a fine 15-1 
dual meet record. Falls made it 
16-1, as they were able to outlast 
the Indians, 34-24, in an Eastern 
Wisconsin Conference dual.

‘It was a tight one,” KHS 
coach John Nell said of the mat­
chup with Falls. “It was a good 
meet. Each team won six mat­
ches. We just needed a few more 
pins.”

The Indians got a big lift ear­
ly, when Jake Gundrum scored a 
reversal in the final seconds of 
this match with Jeremy Wolf at 
112 pounds to win 6-4. “That

Rockets Outlast Indians
By Noel Stollenwerk

CEDAR GROVE - His team 
had a chance to win at the end. 
and that's about all Kewaskum 
wrestling coach John Nell could 
ask for last Tuesday night, here.

But Cedar Grove, ranked in the 
top three in Division 3. got a big 
pin at the heavyweight spot, 
allowing the Rockets to hold off 
the Indians in a dual meet. 33-30.

“They are a real tough team.” 
Nell said of the Rockets, who 
won the highly-regarded Valders 
Invitational with six individual 
champions. “They are a real 
quality team with some top-notch 
kids.”

Ihat depth paid off. as Mar­

was a real good match,” Nell 
said. “That was a tight one all the 
way.”

Nell got a pair of pins from 
Mark Dziedzic at 125 pounds, 
and Todd Muckerheide at 189 
pounds. Dziedzic improved to 
20-l with his pinfall, while 
Muckerheide improved to 16-5.

“His really wasn’t that close of 
a match,” Nell said of 
Muckerheide’s pin, which occur­
red with the senior leading by just 
a 5-3 count. “It really wasn't a 
5-3 match.”

Nell echoed those sentiments in 
describing Josh Kurtz’s 11 -7 win 
over Brent Bender at 152 pounds. 
“He had a tough one, but I wasn’t 
concerned at any time during the 
match,” Nell said.

The KHS coach said that he felt 
that the Falcons were “just wan­
ting to hang with us,” at several 
weight classes. It appeared that 
the Falcon wrestlers were stradl- 
ing the edge of the mat a couple 
of times, in order to avoid 
possibly getting pinned.

“I’m not going to complain,” 
Nell said, adding that the Falcons

tinez was able to put Tim Gun­
drum's shoulder's to the mat in 
l:22 at the heavyweight spot, 
allowing the Rockets to erase the 
30-27 deficit and post the win.

The Indians had several bright 
spots in the meet, however, one 
being the win by Tyler Dieringer 
at 130 pounds. “I was just so pro­
ud of Tyler.” Nell said of Dier­
inger's 9-8 victory. “He had a 
real good match and just toughes 
it out.”

Todd Muckerheide posted a big 
pinfall at 189 to put the Indians 
ahead late in the match. 
Muckerheide’s win came right 
after Mark Morell lost a heart­
breaking 6-4 decision in overtime

are one of the top teams in the 
conference. “They should have 
beaten Plymouth,” he said, 
noting that Falls’ lone loss against 
the Panthers very easily could 
have went the other way. “They 
are a real solid team... highly 
regarded.”

Nell was happy with his kids’ 
performances, especially Chad 
Muckerheide’s 6-3 win over 
Dayton Behnke at 160 pounds. 
Behnke, who was the EW's most 
valuable player in football this 
past season, took an early lead but 
was unable to hold on against 
Muckerheide, who improved his 
record to 16-6.

“We’re getting better,” Nell 
said. “We’re kind of beat up 
right now (from the busy 
schedule). It’s been pretty hard on 
thekids, but I think after this 
break, they’ll be raring to go.”

That break won’t be very long, 
though, as the Indians have a 
makeup meet with Oakfield on 
Tuesday, and then are at Chilton 
on Friday in their final dual meet 
before the conference tourna­
ment.

at 171 pounds.4
“That was a real excellent 

match,” Nell said, noting that 
Anzia had handled Morell quite 
easily last year when the two met. 
“You just hate to see a kid lose 
that kind of a match.”

Mark Dziedzic was the only 
other Indian to have to work for 
his victory. Dziedzic, who im­
proved to 19-1 on the year, out- 
wrestled Neil Metlic 5-3, 
although the match wasn’t quite 
as close as the score indicated, ac­
cording to Nell.

In addition to Morell’s tough 
loss. Jake Gundrum wrestled well 
at 112 pounds, before eventually

KHS wrestling coach John Nell with a very happy smile 
after accepting the team plaque. This is the first time 
Kewaskum has taken first place as a team in a tournament.

Kewaskum's Tyler Diennger gains back points against Don 
Amel of New Holstein. Tyler wins with a 17-4 decision and 
takes fifth place at the Waupun Tournament.

Sue Heisdorf Photos

falling to Jeff Schimberg 9-12. 
Jake did an outstanding job.”

Nell said of the sophomore. “He 
had him (Schimberg) on the 
ropes.”

All in all, Nell was pleased

with the Indians' performance. 
“We were one match away from 
winning." he said. “We knew it 
was going to be tight, so I'm not 
unhappy at all.”

« ontinned on next pui>e)



KHS Boys Blow Big Lead; Lose to Unbeaten Two Rivers Kewaskum Statesman, Thursday, 
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Hy Noel Stollenwerk
KEWASKUM The game had 

all the makings of an upset, but 
the Kewaskum boys basketball 
team just couldn't finish the job 
against Two Rivers here, last 
Tuesday night.

The Indians raced to a 14 point 
lead in the first half, but the 
Raiders stormed back in the se­
cond half, scoring 45 points in the 
final 16 minutes to beat the In­
dians, 60-55.

Kewaskum took full advantage 
of some poor shooting by the 
Raiders in the first half to gain the 
upper hand. Two Rivers con­
nected on |ust six of their 27 field 
goal tries, and trailed by ten. 
25 15, at halftime.

“We played a zone defense, 
and they just couldn’t hit 
anything.’’ KHS coach Jim 
Westphal said of the opening half. 
“We were also playing quite 
well... did a great job at break­
ing their press.”

In fact, by the end of the first 
half, the Raiders had stopped 
pressing the Indians, which is 
very uncommon for a Two Rivers 
squad.

Pomeday, Rockets Run Past Indians
Hy Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM - It didn’t mat­
ter who, or how hard they tried, 
the Kewaskum boys basketball 
team and coach Jim Westphal 
couldn’t find a way to stop Cedar 
Grove's Nate Pomeday here, last 
Friday night.

Pomeday lit up the nets for 35 
points, as he led the Rockets to 
a 90 77 win over the Indians, sen­
ding Kewaskum to its fifth

KHS Skiers Second
Hy Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM Despite an im­
pressive performance by the West 
Bend skiers, the Kewaskum boys 
ski team recently took second in 
a meet held at Sunburst here.

Kewaskum’s John Gildersleeve 
finished third individually in the 
meet, whipping through the 
course in 44.55 seconds. Bill 
Rochon was the lone other Indian 
to break into the top ten. as he 
wound up tenth with a time of 
46.35.

The Indian boys were second as 
a team with a time of 184.97, 
well behind West Bend’s mark of 
176.48. West Bend's Brad Cad- 
dock won the race with a time of 
42.52.

The Kewaskum girls didn't 
field a full team, but a pair of 
KHS skiers did finish the race. 
Meredith Frac posted a time of 
52.91, while Erin Fronek finish­
ed in 53.27.

ANNUAL MEETING OF HON-E-KOR 
TUESDAY NITE MEN’S LEAGUE

The annual meeting of the 
Tuesday Nite Men's Golt League 
will be held on Saturday, 
February 20th at 10a.m. at Hon- 
E-Kor Country Club in Kewas­
kum.

You are asked to bring along 
your roster card and any sugges­
tions you might have to the 
meeting.

If you cannot attend please call 
Hon-E-Kor at 626-2520.

But the powerful Raiders mat­
ched their first-half point total 
midway through the third period, 
as they began their comeback bid. 
Crucial in the Raider rally were 
a pair of back-to-back three- 
pointers by Chad Swoboda.

“That really pumped them 
up,” Westphal said of the two 
long range shots. “They were 
just kind of chipping away at it, 
and then that really got ’em go­
ing.”

The Indians held on for a 
while, staying in front until the 
three-minute mark, when Greg 
Gordon’s pair of free throws gave 
Two Rivers a 48-47 lead.

Kewaskum came right back 
with Adam Laatsch slashing 
through the middle for an ap­
parent basket. But the ball went 
in-and-out, and after Ryan 
Remiker made two free throws on 
the next trip down court, the 
closest the Indians would get was 
three points.

“It rattled around and came 
back out,” Westphal said of 
Laatsch’s shot, which would have 
put Kewaskum back in the lead. 
“We still had a couple of chances

straight defeat.
Pomeday hit on 13 of his 20 

shots from the field, including a 
trifecta of three pointers, as 
Cedar Grove hit for 20 points in 
three of the four quarters, after 
opening the contest with a 
19-point first period.

“He did it all over the court.” 
Westphal said of the sophomore 
guard Pomeday. “Offensively 
and defensively, he’s just a very 
fine basketball player.”

Perhaps the turning point of the 
game occurred in the second 
period, when the Indians were 
whistled for a blocking foul that 
could have gone either way. 
Kewaskum was nailed with a 
technical foul on the play as well, 
and what was a four-point lead 
for Cedar Grove turned into a 
ten-point cushion at the half, 
4131.

“That was a six-point swing 
right there,” Westphal said, 
noting, “We had to play catch-up 
the rest of the way.”

And that wasn't easy with 
Pomeday sizzling the nets. Every 
time the Indians would get within 
possible striking distance. Pome­
day would answer the call.

“We made a couple of runs at 
them.” the KHS coach said, “But 
then he'd just take over. We 
could never get it under 10 
points.”

While Pomeday was having a 
game to remember on both sides

Rockets
CEDAR GROVE 33, KEWASKUM 30

103 - Troy Maertz was pinned 
by Metlic. 1:23.

112 - Jake Gundrum lost to 
Schmiberg, 9-12

119 - Jake Thull was pinned by 
Teunissen. 5:04.

125 - Mark Dziedzic beat 
Metlic. 5-3.

130 - Tyler Dieringer beat 
Hoopman. 9-8.

135 - Corey Rammer won by 
forfeit.

140 - Brad Jackson lost by

down the stretch.”
The Indians’ Jim Marx hit a 

pair of long three-pointers late, 
but Remiker added two more free 
throws with under : IO to play to 
seal the win for Two Rivers.

Marx finished with 18 points to 
lead all scorers, while Travis 
Jacak hit for 12 points and pull­
ed down a season-high 16 re­
bounds. Senior guard Tony 
Knoeck also played well, scoring 
nine points and dishing out a 
number of assists.

“Tony had a very gixxl night,” 
said Westphal, who also lauded 
Keith Herman’s effort. “We 
played quite well. Travis had a 
real good night’s work. They just 
did a better job in the clutch.”

Remiker and Jason Herrmann 
led the Raiders with 16 apiece.

The win enabled Two Rivers to 
stay unbeaten in the Eastern 
Wisconsin Conference at 6-0, 
while the Indians dropped their 
third straight EW contest to fall 
to 3-3, and 3-7 overall.
TWO RIVERS (5-10-22-23) 
Remiker 16, Herrmann 16, 
Shimulonus 3, Gordon 8, Swoboda 
8, Jazdewski 9. Free throws - 17 of 
25. Fouls - 16.

of the ball, the Indians could do 
little right offensively or 
defensively.

“We weren't very effective on 
defense. Our press wasn't effec­
tive at all.” Westphal said. Of­
fensively, while the team scored 
its highest output of the year, 
“We were very careless with the 
ball. Our press break just totally 
broke down.”

The Indians finished with 30 
turnovers.

“It was a shootout,” Westphal 
concluded. “They picked us apart 
pretty bad. We'd help out on 
Pomeday, and he'd find the open 
man. He's probably the best 
player that I've seen so far this 
year.”

The Indians' Jim Marx did his 
best to keep the hosts close. Marx 
scored 22 points to lead the In­
dians. who also got 12 from 
Travis Jacak and 10 from Erik 
Ankerson.

“He hadn’t scored much,” 
Westphal said of Ankerson. “But 
he's very capable. He just doesn't 
look to score much. I'm hoping 
that he'll continue to play well.”

CEDAR GROVE (19-22-25-21) - 
Lukens 3, Pomeday 35, Sohre 19, 
Eernissee 11, Klug 10. Risseevion 3. 
Navis 8. Meyer 1. Free Throws - 22 
of 34, Fouls - 23.

KEWASKUM (12-19-18-28) - 
Laatsch 7. Marx 22. Herman 6. Jacak 
12, Rix 3. Ankerson 10. Knoeck 1, 
Wichtowski 7. Zautner 9. Free 
throws - 17 of 26. Fouls - 26.

technical fall to Ramirez. 0-15.
145 - Rich Farchione lost to 

Watry, 1-.10.
152 - Josh Kurtz won by 

forfeit.

160 - Chad Muckerheide won 
by forfeit.

171 - Mark Morell lost in over­
time to Anzia. 4-6.

189 - Todd Muckerheide pinn­
ed DeRouter, 1:32.

HWT - Tim Gundrum was 
pinned by Martinez. 1:22.

KEWASKUM (12-13-13-17) Marx 
18. Laatsch 5, Knoeck 9, Zautner 4. 
Jacak 12, Herman 7. Free throws - 
9 of 13, Fouls - 21.

Indians End Skid With 
Win Over Warhawks, 62-54

Hy Noel Stollenwerk
KEWASKUM - It’s been a 

streaky year thus far for the 
Kewaskum boys basketball team, 
and for the meantime, the Indians 
are hoping that it will continue 
that way.

That’s because the Indians 
snapped a five-game losing skid 
with an easy 62-54 win over 
former Scenic Moraine Con­
ference rival Germantown here, 
last Saturday night.

After opening the season with 
three straight losses, the Indians 
rebounded to win three of their 
next four before dropping the five 
in a row. KHS coach Jim 
Westphal hopes that the victory 
over the Warhawks will just be 
the start of a long win streak.

“I think we’re doing things bet­
ter,” Westphal said, noting that 
doesn't always produce wins, 
however. “It’s hard to figure.”

The Indians looked to be pull­
ing away from the Warhawks in 
the opening quarter, jumping out 
to a seven-point lead at one junc­
ture. But a rally, capped by Greg 
Kindberg’s buzzer beater, cut the 
Indian lead to just one, at 18-17.

The game remained close until 
a flurry by the Indians late in the 
first half opened things up. W ith 
Germantown up 25-24, the In­
dians came alive to build a 38-29 
cushion at halftime.

“That was very important.” 
Westphal said of the late first-half 
surge. “We were passing the ball 
extremely well against their 
press. It was a repeat of the night 
before (against Cedar Grove), ex­
cept we were on the other side of 
things (with 30 turnovers).”

Leading the Indian charge in 
the first half was Jim Marx, who 
scored 17 of his game-high 21 in 
the opening half. “He had a very 
good night,” according to 
Westphal. “He had the same kind 
of shots that he had been getting. 
They were just falling, in the first 
half especially.”

Some poor shooting by Ger­
mantown in the third quarter 
helped extend the Indian advan­
tage to as many as 20 points.

“I thought their press would

Mistrust a subordinate who never finds fault with 
his superior.

---------Landmark Printing Company---------- 
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Don 't know what to give for a bir­
thday or anniversary? How about a 
subscription to the Statesman. 
626-2626.

give us all kinds of trouble.” 
Westphal went on to say. “But it 
really turned out to be non­
existent.”

The Indians got a balanced at­
tack from a number of players. 
Marx led the team with 21 points, 
while Keith Herman added 12 
and Erik Ankerson chipped in 10. 
Guard Tony Knoeck also played 
well, according to Westphal.

“He played under control,” 
Westphal said. “Tony made 
some good passes. If your point 
guard is playing good like that, it 
makes all the difference. It was 
the best guard-play that we’ve 
had all year.”

Westphal noted that he is 
somewhat troubled by the slump 
that senior Adam Laatsch is in. 
With the exception of the game 
against Plymouth (when he 
scored 22 points), Laatsch has 
scored just 21 points in the five 
other games since the Christmas 
break.

“I'm a little concerned about 
him,” Westphal admitted. “He's 
getting the same shots, they’re 
just not falling. We’d like to get 
both him and Jim (Marx) going 
at the same time... a 1-2 punch. 
But he's (Laatsch) going to draw 
a lot of attention the rest of the 
way. especially because he had 
some good games the first time 
around (in the EW schedule).”

Kindberg and Nate Joy each 
finished with 12 points to pace 
Germantown.

The win improved the Indians’ 
mark to 4-9 overall. Kewaskum 
will get back into conference ac­
tion this week, with a game at 
New Holstein on Thursday.

The Indians will be at Chilton 
next Tuesday, before returning 
home to face Kiel next Friday 
night.

GERMANTOWN (17-12-7-18) - D. 
Johnson 4. J Johnson 2. Baumann 6. 
Reese 3. Kindberg 12. Joy 12. Kolb 
2, Hassenfelt 9. Ferguson 4. Free 
Throws - 6 of 13. Fouls - 13.

KEWASKUM - (18-20-14-10) - 
Laatsch 2. Herman 12. Marx 21, Rix 
2. Knoeck 5, Ankerson 10. Kurth 2. 
Jacak 4. Wichtowski 4. Free Throws 
- 6 of 8. Fouls - 16.

533-8025


