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CHRISTMAS PARADE
Begins at 5 p.m. Sunday

39 to be Confirmed at 
Holy Trinity on Sunday

• The annual Kewaskum 
Christmas Parade will be mar­
ching into town this Sunday, Dec. 
6 with the parade getting under­
way at 5 p.m. Please take note of 
the time change, which is dif­
ferent from last year.

Sponsored by the Kewaskum 
Area Chamber of Commerce, this 
year’s holiday parade promises to 
be bigger and better than 
previous years as more and more 
community-minded individuals 
have agreed to participate.

Another reason the parade has 
grown is due to the generosity of 
the area’s businesses and 
citizenry who have been donating 
money towards the parade 
through the purchase of lights for

the Holiday Magic Christmas Tree 
and Memorial Star. The tree and 
star will remain lit throughout the 
holiday season and lights may be 
purchased accordingly. If you 
haven’t as yet secured a light, 
perhaps you would care to think 
about one after the parade, 
however, our goal is to have the 
entire tree lit for everyone to ad­
mire the evening of the parade.

The panel of judges will have 
the difficult task of choosing four

Pictured above is Santa's 
favorite elf, Louise Martin, who 
is all set for this year's annual 
Christmas Parade being held 
this Sunday at 5 p.m.

winners out of the many entries 
that have already signed up for 
the Christmas Parade. This year 
the prizes have been increased 
to: First Prize - $100; Second - 
$75 and $50 each for third and 
fourth places.

There is still time to whip up a 
spectacular float or unit. You’d be 
surprised at what you can ac­
complish with a few decorations 
and a little creativity. To reserve 
a space call Jane Korth at 
626-2650 (work) or 626-4172 
(home), Adeline Halfmann at 
626-2121 (work), Tim Miller at 
626-2171 (work) or Lana Kuehl 
626-2626 (work) or 626-4518 
(home).

Even if you decjde on Sunday 
morning to put a red bow tie on 
Rover and are worried you won’t 
be able to enter the parade, put 
your mind at ease. You may enter 
without reserving space 
However, be sure to have your 
entry at the firehouse by 4 p m 
Lineup will be arranged on a first- 
come, first-in-the-parade basis

And all you people who are 
waiting in anticipation tor the 
parade to begin, why not show 
your appreciation to the 
businesses who have, so 
generously contributed to the 
parade's success, by coming in­
to town a little early and stopping 
in a few of the business places 
and pick up a few items on your

(Continued on Page 5)

On Sunday afternoon at 2:00 
o’clock. Dec. 6. confirmation will 
be administered at Holy Trinity 
Church. His Excellency, the most 
Reverent Rembert G Weakland 
will celebrate the Sacrament 
within the Eucharistic Liturgy, for 
the candidates of Holy Trinity, St 
Bridget, St. Michael, St John of 
God and St. Matthias

Following Confirmation, 
representatives of the Christian 
Mothers of the churches are 
hosting a reception in the church 
basement

A list of the confirmands 
follows:

ST. MATTHIAS — Nicole 
Hetzel, Robert Loot, Stacey 
Mayer, Curtis Ringwell.

ST. JOHN OF GOD — Jason

Public Informational Meeting Dec. 15 
On Reconstruction of Fond du Lac Ave.

A Public Informational Meeting 
will be held on Tuesday. Dec 15, 
to present the proposed roadway 
design for the scheduled 1995 
reconstruction of Fond du Lac 
Avenue in the Village of 
Kewaskum.

An open house meeting will be 
held from 4 to 7 p m. at the Village 
of Kewaskum Municipal Building, 
located at 204 First Street

Representatives from the 
Wisconsin Department of 
Transportation and Mid-State 
Associates, the engineering firm

Steier.
ST MICHAEL — Scott Donath. 

Derek Follman. Aaron Rettler, 
Christa Schmidt, Jeff Steinert. 
Jennifer Thull, Julie Wagner. 
Bradley Weinreich. Shelly Wenn­
inger. Robyn Winninghoff, 
Anastasia Thull

HOLY TRINITY and ST 
BRIDGET — ThomaS Bauer. 
Bryan Beske, April Bruckert, 
Brian Bruendl, Tanya Eckes. 
Bryan Ellefson, Carrie Fellenz, 
Christopher Geidel. Chad Harlow, 
Thomas Hilt, James Jaklich, An 
thony Knoeck, Nancy Koch. 
Thomas Kuehn, Adam Laatsch. 
James Marx, Heather Mitchell, 
Jennifer Pesch, Kim Sabish, Kurt 
Thorn, Joy Wilson, Ronald Wolf. 
Christine Yogerst

that is designing the project, will 
be available to explain exhibits 
and answer questions regarding 
the combination resurfacing and 
reconstruction project

All affected property owners 
and interested citizens are en­
couraged to attend Written and 
oral comments will be 
documented and considered in 
the design process

This will be the second of two 
informational meetings for the 
project

Tragic Accident Claims Life of Kewaskum Woman
Home Decorating Contest to
Be Judged Monday, Dec. 14

The Kewaskum Area Chamber 
of Commerce is again sponsoring 
a Christmas outdoor decorating 
contest in the Village. With the 
semi-mild weather last weekend, 
the decorations have been going 
up feverishly and it is plain to see 
the judges will not have an easy 
time of making a decision this 
year.

The judges, who are non­
residents, will be making their ap­
pointed rounds on Monday even­
ing, December 14. They have no 
idea who lives where in town, so 
this guarantees fair play. 
However, if you know who the 
judges are, you probably could 
promise them a huge gift and 
then put your name in giant letters 
on your front lawn. But I know 
who the judges are and they won't 
be easily bought. So you'll just 
have to decorate your little hearts 
out and hope they find your home 
the most creatively decorated.

Cash prizes will be awarded to 
the top four residents the judges 
find most attractive. The judging 
will be based on originality, 
creativity and overall general ap­
pearance, not to mention the pro­
motion of holiday spirit.

Winners will be notified by the 
Chamber of Commerce and 
weather permitting, photos will 
appear in an upcoming issue of 
the Statesman.

Untangle your massive 
amounts of holiday lights, figure 
out which ones are burned out 
and then use your imagination! 
And remember... this is suppos­
ed to be fun (?). I have already 
decided to do my decorating for 
1993 at the end of August. This 
winter weather is just too hard on 
the delicate hands! Join me., we 
could probably be the only village 
in the entire country that is 
decorated for Christmas by Labor 
Day!

by Sharon Callaway Roznik
Diane Becht, 33. of Kewaskum 

was killed Wednesday, Nov 26. 
in a two-car head on collision in 
the town of Kewaskum

The accident occurred at ap­
proximately 6:40 p.m. on state 
Hwy. 28, 2/10 of a mile west of 
Forest View Rd Freezing rain 
mixed with snow accounted for 
slippery road conditions at the 
time.

According to a Washington 
County Sheriff’s Dept report, a 
pick-up truck driven by Timothy 
Buss, 16, of Kewaskum, was 
traveling eastbound at about 55 to 
60 miles per hour, when the truck 
began to lose traction and spin. 
A second vehicle was heading 
west on Hwy. 28, carrying five 
passengers and driver Paul 
Becht, 33, of Kewaskum. The 
operator of the first vehicle ap­
parently crossed the center line 
and struck the Becht car head on

The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
arrived at the scene, but was 
short manpowered due to a se­
cond accident in the town of

Wayne Campbellsport and West 
Bend Fire Departments respond­
ed to the call for help, and aided 
in transporting the injured to St 
Joseph's Community Hospital, 
West Bend The Jaws of Life were 
used to remove the accident vic­
tims from the vehicle

Transported to the hospital 
were Diane Becht, who later died 
from extensive injuries, her hus­
band Paul Becht, Paul’s brother, 
Scott Becht, 30, of Milwaukee, 
sons Paul Becht Jr., 9, and Bryan 
Becht, 7, both of Kewaskum, 
Diane's father Louis Pups, 61, of 
Milwaukee and Timothy Buss.

Buss was taken from St 
Joseph’s to Children’s Hospital in 
Milwaukee where he underwent 
surgery for head injuries

Bryan Becht was also transfer­
red to Children’s Hospital, Louis 
Pups was taken to Milwaukee 
County Hospital, and Scott was 
transferred to Froedert Hospital in 
Milwaukee Paul and Paul Jr 
have ben released from the 
hospital, and as of this printing, no 
more information is available as

to the condition of the three re­
maining hospitalized

Services took place for Diane 
Wednesday at 11 a m at St 
Lucas Lutheran Church, 
Kewaskum, with Pastor Henning 
officiating A Memorial Service 
was held at 4 p.m. at Wisconsin 
Memorial Park in Milwaukee

The accident remains under in­
vestigation at this time.

The weather conditions were 
reported to have caused 
numerous accidents throughout 
the county Just seven minutes 
after the Hwy 28 accident call 
came in to the Kewaskum Rescue 
Squad, they received a second 
call to respond to an accident on 
Hwy WW, 1V? south of Hwy W in 
the town of Wayne.

Reports indicate the accident 
involved a vehicle containing two 
males, and an LP truck colliding 
The driver of the truck was unin­
jured, but the occupants of the car 
were transported to St Joseph's 
Hospital, and treated for minor 
injuries.
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Mayville Youth Dies 
In Hunting Accident

A Mayville youth, 14, lost his life 
Friday in a tragic hunting accident 
near Imogene Lake in Vilas 
County.

Michael Franke, son of Ken­
neth and Kathleen Franke, 
Horicon, died instantly when he 
accidentally slipped and his gun 
discharged.

Ken was hunting with his son, 
and discovered him just seconds 
after the shooting. He desperate­
ly attempted to reach help, runn­
ing several miles to their vehicle, 
and finally driving to a relative's 
home several miles away, where 
he collapsed in their driveway. 
The boy’s father was taken to

Phelps Hospital and treated for 
stress and exhaustion.

Michael was a freshman at 
Mayville High School, and had 
earned a hunter safety certificate 
at age 12. He enjoyed hunting, 
fishing, football, baseball and 
hoped to someday work for the 
Dept, of Natural Resources.

The boy’s death occurred on 
the same day Ken Franke’s 
younger sister, Diane was 
tragically killed in a car accident 
26 years ago. Michael leaves 
behind two siblings, Kevin 15, and 
Amy 9, besides his parents and 
many other relatives and friends.

What’s New at the 
Kewaskum Public Library

Kids- There’s still time to sign 
up for the Holiday storytimes for 
four and five year old children. We 
will meet twice, and share stories, 
fingerplays, holiday songs and 
crafts and more. Choose 
Wednesdays, Dec. 9 and 16 at 1 
p.m., OR Fridays, Dec. 11 and 18 
at 10 a.m. Please register no later 
than Monday, Dec. 7. We’ll be 
looking for you!

New books include. Mixed Bless­
ings by Danielle Steel, Driving 
Force by Dick Francis, A Thief of 
Always by Clive Barker, Leaving 
Cold Sassy by Olive Ann Burns, 
Real Men Don't Bond by Bruce 
Feirstein, and Defend and Betray by 
Anne Perry.

Looking for a little romance? 
Come in and look over our paper- i 
back rack, as it is stuffed full of 
new books. Most of these are 
paperbacks which have been 
donated to the library. Are you 
“over-stocked” with paperbacks 
at your house? We accept newer 
books in good condition - think of 
us as you clean before the 
holidays!

Be sure to take time off from all 
the hustle and bustle of shopping 
and holiday preparations for a lit­
tle relaxation. Visit us a the library 
and check out some good books!

THANK YOU
Many thanks to all for respon­

ding to our shed fire. Special 
thanks to Al Weiss, who alerted 
us. Also to the Kohlsville, 
Kewaskum, Allenton, and Camp­
bellsport Fire Departments. The 
men did an excellent job. They 
will never be forgotten.

Thanks again.
Leo & Rose Marie Beck 

and Family

ABC CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners at skat played by 

the ABC Senior Citizens at 
Beechwood Hall on Tuesday, 
Nov. 24, were: Wilmer Firme, 
17-1—16 net; Harold Eggert, 
17-2—15 net; Elmer Stange, 
Heart Solos vs. Five & Four.

/ Beechwood
V Cheese

WISCONSIN TRAVEL FACTS
Wisconsin snowmobile 

trails total 15,210 miles of 
signed and groomed snow 
highways.

ALUMINUM 
CANS

On the first and 
third Saturdays 
10 a.m. to 2 p.m.

SENTRY PARKING LOT 
Kewaskum Mali

Also buying copper, brass, 
batteries and other aluminum

2nd and 4th Tuesday
10 a.m. to 1 p.m: 

STRAUB’S in Campbellsport

MARCOE’S RECYCLING

Kewaskum High School Swing Choir - First row: Chad Harlow, Nichol Loomans, Jenny Stelter, Kim Sabish, 
AH Bruendl, Melissa Lloyd, Mr. Bertelsen. . _ .
Second row: Andrea Pascavis, Cory Hammer, Krysten Ammel, Paul Heis, Becky Yogerst, Mike Marx, Chris 
Schmidt.
Third row: Karl Ankerson, Melissa Piaro, Kevin Klahn, Jake Thull, Hhonda Klesmith, Sara Steinert. 
Fourth row: David Gosa, Peter Heis, Julie Mertz, Tim Strigenz, Hyan Herman, Greta Kuphal.
Not pictured - Kori Chapman, Keith Herman, and Aaron Hettier.

The Kewaskum High School 
Swing choir and the Moraine 
Chorus will perform at the KEYS 
Christmas Concert on Monday, 
Dec. 7th at 7:30 p.m. at

Kewaskum High School.
All proceeds benefit the KEYS 

scholarship fund. Advanced 
tickets are available at Millers Fur-

niture and the Kewaskum High 
School office.

Make plans to attend and enjoy 
these fine performances.

Recycle today for 
tomorrow

IL

Cheese of 
The Month

Borden’s
SWISS CHEESE

Cut, wrapped piece

Deppler
BABY SWISS

Cut, wrapped piece

$2.83 ib
(Reg. $3.07 Ib.)

$2.78 ib
(Reg. $3.02 Ib.)

Cheddar Curd Day
Saturday, Dec. 5

Fresh, warm cheddar curd
READY FOR SALE AT 12 NOON

$2.19 m.
WHILE SUPPLY LASTS

10 to 5 Daily • 9 to 5 Saturday - Closed Sunday

BEECHWOOD 
CHEESE FACTORY

N1598W Hwy. A - Route 1 - Adell, WI 53001
Take Hwy. S to Beechwood, then North 2 blocks on Hwy. A

PHONE 994-9306

J Foop 
lb*.le| ।

Lions usually walk about five miles a day, but 
may walk as many as 15 miles in search of food.

1992 

SPECIAL 
EXPRESS 

CHEESE GIFT BOX

Sent anywhere in CONTINENTAL U.S.

/ Beechwood 
k Cheese

Ship To:
Name: _ _ _ _
Street Address:

City:
State: Zip:

$14.32
1 Block Marble (Colby & Jack Mixed)

1 Stick Medium Cheddar
1 Stick Mild Cheddar

j From:
I Name: _ 
[ Address: 

| City: _ 
| State: 
! Phone 

Zip:

1 Stick Monterey Jack
Block • RANDOM WEIGHT

DA Ib.-Size Pack
Stick - RANDOM WEIGHT

% Ib.-Size Pack
Includes: Gift box, card, 

handling & shipping 
Order by Dec. 15 for 
Christmas Arrival

I THANK YOU! Offer good thru Dec. 31, 1992
•»— — — — .—__ — —._j
Send Check or Money Order to: Carry-out - $9.96

Beechwood Cheese Inc
N1598W Hwy A 
Adell,WI 53001 

414-994-9306



Finishing Touches Added to 
Fund-Raising Christmas Tree

Lee Kempf, President of the Kewaskum Area Chamber of Com­
merce and head Christmas tree repairman, puts the finishing

Left to right, Lanaya Martin (daughter of Larry and Louise), 
assists Lee Kempf and Bob Beisbier brace the Christmas Tree

Christmas Trees tor Sale
With the sounds and sights of 

Christmas quickly becoming a 
part of each and every day. sure­
ly your thoughts about that perfect 
tree in your living room must be 
close to becoming a reality. Well, 
think no longer, that picture 
perfect Christmas tree is waiting 
for you, and the musicians of 
Kewaskum High School are there 
waiting to serve you.

The trees. Scotch and White 
pine, and Frazier fir are available 
at the Sentry parking lot just south 
of Kewaskum on Hwy 45 The 
cost of the Scotch and White 
pines are $14 50 and $18 00. 
depending on the size, while the 
Frazier firs cost $38.00

Anyone purchasing a tree will 
be eligible for a free drawing tor 
either a live White Spruce or a live 
Blue Spruce for planting in the 
spring. So come and help the 
musicians and get your Christmas 
tree now Senior citizens, if you 
need help setting your tree up just 
let us know when you purchase 
your tree and the students will be 
happy to help.

Hours for the tree sales are as 
follows Monday through Friday, 
3:30 to 6 30 p m., Saturday and 
Sunday, 10:00 a m to 5:00 p m

touches on a brace being fitted for the giant wooden Christmas 
tree that stands in front of Valley Bank.

Lee and Bob prepare to hoist up the tree while Kewaskum's brightest star, Louise 
Martin, holds on to Kewaskum’s second brightest star with an assist from daughter 
Lanaya.

OVER’
Rated R

West Bend Cinema
Downtown West Bend

McCauley Culkin in

HOME ALONE 2
\ Baled PC twniw al « U » » OS

Saturday A Sunday Matinees at 1 15 A 4 nc

Dram Stoker 's

DRACULA
Saturday & Sunday Matinees at 1 30 & 4 15

Evenings at 6 55 & 9 15

(Kevin Costner and
\ ^ Whitney Houston in

ovwr THE BODY GUARD
Rated R

Saturday & Sunday Matinees at 1 45 & 4 30
Evenings at 7 & 9 25

Coming Dec. II...

“THE MUPPET S CHRISTMAS CAROL”
SORRY... NO BARGAIN PRICES FOR THESE MOVIES 

ALL PASS LISTS SUSPENDED

334-5466

EVERY 3 MINUTES A 
WOMAN IS DIAGNOSED 
WITH BREAST CANCER.

EVERY 12 MINUTES A . 
WOMAN DIES FROM
BREAST CANCER.

Get the facts.
It could save your life. 

Call (800)221-2141, weekdays, 
9 a.m.-5 p.m., central time zone 

@)V~PE

National Breast Cancer Hotline

KEWASKUM 
FROZEN FOODS

118 Forest Ave., Kewaskum 
Phone 626-2181 or 1-800-660-2710 

Robert Beisbier

JERRY’S

AND...

TV 
and 

ANTENNA 
SERVICE
NOW FEATURING

CHRISTMAS GIFT 
, VARIETY BOXES 

Fgift certificates 
AVAILABLE

Cheese & Sausage Plates 
Available by Request

Open Monday - Thursday 8 a.m. to 5:30 p.m.
Friday 8 a.m. to 7 p.m., Saturday 8 a.m. to 4 p.m.

non
Panasonic.

QUANTUM 
UHF/VHF/FM 
ANTENNAS

★ TVs ★VCRs ★Boom Boxes
★ Tape Recorders ★Camcorders 
★ Radios ★Cordless Phones

136 E. Main St., 
Campbellsport

PHONE 533-4466

• WINTER HOURS •

Tues. - Frt. 9 a.m. to 5:30 p m
Saturday 8 a m to 12 noon 

CLOSED MONDAYS
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Scout/Youth Group 
To Meet at Riveredge

Saturday, December 12, is a 
day set aside for youth groups 
such as scouts and 4-H to par­
ticipate in a program with a 
Riveredge Nature Center 
naturalist.

There are several Saturdays 
that are set aside for such ac­
tivities throughout the Fall, Winter 
and Spring. All groups must 
register for a Saturday prior to 
coming

For more information, call 
Riveredge at 375-2715 (Metro) or 
675-6888 (local) to register.

Riveredge Nature Center is a 
non-profit, 350 acre natural sanc­
tuary and educational organiza­
tion. providing environmental pro­
grams for all ages, and is located 
in Ozaukee County on Highway 
Y, one mile north of Newburg, 
between Saukville and West 
Bend.

t 4 subscription to the Kewaskum 
Statesman - a gift that keeps on 
giving all year long! Phone 
626-2626.

A. Eugene Gruber
Alice (iruber Photo

4-H KETTLE
MORAINE KIDS

The November meeting was 
called to order by Erin Stoffel, 
Becky Guelig led the Pledge of 
Allegiance. Jackie Friedemann 
led the 4-H pledge.

Anne Martz volunteered to be 
the chairman of the Christmas 
Party, which will be held at our 
December meeting. We will be 
feeding the elderly again and Erin 
Stoffel volunteered to chair this 
event.

Our next meeting will be held 
Dec. 10 at the Labor Center, 
Kewaskum. Everyone is welcome 
to attend the meeting. After the 
meeting there will be a Christmas 
party. Hope to see you there!

Club Reporter 
Christina Lettow

Coconut will come 
out of its shell more 
easily if it's first frozen 
for about an hour.

to . *3 ^ fe ^ 3?; ^ ^ '2* ^ M: £ ^

With Our
Servicemen

BMMSMRM^SMRS
WORLD WAR II

(Reprinted from Kewaskum Statesman)

CPL. GRUBER, SURVIVOR OF 
BLOODY BAHLE OF IWO JIMA HOME 
FROM JAPAN; DISCHARGED

CpI. Andrew E. Gruber, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. John Gruber, of this 
village, arrived home Thursday, 
Aug. 15, after receiving his 
honorable discharge from the 
U.S. Marine Corps the same day 
at Great Lakes, III. He arrived in 
the states at Norfolk, Va. on Aug. 
8, from Sasebo, Japan, after ser­
ving overseas 24 months. CpI. 
Gruber served in the armed 
forces 29 months, entering the 
service on March 21, 1944. He 
received his training at Camp 
Pendelton, Calif, and was sent to 
the South Pacific on Aug. 12, 
1944, serving with the 5th and 
2nd Marine Divisions. He took 
part in the invasion and bloody 
battle against the Japs on Iwo 
Jima and was one of the few sur­
vivors of this costly, historic fight. 
Andrew also served overseas in 
Hawaii and later at Sasebo and 
Nagasaki, Japan. He served with 
a military police company, head­
quarters company and motor 
transport outfit in the marines. 
Gruber wears the Asiatic-Pacific 
theater ribbon with one battle star, 
a presidential unit citation with 
one star and the victory medal.

St. Mary’s Springs National 
Honor Society Induction

Twenty five new members were 
inducted into the National Honor 
Society in St. Mary’s Springs Hor­
nung Chapel on October 29, at 
7:30 p.m. Barbara Haase, 
F.A.C.E.S. Administrator, was the 
keynote speaker. Following 
ceremonies was a reception in the 
formal Parlor.

The new members are: 
SENIORS - Alan Heitpas, Erin 
King, Tammy Krause, Bill 
Laudolff, Lori Petrie, and John 
Zehren. JUNIORS - Geoff Bares, 
Erich Birschbach, Shelby Bowser, 
Kari Feucht, Hope Feyen, Andrew 
Flanigan, Caryn Gonon, Kate Grif-r 
fen, Jodi Hernandez, Greg Heit-" 
pas, Jacob Massick, Beth 
Mickiewicz, Kim Mlinaz, Sarah 
Mueller, Margaret Pesch, Laura 
Rinzel, Laurie Strobel, Sara 
Trepanier, and Sean Twohig.

YES! Please add our name to the 
list of Christmas Parade Supporters

GREEN LIGHT - $10 Donation

Family Name

RED LIGHT - $25 Donation (or more)

Name of Business

WHITE LIGHT * $10 Donation

In Memory of

Please mail to:
KEWASKUM AREA CHAMBER OF COMMERCE 

P.O. Box 300, Kewaskum, Wl 53040

One
■^ for the . 

Road

It's not a drink, 
it's your 

Designated 
Driver.

Thinking about going out tonight? Then 
set up your "one for the road” now 
They II be the one to drive everybody 
home the Designated Driver 
Because last year in Wisconsin, over 
300 people were killed by drunk drivers. 
Need another reason? Get busted for 
driving drunk and you II lose over 
$3,000 to fines, fees and raised 
insurance rates. Not to mention 
losing your driving privileges < 
for six months. So, next time 
someone asks you, "One for the 
road9*, tell em you ve already got 1 
one .. your Designated Driver.

Funded toy NHlSA 
Designated Drivers Save Lives

DRIVE Elffl

"A Visit From St. 
Nicholas" ("T'was the 
night before Christmas...”) 
was written by Clement 
Moore in 1822 as a Christ­
mas gift to his children.
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KFD Fire and 
Rescue Squad Calls

Sunday, Nov. 22, 1:39 p.m. - 
The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
was dispatched to Maple Dale 
Manor in Kewaskum when a 
female resident was having pro­
blems with her breathing. She 
was transported to St. Joseph’s 
Hospital in West Bend.

Monday, Nov. 23, 9:03 a m. - 
The Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
responded to a call to Hwy. V, 
Kewaskum when a female patient 
was found in bed pulseless and 
not breathing. CPR was started 
and she was transported to St. 
Joseph’s Hospital in West Bend.

Wednesday, Nov. 25, 4:48 a.m. 
- The Kewaskum Fire Department 
was called to 9443 Lake Bernice 
Dr., Wayne, on a mutual aide fire 
call with the Kohlsville Fire 
Department. Two tankers and the 
pumper assisted with fighting a 
shed fire. The shed was lost.

Wednesday, Nov. 25, 6:44 p.m. 
- The Rescue Squad and Jaws of 
Life were called to Hwy. 28, just 
west of St. Michaels following a 
head-on collision between two 
vehicles. The male driver of the 
pickup, alone in his vehicle, and 
six people in the other vehicle 
were transported to St. Joseph’s 
Hospital. The female passenger 
in the automobile later passed 
away at the hospital. Three other 
patients were transferred to 
Milwaukee area hospitals. Camp­
bellsport and West Bend Rescue 
Squads assisted with the 
transportation of the victims. 
(Kewaskum’s other rescue squad 
unit was on an almost 
simultaneous call listed below).

Wednesday, Nov. 25, 6:53 p.m. 
- Kewaskum’s Second Rescue 
Unit was dispatched, along with 
the Kohslville First Responders to 
another accident, only seven 
minutes after the first call, to Hwy. 
WW, 11/2 miles south of Wayne. 
This mishap involved a car and a 
LP tanker. Two male patients in 
the vehicle were transported to St. 
Joseph’s Hospital in West Bend. 
The driver of the LP truck was not 
injured.

Wednesday, Nov. 25, 8:43 p.m. 
- The second Rescue Squad unit 
had just returned back to the sta­
tion, when they, along with the 
Kohlsville First Responders, were 
summoned to Hwy. H, Wayne, 
when a male patient was suffer-

ing from chest pain and shortness 
of breath. He was transported to 
St. Agnes Hospital in Fond du Lac 
due to the fact St. Joseph’s 
Hospital in West Bend, could not 
at the time, handle anymore in­
coming patients.

Wednesday, Nov. 25, 11:38 
p.m. - The Rescue Squad was 
dispatched to Main Street in 
Kewaskum where a female pa­
tient was suffering from chest 
pain which traveled down the left 
arm. She was transported to St. 
Joseph's Hospital in West Bend.

Friday, Nov. 27, 4:26 p.m. - The 
Kewaskum Rescue Squad 
answered a call to Hwy. H, Farm­
ington, when a male patient had 
a car battery blow up in his face, 
with acid going into his eyes. He 
was transported to St. Joseph’s 
Hospital in West Bend.

Saturday, Nov. 28. 12:44 p.m. 
- The Kewaskum Rescue Squad, 
along with the Kohlsville First

Responders, were called to Island 
Drive, Wayne, when a female pa­
tient fell on the ice and frac- 
tured/dislocated her right elbow. 
She was transported to St. 
Joseph’s Hospital in West Bend.

Sunday. Nov. 29, 1:35 a m. - 
The Kewaskum Fire Department 
was called to Regal Ware in 
Kewaskum when smoke was 
found in a building by the night 
watchman. The fire department 
personnel found a belt smoking 
on a vacuum-compressuie. The 
machine was turned off and the 
firemen returned to the station.

THIS YEAR, THOUSANDS 
OF GOOD LITTLE 

BOYS AND GIRLS WILL GET 
NOTHING FOR CHRISTMAS

To most children Christmas means 
making up to toys and presents But to 
many needy and homeless children 
Christmas means waking up cold and 
hungry The Salvation Army feeds 
clothes shelters and provides toys tot 
thousands of needy children Call us if 
you would like to make a child s 
Christmas wish come hue

SHARING IS CARING
F\-W further information write to 

The Sanation Arm^ "99 &isX''"feic Ase \ e
Verona Ne* Jersey 0'044

FARADS
(Continued from Page 1)

Christmas list. Support the 
businesses, for without them, the 
Christmas Parade would only be 
a memory of last year’s event

So put your holiday spirit in 
high gear, bundle up the kids and 
get ready to greet Santa in a big 
way... this Sunday... 5 p.m. in 
Kewaskum. Be there or you’ll be 
‘ bah, humbugging” all the rest of 
the year!

The tidal wave caused by the erup­
tion of a volcano on the island of 
Krakatau in 188 J reached as far as 
England.

FIREMEN TO MEET
The regular monthly meeting of 

the Kewaskum Fire Department 
will be held at the fire station on 
Thursday, Dec. 3, at 7:30 p.m.

KHS ACTIVITIES 
CORNER

Week of December 4 to 
December 11, 1992

December 4 - Boys Basketball at
Slinger

December 5 - Breakfast with
Santa at 9 a.m.
- Chess Tournament Here at 8 
am.

December 7 - Student Council 
Blood Drive 8 a m. to 12:30 
p.m.

December 8 - Wrestling at Slinger 
- Boys Basketball - Random 
Lake Here

December 10 - Girls Basketball at 
New Holstein

December 11 - Boys Basketball - 
New Holstein Here

PLEASE CONTACT KHS AT 
626-2166 FOR ANY

FURTHER INFORMATION

SANTA’S COMING!
Come share your wish list with Santa Claus & 

Homer the Lion from December 7 to December 11 
at five of our locations on the following days!

Monday, Dec. 7 GERMANTOWN OFFICE 2:30-4:30 PM 
Tuesday, Dec. 8 KEWASKUM OFFICE 2:30-4:30 PM 
Wednesday, Dec. 9 SLINGER OFFICE 2:30-4:30 PM 
Thursday, Dec. 10 JACKSON OFFICE 2:30-4:30 PM 

Friday, Dec. 11 DOWNTOWN WEST BEND OFFICE 3:00-6:00 PM

Get your FREE PHOTO with Santa and Homer and a 
holiday treat. Also, remember December’s Homer’s Saving 

Gift of the month is a Christmas Sticker Book when 
you make a deposit of a dollar or more!

FDIC
INSURED

West Bend Savings Bank, |
West Bend • Germantown • Jackson • Slinger • Kewaskum 

331-5563 255-2900 67 7-3621 611-527 7 626-21X6 RESOURCE
338-0811 GBOyP
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Horner - Podbielski

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Horner, of 
Kewaskum, are pleased to an­
nounce the engagement of their 
daughter, Colleen Marie, to Jeff 
D. Podbielski, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
John Podbielski, Sr., of 
Milwaukee.

Colleen is a 1986 graduate of 
Kewaskum High School and 
received her B.A. in 1990, from 
Marquette University She is cur­

Little House Lady Visits Holy Trinity

Laura Ingalls Wilder’s "Little House on the Prairie" books came 
alive as Lynn Urban, from Racine, dressed as the author in a floor­
length red calico dress and matching bonnet, described pioneer life 
in Wisconsin a century ago

She said she became interested in the LITTLE HOUSE BOOKS 
as she watched the t.v. series with her daughter and decided to 
research the author 's life. She traveled with her family to Pepin, Wis. 
where the author was born, then to Minnesota, Kansas, Iowa, and 
South Dakota ■ all the places where Laura Ingalls Wilder had lived. 
A filmstrip showed scenes from each place.

An hour before the presentation, Urban set up a huge display con­
sisting of artifacts, booklets, newsletters, maps, pictures, posters, 
newspaper articles, and scrapbooks - all of which she gathered in 
her research on the author's life.

The children viewed the display, chose a book from the RIF 
display, which they could take home and call their own, and enjoyed 
a snack and juice before returning to their regular classes. A special 
RIF table contained many books from the "Little House" series.

Photo by Ann Neumann

The safety pin was patented by William Hunt of New 
York City in 1849.

rently employed by Cyganiak 
Planning, Inc. in Brookfield.

Jeff graduated in 1986, from 
Thomas More High School and 
received his B.S. in Business Ad­
ministration from Marquette 
University in 1990. He is current­
ly employed by Value Merchants, 
Inc in Milwaukee.

An August 14, 1993, wedding is 
being planned.

Kanas Charged With 
4-Count Indictment

On Nov. 25, Washington Coun­
ty Sheriff Robert Schulteis, along 
with John E. Fryatt, United States 
Attorney for the Eastern District of 
Wisconsin, announced that a 
federal grand jury has returned a 
4-county indictment against 
Thomas J. Kanas, dob 3/1/55 of 
9301 North Pole Road, Theresa, 
Wisconsin.

The indictment charges Kanas 
with two narcotics of­
fenses involving marijuana, one 
count of money laundering, and 
one count of possessing a firearm 
after previously being convicted of 
a felony. The narcotics offenses 
each carry maximum penalties of 
up to ten (10) years in prison and 
a maximum fine of up to 
$1,000,000.

The money laundering charge 
carries a maximum penalty of up 
to twenty (20) years in prison and 
up to $500,000 in fines. The 
firearms offense carries a max­
imum penalty of up to ten (10) 
years in prison and a fine of up to 
$5,000. The ten (10) year 
penalties for the marijuana 
charges are based on the fact that 
Kanas has a prior conviction for 
a narcotics offense.

The matter was investigated by 
officers of the Dodge County 
Sheriff’s Department, the 
Washington County Sheriff’s 
Department and the Racine 
County Sheriff’s Department, 
working in conjunction with the 
Criminal Investigation Division of 
the United States Internal 
Revenue Service. The case has 
been assigned to Deputy United 
States Attorney R. Jeffrey Wagner 
for prosecution.

This matter remains under in­
vestigation by the Washington 
County Multi-Jurisdictional Drug 
Enforcement Unit which is sup­
ported in part by a grant which in­
cludes $77,000 in federal funding. 
This $77,000 represents approx­
imately 75 percent of the total 
grant award.

John Hazlewood Jr. 
Receives Scholarships

MINNEAPOLIS... John 
Hazlewood, Jr. of West Bend, son 
of John and Carol Hazlewood of 
rural West Bend, was among the 
students honored at Augsburg 
College’s Scholarship Recogni­
tion Dinner recently.

The dinner brought together 
students who have been award­
ed sponsored scholarships for the 
1992-93 academic year, their 
parents, scholarship donors, 
regents, faculty and staff.

Hazlewood, Jr., a graduate of 
Kewaskum High School, was 
recognized as the recipient of The 
Minnesota Mining and Manufac­
turing Company Liberal Arts 
Scholarship, The UPS. Founda­
tion Scholarship and The Perfor­
ming Arts/Drama Scholarship 
Renewal.

Augsburg College is a private 
liberal arts college of the 
Evangelical Lutheran Church in 
America, located in the heart of 
the Twin Cities. Augsburg’s 2,950 
students come from diverse 
religious, cultural and ethnic 
backgrounds. Founded in 1869, 
the College emphasizes intellec­
tual freedom in the search for 
knowledge; responsiveness to the 
needs of society and the world; 
and preparation for service and 
leadership in church and society.

Candles once cost so much that on­
ly wealthy people could afford to use 
them.

DMV Accepting Address Changes by Telephone
The state Department of 

Transportation has good news for 
people who have new addresses 
— it’s no longer necessary to 
stand in line at the motor vehicle 
customer service centers to get a 
duplicate driver's license.

Roger Cross, administrator of 
the Division of Motor Vehicles, 
said people with regular driver’s 
licenses can now use their touch­
tone telephone to report address 
changes on their driver's licenses 
or identification cards by calling 
(608) 266-2353. Holders of com­
mercial driver's licenses are still 
required to appear in person to 
apply for a duplicate license.

“We’re really trying to be less 
intrusive into people’s lives. 
We’re using new technology 
wherever possible as an alter­
native to requiring them to stand 
in line at our service centers,’’ 
Cross said.

The telephone service is 
available 24-hours per day. It 
also saves money for license 
holders. Until recently, people 
were required to apply for a 
duplicate driver’s license if they 
moved or their names changed.

Just 
in time for 

Christmas gifting
DECEMBER

SPECIAL

$1.00 
OFF 
0

SUBSCRIPTIONS
$16.00 in-state
(regularly $17.00)

(regularly $20.00)

OFFER GOOD ON NEW SUBSCRIPTIONS ONLY 
Now through December 25, 1992

DROP OFF AT OR MAIL TO: 

KEWASKUM 
STATESMAN
250 Main St., P.O. Box 98

Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
Phone 626-2626

The transaction used to cost peo­
ple $4 for a duplicate license, 
along with the cost and inconve­
nience of a trip to the driver licen­
sing agency to have a new photo 
license issued.

The telephone service, which is 
conducted by a telephone voice­
response system, was made 
possible by a law change adopted 
in the last session of the 
legislature dropping the require­
ment that a new license be 
obtained.

“When people update their 
records by telephone, it will only 
update the computer files. If peo­
ple want to have their correct ad­
dress on their plastic licenses, 
they will have to come in for a 
duplicate license,” Cross said.

Vehicle owners can also phone 
in their address changes by phon­
ing (608) 266-3666. “Eventually 
we will be able to offer a single 
telephone number for address 
changes on both driver and vehi­
cle records,” Cross said. “But at 
the moment, there is no interface 
between the two computer files, 
so we have to require separate 
calls.”
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Craft Fair Announces Awards and Quilt Winner
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, P: Over 1,200 area residents en­
joyed . “A Kettle Country 
Christmas”, the tenth annual art 
and craft fair sponsored by the 
GFWC Kewaskum Junior 
Woman’s Club on Saturday, Nov. 
21st at Kewaskum High School.

Over 50 exhibitors offered fine 
arts and original crafts of a wide 
variety including hand crafted 
wooden items, country accent 
pieces, ceramics, grapevine, 
pinecone and dried flower 
wreaths, stained glass mosaics, 
appliqued sweatshirts, Christmas 
items and much more.

Receiving the Best of Show 
Award for Arts was artist Wayne 
Banaszak of Campbellsport for 
his originality of design and fine 
technique of his counted cross- 
stitch pictures. The Best of Show 
ribbon for crafts was awarded to 
Joe Martin of Manitowoc for his 
detailed scroll work. Honorable 
Mention ribbons were awarded to 
Lawrence Carley of Omro for arts 
and Ruth Lee of Mukwonago for 
crafts.

The lucky winner of the raffle 
drawing for the Amish Tumbling 
Block quilt was Judy Held of 
Neosho.

The Junior Woman’s Club 
wishes to thank everyone who 
made the day a success, and 
looks forward to next year's show, 
scheduled for Saturday, 
November 20th at Kewaskum 
High School. Happy Holidays to 
all!

Amish Tumbling Block Quilt Raffle winner Judy Held 
(right) of Neosho with KJWC President Terry Christie 
(left).

Eckl's Main Street Inn
I43 Main St.. Kewaskum

★ HOT DRINKS ’ 
AVAILABLE* *
Before and After

The Christmas Parade
You better watch out...
You better not cry...

Make Out Your List Now!

* SANTA*
Will Be Here!

Dine hi... Or Take Out
626-4328

1992 Best of Show Arts Award to Wayne Banaszak of Campbellsport 
(left) pictured with member Donna Beck (right).

Holy Trinity

BINGO
New & More Games 
$10.00 Minimum Prize 

Per Winner
$1,000 Plus 
Per Session

(Depending Upon Attendance)

Sunday, Dec. 6
7 p.m.

Sat., Dec. 19 
11 a.m. to 2 p.m. 
and 4 to 7 p.m.

GIFT 
CERTIFICATES

W A HAHl.l:

(Doors open at 6 p.m.)

Holy Trinity Parish Hall
315 Main St., Kewaskum

HELD THE FIRST SUNDAY OF THE 
MONTH THROUGHOUT THE YEAR

1992 Best of Show Crafts to Joe Martin of Manitowoc by KJWC 
member Donna Beck.

FREE GIFT
1 1 1 El (? with this ad and
if I $5.00 purchase

J LIMIT 1 PEP

tOUCrieS CUSTOMER

Unique gifts and wall decor 
from around the world

Featuring Country 
and Southwest

Kewaskum 
CHRISTMAS

FARADS
Sunday, Dec. 6
* 5 p.m.

Register for 
GIFT CERTIFICATE GIVEAWAY!

1 mile north of Kewaskum at 285 Hwy. S

626-4352
Daily 11 to 5

Tues. & Thurs. 11 to 8
Sat. & Sun 9 to 5

INCOME EARLY...
^ Enjoy Kewaskum!

*Many business places will be open C'

fi *Hot drinks and hot food will be available 

. A.A.L. TREE LIGHTING CEREMONY AT THE V 
£ MUNICIPAL BUILDING FOLLOWING PARADE

m^wwimw
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Turn-of-the-Century Christmas 
Will Be Held at Galloway House

FOND DU LAC... “Christmas at 
Galloway House" will be held 
Saturday and Sunday, December 
12 and 13 at Galloway House and 
Village, 336 Old Pioneer Road, 
Fond du Lac. The hours will be 
from 11 a m. to 3 p.m. with 
grounds and buildings open until 
4 p.m.

The turn-of-the-century 
Galloway House Mansion will 
feature Victorian Christmas decor 
and customs and yuletide music 
in the parlour. Hot cider and 
cookies will be served in the old 
kitchen of the home Handmade 
craft items, homemade cookies

December Exhibitions 
At West Bend Gallery

The West Bend Gallery of Fine 
Arts is pleased to announce its 
December exhibitions.

UPPER GAI. IE RY: 
WASHINGTON COUNTY AND 
GALLERY ERIENDS ANNUAL 

JURIED EXHIBITION 
December 2 - January 3

It's time once again for the 
talented Friends of the Gallery 
and Washington County residents 
to exhibit their recent work. This 
annual event helps us see what 
they’ve been up to in their 
creative nature since last year.

This year’s exhibition should 
prove to be a new adventure in 
exhibiting local art. With the pro­
spectus, the entries are limited to 
two per artist and a bit more 
selective than in the past.

Viewers are invited to enjoy the 
diversity and the talent that the 
many area friends/artists 
demonstrate.

RECEPTION
A public reception for the 

Washington County and Gallery 
Friends Show will be Sunday, 
December 6, from 1:30 to 4 p.m.

LOWER GALLERY 
WISC ONSIN ART 

HISTORY COLLECTION 
December 2 - January 3 

Work from Wisconsin pioneers 
in art will be on exhibit in the lower 
gallery featuring oil paintings, 
watercolors and drawings from 
the gallery's permanent collec­
tion This collection focuses on ar­
tists living and working in Wiscon­
sin from 1850-1950, and provides 
an opportunity for viewers to 
observe the artistic productivity of 
peers of Carl Marr.

Marr lived from 1858-1936, was 
associated with several of the ar­
tists represented in the Early 
Wisconsin Collection, and is the 
focal point of the museum 
collection.

Follow the progression of 
Wisconsin art from the early in­
fluences of the Dusseldorf and 
Munich Academies to the 
Regionalism of the early part of 
this century.

TURNER HALL
Fillmore

Choice dates available
AMPLE PARKING 

692-2597 
If no answer 692-2592

* Catering Available

CORN GAME 
& RAFFLE

Every Third Wednesday
7 pm.

and old fashioned candy will be 
for sale in the Reception Building. 
A new 500-piece Galloway House 
and Village puzzle will be sold.

The elaborately furnished man­
sion, featuring hand-carved wood­
work and many original fur­
nishings will have 15 rooms 
decorated for Christmas. Three 
Christmas trees, a formal tree in 
the parlour, a family tree in the sit­
ting room and a children's tree in 
the upstairs playroom, can be 
seen. Collections of buttonhooks 
and beaded purses will be on 
display in the upstairs bedrooms. 
The house is a classic Midwest 
version of Italian villa-style ar­
chitecture, completed in 1880, 
and is surrounded by a Victorian 
village typical of the 1890’s.

Also open and decorated for 
Christmas will be the 1840’s Log 
Cabin, the Schoolhouse with 
costumed children seated at the 
desks preparing for Christmas, 
and the Blakely Museum, where 
a storyteller will be telling 
Christmas stories to the children. 
A costumed “Brownie" will roam 
the grounds distributing candy to 
the children.

Admission is $3.00 for adults, 
$1.00 for students 18 years and 
under, and pre-schoolers are free. 
Special group tours may be ar­
ranged for Thursday, December 
10, thru Thursday, December 
17th. Call (414) 922-6390 for 
reservations.

Campus Notes
Jonathan Boehlke has been ac­

cepted for admission at Bethany 
Lutheran College, Mankato, Min­
nesota. Founded in 1927, 
Bethany is a two-year Christian 
Liberal Arts College.

Jon is the son of Fred and 
Arlene Boehlke of Kewaskum.

WISCONSIN TRAVEL FACTS
31 percent of the nation's 

population lives within a 500 
mile radius of Madison, 
Wisconsin.

Ballroom Dance 
Class Offered at 
UWC-Fond du Lac

Peter Stroukoff will teach a 
Beginning Ballroom Dance class 
starting on Tuesday, Jan. 12, at 
the University of Wisconsin-Fond 
du Lac. Mr. Stroukoff is one of the 
finest dance instructors in our 
area, and attracts many of his 
students from outside the im­
mediate Fond du Lac area.

Beginning Ballroom Dance is 
scheduled for six weeks and will 
be held in the lower level of the 
Student Center from 6:30 to 7:30 
p.m. The class will teach a varie­
ty of steps in fox trot, waltz, and 
swing.

Peter Stroukoff has a relaxed

This holiday bring your child's dreams to life with a gift of

quality John Deere toys. These durable, die-cast metal replicas 

will bring years of enjoyment as your child plants, harvests and 

reshapes an imaginary world. There’s plenty to choose from and 

they’re all waiting for you at our store. So put a holiday gleam 

in your child’s eyes. Pick up your John Deere toys today.

^^ o^ ^
SERWE IMPLEMENT, INC

HWY. 67 & COUNTY K, ASHFORD £
U| Phone 533-8391 or 269-4224 aim
SgilW' . Ine witkit

teaching style, which allows the 
participants to gain confidence, 
poise, and a feeling of ac­
complishment. There is a $25.00 
single registration fee, or, $40.00 
per couple.

To register for the classes, con­
tact the Office of Continuing 
Education at the University of 
Wisconsin - Fond du Lac at 
929-3622.

Cholesterol Screening 
At Valley View Medical 
Center on Monday

Individuals are invited to par­
ticipate in a cholesterol screening 
which includes a complete lipid 
panel at Valley View Medical 
Center on Monday, December 
7th, from 8 to 10 a.m. There will 
be a $7.50 charge for testing. 
Fasting for 12 hours is preferred.

The physician-approved 
screening held in Valley View's 
laboratory is open to all ages.

Screening results will be mail­
ed to each participant upon com­
pletion. Persons whith high 
cholesterol levels will be advised 
to contact their physician.

To register for the cholesterol 
screening, call Valley View at 
893-1771. ext. 258.
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Fund-Raising for Christmas Parade 
Underway As Lights and Tree Go Up
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Voila! The finished product which rests in front of Valley Bank, includes the 
Christmas tree with the Memorial Star on top and the thank you boards with 
the names of all contributors listed aside of the tree. It is hoped to have the 
entire tree lit up by the time the parade ro Ils past the tree on Sunday even­
ing. All proceeds from the sale of the tree lights is used to defray the cost 
of the Christmas parade and the 1,000 candy bags which will be passed out 
to children watching the parade.

In* .Jw

The Memorial Board, situated on the south side of the Christmas tree 
This board lists the names of deceased family members who will not 
be sharing Christmas with us or enjoying the spectacular parade. It 
also mentions the name of the person who donated the light. The white 
lights on the star are called the Memorial Lights. Each light you donate 
in someone else s name will cost $10. It somehow helps to realize 
our loved ones are at least with us during these festivities in thought 
and spirit.

In Czechoslovakia, a girl puts a cherry twig in water on December 4. If the twig 
blossoms before Christmas Eve, it means she will marry sometime during the year.

The board on the north side of the tree list the names of the con­
tributors of the red and green lights. The green lights which silhouette 
the outside of the tree are for sale at $10 each to all families and in­
dividuals wishing to help support the Christmas Parade. The red lights 
which adorn the inside of th tree can be purchased by any area 
business wishing to contribute towards the parade. There have been- 
many white lights purchased to help light the star and the businesses 
have been great trying to get the decorative red bulbs all lit in time 
for the parade, however, we do need some more green lights pur­
chased if we hope to reach our goal of having everything lit on the 
tree in time for Sunday's parade. There are approximately 40 green 
lights left to light, 20 red lights left and 60 white lights. (There are more 
white lights on the star than there are green and red lights on the tree). 
If you care to help support the parade with the purchase of a light, 
please send your donation to: The Kewaskum Area Chamber of Com­
merce, P.O. Box 300, Kewaskum, Wl 53040. Names of all contributors 
will be placed on the thank you boards and will also be listed in an 
upcoming issue of the Kewaskum Statesman. The tree, star and thank 
you boards will remain up and lit throughout the holiday season.

KEWASKUM FAMILY 
CHIROPRACTIC CENTER 

626-2644 
— OFFICE HOURS —

Monday - 
Tuesday - 
Wednesday - 
Thursday - 
Friday - 
Saturday -

8
8
8
8
8
8

a.m. to 
a.m. to 
a.m. to 
a.m. to 
a.m. to 
a.m. to

12 and 2 to 8
12 and 2 to 6
12 and 2 to 8
12
12 and 2 to 6
12

p.m. 
p.m. 
p.m.

p.m.

1554 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum

Enjoy the Festive Spirit at Bemis Upland Floral 's

CHRISTMAS
OPEN HOUSE

Saturday, Dec. 5 -10 to 4
with Santa Claus from 12 noon to 4 p.m.

Sunday, Dec. 6 -11 to 4 
with Santa Claus from 12 noon to 4 p.m. 
24” BALSAM WREATHS

Trimmed with a Holiday Bow ■ Reg. $8.00

SALE - $6.50 
9’ PINE GARLANDS

Wrap your Home with Holiday Spirit! — Reg $10.50

SPECIAL $8.00
$1.00 OFF EACH POINSETTIA,

Priced at $12.00 and up — Cash and Carry Only
Over 5,000 blooming, home-grown Poinsettias await you!

SELECT #1 MICHIGAN CHRISTMAS TREES 
STARTING AT $11.50 

Free Refrethments — Free Door Priiet!

BEMIS UPLAND
^SPRINGS FLORAL k BA TA VIA — 1.75 miles west of Hwy. 28 on

J Cherry Hill Dr. - OPEN 9:00-5:00 Mon thru Sat

Open Sundays 1:00-4:00 now till Christmas

?/ 994-9134
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Beth Metz Associate Producer 
For TV-5 Telethon to 
Benefit Badger Camp

Reth Metz

PLATTEVILLE — Beth Metz, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Mathias J. Metz of Kewaskum, 
is the Associate Producer for the TV-5 Christmas Telethon benefitting Badger Camp.

Badger Camp is located outside of Prairie du Chien and gives mentally challenged in­
dividuals from across the state a chance to experience new things.

For Beth, a senior at the University of Wisconsin - Platteville majoring in broadcast 
technology management, working for the telethon is ' 'personally rewarding that I was a part 
of making a campers dream come true. ”

Goetsch Announces Property Tax 
Assistance for Seniors

Friends of the Kettle’s Annual Meeting
The "Friends of the Kettle 

Moraine State Forest" held their 
first annual membership meeting 
at the Henry Reuss Ice Age 
Center at Dundee this week.

A number of memberships 
were developed including a 
"Charter Membership." Charter 
or founding members will be 
memorialized through a plaque at 
the Henry Ruess Ice Age Center 
to recognize their $100.00 dona­
tion. This donation is then used as 
seed money for “friends” 
projects.

The other memberships are in­
dividual $5.00, family $10 00 and 
supporting $25.00.

The 1993 Board of Directors 
were also elected. These officers 
are President - Jerry Ninnemann 
of Campbellsport, Vice President 
- Michael McFadzen of Plymouth, 
Secretary - Michael Krueger of 
Fond du Lac, and Treasurer - 
John Cooper of Fond du Lac.

The "Friends of the Kettle 
Moraine” is a non-profit organiza­
tion dedicated to promoting the 
great appreciation of the Kettle 
Moraine. The Friends group in­
volves the public in activities in

future direction of the state forest. 
For further information, contact 
the Kettle Moraine State Forest at 
626-2116.

Money talks — but it never says 
when it's coming baek.

SHEEPSHEAD WINNER’S
5 handed winner's on Wednes­

day, Nov. 25th were: Rose 
Meunier, 76-5—71,23-3—20; Ella 
Smith, 58-6—52, 19-4—15; 
Walter Schmidt, 57-12—45, 
17-10—7; Marion Fritz, 
49-12—37, 19-8—11.

The next 5 handed will be 
Thursday, Dec. 3rd and Wednes­
day. Dec. 9th at 8:00 p.m. sharp. 
Schmitt’s Never Inn.

The Smart Way to Earn Money.
Give the Gift That Keeps on Giving.

Why are CKIS tax-deferred annuities and IRAs the smart way to 
invest? Because your money builds untaxed earnings. Your dollars 
are professionally managed to earn a competitive rate of interest. 
When you begin withdrawal, you're usually in a lower tax bracket 
with less to pay. For full details, talk it over with your CKIS sales

representative.

Kathie Ramthun
626-2869 • 1-8OO-924-9218

ere CATHOLIC KNIGHTS
INSURANCE SOCIETY

The Wisconsin Property Tax 
Deferral Loan program allows 
low-and moderate-income elder­
ly homeowners to convert home 
equity into income to pay proper­
ty taxes.

Property tax deferral is par­
ticularly helpful to elderly who 
have a small fixed or disposable 
incomes but have a significant 
amount of home equity or capital.

The program provides cash in­
come to help pay property tax 
bills, and, in turn, helps to allow 
older citizens to remain in their 
homes.

If you are a homeowner aged 
65 or older and your total income 
is no more than $20,000 annual­
ly you may apply to the Depart­
ment of Administration, Division 
of Housing for a loan equal to the 
amount of the property taxes 
levied. The annual amount bor­
rowed is limited to $1,800.

Loan recipients must maintain 
residence in Wisconsin for at least 
6 months during 1992.

The principal and interest on 
the loan are not repaid until 
ownership of the property is 
transferred to another party or the 
recipient of the loan no longer 
resides in the home. To insure the 
state’s interest and ensure repay­
ment of the loan at a later date, 
the state will file a lien on the pro­
perty for which the loan is issued.

For Seniors receiving SSI or 
medicaid, according to the Divi­
sion of Housing, the loan is not 
viewed as income so it will not ef­
fect the income requirements for 
these programs.

Seniors should also be aware 
that they can participate in both 
the Property Tax Loan Deferral 
Program and the Homestead 
Credit Program. If you are filing a 
Homestead Credit claim for 1992, 
you must submit schedule H to 
determine your total household in­
come for the Property Tax Defer­
ral Loan program. According to 
the Social Security Office, as long 
as your countable resources do 
not exceed a monthly total of 
$2000 your benefits will not be 
effected.

The deadline for applying for a
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| Kewaskum Booster I
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SENTRY PARKING LOT 
— On Saturdays — 

Nov. 21, 28 and Dec. 5 & 12 
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loan under tms program is June 
30, 1993. There is only $550,000 
available for this tax season and 
it will be allocated on a first-come 
first-serve basis. Interested par­
ties are encouraged to apply as 
soon as possible to take advan­
tage of the program.

For more information and an 
application package contact 
Kathy Hanson, Property Tax 
Deferral Loan Program. Wiscon­
sin Division of Housing P.O. Box 
8944 Madison, Wl 53708-8944 or 
call 608-266-1983.

Statesman classified ads get the job 
done. To place yours, call 626-2626.

Family History Century 
Certificate Available

The Wisconsin State 
Genealogical Society, a statewide 
group interested in family history 
research, launched a project in 
1972 to award a PIONEER cer­
tificate to anyone whose 
ancestors settled in Wisconsin by 
1850. Many people are eligible for 
this PIONEER certificate.

A CENTURY certificate is 
available to anyone whose 
ancestors settled in Wisconsin at 
least one hundred years ago. This 
means that hundreds of descen­
dants of early settlers can claim 
this CENTURY certificate.

In order to qualify, interested 
persons must be able to prove 
their ancestors’ residency in 
Wisconsin by one official record, 
such as a census, a county 
history, a birth or death record, a 
land record. The claimant need 
not presently live in Wisconsin.

Several thousand of these at­
tractive certificates, suitable for 
framing, have been issued since 
the project started in 1972.

Applications can be obtained 
by sending a self-addressed, 
stamped long envelope to the; 
Wisconsin State Genealogical 
Society, P.O. Box 5106, Madison, 
Wl 53705-0106.*

$7.00 
$10.00 
$16.00

Purchase at

Contact 
Eileen Kurtz 
338-1068 or 
Larry Ammel 

at KHS
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Vital Care Ambulance Service from West Bend (L to R) Dawn Pomeroy, Spring Gehring and Jennifer Butzlaff listen 
to the talk about emergency ambulance care

4-H Elects Officers

New club officers for the Kewaskum 4-H’ers are Jenny 
Johnson - Vice President, Tracy Baton - Secretary, Spring 
Gehring - Historian, Amy Johnson, Treasurer - Joanne 
Lemke - President. Absent is Jennifer Butzlaff - Reporter.

Announce Diabetes, Cholesterol 
Screening at Sheboygan Memorial

Individuals are invited to par­
ticipate in a diabetes screening 
and a cholesterol screening which 
includes a complete lipid panel, at 
Sheboygan Memorial Medical 
Center on Mondays, Dec. 7, 14 
and 21st, from 9:00 to 10:30 a.m. 
There will be a $2 charge for the 
diabetes screening and a $7.50 
charge for the cholesterol testing. 
Fasting for 12 hours for the 
cholesterol screening is preferred.

The physician-approved

cholesterol screening is open to 
all ages. Persons age 17 and 
younger must be accompanied by 
parents.

Screening results will be mail­
ed to each participant upon com­
pletion. Persons with high 
cholesterol levels will be advised 
to contact their physician.

To register and locations for the 
diabetes and cholesterol screen­
ings, call Memorial’s Education 
Department at 459-5537.

At the November meeting, Jim 
Seine and his partner Barb from 
Vital Care, West Bend, spoke to 
the Kewaskum 4-H’ers club about 
how important emergency am­
bulance care is.

They told the 4-H club about the 
different types of emergencies 
they see and how they transport 
people from nursing homes to 
hospitals and visa-versa. Barb 
showed them the inside of the 
ambulance and all the equipment 
they must know how to use. It was 
a very interesting topic and the 
club members learned a lot.

Order of the Arrow 
Will Meet Dec. 3

Members of the Order of the Ar­
row of Glacier Edge District 11, of 
Bay-Lakes Council of the Boy 
Scouts of America, will meet with 
Chapter Chief Mike Hartwig and 
Advisor Harold Wolk, on Thurs­
day, Dec. 3, from 7:30 to 9 p.m 
in the all-purpose room of Wood­
view School (north side of 
di iveway to John Long parking 
lot), corner of Fifth and Hickory 
Streets, Grafton.

All members from Ozaukee 
County, Random Lake and 
Washington County are invited.

Births
KERN — A daughter, Nicole, to 

Maree and Jim, 2445 N 
Brookfield Road, Brookfield 
Maternal grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerry Hofmeister of 
Hartland Paternal grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Orville Kern.

MUDLAFF — A son to Patricia 
and Jon, N1429 Boltonville Road, 
Adell, on Nov 21.

KIRST — A son to Stephanie 
Luepnitz and Todd Kirst, 5005 
Morning Glory Drive, West Bend, 
on Nov. 4

THE ALL-AMERICAN FAMIIY.
Be it auto, home, business, health or life, our family of produds will suit your needs. 

Consider our coverage. Compare costs. Call me today

RANDY 
GUST 

1040 Fond du Lac Ave. 
Kewaskum 

Office 
626-4050

Auro HOMf BUSINESS HEALTH LIFE

AMERICAN FAMILY
INSUR

American Family Mutual Inwt Company 
Madison, Wl S3 753

^K Star Cablevision
Bright • Clear • Exciting

QQQ.ECOn W21 South Main Street OOO UDOU West Bend

your 
Christmas ' 

mj^ with a needy <JF 
child or adult 

and we'H share 
a cable connection 

special with you. * 
Simply donate new 

clothing or a new toy 
0|^p which has a minimum 

value of $10.00 for our
fe SHARING TREE ^
W Your gift for the Sharing Tree 
: / will be given to a needy child - 

or adult in your community. 
Your free connection to any 

■ of our cable services is our gift 
to you for sharing the 

joy of Christmas with others.
This special applies to cabled areas only 

and expires Friday December 18th. 
Please call our office for details.
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EM obituaries
DIANE E. BECHT

Diane E. Becht, nee Pups, 33, 
of Kewaskum, died Wednesday, 
Nov. 25, 1992, at St. Joseph’s 
Community Hospital, West Bend, 
due to injuries suffered in an auto 
accident.

She was born Oct. 1, 1959, in 
Milwaukee, to Louis and Eliene 
(nee Anderson) Pups, and mar­
ried Paul C. Becht on April 11, 
1981, at North Trinity Lutheran 
Church, Milwaukee.

They moved to the Kewaskum 
area in 1988 where she was 
employed at Regal Ware Inc.

She was a member of St. Lucas 
Lutheran Church, Kewaskum, 
and had been a member of North 
Trinity Lutheran Church, 
Milwaukee.

Survivors include her huband; 
two sons, Paul II and Bryan, both 
at home; her parents, Louis and 
Eliene Pups of Milwaukee; her 
father-in-law, Paul Becht of 
Milwaukee; her mother-in-law, 
Karen (Don) Lory-Stark of 
Milwaukee; two sisters, Loreen 
(Gary) Hanson and Stephanie 
Pups, both of Milwaukee; nieces; 
nephews, and other relatives and 
friends.

Funeral services were held 
Wednesday, Dec. 2 at 11 a.m. at 
St. Lucas Lutheran Church, 
Kewaskum and at 4 p.m. in the 
Chapel of the Chimes at Wiscon­
sin Memorial Park, Brookfield. 
Rev. Timothy Henning officiated 
at both services.

Visitation on Wednesday was 
from 9 to 11 a m. at the church 
and from 2:30 to 4 p.m. at 
Wisconsin Memorial Park.

Memorials are appreciated.
The Phillip Funeral Home, 

West Bend, served the family.

MICHAEL FRANKE
Michael K. Franke, 14, of 

N6713 County Trunk V, Horicon, 
died Friday, Nov. 27, 1992, in 
Vilas County following a hunting 
accident.

He was born June 30, 1978, in 
Fond du Lac, a son of Kenneth 
and Kathleen Rauch Franke.

Michael was a graduate of 
Mayville Middle School and was 
confirmed at St. John’s Lutheran 
Church in Brown's Corner in 
1992. He was a freshman at 
Mayville High School, where he 
was active in many sports.

Survivors include his parents; 
one brother, Kevin, at home; one 
sister, Amy, at home; his grand­
parents, Harold and Marion 
Franke of rural Horicon and 
Calvin and Evelyn Rauch of 
Phelps; and many aunts, uncles, 
relatives and friends.

Funeral services were held at 2 
p.m. Tueday at St. John’s 
Lutheran Church, Brown’s Cor­
ner. The Rev. Edward Marcotte 
officiated. Burial was at the 
church cemetery.

Family and friends called from

4 to 9 p.m. Monday at Koepsell 
Funeral Home, Mayville, and from 
noon to the time of services Tues­
day at the church.

The Rauch family were former 
residents and lived near St. Kilian. 
An aunt, Joanne .Amerling, lives 
in Kewaskum and an uncle, 
Calvin Rauch lives in rural 
Campbellsport.

JAMES R. HANSON JR.
James R. Hanson Jr., 34, of 

734 Chaplin Court, Plymouth, 
passed away unexpectedly 
November 22 in Necedah.

He was born December 14, 
1957 in Plymouth, a son of James 
and Rosaleen Vanderkin Hanson. 
He attended Plymouth area 
schools and graduated from 
Plymouth High School in 1976.

On May 27, 1979 he married 
Jeanne Panzer in Kewaskum. 
The couple lived in Plymouth 
since their marriage. He had been 
employed by the Kohler Company 
for the past 16 years, where he 
also served as a Union Steward.

Mr. Hanson was a coach for the 
Plymouth Junior Football League 
and was an umpire for the 
Plymouth Softball Association for 
the past five years. He also played 
in the American League in 
Plymouth and was a member of 
the Kettle Moraine Dartball 
League.

Mr. Hanson was a member of 
Salem United Church of Christ in 
Plymouth.

Survivors include his wife, 
Jeanne; three children, James III, 
Kevin and Tiffany, all at home; his 
parents, James and Rosaleen 
Hanson of Sheboygan Falls; three 
brothers, Gary (Dawn) Hanson of 
Plymouth, Timothy Hanson of 
Sheboygan Falls, and Randall 
(Christine) Hanson of Plymouth, 
and one sister, Sandra (Benjamin) 
Bonett of Plymouth.

He is further survived by his 
grandmother, Mrs. Olive 
Vanderkin of Plymouth; his great­
grandfather, Harry Vanderkin of 
Plymouth; his father-in-law and 
mother-in-law, Alvin and Janet 
Panzer of Tomahawk; sister-in- 
laws, brother-in-laws, aunts, 
uncles, cousins, nieces and 
nephews.

He was preceded in death by 
one sister, Mary Sue, and his 
grandparents, Amos and 
Madeline Vanderkin, and Eben 
and Loretta Hanson.

Funeral services were held 
Thursday evening, November 26, 
at 7:30 p.m. at Salem United 
Church of Christ, Plymouth. The 
Rev. James Hoppert, Pastor, of­
ficiated and burial was in Zoar 
Salem Cemetery.

Friends called at the church 
from 2 p.m. on Thursday until the 
time of services.

A memorial fund has been 
established in the name of James 
Hanson.

Wittkopp Funeral Service of 
Plymouth served the family.

Eleonore A. Miske, nee Rohde, 
formerly, of Adell, died Thursday, 
Nov. 26,1992, at the Beechwood 
Rest Home, Beechwood, at the 
age of 83.

She was born Dec. 10,1908, in 
the town of Sheboygan, to the late 
August and Emma (nee Widder) 
Rohde, and Inarried Berthold 
Miske Sept. 27, 1930, at Trinity 
Lutheran Church, Sheboygan. He 
passed away Oct. 28, 1980.

She had been a custodian at 
Emmanuel Lutheran Church, 
Adell, for 23 years, and was also 
a Sunday School teacher.

She was a member of Em­
manuel Lutheran Church, Adell, 
the Ladies Aid, Lutheran 
Women’s Missionary League and 
Adell Homemakers.

Survivors include two sons, 
Robert (Christel) of Sheboygan 
and Richard of Orange City, Iowa; 
three daughters, Gertrude 
(Gerald) Shaver of Plymouth, Ber- 
nita (Mervin) Marquardt of St. 
Louis, Mo., and Lois (Norman) 
Schnakeof Clintonville; ^grand­
children; six great-grandchildren; 
a sister, Edna Miske of Birnam­
wood; and other relatives and 
friends.

Preceding her in death were a 
brother and a sister.

Funeral services were Sunday, 
Nov. 29, at 7 p.m. at Emmanuel 
Lutheran Church, Adell. Burial 
was in the church cemetery.

Visitation at the church only 
was on Sunday from 4 p.m. until 
the time of services.

In lieu of flowers, the family ap­
preciates memorials to Em­
manuel Lutheran Church and 
Lutheran High School.

The Wilk Funeral Home, Ran­
dom Lake, served the family.

CARD OF THANKS
A very sincere thank you to our 

relatives, neighbors, and many 
friends, who shared in our loss of 
my beloved wife, our dear mother 
and Grandmother Ruth Krueger.

Special thanks to the 
Kewaskum Rescue Squad, the 
staff at St. Joseph’s Emergency 
room, Pastors Fredrich and Hen­
ning, organist Miss Sweetman, 
soloists the Bollingers, Millers, 
and pallbearers. Thank you to all 
the donors of flowers, food, 
memorial tributes, prayers, cards, 
and anyone who shared their 
respect during our time of sorrow. 
They will long be remembered 
and cherished in our hearts.

Harold Krueger & Terry 
Harry Krueger & Family

Deborah & Jennifer Goodsell

IN MEMORY
In memory of THOMAS F. FAY, 

who passed away four years ago, 
Nov. 30. 1988:
Sunshine passes, shadows fall, 
Love’s remembrance outlasts all. 
And though the years be many or 

few
They are filled with happy 

memories of you.
Loved and missed by his wife, 

daughter and three sons.

Salvation Army Volunteers Help 
“Ring” in Christmas Joy for Others

For The Salvation Army, the 
Christmas season has already 
started and soon volunteers all 
across the Wisconsin and Upper 
Michigan area will “hit the 
streets” beginning another am­
bitious year of ringing the bell at 
The Salvation Army’s familiar Red 
Kettle.

For over one hundred years, 
the red kettle has been a symbol 
of Christmas cheer for the lone­
ly, the jobless, those without so­
meone who cares. Those kettles 
are at work right in your own com­
munity to reach out to those in 
need this Christmas and all the 
year through.

If you, or someone you know,

St. Mary’s Springs 
High School 
Honor Roll

FIRST QUARTER 
High Honors 

GPA 3.75 and above
SENIORS: Joshua Fox, Earl Martin, 

Cynthia Wirtz, Andrea Loehr.
JUNIORS: Shelby Bowser, Kimber­

ly Mlinaz, Katherine Griffin, Trisha 
Larners.

SOPHOMORES: Rachel Fox, Erin 
Murray, Aaron Salo, Christine 
Schmidt, Matthew Becht, Jennifer 
Murray, Steven Will, Patrick Neal, 
Trisha Teofilo, Michael Bechner, 
Virginia Casper, Jeffrey Coon, Jean 
Wang, Beth Martin, Rebecca Jung.

FRESHMEN: Kristen Niebauer, 
Jayme Gilgenbach, Bryan Miller, Erin 
Hansen, Jill Stephany.

Honors - GPA 3.25 to 3.74
SENIORS: Jason Gellings, Chad 

Beres, Carol Jones, Amy Ellestad, 
Brian Stemper, Sara Braun, John 
Zehren, Amy Micki.ewicz, Heidi 
Niemeier, Anthony Jung, Jill Feudner, 
Peter Boettcher, Lori Petrie, Nicole 
Shannon, Jonathan Kaull, Tammy 
Krause, Karin Broecker, William 
Laudolff, Julie Versluys, Peter 
Winkler.

JUNIORS: Sean Twohig, Sarah 
Mueller, Sara Trepanier, Andrew 
Flanigan, Geoffrey Bares, Laurie 
Strobel, Kevin Baker, Gregory Hiet- 
pas, Margaret Pesch, Aimee Wagner, 
Beth Mickiewicz, Laura Rinzel, Hope 
Feyen, Erich Birschbach, Jodi Her­
nandez, Joseph Shea, Michael 
Salchert, Caryn Goron, Jacob Masick, 
Luke Ketterhagen, Amy Schneider, 
Molly Mates.

SOPHOMORES: Amanda
Birschbach, Kathryn Martin, Timothy 
Welsch, Matthew Kaiser, Brad 
Stemper, Sarah Brown, Laura White, 
Joseph Braun, Rachele Gress, An­
drew Zunker, Michael Bruflat, Shan­
non Feucht, Anthony Fields, Genasis 
Fleeter, Connie Guse, Kelly Hackett, 
Sarah Dart, Duncan Seffern, Kristi 
Chopski, Meghan O'Brien, Todd 
Miller, Kathryn Leonard, Jennifer 
Kneeland, Matthew Pucker, Justin 
Dux, Jessica Hornung, Tayce Santy, 
Amy Scherg, Joel Coon, Nicholas 
Blavat, Christopher Keenan, Aaron 
DeLorme.

FRESHMEN: Tara Baker, Benjamin 
Bares, Sarah Schumacher, Lisa 
Kaiser, Bridget Flanigan, Tyler 
Garner, Samuel Mueller, Eric Ende- 
jan, Heidi Graczyk, Thomas Develice, 
Genalyn Johnson, Suzanne Longrie, 
Andrew Weber, James Petrie, Andrew 
Strobel, Ryan Waldschmidt, 
Stephanie Shannon, Andrew Jung, 
Amy Hillebrarid.

would like to touch a life of so­
meone who needs you by 
volunteering to assist with The 
Salvation Army’s Christmas ket­
tle drive in your community, 
please call your local Salvation 
Army volunteer representative or 
The Salvation Army’s statewide 
headquarters at 1-800-242-7094.

Thank you and may God bless 
you!

County Separated and 
Divorced Group to Meet

The Washington County 
Separated and Divorced Men and 
Women Support Group meets 
every Friday at Sacred Heart 
Church in Allenton from 7:30 to 
9:30 p.m.

The purpose of the meeting is 
to provide a group to share ideas, 
concerns, support, fellowship and 
love from a Christian perspective. 
There are also guest speakers, 
panel discussions, small group 
sharing and activities.

The group is open to singles, 
widows and widowers. Many of 
the topics pertain to single 
parents and other individuals 
rebuilding their lives and 
relationships.

Upcoming topics are:
December 4 - “Hope for the 

Holiday” featuring Rev. Douglas 
Livingston of the First Congrega­
tion Church of Hartford.

December 11 - “The True Spirit 
of Christmas” presented by Leo 
Buscaglia on video.

Bethlehem Journey
Travel to the “Little Town of 

Bethlehem” at the time of Christ’s 
birth and see demonstrations of 
various biblical crafts authentical­
ly performed by skilled craftsmen 
in costumes of the era.

See a typical Bethlehem home 
in the time of Christ. Visit King 
Herod’s Court and follow the pro­
cession to view the Holy Family.

This Advent presentation will be 
held by members and friends of 
the Fifth Avenue United Methodist 
Church, at 323 Fifth Avenue, 
West Bend on Friday, December 
4, from 6:30 to 8:30 p.m. and 
Saturday, December 5, from 2 to 
4:30 p.m.

A free will offering for the Mis­
sions will be gathered.

THANK YOU

I wish to express my gratitude 
to all those who sent cards of 
cheer and took time to visit me 
during my recent hospitilization. 
Special thanks to my pastor, doc­
tors and the nurses in ICU and on 
the 2nd floor at St. Joseph's 
Hospital in West Bend.

Wally Ohntann

Announcing...
PHYSICIANS MUTUAL $ INSURANCE COMPANY 
is now serving the Fond du Loe County area with local representatives 
Hospitalization • Cancer • Income Protection • Medicare Supplement

For more information about your current policy or new insurance you may need,
Call: Arlene Hankwitz at 922-6949, 272 N. Main, Fond du Lac

Equal Opportunity Company PMA-261
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DECEMBER 1, 1967

Opened Monday at Fond du 
Lac was a grand jury investigation 
into the slaying of a Chicago resi­
dent, whose body was found on 
a farm 1V2 miles north of 
Kewaskum near the Fond du Lac- 
Washington county line oh Sept. 
12. The body, identified through 
fingerprints as Herbert L. McKin­
ney, 27, a Chicago laborer, was 
found following the crash of a car 
driven by Chester J. Dombrowski, 
30, Chicago police officer, on 
Hwy. 45 north of Kewaskum in 
Washington County just south of 
the Fond du Lac County Line. The 
Chicago police department has 
absolved Dombrowski of any con­
nection with the slaying. McKin­
ney was reported beaten and shot 
in the head. The body was found 
on a seldom-used farm dump, 
face up and nude except for a 
pullover T-shirt. The area, owned 
by Dombrowski and his brother, 
Bernard, is about 100 yards from 
County Trunk S. District Attorney 
Robert J. Kauffman of 
Washington County said 15 
witnesses from Washington 
County, including Kewaskum, 
had been subpoenaed to the 
investigation.

Football letter winners for the 
1967 season at Kewaskum Com­
munity High School were an­
nounced last week. Twenty-three 
members of the squad were 
awarded letters as follows: 
SENIORS — Marvin Tanck, Dave 
Bingen, Jim Manthei, Al Bohn, 
Charles Williams, Dennis 
Terlinden, Chuck Bindrich, Tom 
Gundrum, Allen Theusch, Fred 
Krieser, David Ramthun, Scott 
Waranius, George Martin. 
JUNIORS — Perry Koth, Gerald 
Engeleiter, Mike Gutjahr, Ron 
Strupp, Chuck Theusch, Dan 
Marx, John Reysen, Bob Fellenz, 
Chuck Muckerheide. 
SOPHOMORE — Russ Gavin. 
The Indians will have 10 lettermen 
returning next year and a good 
sophomore group coming up to 
form a fine nucleus for the 1968 
team.

The Kewaskum Kiwanis Club 
honored two outstanding area 
farmers at their Farm-City Night 
program on Monday. They are 
William Thull and Gilbert Stoffel. 
Both families were presented with 
a plaque by Harold Ryan, the soil 
and conservation agent of 
Washington County on behalf of 
the Kiwanis Club for their fine 
work.

Second Lieut. Robert Miller of 
Fort Gordon, Georgia, is spending 
a 30-day leave at the home of his 
mother, Mrs. Rose Miller, 
Kewaskum. Miller was promoted 
to second lieutenant on Nov. 16 
after graduating from Signal 
Corps Officers Candidate School. 
He will leave Dec. 17 for Fort Dix, 
from where he will be sent to 
Munich, Germany, to be station­
ed there the next two years.

A daughter was born to Mr. and 
Mrs. John Klahn, Route 1, 
Kewaskum, on Thursday, Nov. 
23. A son was born to Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Dreher, 222 Linwood 
Terrace, West Bend, on Monday,

Nov. 27. Mr. Dreher is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Dreher Sr. of 
Kewaskum.

50 Years Ano
DECEMBER 4, 1942

Honor roll students’ names 
were posted Thursday for the se­
cond six week period which end­
ed Wednesday, November 25. 
They are: FRESHMEN - Dolores 
Hammes (all A’s) 12 points; Bet­
ty Jane Krueger, 10 points; Joyce 
Stahl, 11 points; Allen Stoffel, 10 
points. SOPHOMORES - Rachel 
Brauchle (all A’s) 1372 points; 
Lois Koch (all A s) 1372 points; 
Dolores Spaeth. JUNIORS - Mar­
jorie Bartelt, 10; John Pamperin, 
10; Harriet Stoffel, IOV2. 
SENIORS - Lorraine Eberle IOV2: 
Joy Zanow 10; Gerald Stoffel, 10. 
A total of 10 points is necessary 
to be placed on the honor roll. The 
point system is as follows: A - 3 
points, excellent, 94 to 100; B - 2 
points, good. 87 to 93; C - 1 point, 
average, 81 to 86; D - 0 points, in­
ferior, 75 to 80; NC - 0 points, no 
credit, below 75.

A 17-year-old Milwaukee youth, 
who stole a 1942 Dodge car own­
ed by Loran L. Backhaus from the 
owner’s garage on his farm on 
Highway 55, a mile north of 
Kewaskum sometime during the 
night on Thanksgiving, twice elud­
ed police and escaped capture 
following a wild chase in the 
stolen car. The car was eventual­
ly retrieved by Milwaukee 
detectives.

Mrs. Edna C. Walker of 
Sturgeon Bay will replace Mrs. 
Fayuthe Schwartz as teacher in 
the grammar room of the 
Kewaskum public school. The lat­
ter left at the close of school 
before the Thanksgiving vacation 
to return to Chilton. This week 
Mrs. Charles Miller substituted as 
teacher in the grammar room 
since Miss Walker was unable to 
arrange to start her duties here 
until next Monday.

The following students in the 
primary department of the 
Kewaskum school have been 
neither absent nor tardy since the 
start of school: Rita Backhaus, 
Leroy Keller, Betty Kober, Donald 
Meisenheimer, Merlin Seefeldt, 
Charles Vorpahl, Henry Weddig, 
Anna Belle Backhaus, Florence 
Dogs, Judith Kaniess, Clark 
Landmann.

An unknown thief or thieves 
walked into the George Eggert 
home on Fond du Lac Avenue 
sometime Wednesday evening, 
Nov. 25, while Mr. and Mrs. Eg­
gert were asleep upstairs and 
stole $31.60 in cash which had 
been placed in the pantry. 
Evidently someone familiar in the 
Eggert home who knew where the 
money was kept is guilty of the 
theft. The door of the home had 
been left open because the Eg­
gerts son, George Jr. was out.

Mr. and Mrs. Elwyn Romaine of 
this village have been informed by 
their son, Tech. Sgt. Curtis Ro­
maine of Kellogg Field, Battle 
Creek, Mich., of his marriage to 
Miss LaVerne Rundel of St. Louis, 
Mo. on Thursday, Nov. 19. Sgt.

Romaine is in the U S. Army air 
corps and is with the 10th Service 
Squadron at Kellogg Field

The parsonage of the Walnut 
Street Methodist Congregation at 
West Bend was the scene of the 
wedding on Nov. 26 which united 
in marriage Miss Verna M 
Liepert, duaghterof Mr and Mrs 
Walter J. Liepert of Route 1. 
Kewaskum, and Glen J. Grasse, 
son of Mrs. John Grasse of Rqpte 
1, Saukville.

The Rev. John B. Reichel read 
the nuptial high mass at St. 
Kilian’s Church. St Kilian, Nov 
24, in which Miss Rita Miller, 
daughter of Mr and Mrs John A 
Miller of Route 1, Campbellsport, 
became the bride of Eugene 
Zehren, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
George Zehren of St. Kilian.

Mr. and Mrs. Benjamin Kurtz of 
Menomonee Falls are the parents 
of a son born at St. Joseph's 
Hospital in Milwaukee on Nov. 24 
The mother is the former Bernice 
Buddenhagen, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Arthur Buddenhagen of 
Kpwaskum

75 Years Ago
DECEMBER 2, 1917

Emil Pietz, age 33 years, was 
found dead in a field on his farm 
in Ashford Thursday afternoon. 
Mr. Pietz was hauling fertilizer, 
and had climbed down to repair 
the spreader. While he was 
underneath the wagon the horses 
started, the rear wheel of the 
spreader passing over his back. 
Death resulted from loss of blood, 
as a blood vessel was broken. 
The man’s back was badly 
twisted. Emil Pietz is a son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Otto Pietz and was liv­
ing at home on the farm.

The Washington County Board 
at its last session voted enough 
additional money to build the re­
located St. Michaels road. Action 
will soon be taken by the Road 
and Bridge Committee to pur­
chase the land needed and make 
it possible to clear the road bed 
of trees and shrubs, and allow an 
early start on the grading next 
spring. This new road will be a big 
asset to the town of Kewaskum 
and the land owners.

The ceremony that united Miss 
Laura E. Schleif of the Town of 
Auburn and William Brandstetter 
of this village was solemnized at 
high noon last Saturday at the 
Reformed Church parsonage at 
Elmore with the Rev. S. Romeis 
officiating.

New work benches have been 
added to the equipment of the 
local pocket book factory. The 
new institution is getting along 
nicely. Mr. Gilbert, manager of 
same, states that if work con­
tinues to crowd them they will be 
forced to look for larger quarters.

No man is useless 
while he has a friend.

Excerpts From 
As I Remember

by Manin Martin
Across the track, on the north 

side of Second Street was the 
Kewaskum Malt and Grain Com­
pany This was suppoosed to be 
the best in the mid west They 
manufactured malt It also was 
used to generate electricity and 
provided heat for several 
buildings in Kewaskum

Directly south of the Malt 
House, on First Street, is the 
Rosenheimer Mill.

On the corner of Fond du Lac 
and Second Street was a tavern 
Then proceeding north, the 
Legion building, which was the 
Lay home at one time.

Just beyond that was Dr. 
Hausmann's home and a small 
building housing his office.

On the west side of Fond du 
Lac Avenue, starting south of First 
Avenue, from North Avenue, was 
the Rosenheimer home and con­
tinuing southward were several 
open lots and th^n the 
Peschbacher home and the 
Peschbacher blacksmith shop 
This was later the first Chevy 
garage in Kewaskum.

Next was the Miller building, 
which was a furniture store and 
undertaker’s parlor which burned 
down nearly 50 years ago, but 
later rebuilt.

On the south side of Forest 
Avenue and Fond du Lac Avenue 
was the Rosenheimer Store, and 
back of that was their implement 
building. There may have been 
one or two more buildings after 
that.

Americans say Christmas 
in many different ways

A Christmas gathering, com 
plete with songs and presents, 
would he called a “Christmas 
party’ in Wisconsin, but not in 
many other places across the 
country

A Minnesotan might say he 
was attending “Christmas 
fools " Or in New York or 
Washington, "Christmas shin­
dig" might be the appropriate 
term

In Michigan you would say a 
“Christmas do " In Maryland, 
a “Christmas thing." In Utah, 
it may be “Christmas exer­
cises."

University of Wisconsin- 
Madison Prof Frederic (i 
Cassidy has s|K‘nl 14 years 
working on his “Dictionary of 
American Regional English' 
(DARE), a dictionary that will 
include expressions for

Auto Craft £

In the Service

Airman Cory A. Hurl
LACKLAND AIR FORCE 

BASE, San Antonio - Airman Cory 
A Hurl has graduated from Air 
Force basic training here.

During the six weeks of training 
the airman studied Air Force mis­
sion, organization and customs 
and received special training in 
human relations.

In addition, airmen who com­
plete basic training earn credits 
toward an associate degree 
through the Community College 
of “^ Air Force.

He is the son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Duane Feuerhammer of N2030 
City Road V Campbellsport

The airman is a 1992 graduate 
of Campbellsport High School

“Christmas gathering" and 
100,000 other terms

Cassidy intends DARI to be 
an accurate account of the 
“language of the people." Ue 
said, “The dictionary will in­
clude America’s folk language 
Il's the kind of language you 
gain from inheritance and not 
books

Cassidy expects DARI to be 
published in 19X0 He and his 
stall of nine have been catalog 
ing words from 1,002 com­
munities since 1970

So during this Christmas 
season if you're asked to attend 
a Californian “Christmas jam 
boree," be sure to lake a pres­
ent And if you are asked to 
lake part in a “Christmas 
affair," don't be embarrassed 
You'll probably spend a 
wholesome evening with pleas­
ant Pennsylvanians

■-Auto Service
ROGER & DAN’S 
AUTO SERVICE

“Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area '

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum ainipoyal

626-2888
24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE

Insurance Work Our Specialty 
Complete Auto Body Repair 

Unibody Repair 
Rental Cars Available 

Fast Service 
Serving the Area for IS Years

Conveniently located between West Bend and Kewaskum

338-0379



Kewaskum Statesman, Thursday, Dec. 3, 1992, Page 14

In the Service

Airman Jeffrey A. Prost
LACKLAND AIR FORCE 

BASE, San Antonio - Airman Jef­
frey A. Prost has graduated from 
Air Force basic training here.

During the six weeks of training 
the airman studied Air Force mis­
sion, organization and customs 
and received special training in 
human relations.

In addition, airmen who com­
plete basic training earn credits 
toward an associate degree 
through the Community College 
of the Air Force.

Prost is the son of Deborah J. 
Turdo of 547 Elmore Drive, 
Campbellsport.

He is a 1992 graduate of 
Frederick High School, Okla.

Holiday Lottery 
Tickets Available

MADISON... The annual holi­
day instant scratch-and-win game 
from the Wisconsin Lottery, Holi­
day Moola, features both instant 
and TV Winner prizes this year.

Holiday Moola, for the fourth 
time in the past four years, offers 
a holiday theme game with a 70 
percent priz£, payout. Initial 
deliveries of the limited edition 
game began Thursday, 
November 19, and continued 
through Wednesday, November 
25.

Holiday Moola offers the added 
bonus that its holiday 
predecessors did not. The game 
offers TV Winner prizes which pay 
$100 instantly and include a 
chance to win up to $64,500 more 
on the weekly MONEY GAME 
television show.

“We look for something special 
about this time each year," Player 
Relations Director Bill Clausius 
said. “Adding the TV Winner 
prize to the holiday game should 
make Holiday Moola a hot seller 
as winter weather moo-ves into 
Wisconsin."

Holiday Moola players mat­
ching three dollar amounts on a 
single ticket win prizes ranging 
from $1 to $200 instantly. Getting 
three TV symbols on a single 
ticket means the player is a Holi­
day Moola TV Winner.

A TV Winner receives a $100 
instant prize followed by a date to 
join the audience for a MONEY 
GAME show with additional prizes 
paid to the TV Winners.

The MONEY GAME, nearing its 
fourth full season of weekly 
telecasts, has awarded nearly $17 
million to TV Winners and Home 
Players.

In addition to TV Winners and 
instant prizes, non-winning Holi­
day Moola tickets may win bet­
ween $750 and $3,000 in the 
weekly Home Player drawing. 
Send five non-winning tickets cur­
rently on sale, including Holiday 
Moola, to Home Player, Madison, 
Wisconsin, 53775. Each week five 
Home Player entries are drawn 
and awarded cash prizes.

There are no small 
victories in the fight 

against heart disease

.American Heart 
^/ Association

Serving Your Area

GAS
Service
for

PHILGAS

Home * Farm or Industry
Cylinder & Bulk Deliveries

NO TANK CHARGE

Serving Gas Customers 
for Over 50 Years

BOEHLKE BOnLED 
GAS CORP.

Plants located at Jackson 
and Random Lake

West Bend 338-8011
Random Lake 994-2229

TOLL FREE 
1-800-448-3388

More Americans are 
now high school grad­
uates—78 percent— 
than at any other time 
in history.

‘Marketing My 
Service’ Forum at 
UW-Extension Dec. 10

In the past year, there has been 
tremendous growth in service­
type businesses. This growth is 
likely to continue and competition 
is likely to become even tighter. 
So, developing a "niche" in the 
marketplace becomes extremely 
important.

A two-hour Forum has been 
developed by UW-Extension to 
discuss "Marketing My Service” 
for Thursday, December 10 from 
7:00 to 9:00 p.m. The Forum will 
be held in Room 162 of the Cour­
thouse in Port Washington. The 
discussion will deal with questions 
like: HOW TO MAKE MY SER­
VICE MORE TANGIBLE, HOW 
TO PRICE MY SERVICE, HOW 
TO KEEP MY COMPETITIVE 
EDGE, AND YOUR CONCERNS.

Leading the Forum will be Mr. 
Don Heinz President of Don 
Heinz & Associates, Inc., a 
Brookfield marketing research 
and consulting firm. Since 1967, 
Don has worked with firms in 
Wisconsin and across the coun­
try to solve marketing problems 
and plan successful marketing 
strategies.

Don has helped retail firms, 
hospitals, clinics, repair firms, 
banks, insurance companies, 
community organizations and 
churches put the marketing con­
cept to work.

Don has degrees from UW- 
Madison, has served as Director 
of Marketing of a scientific instru­
ment firm, as a lecturer at UW- 
Whitewater and UW-Milwaukee, 
as well as Assistant Professor at 
Marquette University. He has 
authored numerous articles on 
marketing and is currently presi­
dent of the Milwaukee Chapter of 
the American Marketing 
Association.

“Businesses, especially service 
businesses, think they are uni­
que. But, the principles work 
across all business types. It is on­
ly a matter of selecting the 
strategies and tactics best suited 
to their specific situation,” says 
Don.

Call Chuck Wise at 
414/284-8288 to register your in­
terest or to get more information. 
There is a $10.00 charge for the 
evening. Call TODAY.

Marriage Licenses
Ann T. Porter, town of Richfield, 

and Thomas A. Ethen, town of 
Kewaskum. Wedding Nov. 24.

Mary Ann E. Nelson, Red 
Granite, and Henry F. Renard, 
West Bend. Wedding Dec. 2.

TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport

533-8094

KLEMME BROS WELL DRILLING INC.
Kewaskum Wl

Emergency Pump Service 
Well Inspection & Code Repair 

Pressure Tank Service 
Well Drilling 

Well Abandonment

CARL KLEMME 
414-626-4592

State License 
# 5935

Ido Ci day Cjift Ideas
Here’s a not-so-nutty 

idea for an excellent holi­
day present: pistachios! 
These delicious nuts from 
California make a great gift 
for just aboutany specialoc-

self.

casion when 
scooped into 
a fancy jar 
or a basket 
you’ve deco­
rated your-

You can also fill a deco­
rative container with pista­
chio cookies —a yummy
holiday treat! Try this 
mouth-watering recipe:

PISTACHIO WHITE
CHOCOLATE CHUNK 

COOKIES

Ingredients:
1 1/4 cups unsalted butter, 

at room temperature
1 cup granulated sugar
1 cup dark brown 

sugar, packed
2 eggs
2 tablespoons milk
2 teaspoons vanilla

2 1/2 cups flour
1 teaspoon each bak­
ing soda, baking pow­
der and salt

1 cup rolled oats
1 1/2 cups coarsely 

chopped, natural 
California pistachios, 
divided

1 package (10 ounces) 
white chocolate 
chunk-size chips*

Directions:
Preheat oven to 350 

degrees F. Cream butter 
and sugars together. Beat 
in eggs, milk and vanilla.

Pistachio Chocolate 
Chunk Cookies make a 
yummy holiday treat.

Combine flour, baking 
soda, baking powder and
salt. Process oats in
blender or food processor, 
leaving some texture. 
Gradually add flour mix­
ture and chopped oats to 
butter mixture, mixing 
well. Stir in 1 cup pista­
chios and white chocolate 
chips. Drop mixture by 
heaping teaspoons onto 
greased baking sheets, al­
lowing for spreading. 
Press remaining pistachios 
on top of cookie dough. 
Bake 8 to 10 minutes or 
until golden brown. Let 
cool slightly on sheet to set 
up. Makes 3 to 4 dozen.

* A 12-ounce package 
of small white chocolate or 
semi-sweet chips may be 
substituted for white
chocolate chunks.

For a free brochure with 
more recipes using pista­
chios, write to: California 
Pistachio Commission, 1915 
N. Fine Ave., Fresno, CA 
93727.

The lungs of a smoker are stained with tars and nicotine. 
You can clean your teeth but no one can wash out dirty 
lungs.

mi 
m3

MU'

Ogg

DUX

Beautifully Efficient
Custom bay and bow replacement windows 

from Great Lakes'^ Window.
No replacement windows lower for improved comfort and fuel 
your energy costs more than- efficiency. Plus Great Lakes 
those from Great ukes. Our bay Windows offer these other 
and bow windows feature fusion- advantages.
welding and high-R insulation

All vinyl construction eliminates the need to caulk and paint. 
Highest R factor for warmer windows.
Lowest tested air infiltration to assure added comfort.

► Available in solid White, Camel, 
Earthtone and optional Natural and 
Golden Oak Wood train finishes.

NOW INSTALLED BY

GREAT LAKES’ 
WINDOW

FREE Estimates

HEBERER BROS. CONST.
626-2598 626-2491 626-2903 626-2384

118 Hwy. H, West 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040
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Marine Lance CpI. Steven A 

Liegl, son of Steven A. and Diane 
P. Liegl of 1170 Hillside Drive, 
Kewaskum, recently participated 
in a Korean Incremental Training 
Program in Pohang, Korea with 
2nd Battalion, 8th Marines, Camp 
Lejeune, NC.

The battalion conducted joint 
live-fire exercises and small unit 
level training with Korean 
Marines.

The 1991 graduate of 
Kewaskum High School joined 
the Marine Corps in June, 1991.

Navy Seaman Recruit Ralph A. 
Boettcher, son of Cliff and 
Marlene R. Boettcher of W. 2556 
Auburn Ashford Road, Camp­
bellsport, recently returned 
aboard the amphibious transport 
dock USS Trenton, homeported 
in Norfolk, Virginia from a six­
month deployment to the Mediter­
ranean as part of Mediterranean 
Amphibious Ready Group 2-92.

Elements of the ready group 
participated in several joint exer­
cises including Display Deter­
mination - 92, the largest combin­
ed NATO exercise in over four 
years. Ships from the ready group 
also participated in Operation 
Provide Promise, the United Na­
tions’ humanitarian relief effort in 
former Yugoslavia.

Their deployment exemplified 
the Navy’s new strategy entitled, 
“...From the Sea,” which shifts 
the sea services” focus from a 
global threat to regional 
challenges and concentrates on 

.near land warfare and maneuver 
from the sea.

The new direction emphasizes 
strategic deterrence and defense, 
forward presence, crisis response 
and reconstruction. It will provide 
the U.S. with naval expeditionary 
forces operating forward from the 
sea that are shaped for joint 
operations and tailored for na­
tional needs.

USS Trenton transports and 
lands Marines, their equipment 
and supplies using embarked lan­
ding craft, amphibious vehicles 
and helicopters. The Navy and 
Marine Corps “sea-air-land” team 
is capable of a full range of action, 
from port visits and humanitarian 
relief to major offensive 
operations.

Boettcher visited ports 
throughout the Mediterranean 
during the deployment.

The 1988 graduate of Camp­
bellsport High School joined the 
Navy in July, 1991.

4 subscription to the Kewaskum 
Statesman - a gift that keeps on 
giving all year long! Phone 
626-2626.

^Cold
Quarter fi 
and Half /A 
Barrels PE 

always ^r 
available at ^
Kuehl’s Zj 
SUDS& ^
SPIRITS
355 Main St. 
Kewaskum /

Phone 626-4565
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As Santa ( Ians is busy pre­
paring gifts for boys and girls 
in his chilly igloo he may be 
thinking of his days as St 
Nicholas Instead of rosy 
cheeks, this gentleman had a 
golden tan from the warm. 
Mediterranean sun The his­
torical Nicholas was born 
sometime in the fourth cen­
tury in Myra, a city on the 
warm southern shore of Tur­
key. Myra, now known as 
Demre, later beatified its be­
loved townsman. Stories tell 
of Nicholas' love for young 
people and his fondness for 
giving gifts in secret.

A story suggests how the 
tradition of filling stockings 
with presents started Nicholas 
wanted to help a poor family. 
He climbed to their roof and 
tossed a bag of gold down the 
chimney. The three daughters 
of the house had hung their 
stockings to dry near the fire­
place and the gold landed in 
the stockings. Other people 
heard the story and began 
putting their empty stockings 
out at night. They got presents 
too!

* * *

Many Americans are finding 
the gifts that St. Nicholas gave 
in Turkey centuries ago make 
fine gifts today. From carpets 
to silks to foodstuffs, Turkish 
products are well known for 
their quality and value.

Habitat Healers

This informal, but informed 
group meets each Tuesday to 
pursue a variety of activities 
related to managing the habitats 
of Riveredge. Prairie seed collec­
ting, systematic surveys of prairie 
insects, transplanting of 
woodland wildflowers and just 
musing are all within the purview 
of activities of this work-learn 
group.

Anyone who thinks this sounds 
like fun may join in at Riveredge 
Nature Center on Tuesday, 
December 8, from 9 a.m. to Noon.

Call Riveredge at 375-2715 
(metro) or 675-6888 (local) for 
more information.

Riveredge is a non-profit, 350 
acre natural sanctuary and 
educational organization, pro­
viding environmental programs 
for all ages. It is located in 
Ozaukee County, on Highway Y, 
one mile north of Newburg, bet­
ween Saukville and West Bend.

W« now lake
nee#
• or

Micro waves

we wil no longer be 
able Io accept

foriecydnfl

LYNN'S Wastepaper Recycling
I2l Island Ave.
West Bend • 334-9542
Open daily
7 am-4 pm; Sat. 7 am-Noon

Shown above are the friendly guys from Neuville Chevrolet-GEO during their 
recent van/truck sale. Obviously, these guys believe in service with a smile. 
Left to right: Ross Krautkramer, Bob Polan (representing A&J Vans). Steve 
Kuehmichel. Steve Cundy and Joe. Neuville.

turkey/bun, buttered corn, pineap­
ple cup, berry crunch, milk.

Thursday, Dec 10 — Chix 
drumstixs, whipped potatoes, 
green beans, muffin/butter, milk.

Friday, Dec. 11 — Toasted 
Cheese, peanut butter & jelly 
sandwich, apple sauce, tri-tatar, 
M & M cookie, milk.

KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 
SCHOOLS

Monday, Dec. 7 — Italian 
spaghetti, French bread w/garlic 
butter, green salad w/asst. dress­
ings, milk & brownie. ‘ Sur-prize 
Day - Elem.

Tuesday, Dec. 8 — Quarter­
pounder or Mr. Rib/bun, (H.S. & 
M.S.), hamburger/bun (E), 
French fries, green beans, milk 
and an M & M fun pack.

Wednesday, Dec. 9 — Wiener 
winks (2 at H.S. & M.S.) tangy 
baked beans, chilled peaches, 
milk and pumpkin bread. (Salad 
Bar - H.S. & M.S.)

Thursday, Dec. 10— Breakfast 
pizza & a string cheese stick (E.) 
pizza buns (H.S. & M.S.), hash 
brown potatoes, pineapple tidbits, 
milk & a peanut butter, choc, chip 
bar.

Friday, Dec. 11 — Ham sub­
marine sandwich, golden potato 
rounds, (E.), scalloped potatoes 
(H.S. & M.S.) whole kernel corn, 
milk and ice cream.

PUBLIC NOTICE
A Public Informational Meeting will be held on Tues­
day, Dec. 15, 1992, to present the proposed road­
way design for the scheduled 1995 reconstruction 
of Fond du Lac Avenue in the Village of Kewaskum.

An open house meeting will be held from 4 to 7 p.m. 
at the Village of Kewaskum Municipal Building, 
located at 204 First Street.
Representatives from the Wisconsin Department of 
Transportation and Mid-State Associates, the 
engineering firm that is designing the project, will be 
available to explain exhibits and answer questions 
regarding the combination resurfacing and 
reconstruction project.
All affected property owners and interested citizens 
are encouraged to attend. Written and oral com­
ments will be documented and considered in the 
design process. This will be the second of two infor­
mational meetings for the project.

12 3 21

HOLY TRINITY 
SCHOOL

Monday, Dec. 7 — Ham­
burger/bun, cheese, lettuce, 
tomatoe slices, baked beans, 
peach slices, crisp rice bar, milk.

Tuesday, Dec. 8 — Soup & 
sandwich, chicken noodle soup, 
egg salad sandwich, peanut but­
ter sandwich, pear half, veg- 
gies/dip, peanutbutter bar, milk.

Wednesday, Dec. 9 — Hot

luminum Cans for Recycling
Help keep Your Community

Environmentally clean

RECYCLE NOW!!
Competitive prices paid forcopper, 

brass, aluminum,lead batteries, 
cardboard,junk automobiles & iron.

Make a Career Change in 1993
The Cedar Lake Home is now accepting applica­
tions for our next Nursing Assistant Orientation 
Class. No experience required. Both full time and 
part time staff are offered these benefits:
‘Health Insurance
‘Ongoing Education
‘Generous Vacation Plan
‘Shift & Weekend Differentials
‘Scholarships Available for LPN & RN Education

NOT JUST A JOB.
A CAREER!

INTERVIEW DEADLINE FOR JANUARY 
ORIENTATION IS DECEMBER 29

CEDAR CAMPUSES
5595 Hwy. Z, West Bend 

334-9487, Ext. 161
Equal Opportunity Employer
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DNR Outdoor Report

Spring Turkey Application Caring for Your 
Deadline is December 10th R©al Christmas Tree

(November 28th & 29th)
Hunting conditions on opening 

weekend of Wisconsin’s 1992 
gun deer season were good to 
above average. More than 
126,000 deer had been registered 
statewide as of Monday, and 
department wildlife managers an­
nounced that an extension of the 
nine-day season .was not 
necessary.

In Douglas and Bayfield coun­
ties, the harvest appeared to be 
down significantly, even though 
fresh snow late last week provid­
ed excellent tracking conditions 
and made the deer more visible. 
The harvest was also down 
elsewhere in the northwest, due 
in part to a lot of standing corn, 
a lack of snow, and muddy 
conditions.

Numbers were up in the 
10-county North Central District. 
Hunters registered just over 
21,000 deer on opening weekend, 
compared with 15,000 a year ago, 
when the season opened under 
near blizzard conditions. The cen­
tral counties were without snow at 
mid-week and the marshes were 
very wet.

In Florence County, back roads 
were in poor condition after three 
inches of rain fell in that area last 
week; the woods remained snow- 
covered. While the crusted snow 
aids visibility and tracking, it 
makes for some very noisy con­
ditions. After the first two days, 
the harvest was up 25 percent in 
Florence County.

In Shawano County, heavy 
rains resulted in wet, sloppy hun­
ting conditions. Deer didn’t move 
around much, and not -a lot of 
them were seen. In spite of that, 
opening day registrations were up 
40 percent at Shawano. The 
harvest was also good in 
Waupaca County, with many nice 
bucks taken. Problems were 
reported with hunters shooting 
deer in one management unit and 
running them to another unit 

. where their permits were valid.
Good hunting success was 

reported on public lands along the 
lower Wisconsin State Riverway. 
Hunters should take along hip 
boots when hunting on these 
lands. Those who used boats 
must conform to boating regula­
tions. Wardens were issuing cita­
tions for various boating and hun­
ting violations.

In Columbia County, hunters 
were harvesting good numbers of 
deer in spite of flooded marshes 
and a lot of standing corn. Always 
remember to use great caution 
when making drives through stan­
ding cornfields. Deer registrations 
were up over last year in several 
southern counties.

In Dane, Jefferson and Rock 
counties, hunting pressure was 
somewhat low and registrations 
were down slightly over last year. 
The deer were being harbored in 
large acreages of standing corn. 
At the New Glarus registration 
station in Green County, a lot of 
one-antlered deer were brought 
in.

Wildlife managers reported that 
the early bow deer season went 
well in the new Madison Metro 
unit, where numerous deer were 
taken and the harvest was up 
over last year. Pheasant hunting 
is good in Rock County.

There’s not much fishing activi­
ty. In the southeast, the rivers are 
high and muddy following recent 
rainfall, and little or no action is 
occurring. Anglers are hooking a 
few steelhead near the dam on 
the Root River in Racine County, 
but are having a tough time lan­

ding the fish because of the fast 
current. Brown and brook trout 
are starting to spawn in Black 
River Falls area streams. Water 
levels on both the Mississippi and 
Wisconsin rivers are coming up. 
Ice hasn’t formed yet. Sauger are 
being taken below the Dubuque 
dam. A thin layer of ice is reported 
on many waters in the north, but 
it’s not safe to travel on.

With each passing weather 
front, more bald eagles are mov­
ing into the La Crosse area and 
other locations in western and 
southern Wisconsin where they’ll 
have open water for the winter.

A reminder that you cannot cut 
holiday trees on county lands. 
You may, however, obtain a per­
mit to cut a tree in the Che- 
quamegon or Nicolet national 
forests. The permits cost $3.00 
each, and there is a limit of three 
per family. For more information, 
contact a National Forost Service 
office.

Farm Income Tax 
Class Date Changed

Moraine Park Technical Col­
lege's Farm Income Tax class, 
originally scheduled to begin on 
Wednesday, Dec. 9, has been 
rescheduled to begin on Tuesday, 
Dec. 8, at 8 p.m.

Farm Income Tax, course 
094-430-001, is a 20-hour course 
on preparing farm business in­
come taxes and will provide the 
latest information for the prepara­
tion of your 1992 farm taxes.

To register for this course call 
the Fond du Lac Campus at 
929-2100.

Q. WHERE DOES YOUR FISHING
& HUNTING LICENSE DOLLAR GO?

LOWER ENERGY COSTS!
• Save on energy bills with up to 

12.) S.E.E R. efficiency and 
94.6% I.C.S. A.F.U.E.

• Free estimates with 
NO obligation.

• Full service by trained 
professionals.

Call before the seasonal rush!

TEMPSTAR
Heating and Cooling Products

mu

L.K. HEATING & 
AIR CONDITIONING 

357 Main St., Kewaskum
PHONE 626-4342

PUBLIC AUCTION 
KEWASKUM, Wl

SUNDAY, DECEMBER 6TH 9:00AM 
8:00am Inspection

LOCATION: Hwy.'s 45 or 28 to Kewaskum, east at stop & go lights on 
Hwy. 28, 3 blocks to County "S", then north 11A miles to PAUL 
AUCTION CO. hall.
AUCTIONEER'S NOTE: Richard & Clem Cwlcllnskl, rural Elkhart 
Lake are selling their large country home and moving to small 
quarters, we are selling their 30 year collection ol antiques and 
collectibles. In addition we have the Janette Pullen household and 
antiques, giving up housekeeping plus Items from Ken & Harriet 
Jahncke, all of West Bend. Interesting sale.
HOUSEHOLD, ETC: 3 cushion sofa, like new; pr. occasional chairs; 
sofa bed; pr. walnut dropleaf end tables; Boston rocker; small portable 
bar with 2 stools; floor and table lamps; wall hangings; linens and 
bedding; Canister vacuum; costume |ewelry; pots; pans; dishes; 
glassware and household box lots. Extension dining table, folds Into 
cabinet and other Items.

ANTIQUES* THINGS OLD
FURNITURE: Nice marble top and back splash commode; fruit 
carved pulls; (3) oak 3 door bookcases, 11s mission style; oak curved 
glass china cabinet; oak side-by-side secretary-bookcase with mirror; 
Governor Winthrop writing desk; Duncan Phyfe dining room set, 6 
chairs and leaf; serving board; china cabinet; mahogany twin 
bedroom set, dresser with mirror, highboy and night stand; small pie 
crust tilt-top table and other pieces.
CONCERTINAS & ACCORDIANS: German Tanzbar PLAYER 
concertina with 20 rolls; Lange 56 button concertina; Hohner button 
accordlan; ST metronome.
THE REST OF THE SALE: Red Wing pantry Jar with lid; Sleepy Eye 
#4 pitcher, mint; Red Wing and other stoneware to 20 gal.; over 50 pc’s 
Jewel Tea dinner and kitchenware; several nice pc's flow blue; GwTW 
Sius table oil lamps; cuckoo clock; (2) 400 day clocks; pigeon blood 

all light shade plus lamp chimneys and light shades; 4 old floor 
radios; several windup tin toys; early Tinker Toy motor; battery toys; 
Dealer Pro-Mo cars; riding fire engine; cased Japanese dolls In 
traditional dress; cookie jars; McCoy, Shawnee and other pottery pc's; 
lots of beer steins, older and contemporary, beer trays, mugs, etc.; 
several Jim Beam vehicle decanters ana others; over 40 boxed 
collector plates, Rockwell, etc.; several Steiff small animals; Stangl 
#3925 bird; HUMMEL #460 dealers plaque plus Goebel figurines; 4 
Royal Doulton Toby jugs plus Sandlands pc s; porcelain and bisque 
figurines; Occ. Japan, etc; over 20 pc's carnival glass; decorated china 
pc's, Nippon, cracker jar, etc.; Baccarat Crystal In orig. boxes; Davy 
Crocket bowls; Cherry Boy statue; Doulton "Balloon Seller"; pattern 
and depression glass; Duncan swans; Mary Gregory type glass; 
opalescent pc's; Huby cut to clear pc's; Black Amethyst; service for 
12 Royal Doulton "Grantham" dinnerware set; Opal-cranberry 
hobnail pitcher and 6 tumblers; old 78 records; Black collectibles; F&F 
syrup, shakers, etc.; old military nose bag for horse; nice grey granite 
convex water pitcher and many other Items.

Charbrolled brats, hamburgers & refreshments

Jim & Mike Paul • Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
(414) 338-3030

ApC TIO N^COT]

APPRAISALS - REAL ESTATE 
INDOOR OR ON-SITE AUCTIONS

MADISON... Even though the 
gun deer season has just drawn 
to a close, hunters who plan to 
participate in the 1993 spring 
Wisconsin turkey hunt have until 
December 10th to get their ap­
plications in, said Department of 
Natural Resources (DNR) Upland 
Wildlife Ecologist Bill Vander 
Zouwen.

“The 1993 spring turkey hunt 
promises to be yet another record 
for Wisconsin,’’ Vander Zouwen 
said. “I expect that the turkey 
harvest will exceed 10,000 birds 
for the first time ever.”

A total of 62,160 permits will be 
available in 31 zones and 11 state 
parks. Six of these zones will be 
opened in 1993 for the first time. 
Five state parks will be open to 
turkey hunting for disabled 
hunters only.
“Hunters may pick up with their 

permit application an information 
sheet that shows a map of the 
zones, the number of permits 
available and the past success 
rates for each zone,” Vander 
Zouwen said.

This spring some hunters will 
be able to harvest two bearded 
turkeys.

Any permits remaining after the 
first drawing will be issued by 
means of a second drawing for 
hunters who applied by 
December 10th but were not 
selected in the first drawing. On­
ly one application and application 
fee is necessary.

All permits will be mailed to 
successful applicants by January 
31.
“Fall 1992 turkey hunters 

should save their turkey stamp for 
use in spring because it is valid 
for both seasons,” Vander 
Zouwen explained. “However, a 
separate spring turkey license is 
required for the spring hunt.”

Hunters are encouraged to at­
tend one of the free turkey hunter

education clinics sponsored by 
the DNR and the National Wild 
Turkey Federation.

Clinics focus on turkey biology 
and behavior, hunting techni­
ques, safety and hunter­
landowner relationships. About 40 
of these 31/2 hour clinics will be 
held around Wisconsin between 
February and April.

Clinic locations and times will 
be mailed to successful spring 
turkey license applicants.

Christmas for Wildlife
Join Riveredge Nature Center 

on Sunday, December 6, between 
1:30 and 3:30 to help make some 
super treats for our wild friends.

They will be making chickadee 
delight, Christmas pies, seedy 
cookies and a host of treats to 
decorate their wild tree.

The fee is $3.00 for adults and 
$2.00 for children.

Call Riveredge at 675-6888 
(local) or 375-2715 (metro) for 
more information.

Riveredge is a non-profit, 350 
acre sanctuary and educational 
organization, providing en­
vironmental programs for all ages. 
It is located in Ozaukee County on 
Highway Y, one mile north of 
Newburg between Saukville and 
West Bend,.

To add length to short stemmed flowers, slip 
stems into drinking straws before placing in vase.

Trees are thirsty! To allow 
your tree to “drink” in the 
water it needs, make a fresh cut 
off the bottom of the trunk end. 
(This removes the sap that has 
collected on the butt edge, so 
tree can take on water).

Put your tree in a large water­
bearing stand and make sure to 
always keep water in the stand. 
A real tree may use between 
two pints and a gallon of water a 
day, especially the first few 
days in the home. If the stand 
gets dry, a new seal will form at 
the end of the trunk and the tree 
cannot take on any more water. 
A real Christmas tree with high 
moisture content will not 
support combustion.

If you buy your tree several 
days before it will be set up, 
store the tree in a cool, shelter­
ed place like a garage or porch.

Locate your tree away from 
heat sources: fireplaces, 
radiators, space heaters, etc.

Check over all electrical 
lights, cords and connections 
before you decorate the tree. Do 
not use decorations with worn 
or frayed cords or light sockets. 
Never use lighted candles or 
combustible decorations of any 
kind.

Sit back and enjoy the fresh 
pine fragrance and delight in 
the natural beauty of a Real 
Christmas Tree.



Ke
w

as
ku

m
 St

at
es

m
an

, T
hu

rs
da

y,
 De

c.
 3,

 19
92

, P
ag

e 1
7

Put Yourself in the mi amthvm 
Marketplace, in the UAN« »W

ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE
RATE: $2.00 up to 20 words; over 20 words * add 10c per word

NEW CLASSIFIED AD POLICY
All classified ads must now be paid in advance. Classified ads phoned in or brought 
to our office must be paid by noon on Tuesday of the week you want the ad publish­
ed. The ONLY exception will be for those businesses who have regular running ac­
counts with the Statesman.

spotlight on health

Dressing Right Helps Prevent Hypothermia

SANTA FOR HIRE — Anytime 
Holiday parties, Christmas Eve, 
Christmas Days or before. Call 
anytime. Phone 626-2471.12-3-4p

FOR SALE — Fishing rods $3.00 
to $10.00. Also reels and some 
lures. Ph. 626-4937. 11-26-4p

CHRISTMAS WRAP — 33 ft. 
rolls, $1.75 ea.; also toy dolls, 
trucks and other gift items. Ph. 
626-4937. 11-26-4p

CHRISTMAS TREES — For sale, 
very reasonable. Call 626-4715.

12-3-3t

FOR SALE — Kewaskum Town 
Shop, 9340 Hwy. 45, Kewaskum. 
45’ x 48’ aluminum sided pole 
building, 1.27 acres. Shop area 
2,016 sq. ft., blower system heat; 
18’ x 8’ enclosed office, panelled, 
carpeted, electric heat. Town of 
Kewaskum is accepting sealed 
bids. Minimum bid $40,000. Bids 
due 12/21/92, 7 p.m.; open bids 
at Town Board Meeting 
December 21, 1992, 7:30 p.m., 
Labor Hall, 1230 Fond du Lac 
Avenue, Kewaskum. Building 
open for inspection by appoint­
ment. Call Clerk 626-2550 or 
Chairman 626-4716. 11 -19-6t

FOR SALE — 1980 Oldsmobile 
Delta 88 two-door, $1,100 or best 
offer. Call 626-4565 or 626-4518. 

11-19-tf

WANTED TO BUY — Old Orien- 
tial Rugs. Any size or condition. 
1-800-443-7740. 11-25-2tp

SEWING MACHINES
Scratched in shipment. New 
Deluxe Sewing Machines, no at­
tachments required. $93 each. 
Terms available. Sewing Machine 
Warehouse, 212 Main St., 
Kewaskum. 12-3-3t

CIDER PRESSING — Empire 
Mills, W4478 4th St. Rd., two 
miles east of Fond du Lac on 
Hwy. T. Open Saturdays, 8 a.m. 
to noon. Open Sat. thru Nov. 28 
Call (414) 921-9509. 10-22-tf

FREE — Electric stove with 
microwave oven on top. Ph. 
626-4565 or 626-4518. 12-3-tf

SERVICE OFFERED 
SPECIAL ON NOW 

$ave, carpet cleaning at it’s finest. 
Truck mounted unit. Commercial, 
residential and apartments. 
Kohlsville Karpet Kleaning, 
owner/operator, Gene Schuppel, 
7723 Hwy. W (Kohlsville), West 
Bend. Call now! 629-5764.

11-19-6t

Call for Free 
Market Analysis

NORB 
ROHLINGER
Eighteen years 
experience in 
meeting people's 
real estate needs

Residence 
626-2332

Tnm^jer
J REALTY J 

334-1700
1700 E. Washington St., Wot Bend

FIREWOOD FOR SALE — Finest 
quality seasoned red and white 
oak. Cut, split and delivered. $125 
cord. Immediate or later delivery. 
Inspections welcome. Phone 
922-1575. 9-24-tf

HELP WANTED — Daytime 
cook, weekdays and weekends; 
adult waitresses, days and even­
ings. Eckl’s Main Street Inn. Call 
626-4328. 7-23-tf

HELP WANTED — RN or LPN, 
casual hours, available on all 
shifts. No weekends. Small 26 
bed skilled facility. Come and join 
our friendly, professional staff. 
Contact Evelyn Schmidt, D O N., 
Beechwood Rest Home, N1495 
W. Hwy. A, Kewaskum, Wl 
626-4258 or 994-4717. 7-2-tf

HELP WANTED — Certified 
nurses aides. P.M. shift with oc­
casional rotation to days and 
nights. Sign on bonus - com­
petitive wages. Come join our pro­
fessional, caring staff. Contact 
Evelyn Schmidt, DON, 
Beechwood Rest Home, N1495 
W., Hwy A, Kewaskum, Wl 53040. 
626-4258 or 944-4717. 5-14-tf

HELP WANTED — Male or 
female to milk cows in parlor. Full 
or part-time. Call 338-6308.

12-3-4p

HELP WANTED — Dietary aide, 
part-time, a.m./p.m. Relief posi­
tion. Call St. Joseph Convent, 
Campbellsport, 533-8351.

11-26-2t

DIETARY — Work part-time in a 
challenging, fast-paced dietary 
dept. If you are a team player who 
is quality minded and enjoys a 
variety of duties, you are urged to 
apply. Our benefit package in­
cludes health insurance, vaca­
tion, pension plan and much 
more. Contact Cedar Campuses, 
5595 Hwy. Z, West Bend, 
334-9487 Ext. 161, Equal Oppor­
tunity Employer. 11-26-2t

BERTRAM SIDING 
AND

HOME IMPROVEMENT
Vinyl and Aluminum Siding 

Custom Windows and Doors
Overhang Trim - Roofing - Gutters 

Repair Work - Insulation
10 Years Experience 

533-8599
11-12-4p

BABYSITTER NEEDED — For 
two-year-old, Tues., and Thurs., 3 
to 5 p.m. Call 626-8285. 12-3-tf

HELP WANTED
Part-Time Office Cleaning 

Regular part-time office cleaning 
help needed immediately. Must 
be able to work independently to 
vaccum, dust, mop floors, empty 
wastebaskets, clean restrooms, 
etc. Evening hours Mon. through 
Fri., Some benefits included. App­
ly in person at Regal Ware, Inc., 
1675 Reigle Drive, Kewaskum, 
between 8 a.m. and 4 p.m. An 
Equal Opportunity Employer.

12-3-1t

Want to buy or sell? Try a Statesman 
classified ad. 626-2626.

ONE STALL and outside boar­
ding. large pasture - Full service 
- References available. Call 
533-5100.11-5-tf

FOR RENT — Kewaskum brand 
new 2-bedroom apartment 
available. January 1st. All new ap­
pliances, water & sewer included, 
garage also available. Call 
626-8760. 12-3-tf

FOR RENT — Eden. Deluxe 2 
bedroom apartment. Includes 
garage, all appliances, air condi­
tioner, washer and dryer, cable 
ready. No pets. $525 per mo. Ph. 
477-4561 or 477-4793. 12-3-2t

FOR RENT — Deluxe two 
bedroom apartment in 
Kewaskum, appliances included. 
Call 626-4321 or 626-2653. 

10-29-tf

FOR RENT — One, two and three 
bedroom apartments and 
townhouses. Rustic Timbers 
Apartments. Phone 334-1395.

4-30-tf

RESIDENTIAL — Building lots for 
sale. Approximately four miles 
north of West Bend. Terms: Call 
334-7306. Licensee/Owner.4-30-tf

WANTED TO RENT — Due to job 
relocation, family needs house, 
condo, or townhouse, excellent 
references. Call 334-1577.12-3-4p

WORK WANTED — Lloyd’s 
Home Maintenance, No job too 
small. Repairs, remodeling, 
carpentry, painting, varnishing, 
wallpaper, woodgraining, ceramic 
tile, etc. Lloyd M. Ebert 533-8013.

4-30-tf

HAVE BUYERS — For country or 
village homes within 3 miles of 
Kewaskum. If you are thinking of 
selling, call Ann Enright, 
Hometown Realty of West Bend. 
338-5656 or 692-2607 collect.

5-21-tf

Instead of Spending 
$$$ to Heat Your 
Old Home This 
Winter...

Spend it wisely on a 
new energy efficient 
KIRST BUILT HOME!

Our homes EXCEED re­
quirements for the 
Wisconsin Energy Code 

New shur-dri 
foundation system

HURRY!! WHILE RATES 
ARE DOWN!

KIRST 
BUILDERS

411 Main St. 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040 

626-4392

Surprising to many outdoor 
enthusiasts is that most cases 
of hypothermia develop in air 
temperatures between 30 and 
50 degrees Simply put, hypo­
thermia occurs when your 
body has lower than normal 
body temperature Symptoms 
of this dangerous condition 
include shivering, confusion, 
sleepiness, stiffening of the 
arms and legs, unconsciousness 
and'coma

To avoid hypothermia, ex­
perts recommend dressing in 
layers of clothing that keep 
you comfortably warm no 
matter how dreary the weather 
This is called layering and the 
trick is to sandwich just the 
right amount of warm air be 
tween each layer Too lit th1 
and your body loses heat; too 
much and you will perspire, 
causing a cooling effect that 
can increase your heat loss by 
25 percent

To avoid this problem, the 
first layer of your clothing 
system must be breathable 
and well insulated Many 
outdoor experts recommend 
clothing made from a new 
Du Pont-certified fabric called 
“Thermax." This fabric is

BICYCLES — Sales and Service 
Wally’s Bike Shop, 208 North 
Ave., Kewaskum. 4-30-tf

SEWING — Will do light mending 
and alterations. Call 626-4495. 

4-30-tf

TOM CLARK’S TREE SERVICE 
& STUMP REMOVAL — 
Reasonable rates. Free 
estimates. Call 626-2513 4-30-tf

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 
626-2888 4-30-tf

4 classified ad is a BIG bargain. 
To place yours, call 626-2626.

^Hometown
REALTY

OF WEST BEND, INC.
2375 W. Washington St

338-5656
OPEN HOUSE SUNDAY - 1 to 3 p.m

DIRECTIONS Hwy 45 N to Old Bridge Rd 
East to Alpine Lane (NM2 Alpine) * REDUCED - LOW TAXES *

4 bedroom Colonial on country acre Large 
family room with natural fireplace flanked 
by bookshelves, formal dining room, many 
quality cabinets line the roomy kitchen 
Beautifully landscaped yard #24 Ack for 
Ann Enright. 692 260 7

Country Reflections Condominiums of Kewaskum
#••.•00 Luxury 2 bedroom units

In-Unit laundry
2 bathrooms
Deluxe kitchen with appliances
Garages and parking
Beautiful view of Kettle Moraine Hills 
Be among the first for a good '.election
Call Collect Ann Enright, 692 2607 
* SHOWINGS BY APPOINTMENT*

VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM COLONIAL
Village of Kewaskum Colonial Four 
spacious bedrooms, family room with par­
tial open staircase, beautifully decorated, 
quality construction Desirable location 
near park #15 Call Ann at 692-2607

VACANT LAND
BUILD your new home in this quiet country subdivision 1 0? acres that percs for a conven 
tional septic system $10,900 Call Darlene Kremer 334 9562 *200
OVER ’/» ACRE parcel in country subdivision just minutes from West Bend $9,900 Call Darlene
Kremer 334 9562 *202
WINDY ACRES SUBDIVISION I wo 2 acre country lots Beautiful view Only$17 500 Call Ann 
collect 692 2607 *216
7 5 BEAUTIFUL ACRES with Mink Creel- running thru Wonderful scenic views *214 $28 900
Call Ann Enright collect 692 2607
2 97 ACRE WOODED LOT sloped to the south for energy efficient dwelling If you enjoy privacy 
and nature this lot is for you1 *220 $23 900 Call Ann Enright Collect 692 2607

Dressing right in dreary 
weather means sandwich­
ing just the right amount 
of warm air between each 
layer of clothing ______  

based on an old design that 
mimics polar bear fur. one of 
the warmest of all natural fi­
bers. “Thermax" creates pock 
ets of warmed air around 
your body and keeps the body 
dry by "wicking" heat-robbing 
perspiration away from thi* 
skin The second layer should 
be made of loose, lofty fabrics 
that trap significant amounts 
of air but no moisture Be­
cause the outer layer profits 
you train the hostile elements, 
it should be resistant to both 
wind and rain

By following these simple 
rules on dressing you can take 
the chill out of your winter 
activities.

Holiday Craft Show
A Holiday Craft Show will be 

held December 12 and 13 at the 
West Bend Outlet Mall located at 
180 Island Avenue in Downtown 
West Bend.

Thre will be hundreds of last 
minute unique gift ideas including 
quality handcrafted jewelry, wood 
toys, dried floral swags, 
miniatures, dolls, appliqued and 
painting clothing, quilted 
Christmas tree skirts, hand carv 
ed walking sticks and much more

The hours for the craft sale are 
9:30 a m. to 6 p.m. on Saturday 
and 10 a m to 6 p.m. on Sunday 
There is free parking, admission 
and drawings every V? hour

Darlene Kremer 
Ann Enright.....  
Wendy Coulter.. 
Agnes Jelic.... 
Marilyn Filler... 
Lynn McBride...

334 9562 
692 2607
338 3296 
488 3122 
338 0313
334 9622

REALTORS'
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Plans Announced for 
UMC Recognition Dinner

MILWAUKEE — Indianapolis 
Motor Speedway president Tony 
George has been named the reci­
pient of the 1993 Tom Marchese 
Award.

Named for Marchese, the fam­
ed Milwaukee Mile auto racing 
promoter, the award will be 
presented at the Wisconsin 
Motorsports Charities Recogni­
tion Dinner at the County Inn 
Hotel and Convention Center in 
Waukesha on Friday, January 8, 
1993.

That event, now in its second 
year, is already near the sellout 
mark of 500 people.

Over the years, such racing 
greats as four time Indy 500 
champion A.J. Foyt, Indianapolis 
Speedway president Tony 
Hulman, Road America founder 
Cliff Tufte, broadcaster Chris 
Economaki, Indy car official and

Annual Christmas 
Bird Count Dec. 19 
At Rive redge Center

If you enjoy birds, have some 
basic identification skills, and 
would like to do something prac­
tical to help ornithologists obtain 
valuable bird population trend 
data, join in on Saturday, 
December 19th, at Riveredge 
Nature Center, Newburg, for their 
annual Christmas Bird Count!

The goal of the Christmas Bird 
Count is to determine how many 
and what kinds of birds are living 
in or passing through a certain 
area on a certain day (dawn to 
dusk). Annual results of the count 
are compared to determine 
changes in the total number of 
species as well as in the popula­
tions of each species from year to 
year.

Information gathered from 
these counts can be used to study 
the effect of seed crop fluctua­
tions, weather, and the influence 
of man on birds. Birds sighted in 
the count fall into four categories; 
permanent residents, winter 
visitors, late migrators and 
rarities.

You may participate in the 
count in one of two ways. As a 
field counter, you will travel in an 
assigned area from dawn until 
dusk counting by sight or by 
sound all birds encountered. Over 
the years groups have formed 
that usually count the same sec­
tion yearly.

First time counters will be plac­
ed in either a section needing 
help, or by location of the par­
ticipants choice. The other option 
is to observe your feeder at home 
within the count area on the count 
day, for one hour in the morning 
and one hour in the afternoon. 
Feeder counters are especially 
needed to make the count more 
complete.

This year will mark Riveredge's 
24th year of participation in the 
count on behalf of and in coopera­
tion with, the Wisconsin Society 
for Ornithology. The survey area 
that will be covered by Riveredge 
is a circle 15 miles in diameter 
bounded by Huiras Lake to the 
north, Cedarburg to the south, 
West Bend Airport to the west and 
Port Washington Harbor to the 
east.

If you are interested in par­
ticipating in the count, or have any 
questions, contact the Center at 
675-6888 (local) or 375-2715 
(metro).

Milwaukee native Ted Lake, and 
legendary Indy car builders Dale 
Drake and Louis Meyer have all 
received replicas of the original 
award.

Kuehn also initiated a scholar­
ship award in 1968 which still ex­
ists in his name today. The $4,000 
award will this year go to Nicole 
Wolfgang, daughter of Doug 
Wolfgang, a World of Outlaws 
sprint car star who was critically 
injured during the 1992 racing 
season.

Also receiving awards at the 
January 8 WMC dinner will be 
drag racing legend “Big Daddy" 
Don Garlits; two-time Indianapolis 
500 winner Roger Ward; current 
NASCAR Winston Cup star and 
Wisconsin short track ace Dick 
Trickle; World of Outlaws sprint 
car star Dave Blaney; and 
American Speed Association 
1992 Rookie of the Year Steve 
Holzhausen.

Additionally, racing legends 
Augie Dabst and Willie Goeden 
will be recognized for tneir on- 
track achievements.

Hales Corners Speedway star 
Frank Smith will also be honored 
as will Michael Hunter, who will 
receive the Ted Lake Dedication 
to Racing Award.

Last but not least, Slinger and 
Madison International Speedway 
star Conrad Morgan will pick up 
a check for $15,000 from race 
promoter Wayne Erickson for 
completing the most laps at the 
two facilities this season.

The 1993 WMC event expects 
to raise $20,000 for The Ranch, 
an adult rehabilitation center in 
Menomonee Falls, Wisconsin. 
The initial 1992 dinner drew 350 
people and generated $10,000 for 
the facility.

For more information about the 
1993 Wisconsin Motorsports 
Charities Recognition Dinner, 
please write 913 Old Tower Road, 
Oconomowoc, Wisconsin 53066, 
or call (414) 567-7837.

EWSCA Board 
Of Directors

Plymouth, Wl. The Eastern 
Wisconsin Stock Car Association 
has elected their Board of Direc­
tors for the 1993 Season.

Modified driver and 1992 
Secretary Chuck Melis of 
Plymouth will serve as President, 
with fellow modified driver Randy 
Tracy also of Plymouth as Vice- 
President. Bill Hoftizerwill return 
as Treasurer and Glen Schniche 
as Secretary.

Returning to the Board of Direc­
tors are Willie Goeden and Hap­
py Laack. Veteran modified driver 
Ken Blaine of Kewaskum was 
also elected to the Board.

Roundtables for 
Scout Leaders Dec. 3

Glacier Edge District 11, Bay- 
Lakes Council of the Boy Scouts 
of America, will conduct Round­
tables for all Cub and Boy Scout 
leaders, their assistants and Pack 
and Troop Committee Members 
on Thursday, Dec. 3, from 7:30 to 
9 p.m. at John Long Middle 
School, corner of Fifth and 
Hickory Streets in Grafton.

The "Pirate Waters” theme will 
be explored by the Cub person­
nel in the All-Purpose Room, 
opening with "The Six Ships of 
Scouting." Roundtable Commis­
sioner Ann Mueller and her staff 
will discuss ship building projects, 
including scrap crafts like corks, 
toothpicks and juice cans. Ideas 
for the official Raingutter Regat­
ta will be incorporated and two 
lanes will be exhibited.

Staff members Linda Spawr 
and Carol Stuckert, will also cover 
the Ethics In Action segment, 
while Rocky Myers and Dave 
Parkinson meet with Webelos 
Leaders to explain the Fitness 
and Readyman Activity Badges.

Boy Scout personnel will meet 
in the school library, where 
Meteorologist Vince Condella, 
from Channel 6 Television, will 
present a Cold Weather Survival 
Program covering advance 
preparations, weather, measures 
to prevent freezing and 
hypothermia.

A critique of the nine-day excur­
sion by Troop 852, Mequon, to 
Sand Lake, Canada, will be given 
by their committee chairman, 
Gordon Hetzel, and Assistant 
Scoutmaster Al Lustig. Details of 
planning the trip, the train ride to 
Algonquin, canoeing Sand River 
and Old Woman Lake Route will 
be highlighted.

Photographers 
Anonymous

Photographers Anonymous will 
meet on Tuesday, December 8, at 
Riveredge Nature Center. Visitors 
are always welcome to this infor­
mal group of amateur 
photographers.

The subject this month will be 
"The Best in ’92.” Bring your best 
5-10 slides taken during ’92 to 
share and critique.

Call Riveredge at 375-2715 
(Metro) or 675-6888 (local) to 
register.

Riveredge Nature Center, a 
non-profit, 350 acre natural sanc­
tuary and educational organiza­
tion, providing environmental pro­
grams for all ages, is located in 
Ozaukee County, on Highway Y, 
one mile north of Newburg, bet­
ween Saukville and West Bend

There is a pleasure annexed to the 
eoininunieation of one's ideas, 
whether by words of mouth or by let­
ter, whieh nothing earthly ean supp­
ly the plaee of.

“Smart” Drugs Hit The Target
Over the last few years, 

important new drugs have 
been developed to treat a 
variety of serious illnesses. 
What many of these drugs 
have in common is the way 
they work.

When scientists discover 
exactly which body chemi­
cals and cells are involved 
in a disease, they can often 
design medications to tar­
get these chemicals and 
cells. Doctors call these 
medications site-specific. 
Once these “smart” drugs 
are in the body, they head 
right for their target.

Take, for example, a 
new drug called Zofran 
(ondansetron HCI), which 
doctors can now give to 
cancer patients to prevent 
the nausea and vomiting 
that often follow chemo­
therapy (treatment with 
anticancer drugs). Zofran is 
the first site-specific drug 
to switch off the sickness 
of chemotherapy.

Some chemotherapy 
drugs cause nausea and vom­
iting because they damage 
cells in the stomach. This sets 
off a signal that travels to the 
vomiting control center in the 
brain, causing nausea and 
vomiting that can be very 
severe. The sickness can last 
for several days, causing pa­
tients to lose so much weight 
and become so weak that 
they cannot go to work or 
school or even do simple 
household chores.

Older medications given 
to prevent the nausea and 
vomiting caused by 
anticancer drugs are not site- 
specific. Also, for many can­
cer patients, they fail to pre­
vent the sickness of 
chemotherapy. Studies have 
shown that Zofran is more

effective than these older 
drugs. When cancer patients 
receive Zofran along with 
their chemotherapy, most 
can go home, eat a regular 
meal, and get right back to 
their daily routine.

The older medications 
have another disadvantage. 
Because they are not site­
specific, they do not only 
affect the cells and body 
chemicals they are aimed at; 
they affect other body func­
tions, as well. This means 
that many of these drugs 
have unwanted side effects, 
including muscle spasms 
and extreme restlessness.

In contrast, patients tak­
ing Zofran do not experi­
ence such distressing ef­
fects. The most common 
side effect associated with 
Zofran is a mild headache.

Of course, cancer patients 
are not the only ones to ben­
efit from “smart” drugs. 
People with asthma, high 
blood pressure, and ulcers are 
also treated with such drugs, 
and many more site-specific 
drugs are in the pipeline. 
One that may benefit a great 
number of people is being 
developed to prevent mi­
graine headaches. Scientists 
are also testing site-specific 
drugs for arthritis, cocaine 
and alcohol addiction, epi­
lepsy, and even the common 
cold. As our scientists get 
smarter, our medicines will 
be smarter, too.

LOSING TRACK OF ALL THE THINGS YOU'VE 
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The Wisconsin Newspaper Association Clipping Service 
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By Noel Stollenwerk
KEWASKUM — With the return 

of one state champion, another 
state qualifier, six more ex­
perienced letterwinners, and a 
host of young talent, the upcom­
ing 1992-93 campaign has the 
possibility of being one of the best 
ever for the Kewaskum wrestling 
team and coach John Nell.

But Nell will be the first to point 
out that the team may have some 
problems early in the year, as 
wrestlers try to get down to their 
respective weights.

“We might take some lumps in 
the early going,” Nell said recent­
ly, noting that he has very inex­
perienced kids at the lower 
weights, and will probably hold 
them out of the first couple of 
meets.

One wrestler that won’t be 
held out is returning 145-pound 
state champion, Josh Kurtz, who 
posted a fine 32-2 mark in his 
junior year. Nell expects more big 
things from Kurtz, who is the on­
ly state champ in school history.
“He’ll be the one to beat,” in 

the 145-pound class, where Kurtz 
will eventually be wrestling at. “I 
think he certainly has the ability 
to get back there (to Madison).”

The same can be said for the 
Indians’-other state qualifier of a 
year ago, 135-pounder Mark 
Dziedzic, who recovered from an 
early-season knee injury to post 
a 15-8 mark last year. “He could 
very well do it (go to state) again,” 
Nell said of the senior Dziedzic.

Also returning to the fold this

KHS JV’S Win Invite Championship
By Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM — Some tough 
defense spelled victory for the 
Kewaskum junior varsity girls 
basketball team, which captured 
the championship in the JV por­
tion of last week's Indian

Tips on Handling, 
Storing and Serving 
Wild Game Meats

Wisconsin hunters have stock­
ed home and rental freezers with 
millions of pounds of venison. 
Now what? In a new 32-page 
booklet, University of Wisconsin- 
Extension specialists Mary Men- 
nes and Scott Craven tell how to 
turn wild game into tasty, and safe 
to eat, meals.

‘‘Wisconsin’s Wild Game: En­
joying the Harvest,"features:
‘Tips on processing, storing 

and serving wild game meats - 
venison, squirrel, rabbit, upland 
game birds, duck and goose, 
turkey and others.
‘Handling shortcuts to avoid 

wasting a valuable wild resource.
‘42 recipes from experienced 

wild game cooks, including Larry 
Meiller, popular Wisconsin Public 
Radio talk show host.
‘Food safety guidelines, nutri­

tion information, index.
The authors remind you to 

check with your local Department 
of Natural Resources office or 
conservation warden about rules 
on serving wild game to groups.

You can order “Wisconsin’s 
Wild Game: Enjoy the Harvest,” 
(B3573, 1992) from your county 
UW-Extension office. Or send 
$3.75 (includes tax and shipping) 
to: Cooperative Extension 
Publications, 30 N. Murray Street, 
Room 245. Box WG, Madison, 
Wisconsin 53715, phone (608) 
262-3346. Make checks payable 
to: University of
Wisconsin-Extension.

year are the Muckerheide’s. Todd 
and Chad. Todd, who will wrestle 
at 189 again this year, posted a 
21-14 as a junior last season, 
while Chad, who will once again 
go at 160 pounds, compiled a 
17-13 mark as a sophomore.

Mark Morell will anchor the 
171-pound class, returning from 
a 15-12 junior year. With these 
three letterwinners, along with 
152-pounder Rich Farchione 
(13-11 as a freshman last year), 
the upper weights should be a 
strength for Kewaskum this 
season.

“We’ve got five or six top notch 
kids back this year,” Nell said , 
adding that “we have the most 
experience at the upper weights. 
They all worked real hard in the 
off-season.”

A pair of sophomores will also 
be back this year. Jake Gundrum 
(8-12-1) and Jake Thull (5-14) will 
look to nail down spots in the In­
dian lineup, probably at 119 and 
112 pounds, respectively.

Nell already has had to deal 
with injury, as he lost soph Tyler 
Dieringer for about a month, due 
to a back injury. “That kind of 
hurts us,” Nell said, noting that 
Dieringer did well at the JV level 
last season, and could be a big 
help when he returns.

James Schaefer should give 
Nell some help at the middle-to- 
upper weights, as he comes off a 
14-6 campaign last year on JV’s. 
Fellow junior Brad Jackson (8-15) 
also should help out.

"Andy Mathias could help us 
out,” Nell went on, adding that

Invitational.
‘‘I'm so proud of them,” JV 

coach Keith Amundson said of his 
troups, which defeated Cedar 
Grove 36-19 in Saturday’s final 
contest. The Indians had beaten 
Campbellsport Friday night, 
42-24.

“We started out slow defen­
sively,” against Campbellsport, 
Amundson said, as the Indians 
held just a three-point edge at the 
half, 18-15. But some tough 
defense by Missy Rohrer and 
Greta Kuphal propelled the In­
dians in the second half. Kuphal 
led the JV’s with 12 points, while 
Mary Yahr chipped in 11.

Against the Rockets, 
Kewaskum switched from a zone 
defense to a man-to-man in the 
second half “to step up the inten­
sity,” according to Amundson. 
The strategy worked, as the In­
dians pulled away for the easy 
win.

Rohrer led the Indians with 14 
points, while Kuphal added six. 
Amundson also cited the entire 
team for “great aggressive play,” 
in the win.

The victories helped the JV’s 
go 3-0 on the season, as 
Kewaskum also edged Slinger 
last Tuesday night in a thriller, 
40-38. Kuphal’s length of the 
court pass to Rohrer led to a layup 
as time expired, giving the Indians 
the win. Rohrer finished with 17 
points, while Chrissy Neumann 
had eight, and Kuphal seven.

The Indian freshman also won 
a barn-burner, as Kelly Schref- 
fler's basket in the final seconds 
gave the Indians a 28-27 victory. 
Shreffler finished with a game- 
high 11 points.

Snakes swallow food whole. They 
can unhinge their jaws to swallow 
egg'' ,,r animals much larger than 
their own heads.

the soph will probably work his 
way into the lineup at the 
heavyweight spot, a spot that Nell 
would like desperately to fill.

Nell will also try and season a 
group of freshman that are cur­
rently competing for two openings 
at 103 and 112. “We have five 
freshman there, and I’m not real­
ly sure what we re going to do 
yet,” he said. Among those com­
peting for varsity spots are 
freshmen Troy Maertz. Eric Rahlf. 
Jeff Junk, Chris Justman and 
Robert Smith, along with soph 
Shane Engelking.

Others looking to break into the 
Indian lineup include freshmen 
Todd Cartwright, Tim Gundrum. 
Joe Hawig. Matt Heather, Ted 
Kuehn, Jason Liegl, Keith 
Neighbor, Peter Reis, Richard 
Wulff, sophomores Craig Erd­
man, Cory Rammer, Brian Redig, 
Paul Reis, Matt Towler, Chad 
Trzinski, and junior Rachel 
Chambers.
“I’d like to be optimistic,” Nell 

said. “But I think that we ll' be 
respectable. I don’t think anybody 
is going to blow us out. We should 
be very competitive (in the 
Eastern Wisconsin Conference)."

The Indians opened their 
season on Tuesday with a triple 
dual at Brown Deer, and travel to 
Two Rivers Thursday night. After 
a meet at Slinger this Tuesday, 
the Indians return home for their 
lone home meet before Christmas 
break, as they host Plymouth 
Dec. 18th.

WISCONSIN TRAVEL FACTS
Wittman Field in Oshkosh 

becomes the busiest airport in 
the world every summer dur­
ing the annual Experimental 
Aircraft Association's seven­
day Fly In and Convention.

BOYS VARSITY SCHEDULE
Dec. 1 Port Washington Away Jan. 19 Two Rivers Home
Dec. 4 Slinger Away Jan. 22 Cedar Grove Away
Dec. 8 Random Lake Home Jan. 23 Germantown Home
Dec. 11 New Holstein Home Jan. 28 New Holstein Away
Dec. 15 Lomira Home Feb. 2 Chilton Away
Dec. 17 Chilton Home Feb. 5 Kiel Home
Dec. 22 Kiel Away Feb. 9 Ozaukee Home
Jan. 5 Campbellsport Away Feb. 11 Sheboygan Falls Home
Jan. 8 Sheboygan Falls Away Feb. 19 Plymouth Away
Jan. 16 Plymouth Home Feb. 26 Two Rivers Away

GIRLS VARSITY SCHEDULE
Nov. 24 Slinger Away Jan. 19 Oostburg Away
Nov. 27-28 Tournament Home Jan. 22 Ozaukee Home
Dec. 10 New Holstein Away Jan. 26 New Holstein Home
Dec. 18 Chilton Away Jan.29 Chilton Home
Dec. 22 Kiel Home Feb. 2 Kettle Moraine
Dec. 29-30 Tournament Lutheran Home

Mayville Away Feb. 4 Kiel Away
Jan. 7 Sheboygan Falls Home Feb. 12 Sheboygan Falls Away
Jan. 12 Plymouth Away Feb. 16 Plymouth Home
Jan. 15 Two Rivers Away Feb. 18 Two Rivers Home

DUNDEE 
SAND & GRAVEL
G. RAMTHUN 533-4549 

Washed Sand
* Crushed Gravel 
* Stone and Lime Chips

Also Gravel and Sand Fill 
Topsoil 

GENERAL TRUCKING

Allenton Student on Team

Gateway Wins Aviation Maintenance
Technology College Bowl Contest

Gateway Technical College. 
Kenosha, has won the first Avia­
tion Maintenance Technology 
College Bowl sponsored by the 
Wisconsin Department of 
Transportation recently at the Fox 
Valley Technical College Aviation 
Center at Wittman Regional Air­
port, Oshkosh

Aviation maintenance 
technology students enrolled at 
the Gateway, Milwaukee Area, 
Blackhawk (Janesville), and Fox 
Valley (Oshkosh) Technical Col­
leges answered 75 questions 
about the field in a format that 
was a cross between the old Col­
lege Bowl and the current Jeopar­
dy TV programs.

Pat Repovsch, 6538 Hwy 28,

Schlice Named to All-Tourney Squad
By Noel Stollenwerk

KEWASKUM — Kewaskum's 
Bonnie Schlice was named to the 
first-ever Indian Invitational all- 
tournament team last weekend.

Schlice finished with 11 steals 
in the two games, leading all other 
players in that category. The 5-6 
senior also added 13 points and 
six assists in helping the Indians 
take second.

“She really stood out defen­
sively, KHS coach Glenn 
Eichstedt said of Schlice's play. 
“She really turned it up a notch 
in the semifinals.”

Also making the inaugural 
squad were Cedar Grove's Sally 
Dykstra (17 points, 10 steals, 4 
assists) and Abby Huenink (26 
points, 19 rebounds, 5 steals), 
Campbellsport's Becky Roth (18

JIM SCHAUB J
‘ ‘for the repair /ob that‘s 

been put off for too long"

P.O. Box 177
Kewaskum. Wl 53040

Garages/Garage Doors/Remodeling 
Siding/Storm Doors/Storm Windows 

Decks/Roofing

Allenton, was on the winning 
Gateway team, coached by David 
Klapstein, faculty advisor

Other winning team members 
included Ron Cleason. Kenosha; 
Steve Herman, Greendale: Brian 
Mattson, Superior; Jeff Pietrzak. 
West Allis, and Terry Sell, West 
Bend.

MATC students placed second, 
followed by Blackhawk and Fox 
Valley contestants

The students and schools 
received awards from WisDOT. 
the Federal Aviation Administra­
tion, the Experimental Aircraft 
Association, and the Snap-On 
Tool Corporation, a major supplier 
of aviation maintenance hand 
tools.

points. 10 assists, 5 steals) and 
Fond du Lac St. Mary’s Springs’ 
Lori Petrie (23 rebounds. 17 
points. 10 blocked shots).

All five of the athletes received 
Indian Invitational All-Tournament 
certificates.

Wyoming is nick­
named "The Equality 
State” because Wyoming 
women were the first in 
the nation to vote, hold 
public office and serve 
on juries.

IMPROVEMENT



Lose to Cedar Grove in Finals

Indians Finish 2nd in Tournament
Indians Down Cougars in Semi’s

By Noel Stollenwerk
KEWASKUM — The 

Kewaskum girls basketball team 
knew what it was up against in 
Saturday night’s championship 
game of the Indian Invitational 
here. The Indians just couldn’t do 
a whole lot about it.

Cedar Grove’s defensive 
pressure forced numerous Indian 
turnovers, resulting ip an easy 
62-37 win for the Rockets, giving 
them their third straight cham­
pionship in the tournament.

“We knew they were going to 
press us,” KHS coach Glenn 
Eichstedt said after the game. 
“We knew it would take a good 

solid effort to best them.”
And while the effort may have 

been there, the hoped result 
wasn't, as the Rockets used their 
pressure to forge a 20-8 first 
quarter edge. In the quarter, 
Cedar Grove out-rebounded 
Kewaskum by a whopping 18-4 
margin, thus giving the guests 
many more second-chance 
baskets.

“They had more opportunities 
to score,” Eichstedt said of the re­
bounding edge.

The Indians played better in the 
second quarter, virtually staying 
with the potent Rockets, but still 
found themselves trailing 32-16 at 
the half.

“At halftime, we decided that 
we would try to go inside and

Lady Indians Run Out of Steam; Lose Opener
By Noel Stollenwerk

SLINGER — Missing a pair of 
key players in their season­
opener, the Kewaskum girls 
basketball team simply ran out of 
steam here, last Tuesday night.

The Lady Indians were 
outscored 22-5 in the final ten 
minutes of their game with 
Slinger, as the Owls pulled away 
late to win 44-35 in the first game 
played in the Owls’ new facility.

"We physically ran out of gas,” 
Indian coach Glenn Eichstedt 
said regarding the loss, in which 
his squad shot just 27 percent. 
“Our legs got tired, and the shots 
just wouldn’t fall.”

Eichstedt was without two key 
players, having found out about 
the absences the day of the 
game. Starting guard Bonnie 
Schlice missed the game with the 
flu, while Christa Fleischman, the 
first Indian off the bench, suffered 
an ankle injury and was in a cast. 
She could be out for a couple of 
weeks.

Without the two, the Indians 
were still able to gain the upper 
hand in the first half. After battl­
ing to an 8-8 tie after one quarter, 
the Indians, behind Robyn Winn- 
inghoff’s eight points, managed a 
22-14 halftime lead.

"We started out doing what we 
wanted to do,” Eichstedt said, 
noting his squad was able to 
press the Owls successfully, for­
cing an up-tempo game.

But that style of play was 
suitable to the Indians on this 
night, as they tired in the late 
stages of the third period. A 
basket by Kim Sabish gave the In­
dians a 30-22 lead with just over 
2.00 to go in the period, but the 
Owls answered with a run of their 
own.

Slinger’s press forced 
numerous Indian miscues, allow­
ing the Owls to pull to within 30-27 
heading into the final stanza. The 
continued pressure by the hosts 
wore down the Indians, who turn­
ed the ball over several more

make use of our height advan­
tage,” Eichstedt noted. “And I felt 
that as a result, we played better 
in the second half.”

That they did, although it wasn’t 
enough to even come close to 
overtaking the Rockets, whose 
lead never got below double 
digits.

There were some bright spots 
in the defeat, however. Junior 
Missy Radtke came off the bench 
to pull down a game-high 15 re­
bounds. “That’s a real strong per­
formance. She’s going to help us 
out in that area,” Eichstedt said. 
He also cited Bonnie Sdhlice for 
her fine defensive effort.

Ginger Wiesner and Robyn 
Winninghoff led the Indians with 
10 points apiece. As a team, the 
Indians continued to struggle from 
the field, hitting just 23 percent of 
their tries.

Cedar Grove, meanwhile, hit on 
44 percent of their tries, and were 
led by Abby Huehner, who had 14 
points. Kathy Naus (11), Sally 
Dykstra (10) and Brenda Hilbelink 
also hit for double figures, while 
Hilbelink led the Rockets on the 
boards with 12 rebounds.

Eichstedt was a bit disap­
pointed in the fact that the 
Rockets kept their starters in the 
game until the closing minutes. 
The KHS boss had emptied his 
bench early in the final stanza, 
and as a result, the deficit balloon­

times in the fourth.
A basket by Slinger’s Nicole 

Parentice gave her team the lead 
for good with just over five 
minutes to go. The Indians, mean­
while, managed just two field 
goals in the final stanza.

Things got worse for 
Kewaskum, as Sabish landed 
hard midway through the final 
period, injuring her ribs. That left 
the Indians with just one true ball­
handler, that being junior Ginger 
Wiesner.

"We just didn't have anything 
left,” Eichstedt said. “Being the 
first game, we just couldn't keep 
that fast pace going.” •

Winninghoff led the Indians 
with 10 points, while Wiesner 
chipped in nine in the losing ef­
fort. Parentice led the Owls with 
eight.

All in all, Eichstedt was pleas­
ed with his team's effort.

"It was a good learning game,” 
he said. "We moved the ball well 
and passed well. We just couldn’t 
sustain it for the four quarters.”

After finishing second in their

XYZ CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners at skat played by 

the XYZ Senior Citizens at the 
Municipal Building on Wednes­
day, Nov. 25. were: Willy Blecher, 
26-5—21 net; Fred Klein, 
19-2—17 net; Syl Schmidt, 
21-4—17 net; Willy Blecher, Heart 
Solo vs 5; Elmer Stange, Club 
Solo vs 4; Frank Sell, Heart Solo 
vs 4.

Mike’s 
WILD GAME 
PROCESSING

N860 Hwy. G 
Campbellsport 

626-4741

ed from 15 points to 25.
Still, Eichstedt wasn’t about to 

discredit the Rockets, who will not 
be back to defend their title next 
year, as they have dropped out of 
the tourney. “They played real 
well. That makes three years in a 
row now that they’ve won it.”

Kewaskum, now 1-2 on the 
year, has off until Dec. 10th (at 
New Holstein), and then has 
another week off before they 
travel to Chilton (Dec. 18th). The 
layoff should benefit the Indians, 
though, according to Eichstedt.

“It’ll give us a chance to 
regroup,” he said. “We’re doing 
things better, and I’m pleased 
with the effort. At least the areas 
in which we are struggling are 
correctable areas. The rest will 
definitely help.”

1992 KEWASKUM 
INDIAN INVITATIONAL 

VARSITY
SEMIFINALS — Kewaskum 46, 

Campbellsport 38; Cedar Grove 50, 
Fond du Lac St. Mary’s Springs 48

CONSOLATION — St. Mary’s 
Springs 59, Campbellsport 25.

FINALS — Cedar Grove 62, 
KEWASKUM 37.

JUNIOR VARSITY
SEMIFINALS — KEWASKUM 42, 

Campbellsport 24; Cedar Grove 41, 
St. Mary's Springs 39.

CONSOLATION — Campbellsport 
41, St. Mary’s Springs 34.

FINAL — Kewaskum 36, Cedar 
Grove 19.

own holiday tournament, the In­
dians are off until Dec. 10, when 
they travel to New Holstein.

ENTERTAINING BUYS FOR YOUR

• What to Buy?

355 Main St., Kewaskum Kuehl’s
SUDS w

By Noel Stollenwerk
KEWASKUM — After losing 

their season - opener with a 
fourth-quarter collapse, the 
Kewaskum girls basketball team 
was going to make sure that it 
wouldn.’t happen twice in a row.

Instead, it was the Indians who 
went on a fourth-quarter run, 
outscoring Campbellsport 19-4 in 
the final period, to pull out a 46-38 
win over the Cougars in the 
semifinals of the Indians 
Invitational.

The Indians eventually lost in 
the finals to Cedar Grove 62-37. 
(See accompanying story.)

Things looked dismal for the In­
dians in the early going, as the 
Cougars used poor Indian 
shooting to gain a 10-1 lead after 
one quarter of play.

"The shots just weren’t dropp­
ing.” KHS coach Glenn Eichstedt 
said of the opening quarter, which 
produced just a single free throw 
from Robyn Winninghoff. “It took 
us a while to get it going.”

Behind the play of junior Ginger 
Wiesner, the Indians got it going 
in the second quarter. Wiesner 
chipped in eight of her game-high 
18 points in the quarter, but the 
Indians could pull only to within 
seven, at 24-17.

"We missed so many free 
throws,” Eichstedt said, disap­
pointingly. KHS missed all eight 
of their FT opportunities in the se­
cond period, and finished just six 
for 16 on the night.

Kewaskum couldn’t shave any 
points off the lead in the third 
quarter as well, and the Cougars 
maintained their seven-point edge 
(34-27) heading into the fourth.

But that’s where the Indians 
defense took over, thanks in large 
part to senior Bonnie Schlice.

CHECK OUT 
OUR NEW 

GIFT TABLE
JUST IN TIME 

FOR CHRISTMAS 
GIFT-GIVINGI

ranzia
WINE
3 liter box 

White Zinfandel 
White Grenache 
Blush & Rhine 
$7.99

“She really really turned it up a 
notch,” Eichstedt said of the 5-6 
sparkplug, who keyed the rally 
with numerous steals and 
fast-breaks.

Schlice finished with seven 
points in the final period, including 
three of four free throws. Winn­
inghoff and Wiesner each added 
s*x points, as Kewaskum overtook 
the Cougars with their defensive 
pressure.

"Our defense didn’t allow them 
any good shots,” Eichstedt said. 
“We were waiting for that 
pressure to take effect, and it 
finally did. They became noticably 
tired.”

That allowed the Indians to 
come up with eight steals in the 
fourth, as the team finished the 
night with a total of 21 thefts, five 
belonging to Schlice.

After Wiesner’s game-high 
total, Winninghoff was next high 
with 11 points, while Schlice add­
ed nine.

Campbellsport went on to lose 
to Fond du Lac St. Mary’s Springs 
in the consolation game, 59-25.

EDEN KNIGHTS
SAT. MIXED COUPLES 

11-28-92
EZ Riders, 28-14; Pinheads, 

26-16; M&M’s, 25-17; The Udder 
Team, 23-19; W&W’s, 21-21; 
Strikeless, 20-22; Busy Bodies, 
14-28; The Fuzzy Four, 11-31.

Men’s High Series: Elsmer Zim- 
dahl, 637; Al Miller, 598; Chuck 
Muckerheide, 552.

Men’s High Game: Al Miller, 
244; Elsmer Zimdahl, 230; Den­
ny Theisen, 222.

Ladies High Series: Deb
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Wiesner, 517; Kim Bulette, 515;
Julie Miller, 479.

Ladies High Game: Kim 
Bulette, 209; Karolyn Schmidt. 
200; Sue Wessing, 195.

PHONE 626-4565
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Faff Loan Sale
8.75% APR

Bank One is having a sale on the one thing you can always use: Money1 
Fora limited time, Bank One is offering personal loans lor a lived annual 
percentage rate ol 8.75 %, up to $10,000 with up to 30 months to repay * 
You can use the money to fix up the house, pay college tuition, buy a car, 
take a vacation or use lor whatever worthwhile purpose you choose'

We've made it easy to apply, too! Simply fill out the application on back and 
drop it oil at any ol the Bank One offices listed below. Or mail your applica­
tion to: Bank One, West Bend, FALL LOAN SALL, PO Box 557, West Bend, 
Wl 53005. And, ol course, you arc always welcome to stop by and talk 
with one ol our loan officers.

Main Office • 801 W Washington Street • 3 38-2 I 11

Westwood Office • 2412 W Washington street • 3 35-71 11 

Paradise Office • 7lh Ave. and Paradise Drive • 3 34-02 2 2

BANK=ONE
WklDtT it tellies.

Bank ()ne. West Bend 
Membei I I >l<
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Fall Sale Loan Application lose
Type of Loan Requested: Separate Joint with Spouse Joint with Person other than Spouse 9-25.

AMOUNI REQUESTED PURPOSE OE IOAN NUMBER OF MONTHS TO REPAY
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Im Alimony. child support, or separate maintenance need not be revealed il applicant does not wish to have it considered a basis for repaying this obligation 5®5‘
AMOUNT OF OTHER INCOME' OTHER INCOME * TOTAL MONTHLY PAYMENTS ON ALL DEBTS (excluding mortgoge/rent payment)
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INDICATE IF YOU HAVE FINANCIAL INSIITUIION (OMPANY NAME CARO IS WITH FINANCIAL INSTITUTION WHERE CHECKING ACCOUNT IS HELD imidt.

I MasterCard/VISA
American Express _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ financial institution where savings account is held -- - - - - - -

»re, last Department Store Credit Card _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _
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Everything lAve have stated on this application is true to the best ol my/our know ledge lAve understand that Bank One will retain this application whether or not it 
is approved Bank One is authorized to check my/our credit and employment history and to answer questions about Bank One’s credit experience with me/us. 1/we 
understand all questions asked and lAve responded to these particular questions This application is reflective ol my/our true financial position(s), which shall not 
change substantially or materially up io the time this loan is made or completed.

APPLICANT S SIGNATURE DATE CO-APPLICANT S SIGNATURE DATE
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on

• injury c |M4R/74L PROPERTY PURPOSE STATEMENT - If married and a Wisconsin Resident and spouse is not signing the note, complete spouse information.

Id be oi APPLICANT'S MARITAL STATUS (Wisconsin Residents only) NAME OF SPOUSE SPOUSE'S SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER 4
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Married Unmarried Legally Separated L
SPOUSE'S ADDRESS (If ottiei than Applicant's oddiess above) ” - - - - - - - - - -

NOTICE io MARRIED MTIk \\ls RESIDING IN WISCONSIN No provision ol any marital property agreement, unilateral statement under sec 766 59 ^
\\ isconsin Stats . or conn decree under sec. 7 oo / 0 adverseh allects the interest ol the creditor unless the creditor, poor to the time the credit is granted is furnished a 
copy ol the agreement, statement or decree or has actual knowledge ol the adverse provision when the obligation to the creditor is incurred \

1 he obligation evidenced by a Note ol even date is being incurred in the interest ol my marriage and family. 1
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