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Lions to Host Annual Kettle 
20, Chicken Bar-B-Q Sunday

Kewaskum School District Welcomes
Students Back on Tuesday, Sept. 4

by Sharon Callaway Roznik
Get your running shoes ready 

because its time once again to 
face on foot the rugged hills and 
gorgeous terrain of the Kettle 
Moraine State Forest, as 
competitors from across 
Wisconsin, neighboring states, 
and Canada converge in 
Kewaskum for the Kettle 20 + 2 
race. &

The 20 kilometer event (12.4 
miles) will be accompanied by 
two easier runs — 3.5 and 5 
miles, and will include various 
mens’ and womens’ divisions. 
The event is sponsored by the 
Kewaskum Lion’s Club and is 
held in conjunction with the 
annual chicken bar-b-que at 
River Hill Park on Sunday, 
August 19. The race begins at 9 
a.m. at the Park, located along 
the Milwaukee River. 
Registration begins at 8 a.m. (in 
advance) up until race time.

Divisions for the Kettle 20 are 
as follows: six men’s age groups 
1-17, 18-29, 30-39, 40-49, 50-59, 
and 60 and over; four women’s 
age groups 1-17, 18-29, 30-39,

Kewaskum Frozen Foods Wins Two 
National Champion Awards

Dave Nigh, left, and Bob Beisbier display the latest national champion 
awards received for their summer sausages.

By GERRY MUELLER
Statesman Staff Writer

Dave Nigh and Bob Beisbier, 
co-owners of Kewaskum Frozen 
Foods, have reason to smile this 
week as two of their entries in a 
national cured meats show last 
month were judged as the 
national champions in their 
categories.

The American Association of

and 40 and over. Top male and 
female runners will each receive 
a trophy, followed by medals for 
second and third place, and 
ribbons for fourth and fifth. The 
two smaller races will offer 
awards to the top place winners.

Entry fee for all races is $7 
with a t-shirt, and $5 without. 
Those who register in advance 
will receive $1 off each race. To 
date 51 runners have pre­
registered. “Were expecting 
about 80 or 90 runners to 
pre-register,’’ says race 
chairman Dale Squier of 
Kewaskum. “On the day of the 
race, another 80 usually sign 
up.’’ Racers enjoy coming back 
year after year to the Kettle 
20 + 2, both for the challenge 
and a glimpse of the rugged 
landscape touched by 
Wisconsin Glaciers thousands 
of years ago.

The record to beat is 65 
minutes set in 1976. There will 
be water stops along the way 
and showers will be available at 
the Kewaskum Middle School.

Chicken dinners will be 
served throughout the day,

Meat Processors awarded 
Kewaskum Frozen Foods the 
1990 champion honors for both 
their uncooked and cooked 
summer sausages. The 
selection was made July 28, 
during the association's na­
tional convention held July 25 
through 29, at Nashville, 
Tennessee, attended by Nigh.

The awards continue to

beginning at 11 a.m., and 
running til 5 p.m. Cost is $4.50 
for one-half chicken and $4 for 
one-quarter chicken plate, 
complete with mashed potatoes, 
vegetables and salad. All 
runners can purchase their 
chicken dinners for the special 
price of $3 each. Carryouts will 
be available.

Whether you’re there to 
cheer on the runners, compete 
in the race, or enjoy the food, 
don’t miss the popular Eddie 
Schneider and his music. Beer, 
soda, hamburgers, ice-cream 
and other refreshments will be 
available at the park.

Proceeds from this annual 
event are used for local “Lions” 
community service projects, 
with an emphasis on the Quest 
program, a drug and alcohol 
educational project in the 
Kewaskum School District.

Mail-in registrations for the 
race can be sent to Dale Squier, 
1305 Roseland Dr., Kewaskum, 
WI 53040 to register in advance. 
For more information on any of 
the days events, contact Dale at 
626-2731.

confirm Beisbier and Nigh’s 
committment of putting only 
quality meat products before 
the public. Kewaskum Frozen 
Foods and its meat products 
have been consistent state and 
national champions for several 
years.

To help celebrate its latest 
achievement, Kewaskum

(Continued on Page 2)

Tuesday, September 4 is the 
first day of school for returning 
and new students of the 
Kewaskum School District.

Parents and guardians should 
by this time have received 
information on bus rules and 
pick up times. If you have not, 
please call the Johnson Bus 
Company at 626-4414 to 
complete arrangements.

We ask that families take 
time to review the bus riding 
rules and safe boarding, riding, 
and unloading procedures. If 
this is your child’s first 
experience at riding on a bus. 
why not take some time to 
accompany him/her or arrange 
for someone else to accompany 
him/her for their first pick-up 
and drop-off?

Also, please be aware of the 
times crossing guards are 
present on village street corners 
and utilize them accordingly. 
Please do not send or drop your 
children off at school before the 
school doors open because they 
will be unsupervised.

Information for those 
interested and eligible for the 
free and reduced hot lunch 
program was previously 
published in the Statesman. 
Middle school and high school 
students also received copies 
during registration. Forms will 
again be given to elementary 
students (one per family) during 
the first week of school. If you 
did not receive one or wish to 
review the qualifying criteria, 
please call the business office at 
626-8427.

Hot lunch prices have been 
increased for the 1990-91 school 
year. The lunch price at the 
elementary schools is $1.10 per 
day or $5.00 per week. The 
lunch price at the middle and 
high school is $1.25 per day or 
$5.50 per week. School on 
Tuesday is a full day and hot 
lunch will be served. The 
calendar for the school year has 
been published and each family 
will receive one at registration. 
Extra calendars are available 
for purchase at the business 
office.

School Board Okays 
Borrowing $200,000

By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

The Kewaskum Board of 
Education, Monday night, 
approved a resolution to borrow 
$200,000, to be used for a 
variety of capital 
improvements.

The action was taken after the 
electors at last month’s annual 
meeting vetoed a motion which 
would have added the $200,000 
to the 1990 tax levy and

The school district does not 
carry accident insurance for 
students. We therefore urge 
parents/guardians to review 
their own policies to be certain 
coverage is adequate. 
Particularly in the case of 
athletics, this is a necessity. 
The schools do have insurance 
forms provided by Student 
Assurance Company of 
Stillwater, Minnesota available 
to parents who would like to 
purchase additional insurance 
or insurance for their children. 
The parents purchase the 
insurance on their own - the 
district is not involved in the 
sale of insurance.

The buildings and grounds 
are in good shape and the 
classrooms are clean and ready 
for students. All is in readiness 
and all are anxious to greet the 
children and begin anew.

Many teachers have attended 
various courses, workshops and 
seminars over the summer to 
improve their educational skills. 
Administrative staff worked to 
hire new staff and arrange 
schedules, discuss goals and 
establish a vision for the 
district.

Most important to us will be 
the continued support and 
involvement of parents, 
grandparents, guardians and 
community members at large. 
Please take the time to review 
school handbooks and rules 
with your children, help them 
with their homework, call their 
teachers or principals, and visit 
their schools. You are important 
and we need your assistance.

Hints for a successful start to 
the 1990-91 school year include 
the following: Be positive about 
the teacher(s) your child(ren) 
has/have and the programs 
available; be interested in what 
is happening on a daily basis; 
encourage participation in 
extra-curricular activities; set 
goals that are high enough yet 
realistic; and set aside some 
time to talk to your child/child- 
ren.

Welcome back and we all 
hope you have a great year!

recommended the district 
borrow the money.

The motion to go ahead with 
the borrowing was passed on a 
5-1 vote, with board member 
Paul Seymour voting against it 
and Perry Ankerson absent.

Seymour told fellow board 
members he was against the 
borrowing because it was going 
to cost the district over $40,000 
for the four-year loan. “I don’t

(Continued on Page 2)
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like adding costs to things we 
should go after and do through 
the budgeting process.”

In conjunction with the 
resolution, District Ad­
ministrator Dr. David Heather 
provided the board with a list of 
nine projects he would like to 
see accomplished with the 
funds. The price tag on those 
items came to $207,000. 
Heather projected ‘‘the 
additional $7,000 would come 
from the interest earned on the 
invested money or cost under 
runs on the various listed 
projects.”

Those projects included 
$35,000 for remodeling the 
science labs and equipment and 
ventilating of the art class 
rooms.

The bulk of the loan, $80,000 
is targeted for a major computer 
upgrading at Kewaskum 
Middle School and the 
‘networking’ (linking togetherl 
of computers in the high school 
as well as new equipment for 
the district administration 
office.

Replacement of classroom 
desks at a cost of $10,000 was 
the fourth item. Another 
$14,500 is designated for the 
KHS Home Ec kitchen which 
has not had such things as 
cabinets, sinks, etc., replaced 
since the school was built in 
1955.

Funds of $20,000 for the 
Vocational Education shop for 
the purpose of purchasing new 
up-to-date equipment was also 
included. Heather noted, 
however, that money was just ‘a 
starter.’

Another equipment item was 
$14,000 for the districtwide 
purchase of maps to replace 
present ones, of which, Heather 
said 99% were outdated. Again, 
Heather noted this money 
would not cover the complete 
cost of the project.

Another item, the addition of 
equipment for the KMS 
technical education program, 
$5,000. To meet state inspection 
requirements, the district will 
have to install a dust collection 
system in the KHS wood shop 
estimated cost, $15,000.

Another equipment 
purchase, two copiers for the 
elementary schools, $13,500.

When the board and Heather 
were questioned about some 
items such as the desks, maps 
and copiers not fitting the 
description of ‘Capital 
Improvements,’ Heater agreed 
noting the list should probably 
be called Capital Improvements 
and Equipment Replacement 
and Purchases. He indicated 
that these items were added 
because the district had failed 
to maintain a system of routine 
rotating replacement over the 
years and now it is looking at 
the problem of having to replace 
some items all at one time. 
Heather said he hoped to get 
the district back on track with

APPLIANCES PLUS 
LAWN & GARDEN 

Sales and Service
617 E. Main St., Campbellsport 

PHONE 533-5280
STORE HOURS Mon . Tuos. & Thurs 8 a m to 5:30 p m 

Weds & Fri 8 am io 7pm, Sat 8 a m to 3 p m

SERVICE AVAILABLE ON ALL LAWN & GARDEN 
EQUIPMENT AND MAJOR BRAND APPLIANCES 

*Reasonable Service Rates*

such a program.
Over and above the nine 

priority items targeted for the 
loan money, Heather also listed 
another four projects to be 
considered and/or substituted if 
some of the first nine were 
dropped.

Of these, the first was the 
ceiling replacement at Kewas­
kum Elementary School. 
Heather felt, however, this 
could be accomplished to a 
large extent, with existing 
funds remaining from last 
year’s loan.

The second list also included 
$20,000 for paving repairs 
around the middle and high 
schools.

Another $15,000 for a TV dish 
and equipment to offer courses 
and classes the district cannot 
teach or justify staffing for such 
as a variety of foreign 
languages such as Japanese, 
Chinese and Russian.

Based on the Building 
Superintendent’s recommenda­
tion, as an energy and 
maintenance saving item, 
$18,000 was listed for the 
conversion of the 1955 KHS 
building from steam to hot 
water heat.

It is now up to the board to 
make the final decisions on 
what projects will or will not be 
done with the funds.

In other business, the board 
discussed the district’s 1989-90 
report to the community which 
included a variety of 
competency based test scores 
for district students. Heather 
gave his views on the results 
and plans to improve areas 
where the students showed 
weaknesses.

Also approved were the short 
and long-term goals and 
objectives set for the district by 
the board. Short term goals for 
1990-91 include; developing 
principals as instructional 
leaders, periodically conducting 
board work sessions, including 
board member self-assessment, 
curriculum development and 
review, promoting better 
community relations and 
improve public contact with 
school system by 30% and 
increasing computer usage and 
integration of computers at all 
grade levels.

Long term goals and objective

ALUMINUM 
CANS

On the first and 
third Saturdays 
10 a.m. to 2 p.m.

SENTRY PARKING LOT 
Kewaskum Mall 

HAVE CAN CRUSHERS

2nd and 4th Tuesday
10 a.m. to 1 p.m.

STRAUB'S in Campbellsport

MARCOE’S RECYCLING

for 1990-91 and beyond include; 
board pressure to change the 
Mediation/Arbitration law, 
increase computer usage/- 
programming/electronic teach­
ing capabilities by 10%, increase 
Competency Based Test scores 
over the next three years by 5%, 
facilities development and 
improvement and budget 
increases to reflect district 
educational goals.

The board also reviewed a 
plan to meet the Department of 
Public Instruction’s mandate for 
identifying and working with 
“Children At Risk.” Students 
considered a ‘child at risk,’ are 
those who may be having 
difficulty in school for a variety 
of reasons, from being behind 
in their learning skills, to being 
a delinquent, school-age parent 
or drop-out and may be in 
danger of not completing their 
education without additional 
assistance and/or tutoring from 
the district.

In other action the board 
approved the district’s applying 
for a grant to participate in the 
Wisconsin/IBM Writing to 
Read program, a contract with 
CESA 6 for a half-time social 
worker and five teaching and 
two coaching contracts for the 
1990-91 school year.

2 Liters

*3rebateWHISKEY
1.75 liter

liter

BRANDY

s^652^ 
With m*^1’

Canadian 
LTD

$12.89
SAVE $3.00 

With mail-in rebate!

liter

$7.89 SgS

Don’t Forget to 
Visit Our ^ 

CRAFT
CORNER i

u Now Featuring
8 Area Crafters

Andre 
champagne
$3.39

SUDS aid SPOUTS
355 Main Street, Kewaskum

PHONE 626-4565

YMCA Offers Tot 
Time at Peace 
Church Here

Openings are still available in 
the three year old Kewaskum 
Tot Time class for the 1990-1991 
school year. The class will meet 
from 9:30 - 11:30 a.m. on 
Tuesdays and Thursdays at 
Peace United Church of Christ 
starting September 4.

YMCA Tot Time is designed 
to help preschoolers grow 
socially, emotionally, 
intellectually and physically. 
Activities in art, music, 
dramatic play, science and 
language, encourage skill 
development and social 
interaction. Group activities and 
self-directed activities are 
provided each day. Numerous 
field trips are taken throughout 
the year. The three year old 
program is designed to 
introduce children to the school 
setting. Enrollment in the class 
is limited to 18 children.
' Tot Time is a cooperative 
program encouraging parental 
participation in their child’s 
preschool experience. Parents

BUSCH or 
BUSCH 

LIGHT 
BEER 

case cans

$6.59

assist in the classroom several 
times during the school year. 
Families are invited to attend 
school programs and picnics.

Registrations for the three 
year old class are now being 
taken. For information contact 
the YMCA at 334-3405.

Awards
(Continued from Page 1)

Frozen Foods will have a special 
sale running August 23, 24 and 
25, featuring their award - 
winning sausages.

Beisbier and Nigh also invite 
everyone to attend Kewaskum’s 
“Kettle Kountry Kolors” 
festival on October 13 and 14, 
and to participate in Kewaskum 
Frozen Foods’ weight-guessing 
contest. They will be making a 
‘Giant’ summer sausage 
approximately ten feet long and 
a prize of $500.00 will be 
awarded to the person who 
comes closest to guessing the 
sausage’s actual weight (in case 
of duplicate guesses, a random 
drawing will be held).

“n Country 
nWlNE 
coolers

FLEISCHMANNS’ 
GIN

1.75 Liter $13.59
SAVE $3.00 

With mail-in rebate 

liter $7i49
SAVE $2.00 
With mail-in 
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Surplus Food Distribution to
Eligible Households Aug. 18

On Sunday, August 5th, graduates of Holy Trinity School in Kewaskum, celebrating their 
77th, 70th, 60th, 50th, 40th, 35th and 25th Anniversary of eight years of religious educa­
tion were special guests at the 9 a.m. Mass held here. Graduates between 1914 and 1939 
were also invited. Thirty-nine alumni and their families attended.

The following alumni were present: Quintin Peters -1921; Roseline (Pflum) Kohler - 1922; 
Philip McLaughlin, Joseph Metz - 1923; Lauretta (Pflum) Prost -1924; James Andre, Helen 
(Harbeck) Felix, Margaret (Miller) Mehring; Rose (Schaeffer) Weddig - 1925; Marcella 
(Casper) Schaefer - 1926; Dolores (Andre) Lemke -1927; Lloyd Hron, Ed Theusch - 1928; 
Ray Smith - 1929; Joe Miller - 1930; Catherine (Schoofs) Vitrano - 1931; Fred Miller, Ar­
mond Smith - 1933; Louis Bath Jr., Pearl (Hron) Miller; Clara (Metz) Weiss - 1934, Annette 
(Beilke) Kruepke - 1935; Ernest Gruber, Sr. Mercedes (Lois Geib), Anna (Schoofs) Nigh 
-1936; Donald Seii - 1937; Lucille (Schoofs) Nigh, Dolores (Stoffel) DuPont - 1938; Alex 
Beck, Gerald Stoffel -1939; Dorothy (Harter) Nigh, Nathan Nigh, Ralph Schoofs, John and 
Harriet (Stoffel) Stellpflug - 1940; Christine (McElhatton) Badri, Marilyn (Reindl) Brath, Joan 
(Schoofs) Thompson, and Mary (Strobel) Gutjahr - 1965.

Ann Neumann Photo

Washington County has receiv­
ed surplus commodity food items 
that will be distributed to eligible 
households on Saturday. Augugst 
18, from 9;00 to 11:30 a.m. (as 
long as supply lasts).

Eligible households will receive 
butter, peanut butter, canned pork, 
vegetarian beans, green beans, 
honey, raisins, flour and cornmeal.

Locations for the free distribu­
tion are as follows:

West Bend. St. Frances Cabrini 
Church. 615 Hawthorn Dr. (lower 
level parking lot); Hartford, St. 
Kilian School. 245 High St. 
(cafeteria); Germantown, Senior 
Activity Center. W162 N11960 
Park Ave.; Slinger. Village Hall. 
220 Slinger Road; Allenton. Ad­
dison Town Hall. Village of Allen­
ton; Kewaskum. Kewaskum High 
School, north entrance, and 
Jackson, Jackson Fire Department, 
S. Jackson Dr.

Eligibility is based on the current 
monthly gross income (before 
taxes) of all household members 
with the following limits: 
Household size 1, income limit 
$785; 2. $1,053; 3. $1,320; 4. 
$1,588; 5. $1,855; 6. $2,123; 7. 
$2,390; 8. $2,658; 9. $2,925; 10. 
$3,193.

For more information, the public

may phone 338-4610.
Home delivery is available for 

Elderly and Handicapped if there 
is no one in the household who can 
get to a distribution site. To make 
arrangements, call the distribution 
site in your area. West Bend 
residents please call 338-4610.

Although no income verification 
information is required, a self 
declaration form must be signed by 
the recipient and is subject to state 
audit. You may also be asked to 
provide proof of residency.

This program is being coor­
dinated by the Washington Coun­
ty Department of Social Services, 
and handled locally by various 
volunteer workers in each 
community.

JOB CLEANING CONTRACT
The job cleaning contract at the 

Kewaskum Post Otfice will 
become open for bids. Persons 
interested in receiving job 
descriptions for bids should con­
tact the postmaster or call 
626-2575.

A successful skin graft can only 
come from one’s own body or 
that of an identical twin.

Over two million Americans are 85 and over.

Shefond

1149 Fond du Lac Ave. 
Kewaskum

Mobil
Mart

626-4300

Is this 
the way 

you always 
celebrate 
birthdays?

BELATED 
BIRTHDAY 
WISHES!

SELF/SERVE CONVENIENCE... Designed with You in Mind
American Express, Discover, Visa, Master Card and Mobil...

SAME AS CASH

24 pk.

COKE or 
DIET COKE 
$4.99 

LIMIT - 3 CASES 
While Supply Lasts

FROM THE BAKERY

Frito Lay

Twin Pack Box

POTATO CHIPS

SAVE 50c... Reg. $1.49

99c

Lions Club 
Paper Drive

Saturday, Aug. 18
All paper must be on the curb by 9 
a.m. tied in bundles, or packed in 
paper bags. No waxed or glossed 
paper, magazines, cardboard or 
boxes please. This drive is con­
ducted every third Saturday of the 
month.

Money Used for Local Projects

THIS WEEK’S 
SANDWICH SPECIAL 

FREE COOKIE 
with any 

JR Sandwich 
Purchase

—^ . —* • » *Raisin Bran UAlLl 'Blueberry
★Cranberry
★Lemon Poppy Seed

tv try Tuesday is 
k ( ustumrr Appreciation Day

FREE
Cup of Coffee
Every Tuesday

5 to 8 a m.

Every Wednesday is 
SENIOR

CITIZENS DAY
Receive a 2c per gallon 

discount if you are 
62yearsoroldet^

JR’s

&

CHECK OUT 
OUR MUFFINS

F RENT-A-FLICK |
Movie Rentals

‘Hard to Kill 
‘Blue Steel

‘Flashback 
‘Revenge 
‘ Blaze

Monday- Thursday 
Rent One, Get One FREE!

NEWER RELEASES
‘Born on the 4th of July

Nintendo Rentals
Fish around 

no longer
Seif-Serve 

Live & Frozen 

FISHING BAIT 
& TACKLE 

AVAILABLE
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Seated on the wooden sidewalk on Wilhelmina Street or Strasse, Kewaskum, about 
1917, were Bill Harbeck, Emily Forrer and Helen Harbeck (Felix). The picture was 
taken between the Nic Remmel and Lizzie Steichen residence. These homes are 
now owned by the Jim Paul and Margaret Simon families. There has also been 
a home built on the empty lot in the background. At that time, there were regular 
drills on this street by the Homeguard in military uniform, in case they were called 
into World War I. On one occasion Kaiser Wilhelm was burned in effigy on Main 
Street. The name Wilhelmina Street was changed to First Street, since anything 
with a German ring to it was not popular at that time.

Photo courtesy of Helen Felix

Raisins are rich in nutrition, containing ten minerals of 
important food value, including iron and copper.

THANK YOU
Thank you St. Jude for 

prayers answered.
J.M.

Births
BACKHAUS — A son, Brian 

Joseph, to Joseph and Debra 
Backhaus, Kewaskum, born 
August 7, at Elmbrook Memorial 
Hospital, Brookfield. He joins a 
sister, Michelle. Maternal grand­
parents, Virginia Oppermann and 
the late Armin Oppermann. Pater­
nal grandparents, Gerald 
Backhaus and the late Shirley 
Backhaus.

STROBEL — A daughter, 
Jenna Mae, to John and Jodi 
Strobel, 3535 Hwy. 28E, 
Kewaskum, on July 15.

EBERT — A son to Cathy and 
Kevin Ebert, 219 Main St., 
Kewaskum, on Aug. 3.

On June 13, 1948, a Los 
Angeles resident named Jack 
O’Leary caught a fit of 
hiccoughs. It was not until June 
1, 1956 • about 160 million 
hiccoughs later — that the fit 
ended.
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Happy 
24th 

Birthday 
MOM!

xoxoxoxo... 
KAYLA

Happy 45th Anniversary
August 11th

HAROLD and EDNA

Love... Your Family

Can these two share one car?

HAPPY 16TH BIRTHDAY
on the 15th

Love... Mom, Dad & Corey

Take the 
Cholesterol 
Test that 
could save 
your life 
Join Karch Kiraly, U.S. Olympic 
volleyball gold medalist, in the 
national campaign against 
heart disease. Take a simple 
3-minute cholesterol test 
now. It could help save 
your life.
Score one against heart disease.

Yourtuni
National Cholesterol Screening Program

Get Your Cholesterol Tested in the Pharmacy While Shopping At:

927 FOND DU LAC AVE., KEWASKUM,WISCONSIN 530*0 
PHONE 626-8001

Thursday, August 16 - na.m.to6P.m.



Kewaskum Statesman, Thursday, Aug. 16, 1990, Page 5



Schneidewind - Herriges Reindl Printing Opens 
Fond du Lac Office

Ben

Richard Reindl

Carrie Louise Schneidewind 
and James Lee Herriges 
exchanged vows of Holy 
Matrimony on Saturday, May 
12, 1990 during a 1:30 p.m. 
ceremony at St. Bridgets, Town 
of Wayne. Father Berghammer 
officiated.

Parents of the couples are Eva 
and Gil Carlson of West Bend, 
Leander and Mary Herriges of 
the Town of Wayne.

Music was provided by the 
Bertelson’s of West Bend. Pat 
Marx of Fond du Lac did the 
reading, the groom’s 
godmother.

The bride choose Melanie 
Orth of Hartford as her maid of 
honor. Bridesmaids included 
LeAnna Sekeres - West Bend, 
sister of the bride, Melissa Dorn 
- Kewaskum; Brenda Campbell 
- West Bend; Donna Krewald - 
Kewaskum; Amber Charland - 
Milwaukee; Jackie Herriges - 
Kewaskum, sister of the groom; 
and Renee Ganshow - Jackson, 
was the flower girl.

John Herriges of Wayne, 
brother of groom served as best

Televised Business 
Courses Offered
By Moraine Park

Moraine Park Technical 
College’s West Bend campus is 
offering the following business 
classes on cable television this 
fall. Courses are televised at 
various times during the day.

BUSINESS LAW - TV (105- 
160-012). Cost: $118.05.

BUSINESS ORGANIZATION 
- TV (105-120-007). Cost 
$118.05.

THE BUSINESS OF 
MANAGEMENT - TV (196-158- 
001). Cost: $119.55.

MARKETING PRINCIPLES - 
TV (104-102-005). Cost: $156.40

PRINCIPLES OF DATA 
PROCESSING - TV (105-139- 
019). Cost: $118.05.

To register for these classes 
call Moraine Park’s West Bend 
campus, 334-0909. Advanced 
registration is required. Use the 
appropriate course number to 
enroll. Classes begin the week 
of Aug. 27.

man. Groomsmen, were Jon 
Lepp, Random Lake; John 
Schmidt - Kewaskum; Tom 
Herriges - Kewaskum, cousin of 
the groom; Brian Ruplinger - 
Allenton; Robert Schneidewind 
- Port Washington, brother of 
the bride; Joe Schmidt, 
Kewaskum; and Darrick 
Sekeres, West Bend was the 
ring bearer.

Ushering duties were shared 
by Eddie Schneidewind, brother 
of the bride and Ron Theusch, 
friend of the couple.

A reception and dance 
followed at Amerahn, 
Kewaskum.

The bride attended West 
Bend West High School. She is 
employed at Sundance Photo 
Inc. as a Merchandise 
Manager, Jackson, WI.

The groom attended 
Kewaskum High School. He is 
engaged on his family farm in 
the Town of Wayne.

The couple enjoyed a 
honeymoon trip to California.

The couple reside at 8805 
Hwy. W, Allenton, WI 53002.

Free Career Exploration 
Workshops Available

A pair of free Career Decision 
Workshops are being offered by 
Moraine Park Technical College 
at its West Bend campus in 
September and October.

These workshops are 
designed to assist people who 
are unsure of which field of 
employment to enter, are 
thinking of changing careers, 
reentering the job market or 
who were laid off with little 
chance of being rehired. 
Assistance is also offered in 
resume preparation and job 
seeking and interviewing skills.

The September workshop 
(862-321-006) will be held from 
5:30 - 8:30 p.m. on Sept. 17, 18, 
19 and 20, The October 
workshop (862-331-004) will be 
held from 9 a.m. - noon on Oct. 
15, 16, 17 and 18.

For more information or to 
register, call Moraine Park 
Technical College’s West Bend 
campus, 334-3413, ext. 30.

Richard Reindl, President of 
Merrill, Wisconsin based 
Reindl Printing, has announced 
the opening of a sales and 
customer service center in Fond 
du Lac. The office will service 
Reindl’s growing sales base in 
the Southeastern part of the 
state.

The office opening coincides 
with Reindl’s appointment of 
Jeff Kuhnz as office and sales 
manager for the territory. 
Kuhnz has more than 20 years 
of experience in graphic arts

Final Registration for 
Kettle Moraine Lutheran

Kettle Moraine Lutheran 
High School, 3399 Division 
Road, Jackson, WI will hold its 
final registration for the 1990-91 
school year on: Friday, August 
17, 1990, from 9:00 a.m. - 4:00 
p.m. and 6:00 p.m. - 8:00 p.m.

Any questions regarding 
registration should be directed 
to the school at 677-3877 or 677- 
4051.

Wednesday, August 22, from 
7:45 till noon will be freshman 
orientation day, with only the 
ninth graders in attendance. 
The first full day of school for all 
students will be Thursday, 
August 23. The opening service 
for the new school year will also 
be held on Thursday, August 
23, at 7:45 a.m.

Adult CPR Courses
At Moraine Park

Moraine Park Technical 
College is offering evening 
cardiopulmonary resuscitation
(CPR) Adult Basic Life
Support courses this fall. These 
two-week courses cost $8.55.
Each course runs from 
9:30 p.m.

Course 531-432-004 
Wednesday, Sept. 19.

Course 531-432-005
Tuesday, Oct. 9.

Course 531-432-006
Monday, Nov. 5.

6:30 to

begins

begins

begins

Advanced registration for the 
course is required. Registration 
began Aug. 13. To register, call 
Moraine Park’s West Bend 
campus, 334-0909. Use the 
course number to enroll.

and commercial printing sales. 
Prior to joining Reindl, Kuhnz 
was a sales executive with 
Action Printing. The sales and 
customer service center will be 
located at 649A Fond du Lac 
Avenue. The telephone number 
is 414-922-9010.

Reindl Printing is a 
commercial printing specialist 
that services many of 
Wisconsin’s largest corpora-
tions. The company 
established in 1978.

was

When female elephants 
fight, it is said, they usually 
try to bite off each other's 
tail.

BARTOLI’S
PRODUCE & GREENHOUSE

Four miles north of Kewaskum on Hwy. V

Phone 533-4092
HOURS: Open Daily 9 to 8, Sat. & Sun. 9 to 5

This Week’s

SPECIALS 23
Red or White 
Potatoes........................... 
Homegrown Cauliflower.
Homegrown Cucumbers
Sweet Corn......................

^ Green and Yellow Beans ^Kohlrabi 
^Zucchini ^Cabbage 

^Pickles and Dill
★ FRESH FRUITS & VEGETABLES ★ 

15% off trees and shrubs
NOW TAKING ORDERS FOR 
CANNING AND FREEZING 
FRUITS & VEGETABLES

Moraine Park Offers 
Weekend Courses

Are you busy during the week 
but still would like to take some 
classes? Moraine Park 
Technical College’s West Bend 
campus is offering weekend 
courses this fall.

The following courses will be 
held on Saturdays at Moraine 
Park’s West Bend campus:

Lotus 1-2-3 (107-180-021) 8 
a.m. - noon, eight weeks for two 
credits.

Managing Human Resources 
(196-142-001) 8:30 a.m. - 4:30 
p.m., four weeks for three 
credits.

Real Estate Law (194-170- 
003) 8 a.m. - 3 p.m., nine weeks 
for three credits.

Selling (104-105-006) 8 a.m. - 
4 p.m., four weeks for three 
credits.

Small Business Organizing 
(104-380-005) 8 a.m. - 4:30 p.m. 
for four weeks.

Machine Shop, Advanced 
(420-315-005) 8 a.m. - 1:30 p.m. 
for nine weeks.

Registration for fall classes 
began Aug. 13. To register, call 
Moraine Park’s West Bend 
campus at 334-0909. Use the 
course number to enroll.

Weekend courses begin in 
September. Additional classes 
can be found in the new 
Moraine Park Schedule of 
Courses for Fall 1990 recently 
distributed throughout the 
district.
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Campus Notes
The University of Wisconsin -

River Falls
Dean’s List 
students has 
by Registrar 
son.

spring quarter 
honoring 627 

been announced
Melvin German-

Included on the 
Kewaskum: Pearson, 
745 E Main St. #1;

list are: 
Eric C, 
Random

Lake: Junge, Kyle W, 3005 
Silver Crk-Cascade; West Bend: 
Zlesak, David C, 6540 Meadow­
lark Ln.

Call the Statesman for all your 
advertising needs 626-2626.

10 lbs. $1 .69
.............ib. 59c
.......  5/$1
.. .doz. S1.25



Kewaskum Statesman, Thursday, Aug. 16, 1990, Page 7

David Scheifel's carving was chosen as the judges’ 
favorite at the 4th Annual Wisconsin State Fair Cheese 
Carving Challenge sponsored by Wisconsin Milk 
Marketing Board. Scheifel, executive chef at Inn on the 
Park, Madison, received the Cheese Carving Challenge 
award for the third consecutive year.

St. Kilian, Other Churches Honored
St. Kilian Church in St. Kilian 

was one of three area churches 
honored by the National Historical 
Organ Society on Thursday, July 
26.

Close to 300 people attended 
an organ recital at St. Kilian’s 
Church, St. Paul's Evangelical 
Lutheran Church, Lomira and St. 
Anthony’s Church in St. Anthony. 
Recitals were given by organists 
at the different churches.

Four busloads of organ buffs 
traveled from Milwaukee where 
the National Organ Historical 
Society was holding the National 
Convention. People from all over 
the United States, Canada and 
England were traveling 
Southeastern Wisconsin for these 
recitals.

The organ at St. Kilians was 
built around the turn of the 
century.

Collegiate Athletic 
Scholarships Available

Over 100,000 Collegiate 
Athletic Scholarships are 
available each year to male and 
female high school and junior 
college student athletes. 
Contrary to popular belief, 
students don’t have to be All 
State to qualify. Much of this 
money goes unused.

A new publication with 
forms, sample letters and tables 
of factual information is 
available for student athletes. It 
takes them step by step thru the 
important process of getting an 
athletic scholarship and 
includes college and conference 
listings.

For details on how to get a 
collegiate athletic scholarship, 
send a large self addressed, 
stamped envelope to The 
National Sports Foundation, 
612A Willow, Dr., P.O. Box 
940, Oakhurst, NJ 07755.

Free Blood Pressure 
Screening Offered

The Community Health 
Nursing Service .Cardiovascular 
Risk Reduction Program is 
offering a free blood pressure 
screening at the following site 
during the month of August.

August 25 — West Bend Fire 
Department, 320 N. 7th 
Avenue, 1 p.m. - 4 p.m.

Questions about the program 
may be directed to Doris Dauer, 
Coordinator, at 338-5274, 644- 
5204 or 342-2929 (toll free, ext. 
4707).

Closed Monday and Tuesday

Friends of Abused 
Families to Host
Kids from Wisconsin

For the fourth consecutive 
year, Friends of Abused 
Families of West Bend will host 
Wisconsin’s Musical 
Ambassadors - the Kids from 
Wisconsin.

This year’s high powered 
show is totally new and features 
West Bend's Adam Theisen, 
Hartford’s Dani Wallisch, and 
Fredonia’s Chris Malueg. Hits 
from the popular Broadway 
show “Phantom of the Opera,” 
a forties blues medley, and a 
tribute to Duke Ellington are 
but a few of this year’s crowd

FRANK’S ON THE LAKE
1 mi. west of Dundee on Hwy. F 533-8445

SUNDAY BRUNCH
11 a.m. to 2 p.m. - Regular Menu 2 to 9 p.m. 

SATURDAY - 4:30 to I0
FRIDAY SEAFOOD BUFFET - $6.95 - 4:30 to 10 p m 

- Fish Frys and Full Menu -
THURSDAY SHRIMP BOIL - $8.50

ALL YOU CAN EAT
WEDNESDAY SMELT OR CHICKEN PI ATE 

$4.50 (Salad Bar Included)
PRIME RIB DINNER - $6.95 at all times

HOWARD SCHNEIDER 
BIG BAND

, Sunday, Sept. 16 • 2 >o s P m

pleasers.
The show will be held at the 

air conditioned West Bend High 
School Auditorium on Monday, 
August 27 beginning at 7 p.m.

Tickets are available in West 
Bend at all Bank One and M & I 
Banks, both Pick-and-Save 
stores, and Walgreens. Prices 
are $6.00 for adults; $4.00 for 
youth and senior citizens. Prices 
at the door on performance 
night will be 50c more. Special 
reserved seats for $12.50 are 
available by calling Friends at 
334-5598. Great entertainment 
for the whole family!

Remember the Statesman for 
all your advertising needs.

AMERAHN
Bar & Hall

Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum

Sunday, Aug. 19 - 2 to 6 p.m.

UNCLE OZZIE
Friday, Aug. 24 - 8:30 to 12:30

DIRECT FROM MINNESOTA...

PETER & PAUL 
WENDINGER
PHONE 626-4031
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Left to right: Mrs. Ida Weber, Fond du Lac, with her 107th birthday cake and of­
ficers Mary Jane Johnson. Destin, Florida, secretary; Carole Keller, Kewaskum, 
treasurer; Phil Majerus, Campbell Road. Fond du Lac, president; Alice Crass, West 
Bend, vice president; Mildred Thornton, Fond du Lac, historian. Not pictured Alfred 
Seefeldt, Kewaskum, genealogist.

Dieringer Family Reunion Held

Cloudy skies and a brief, but 
heavy, downpour of rain did not 
dampen the spirits of 140 
relatives and guests who 
gathered at Kewaskum’s 
Riverhill Park on Sunday, July 
29, 1990 for the 51st Seefeld/t 
Annual Reunion. In keeping 
with this year’s national census, 
the theme of the reunion was 
“Come and Be Counted.” 
Members ot the Seefeldt and 
Seefeldt families, descendants 
of Christian Friedrich Seefeld 
(1795-1865) and Anna Sophia 
Kohs (1795-1835) meet each 
year in Kewaskum, on the last 
Sunday of July, for their annual 
reunion. In eight generations 
there are over 2,100 known 
members of the clan. Relatives 
in attendance this year were 
from Arizona, Florida, Illinois, 
Indiana, Massachusetts and 
Wisconsin.

The day’s activities began 
with a “share a dish” picnic 
dinner. A large birthday cake 
honored Mrs. Ida Fink Weber, 
107, the oldest living member of 
the clan. Following dinner, 
Reunion President, Phil 
Majerus, conducted the annual

business meeting. Greetings 
and letters were shared from 
relatives who were unable to 
attend the reunion.

Attendance prizes were 
awarded to Mrs. Weber of Fond 
du Lac, 107, and Alfred H. 
Seefeldt of Kewaskum. 93, the 
oldest lady and gentleman 
present; 6-month old Amber 
Lynn Knoeck, youngest 
member present and Matthew 
Lawrenz of Scottsdale, Arizona, 
traveling farthest to attend. 
Milton and Margaret Seefeld of 
Oshkosh, married 57 years, 
were the longest married couple 
present and Jeffery and Cathy 
Miller of Aurora, Illinois were 
the most recently married 
couple.

Harold Klug of Aurora, 
Oregon sent gifts of honey 
which were presented to those 
persons attending a Seefeld/t 
reunion for the first time, and to 
David Muench of Marshfield 
and Tony Knoeck of 
Kewaskum, relatives traveling 
the longest and shortest 
distance in Wisconsin to reach 
Riverhill Park.

The secretary's report for the

1989-1990 “reunion year” 
listed 26 births. 5 deaths, 9 
marriages and 5 living members 
of the Seefeld/t Ninety Club. 
Living members of the Ninety 
Club, in addition to Ida Fink 
Weber and Alfred Seefeldt, are 
Mrs. Esther Guell Seefeld of 
Fond du Lac, 95; August H. 
Seefeldt of Kewaskum, 91, and 
Miss Amalia Seefeldt of West 
Bend, 90.

Following the business 
meeting, Elmer Seefeld led the 
group in singing. Alice Crass, 
and Wayne and Therese Casper 
were in charge of games.

The following officers were 
elected to serve for 1990-91; 
President, Phil Majerus of Fond 
du Lac; Vice President, Alice 
Crass of West Bend; Secretary, 
Neil and Mary Jane Johnson of 
Destin, Florida; Treasurer, 
Carole Keller of Kewaskum; 
Historian, Mildred Thornton of 
Fond du Lac, and Genealogist, 
Alfred Seefeldt of Kewaskum.

The first woman to see her son 
inaugurated for a second term 
as president of the U.S. was 
Sara Delano Roosevelt, mother 
of Franklin D. Roosevelt.

Ninety-six descendants of 
Andrew, Sigmund, Norbert, 
Barnabus and Franceska 
Dieringer gathered at 
Fireman’s Park, Campbellsport 
on Sunday, August 3rd.

Several awards were given; to 
Charles and Esther Dieringer of 
La Habra, CA, who traveled the 
farthest; to Rose Hatland of 
Kewaskum for bringing the 
most children with her to the 
reunion; to Mrs. Alice Schmidt 
of St. Paul, MN for being the 
oldest, age 78; To Evan Lee 
Dieringer, son of Henry Lee 
Dieringer of Germantown for 
being the youngest, age 1 
month; to Alvin and Valeria 
Straub of rural Campbellsport 
for having the most 
grandchildren, 17; to Jerry 
Menke of West Bend for being 
the tallest 6' 2” tall.

A donation of $35.25 was 
collected and given to the 
Campbellsport Firemen for use 
of the park.

The children of Irving 
Dieringer, Loraine Seibel, 
Helen Rohlinger, Ruth Menke 
and John Dieringer hosted the 
event which drew families from 
Belgium, Kewaskum, Port 
Washington. Germantown, 
Fond du Lac, West Bend, 
Lomira, Marshfield, Stevens 
Point, West Allis, Plymouth, 
Milwaukee, Ixonia. Wis. and 
surrounding areas as well as 
Minnesota. Illinois and 
California.

Games were played after a

TURNER HALL
Fillmore 

Choice dates available 
AMPLE PARKING 

692-2597 
If no answer 692-2767 

‘Catering Available

CORN GAME 
& RAFFLE

Every Third Wednesday
7 p.m.

potluck dinner and enjoyable 
time was had by all. The 
children of Lauretta Dieringer 
Straub will be hosting the next 
reunion on the first Sunday 
in August 1995.

FOR 
CHILDREN 

WHO HAVE 
ASTHMA

American ZLung Association 
°f Wisconsin

(414)463-3232 (800)242-5160
So»c» conlr.twt«l By IM put»i»M> m * puBic true*

WEST BEND 
CINEMA

Phone 334-5466

HELD OVER!

FLATLINERS
Rated R

Evenings at 6:45 & 9 p.m. 
Sunday Matinees at 2 & 4:15

HELD OVER!

GHOST
Rated PG-13

Evenings at 7 & 9:15 p.m.
Sunday Matinees 

at 2:15 & 4:30

GIFT CERTIFICATES 
ARE AVAILABLE!

Over two million Americans are 85 and over.

£^^ > St. John 
j^&y Lutheran Church

.PICNIC r In New Fane
M Sunday, Aug. 26

starting at 11 a.m. 
Music By 

JIGGS & CO.
Hamburgers Refreshments
Beef Sandwiches Games
Brats Food

★ DOOR PRIZES*
TICKETS AVAILABLE AT THE PICNIC

A Dav at 
the Beach!

Saturday, Aug. 18

voReyball

Starting at
12 noon

$5.00 COVER CHARGE AT THE DOOR 
includes swimming... food... and alot of fun!

Children under 12 years of age - $3.00 
(Must be accompanied by parent or guardian)

Coming Saturday, Aug. 25...

First Annual Auburn Lake
BASS TOURNAMENT

Call for Details
^1620 Lakeshore Dr., Campbellsport

PHONE 533-8134
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Announces New Employee MDA Bike Ride Slated for Sept. 16

Kelly Oppelt

The Muscular Dystrophy 
Association West Bend 
Professional Firefighters 
Century Ride 1990 (25, 50, 75 or 
100 mile routes) will be held on 
Sunday, Sept. 16, (rain or shine) 
at Regner Park, West Bend, 
into the country and back to 
Regner Park, to help raise 
money for MDA and to help all 
of Jerry’s Kids.

All you need is a bicycle and 
your $10 entry fee. Late entry

fee of $15 after Sept. 10.
If you choose to solicit 

pledges per mile that you ride, 
your registration fee is $5 (with 
a minimum of 5 sponsors). With 
this option you DO NOT have to 
go back and collect your pledges 
as MDA collects for you with 
their mail-back pledge forms.

To register contact Muscular 
Dystrophy Association, 811 N. 
Hawley Road, Suite 100, 
Milwaukee, WI 53212, (414)

453-7600 or West Bend 
Professional Firefighters Local 
2025, (414) 338-5054.

“Pedal with a purpose.”
Places in West Bend that 

have registration forms are as 
follows: West Bend Fire Dept., 
Pick ‘N Save North, Pick ‘N 
Save South, Kohl’s Food Store, 
Benidt Foods, Piggly Wiggly 
Super Market, Kettle Moraine 
Fitness, YMCA, Toucan 
Custard and Deli-Food Xpress.

JrpL2Zi5I^^ 

338-0201 
e Call for appointment

Qaanaaoann
1720 Barton Ave. 

West Bend
D 
□

Kelly Oppelt has joined the 
staff at Wau-Bun Girl Scout 
Council as Field Executive/- 
Public Relations. Oppelt 
received her Bachelor of 
Science degree in Human 
Services from UW-Oshkosh in 
1989. With over 13 years of Girl 
Scout experience as both a girl 
member and adult volunteer, 
she has participated in a variety 
of Girl Scout activities ranging 
from troop leader to member of 
a Contemporary Issues Task

Glacier Edge 
Scouting Kickoff

The 1990-91 Kick-Off 
Meeting for adult leaders of all 
Cub Scout Packs and Boy Scout 
Troops, Commissioners, 
District Committee and 
Members at Large, of Glacier 
Edge District 11, Bay-Lakes 
Council of the Boy Scouts of 
America, will be conducted 
Thursday, August 16, at 7:30 
p.m. (Commissioners will meet 
at 6:30 p.m.) The location has 
been changed from St. Joseph 
Church, Grafton, to Ozaukee 
County Courthouse, 123 W. 
Main Street, Port Washington.

District Executive, Dan Me 
Manus, requests that all units 
be represented to obtain 
information and pick up their 
Kick-Off Packet. District and 
Council Calendars will be 
distributed and supplies will be 
available.

James Maersch is Kick-Off 
Chairman and James Winget 
will serve as Master of 
Ceremonies.

Force. Most recently, as 
Community Development 
Coordinator, Oppelt assisted in 
the development of a council 
wide literacy program and 
oversaw the partnered linkage 
of Malta Girl Guides and the 
Fox River Area Girl Scout 
Council. In addition to Public 
Relations responsibilities, she 
will provide field services to 
nine service areas in the council 
jurisdiction.

Offer Cholesterol 
Screening, Blood 
Pressure Measurement

Cholesterol screening and 
blood pressure measurement 
will be offered to West Bend 
area residents by the 
Community Health Nursing 
Service Cardiovascular Risk 
Reduction Program.

Screening tests will be 
available once a month at the 
WASHINGTON COUNTY 
COURT HOUSE, 432 E. 
Washington, West Bend.

Screening schedule: Aug. 
23rd, beginning at 9:30 a.m., in 
room 243, (main level of court 
house).

Blood Pressure and 
Cholesterol screenings will be 
done BY APPOINTMENT 
ONLY. Cholesterol screening 
will be done for a charge of 
$5.00.

To schedule an appointment 
for cholesterol and/or blood 
pressure screening, call 
338-4707 or 644-5204 or 342- 
2929 (toll free, ext. 4707).

a Wisconsin House Woodworksc
O Featuring custom built fine furniture, architectural woodwork
G and other handcrafted specialties1
^b a a a a a a qlocated in the olde barton villageo a a a a a

O 
D 
D 
O 
O

S[^^W

Wallpaper
Sale

30% OFF
Selected Books

Simplicity

Public 
Notice

Simplicity Manufacturing of 
Port Washington, Wisconsin 

has appointed 
TENNIES <^B HARDWARE

To Liquidate excess and 
discontinued Simplicity Inventory at 
Low Low Prices. All Equipment will 
be fully set up and serviced by 
TENNIES HARDWARE
Service Department. All equipment 
sold will carry a complete full 2 yr. 
warranty. Most units are fully 
crated -others slightly scratched or 
dented floor models. Sale is subject 
to quantities 
available in J 
warehouse. Don't V p , 
miss this one time y foe 
sale only at <C 
TENNIES L 
(^fpMut) -^
HARDWARE. ^A/^

Sale ends August 26th. 1990.•••*»<:„ do not reflect Freight ft Prop extra FlnanonJ

HARDWARE
LUMBER • HARDWARE - PAINT 

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum, Wl 626-2164

TENNIES HARDWARE
112 S 5TH AVENUE 869 S MAIN STREET

WEST BEND 338-2316 WEST BEND. 334-5891
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WINNER . . . Cheesy Mushroom Puffs is flavor winning 
time saver for holiday hostess. Made with refrigerated crescent 
roll dough, they can he made ahead of time, refrigerated and 
served warm from the oven when company arrives.

3-oz. package cream 
cheese, softened
2-oz. can (1/3 cup) 
mushrooms, drained 
and chopped
2 tablespoons chopped 
pimento
1 teaspoon instant minced 
onion or 1 tablespoon 
chopped onion
2 drops Tabasco 
pepper sauce 
8-oz. can Pillsbury 
Refrigerated Quick Cres­
cent Dinner Rolls 
1/3 cup finely chopped 
nuts

Preheat oven to 375°. In small

Orientation, Dinner 
For New UWWC 
Students Aug. 30

WEST BEND — This year’s 
student orientation at UWWC 
will be a relaxing evening of 
introductions, dinner and 
entertainment. All new 
students and their parents or 
spouses are invited to attend 
orientation, including a sit down 
dinner, on Thursday, August 30 
at 5:15 in the University Student 
Union.

According to Associate 
Director of Student Services Jan 
Ford, this is the third year 
orientation has been handled 
this way. It has been a success 
because the cost is minimal, the 
dress casual, and the 
atmosphere relaxed. “We hope 
students will become more 
comfortable with UWWC and 
be able to get acquainted with 
us,” she said.

Students, parents and 
spouses will be able to meet 
with faculty and staff, speak 
with student advisors, and tour 
UWWC’s expanded facilities. 
Student group leaders will be 
seated at each table at dinner to 
share their perspectives on 
campus life.

The evening will be capped 
off with a performance by the 
Phillips Brothers, a pair of 
professional comedians bound 
to shake off any pre-school 
jitters. Reservations are 
required for the program and 
can be made by sending a check 
of $4 to cover the cost of dinner, 
to UWWC Student Services 
Office, 400 University Dr., West 
Bend, WI 53095.

bowl, blend first 5 ingredients. 
Separate crescent dough into 4 
rectangles; press perforations 
to seal. Spread each with about 
1 tablespoon mushroom mix­
ture. Starting at longer side, 
roll up; seal. Cut each into 6 
pieces. Roll in nuts. Bake on 
ungreased cookie sheet 15 to 20 
minutes until golden brown. 
Serve warm. 24 appetizer puffs. 
(Refrigerate any leftovers.)

MAKE AHEAD TIPS:
Prepare, cover and refrigerate 
up to 2 hours; then bake as 
directed. To reheat bakeo ap­
petizers, wrap in foil; heat at 
350° for 10 to 12 minutes.

Diane Majerus
ELECTROLYSIS SALON

Remove Unwanted Hair Permanently 
Through electrolysis — the only method approved 

by The American Medical Association 
FOR APPOINTMENT OR CONSULTATION CALL

533-4603
384 Windell Ave. Campbellsport

PRIME TIME
BOWUNG LEAGUE 

OPENINGS
★ TEAMS NEEDED *

Ladies - Monday, 6:30 - 5 Per Team - 2 Teams Needed 
Ladies - Thursday, 6:30 - 5 Per Team - 1 Team Needed 
Men - Tuesday, 6:40 - 5 Per Team - 4 Teams Needed 
Men - Wednesday, 6:40 - 5 Per Team - 3 Teams Needed 
Men - Friday, 6:40 - 5 Per Team - 4 Teams Needed

For more information 
Call 334-3071

ZERNIA'S 
LIGHTHOUSE LANES, INC.

Hwy. 45 to Hwy. ‘D’ exit - East two blocks 
ACROSS FROM K OF C HALL

Village Board 
Meeting Monday

Public notice is hereby given that 
the next meeting of the Village of 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin, Village 
Board is scheduled for Monday 
evening, Aug. 20, 1990 at 8:00 
p.m. in the Council Room of the 
Municipal Building, 204 First 
Street.

The agendas for meeting are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the clerk 
at the Municipal Building on 
Thursday preceding the meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and lobby 
of the Valley Bank.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

TOWN OF KEWASKUM 
TOWN BOARD MEETING
The Kewaskum Town Board 

will meet Monday, August 20, 
1990, at 7:30 p.m. at the Labor 
Hall, 1230 Fond du Lac Avenue, 
Kewaskum.

On the agenda is payment of 
bills.

The Town Board meeting will 
adjourn into closed session at 
7:50 p.m. The Board will move 
to the Town Hall and will 
interview persons for a full-time 
highway and maintenance 
employee of the township.

A complete agenda is 
available from the Town Clerk 
the Saturday before the 
meeting.

Barbara Hinz
Town Clerk

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU 
Meadowcreek Apartment

Complex
Monday, Aug. 20 — Crispy 

baked chicken, parsley potato 
salad, melon salad, pumper- 
nickle bread w/butter, peanut 
butter cookie, milk and coffee.

Tuesday, Aug. 21 — Baked 
fish w/tarter sauce, oven brown 
potato, cole slaw, cracked 
wheat bread w/butter, red 
raspberry gelatin, milk and 
coffee.

Thursday, Aug. 23 - Tomato 
juice, swiss steak w/gravy, 
whipped potatoes, wax beans, 
rye bread w/butter, peach pie, 
milk and coffee.

Ceramics at 10:00 a.m. every 
1st and 3rd Tuesday of the
month.

Card playing everyday.

APR
“We’ve got the best deal on wheels”

West Bend Savings
West Ucsd Miuger Kewaskum Genuaulouo Jackson Weal Bend 
338-0811 844-5277 626-2186 255-2900 077-3621 334-5563

• Rale may adjust over the term of tlie loan

The road to better financing

HON-E-KORC.C.
Tuesday Nite Men’s League 

8-7-90
Top teams this week: 

Handicappers - 5; Longbranch - 
5; LR Divot Diggers - 5; Wild 
Ones - 5; Par Nons - 3; 
Everglades - 3; Dave’s Pudders 
- 3; Gruber Toolers - 3.

Low Gross: Joe Doherty - 36, 
Steve Van Ess - 37, Mike 
O’Connor Jr. & Dave Wietor - 
38.

Low Net: Joe Doherty & Mike 
Pfeiffer - 31. Dave Wietor, Ed 
Hall and Marsh Alf - 32.

Low Team Net: Wild Ones - 
135.

Highlights: Tom Kachel- 
meyer won the special event on 
hole #16. Joe Doherty had two 
birdies.
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 11 Economic Assistance Loans Available 

For Education of Veterans, Children
By Richard W. Baker, County' Veterans' Service Officer

To finance their education 
expenses, Wisconsin veterans, 
dependent children of deceased 
veterans and unremarried 
widows or widowers of veterans 
may qualify for loans and grants 
from the Wisconsin Department 
of Veterans Affairs (WDVA).

For the education of 
Wisconsin veterans and their 
children, WDVA offers an 
Economic Assistance Loan with 
an interest rate of only 6 
percent with up to five years 
after graduation to repay. In 
addition, WDVA has full-time 
study grants, which don’t have 
to be repaid.

Eligible applicants may 
borrow up to $4,500.00 with an 
Economic Assistance Loan. 
Generally, the funds are 
distributed in equal, annual 
payments while the student is 
enrolled full time. To qualify for 
this loan, the combined income 
of the veteran and spouse 
generally cannot exceed 
$30,000.00 plus $500.00 for 
each dependent in excess of two 
dependents.

WDVA also offers Full-Time 
Grants exclusively to Vietnam 
Era veterans and post-Vietnam 
veterans who served in 
hostilities, such as Grenada, 
Lebanon and Panama.

Based on financial need, the 
maximum full-time Education 
Grant per academic year is 
$200.00 for single veterans and 
$400.00 for a married veteran or 
a veteran with dependents. 
Qualified veterans may receive 
a full-time Education Grant 
each year for up to four 
academic years. Dependents of 
veterans and veterans with 
bachelor’s degrees are not

eligible for the full-time grant.
For more information about 

additional WDVA eligibility 
requirements for education 
grants and loans, contact the 
County Veterans’ Service 
Officer of your county or 
Richard W. Baker, Washington 
County Veterans’ Service 
Officer at 338-4457.

Junior Women’s 
Recipe of the Month

This recipe and many more 
can be found in the Kewaskum 
Junior Woman’s Club new 
cookbook. To buy your copy ask 
any Jr. Woman’s Club member 
or else they can be found at 
Kennelly Pharmacy, Regal 
Ware Outlet or Kewaskum 
Frozen Foods.

Blueberry Jell-O Salad
Gayle Van Ess

3 sm. boxes sugar-free 
raspberry Jell-0

1 can blueberries (not pie 
filling)

1 can crushed pineapple
1 c. crushed nuts
1 pkg. Dream Whip topping
*/t c. milk
Drain pineapple and 
blueberries, reserving juice as 
liquid to make Jell-O. From 6 
cups of Jell-0 reserve 2 cups. 
Add pineapple, berries and nuts 
to 4 cups of Jell-O, refrigerate 
until set in 13 x 9 inch pan. 
When reserved 2 cups is set, 
beat until frothy and add one 
package of prepared Dream 
Whip. Spread over blueberry 
Jell-O. Chill.

The basketball dribble was first 
used professionally by Bert 
Loomis in 1896.

Lehman

MADISON.. .Representative 
Michael Lehman (R-Hartford) 
was recently appointed to serve 
on a Republican Task Force 
which will look into the issue of 
unfunded state mandates.

Members of the task force 
will be touring the state to meet 
with local officials to hear their 
concerns on unfunded state 
mandates. This will provide an 
opportunity for local govern­
ments to voice their opinions on 
how the Legislature can 
minimize the increasing costs it 
imposes on local taxpayers, by 
looking at current and proposed 
mandates.

With the information 
obtained, the members will

HON-E-KOR 
Thursday Night Ladies 

Golf League
PARS: Hole 10- Lynn Judnic, 

10 - Audrey Pfister, 12 - Eileen 
Gajewski, 12 - Judi Tieglman, 
13 - Sue Thelen, 14 - Jo Ellen 
Christie, 14 - Lyn Griffin, 14 - 
Nancy Holquist, 14 - Jan 
Leverenz, 14 - Carol Martin, 14 
- Judy Moede, 14 - Karen 
Oelhafen, 14 - Tracey Schaub, 
14 - Muriel Wondergem, 15 - 
Donna Bichler, 16 - Pat Loduha, 
18 - Carol Martin.

BIRDIES: Hole 15 - Judy 
Moede.

CHIP-INS: Hole 18 - Ardy

Bergerud.
LOW NET: Mary Gundrum - 

score of 28.
EVENT ■ PUTTS: Class A - 

Audrey Pfister, Class B - Carole 
Timblin, Class C - Lu Freeze, 
Class D - Marolyn Kell, Class D 
- Marilyn Orlopp.

BLIND BOGEY: Cheryl 
Bales - Score of 59, Mary 
Korpinen - Score of 59, Eleanor 
Marx - Score of 59, Jan Young - 
Score of 59.

Spend your money wisely. Ad­
vertise in the Statesman.

In the 1945 movie To Have and Have Not Lauren Bacall’s 
singing voice was dubbed in by 14-year-old Andy Will­
iams.

King Crossword
ACROSS

1. Degree
5. Saratoga Springs
8. Wild hog

12. North Star
14. Large pulpit
15. Macaroni 

ingredient
16. Lively air
17. Golfer’s goal
18. Tends the 

turkey
20. Marsh bird
23. Bartok or

Lugosi
24. River in 

France
25. Disputant
28. Wad of clay
29. Beautiful, 

charming girl
30. Female parent
32. Italian 

porridge
34. Nevada city
35. Single units
36. Harass

37. Delete
40. Woeful
41. Region
42. Runs
47. English 

prison
48. Skunks
49. Sea bird
50. Conger
51. To corner
DOWN

1. Shore Patrols 
(abbr.)

2. — the mark
3. Stately tree
4. Race, tribe 

or nation
5. Mix
6. Goat-eared 

god
7. Girl’s name
8. Word with fir 

or spruce
9. Neglect

10. Competent
11 Decomposes
13. Lath

19. Nautical word
20. Weep con­

vulsively
21. Deadfall
22. Preposition
23. Flees
25. Wife of 

Odysseus
26. Caesar's

fateful date
27. A staff
29. Part of N.B.
31. Witty saying
33. Situation
34. Wield a 

blue pencil
36. Unconcealed
37. Goalie's

charge
38. Sandarac tree
39. A gas
40. Vend
43. American 

author
44. Old salt
45. Summer in Caen
46. Compass reading

report their recommendations 
to the Legislature for debate 
during the upcoming session. 
The goal would be to pass 
legislation that would restrict 
the state from approving costly 
programs without funding, 
which usually leaves local 
officials to find other sources of 
revenue to finance these state 
mandated programs. The 
Legislature must find a new 
approach to ensure funding 
before implementing mandates. 
This would, in turn, relieve the 
burden of local officials, who 
usually have to raise property 
taxes or impose a local sales tax 
as a source of their funding.

The Wisconsin Counties 
Association is requesting an 
advisory referendum on this 
issue. Currently, sixty of the 
seventy-two state counties have 
agreed to present this 
referendum to their voters 
during the upcoming fall 
elections.

“It is time that the 
Legislature finally take the 
responsibility of providing 
funding when passing state 
mandates,’’ stated Lehman.

The following are scheduled 
public hearings to be held in the 
area: September 18th: Brown 
County Library, rooms 1 & 2, 
515 Pine St., Green Bay; 
September 19th: City County 
Government Center, Rooms D 
& E, 160 S. Macy St., Fond du 
Lac; October 9th: The Arena, 
Fox River Room' N1 W24848 
Northview Rd., Waukesha; 
October 10th: County Public 
Works Division, Auditorium, 
14200 Washington Ave. (Hwy. 
20), Racine; and October 16th: 
County Court house, Room 
201B, 901 N. Ninth St., 
Milwaukee.

If you have questions, or 
would like to let Rep. Lehman 
know of your concerns on this 
issue, feel free to contact him in 
Madison at: Room 310 West, 
State Capitol, Madison 53712, 
or by calling the Legislative 
Hotline: 1-800-362-9696.

o) sj»M8uy

Family Hair Salon
227 Main St., Kewaskum

__________ 626-2650__________
STy^Ng eye brow arching ^^

AU KIDS AGES 5-18 
JUNIOR BOWLING PROGRAM ; 

Bantams, Bumpers & Juniors ■ Majors 
SIGN UP SATURDAY, AUG. 25TH

10 a m. to 1 p.m.

^Awards Program ^Shirt ^Trophies i 
^Tournaments ^Fun Days ^Ball Rental Program ]

Y A B A Sanctioned with Certified Instructor I 
For more information call 334-3071 > 

or stop in! [
ZERNIAS

Sandy and

Tom Zernia's

LIGHTHOUSE LANES, INC
Hwy 45 to Hwy D' exit, east two blocks 

ACROSS FROM K OF C HALL
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MARY L. HRON
Mary L. Hron, 73, of Ke­

waskum passed away on Satur­
day, August 11, 1990 at St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital 
in West Bend.

She was born on August 17, 
1916 in the Town of Ashford, 
the daughter of the late John 
and Kathryn (Becker) McCarty. 
On June 23, 1936 she was 
united in marriage to Elroy 
“Buckley” Hron at St. 
Matthews Catholic Church in 
Campbellsport. He preceded 
her in death on November 20, 
1964.

Mrs. Hron was a member of 
the Holy Trinity Catholic 
Church in Kewaskum and the 
Ladies Altar Sodality and had 
been a resident of Samaritan 
Nursing Home in West Bend for 
the past one and a half years.

Survivors include five 
daughters: Mary Jane (John) 
Bauer Sr. of Campbellsport, 
Patricia (John) Coulter of 
Kewaskum, Julianne (Dennis) 
Luedtke of Mayfield, Deborah 
(Thomas) Begun of Oshkosh, 
Penelope (James) Martz of 
Wauwatosa; four sons: John A. 
(Chris) of Fond du Lac, Kevin 
(Chung Sue) of Mareno Valley, 
Calif.; Keith of Pirimasims, 
West Germany and Brian 
(Margaret) of Madison, a sister 
Alice (Justin) Baucom of 
Campbellsport; four brothers: 
William (Lucy) McCarty of 
Kewaskum, George McCarty, 
John F. (Gloria) McCarty and 
Daniel (Helen) McCarty all of 
Campbellsport; 25 grandchild­
ren and 13 great-grandchildren.

She was preceded in death by 
a daughter Kathleen Haug, a 
sister Helen and three brothers: 
John Thomas, Leo and John.

Funeral services were held at 
the Miller Funeral Home, 
Kewaskum at 7:30 p.m. with a 
Mass of Christian Burial at Holy 
Trinity Catholic Church, 
Kewaskum, at 8:00 p.m. on 
Tuesday August 14, 1990 with 
Father Thomas Venne and 
Father Robert Berghammer 
con-celebrating. Burial was in 
the parish cemetery at 10:00 
a.m. on Wednesday. Friends 
called from 4:00 p.m. until time 
of services at the funeral home 
on Tuesday.

Memorials may be given to 
the Holy Trinity School Fund.

JOHN L. KUESTER
John L. Kuester, of 3460 

Town Hall Road, Kewaskum, 
died Monday, Aug. 6, 1990, at 
St. Joseph’s Community 
Hospital, West Bend, at the age 
of 67.

He was born Aug. 17, 1922, 
in West Bend, and married 
Grace Otten Nov. 6, 1946, at St. 
Mary’s Immaculate Conception 
Parish, West Bend.

He was a member of St. 
Mary’s Immaculate Conception 
Parish and the Historical Truck 
Society.

Survivors include his wife; 
four children, Mary (David) 
Klein of Campbellsport, Amy 
(Paul) Weis of Hilbert, Susan 
(Martin) Ott of West Bend and 
Julie (Paul) Giese of Appleton; 
10 grandchildren; a brother, 
Robert (Mary) of West Bend, 
and other relatives and friends.

Memorial services were 
Saturday, Aug. 11, at 2 p.m. at 
the Myrhum Funeral Home, 
West Bend, with Fr. John 
Furtmann officiating.

The family greeted relatives 
and friends prior to the service.

ESTHER K. BERG
Esther K. Berg, nee Kern, of 

Germantown, formerly of West 
Bend, died Monday, Aug. 6, 
1990, at St. Joseph’s 
Community Hospital, West 
Bend, at the age of 65.

She was born June 9, 1925, in 
St. Kilian, and in 1944 moved to 
Nenno. In 1960 she moved to 
West Bend where she was 
employed at The West Bend Co. 
for more than 30 years, retiring 
in 1987. She had lived in 
Germantown since 1985.

Survivors include a daughter, 
Nancy Berg of Germantown; a 
grandson, Joseph Nienaber; a 
sister, Gladys (Charles) Peters 
of Richfield; two brothers, 
Orville (Ruth) of St. Kilian and 
Richard (Barbara) of West 
Bend, and other relatives and 
friends.

She was a member of the 
Legion of Mary, the Christian 
Women’s Confraternity at St. 
Boniface Church, Goldendale 
and the 25-Year Club at The 
West Bend Co.

Funeral services with a Mass 
of Christian Burial was held 
Wednesday, Aug. 8, at 10 a.m. 
at St. Boniface Church, 
Goldendale. Fr. Leonard Andre 
was the celebrant, and burial 
was in the church cemetery.

Visitation at the Schmidt 
Funeral Home, West Bend, was 
Tuesday, from 4 to 9 p.m., with 
a prayer vigil at 7:30 p.m.

MARGARET R. YOGERST
Margaret R. Yogerst, nee 

Janzer, of West Bend, died 
Thursday, Aug. 9, 1990 at the 
Cedar Lake Home, West Bend, 
at the age of 73.

She was born Sept. 2, 1916, in 
the Town of Richfield. After her 
marriage to Felix J. Yogerst at 
St. Mary’s Church, Richfield, 
on July 17, 1935, they settled on 
a farm in Kohlsville. In 1967, 
they moved to West Bend 
where she lived up to the time 
of her death.

Prior to her retirement in 
1981, she was employed at The 
West Bend Co. for over 35 
years.

Her husband passed away 
April 29, 1981.

Survivors include two 
daughters, Rosalie (Gordon) 
Gorecki and Joanne (Nick Jr.) 
Habersetzer, both of West 
Bend; five grandchildren; 11 
great-grandchildren; two 
sisters, Marie Yogerst of Nabob 
and Theresa Bruckert of West 
Bend; two brothers, Alphonse 
of Richfield and William of 
West Bend; two brothers- 
in-law, Clemens Yogerst of 
Juneau and Alvin Ewert of 
Jackson; three sisters-in-law, 
Lorraine Zabojnik of 
Menomonee Falls, Estelle 
Giese of Mayville and Margaret 
Janzer of Allenton, and other 
relatives and friends.

Her parents and two brothers 
preceded her in death.

She was a member of the 
25-Year-Club at The West Bend 
Company and Holy Angels 
Parish.

Funeral services were 
Saturday, Aug. 11, at 9:30 a.m. 
at the Schmidt Funeral Home, 
West Bend, with a Liturgy of 
the Resurrection at 10 a.m. at 
Immaculate Conception 
Church. Rev. Jerome Rinzel 
and Rev. Gary Heinecke, 
C.S.S.R., will con-celebrate, 
and burial was in St. Anthony’s 
Cemetery, St. Anthony.

Visitation at the funeral home

was Friday after 4 p.m., with a 
prayer vigil at 8:30 p.m.

JOE RAWLINGS
Joe Rawlings, 68, of 319 S'. 

Fond du Lac Ave., Campbell­
sport, died Saturday, Aug. 11, 
1990, at Grancare Nursing 
Home, Fond du Lac.

Mr. Rawlings was born Jan. 
30, 1922, in Iowa, a son of Roy 
and Goldie Fulton Rawlings. On 
Dec. 18, 1965, he married Ruth 
Howard at First Baptist Church, 
Campbellsport.

Mr. Rawlings was employed 
with West Bend Co. until his 
retirment. He served in the U.S. 
Army in the Pacific during 
World War II and was a 
member of First Baptist 
Church, Campbellsport. He 
served as trustee of the church 
and was a member of the 
church’s men’s group and the 
25 Year Club of West Bend Co.

Survivors include two 
brothers, Orville and his wife 
Caroline of Omaha, Neb., and 
Virgil and his wife Clara Mae of 
Phoenix, Ariz.; and three 
sisters, Violet Wasson of 
Villisca, Iowa, Darlene 
Stiverson of Red Oak, Iowa and 
Flora Shepherd of Illinois. 
Preceding him in death was his 
wife on Feb. 16, 1981.

Funeral services will be held 
Thursday at 1 p.m. at First 
Baptist Church, Campbellsport. 
The Rev. Larry Schaefer will 
officiate. Entombment will be 
in Shrine of Rest Mausoleum, 
Fond du Lac.

Friends may call Wednesday 
from 4 to 8 p.m. at Twohig 
Funeral Home Campbellsport, 
and Thursday from noon to the 
hour of services at the church.

Memorials may be directed to 
the church.

BEN SADOFF
Funeral services for Ben 

Sadoff, 90, a resident of Fort 
Lauderdale, Fla., and Fond du 
Lac, were held Tuesday at 11 
a.m. at Temple Beth Israel.

Rabbi Morton Shalowitz 
officiated. Burial was in the 
Temple Beth Israel section of 
Rienzi Cemetery.

Friends called Tuesday from 
10 a.m. to the hour of services 
at the temple.

Mr. Sadoff died Sunday, 
Aug. 12, 1990, at N7206 
Winnebago Drive, Lakewood 
Beach, the home of his sister 
where he resided.

He was born June 11, 1900, in 
Odessa, Russia, a son of 
Abraham and Rebecca Manis 
Sadoff. On June 25, 1924, he 
married Dina Cohen in Fond du 
Lac.

Mr. Sadoff attended Union 
School and Franklin School and 
later joined his father in the 
business of buying scrap metal, 
then known as A. Sadoff and 
Son. The firm also bought the 
scrap metal from Regal Ware 
for many years.

Along with his lifetime of 
business establishments and

MONUMENTS
★ Uprights and flat 
★ Markers of all kinds 
★ Completely installed 
★ Death date put on 
★ Mausoleums

VINCE’S 
MONUMENTS
1857 Hy. 67 in Ashford 

PHONE 533-8178

acquisitions in Fond du Lac, he 
was known for his major 
charitable contributions to 
many city organizations 
including the YMCA; Temple 
Beth Israel, where he was a 
founder and charter member; 
Workshops Inc.; Blandine 
House; and the Boy Scouts.

He served as president or 
chairman of the board at many 
firms and was a director of 
National Exchange Bank, First 
Wisconsin National Bank and 
the Fred Rueping Leather Co.

In 1967 he received an 
honorary doctor of laws degree 
from Marion College. The 
Science Building at the college 
has since been named for him.

In 1954 he received the Silver 
Beaver Medal from the Boy 
Scout Council, and in 1964 was 
chosen for the Golden Deeds 
Awards by the Exchange Club. 
He also received a Paul Harris 
Award from the Rotary Club. 
Mr. Sadoff was a member of 
B’naiB’rith.

Survivors include one 
brother, Arthur and his wife 
Thelma of Fond du Lac; and 
four sisters, Fannie Nemschoff, 
Betty Hammes and Leone 
Fishelson, all of Fond du Lac, 
and Rose Ruttenberg of 
Monroe, La; two grand­
daughters, Debra and Julie; 
and nieces and nephews.

Preceding him in death were 
his wife on Dec. 17, 1970, one 
son, Howard, two brothers, 
George and David, and a sister, 
Chama Smith.

Mach Funeral Chapel is 
handling arrangements.

IN MEMORY
In memory of ADELINE 

VOLM, who passed away 15 
years ago, August 18, 1975: 
Being far away from you, 
We think of you often, 
But it is not an empty feeling. 
It is a feeling of appreciation. 
We remember the uniqueness 
Of your expressions, 
The depth of your love, 
And the joy and laughter 
You brought to our world.
And through our memories of 

you,
We are never alone.

We still miss you, 
Ed and family

IN MEMORY
In loving memory of ROBERT 

GROSS, who passed away eight 
years ago, August 18, 1982: 
God took him home
It was his will
But in our hearts we love him 

still.
His memory is as dear today 
As in the hour he passed away.

Sadly missed by his wife and 
family.

WEST BEND 
MONUMENT CO.

334-3071

Modern Memorials Designed for You 
"Serving Wisconsin Since 1903"

Gary Koenings and Wally Miller
^*3^^ 25 E. Washington 1
HILCINDORF/ (Hwy. 33), West Be 
yMEMORIALS A/? block east of the railroad 

Parking in rear of build

IN MEMORY
In Loving memory of DORIS 

KLUEVER who passed away 
three years ago, Aug. 16, 1987: 
We often sit and think of you 
And speak of how you died;
To think you could not say 

goodbye to us
Before you closed your eyes.
The flowers we place upon your 

grave,
May wither and decay
But the love for you who sleeps 

beneath
Shall never fade away.

Loved and missed by her 
husband and son.

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to thank 

everyone who helped us 
through the recent loss of our 
husband and dad.

The prayers, gifts, cards, 
food, flowers, phone calls and 
visits were sincerely 
appreciated.

Special thanks to the Michels 
Road Crew, the Fond du Lac 
Rescue Squad, St. Agnes 
Hospital, Miller’s Funeral 
Home, Pastor Edwin Fredrich 
for his beautiful sermon, Lee 
Kempf and Deborah Hoenecke.

It comforts us to know how 
many people his life touched.

The family of
Lawrence J. “Gabby” 

Galabinske Jr.
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SHEEPSHEAD WINNERS
5 handed winners on Thurs­

day, Aug. 9th were: Bob Kuells 
69-9-60, 22-5-17; Anita 
Hartmann 69-10—59, 21-9—12; 
Bob Becker 59-7—52, 14-5 — 9; 
Ed Hartmann 55-8 — 47, 
18-7—11; Rose Meunier 
55-12-43, 20-6-14; Frona 
Justman 51-10—41, 18-6—12; 
Jean Becker 49-11 — 38, 
14-6-8.

The next 5 handed will be 
Thursday, Aug. 23rd and 
Wednesday, Aug. 29th at 8:00 
p.m. Schmitt’s Never Inn.

Kettle Moraine 
Hospice Services, me.

-In home supportive care for 
the terminally ill throughout 

the Washington County area.
-Completely volunteer 

and cost free

P.O. Box 852
West Bend, Wl 53095 

(414)334-9559
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KETTLE MORAINE STATE FOREST 
NO NATURALIST PROGRAM 

August 22nd-25th
WEDNESDAY, AUGUST 22, 9:30 a.m.- ' THE LAND THE 
GLACIERS CREATED" - Glacial geology is the topic of this walk 
to a high ridge above Long Lake Originates at the NORTH 
BEACH at Long Lake. 1:30 p.m. “ AN INTRODUCTION TO 
ORIENTEERING" - Learn to use a compass in this activity for 
the adventuresome. Meet at the ICE AGE CENTER.
THURSDAY, AUGUST 23, 9:30 a.m. - "THE SPRUCE LAKE 
BOG" - This short walk into a fascinating world originates at the 
ICE AGE CENTER and then requires a 5-mile drive to the bog. 
1:30 p.m. - "INCREDIBLE EDIBLES" - The fascinating world 
of “wild vittles" will be our focus. Meet at the LONG LAKE 
NATURE TRAIL at Long Lake.
FRIDAY, AUGUST 24, 1:30 p.m. - "THE PRAIRIE" - A look 
at a community of plants that at one time covered 6% of Wiscon­
sin’s land area. Meet at the intersections of County "G" and 
“SS” just west of New Prospect

SATURDAY, AUGUST 25, 1:30 p.m. - "KAMES, KETTLES & 
ESKERS" - Auto Tour. This auto tour originates at the Ice Age 
Center and is a fine opportunity to see first hand and learn more 
about the geology of this area. Tour lasts two hours and covers 
25 miles.

......... EVENING PROGRAMS..........
FRIDAY, AUGUST 24. 7:30 p.m. - "GLACIAL LEGACY" - This 
is an interesting information film about glaciers produced by the 
National Park Service. This film is being shown at the Ice Age 
Center Auditorium. You will enjoy this colorful film.

SATURDAY. AUGUST 25 - 7:30 p.m. - "INCREDIBLE 
EDIBLES" - Learn about the many delicacies of the forest in 
a slide program presented by Roger Reif, Naturalist, in our even­
ing presentation

Sports Quiz
by Larry Duncan

1. Name the player who pitched the first-ever baseball 
game for the New York Mets in 1962.

2. Who is the lifetime grand slam home run leader 
(active player) in the m^jor leagues?

3. Who was the winning pitcher in Game 5 of the 1969 
World Series when the Mets won it all against Baltimore?

4. Name the last Kansas City Royal to hit for the cycle in 
a game (single, double, triple, home run).

5. Who managed the expansion Seattle Pilots (now 
Milwaukee Brewers) in 1969?

6. What was the name of the stadium the 1969 
expansion Seattle Pilots played in?

7. What was the name of the stadium the 1969 
expansion Montreal Expos played in?

8. Name the first Kansas City Royal to ever hit a grand 
slam home run.

9. Name the first player the expansion 1969 Expos 
drafted.

10. Name the first Montreal Expo player to win a Gold 
Glove Award.

Sports Quiz Answers
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“They’re lovebirds, lady 
They’re supposed to fight.”

THE HONECK TRADITION CONTINUES

Banish the odor of fish from cooking and cleaning uten­
sils by rinsing in vinegar water

tn
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o

Kewaskum Women's

WISCONSIN 
LOTTERY

USED CARS
1111 sizi-ivyinuKs

'87 Buick I .eSabre 4 Dr.
\ 6. auto. air. stereo
'87 Chevy (Caprice Station Wagon
\ 8. auto., stereo, cruise. 3 seals

$8995

m

o z m

3

Tuesday Night 
Volleyball League 

Aug. 7
Gruber Tool and Die 8-0, 

Amerahn 7-1, Thelen Construc­
tion 8-4, Ike’s Repair Shop 6-6, 
Shefond Self Servers 5-7, My 
Little Friends 5-7, Barrel Haus 
5-7, LR Trophy 3-5, Homeplate 
1-11.

In the 6:00 p.m. games. 
Gruber Tool and Die took all 
four games from Thelen 
Construction, 15-11, 15-9, 15-2, 
15-2.

At the 7:00 p.m. games, the 
Amerahn swept their four 
games with the Homeplate, 
15-3, 15-13, 15-7, and 15-3.

The 8:00 p.m. games saw the 
Barrel Haus take three games 
from the Shefond Self Servers. 
The Barrel Haus won games #1, 
*3 and *4, 15-6, 15-6 and 16-14. 
Shefond won game #2, 15-3.

In the night cap, Ike's Repair 
Shop also took all four games 
from My Little Friends, 15-6, 
15-4, 15-9, and 15-4.

LR Trophy had a bye.

-•Auto Service
LU z o

"84 Buick I .eSabre 4 Dr.
V8. auto., loaded
'84 Chevy Caprice Classic 4 dr. \8. auto..
air. loaded. 47.000 mi . 1 ow ner
*84 Choy Caprice Classic 4 dr. \ 8. auto..
air. stereo. 26.000 mi. . ..................

$(>995

$<>995

$6995

Q
o 
o

ROGER & DAN’S 
AUTO SERVICE

“Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area”

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum

626-2888
24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE

BACKTOYOU- 
GOODASNEW!
Fender benders to major 
damage—we can fix it.
Put your car in our 
care and let our 
experts handle 
the job!
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'90 Chevy Beretta 2 Dr.
4 cyl . auto., air. stereo
*89 Pontiac Grand Am 4 Dr. 
auto., air. stereo, cntise
'87 Buick Skyhawk 2 Dr.
auto., stereo, air. red

TRICKS ^m*
’87 Chevy S-10 Pickup \ (». unto

'86 Chevy Astro Van
\ 6. auto. air. cassette. 7 passenger

'86 Plymouth Voyager
auto., air. stereo, cruise. 1 owner

'85 Plymouth Voyager auto., stereo
'85 CMC '/j Ton Pickup V8. auto., cassette

$19,995

$«995

$6495

$6«95

$8995

$8495 
$6495 
$5995
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Unibody Repair 
ASE Certified 
Technicians 
High Tech 
Equipment 
Infra-Red 
Paint curing

—y^li^^^A^ 
338-0379 U

3458 Trap ShootLaneWest Bend
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MIDSlZTSEhmMBlITS
’89 Chevy Corsica 4 Dr.
auto., air. stereo, only 13.000 mi.

'88 Plymouth Reliant
4 dr., auto., stereo, air

'88 Olds Cutlass Ciera 4 Dr.
auto., stereo, air. pwr windows

'87 Chevy Celebrity Etirosport 4 Dr.
4 cyl. auto. air. pw

'87 Ford Tempo 4 Dr.
4 cyl., auto., stereo

'86 Chevy Celebrity
4 dr.. V6. auto., air. stereo

'86 Olds Calais 4 Dr. \ 6. auto., air.
cruise, stereo. 1 owner

’83 Olds Cutlass Ciera 4 Dr 4 cyl. auto, air

koxomk \i mim

m

$8995

$6495

$7995

$6995

$5495

$5495

$5995

$3495

'90 GEO Metro 2 Dr. auto., air. stereo, only 50(H) tin $7995
'89 GEO Metro LSI 2 dr . 3 cyl . 5 sp cass . ex sharp $5995
'86 Buick Skyhawk Station Wagon 
auto . stereo, air. cruise
'83 Olds Fierenza Station Wagon
4 cyl. auto, air

DEALER
Geo

$6995

$3895

HONECK CHEVROLET-GEO
HWY. 48, KEWASKUM ••2MW

Hours: Morxlar^uradaytiO; Friday t»6; Saturday «II4
THEHONECK TRADITION CONTINUES
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In State Dog Grooming

Joy Kuhnke, left, with Nature’s Choice sales representative 
Dorothy Boll, and Cimmy, owned by Gladys Seefeldt of 
Kewaskum.

This year, Wisconsin State 
Professional Dog Groomer 
Assoc., held their first 
Grooming Contest. Contest and 
Seminars are held to increase 
and maintain a high standard of 
quality and professionalism.

Pet Grooming is defined as 
the topical care of pets (dogs 
and cats) through proper 
brushing, bathing and hair 
trimming for cosmetic and more 
importantly, health reasons.

A Professional Groomer must 
be knowledgeable enough to:

A. Work with a variety of pet 
personalities.

B Know different bathing and 
drying methods for numerous 
hair coat types.

C. Be* able to style each breed 
to perfection.

D. Be creative in styling 
mixed breeds.

E. Be conscientious about 
sanitation and external parasite 
control.

F. Be informative to pet 
owner on all aspects of pet care.

During the competition, dogs 
are brought into the grooming 
ring only bathed, brushed and 
dryed. All other grooming is 
done in front of the judges while 
being timed. Because a 
groomer is expected to meet the 
Professional Groomers 
standards, any dog that is mis­
treated, abused or injured in 
any manner are immediately

excused from all further 
grooming and all awards are 
revoked. A good groomer 
should never injure a dog while 
being groomed or while in the 
groomers care.

This years competition held a 
very high standard of grooming, 
with 29 groomers entered in the 
four categories. It was good to 
see many excellent groomers 
from Wisconsin and Minnesota.

Joy Kuhnke of Joy’s of 
Grooming here in Kewaskum 
and Julie Konwent, C.M.G. 
(Joy's sister) entered this years 
competition.

Julie entered one class misc. 
(all other pure bred), taking 
first - with an American Cocker 
named Bogie. Joy also entered 
this class with another 
American Cocker, named Buffy 
Rohrer, placing 4th against 15 
other groomers.

Joy also entered the other 
three classes. Taking Cimmy 
Seefeldt in the Poodle class, 
placing 4th; Terrier class with 
Scruffy Byres placing a 5th; and 
the mix breed class placing a 
very strong 2nd, with a 
Cockapoo, Jigger Sabish.

Points are given out for each 
placement, tallied and the 
groomer to accumulate the most 
points wins Best All-Round 
Groomer. A groomer from 
Silver Leash in Hartland won 
All-Round. Joy came in a close

2nd All-Round Groomer. Joy 
and Jean were the only two 
groomers to qualify for this 
award. Joy also had the highest 
accumulation of groomers from 
Washington Co.

Not too bad, considering Joy 
was grooming with a broken 
arm. Joy is now grooming with 
the assistance of Julie 
Konwent’s student, Marilyn 
Kropp. Joy hasn’t had her 
surgery on her arm, the new 
surgery date is for Aug. 15, 
1990.

Piano Workshop 
Held at UWWC

WEST BEND — Seventeen 
young pianists performed for 
their parents and friends 
recently at UWWC’s 
auditorium. The performance 
culminated a week-long piano 
workshop sponsored by the 
Moraine Area Private Music 
Teachers Organization and the 
UWWC Music Department. It 
was geared toward students in 
grades 5 through 8 who have 
had at least 2 years of piano 
instruction.

The workshop focused on 
music theory, composition, 
history, and ensemble playing. 
Another of the activities 
included a Capriccio class which 
explored the music of the 19th 
century with an emphasis on the 
music of Felix Mendelssohn and 
his sister.

The staff for the workshop 
included Jean Dorney, Jeri 
Bowerman and Judie Lewis, 
and ensemble teachers Anna 
Asch, Pat Hauser, Wayne 
Heisler, and Michelle Marsala.

Those who attended the 
workshop included: Julie 
Kostuch, Brittany Gill, Mike 
Marsala, Peter Anderson, 
Katherine Kliss, Jennifer 
Hauser, Rachelle Schmidt, 
Nathan Gergetz, Ann Terlizzi, 
Andy Gill, Jason Broecker, 
Andrea Coppens, Katie 
Johnson, Melissa Rohrer, Kelly 
Treml, Holli Broecker, Monica 
Spella.

Walters Buildings

$
JIM SCHAUB 

“for the repair job that’s 
been put off for too long’’

P.O. Box 177 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040

r iioMf \ 
iMPROVrMFNT.

626-8227

Garages/Garage Doors/Remodeling 
Siding/Storm Doors/Storm Windows 

Decks/Roofing

RUSS BREIT
District Manager

P. O. Box 388 
Allenton, Wl 53002

Bus: 414/629-5521 
Bus: 414/338-1236

Jeff Frei

WELDING
All Metals

9 a.m. to 1 p.m.

IRON HORSE
BLACKSMITH SHOP

New Fane Phone 626-8210

Capitol Comment
An opinion by 

U.S. Senator Herb Kohl of Wisconsin

New Medicare Policy lakes Effect September 1

For some of you, going to the doctor will no longer mean filling 
out those often confusing Medicare claims. Beginning September 1, 
that burden shifts from patients to doctors. If you do file your own 
claim after September 1, it will be denied. If this happens, simply 
call your doctor and have him or her file it.

This new policy shouldn’t affect too many of you. Nationwide, 
less than five percent of Medicare beneficiaries now file their own 
claims. But with the change, the federal government hopes to 
eliminate the confusion for this small minority as well as maintain 
more accurate information on Medicare recipients.

The new policy requires doctors to file Medicare claims in a 
timely fashion. It’s not likely that your doctor would risk losing your 
business by hanging on to a claim for a long period of time, but 
if you are concerned, ask your doctor when he is going to submit 
your claim. Physicians who fail to file Medicare claims or who charge 
their patients for the cost of this new paperwork requirement could 
face fines of up to $2,(XX).

If you have any problems with this new policy or have any ques­
tions, feel free to contact one of my state offices: Eau Claire - (715) 
832-8424; Kenosha - (414) 657-7719; Madison - (608) 264-5338; and 
Milwaukee - (414) 297-4451.

Coupon Corner
by Rose Lynn

If you have any comments or specific questions on 
couponing or refunding, you can send them to Rose Lynn, 
P.O. Box 252, Nedrow, N.Y. 13120. Please mention the 
name of the paper in which this column appears. If you 
want a personal response, be sure to include a 
self-addressed, stamped envelope.

Here are this week’s offers:
KODAK VIDEOCASSETTE/COLOR FILM OFFER 

P.O. Box 3433, Monticello, Minn. 55365-3433 (receive a 
check worth $2 off the purchase of three rolls of Kodak 
film, made out to the store where the original purchase 
was made). Buy three T120 MIS videocassettes OR 
eight-millimeter format videocassettes. Send in the three 
finger tabs from T120 cassettes or three cellophane 
wrappers from eight millimeter cassettes. Also send in 
your dated sales receipt. On the form, list the name of the 
store where purchase was made. Purchases must be made 
by 12/31/90. Store form required. Must be received by 
1/31/91. Limit two refunds per household.

In last week's column, we had a misprint in the Jeno’s 
offer. Below is the corrected offer:

FREE JENO’S OFFER. P.O. Box 600131, El Paso, 
Texas 88560-0131 (receive a coupon for a free box up to 
$1.39 value). Buy three packages of Jeno’s Pizza Rolls. 
Send in the three UPC symbols. Newspaper insert form 
required. Expires 8/31/90.

THE BUDGET GOURMET COUPON OFFER, P.O. 
Box 8603, Elmhurst, Ill. 60126-8603 (receive a coupon 
good for $1 off any Budget Gourmet Entree or Dinner, Lite 
or Original style). Buy any one of the Budget Gourmet Lite 
or Original Entrees, Lite Einner or Three-Dish Dinner 
varieties. Send in the proof-of-purchase which is the UPC 
symbol. Newspaper insert form required. Expires 7/29/90.

FREE CHICKEN OFFER, P.O. Box 710444, Dept. 
A043, El Paso, Texas 88571 0444 (receive a coupon good 
toward your next chicken purchase up to $1.50 value). 
Buy one McCormick/Schilling Seasonall (any flavor) and 
two packages of Pennsylvania Dutch noodles. Send in the 
three UPC symbols along with your cash register tape 
with all three purchases on it. Newspaper insert form 
required. Expires 8/31/90.

•Commercial 

•Residential 
•Farm

•Front discharge ready mix trucks
•Delivery available Saturdays
•Radio dispatch

KLOKE 
READY MIX, Inc.
523 Elmore Dr., Campbellsport, Wl

533-8034
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Aug. 13,1965

One hundred eighteen 
families tracing their farm or 
home ownership to pioneer 
relatives of 100 or more years 
ago will be awarded Century 
Farm and Home certificates by 
State Fair of Wisconsin and the 
Wisconsin Exposition Board 
during the State Fair, Aug. 13 
thru 22. The ceremony 
scheduled for Aug. 17, on 
Recognition Day, will include an 
award to Ray Schaefer, Town of 
Kewaskum, Washington 
County, and Mrs. Fred Schleif, 
Roger Schleif and Mrs. Otto 
Weddig, Town of Auburn, Fond 
du Lac County.

The public has undoubtedly 
noticed a name change at the 
Marx food store here in 
Kewaskum. Harold Marx, 
owner, is pleased to announce 
that the store will, in the very 
near future, became a brand 
new Sentry Food Store as soon 
as all remodeling and 
construction is completed. 
Plans and work are now under 
way in the store.

This community was shocked 
on Thursday, to learn of the 
death of John C. Geidel, 1405 
Roseland Dr., Kewaskum, 
village official and active 
organizations member, who 
passed away at the young age of 
36 years at Rockford Memorial 
Hospital, Rockford, Illinois, 
following an apparent stroke. 
John went to the hospital on 
Sunday to undergo minor ear 
surgery Monday morning. After 
the operation he called to report 
he was feeling fine and would 
be coming home soon. Early 
that same evening he reportedly 
suffered the unexpected stroke. 
The stroke proved fatal to him 
three days later on Thursday.

Births - A son to Mr. and 
Mrs. Gerald Zimmel, R. 2, 
Kewaskum, Wednesday, Aug. 
4. A son to Mr. and Mrs. James 
Klahn, R.l, Adell, Saturday, 
Aug. 7. A son to Mr. and Mrs. 
Joseph Zimmer, Kewaskum, 
Monday, Aug. 9.

50 Years Ago
Aug. 16,1940

A bouquet of Gladiolas grown 
by Bernard Seii, in his garden 
here, won the highest possible 
honors in the state Gladiolas 
show at Columbus, Wis., last 
Saturday and Sunday. His 
flowers furnished the 
centerpiece on the table which 
puts them in the highest class. 
Mr. Seii is a member of the 
state Gladiola Association.

Sylvester Harter, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jac. Harter of the 
Town of Auburn, who has been 
employed by the Kewaskum 
Creamery Company, is leaving 
tonight, for Toledo, Ohio, where 
he will enroll at the National 
School of Meat Cutting. 
Sylvester will take a six week's 
course at the school.

A double wedding dance in 
honor of Evelyn and Carl 
Schultz and Lucille and Marlin 
Schultz will be held at the 
Kewaskum Opera House, 
Saturday, Aug. 24. Music by 
the Volesky Family orchestra. 
Admission 30c including tax. 
Free lunch.

Banns of marriage were 
announcement for the first time 
in Holy Trinity Church on 
Thursday for Miss Anna 
Lecher, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Steve Lecher, Kewaskum 
and Joseph Meyer of 
Milwaukee. Their marriage will

take place Aug. 31.
Births - A daughter to Mr. 

and Mrs. Arthur Weddig of 
West Bend, Friday, Aug. 9. Mr. 
and Mrs. Ervin Coulter of St. 
Kilian are the parents of a son 
born Saturday, Aug. 10.

Mrs. Frank Wietor and sons 
Leo and Cyril, spent Monday at 
the Earl Hessler home at 
Milwaukee. While there they 
also attended the baseball 
tournament at Borchert Field.

Donald Koerble and Buddy 
Naumann bicycled to Fond du 
Lac Sunday, where they 
attended the county fair.

75 Years Ago
Aug. 14, 1915

Last Thursday evening when 
a man was offering a horse for 
sale in this village, Marshal Geo 
F. Brandt became suspicious of 
the party and arrested him. 
After being questioned he gave 
his name as Frank Jennings, 
residing some place in 
Minnesota. He also admitted 
stealing the horse from a farmer 
by the name of Edward Gerner, 
residing near Fillmore. At the 
time of the arrest there he was 
in possession of the horse and 
harness only, claiming that the 
buggy was somewhere near 
New Fane, where he encounter­
ed an upset. Jennings was 
employed by Mr. Gerner the 
past summer. As we go to press 
Marshal Brandt was in 
communication with Mr. Gerner 
and it is expected that the latter 
will arrive here some time today 
to claim the ownership of the 
horse. Proceedings for the 
punishment of the horse thief 
will no doubt be instituted.

Late Wednesday afternoon 
the worst hail storm of which 
there was any record in Fond du 
Lac County struck Waucousta 
and vicinity. Farm house 
windows were broken, grain 
flattened out and even potato 
and tomato vines so damaged as 
to practically render useless the 
prospective crops in a number 
of fields. In one instance, that of 
John Rinzel a well-known 
farmer just east of the village, 
all the crops on his farm, save 
two acres of oats, were 
absolutely ruined. Some of the 
hailstones were almost as large 
as pigeon eggs.

Rah Rah, Old Timers. This 
phrase could be heard with wild 
cheers after the ball game last 
Sunday afternoon, when the Old 
Timers defeated the Regulars in 
a one-sided but interesting 
game, score being 9 to 2. A 
large crowd was present to see 
the finish of the Regulars. And 
just as predicted the game was 
one that was worth going miles 
to see. Now you hear the

Kewaskum School District

OFFICIAL NOTICE
Student Directory Data

As per Wisconsin State Statute 118.125 the Kewaskum School 
District includes the following information to be considered as stu­
dent directory data information: The student’s name, address, 
telephone listing, date and place of birth, major field of study, par­
ticipation in officially recognized activities and sports, weight and 
height of members of athletic teams, dates of attendance, 
photographs, degrees and awards received, and the name of the 
school most recently attended by the student,

Student directory data will be considered public information and will 
be released upon request unless an adult student or the parent or 
guardian of a minor student, refuses the release in writing of their 
own initiation. The letter of refusal should be addressed to the prin­
cipal of the school you or your child attends This request should 
be completed within two weeks frpm the date of publication of this 
notice.

remarks, “Where are the 
Regulars, guess we will go out 
with a dark lantern to find 
them.”

The Wisconsin Railroad 
Commission handed down a 
recent decision allowing the 
Random Lake Telephone Co., 
and the Ozaukee - Washington 
Telephone Co., to raise their 
rates 20 per cent.

Deadline Aug. 20 for 
Elderly/Disabled 
Van/Bus Applications

Private, nonprofit organiza­
tions have until the week of 
Aug. 20 to begin the process to 
apply for $1.4 million in state 
and federal grants for vans and 
buses to transport elderly and 
disabled Wisconsin residents.

Applicants must publish a 
notice to apply for the funds by 
Aug. 27 to be eligible for the 
grants, according to the state 
Department of Transportation.

The DOT will provide 
$670,000 and the federal Urban 
Mass Transportation 
Administration $712,000 of the 
grant money. Local organiza­
tions have to provide a 20% 
cash match.

This year for the first time the 
vehicles to be purchased will be 
more standardized, and money 
previously spent on communi­
cations equipment will be used 
to purchase additional vehicles.

“Applicants must show that 
they are meeting a 
demonstrated need and that 
they have the fiscal and 
management capabilities to 
administer the program,” said 
Beth Trautsch, manager of the 
program. “Priority will be given 
to those organizations that 
coordinate their services with 
other agencies and those that 
offer transportation services to 
all elderly and disabled 
persons.”

She said that an applicant can 
apply to operate vehicles itself 
or can indicate it will lease the 
vehicles to a third party, such as 
a professional bus contractor, 
which would then provide 
service for elderly and disabled 
persons.

Trautsch urged minority 
firms and other private, 
non-profit organizations that 
have never before received 
funds for the specialized 
transportation equipment to 
consider applying. Complete 
application information can be 
obtained from the transit 
coordinator in the DOT’s local 
transportation district offices.

In the last application cycle 
the DOT distributed $1.3 
million to 22 organizations 
throughout the state to

New Law Restricts Winter Use of 
Vehicles with Collector Plates

Vehicles with “collector” 
license plates will now have to 
be stored during the winter 
months, under a new law that 
goes into effect Sept. 1. The 
new law also increases the 
registration fees for collector 
vehicles registered after that 
date.

Joyce Gelderman, acting 
Administrator of the state 
Department of Transportation’s 
Motor Vehicles Division, said 
the new law prohibits the use of 
collector vehicles on the 
highways during January, 
February and March. The 
legislative action was intended 
to help preserve the integrity of 
the program designed to 
encourage preservation of 
historic vehicles.

The “collector” license 
plates are issued to owners of 
snecial interest vehicles which

purchase 23 vans and 27 buses. 
Some $14.8 million in state 
grants has contributed toward 
the purchase of 684 vehicles in 
85 Wisconsin communities 
since the program began in 
1975.

Kewaskum School District
OFFICIAL NOTICE
Non-Discrimination Statement 

and
Discrimination Complaint Procedure
The Kewaskum School District is committed and dedicated to the task 
of providing the best education possible for every child in the District 
for as long as the student can benefit from attendance and the student's 
conduct is compatible with the welfare of the entire student body.
The right of the student to be admitted to school and to participate fully 
in curricular, extracurricular, student services, recreational or other pro­
grams or activities shall not be abridged or impaired because of a stu­
dent's sex, race, national origin, ancestry, creed, pregnancy, marital 
or parental status, sexual orientation or physical, mental, emotional or 
learning disability.

Complaints regarding the interpretation or application of this policy shall 
be referred to the District Administrator and processed in accordance 
with procedures established by the Discrimination Complaint Procedure

DISCRIMINATION COMPLAINT PROCEDURE

Any complaint regarding the interpretation or application of Kewaskum 
School District's student non-discrimination policies shall be process­
ed in accordance with the following grievance procedure:
1) Any student, parent or resident of the School District complaining 
of discrimination on the basis of sex, race, national origin, ancestry, 
creed, pregnancy, marital or parental status, sexual orientation or 
physical, mental, emotional or learning disability in school programs or 
activities shall report the complaint in writing to the District Administrator.

2) The District Administrator, upon receiving a written complaint, shall 
immediately undertake an investigation of the suspected infraction. The 
District Administrator will review with the building principal, or other ap­
propriate persons, the facts comprising the alleged discrimination Within 
30 days after receiving the complaint, the District Administrator shall 
decide the merits of the case, determine the action to be taken, if any, 
and report in writing the findings and the resolution of the case to the 
grievant.
3) If the grievant is dissatified with the decision of the District Ad­
ministrator, he/she may within 15 days, appeal the decision in writing 
to the School Board. The Board shall hear the appeal at its next regular 
meeting, or a special meeting may be called for the purpose of hearing 
the appeal. In either case, the Board must hear the appeal within 45 
days of its receipt. The Board shall make its decision in writing within 
15 days after the hearing. Copies of the written decision shall be mail­
ed or delivered to the grievant and the District Administrator.
4) If the grievant is dissatisfied with the Board's decision, he/she may 
within 30 days appeal the decision in writing to the State Superinten­
dent of Public Instruction.
5) Discrimination complaints relating to the identification, evaluation, 
educational placement or the provision of a free appropriate public 
education of a child with exceptional needs shall be processed in ac­
cordance with Wis. Stat. Ch. 115, Subch. V and Wis. Admin. Code Ch. 
PI 11.

6) Discrimination complaints relating to programs specifically govern­
ed by federal law or regulation shall be referred directly to the State 
Superintendent of Public Instruction.

are 20 or more years old, and 
who own at least one other 
vehicle with regular registration 
plates.

The new fee schedule to 
register special interest vehicles 
after Sept. 1 is an initial $50, 
plus a sum equal to twice the 
regular annual fee for the same 
type of vehicle. The license 
plates remain valid while the 
vehicle is owned by the 
applicant without payment of 
additional fees.

Gelderman said there is a 
provision in the new law to issue 
a temporary operation permit 
for $5 to operate the vehicle 10 
successive days during 
January, February and March. 
“The other option would be to 
re-register the vehicle under 
regular registration 
procedures,” Gelderman said.

ABC CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners at skat played by 

the ABC Senior Citizens at 
Beechwood Hall on Tuesday, 
August 7, were: Harold Eggert, 
30-3 — 27 net; Ruth Egerer 
17-2—15 net; Frank Kadinger 
16-2—14 net; Elmer Fabian 
10-2 — 8 net.



Jobs 2000 Addresses 
Business Concerns

Recent national reports warn 
that significant portions of the 
country’s worker pool lack 
employable job skills. A 
General Accounting Office 
study says nearly 30 percent of 
the nation’s 33 million young 
people (ages 16 to 24) will not 
have employable job skills by 
the time they turn 25.

Employers continue to report 
that many of their employees 
lack basic skills in reading, 
writing and mathematics which 
makes it difficult to train those 
employees for advancement 
into higher-level jobs that 
require greater technological 
skills.

Meanwhile, the U.S. Depart­
ment of Labor reports that by 
the year 2000, 75 percent of 
today’s workers will need to be 
retrained. The Hudson Institute 
states that within 10 years, 52 
percent of all jobs will need 
more than a high school 
diploma while 70 percent of all 
jobs will require less than a 
bachelor’s degree.

Moraine Park Technical 
College is proposing an 
extensive expansion of its 
facilities to meet demands from 
local business and industry that 
the college provide more 
programs and graduates to deal 
with this serious shortage of 
skilled labor.

Called JOBS 2000, this 
proposed expansion project 
would add facilities at Moraine 
Park’s three campuses in 
Beaver Dam, Fond du Lac, and 
West Bend, as well as remodel 
portions of the existing facilities 
to improve instructional space 
and student services.

Moraine Park would use this 
additional space to expand its 
more hard-pressed programs 
and add new programs to meet 
growing demands from 
employers for more skilled 
workers.

There is a serious shortage of 
skilled workers in the Moraine 
Park Vocational, Technical and 
Adult Education District. 
Moraine Park’s Placement 
Office was able to fill fewer than 
half of the job orders it received 
from employers in 1989 — 
despite the fact that it placed a 
record 94.2 percent of Moraine 
Park graduates that year.

Ironically, while calls from 
employers for more Moraine 
Park graduates go unanswered 
because of a lack of space at the 
college, enrollment waiting lists 
of up to two years have 
developed in some of the more 
“in demand’’ occupations — 
tool and die, nurses, computer 
skills, just to name a few.

The Wisconsin Department of 
Industry, Labor and Human 
Relations (DILHR) predicts the 
state will face an acute shortage 
of skilled workers by the year 
2000.

Labor market studies for the 
counties within the Moraine 
Park VTAE District also reveal 
similar troubling statistics. A 
DILHR study says that more 
than 5,300 jobs will go unfilled 
by the year 2000 in Fond du Lac, 
Green Lake and Winnebago 
counties because of a lack of 
sufficiently trained workers to 
fill them.

Comparable skilled worker 
shortages are seen for 
Washington, Dodge and 
surrounding counties as well.

In the Waukesha, Ozaukee 
and Washington counties 
Private Industry Council service 
area it was predicted that the 
largest number of jobs that will 
go unfilled by the year 2000 will

be in trained, entry-level 
positions and in highly skilled 
technician jobs. Examples of 
some of the employment areas 
expected to experience skilled 
worker shortages are building 
trades; most health care jobs — 
registered nurses, practical 
nurses, nurse’s aides, home 
health care; manufacturing 
technician jobs — tool and die, 
computer aided manufacturing, 
computer aided design; 
computer technicians; 
accountant technicians; math 
technicians with skills working 
in statistics; quality control 
technicians; and almost all 
service industry jobs. Most of 
these are employment areas 
Moraine Park is already 
offering training in or has plans 
to start a training program.

These reports stress that 
there will be no shortage of 
workers available, but there will 
be a serious shortage of workers 
with the proper technical 
training.

With these sobering statistics 
in mind, Moraine Park hopes to 
provide some relief to 
businesses and industries 
within the Moraine Park 
Vocational, Technical and Adult 
Education District — the sole 
reason why it is proposing its 
JOBS 2000 project.

For that reason, on July 19 
the Moraine Park VTAE Board 
unanimously endorsed JOBS 
2000 and voted to submit the 
funding for the $13.8 million 
project to a district - wide 
referendum on Sept. 11.

If approved by the district’s 
voters, the expansion would 
provide additional space needed 
for new training programs 
already scheduled to be taught 
at Moraine Park — Public 
Safety Telecommunicator 
(dispatchers), Industrial Screen 
Printing, Manufacturing 
Tooling Engineering Technican 
(tool and die makers skilled in 
computer manufacturing), 
Alcohol and Other Drug Abuse 
Counseling, Marketing 
Communications and Desktop 
Publishing.

JOBS 2000 would also 
provide Moraine Park the 
opportunity to expand its 
retraining opportunities for 
adults seeking skills upgrading

Castor oil is used as a lubricant 
in jet planes.

Looking for
Employment?

•MAJOR SANITATION
•GENERAL FACTORY

10-1/2 Hour 
Shifts Available

Good wages, friendly 
environment 

Apply Now!
1 a.m. to 9 p.m. 7 Days a Week

The Pillsbury/ 
Green Giant Company

500 SOUTH CLARK STREET 
MAYVILLE, WISCONSIN 53050 

(414) 317-2500

or who face mid-life career 
changes with such programs as 
Workplace Basic Skills, 
Extended Degree evening 
classes and technical training in 
more than 50 existing 
occupational fields.

AUGUST 
COMMUNITY
CALENDAR
Coming events will be listed on­

ly if they are submitted to the 
Statesman and are of area in­
terest. We will be happy to list 
meetings of your non-profit 
organization only if they are sent 
in to us each month. We can no 
longer be responsible for keeping 
a running file of meetings for the 
entire year. Please submit your 
meeting notice for publication the 
week before it is to be published. 
Bear in mind, if your coming event, 
is designed to make money for 
your organization, it should be 
considered advertising.

The Community Calendar col­
umn is run a TIME AND SPACE 
AVAILABLE BASIS ONLY

FRIDAY, AUGUST 17
11 th Annual Door County Style 

Trout Boil at Our Lady of Angels 
Parish Hall in Armstrong will be 
served from 4:30 to 9 p.m. Hot dogs 
and hamburgers will also be available 
and homemade desserts. Adults - 
$6.50. Children - $3.00.

FRIDAY, AUGUST 17
Meeting of the Washington Coun­

ty Separated and Divorced Men and 
Women’s Group at Sacred Heart 
Church in Allenton, from 7:30 to 
9:30 p.m. The topic will be “From 
Hardened Clay to a Piece of Art" by 
Shirley Blecher. from the 
Washington County Separated and 
Divorced Ministry.

FRIDAY, AUGUST 17 
SATURDAY, AUGUST 18

SUNDAY, AUGUST 19
The Campbellsport Jaycees present 

the 1990 Start Your Heart Olympics, 
a fund raiser at the Campbellsport 
Fireman's Park that you can par­
ticipate in. Just get an Olympic team 
of five men and five women together 
and compete for a grand prize of 
$500. Events will include turkey 
bowling, row boat relay, barstool 
throwing, volleyball and much more. 
Kids events will be held too. For 
more information, call 533-5302 or 
533-5322.

Now accepting 
applications for 
1990 Corn Pack
•LAB
•FORKLIFT 
•MAINTENANCE

SUNDAY, AUGUST 19
Annual Kewaskum Lions Club 

Chicken Barbeque and Kettle 20 plus 
2 Foot Race at River Hill Park in 
Kewaskum. Serving from 11 a.m. to 
5 p.m. with carryouts available. Live 
music from 11 a.m. to 2 p.m. by Ed­
die Schneider.

TUESDAY, AUGUST 21
Regular meeting of the Kewaskum 

Historical Society will be held in the 
Community Room at 8 p.m. Early 
Farm Days is on the agenda. Old and 
new members are always welcome. 
For more information, contact Jake 
Schmidt at 338-1568 weekdays after

Boycotting the Local Gasoline Dealer is 
Like Blaming the Victim for the Crime

Calls for boycotting local 
gasoline dealers in response to 
price increases is ineffective and 
hits the wrong target. The local 
gasoline dealer is an independent 
business person who, like the 
customer, purchases his product 
from another. The terminal price 
(from which the retailer and 
marketer purchases) has increas­
ed at a rate slightly greater than 
that passed through to the 
consumer.

Greater to the retailer and 
wholesale marketer than to the 
consumer? Yes, ofte n competi­
tion will not allow full pass through 
of higher prices, especially at the 
rate they have recently occurred. 
The low volume retailer will pur­
chase less often than the high 
volume retailer, therefore manage 
to skip one or more increases. 
This will lead to some variation of 
price on the street.

The local retailer and marketer 
margin (gross profit) is the same 
or slightly less today compared to 
pre-panic pricing of late July.

The dealer and wholesale 
marketer have also been placed 
on allocations (specific volumes of 
product they may purchase) 
which forces them to limit pur­
chases as a hedge against higher 
prices to come. In effect, they are 
forced by their suppliers to 
operate lean so that they must 
pay higher prices as they occur.

The local business person has 
invaded no country, owns no 
tankers, operates no refinery or 
pipeline and has no influence on 
pricing of petroleum products. A

NOTICE OF ELECTION
TO: ELECTORS OF MORAINE PARK VOCATIONAL, 

TECHNICAL AND ADULT EDUCATION DISTRICT
TAKE NOTICE that a referendum election will be held at the regular­

ly scheduled election on September 11, 1990 in Moraine Park Voca­
tional, Technical and Adult Education District for the purpose of approv­
ing or rejecting an Initial Resolution authorizing general obligation bonds 
or promissory notes of the District in an amount not to exceed $13,800.00 
adopted by the District Board on July 19, 1990, and the capital expen­
diture projects described in the Initial Resolution and in an Intent Resolu­
tion adopted by the District Board on June 21, 1990.

The referendum question reads as follows:

“Shall Moraine Park Vocational, Technical and Adult Education 
District, Wisconsin, be authorized to issue, pursuant to Chapter 67, 
Wisconsin Statutes, general obligation bonds or promissory notes in an 
amount not to exceed $13,800,000 for the public purpose of paying the 
cost of a building program, consisting of constructing buildings and 
building additions and enlargements and remodeling and equipping 
facilities at the District’s Beaver Dam, West Bend and Fond du Lac cam­
puses?"

District electors must vote on the referendum question at the times 
and places at which they cast their ballots in the regularly scheduled 
election.

Copies of the resolution directing submission of the question set forth 
above to the electorate and information concerning District boundaries 
may be obtained at the Moraine Park Vocational, Technical and Adult 
Education District offices located at 235 North National Avenue, Fond 
du Lac, Wisconsin 54935.

Persons with questions regarding the referendum election should con­
tact John Willis, Vice President, Business and Finance, of the District.

MORAINE PARK VOCATIONAL, TECHNICAL 
ANO ADULT EDUCATION DISTRICT

Kathryn J. Sweat, District Secretary

5 p.m.
SATURDAY A SUNDAY 

AUGUST 25 A 26
The fifth annual Old World 

Wisconsin “Heirloom Garden Fair” 
will take place at the historic site near 
Eagle in Waukesha County. Visitors 
will see exhibits of fruits, vegetables 
and Howers raised from authentic 
19th century seed varieties such as 
those used by Wisconsin pioneers. 
Visitors can also talk about historic 
gardening with the experts. For more 
information contact Old World 
Wisconsin, S103 W3789O Hwy. 67. 
Eagle. W1 53119. (414) 594-2116.

boycott at this level accomplishes 
nothing. Might as well kick the 
dog.

Still Time to Enroll
At Moraine Park

There is still time to enroll in 
certain programs at Moraine Park 
Technical College.

Programs that currently have 
openings:
‘food science technician 
‘restaurant and hotel cookery 
‘food service
‘child care associate/nanny 
‘infant and child specialist 
‘child care services 
‘manicurist
‘barber/cosmelologisi January 

class
Student registrations continues 

through August 17, with classes 
scheduled to begin August 27. 
For more information, call the 
Fond du Lac campus at 922-8611.
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SEASONED FIREWOOD — 
100% oak or mixed hardwood. 8 
ft. lengths, by the semi-load, 
10-11 cords, $60. Also cut & 
split $45 face cord, $120 full 
cord. Call Ray Herriges, 692- 
2289 or 533-4165. 10-6-tf

SCREEN and WINDOW 
REPAIR — KL Home and 
Hardware, Hwy. 45 South, 
Kewaskum. Phone 626-2164.

2 PRIME RESIDENTIAL 
BUILDING LOTS — Near park, 
Village of Kewaskum, 
improvements, for sale by 
owner. Call 626-4062. 6-14-tf
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Marketplace, in the ™‘ “^
ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE

RATE: $2.00 up to 20 words; over 20 words - add 10c per word
NEW CLASSIFIED AD POLICY

All classified ads must now be paid in advance. Classified ads phoned in or brought 
to our office must be paid by noon on Tuesday of the week you want the ad publish­
ed. The ONLY exception will be for those businesses who have regular running ac­
counts with the Statesman.

MULTI-FAMILY RUMMAGE 
SALE — Aug. 17, 18, 19. 8 a.m. 
to 4 p.m. Children’s, teen and 
adult clothing, winter jackets, 
small electric appliances 
(salesman’s samples, never 
been used), men’s rain and 
shine coat, (paid $150, never 
worn), small desktop Tandy 
computer with some games, 
small antique tables, Home 
Interiors, wall pictures, Avon 
products, many toys including 
Fischer Price, Little Tykes 
stove/refrigerator/sink, 
chilren’s electric organ, and 
many more miscellaneous 
items. 198 Hwy. 45. 2 miles 
north of Kewaskum on Hwy. 45, 
watch for signs. 8-16-lt

RUMMAGE SALE — Aug. 17 - 
18, 9:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
Multi-family - many different 
items, large wet bar, metal desk 
and chair, 8651 Hwy. B, 
Kewaskum.8-16-ltp

GARAGE SALE — Aug. 17 and 
18, 8 to 5, 1320 Brooklane Dr., 
Kewaskum. Electric range, 
queen-size waterbed, 12-speed 
bike, clothes, household items, 
misc.8-16-lp

RUMMAGE SALE — Friday, 
Aug. 17, 4 p.m. to ? Sat. and 
Sun., Aug. 18, 19, 8 a.m. to ? 
Lots of misc. items, 2 miles 
north of Kewaskum on Hwy. 45, 
#292. No checks please. 8-16-lp

Multi-Family 
RUMMAGE SALE

Friday, Aug. 17
8:30 a m. to 4:30 p.m.

Saturday, Aug. 18
8 a.m. to 3 p.m.

350 Clinton St. 
Kewaskum 

(on the cul-de-sac) 
Lots of clothes for back-to- 
school, baby to teens and 
adult sizes, miscellaneous 

and much more!
NO CHECKS PLEASE

FOR SALE — Farm fresh eggs, 
75c doz. Pick up or will deliver 
10 doz. or more. Call 626-4242. 
______________________7-19-5p

FOR SALE — 1954 Ford pick-up 
truck, 1965 motor home with 
low mileage. 626-4724 or 626- 
4028.8-9-2p

FOR SALE — Two Lazy Boy 
swivel rockers in first class 
condition. Matching pair. Call 
626-4712. 8-9-2t

LOT FOR SALE — On Stark St., 
Kewaskum includes water, 
sewer and sidewalk. Ph. 626- 
4487. pr 8-9-12t

FOR SALE — Antique dresser, 
with mirror. Early 1900s. After 
5:00.626-2623. 8-9-3p

FOR SALE — Cob corn, $75 a 
ton. Call 626-2491.8-2-3t

WOOD — Now taking orders 
for quality red and white oak. 
Seasoned cut split and 
delivered. 1 full cord $120.00. 
Inspections are welcome. 477- 
7322.8-16-tf

FOR SALE APPLES — Yellow 
Transparents, Melbas, Early 
Mac s and Miltons. Sold by 
bushel, l/» bushel or peck. 
(Schoofs Family Orchard). 1 
mile west of Kewaskum on 
Hwy. 28. For more information 
call 626-2525.8-16-tf

FOR SALE — 1975 four-door 
Buick La Sabre, runs good, 
$500.00. Call 626-4392. 8-16-2t

FOR SALE — ’80 Pinto wagon, 
4 cyl. automatic, 74,400 miles, 
clean, good tires. $1,200.00 or 
best offer. 626-4208 after 3:30.
______________________ 8-16-lp

FOR SALE — 1970 Chevrolet 
Malibu hardtop. Collector’s 
item. 54,000 original miles. 533- 
4004.8-16-lp

FOR SALE — 1977 Chevy 
Impala station wagon. Good 
shape, $1100.00 or best offer. 
Call 626-4438.8-16-lp

FOR SALE — 14 foot Ranger 
fishing boat, 6 h.p. motor, 
trailer. Call 626-4086. 8-16-lp

HELP WANTED — Full-time 
LPN needed primarily 3rd shift, 
occasional 2nd shift. Call 
Beechwood Rest Home, 
994-4717 or 626-4258. 6-13-tf

CHILD CARE — Provided in 
my home full or part-time, days, 
Campbellsport/Kewaskum 
area. 626-4367. p 8-2-3t

REDUCE: Burn off fat while 
you sleep, take OPAL available 
at Kennelly Pharmacy. 7-26-5tp

COMPUTER SIGNS — Made to 
order. Banners, signs, greeting 
cards and letterheads for any 
occasion. Call 626-4493. 7-16-tf

$44,900
Two bedroom ranch with 
one car attached garage. 
% acre lot. Country, but 
close to town.

$16,000
Fully improved village lot

Kirst Builders
626-4392

411 Main St.
Kewaskum, Wl

FOR RENT — One, two and 
three bedroom apartments and 
townhouses. Rustic Timbers 
Apartments. Ph. 334-1395.

______________ 6-21-tf

FOR RENT — 1 bedroom upper 
apartment. Village of 
Kewaskum. Available Sept. 1st. 
Call 626-2171, ask for Brian.

8-16-2t

HELP WANTED — Reliable 
babysitter after school. 
Approximately 2:45 to 5:00. 
Please call 626-4850 after 4:30. 
______________________8-16-2p

HELP WANTED — Part-time 
person for Milk Receiving 
Station. No heavy work - but 
person selected must be able to 
accept responsibility. Call 
Tyrone 626-8008 days or 533- 
5342 evenings.8-16-2t

HELP WANTED — Third shift, 
full and part-time cashiers. 
Dependable and reliable person 
can stop in for applications at 
1512 W. Washington St., West 
Bend or 1149 Fond du Lac Ave., 
Kewaskum. 8-16-tf

CHILDCARE AVAILABLE — 
In my Kewaskum home, 
playmates and references. 626- 
8049.8-9-2p

RIDE NEEDED — To Sheboy­
gan, around 7 a.m., 3 days per 
week .Call 626-4295. 8-9-2p

HELP WANTED — Person to 
make telephone calls for local 
business. Evenings two or three 
times a week. Flexible. Send 
letter of application to P.O. Box 
98, Kewaskum, WI, 53040. 
_______________________ 8-9-3t

CUSTODIAN WANTED — For 
Kewaskum Schools. Hours are 
7:30 to 11:30 a.m. and 4:00 to 
8:00 p.m., Monday through 
Friday, school year only. 
Contact Kewaskum High School 
for application. Deadline is 
August 20, 1990. 8-9-2t

BABYSITTER WANTED — 
Full-time, year round position 
in our home. 7:30 a.m. to 4:30 
p.m. Top pay, pleasant working 
conditions, light housework, 
must have own transportation, 3 
miles south of Kewaskum. Call 
334-1395 evenings. 8-9-tf

HELP WANTED — Now 
accepting applications for the 
following positions: RN, LPN, 
Nurses Aides (certified), 
dietary, housekeeping and 
laundry, full and part-time 
competitive wages and benefits. 
Beechwood Rest Home, a 26 
bed certified, skilled care 
facility, N1495 W Hwy. A, 
Kewaskum. 994-4717 or 626- 
4258. ( 7-12-tf

HELP WANTED — Cooks, full 
time and part-time, experience 
not necessary, must be 18 or 
older. WAITRESS full-time, 
will train, must be 18 or over. 
629-5125.7-lf-tf

TIRES — There’s, always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 626- 
2888. ____________________

Due to discrimination 
laws, we are obligated to 

• run various forms of 
advertising submitted to 
us by out-of-the area 
businesses. Publication 
of these ads does not 
mean the advertisers are 
endorsed by this paper. 
Our readers are advised 
to use their own discre­
tion when responding to 
any ad. If you have any 
questions concerning 
the credibility of an 
advertiser, we suggest 
you contact the Better 
Business Bureau.

SALES AND SERVICE — TV, 
radio, stereo, satellite antenna, 
TV antenna, and VCR - head 
cleaning & repair. Reasonable 
rates. R.B. Electronics - 626- 
8019. 8-18-alt.

KETTLE MORAINE 
IMPROVEMENTS — Roofing, 
siding, general repair, 
remodeling, gutters, etc. Gery 
R. Schweder, 338-0814. 7-5-tf

RESIDENTIAL — Building lots 
for sale. Approximately four 
miles north of West Bend. 
Terms: Call 334-7306. 
Licensee/Owner.2-24-tf

HAVE BUYERS — Fer country 
or village homes within 3 miles 
of Kewaskum. If you are 
thinking of selling call Ann 
Enright, RE/MAX Realtors 
334-7411 or 692-2607 collect.

9-19-tf

338-5656

cabinet.
underground parking tor 2 cars quality 
throughout Near golt course Ask tor Ann 
Enright 692 2607 #402

baths, laundry room

NEW LISTING

CONTEMPORARY MULTI LEVEL 
Town of Farmington

SPACIOUS CONDO
Luxury space galore in this 2-story condo in 
Kewaskum Open stairway built-in china

7 Cwudt

2364 W. Washington St

VACANT LAND
Wooded and rolling - 3 acre building site tor your dream home 1 acre woods, several building 
sites Easy Highway 45 access for commuters The Kettle Moraine at its finest $2 7 900 
Ask tor Ann Enright. 692-2607 #P220

10 ACRES WOODED • Town of Farmington Rolling wooded parcel on quiet road 15 minutes 
north of West Bend Near lakes ski snowmobile trails Ask lor Ann Enright 692-2607 *213 
$29 900

Werner Drive village lot x 128 ft frontage $20,000 Call Gloria Serwe 626-2880 »240 
Valley View Dr ■ 7 94 acres. Kettle Moraine wooded Call Gloria Serwe 626-2880 *238 
Secluded 33 acres Pond, river frontage $39 500 Call Gloria Serwe 626-2880 #215 , 
Wesley Estates Town of Farmington 3 acres wooded $22 900 Call Ann 692-2607 #20^ 
Cui de Sac Kewaskum Village lot Next to open country $18 900 Call Ann 692-2607 #$05 

1 Acre, north of West Bend Only $8,000 Call Ann Enright 692 2607 #211 
Country Subdivision 1 acre lot. $10 000 Call Ann Enright 692 2607 #66 '

HOME AND BUSINESS/KEWASKUM
5832 sq ft commercial building and showroom 2 plus acres Insulated and heated 
Possibilities unlimited for retail or wholesale business Well maintained 1800 sq ft home 
3 bedrooms, mam floor family room with natural fireplace Newly redone kitchen with built 
in oven/range and dishwasher Close Io village and 45 Bypass REDUCED $175,000 Call 
Gloria Serwe 626 2880 K22

R6W
REALTORS*

of West Bend

BICYCLES — Sales and 
Service, 208 North Ave., 
Kewaskum Wally’s Bike Shop.

WORK WANTED — Lloyd’s 
Home Maintenance. No job too 
small. Repairs, remodeling, 
carpentry, painting, varnishing, 
wallpaper, woodgraining, 
ceramic tile, etc. Lloyd M. 
Ebert. 533-8013.1-23-tf

WANTED TO BUY
IMMEDIATE CASH PAID 

Cash paid for one item or entire 
estate. Always looking for wood 
furniture, old tools, crocks, 
decoys, trunks, fish lures, toys 
and toy tractors, glassware, 
quilts, lamps, cookbooks, etc. 
Top prices paid — before you 
throw it out or sell it, check with 
me, Jim Walter, 533-8731.4-1-tf

CONCRETE WORK — Drive­
ways, sidewalks, patios, 

'basements and garages. 626- 
4367. 5-10-tf

APPLIANCE DOLLY — for rent 
$5.00 per day. KL Home and 
Hardware, Hwj 45 South 
Kewaskum. 626-2164. 4-26-tf

CRAFTERS — Are you 
interested in selling your craft 
items retail. If so, contact us 
evenings at 626-4565 or 626- 
4518.3-25-tf

, SCHOOL BUS DRIVERS 
WANTED — For Kewaskum 
School District, apply at 3618 
Hwy. 28E, or call 626-4414. 
Now training for the coming 
1990/91 school year. 7-5-tf

STUMP REMOVAL — Reason­
able rates, free estimate. Tom 
Clark 626-2513. 5-24-tf

REDUCED $114,900
Ideal home for active family Stone fireplace 
in family room Rec room has woodstove and 
patio doors leading to 1 7 acre yard with above 
ground pool 4 bedrooms 2 full and 2 half 
baths Huge country kitchen Quality 
throughout Ask tor Ann Enright 692 2607 
#32

DUPLEX $69,900 
VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM

Very well maintained brick duplex all separate 
utilities 100 amp service newer turnaces 
new root 1990 New siding on garage 1990 
plus extensive remodeling and decorating 
Great investment opportunity $69 900 *503 
Call Gloria Serwe at 626 2880
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Offers New Opportunities

The Wisconsin Department of 
Development recently 
announced that $600,000 in 
biennial funding is available 
through its Rural Economic 
Development program. This 
program is aimed at stimulating 
the growth of businesses in 
small communities and rural 
areas. This money will be 
available through grants and 
loans of up to $30,000.

In a state with as many 
diverse economic interests as 
Wisconsin, it is a necessity to 
ensure a healthy balance of 
economic development between 
rural and urban areas. By 
targeting this funding to 
counties with less than 150 
people per square mile and to 
communities of under 4000 
residents, the Department of 
Development hopes to 
effectively channel funds to 
small businesses outside of 
urban areas. To be eligible for 
funding, businesses must have 
fewer than twenty-five full time 
employees.

THANK YOU
A special thank you to my 

family, friends and relatives 
who visited me in the hospital, 
and to those who sent cards, 
gave gifts and offered prayers.

Thank you to Pastor Schultz 
for his visits and prayers. 
Thanks also to Dr. Guth, Dr. 
Geiger and the nurses during 
my stay at St. Joseph’s 
Hospital, in West Bend.

The funds available through 
the Rural Economic Develop­
ment program can be used 
towards starting a new business 
or expanding an existing one. 
The activities covered by this 
program include, feasibility 
studies, business plans, 
engineering studies, appraisals, 
marketing and management 
assistance, and legal accounting 
of managerial services. The aim 
of this program is to help offset 
some of these costs associated 
with the start-up and expansion 
of small businesses.

A nine member citizen board 
will review the applications and 
distribute funds as grants or low 
interest loans, based upon the 
need of the applicant business. 
Application forms may be 
obtained from the Wisconsin 
Department of Development. 
For further information contact 
Paul Van Rooy at (608) 266-3278 
or Craig Kettleson at (608) 267- 
0750 at the Department of 
Development.

XYZ CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners on Wednesday, 

August 8 played by the Senior 
Citizens XYZ Club at the 
Municipal Building in Kewas­
kum were: Frank Sell 42-4 — 38 
net: Marvin Martin 18-2—16 
net; Ken Kaschner 17-2—15 
net; Elroy Egerer 18-4—14 net; 
Joe Butschlick Spade Solo vs 4; 
Marvin Martin Diamond Solo vs 
4; Frank Sell Club Turn vs 5.

Sincerely,
Edward “Sonny” Lepp

The ABC’s of Back-to-School
The lazy days of summer are 

over and the back-to-school race 
is here.

Running to school in the morn­
ing or from school in the afternoon, 
children run the risk of injury.

“Head injury is among the 
most dangerous of injuries, espe­
cially for children,” according to 
Dr. James Wasco, medical direc­
tor for the New Medico Head 
Injury System. “Any injury to the 
brain can significantly impair a 
child’s ability to learn, concen­
trate or remember information 
and this can have a damaging 
effect on a child’s development.”

Before you send your children 
back to school, outfit them with a 
few safety reminders.
Walking to School

Most pedestrian accidents are 
the fault of the walker, not the 
driver, according to the National 
Safety Council, so:
• Be sure to allow enough time 

for your child to get to school 
without rushing.

• Plan your child’s walking route 
to minimize the number of 
street crossings.

• Teach your child always to use 
sidewalks and to cross at 
crosswalks. Where there arc no 
sidewalks, have your child walk

CAMPBELLSPORT 
Sportsman Club

Tuesday Nite Trap League
Dundee Sand & Gravel over 

West Bend Company 119-107, 
Kettle Moraine Hardwoods over 
Rochwite’s Pere Testing 99-87, 
Allenton Sportsman Club tied 
Van Beek Cycle 109-109, C.C.’s 
over Battery Components 
101-96; R.T. Speedshop over 
Hit Your average 107-100.

Dundee Sand & Gravel 
11i/2-4'/2; Citizens/Weis Corp. 
11-4, C.C.’s 11-5, Mid-Cities 
Tool & Die 10-5, Allenton 
Sportsman Club 10-6, Van Beek 
Cycle 9*/2-6‘/2; R.T. Speed Shop 
8-8, Kettle Moraine Hardwoods 
6-10, Battery Components 4-12, 
Rochwite’s Pere Testing 4-12, 
West Bend Company 4-12.

25 x 25 — Mark Schaub, 
Darwin Buslaff.

24 x 25 — Scott Stuart, Tom 
Ertl, Ron Heinhold, Glenn 
Schellinger, Terry Wall, Jeff 
Swift, Ken Beisbier.

Word Play
IMMODERATENESS 
— the quality or state 

of being immoderate.
From the above word, 

find at least 20 five-or- 
more-letter words within a 
three-minute time frame.

POSSIBLE 
SOLUTIONS

immoderate trend
moderate stein
modern stain
trade drain
modem drone
stand smote
mater 
dimmer 
tense 
rinse

facing traffic, so the child can 
see oncoming cars.

Riding the School Bus

Although school buses are 
much safer than family cars, sta­
tistics indicate that 40 students 
die and 7,000 are injured each 
year in school bus accidents. T he 
majority of these accidents occur 
outside the bus, when students are 
boarding or exiting.
• Have your child wait for the 

bus to stop completely, then 
board carefully, using the 
handrail.

• Tell your children to take their 
seat quickly and stay in that 
seat for the entire ride — never 
putting head, arms or hands 
out the window.

• Teach your children to cross at 
least 10 feet in front of the bus 
so the driver can see them.
If you need more information 

about head injury and rehabilita­
tion, call the New Medico Head 
Injury System at 1-800-CARE 
TBI, ext. 3070.

“Going to school without par­
ents is a sign of a child’s inde­
pendence,” said Dr. Wasco, “but 
children must learn that practicing 
safety is a prerequisite for 
independence.”

resent 
reason 
treason 
dream

A 
U
L

Home Hints
COOL BABY’S BOTTLE — Last summer, my 

mother-in-law came up with a great suggestion for 
keeping my daughter’s bottled formula or juice cooler 
during hot weather. This tip worked well for me, and I 
would like to share it with other mothers now that 
summer weather is just around the corner.

Most grocery stores carry reusable ice cubes. They are 
made of a plastic material and filled with distilled water. 
Once frozen in the freezer, they can be added to the baby’s 
bottle to keep the milk or juice cooler. These “ice cubes” 
do not melt down and dilute the beverage and are 
reusable after cleaning and refreezing. Tina R., Lawton, 
Okla.

Thinking of Buying or Selling?
GO TO THE TOP! 
Call Bev Kirchner

★ Full Time Realtor
★ Top Producer 1989
★ Sales Associate of the Year for 1987 and 1988
★ Million Dollar Producer

Find out what your home is worth
Call me for a free market analysis today!

Looking for a new home?
Let my 16 years in real estate go to work for you

COLDUJeU. 
BANKCRU

SPECTRUM
REAL ESTATE

Give me a call today
Office: 334-3334 
Home: 626-4848

PUBLIC AUCTION 
KEWASKUM, Wl 

SUNDAY, AUGUST 19th, 10:00 a.m. 
INSPECTION after 8:00 a.m.

LOCATION: Hwy's 46 or 28 to Kewaskum, east at stop & go lights on Hwy 
28, 3 blocks to County "S", then north 1 % miles to PAUL AUCTION CO. hall. 
AUCTIONEER'S NOTE: Combined sales from the Gladyce Rimestad estate. 
West Bend; Households of Alma Herbst plus John & Mery Whelan, West Bend, 
and Lorraine Rowen, Mequon with addition from area home & estates.
HOUSEHOLD, ETC.: Sampo 19 in. color TV; GE window eir cond.; Kenmore 
elec, clothes dryer; Smell Formice table w/leaf; Flexsteel 3 cushion sofe, near 
new; Occasionel cheirs; Early Am. pine deacon's bench & cobbler's coffee table; 
Home entertainment cabinet Utility shelves & cabinets; Roll-around file cabinets; 
Writing desks; Breeze boxes; Decorator table lamps; Beveled well mirror; Hoover 
upright vacuum & other small appliances; Pots, pens, dishes, glesswore, etc; 
Card tables Er cheirs; Smell weight lifting set w/bench; Lawn furniture; Jecob- 
son self-propelled rotary mower; Dehumidifier; Shop-Vec; Stihl 16 in. ges chein 
saw. Lawn, garden & household hand tools; Elec, sander Er saber saw; Ice fishing 
equipt.; Coleman, etc.; Toboggan; 7 ft. step ladder; Bettery cherger; Bumper pool­
poker game table and other items.

ANTIQUES & COLLECTIBLES
FURNITURE: 3 oak double glass door bookcases, ell w/adjustable shelves; 3 
section staking oak bookcase w/desk & leaded glass units; 1930's secretary/desk 
w/bookcase top, serpentine drawers; Nice 20's walnut buffet Er chine cebinet 
Oak, 20's walnut & 40 s Chippendale high boys; 1930's deco 3 pc. double bedroom 
set w/venity dresser; Square oak table w/2 leeves; Oak frame upholstered love 
seat Ash oval dropleaf table; Early tapered swing leg pine drop leef table; 
"Possum belly" baking table; LIMBERTS oek arm chair; STICKLEY BROS. Ear­
ly Am. rocker; Oak sewing Er pletform rockers; Metching wicker rocker Er choir; 
Oek corner chair; Two 30's sewing cabinets; Mise, chairs; 20's walnut twin bed; 
Jenny Lind bed; Tea cart Captain's chair; 40's corner what not stand; Oak preesed 
back youth chair; Folding oak pressed Er caned high choir-stroller; Child's holl 
tree Er wicker rocker; Contemporary "Whale" coffee table Er "Gresshopper" 
decoration plus other items.
COLLECTOR DOLLS: Early Teddy Beer w/"Our Tedd-ee" bennor; AM #341 in- 
fent bisque doll; Doll dresser Ef bed; A HUGE VARIETY of collector dolls some 
of which ore os follows—Effenbee Anne-Shirley, Modeme Alexonder; Marx 
Disney characters, Disney Grumpy, 4 different Whimsies, Mary Poppins, Hong 
Kong Lilli, Littiechap family. Campus Cuties. Deluxe Reeding dolls, Annie Oakley 
Er Horse plus Doc Holliday?, Heidi Hospital set Horsmon, Barbie, Merionettes, 
Baby Berry, Indian leather dolls w/beedwork, Braves doll. Pin cushion, Dolls of 
ell notions. Cut-outs end others.
TOYS, TRAINS, COMICS, ETC: Lionel includoe 2023 dieeels; 210 diesels; 50 
gong cor; Santa Fe freight set in box plus freight core; American Flyer "0" gege 
freight set Morx Canadian Pacific freight sot in box; 1964 Erector set Battery 
toys include Dendy the Drumming Dog. Circus Lion, Wolking Dog & Indian drum­
mer; ARCADE includes #273 tractor, steom shovel Er stoke truck; Wind up 
animals; BASEBALL CARDS include 1933 Goudey #30, 222. 228 phis o few re­
cent Gene Autry memorabilio; Approx. 200 comic books from the 60 s Er 60 s; 
Tootsietoys; Tin cars Er trucks; Early SUPERMAN wrist watch and more. * 
OTHER GOOD ITEMS: Large straddle type kraut cutter; Unuaual wainscoted 
frame tin both tub, made by Bertschy Bros.. Allenton, Wl; Childe pull type bob 
sleigh w/wegon box; Flexible Flyer & other sleds; 9x12 ft American oriental rug; 
2 old spinning wheels; Organ stool; Wall magneto telephone; 8 drawer wood 
spice cebinet Edieon C160 oak floor phonograph; 4 1920's dresses; Nice horse 
weather vene; Swiee cow be# Er strap; Old violin; St mstronoms; 2 cuckoo clocks; 
400 day clock; Stonswars; 11 in. spongs bowl; Copparwsrs; Broad ax; 3 signed 
EVANS decoys; Lake Wlnnebego STURGEON decoy; Well coffee grinder. Old 
trapping booka; 1864 Civil Wer book; Elbert Hubberd book; Soler Motorcycle 
light Ford Moto-meter; GUNS include old Remington RoIRng block 32 gege 
shotgun; 7.36 mm Carcano rifle w/folding beyonet 11mm Dutch Beeumont ri­
fle; Wood dough trey; Old licenee pletee; 6 Dryden pottery tumblers; Baverien 
dinnerwere; Sterling pitcher; Royal Copenhagen Xmae plates; Large ornetely 
cerved soepstone vase; Porcelein figurines; Collectible gless Er chine end there 
will be other heme.

Cherbroiled Brets. Hemburgers & Refreshments
aui man > auctions 
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Goeden Wins Again

Don Goeden

Last Saturday evening at the 
Sheboygan County Fairgrounds 
in Plymouth, two professional 
modified drivers, Frankie 
Heimerl of West Bend and Don 
Goeden of Kewaskum, put their

Dean to Compete 
In State Open

MEQUON - When the 
state’s top pro and amateur 
golfers get together at 
Mequon’s North Shore Country 
Club next week for the 1990 
Wisconsin State Open, 
Kewaskum’s Hon-E-Kor golf 
club will finally be represented.

Gregg Dean became the first 
Hon-E-Kor golfer ever to 
qualify for the prestigious 
event, as he finished fifth in a 
qualifying regional meet held at 
Muskego Lakes Country Club 
July 31st.

Dean, who will be a junior at 
UW-Stout this fall, shot a 74 to 
take the fifth of 12 spots 
advancing to the State Open. Of 
the 57 golfers participating in 
the regional qualifier, 40 were 
professionals, including three of 
the four golfers finishing ahead 
of Dean.

“I was just shooting for 
pars,” Dean said of his 
qualifying round. “I was just 
trying to hit the greens and 
two-putt. I was looking for 
consistency.”

His consistency helped him 
make a bit of history, as he now 
will focus on the State Open, to 
be held Monday through 
Wednesday. Dean said his 
tee-off times were to be Monday 
at 1:46 p.m., and Tuesday at 
9:14 a.m.

After the first two rounds are 
played, the original field of 180 
golfers, which are for the most 
part professionals, will be cut 
down to the top sixty scores, 
including ties.

The herring is the world's 
most widely-eaten fish.

Quality-

a

Replacement 
WINDOWS & DOORS

Custom Made to
• Fit Your Opening

^Insulation ^Siding
Additions

•Soffit Systems and Custom Trim
-r-J \ •Seamless Aluminum Gutters

Ke„asl^\ FREE ESTIMAtes ■ FULLY INSURED

HEBERER BROS. 
CONSTRUCTION

driving talents and the 
“set-ups” of their cars to the 
test.

With Heimerl chosing the 
outside groove and Goeden 
taking the inside groove, they 
gave the fans something to 
stand, stump and cheer about. 
Together, they performed a 
clean competitive duel to the 
finish, with Goeden crossing the 
finish line three car lengths 
ahead of Heimerl, to take the 
W.C.U.B. Radio of Manitowoc 
win and trophy.

Frankie Heimerl is the 
current Eastern Wisconsin 
Stock Car Assn, point leader 
and Goeden is in 4th place in 
the Modified Division, point 
standings. Enjoy the E.W.S.C. 
races every Saturday night at 
Plymouth on the quarter mile 
clay oval. Time trials at 6:00 
p.m. and the first race is at 7:30 
p.m. (Time for sound curfew is 
11:00 p.m.)

Adopt a Wild Horse
On October 20 & 21, 1990, 

100 young wild horses recently 
rounded up from fragile 
western rangelands will be 
offered for adoption at The 
Midwest Livestock Producers 
Cooperation in Marion, 
Wisconsin. The adoption event 
to be held in Marion is 
sponsored by the U.S. 
Department of the Interior’s 
Bureau of Land Management.

Since the program began in 
1973, over 96,000 animals have 
been adopted to more than 
40,000 people in the United 
States. As of June 21, 1990, 
over 1,000 animals have been 
adopted by the residents of 
Wisconsin. Most wild horses 
are found in Nevada, Wyoming, 
California and eastern Oregon. 
Before shipping each animal 
rounded up by BLM is 
thoroughly checked by a 
veterinarian, coggins tested, 
wormed, and vaccinated for 
various equine disorders.

To qualify to adopt up to four 
animals, applicants must have a 
sturdy corral at least 6 feet 
high, shelter, transportation, 
and means of caring for the 
animals. The adoption fee of 
$125.00 per horse is payable in 
cash or money order at the time 
of adoption.

After an animal has been 
adopted, BLM personnel will 
halter and load the animal for 
the adopter and provide 
information on health care, 
feeding and training of wild 
horses.

For applications and more 
information about this event 
contact the Bureau of Land 
Management, P.O. Box 631, 
Milwaukee, WI 53201-0631, or 
call 414-297-4433.

Roger 626-2598

Norm 626-2491

Bill 626-2384

Athletic Club to Sponsor 
Flag Football League

The Kewaskum Athletic Club 
- Youth Division is again 
sponsoring a Flag Football 
League this fall for all 6th, 7th, 
and 8th graders in the Kewas­
kum School District. One goal of 
the program is to teach football 
fundamentals which can be 
used at the high school level.

The cost to play will be $5.00 
per family. The $5.00 contri­
bution is a membership fee to 
the Athletic Club and allows 
participation in any Athletic 
club sponsored programs for 
the year. All players interested 
should fill out the application 
below along with the $5.00 and 
send it to Jerry Marx or Tom 
Bartelt.

All players must attend an 
organizational practice on 
September 8th at 1:00 p.m. at 
the Varsity Football field behind 
Kewaskum Elementary School.

This is the second program

Providing Shelter for 
Homeless Wildlife

Bird houses and feeders 
provide safety and comfort for 
wildlife and attract a variety of 
birds and small mammals to 
watch and study.

If you are interested in 
constructing bird houses, see 
“Shelves, Houses and Feeders 
for Birds and Mammals,” North 
Central Regional Publication 
338. This manual contains 
detailed information with 
illustrations on building and 
maintaining many types of 
animal shelters.

Publication NCR 338 costs 
$1.75 per copy and can be 
ordered from Agricultural 
Bulletin, Room 245, 30 N. 
Murray St., Madison, WI 
53715, (608) 262-3346. It is also 
available at some county 
Extension offices.

AUTO 
CRAFT

COMPLETE 
AUTO BODY 

REPAIR

DUNDEE 
SAND & GRAVEL 
G. RAMTHUN 533-4549 

* Washed Sand 
* Crushed Gravel 
* Stone and Lime Chips 

Also Gravel and Sand Fill 
Topsoil 

GENERAL TRUCKING

Residential & Commercial 
Careful 

Conscientious 
Reasonable

sponsored by the Youth 
Division. The summer baseball 
program was a huge success 
again with the team being very 
competitive in the Lakeshore 
Baseball League.

Participation is the key to the 
success of these programs. Any 
parent or person interested in 
coaching or helping to run this 
program should contact Jerry 
Marx or Tom Bartelt, or attend 
the organizational meeting on 
September 8th.

Jerry Marx, 707 Moraine Ct., 
Kewaskum, WI 53040, 
626-4384.

Tom Bartelt, 1226 Pine Lane, 
Campbellsport, WI 53010, 626- 
4903.

Name

Address

Phone Number

Grade

Date of Birth

Team Played on Last Year

Parent's Signature

Return to either of the above 
addresses as soon as possible

TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport

533-8094

DON’S ELECTRIC
Don Scheid, Owner

NEW CONSTRUCTION OR REMODELING

Update your old 60 angp fuse box with 
100 amp service and circuit breaker box

•Residential •Commercial
•Industrial Wiring

^■Quality Work ^Reasonable Rates ^Free Estimates
PHONE 334-7565

Tired of Mud?
THINK CONCRETE!

BUTCH’S CONSTRUCTION
Sidewalks - Patios - Driveways - Garages - Basements 

Pole Buildings - Barnyards - Concrete Sawing - 
SKID LOADER WORK

GERALD (Butch) WINNINGHOFF
8412 Hilltop Lane, Kewaskum

334-3186

Specializing in New Lawn Construction

Bob Koenig Landscaping
2579 Hwy F. Campbellsport, WI 53083

477-7322
Grading - Seeding - Sodding - Edging
Straw Mulching - Decorative Stone

In 1983, a Florida schoolboy 
found a bag of diamonds on a 
railroad track while looking for 
his missing bicycle. The jewels 
remained unclaimed for over a 
year and were then auctioned 
off for $350,000 which went to 
the boy.

FOR SALE
2-Door Cooler

Waukesha Zero Zone 
Self-Contained

$995
626-4565

FULLY 
Insured

Free 
Estimate*



Annual Horseshoe Tournament Held RESULTS OF THE KEWASKUM OPEN 
HORSESHOE TOURNAMENT

AUGUST 44 5, 1990

CLASS A MEN
1----DON TARGaS
2 RALPH MAYLAHN
3 MARK STEVENS
4 CHET OGI BA
5 STEVE WI EGERT
6 JIM HAUPT
7 RICK PRITZLAFF
S LEON UHL

CLASS B MEN
I NORMANTUEN
2 Gl ENN B06ENSCHNE1DER
3 TONY SCR IMA
4 DENNIS AMBUEHL
5 OUS SCHRaM
6 WES TAYLOR
7 GERALD WEIKERT
8 FELIX KUBLY

CLASS C MEN
T-----JTTTTITEMERS
2 MARV GUETZKE
3 GERALD GROMOWSKI
4 CHARLES CHRISTOPHS
5 BOB TRaBER
o LEON VOIGT
7 MIKE STRUEBING
8 WARREN KNIPPEL

WEST ALLIS.
GENESEE DEPOT,
MARENGO, 
MOSINEE. 
GREEN BAY, 
MILWAUKEE, 
OAK CREEK, 
SHEBOYGAN,

LOMIRA, 
KENOSHA, 
WAUKESHA. 
OCONOMOWOC,

6 1
5 2
4 3
4 3

RINGLE, 3 4
WEST BEND, 3 4
MARSHALL, 2 5
WATERTOWN, 1 6

FOND DU LAC, 
GERMANTOWN, 
OCONOMOWOC, 
SHEBOYGAN, 
CEDARBURG, 
WEST BEND. 
CAMPBELLSPORT, 
WAUKESHA,

4 3
2 5

7. 
69771
58.86
60.29
55.71
49.93 
48.00 
49.14
42.29

50.00
48.27
46.29
45.71
41 .43 
36.86 
37.71 
36.57

43.71
42.00
40.57
40.00
38.29
33.71
33.71
29.14

Some of the pitchers from the 102 entries enjoying a beautiful day pitching shoes 
in Kiwanis Park.

CLASS D MEN
1 TTTmTE RMaN
2 CLIFF TR0ULL1ER
3 STEVE STEVENS
4 HAROLD WENDORF
5 DENNIS JANCOSKI
6 RON SABISH JR.

FOND DU LAC, 
MANITOWOC, 
MARENGO, 
GLENBEULAH. 
ST. FRANCIS, 
CAMPBELLSPORT,

5 0
3 2
3 2
2 3
2 3
0 5

42.80 
40.40 
38.80
30.80 
30.00 
13.60

It didn't look very good for 
pitching horseshoe; cloudy, 
raining, but sure enough 
around seven fifteen it stopped 
raining. Around eight o’clock 
you could hear the sound of 
horseshoes hitting the stake. 
The Horseshoe League lucked 
out again with good weather.

There were 102 entries from 
all over the state. Don Kangas 
from West Allis, also last years 
state champ, took first in Class 
A mens with averaging 69.7 
percent ringers. Joan Guetzke 
of Germantown took Class A 
ladies pitching 67.6 percent 
ringers.

Joan and Rob Struebing, 
tournament directors, would 
like to thank all who helped in 
making the tournament a 
success, especially the young 
scorekeepers and Herb and 
Dianne Theisen for the use of 
their computer again. The 
results of the tournament are as 
follows:

Tournament directors Joan and Rob Struebing making sure 
everything is running on time.

CLASS E MEN
I JIM BOESEL
2 KEN DAVISON
3 DENNIS BACH
4 LEO ZAMZOU
5 DALE HE INELK
6 BILL MATE।
7 RICHARD CONRAD
8 JAY BOEGEL

L LASS. F MEN
1 WALLY MlLHAELS
2 RUN SABISH SR.
3 RON KMIEC1AK 
4 STAN SCHERER
5 DON BURMEISTER
6 HERMAN PINT

CLASS'S MEN
I JUEVTAHTLEY
2 HOWARD SELLE
3 GARY BLOEDORN
4 DaN EBERT
5 JOHN WALLENDAL
6 BOB DAMK0T

CLASS H MEN 
i—rshttoegel 
2 JIM N0REN 
3 tim Bartley 
4 FRANS KLEINNASSINK 
5 PAUL NEUMANN 
6 JOHN GOMOLL

CLASS 1 MEN
I—PufTTATSK
2 DICK MACKAY
3 russell Bartley
4 WILLARD SMITH
5 JAMES RIEL
6 GEORGE SURA

KEWASKUM. 6 1
MENOMONEE FALLS, 6 1
DORCHESTER. 5 2
FOND DU LAt. 43
WISCONSIN RAPIDS, 34
APPLETON, 2 5
PEWAUKEE, 1 6
KEWASKUM 1 6

FREDONIA. 
Campbellsport, 
OAK CREEK. 
FOND DU LAC, 
BROWN DEER, 
GREENDALE,

WEST BEND, 
ELM GROVE, 
FOND DU LAC, 
FREDONIA, 
WAUPUN. 
SHEBOYGAN,

KEWASKUM, 
KEWASKUM, 
KEWASKUM, 
SHEBOYGAN, 
OCONOMOWOC, 
WATERTOWN,

RANDOM LAKE, 
GERMANTOWN, 
RICHFIELD, 
OSHKOSH, 
WAUPUN, 
COLGATE,

4* J
1 4
1 4

5 0
4 1
3 2
1 4
1 4
1 4

4 1
3 2
3 2
3 2
1 4
1 4

36.00
34.5?
38.00
32.00
29.14
26.86
22.57
20.00

28.80
31 .20
27.60
28.00
25.60
24.00

30.80
34.40
24.40
23.60
17.20
17.20

25.20
28.40
25.60
20.00
20.00
16.00

26700
20.00 
21 .20 
20.80 
15.60 
15.60

Fall Sports 
Season to Open

With school set to start in a 
matter of weeks, it means it is 
once again football season, as 
Kewaskum High School is set to 
begin yet another fall sports 
season.

Head coach Clark Pearson 
and his troops are preparing for 
their season-opener, when the 
Indians host their small - town 
rivals, the Campbellsport 
Cougars on August 24. In the 
meantime, the Indians will 
prepare for their opener with a 
scrimmage this Friday, when 
they host Slinger and West 
Bend East in a controlled 
scrimmage.

Other dates to remember for 
season-opening meets involving 
Kewaskum teams include 
August 23rd, when the girls 
tennis team travels to Slinger; 
August 25th, when the girls 
volleyball team opens their 
season by hosting the Indian 
Pre-Season Invite; and August 
28th, the day the cross country 
teams begin competition in a 
meet at Howards Grove with 
Sheboygan Falls.

SPORTS LICENSES FOR 
1990-91 ON SALE NOW

MADISON, WI - Wisconsin 
hunters and anglers who have 
Sports Licenses should be 
aware that the license expires 
Friday, Aug. 31, reminds 
Department of Natural 
Resources license sales staff.

The Sports License is a 
combined license that allows its 
purchaser to fish, hunt small 
game and hunt deer with a gun. 
The Sports License for 1990-91 
is available now at all DNR and 
county clerk offices and at many

sport shops and retail vendors. 
The license is valid from Sept. 
1, 1990 through Aug. 31, 1991.

A Sports License costs $32.60 
and is only available for 
Wisconsin residents. When 
purchased separately by 
residents, a deer hunting 
license is $15.35, a small game 
hunting license is $9.60, and an 
individual annual fishing 
license is $9.10. The 
department sold 210,668 Sports 
Licenses in 1989.

For more information contact 
DNR Information Center, 608- 
266-2621.
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The tallest woman basketball 
player was Juliana Semenova 
who played on the 1976 Russian 
Olympic team and stands seven 
feet two inches tall.

Annual

TRAP SHOOT
r Poultry and Cash Prizes

Sponsored by the 
Campbellsport 

Sportsmen's Club

Sunday, Aug. 26
> 10 a.m. to ??

CLUBHOUSE GROUNDS
★ Food and Refreshments*
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2 JANET ROHL INGER
3 NANCY BOEGEL
4 MARY SCHERER
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The largest fish ever caught by rod and reel was a white 
shark that weighed over 2,500 pounds!
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