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for weeks, before you find 
something you can buy with it.”

area siiue 1895

Kewaskum Statesman
(. VIEW \Y l(> mi hi: II IE MORAINE MATE FOREST”

The Only Newspaper Working for Kewaskum
(Official Nru spapcr for i hr \ ilhige of Kewaskum. I <>u iiships ol Kewaskum .mil Waj nr. anil School District of hew ask uni

Volume 94 Number 29 Kewaskum Wisconsin 53040 Thursday, July 5, 1990 SINGLE COPY 30c

School Board to Recommend 
$9.3 Million Budget for ’90-91

By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

After bantying about 
numbers and “what-ifs” for 
almost two hours, the Kewas­
kum Board of Education finally 
adopted a budget to present to 
the electors at the school 
district’s Annual Meeting set 
for July 23rd.

The $9.3 million budget 
proposed for the 1990-91 school 
year includes an additional 
$200,000, which covers a variety 
of so-called Capital Improve­
ments which range from 
building repairs and 
improvements to equipment 
replacement and purchases. 
That $9,308,045 budget 
represents a 13% increase over 
the 1989-90 budget of $8,268,- 
513.

The $200,000 was added to 
the proposed budget after the 
board, at an earlier meeting, 
voted down District 
Administrator David Heather’s 
recommendation that the 
district acquire a $200,000 loan.

Pastor Eckert Installed at 
St. John's Lutheran Church

Pastor Mark Eckert
On Sunday, June 24th, 1990, 

St. John’s Lutheran Church, 
New Fane, held a special 
installation service for its new 
pastor, Mark Eckert.

Pastor Mark Eckert was born 
and raised in Racine, Wiscon­
sin. After graduating from 
Racine Lutheran High School in 
1978, he attended Concordia 
College in Ann Arbor, 
Michigan, enrolled in the pre- 
ministerial program. During the 
summer of 1981, he and 
Luanne, also of Racine, were 
married. Earning a Bachelor of 
Arts degree in 1982, it was then 
off to the seminary for the 
Eckerts. Pastor Eckert attended 
Concordia Theological 
Seminary in Fort Wayne.

Heather felt the loan, possibly 
through the State Trust Fund, 
would be less of a burden to the 
taxpayers than increasing the 
tax levy by that much.

The proposed budget was 
approved on a 5-2 vote, with 
board members Perry Ankerson 
and Ruth Schmitt casting the 
dissenting votes.

Ankerson again stated his 
position that the board had not 
done enough to reduce 
spending. He read a portion of 
an article written last May, by 
Representative Mary Panzer, in 
which she stated there has been 
no correlation between the 
amount of money spent and the 
increased quality of education. 
Ankerson noted that the 
district’s increased spending 
had not resulted in any 
significant improvement in 
student test scores over the last 
few years.

“The often heard comment 
that 85% of the budget is fixed 
cost is a ‘cop-out’,” said 
Ankerson. “Seven members on

Indiana for two years before 
being assigned to a vicarage at 
a vacant congregation just south 
of Fresno, California. Com­
pleting the requirements for his 
Master of Divinity degree, 
Pastor Eckert was accepted as a 
candidate and ordained into the 
public ministry in 1986. He has 
served in the metropolitan 
Detroit area until accepting the 
call to St. John’s, New Fane. 
The Eckerts have been blessed 
with four children: Daniel (age 
7), Steven (turning 6 in July), 
Sandra (age 4), and Alan (age 
2).

A reception followed the 
service at the church school 
next door.

this board are responsible for 
this budget and no one else, and 
we should not blame it on the 
state for its mandates or anyone 
else.” Ankerson noted, it's up 
to us (the board), if we truly 
believe in the budget we should 
support it and if we don’t, then 
it is up to us to vote it down.

Schmitt said she had no big 
problem with the budget other 
than the fact she felt strongly 
that the $200,000 should be a 
loan, rather than added to the 
budget.

Board member Ron Beimborn 
asked Heather, “If we say cut 
the budget, where in the 
vaguest terms would you 
recommend we cut?” Heather 
said, “Number one, you could 
cut the new language art books, 
that would represent $70,000. 
You could also cut all extra 
curricular activities including all 
sports, Odyssey of the Mind, 
choir and band, etc., that’s 
$167,000. And you could cut 
teachers overloads, that’s 
another $70,000. You could,” 
said Heather, “but I wouldn’t 
recommend it and I don’t think 
you would really want to do it.”

Along with the budget figures 
were four sheets of information 
on the tax levy itself. The total 
levy for the proposed budget, 
including the additional 
$200,000 and the debt service 
levy of $116,112, comes to 
$4,740,677.

The levy can and will be 
affected by a variety of factors, 
such as, will there or will there 
not be an increase in equalized 
valuation and if so, how much? 
Will the $200,000 be left in the 
budget or removed and 
approved separately in the loan 
format? And lastly, will the 
electors even approve the 
additional $200,000, or turn it 
down completely?

With all those variables 
involved, the levy could 
present an increase anywhere 
from 7.35% or $1.13 per $1,000 
to 15.56% or $2.39 per $1,000 of 
valuation.

The low hike would see the 
tax rate increase from the 1989- 
90 figure of $15.36 per $1,000 to 
$16.49 while on the high end, 
that increase could go up to 
$17.75 per $1,000.

On a $70,000 home, that 
could represent an increase 
anywhere from $79 to $168, 
depending upon which levy rate 
is finally adopted. Since he has 
not received any information on 
the district’s equalized 
valuation as yet, Heather said 
he could only speculate as to 
what the levy rate will be. 
Right now, it looks like we will 
be in the 12-14% range, he 
noted.

Huge Parade Sunday at Noon

Annual Firemen-Legion
Picnic Here July 6, 7, 8

Kewaskum's annual Fire- 
men-Legion picnic will take 
place in River Hill Park Friday 
and Saturday evenings and 
Sunday, July 6, 7 and 8.

This year the festivities begin 
on Friday night with the Larrys 
playing in the beer garden from 
8 to midnight. Saturday night 
will feature Class of '62/Surf 
Boys from 8 to midnight in the 
beer garden. All rides, 
refreshments and games will be 
in operation.

Waterfights will begin at 5:30 
Saturday evening with many 
neighboring fire departments 
competing for the championship 
trophy.

On Sunday the mammoth 
parade will get underway at 12 
noon led by the Kewaskum 
High School Band. This 
legendary event features the 
Milwaukee Civic Riders 
Motorcycle Club, Tripoli Drum 
and Bugle Corps of Milwaukee, 
Marquis Drum and Bugle Corps 
of Fond du Lac, the Hartford 
City Band, and other musical 
units as well as the Princettes 
Baton Group of Kewaskum and 
the Middle School Color Guard.

The firemen and legion are 
asking parade participants to 
please refrain from throwing 
candy from the trucks or 
vehicles, due to the danger 
involved with the little children 
running out on the road to pick 
it up. If you wish to give candy 
to the children please have 
someone walk beside the float 
and hand the candy out to the 
children.

The mammoth parade will 
again feature many beautiful 
floats, dance bands, baton 
twirlers, novelty and military 
units, drill teams, children’s 
specialties, comic and clown 
entries, clubs and 
organizations, visiting fire 
departments, Legionnaires, 
antique cars, horses and riders, 
and much much more.

This years parade theme is: 
“The Gay Nineties.” The 
parade will originate from the 
High School campus area and 
adjacent streets, and proceed 
from there to River Hill Park. 
All participants should be ready 
to line up no later than 11:30 
a.m. Many great prizes will be 
awarded for the best floats and 
children’s specialties.

Sunday afternoon entertain­

ment will feature continuous 
music from 1 to 6 by Spid Pieper 
and Hickory Wind in the beer 
garden and Ralph Buchel with 
Joey Klass in the north beer 
stand from 1 to 5.

Purchase tickets for 
numerous cash and 
merchandise orizes and be a 
winner. They will be on sale in 
the park. at some area 
businesses, and through any 
Fire Department or legion 
member.

Anyone interested in 
sponsoring units or bands, or 
donating money towards 
sponsoring units, please contact 
Bob Stoltzmann at 626-4503 or 
Bob Staehler at 626-2329.

Attend the Kewaskum picnic 
and enjoy a weekend of good 
food, games, and rides, live 
entertainment, and lots of good 
family fun.

AFS Student
Says Goodbye

Satoko Kamimura

Thank you very much. I had a 
great year. You are kind. 1 
learned many things from you. 
In my first school day, 1 was 
surprised that student’s 
clothes. Some students put on 
short pants and accessories. In 
my Japanese high school, we 
can't put on these. I had known 
about American student style, 
but when I saw them, I was 
shocked little. Then now, I put 
on earrings, rings and short 
pants.

I also think my opinion was 
changed. I am able to say 
myself, I like it here very much.

Thank you, my friends, 
teachers, 4-H, and my U.S.A, 
family. I will never forget you.

Satoko Kamimura
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TWO RIVERS - When your 
starting pitcher gives up the 
same number of hits in seven 
innings that your leadoff hitter 
collected in the same game, a 
team’s prospects of winning are 
pretty great.

Although it wasn’t a blowout 
by any means, the Kewaskum 
baseball team will definitely 
take its 2-1 victory over Two 
Rivers here, last Monday.

There was no question who 
the stars of this contest were, on 
either side for that matter. For 
the Indians, sophomore Chad 
Cook threw a three-hitter and 
struck out eight Two Rivers 
batters to record his third 
conference victory of the year, 
while senior Dan Heisdorf 
continued to tear up the league, 
rapping out three hits, 
including the game - winner in 
the top of the seventh inning.

Heisdorf, along with junior 
Chris Donath collected five of 
the seven hits that the Indians 
got off of the Raiders’ starting 
pitcher. Miller. Donath figured 
a prominant role in each of the 
Indians' run-scoring innings.

Miller, meanwhile, was the 
one-man show for the hosts, 
singlehandedly keeping his 
team in the ballgame. Miller 
struck out ten Indian batters, 
while only allowing the seven 
base hits. Miller also made his- 
presence felt at the plate, 
slugging a solo home run for the 
Raiders in the bottom of the 
fourth, but that was the only run 
Two Rivers could muster off the

Heisdorf, Schneider Lead 
Indians Past Sheboygan Falls

SHEBOYGAN FALLS - 
Even though it came against a 
winless and last-place Sheboy­
gan Falls team, Kewaskum’s 
7-2 victory here, last Tuesday 
night showed once again that 
the Indians have what it takes to 
win a big game.

Timely hitting and strong 
pitching have been the keys for 
Indian victories thus far this 
summer, and the same was the 
case again Tuesday.

Dan Heisdorf continued his 
onslaught of opposing pitchers 
as he went and collected 
another three hits, his second 
three-hit game in as many days, 
with driving in four runs to pace 
the Indians offensively.

Meanwhile on the mound, 
Shawn Schneider was strong 
once again, going the full seven 
innings while only giving up 
four hits. Schneider, who was 
rocked by West Bend East in his 
first start of the year, but has 
come back to pitch brilliantly 
since, struck out five and 
walked three.

For a while it looked as if the 
host Falcons might break into 
the win column in conference 
action, as Falls held a 2-1 lead 
after three innings.

The Indians got on the board 
first, as they used a Jason 
Krahn single, a sacrifice and 
Heisdorf’s first hit of the game 
to drive in Krahn and take a 1-0 
lead. But Falls quickly 
answered in the bottom half of 
the inning with a run, and then 
took the lead with another tally 
in the third.

But Schneider then bore 
down and didn’t allow another 
hit the rest of the way, and with 
the way the Indians defense has 
been playing recently (one error 
in the pest three games), it 
would be up to the offense to

southpaw Cook.
The Indians got on the board 

first, as they tallied a single run 
in the top of the fourth, with 
everything coming after there 
were two outs. Senior Chris 
Weddig opened things up by 
reaching on a Raider miscue. 
Donath then singled to 
rightfield, and when the 
rightfielder’s throw to try and 
cut down Weddig at third was 
wild, Weddig scampered home 
with the game’s first run.

Miller socked his homer in 
the bottom of the inning to tie 
things at one, and that’s the 
way things stayed until the 
seventh, as both Cook and 
Miller showed no signs of 
letting up.

The Indians finally got to 
Miller in the seventh, though. 
With one out, Donath got his 
second hit of the game, a single, 
and moved to second when 
Brian Leitheiser walked. 
Heisdorf then came through 
with his third hit, a single 
which scored Donath and put 
the Indians out in front 2-1.

In the bottom of the seventh, 
things got a bit hairy when Cook 
walked the first batter of the 
inning. But Cook quickly 
rectified himself as he got the 
next batter to ground into a 
double play, and then struck out 
the ensuing Raider to end the 
ballgame.

The win moved the Indians 
back above the .500 mark, as 
they improved to 8-7 overall, 
including 5-4 in the Eastern 
Wisconsin Conference.

come through against the last­
place Falcons.

The offense did just that as it 
picked up a pair of runs in the 
fourth. Ken Krause and Shawn 
Schneider reached base with 
one out, and Heisdorf again 
came through, ripping a single, 
but Krause was thrown out at 
the plate trying to score on the 
play

Bruce Waechter followed 
with a walk, and when Chris 
Weddig did likewise, Schneider 
came into score. A passed ball 
allowed Heisdorf to come across 
the plate, and the Indians were 
ahead 3-2.

After adding another run in 
the sixth, Heisdorf put the 
game away in the top of the 
seventh. With the bases loaded, 
the senior slugger ripped a 
triple to clear the bases and put 
his team out in front 7-2.

The win gave the Indians a 
6-4 mark in the Eastern 
Wisconsin Conference, while 
they improved to 9-7 overall.

HON-E-KOR
LADIES ASSOCIATION

On Wednesday, June 20, 
Shirley O’Connor won the Day 
Event, “Low Net Minus Putts 
with a score of 15.

The Class Event was “3 Club 
Tournament.’’ These winners 
were: Class A - Judy Moede, 
54; Class B - Shirley O’Connor 
56; Class C - Sue Kreiger 60; 
Class D - Ada Kannenberg 64.

The 18 hole winner was Judy 
Moede with 78. Shirley 
O’Connor had a chip in on #5. 
Bridge winners were Eleanor 
Marx and Corliss Fassbinder.

Carole Timblin, Publicity

First Place Kiel
KIEL — The Kewaskum- 

baseball team had an ideal 
opportunity to really tighten 
things up in the Eastern 
Wisconsin Conference baseball 
race when it took on first-place 
Kiel here, last Thursday.

Things looked good for the 
Indians, leading the hosts 2-1 
with sophomore lefty Chad 
Cook cruising along on the 
mound, pitching a four-hitter.

But things fell apart for Cook 
and the Indians in the bottom of 
the fifth, as a pair of Raider 
home runs in the inning was 
more than enough for Raider 
pitchers Chris Held and Mike 
Lepisto to work with, and the 
result was a 5-2 Kiel victory, 
dropping the Indians 
conference record to 6-5, while 
Kiel moved to 8-3.

Just as Cook had outpitched a 
fine Two Rivers pitcher just 
three days earlier, the same was 
done unto him by Held and 
Lepisto. Held gave up a pair of 
Indian hits in the top of the first 
when the Indians scored a 
couple of runs, but did not allow 
another base hit up until he was 
replaced by Lepisto in the fifth. 
Lepisto in turn held the Indians 
hitless the rest of the way.

In the opening inning, Chris 
Weddig started things off by 
reaching on an error with two 
outs. Rich Radtke followed with 
a single, and when the Raider 
outfield misplayed the ball, it 
was off to the races for Weddig, 
who eventually scored on the 
play. Mark Felix then followed 
with a single to score Radtke, 
giving the Indians a 2-0 lead.

But that was the extent of the 
Indian offensive attack for the 
game, and while Cook didn’t 
pitch badly either (seven hits), 
one bad inning cost him dearly.

Kiel got one run back in the 
bottom of the fourth. Dean 
Meyer got things started with a 
single, and he advanced to third 
on Craig Neils’ double. Jay 
Binversie followed with a 
single, scoring Meyer and 
moving Neils to third. Cook 
survived any further damage by 
enticing Brian Neils to hit into 
an inning - ending double play, 
but an inning later, Cook’s luck 
ran out.

A single and a fielder’s choice 
left runners on first and second 
with two out in the fifth for the 
Raiders. Just when it looked as 
if the soph lefty would get out of 
the jam, the next batter, Meyer, 
connected for a three-run blast 
over the fence, giving the hosts 
their first lead of the game, 4-2. 
Neils followed and promptly 
delivered another Cook offering 
over the fence in right to extend 
the Kiel lead to 5-2.

Indians head coach Tom 
Bartelt replaced Cook with 
junior Ken Krause, who made 
his return last week after being 
hit in the eye with the ball on a 
play earlier this year, and 
Krause finished up, retiring all 
four Raiders he faced.

But the damage had already 
been done as far as the Indians 
were concerned, as they slipped 
back to just a game over the 
.500 mark, at 9-8 overall.

ABC CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners at skat played by 

the ABC Senior Citizens at 
Beechwood Hall on Tuesday, 
June 19, were: Joe Butschlick 
23-4—19 net; Francis Gilboy 
14-1 — 13 net; Willy Blecher 
14-2—12 net; Elroy Egerer 
18-7-11 net.

Area Athletes Victorious 
At Badger State Games

The Kewaskum area was well 
represented at the Badger State 
Games held in Madison over the 
weekend.

In Saturday’s wrestling 
competition held at the 
University of Wisconsin 
Fieldhouse, Kewaskum’s 
Bobby Castro won a third place 
bronze medal in the 125.5 
pound weight class.

Another Kewaskum athlete, 
Rich Straub a junior at UW 
Whitewater, made a clean 
sweep of his competition 
winning all six of his matches in 
the 149.5 pound Open Division 
(collegiate). Four of his matches 
came by way of pins. A fifth 
match was a 9-4 decision over 
Kevin Kopa.

Straub qualified for the finals

Kewaskum Jaycees Youth Softball 
SCHEDULE

JULY 11th
6 p.m. - Dukes (home) vs. 

Const. Crew, (away); Panthers 
(home) vs. Gems (away).

7 p.m. A’s (home) vs. Indians 
(away); Lions (home) vs. 
Superstars, (away).

JULY 18 
(Parents Night)

6 p.m. - Superstars (home) vs. 
Const. Crew (away); Mean 
Machine (home) vs. Gems (away).

7 p.m. - Panthers (home) vs. 
A’s (away); Indians (home) vs. 
Dukes (away).

JULY 25th
6 p.m. - Mean Machine (home) 

vs. Panthers (away); Dukes 
(home) vs. Lions (away).

7 p.m. Gems (home) vs. A’s 
(away); Superstars (home) vs. In­
dians (away).

by defeating opponent Ken 
Johnson of Racine. A knee 
injury to Straub’s last opponent 
gave him the match by default.

Bruce Torson of Slinger won 
the heavy-weight title in the 
Masters Division.

Ken Schmidt of 
Campbellsport brought home 
top honors in the fifth and sixth 
grade divisions at 65 pounds.

Matt Oswald of West Bend 
took third place in the Masters 
Division.

Chris Berglin of West Bend 
wrestling at 136 pounds, lost his 
first match, won his second and 
then was knocked out of 
competition by an injury.

Tom Williams of Slinger took 
two matches in the Open 
Division heavyweight class.

AUGUST 1 
(Parents Night)

6 p.m. - Superstars (home) vs. 
Mean Machine (away); Panthers 
(home) vs. Const. Crew (away).

7 p.m. - Lions (home) vs. A’s 
(away); Indians (home) vs. Gems 
(away).

AUGUST 8th
6 p.m. - Panthers (home) vs. 

Lions (away); A’s (home) vs. 
Superstars (away).

7 p.m. - Mean Machine (home) 
vs. Dukes (away); Const. Crew 
(home) vs. Gems (away).

AUGUST 9th
ALL STAR GAME

All 12 YEAR OLDS PLAY
Division I consists of players 

from teams 1, 3, 5, 7, 9 in 
standings.

Division II 2, 4, 6, 8.
Party for all teams and parents 

follows the all star game.

The Fourth of July is a 
★★★★★★★★★★★★★

time to take pride in our 
★★★★★★★★★★★★★

nation. Show your pride 
★★★★★★★★★★★★★

all year long and buy 
★★★★★★★★★★★★★

American goods.
★★★★★★★★★★★★★

Buying quality American 
made goods not only helps 
to strengthen our economy, 
but also keeps our money 
circulating in our towns and 
businesses, which helps 
keep employment steady.

When you sit down and 
think about it, doesn’t it make 
sense to buy American? Yes.
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School Board to Recommend 
$9.3 Million Budget for ’90-91

By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

After bantying about 
numbers and "what-ifs" for 
almost two hours, the Kewas­
kum Board of Education finally 
adopted a budget to present to 
the electors at the school 
district’s Annual Meeting set 
for July 23rd.

The $9.3 million budget 
proposed for the 1990-91 school 
year includes an additional 
$200,000, which covers a variety 
of so-called Capital Improve­
ments which range from 
building repairs and 
improvements to equipment 
replacement and purchases. 
That $9,308,045 budget 
represents a 13% increase over 
the 1989-90 budget of $8,268,- 
513.

The $200,000 was added to 
the proposed budget after the 
board, at an earlier meeting, 
voted down District 
Administrator David Heather’s 
recommendation that the 
district acquire a $200,000 loan.

Pastor Eckert Installed at 
St. John’s Lutheran Church

Pastor Mark Eckert
On Sunday, June 24th, 1990, 

St. John's Lutheran Church, 
New Fane, held a special 
installation service for its new 
pastor, Mark Eckert.

Pastor Mark Eckert was born 
and raised in Racine, Wiscon­
sin. After graduating from 
Racine Lutheran High School in 
1978, he attended Concordia 
College in Ann Arbor, 
Michigan, enrolled in the pre- 
ministerial program. During the 
summer of 1981, he and 
Luanne, also of Racine, were 
married. Earning a Bachelor of 
Arts degree in 1982, it was then 
off to the seminary for the 
Eckerts. Pastor Eckert attended 
Concordia Theological 
Seminary in Fort Wayne,

Heather felt the loan, possibly 
through the State Trust Fund, 
would be less of a burden to the 
taxpayers than increasing the 
tax levy by that much.

The proposed budget was 
approved on a 5-2 vote, with 
board members Perry Ankerson 
and Ruth Schmitt casting the 
dissenting votes.

Ankerson again stated his 
position that the board had not 
done enough to reduce 
spending. He read a portion of 
an article written last May, by 
Representative Mary Panzer, in 
which she stated there has been 
no correlation between the 
amount of money spent and the 
increased quality of education. 
Ankerson noted that the 
district’s increased spending 
had not resulted in any 
significant improvement in 
student test scores over the last 
few years.

"The often heard comment 
that 85% of the budget is fixed 
cost is a ‘cop-out’,” said 
Ankerson. "Seven members on

Indiana for two years before 
being assigned to a vicarage at 
a vacant congregation just south 
of Fresno, California. Com­
pleting the requirements for his 
Master of Divinity degree. 
Pastor Eckert was accepted as a 
candidate and ordained into the 
public ministry in 1986. He has 
served in the metropolitan 
Detroit area until accepting the 
call to St. John’s, New Fane. 
The Eckerts have been blessed 
with four children: Daniel (age 
7), Steven (turning 6 in July), 
Sandra (age 4), and Alan (age 
2).

A reception followed the 
service at the church school 
next door.

this board are responsible for 
this budget and no one else, and 
we should not blame it on the 
state for its mandates or anyone 
else.” Ankerson noted, it’s up 
to us (the board), if we truly 
believe in the budget we should 
support it and if we don’t, then 
it is up to us to vote it down.

Schmitt said she had no big 
problem with the budget other 
than the fact she felt strongly 
that the $200,000 should be a 
loan, rather than added to the 
budget.

Board member Ron Beimborn 
asked Heather, "If we say cut 
the budget, where in the 
vaguest terms would you 
recommend we cut?” Heather 
said, "Number one, you could 
cut the new language art books, 
that would represent $70,000. 
You could also cut all extra 
curricular activities including all 
sports, Odyssey of the Mind, 
choir and band, etc., that’s 
$167,000. And you could cut 
teachers overloads, that’s 
another $70,000. You could,” 
said Heather, "but I wouldn’t 
recommend it and I don’t think 
you would really want to do it.”

Along with the budget figures 
were four sheets of information 
on the tax levy itself. The total 
levy for the proposed budget, 
including the additional 
$200,000 and the debt service 
levy of $116,112, comes to 
$4,740,677.

The levy can and will be 
affected by a variety of factors, 
such as, will there or will there 
not be an increase in equalized 
valuation and if so, how much? 
Will the $200,000 be left in the 
budget or removed and 
approved separately in the loan 
format? And lastly, will the 
electors even approve the 
additional $200,000, or turn it 
down completely?

With all those variables 
involved, the levy could 
present an increase anywhere 
from 7.35% or $1.13 per $1,000 
to 15.56% or $2.39 per $1,000 of 
valuation.

The low hike would see the 
tax rate increase from the 1989- 
90 figure of $15.36 per $1,000 to 
$16.49 while on the high end, 
that increase could go up to 
$17.75 per $1,000.

On a $70,000 home, that 
could represent an increase 
anywhere from $79 to $168, 
depending upon which levy rate 
is finally adopted. Since he has 
not received any information on 
the district’s equalized 
valuation as yet, Heather said 
he could only speculate as to 
what the levy rate will be. 
Right now, it looks like we will 
be in the 12-14% range, he 
noted.

Huge Parade Sunday at Noon

Annual Firemen-Legion
Picnic Here July 6, 7, 8

Kewaskum’s annual Fire­
men-Legion picnic will take 
place in River Hill Park Friday 
and Saturday evenings and 
Sunday, July 6, 7 and 8.

This year the festivities begin 
on Friday night with the Larrys 
playing in the beer garden from 
8 to midnight. Saturday night 
will feature Class of ’62/Surf 
Boys from 8 to midnight in the 
beer garden. All rides, 
refreshments and games will be 
in operation.

Waterfights will begin at 5:30 
Saturday evening with many 
neighboring fire departments 
competing for the championship 
trophy.

On Sunday the mammoth 
parade will get underway at 12 
noon led by the Kewaskum 
High School Band. This 
legendary event features the 
Milwaukee Civic Riders 
Motorcycle Club, Tripoli Drum 
and Bugle Corps of Milwaukee, 
Marquis Drum and Bugle Corps 
of Fond du Lac, the Hartford 
City Band, and other musical 
units as well as the Princettes 
Baton Group of Kewaskum and 
the Middle School Color Guard.

The firemen and legion are 
asking parade participants to 
please refrain from throwing 
candy from the trucks or 
vehicles, due to the danger 
involved with the little children 
running out on the road to pick 
it up. If you wish to give candy 
to the children please have 
someone walk beside the float 
and hand the candy out to the 
children.

The mammoth parade will 
again feature many beautiful 
floats, dance bands, baton 
twirlers, novelty and military 
units, drill teams, children’s 
specialties, comic and clown 
entries, clubs and 
organizations, visiting fire 
departments, Legionnaires, 
antique cars, horses and riders, 
and much much more.

This years parade theme is: 
"The Gay Nineties." The 
parade will originate from the 
High School campus area and 
adjacent streets, and proceed 
from there to River Hill Park. 
All participants should be ready 
to line up no later than 11:30 
a.m. Many great prizes will be 
awarded for the best floats and 
children’s specialties.

Sunday afternoon entertain­

ment will feature continuous 
music from 1 to 6 by Spid Pieper 
and Hickory Wind in the beer 
garden and Ralph Buchel with 
Joey Klass in the north beer 
stand from 1 to 5.

Purchase tickets for 
numerous cash and 
merchandise prizes and be a 
winner. They will be on sale in 
the park. at some area 
businesses, and through any 
Fire Department or Region 
member.

Anyone interested in 
sponsoring units or bands, or 
donating money towards 
sponsoring units, please contact 
Bob Stoltzmann at 626-4503 or 
Bob Staebler at 626-2329.

Attend the Kewaskum picnic 
and enjoy a weekend of good 
food, games, and rides, live 
entertainment, and lots of good 
family fun.

AFS Student
Says Goodbye

Satoko Kamimura

Thank you very much. I had a 
great year. You are kind. I 
learned many things from you. 
In my first school day, I was 
surprised that student’s 
clothes. Some students put on 
short pants and accessories. In 
my Japanese high school, we 
can’t put on these. I had known 
about American student style, 
but when I saw them, I was 
shocked little. Then now, I put 
on earrings, rings and short 
pants.

I also think my opinion was 
changed. I am able to say 
myself, I like it here very much.

Thank you, my friends, 
teachers, 4-H, and my U.S.A, 
family. I will never forget you.

Satoko Kamimura
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Exchange Student

Jennifer Kissinger

Jennifer Kissinger, daughter 
of Karen and Thomas 
Kissinger, 369 Braatz Drive, 
Kewaskum, is one of 
approximately 50 students,

ages 15 to 19, from Wisconsin 
and Upper Michigan 
participating in this year’s 
Rotary International Summer 
Youth Exchange Program with 
eight European countries.

Jennifer left for England on 
June 20, where she will be 
hosted in four homes in the 
central and northern regions of 
that country. She will return 
on July 19 with one of her “host 
sisters,” Victoria Williams, of 
Stickney, England. Victoria will 
be spending the first portion of 
her four-week stay with the 
Kissinger family and the last 
part on tours with the Rotary 
Club.

The Kissingers would like to 
say a special “Thank You” to 
the West Bend Rotary 
Club/District 627 for providing 
this fantastic opportunity to 
their daughter.

For more information on the 
Student Exchange Program, 
please contact your local Rotary 
Club.

Pictured above is the Skoal Bandit Monster Truck which paid a visit to She- 
fond Mobil Mart in Kewaskum on Monday, June 18. Adults and youngsters 
alike delighted in checking out all the features of this giant pickup truck.

Hwy. 41 Designated Major Project If a kernel of popcorn were dropped on a neutron star, it would produce as much 
energy as a World War II atomic bomb.

The Wisconsin Department of 
Transportation is recommending 
that Highway 41 be treated as a 
major project and that the entire 
corridor, from Milwaukee to 
Abrams, be evaluated for the 
statewide ranking determining the 
level of funding, according to Sen. 
Carol Buettner (Oshkosh).

The recommendation that the 
129 miles become a freeway con­
version was made recently to the 
Transportation Projects Commis­
sion. The plan remains the same, 
but the difference is the source of 
funding.

“A major project designation-- 
places Hwy. 41 in the spotlight as 
it comes under close scrutiny at 
public hearings before the com­
mission. The level of public sup­
port or opposition will influence 
the governor and the legislature 
who will determine a level of fun­
ding following a department 
recommendation,” Buettner said.

Major projects are long-term 
solutions to the most serious 
needs on highly traveled 
segments of Wisconsin's highway 
system. All projects are 
thoroughly reviewed and ranked 
with other state highway improve­
ment projects.

“One of the reasons the depart­
ment is recommending this 
designation is because the Fox 
Valley is experiencing a surge of 
economic development activity,” 
Buettner said.

Highway 41 is included in the 
network of superior economic 
development highways contained 
in Corridors 2020, a strategic in­
vestment plan for the state 
transportation system. The pro­
posed timetable for freeway con­
version, if approved by the 
Legislature, would occur between 
1992 and 2000.

The Transportation Projects 
Commission has 15 members in­
cluding the Governor, three 
citizens appointed by the Gover­

nor, five Senators and five 
Representatives appointed by the 
Legislature, and the Wisconsin 
Department of Transportation 
Secretary as a non-voting 
member.

Bj births.......I
LEITHEISER - A son to 

Sandra and Tim Leitheiser, 
2300 W. Chestnut St., Apt. 1, 
West Bend, on June 28.

BOHLMAN — A daughter to 
Chris and Dean Bohlman, Route 
1, Campbellsport. Grand­
parents are Larry and Dorothy 
Bohlman of Eden and Cyril an 
Pat Serwe of Campbellsport. 
Great-grandparents are Eola 
Bohlman of Fond du Lac and 
Roland and Dorothy Comins of 
Campbellsport.

Remember the Statesman for all 
your advertising needs.

ALUMINUM 
CANS

On the first,third 
and fifth Saturdays

10 a.m. to 2 p.m.

SENTRY PARKING LOT 
Kewaskum Mall 

HAVE CAN CRUSHERS

2nd and 4th Tuesday 
10 a.m. to 1 p.m. 

STRAUB'S in Campbellsport

MARCOE S RECYCLING

TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport

533-8094
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Begins for Peace Church Members

Twenty-one members of Peace 
United Church of Christ in 
Kewaskum were commissioned 
on Sunday, July 1, for the fourth 
annual Habitat Work Week of 
the local church.

The group will be building a 
new house for Habitat for 
Humanity in Lexington, 
Kentucky, during the week of 
July 9-13. The group will leave 
Kewaskum at 5:00 a.m. 
Saturday, July 7 and return July 
14 by truck and vans.

At the commissioning 
dedication during the 9:30 a.m. 
church service, Rev. James 
Bettin noted the years of service 
volunteered by members of this 
year’s group. Richard Zarling, 
Brett Rauch, Marion Erdmann, 
Betty Bettin, and the pastor are 
all on their fourth year of work. 
Willard Gruhle, Robert 
Schreffler, Pat and Patrick 
McFadden, Mitchell Ogi, 
Jennifer Stelter, and Karen 
Kletti are three year volunteers. 
Ogi is Peace Church president 
at present. Mary Lou Stelter, 
Darlene and Wayland Tessar, 
Howard Zemlicka and Susan 
McFadden are two year 
veterans. Kim and Charles 
Petrie and Brett and Clark 
Pearson join the Kentucky trip 
for their first year of work. The 
“repeaters” are an example of 
what Millard and Linda Fuller 
refer to in their 1990 book, The 
Excitement is Building, as 
“infectious Habititis”!

The entire Peace Church 
congregation supports this 
venture with Lenten offerings, 
individual monetary sponsor­
ships, and encouraging love and 
prayers. The 1987 work project 
was new construction in 
Nashville, Tennessee, 1988 and 
1989 marked more rehabilita­
tion in Zanesville, Ohio. Rev. 
Bettin coordinates these 
ventures. Housing is arranged 
by the host work site Habitat 
committee. This year the Peace 
Church group will reside at 
Koinania House on the 
University of Kentucky campus 
at Lexington. The local group 
cooks and provides its own 
meals.

A monetary gift for building 
supplies will also be donated to 
the Lexington Habitat project

WISCONSIN 
LOTTERY

“I BOUGHT 
MY TICKET HERE!” 
Erwin Kamrath, Kewaskum 

Won $1,327 Instantly!

by Peace Church, and a tithe of 
this gift will be used for 
overseas Habitat building.

This sharing project is part of 
the program began in 1976 by 
Millard Fuller, Habitat for 
Humanity International 
founder. Fuller presented a 
speaking program at Peace 
Church in November, 1986. 
Together with Holy Trinity 
Catholic Church, Peace is also 
part of the Washington County 
Habitat project for Milwaukee 
rehabilitation work from 
Kewaskum. This program 
involves day work assignments 
on a commuter basis by parish 
members.

Peace Church to 
Hold Vacation
Bible School

“Journeys with Jesus” is the 
theme of Vacation Bible School 
at Peace United Church of 
Christ in Kewaskum. The 
community is invited to attend 
the classes for four-year-olds 
through 6th grade on July 23 - 
27. Vacation Bible School is in 
session from 9:30 a.m. to 12:00 
p.m. each day. The church is 
located at 343 1st Street.

Students will participate in 
Bible stories, art activities, 
music, service projects, 
recreation, and worship - all 
centered on five themes: 
“Journey with Jesus at the 
Synagogue - Sharing the Good 
News,” “Journey with Jesus to 
the City - Responding in Faith,” 
“Journey with Jesus by the Sea 
- Trusting in God,” “Journey 
with Jesus on the Road - 
Serving God and Others,” and 
“Journey with Jesus in the 
Country - Witnessing in New 
Places.” A special feature of 
the program is the Mission 
Expedition all-school center. 
This learning center offers 
many opportunities to explore 
other cultures and discover the 
work of Christians in many 
lands.

Journeys with Jesus is an 
exciting and important learning 
opportunity for children. It aims 
to provide a learner - centered,

fun-filled, and happy occasion 
for all who participate.

Registration for Vacation 
Bible School is now in progress. 
You can register or obtain 
additional information by 
visiting the church office 
between the hours of 8:30 a.m. 
and 12:00 p.m. or by calling 
626-4011.

Kewaskum Lottery 
Winner Listed

MADISON...The following 
area resident has recently 
claimed high-tier prize from the 
Wisconsin Lottery.

He is Erwin A. Kamrath, 
Kewaskum, who won $1,327.

The fellow on the crowded bus 
could stand it no longer. 
“Madam,” he began politely, 
“you are standing on my foot." 
Put your stupid foot where it 
belongs,” snapped the woman. 
“Don’t tempt me,” murmured 
the man, “don’t tempt me!”
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338-0201
Call for appointment

a a a a a a a olocated in the olde barton villager aannn ^

Shefond

626-4300
SELF/SERVE CONVENIENCE...

Designed With You In Mind

YS^
American Express, Discover, Visa 

Master Card and Mobil
. ..SAME AS CASH

THIS WEEK’S 
SANDWICH SPECIAL

Kitchen Fresh 

EGG SALAD & MED. 
FOUNTAIN SODA 

99c

AREA HIGH SCHOOL 
STUDENTS AWARDED

Area high school students 
were among those from 
throughout the state selected by 
the University of Wisconsin - 
Whitewater to receive 1990 
Awards for Excellence in 
Language Study. They 
included:

Kewaskum High: Michelle 
Lee Marx, German; Chris 
Ramthun, Spanish.

Each year, the UW-White- 
water Foreign Language 
Department honors outstanding 
foreign language students from 
various state high schools. Each 
student receives a certificate 
indicating the honor.

This award program was 
established by UW-Whitewater 
to recognize the importance of 
foreign language studies, as 
well as to honor those who excel 
in their respective language.

SJI^

Wisconsin House Woodworks
Featuring custom buill fine furniture, architectural woodwork 

and other handcrafted specialties1

Luxury is something you ought 
to get along without, but don’t. 
Necessity is something you 
cannot get along without, but 
do.

Divorced, Separated, 
Widow or Widower

YOU’RE 
WELCOME 

at

West Bend 
Church of God 

223 Paradise Dr.
West Bend 

“The Church with the 
Welcome You'll 
Never Forget’’

1720 Barton Ave. 
West Bend

□ 
D 
D 
□ 
□

Mart
Kewaskum

Any 12 pk.

PEPSI PRODUCT
$2.99 4

WISCONSIN 
LOTTERY

TICKETS 
SOLD HERE!
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The average car uses 1.6 
ounces of gas idling for 
one minute.

The above wedding photo was taken fifty years ago on June 
25, 1940. The bride and groom (center) are Anna Felix and 
Gilbert J. Reindl. Attendants from left are: bridesmaid Bernetta 
(Reindl) Bruessel, sister of the groom; maid of honor Rose Felix, 
sister of the bride; best man Allen Reindl, brother of the groom; 
and groomsman Kilian Felix, brother of the bride. Pictured in front 
are flower girl Janice Bruessel Thill, niece of the groom and ring 
bearer John Heiting, nephew of the bride.
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We Wish 
You a 

HAPPY 
BIRTHDAY 

on the 9th!

From Mary Ann, Junior, 
Donna, Shelly and Eddie

If You See 
This Girl 

On July I Oth 
Wish Her a

HAPPY 
50TH!
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David R. Bilgo Honored by

•vx Vietnam Veterans of America•/ r s. st.xv^fch<^ *tb *

This memory parade photo was taken around 1915. Notice the bunting on the 
business places, the flags strung across Main Street from the business places, and 
onlookers dressed in their Sunday best. Dorothy Breseman Photo

The Wisconsin State Council 
of Vietnam Veterans of America 
today announced that David R. 
Bilgo of West Bend has been 
named a recipient of the 1990 
“Outstanding achievement 
Award. Mr. Bilgo is a former 
Army Sgt. who served in 
Vietnam in 1969 and 1970. He 
has been the Executive Director 
of two different Big Brother/Big 
Sister agencies in Wisconsin, 
and has personally served as a 
Big Brother to five different 
boys. He has been active 
JayCee member, and a member 
of the Oshkosh Exchange Club 
for Civic service, as well as 
establishing a little league team 
for father-absent boys. He has 
served as a Volunteer in 
Prevention program for youth 
already a part of the Juvenile 
Justice System, and has been a 
guest lecturer at the

UW-Oshkosh in the areas of 
juvenile delinquency and self 
esteem as well as training 
student interns in social work 
and human services.

David Bilgo continues the 
tradition of service to nation and 
community that so many 
Vietnam Veterans take pride in.

The Wisconsin State Council 
of Vietnam Veterans of America 
initiated the Outstanding 
Achievement Award for 
Vietnam Veterans in 1987 to 
recognize the many 
contributions of Vietnam 
Veterans to their communities. 
Each year there are ten 
recipients of the Achievement 
Awards, with one of those 
selected at Vietnam Veteran of 
the Year. John Margowski of 
Waukesha is this year's 
Veteran of the Year.

No Simple Explanations for 
Erratic Weather, Says Expert

Record low temperatures in 
December, spring-like weather 
in January, and snow in May — 
the crazy weather may have 
many Wisconsinites wondering 
whether it’s nature’s idea of a 
practical joke or signs of global 
climate changes.

The answer to what’s causing 
this weather is not a simple one, 
says University of Wisconsin - 
Extension climatologist Pamela 
Naber, and it may be a while 
before we know for sure.

“Wisconsin’s climate is 
extremely variable,’’ says 
Naber. Part of the reason the 
erratic weather seems so 
extreme is because most people 
compare it to the nice weather 
that we’ve experienced in 
recent history, she says.

“Most people forget that the 
climate has been abnormal in 
that it’s been relatively constant 
since 1958,’’ says Naber. “They 
don’t look back to the 1930s 
when we had many years of 
drought and also the wettest 
year on record.”

While it’s unusual to have 
snowfall in May and record hot 
weather in the summer, it’s still 
within the realm of Wisconsin’s 
weather variability. It may be a 
while before we know for sure 
whether these extremes are 
caused by factors such as the 
greenhouse effect, she says.

“By the turn of the century 
we should have a much better 
feel for whether this is a trend 
that’s going to continue or if it’s 
just an aberration,” says 
Naber. She warns that it’s 
deceptive to draw conclusions 
from weather in a small 
geographical region or span of 
time.

“When you look at climate, 
you have to look globally,” 
explains Naber. “It’s not 
enough to look at just one 
place.”

Distant factors affect the 
weather in Wisconsin. For 
example, a warm ocean current 
that reaches the coast of Peru 
every three to five years sets off 
a chain reaction that sometimes 
makes Wisconsin weather 
warmer. Lots of volcanic activity 
causes the weather to be cooler 
because the soot and sulfuric 
acid droplets in the atmosphere 
reflect the sunlight back into 
space. Sunspot activity, which 
peaks in 11- or 22-year cycles, 
could cause climate to change 
because of the variable

radiation output. Variations in 
the Earth’s orbit also affect how 
much sunlight we receive.

In general, however, many 
scientists believe that global 
warming is taking place and 
that it may increase average 
global temperatures four 
degrees Fahrenheit within the 
next 100 years, according to 
Naber. The question is whether 
those changes have already 
started.

“I don’t think anyone can 
definitely say this is the 
greenhouse effect,” says 
Naber. “We only have 100 
years of records to compare (the 
recent weather) to, and climate 
can vary on a much longer scale 
than that.”

Of the five great lakes, only Lake Michigan is wholly in 
the U.S. The others are partly in Canada.

/ Beechwood
V Cheese

Cheese of 
The Month

MILD BRICK 
$1.79 lb. 

Regularly $2.10 lb.

Offer good on VA, 2 V? & 5 lb. packages 
JULY 1 TO JULY 31, 1990

Cheddar Curd Day
Saturday, July 7
Fresh, warm cheddar curd 

READY FOR SALE AT 12 NOON 

$2.05 io.

BARTOLI’S 
PRODUCE & GREENHOUSE 

Four miles north of Kewaskum on Hwy. V

Phone 533-4092
HOURS: Open Daily 9 to 8, Sat. & Sun. 9 to 5

•Flower & Vegetable Plants
Va OFF regular price

•All Trees & Shrubs 
15% OFF

•Hanging Baskets 
$5.00 OFF 

Regular Price

10 to 5 Daily ■ 9 to 5 Saturday ■ Closed Sunday 

BEECHWOOD 
CHEESE FACTORY 

N1598W Hwy. A - Route 1 - Adell, WI 53001 
Take Hwy. S to Beechwood, then North 2 blocks on Hwy. A 

PHONE 994-9306

★ KRAZY DAZE SPECIALS*
Peaches............................... 3 ibs. $1.00
Bananas....................................... /b. 35c
Mushrooms.............................. Ib. $1.39

PRICES GOOD MONDAY, JULY 9 ONLY 

REGISTER HERE FOR A 
BUSHEL OF FRUIT & VEGETABLES

NOW TAKING ORDERS FOR 
CANNING AND FREEZING 
FRUITS & VEGETABLES

In the Service
Airman Tony L. Carter has 

graduated from the U.S. Air 
Force inventory management 
course at Lowry Air Force Base, 
Colo.

During the course, students 
were taught property 
accounting, customer support, 
stock control and equipment 
management for a base supply 
system. They also were taught 
to inventory supplies using 
electronic data processing 
machines. The graduates 
earned credits toward an 
associate degree through the 
Community College of the Air 
Force.

Carter is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Norbert Carter of 5546 
Highway M, West Bend.

The airman is a 1989 
graduate of West Bend West 
High School.

Living Will, Power Of Attorney Health Care 
Forms Available

Living Will and Power of 
. Attorney for Health Care forms 
are available free of charge to 
persons who send self-address­
ed stamped business size 
envelopes to the following 
address: Living Will, Division of 
Health, P.O. Box 309, Madison, 
WI 53701-0309. Power of 
Attorney, Division of Health, 
P.O. Box 309, Madison, WI 
53701-0309.

Persons requesting forms 
may receive four copies of the 
Living Will or two copies of the 
Power of Attorney for Health 
Care. No telephone requests are 
accepted for these forms.

The largest painting now in existence is probably The 
Battle of Gettysburg, completed in 1883, after two and 
a half years of work, by Paul Philip teaux and 16 assist­
ants. The painting is 410 feet long, 70 feet high and 
weighs 11, 792 pounds.

The Living Will, also known 
as the “Declaration to 
Physicians,” is a form a person 
fills out to inform their doctor 
that in the event of a terminal 
illness or injury, life-sustaining 
procedures should be withheld 
or withdrawn so the person may 
be permitted to die naturally.

The Power of Attorney for 
Health Care is a form a person 
uses to assign a health care 
agent who would make 
decisions concerning health 
care should the person become 
physically or mentally 
incapacitated.
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Backhaus - Griggs

Elizabeth Robinson and Mark 
Berg were united in marriage 
on June 2, 1990 at Immanuel 
Lutheran Church in the Town of 
Scott during a 1:30 p.m. 
ceremony. The Rev. William 
Robinson officiated.

Parents of the couple are Rev. 
and Mrs. William Robinson, 
W8497 Brazelton Dr., Random 
Lake, and Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Berg, 9205 NE 11th St., 
Vancouver, WA.

Music was provided by 
organist Dr. John A. Behnke, 
violist Marie Buss, oboist Jeff 
Wilde, and soloists Jeff and 
Barb Wilde.

The bride chose Marlene 
Goedde of St. Cloud, MN, as 
her maid of honor and Sandra 
Sramek - Weyker of Waukesha

as her matron of honor. 
Bridesmaids in attendance were 
Cammy Anderson of Richfield, 
MN and Judy Berg of 
Vancouver, WA, both sisters of 
the groom. Junior bridesmaid 
was Sarah Oelrich of 
Marshfield, cousin of the bride.

The bride’s brother, Paul 
Robinson of St. Louis, MO, 
served as best man. 
Groomsmen included Jerry 
Berg of Huntington Beach, CA; 
Jeff Berg of Washougal, WA; 
and Tim Berg of WA: all 
brothers of the groom.

Ushering duties were shared 
by Joel Boyer of Fort Wayne, IN 
and Phil Ebert of Lebanon, IL.

A reception followed the 
service in the church basement 
and a wedding dinner was held

WASHINGTON COUNTY

at Boder’s on the River, 
Mequon.

The bride is a 1984 graduate 
of Random Lake High, and an 
’88 graduate of Concordia 
College, Mequon. She is 
employed as a teacher.

The groom is a 1979 graduate 
of Armstrong High School in 
Plymouth, MN; an '86 graduate 
of Concordia College in 
Portland, OR; and a 1990 
graduate of Concordia 
Theological Seminary. He 
works as a minister.

The couple enjoyed a 
honeymoon trip to Door County 
and are now residing at 2002D 
Redford Crt., Crawfordsville, 
IN.

The marriage vows of 
Marjean Backhaus and Andrew 
Robert Griggs were exchanged 
during a 2:00 p.m. ceremony on 
March 24, 1990 at St. Lucas 
Lutheran Church, Kewaskum. 
Pastor Edwin Fredrich 
officiated.

The bride is the daughter of 
Eugene and Marilyn Backhaus, 
Kewaskum. She was presented 
in marriage by her father to the 
son of Philip and Cynthia 
Griggs, Collinsville, 
Connecticut.

The maid of honor was Mary 
Ellen Regan of Rhode Island, 
friend of the bride, and the 
matron of honor was Debra 
Backhaus, Kewaskum, sister- 
in-law of the bride. Bridesmaids 
included Michelle Dale, 
Milwaukee, friend of the bride, 
Alisa Griggs, Collinsville, CT,

by Edward Griggs, brother of 
the groom, and Charles Griggs, 
cousin of the groom.

Following the ceremony, a 
reception, dinner and dance 
was held at The West Bend 
Hotel, West Bend.

The bride is a graduate of 
Kewaskum High School and 
UW-LaCrosse. She is currently 
attending UW-Milwaukee 
pursuing a Master’s in Health 
Service Administration and is 
the Director of Activities at 
Beverly Terrace Nursing Home, 
Watertown, WI

The groom is an attorney with 
Niemann, Ullsvik, Neuberger & 
Lorenz of Watertown. He is a 
graduate of Avon Old Farms 
School, Avon, CT, Bates 
College, Lewiston, Maine and 
Marquette University Law 
School.

VETERANS' SERVICE OFFICE
RICHARD W. BAKER SERVICE OFFICER

and Carolyn Griggs, W. 
Hartford, CT, both sisters of the 
groorh. Tiffany Laubach, 
Kewaskum, godchild of the

After a honeymoon in Hawaii, 
the couple is residing in 
Watertown, WI.

Veterans Can Qualify for WDVA Loans
Beginning July 1, eligible 

veterans and their spouses may 
have a combined annual income 
of up to $39,000.00 and still 
qualify for Wisconsin 
Department of Veterans 
Affairs’ (WDVA) home loans 
with an 8.25 percent interest 
rate.

Previously, to be eligible for 
WDVA home loans, the 
combined, regular annual 
income of the veterans and 
spouse could not exceed 
$36,500.00.

WDHA housing loans can be 
used for purchasing an existing 
home, building a new home or 
making home improvements.

This loan program has many 
advantages including an 8.25 
percent interest rate, no

requirement for private 
mortgage insurance or loan 
guarantee, no discount points, 
no prepayment penalty, no limit 
on assets retained.

WDVA also offers a home 
improvement loan. Veterans 
may borrow from $3,000.00 to 
$15,000.00 with a repayment 
term of 15 years. The home 
improvement loan can be used 
for alterations, repairs or 
improvements that increase the 
livability or energy efficiency of 
the veteran’s principal 
residence.

Down payments for WDVA 
morgages to purchase or build 
homes are 5 percent of the total 
cost. For a home improvement 
loan, the owner’s equity, if it’s 
at least 10 percent, may be

substituted for 
payment.

There are no 
maximum down

the down

limits on 
payment

primary mortgage loans 
home improvement loans.

the 
for 

and

For more information or to 
get a WDVA certificate of 
eligibility, contact Richard W.
Baker, 
Service

County 
Officer

Veterans’ 
at the

Courthouse, phone 338-4457.
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Family Hair Salon 
227 Main St., Kewaskum 

626*2650

EYE BROW ARCHING ^

bride was the junior brides­
maid.

Mark Lynch of Miami Lakes, 
FL, friend of the groom, served 
as the best man. Groomsmen 
included Dennis Backhaus, 
Kewaskum, brother of the 
bride, Daniel Blank, Superior, 
WI, Russel London, 
Wethersfield, CT, and Charles 
Baldwin, Boston, MA, all 
friends of the groom.

Ushering duties were shared

Marriage Licenses
Mary B. Tibbs, Kewaskum, 

and Dennis L. Westerman, 
Kewaskum. Wedding June 29.

Judy A. Markiewicz, Town of 
Farmington, and Paul C. 
Seeker, Town of Farmington. 
Wedding June 27.

Sandra A. Schilk, Kewaskum, 
and John W. Remmel, 
Kewaskum. Wedding July 7.

“Take the first । 
step to better 
hearing today.”

^o^tor>e ^ My two ^ny Beltone Petite hearing aids | I enabled me to hear and understand every ■
word my friends and family wanted me to hear. Now we can |I relax and enjoy each others’ company again. Find out if Beltone . 
can help you too. Call today to schedule a free hearing evaluation.!

Bring this coupon in for a FREE hearing test ■

(^1990 Beltone Electronic* Corporation

KENNELLY PHARMACY
927 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum

Phone: 626-8001
Expires 7/31/90

Printed in US A
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On Saturday, June 9, members of the Kewaskum 
Historical Society went to visit the Waupun Historical 
Society. After a tour of the museum, they were treated 
to desserts and punch. A great time was had by all. 
Hosts for the day were Mrs. Nagel, Mrs. Drummy, Max­
ine White and Mable Carlson.

Badger Cash Game 
Unveiled at Summerfest

MILWAUKEE - Wisconsin 
Lottery Executive Director 
William F. Flynn, Jr. 
introduced the Lottery’s third 
pull-tab game, BADGER CASH 
at a news conference at 
Milwaukee’s Summerfest 
Monday, July 2.

BADGER CASH is the first 
Wisconsin Lottery game to use 
winning combinations of state 
symbols to pay prizes ranging 
from $25 to 50 cents.

BADGER CASH, being 
delivered to nearly 2,000 
Wisconsin Lottery retailer 
locations this week, joins 
WISCONSIN RED and the 
RED, WHITE & BLUE game as 
games for Wisconsin Lottery 
pull-tab players.

“BADGER CASH is going to 
be a strong seller. The 
Wisconsin Lottery sells more 
pull-tab tickets per year than 
any other Lottery in the nation 
and has sold about 100 million 
pull-tab tickets since we first 
put them on sale in 1988.

“Players will have fun trying 
to match state symbols such as 
badgers, holstein cows, 
muskies, robins, and violets to 
win prizes.

“Not only do Wisconsin 
residents love the Badger State, 
tourists from Illinois, Iowa, 
Minnesota, Michigan, and the 
rest of the country love 
Wisconsin as well. I think this 
game will really be popular with 
the millions of tourists we 
welcome each year, because, in 
some cases, I expect these 
tickets will be kept as 
souvenirs!” Flynn said.

Campus Notes
OSHKOSH - University of 

Wisconsin - Oshkosh officials 
have announced the names of 
students who qualified for the 
university’s Dean’s List and 
Honor Roll in the 1989-90 spring 
semester.

To qualify for the Honor Roll, 
students must take at least 12 
credits and earn a grade point 
average of at least 3.3 (out of a 
possible 4.0, or “straight A”).

Those with a grade point 
average of 3.75 or higher 
qualify for the Dean’s List.

Area students included:
KEWASKUM - Denise M. 

Gruber, 227 2 St. Box 348, 
(Dean’s List — straight ‘A’); 
John S. Markus, 8343 Kettle­
view Dr., (Dean’s List - Straight 
‘A’); Timothy J. Rohlinger, 
1255 Brooklane Dr., (Dean’s 
List - Straight ‘A’); Christine A. 
Bodden, 1246 Meadow Ln.; 
Michele Stoffel, 4595 Hwy. 
28W.

CAMPBELLSPORT - Jeanie 
K. Benson, 411 Lakeview Rd., 
(Dean’s List — Straight *A’); 
Joann Giese, 325 N. Railroad 
St., (Dean's List - Straight ‘A’); 
Jim K. Kertscher, 2049 Vista 
Dr., (Dean’s List - Straight ‘A’); 
Carol J. Lackas, 272 Forest St., 
(Dean’s List — Straight ‘A’); 
Kristine A. Flood, 2738 Scenic 
Rd., (Dean’s List); Jeanne M. 
Koenig, 2579 Hwy. F, (Dean’s 
List); Amy L. Lackas, 272 Forest 
St., (Dean’s List); Sherri A. 
Batzler, Rt. 2, 690 Hwy. VS, 
Lana M. Beisbier, 703 Hwy. 45, 
Rachelle L. Ketter, 517 S. Elm 
St., Troy A. Ketter, 517 S Elm, 
Stacy L. Oppermann, 1113 
Hwy. G, Robyn A. Serwe. 403 
E. Main St., Stephen J. Volz, 
318 S. Fond du Lac Ave.

Alzheimer’s Support 
Group to Meet July 11

♦The Alzheimer’s and Related 
Disorders Support Group will 
hold its next meeting on 
Wednesday, July 11 from 1:00 - 
3:00 p.m. at the Cedar Lake 
Home Campus, 5595 Hwy. Z, 
West Bend.

This meeting is the Support 
Group’s annual picnic when 
participants have a fun and 
relaxing time at the beautiful

Cedar Lake Home Campus and 
enjoy the beauty of Big Cedar 
Lake.

The support group invites 
community caregivers and other 
interested individuals to 
participate in its monthly 
meetings. It meets the second 
Wednesday of the month.

The support group strives to 
better understand the nature of 
Alzheimer's Disease and

related disorders through 
sharing of concerns, 
educational programs and 
learning to care for the 
caregiver. Topics are of interest 
for anyone who knows someone 
who is becoming more forgetful 
or disoriented.

Advance registration is not 
required. For more information, 
call the Cedar Lake Home 
Campus at 334-9487.

«^»« • --*«. «-w^ •^r^t 'tm -rm 'rr^ '.rS



Holland Festival 
At Cedar Grove

Since its 100th birthday in 
1947, the Dutch Village of Cedar 
Grove has celebrated its heritage 
with a Holland Festival at the end 
of July, complete with costumed 
dancers, wooden shoes and 
street scrubbing.

Colorful dancers from the 
“Kinder Klossers” to the older 
“Stage and Street Dancers” per­
form after the street scrubbing 
event held on both days. The 
Festival is then declared open by 
the Burgemeester and the Town 
Crier.

On Friday, several events have 
been planned to highlight the day, 
starting with bus tours in the mor­
ning. You can feast on the 
World’s Largest Worstebroodje; 
enjoy several musical groups per­
forming at the bandshell in the 
park or see the “Reflections of 
Holland,’’ a slide show 
presentation.

For four evenings, starting on 
Wednesday, July 25, the musical 
“Fiddler on the Roof” will be 
presented by the Holland Festival 
Players. The play will begin at 7 
p.m. Wednesday through Friday 
and at 5 p.m. on Saturday.

On Saturday the day will begin 
with the Holland Festival Run and 
Walk held at Independence Park. 
The run features a 2 and 6.2 mile 
race starting at 8:30 a.m. There 
will be the Holland Festival “Art 
Fair on the Green” which features 
talented artists and craftsmen 
from Wisconsin and the Midwest. 
The Art show begins at 9 a.m. ad­
jacent to Memorial Park. There 
will also be a flea market located 
adjacent to the park. Saturday 
afternoon will feature a large 
parade, preceded by street scrub­
bing and dancing.

A variety of ethnic foods will be 
available while musicians and 
bands perform throughout the day 
and evening in Memorial Park. 
While enjoying the music you can 
watch the Klopenhouwer carve a 
pair of wooden shoes or walk a 
block to the “Het Museum” and 
step into the past by seeing a col­
lection of memorabilia and early 
household and commercial 
artifacts.

WEST BEND 
CINEMA 

Phone 334-5466

HELD OVER!

DAYS OF 
THUNDER

Rated PG-13

Evenings at 6:45 & 9 
Sunday Matinees at 2 & 4:15

Come and see 
Slinger Speedway’s 

SCOTTY EIFLER 
with his late model 

1990 Lumina car #15
Bring your camera and 
take your picture with 

Scotty and his car! 
Scotty will be at the 
West Bend Cinema 

July 6 - 6 to 9 p.m. only

HELD OVER!

DICK TRACY
Rated PG

Evening* at 7 & 9:15 
Sunday Matinees at 2:15 & 4:30

GIFT CERTIFICATES 
ARE AVAILABLE!

Pressure Canning 
Testing Clinics

The canning season is again 
upon us here in Washington 
County, and whether you are an 
avid canner or a beginner, the 
time is now to check your gauge 
for safety and accuracy. Quality 
of the finished product (low-acid
fruits, meats, vegetables, « 
poultry, fish and other non-acid 2 
foods) depends on the condition 
of the pressure canner used for 
processing.

Pressure canner dial gauges 
should be checked each year. 
However, canners should be 
tested more if (1) you do a lot of 
canning, (2) the lid has been 
dropped or submerged in water, 
(3) the gauge glass is cracked, 
or (4) if any parts are rusty. In 
addition, gauges should be 
replaced if they are more than 
3-4 pounds “off.”

Replacement of rubber or 
combination gasket seals may 
be necessary if they have dried 
or shrunk. This causes an 
incomplete seal and allows 
steam to escape. Metal-to- 
Metal seals should be kept free 
or rust and corrosion by 
polishing with a non-abrasive 
cleaner and coating with a thin 
layer of petroleum jelly. Lime 
deposits can be removed from 
safety valves by using a pipe 
cleaner and vinegar. These 
areas, kept clean and dry, will 
enhance the performance of the 
canner and maintain the safety 
of the product.

The Washington County 
Extension Office is offering 
Pressure Canner Testing and 
Inspection to ensure safety and 
performance for hours of 
healthful canning this summer. 
Melanie Yager, Summer Home 
Economist, will be available at 
the following times to test 
gauges and answer questions. 
Bring your canner lid and gauge 
to one of the three locations.

Friday, July 13 — 9:00 a.m. - 
11:45 a.m. — UW Extension 
Office, Room 235, 432 E. 
Washington St., West Bend, 
WI.

Saturday, July 14, 9:30 a.m. - 
11:30 a.m. — Schmidt True 
Value Hardware, 2945 Hwy. 83, 
Hartford, WI

Thursday, July 19, 9:30 a.m. - 
11:30 a.m. — Rooney’s Jack & 
Jill’s Supermarket, N112 
W15800 Mequon Rd.,

AMERAHN 
Bar & Hall

Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum

Friday, July 6 - 8:30 to 12:3O 

TOM KNIESS ORCHESTRA 
From Wausau

Sunday, July 8 - 2 to 6 p.m. 

BOB KUETHER 
• Big Band •

Sunday, July 15 - 2 to 6 p.m.

HOWARD SCHNEIDER
Sunday, July 22 - 2 to 6 p.m. 

THE LITTLE PEOPLE
PHONE 626-4031

Germantown, WI.
If these dates and times are 

not convenient, pressure canner 
gauges can be tested at the 
UW-Extension Office. Bring 
your canner in one day and pick 
it up the following day after 1:00

Megan Pintens, Heather 
Reineck, Grant Rondorf, Mary 
Sheehy, Anna Stellmacher, 
Katie Weichsel and Katherine
Yahr.

Stern Family 
Reunion July 15

The 6th reunion of the Stern 
family will be held at River Hills 
Park in Kewaskum on Sunday, 
July 15th. The event will begin 
with a picnic type luncheon at 
12:00 noon.

All decendants of Gottlieb 
and Fredricke Stern are invited 
and urged to attend.

The noon meal will be 
followed by an afternoon of live 
music, games for young and 
old, as well as a time for 
visiting, reminiscing and 
looking over any old photos you 
care to share with us.

Those planning to attend are 
asked to bring their own 
dinnerware, sandwiches and 
refreshments as well as a dish 
or dessert to pass. Coffee will 
be provided.

Additional information may 
be obtained by contacting any 
committee member. Members 
are: Dolores Petry 251-1590, 
Leona Stanowsky 377-5228, 
Grace Maciejewski 677-3230, 
Gerald Stern 893-8783, Iona 
Ebert 533-4953.

Two years have passed since 
last we’ve met. Let’s make this 
reunion our greatest yet!

p.m.
If you have any questions or 

would like information on 
pressure canning or canners, 
call 338-4479, 644-5204, or 342- 
2929.

Participating in 
Children's Theatre 
Workshop at UWWC

Twenty-one children, ages 7 
through 12, are participating in 
the fifth annual Children’s 
Theatre Workshop at the 
University of Wisconsin Center 
— Washington County, West 
Bend.

Workshop activities began 
May 12 and run through July 
12. Participants are currently 
working on three summer 
productions during Monday 
through Thursday morning 
sessions.

Climax of the children’s 
season will be 2:30 p.m. 
matinees, on Saturday July 14 
and July 21. Every child will be 
involved in the productions. 
This summer’s productions 
include a presentation-style 
musical, “Kiddledywinks,” 
which deals with the trials of 
childhood. Also included is a 
rip-roaring Western 
melodrama, “Cactus Wildcat" 
and a children’s play “How the 
Camel Got His Hump,” based 
on a story by Richard Kipling.

Matinee tickets cost $2 and 
may be purchased at the door or 
in advance at UWWC, 
335-5208. The public is invited.

The workshop is co-spon- 
’ sored by Theatre on the Hill and 

the UW Extension continuing 
education program at UWWC.

1 Workshop members, by 
communities are: Cedarburg - 

l> Janet Swanson; Hartford
Jenny Bodien; Kewaskum - 
Katie Survis; Newburg 

e Graham Killeen; West Bend - 
’ Adam Berndes, Brenna Biron, 

Lauren Daley, Kenny 
' Dickmann, Carrie Haug, 

Christopher Haug, Bob 
Hemauer, Elizabeth Kelln, 

’’ Jenny Klahn, Jill Pintens,

533-84451 mi. west of Dundee on Hwy. F

Closed Monday and Tuesday

SUPPER CLUB
Hwy. G in St. Cloud

FRANK’S ON THE LAKE
SUNDAY BRUNCH

11 a m. to 2 p.m. - Regular Menu 2 to 9 p.m.
SATURDAY-4 30 to 10

FRIDAY SEAFOOD BUFFET- $6.95 - 4:30 to 10 pm 
Fish Frys and Full Menu

THURSDAY SHRIMP BOIL - $8.50
ALL YOU CAN EAT 

WEDNESDAY SMELT OR CHICKEN PLATE 
$4.50 (Salad Bar Included)

PRIME RIB DINNER 
$6.95 at all times

Dave and Brenda’s
IDLEWILE INN

Chef David Panko 
Formerly of the 

Bar-N-Annex and White Tail Inn 
is featuring all his 

well known specialties

including 
bar-h-que ribs and 
Cajun foods, as well 
as chicken, seafood 
and steaks.

FRIDAY FISH FRY 
and SATURDAY

HOUSE SPECIAL 
...PRIME RIB!

*Salad Bar Included with All Dinners*

BAR OPENS AT 4 P.M.
KITCHEN HOURS: Mon., Weds., Thurs. 5 to 10 p.m. 

Fri. & Sat. 5 to 11 p.m.; Sunday 11 to 2 and 5 to 8:30 p m
CLOSED TUESDAYS

Reservations Appreciated
PHONE 999-4404

Jaeger Family 
Reunion in August

The Jaeger Family Reunion 
will be held at the Ashford 
Town Hall on Hwy. 67, on 
Sunday, Aug. 19th.

It is the descendents of 
Bartholomew Jeager who 
settled in the town of Ashford in 
1850.

Registration is at noon. Plan 
on eating around 1:30 p.m. 
Please bring a dish to pass, your 
own plates, utensils, cups and 
lawn chair. Bring any family 
memorabilia you would like to 
share.

If coming please call 533-4470 
after 4:30.

An average of 150 tornados hit 
the United States each year.
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TURNER HALL
Fillmore

Choice dates available
AMPLE PARKING 

692-2597 
If no answer 692-2767

"Catering Available

CORN GAME 
& RAFFLE

Every Third Wednesday
7 p.m.

and SUNDAY BRUNCH
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Announce KHS 
Honor Roll

The Kewaskum Community 
High School honor roll for the 
fourth quarter, 1989-1990 school 
year has been announced.

Honor roll 3.001 to 4.000 grade 
point average.

4.000 Students
FRESHMEN — Nicole Cayner, Car­

rie Fellenz, Julie Mertz, Daniel 
Schulteis, Jenefer Van Assche.

SOPHOMORES — Teresa Ander­
son, Rachel Gosa, Stacey Pampenn, 
Jennifer Schinker, Tamara Schmidt.

JUNIORS — Brenda Behling, Amy 
Chesak, Nicole Gaffke, Stacy Kode, 
Matthew Kuehn, Melissa Miller, Amy 
Redig, Kelly Sarauer, Joseph Steier, 
Tammy Troeller, Laura Vogt, Chris­
tian Wunsch.

SENIORS — Sandra Harmon. Vicki 
Kurth. Michelle Marx, Christine Ram- 
thun, Kristina Schinker. Brian Sharpee. 
Tina Weddig, April Wulff.

3.500 - 3.999

FRESHMEN — Kate Berres, Karyn 
Dossinger. Amy Justman. Shiela Mar­
tin, Andrea Pascavis, Jennifer Pesch. 
Andrew Reichert. Aaron Rettler, James 
Rix, Marty Schlice, Yvonne Schlice.

SOPHOMORES - Ryan Amerling. 
Jennifer Beimborn, Jennifer Brigham. 
Shawn Erdmann, Karen Junk, Melissa 
Kuechler, Kim Marx, Nancy 
Neumann, Kimberly Petrie, Adam 
Pilachowski, Jessica Rohrer, Tracy 
Ruplinger, Angela Schiller, Tricia 
Schultz. Dan Staehler. Theresa Vogt

JUNIORS — Patti Aupperle. Stacey 
Betts, Steven Bodden. Angela Brath. 
James Dionne. Brian Dobke, Nicole 
Doherty. Brenda Falk. Pamela Gauger. 
Scott Hass, Erin Hein. Traci Hoerig. 
Gregory Holl. Kari Krueger. Heather 
Kulcinski. Jeffrey Landvatter, Kelly 
Rohlinger. John Schmidt. Ira Sison. 
Laura Strancke, Jason Thull, Rachelle 
Zuehlke.

SENIORS — James Coulter. Karen 
Felix. Steven Gerhartz. Bernd Gusinde. 
John Hazieuixid. Shelly Hug. Dawn 
Jandre. Pam Johann. Satoko 
Kamimura. Shelley Kasseckert. David 
Kuphal. Carla Lemke. Becky Manthei, 
Willa Marshall. Dana Neuser. Amy 
Quinlan. Donald Ritchie. Judith 
Schluep. Christopher Schmid. Jessica 
Schmidt. Michelle Schuster, Jodi 
Struck. Melissa Webber. Leeann 
Winninghoff.

3.001 - 3.499

FRESHMEN — Jennifer Gundrum. 
Chad Harlow. Rachel Howel). Beth 
Kempf. Timothy Lettow. Patrick 
McFadden. Staci Petushek. Kerry 
Resch, Kim Sabish. Chris Schmidt. 
Lynn Seii, Debra Steger. Jennifer 
Thull. Jean Turner. Shelly Wenninger

SOPHOMORES - Scott Backhaus. 
Tina Bath, James Becker. Keith 
Butschlick. Leila Byers. Jennifer 
Campbell, Kevin Gundrum, Sherry 
Hass, Stacey Heberer, Dina Heckel. 
Jason Jagielski. Amie Kirmse. Thadeus 
Koontz, Aimee Marshall. Garett 
Mielkie. Dean Moebius. Jason Noren. 
Sara Nysse. Sheldon Oppermann. Scott 
Paulson. Stephanie Reindl. Brian 
Staehler. Michael Stopar. Christopher 
Trapp. Andrea Waala. Scott Wiesner.

JUNIORS — Curtis Ammel. Ingrid 
Ankerson, Amy Baron, Kelly Berres. 
Traci Bindrich. Brent Boegel. Angie 
Clements, Jenny Degnitz, Melissa 
Ebert. Janel Flynn. Tania Friedel. Terri 
Grahl, Rebecca Hammes. Wanda 
Jacobs, Lynn Johann. Brenda Klahn. 
Phillip Lettow, Stacey Port. Rebecca 
Reysen, Tracey Steinert. Marlene 
Wodsedalek.

SENIORS — Curtis Arndt. Kevin 
Bartelt, Paul Becker, Timothy 
Butschlick. Andrea Fliess. Kenneth 
Krause. Laura Landvatter, Kristi 
Lubahn, Dale Mauritz. Michael 
Melzer, Eva Nowak, Timothy 
Oelhafen, Jenny Oneska. Cornia 
Oresnik. Michael Pascavis. Jill Peter­
son, Debra Remmel. Randy Romaine. 
Michael Ruplinger. Rebecca Schlosser. 
Stacey Schmitt. David Schulz. Tricia 
Schwartz. Nathalie Stercq. Kimberly 
Stielow. Bruce Theusch

KMLHS Announces 
Honor Roll

Kettle Moraine Lutheran High School, 
Jackson, announces its honor roll for the 
fourth quarter and second semester of the 
1989-90 school year.

SECOND SEMESTER 
High Honors (3.6 - 4.0)

GRADE 12
Ruth Biedenbender. Daniel Egelseeer, 

Michael Gehl, Michael Hinds. Jason Jobs, 
Ramona Johne, Scott Mund. Kimberly 
Pruess, Rachel Schmidt, Carrie Schmiege. 
Dawn Zarling.

GRADE 11
Travis Breitkreutz. Ginger Egelseer. 

Jeremy Ferch, Kevin Hahm, Todd 
Oestreich, Jennifer Piippo, Kellane R'lbin- 
son. Ted Schmidt, Gretchen Thiesfeldt.

GRADE 10
Robin Bechler, Lori Francis, Kristin 

Hahm, Debra Keller. Mark Pieper, Rachel 
Schmiege, Jennifer Schramm, Tracy 
Siikarla, Jon Wirkkula.

GRADE 9
Joel Heckendorf, Kristen Kieselhorst, 

Scott Lisko, Uriah Monday, Michelle 
Oestreich, Lisa Scheunemann, Stephanie 
Traska. Rebecca Walther.

Honors (3.3 • 3.59)
GRADE 12

Jana Bechler. Tamara Behling. Danielle

Brazee. Paul Haferman. Jeremy Juern. 
Kimberly Kurth. Amy Neuwirth. John 
Pamperin, Michael Schulz, John Thar- 
man, Beth Winkelmann, Melissa Ziebell

GRADE 11
Sharon Dobberphul, Jakob Erlandsson, 

Mary Grulke, Heidi Krenek, Marc 
Krewald, Rachel Nommensen. Kimberly 
Yahr.

GRADE 10
Scott Braemer. Tara Breitkreutz. Debra 

Ciriacks, John Collins, Eric Derge. An­
drew Fenske, Anna Graf, Lana Pamperin, 
Robin Pratt. Allen Schiller. Matthew 
Schmidt. Jennifer Schnorenberg. Laura 
Schulz. Valerie Teague.

GRADE 9
Richard Fischer. Christin Oppermann. 

Wendy Oppitz. Amanda Radloff. Janette 
Schramm. Johnold Strey, Benjamin 
Washbum. Christy Wilm. Travis Wolter

FOURTH QUARTER
High Honors (3.6 ■ 4.0)

GRADE 12
Ruth Biedenbender. Daniel Egelseer. 

Michael Gehl, Michael Hinds, Jason Jobs. 
Ramona Johne. Scott Mund. Rachel 
Schmidt. Carrie Schmiege, Dawn Zarling

GRADE 11
Travis Breitkreutz, Ginger Egelseer. 

Jeremy Ferch. Kevin Hahm. Todd 
Oestreich. Jennifer Piippo. Kellane Robin­
son. Ted Schmidt, Gretchen Thiesfeldt

GRADE 10
Robin Bechler. John Collins. Lori Fran-

cis. Kristin Hahm. Mark Pieper. Allen 
Schiller. Rachel Schmiege. Tracy Siikarla. 
Jon Wirkkula.

GRADE 9
Joel Heckendorf. Kristen Kieselhorst. 

Scott Lisko, Uriah Monday, Michelle 
Oestreich. Lisa Scheunemann. Stephanie 
Traska. Rebecca Walther.

Honors (3.3 ■ 3.59)
GRADE 12

Jana Bechler. Jeremy Juern. Kimberly 
Pruess.

GRADE II
Sharon Dobberphul. Jakob Erlandsson. 

Daniel Fritz. Mary Grulke. Heidi Krenek. 
Marc Krewald. Monica Laubenstein. 
Rachel Nommensen. Kimberly Yahr.

GRADE 10
Scott Braemer. Tara Breitkreutz. Debra 

Ciriacks, Eric Derge. Andrew Fenske. 
Courtney Hahm. Nathan Kaschner. Debra 
Keller, Lana Pamperin, Robin Pratt. Kay 
Prichard, Matthew Schmidt. Jennifer 
Schnorenberg. Jennifer Schramm.

GRADE 9
Christin Oppermann. Wendy Oppitz, 

Rebecca Przybyla. Janette Schramm. 
Johnold Strey, Benjamin Washburn.

No, I’m not looking for work, 
but 1 would like a job!

BUNKELMAN INFANT 
BAPTIZED SUNDAY

The infant son of Lowell and 
Lisa Bunkelman was baptized 
Sunday afternoon, July 1 at 
Holy Trinity Church, Kewas­
kum by Father Tom Veene. He 
received the name Michael 
Lowe and his sponsors were 
Jane Halfmann proxy for 
Richard Halfmann of 
Campbellsport and Jan Bartelt 
of Kewaskum. The guests were 
entertained at the Bunkelman 
home for the occasion.

■

■

At Wisconsin Electric, we 
don’t take saving energy lightly.

From April 1 through 
December 31,1990, we’ll help 
lighten your load when you pay your 
electric bill.

We’ll give you up to $650 
in rebates when you buy a new 
energy-efficient refrigerator,
freezer, electric water heater or 
home lighting.

See your dealer for qualify ing 
models, or call the Smart Money 
Energy Line at 221-4800. Outside 
the Milwaukee area, call toll-free 
at 1-800-922-6253.

You’ll agree. The prospects for 
savings have never been brighter.

Wisconsin 
Electric 
POWER COMPANY

Call 221-4800. Outside Milwaukee,1-800-922-6253.
You can also save with Smart Money for Business.
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HERE COMES THE SUN: 
With Sunscreen, It’s All Right

Bv Marc Kennedy, UW-Madison Center for Health Sciences

It’s summer. Time to relax, go 
to the pool or beach and catch 
some rays. And to achieve the 
desired bronze hue as soon as 
possible, many sun-worshippers 
will baste themselves with tann­
ing oil and skip the sunscreen, an 
oversight that is not only un­
necessary, but also potentially 
deadly.

“There’s a common fallacy that 
you won’t tan if you wear a 
sunscreen. This just is not true,’’ 
says Dr. Derek Cripps, a der­
matologist at the University of 
Wisconsin Hospital and Clinics 
and a UW Medical School pro­
fessor of dermatology. 
“Sunscreen blocks out the 
‘ultraviolet B' rays of the sun, 
those that cause skin cancer, 
You’ll still tan; it will just take 
longer — a week or so rather than 
a few days. But this is a small 
sacrifice considering what’s at 
stake.”

Dermatologists directly relate 
the steady increase in skin cancer 
during the last half century to in­
creased outdoor leisure activity by 
Americans, including sunbathing. 
Also during these years, 
swimwear has shrunk, causing 
cases of skin cancer in areas rare­
ly exposed to the sun before the 
advent of string bikinis and racing 
suits. There is also some 
evidence that a depleted ozone 
layer may be allowing more ultra­
violet rays to reach the earth.

“Using sunblock with a sun 
protection factor (SBF) no lower 
than 15, most people will tan 
without burning or increasing risk 
of developing skin cancer,” says 
Cripps, who developed the SPF 
rating system for the Food and 
Drug Administration.

Nonetheless, Cripps admits it’s 
difficult sometimes to convince 
people to use sunblock, as 
evidenced by statistics showing 
that all types of skin cancer — in­
cluding malignant melanoma, its 
deadliest form — are rising. In the 
1960s, the chances of developing 
skin cancer were one in 180. To­
day, the risk is one in 135, and it’s 
projected to increase to one in 
100 by the year 2000

Since sun exposure is the 
leading cause of skin cancer, the 
American Academy of Der­
matologists is urging people who 
play, swim or work outdoors to 
properly protect themselves from 
skin damage. Guidelines include:

'Avoid the sun’s rays during 
midday when they’re strongest;

•Cover up with lightweight 
clothing, such as long-sleeved 
shirts and pants, and wear a 
brimmed hat to protect your face 
and ears;

‘Wear sunscreen, even on 
cloudy days, and reapply it 
often, especially when in the 
water or perspiring.

“People with dark hair, eyes 
and skin can use SPF 15, but 
those with a lighter complexion

Specializing in New Lawn Construction 

Bob Koenig Landscaping 
2579 Hwy F. Campbellsport, Wl 53083 

477-7322 
Grading - Seeding - Sodding - Edging 
Straw Mulching - Decorative Stone

Residential Er Commercial 
Careful 

Conscientious 
Reasonable

Excerpt from 
‘Menagerie ’
QUIET AS A MOUSE

I always wanted to be loud; 
maybe not a hollering big 
mouth, but just a little louder. 
Every time I try to state my 
opinion to a class or even just a 
friend, my tongue gets twisted, 
my hands clam -up, and I begin 
to feel very tense. It seems that 
I can write anything down on 
paper. My hand just seems to 
move. If I could be more that 
way with my mouth and less 
with the pen, I feel I would have 
accomplished one of my highest 
goals. I don’t know how to be 
open with people. Maybe, if I 
were more open, people would 
realize I’m not a snob. I’m just 
too shy to speak up! I really 
want to take a few steps toward 
achieving this goal, but I just 
never have.

I remember in seventh grade, 
we had to memorize a three - 
minute speech and say it out 
loud to the class! That was the 
scarriest and most dreadful 
thing I have everdone! Now, I 
realize that, that speech I made 
on the handicapped was not 
that hard. I thought many times 
about trying forensics, but I 
always seemed to have last - 
minute decisions.

Just like George in the story, 
“A Summer’s Reading,” I have 
a problem taking a first step!

Carrie Fellenz 
Grade 9 
Kewaskum High School

should use at least SPF 20,” ex­
plains Cripps. “Blonds and 
redheads should use at least a 30. 
Some light-skinned people will 
never tan well; it's a fact of life that 
can't be changed.

"It’s another fact that your skin 
is like a bank account with a 
memory: it never forgets sunlight 
to which it’s been exposed. 
Unless you protect your skin, 
there will come a time when it can 
no longer accept any more sun 
damage, leading to wrinkling, 
cracking and probably cancer,” 
he adds.

Dark-skinned people are not 
immune to the sun’s rays either, 
he says. “Blacks and Hispanics 
can still burn, and they run the 
risk of developing skin cancer if 
they don’t take precautions as 
well.”

Cripps also warns against try­
ing to cram a lot of tanning or time 
in the sun into one or two days. 
“These weekend warriors' who 
work inside all week and want to 
catch up’ on Saturday and Sun­

day can seriously damage their 
skin without the proper protection. 
Cases of people developing 
cancer from a single serious sun­
burn have been documented, so 
it isn't always a result of years and 
years of exposure to the sun.”

And what of the young immor­
tals who shrug off warnings as 
they drip with tanning butter in the 
sun?

“No tan is worth dying for,” 
says Cripps. “Avoiding sunburn 
is easy: stay out of the sun when 
it’s hottest, wear a hat and protec­
tive clothing, and use sunblock if 
you want to get a tan. It’s easy to 
use, avoids the pain and discom­
fort of burning, and reduces the 
risk of developing skin cancer.”

The most successful method of 
treating skin cancer today was 
developed at the UW Medical 
School in the 1930s by Dr. 
Frederick Mohs, now emeritus 
professor of surgery. The techni­
que, known as Mohs surgery or 
chemosurgery, involves removing 
and analyzing skin layer by layer 
until all cancer cells are gone

Free Blood Pressure 
Screenings Offered

The Community Health 
Nursing Service Cardiovascular 
Risk Reducation Program is 
offering free blood pressure 
screening at the following sites 
during the month of July.

July 14th — West Bend Fire 
Department, 320 N. 7th 
Avenue, 1 p.m. - 4 p.m.

July 28th — West Bend Fire 
Department, 320 N. 7th 
Avenue, 1 p.m. - 4 p.m.

Questions about the program 
may be directed to Doris Dauer. 
Coordinator, at 338-5274, 644- 
5204 or 342-2929 (toll free, ext. 
4707).

Immunization 
Clinics Slated

All recommended immuniza­
tions are available to children 
and adults of Washington 
County at the immunization 
clinics offered by Washington 
County Community Health 
Service. JULY clinics are:

July 3, 2-5:00 p.m. — 
Community Health Nursing 
Service. Courthouse. Room 119, 
432 E. Washington St., West 
Bend.

July 10, 2-5:00 p.m. — 
Germantown Senior Citizen 
Center, W162 N11960 Park 
Avenue, Germantown.

July 17, 9-12:00 p.m. — 
Hartford City Hall, 109 N. Main 
Street, Hartford.

July 24, 9-12:00 p.m. — 
Community Health Nursing 
Service, Courthouse, Lower 
Level, Room 119, 432 E. 
Washington St., West Bend.
Parents must bring their 

records of each child’s past 
immunizations to clinics. 
Immunizations will not be given 
without a record card.

For further information, call 
338-4462, 644-5204, or 342- 
2929.

THE FLYING 
IBARRAS

Jorge Barreda’s 
FEROCIOUS LIONS

FULLY 
Insured

Free 
Estimate#

Regal Names Dilling Manager-Corporate 
Systems, Procedures Budgets

Steven Dilling

KEWASKUM, Wis. — Regal 
Ware, Inc. has named Steven 
Dilling to the position of 
Manager - Corpate Systems, 
Procedures Budgets. In this 
position he will be responsible 
for the installation of new 
systems and procedures, 
coordination of training and the 
review and update of policies 
and systems.

Dilling comes to Regal with a 
bachelor’s degree in Business 
Administration from 
UW-Oshkosh and four years of 
accounting experience.

Regal Ware, Inc. is a major 
manufacturer of cookware, 
kitchen electrics and microwave 
ovenware headquartered in 
Kewaskum.

Seasons Best Stra ;bcrrv Short cake
BERRIES

1/3 cup honey
2 tablespoons lemon juice
3 pints strawberries, sliced 

SHORTCAKE
2 cups flour
2 tablespoons sugar 

yh teaspoons baking powder 
1/2 cup butter, chilled 
114 cup dairy sour cream

1/4 to 1/2 cup milk
CREAM

1 cup whipping cream
1/3 cup sifted powdered sugar 

1 teaspoon vanilla
1/2 cup dairy sour cream

Combine honey and lemon juice in medium bowl Stir in strawberries ( hill 

Combine flour, sugar, and baking powder, cut in butter until mixture resembles 
fine crumbs Add sour cream; mix in lightly with fork With fork, stir in just 
enough milk to form soft dough On lightly floured surface, roll dough to 1/2 
inch thickness Cut with 5 inch biscuit cutter Reroll dough as necessary to make 
six shortcakes Place on ungreased 
cookie sheet Bake an 2 5 . Isminutes 
or until golden brown

Beat cream until soft peaks form Add 
sugar and vanilla, continue beating un 
til stiff peaks form Fold in sour cream 
Chill

When readv to serve, split shortcakes 
in half Place bottom half on serving 
plates Top with half of strawberries 
and half of cream; repeat layers

ULSTER BACK INTO THE GOLDEN DAYS 
OF THE AMERICAN 

* CIRCUS

£ WA>»W0 A OY

6 WORLD $ 
C MUSEUM V_i 

BARABOO. WISCONSIN AflM^Mi
ALL NEW

| STAR SPANGLED 
1990 EDITION

BIG top show 
y featuring 

Lou Ann Jacobs

ELEPHANTS
live

Howard Bros. 
Miniature Circus 
“The Biggest Little 

Circus in the World

stage
Two Hemispheres 
World’s Largest 
Circus Wagon

SHOW
The Man"6
of MaglC WILD ANIMAL MENAGERIE

OPEN DAILY. 9AM-6PM thru SEPT 16

a SPECIAL STARLIGHT SHOW .
July 21 - Aug 22 8 00 PM «

For Brochure * Schedule Write Bereboo. Wl 53913

Minutes from Wisconsin Dells
RAIN or SNINE

NEW-INFO LINE 
CALL 608-356-0800

OWNED BY STATE HISTORICAL SOCIETY OF WISCONSIN



THE HENRY S. REUSS 
ICE AGE VISITOR CENTER

The Center is administered by the Wisconsin Department of Natural 
Resources under review of the National Park Service. It opened in 
January of 1981 for the purpose of introducing and orienting visitors 
to the Ice Age National Scientific Reserve, whose goal in turn is "to 
assure protection, preservation and interpretation of the nationally signifi­
cant values of Wisconsin’s continental glaciation.” The Center is not 
and should not be considered a museum. The museum is the 40,000 
glacial landscaped acres constituting the nine individual units comprisino 
the Reserve. a

Upon entering the Center, one's attention is quickly drawn to a large 
mural depicting an artists interpretation of a scene of the area 10,000 
to 12,000 years ago when the last major advance of ice was melting 
It is suggested before viewing the exhibits, to watch the excellent inter­
pretive film Night of the Sun" (20 minutes in length) shown every hour 
and half-hour. The exhibit area presents some interesting facts and con­
cepts about the Ice Age, while the view from the deck interprets several 
visible landscape formations.

This area is internationally known for it's famous glacial features and 
interesting array of plants and animals. You are invited to learn more 
about this important part of our heritage by visiting the Henry S. Reuss 
Ice Age Visitor Center and participating in the Naturalist Program.

During the summer the naturalist program offers nature walks, talks, 
auto tours, evening programs, visiting guest speakers, etc. These events 
offered at the Center or the Mauthe Lake and Long Lake Recreational 
Areas are easy and enjoyable ways to learn more about the area. Dur­
ing the remainder of the year group interpretive programs are available 
upon request.

The Center is located one mile south of the Village of Dundee on State 
Hwy. 67 in the Northern Kettle Moraine State Forest, about 55 miles 
north of Milwaukee, Wisconsin.

A self-guided 40 mile geology tour and a short self-guiding nature trail 
“The Moraine Ridge Trail" originate at the Center. Guidebooks for both 
are available in the Center. There are also two other self-guiding nature 
trails within the forest.

The Center is open year-round (except for major holidays) Monday thru 
Friday (8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m.) and Saturday and Sunday (9:30 a.m. to 5 
p.m ). The mailing address is Box 410, Campbellsport, Wisconsin 53010. 
Telephone number 414-533-8322. Although no admission is required 
to visit the Center, vehicle park stickers are required on the visitor’s 
vehicle.

KETTLE MORAINE STATE FOREST 
NU NATURALIST PROGRAM 

July 11-14th
WEDNESDAY, JULY 11, 9:30 a.m. - "THE LAND THE 
GLACIERS CREATED” - Glacial geology is the topic of this walk 
to a high ridge above Long Lake. Originates at the NORTH 
BEACH at Long Lake. 1:30 p.m. - "AN INTRODUCTION TO 
ORIENTEERING” - Learn to use a compass in this activity for 
the adventuresome. Meet at the ICE AGE CENTER.
THURSDAY, JULY 12, 9:30 a.m. - “THE SPRUCE LAKE BOG” 
- This short walk into a fascinating world originates at the ICE 
AGE CENTER and then requires a 5-mile drive to the bog. 1:30 
P,m> * “^CREDIBLE EDIBLES” - This fascinating world of “wild 
vittles” will be the focus. Meet at the LONG LAKE NATURE 
TRAIL at Long Lake.

FRIDAY, JULY 13, 1:30 p.m. - “THE PRAIRIE” - A look at a 
community of plants that at one time covered 6 percent of 
Wisconsin’s land area. Meet at the intersections of County “G” 
and “SS” just west of New Prospect.
SATURDAY, JULY 14, 1:30 p.m. - “KAMES, KETTLES & 
ESKERS” - Auto Tour. This auto tour originates at the Ice Age 
Center and is a fine opportunity to see first hand and learn more 
about the geology of this area. Tour lasts two hours and covers 
25 miles.

......... EVENING PROGRAMS..........
FRIDAY, JULY 13, 7:30 p.m. - “POISONOUS PLANT OF 
WISCONSIN” - A slide program presented by Mr. Roger Reif, 
Naturalist. From mild dermatitis to sudden death, positive iden­
tification has no substitute. Join Roger at the ICE AGE CENTER 
Auditorium.

SATURDAY, JULY 14 - 7:30 p.m. - "CRITTER CARE” - Injured 
wild animals, as well as all nature lovers are fortunate to have 
rehabilitators like Jeannie Lord. Join Jeanie and some of her 
live patients at the ICE AGE CENTER Auditorium.

SUNGLASSES: Be Comfortable and Stylish, Too
By Judy Kay Moore, UW-Madison Center for Health Sciences

MADISON, Wis. - While 
many people see sunglasses as 
little more than a fashion 
accessory, this time of year the 
right pair of sunglasses can also 
be a welcome source of comfort 
and relief from the bright glare 
of the summer sun.

Experts at University of 
Wisconsin Hospital and Clinics 
advise that sunglasses can help 
control the amount of light let 
into the eyes, thereby 
diminishing reflective glare, a 
common problem around water, 
snow and paved roads. 
Sunglasses also can help those 
whose eyes are sensitive to dust 
and may help prevent skin 
cancer from developing around 
th(> eyes by shielding them from 
the sun's harmful rays.

Doug Bredeson, an optician 
who serves patients at 
University of Wisconsin 
Hospital and Clinics, advises 
consumers to look for lenses 
that block 80 percent of the 
light. These will provide relief

recommend these shopping 
tips:

* Check for distortion. Hold 
the glasses at arm’s length and 
look through the lenses, moving 
the glasses slowly back and 
forth while watching for image 
distortion.

* Check the tint. Be sure the 
lens color is evenly applied, not 
darker in one area and lighter in 
another. Some lenses are 
designed to be darker on top.

but make sure the change is 
gradual.

* Be aware of the lens 
material. Lenses made of glass 
break more easily than plastic 
lenses, but plastic lenses are 
more susceptible to scratches.

* Choose a style that suits you 
best. People whose eyes are 
especially sensitive to light may 
prefer darker lenses that wrap 
around the eyes to further 
reduce light entering the eyes.

JULY 
COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR

mation or to sign up for this fun ac­
tivity, contact the Center at 675-6888.

FRIDAY, JULY 6 
SATURDAY, JULY 7 

SUNDAY, JULY 8
The Annual Kewaskum Firemen 

and Legion Picnic will be held at 
Riverhill Park in Kewaskum. There 
will be live music on Friday and 
Saturday nights and Sunday after­
noon. waterfights on Saturday at 5:30 
p.m. and a mammoth parade will be 
held on Sunday at 12 noon. There 
will also be rides, games, food, 
refreshments, fun and a chance to 
meet up with old friends. Don’t miss 
it.

SUNDAY, JULY 8
“A Day In The Park” will be the 

theme for the 19th annual arts and 
crafts fair sponsored by the Women’s 
Affiliate of the Beaver Dam Chamber 
of Commerce which will be held 
from 10 a.m. to 5 p.m. at Swan City 
Park in Beaver Dam. On display will 
be a wide variety of arts and crafts 
items, with sandwiches, ice cream 
sundaes, root beer floats and snow 
cones served on the grounds.

SUNDAY, JULY 15
Annual St. Kilian Parish Picnic will 

start at noon on the church grounds. 
There will be a charcoal broiled 
chicken dinner served from 3 to 6 
p.m. with carryouts available. There 
will also be a couples volleyball tour­
nament, games, food, refreshments 
and live music.

SATURDAY, JULY 21
The 26th annual celebration of Fish 

Day will be held in Port Washington. 
Attractions for the all-day family 
event will include a spectacular 
2-hour parade beginning at 11 a.m.. 
an 8K run/2 mile walk, live entertain­
ment. a petting zoo, antique car 
show, helicopter and carnival rides, 
fire department demonstrations and 
fireworks at 9:30 p.m. Free shuttle 
bus service from specially marked 
Fish Day parking lots will be 
available to transport festival-goers to 
Port Washington's lakefront.

from the
without 
vision.

While 
available

• sun’s brightness 
adversely affecting

sunglasses are
in a variety of lens

tints, gray is a favorite for sun 
protection because it is the best 
shade for distinguishing 
between colors. Gray lenses 
transmit light evenly through 
the entire visible spectrum, 
allowing colors to be seen 
naturally. Dark green lenses 
also minimize color distortion.

In addition to color, lenses 
also vary in size, shape and in 
their ability to absorb light.
Polarized lenses, 
reflection and 
especially useful

which reduce 
glare, are 

around water
or snow. Photochromic lenses 
become darker in bright light 
and lighter in its absence.

When shopping, look for 
comfortable sunglasses with 
distortion - free and scratch - 
resistant lenses. Eye doctors

More Than 1,100 Enroll In 
Moraine Park’s Summer School

A total of 1,161 students have 
enrolled in summer classes at 
Moraine Park Technical 
College's three campuses and 
16 instructional centers.

According to Moraine Park’s 
Registrar's office, 113 students 
are enrolled at the Beaver Dam 
campus, 544 at the Fond du Lac 
campus, 288 at the West Bend 
campus and 216 at the various 
instructional centers located 
throughout the Moraine Park 
Vocational, Technical and Adult 
Education District.

Summer school classes began 
June 11 at Moraine Park.

“We are pleased," said Betty 
Brunelle, vice president for 
instruction at Moraine Park. 
“The numbers are about where 
we had hoped they would be for 
summer enrollment.

Curtailed in 1987 because of a 
budget crunch, summer school 
was reestablished at Moraine 
Park this year with a greatly 
expanded number of day and 
evening classes offered at all 
three campuses. In 1989, 
Moraine Park offered only a 
handful of morning-only classes

determine what students served 
by the college are looking for as 
far as summer school course 
subjects and scheduled times, 
she said.

“We still sit back and analyze 
these summer school 
enrollment figures to determine 
what we will do for next year," 
Brunelle said. “I’m sure we’ll 
have to make some adjustments 
in what courses we offer and 
what time of day we offer them, 
but overall I could call this

Coming events will be listed on­
ly if they are submitted to the 
Statesman and are of area in­
terest. We will be happy to list 
meetings of your non-profit 
organization only if they are sent 
in to us each month. We can no 
longer be responsible for keeping 
a running file of meetings for the 
entire year. Please submit your 
meeting notice for publication the 
week before it is to be published 
Bear in mind, if your coming event, 
is designed to make money for 
your organization, it should be 
considered advertising.

The Community Calendar col­
umn is run a TIME AND SPACE 
AVAILABLE BASIS ONLY

FRIDAY. JULY 6
The Washington County Separated 

and Divorced Men and Women 
Group will meet at Sacred Heart 
Church in Allenton from 7:30 to 9:30 
p.m. The program will include a 
small group discussion on “What's 
On Your Mind?"

In the Service
Marine Pvt. Ross A. 

Krueger, son of Gene Krueger 
of Route 4, Campbellsport, WI, 
has completed recruit training 
at Marine Corps Recruit Depot, 
San Diego.

During the 13-week training 
cycle, Krueger was taught the 
basics of battlefield survival. He 
was introduced to the typical
daily routine that he
experience 
enlistment and 
personal and

during 
studied

will 
his 
the

professional
standards traditionally 
exhibited by Marines.

He participated in an active 
physical conditioning program

SATURDAY, JULY 7
Third Annual Butterfly Count 

Riveredge Nature Center located
at 
in

and gained proficiency 
variety of military 
including first aid, 
marksmanship and close 
drill. Teamwork and

in a 
skills 
rifle 

order 
self-

for all three campuses.
Moraine Park considers this 

's summer school schedule 
Brunelleyear 

an experiment,
explained.
schedule is

The expanded
being used to

summer
success."

For a
Moraine

school

week
Park

schedule a

in August 
will offer

Concerning Learning, a study 
skills improvement course. 
Offered at all three campuses. 
Concerning Learning is 
designed to help students focus 
on study habits, test-taking 
skills and other learning 
fundamentals while acquainting 
them with various resources 
available at Moraine Park.

Moraine Park’s instructional 
centers are located at Berlin, 
Campbellsport, Green Lake, 
Hartford, Horicon, Hustisford, 
Juneau, Kewaskum, Lomira,

Newburg. As part of a continuous ef­
fort to assess butterfly populations, 
the count will be conducted from 9 
a.m. to 5 p.m. There is a need for 
those who can identify as well as 
catch butterflies. For additional infor-

discipline were emphasized 
throughout the training cycle.

A 1989 graduate of Nathen 
Hale High School, West Allis, 
he joined the Marine Corps in 
February 1990.

APPLIANCES PLUS 
LAWN & GARDEN 

Sales and Service
617 E. Main St., Campbellsport 

PHONE 533-5280

. Markesan, Mayville, 
Holstein, Princeton, 
Slinger/Allenton 
Waupun/Fox Lake.

New 
Ripon, 

and

STORE HOURS Mon , Tuos. & Thurs. 8 a m to 5:30 p m 
Weds & Fri 8 a m to 7 p m , Sat 8 a m. to 3 p m

SERVICE AVAILABLE ON ALL LAWN & GARDEN 
EQUIPMENT AND MAJOR BRAND APPLIANCES 

‘Reasonable Service Rates*

Also... ^AMERICAN COUNTRY CRAFTS 
By The Old Mill and Katydid
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EMALYN B. HERMANSON
Emalyn B. Hermanson, nee 

Vislisel-Whiting, of 1119 
Roseland Drive, Kewaskum, 
died Tuesday, June 26, 1990 at 
the Samaritan Home, West 
Bend, at the age of 92.

She was born Dec. 17, 1897, 
in Pisek, N.D. and married 
Leonard Whiting July 19, 1923, 
in Beaulue, Minn. He passed 
away June 8, 1964. She then 
married John S. Hermanson, on 
July 3, 1969, in Two Harbors, 
Minn. He preceded her in death 
Sept. 11, 1985.

She was a member of St. 
Matthew’s Catholic Church, 
Campbellsport.

Survivors include a son, Neil 
(Catherine) Whiting of 
Aberdeen, S.D.;two daughters, 
Mary (Alvin) Vorderbruggen of 
Kewaskum and Shirley Wynne 
of Carlsbad, Calif; six grand­
children; nine great­
grandchildren, and other 
relatives and friends.

Preceding her in death were 
five brothers, six sisters, a 
grandson and a son-in-law.

Funeral services were Friday, 
June 29, at 11 a.m. at St. 
Matthew’s Catholic Church, 
Campbellsport. Rev. Michael 
Moran officiated and burial was 
in the parish cemetery.

Visitation at the Twohig 
Funeral Home, Campbellsport, 
was Friday from 9 to 10:30 a.m.

CHRISTOPHER A. KIRSCH
Christopher A. Kirsch, 18, of 

Kewaskum, died Sunday, June 
24, 1990.

Survivors include his parents, 
Lona Schowalter and Rodney 
Kirsch, a brother Brian, 
grandparents, aunts, uncles, 
other relatives and friends.

Funeral services were Thurs­
day evening. June 28. at 8 p.m. 
at the Funeral Home. Interment 
was in Union Cemetery, Port 
Washington, and visitation was 
Thursday, from 4 to 8 p.m.

Memorials are appreciated. 
The Eernisse Funeral Home is 
serving the family.

IN MEMORY
In loving memory of LUELLA 

MARQUARDT, two years ago, 
July 6th, 1988:
God stood that morn beside 

your bed
These are the words He must 

have said:
“You have suffered more than 

you can stand.
Come with Me — just take My 

hand.’’
It broke our hearts to lose you, 
But you did not go alone, 
For part of us went with you. 
The day God called you home.

Loved and remembered by 
her children and grandchildren.

MONUMENTS
★ Uprights and flat
★ Markers of all kinds 
★ Completely installed
★ Death date put on
★ Mausoleums

VINCE’S 
MONUMENTS
1857 Hy. 67 in Ashford 

PHONE 533-8178

In loving memory of Viola A. 
Spoerl who entered her Heaven­
ly Home one year ago, July 6, 
1989:
In life we loved you dearly 
In death we love you still 
In our hearts you hold a special 

place,
No one else can ever fill.

It broke our hearts to lose you 
But you didn’t go alone 
For part of us went with you, 
The day God called you home.

Sadly missed by her husband 
Fred, children and grandchild­
ren and great-grandchild.

25 Years Ago
July 2, 1965

The annual spectacular 
Fourth of July holiday fireworks 
display sponsored by the village 
of Kewaskum under the 
supervision of the Kewaskum 
Fire Department will be held in 
the village park on the night of 
Saturday, July 3. Hundreds of 
dollars worth of fireworks have 
been purchased and this year’s 
display will be bigger and better 
than ever.

Funeral services were held 
Monday, June 28, for John P. 
Van Blarcom, 63, of this village, 
who passed away Thursday, 
June 24, after suffering an 
attack at his home. He had been 
ailing with asthma for several 
years. Mr. Van Blarcom was 
born Dec. 13, 1901, at Bolton- 
ville. He was married to the 
former Frances Raether and 
lived most of his life in 
Beechwood and Kewaskum. He 
was in the plumbing and 
heating business in Kewaskum 
and also operated the Gambles 
store for several years before 
becoming a rural mail carrier, 
which position he held at the 
time of his death.

Three Kewaskum youths 
injured at 1:30 a.m. Sunday 
when a car driven by Robert J. 
Miller, 18, of 215 Main St., 
Kewaskum, left Hwy. D, about 
three miles east of New Fane 
and struck a tree. Miller 
suffered a cut left cheek, his 
brother Michael. 16, sustained 
bruises and another passenger 
in the car, 16-year-old Christie 
L. Heberer of R.l, Kewaskum, 
suffered a fractured jaw, tongue 
and head injuries. The three 
were reported on their way 
home after already taking a 
fourth passenger, Bernadine 
Fellenz, to her home about a 
mile east of the scene of the 
mishap. Miller was proceeding 
west when the car he was 
driving, owned by his uncle, Joe 
Schmitt, left the road, struck 
the tree and came to rest in a 
ditch facing the opposite 
direction. The right side of the 
auto was demolished.

Birth — A daughter to Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Steiner, 221A 
Main St., Kewaskum, 
Wednesday, June 25.

WEST BEND 
MONUMENT CO.

334-3871

Modern Memorials Designed for You 
"Serving Wisconsin Since 1903" 

Gary Koenings and Wally Miller
"^^S^S. 25 E. Washington St.
HILCENDORF/ (Hwy. 33), West Bend

EMORIALS/i/2 block east of the railroad tracks 

Parking in rear of building

July 2, 1940
The Kewaskum Sportsmans 

Club has received 300 more 
day-old Pheasant chicks from 
the Wisconsin Conservation 
Commission, which were 
hatched at the state game farm 
at Poynette. Another order of 
4-week old chicks is expected to 
be received by the club from 
Poynette in the next couple of 
months. The chicks are being 
housed on the Dr. R.G. 
Edwards property near the 
south village limits. The club 
has erected an addition onto the 
feed room of the brooder house 
at their farm and now have the 
facilities to care for all the birds 
very satisfactorily. Last 
Saturday club members 
released 30 full grown birds in 
the vicinity.

Jacob Haug, 64, widely 
known Town of Auburn farm 
resident and brother of P.J. 
Haug of this village, died 
unexpectedly, Thursday, July 4, 
at his home near Five Corners 
of injuries sustained a week 
before in a fall at his farm. Mr. 
Haug suffered a broken collar 
bone and internal injuries when 
he fell from a wagon laod of hay 
while hauling some at his farm.

The little daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Marx of this village 
was baptized last Sunday in 
Holy Trinity Church by the Rev. 
Philip Vogt. She received the 
name Judith Mary. Sponsors 
were Sylvester Marx of 
Milwaukee and Miss Pearl 
Hron.

Miss Ruth Runte is attending 
the LeClaire School of Beauty in 
Milwaukee. She left for that city 
last Friday evening. Ruth 
graduated from the local high 
school this year.

Special, delicious fresh fish 
liver, something different in a 
lunch, will be served at 
Heisler’s Tavern Saturday 
evening, July 6. Stop in for this 
treat. Visit Pete’s tavern, 
Kewaskum, for a bowl of turtle 
soup, to be served special for 
Saturday evening. You’ll enjoy 
a fine treat.

Kettle Moraine 
Hospice Services, inc.

-In home supportive care for 
the terminally ill throughout 

the Washington County area
-Completely volunteer 

and cost free

P.O. Box 852
West Bend, Wl 53095 

(414)334-9559
WARREN SEKAS

Feb 12, 1934-June 23. 1982

75 Years Ago
July 3, 1915

Martin Wietor of this village, 
employed with the Jos. Guldan 
mason crew, had the misfortune 
to fracture his right leg above 
the ankle Monday morning 
while at work on the John 
Foerster farm near St. Kilian. 
Dr. Hoffman of Campbellsport 
was immediately summoned 
and the fracture set. He was 
removed to his home and is 
doing nicely.

Jos. Rosenheimer of 
Schleisingerville has sold his 
machinery - business to Wm. E. 
Langenecker of Allenton, who 
took possession this week. The 
new owner contemplates 
erecting a large warehouse.

Last Monday morning as 
Mrs. Albert Opgenorth was 
doing her washing, she placed a 
bottle of gasoline on the wash 
bench while she went into the 
house to get her husband’s 
breakfast. In the meantime, her 
youngest son Sylvester got a 
hold of the bottle and drank 
some of the contents. The child 
was at once hurried to Dr. 
Driessel where everything 
possible was done for him. At 
present the child is getting 
along nicely but the doctor 
states that if the boy had drank 
much more it would have killed 
him.

While unloading hay in his 
barn Wednesday afternoon, 
Aug. Bilgo, Sr. received a 
severe cut on the back of his 
head. A rope which Mr. Bilgo 
was pulling in trying to change 
the hay carrier, tore and the 
pulley attached to same fell 
striking him on the head and 
inflicting a gash of about three 
inches. With the assistance of 
neighbors, the flow of blood was 
stopped and medical aid

A LIVING MEMORIAL...
Please send contributions to:

CVCkemstoTy^ 
L SCHOLARSHIPS, INC.

P.O. BOX 124, KEWASKUM, Wl 53040

RAYMOND P. ZEIMET
Aug 23. 1910-June 24, 1978

JOHN C. REINDERS
Oct 6. 1890-June 30. 1964

HAROLD KUEHL
Jen 12, 1918-July 5. 1980

Our g°al's 1° serve everyone as if they were members 
of our own family...with gentleness, privacy and respect." 
Specializing in pre-need arrangements; irrevocable trusts

(~)niF(&F
FUNERAL HOME 

Kewaskum Phone 626*2185

summoned, but as neither Dr. 
Driessel nor Dr. Hausmann of 
here were home at the time, Dr. 
Sylvester Driessel of Barton was 
summoned. The latter arrived 
in a short time. It required a 
number of stitches to sew the 
cut.

A barnraising bee was held at 
Richard Friedemann’s Kohls- 
ville on Wednesday.

IN MEMORY
In loving memory of EVELYN 

LUDWIG, who passed away ten 
years ago, July 10th, 1980: 
God saw she was getting tired 
And a cure was not to be.
So he put His arms around her, 
And whispered “Come with

Me.”
With tearful eyes we watched 

her suffer.
And saw her fade away, 
Although we loved her dearly. 
We could not make her stay. 
A golden heart stopped beating, 
Hard working hands to rest 
God broke our hearts to prove 

to us,
He only takes the best.

Mr. and Mrs. Elton Ludwig 
Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd Gatzke 
Mr. and Mrs. Dave Arndt 

and grandchildren

THANK YOU
Thanks to Sacred Heart of 

Jesus and St. Jude for prayers 
answered.

T.T.

The customer was busy sawing 
on the steak he had ordered and 
was having a difficult time.
Waiter: Is it tough?
Customer: |Exhausted] When I 
order beef and get horse, I don't 
care. But next time, take the 
harness off before you start 
serving.

Flying Our 
Flag In 

Remembering 
Our Veterans

NICHOLAS ENGELMAN 
1887-June 23, 1972

RAYMOND H. KRAHN 
Aug 1, 1906-June 25. 1984

FRANK T. BROSKEY
Aug 22. 1877-June 30. 1954

WERNER A. BRUHN
July 11. 1909-July 5. 1953
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We’re dropping them!

Great time to Drive Away with Savings on all our cars & trucks

THE

OF AMERICA

^CHWARTZBURG
CHEVROLET 0 OLDSMOBILE 0 GEO

Hwy 33 "Automotive Row" • West Bend • 334-3858 • 800-924-8800 
Open Mon. thru Fri. "till 9:00 p.m., Sat. 'till 4:00 p.m.



KHS Announces Names of 
Perfect Attendance Students

According to our records the 
following students have had an 
excellent attendance record 
during the 1989-1990 school 
year. This is a commendable 
accomplishment for developing 
the correct attitude about being 
in school as being very 
important. There is a direct 
relationship between good 
attendance and grades as well 
as an interest in school. This 
also carries over into the world 
of work. Industry is concerned 
about unusual absenteeism and 
when employers call the school 
their first question often 
concerns attendance records.

There may be situations when 
a student is needed at home or 
if a student is sick he/she 
should not be in school. The 
attitude of the parents towards 
attendance in school and later in 
life on the job is reflected in 
their children. Truancy tends to 
be a warning that the student is 
potential drop-out and ." many 
cases headed for other 
problems.

As we prepare for the A-9'. 
school year, we again ask for 
parents cooperation in 
encouraging their students to 
be in school.

We congratulate the 
following students:

PERFECT ATTENDANCE
Scott Backhaus, Jenny Bauer, 

Jenny Beimborn (2), Steve 
Bodden (3), Brian Breundl, 
Keith Butschlick (2), Jeff 
Dirmeier, Carrie Fellenz, Don 
Harmon, Sandy Harmon (2), 
Sherry Hass, Brian Heller, Lynn 
Johann, Heather Koch, Kristen 
Krebs, Melissa Kuechler (2), 
Adam Laatsch, Jeff Landvatter, 
Carla Lemke (3), Phillip Lettow.

Kim Marx (2), Julie Mertz, 
Nancy Neumann, Sara Nysse 
(2), Andrea Pascavis, Amy 
Redig, Jason Reindl, James 
Rix, Randy Romaine, Kim 
Sabish, Christopher Schmidt, 
Tamara Schmidt, Daniel 
Schulties, Julie Schulz, Tina 
Schwartz, Debra Steger, 
Jennifer Thull, Laura Vogt, 
Bradley Weinreich.
ABSENT TWO DAYS OR LESS

Dan Bastian, Tina Bath, 
Thomas Bauer, Sara Beck, 
Brenda Behling, Scott Berger, 
Kate Berres, Brent Boegel, 
Angela Brath, Rebecca Braun, 
Jennifer Brigham, Jeff 
Brigham, Eric Bude, Timothy 
Butschlick, Nicole Cayner, Amy

SOCIAL, SECURITY NEWS

Applying for Survivors Benefits
By

David W. Becker 
Branch Manager

If you believe that you may be 
eligible for Social Security 
survivors benefits, you should 
apply for them as soon as 
possible after the worker’s 
death. You can apply at any 
Social Security office. In some 
cases, benefits are not payable 
for any month before the month 
you apply.

The application process can 
be quicker if you have needed 
evidence when you apply. 
However, do not delay simply 
because all the proofs are not 
readily available. The people at 
the Social Security office can 
start the application process 
and advise you about 
submitting additional evidence.

Chesak, Nicole Doherty, Wendy 
Fideler, Joel Fleischman, 
Nicole Gaffke, Pamela Gauger, 
Tania Friedel, Joseph Gayan, 
Chris Geidel, Rachel Gosa, 
Heide Gruhle, Scott Hass, John 
Hazlewood, Mark Heather, 
Steven Heberer, Keith Herman, 
Tim Herman, Greg Holl, John 
Hupfer, Melissa Jacak, Helena 
Jaromin.

Beth Kempf, Jeff Kissinger, 
Jeremy Korneli, Kelly Korth, 
Kelly Krahn, Corey Krahn, 
Rachelle Krahn, Dean Kreis, 
Thomas Kuehn, David Kuphal, 
Aaron Laatsch. Jacquline 
Laufer, Catherine Lauters, 
Timothy Lettow, Steven Liegl, 
Michelle Marx. James Marx, 
Jason Miller. Melissa Miller, 
Jamie Miller. Jason Noren, 
Timothy Novotny. Eva Nowak. 
Nicole Oppermann. Sheldon 
Oppermann, Pamela 
Osierbrink. Michael Pascavis. 
Jennifer Pesch. Stacy Port. 
Chris Ramthun. Vicki Rehbein. 
R bin Rehbein. Rebecca Reis. 
Steven Rudzitis. Brian 
Repinski.

Tracy Ruplinger. Angela 
Schiller. Jennifer Schinker. 
Kristina Schinker. Marty 
Schlice, Yvonne Schlice. Randy 
Schlice, John Schmidt, Jessica 
Schmidt, Sandra Schmidt, 
Jennifer Schneider, Tricia 
Schwartz, Jamie Severance, 
Jason Sharpee, Ira Sison, 
Joseph Steier, Tisha Stradtman, 
Christy Towler, Christopher 
Trapp, Tammy Troeller, Jean 
Turner, Jennifer Van Assche, 
Terri Vogt, Andrea Waala, 
Deanna Wagner, Chris 
Weddig, James Wichtoski, Scot 
Wiesner, Jean Wiesner, Leeann 
Winninghoff, Marlene 
Wodsedalek, April Wulff, 
Christian Wunsch, Christine 
Yogerst, Shelly Winninger.

ABC CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners at skat played by 

the ABC Senior Citizens at 
Beechwood Hall on Tuesday, 
June 26, were: Joe Butschlick 
30-0—30 net: Ruth Egerer 
18-3—15 net; Elroy Egerer 
14-2—12 net; Wilmer Firme 
17-5—12 net; Elroy Egerer Club 
Solo vs 4.

Money may talk, but it never 
gives itself away.

Some of the evidence you will 
need when applying for 
survivors benefits includes:

* The applicant’s and the 
deceased worker’s Social’ 
Security numbers.

* Proof of the applicant’s age.
* Proof of marriage, if the 

person is applying for widow’s 
or widower’s benefits.

* Proof of the worker’s death.
* Children’s birth certificates 

if they are applying for benefits.
* The deceased worker’s W-2 

form (or Federal tax return, if 
self-employed) for the most 
recent tax year.

Other evidence may also be 
required depending on the kind 
of survivors benefits you are 
filing for.

Call Social Security at 1-800- 
234-5772 to set up an appoint­
ment to file for benefits.

Kids!
It’s a Readlicious Summer 

at the Public Library

Kew
askum Statesm

an, Thursday, July 5, 1990, Page 14

1. Almond
2. Cooksville
3. Clam Lake
4. Cream
5.
6.
7.
8.
9.

10.

Serigraph Receives 
TRW Quality Award

TRW Canada Ltd. is honoring 
Serigraph Inc. with an 
“Excellence in Quality” award, 
one of only two presented by the 
automotive supplier since 1985.

Serigraph is being cited for 
the overall quality of products 
and services to TRW, a major 
supplier to the auto industry. 
Serigraph, one of the nation’s 
largest screen printing 
companies, makes appliques for 
controls such as defroster 
switches for TRW.

The Transportation 
Electronics Division of TRW 
Canada has more than 60 
suppliers. The only other 
supplier to win the award was 
Maverick Spring Co. in 1985. 
Serigraph has been a supplier to 
TRW since 1986.

Serigraph, with three plants 
in West Bend, is a national 
supplier of graphics products to 
the automotive, appliance / 
electronics, marine and 
consumer markets.

Cholesterol, Blood 
Pressure Screening

Cholesterol screening and 
blood pressure measurement 
will be offered to West Bend 
area residents by the 
Community Health Nursing 
Service Cardiovascular Risk 
Reduction Program. Screening 
tests will be available once a 
month at the WASHINGTON 
COUNTY COURT HOUSE, 432 
E. Washington.

Screening schedule: July 26th 
beginning at 4:30 p.m. in room 
119, (lower level of court 
house).

Blood Pressure and 
Cholesterol screenings will be 
done BY APPOINTMENT 
ONLY. Cholesterol screening 
will be done for a charge of 
$5.00.

To schedule an appointment 
for cholesterol and/or blood 
pressure screening, call 
338-4707 or 644-5204 or 342- 
2929 (toll free, ext. 4707).

These Wisconsin towns sound as though 
they belong the kitchen, but you should 
match each to its county. Can you think of 
other Wisconsin towns, rivers, lakes, or islands 
that fit this theme?

a.
b.

Egg Harbor 
Lime Ridge 
Plum City 
Rice Lake 
Sugar Bush 
Whitefish Bay

d.
e.
f.

g-
h.

j-

Door County 
Outagamie County 
Barron County 
Portage County 
Ashland County 
Pierce County 
Milwaukee County 
Sauk County 
Rock County 
Buffalo County

Find the answers at the public library.

Kewaskum Public 206 First Street

Created by the Division for Library Services, 
Wisconsin Department of Public Instruction, 1990.

ROGER & DAN’S 
AUTO SERVICE

“Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area”

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum nnn^YfAU
626-2888

24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE

BACKTOYOU- 
GOODASNEW!
Fender benders to major 
damage—we can fix it.
Put your car in our 
care and let our 
experts handle 
the job!

3458 Trap Shoot Lane, West Bend

^^^^
3384)379

•Unibody Repair
• ASE Certified 

Technicians
• High Tech 

Equipment
• Infra-Red 

Paint curing
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5 Flag Burning Laws Defensible

By Senator Don Stitt

This week the U.S. Supreme 
Court struck down a federal law 
against desecrating the U.S. 
flag. This is the second time in a 
year that the high court has 
declared such laws as 
unconstitutional.

Last summer the Supreme 
Court also invalidated a Texas 
statute that would have held 
people accountable for burning 
U.S. flags.

In their 5 to 4 decision, the 
Supreme Court maintained that 
the federal law, like the Texas 
statute, was a violation of the 
First Amendment’s guarantee 
of freedom of speech.

While I understand the free 
speech arguments employed by 
the Supreme Court, I believe 
that any desecration of the U.S. 
flag, which is a symbol of our 
freedom and democracy, is a 
shameful act.

The high court’s decision is 
unfortunate in the sense that I 
believe each state in the nation 
ought to have the right to enact 
flag burning statutes.

Fortunately, Congress is in 
the process of considering a 
constitutional amendment that 
would empower the states to do 
this.

The twenty words of the 
proposed amendment are as 
follows: “The Congress and the 
States shall have power to 
prohibit the physical 
desecration of the flag of the 
United States.’’

From all indications, a floor 
vote on this constitutional 
amendment, or a similar 
variation of this amendment, is 
due soon.

If passed, Wisconsin should 
be among the first states in the 
nation to draft and pass a flag

WANTED- 
ALUMINUM 

CANS 
FOR RECYCLING I

Also buying copper, brass, aluminum, lead batteries, cardboard and iron
Prices subject to change without notice 

DELIVER TO

LYNN’S WASTEPAPER CO., INC.
121 Island Ave., West Bend 334-9542

Open Daily 7 a.m. to 4 p.m.; Saturday 7 a.m. to noon

DON’S ELECTRIC
Don Scheid, Owner 

NEW CONSTRUCTION OR REMODELING

Update your old 60 amp fuse box with 
100 amp service and circuit breaker box

•Residential •Commercial
•Industrial Wiring 

^Quality Work ^Reasonable Rates ^Free Estimates 
__________ PHONE 334-7565_______ ___  

**‘NOTICE*** 

Quality Concrete 
& Excavating, Inc. 

will be doing the 
city sidewalks soon. 

if anyone desires any additional 
private work, please call: 

414-596-3306 
✓DRIVEWAYS ✓PATIOS 

✓SERVICE WALKS

burning law.
Many proponents of free 

speech are now taking it upon 
themselves to conduct public 
displays of flag burning as a 
symbolic measure of their right 
to desecrate the flag.

This is an astonishing abuse 
of one symbol, our flag, in order 
to exercise a symbolic 
expression of free speech. 
Regardless of the Supreme 
Court’s ruling, burning our 
country’s flag is vulgar 
defamation.

All you have to do is turn on 
your television set and watch 
what kind of people burn flags 
in other countries. Lately, it’s 
been freedom seekers who, in 
liberation against communism 
and socialism, are burning flags 
in public squares to show their 
solidarity against tyranny.

According to First 
Amendment advocates, that is 
not what American citizens are 
doing when they burn our flags. 
Rather, they are exercising a 
guaranteed right — and 
providing to the rest of the 
world that American 
democracy, of all things, is 
tolerant.

Tolerance is fine, but abuse 
of a flag that symbolizes the 
very roots of this tolerance is 
wrong and disrespectful.

For others who burn the flag 
out of frustration about United 
States government - well, go 
ahead and do it. However, these 
flag desecraters should be 
penalized for their actions.

Our democracy has a number 
of outlets for dissident opinions. 
Burning the flag is an 
ineffective and useless 
expression of an individual’s 
desire to change things in this 
country.

Moraine Park Has 
Lowest Student 
Loan Default Rate

Moraine Park Technical 
College has the lowest student 
loan default rate among 
Wisconsin Vocational, 
Technical and Adult Education 
districts for the second year in a 
row.

The Department of Education 
recently informed Moraine Park 
that the college loan default rate 
for fiscal year 1988-89 was 4.8 
percent. That means that of the 
330 student borrowers from 
Moraine Park repaying loans for 
that year, 16 defaulted. Of the 
$709,402 in repayment for 1988, 
the 16 defaulted borrowers owe 
$28,639 - an average of $1,800 
per student.

Numerous efforts to advise 
students of the consequences of 
debt and how to manage debt 
seems to have paid off for 
Moraine Park according to 
Katie Soles, vice president of 
student services. She pointed 
out that Moraine Park’s default 
rate of 4.8 percent is well below 
the national average of 15.6 
percent as determined by the 
United States Department of 
Education.

Before Moraine Park 
students take out a student 
loan they are required to view a 
videotape on the loan process 
and participate in an entrance 
loan counseling session, Soles 
said. Before leaving school, 
students are required to attend 
a debt management counseling 
session or receive a packet of 
information relative to loan 
repayment, or both.

Moraine Park also sends a 
letter to students who have 
been referred to the guarantee 
agency for collection assistance 
urging them to contact their 
lending institutions before they 
reach default status, Soles 
explained.

As a last resort, Moraine Park 
withholds records of students 
when notified that the students 
are defaulting on their loans. 
These students are assisted in 
contacting the guarantee 
agency to arrange for 
repayment, Soles said.

An informal study by 
Moraine Park's Financial Aid 
Office reveals that, typically, it

JIM SCHAUB 
“for the repair job that's 

been put off for too long’’

P.O. Box 177 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040

r HOME \ 
IMPROVEMENT

Garages/Garage Doors/Remodeling 
Siding/Storm Doors/Storm Windows 

Decks/Roofing

626-8227

•Front discharge ready mix trucks
•Delivery available Saturdays
•Radio dispatch

KLOKE 
READY MIX, Inc.
528 Elmore Dr., Campbellsport, Wl 

533-8034

is students who do not graduate 
who default on their student 
loans. “Most students who 
complete their courses of study 
at Moraine Park are very 
responsible about repaying 
loans,’’ Soles said.

Moraine Park has three 
campuses located in Beaver 
Dam, Fond du Lac and West 
Bend, as well as 16 instructional 
centers. The Moraine Park 
Vocational, Technical and Adult 
Education district includes all of 
Fond du Lac and Green Lake 
counties; most of Dodge and 
Washington counties; and 
portions of Calumet, Columbia, 
Marquette, Sheboygan, 
Waushara and Winnebago 
counties.

Prevention of 
Food Poisoning

It’s picnic season! How can 
you be sure your foods are safe 
to eat in hot, summer weather? 
Here are three ways to prevent 
food poisoning by handling food 
properly.

A basic rule is to KEEP HOT 
FOOD HOT and COLD FOOD 
COLD. Germs multiply very 
quickly at in-between 
temperatures, and they can 
cause food poisoning.

Foods which must be kept on 
ice include dairy foods, eggs, 
and salads with creamy 
dressings. A good tip for 
hotdogs or sandwich meat is to 
freeze them ahead; they will 
thaw on the way to the picnic. 
They will still be plenty cold 
when you are ready to use 
them. For sandwiches, pack the 
meat separately from other 
sandwich makings. Then, put 
the whole sandwich together 
minutes before you eat. The 
lettuce will be crisp, and the 
bread will not be soggy, and the 
mayonnaise can also be kept 
cold so all the sandwich 
makings will be safe to eat.

Those who like to grill 
chicken or ribs away from home 
would be wise to precook the 
meat. Meats should be well 
chilled on ice and packed 
separately from other foods so 
that meat juices will not 
contaminate other foods. 
Precooking can also insure that 
food is thoroughly cooked. Just

•Commercial 
•Residential 
•Farm

because the outside is well done 
does not mean the center is 
adequately cooked. Keep extra 
meats warm on the edge of the 
grill rather than let them sit out 
at air temperature. Char-broil­
ing or adding barbecue sauce on 
the grill will add flavor and color 
to the precooked meats.

A second basic rule is to keep 
foods as germ-free as possible. 
Pack plenty of utensils for 
serving. If a serving spoon is 
passed from one dish to the 
next, germs will also be spread. 
Each dish should have its own 
utensil.

Children love to help prepare 
and serve foods. Double check 
that their hands are clean. Also 
remind them not to put their 
“used" utensils into a serving 
dish!

Keep items such as relish 
trays and salads covered until 
serving time, and recover them 
right away when people are not 
being served. Bugs enjoys 
picnics too!

Finally, throw out any foods 
that have been sitting out at 
room or air temperature. For 
foods that spoil easily, bring 
only the amount of food you 
think can be eaten when fresh 
rather than a large amount. 
Bring plenty of foods that do not 
spoil, like popcorn, pretzels, 
peanutbutter and bread, 
cookies or cake. Any food that 
can spoil easily and has been at 
air temperature for even half an 
hour may have enough germs to 
give you food poisoning.

Keep your family's food safe 
this summer!

For further information on 
food safety, contact Melanie 
Yager, Washington County 
Summer Home Economist, P.O. 
Box 1986, West Bend 53095.

LOWER 
ENERGY BILLS!

Higher efficiency can save you 
money on energy bills If vourokl 
system is IS years old or more your 
new lempstar system could actually 
piy for itself in a tew .cars

A New Tempstar 
System Can Pay 
for Itself!

HIH

I
L

Tempstar Heating t Cooling Systems

A new lempstar heating and cooling 
system can save \ou monev even 
month you operate it A lempstar 
system tan bring comfort to your 
home and to your mind because it s 
going to last a good longtime hall 
your lempstar dealer and ask about 
the savings you ran obtain from a full 
lempstar system

■ Upto94.l%I.C.S. A.MM.
Mooting Efficiency

■Upto 12 S.E.E.R. Cooling Efficiency

TEMPSTA4
Heating and Cooling Products

LK. HEATING
& AIR CONDITIONING

357 Main St., Kewaskum
626-4342



Ten-Year Stewardship Program 
For Land Conservation Begun

TODAY’S AGRICULTURE
By Jack Trzebiatowski, Extension Agriculture Agent

What You Don’t Know 
Can Hurt You

MADISON, WI - The 
Stewardship Program, a 
10-year, $250 million conserva­
tion land acquistion program 
administered by the Depart­
ment of Natural Resources, 
began July 1, 1990.

The Stewardship Program 
was created by the 1989 
Wisconsin Legislature and 
earmarks $25 million each year 
through the 1990s to purchase 
land, provide recreation 
opportunities, restore and 
preserve wildlife habitat, and 
protect water quality statewide.

The $25 million available for 
Stewardship each year will be 
divided among 11 programs, 
providing for a variety of land 
acquisition and conservation 
efforts. The 11 programs and 
their yearly funding are as 
follows:

* General Land Acquisition 
— $8.9 million for unspecified 
land acquisition, with an 
emphasis on lands located 
within department project 
boundaries.

* Property Development — 
$3.5 million for recreational 
development in public use 
areas, with an emphasis on 
bringing existing facilities up to 
standard.

* Wildlife Habitat 
Restoration Areas — $1.5 
million to enhance wildlife - 
based recreation, including 
hunting, fishing, nature 
appreciation and wildlife 
watching. Emphasis will be on 
wetland and grassland restora­
tion.

* Local Park Aids — $2.25 
million for the existing Local 
Park Aid program (the 1989-90 
funding was $830,000) to 
provide local units of 
government with money for 
park acquisition and develop­
ment.

* Urban Green Spaces — 
$750,000 for grants to local 
governments and nonprofit 
organizations to provide open 
natural space near urban areas, 
protect natural features having 
scenic or ecological value, or to 
provide space for non­
commercial gardening.

♦ Lower Wisconsin State 
Riverway — $2 million to 
acquire lands in accordance 
with the Master Plan developed 
for the riverway.

* State Trails — $1 million to 
develop trails on existing DNR 
lands and to provide grants to 
nonprofit conservation organi­
zations to acquire lands for 
trails.

• Ice Age Trail — $500,000 to 
acquire or develop the Ice Age 
Trail and to provide match 
grants to nonprofit organiza­
tions to acquire land for the 
trail.

* Stream Bank Easements — 
$1 million to acquire

streambank easements to 
protect water quality and fish 
habitat, with emphasis on 
streams where water quality is 
affected by urban and agri­
cultural runoff.

* Natural Areas Acquisition 
— $1.5 million to continue land 
acquisition under the existing 
Natural Areas program and 
provide grants to nonprofit 
conservation organizations to 
acquire lands.

* Natural Areas Heritage 
Program — $500,000 to the 
existing Heritage Program. 
When land or money is donated 
to the Natural Areas program,

Barn and Silo Fires
A number of Farm and Silo 

fires occur each year in 
Wisconsin due to spontaneous 
ignition. This is a real concern 
when hay is stored at wetter 
than normal temperatures in 
barns or dryer than normal, 
temperatures in silos.

Weather conditions for

an equal 
released 
allocation 
purchase

amount of money is 
from the Heritage

for the DNR to
addition lands for

Natural Areas.
Also through the Stewardship 

Program, nonprofit organi­
zations have an opportunity to 
share land stewardship 
responsibility with the DNR. 
The Stewardship Program 
includes a grant program that 
provides up to a total $9 million 
each year in 50 percent match 
grants to qualifying nonprofit 
conservation organizations.

Nonprofit conservation 
groups will be able to apply for 
grants in five Stewardship
programs: 
restoration,

wildlife habitat 
stream bank

protection, trails, natural areas 
and urban green space. The 
first grants are anticipated to be 
made early in 1991.

The Stewardship Program is 
funded through the sale of 
general obligation bonds.

For more information contact: 
Bureau of Property Manage­
ment - 608-266-2135.

Priority Watersheds 
And Soil Erosion

In the 1
Sheboygan 
Winnebago 
Watersheds 
eligible for 
conservation

Milwaukee
River,
East 

fields

River, 
and

Shore
may be

cost sharing of 
practices. Cost

sharing is not based on the 
amount of soil eroding from a 
field, but on the amount of 
sediment and pollutants which 
actually enters a watercourse. 
Present and potential water 
quality has been assessed in 
these watersheds. Based on this 
assessment, reasonable water 
quality goals from reduction of 
this sediment are set. To reach 
these goals, the fields 
delivering the highest amounts 
of sediment are eligible for cost 
sharing of conservation 
practices.

One conservation practice

$46,900
Two bedroom ranch with 
one car attached garage. 
14 acre lot. Country, but 
close to town.

$16,000
Fully improved village lot

Kirst Builders
626-4392

411 Main St.
Kewaskum, WI

making dry hay have not been 
very favorable this season, 
frequent rain falls have made it 
difficult for farmers to get hay 
to dry down properly for storage 
in barns.

Hay that has a moisture 
content of 30 percent or greater 
is a potential fire hazard. 
Whether the hay starts to burn 
or not depends mainly on the 
size of the pile and the materials 
surrounding it. If the pile cools 
as fast as heat is generated, it 
turns brown and possibly 
moldy. If there is enough of a 
pile around the hot spot to 
prevent the escape of heat a fire 
can occur.

Hay with higher moisture 
content can be stored in a barn 
if preservatives are used. These 
preservatives can reduce the 
growth of mold and keep 
temperatures from getting high 
enough to develop into a fire.

Many times people recognize 
that a mow of hay is heating up

and wonder whether or not 
there is a need to take action to 
prevent fire from developing.

One way of monitoring the 
situation is to use a temperature 
probe and measure changes in, 
temperature. This should be 
approached carefully as there is 
danger in walking on a stack of 
hot hay without taking proper 
precaution.

If temperatures of 130
degrees or higher are measured 
the hay should be watched 
carefully for changes in 
temperature. If the temperature 
climbs to a 160 degrees 
Fahrenheit it should be 
rechecked every 2 to 3 hours. If
temperatures reach 190
degrees Fahrenheit local Fire 
Department officials should be 
notified and arrangements 
made to remove the hay from 
the building.

If a temperature hay probe is 
not available an iron rod may be 
driven into the material and left 
for 15-20 minutes. If after

MILWAUKEE - What you 
DON’T know CAN hurt you 
when working around electric 
power lines.

Before clearing the way for a 
new swimming pool or perform 
ing major garden surgery, 
Wisconsin Electric Power Co. 
customers should be sure to call 
the Diggers Hotline or MISS 
DIG for information about 
electric lines.

“With warmer weather upon 
us and everyone working 
outdoors, the chances of 
contacting underground lines 
are much greater than during 
winter. We need to be sure that 
our customers all are aware of 
the potential hazards, even in 
their own backyards,’’ said 
Bob Steinhart, WE coordinator 
of construction.

“It’s just as important to look 
up and look out for overhead 
lines,’’ he said. “Any contact 
risks injury or even death.’’

Steinhart said that most 
contacts occur between 
overhead lines and dump trucks 
or tandem trucks that move with

Kew
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withdrawing the rod it is to 
to hold in your hand 
situation is critical.

Individuals interested

hot 
the

in

their boxes raised, 
also is a risk of 
underground lines 
digging project.

but there 
contacting 
during a

more information can contact 
the County Extension Office for 
Publication A2805 “Prevent 
Hay Mow and Silo Fires.’’

eligible for cost sharing is 
conservation tillage. The cost 
share rate is a one time 
payment of $15.00 per acre for 
fields with a rotation involving 
hay, and $45.00 per acre, 
divided over a three year 
period, for continuous row crop 
fields. Conservation tillage is 
the practice of leaving crop 
residue on the soil surface after 
planting the next years crop. It 
gives farmers the opportunity to 
cut production expenses while 
reducing soil erosion losses. 
Conservation tillage systems 
also offer good field and 
rotation flexibility, time 
savings, better use of available 
moisture, and usually requires 
few equipment changes.

Farmers can select from a 
range of conservation tillage 
systems. Chisel plows, discs, 
and other implements can be 
used to leave crop residue. 
Tillage systems should be 
matched to the soil and growing 
conditions. On many farms a 
combination of tillage systems 
may work best. Further 
information on conservation 
tillage systems and other 
conservation practices can be 
obtained at the Fond du Lac 
County Land Conservation 
Office at 923-3033.

Customers should contact the 
Diggers Hotline (259-1181 in 
the Milwaukee metropolitan 
area or 1-800-242-8511 else­
where in Wisconsin) or MISS 
DIG (1-800-482-7171 in 
Michigan) to have underground 
utility lines located and marked 
before beginning a digging 
project.

If you could harness 
the energy in an average 
lightning bolt, you could 
heat or cool your home 
for about two months.

■OY IT 01 UU. IT - MIRE IT OR RUT IT 
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NOTICE TO THE PUBLIC

Thinking of Buying or Selling?
GO TO THE TOP! 
Call Bev Kirchner

★ Full Time Realtor
★ Top Producer 1989
★ Sales Associate of the Year for 1987 and 1988
★ Million Dollar Producer

Find out what your home is worth
Call me for a free market analysis today!

Looking for a new home?
Let my 16 years in real estate go to work for you

COLDUUCU. 
BANKER □

SPECTRUM
REAL ESTATE

Give me a call today
Office: 334-3334
Home: 626-4848

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN by the Wisconsin Employment Rela­
tions Commission that, on June 25, 1990 pursuant to the provisions 
of Sec. 111.70 (4) (cm) of the Municipal Employment Relations Act, 
the Commission appointed an arbitrator to resolve a deadlock in 
negotiation between:

Kewaskum School District 
and

Kewaskum Auxiliary Personnel
The collective bargaining unit involved consists of:

all regular full-time and regular part-time educational support staff; 
Said deadlock concerns wages, hours and conditions of employment 
to be included in a new collective bargaining agreement by the is­
suance of a final and binding arbitration award based on the final 
offers of the parties. The name and address of the appointed arbitrator 
is as follows:

Mr. David B. Johnson, Professor 
Department of Economics 
University of Wisconsin 
Madison, WI 53706

ANY PERSON who desires a copy of the final offers of the parties 
and cannot otherwise obtain same, may obtain copies by requesting 
same, in writing, from the Wisconsin Employment Relations Com­
mission, P.O. Box 7870, Madison, Wisconsin 53707-7870, and pay­
ing the cost of reproduction plus postage.

YOU ARE FURTHER ADVISED that pursuant to the provisions 
of Sec. 111.70 (4) (cm)6.b. any five citizens of the jurisdiction serv­
ed by the above-named Municipal Employer may file a petition, within 
ten days of the appointment of the arbitrator, with the Wisconsin 
Employment Relations Commission, P.O. Box 7870, Madison, 
Wisconsin 53707-7870, requesting that a public hearing be scheduled 
by the arbitrator for the purpose of providing the opportunity to both 
parties to explain or present supporting arguments for their respec­
tive positions and to members of the public to offer their comments 
and suggestions. A copy of such petition shall be served on the par­
ties and the arbitrator.

SUCH PETITION MUST BE RECEIVED BY THE COMMISSION ON 
OR BEFORE JULY 5, 1990

No 26484 A
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Put Yourself in the pi ANjmpni! 
Marketplace, in the wmASSIFIEDS

ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE
RATE: $2.00 up to 20 words; over 20 words ■ add 10c per word

NEW CLASSIFIED AD POLICY
All classified ads must now be paid in advance. Classified ads phoned in or brought 
to our office must be paid by noon on Tuesday of the week you want the ad publish­
ed. The ONLY exception will be for those businesses who have regular running ac­
counts with the Statesman.

WORK WANTED — Lloyd’s 
Home Maintenance. No job too 
small. Repairs, remodeling, 
carpentry, painting, varnishing, 
wallpaper, woodgraining, 
ceramic tile, etc. Lloyd M.

People believe if a spider 
swings down in front of 
you, you will hear good 
news.Ebert. 533-8013. 1-23-tf

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 626- 
2888.

ANTIQUE HOUSEHOLD SALE 
— Wooden duck decoys, library 
and round tables, crocks, dishes 

some antique, many 
household items too numerous 
to mention. No checks please. 
July 5, 6, 7 & 8 from 8:00 to 5:00 
at 1608 Fond du Lac Ave.

6-28-2p

HELP WANTED — Full-time 
position — brushing, mowing 
roadway, signing, snow 
plowing, mechanical repair of 
equipment, patching, general 
road maintenance. Salary & 
benefits negotiable. Fill out 
application, include resume. 
Contact Town of Kewaskum, 
George Allmann, 626-4716, for 
applications. Applications taken

FARM HELP WANTED — Full 
or part time on dairy farm. 
Housing available. Call 533-
8420. 7-5-2t

HELP WANTED — Full time 
nursing assistant 2nd shift. Call 
St. Joseph’s Convent, 
Campbellsport, 533-8351. 7-5-lt

STUMP REMOVAL — Reason­
able rates, free estimate. Tom
Clark 626-2513. 5-24-tf

State of Wisconsin
Circuit Court
Washington County
Probate

NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS

IN THE MATTER OF THE 
ESTATE OF HILDEGARD R.

BICYCLES — Sales and 
Service, 208 North Ave., 
Kewaskum Wally’s Bike Shop.

WANTED TO BUY — One girls 
bike with training wheels, 16” 
or 18” and one used coaster 
wagon. Call 626-4413. 4-25-tf

KOHN, 
KOHN 
KOHN,

a/k/a HILDEGARDE
AND HILDEGARD 

Deceased.
File No. 90-IF-259

RUMMAGE SALE at St. 
Matthew's Catholic Church. 
Campbellsport on Kraze Daze, 
Monday, July 9 from 9:00 a.m. 
to 2:00 p.m. Used folding chairs

to July 30. 7-5-2t

will also be sold. 7-5-Ip

SCHOOL BUS DRIVERS 
WANTED — For Kewaskum 
School District, apply at 3618 
Hwy. 28E, or call 626-4414. 
Now training for the coming

RUMMAGE SALE 1270 1990/91 school year. 7-5-tf
Brooklane Dr., Thurs.. Fri., & 
Sat., July 12, 13 & 14, from 8 to 
5. Clothing - baby to age 12,

WANTED TO RENT — Or rent 
to own, by Aug. 15, 3 to 4

WANTED TO BUY
IMMEDIATE CASH PAID 

Cash paid for one item or entire 
estate. Always looking for wood 
furniture, old tools, crocks, 
decoys, trunks, fish lures, toys 
and toy tractors, glassware, 
quilts, lamps, cookbooks, etc. 
Top prices paid — before you 
throw it out or sell it, check with 
me, Jim Walter, 533-8731.4-1-tf

REDUCE: Burn off fat while 
you sleep. Take OPAL available 
at Kennelly Pharmacy. 6-7-5p

toys, lots of misc. 7-5-2t

DO YOUR CHILDREN A 
FAVOR! Buy WORLD BOOK 
Ency. during BIG WEEK! Help 

them get answers to their 
questions, not the teacher’s, 
during the summer. 533-4068.

______________________ 7-5-2p

bedroom 
"fixer-upper” 
Kewaskum to 
Call 338-0113.

farmhouse, 
ideal, prefer 

Waucousta area. 
__________7-5-3p

WANTED TO RENT — 3 to 4 
bedroom house, Kewaskum 
school district. Call 922-0403
after 2:00 p.m. 6-28-2p

FOR SALE 
2-Door Cooler

Waukesha Zero Zone 
Self-Contained 

$995 
626-4565

An application has been filed 
for Informal Administration of 
the estate of the above named 
person. Washington County, 
Wisconsin, whose post office 
address was 361 Clinton Street, 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin 53040

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
All creditors’ claims must be 

filed on or before September 19. 
1990, or be barred.

By The Court: 
Kristine M. Deiss 
Probate Registrar 
June 19, 1990

Schloemer, Alderson, Seefeldt, 
Spella & Shanebrook, S.C.
P.O. Box 176
West Bend, WI 53095

KETTLE MORAINE
6-28-3t

FOR SALE — 1981 AMC Spirit 
4-speed, A/C, $450. Call 
626-824?. _____  7-5-2p

FOR SALE Three piece
davenport set, blue and beige, 
electric clothes dryer, wringer 
washer, stereo. Call 626-2704.

____  ______________7-5-3p

BUNNIES — For sale. Beautiful 
English Angora s, 9 weeks old, 
great family pets. Breeding 
stock available. Call 921-8104.

______ 7-5-Ip

FOR SALE — 1 Canary and 1 
grey Cockatiel. Take one or 
both. Best offer, cages not 
included. 533-8833 after 4 p.m.

7-5-Ip

FOR SALE — Ice shanty, 5x8, 
two holes, at Long Lake. Call
533-4193 after 5. 6-28-2p

FOR SALE 1978 Buick
Century - good condition. 626-
2370. 6-28-3t

TRUCK FOR SALE 1979
Ford Bronco 4x4 lock-outs, 
sunroof, push bar, auto, 
AM-FM stereo, tinted windows, 
40,000 miles. Call after 4 p.m.
692-2068. 6-28-2p

FOR SALE Three-section
spring tooth, 8-foot disc, corn 
planter, cement mixer, 50-foot 
belt, calf crate, beef feeder, flat
rack. 626-2702. 6-28-2p

SALES AND SERVICE — TV, 
radio, stereo, satellite antenna, 
TV antenna, and VCR - head 
cleaning & repair. Reasonable 
rates. R.B. Electronics - 626-
8019. 8-18-alt.

LAWN CARE — Will do lawn 
care, mowing, fertilizing, tilling 
etc. 13 years old. Two years 
experience. Have references. 
Call Rick Wulff 626-4015. 7-5-2p

IMPROVEMENTS — Roofing, 
siding, general repair, 
remodeling, gutters, etc. Gery
R. Schweder, 338-0814. 7-5-tf

FARMERS and SELF- 
EMPLOYED — Low group rate 
health insurance and over 100 
other benefits are enjoyed by 
over 200,000 members of 
NASE. Call Larry after 5:00 
p.m. 414-475-0985 or send 
name and phone number to 
NASE Enroller, P.O. Box 
13072, Wauwatosa, WI 
53213-1172. 7-5-2p

HELP WANTED — Part-time 
work at local stable, previous 
experience working with the 
public or operating farm 
machinery helpful. Call 626-
4096 if qualified.

HELP WANTED

6-28-2t

Nursing
assistants, part-time, all shifts. 
Some openings for every other 
weekend. Call St. Joseph’s 
Convent, Campbellsport, 533-
8351. 6-28-2t

HELP WANTED • HORSES - 
Girl to work weekend mornings, 
cleaning stalls, grooming, etc.
Call 533-5028. 6-28-It

BABYSITTER WANTED — For 
two boys age seven and three, 
from 6:45 to 3:30. Call after 4:00
p.m. Ph. 533-8990. 6-28-Ip

HELP WANTED — Full-time 
LPN needed primarily 3rd shift, 
occasional 2nd shift. Call 
Beechwood Rest
994-4717 or 626-4258.

Home, 
6-13-tf

HELP WANTED
SECRETARY, 
position available 
seeking person 
with IBM,

full-time 
in law firm, 
experienced 
compatible 
perfect 5.1 
equipment.

computers, word 
and transcription .
Shorthand also preferred but 
not essential. Send resume to 
McKenna & Kiefer, P.O. Box 
550 Kewaskum, WI 53040.

6-14-tf

FOR RENT — One, two and 
three bedroom apartments and 
townhouses. Rustic Timbers 
Apartments. Ph. 334-1395.

6-21-tf

HAVE BUYERS — For country 
or village homes within 3 miles 
of Kewaskum. If you are 
thinking of selling call Ann 
Enright. RE/MAX Realtors 
334-7411 or 692-2607 collect.

9-19-tf

RF/WBC 
of West Bend 

2364 W. Washington St.

^'

* Lan^f

338-5656

CRAFTERS 
interested in 
items retail, 
evenings at 
4518.

— Are you 
selling your craft 
If so, contact us 
626-4565 or 626- 

3-25-tf

CONCRETE WORK — Drive­
ways, sidewalks. patios, 
basements and garages. 626-
4367. 5-10-tf

APPLIANCE DOLLY — for rent 
$5.00 per day. KL Home and 
Hardware, Hwy. 45 South 
Kewaskum. 626-2164. 4-26-tf

SEASONED FIREWOOD — 
100'"< oak or mixed hardwood. 8 
ft. lengths, by the semi-load, 
10-11 cords, $60. Also cut & 
split $45 face cord, $120 full 
cord. Call Ray Herriges, 692-
2289 or 533-4165. 10-6-tf

2 PRIME RESIDENTIAL 
BUILDING LOTS — Near park. 
Village of Kewaskum, 
improvements, for sale by 
owner. Cail 626-4062. 6-14-tf

RESIDENTIAL — Building lots 
for sale. Approximately four 
miles north of West Bend. 
Terms: Call 334-7306. 
Licensee/Owner. 2-24-tf

SCREEN and WINDOW 
REPAIR — KL Home and 
Hardware, Hwy. 45 South, 
Kewaskum. Phone 626-2164.

FOR SALE — Finest quality 
seasoned red and white oak, 
cut, split and delivered. $105. 
Inspections welcome. Ph. 477- 
7322. 10-27-tf

SPACIOUS CONDO
Luxury space galore in this 2-story condo in 
Kewaskum Open stairway, built-in china 
cabinet. 1% baths, laundry room, 
underground parking for 2 cars, quality 
throughout Near golf course Ask for Ann 
Enright 692 2607 #402

CONTEMPORARY MULTI LEVEL 
Town of Farmington

Ideal home for active family Stone fireplace 
in family room Rec room has woodstove and 
patio doors leading to 1 7 acre yard with above 
ground pool 4 bedrooms. 2 full and 2 half 
baths Huge country kitchen Quality 
throughout Only $119 900 Ask for Ann 
Enright 692 2607 #32

2 FIREPLACES WOODS 
Town of Farmington 

Immaculate bi level in country subdivision 1 % 
acre partially wooded lot on end of < ul dn ' ac 
Vaulted ceiling in living room Huge family 
room, formal dining. 3 bedrooms #16 Ask for 
Ann Enright 692 260 7

M
r

««»;A

HOME ANO BUSINESS/KEWASKUM
5832 sq H commercial building and showroom 2 plus acres Insulated and heated 
Possibilities unlimited for retail or wholesale business Well maintained 1800 sq ft home 
3 bedrooms, main floor family room with natural fireplace Newly redone kitchen with built- 
in oven/range and dishwasher Close to village and 4 5 Bypass $183 900 Call Gloria Serwe 
626-2880 K22

TJWP

PRICE REDUCED $69,900 
Store/Duplex

Great investment opportunity Two residential 
units plus 668 sq ft store or office etc Busy 
Mam Street location 3 bedroom lower unit. 2 
bedroom upper Perfect for home business 
Kewaskum Ask for Ann Enright 692-2607 
#301

VACANT LAND
Wooded and rolling - 3 acre building site for your dream home 1 acre woods, several building 
sites Easy Highway 45 access tor commuters The Kettle Moraine ai its finest $27,900 
Ask for Ann Enright. 692-2607 #P220

Werner Drive ■ village lot x 128 ft frontage $20,000 Call Gloria Serwe 626-2880 #240 
Valley View Dr ■ 7 94 acres. Kettle Moraine, wooded Call Gloria Serwe 626-2880 #238 
Secluded 33 acres Pond, river frontage. $39,500 Call Gloria Serwe 626-2880 #215 
Wesley Estates; Town of Farmington 3 acres wooded $22,900 Call Ann 692-2607 #207 
Cui de Sac Kewaskum Village lot Next to open country $18,900 Call Ann 692-2607 #205 
1 Acre, north of West Bend ■ Only $8,000 Call Ann Enright 692-2607 #211 
Country Subdivision 1 acre lot, $10,000 Call Ann Enright 692-2607 #66
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Minutes of Village 
Board Meeting

Regular Meeting 
June 18, 1990 
8:00 P.M.

The Village Board of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wisconsin, met in 
Regular Session in the Council Rixim of 
the Municipal Building, 204 First Street.

President Paul Blumer presided. Trustee 
Larry Williams was absent, all other 
Trustee members were present. A quorum 
was present.

The meeting was opened with a moment 
of silence and Pledge of Allegiance.

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton, seconded by Trustee Robert 
Beisbier and unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the minutes of June 4, 1990 were 
approved as printed.

A public hearing was held on the special 
assessments for municipal improvements 
(repair and replacement of curb/gutter and 
sidewalks) as noticed. Two property 
owners were in attendance and directed 
various questions to the Board and the 
Village Engineer Kenneth Ward

On a motion by Robert Beisbier, 
seconded by Trustee Gary Gavin and car­
ried by majority roll vote, the Board closed 
the public hearing for the repair and 
replacement of curb/gutter and sidewalks 
as noticed. Roll call vote was 6 "Aye," 
0 “Nay.” 1 "Absent."

On a motion by Trustee Gary Gavin, 
seconded by Trustee Mary Krueger and 
carried by majority roll call vote, the 
Board suspended the rules to consider IX. 
B. & VIII. A., a Unai resolution regar­
ding sidewalk repair/replacement/im- 
provements and engineers recommenda­
tion on the awarding of the capital im­
provements sidewalk rehabilitation con­
tract. Roll call vote was 6 “Aye." 0 
"Nay,” I "Absent."

Action was taken on Resolution No. 
90-17, a Final Resolution Regarding 
Sidewalk Repair/Replacement/Im- 
provements and Levying Special 
Assessments Against Benefited Property 
as heard at public hearing and as attach­
ed hereto:

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton, seconded by Kenneth 
Bonlender and unanimously carried by 
majority roll call vote, the Board approv­
ed the awarding of the contract for the 
aforementioned municipal improvements 
bid on May 24, 1990. Engineer Kenneth 
Ward recommended awarding the contract 
to Quality Concrete, Manawa, W1 the low 
bidder at a cost of $55,799.37. The 
Village Administrator/Clerk and Village 
President were authorized to sign that 
contract.

A public hearing was conducted on the 
applications for two Combination Class 
“B" Fermented Melt Beverage and Intox­
icating Liquor Licenses renewals. There 
were no objections from the floor to any 
of the applications as publicly noticed and 
read. The Police Department had no ob­
jections to either of the applications at this 
time. On a motion by Trustee Kenneth 
Bonlender. seconded by Trustee Robert 
Beisbier to close the public hearing. Roil 
call vote was 6 "Aye.” 0 "Nay." 1 “Ab­
sent.”

Chief of Police Richard Knoebel in­
formed the Board that the Village may be 
mandated in the near future to offer 
hepatitis B shots to its Fire/Police/DPW 
personnel. The projected cost would be 
$110.00 per employee for a series of three 
shots. The office was instructed to check 
into the possibility of our insurance car­

riers coverage in this instance.
The Chief also brought up the problem 

being experienced in the Kiwanis Park 
regarding vehicular traffic in and around 
the baseball diamonds and concession 
stands. It was the consensus of the Board 
that only one vehicle be allowed per con­
cession stand for loading or unloading pur­
poses. Any other vehicles or traffic may 
be subject to citations from the police 
department .

Superintendent of Public Works Augie 
Bilgo informed the Board that the Bonnie 
kLane water/sewer installation was pro­
ceeding as planned until today, due to a 
strike by heavy equipment operators. It is 
not anticipated the strike situation will be 
long standing.

On a motion by Gary Gavin, seconded 
by Trustee Thomas McElhatton and 
unanimously carried by voice vote, the 
Board approved the applications for 
Operator’s Licenses upon proper payment 
of fees and authorized the office to issue 
said licenses for 90/91 as follows:

Backhaus, Victor - Kewaskum. WI 
Capelle, ShaiamarT. - Campbellsport,

Wl
’Gross, Judy M. - Kewaskum, Wl 
Kempf, Leander F. - Kewaskum. WI 
Koch. Harry E. - Kewaskum. WI 
Marchant, Jeanne A. - Kewaskum, Wl 
Roecker, Harry E. - Kewaskum, WI 
Roecker, Lori A. - Kewaskum, WI 
Rohlinger, Beverly M. - Kewaskum,

Wl
Rohlinger, Kathy M. - Kewaskum. WI 
Rohlinger. Timothy J. - Kewaskum. WI 
Schneider. Diane M. - Kewaskum, WI 
Strobel. Bernard - Kewaskum, WI 
**Struebing, Joan M. - Campbellsport, 

WI
* Indicates a New Operator License 
’’Indicates a Temporary Operator 

License (7/30/90 - 8/13/90)'
The balance of above applicants are 

renewal licenses.
Note: The Police Department had no 

objection to the applications.
A lengthy discussion came up under 

Park and Recreation regarding the situa­
tion at the Kiwanis Park concerning the 
Athletic Association Concession Stand. 
On a motion by Trustee Gary Gavin, 
seconded by Trustee Mary Krueger and 
unanimously carried by voice vote, the 
Board authorized the office to send a let­
ter to the Athletic Association c/o Harry 
Roecker, that the concession building must 
be brought up to code by Monday, June 
25, 1990. or the Board would take action 
to close its operation.

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton. seconded by Gary Gavin and 
carried by majority roll call vote, the 
Board approved the following applications 
tor Combination Class “B” Fermented 
Malt Beverage and Intoxicating Liquor 
Licenses for a period commencing July 1, 
1990 and ending June 30, 1991 upon pro­
per payment of fees. The Police Depart­
ment had no objection to the issuance of 
any license at this time and the Board 
authorized the office to issue said licenses. 
Roll cal) vote was 6 "Aye,” 0 “Nay,” 
I “Absent."

William J. Kulas. 109 Main Street, 
Kewaskum, WI
Robert G. Romaine Legion Post 384, 
1538 Fond du Lac Avenue. Kewaskum.
Wl

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton. seconded by Trustee Kenneth 
Bonlender and carried by the majority roll 
call vote, the Board adjourned the 
meeting. Roll call vote the 6 “Aye,” 0 
“Nay,” 1 “Absent.”

Janet L. Knops 
Deputy Clerk

Village Board 
Meeting Monday

Public notice is hereby given that 
the next meeting of the Village of 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin, Village 
Board is scheduled for Monday 
evening, July 9, 1990 at 8:00 p.m. 
in the Council Room of the 
Municipal Building, 204 First 
Street.

The agendas for meeting are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the clerk 
at the Municipal Building on 
Thursday preceding the meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and lobby 
of the Valley Bank.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

Liquor License 
Application

The following person has 
made an application for a 
Combination Class B Beer and 
Liquor License for the period of 
July 19, 1990 to June 30, 1991.

Lester E. Hahn, Sky Ranch 
Bar, 5121 Hwy. D, West Bend, 
WI 53095.

The above application will be 
heard and considered at a board 
meeting at 8:00 p.m. Wednes­
day, July 18, 1990.

Orville Kern, Clerk

Official Notice
PROPOSED AGENDA

There will be a Regular Meeting of the Kewaskum School District 
Board of Education on Monday, July 9, 1990. Said meeting to commence 
at 7:00 p.m. in the commons area at Kewaskum High School.

Anticipated agenda items will include the following:

I. Call to order-President Weare
II. Roll call

III. Pledge of allegiance
IV. Approval of agenda; deletions or corrections
V. Audience to visitors; receiving of delegations

VI. ACTION ITEMS
A. Approval of minutes from past meeting(s)
B. Committee Reports

I. Policy-Legislation-Bylaw Committee
a. First reading of the following policies: 

#346.3-Competency Testing of Limited English 
Proficiency (LEP) students

#346.4-Competency Testing of Exceptional
Educational Needs (EEN) Students 

#377.2-Academic Eligibility for Interscholastic
Competitive Activities

b. Next meeting date:
2. Finance-Transportation-Buildings and Grounds

a. Next meeting date: July 19, 1990 7:00 p.m.
C. New Business

I. Approval of payroll and accounts payable
2. Discussion and action concerning additional elementary 

guidance counselor for 90-91 school year-Mr. Weare-Donna 
Sleser

3. Discussion and action concerning air conditioning at 
Farmington Elementary School-Mr. Weare-Mr.& Mrs. Potter

4. Approval of hot lunch price increase for 90-91-Mrs. 
Robinson

5. Discussion and action concerning Language Arts adoption 
grades K-6-Mrs. Strand

6. Discussion and acceptance of 20 standard audit report- 
Dr. Heather

7. Discussion of instructional aides' effectiveness during 
89-90 school year-Mrs. Strand

8. Discussion and action concerning Quest training for 
Instructional staff In grades 1-4-Mrs. Strand

9. Approval of actolnlstratIve and confidential secretaries 
salaries for 90-91-Dr. Heather

10. Approval of assistant football coach-Dr. Heather
11. Approval of teachers for the middle school-Dr. Heather
12. Approval of foreign language instructor at KHS for 

90-91-Dr. Heather
13. Approve request for leave of absence for 90-91 school 

year by Instructional staff member.
14. Approve resignation of Instructional staff member.

VII. Adjournment

THANK YOU
We wish to thank our family, 

relatives and friends for the 
beautiful cards, gifts and well 
wishes and all the favors anyone 
did for us for our 50th wedding 
anniversary. Also thanks to the 
Hon-E-Kor for their accomoda­
tions. Thanks again everyone 
for the happy memories of our 
50th wedding anniversary.

Gilbert and Anna Reindl

WEEKEND PART-TIMERS WANTED
Opportunity to earn extra money on weekends. We’re growing and need help keep­
ing our machines running around the clock We need Machine Tenders in our 
Plastics Department tor 12-hour shifts Saturday and Sunday only. Year-round posi­
tions to start immediately Will train. Some benefits included. Serious workers call 
or stop in today.

KEWASKUM MANUFACTURING CO., INC.
Subsidiary of Regal Ware, Inc.

201 Second Street, Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
Personnel Dept. - 414-626-8551

An Equal Opportunity Employer MFHV

PRODUCTION WORKERS WANTED 
- ALL SHIFTS -

Come grow with us! We re a leading housewares producer and need 
more general production workers. Fulltime manufacturing and assembly 
jobs. Will train. We offer good pay and advancement opportunities. 
Generous benefit package includes health, life and dental insurance, 
11 paid holidays, paid vacation, profit sharing and 401K programs.

Apply in person Mon.-Fri. 7:30 a.m. to 4 p.m.:

Kewaskum Manufacturing Co., Inc.
Subsidiary of Regal Ware, Inc.

201 Second Street, Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
Personnel Dept. - (414) 626-8551

An Equal Opportunity Employer ■ MFHV

THANK YOU
I would like to thank my 

family and friends for their 
thoughts, prayers, cards and 
gifts during my recent surgery 
and recovery at home. Your 
many acts of kindness are great­
ly appreciated.

Rosie Ritger

Town of Kewaskum
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 
ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Town of Kewaskum 
Zoning Board of Appeals will conduct a hearing on the ap­
plication for appeal filed by Eugene Ebert. The hearing will 
be held at 7:00 P.M. on July 16,1990 at the Labor Hall located 
at 1230 Fond du Lac Avenue, Kewaskum, Wl 53040.

The applicant’s property is located at 9143 S. Mill Road, 
Section 11, Town of Kewaskum.

The appeal seeks a variance from the requirements of the 
Zoning Ordinance and if granted will permit the applicant to 
construct a garage in the front yard.

All interested persons wishing to comment on the appeal 
should appear at the hearing.

Dated June 25, 1990

6-28-2t Barbara Hinz, Zoning Secretary



Kohl Pleased as Senate Approves Bill 
Giving West Bend Company a Break

aw
Members of the West Bend Rugby Club which posted a 1-3 
record at the Badger State Games included, left to right, kneel- 
ina- Kevin Chambers, Dale Klitzke, JeffPikulik, John Torinus. 
Standing: Brian Johnston, Jerry Vetter, Tony Miller, Andrew 
Buchert, Chuck Keller, Curt Meinders, Kent Dalsing, Rob 
Oreet, Jeff Brodzeller and Tom Atwell.

Photo by Meri Lou Chambers

West Bend Rugby 
Club Competes in 
State Games

The West Bend Rugby Club 
competed in the rugby tens 
tournament at the Badger State 
Games in Madison, Saturday, 
June 23.

West Bend lost the first 
round game to the eventual 
division winner Oconomowoc by 
a lopsided 20-0 margin. The 
second round saw some 
improvement as the “Blues" 
lost to the “Black and Blues” 
from Milwaukee 20-10. The 
team continued to improve, 
losing to a highly experienced

West Bend Rugby 
Spring Season Ends

Madison team 
time was the 
Bend notched 
Milwaukee 11

12-6. The fourth 
charm as West 
a win over the 
team by a 12-9

score.
The ten-team field was 

divided into two groups of five. 
The teams competed in a round 
robin format playing each of the 
teams in its division once. 
Division leaders met in the 
finals. Milwaukee 1 defeated 
Oconomowoc for the title.

The West Bend tournament 
roster included: Dale Klitzke, 
Andrew Buchert, Jeff 
Brodzeller, Kevin Chambers. 
Brian Johnston, Jerry Vetter, 
Tony Miller, Chuck Keller, 
John Torinus, Rob Greet, Kent 
Dalsing, Curt Meinders, and 
Thomas Atwell.

XYZ CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners on Wednesday, 

June 27 played by the Senior 
Citizens XYZ Club at the 
Municipal Building in Kewas­
kum were: Francis Gilboy
24-1-23
26-5-21
20-2-18

net;
net; 
net;

Frank Sell 
Elroy Egerer 
Allen Reindl

14-1 — 13 net; Francis Gilboy 
Heart Solo vs 4.

DUNDEE 
SAND & GRAVEL 
G. RAMTHUN 533-4549 
* Washed Sand 
* Crushed Gravel

Stone and Lime Chips

Also Gravel and Sand Fill 
Topsoil 

GENERAL TRUCKING

WASHINGTON - In a 92-to- 
zero, vote the U.S. Senate 

• recently adopted a bill making 
technical changes to various 
trade laws, including legislation 
introduced by Sen. Herb Kohl 
to reduce the tariffs on timers 
used by the West Bend 
Company. Kohl voted for the 
bill.

“This legislation will save

The West Bend Rugby Club 
posted a respectable 3-1-1 
record for the spring portion of 
the 1990 season.

Kewaskum area athletes 
participating on the West Bend
Rugby 
Pesch 
(wing) 
(prop).

Club included: Dave 
(hooker), Jerry Vetter 
and Kevin Chambers

The season opened with a 6-6 
tie against Ripon College March 
31. The Blues put one in the win 
column by defeating 
Oconomowoc 8-6 in a road game 
April 7. Two weeks later, 
Racine drubbed West Bend 24-4 
at Racine. The final two games 
saw West Bend hand out the 
defeats as both Green Bay and 
UW Milwaukee fell by identical 
20-8 tallies.

The team is now competing in 
an informal summer schedule 
which features tournaments at 
Racine. Madison, Milwaukee, 
and Appleton. Madison was a 
ten-man team tournament as
part of the Badger State Games. 

Milwaukee, andRacine, 
Appleton 
seven-man

Practice 
will begin

are hosting 
teams.
for the fall season 
in mid-August. If

interested in finding out more 
about the team, call club 
president Mark Van Lieshout at 
338-2287.

SHEEPSHEAD WINNER’S
5 handed winner’s on Thurs­

day. June 28th were: Delores 
Mielke 65-6-59, 19-3-16; Ed
Hartman 51-6 — 45, 
Fred Mielke 
21-6-15; Harry

15-4-11;
55-9-44, 

Heinicke
51.9-42, 18-6-12.

The next 5 handed will be 
Thursday. July 12th and 
Wednesday, July 18th at 8:00 
p.m. Schmitt’s Never Inn.

West Bend hundreds of

KEWASKUM WOMEN’S 
TUESDAY NIGHT

VOLLEYBALL LEAGUE
Gruber Tool & Die 28-0, 

Shefond Self Servers 18-6, 
Amerahn 16-8, Barrel Haus 
12-12, Thelen’s Construction 
11-13, L.R. Trophy 11-13, Ike’s 
Repair Shop 9-15, My Little 
Friends 5-19, Home Plate 2-26.

Results - June 26
In the 6:00 p.m. games, L.R. 

Trophy won all four games from 
the Home Plate, 15-12, 15-2, 
15-5, and 15-4.

At the 7:00 p.m. games, once 
again Gruber Tool and Die 
flexed their muscles, and swept 
four games from My Little 
Friends, 15-2, 15-2, 15-6, and 
15-1.

At the 8:00 p.m. games, 
Amerahn split their games with 
the Barrel Haus. Amerahn won 
games *1 and *3, 15-6 and 15-4. 
The Barrel Haus won games #2 
and *4, 15-10 and 15-8.

In the night Cap, Thelen 
Construction came out spiking, 
winning game *1 15-5. But the 
Shefond Self Servers came back 
to win the last 3 games, 15-13, 

‘ 15-9 and 15-5.
Ikes Repair Shop had a bye.
No games will be played on 

July 3rd.

thousands of dollars a year," 
Kohl said. “I simply corrects a 
mistake made when tariff rates 
were converted in 1988."

The tariff rate on the timers 
used by West Bend now stands 
at 25 percent; Kohl's measure 
reduces it to four percent.

The Miscellaneous Tariff Bill 
contains provisions covering 
temporary duty suspensions, 
duty-free changes and technical 
errors made when the United 
States converted to a new 
harmonized tariff schedule. It 
also permanently extends the 
Caribbean *Basin Economic 
Recovery Act, which gives 
duty-free status to certain 
imports from Caribbean Basin 
Initiative (CBI) beneficiary 
countries.

In a move that will benefit 
LaCrosse Footwear, Inc., the 
Senate rejected 63 to 33 an

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU 
Meadowcreek Apartment 

Complex
Monday, July 9 — Baked fish 

w/tartar sauce, oven brown 
potatoes, cole slaw, cracked
wheat bread w/butter, 
raspberry gelatin, milk 
coffee.

Tuesday, July 10 — 
chop suey, seasoned rice,

red 
and

Pork 
peas

w/mushroom & pearl onions, 
kaiser roll w/butter, applesauce 
cake, milk and coffee.

Thursday, July 12 — Chicken 
cacciatore, fettuccine, steamed 
broccoli, garden salad, clover 
leaf roll w/butter, lime chiffon 
dessert, milk and coffee.

Ceramics at 10:00 a.m. every 
1st and 3rd Tuesday of the 
month.

Card playing everyday.

amendment to 
duty rate on 
fabric-upper 
imported from 
This type of 
manufactured

cut in half the 
rubber-soled/- 

tennis shoes 
CBI countries, 

tennis shoe is 
by LaCrosse

HON-E KORC.C.
Tuesday Nite Men's League 

6-26-90
Top Teams This Week Were: 

Driving Range - 5, Dave’s 
Pudders - 5, Hon-E-Kor - 5, LR 
Divot Diggers - 5, Sentry 
Mixers - 5, Handicappers - 5, 
Berndt’s Bums - 5. Bank I - 4, 
T’s Lounge - 3.

Low Gross: Mike O’Connor 
Jr. and Craig Anderson - 36. 
Steve Van Ess - 37, Tom Bartelt 
- 38, Jack Holfeltz and Jim 
Zernzach - 39.

Low Net: Dick Zarling and 
Jack Holfeltz - 31. John Degner, 
Steve Van Ess, Jim Zernzach, 
Mark Backhaus and Tom 
Bartelt 32.

Low Team Net: T’s Lounge - 
133.

Highlights: Tom Kachel- 
meyer won the special event on 
hole *11. Dave’s Pudders won 
the first half championship.

Footwear as well as factories in 
North Carolina, Pennsylvania 
and Maine.

Kohl said the measure would 
have posed a considerable 
threat to jobs in the U.S. 
footwear industry, including 
jobs at the LaCrosse plant.

"This amendment would 
have put Wisconsin jobs at 
risk,” Kohl said. “While I 
appreciate the need to help the 
economies of Caribbean Basin 
countries, I am not willing to do 
this at the expense of Wisconsin 
jobs.

“Footwear is a tremendously 
import-sensitive product — 
which is why it was specifically 
excluded from the original CBI 
legislation.

“Reducing the duty on an 
import-sensitive product simply 
encourages domestic 
manufacturers to move abroad. 
In this case, we would have 
encouraged the flight of 
footwear manufacturers — and 
U.S. jobs — to the Caribbean 
Basin. I can’t support that."

The bill includes an amend­
ment offered by Sen. Bob 
Packwood (R-Oreg.) to prohibit 
the export of logs from federal 
lands west of the 100th 
meridian. The measure, which 
was supported by a coalition of

HON-E-BEES
LADIES ASSOCIATION

On Wednesday, June 27, the 
Day Event was “Low Putts," 
with Irene Thomas coming in to 
win it with 14 putts. The Class 
Event was “Low Net." These 
winners were: Class A - Judy 
Moede - 33, Class B - Helen 
Goetz - 38, Class C - Ginny 
Warner - 33, Class D - Joyce 
Simons - 50.

The 18 hole winner was Judy 
Moede with a net of 68.

Carole Timblin, Publicity

A GREAT

WORKOUT

CAN BE

WIPED OUT 
BY THE RIDE HOME

BUCKLE UP!
Wisconsin Safety belt Coalition

Team members are
Pfeiffer, Tom Bartelt, 
Dean, Kevin Griffin,

Mike 
Jim 

Scott
Rohlinger. Pat Griffin & Coley 
Griffin. Scott Rohlinger had (2) 
birdies.

Tired of Mud?
THINK CONCRETE!

BUTCH’S CONSTRUCTION
Sidewalks - Patios - Driveways - Garages - Basements 

Pole Buildings - Barnyards - Concrete Sawing - 
SKID LOADER WORK

GERALD (Butch) WINNINGHOFF
8412 Hilltop Lane, Kewaskum

334-3186

environmental, labor 
timber organizations, 
adopted on a 81-to-17 
Kohl voted for it.

and 
was 

vote. AUTO 
CRAFT

If you're afraid of 
lightning, stay out of 
Florida, Texas and North 
Carolina They are the 
three states with the 
greatest number of deaths 
due to lightning

/ Quality. ••

COMPLETE 
AUTO BODY 

REPAIR 

338-0379

Replacement 
WINDOWS & DOORS

Custom Made to 
? Fit Your Opening 

^Insulation ^Siding 
Additions

•Soffit Systems and Custom Trim 
\ •Seamless Aluminum Gutters

Kewaskum^ FREE ESTIMATES - FULLY INSURED

HEBERER BROS. 
CONSTRUCTION

Roger 626-2598
Norm 626-2491

Bill 626-2384



KMS Relay Team 1st at Badger State

State champions in 1600 meter relay, pictured left to right: 
David Gosa, Mark Stephani, Brad Jackson and Tom Reehl.

The Kewaskum Middle 
School 1600 meter relay team 
took 1st place at the Badger 
State Games at Madison on 
Saturday, June 23 with a time of 
4:13.12. The relay team running 
in the following order: Tom 
Reehl, Brad Jackson, Mark

Kewaskum Midget 
Little League

Kewaskum’s Midget Little 
League Baseball team, 
comprised of boys ages 9 to 11, 
have qualified for the semi-final 
playoff games. They will be 
held at 2 p.m. on Saturday, July 
7th at the baseball park in 
Eden.

The team is sponsored by Dr. 
Steve Van Ess and the 
American Legion, and coached 
by Gary Schweder.

Standings
June 30

Kewaskum 16 - Cascade 1
July 1

Kewaskum 30 - Campbell­
sport 9

Kewaskum 0 - Long Lake 4

The athletes of the host country of the Olympic Games 
enter the Olympic stadium last

LOSS

lot SHEER 1990 
ROUND 1 POINTS LEADER

DICK TRIC KIT 
1989 NATIONALS CHAMPION

Stephani and David Gosa was
thrilled with 
Reehl was 
replacement 
who was

their victory. Tom 
a last minute 

for Heath Heise, 
injured playing

baseball a few days before the 
state meet.

Players Sought for 
Old Timers Game

All former Kewaskum area 
hardball players are invited to 
participate in the “Old Timers 
Game," which will be held 
Saturday, July 21st at 2 p.m. on 
the Kewaskum High School 
baseball diamond.

Batting practice will be 
available, starting at 12 noon up 
until game time, for all players.

Refreshments will be served 
by the Kewaskum Athletic Club 
Youth Division, with proceeds 
to be used to fund youth sports 
activities.

For further information 
contact Ron Theusch at 533- 
4129.

M ROUND 2
Tuesday Night, July 10 

250 LAP FEATURE
Gates open 4:30, Timing 6:00, Racing 7:30 

Plus Dash Heats and Semi
Sponsored by Slinger Speedway Auto Rating

RUSTY WALLACE 1990 
NASCAR CHAMPION

Kewaskum Jaycees 
Youth Softball 

SCHEDULE
JULY 18 

(Parents Night)
6 p.m. - Superstars (home) vs.

Const. Crew (away); Mean 
Machine (home) vs. Gems (away).

7 p.m. • Panthers (home) vs. 
A's (away); Indians (home) vs. 
Dukes (away).

JULY 25th
6 p.m. - Mean Machine (home) 

vs. Panthers (away); Dukes 
(home) vs. Lions (away).

7 p.m. Gems (home) vs. A’s 
(away); Superstars (home) vs. In­
dians (away).

AUGUST 1 
(Parents Night)

6 p.m. - Superstars (home) vs. 
Mean Machine (away); Panthers 
(home) vs. Const. Crew (away).

7 p.m. - Lions (home) vs. A s 
(away); Indians (home) vs. Gems 
(away).

AUGUST 8th
6 p.m. - Panthers (home) vs 

Lions (away); A's (home) vs. 
Superstars (away).

7 p.m. - Mean Machine (home) 
vs. Dukes (away); Const. Crew 
(home) vs. Gems (away).

AUGUST 9th 
ALL STAR GAME 

All 12 YEAR OLDS PLAY 
Division I consists of players 

from teams 1, 3, 5, 7, 9 in 
standings.

Division II 2, 4, 6, 8.
Party for all teams and parents 

follows the all star game.

Most monkeys are extremely 
nearsighted.

WHOA!!!
No 

Horsing 
Around...
We Deliver Quality 
Building Materials, 

At Reasonable Prices!

HON-E-KOR 
THURSDAY NIGHT 

LADIES GOLF LEAGUE
PARS: Hole 14 - Mary 

Gundrum, Hole 14 - Lila Stahl, 
Hole 14 - Judi Tieglman, Hole 
15 - Trudy Trapp, Hole 16 - 
Tracey Schaub, Hole 16 - Carol 
Wilks, Hole 17 - Teresa Dreher.

CHIP - INS: Hole 16 - Debbie 
Timblin, Hole 16 - Trudy Trapp, 
Hole 17 - Sandy Semler.

BIRDIES: Hole 18 - Judy 
Moede.

EVENT - LOW GROSS 
WITHOUT HOLE 18 - Class A 
- Tracey Schaub - Score of 42, 
Class B - Jan Leverenz - Score 
of 48, Class C - Evie Faehling - 
Score of 50, Class D - Marilyn 
Gering - Score of 61.

BLIND BOGEY - Tracey 
Schaub - Score of 52.

LOW NET — Sandy Semler - 
Score of 33, Trudy Trapp - 
Score of 33.

TEAM STANDINGS
WOODS DIVISION: Swingers 

14 points, Chip-N-Dales 13, 
Teed Off 13, Chippers 12, 
Swizzlesticks 12, Lost Birdies 
10. Par Pushers 10, T P C 10, 
Turf Busters 10, Golf Bags 8, 
We re In Trouble 8, Double 
Bogeys 6, A Hit & A Miss 5, 
Swing, Sweat & Swear 5, 
Whiffers 4, Plunkers 0.

IRONS DIVISION: Par 
Pushers 13 points, Hot Sand 
Wedges 12, Hazards 11, Grass 
Clippers 10, Me Duffers 10, 
Sand Trappers 10, Swee-Tees 
10, Tee Busters 10, Ball Busters 
8, Earthmovers 8, Ex-Rookies 8, 
Golden Girls 8, Golf Bums 8, 
Rough Riders 8, Woodpeckers 
6, M & M’s 4.

NEW FANE 
SPORTSMEN CLUB 

6-27-90
Kettle Moraine Ins. 812-2*2, 

Nichols Trans. 8-3, Main Street 
Tatto 8-3, Callaway & Co. 7-4, 
Shefond Oil 6-5, Amerahn II 
6-5, Heberer Bros. Const. 
5* 2-5* 2, Kewaskum Saloon 5-6, 
Riverview Tap 5-6, Mermaid 
4*/2-6'/2.

Diversified Services 7* 2-3* 2, 
Westerman Mas. 7-4, T’s 
Lounge 6* 2-4 * 2, Amerahn 1 6-5, 
Serigraph 5*/2-5*2, Cleary 
Building 5-6, Campbellsport 
Builders 5-6, Bar-N-Annex 
3*2-7'/2, LK Heating 2-9, 
Midwest Shooters 2-9.

25 straight — Ken Bales - 
Amerahn II, Rick Heberer - 
Heberer Bros. Const., Erv 
Lange - Mermaid.

KETTLE MORAINE GIRLS 
SOFTBALL ASSOC.

Senior Division
Campbellsport I 4-0, 

Farmington 4-0, Long Lake 2-0, 
Adell 2-1, Campbellsport II 1-2, 
Beechwood 1-3, Kewaskum 1-3, 
Fredonia 0-3, Random Lake 0-3.

Junior Division
Beechwood 3-0, Campbell­

sport II 3-0, Random Lake 3-1, 
Campbellsport 12-1, Long Lake 
2-2, Farmington 1-2, Adell 1-3, 
Fredonia 1-3, Cascade 0-4.

Midget Division
Random Lake 5-0, Long Lake 

I 4-0, Long Lake II 4-0, 
Farmington I 3-1, Beechwood 
3-2, Campbellsport I 3-2, 
Campbellsport II 1-3, Adell 0-5, 
Cascade 0-5, Farmington II 0-5.
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BUTCH MILLER 
Plus many more Top 

National & Midwest Drivers

^!ak
IUST ANNOUNCED 

Ernie Irvan

KIN SCHRADER

ALSORACINC f VERY SUNDAYMGHT'

RAIN DATE 
WEDNESDAY NIGHT 

JULY 11th

Late Model Qualifying Mon. Night, July 9th
Gates open 5:00, Timing 7:00pm 

Nascar vs. Midwest Gang
FREE ADMISSION to all advance tkket holders SS OO all others

Sportsman Racing to follow
Autograph session and party with live music after the races

Reserved Stat Tkbeti Available a!
Slinger Speedway Track Office from 9am Spm (414) 644 S921 or write Slinger
Super Speedway Boi 112 Slinger Wicconiin StOM All l.iketron Outlet, Wed

I Campbellsport 227 W. Main St. S 
5 Campbellsport 5: Building \
; Phone ;: Supply 533-4412 :

1/4 Mile west of U.S 41 on 
Highway 144 • Slinger, Wisconsin

All reserved seats, advance $ 14 ^a™>■" ‘ vio« date |uiy a
Race day, adults ...............$16 o««e 6BS
Children 10 and under $6 X 59


