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United Way Begins 1988 Campaign Junior Women to Host WFWC 
6th District Fall Conference

UNITED WAY CAPTAINS — Left to right: Dennis Connor, Gerald Gosa, Ruth Ramel, 
Pat Sella, Chuck Wilgenbusch and Bob Beisbier.

The Kewaskum Area United 
Way 1988 campaign has begun. 
On Monday, September 26, 
President Dennis Connor laid 
out his game plan for the 
captains with the help of his co- 
chairmen, Leroy Kopecky and 
Kim Peterson. Part of that team 
is pictured here before they 
head out to the field.

The goal this year of $32,000 
is well on its way with $4860 
from Captain Gerry Gosa’s 
public sector. The teachers and 
support staff increased their 
support by 24% over last year.

KHS to Celebrate Homecoming ’88
The week of October 4 

through October 8 is 
Homecoming at Kewaskum 
High School.

Activities will begin on 
Monday with the start of float 
building. Class competition 
begins with the different dress 
up days with Tuesday “Pajama 
Day,’’ Wednesday is * Wood- 
stock/ Flower Power Day” and 
Thursday will be “Inside out/- 
Backward Day,’’ Friday will be

KHS Seniors Invite Class 
Of 1984 to Homecoming

We, the Senior Class of 1989, 
would like to honor the Class of 
1984 by inviting you to our 
Homecoming this year, October 7 
and 8.

Come cheer on your Alma Mater 
as we take on the Kiel Raiders, Fri­
day, October 7, at 7:30 p.m.

You are also welcome to the 
Homecoming Dance Saturday, Oc­
tober 8, from 8 to 11:30 p.m. The 
Grand March is at 9 p.m.

With that incentive the captains 
from the other sectors will be 
asking contributors to help 
them meet that challenge or 
better it.

The dollars you give help 
support these agencies: Council 
on Alcohol and Other Drug 
Abuse of Washington County; 
Threshold, Inc.; Citizen 
Advocacy of Washington Cty, 
Inc.; Girl Scouts of USA, 
WauBun Council; Kewaskum 
Blood Bank; American Field 
Service - Kewaskum; Big

the traditional “Green, Gold 
and White Day.”

Hall decorations will be put 
up Wednesday after school and 
will add much color and excite­
ment to the halls.

A pep assembly will be held 
Friday afternoon at which time 
all varsity fall sports members 
will be recognized along with 
the introduction of the 
Homecoming Court and this 
year’s King and Queen.

The parade will be Friday 
night at 6:00 p.m., which will 
include the KHS Marching 
Band, several floats, con­
vertibles as well as the football 
team. The Indian fans are 
hoping for a victory as the team 
plays the Kiel Raiders at 7:30 
p.m.

The Homecoming dance will 
be on Saturday, Oct. 8 from 8:00 
to 11:30 p.m. with music 
provided by The Grove. Ticket 
prices are $3.00 for singles and 
$5.00 for couples in advance 
and $3.50/$6.00 at the door. 
Parents are welcome to attend 
the dance compliments of the

Brothers & Sisters of 
Washington Cty.; Boy Scouts of 
America, Bay Lakes Council; 
Christian Record Braille 
Foundation; D.D.S.F. Programs 
of Lutheran Social Service; 
Friends of Abused Families; 
Kewaskum Special Olympics; 
Nova Services, Inc.; American 
Red Cross of Washington Cty., 
and the Kettle Moraine 
Hospice.

Please give when a volunteer 
asks. Thanks to you - it works 
for all of us - The United Way!

Class of 1989. The Grand March 
will be at 9:00 p.m. with the 
crowning of the King and 
Queen immediately after.

The Class of 1989 has chosen 
to invite back the Class of 1984 
and we hope to see as many 
people as possible from that 
class at the game and dance. 
The Championship team from 
1983 will be here to celebrate 
their five year reunion.

Post Office Notice
The last pick-up for out-going 

mail will be 5:30 p.m. Monday 
thru Saturday, starting 
Monday, Oct. 10.

9-30-2t

On Tuesday, October 18, the 
GFWC Kewaskum Junior 
Woman’s Club will host the 
WFWC 6th District Fall Con­
ference at the Peace Church in 
Kewaskum. Approximately one 
hundred women’s club 
members from thirty-two clubs 
in the 6th district will attend. 
The district includes Calumet, 
Fond du Lac, Ozaukee, Sheboy­
gan, Washington and Winne­
bago Counties, serving 1600 
members.

Local women serving as 
district officers include Gayle 
Van Ess as District President 
and Diane Shreves as District 
Corresponding Secretary. 
Kathy Charland and Jean 
Goeden serve as president of 
the Kewaskum Junior Woman’s 
Club and Kewaskum Woman’s 
Club respectively.

The fall conference schedule 
includes workshops in each of 
the six departments of the 
GFWC: arts, conservation, 
education, home life, interna­
tional affairs and public affairs. 
In addition, Lois Reinfeldt, 
WFWC President will address

West Bend’s Roethke 
Wins Olympic Silver

Lynn Roethke made interna­
tional news Wednesday at the 
Winter Olympics in Seoul, 
South Korea, when she took the 
silver medal in amateur judo 
competition, losing to Diane 
Bell of Great Britain on a 
penalty point.

Competing in the 134 lb. 
weight class, Roethke also won 
the gold medal at the 1987 Pan 
American Games and finished 
second in the World Champion­
ships in Essen, West Germany.

Cheering her on in the 
Changchung Gymnasium was 
her own support team: her 
mother, Joyce; aunt Lolly 
Nichols, Eden; cousin Virginia

News In Brief...
By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

Washington County District 
Attorney David Resheske has 
announced his resignation. 
Resheske will leave office to go 
into private practice with the 
West Bend law firm of Bunk, 
Doherty & Griffin, S.C.

Just two weeks ago Resheske 
virtually won re-election as DA 
after running unopposed in the 
September 13th primary. 
Unless a write-in candidate 
receives more votes than 
Resheske, whose name will still 
appear on the November 8th

the group on “Aging. . .Put 
Your Heart In It,’’ and Kevan 
Jones, WFWC Junior Director 
will speak on '‘Youth Suicide.’’ 
Mr. Wilford Nehmer Jr., noted 
author and jazz musician will 
speak on the theme of his book, 

“Have A Heart - The Lighter, 
Brighter Side of Recovery.’’

Following the conference, 
Kewaskum Juniors are 
encouraging their guests to stay 
in Kewaskum, enjoying the 
Historical Society Museum and 
beauty of the Kettle Moraine, 
as well as to shop in Kewaskum, 
have dinner, and enjoy the 
hospitality of Kewaskum 
businesses, many of whom are 
offering door prizes or daily 
specials to the delegates.

The Kewaskum Area Chamber 
of Commerce is encouraging all 
their members to participate in ex­
tending a cordial welcome to our 
community' to the visiting GFWC 
members. Let's offer them a slice 
of Kewaskum that they can take 
home with them to remember for 
many years to come.

Sterr, Lomira; and friends 
Gladys Schmidt and Marion 
Lang, West Bend; Diane 
Weider, Juneau; Barbara 
O’Donnell, Albany, N.Y.; and 
Connie Shigamoto of San Jose, 
Calif.

Roethke plans to vacation in 
Hawaii after the games, and 
will then attend a Women’s 
Sports Foundation banquet in 
New York.

The West Bend Chamber of 
Commerce is responsible for 
raising more than $22,000 for 
Lynn's expenses since April 
1987. Lynn is the daughter of 
Joyce and Charles Roethke, Sr. 
of West Bend.

ballot, Governor Tommy 
Thompson will have to appoint 
an individual to finish out 
Resheske’s present term which 
expires in January and the next 
two-year term he would win in 
the November election.

Lottery sales are booming. As 
of Monday, almost $21 million 
in Wisconsin State Lottery 
tickets have been sold. That 
figure includes 20.1 million one- 
dollar instant-win tickets and 
$850,000 worth of the fifty-cent 
pull-tab tickets.

If sales continue at this level,
[Continued on Page 8]
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Christ to Celebrate Centennial

St. John’s United Church of 
Christ, Beechwood, will observe 
the 100th Anniversary of its 
founding with morning services 
and an afternoon program on 
Sunday, October 16th.

The morning church service 
will begin at 10:00 a.m. with Dr. 
Rev. Frederick Trost, Wis­
consin Conference Minister, as 
guest speaker. Liturgist for the 
service will be Rev. Robert 
Horst, Southeast Association 
Minister of the Wisconsin 
Conference, Rev. William 
Resting, Jr., present pastor, 
and former pastors.

A 12:00 noon dinner will be 
held at the former Beechwood 
Firehouse at the corner of Hwy 
S and A. Dinner reservations 
must be made in advance and 
no later than October 6. Adults: 
$6.50, Children ages 5-10: 
$4.50, under 5: $1.50. Mail 
remittance to Mrs. Sylvester 
Krahn of Route 1, 807 Hwy A, 
Adell, WI 53001. Make checks 
payable to: St. John’s 
Centennial Fund.

The afternoon program, also 
held at the Fire Hall and 
beginning after dinner, will 
include the “Good News 
Singers’’ of Lakeland College, 
and a message given by Rev. 
Charles Koch, son of the 
congregation. A slide presenta­
tion of Confirmation classes 
prepared by the Centennial 
Committee will climax the 
afternoon program.

Anniversary booklets have 
been prepared with a complete 
history of the congregation, 
pictures of members and their 
families, pictures of the various 
organizations of the church and 
a statistical listing including all 
the births, baptisms, marriages

and deaths that were recorded 
in the records of St. John’s. 
These booklets and the 
Centennial plates will be on sale 
that day.

The public is cordially invited 
to share St. John’s Centennial 
festivities with its members.

Open House at 
WB Red Cross

The West Bend Chapter of 
the American Red Cross has 
moved to a facility at 422 
Meadowbrook Dr., phone 414- 
334-5687. An OPEN HOUSE 
will be held for our friends of 
the general public on Sunday, 
October 9th from 1 to 4 p.m., 
serving coffee and cookies.

The Red Cross generates its 
funding from the United Way.

Come investigate your Red 
Cross. Find what services such 
as transportation of patients to 
area and Milwaukee treatment 
centers, donations to veterans 
centers and aid to military 
personnel and families, classes 
in first-aid and other life-saving 
courses the Red Cross 
performs. Avail yourself of 
these services.

Come to find out if you might 
want to volunteer your services 
to help the Red Cross, come as 
an interested resident of your 
community; come to visit us and 
have an enjoyable afternoon.

You ought to do something 
about your image if you ask the 
waiter to recommend a wine 
and he suggests muscatel.

See the Colorama
‘Open House Day’ Sunday In 
Kettle Moraine State Forest

Give yourself a break 
recommends Walt Adams, 
Superintendent of the Kettle 
Moraine State Forest. Come out 
to the Kettle Moraine Colorama 
on Sunday, October 2, 1988 on 
“Open House Day.’’ No vehicle 
admission fees will be charged 
at the various public use areas 
and trail parking lots. Fall 
colors are expected to be 
brilliant for a visit to the forest 
facilities. The area offers a 
variety of activities for the 
whole family.

Visit the Ice Age Center and 
observe the glacial scenes from 
the deck at the Center, climb 
Dundee Mountain to view the 
countryside (access from Area F 
in the Long Lake Campground), 
follow the Scenic Kettle 
Moraine Drive to the new 60-ft. 
Parnell Tower. The panoramic 
view from atop the tower will 
probably be the highlight of

New Parnell Tower Dedicated
Much to the delight of its 

neighbors, the Kettle Moraine 
Forest’s Parnell Tower once 
again stands tall, looking over 
the wooded Wisconsin country­
side.

Several hundred people were 
in attendance at Saturday’s 
ceremony to dedicate the new 
structure which replaces its 
predecessor built in 1941, a 
product of the Depression era.

After 46 years of service, the 
original tower was closed and 
torn down because of deteriora­
tion. There were no plans to 
replace the 50 foot tower until 
area residents began a letter­

your day. Take the family and 
make the day complete with 
wild berry and nut picking.

Flocks of migrating geese can 
be heard daily along with 
frequent sightings of deer and 
wild turkey.

Hikers will be delighted to 
hike the many fine trails laid out 
in the forest. Fall season is 
perfect for hiking with cooler 
temperatures and no insects to 
contend with. The forest has 
several loop trails: New Fane 
7.7 mi., Butler Lake 3.1 mi., 
Parnell Tower Trail 4 mi., 
Greenbush 10.9 mi., Zillmer 
Trail 17.5 mi., and of course the 
nature trails at Mauthe Lake 
and at the Ice Age Center.

Small Game Hunting and 
Bow Season is in progress at 
this time. Whatever activity you 
partake in, we are sure a visit to 
the State Forest will be most 
enjoyable.

writing and petition campaign 
to have the landmark rebuilt.

Those efforts proved success­
ful, and now, the Parnell Tower 
once again graces the skyline as 
a giant tempting visitors to 
climb its lofty wooden stairs for 
a magnificent view of the kames 
and kettles which make up the 
Kettle Moraine.

Now ten feet taller than the 
original, the new 60-foot tower 
will provide an even more 
spectacular view to the 12,000 
to 15,000 people who are ex­
pected to climb the structure 
each year.

Teenage Sexuality 
Presentation Oct. 3

Holy Trinity and St. Bridgets 
Parish are featuring a guest 
speaker at their CYM registra­
tion night, Sister Kieran 
Sawyer.

Sister Sawyer is director of 
“Time Out” - a Youth Ministry 
Center in Mequon, and a retreat 
center in Milwaukee. She is 
author of several religious texts 
and is widely known for her 
work with teenagers and young 
adults.

The public is invited to attend 
her presentation on Teenage 
Sexuality at Holy Trinity Parish 
in Kewaskum on Monday, 
October 3 at 7:30 p.m. All 
parents are encouraged to 
attend this religious education 
program. For further informa­
tion call 626-2860.

CYM Registration 
At Holy Trinity

Parents of Holy Trinity 
Catholic Church and St. 
Bridgets Parish high school 
students are asked to attend a 
CYM Orientation on Monday, 
October 3 at 6:30 p.m. at Holy 
Trinity Parish in Kewaskum. 
There will be a special guest 
speaker preceding registration. 
For more information contact 
Karen Ellefson at 626-4853.
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If you need a trivet for a hot 
pot, wrap some foil around 
several thicknesses of 
newspaper.

/ Beechwood 
v Cheese

Cheese of 
The Month

-DULY JACK
(Dill weed in Monterey Jack) 

Regularly $2.00 lb.

$1.69 lb

PEPPER CHEESE
(Jalapeno peppers in Monterey Jack) 

Regularly $2.00 lb.

$ 1 .69 lb.
Offer good on VA, 2’/2 & 5 lb. pkgs. 

OFFER GOOD FROM 10-1-88 THRU 10-31-88

CHEDDAR CURD DAY
Saturday, Oct. 1
Fresh, warm cheddar curd 

READY FOR SALE AT 12 NOON 

$1.90 fc
9 to 5 Daily - Closed Sunday 

BEECHWOOD 
CHEESE FACTORY

1713 Hwy. A • Route 1 - Adell, WI 53001 
Take Hwy. S to Beechwood, then North 2 blocks on Hwy. A 

PHONE 994-9306

IS SOMETHING

§P1Rl>

k\ TO TOOT

|] YOUR HORN 

ABOUT!

HELP THE COMMUNITY,.

DONATE BLOOD

LOCATION ~ DATE Oct.
Kewaskum High School IIME-1#J^
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Grant for Handicapped Children
MADISON - State 

Superintendent Herbert J. 
Grover has notified the school 
District of Kewaskum that it will 
receive $4,800 to assist in 
providing special education 
programs for pre-schoolers with 
exceptional education needs 
(EEN).

Administered by the Wiscon­
sin Department of Public 
Instruction, the grant is made 
available under Public Law 99- 
457, the Education for All 
Handicapped Children Act, 
Amendments of 1986. The 
preschool-incentive provision of 
this federal law has been 
amended to strengthen the 

Cycle Accident 
Injures Two

By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

An accident late Sunday 
evening injured two Kewaskum 
area motorcyclists. According to 
a Washington County Sheriffs 
Department report, Richard 
Postuma, 38, of 8561 Salisbury 
Road and Michael Nigh, 33, of 
3824 Badger Road, were 
traveling south together on 
Kettle Moraine Drive at 
approximately 10:28 p.m. As 
they approached a stop sign at 
the intersection of Kettle 
Moraine and highway 28, 
Postuma stopped. Nigh.’s cycle 
approached Postuma and 
apparently began skidding 
striking the Postuma 
motorcycle in the rear. The two 
machines skidded into the 
intersection.

The Kewaskum Rescue 
Squads transported the two 
men to St. Joseph’s Hospital, 
West Bend. Postuma was 
treated for leg and shoulder 
injuries and Nigh a fractured 
collarbone. Both men have been 
released from the hospital.

incentive for states to serve all 
handicapped children, ages 3 
through 5.

Statewide, all local educa­
tional agencies will share in the 
$2.7 million available under this 
program during the 1988-89 
school year. Seventy-five 
percent of these federal 
entitlement funds will flow 
directly to local school districts.

The entitlement program may 
provide a broad range of local 
programs and services to 
handicapped preschoolers. 
Funds in Kewaskum will be 
used to purchase special 
materials and equipment and 
arrange for specialized evalua­
tions.

Commenting on the grant 
award, Richard E. Zarling, the 
project’s director, said, “We 
are pleased to receive these 
monies to assist us in providing 
quality programming to our 
younger handicapped children 
and to assist us in identifying 
their needs. The program 
continues to provide specific 
educational services for the 3-5 
year olds thereby creating a 
stronger background for them 
when they reach regular school 
age and join the mainstream 
school population.”

THANKS TO ST. JUDE
ST. JUDE’S NOVENA. May 

the Sacred Heart of Jesus be 
adored, glorified, loved and 
preserved throughout the 
world, now and forever. Sacred 
heart of Jesus, pray for us. St. 
Jude, worker of miracles, pray 
for us; St. Jude helper of the 
helpless, pray for us. Say this 
prayer 9 times a day, by the 8th 
day your prayers will be 
answered. It has never been 
known to fail. Publication must 
be promised. Thank you St. 
Jude.

PMM

TO HOLD MOTHER/SON 
WORKSHOP WEDNESDAY

Planned Parenthood of Wis­
consin is presenting a “Mother 
and Son Workshop,” Wednes­
day, October 5th from 6:30 to 
8:30 p.m. at Bank One, 801 W. 
Washington Ave., West Bend.

This workshop is designed for 
pre-adolescent boys, ages 9 to 
11, and their mothers (or signi­
ficant other female adult). It 
focuses on puberty, the 
changing bodies and changing 
emotions that are a part of 
growing up male. The workshop 
includes group activities, 
mini-lectures, and a film.

The fee is $10.00 per adult/- 
child couple. For more informa­
tion or to register, call the 
Community Services Depart­
ment of Planned Parenthood at 
(414) 271-6033.

.^tis^NATlONALs^s

APPLE MONTH
«sWCTOBERl-31«sie

Shefond
1149 Fond du Lac Ave.

MPTC Classes 
In Kewaskum

1. Beginning and Refresher Typing
Monday, Oct. 10, 7 to 9 p.m.

2. Upholstery
Day, Thursday, Oct. 13, 11 a.m. to 2 p.m. 

Evening, Wednesday, Sept. 28, 7 to 10 p.m.
3. Computer Concepts

Tuesday, Oct. 11, 7 to 9 p.m.

Call Kewaskum High School at 626-2166 
for information or registration

Revival Services
KEWASKUM

LIVING WATERS CHURCH
Labor Center Hall

1230 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum

Evangelists Dave & Caroline Hamer 
Thursday, Sept. 29 & Friday, Sept. 30 

at 7 p.m.

Sunday Morning, Oct. 1 at 9 a.m.
For More Information Call

PASTOR ROBERT LORMIS 626-833 7

LUCKY WISCONSIN LOTTERY WINNER — Rick 
Schlosser, Route 1, Allenton, was the Kewaskum area’s 
first reported $500 winner in the new Wisconsin State Lot­
tery Scratch Tickets. He bought his first $20 worth of 
Wisconsin tickets at Shefond Mobil Mart, Kewaskum, on 
Sept. 18 and received $512 in total winnings from the 
tickets. Receive any marriage proposals yet, Rick?

IM bill
626-4300

Mart
Kewaskum

SELF/SERVE CONVENIENCE
Designed With You In Mind

American Express, Discover, Visa, 
Mastercard and Mobil

— SAME AS CASH 1

This Week's

SANDWICH 
SPECIAL 

FREE

VISA

COKE 
PRODUCT 
$2.99

Basil# of Milk 
With Any

Tuna Salad 
Sandwich ^ 
Purchase

Try Our

HOSTESS PIES
Vanilla - Cherry - Peach 

Lemon - Apple - Blueberry 

20c Off
Every Tuesday is 

k Customer Appreciation Day

FREE
Cup of Coffee

^ Every Tuesday
5 to 8 a.m.

Papa Ron’s
Cheese Sausage

PIZZA 
$1.99

V 12” 16 oz.

Every Wednesday is 
SENIOR 

CITIZENS DAY 
Receive a 2c per gallon 

discount if you are 
62 years or older

Get Ready for Winter.

WISCONSIN 
LOnERY

Crystal Clear - Top Quality

K-1 KEROSENE
Now available at 
self-serve price!

$7,911
Worth of Lottery Winners Paid Out Through 9-23-88
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The Statesman welcomes readers to submit * 
photos for the "Memories” feature. Photos should 
show life in the olden days in this area. Deliver 
or mail to The Statesman, 250 Main St., P.O. Box 
98, Kewaskum, Wl 53040. Photos can be picked 
up again after publication.

The above memory picture was taken in 1941. It shows the Rex Garage, which was 
located next to Miller's Furniture. Left to right: Myron Perschbacher, mechanic, son of 
Arey Perschbacher, owner and John Lecher, mechanic. The garage sold Buick, Dodge 
and Plymouth cars. During World War II, Perschbacher was rationed to five cars a year 
and therefore started selling farm machinery. The property was later sold to Miller's when 
they expanded their furniture store. The photo was sent out as a Christmas card to all 
customers.

Bfbirths......
ULLRICH - A son, 

Brandon John, to Mr. and 
Mrs. Kurt Ullrich, 130 W. 
Sheboygan St., Camp­
bellsport, Sept. 11.

RAM EL — A son to Debra 
and Mark Ramel, 3491 County 
I), Random Lake, on Sept. 19.

GEIGER — A daughter to 
Amy and Randall GEIGER, 
167 Mill St., Campbellsport, 
on Sept. 20.

TERLINDEN - A daughter 
to Carl and Marilyn Terlinden, 
784$) Kettle View Drive, 
Kewaskum, on Sept. 21.

Weighty Wood
The lumber of the lead wood, or 
black ironwood tree is the 
heaviest timber in North 
America. Ranger Rick magazine 
reports that the wood from this 
Florida tree is so heavy that it 
sinks in water.
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to thank all the people who made this 
year’s Chicken BBQ a success!

President Charles Kleinke

SHEEPSHEAD WINNERS
5 handed winners on 

Wednesday, Sept. 21st were: 
Vivian Bartelt, 65-5 — 60, 
20-5—15; Judy Lickmann 
60-5-55, 16-3-13; Jerry 
Darmody 57-9-48, 21-4-17; 
Rose Meunier 50-11—39, 
18-7—11; Walter Schmidt 
49-12-37, 18-5-13.

The next 5 handed 
Sheepshead will be Wednesday 
Oct. 5th and Thursday Oct. 13th 
at 8:00 p.m. Schmitt’s Never 
Inn.

Winners at Kewaskum 
Lions Club Chicken BBQ

1. $200 - Dolores Kleinke, Kewaskum
2. $100 - Marilyn Peterman, Kewaskum
3. $50 - Nicole Behring, Kewaskum
4 $25 - Homer & Mary Schaub, Kewaskum
5. $10 Gift Certificate, Miller’s Furniture - Jane Sedgwick, Men. Falls 
6 $10 Gift Certificate, Miller's Furniture - Virgil Hackbarth, Kewaskum 
7. Chicken Dinner, Amerahn - Crickets Rohlinger, Kewaskum 
8. Fish Dinner, Amerahn - Jay Tessar, Kewaskum
9 $5 Cheese, Schmitt’s Never Inn • Kevin Nigh, Kewaskum

10. Friday Nite Fish Fry, Riverview Inn - Jenny Krieser, Kewaskum
11. Friday Nite Fish Fry, Riverview Inn - Phyllis Bardon, Elkhart Lake
12. Bottle Booze, Thiemer's Tap - Alice M. Kleinke, Eau Claire 
13. 12 Pk. Old Style, McDonald’s Tavern • Shawn Sedgwick, Men. Falls 
14 10 lbs. Brats, Behring's Meat Market - Clarence Schmidt, West Bend

The Kewaskum Lion’s Club would like

RIVEREDGE BIRD 
CLUB MEETING

The sport of falconery will be 
discussed by Mark Foreman at 
the October 4 Riveredge Bird 
Club meeting. Mr. Foreman, a 
school teacher from Milwaukee, 
will show slides and bring one 
of his birds to the program. The 
last 6 p.m. bird hike of the 
season will precede the 7 p.m. 
program at the Riveredge 
Nature Center north of 
Newburg on Highway Y.

Happy 

Birthday 

to 
M.M.

(Motor-Mouth ?) 
In Baltimore

Love, Your Friends and 
Relatives in Wisconsin

Medicare Maze
“Medicare Maze,’’ a ninety 

minute presentation of the 
Cedar Lake Home Tri-Campus 
Program/Education Committee 
will be held at 2:00 p.m. on 
Friday, October 21 at Cedar 
Ridge Retirement Campus, 113 
Cedar Ridge Drive, West Bend.

Dave Becker of the Social 
Security Administration office 
in West Bend will discuss 
catastrophic coverage, how to 
file a claim, record keeping, the 
appeal process and other 
medicare related information. A 
question and answer period will 
follow.

Reservations for the free 
discussion are required by 
October 14. To make a reserva­
tion call Lucille Gates or Don 
Stettler at 334-9487, Extension 
293.

THANK YOU
I would like to thank all of my 

good friends, relatives and 
fellow church members for their 
prayers, cards, calls and 
general concern for me while at 
my stay at Rochester, Memorial 
Hospital. Your continuing 
support and prayers mean so 
much.

Elizabeth (Betty) Johnson

BARTOLI’S 
GREENHOUSE 
and PRODUCE
Four miles north of Kewaskum on Hwy. V 

Phone 533-4092
NEW HOURS: 9 to 6 Mon.-Fri., 9 to 5 Sat. & Sun

Due to the rain.7.
PICK YOUR OWN

POTATOES
Has Been Re-Scheduled for

Saturday, Oct. 1
9 a.m. to 4 p.m.

SPECIALS OF THE WEEK
Tomatoes...................... ib. 39c or $4 bu.
Peppers....................... 8/$1 or 20c ea.
Pears............................................./b. 39c
Cucumbers......................  25c or 5/$1
Home Grown 
Cauliflower................................... Ib.59c

Fresh Homegrown
J^SWEET CORN 
^^Msiill Available for

Another Two Weeks!
MUMS In All Colors

FOX & HOUNDS
BENEFIT LUNCHEON

Tickets are now available for 
the annual YMCA Benefit 
Luncheon and Style Show on 
Monday, October 17th at the 
Fox and Hounds Restaurant.

All the guests seated in the 
charming dining area of the Fox 
and Hounds will enjoy seeing 
their neighbors and friends 
modeling fall fashions present­
ed by Alstons and Youth Towne 
with hair and makeup by Erik of 
Norway.

The price of the ticket 
includes the gourmet luncheon 
and fashion show. Tickets are 
$15.00 and are sold in groups of 
four; however, a few tables for 
parties of six and eight are 
available. Tickets may be 
obtained from the YMCA or by 
calling 334-3405.

Proceeds from this will go to 
the YMCA.

The cucumber, eggplant, 
pumpkin, squash and to- 
matp are all fruits, not veg­
etables.
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HEART-SHAPED GRAPEVINE WREATHS will be 
available at Barbara Shimp’s booth at the Kewaskum 
Junior Woman’s Club Annual “Kettle Country 
Christmas. ’’ This year’s Art and Craft Fair will be held 
atAmerahn on Sunday, November 27, from 10 a.m. to
4 p.m. Everyone is welcome. There are some spaces 
still available. Please call 626-4291 for more information.

OCTOBER
COMMUNITY
CALENDAR

Coming events will be listed only if 
they are submitted to the Statesman 
and are of area interest. We will be 
happy to list meetings of your organiza­
tion only if they are sent in to us each 
month. We can no longer be respon­
sible for keep a running file of your 
meetings for the entire year. Please 
submit your meeting notice for publica­
tion the week before it is to be 
published.

SUNDAY, OCT. 2
Family Fun Night at Holy Trinity 

Parish, Kewaskum, beginning at 7 p.m.

SUNDAY, OCT. 2
Fall Fest '88 at Cedar Lake Home Cam­

pus, 5595 Hwy. Z, 11 a.m. to 5 p.m. Hay 
rides, petting zoo. carriage rides, craft 
sales, entertainment, food, antiques, plus 
much more. Hot sirloin dinner $5 served 
from 11 a.m. to 1:30 p.m.

SUNDAY, OCT. 2
Fall Harvest Day at historic Galloway 

House and Village, 336 Old Pioneer Rd., 
Fond du Lac. from 1 to 4 p.m. Threshing, 
cider making and square dancing will be 
featured.

FRIDAY, OCT. 7 
SATURDAY. OCT. 8 

SUNDAY, OCT. 9
Autumn Fest '88 at the Pioneer Bowl, 

Hwy. 41 North. Exit 167 West. Richfield. 
Beer tents, carnival rides, antique car 
display, flea market, arts and crafts, live 
music, food and beer. Mud drags on Sun­
day. Celebrate the leaves turning color!

SUNDAY, OCT. 9
Red Cross Open House from 1 to 4 p.m. 

Coffee and cookies will be served. 422 
Meadowbrook Dr., West Bend.

SUNDAY, OCT. 9
Fall Festival at St. Matthew’s 

Parish in Campbellsport. Chicken 
and dressing dinner, 11 a.m. to 3 
p.m. served country style, prizes, 
Christmas craft booth, games and 
entertainment.

Any church group or civic 
organization is invited to submit 
their coming events for listing in 
this column, however, we do ask 
that you keep words to a 
minimum. (We also appreciate 
your advertising these events).

A newly hatched alligator 
is just eight inches long. It 
will grow about a foot a 
year until it reaches the av­
erage adult length of six to 
eight feet.

Junior Woman's Club 
Recipe of the Month

This recipe and many more 
can be found in the Kewaskum 
Junior Woman’s Club new 
cookbook. Cookbook can be 
purchased at Kennelly 
Pharmacy and the Regal Ware 
Outlet.

VAUGHAN’S POTATOES
Chris Schoofs

3 med. potatoes, peeled and 
quartered

lA c. Parmesan cheese, grated 
Vi of a 3 oz. pkg. cream cheese 
1 T. butter or margarine
1 T. chopped green onion 
2*/2 tsp. instant onion soup mix 
Dash of pepper
Milk
1 beaten egg
l'/2 c. cornflakes, coarsely 

crushed
In saucepan cook potatoes ,in 
boiling water about 20 minutes 
or until tender. Drain and mash. 
Stir in Parmesan cheese, cream 
cheese, butter or margarine, 
green onion, onion soup mix, 
and pepper. Mix well. Add 1 to 
2 tablespoons milk if mixture is 
dry. Shape mixture into 8 balls. 
Dip in beaten egg; roll in corn­
flakes. Place on greased cookie 
sheet, bake at 400° for 10 to 15 
minutes or until hot and crisp. 
Makes 4 servings.

Wallpaper 
Sale 

30% OFF
Selected Books

865 Fond du Lac Mrw* Kawaakum. Wisconsin 626-2164

Free Arthritis Classes 
Offered at Cedar Haven 
Retirement Campus

A series of four, free arthritis 
self-help classes will be offered 
at Cedar Ridge Retirement 
Campus located on Scenic 
Drive, just off Highway 33 in 
West Bend. The continuing 
series will begin Wednesday, 
October 5 and continue on 
October 12, 19, 26, from 6:30 to 
8:00 p.m.

This series of four classes is 
co-sponsored by Cedar Haven 
Rehabilitation Agency and the 
Arthritis Foundation, Wiscon­
sin Chapter.

To register, individuals are 
encouraged to call the Self-Help 
Coordinator at 1-800-242-9945. 
When individuals are register­
ing, they are registering for the 
entire four classes.

The purpose of the self-help 
class series is to provide an 
awareness and understanding 
of arthritis and improve an 
individual’s ability to make
better personal decisions 
regarding the management of 
their disease. Class participants 
will learn in general terms 
about the medical, physical and 
psychological methods available 
for the treatment of arthritis.

Session I on October 5 will 
feature Dr. Hilgeman, 
Rheumatologist, Amy Leit- 
heiser, P.T. and Charmaine 
Loomans, PTA. Topics to be 
covered are introduction to 
sessions, anatomy of a joint, 
possible causes, how to 
diagnose, treatment and team 
approach, medications and 
injections and what arthritis is.

Session II will be on October 
12 and will feature Jon Herd­
rich, Pharmacist discussing 
types and benefits of medica­
tions, side effects and unproven 
methods. Dr. Reineck, ortho­
pedic surgeon will discuss 
surgical options and joint 
replacements.

Session III will be on October 
19 and will feature Rosemary 
Schrauth, O.T.R., discussing 
joint protection, splints, energy 
conservation and self-help 
devices. Joanne Bodien, P.T. 
will cover exercise, body 
mechanics, posture, heat and 
cold, rest and equipment.

The final Session, October 26 
will feature Lynette Gagnon 
discussing nutrition, weight 
loss management. Sarah 
Rehring will discuss stress and 
coping.

Unemployment Office 
Offering Seminars on 
UC System Changes

The West Bend Unemploy­
ment Compensation Office is 
offering free one-hour seminars 
to explain to workers the impact 
on them of the changes in the 
state's UC system. These 
changes will become effective in 
April of 1989.

Wisconsin is making a major 
conversion to a new system for 
obtaining wage information 
from employers. The informa­
tion will be used to compute an 
eligible UC claimant’s benefits, 
as well as for other purposes. 
The program is administered in 
Wisconsin by the State Depart­
ment of Industry, Labor and 
Human Relations.

Unions and community 
organizations assisting un­
employed workers are among

Interior Paints Also On Sale

HWI Are Quality Paints 
Manufactured by Sherwin Williams

HWI

A LUMBER - HARDWARE - PAINT

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum, Wl 
PHONE 626-2164

STORE HOURS: Mon. thru Fri. 7:30 a m to 5:30 p.m.; 
Sat 7:30 a m. to 2:30 p.m.

. OPEN SUNDAY 9 to 1

those most likely to request the 
seminars, according to Larry 
Sorenson, the local UC office 
manager. Employers may also 
wish to schedule the seminars 
for their employees, Sorenson 
said.

Seminars will be conducted 
by local office managers.

“We’ll explain why we’re 
changing the system, how the 
changes will affect employees 
and the benefits they receive,, 
and what parts of the system 
are not changing,” Sorenson 
said.

“We prefer to have 20 
persons in each seminar,” 
Sorenson said. “We’d also 
prefer that those asking for 
seminars also propose a location 
and give us two weeks or more 
notice if possible.

To request a seminar, call the 
UC office at 338-4749 or write to 
the UC office at 1043 S. Main 
St., West Bend, Wis., 53095.
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School Play ‘No, No Nanette
Season Tickets for 
Moraine Symphony 
Orchestra on Sale

WEST BEND Season
tickets for the 1988-89 Moraine 
Symphony Orchestra season 
will go on sale Oct. 1. Persons 
buying a season pass will get to 
attend one regular concert free.

Joyce Christie of Grafton, 
president of the 55-member 
orchestra, said the money­
saving offer is in keeping with 
the philosophy of the group. 
“We’re not trying to make a lot 
of money,” she said. “We want 
people to come out and enjoy 
good music.”

Season tickets cost $14 with a 
student and senior citizen ticket 
available for $12. Tickets admit 
symphony-goers to a season 
opener on Nov. 12, to table 
seating at an April 29 Pops
Concert and to 
concerto concerts 
or April 9.

The Nov. 12

one of two 
on March 19

concert will
feature a 70th birthday salute to 
Leonard Bernstein. Admission 
to the Pops Concert includes a 
special cheese, snack and 
drinks package. The concerto 
concerts will feature special 
soloists and the winners of the 
symphonies annual Youth 
Concerto Contests in Ozaukee 
and Washington counties.

The orchestra was founded in 
1968 by director Albert Asch, a 
professor of music at the 
University of Wisconsin Center 
— Washington County. This is 
the first time season tickets are 
being offered for a symphony 
season.

Season sales will end Nov. 1. 
Tickets are available to 
individual concerts at $4 or $2 
for students and senior citizens. 
All table seating at the Pops 
Concert costs $10.

The symphony will present its 
annual Cathedral Concert at St. 
Mary’s Catholic Church in Port 
Washington on Dec. 4. That 
performance is free.

WEST BEND 
CINEMA 
Phone 334-5466

Starts Friday!

YOUNG GUNS
Rated PG-13

Evenings at 7 & 9 
Sunday Matinees at 1, 3 & 5

Held Over!

COCKTAIL
Rated R

Evenings at 7 & 9 
Sunday Matinees at 1, 3 & 5

BARGAIN NIGHTS 
on Monday and 

Tuesday Evenings

Oct. 1-9 a.m. to 12 p.m. 
ORIGINAL MOVIE 
POSTERS SALE 

$5.00 each 
Decorate your bedroom, 

dorm or rec room!

“No, No Nanette” will be the 
Fall presentation to be shown at 
Kewaskum High School on Nov. 
4-5. The play consists of seven 
major roles and after initial try­
outs and call backs, the cast was 
selected. Playing the role of 
Nanette will be Angie Schoofs, 
a sophomore with a beautiful 
singing voice. Other female 
major roles include Lucille 
played by senior Shannon 
McFadden, Pauline played by 
junior Becky Manthei, and Sue 
played by Senior Cindy Wilson. 
The minor female roles of Flora, 
Betty, and Winnie will be 
piayed by junior Jill Peterson, 
and sophomores Pam Gauger 
and Ingrid Ankerson.

Playing the male major roles 
are sophomore Curt Ammel as 
Jimmy, junior John Hazlewood 
as Billy, and junior Jeff 
Brigham as Tom

The play takes place in the 
1920’s and will feature that 
style of music and costumes. 
Said Dave Bertelsen, the plays 
director, “A smaller cast has

2

/Ofall FESTivAiff
I Chicken & Dressing

DINNER
With Homemade Desserts

Sunday, Oct. 9 
ST. MATTHEW’S PARISH 

Campbellsport 
PRIZES: $500 - $300 - $200 

Plus Many Others 
Christmas Craft Booth 
Games ‘Entertainment 

MASSES AT 
8, 9 & 10 A.M.

AMERAHN
Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum

Sunday, Oct. 2 - 10 a.m. to 1 p.m. 

FALL BRUNCH 
Catering by Homeplate 

RESERVATIONS ONLY

Sunday, Oct. 2 - 2 to 6 

BRIAN & THE MISSISSIPPI 
VALLEY DUTCHMEN

PHONE 626-4031

TAKE THE TIME to 
ENRICH YOURSELF

S'KETTLE MORAINE NURSE'S
ASSOCIATION

CORDIALLY INVITES
ALL NURSES IN THE AREA 
TO THEIR FALL DINNER ON

OCTOBER 13, 1988

TIMMER'S 
6:00 - 8:15

GUEST SPEAKER
JAN STRECHER, R.N., M.S. 

"NURSING TOUCHING OTHER LIVES" 
Jan has practiced for 27 years as a nurse, 
manager and educator in acute and long­
term care. Author of DREAM MACHINES 
and MAGIC POTIONS: other notes from life. 
For More Information Contact St. Joseph's 

Community Hospital's Public Relations Office 
at 334-8391 • Reservations Due by October 7

11 a.m. to 3 p.m. 
CARRYOUTS AVAILABLE

« Served Country Style 
.*•=1 With l-lrirnc* marie* Dpqqpj

been much easier to work with. 
There’s also a lot of talent.” He 
praised the chorus of the play 
also which he said was “sound­
ing excellent.” All in all 
rehearsals are running quite 
smoothly. For reserved seating
information, 
Kewaskum 
626-2116 and 
Ammel.

please call 
High School 
talk with Larry

ABC CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners at skat played by 

the ABC Senior Citizens at 
Beechwood Hall on Tuesday, 
Sept. 20, were: Marvin Martin, 
22-5—17; Julius Yahr, 19-3—16 
.net; Ruth Egerer, 16-3—13 net; 
Ralph Laux, 10-1—9 net.

XYZ CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners on Wednesday, 

Sept. 21, played by the Senior 
Citizens XYZ Club at the Legion 
Hall in Kewaskum were: Allen 
Reindl, 21-3—18 net; Sylvester 
Schmidt, 22-5—17 net; 
Ken Kaschner 16-2—14 net; 
Marvin Martin, 15-3 — 12 net; 
Elroy Egerer, Heart turn vs 5.

A

Resolve Through Sharing to 
Sponsor ‘Walk to Remember

During the month of October 
(National Perinatal Bereave­
ment Awareness Month) 
hundreds of parents, health 
professionals and friends across 
the U.S. will be participating in 
“A Walk to Remember.” The 
Fond du Lac area Resolve 
Through Sharing support group 
is sponsoring a Walk To 
Remember on Saturday, 
October 1.

This walk is dedicated to the 
approximately 770,000 babies 
that die each year through 
miscarriage, stillbirth, or 
newborn death. The walk also 
symbolically joins all the people 
nationwide who are working to 
raise awareness on perinatal 
grief and ensure that sensitive 
care is given to parents.

The Resolve Through Sharing 
Walk to Remember will be held 
Saturday, October 1, at 10:00 
a.m. Interested persons are 
invited to meet in the lobby of 
St. Agnes Hospital at that time. 
Participants will walk to the 
Calvary Cemetery for a small 
presentation at the baby burial 
site, then return to the hospital. 
The walk is approximately one 
mile to the cemetery and one 
mile back. In case of rain, the

Walk to Remember will be held 
Sunday, October 2 at 2:00 p.m.

For more information about 
the Walk to Remember, contact 
Lillian Foote at 921-4699.

Planned Parenthood 
To Present Workshop 
For Young Girls

Planned Parenthood of Wis­
consin is presenting a workshop 
entitled “Boys, Boys, Boys: A 
Program For Girls” on Wed­
nesday, October 19th from 6:30 
to 8:30 p.m. at Bank One, 801 
W. Washington Avenue in 
West Bend.

This workshop is designed for 
girls, ages 10-13, and a parent 
(or other significant adult). 
Topics of discussion will focus 
on male anatomy, male puberty 
changes, and conception. Prior 
attendance at Mother Daughter 
Program is recommended.

The fee for this workshop is 
$10.00 per parent/child couple. 
For more information or to 
register, call the Community 
Services Department of Planned 
Parenthood at (414) 271-6033.
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Can ‘Team Up’ With Children

by Joyce Albrecht, 
Extension Home Economist
This may sound old-fashion­

ed, but reading out loud is one 
of the best things you can do for 
your child.

Children need to hear how a 
good sentence sounds before 
reading them makes sense. 
They benefit in the same way 
that a music student benefits 
from hearing a polished 
concert. Hearing a story read 
aloud teaches a child what 
reading is all about.

The statewide campaign to 
promote family involvement in 
education will continue during 
the new school year. “Our 
Children...Wisconsin Cares’’ is 
the year’s theme. .

Reading to your child is one 
way to show you care. Research 
shows parents can make a big 
difference in helping children 
learn to read and help them 
read better.

For toddlers, reading aloud 
stimulates spoken language. 
The child who speaks fluently, 
who can describe and explain 
things well, is the one who will 
learn to read most easily.

Spoken language lays the 
foundation of written language.

In a recent study, researchers 
found parents could boost the 
language skills of their two and 
three year olds by doing a few 
simple things when they read 
storybooks:

— Instead of reading the 
book straight through, parents 
stopped to ask questions.

— The questions they asked 
were open-ended. They did not 
have a yes/no answer, nor did

they require the child just to 
point to something. One 
example is asking “What 
happened to Humpty- 
Dumpty?” instead of “Did 
Humpty-Dumpty fall down?”

— Parents also expanded on 
their children’s answers, 
praised correct answers, 
suggested alternative answers, 
and asked progressively more 
challenging questions.

No matter what ages your 
children are, reading aloud is a 
great activity for the whole 
family, says Joyce Albrecht, 
Washington County Extension 
home economist. She offers 
these tips:

— Choose books or stories 
that everyone can enjoy. The 
librarian at your local public 
library can help.

— let older children take 
turns being the reader.

— Consider setting aside no­
television nights just for 
reading and other family 
activities. Many children will 
remember the times when their 
parents read to them as among 
their happiest family times.

— To make your reading 
aloud successful, let your child 
help select the stories to be 
read. Sometimes a child will 
want to hear the same story 
over and over again; that’s 
alright as long as you can talk 
about some aspect of the book 
together, too.

— Make sure you quit 
reading when the young ones 
begin to lose interest.

— Try to read to your child at 
least an hour each week (they 
need at least this much), but not

all at one time.
When parents and teachers 

work together, the children 
really benefit, Albrecht says.

“Too often, parents and 
teachers only talk together 
when they are required to, or 
when there is a problem,” she 
says. “Surprise your child’s 
reading teacher — call her or 
him up and ask how you can 
supplement at home what your 
child is learning at school.”

Some schools provide parents 
with materials to use at home, 
for example, reading games and 
books.

Your child’s teacher will be 
encouraged to work even harder 
for your child if she or he knows 
that you care enough to work on 
reading at home.

The Washington County UW- 
Extension Office has a variety of 
publications for parents of 
school-aged children. Stop in at 
our office located in the 
Courthouse, 432 E. Washington 
Street in West Bend for more 
information.

PUTTING FOOD PRICES 
INTO PERSPECTIVE

Although we’re paying more 
at the supermarket checkout 
than we did a year ago, the cost 
of food at home for the average 
U.S. household continues to 
decrease.

According to data collected 
by the Food Marketing Institute 
and U.S. Department of Agri­
culture, the average shopper 
spent just 9.6 percent of 
disposable income on groceries 
in 1987, compared to 12.5 
percent in 1977 and 20.5 
percent in 1947. At the turn of 
the century, Americans spent as 
much as 40 percent of their 
disposable income on food.

SCHOOL
MENUS

KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 
SCHOOLS

Monday, Oct. 3 — No School.
Tuesday, Oct. 4 — Double 

hamburger/bun (H.S. & M.S.), 
single hamburger (E.) French 
fries, relishes & dip and pine­
apple chunks.

Wednesday, Oct. 5 — Chili, 
crackers, buttered peas, slice of 
white bread/butter, peaches 
and an okie dokie cookie. (Salad 
Bar - H.S. & M.S.).

Thursday, Oct. 6 — Cheese & 
sausage pizza, green beans, 
homemade bread, pears and 
choc, cake w/choc. frosting.

Friday, Oct. 7 — Roast beef 
w/gravy, mashed potatoes, 
buttered corn, whole wheat 
dinner roll and cherry jello.

HOLY TRINITY 
SCHOOL

Monday, Oct. 3 — In-Service. 
No School.

Tuesday, Oct. 4 — Chicken 
pattie/bun, lettuce/mayo, 
fresh fruit, veggies/dip, cake/ 
cream, milk.

Wednesday, Oct. 5 —

Meatballs or meatloaf/gravy, 
whipped potatoes, green beans, 
dinner roll/butter, milk.

Thursday, Oct. 6 — Bar-B-Q, 
hot cheese sauce, w/nacho’s, 
buttered corn, pear half, 
cupcake, milk.

Friday, Oct. 7 — Fish & 
chips, cole slaw, chilled 
peaches, milk.

WASHINGTON COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU
Meadowcreek Apartment 

Complex
Monday, Oct. 3 — Grilled 

chopped steak w/mushroom 
gravy, whipped potatoes, green 
beans, white bread w/butter, 
chocolate pudding, milk and 
coffee.

Tuesday, Oct. 4 — Pork 
steak, augratin potatoes, whole 
baby carrots, 7 grain bread 
w/butter, apple sauce, milk and 
coffee.

Thursday, Oct. 6 — Veal 
parmesan, spaghetti, broccoli, 
Vienna bread w/butter, apple 
pie, milk and coffee.

Ceramics at 10:00 a.m. every 
3rd Tuesday of the month.

Card playing everyday.

Big Thirst
How much water does a big tree 
need? According to Ranger Rick 
magazine, a large leafy tree 
may take up as much as 240 
gallons [900 liters] of water 
from the soil every day. That 
would fill the average bathtub 
more than three times.

X

0

1523 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum 
PHONE 626-4982

W at AMERAHN
” Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum

Sunday, Oct. 2
10 a.m. to 1 p.m.

ALL YOU CAN EAT

OCTOBER ^
[lunch SPECIAL I

Includes scrambled eggs, sausage, 
fried potatoes, ham, chicken, mash­
ed potatoes and gravy, assorted 
salads and desserts.

ADULTS: $5.00 - CHILDREN (10 & under): $2.50 
Three Years and Under: FREE
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it is expected the first $1 million 
winner could be drawn some 
time in October.

A proposed bill could mean 
dramatic changes in the na­
tion’s welfare system. The five- 
year plan is directed toward 
getting welfare recipients into 
the workforce as well as help 
them collect more child support 
from non-resident parents.

Under the bill, which would 
cost $3.34 billion, welfare 
parents with children over three 
years old would be required to 
enroll in state basic education, 
job training, work experience 
and job search programs.

In fiscal 1990 and 1991, states 
would be required to enroll at 
least 7% of eligible parents in 
programs. By 1995, that figure 
would increase to 20%,

To aid recipients in transi­
tion, they would be assured one 
year of daycare and one year of 
Medicaid eligibility after 
obtaining a job.

The bill would also require 
automatic employer deductions 
for legally due child support 
payments from the absent 
parent’s paycheck.

Beginning in 1989, states 
would be given $600 million to 
institute a JOBS (Jobs Op­
portunities and Basic Skills) 
program, raising that figure to 
$1.3 billion in 1995.

Starting in 1994, one adult in 
each two-parent family would 
be required to perform 16 hours

a week of on-the-job training, 
community work or other work 
activities.

More reports of “Big Cat’’ 
sightings. The Waupaca County 
Sheriffs Department, this week, 
investigated the report of an 
attack by a large cat on a Town 
of Larabee farmer’s pigs.

A veterinarian’s examination 
confirmed the pigs had been 
attacked by what he considered 
to be a very large cat. An 
investigation of the animal’s 
paw prints and stride marks 
indicated the unknown type cat 
to be about four feet long, 
weighing approximately 100 
pounds. Neighboring Shawano 
County Sheriffs Department 
officials have also received 
sightings of a large black cat in 
its southern area near the 
Waupaca County line in recent 
weeks. The majority of 
Waupaca sightings have been 
in the Iola-Scandinavia area. A 
Shawano County driver report­
ed a large black cat with silver 
markings leapt across a road in 
front of his car.

Early Farm Days 
Another Success

On Sunday, September 11, 
the Kewaskum Historical 
Society held its 14th annual 
Early Farm Days.

We would like to first thank 
all of the people who came out 
and helped to support the 
society by buying food and 
drinks, and donating money to

the society. Second to all of 
those who exhibited their early 
farm equipment, including Matt 
Harvey and Dan Naumann who 
did the blacksmithing, also the 
Kettle Country Cloggers & the 
Kettle Moraine Squares. Finally 
we would like to especially 
thank Bud & Dean Schmidt of 
New Fane, and Alvin Panzer of 
Kewaskum for bringing their 
horses and wagons to give the 
people free hayrides, all of their 
time and effort is donated, and 
very much appreciated.

Sunday, November 13, is our 
annual dinner meeting. It will

TheI AST 
EMDER@R

AVAILABLE ON VIDEOCASSE TTE

WINNER 
OF 9 

ACADEMY 
AWARDS 

INCLUDING 
BEST PICTURE

Available at:
SHEFOND MOBIL MART

1149 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum
626-4300

Academy Awards it the regi tiered (fademark o< (hr Academy of Motion Picture Arts and Sciences

start at 11:30 a.m. with dinner 
at 12:30 p.m. at the Kewaskum 
Community Room. More 
information to follow. Our 15th 
Annual Early Farm Days will be 
on Sunday, September 10th, 
1989.

If you have any questions or 
would like to become a member, 
please call Jake Schmidt at 338- 
1568 weekdays after 5:00 p.m.

Statesman classified ads really 
work.

Lightning Strikes Twice
The idea that lightning never 
strikes twice is a myth. National 
Wildlife magazine says that not 
only does lightning strike some 
places more than once, but 
some areas like Castle Rock, 
Colorado and Cape Canaveral, 
Florida are struck frequently. 
Upward moving air causes the 
frequent strikes near the 
Continental Divide, while 
converging sea breezes attract 
the lightning on the Florida 
coastline. _

Holy Trinity 

FAMILY 
FUN NIGHT
Sunday, October 2

7:00 p.m.
HOLY TRINITY PARISH HALL

331 Main St., Kewaskum

Held the First Sunday of 
The Month Throughout the Year
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Draws Record Capacity Crowd

WEST BEND - Fall 
semester freshman orientation 
drew the largest group ever 
assembled on campus during 
the first 20 years of the Uni­
versity of Wisconsin Center — 
Washington County.

The capacity crowd of 
students, parents and spouses, 
completely filled the UWWC 
gym for dinner, necessitating a 
second orientation session on 
Sept. 8, during the first week of 
classes.

UWWC has a record 854 
students enrolled this fall, 
including 382 new freshman, 41 
above the previous high set in 
1986.

On Sept. 9, at the end of the 
first week of classes, Mike 
Murphy, director of student 
services, said the campus has 
another new record this fall: a 
full-time-equivalent enrollment 
of 616, up from 576 last fall.

The FTE figure, he explain­
ed provides an indication of how 
fully utilized a campus is. The 
figure is obtained by dividing 
the total number of credits 
being carried by 15 credits.

Dean Robert T. Thompson 
told the orientation crowd that 
they had made a good choice in 
UWWC. The campus, he said, 
has everything a person needs 
to get a good education — a 
strong, excellent academic 
program, coupled with a good 
faculty and staff that's easy to 
find and get help from.

“The only thing missing is 
you and what you bring,’’ 
Thompson said to the students. 
“We all want you to be success­
ful.’’

Jan Ford, associate director 
of student services, told 
students that the process of 
learning can be an exciting one.

“Learn to trust your 
teachers,” she said. “They’ll 
be able to give you the things 
that have relevance and 
meaning — things that down 
the road will have a real 
meaning for you.”

Ford described UWWC as a 
friendly place, where students 
often run into friends they know 
and can try something new 
without feeling at risk.

Staff, faculty and 28 
sophomore students were on 
hand to provide information on 
classes, student activities and 
give guided tours of the 
campus.

The evening orientation 
program was planned and 
sponsored by the UWWC 
Student Government 
Association and the Student 
Services office. For the first 
time, orientation included a 
sit-down dinner for all guests, 
along with professional enter­
tainment in the form of a 
brother comedy-magic act.

Some start the new year with 
high hopes: others just start 
high.

WISCONSIN 
LOHERY

KING PIN TUES. 
FIVE STAR League 

King Pin Lanes
Sept 20. 1988

Barrel Haus. 17-4; King Pin Pro Shop. 12-9; 
Dundee Sand & Gravel. 12-9; Serwe Roofing. 
11-10: Robbies Bar & Rest., 10-11; Honeck 
Chevorlel. 9-12; Tom's Custom Mill. 8-13; 
Barney's Bar. 5-16

Highlights
First high individual game — 237. Fred Kiss­

inger; Second high individual game — 237. Ron 
Mans. Third high individual game - 231. Kelly 
Rauch

First high individual series — 663. Fred Kiss­
inger; Second high individual series — 632. 
Dick Schuppel; Third high individual scries — 
606. Jett Pelischek

FRIDAY NITE 
MAJOR 800 LEAGUE 

King Pin Lanes
Sept 23. 1988

Welcome Inn. 15-6. T's Lounge. 12-9. She- 
fondOil, 11-10; King Pin Lanes. ll-IO;C-Port 
Self Serve. 10-11; American Family Ins., 
10-11; Ken Keller Agency. 9-12; Fin N- 
Feather. 6-15.

Highlights
First high individual game — 259. Ken 

Schmitt. Second high individual game — 257, 
Braatz Pierret; Third high individual game — 
242. Cary Serwe.

First high individual series — 697, Ken 
Schmitt; Second high individual series - 662. 
Braatz Pierret; Third high individual series — 
048. Gene Weber.

^AUTUMN COUNTRY^
MUSIC FEST ^

Thursday-Friday-Saturday-Sunday^
OCTOBER 6-7-8-9

at thePioneer 
Bowl

Live Music Under 
The Big Tent

TIMES: Thursday & Friday - 6 p.m. to Midnight
Saturday & Sunday - 10 a.m. to Midnight

Hwy. 167 & 175, Richfield, W1
Located in the Beautiful Kettle Moraine

^ Franks on the Lake ;
7 Gary and Nancy Frank, Proprietors

j/ (Formerly Nonn’s Resort) * / A.
533-8445

Serving from our dining room Tuesday thru Sunday
SUNDAY BUFFET - 11 a m to 2 p m

Off the Menu 2 to 8 p.m.
TUESDAY-WEDNESDAY-THURSDAY SPECIAL 

Complete Prime Rib Dinner - $5.95
FRIDAY FISH FRY

Sat., Oct. 8 - SPID PEEPER - 9 to 1 in the Dance Hall

HALLOWEEN DANCE - Friday, Oct. 28 
9 to 1

PRIZES FOR BEST COSTUME 
Hall Available for All Occasions

Thurs., Oct. 6
6 p.m. to Midnight 

•Softball •Bowling 
•Silver Dollar Midway 
FREE BEER 7 to 8 P.M

8 p.m. to Midnight 

Live Music By 
SKY HARBOR

SCHEDULE OF EVENTS

THE DEADLINE 
FOR DISPLAY ADS 
IS TUESDAY NOON

NEWS DEADLINE 
IS TUESDAY 

AT 3 P.M.
It stands to reason, however, the sooner 
you bring in your copy, the more time we 
have to devote to do it.

Classified Ads Will Be Accepted 
Until 12 noon on Wednesday.

A 24-Hour Door Slot Is Available 
For Your Convenience.

Fri., Oct. 7
6 p.m to Midnight 

•Softball * Bowling 
•Silver Dollar Midway 
FREE BEER 7 to 8 P.M.

8 p.m. to Midnight 

Live Music By 
PLUM LOCO

Sat., Oct. 8
10 a m to Dusk 

Autumn Fest Giant 
FLEA MARKET

It a m. to 4 p.m.

Antique Steam 
Engine Display

Noon to 8 p.m.

BINGO
By St Bonijace Churih 

Of Germantown
Noon to 4 p.m.

FREE HAY RIDE
On the Beautiful Trails 
Of the Kettle Moraine

Noon to 4 p m.

Pumpkin 
Carving Contest

2 p.m to 6 p.m.

Live Music By 
DANGER ZONE

8 p.m. to Midnight

Live Music By 
BRUCE RUSSELL 

& THE RUSTLERS 
Noon to Midnight 

•Softball •Bowling 
•Silver Dollar Midway

Sun., Oct. 9
10 a in to Dusk 

Autumn Fest Giant 
FLEA MARKET

11 a.m to 4 p.m. 

Show & Shine 
Truck Competition 

Antique Car Show & 
Antique Steam 
Engine Display

Noon to 4 p m

Live Music By 
DANGER ZONE

Noon to 4 p.m.

FREE HAY RIDE 
On the Beautiful Trails 
Of the Kettle Moraine

Noun io 4 p in 

Pumpkin Carving 
Contest

Noon to 8 p in.

BINGO
By St Boniface Church

Of Germantown
2 p.m. to 5 p.m.

Special Attraction 
4x4 

MUD DRAGS

3 p.m. to 5 p in 

Special Appearance 
Of the 1989 Girls 
Of the Wisconsin 
Women Calendar
Sunday Evening

5 p in to 10 p.m

Live Music By 
WHISKEY RIVER

"Nothing Bui the Best 
In Country Music"
Noon lo 10 p.m

•Ethnic Foods 
•Flea Market

•Suftball • Bow ling 
•Silver Dollar Midway

lot 3

• SV'"’’

Kewaskum Statesman

.So-’ \\0°u
'•’ W*

Celebrate Autumn Fest '88
Sunday, October 9th 

2:00 p.m.
Hain or Shine — We Hare

Pioneer
Bowl Hkh"'w

(Hwy 41 North Exit 167 West)
Family Entertainment • Bring the Whole Family 

Rain or Shine — We Race
PRICES Children Under 5 Free - Adults $7.00 • $4.00 Children 12 & Under
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BABES Program at ETN Offers Classes
The Council on AODA For Librarians

Two members of the Pre­
vention staff at The Council on 
Alcohol and Other Drug Abuse 
of Washington County have 
become certified BABES 
presenters. Beginning Alcohol 
and Addictions Basic Education 
Studies (BABES) is a primary 
prevention program designed to 
give children a lifetime of 
protection from substance 
abuse.

Sandy Gunderson, 
Prevention Specialist, and 
Marty Ison-Kocos, Public 
Information Coordinator will be 
facilitating the program 
utilizing animal puppets which 
are humanized to be like men, 
women and children we all 
know. The information will be 
presented in a factual, gentle, 
persuasive and non-judgmental 
manner.

"The lessons about 
self-image and feelings, 
decision making and peer 
pressure, and coping skills are a 
blending of actual child 
experiences plus the wisdom of 
a recovering cross-addicted 
friend," said Ison-Kocos. 
‘‘These lessons will apply to 
other problem situations that 
our children may encounter as 
they grow."

Sandy Gunderson, familiar to 
AODA Prevention pro­
gramming in all Washington 
County school districts, stated 
‘‘We hope to be assisted in 
these programs by our Peer 
Listeners and other 
volunteers."

For more information on the 
BABES program contact The 
Council, 338-1181.

Baby spiders are known as spiderlings

Librarians in Washington 
County will be able to partici­
pate in over a dozen programs 
to be held at the Hartford Public 
Library and UWWC in West 
Bend this Fall.

Conducted by the Continuing 
Education Services of the 
University of Wisconsin- 
Madison’s School of Library and 
Information Studies, the 
programs will be offered state­
wide through the UW-Exten- 
sion ’ s Educational
Teleconference Network (ETN).

The classes and their dates 
are: Language Arts, Science 
and Social Studies K-9 Trade 
Books, Oct. 3 and 10; The 
Basics of Budgeting and 
Bookkeeping for the Small 
Public Library, October 14 and 
18; Timely Topics for Small 
Public Libraries, five sessions, 
October 20 - April 13; In­
tellectual Freedom and 
Libraries Today, Nov. 3 and 10; 
Library Services and Construe-

A&K 
RESTAURANT

Home Cooking
Carryout Dinners 
Available Daily

OPEN 9 A M. TO 10 P.M.
Closed Mondays

Hwy. 28 & 144 
Random Lake 

994-4725

Country 
CRAFT 

FAIR

tion Act, four sessions, Nov. 8- 
29; Health Science Online 
Users, three sessions, Nov. 17 - 
March 16; Alumni Session, 
November 18; Automation in 
the Small Public Library, Nov. 
30;and A Book is a Gift You Can 
Open Again and Again, Nov. 
30.

For an enrollment form or a 
catalog describing these and 
other ETN classes, call the 
University Center, 338-5204. 
For more information about a 
library program, contact Jane 
Pearlmutter, program 
coordinator, School of Library 
and Information Studies, 600 N. 
Park S., Madison, WI 53706; 
(608) 262-6398.

Customer to postal clerk: "It’s 
fragile, so please throw it 
underhand."

Nicely Redecorated

TURNER HALL
Fillmore

Choice dates available

WASHINGTON, D C. - Mrs. Barbara Bush, wife of the Vice Presi­
dent, recently welcomed Mrs. Eva Kasten, wife of Senator Bob Kasten, 
into the Congressional Wives for Bush Committee. The Committee will 
work to promote the Vice President's campaign among women voters.

for weddings, etc.
AMPLE PARKING

692-2597
* Class Reunion Special
★Catering Available
* Wood Dance Floor

MAXWELL ST. DAY

CORN GAME
Every Third 
Wednesday

7 p.m.

SUNDAY, OCT. 2nd, 1988 
CEDARBURG, WI — FIREMEN’S PARK

Gates Open 4:30 A.M.
Sponsored by CEDARBURG FIRE DEPT.

P.O. Box 344, Cedarburg, WI 53012
Free Admission, Refreshments on Grounds. Refreshment 
Concession Rights Reserved by the Cedarburg Fire Dept. 
No animals allowed on grounds. Parking Available on 
Grounds $1.00.___________________________________

BILLY JEAN’S
COUNTRY TAP
(Formerly Hinn’s Tap)

413 Hwy. S, New Fane

Sunday, Nov. 27
11 a m. to 5 p.m.

BOOTHS STILL AVAILABLE 
Call Jean at 626*2831

★Food and Refreshments*



Kewaskum Statesman, Friday, Sept. 30, 1988, Page 11

Clarence A. Schwartz, Sheriff

Washington 
county, wis.
SHERIFFS

Local Sheriff Offers Children

Back-to-School Biking Safety Tips

"As school resumes, children 
will again be riding their 
bicycles to and from school,” 
comments Washington County 
Sheriff Clarence A. Schwartz. 
"All too often, children — like 
adults — become creatures of 
habit and overlook simple safety 
precautions. I would like to ask 
all school children who ride 
their bicycles to remember a 
few safety tips:

- Only one person belongs on 
your bike. Never let a second 
person ride with you.

- Allow plenty of room for a 
safe stop. Never follow bikes or 
cars too closely.

- Keep both hands on the 
handle bars for safe steering.

- Always give proper signals. 
Keep a firm grip on the handle 
bars with your right hand and

Schoenwetter Elected An 
Assistant V.P. at 
B.C. Ziegler Co.

B.C. Ziegler and Company, 
an investment banking firm, 
has announced that David J. 
Schoenwetter, registered 
representative in the firm's 
West Bend office, was elected 
an assistant vice president.

Schoenwetter received a 
bachelor of arts degree in 
history from St. Norbert College 
in West De Pere, Wisconsin.
Prior to joining Ziegler in 1983, 
he was a teacher and coach for 
Campbellsport High School. He 
was a sergeant in the U.S. Army 
Reserve for six years and he is a 
member of the West Bend 
Rotary. Schoenwetter and his 
wife,Kathryn,, have two 
children and reside in West 
Bend.

Ziegler, retirement 
investment specialists serving 
the conservative needs of 
America’s families, is an 
investment banking firm that 
specializes in the underwriting 
of taxable and tax-exempt debt 
securities for health care 
institutions, retirement 
facilities, corporations, financial 
institutions and churches. The 
company has 29 offices 
nationwide.

EYE 
BROW 

ARCHING

FAMILY HAIR SALON 
227 Main St., Kewaskum 

626-2650
HAIR COLORING 

STYLING MAKEUP

[ DEPARTMENT Zacher - Vorpahl

use your left arm and hand to 
signal turns and stops. Arm 
straight out is a "left” turn; 
arm bent up at the elbow is a 
"right” turn; and arm bent 
down at the elbow is a "stop.”

- Avoid riding your bike at 
night. If you must ride at night, 
equip your bike with a good 
headlight and rear reflectors. 
Wear light colored or reflective 
clothing so others can see you 
easily.

- Make sure you obey all 
traffic signals. Stop completely 
at stop signs, and always look 
both ways before starting out 
again.

The Sheriff explains that it’s 
easy for children to get into a 
routine in traveling back and 
forth to school. However, he 
stresses that children should 
remind themselves — and be 
reminded by their parents — 
that practicing safety every day 
can save them from serious 
injury.

"Remember that a bicyclist is 
like a motorist,” Sheriff 
Schwartz concludes. "He must 
be skilled like an automobile 
driver in handling his vehicle 
and should always be cautious 
when traveling the roads.”

Cattle branding was prac­
ticed 4,000 years ago. Old 
tomb paintings show Egyp­
tians branding their cattle.

RICHARD’S
Kut and Style Shop

Will Be

CLOSED
Sat., Oct. 1

and

Tues., Oct. 4
Thank You, 
RICHARD

The marriage vows of Sherry 
Zacher and Thomas Vorpahl 
were blessed during a May 7, 
1988 ceremony at Holy Angels, 
West Bend.

Parents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. Steve Zacher and Mr. 
and Mrs. John H. Vorpahl both 
of West Bend.

The maid of honor was 
Bonnie Reuwsaat, friend of the 
bride and bridesmaids were 
Donna Crass, Shelly Zacher,

Beautiful Furniture for Your Home

PERM 
WAVING

Stephanie Jung, Sheryl Zacher 
and Jean Strobel.

Dale Schmidt, cousin of the 
groom served as best man, and 
Mike Schmidt, John Vorpahl 
Jr., David Jung, Lawrence 
Vorphal, and Jeff Vorpahl were 
groomsmen.

Ushering duties were shared 
by Charlie Zacher, Uncle of the 
bride and Steven Charles, 
friend of the groom.

A reception followed at the

K.C. Hall, West Bend.
The bride is 1980 graduate 

from West Bend East High 
School and is employed at A.N. 
Ansay & Associates, Port 
Washington.

The groom is a 1982 graduate 
from Kewaskum High School 
and is employed at ATACO 
Steel Company, Grafton.

The couple reside at 2109 
Barton Ave., West Bend, with 
their son, Kyle John Vorpahl.
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Change to Speed Needed Highway Projects
Governor Tommy Thompson 

recently proposed using some of 
the Transportation Fund’s 
ongoing cash balances to 
accelerate work on 17 major 
highway construction projects 
around the state without a tax 
increase.

“Using these cash balances is 
a down payment toward 
completing ‘corridors 2020,’ our 
highway-economic development 
plan to help Wisconsin compete 
in the world economy,” 
Thompson said.

Using the cash-balance plan 
would speed up work on four 
projects already approved by 
the Legislature, Thompson told 
the state Transportation 
Projects Commission:

* Highway 53, from Solon 
Springs to Hawthorne in 
northwestern Wisconsin, 
planned for construction in 
1992-93, could instead be-built 
in 1990-91;

* Blue Mound Road (US 18) 
in Waukesha County, planned 
for 1992-95, could be advanced 
to 1990-92;

* Rhinelander Beltline (US 8), 
scheduled for 1991-92, could be 
built in 1990-91 and

Highway 151, from Sun 
Prairie to Columbus, planned 
for 1991-93, could be advanced 
to 1989-91.

Adding two lanes to the West 
Bend Bypass (US 45), set for 
1991, can be moved up to next 
year because the state last 
month received some additional 
federal highway aids when the 
federal government distributed 
dollars not used by other states.

Thompson said his proposed 
use of some cash balances is a 
prudent way to manage the 
Transportation Fund that would 
allow Wisconsin to capture the 
benefits more rapidly from the 
completion of economically- 
justified projects. He said his 
plan would allow the state to 
accelerate work on 8 to 11 
projects recommended by the 
Department of Transportation 
and being considered by the 
Transportation Projects 
Commission for the upcoming 
1989-91 budget:

* River Falls’ Beltline could 
be constructed in 1991-92 
instead of 1993-94;

* Eau Claire’s North Crossing 
over the Chippewa River, 
(which would be built in 1994-95 
under current financing 
methods), could be finished in 
1992-93;

* Highway 61/151 from

u-"^
If Not, Talk to

Physicians Mutual ^X^^J Insurance Company

About Our
MEDI-FLEX MEDICARE SUPPLEMENT POLICY 

that with optional rider pays 100% of ALL covered 
Medicare eligible expenses not paid by Medicare

• Payments based on the ACTUAL bill
• NO WAITING PERIODS for pre-exisiting conditions
• Premiums CANNOT INCREASE because of age or health
• Optional Riders can INCREASE BENEFITS or LOWER PREMIUMS

PM A 253

CALL OR MAIL THE COUPON BELOW TO

ARLENE HANKWITZ
7 Guindon Blvd. * Fond du Lac, Wl 54935 • 922-6949

There is NO COST OR OBLIGATION!
BirthdateName

Address Phone

Cl,y———————— State 2'P

Sandy Hook to Dickeyville in 
Grant County could be done by 
1993 instead of 1994;

* The Fort Atkinson Bypass 
could be built in 1991-94 instead 
of 1993-95;

* Highway 41 from Abrams to 
Oconto could be constructed in 
1991-93 instead of 1994-95;

* Highway 41 in Winnebago 
County, from WIS 114 to 
County OO, could be expanded 
to six lanes 1991-94 instead of 
1993-95;

♦ Highway 54 from Wisconsin 
Rapids to Plover could be built 
in 1992-96 instead of 1994-98; 
and

* Highway 53 from Trego to 
Solon Springs could be finished 
in 1992-97 instead of 1994-98.

Three other projects 
recommended by DOT for 
construction were:

* Highway 51 from Columbus 
to Beaver Dam, scheduled for 
1991-93;

* Highway 12 from Sauk City 
to Middleton, set for 1991-95, 
and

* Highway 60 from Hartford 
to US 41, scheduled for 1991-93.

In addition, the Governor 
said, the financing method he is 
proposing would allow the 
Legislature to approve five 
other DOT - recommended 
projects in the next budget — 
over and above the 11 it would 
be able to name under current 
financing methods:

* Highway 50, the New 
Munster Bypass in Kenosha 
County, starting in 1992;

* Highway 51 from Merrill to 
County S in Lincoln County, 
starting in 1993;

♦ Highway 29, the Chippewa 
Falls Bypass, with construction 
starting in 1994;

* Highway 18/151, the 
Verona Bypass, starting in 1992 
and

* Highway 36 from 
Burlington to WIS 100, starting 
in 1994.

All of the proposed changes 
would be contingent upon 
reaching local cost-sharing 
arrangements wherever 
appropriate.

Governor Thompson said the 
cash-balance plan would also 
make available a “substantial 
amount of money to get the ball 
rolling on work we need to do 
now to make progress on key 
highway corridors like 
Highways 29 and 151.”

DOT Secretary Ronald 
Fiedler said the plan would 
make available funding needed

to accelerate location, 
environmental and design work 
on highways included in the 
Corridors 2020 proposal. This 
will assure that plans are ready 
by 1993 for actual construction 
of substantial segments of key 
highway corridors like 
Highways 29, 41 and 151. The 
construction itself will require 
an additional $50 million 
annually beginning about 1993.

Fiedler emphasized that by 
completing these candidate 
major projects earlier, 
resources can be concentrated 
on corridor development in the 
1990s.

Highways 29 and 151 are key 
parts of the Governor’s 
Corridors 2020 proposal 
announced in early August. The 
highway-economic development 
plan identified highway 
“economic lifelines” he said 
need to be improved to help 
Wisconsin businesses compete 
in national and world markets.

The Governor’s cash-balance 
plan would free about $20 
million for additional 
construction over each of the 
next four to six years.

The current method, which 
has been used since the mid- 
1970s, focuses on when 
financial obligations are made 
rather than when the actual 
cash payments are made. 
Thompson's proposal uses the 
ongoing portion of the cash 
balance, which can be tracked 
on a daily basis.

Fiedler said the average cash 
balance in the Transportation 
Fund in the last fiscal year has 
been $150 million, ranging from 
a maximum of $200 million to a 
minimum of $70 million.

The cash-balance initiative 
would use the portion of the 
cash balance which is constant 
— the amount not needed for 
current-year payout and thus 
available for other purposes — 
to speed up the major highway 
projects.

Another immediate 
advantage of the new plan 
would be the use of cash and the 
deferral of bonding already

approved.
The DOT, at a recent 

Transportation Projects 
Commission meeting released 
its list of 35 candidate major 
projects showing how they 
ranked following this summer’s 
public hearings. The 
commission will make its final 
recommendations to the 
Legislature by Dec. 1.

This year’s evaluation 
process placed a greater 
emphasis on economic develop­
ment-related criteria such as 
the project’s ability to help 
existing businesses be more 
competitive, attract new 
business, and their relationship 
to the economic-corridors plan.

Other goals considered in the 
ranking were the project’s 
ability to improve highway 
service, improve safety, 
minimize undesirable social or 
environmental impacts, and to 
serve community objectives.

WEDNESDAY MORNINGETTES 
LEAGUE 

King Pin Lanes
Sept. 21. 1988

Joe Berres Insurance, 22-6; Grapevine. 
17-11. Shefond Oil. Inc., 17-11; Fin-N-Feather. 
14 14. Bauman's Dairy, 12-16; Bar-N-Annex, 
12-16; Herriges Oil, Inc., 10-18; Alice Ketter 
Cakes. 8-20.

Highlights
First high individual game — 189, Lorraine 

Serwe; Second high individual game — 187, 
Dianna Faul; Third high individual game — 
183, Cheri Staehler.

First high individual series — 509, Lorraine 
Serwe; Second high individual series — 476, 
Marian White; Third high individual series — 
476, Janet Serwe.

In the Pink
In captivity, flamingos are fed 
carrot oil to keep their feathers 
pink. Ranger Rick magazine 
reports that carrot oil contains 
carotin, a chemical that gives 
the flamingo's feathers a pink 
color. Without this chemical the 
bird's annual growth of new 
feathers would be white. In the 
wild, a flamingo's pink color 
comes from the carotin in the 
tiny shrimp-like animals they 
eat.

MONDAY, OCTOBER 3
NO SCHOOL FOR

STUDENTS
TUESDAY, OCTOBER 4

KHS Girls Volleyball - New 
Holstein here

KHS Girls Tennis Sectionals
KMS Girls Track at Pewaukee - 

3:30
WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 5
KHS Girls Tennis Sectionals
THURSDAY, OCTOBER 6
KHS JV Football at Kiel
KHS Freshman Football - Kiel 

here
KHS Cross Country - Cougar 

Invitational
KMS Girls Track at Beaver Dam 

- 4 p.m.
ERI DAY, OCTOBER 7

KHS HOMECOMING GAME - 
Varsity Football - Kiel here - 7:30 
p.m.

SATURDAY, OCTOBER 8
HOMECOMING DANCE - 

Rose Hall - 8 to 11 p.m.
MONDAY, OCTOBER 10
SCHOOL BOARD MEETING - 

7 p.m. - Commons at Kewaskum 
High School

UNIVERSAL
CHILDREN’S
DAY □ OCTOBER 3 □
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Wisconsin Farm Progress Days

Over 40 members of the 
Kewaskum High School agri­
culture department attended 
this years Wisconsin Farm 
Progress Days on Thursday, 
September 22. The three day 
farm show was held near Janes­
ville in Rock County.

Tent City, the commercial 
exhibit area of the show, took 
up over 60 acres at the 1988 
show. Students were respon­
sible for visiting various 
exhibitors and reporting to the 
class the important aspects of 
the exhibit and its importance to 
agriculture.

Other features of this years 
show included youth activities, 
farm management demonstra-

Publications on Single 
Parenting Now Offered 
At Extension Office

Making ends meet is often 
difficult for households with 
children, but single parents face 
a unique challenge.

A new 14 part series of 
publications, “Parenting On 
Your Own" is designed to help 
single parents make the most of 
their money and skills, cope 
with stress and be effective 
parents.

The titles include: Feeling 
Good About Yourself, Turning 
Lonely into Alone, Managing 
Stress, Friendship and Support, 
When There’s Not Enough 
Time, Be in Control of Your 
Finances, Getting and Using 
Credit, Finding the Job You 
Want, Merchandising, Your 
Job Talents, Discipline, Provid­
ing Care for Your Children, 
How Divorce Affects Kids, 
Helping Children Adjust, and 
Sharing Parenting Respon­
sibilities.

You can obtain the “Parent­
ing On Your Own” series by 
contacting the Washington 
County UW-Extension Office at 
338-4479; 644-5204 or 342-2929. 
The cost of the publication is 
$3.45.

From Tom Kennelly

EXERCISE - LONGEVITY
Exercise lengthens your 

life! A study of 17,000 Harvard 
alumni, over a 16-year period, 
suggests that for every hour of 
exercise, these graduates 
lived that hour over, plus one 
or two extra hours. Simply 
walking, stair climbing, and 
sports that used 2000 calories 
a week lowered death rates 14 
to */3 below that of less active 
persons. Heavy exercise that 
consumes more than 3500 
calories per week, appears to 
have a slightly detrimental 
effect.
Filling your prescription is 
our most important work

KsnnEtiv 
PHARfflACV

927 Fond du lac Ave.
Kewaskum 626-8001

tions, family living programs, 
and old time machinery 
displays. While the wet weather 
cancelled all of the field 
demonstrations, the students 
had a chance to visit the host 
farm set-up.

The students that ' attended 
the show were: Curt Arndt, 
Lynn Dorzok, Scott Krueger, 
Paul Retzlaff, Dave Steger, 
Scott Volm, Steve Ramthun, 
Tom Batzler, Scott Berger, 
Brian Butzlaff, Jason Flasch, 
Todd Gnacinski, Steve Holl, 
Jeff Jeske, Matt Klug, Ken 
Krause, Jon McElhatton, Erik 
Reha, Jason Reindl, James Van 
Beek, Craig Amerling, Joe 
Jeske, Lee Kurth, Scott 
Limberg, Mike Ramthun, Kevin 
Resch, Mike Ruplinger, April 
Wulff, Mike Yahr, Paul Becker, 
Tim Butschlick, Chad Krahn, 
Dave Kuphal, Mike Melzer, 
Chris Michaels, Tim Oelhafen, 
Trevor Roesel, Chris Schmid, 
Tim Schultz, Bruce Theusch, 
David Brooks, Jenny Degnitz, 
Darrin Haeuser, Tim Herman, 
John Hupfer, Rick Kreif, 
Jeremy Lubahn, Jason Thull, 
Jason Walls, Buffy Reseburg. 
The students were chaperoned 
by Mr. Rizzardi and alumni 
members Bill Butzlaff, Steve 
Redig and Jeff Mueller.

ONLY THE NEWSPAPER goes 
behind the scenes for the 
facts behind the events. No 
other medium can approach 
this thoroughness. The regular 
reader of a newspaper not 
only knows what’s going on, 
but also why.

Replacement 
WINDOWS & DOORS 

Custom Made to Fit Your Opening 
^Insulation ^Siding ^Additions

•Soffit Systems & Custom Trim ’Seamless Aluminum Gutters

^ HEBERER BROS. 
^\ CONSTRUCTION
I > Roger 626-2598 Norm 626-2491
Kewaskum^} __________ Bill 626-2384__________

LEHMAN
59th District

Assembly Candidate
Says

THANKS
To all voters who supported me in the 
primary. Now, we must all work 
together towards winning the 
November 8, General Election.

Looking forward to 
working with and for you!

Thanks,
Michael A. Lehman

Authorized and paid tor by Lehman tor Assembly Mary Ellen Lehman, Treasurer

THANK YOU...
to all the people who supported me and 
voted for me in the past primary election. 
Your continued support is greatly 
appreciated

Todd Bodden
Authorized and paid for by Todd Bodden N8202 Hwy 175, Theresa, Wl 53091

25 Years Ago
September 27, 1963

Fire Chief Armin Oppermann 
and several members of the depart­
ment were to Appleton on Wednes­
day to pick up and deliver the 
Kewaskum Fire Department’s new 
fire engine pumper which was pur­
chased at a cost of approximately 
$28,000, including the equipment. 
About 50 per cent of the cost of the 
engine is being absorbed by the fire 
department itself. The pumper, 
ordered by the department some 
months ago, is a Clintonville four- 
wheel drive and was purchased 
from the Boland Truck and Equip­
ment Company of Milwaukee. It is 
capable of pumping 1,000 gallons 
of water a minute.

In a special referendum election 
held Tuesday in the grade school 
gymnasium, electors of the 
Kewaskum Elementary School 
Joint District No. 1 approved the 
issuance of $250,000 in general 
obligation bonds for construction of 
an addition to the present elemen­
tary school building in the village. 
The vote was 161 “yes” and 109 
“no.”

Homecoming festivities for 1963 
will be held at Kewaskum High 
School on October 3 and October 
4. The parade and pep rally will be 
held on Thursday, Oct. 3, starting 
at 7:30 p.m. The football game 
with Campbellsport will be played 
under the lights at 7 p.m. on Fri­
day. Oct. 4. After the game a dance 
will be held in the high school gym. 
“Autumn Leaves” is the theme of 
this year’s homecoming. Michael 
Coulter has been chosen king of the 
festivities by his fellow teammates. 
He has selected Colleen Held as his 
queen. The other members of the 
royal court and their escorts are: 
Seniors, Carol Bruessel and Robert 
Schaefer; Karen Luedtke and 
Robert Rossow; Laura Laghi, AFS 
student, an honorary member of the 
court and her escort Gerald Miller. 
Representatives from the junior 
class are Elaine Vetter and Hiram 
Justman, and Mary Nigh and 
Ronald Amerling. Lucile Kirchner 
and Ralph Bier will represent the 
sophomore class. The freshman 
class will be represented by Lois 
Herriges and Barry Beimborn.

Miss Diane Becker, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Becker, Route 
2, Kewaskum, and Gerald Buchel, 
son of Mrs. Ruth Buchel of 
Beechwood, exchanged vows in St.

Lucas Lutheran Church, 
Kewaskum on Sept. 21.

Norman Zuehlke, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmer Zuehlke. Route 1, 
Kewaskum, claimed Miss Helen 
Kimmerling, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. George G. Kimmerling, Hart­
ford, as his bride during a 2 p.m. 
weddding ceremony performed in 
St. John’s United Church of Christ, 
Slinger, on Sept. 14.

A son, Timothy Carl, was born 
to Mr. and Mrs. Jay Van Blarcom 
of Garden Grove, California, on 
Sept. 7. Mr. Van Blarcom is a son 
of Mr. and Mrs. John Van Blar­
com, Kewaskum.

50 Years Ago
September 30, 1938

St. John’s Evangelical Church at 
Beechwood will celebrate its fif­
tieth anniversary or golden jubilee 
Oct. 2. Rev. Richard M.A. 
Gadow, pastor of the Peace 
Evangelical Church, in Kewaskum 
is also pastor of the Beechwood 
congregation. St. John’s was 
established in 1888. Raymond 
Krahn is church president; Martin 
Krahn, Sunday school superinten­
dent; Mrs. Henry Kraemer. Ladies 
Aid president; Norman Held, 
Young People’s League president; 
Mrs. Winferd Walvoord, organist 
and choir director. Three services 
will be held in observance of the 
jubilee.

John Kleinhans, St. Kilian, 
received word from his wife, who 
is visiting their son-in-law and 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Jos. 
Librizzi and family at Providence, 
Rhode Island, that they are safe 
after the hurricane and flood which 
struck the Eastern states last week 
Wednesday. However, they suf­
fered slight damage form the storm 
and water. Mrs. Kleinhans states

JIM SCHAUB
“for the repair /ob that s 

been put oft for too long ’
PO Box 177 

Kewaskum. Wl 53040

Garages / Garage Doors / Remodeling / Roofing 
Siding / Storm Doors / Storm Windows 

Decks / Concrete

that the store where Mr. Librizzi 
is employed was filled with water 
to the ceiling of the first floor. The 
Librizzi family recently transferred 
their residence from Milwaukee to 
Providence. Mrs. Kleinhans had 
accompanied them to assist in get­
ting settled.

75 Years Ago
September 27, 1913

This issue is missing from our 
files. This column will return with 
the October II, 1913 issue.

In the Service
Kevin R. Kumrow, son of 

Gloria J. and Ronald E. 
Kumrow of 8080 Highway 144 
N., West Bend, has been 
promoted in the U.S. Army to 
the rank of specialist.

Kumrow is a missile 
electronics material specialist 
with the 9th Field Artillery in 
West Germany.

He is a 1986 graduate of 
Kewaskum High School, Wis.

• • •
Air Force Capt. (Dr.) Michael 

A. Strigenz, son of Anthony J. 
and Elizabeth A. Strigenz of 
Kewaskum, has arrived for duty 
at Wright-Patterson Air Force 
Base Hospital, Ohio.

Strigenz is assigned as the 
assistant chief of otolaryngology.

His wife, Mary, is the 
daughter of Edward and 
Florence Oswall of 485 
Woodside Terrace, Madison.

The captain, a 1975 graduate 
of Kewaskum High School, 
received his doctorate in 1983 
from Marquette University 
Medical College of Wisconsin, 
Milwaukee.

IT HOME \ 
[IMPROVEMENT.
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11 year old Brendan is 
looking at the world through 
new eyes now. The fuzzy shapes 
are clear to him at last, thanks 
to in organization called New 
Eyes for the Needy, Inc.

Since 1932, New Eyes for the 
Needy has helped more than 4 
million people both here and 
overseas — without ever asking 
anyone for a dime!

New Eyes receives no federal 
funds, and never requests a 
monetary donation, but because 
of their good work, many 
children and adults can see the 
world clearly now. A world that 
was a confusing place of blurry 
shapes and fuzzy images 
before.

How do they do it? By asking 
individuals and organizations to 
donate discarded metal frames 
in any condition, reusable 
plastic framed glasses and 
precious metal scraps such as 
old watches, jewelry and 
silverware.

Metal frames and scrap metal 
are sold to a refinery, and the 
redeemed cash is used to 
purchase new prescription 
glasses for people here in the 
states — people who otherwise 
could not afford the glasses they 
need to function. The plastic 
framed glasses are classified 
and sent to medical missions 
overseas for distribution to 
those in such dire need. The 
glasses are never sold, they are 
distributed to people who need 
and can use them.

Nothing is left to chance or to 
waste at New Eyes. The intact 
jewelry and silverware are sold 
at locally publicized sales where 
hundreds of volunteers and 
participants are involved. The 
money realized from the sales is 
also used to purchase new 
prescription glasses for our less 
fortunate neighbors across the 
country. * The great thing about 
New Eyes,” wrote a lady from 
Iowa with her donation of old

glasses and jewelry, “is all the 
good you do with things just 
lying around the house. Now I 
have a chance to help others in a 
very real way — even though I 
have no money to spare.”

And donations really do make 
a difference. Last year New 
Eyes mailed more than 250,000 
reusable plastic framed glasses 
overseas and paid for 
approximately 6,000 new 
prescription glasses in the 
United States. Just last month, 
New Eyes received a neatly 
printed note from a 7 year old in 
Texas. It simply said, “I can 
see! Thank you New Eyes.”

All this work is done by 
volunteers and people who care 
enough to send discarded 
glasses, jewelry and silverware 
to the New Jersey 
clearinghouse. You can help, 
too. Send your donation to: New 
Eyes for the Needy, Inc., P.O. 
Box 332, 549 Millburn Avenue, 
Short Hills, New Jersey 07078.

Or you can work with your 
church group, civic organization 
or fraternal lodge to conduct a 
collection drive. New Eyes will 
supply posters, sample news 
releases and brochures. Write 
to that address for more infor­
mation.

For the cost of a postage 
stamp, you can make a 
difference in someone’s life.

INSURANCE CLAIMS 
APPROVED SERVICE

■ Auto Glass
Replacement

■ Windshield Repair 
(Novus Method)

■ Home Glass
■ Sunroofs
■ Pickup Sliding 

Back Glass
■ Mirrors

Another successful and 
enjoyable Girl Scout Day Camp 
was held again this year. Girls 
from Campbellsport, Farming­
ton, Wayne, Kewaskum, and a 
few from West Bend and 
Allenton attended camp at the 
Kiwanis Community Park in 
Kewaskum from July 18 to 22.

The Wau-Bun Council’s 
theme - “Girl Scouts take the 
Lead!”, was well construed, as 
the girls were “led” into many 
new camping skills. These 
included fire building, making 
PUKKY pies, knot tying, and so 
much more.

The older unit of 4th and 5th 
grade girls in Jr. Girl Scouts 
could say they experienced the 
best of Girl Scout cooking and 
baking. One meal included 
Hobo dinners, followed by a 
delicious cake made in ‘a box” 
- that is an aluminum foil lined 
cardboard box, heated with 5 or 
6 gray-white charcoal, and used 
like an oven. (And you can 
believe me...the cake was 
delicious!).

On Tuesday, the girls made 
plans for an International and 
National Day. The idea was that 
the girls would learn things 
about other Scouts and Girl 
Guides from all over the world. 
The countries the girls were 
interested in were Mexico, 
Japan, Greece, Kenya and the 
U.S. The first year Brownies (6 
and 7 yr. old girls) really worked 
hard. They learned different 
things about the American 
Indian. All the girls presented 
what they learned on Friday 
afternoon during “skits,” 
when they took turns singing 
songs, teaching games, or 
presenting short stories in 
forms of rehearsed plays and 
puppet shows.

On Wednesday and Thursday 
of the week, the girls kept 
themselves really busy! 
Learning to tie-dye was found to 
be a lot of fun, and work. It was 
even harder to fit it into their 
schedules, since cooking 
sometimes took a long time. 
(That also took planning on 
their part). Yet all the girls who 
tried tie-dying learned 
something new and gained 
something new to wear...for 
example, beautifully designed 
T-shirts, scarves, blouses, and 
even a few pair of socks, and a 
pair of pants became Girl Scout 
originals.

tookMany of the Brownies

1326 N. MAIN ST, WEST BEND 
338-2280 or 1-800-522-0330 
Mobile Service Open Mon-Fri 8am-5pm 
lifetime Warrant/!

the time to work on one of the 
outdoor Try-its. With the help 
of “Sunshine” (Lois B.), the 
girls made plaster of paris and 
created sedimentary rocks and 
fossil prints. .

In closing, the experience at 
Day Camp was a learning one 
by doing for many of the girls- 
But, by volunteering as a staff 
member it proved to be a lot of 
fun and succeeded in teaching 
ME new things too!

Sincerely, Korky.

P.S. I hope this encourages a 
few new faces to help us out 
next year... experience not 
necessary; your help and talents 
would be greatly appreciated.

Cub Leader Basic 
Training Course

Glacier Edge District 11, of 
the Bay-Lakes Council of the 
Boy Scouts of America, will 
conduct a Basic Training Course 
for all Cubmasters, Committee 
Chairmen, Den Leaders, 
Webelos Leaders, Den Leader 
Coaches, their assistants and 
Pack Committee Members. To 
accomodate everyone, two 
options are offered: Saturdays, 
October 8, from 9:00 - 12:00 
a.m., and October 15, from 9:00 
a.m. - 2:00 p.m., at the Grafton 
Senior Citizen Center, 1665 
Seventh Avenue Grafton; and 
Wednesdays, October 12, 19 
and 26, from 6:45 - 9:00 p.m., at 
Fifth Avenue United Methodist 
Church, 323 S. Fifth Avenue, 
West Bend. Cost is $2.50. 
Participants for October 15 are 
asked to bring a bag lunch.

Sessions on October 8 and 12 
will include: Youth Protection, 
Cub Scouting Purpose and 
Methods, Pack Organization 
and Leadership, Activities and 
Resources, Outdoor Program, 
Rules and Regulations and 
Uniforming. Sessions for 
October 15, 19 and 26 are: 
Program Planning, Group 
sessions for Den “Leaders, 
Webelos Leaders and Pack

-Auto Service—......  ■

ROGER & DAN’S
AUTO SERVICE

“Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area”

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum GOOD-YEAR 
626-2888

24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE ^@%i

On the Farm 
TIRE SERVICE

We are now stocking 
a complete line of 

ARMSTRONG FARM TIRES 
Tractor and Implement 

CALL 626-2244 

HERRIGES OIL, INC. 
^45 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum

Leaders, Family Involvement, 
God and Country, Plans for 
Action and the Pack Meeting.

For more information, call 
Training Chairman, Carol 
Winget 334-5703.

Webelos Leaders will also 
attend the Outdoor Skill 
Training on Saturday, Novem­
ber 5, from 9:00 a.m. - 8:00 
p.m., at the St. Lawrence Fire 
Department, 4955 Highway 
175. Contact Bill Yankus 644- 
5391, or Steve Zillmer 629-5230 
for additional information.

Scout Roundtables 
Oct. 6 at Grafton

Adult leaders and Committee 
Members of the Cub Scout 
Packs and Boy Scout Troops of 
Glacier Edge District 11, of the 
Bay-Lakes Council of the Boy 
Scouts of America, will gather 
Thursday, October 6, at 7:30 
p.m., for the monthly 
Roundtables to be held at John 
Long Middle School, Fifth and 
Hickory Streets, Grafton.

The Cub Leader Roundtable 
will center their “See and Do It 
Show” in the All-Purpose 
Room. Activities will include 
Charades with Marilyn Haug; 
Finger Printing, Agnes Knapp 
First Aid, Carol Wingett; Magic 
Tricks and Puzzles, George 

, Krueger; Rope Tricks, Cindy 
Balke; and Use of Tools/Tool 
Safety, Ron Roecker. Fran 
Dimick will supply a musical 
touch for Thanksgiving. All 
Packs are asked to bring 
Thanksgiving projects for the 
Idea Exchange.

Webelos Leaders will cover 
the Citizen and Craftsman 
Activity Badges.

Norman Petersen will be 
conducting the Boy Scout 
Leader Roundtable in the school 
library. District Executive, 
David Trehey, will instruct 
participants in the proper 
procedure for the new Advance­
ment Merit Badge, Registration 
and Tour Forms.

1 When your vehicle needs repair,
we provide fast, efficient service and speedy return. 

Because at Autocraft, 
we knew you depend on your vehicle.
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ROMAN D. ANDERS
Roman D. Anders, of 1643 

County H, Kewaskum, died 
Friday, Sept. 23, at his 
residence, at the age of 60.

He was born Oct. 5, 1927, in 
Warsaw, Poland, and married 
Clara Newton Sept. 14, 1963 in 
West Bend.

He served in the U.S. Army 
during the Korean Conflict, and 
had been employed at 
Schneider-Vetter Glass 
Company, Milwaukee.

Survivors include his wife; a 
son, Philip of West Bend; three 
daughters, Kathy (Mark) 
Schwanke of Ripon, Patricia 
(Jacob) Samphere of Juneau 
and Lynn Anders, at home; two 
grandchildren, Leah and 
Laurene Schwanke; a sister, 
Marie Kerkuszof Allenton, Pa., 
and other relatives and friends.

Memorial services were held 
at the Kingdom Hall, West 
Bend, at 6:30 p.m. on Monday, 
Sept. 26, with Don Patton 
officiating. Cremation was held 
at Valhalla Memorial Park, 
Milwaukee.

Miller Funeral Home, 
Kewaskum, served the family.

EDWARD PROST
Edward Prost, 81, of Ke­

waskum, passed away on 
Tuesday, Sept. 27, 1988, at St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital 
in West Bend.

He was born on November 
16, 1906 in the Town of 
Kewaskum, the son of the late 
Charles and Amelia (Kirchner) 
Prost.

On November 15, 1930, he 
was united in marriage to 
Loretta Pflum at Holy Trinity 
Catholic Church Rectory in 
Kewaskum.

Mr. Prost farmed for 25 years 
until moving to Kewaskum 
where he worked for the U.S. 
Post office for over 20 years.

Survivors include his wife 
Loretta; a daughter, Mrs. 
Beulah (Sylvester) Hawig of 
Chilton; three grandchildren 
Chris deCoster, Jeanne and 
Joey Hawig.

In addition to his parents he 
was preceded in death by three 
brothers Charles, Clarence and 
Albert and a sister-in-law
Louise.

Private funeral services will 
be held at the Miller Funeral 
Home, Kewaskum, with Father 
Robert Berghammer officiating. 
Burial will be in the Holy Trinity 
Cemetery in Kewaskum. There 
will be no visitation.

SAMUEL WOOD
Samuel H. Wood, 60, of 

Route 1, Mount Calvary, died 
Saturday, Sept. 24, 1988, at his 
home.

He was born April 4, 1928, in 
Wisconsin Rapids, a son of 
Samuel and Rosie Crocker 
Wood. On Oct. 5, 1947, he 
married Dolores Shenk in 
Sparta.

Mr. Wood owned and 
operated Sam’s Painting and 
was formerly employed with 
Brenner Tank.

Survivors include his wife;

three sons, John and his wife 
Sally of Van Dyne, Richard of 
Milwaukee, and Michael of 
Kentucky; one daughter, 
JoAnne Mielke and her 
husband Roger of Campbell­
sport; 10 grandchildren; his 
mother; three stepsisters, Betty 
Olson and Ruth Brockman, both 
of Missouri, and May Arnold of 
Kewaskum. One son and his 
father preceded him in death.

Funeral services were held 
Monday at 8 p.m. at Twohig 
Funeral Home, Fond du Lac. 
The Rev. Lee Arellano 
officiated. Burial followed in 
Estabrooks Cemetery.

Friends called from 5 p.m. to 
the hour of services at the 
funeral home.

JUDITH E. VORE
Judith E. Vore, nee Peters, of 

West Bend, died Saturday, 
Sept. 24, at St. Joseph’s 
Community Hospital, West 
West Bend, at the age of 48.

She was born Nov. 4, 1939, in 
the Town of Trenton, and 
graduated from St. John’s 
Lutheran Day School and West 
Bend High School in 1957. After 
her marriage to Leon Vore at 
Trinity Lutheran Church, West 
Bend, on Aug. 29, 1959, they 
settled in West Bend until 1968 
when they moved to their 
present home in the Town of 
Trenton.

She was employed at the 
Wesbar Corp, for 17 years.

Survivors include her 
husband; five children, Russell 
(Linda), Linda Vore, Barbara 
(Ralph) Averill and James, all of 
West Bend, and Ronald of Ke­
waskum; two grandchildren, 
Lucas and Jessica; her parents, 
Arthur and Edna Peters of West 
Bend; parents-in-law, Richard 
and Esther Vore of West Bend; 
a sister, Betty Flasch of Antigo; 
five brothers, Robert of 
Newburg, Richard (Adeline), 
William, Donald (Cindy), all of 
West Bend and Thomas (Rose) 
of Jackson and other relatives 
and friends.

A sister, Janet, predeceased.
Funeral services were 

Wednesday, Sept. 28, at 11 
a.m. at Trinity Lutheran

WEST BEND MONUMENT CO. 
“Serving Wisconsin Since 1903"

25 E. Washington St. (Hwy. 33), West Bend, Wl 53095 
PHONE 334-3871

Vei™^ Purchase Now for ^““"y Summer Installation
Monuments and Markers to Meet 

All Cemetery Specifications 
GARY KOENINGS & WALLY MILLER

PORTABLE & 
TRUCK MOUNTED 

MOBILE PLANT

CARPET & UPHOLSTERY 
CLEANING SERVICE

PROFESSIONAL 
DEEP STEAM EXTRACTION 

RESIDENTIAL & COMMERCIAL 
Free Estimates - Call Anytime 

338-0783 
- Reliability in Professional Cleaning - 

SYL STERN, Prop 
7429 Kevin Drive 

West Bend. Wl 53095

Acoustical Ceiling Cleaning - Water Restoration

Church, West Bend. Pastor 
Kenneth Merckx officiated 
and burial was in Washington 
County Memorial Park.

Visitation at the Schmidt 
Funeral Home, West Bend, was 
Tuesday, Sept. 27, from 4 to 9 
p.m. and at the church on 
Wednesday from 9:30 a.m. until 
time of services.

MARIE RAMEL
Marie Ramel, 71, died Thurs­

day, Sept. 22 at Mount 
Pleasant.

She was born March 18, 1917 
in the Town of Trenton.

She married Arno Ramel 
April 19, 1941 and they resided 
at 3443 Cranberry Road, Town 
of Scott. She lived in West Bend 
for a short time before going to 
Mount Pleasant.

She was preceded in death by 
her husband, her parents, a 
brother and a sister.

She is survived by one 
brother, Bernard (Dorothy) of 
Racine; five sisters, Polly 
(William) Gavin, West Bend, 
Betty (William) Cline, 
Evanston, Ill., Hildegarde 
Birkholz of Fond du Lac, 
Rosemary (John) Drott of 
Racine and Jean (Carl) 
Berendes of Raleigh, N.C., 
besides, nieces, nephews other 
relatives and.friends.

Funeral services were held at 
Emanuel Lutheran Church, 
Town of Scott at 11 a.m., 
Saturday, Sept. 22.

Burial was in the church 
cemetery.

KATHRYN DORNACKER
Kathryn L. Dornacker, nee 

Schladweiler, of 474 N. Main 
St., Hartford, died un­
expectedly at her residence on 
Monday, Sept. 26, at the age of 
32.

She was born May 27, 1956, 
in Hartford, where she lived all 
her life. She married Joseph 
Dornacker Sept. 23, 1977, in 
West Bend.

Survivors include her 
husband; two children, Amy 
and Glen, both at home; her 
father, Francis (Betty) 
Schladweiler of Slinger; her 
mother, Lucille (Ben) Magiera 
of Hartford; three brothers, 
Lawrence (Gayle) of Hubertus 
and Thomas and Kenneth, both| 
of Hartford; two sisters, Rae 
Ann Schladweiler, and Marilyn 
Schladweiler both of Hartford; 
two step-sisters, Karen

(Charles) Vixmer of Slinger and 
Debbie (Mark) Niehoff of Port 
Washington; her mother-in- 
law, Marilyn Legate of Kewas­
kum; a brother-in-law, Rodney 
Legate of Slinger; a sister-in- 
law, Bonnie (James) DeWitz of 
Slinger, and other relatives and 
friends.

Funeral services were held 
Wednesday, Sept. 28, at 6:45 
p.m. from the Matenaer- 
Schramka Funeral Home, 
Hartford, to St. Kilian Church 
for Mass of Christian Burial at 7 
p.m. Rev. Eugene Neuman 
officiated.

Visitation at the funeral home 
was Wednesday from 3:30 p.m. 
until time of services.

MARTIN REILAND
Martin D. Reiland, died at 

the Samaritan Home Thursday, 
Sept. 22, at the age of 87.

Born Aug. 16, 1901, in the 
Town of Barton, he lived at the 
Reiland Homestead, which he 
farmed until 1970. He moved to 
Kewaskum after his retirement 
and became a resident of 
Samaritan in 1976.

He is survived by nieces and 
nephews and other friends and 
relatives.

Two brothers and two sisters 
preceeded him in death.

Funeral services were held 
Sunday, Sept. 25, at 8 p.m. at 
the Schmidt Funeral Home, 
West Bend, with the Rev. 
James Strupp officiating. Burial 
was in St. Mary’s Cemetery, 
West Bend. .

Unibed Way
of Kewaskum

TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING 
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport 

533-8094

DON’S ELECTRIC
Don Scheid, Owner

NEW CONSTRUCTION OR REMODELING
Update your old 60 amp fuse box with 

100 amp service and circuit breaker box

•Residential •Commercial
•Industrial Wiring

Quality Work ^Reasonable Rates ^Free Estimates
PHONE 334-7565

Specializing in New Lawn Constuction

A (Bob ‘Xpenig 
Landscaping

Campbellsport 477-7322
•Grading •Seeding •Sodding

Mulching •Edging •Decorative Stone

FREE ESTIMATES FULLY INSURED
Careful - Conscientious - Reasonable

TH.^NK YOU
Prayer through application to 

the Holy Spirit. Holy Spirit, you 
who solve all problems, light all 
roads so that I can attain my 
goal. You who give me the 
divine gifts to forgive and forget 
all evils against me and that in 
all instances of my life you are 
with me. I want in this short 
prayer to thank you for all 
things as you confirm once 
again that I never want to be 
separated from you, even and in 
spite of all material illusion. I 
wjsh to be with you in eternal 
glory. Thank you for your mercy 
toward me and mine.

The person must say this 
prayer for three consecutive 
days. After three days, the 
favor requested will be granted, 
even if it may appear difficult. 
This prayer must be published 
immediately after the favor is 
granted.

B.K.

NOVENA TO ST. JUDE
O holy St. Jude Apostle and 

Martyr, great in virtue and rich 
in miracles, near kinsman of 
Jesus Christ, faithful inter­
cessor of all who invoke your 
special patronage in time of 
need, to you I have recourse 
from the depth of my heart and 
humbly beg to whom God has 
given such great power to come 
to my assistance.

Help me m my present urgent 
petition. In return, I promise to 
make your name known and 
cause you to be invoked, say 
three Our Fathers, three Hail 
Marys and three Glorias. St. 
Jude pray for us, and all who 
invoke your aid. Amen.

This Novena has never been 
known to fail. This Novena must 
be said for 9 consecutive days, 
and publication must be 
promised.

B.K.



State’s Vehicle Emission Inspection 
Program One oj Best in United States

The Wisconsin Department of 
Transportation’s (DOT) Vehicle 
Inspection Program has been 
called one of the best in the 
country by the regional office of 
the U.S. Environmental Protec­
tion Agency (EPA).

Shirley Mitchell, chief of 
EPA’s Air Planning Section, 
said a recent audit of the 
Wisconsin program "recon­
firmed our perception that...the 
program is well designed and is 
being operated effectively and 
efficiently.”

Southeastern Wisconsin was 
identified as a metropolitan 
area with air pollution levels 
that exceeded federal health 
standards. Motor vehicles are 
one of the major sources of air 
pollutants in metropolitan 
areas. Vehicle exhaust emis­
sions pollute the air with carbon 
monoxide and hydrocarbons.

The federal Clean Air Act 
requires states to implement a 
plan to improve air quality 
standards. Vehicles registered 
in Kenosha, Ozaukee, 
Milwaukee, Racine, 
Washington and Waukesha 
counties are tested for excessive 
hydrocarbon and carbon

monoxide emissions. Vehicles 
must pass the test before 
owners are allowed to register 
them.

Mitchell said the audit team 
was particularly impressed with 
the knowledge and capabilities 
of the DOT staff and the 
professionalism they displayed 
in deabng with the public.

Robert W. Baker, deputy 
administrator of the Division of 
Motor Vehicles, welcomed the 
audit findings and said he feels 
the success is due to the public 
support of the program.

"The people of southeastern 
Wisconsin recognize that each 
of us plays a role in improving 
air quality through proper 
maintenance of motor 
vehicles,” Baker said.

Baker called DOT’s emphasis 
on education, outreach and 
public relations an important 
factor in achieving the 
program’s goals.

Donald Dean, section chief 
for the inspection program, also 
credits efforts to increase 
awareness of the need for the 
program and to make it more 
convenient to comply with the 
requirements for the degree of

acceptance by the public.
Dean said steps have been 

taken to improve efficiency of 
the program, such as shifting 
inspections to less-busy times of 
the year, to keep waiting times 
at the test stations to a 
minimum.

"Each year since the 
inspection program began in 
1984, vehicle emissions have 
been reduced, thanks to the 
conscientious efforts of 
motorists and the repair 
industry,” Dean said.

KING PIN TUESDAY 
MORNING MEN LEAGUE

King Pin Lanes 
Sept 20. 1988

Jan & Mush, 15-6; Benson's Resort. 15-6. 
M & S Outdoor Supply. 11-10; Bear Point 
Yacht Club, 9-12; Bohlman's Bar, 9-12; 
Weaver In, 9-12; Barrel Haus, 9-12; Weasler 

Engineering, 7-14
Highlights

First high individual game — 245, Mike Pet­
tit; Second high individual game — 222, Gary 
Radtke; Third high individual game — 210. Ron 

Prochnow.
First high individual series — 685, Mike 

Pettit; Second high individual series — 588, Ron 
Prochnow; Third high individual series - 548, 

Gary Radtke

Turtles give their young no 
care at all. The mother sea 
turtle digs a hole on a 
beach and lays her eggs, 
covers them with sand and 
then returns to the sea. 
The sun hatches the eggs.

MONDAY NIGHT 
UPTOWN LEAGUE

King Pin Lanes 
Sept. 19, 1988

Kettle Moraine Elec., 15-6; Amber Hotel, 
12-9; Mueller Excavating, 11-10; Thelen & 
Janous. 11-10; King Pm Lanes, 10-11; Hernges 
Oil, Inc., 10-11; Lentz Custom Homes, 9-12; 
Bar-N-Ranch. 6-15

Highlights
First high individual game — 255, Tom 

Lichtensteiger; Second high individual game - 
248, Rick Del Ponte; Third high individual 

game — 246. Rick Serwe.
First high individual series — 643, Rick 

Serwe; Second high individual series - 617, 
Greg Gutjahr; Third high individual series - 
Rick Del Ponte.

Town of Kewaskum 
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING 
For Conditional Use Permit

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a public hearing will be held before 
the Town Board at the Labor Hall located at 1230 Fond du Lac Avenue, 
in the Village of Kewaskum at 7:30 P.M. on October 17, 1988, to con­
sider the application of Emil Shulka for the issuance of a Conditional 
Use Permit under the Town Zoning Ordinance.
Granting the permit will allow the applicant to construct a two-family 
dwelling in Residential A2 Zoning District upon the applicant's proper­
ty located on vacant lot next to residence at 2750 Hwy. H, in the SEV4 
of the SW1A of Section 13 and NEV# of the NW'A of Section 24 in the
Town,
Dated September 16, 1988

Barbara Hinz
Town Clerk

MONDAY NIGHT 
MOONLIGHTERS LEAGUE 

King Pin Lanes
Sept. 19, 1988

Sentry Foods. 18-3; King Pin L™es 17-4; 
M&E Restaurant. 14-7; L&R Trophy & Sports, 
10-11; Bartoli's Produce. 7-14, Amber Hotel. 
7-14; Smith Insurance, 6-15; Bowl Against 

Ave., 5-16.
Highlights

First high individual game — 223, Kat y 
Rohlinger; Second high individual game - 204, 
Helen Lauters; Third high individual game - 
200, Helen Kertscher

First high individual series — 600, Kathy 
Rohlinger, Second high individual series - 524, 
Helen Kertscher; Third high individual series 

— 503, Janet Serwe.

NOTICE OF HEARING
TOWN OF WAYNE

ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Town of Wayne zoning 

Board of Appeals will conduct a hearing on the application for 
appeal filed by Lisa Oelhafen. The hearing will be held at 9:00 
A M on October 8, 1988, at the applicant’s property located at 
6298 Beaver Dam Rd., Allenton, Wl 53002.

The applicant’s property is located in the SE-SW Section 33 
Town of Wayne.

The appeal seeks a variance from the requirements of the Zon­
ing Ordinance and if granted will permit the applicant to build 
a porch deck closer to the road than the requirements of Sec­
tion 1.36(B) of the Town Zoning Code.

All interested persons wishing to comment on the appeal 
should appear at the hearing.

Dated August 31, 1988
Orville Kern

9.232f Zoning Administrator

.^/M»
RELINK of west bend A

An Independent Member Broker ann enright

2364 W. Washington St. 
West Bend

338-5656 355*4600

GLORIA SERWE 
CHRIS KUECHLER 
JOEL BARTLEY 
WENDY COULTER 
DAN COULTER 
DENNIS SCHERWINSKI 
MARY K STEPANIUK 
DARLENE KREMER

692-2607 
626-2880 
334-4488 
677-4001 
338-3296 
338-3296 
677-4088 
533-8648 
334-9562

OFFICIAL NOTICE
AGENDA

There will be a Special Meeting of the School District of 
Kewaskum Board of Education on Monday, October 3, 1988.

The meeting will begin at 7:00 p.m. in the Kewaskum High 
School commons area.

The meeting is held in response to a request of the Board 
of Education at its Regular Meeting on September 12, 1988 
and State Statute 120.11(2).

I. Call to order - President Horner
II. Roll call - Clerk Schmitt
III. Self insurance - Orval Behnke
IV Appointment of delegate to Eastern Wisconsin & Cen­

tral Lakeshore Athletic Conference Negotiations - 
Ruth Schmitt

V. Appointment of Speech/Language instructor for the 
remainder of the school year.

VI. Approval to join regional media center at CESA 6
VII. Approval of asbestos management plan for the 

Kewaskum School District
VIII. Permission to approve the purchase of saxophone 

- Steve King
IX. Short-term borrowing for 1988-89 - Cherna Gorder 
X. Official delegate certification to WASB convention 
XI. Welding shop ventilation and electrical supply 
XII. Concession stand
XIII. Adjournment

NEW CONSTRUCTION
Beautiful 1,800 sq ft bi-level in coun­
try subdivision, large 2’/z acre lot. 
Custom oak kitchen cabinets with 
snack bar Natural cream city brick 
fireplace and vaulted ceiling in living 
room. 3 bedrooms, 2 baths Rustic 
family room with barn board paneling 
and oak beams. Deck plus patio, 2 car 
garage MOVE RIGHT IN Call Ann 
Enright 692-2607. P78

BRICK FARM HOUSE
Impeccably restored cream city brick 
farmhouse Large wrap-around front 
porch Pine plank floors in living and 
dining room. Open, vaulted, beamed 
ceiling in large family room w/Franklin 
stove. Open stairway to 21 x 10 sitting 
area and 3 nice sized bedrooms with 
barn door style doors. 1974 new wiring, 
plumbing, window sashes, heating, 
roof, etc Quiet location only 2 miles off 
Hwy 41. K127. Call Ann Enright.

CAMPBELLSPORT
Need 5 bedrooms? Huge yard? Call for 
a showing today on this affordable 
village home priced to sell at 
$33,500.00 Close to schools and park. 
Huge yard with many, many fruit trees 
and garden area Spacious kitchen 
Perfect for the growing family. Call 
Gloria Serwe at 626-2880 K115.

HANDYMAN SPECIAL *
Older home has newer windows, fur­
nace. Needs someone with ambition to 
turn into an affordable home. Has barn 
with newer roof. City Sewer Call Ann 
Enright 692-2607. K158.

NEW LISTING
Affordable lot in Beechwood Nice little 
community. Beautiful lake for fishing 
and recreation. Priced for quick sale 
$5,500 Call Gloria Serwe at 626-2880. 
K111.

ATTENTION FIRST 
TIME HOME BUYERS!

WHEDA Money Available
Immaculate 3 bedroom Cape Cod, 
Village of Kewaskum. New aluminum 
siding, roof, windows, carpeting, floor 
coverings. New miscellaneOt* items 
too numerous to mention. $58,900 
K48. Call Gloria 626-2880

IT’S SO PEACEFUL
GrBat for kids and their dog. New 3 
bedroom country ranch on 1 acre with 
pool. Near Long Lake. Brick and 
aluminum exterior. ’A bath off master 
bedroom. Large, bright cheery kitchen. 
Full basement. 2 car attached garage 
Call Darlene Kremer at 334-9562. K92.

AVAILABLE FOR FIRST TIME 
3 BEDROOM CONDO

Feel like you're stepping into "Better 
Homes and Gardens" when you view 
this spacious, quality 1500 sq. ft. home. 
Immaculate condition and VERY 
tastefully decorated throughout. In-unit 
laundry, security, underground parking. 
Patio doors lead to private backyard 
and patio. Call Gloria, 626-2880 K33

PRICED TO SELL AT $24,000 
■80 acres. Rusk County, Village of 
Hawkins Beautiful, partially wooded 
with pines and creek. Close to hunting, 
fishing and outdoor recreation, in­
cluding Flambeau River and State 
Forest. Call Gloria at 626-2880. K220.

BEAUTY BUSINESS
Small shop, all equipment and inven­
tory included. Very nice set up, ready 
to go. Everything in excellent condition. 
Call for specific information $10,500. 
Chris Kuechler 334-4488 K95

COMMERCIAL
Brick building on Main St. in 
Kewaskum. Ideal for insurance office, 
tax accountant, antique shop. etc. Ex» 
cellent condition, good investment. Call 
for more details. $45,900. Chris 
Kuechler 334-4488. K112.

COUNTRY SETTING...
MINUTES FROM TOWN 

Over two partially wooded acres sur­
rounding this beautiful rustic raised 
ranch. Great room open concept with 
cathedral ceiling. Patio doors lead to 
huge deck Put your own decorating 
ideas to work on the partially finished 
exposed lower level with patio 
possibilities unlimited. Huge shop 
garage suitable for semi. Central air, 
Kewaskum School District. K123. Call 
Gloria at 626-2880.

VACANT LAND
VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM Pretty lot - Moraine Court cul de sac • one of the nicest lots in town' 
Call Ann Enright 692-2607 P205
2 ACRES in Boltonville Only $6,000 Call Ann Enright 692-2607
REDUCED-ONLY $18,000. HUNTER'S ATTENTION 25 acres Kewaskum School District Beautiful 
woods and some lowland, plus scenic hillside home building site Call Ann 692-2607. K65.
ONLY $14,900. Village of Kewaskum, all level lot next to park. All utilities and sidewalks are in 
Buy just the lot or we can draw your plans and build according to your needs Call Dennis, 677-4088 
K86
ONLY $7,900: 2 acres m Town of Scott near Boltonville Affordable building site with pretty country 
location Call Ann, 692-2607. K81
COUNTRY SUBDIVISION: Large 2 + acre lots with fantastic views in Town of Farmington. Good 
commuting location ONLY $10,000 each Call Ann, 692-2607 K71
1 ACRE LOT Alpine Dr. Town of Auburn Directions: Hwy 45 N to Old Bridge Rd , right to Alpine 
$10,000 Call Ann Enright 692-2607 K66

MOVE IN AND START MILKING 
125 Acre grade A dairy farm. 38x110 
barn with 30x50 attached loafing barn, 
pipeline milking system, 46 stanchions, 
3 silos, 54x126 pole shed Other out­
buildings in good condition. Spacious, 
remodeled farmhouse. Call Dan 
338-3296. K82.

FARMINGTON AREA
Custom designed bi-level with 6 inch 
wall construction for low heat costs. 
DREAM kitchen with built-in desk and 
eating island, gigantic family room with 
free standing fireplace. Located on 21A 
acre country lot. $95,900. Call Ann 
Enright 692-2607. K42

PEACE AND SERENITY 
will surround you when you build your 
dream home on this beautiful 3Vz acre 
wooded lot minutes from town. K151. 
Call Gloria 626-2880.

PRICE REDUCED
TAVERN 

GREAT INVESTMENT OPPORTUNITY 
Cream City brick tavern with living 
quarters plus 3 bedroom rental unit. 
Spacious bar area, equipment includ­
ed Call Ann Enright 692-2607. K93.
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ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE 
RATE: $1.50 up to 20 words; over 20 words - add 5c per word 

75c billing charge for classified ado not paid in advance

FOR SALE — Pop-up camper, 
sleeps six, fully equipped with 
pots, pans, utensils, dishes, 
patio lights and lots more. $850. 
Call 994-9759.9-30-4t

FOR SALE — Miniature 
Schnauzer pups, AKC, shots, 
home raised. Schnauzer stud 
service. Harold Pesch 626-4307. 
______________________10-7-2t

FALL RUMMAGE SALES — 
Thursday, Sept. 29, Friday, 
Sept. 30, 8:30 to 5, 806 
Memorial Dr., Kewaskum. 
Clothes from infant to adult 
larger sizes, bedspreads, 
curtains, yard goods, winter 
apparel, crafts and craft 
supplies, some household.

______________ 9-30-Ip

ONE DAY ONLY — Rummage 
Sale, Oct. 1, 9 a.m. to 4 p.m., 
first time this year, lots of baby 
and childrens clothes, most 
items 25c to 50c, 4782 Hwy.
28W, Kewaskum. 9-30-It

FOR SALE — Older stone four 
bedroom home, 1.2 acres, 
excellent condition, 3 car 
garage/barn with loft, broker. 
334-2773.9-30-4t

FOR SALE — MANY EXTRAS 
in this two bedroom, P/i bath, 
kitchen, dining, living and 
utility room, no pets, Moraine 
Condominium East, 745 Main 
St. For inspection call 626-2685. 

9-16-4p alt.

HELP WANTED
Secretarial * Receptionist 

Position Available
15-20 hours per week, must be flex­
ible, experience helpful

Send resume to P.O. Box 98, 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040

EMPTY NEST SYNDROME — 
Will sell or trade four bedroom, 
2 bath, carpeted older country 
home with 2‘/j car garage and 
fertile river acreage, if desired, 
for village or ranch home of 
comparable value. Write P.O. 
Box 701, Campbellsport, WI 
53010. JM9-tf

HUGE RUMMAGE AND 
COLLECTIBLE SALE — 
Bedroom, living room, dining 
room and kitchen sets, chairs of 
all types, desks, dressers, 
chests of drawers, rocker­
recliners, stereos, T.V.s, 
stoves, refrigerators, freezers, 
antiques, loads of glassware, 
too many items to list. We’ve 
got it all at prices you can’t 
afford to miss. Four miles east 
of Lomira on Hwy. 67, four 
miles west of Campbellsport on 
Hwy 67. 1948 Hwy. 67W.

_______________ 7-29-lp-tf

$10,000 Sapphire/Diamond 
Ring — Can be yours in Avon’s 
Facets Perfume Sweepstakes. 
Ask your AVON representative 
for a free sample today. Call 
Helen at 626-4604 for more 
in form ation.9-16-3t

CHRISTMAS - around Septem­
ber? Why not let a personal 
shopper assist you with gift 
buying ideas. Contact your 
AVON representative today. 
Avon, we’re more than perfume 
and bath bubbles. Call Helen at 
626-4604. 9-16-3t

HELP WANTED — Third Shift 
Cashier. Please send resume to
P.O. Box 98, Kewaskum, WI 
53040.9-16-tf

HELP WANTED — Waitress. 
Apply at Frank’s on the Lake, 
Kettle Moraine Lake. Ph. 533- 
8445.9-30-Ip

WANTED — Person to do 
calligraphy. Call 533-5143.
_____________________ 9-30-It

BABYSITTER WANTED — 
Days, prefer my home, will 
consider yours. Ph. 626-4165.

9-30-Ip

HELP WANTED — Part-time at 
General Store Antique Mall. 
Must be willing to work some 
weekends. Apply within. 1277 
Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum. 
_____________________ 9-30-lt

CONSTRUCTION WANTED — 
Estimates needed for re­
modeling of 900 sq. ft. attic into 
living space, plus stairway. All 
the builders we can seem too 
busy. Perfect winter job. Call 
533-5143 or 626-4609. 9-30-2t

WEEKEND FARMER — 
Responsible for four milkings 
and feeding cows. Occasional 
weekends off by request. Write 
Box 98, Kewaskum, WI 53040. 
_____________________ 9-30-4t

ATTENTION MOMS!
Back to school costs running 
you broke? Need extra cash to 
cover the books, tuition, 
supplies and designer jeans? 
We have the answer! Earn good 
money as a Christmas Around 
the World demonstrator! Work 
your own hours now thru Nov. 
showing our fantastic line of 
Christmas decor! Absolutely no 
investment, delivery or 
collecting! Free $300 sample 
kit, supplies and hostess gifts! 
For more information call 533- 
8101. Also booking parties!
_____________________ 9-30-2t

FREE TO GOOD HOME — l/2 
dingo/ ‘A lab 8 month old 
puppy, housebroke, does tricks, 
needs kids to play with. Call 
533-4099. 9-30-lt

HELP WANTED
Part-time, 15 to 25 hours per week

Immediate position open in building supply and hardware 
store. Looking for mature ambitious individual. Customer 
sales, ordering, stocking, previous experience beneficial.

Pick up application at:

KL HOME & HARDWARE
Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum

PATROLMAN - PART TIME
The Village of Kewaskum Police Department is accepting 
applications to establish a list of prospective part time 
patrolmen.
Applications can be picked up at the Kewaskum Municipal 
Building between the hours of 8:00 A.M. and 5:00 P.M., 
Monday thru Friday.
DEADLINE for applications is 5:00 P.M., Friday, October 
14, 1988.

CAMPBELLSPORT 
MINI-STORAGE

CONTACT:
533-8798,533-4412, or 626-2702

HELP WANTED — Full time 
maintenance person with 
positive attitude to work in 
nursing facility. Must be willing 
to do all phases of building 
maintenance, be on call 
evenings and weekends on a 
rotation basis, be considerate of 
the elderly, and relocate if 
necessary. Send resume to P.O. 
Box 692, Campbellsport, WI, 
53010.9-23-2t

HOUSEKEEPER WANTED — 
Live in housekeeper to care for 
elderly woman in Kewaskum 
area, room and board included. 
Ph. 626-4906. 9-9-5t

ALUMINUM 
CANS

On the first and 
third Saturdays 
10 a.m. to 2 p.m.

SENTRY PARKING LOT
Kewaskum Mall

50c lb. over 100 lbs.
47c lb. under 100 lbs.

2nd and 4th Tuesday 
10 a.m. to 1 p.m.

STRAUB’S in Campbellsport

MARCOE’S RECYCLING

HELP WANTED — Presently 
hiring adult male employees 
mature, reliable, outgoing over 
college age with fitness 
backgrounds; experience 
preferred but will train; must 
work some evenings & part 
Sat., part-time year round; 
flexible schedule; includes 
salary, membership, schooling 
& instruction for certification as 
a fitness instructor, in-house 
discounts; apply in person at 
the Health Hut Fitness Center, 
150 W. Main St., Campbell­
sport, call 533-4747 for appt.

________________ 8-19-tf

HAVE BUYERS — For country 
or village homes within 3 miles 
of Kewaskum. If you are think­
ing of selling call Ann Enright, 
RE/MAX Realtors 334-7411 or 
692-2607 collect. 9-19-tf

HELP WANTED — full - time 
mechanic experience required, 
Honeck Chevrolet. Call and ask 
for Marvin 626-2161. 7-22-tf
STUMP REMOVAL — Reason­
able rates, free estimates. Call 
626-2513.6-17-tf

$$ • NOTICE • $$
Paying 

immediate
CASH

TOP DOLLAR for all 
your unwanted GOLD, 
DENTAL, SILVER, 
DIAMONDS & OLD 
WATCHES and most
OLD COINS

Our Goldsmith can 
come to your home

CALL FOR APPOINTMENT
(Confidential)

$$ Callaway 
& Co. $$

409 Main St., Kewaskum
626-4609

FOR RENT — Immediate 
occupancy. One bedroom 
heated apartment in 
Campbellsport. Phone 528-' 
8652. 7-22-12tp

SCREEN and WINDOW 
REPAIR — KL Home and 
Hardware, Hwy. 45 South, 
Kewaskum. Phone 626-2164.

9-23/11-25

Rug & Carpet Cleaners

FLITTER’S
Carpet Cleaning
Rotary Steam Cleaning

Phone 533-4954

STORAGE SPACE
AVAILABLE

Pick Your Plan
1 month, 4 months, 8 months, 1 year or more

CIDER PRESSING — Empire 
Mills 1009, 4th St. Road, 2 miles 
east of Fond du Lac on Hwy. T. 
Saturdays 8 - noon. 414-921- 
9509. Open now thru Nov. 26.

8-19-15t

WORK WANTED — Lloyd’s 
Home Maintenance. No job too 
small. Repairs, remodeling, 
carpentry, painting, varnisi ng, 
wallpaper, woodgrain.ng, 
ceramic tile, etc. Lloyd M. 
Ebert. 533-8013.P23-tf

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 626- 
2888. _____ _

WANTED TO BUY 
IMMEDIATE CASH PAID

Cash paid for one item or entire 
estate. Always looking for wood 
furniture, old tools, crocks, 
decoys, trunks, fish lures, toys 
and toy tractors, glassware, 
quilts, lamps, cookbooks, etc. 
Top prices paid — before you 
throw it out or sell it, check with 
me, Jim Walter 533-8731. 4-1-tf

BICYCLES — Sales and Ser­
vice, 208 North Ave., Kewas­
kum. Wally’s Bike Shop.

SIGNS ‘N’ LINES 
UNLIMITED

‘Wood Signs ‘Designs 
•Artwork

Wildlife Art. Prints, 
Originals, Portraits 
Matting, Framing

DEAN BOHLMAN - (414)533-4358
Experienced, National Recognition, 

FREE ESTIMATES

DUNDEE 
SAND & GRAVEL
G. RAMTHUN 533-4549

* Washed Sand
* Crushed Gravel 

Stone and Lime Chips

Also Gravel and Sand Fill 
For the Best of 

Concrete Materials
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Board Meeting
Mid-Monthly Meeting 
September 19, 1988 
8:00 P M.

The Village Board of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wisconsin met in 
Regular Session in the Council Room of 
the Municipal Building, 204 First Street.

President Paul Blumer presided Trustee 
Howard Laubenstein was absent, all other 
Trustee Members were present A quorum 
was present.

The meeting was opened with a Moment 
of Silence and Pledge of Allegiance.

A public hearing was conducted on the 
application of The Herro Company, Inc 
for the parcel of property located al 1040 
Fond du Lac Avenue, Kewaskum, WI. 
I he request is for (he rezoning of a por­
tion of this property as shown on a cer­
tified survey map from B-2, General Retail 
Service District to R4. Multi-Family 
Residence District. This rezoning would 
allow for the construction and placement 
of 2 16 Unit Multi-Family Buildings for 
the elderly and general public. Nine 
residents were present to ask questions 
regarding ihe proposed project None of 
them were totally against the project, but 
had concerns they wanted addressed. A 
letter was received from an area resident, 
which indicated they were for communi­
ty growth, but had concerns regarding 
traffic on USH 45. Mi Lewis Herro of 
The Herro Company was present and 
described the proposed project to Ihe 
Village Board and people present.

On a motion by Trustee Richard 
Schlicc, seconded by Trustee Charles 
Boegel to close the public hearing. Roll 
call vole was 6 “Aye.” 0 "Nay," I "Ab­
sent.” Roll call vole was passed 
unanimously and the Board declared the 
public hearing closed

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton. seconded by Trustee Kenneth 
Bonlender and carried by ihe majority, the 
Board suspended the rules io address Item 
IX New Business A Discussion regar­
ding review of rezoning request of The 
Herm Company, Inc. as heard at public 
hearing Roll call vole was 6 “Aye,” 0 
fNay,” I “Absent.”

On a nutlion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton, seconded by Trustee Richard 
Schlice and carried by the majority, the 
Board approved the rezoning of said land 
as referred to al public hearing contingent 
upon an agreement regarding the access 
road, developers agreement, and utility 
easement. The zoning will be R 4 Multi 
Family Residence District vs B-2 General 
Retail Service District. Roll call vole was 
I “Abstention,” 5 "Aye,” 0 “Nay,” I 
“Absent.”

Administrator Daniel Schmidt advised 
the Board of a review of the TIF refinan­
cing as studied by Clayton Brown & 
Assoc., Inc. It was recommended that it 
will be more advantageous to look at the 
refinancing in 1989 versus 1988.

Administrator Daniel Schmidt review­
ed two correspondence:

I) Mid-Moraine Municipal Association 
notice in reference to September 28. 1988 
meeting.

2) A letter from the Wisconsin Depart­
ment of Administration responding to the 
Village’s challenges regarding the current 
Village census. The DOA informed the 
Village that a census revision is so noted 
and the new census is 2434 versus 2327.

Trustee Richard Schlice asked if the 
Police Department would monitor the 
skateboard situation in reference to a need 
for an ordinance revision It was mention­
ed by another Trustee to check into the 
parking stall status on the North side of 
Clinton Street across from Shefond

Trustee Charles Boegel asked if the 
Village could check into the possibility of 
opening the Open Saturday gym program 
earlier this fall.

Trustee Kenneth Bonlender informed 
the Board that the Library has set times 
and dates for story hour. It shall be from 
October 5 through October 26, 1988 at 
10:00 to 10:45 a m and 11:00 to 11:45 
a m. on Wednesdays.

Trustee Mary Krueger, the County-. 
Incineration Committee Board Represen­
tative, reported that a meeting has been 
scheduled for September 22. 1988 The 
meeting is to be held at the West Bend 
Library Lower Level.

It was noted that the sidewalk contrac­
tor has started to move into the Vllage and 
is hopeful to finish the project on schedule.

A brief discussion was held on the 
recycling program and on some items that 
the State are making mandatory, such as 
yard waste (composting).

Action was taken on Resolution No. 
88-15 as attached hereto:

On a motion by Trustee Kenneth

Bonlender, seconded by Trustee Richard 
Schlice and unanimously carried by voice 
vote, the Board accepted the Police Chief s 
recommendation to hire Steven F. Seitz 
of West Bend as a Police Patrolman It was 
noted I application was received from the 
in-house posting as called for in Chapter 
4.03 of the Municipal Code.

On a motion by Trustee Charles Boegel. 
seconded by Trustee Mary Krueger and 
unanimously carried by voice vote, the 
Board designated Sunday, October 30, 
1988, from I 00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m. as the 
Village of Kewaskum Trick or Treat 
hours. (This coinsides with other 
Washington County communities).

President Paul Blumer informed the 
Board of a Proclamation prepared and 
published in cooperation with the Com 
mission on the Bicentennial of the United 
States Constitution, do hereby proclaim 
September 17 as Citizenship Day and the 
week of September 17-23 as Constitution 
Week, and invite every citizen and institu­
tion to join in the national 
commemoration.

On a motion by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton, seconded by Trustee Mary 
Krueger to adjourn to closed session under 
Chapter I9.85(l)(c) and 19.85(l)(e) of the 
statutes to consider employment, compen­
sation and performance of public 
employees over which the governmental 
body has jurisdiction and to deliberate and 
negotiate the disposition of public lands. 
Roll call vote was 6 “Aye,” 0 “Nay,” 
1 “Absent." The motion was carried by 
the majority.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Admistrator

RESOLUTION NO. 88-15 
PRESIDENTIAL ELECTION 

POLL HOURS
WHEREAS, the Fall Election of 1988 

is mainly to elect a President of the United 
States; and

WHEREAS, the greatest percentage of 
eligible voters will vote at the Presiden­
tial Election at the Village of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wisconsin, Polls; 
and

WHEREAS, voters have requested 
longer and more convenient poll hours for 
the Presidential Election;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLV 
ED. that the Village Board of the Village 
of Kewaskum, Washington County, 
Wisconsin, will lengthen the poll hours for 
the Presidential Election. November 8. 
1988.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that 
the official hours of the polls in the Village 
of Kewaskum, for the Presidential Elec­
tion only. November 8. 1988. shall be 
7:30 a.m. to 8:00 p.m.

Adopted and approved this 19th day of 
September. 1988, by the Kewaskum 
Village Board.

Paul E. Blumer 
Village President 
Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

Introduction by Trustee Mary Krueger 
Motion for adoption by Trustee Richard 
Schlice
Motion for adoption seconded by Trustee 
Charles Boegel
Roll call vote was 6 "Aye.” 0 "Nay." 
I “Absent.”

Farmers Inc. Elevator
Allenton, WI

SEED
^ Mixed Bird Feed 
/Niger Thistle Seed 

BIRD FEEDERS ALSO AVAILABLE 
Bird feed supplies for all 

your fine-feathered friends

- Feed Testing
- Ration Balancing

(Custom Mineral Mixing) 
- Pickup and Delivery 
- Grinding and Rolling 
- On Farm Consulting 
- NK Seeds

ITT HOME AND AL HARDWARE

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum
STORE HOURS Mon thru Fn 7 30am to 5 30 p m

rHUNt bib 4 Sat 7:30 a m to 2:30 p.m
OPEN SUNDAY 8 to 1

Valley Bank Offers Next 
Day Deposit Availability

Appleton, Wis. — “Valley 
Banks will make checks deposit­
ed to customers’ checking 
accounts available for 
withdrawal far faster than the 
new federal regulation 
requires,” Peter M. Flatten, III, 
President & Chief Operating 
Officer, said recently. “This 
policy reflects our continued 
commitment to providing high 
quality financial services to our 
customers,” he said.

Flatten indicated that nearly 
all checks deposited at any of 
Valley Banks’ 88 locations will 
be available for withdrawal on 
the next business day. There 
will be a few exceptions 
determined on a case-by-case 
basis.

A federal * regulation 
scheduled to go into effect 
September 1, 1988 requires all 
financial institutions to give 
customers next day access for 
certain items that are deposited 
such as cash, electronic 
transfers, and U.S. Government
checks.

For most other check 
deposits, the regulation 
requires that only $100 be made 
available on the next business 
day. Amounts over $100 could 
be held from three to seven 
business days before they are 
made available, depending on 
the type of check and the loca­
tion of the financial institution 
on which it is drawn.

“The regulation was written 
to protect consumers and 
businesses from having their 
funds held for an excessively 
long period,” Sal A. Troia; Vice 
President/Operations and 
Treasurer, said. “But really it is 
not as pro-consumer as Valley’s 
own practice of next day 
availability. Valley’s policy is to 
give our customers full access to 
their money as quickly as 
possible.”

Troia offered some advice for 
people who are not Valley Bank 
customers and are concerned 
about having check deposits 
available for withdrawal as 
quickly as possible.

Financial institutions are 
required to make local checks 
available for withdrawal faster 
than non-local checks. If you are 
not sure whether the check you 
are depositing is local or not, be 
sure to ask, Troia advised.

“Also, ask for a written copy 
of your financial institution’s

funds availability policy,” he 
said. Your financial institution 
will be required to tell you in 
writing when it will make your 
deposit available.

SUNDAY NITE 
EVEN CPLS.

League 
King Pin Lanes

Sept. 18, 1988

All Screwed Up. 5-2; 4 Pins, 5-2; B S er's, 
4-3; Toys R’ Us Pan II, 4-3; K P s. 34; Bad 
Altitude. 34; Holy Rollers, 2-5; G.A Nass 
Upholstery, 2-5

Highlights
First high male game — 203, Boh Tischen- 

dorf; Second high male game — 183, Kevin 
Beck; Third high male game — 180, Fran 
Ruplinger

First high male series — 539, Bob Tischen- 
dorf; Second high male series — 476. Fran 
Ruplinger, Third high male series — 475, Kevin 
Beck.

First high female game — 231, Lorraine 
Serwe; Second high female game — 179, Millie 
Tischendorf; Third high female game — 176, 
Tracy Ann Nass

First high female series — 576. Lorraine 
Serwe; Second high female series — 492. Trace 
Ann Nass; Third high female series — 485. 
Penny Beck

KING PIN TUES. 
NITE LATE League 

King Pin Lanes 
Sept. 20. 1988

Smith Insurance. 19-2; King Pin Lanes. 12-9;
Welcome Inn, 12-9; Camp. Bldg Supply, 12-9; 
Braatz Painting, 11-10; Smith Trucking, 8-13; 
Bohlman's Bar, 7-14; On the Rocks, 3-18.

Highlights
First high individual game — 279. Elsmer 

Zimdahl; Second high individual game — 256. 
Mike Bassill. Third high individual game — 
234, Roger Ramthun.

First high individual senes — 722, Elsmer 
Zimdahl. Second high individual series — 621, 
Mike Bassill, Third high indiviudal series — 
621, Roger Ramthun

Theresa 
Feed & Seed 

for all your 
mixing needs 

featuring 
Vigortone Feeds

488-2131 
in 

Theresa Station 
(W663 Hwy. DD)

SUNDAY EARLY BIRDS
League

King Pin Lanes
Sept. 18. 1988

Country Heir Farm. 4-0; Three Hits & A 
Mess. 4-0. Who Cares. 4-0; Steam Rollers, 4-0; 
Fun Lovers, 04; Social K. 04; So What s!!, 
04; Good Times, 04

Highlights
First high male game — 213. Roger Uttech;

Second high male game — 213, Norman 
Kempf; Third high male game — 198. Jim 
Ruplinger.

First high male series — 609, Norman 
Kempf; Second high male series — 608, Roger 
Uttech; Third high male series — 525, Tim
Schoeder.

First high female game — 202, Debbie 
Kreuser; Second high female gam^ — 198, Judy 
Westerman; Third high female game — 180, 
Bonnie Liepert.

First high female series — 518, Judy Wester­
man; Second high female series — 487, Deb­
bie Kreuser; Third high female series — 466, 
Bonnie Liepert

KING PIN 
MIXED CPLS. LEAGUE 

King Pin Lanes 
Sept 16, 1988

NO NA ME, 6-2; Floydy R s. 5-3; Kool- 
Aid-Kids, 5-3; The Coasters, 5-3; Scratch-N-
Sniff, 44; Nobody's, 44; Rotten Rollers, 2-6; 
Don’t Know, 1-7.

Highlights
First high male game — 232, Dick Gueli; Se­

cond high male game — 208. Math Serwe; 
Third high male game — 203, Terry Gueil.

First high male series — 601, Math Serwe; 
Second high male series — 570, Dick Gueli; 
Third high male series — 562, John Gellings

First high female game — 196, Helen Ken 
scher; Second high female game — 188, Sue 
Jacak; Third high female game — 181, Lorret- 
ta Schroeder.

First high female sfnes — 506. Helen Kert- 
scher. Second high female series — 492. Janet 
Serwe; Third high female series — 476, Loret­
ta Schroeder.
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NEWS EXTRA...

Safety Belts: Tips for Users
It started out as a routine trip for Donna Pugh of Houma, Louisiana. 

Routine, until her light truck was sideswiped. According to Donna, who 
was eight months pregnant at the time, “My truck did a 180-degree turn 
before slamming into a large steel pole. Fortunately, my two-year old son, 
Cody, was strapped into his car seat and I was wearing my safety belt. 
Without our restraints, both of us would have been seriously injured or 
killed. Today she says, “Thanks to our belts, I now have two beautiful 
boys and they have a healthy mom.”

The safety belts which saved Donna's life have been standard equip­
ment on all cars sold in the U.S. fof the last 20 years. Over and over, 
safety belts have proved to be remarkably effective in helping the human 
body withstand the violent impact of motor vehicle crashes. The National 
Highway Traffic Safety Administration (NHTSA) estimates that safety belts 
have saved more than 8,000 lives and prevented 95.500 injuries in just 
the last five years. Even more lives could be saved and injuries avoided, 
if belts were worn correctly and on every trip. The enactment of safety 
belt use laws in thirty-two states and the District of Columbia has resulted 
in a record number of Americans buckling up. Forty-three percent of 
Americans wear their safety belts regularly, and usage is even higher in 
states with belt laws.

Today's belt systems are easy to use and designed to offer comfort and 
some movement without compromising protection. The lap and shoulder 
belt combination, for example, is engineered to offer maximum protec­
tion so that crash forces are absorbed and distributed across the strongest 
areas of the body - the bones of the hips and shoulders. The shoulder belt 
portion is attached to a retractor mechanism that is designed to let the web­
bing move freely in and out, except during sudden deceleration, when it 
locks automatically, keeping occupants in place and preventing them from 
striking the dashboard, windshield or other hard interior components. Belts 
also prevent motorists from being ejected, a frequent cause of death or 
injury for people not wearing belts

People come in all sizes and modern belt systems are engineered to ad­
just as necessary. However, the very features that make belt systems fit 
comfortably and convenient to use can, if used incorrectly, make them 
less effective.

The most common and dangerous form of misuse by adults, is placing 
the shoulder belt under the arm. This eliminates the critical protection the 
shoulder belt provides in keeping the upper portion of the body from pit­
ching forward and striking the steering wheel, dashboard or windshield. 
Another serious mistake is locating the shoulder belt behind the back which 
also allows the body to pitch forward.

Excess slack is another problem. American car manufacturers have in­
stalled tension release devices which function like a window shade, enabling 
motorists to relieve some excess pressure exerted by the shoulder belt. 
But too much slack defeats the belt’s purpose. The shoulder belt should 
be comfortable but snug across the chest. Excess slack should be eliminated 
by tugging on the shoulder belt, or pulling it out slightly, and then releas­
ing it quickly.

Lap belts and the lap portion of lap/shoulder belt combinations should 
always be worn low and snug across the bones of the pelvis and not up 
across the soft organs of the abdomen. Are lap belts effective? Studies 
have shown that the overall fatality risk of back seat passengers is reduc­
ed by 17 to 26 percent with lap belt use. This is because people are prevented 
from being thrown against each other or ejected from the car. An estimated 
660 lives could have been saved and 10,200 serious injuries avoided in 
1987 if back seat belt use had been 100 percent. People who want to add 
shoulder belts for extra protection in the back seat should contact their 
dealers or a manufacturer’s representative.

Children travelling by car have special needs, and they are protected 
by laws in all fifty states and the District of Columbia. These laws require 
small children (usually up to age 4) to ride in approved child safety seats 
or to use safety belts, whether they are in the front or back seat. Again, 
when lap belts are used, they should be placed as low on the lap as possi­
ble, under the abdomen.

NHTSA's latest observational survey found that 84 percent of children 
ages four and under were in child safety seats (up from 54 percent in 1985) 
but one-third of the seats were not being used correctly. Parents and other 
adults must take the responsibility and the time to make sure child safety 
seats are used corrrectly, by following the manufacturer’s instructions 
carefully. The safest place for the child safety seat is in the back seat of 
the car.

In addition to proper adjustnient and use, safety belts and child safety 
seats should be inspected periodically. Look for twisted webbing, frayed 
fabric and check to see if the belt is retracting properly. If the belts need 
cleaning, instructions can be found in the owner’s manual. Check child 
safety seats to make sure that they are installed according to manufacturer’s 
instructions, that the harness is adjusted properly and not twisted, that there 
are no cracks in the shell and that the harness and buckle are in good 
condition.

Safety belts and child safety seats used in a crash have been subjected 
to enormous forces and should be replaced. In addition, malfunctioning 
or poorly-functioning mechanisms, frayed belts, etc. should be repaired 
or replaced immediately.

Customer enthusiasm for safety and new technological developments 
is resulting in more and more safety features being provided as standard 
equipment. Manufacturers are phasing in lap/shoulder belts for people 
riding in the rear seats, anti-lock brakes, automatic safety belts and air 
bags. But keep in mind that even with an air bag, SAFETY BELTS ARE 
A NECESSITY. Air bags provide protection in head-on crashes, but for 
complete protection inside, rear and rollover crashes, and for even more 
protection in frontal crashes, safety belts must be used on every trip.

Safety is becoming an important consideration in the new car marketplace. 
Be an informed consumer who knows what safety features are available 
— and then take advantage of them. Donna Pugh and her sons are alive 
today because they were convinced that safety belts make sense and using 
them every trip is a habit they couldn’t afford not to get into. Safety belts 
are a habit for life.

HARBINGERS OF WINTER...Dark gray skies and 
Canadian geese heading south are signs that the warm 
days of summer will soon be just memories. It is 
estimated that approximately 1,000,000 geese will stop 
at Horicon on their migration south this year.

Statesman Photos by Gerry Mueller

WISCONSIN OUTDOORS 
AND

CONSERVATION NEWS

Wisconsin Requires Steel Shot 

Statewide for Waterfowl

VOLLEYBALL RESULTS
9-20-88

Playoff for 4th place in 2nd 
half.

Saloon Spikers — 15, 8, 4;
Amerahn — 8, 15, 15.

Playoff for 2nd and 4th 
overall standings.

My Little Friends — 15, 15, 
15; Shefond — 3, 15, 10.

Saloon — 17, 15; Amerahn

The names of the five great lakes can be remembered 
thusly: H-O-M-E-S for Huron, Ontario, Michigan, Erie and 
Superior.

MADISON, WI - Wisconsin 
waterfowl hunters are reminded 
that steei shot is required for all 
waterfowl hunting statewide 
and this includes muzzleloaders 
for 1988, Dave Gjestson, 
Department of Natural 
Resources wildlife biologist 
said.

“The federal steel shot rules 
affecting all firearms used for 
waterfowl hunting was 
established last year (1987), but 
Wisconsin and other states 
received a one-year waiver for 
applying the rule to muzzle­
loading firearms,” Gjestson 
said. “That waiver expired on 
September 1 this year.”

Waterfowl hunters are also 
reminded of the consumption 
advisory issued for waterfowl 
from certain areas in 
Wisconsin. Wisconsin Depart­
ment of Health and Social 
Services has recommended 
people not eat certain species of 
ducks due to contamination 
levels of polychlorinated 
biphenyls (PCBs) above the 
U.S. Food and Drug Ad­
ministration standard of three 
parts per million.

The advisory recommends 
that no one eat mallards taken 
from the Sheboygan River from 
Sheboygan Falls downstream to 
Lake Michigan; from the 
Milwaukee River from Highway 
167 (Thiensville) upstream to 
the Lime Kiln Dam at Grafton; 
from Cedar Creek from the 
Milwaukee River up to the 
Bridge Road in the Village of 
Cedarburg; and from 
Milwaukee Harbor.

Also listed in the “don’t eat” 
category are black ducks and 
ruddy ducks from the Milwau­
kee Harbor and lesser scaup 
(bluebills) from the Sheboygan 
Harbor.

Health officials also advise 
removing all skin and visible fat 
before cooking and discarding 
drippings or stuffing (because 
they may retain fat that contains 
PCBs) from mallard ducks from 
the Lower Fox River from Lake

Winnebago at Neenah and 
Menasha downstream to the 
city limits of Kaukauna and 
from the De Pere Dam to the 
river’s mouth at Green Bay, and 
from lower Green Bay south of a 
line from Point Sauble west to 
the west shore of Green Bay.

For more information contact: 
Dave Gjestson - 608/266-5463.

SUNDAY NITE SWINGERS 
King Pin Lanes

Sept. 18, 1988

M&M's, 5-2; Vetter s. 5-2: ?. 4-3; Sundae 
Fun-Knees. 4-3; 4-Opens, 3 4; Killer B’s. 3-4; 
B.S. ers. 2-5; Alley Cats. 2-5.

Highlights
First high male game — 213. Larry Maniny;

Second high male game — 213. Jim Buechel;
Third high male game — 203. Larry Sabish.

First high male series — 568. Larry Martiny;
Second high male series — 562. Rick Vetter;
Third high male series — 549, luirry Sabish.

First high female series — 192. Carol Sabish;1 
Second high female game — 183, Patty 
Mueller; Third high female game — 176. Pat 
Vetter.

First high female series — 472. Carol Sabish; 
Second high female series — 452. Renee 
Beisbier; Third high female series — 446, Lynn 
Liermann.

WEDNESDAY 
QUEEN HITS LEAGUE 

King Pin Lanes
Sept. 21. 1988

Tippel In, 16-5; Bauer Spraying. 15-6; 
Dundee Sand & Gravel. 14-7; Barney's Bar. 
14-7; Valley Bank. 12-9; Sharons Beauty Salon, 
12-9; Waala Wheel & Tire, 12-9; Everglades. 
9-12; Herman’s Construction, 9-12; Newsettes, 
9-12; Robbies. 9-12; Johann Plumbing. 9 12; 
T’s Lounge, 8-13; Les & Arlene's, 8 13; Sen­
try, 7-14; Lauries, 5-16.

Highlights
First high individual game — 221, Kathy 

Rohlinger; Second high individual game — 212, 
Helen Kertscher; Third high individual game — 
202, Barb Falk.

First high individual series — 570, Janet 
Serwe; Second high individual series — 557. 
Helen Kertscher; Third high individual series 
— 543, Ernie Hammen.

Alexander the Great made 
his soldiers keep clean­
shaven so the enemy 
couldn't grab them by 
their beards.

- 15, 5.

Final Results
Thelen Construction 
My Little Friends 
Shefond 
Saloon Spikers 
Amerahn
Barrel Haus
Ike’s Repair, T’s Lounge

Crash 
course!

Some people learn a lot 
about their insurance 
after they’ve had an ac­
cident. At American 
Family, we like to make 
things clear before you 
have trouble. What’s 
more, we may save you 
money! So don't wait for 
a crash course. Give me 
a call!

We’re driving down 
the cost of insurance.

RANDALL 
J. GUST

1040 Fond du Lac 
Ave. - Kewaskum

Office 626-4050 
Res. 626-4154

AMERICAN FAMILY
AUTO HOME BUStMESS HEALTH LIFE ®

American Family Mutual Insurance Co 
Madison, Wis

INSURANCE



Indians Bow to Two Rivers
In their second “away” 

game of the season, our Indian 
team traveled to Two Rivers 
only to suffer a 35-6 loss.

Two way player and starting 
quarterback Mike Heberer 
didn’t see any action due to a 
sprained knee which he 
suffered just minutes into last 
weeks home game. “This 
hurts our offensive game,” 
commented coach Pearson. 
Starting quarterback was 
junior Brian Leitheiser who 
completed 7 of 12 pass 
attempts but also threw three 
interceptions in the loss.

The only bright spot in the 
game came on a third quarter 
drive by our Indians that

ended with a seven yard 
touchdown run by senior Joel
Serwe. The 
conversion 
successful 
Kewaskum 
game.

extra two point
play was
to end

scoring for

un- 
the 
the

Said Coach Pearson of the
game, ‘‘We didn’t play as bad 
as the score indicates.”

Tomorrow night our Indians 
will be at home against the 
Sheboygan Falls Falcons. 
Game time is 7:30.

Experimental Goose Hunt at 
Theresa Marsh Opens Saturday

Announce Football 
Fundamentals Winners

The Kewaskum JC Football 
Fundamentals was a huge 
success with 42 boys and girls 
competing. The weather was 
perfect, the help exceptional. 
Thanks go to the local 
businesses for having posters 
up, to the schools for 
announcing the event and the 
use of a few items and the 
practice field. To coach Pearson 
and his players for their 
expertise, and all the many 
parents that were there with 
support for the kids, to all the 
participants, your sportsman­
ship, it was great.

Regionals will be held on Oct. 
15th at the Slinger high school 
practice field. First place 
winners attending will be as 
follows: Age 8: Ryan Rammer; 
Age 9: Kevin Martin; Age 10: 
Nathan Scheel; Age 11: Cory 
Rammer; Age 12: Rick Bartelt; 
Age 13: Keith Herman. Con­
gratulations to you all, good 
luck at Regional.

Other winners were: Age 8: 
2nd place, Paul Wiedmeyer; 3rd 
place: Christopher Wessing; 
4th place: Ryan Martin.

HON-E-KOR
LADIES ASSOCIATION

On Wednesday, September 
21, the closing dinner was held, 
ending another year’s activities. 
The ladies had open golf, 
followed by a cocktail hour and 
a prime rib dinner. After dinner 
the Summer Medal winners 
were announced. Prizes were 
given these winners and many 
other prizes were given out for 
the ringer, chip ins, pars, and 
door prizes. The Summer Medal 
winners were: Class A - Betty 
Hallen (102), Judi Tieglman 
(102); Class B - Carole Timblin 
(88); Class C - Kathy Wierman 
(101); Class D - Sandy Semler 
(92).

A big thank you was given 
Betty Hallen for the super job 
she did as our president this 
year, and the new officers were 
then announced with the gavel 
given to the new president. 
Next years officers will be: 
President - Fran Rohlinger;
Vice President
Justman;
Semler;
Moede.

Carole

Secretary
Treasurer

Kathy 
Sandy 
Judy

Timblin will be in
charge of publicity for Kewas­
kum and Doris Bohn for West
Bend.

Card 
Laura 
Hron;

winners were: Bridge - 
Mathews and Lavern 
Sheepshead - Faith

Age 9: 2nd
Laatsch; 3rd
Schultz; 4th 
Strassburg.

place: Andrew 
place: Robbie 
place: Jeremy

Nanetti and Marge Bauer; 
Rekop - Pearl Miller and Gertie 
Backhaus.

SEE YOU ALL IN 1989!
Carole Timblin, Publicity

An experimental Canada 
goose hunt will again be held 
this year at the Theresa Marsh 
Wildlife Area in Washington 
and Dodge counties.

“We expect a banner year for 
the goose hunter,” exclaim­
ed Bill Ishmael, Wildlife 
Manager in the Southeast 
District. “The Theresa hunt is 
designed to allow the goose 
hunter to harvest more geese 
while maintaining harvest 
control. This year, hunters will 
have the opportunity to harvest 
3,000 geese.”

There are special rules that 
apply to the Theresa hunt. They 
include the following:

1. Only hunters NOT 
receiving a 1988 Horicon, 
Collins, Pine Island, or Exterior 
Zone Permit are eligible to 
participate in the Theresa hunt.

2. Participants may apply in 
person at the registration 
station, located south of State 
Trunk Highway 28 on North 
Pole Road. Permits are avail­
able between 9:00 a.m. to 4:00 
p.m. September 24 - 30 and 
from 5:30 a.m. to 3:00 p.m. 
starting October 1. All eligible 
applicants will receive a permit 
while the season is open.

3. The season will open on 
October 1 and continue through 
November 19 or until 3,000 
geese are harvested.

4. Hunting hours will be from 
sunrise until 1:00 p.m. during 
the open season except on 
October 8 when the season 
opens at noon and closes at 6:23 
p.m.

5. All Canada geese 
harvested must be registered at 
the DNR registration station by 
3:00 p.m. on the day of the 
harvest except on October 8 
when geese must be registered 
by 8:00 p.m.

6. The bag is one goose per 
permittee for each five day 
period. Periods begin on 
October 1 or on the date of 
application, whichever is later. 
The season limit is four geese.

7. Blinds are required for 
hunting Canada geese on all

private property within the 
Theresa zone.

Ishmael added that should 
the goal of 3,000 geese be 
reached before November 19, 
news media outlets near the 
Theresa zone will be notified. 
For closure status questions, 
hunters should contact the 
registration station at (414) 448- 
2535 or the DNR offices in 
Milwaukee (414) 562-9500, 
Horicon (414) 485-3000, 
Plymouth (414) 892-8756 or Pike 
Lake (414) 644-5248.

KHS Volleyball
Team Takes 2

Age 10: 2nd place: Brian 
Butschlick; 3rd place: Luke 
Chesak; 4th place: tie, Jason 
Bartek and Aaron Kurth.

Age 11: 2nd place Tim Kiebs; 
3rd place: Ryan Radtke; 4th 
place: Ryan Herman.

Age 12: 2nd place: Erick
Andersen; 3rd place:
Fideler; 4th place: Paul

Shaun 
Reis.

Age 13: 2nd place Adam
Laatsch; 3rd place:
Larsen; 4th place: 
Marx.

Shawn 
Michael

^SKITHE NEW 

f SUNBURST 
l SEASON PASS SALES 
J (OFFERS UNLIMITED SKIING)

Congratulations to everyone.
Hope to see 
1989 Football

everyone at the 
Fundamentals. September 12900

Plus Tax

The oldest Olympic winner
was Oscar G. Swahn of Sweden 
who won the gold in the 1912 
Running Deer team shooting 
competition at 64 years, 258 
days. He won a silver medal for 
shooting in the 1920 Olympics.

October 14900
Plus Tax

November 16900
Plus Tax

Deb Donath. The assist leader 
was Tina Weddig. Tina was also 
the save leader.

The J.V. volleyball took 
Plymouth in all three games 
with the scores of 15-8, 15-9, 
and 15-2. J.V. finally reached 
their goal of serving 90% in a 
match. The good serves were 
made by Tracey Steinert, Kelly 
Rohlinger, and Janet Flynn. 
Good spiking was by Nicole 
Doherty and Tracey Steinert.

The Varsity Volleyball team 
beat Plymouth last Thursday at 
Kewaskum. The scores were 15- 
8, 15-9 & 13-15. Both serving 
and spiking was good in all 
three games. The high servers 
were Karen Felix with 16, 
LeeAnn Winninghoff - 15, and 
Deb Donath with 11. The high 
spikers were Andrea Fliess, 
Sandy Stollenwerk, Deb 
Donath, and LeeAnn Winning­
hoff. The high scorer of Varsity 
was Deb Donath with a total of 
11 points. The assist leader was 
Deb Remmel with 11 assists. 
Deb Remmel was also the save 
leader with two saves.

Tuesday the volleyball teams 
traveled to Kiel to defeat them 
on their parents night. The 
Varsity took the match in 2 
games. The scores were 15-6, 
5-15, and 15-6. Deb Donath did 
excellent in making 20 serves. 
Tina Weddig followed up with 
15 serves. The high scorer was

Against Kiel, the J.V. came 
back from a loss to take the 
match. The scores were 10-15, 
15-9, and 15-5. They didn’t 
quite reach their goal in serving 
again but did fairly well. High 
serves were Marlene 
Wodsedalek, Lora Delcore, 
Jessica Schmidt, Kun Stielow, 
and Shelly Kasserchert. There 
was a lot of spiking attempts 
from various people. Some of 
the high spikers were Carrie 
Krause, Jessica Schmidt, 
Tracey Steinert, Kina Stielow, 
Marlene Wodsedalek and 
Melissa Braun.

The freshmen played ex­
cellent against Plymouth to take 
the match in all three games. 
The scores were 15-8, 15-9, and 
16-14. Good serving was by 
Tricia Schultz and Tammy
Gundrum, 
comments, 
and Jackie 
aggressive

Coach Hofeltz
‘ ‘ Stacey Heberer 
Hintz played an 

game along with
good sets.” ,

Against Kiel, the freshmen 
won it in two games after losing 
the first game. The scores were 
11-15, 15-8 and 15-3. Good 
movement was done by Tammy 
Gundrum, Tricia Schultz, 
Tammy Schmidt and Tina 
Schwartz. This brings the 
freshmen to 4 and 3.

For complete information on Camp­
bellsport Building Supply’s products 
and services available, give us a cal! or 
stop in today ... day after day, you can 
count on getting a fair shake at...

Campbellsport 
Building 

Supply
227 W. Main St.. Campbellsport

Phone 533-4412
Open Monday thru Friday 6:30 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Saturday from 7 a.m. to.12 Noon

Get a better shake 
when you build.
Campbellsport Building Supply has 

earned the reputation of being an inno­
vator, a problem solver, and a helping 
hand when you need it most.

We have achieved this position by 
offering our customers greater value 
and quality in the products we sell, and 
personalized service to make sure your 
building project gets done right.

AL’S 
TAXIDERMY STUDIO 
“Home of Father Nature" 
9383 Old Fond du Lac Rd. 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040

•Licensed Professional 
•Fish & Gamehead Specialist 
•Archery Supplies

LICENSES 
FISH - $2.75 per inch 

414-626-2073

Family & Group Passes Available 
For More Info. Call: 

626-4605

8355 Prospect 
Kewaskum, Wl 

Sept. Office Hours 
Mon Wed Thurs 10-4
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