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Today an old fashioned couple 
isn’t one that stays married, it’s 
one that gets married.
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Year 2,000 Sewer Service Plan Approved
By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

While the year 2,000 seems in 
the distant future, the fact is 
that it is only twelve years 
away. On that basis, the 
Kewaskum Village Board, last 
week, approved a revised 
extended sanitary sewer service 
area which is taking into 
account the possible need for 
expanded service to the village 
and land bordering its 
boundaries during those next 12 
years.

At the public hearing held 
last Monday night, Bruce 
Ruben, Chief Land Use Planner 
for the Southeast Wisconsin 
Regional Planning Commission, 
said the revision was drawn up 
in response to a request from 
the village.

While the service area maps 
had been intended to be used as 
a guide and tool for munici­
palities, SEWRPC and the 
various local governments soon 
found that the Department of

Miracle Baby Lindsey Hackbarth

Lindsey Hackbarth at one month.

It was a fragile beginning for 
baby Lindsey Jean Hackbarth, 
daughter of Mark and Linda 
(Faber) Hackbarth, former 
residents of Kewaskum and 
West Bend. The Hackbarths 
now live in Bozmen, Montana 
the last 5‘/a years.

Linda is a member of Salem 
U.C.C. church of Wayne and 
Mark was a former member of 
St. Lucas Church of Kewaskum.

They would like to share their 
emotional experiences having a 
premature baby girl born July 
23, 1987. She weighed one 
pound, 14 ounces. She was 
fourteen weeks early and was 
flown with Flight for Life to Salt
Lake City, which was 800 miles really mine,

Natural Resources had been 
using those same maps in 
reviewing and approving 
requests for sewer extensions. 
If land seeking sewer service 
had been included in a sewer 
service area, noted Ruben, the 
DNR would approve the 
extension. If not, there was a 
good chance the request would 
be denied.

The village’s new area is 
more than double in size than 
its original plan. The new map 
covers 3.8 square miles, which 
includes the original 1.5 square 
mile plan and it also designates 
primary and secondary 
corridors which would not 
normally be considered 
appropriate for development 
such as wildlife areas and 
marshes.

While there is no specific 
plan, request or mandate to 
extend sewer service in the 
area, requests for such service 
would be looked on more 
favorably by the DNR because

away. She then dropped to one 
pound, nine ounces, where she 
held on by a string.

Linda and Mark got to see 
their daughter for the first time 
on Tuesday, July 29, 1987. Her 
life was a miracle to them. A 
tiny body, red, wrinkled, and 
emaciated, lay in an incubator, 
a ventilator helping her 
breathe, with a maze of tubes 
and wires trailing from her 
body. Linda was able to hold her 
daughter for the first time after 
2‘/a weeks, it was very scary. 
She was on the ventilator. It was 
like holding nothing, but a 
featherfl cried when I held her 
and finally felt like she was 

” Linda said. The

they have been included in the 
area.

SEWRPC estimates popula­
tion growth for the area to range 
from 3,100 to 4,900 by the year 
2,000. (The village’s present 
population is approximately 
2,400). George Allmann, 
chairman for the Town of 
Kewaskum, who was present at 
the hearing said he had no 
objections to the land being 
included in the new area since 
septic installations are being 
curtailed. He did question 
SEWRPC’s growth estimates 
for the village. Allmann indi­
cated he felt the low end of the 
projection seemed more logical. 
Ruben said it was better to over 
estimate than under estimate. 
On that basis the plan would 
remain in tact even longer.

Ted Meilahn of Kewaskum, 
and a surveyor, asked how long 
the plan would be in effect. 
Ruben replied, ‘‘Until the

[Continued on Page 2)

doctors and nurses were really 
supportive and kept saying 
everything will be O.K.

Lindsey was in Salt Lake City 
for two months. Several trips 
were made every week by their 
Pastor, family, friends and 
neighbors. Then she weighed 
three pounds 11 ounces. They 
flew her back to Bozmen 
Hospital for one month. She 
came home on October 17, 
1987. Then she weighed four 
pounds, four ounces.

Lindsey was a Christmas 
miracle baby and was baptized 
on that day. Lindsey’s 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Faber of Wayne and

[Continued on Page 3] . ■

Chosen Contestant 
In Miss Wisconsin 
Teen Pageant Finals

Patti Lynn Aupperle, 
daughter of Ronald and Darlene 
Aupperle of Kewaskum, has 
been selected to be a state
contestant in the Miss Wiscon­
sin U.S. Teen Pageant at the 
Red Carpet Hotel, in Milwaukee 
on April 16, 1988 at 8:00 p.m.

The Miss Wisconsin U.S. 
Teen Pageant is the official 
state finals to the Miss U.S. 
Teen Pageant. Contestants 
from all over the state will be 
competing for the title of Miss 
Wisconsin U.S. Teen. The girls 
will be judged on scholastic 
achievement, service to 
community and school, 
personality, poise, grooming, 
and similar factors.

Patty is a Kewaskum High 
School freshman, and has 
served seven years in the Indian 
Princess Twirlettes, is 
President of her freshmen class, 
secretary of the FBLA, a 
member of AFS, Spanish Club 
and Wrestling Club, a cast 
member in “Grease” in 9th 
grade and “Happy Days” in 8th 
grade, a member of Key Club, 
Forensics, Girl Scouts, has been 
a high honor roll student since 
7th grade. Her hobbies include 
jogging, ceramics, softball, 
drawing and reading. She was 
on the State Softball League, 
champs in the summer of 1987, 
a member of the freshmen 
volleyball, basketball and track 
team.

Among the gifts awarded to 
the new Miss Wisconsin U.S. 
Teen will be a tuition scholar­
ship, cash, a watch, expense 
paid trip to the National 
Pageant, tiara, trophy, and 
many other gifts.

Wendy Fabian, the 1987 Miss 
Wisconsin U.S. Teen, will be 
present to crown the new 
winner.

League of Women 
Voters to Hold
Political Forum

The League of Women Voters 
of Washington County will be 
holding a political forum on 
Tuesday, March 15th, at the 
Kewaskum High School.

Candidates for the position of 
Village Trustee will appear at 7 
p.m. They include, Howard 
Laubenstein, Thomas Mc- 
Elhatton, Richard Schlice, and 
Richard Schmidt.

Candidates for the position of 
Kewaskum School Board 
member appear at 7:45 p.m. 
They are Edward Sieger and 
Neal Weare.

The public is urged to attend 
this important meeting.

Dinner Concert 
At High School

The Kewaskum High School 
Bands will be presenting a 
Dinner Concert on Tuesday, 
March 22. The dinner will begin 
at 6:00 p.m. with the concert 
starting at 6:30 p.m. The meal, 
which costs $7.00, will be 
catered by Homeplate and 
includes barbecued ribs, turkey 
with all the trimmings, rolls, 
salad and dessert.

All profits from the concert 
will go to the new band uniform 
fund and Homeplate will again 
this year give a $1.00 donation 
for each meal served. The music 
for the evening will consist 
entirely of classical music from 
all periods and styles of our rich 
musical heritage.

Tickets may be purchased 
from any high school band 
student or from the high school 
office. Tickets will not be sold 
after Friday, March 18, so get 
yours soon and avoid the rush. 
See you in Rose Hall on 
Tuesday, March 22, at 6:00 
p.m.

[hop to iff]
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York Will Not Seek Re-Election 
To State Assembly in 1988

State Representative Dwight 
York, Republican of the 59th 
Assembly District, announced 
at the Washington County 
Realtor Association’s meeting 
in West Bend on March 2nd 
tht he would not be a candidate 
for re-election in November of 
this year.

York is the ranking member 
on the Education Committee 
and also serves on the Health, 
Housing and Securities 
Committees, as well as Forward 
Wisconsin. York who has 
served two terms in the 
Assembly stated, “I have 
enjoyed the experience very 
much, however, “I wish to get 
back into an administrative 
position.” York had been 
superintendent of Lomira 
schools previously.

“I have been happy to serve

in the Assembly, especially this 
term when we have been able to 
cut income taxes, inheritance 
taxes, and keep the capital 
gains tax credit. I look forward 
to passing the Governor’s 
property tax plan after a few 
changes before I finish my 
term,” York stated.

A primary election will be 
held on September 13, 1988 and 
the general election will be on 
November 8, 1988.

The 59th Assembly District 
includes the Washington 
County towns of Erin, Hartford, 
Addison, Wayne and Kewas­
kum; the city of Hartford and 
the villages of Slinger and 
Kewaskum, as well as Ashford 
Township and the Village cf 
Campbellsport in Fond du Lac 
County and the eastern portion 
of Dodge County.

Village
(Continued from Page 1] 

village decides to change it.” 
He noted, however, that 
SEWRPC recommends the plan 
be reviewed every five years.

In order for developers with 
land within the plan, but 
outside the village limits, to 
request sewer service they must 
be annexed by the village and 
pay for all the necessary work 
required to provide that service.

Now that the village has 
approved the revised area, the 
plan will be presented to the 
SEWRPC Board of Com­
missioners for approval at their 
quarterly meeting this month. If 
it is approved by the 
commissioners, it will be 
forwarded to the DNR for its 
review and approval.

The adult heart beats about 40 
million times a year.

Spradau Stepping Down As 
Campbellsport Police Chief

Eldon Spradau has indicated 
his intention to end his 41-year 
career as police chief for the 
Village of Campbellsport.

At Monday night’s Village 
Board meeting, president Phil 
Ketter announced Spradau’s 
decision to give up his duties as 
police chief by the end of the 
year-

Spradau began his official 
duties as chief on April 1, 1947. 
also taking on the positions of 
village clerk and assessor. 
Spradau said he will continue to 
serve in his capacities as village 
clerk and assessor.

An informational meeting will 
be held in April to discuss 
Campbellsports police protec-

tion needs.
Besides Spradau, the village 

is served by two part time 
officers with backup from Fond 
du Lac county when the officers 
are off duty.

Births
LONG . — A daughter to 

Lorraine and Richard, 1071 
County S, Kewaskum, on Feb. 
27.

EGGERT — A son to Cynthia 
and George, 2053 Elm Tree 
Drive, Kewaskum, on March 4.

Spring Sofa 
Spectacular!

Celebrate the arrival, 
of spring in your 

home by adding the 
beautiful sofa of your 
choice. You’ll save on 
the exact style and 

fabric you want, for a 
look that’s perfect for 

your home.

30% savings on special orders

The style you want... thefabric you want... 
the size you want.. .at special sale prices for 
two weeks only!

We’re your X^RMALK Special Order Gallery store.

FINE FURNITURE OF KEWASKUM

Free Delivery and Room Placement 
Free Layaway*Master Card*VISA 
Highway 45, Kewaskum 

626-2184
Monday and Friday 9 to 9 

Tuesday, Wednesday. Thursday b Saturday 9 to 5
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Mark and Linda Hackbarth with their daughter 
Lindsey taken on Christmas, the day of her 
baptism.

Kewaskum Children 
To Sneak a Peek 
Behind the Scenes

More than 250 Kewaskum 
school-children will have the 
opportunity to learn theatre 
techniques, make-up and 
special effects from a member 
of The Great American 
Children’s Theatre Company 
(GACT), during an eight-week 
tour to Wisconsin schools.

Actor Danny Musha will 
perform throughout South­
eastern Wisconsin beginning 
February 29, 1988. He will be at 
Farmington Elementary School, 
8736 Boltonville Rd., Kewas­
kum, on Monday, March 14, at 
9:15 a.m.

In April, GACT will produce a 
stage adaptation of E.B. 
White’s classic CHARLOTTE’S

WEB. More than 99,000 child­
ren, teachers and parents plan 
to attend the performance at 
Milwaukee’s Pabst Theater, the 
Madison Civic Center, the 
Grand Theater in Wausau and 
Green Bay’s West High 
Auditorium.

In conjunction with 
CHARLOTTE’S WEB, GACT 
offers an in-school program, “A 
Peek Behind The Scenes.” The 
45 minute presentation is 
designed to bridge the gap 
between the classroom and the 
theatre experience. The main 
focus of the program is to 
introduce the children to 
theatrical staging and to 
encourage their active 
participation.

“A Peek Behind The Scenes”

will be performed in 232 schools 
in more than 121 Wisconsin 
cities and towns. For additional 
information contact Dana 
Mueller (414) 276-4230.

The Great American 
Children’s Theatre Company is 
a member of the United 
Performing Arts Fund and 
Theatre Communications Group 
(TGC), the national organiza­
tion of professional theatres.

The first known sewing 
needles were made of bone 
and they are over 30 thou 
sand years old.

Shefond
[Continued from Page 1]

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Hackbarth 
of West Bend, were there to 
bless her.

Linda and Mark and big 
brother Travis, two years old 
would like to thank you all for 
the gifts and cards and 
especially your prayers that God 
answered. Now she is seven 
months old and weighs twelve 
pounds, two ounces and doing 
as good as can be expected.

Now the bills are all adding 
up to this point. The bills at Salt 
Lake City are over $100,000.00 
That includes Flight for Life 
$4,700.00; $2,100.00 for

Lindsey’s delivery in Bozmen 
and $150.00 an hour for 
“Critical Care” in Salt Lake 
City. There are more check-ups 
and more trips to be made in the 
future. They have some of this 
covered by insurance, but there 
will be over $25,000.00 left if 
not more to pay. This will have 
to be payed off over a long 
period of time according to the 
parents. There is a trust fund 
set up for her at the Valley Bank 
of Kewaskum, or any donations 
can be sent to: Mark and Linda 
Hackbarth, 11911 Gooch Hill 
Road, Gallatin Gateway, MO 
59730.

MgM
Mart

1149 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum 626-4300 
SELF/SERVE CONVENIENCE

Designed With You In Mind
American Express, Discover, Visa, 

Mastercard and Mobil
— SAME AS CASH

(4dA 
[Colomatdi I 

ASystanA 99^
FILM

With every Color Print Roll Any 
Size (12, 15, 24 or 36 exposure) 
you bring in for processing, you 
can get a 24 exp. or 15 exp. Disc 

roll of Color Film for 99C

* OFFERVALIP *
March 14 - 27, 1988

Not valid with any other offer.
Coupon Must Accompany Order.

KEMEUV 
PHARffiACYnc

927 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum
626-8001

SKIM MILK
Cheese & 
Sausage

DIET 7 UP 
DR. PEPPER 
^ CHERRY 7 UP

DIET CHERRY 7 UP 

$2.69 ,2 pk

$1.49 g„.

MOVIE 
RENTALS

VISA

d>etL IP

EXPIRES 3-16-88

PIZZA<«^ 
^ 2/$5.00

Jays

PRETZELS
Twists, Rods 

or Sticks

79c

(CWoiwatdi)J 
AtystemA

Let us entertain you!
Monday & Tuesday

RENT ONE...GET ONE FREE
Wednesday & Thursday

GET ONE FREE 
WITH MACHINE RENTAL

NEWER RELEASES
*The Squeeze 
‘Hamburger Hill 
‘Lost Boys
‘Revenge of the Nerds II
‘Nowhere to Hide

and many more...
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The above photo shows the late Mrs. Mary 
Herman at her home on Fond du Lac Avenue 
in Kewaskum, taken around 1934. The home 
is located next to the Uptown Liquor Mart. 
Mrs. Herman was well known for the 
beautiful flowers she grew. This single lily 
plant had over 20 flowers. Count them!

Photo submitted by Margaret Staehler

The Statesman welcomes readers to submit photos for 
the ' Memories' ’ feature. Photos should show life in the 
olden days in this area Deliver or mail to The Statesman, 
250 Main St., P.O. Box 98, Kewaskum, Wl 53040. 
Photos can be picked up again after publication.

Milton Howe Wins 
AWSC Snowmobile

Milton Howe of the Bolton- 
ville Bunch Snowmobile Club 
won a Polaris 400 Snowmobile 
donated by Ryerson Corpora­
tion in the AWSC contest held 
in January. This was first prize 
of the Early Bird Winners of the 
AWSC membership contest.

It was an exciting dav in the 
Howe household. He received 
his first unemployment check 
the same day he won the 
snowmobile. “What a shot in 
the arm," said Milton. “Thank 
you AWSC and the Ryerson 
Corporation! ”

Milton is again employed. 
“The Lord is with us,” said 

Linda. “We have a lot to be 
thankful for.”

KEWASKUM STATESMAN 
250 Main St., P.O. Box 98 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
Phone 626-2626
(USPS 294-060)

Second Class Postage Paid at 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
Lana Harbeck Kuehl 

Publisher
Subscription Rates: 

$11.00 a year - in state 
$13.00 a year - out of state 

Single copy - 25c
active member

WISCONSIN 
NEWSPAPER 
ASSOCIATION

NATIONAL NEWSPAPER 
ASSOCIATION

WEDNESDAY 
MORNINGETTES

Cliff’s Hangers 107-75, Joe 
Berres Ins. 99-83, King Pin 97- 
85, Bar-n-Annex #2 96-86, 
Shefond Oil 96-86, Herriges Oil 
85-97, Bar-n-Annex 01 78-104, 
Bauman’s Dairy 70-112.

Highlights: Max Hahn 533, 
Lorraine Serwe 501, Donna 
Buczek 501.

4-H to Celebrate 
75th Anniversary

Get ready for a big anni­
versary celebration, 4-H 
enthusiasts!

Wisconsin 4-H will be 75 
years old in 1989, and the 
celebration will be going all 
year long.

The kick-off will be held 
during State 4-H Week in 
October 1988. The celebration 
will include a state-wide poster 
contest and special events at the 
1989 State 4-H Congress, the 
Wisconsin State Fair and Farm 
Progress Days.

Among the highlights will be 
a birthday celebration May 8, 
1989, in Madison. This 
convocation of leaders will 
provide a time to present 
educational activities that look 
ahead to the future of 4-H as 
well as celebrate its past.

The birthday celebration 
coincides with the anniversary 
of the signing of the Smith- 
Lever Act, the legislation that 
paved the way for the federal 
Cooperative Extension Service. 
The first local 4-H club in 
Wisconsin was organized under 
the terms of this act by a 
representative of the Land 
Grant College in Walworth 
County in 1914.

It will be more than just an 
anniversary celebration. The 
anniversary theme, “Design for 
the Future,” emphasizes the 
notion that 4-H is not just 
celebrating its past, but also its 
present and its future. The 
celebration aims to increase 
awareness of 4-H — its place 
within UW-Extension, its 
educational mission and its
diversity, as well as recognizing 
past accomplishments and 
support.

Encouragement is focused on 
local 4-H clubs to participate in 
the celebration by becoming 
involved in the state-level 
activities and by coordinating 
their own local activities. The 
goal is for each local club in 
Wisconsin to celebrate the 75th

Gertie* s 
29 Again!
Happy 

Birthday
March 15!

Love...Jim, Linda 
and Girls

Guess Who 
Turned 
40 

On the 
Ninth?

Love, Harry, Kim, Kristie, 
Ralph and Buddy

anniversary in some way and to 
have fun doing it.

If interested in becoming 
involved in any of the anniver­
sary activities, contact your 
local county UW-Extension 
agent.

UW-Oshkosh Lists 
Fall Honor Roll

Oshkosh — University 
officials announced the names 
of students who qualified for the 
Univ, of Wis. - Oshkosh Dean’s 
List and Honor Roll in the 1987- 
88 fall semester.

To qualify for honor roll, a 
student must take at least 12 
credits and earn a grade point 
average of at least 3.3 (out of a 
possible 4.0 — (“straight A”).

Those with a grade point 
average of 3.75 or higher 
qualified for the Dean’s List.

Campbellsport — Tanya 
Jaeger, R. 2, 2000 Sunset Dr. 
(Dean’s List — Straight ‘A’).

Carol J. Lackas, 272 Forest 
St. (Dean’s List — straight ‘A’).

Tammy J. Rentmeester, 2332 
Hwy. F (Dean’s List — straight 
‘A’).

Pamela Walgren, R. 4, 993 
Spring Dr. (Dean’s List —

Happy 
Birthday

Love from your family

straight ‘A’).
Kathy J. Konstanz, 128 Fond 

du Lac Ave. (Dean’s List).
Joann E. Schill, 2036 Hwy. F. 

(Dean’s List).
Angela J. Venturini, 1461 

Maple Dr., R. 2.
Sherri A. Batzler, R. 2, 690 

Hwy. VS.
Scott' D. Marjerus, 182 E. 

Main St.
Michael M. Schill, 2036 Hwy. 

F.

XYZ CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners on Wednesday, 

March 2, played by the Senior 
Citizens XYZ Club at the Legion 
Hall in Kewaskum were: Harold 
Eggert 26-2—24 net; Allen 
Reindl 30-9—21 net; Joe Miller 
18-1 — 17 net; Frank Sell 
17-3—14 net; Jim Andrae 
Spade Solo vs 4; Frank 
Kadinger Club Solo vs 4; 
Francis Gilboy Spade Solo vs 4; 
Marvin Martin Diamond & 
Heart Solos vs 4.
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Some kangaroos live ir 
treetops.

Sexy and 
“17”

Happy 
Birthday

KERI 
RAMTHUN 

P.S. Remember ROCKIES

DANNI 
JEAN

NASS
Hope you 

had a 
HAPPY 

GOLDEN 
BIRTHDA Y 

Party!

Love from Biloxi, 
Grandpa and Grandma
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e 5 Winners In Moraine Area Concerto Auditions

Top junior piano division winners in the Moraine Area Concerto 
Auditions are West Bend students Amy Steiner, left, first place, 
and Stephen Servais, second.

Intrumental judge James Grine, a professor of music and flutists 
at UW-Oshkosh, stands between senior instrumental division 
winners in the Moraine Area Concerto Auditions: left, Carrie 
Schmiege of West Bend, oboe, first place, and Michelle Mar­
sala of Slinger, violin, second place.

Four West Bend music 
students won top honors in the 
recent Moraine Area Concerto 
Auditions. They will perform 
their winning pieces on March 
26 with the Moraine Symphony 
Orchestra under the direction of 
Albert Asch.

Forty-seven youth from four 
Washington County 
communities competed in the 
17th annual auditions, which 
were sponsored by Moraine 
Area Private Music Teachers, 
the Music Department at the 
University of Wisconsin Center 
- Washington County and the 
symphony.

First place piano winners 
were: Junior Division — Amy 
Steiner of Cabrini School, a 
piano student of Barbara 
Froelich, playing “Concertino” 
by Carre; Senior Division — 
Steve Gergetz of West Bend 
East, a piano student of Anna 
Asch, playing “Jubilation” by 
Asch.

First place instrumental 
winners were: Junior Division 
— Tim Stolaski of Badger 
Middle School, a viola student 
of Judy Muelling, playing 
“Gavotte” by Bach; Senior 
Division — Carrie Schmiege of 
Kettle Moraine Lutheran, an 
oboe student of Albert Asch, 
playing “Concerto in C minor 
(I)” by Marcello.

In addition to their per­
formances with the symphony, 
senior winners will receive a 
$100 award and the junior 
winners, a gift.
' Thirty-six youth in grades six 
through eight participated in 
the junior divisions — 27 in 
piano and nine in instrumental.

Also winning honors in junior

piano were: second place, 
Stephen Servais of West Bend, 
a student of Froehlich; and third 
place, Cara Conner of West 
Bend, a student of Mugs 
McFadden.

Receiving Honorable 
Mention were Matthew 
Schaefer of West Bend, a 
student of Froehlich, and three 
West Bend piano students of 
Judy Mitchell: Nicola Prahl, 
Chris Sepersky and Becky 
Trzebiatowski.

In junior instrumental, Katie 
Hill of Jackson, viola, a student 
of Muelling, placed second. 
Honorable Mention went to 
Jessica Rohrer of Kewaskum, 
flute, a student of Kris Hanson; 
and two students of Ed 
Muelling — Sara Patton of 
West Bend, cello, and Shelly 
Lange of West Bend, violin.

Eleven students from grades 
nine through twelve entered the 
senior auditions: nine in piano 
and two in instrumental.

In senior piano, Michelle 
Pieper of West Bend, a student 
of Anna Asch, placed second, 
and Shannon McFadden of 
Kewaskum, a student of Asch, 
received honorable mention.

In senior instrumental, 
Michelle Marsala of Slinger, 
violin, a student of Jane Rinka, 
placed second.

Other participants, by 
divisions and communities (with 
teacher’s names in parenthesis) 
were:

JUNIOR PIANO:
Jackson — Katie Hill (Cheri 

Hron), Tiffany Zopf (Susan 
Johnson);

Kewaskum — Patrick 
McFadden (Asch);

West Bend — Laura Schulz

Instrumental judge James Grine, a professor of music and flutists at UW- 
Oshkosh, stands behind junior instrumental division winners in the 
Moraine Area Concerto Auditions. Top instrumentalists are, from left: first
place - Tim Stolaski of West Bend, viola; honorable mention - Jessica 
Rohrer of Kewaskum, flute; Shelly Lange of West Bend, violin; Sara Pat­
ton of West Bend, cello; second place - Katie Hill of Jackson, viola.

Receiving junior piano division honors in the Moraine Area Concerto Audi-
tions were five West Bend students, from left: Cara Connor, third place, 
and honorable mention: Chris Sepersky, Nicola Prahl, Becky 
Trzebiatowski, Matthew Schaefer.

Piano judge Hugo Hartig, professor of music at Carroll College, left, 
stands with senior division piano winners in the Moraine Area Concerto 
Auditions: Steve Gergetz of West Bend, first place; Michelle Pieper of 
West Bend, second place; and, right, Shannon McFadden of Kewaskum, 
honorable mention.

(Eileen Schmiege), Debra 
Ciriacks (Schmiege), Julie 
Schloemer (Ida Kuss), Jason 
Beerends (Judie Lewis), 
Kimberly Mitchell (Lewis), 
Valeri Wujcik (Lewis), Sara 
Krausert (Karen Pautz), Coreen 
Scherschel (Pautz), Noah Eckert 
(Lewis), Charlene Liu (Nan 
Yagow), Kristin Rodell 
(Schmiege), Mark Martin 
(Kuss), Amy Schaefer (Yagow), 
Jennifer Hausmann 
(Schmiege), Rachel Schmiege 
(Pautz), Dawn Ciriacks 
(Schmiege) and Ericka Tyberg

(Yagow);
JUNIOR INSTRUMENTAL:
Kewaskum — Peggy Gross, 

clarinet (Kris Hanson);
West Bend — Rachel 

Schmiege flute (David Schleif) 
Aubrey Blahnik trombone 
(Hanson), Jennifer McVey (Ed 
Muelling);

SENIOR PIANO:
West Bend — Jacob Kist 

(Jeri Bowerman), Wayne 
Heisler (Anna Asch), Carrie 
Schmiege (Pautz), Jill Shaw 
(Bowerman) and Debbie Siegler 
(Pautz).

FIRST ROBIN
Ted Schoofs, Kewaskum, was 

the first one to report spotting 
the first robin on Monday 
morning near the Kewaskum 
Elementary School.

Numerous flocks of geese 
have been seen flying north the 
past two weeks. Spring is just 
around the corner!

To subscribe to the Kewaskum 
Statesman, just call 626-2626.
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Kutz - Zimdars
THANK YOU

Ehnert - Shallman

Mr. and Mrs. Frank Kutz, 
1161 Kewaskum St., 
Kewaskum, are happy to 

.announce the birthday engage­
ment of their daughter, Nancy 
Ann to Scott Allen Zimdars, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Robert

KMS Students 
Of the Month

A new program has been 
instituted by Julie Backus, 
KMS principal to recognize 
students who show special 
achievement, progress, or 
contributions. A principal’s 
award is given to 3 students 
each month, one from each 
grade, based on staff nomina­
tions.

Those recognized in February 
include Stacey Pamperin, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Walter Pamperin, 8th grade; 
Jason Stockinger, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. James Stockinger, 7th 
grade and Stacy Heckel, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
William Heckel, 6th grade. 
Stacey Pamperin was cited for 
her contributions to class, 
excellent work, and is a model 
and creative student. Jason has 
worked very hard to improve 
and maintain his behavior at 
school. As a member of the 7th 
grade basketball team, he was 
an excellent team member who 
always played his hardest. 
Stacy Heckel was cited for her 
positive polite, friendly, helpful 
attitude and caring attitude 
shown toward the staff. She 
consistently does her school 
work to the best of her ability.

In addition to school wide 
recognition, each student was 
Mrs. Backus’s guest for break­
fast and will be eligible for a 
special prize drawing at the end 
of the year.

Zimdars, 529 S. 16th Ave., 
West Bend.

Nancy is a 1985 graduate of 
Kewaskum High School and is 
employed at Serigraph Inc., 
West Bend.

Scott is a 1982 graduate of 
West Bend East High School 
and is employed at Leeson 
Electric Corporation, Grafton.

A June 10th, 1989 wedding is 
being planned by the couple.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Ehnert 
of Kewaskum are happy to 
announce the engagement of 
their daughter, Carol, to Jim 
Shallman, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
William Shallman of Lake 
Montezuma, Arizona. Carol and 
Jim reside in Northglenn,

Free Blood Pressure 
Screening for March

The Washington County 
Cardiovascular Risk Reduction 
Program is offering free blood 
pressure screening at the 
following sites during the 
month of March. This program 
is sponsored by the Washington 
County Community Health 
Nursing Service and the 
American Heart Association.

March 12 — West Bend Fire 
Department, 320 N. 7th 
Avenue, 1 p.m. - 4 p.m.

March 17 — Walgreen’s 
Drug Store, 822 S./ Main 
Street, 1 p.m. - 4:30 p.m.

March 26 — West Bend Fire 
Department, 320 N. 7th 
Avenue, 1 p.m. - 4 p.m.

Questions about the program 
may be directed to Doris Dauer, 
Coordinator, at 338-5274, 644- 
5204 or 342-2929.

Colorado.
Carol is a cytotechnologist 

working for National Health 
Laboratories in Englewood. Jim 
is employed by AT&T in Denver 
as a computer scientist.

A June 25, 1988 wedding is 
being planned by the couple.

A warm thank you to all my 
relatives and friends who 
remembered me with prayers 
flowers, gifts, food, cards, and 
calls while in the hospital and 
convalescing at home. A special 
thanks to Drs. Sison and Castro 
and the caring nursing staff at 
St. Joseph’s Hospital. All your 
kindness was greatly ap­
preciated. Thanks so much.

Jim Schaub

CHIU DINNER
Sunday, March 20

11 a.m. to 3 p.m.

SALEM UNITED CHURCH OF CHRIST
8925 Highway W, Wayne

Chili * Crackers - Cheese * Relishes * Desserts
Adults - $3.00

Children Under 12 - $2.00

MISS TINY WEST
and Her Country Swingers

S%«

German’s

Little Red Inn
Hwy. 175 & K, St. I.awrence, 644-8181

WEDNESDAY

Smelt Fry & 
French Fried 

Chicken
ALL YOU CAN EAT $3.95

Saturday, March 19
9 to 1 

NEWLY REMODELED HALL

McDonald’s Tavern 
215 Main St., Kewaskum 

626-2055

St. Patrick’s Day 
Thursday, March 17th 

Corned Beef 
and Cabbage

Served from Ila. in. to 2 p.m., 
and4p.m. to 9p.m.

Family Style 
FRIDAY FISH FRY 

Also Serving

Large Perch - Walleye Pike 
BBQ Ribs and Broasted Chicken Daily

a ?SmF and Ce,ebr3te Spring With Us...
at The Amber Hotel, Wednesday, March 23rd

nin^imOdUCin9 ,aJhiOns from The Clofhes p°^ Campbellsport, 
Shw Hew^ summer hairstyles and hair decorations from 
dressthZt^ SalOn' Ben Franklin F,oral Boutique will

°Ur Spnng celebra"on and The Amber hitchen 
will serve several tempting luncheon entrees.. please be sure to 

2momeTh!!rJ7^ SOOn- Lunche°n hours are from 11a.m. to 
P • s,Yl0showwlllbe continuous. For reservations call 533-8816

SMELT - Tues., Weds., Thurs.

THE PHANTOMS 
EXPRESS

professional portable DJ entertainment 
system is once again available for your 
parties, weddings and other occasions.

Featuring
DJ BOB BONENFANT

(formerly ol 2G\ A Phantom s II Night Clubl
We are now taking booking 

for vour event 
EXPERIENCED an,I 

PERSONALITY ORIENTED 
FOR A GOOD TIME 

338-2264

Available Anytime Daily

•Soups
•Chili

Open at 11 a.m.
CARRYOUTS WELCOME

CLOSED MONDAYS

#& HHH]

I ^^d^r^T^f^ 
1m\ ^ Sunday, April 3rd

Served from 11 a.m. to 4 p.m.
French Fried Chicken, Ham, Dressing, 
Mashed Potatoes and Gravy, Hot Vege­
tables, Cole Slaw, Cranberries, Rolls.

Adults $6.75 Child $3.10

THE AMBER HOTEL
39 W. Main, Campbellsport • Call 533-8816 for reservations
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Good Neighbor Energy 
Fund Extended Year

Wisconsin Electric Power 
Co.’s Good Neighbor Energy 
Fund is being extended another 
year; good news for financially 
troubled families trying to meet 
their energy costs.

“We’re asking our 
employees and customers to 
contribute to this fund, which 
already has helped nearly 8,000 
families in our region,” said 
Rene Males, Wisconsin Electric 
senior vice president.

WE began the fund in 1983 
along with Wisconsin Natural 
Gas Co. Since then, about $1 
million has been raised to assist 
low-income families, the 
elderly, disabled and 
unemployed.

‘‘This emergency energy 
assistance fund can make a 
crucial difference for people in 
need, when other government 
or private funds are not 
available,” Males said.

Inserts explaining the 
program and soliciting tax­
deductible contributions will be 
mailed to customers along with 
utility bills beginning next 
week. Customers may make a 
one-time donation or check off 
an amount to be collected on 
their next 12 bills.

Social service agencies 
administer the fund and make 
the energy-assistance grants.

The Interfaith Conference 
and the Social Development 
Commission administrates the 
fund in Milwaukee. Other 
administering agencies are the 
Salvation Army (Appleton, 
Racine and Kenosha), St. 
Vincent de Paul (Northern 
Wisconsin and Michigan’s 
Upper Peninsula), La Casa de 
Esperanza (Waukesha), Family 
Sharing (Port Washington), and 
the American Red Cross (West 
Bend).
' Information about the Good 
Neighbor Energy Fund and 
other energy assistance 
programs is available through 
WE’s Energy Facts Phone, 221- 
2000 in the Milwaukee area or 
1-800-222-9288.

FIN-n-FEATHER
Supper Club in New Prospect 

will be serving their famous j
CORNED BEEF and 
CABBAGE BUFFET

Call 533-4135 
for Reservations

Thursday, March 17

Host Families Sought 
For International 
High School Students

I. Host Families are being 
sought for high school students 
from Sweden, Norway, Denmark, 
Finland. Holland, Belgium. 
Austria, Switzerland. West Ger­
many, Spain, France, Italy, 
Ecuador, Japan and Australia for 
the school year 1988-1989 in a pro­
gram sponsored by the American 
Intercultural Student Exchange 
(A1SE).

The students, age 15 through 17, 
will arrive in the United States in 
August 1988, attend a local high 
school, and return to their home 
countries in June 1989. The

students, all fluent in English, have 
been screened by their school 
representatives in their home coun­
tries. have spending money and 
medical insurance.

Host Families may deduct 
$50.00 per month for income tax 
purposes.

2. AISE is also interviewing 
American high school students age 
15 through 17 who would like to 
spend a High School Year in 
Sweden. Norway. West Germany. 
Switzerland. France. Spain or 
Australia or participate in a five 
week summer host family stay 
throughout Western Europe.

Families interested in either pro 
gram should contact the State Coor­
dinator named above or telephone 
toll-free: l-8(X)-SIBLING.

Botanically, the onion is a 
lily.

WEST BEND 
CINEMA 
Phone 334-5466

Starts March 11

BROADCAST 
NEWS

The movie that is up for 
7 Academy Awards, and 

Best Picture is one of them 
Rated R

Evenings at 6:45 & 9:10 
Sunday Matinees at 1:45 & 4:05

ALSO...

FRANTIC
Rated R

Evenings at 7 & 9:15 
Sunday Matinees at 1, 3 & 5

Bargain Prices on 
Monday & Tuesday Eves

Kewaskum Lions Club

at the J
AMERAHN

Hwy. 45 North, Kewaskum

Sunday, March 13 - 2 to 6 p.m.

BOB KUETHER ORCHESTRA
BIG BAND DANCING

— PRIZES — 
Serving Corned Beef

and Cabbage

Kewaskum
Frozen Foods

118 Forest Ave.
626-2710

LENTEN 
PIZZA SALE

25 oz. garden whole wheat crust 2/$5.00
22 oz. cheese whole wheat crust 2/$4.50
17 oz. cheese regular crust 2/$4.00 
Regular or whole wheat garlic bread 69c

Buy 6 or more Papa Ron’s meatless pizzas 
and receive ONE FREE GARLIC BREAD

GREAT SAVINGS 
also on our sausage pizza

Papa Ron’s Pizza is manufac­
tured and distributed by 
Kewaskum Frozen Foods and 
is made with 100% real 
cheese, all natural ingredients 
and no preservatives.
Offer good until April 2, 1988 

ONLY AT KEWASKUM 
FROZEN FOODS

THE
Glacier Inn

Hwys. 45 & 28 In Kewaskum
PHONE 626-2711

ST. PATRICKS DAV

SPECIAL
Thursday, March 17

Serving

Corned Beef & Cabbage
With boiled potatoes and carrots

Also serving from our regular menu

THEE A VENUE
1139 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum

PHONE 626-4441

&*• Stiyrid^DgrM
Thursday, March 17

^ Corned Beef and Cabbage
^ Green Beer
^ Lots of Irish Whiskey

Sunday, March 20

«•* UPatriefcsI^^^
DANCE
Featuring the

PETE RUNDE BAND
5 to 9 p.m.

^Even More Green Beer 
and Irish Whiskey

i*a *»*»*»*»*»*



Kewaskum Native Dr. Chet 
Perschbacher Honored

The following news story 
about Chester Perschbacher, 
D.D.S., Appleton, a native of 
Kewaskum, was submitted by 
his sister-in-law, Mrs. Lazeda 
(Myron) Perschbacher, Ke­
waskum. The story was taken 
from the Outagamie County 
Dental Society, a component of 
the Wisconsin State Dental 
Society Newsletter. It follows:

“As we consider the status of 
both our present and future 
dental practices and participa­
tion as members of our local 
dental community, it is im­
portant to focus on our heritage 
and, in particular, the involve­
ment of one of our members - 
Dr. Chet Perschbacher. Cer­
tainly, none other presently 
among us more highly repre­
sents the professional image of 
a master dentist. A dental 
career which represents 
excellence in both technical 
areas, as well as patient care, as 
represented by the bonded 
relationships he holds with four 
generations of patients is 
worthy of our review and 
admiration. While Chet’s career 
has been highlighted by great 
achievements, the theme of his 
Career has been that of mutual 
respect and thankfulness for the 
support he has received locally 
from his colleagues. His 
warmth, humility, optimism, 
and good humor are truly a 
great asset to the Outagamie 
Dental Society.

Chester 1. Perschbacher 
D.D.S.

Chet was born in October, 
1901, in Kewaskum, Wisconsin. 
He was raised there with three 
sisters and two brothers. His 
father had started a garage 
about ten years earlier in the 
building next to their house. 
This included a blacksmith 
shop, a carriage repository, and 
implements of the farming 
trade. With the advent of the 
automobile, Chet’s father 
changed the business to that of 
selling • and servicing 
automobiles about the time the 
Model T Ford became popular.

Shortly following graduation 
from Kewaskum High School in 
1919, Chet built his own auto­
mobile. He entered Marquette 
University in the fall of 1919 in 
the School of Commerce. In 
1921 Chet convinced the Dean

of the School of Dentistry to 
allow him to enroll in that pro­
gram. There were 165 men and 
three women in his class. 
During that time, he developed 
a mentor relationship with Drs. 
Jim and Mort Mortohson, 
nationally renowned dentists 
and professors in the School of 
Dentistry. This relationship was 
to be strongly influential in the 
development of Chet’s technical 
skills, as well as perceptions of 
dentistry. These men were also 
strongly influential in Chet’s 
choice of the Fox Cities area for 
locating his practice. To this 
day, he remains grateful for 
their interest and influence in 
his career.

Chet established his practice 
in Appleton in the fall of 1925 
setting up the first of his offices 
in what today is the AAL 
building. (He paid $50 a month 
rent with a five year lease). The 
second office was later located 
in the same building. He moved 
his practice later to the Zuelke- 
building, and finally to a 
location at what has been his 
residence at 1430 West Cedar 
Street. His location in these 
offices spanned 61 years in 
practice.

Chet joined the Fox Valley 
Dental Society in 1925, became 
Secretary in 1927, and was 
elected President in 1929.

That summer while double 
dating with a friend from 
Escanaba, Michigan, he met 
Louise Harder, who was home 
from Mills College in California. 
This was the beginning of many 
road trips between Appleton 
and Escanaba until the 
following winter when Chet 
spent an hour one day in sub­
zero weather getting permission 
from Louise’s father for her 
hand in marriage. They were 
married the following fall in 
September, 1931, and have 
been together for over 56 years. 
They have three children and 
seven grandchildren. Their 
daughter, Ann is married to

John Kloehn.
Chet’s brother, Ray, 

graduated from the University 
of Minnesota School of 
Dentistry and joined him in 
dental practice. They practiced 
together for 14 years. Ray 
married Louise’s twin sister and 
they later moved his practice to 
the Denver area following 
military service. Chet and his 
brother enjoyed putting on 
dental clinics, both nationally 
and locally over the years from 
1928 to 1960. These clinics 
involved direct gold inlay and 
crown casting techniques, as 
well as reconstructive dentistry 
including the use of precision 
crown and bridge attachments.

In 1931 Chet became the 
youngest dentist to become a 
member of the American 
Academy of Restorative 
Dentistry. He would later serve 
on the Council of that organiza­
tion in 1955.

Professionally, Chet is 
recognized as a member of 
several dental organizations. 
He is a member of the Inter­
national College of Dentists, 
being elected a Fellow in 1938, 
President of the USA Section in 
1956, serving on the Executive 
Council of the World’s Section 

, in 1956, and becoming 
President of the World’s 
Section in 1963. (It was about 
this time that his hair turned 
white).

He has been a past member 
of the Milwaukee Dental Forum 
and served as their President in 
1960. He has been an associate 
member of the Chicago Dental 
Society since 1926. He is a 
member of the Wisconsin State 
Dental Society 50 Year Club. He 
is a life member of the Psi 
Omega Dental Fraternity, as 
well as the Pierre Fauchard 
Dental Academy. He is a Fellow 
of the American College of 
Dentists.

During these years, Chet had 
become a leader and innovator 
in the development of veneer 
crowns, as well as the use of two 
or more precision attachment 
partial dentures. He developed 
innovational stress breakers for 
posterior teeth, as well as the

use of asbestos pads for dental 
castings. He devised a system 
of pre-measuring and 
packaging investment materials 
with proper water powder 
ratios. He was an innovator, as 
well, in the preventive use of 
antibiotics in dental treatment.

Chet’s interests have 
included automobiles, hunting, 
fishing, and professional dental 
organizations. At one time, he 
held the U.S. record for the 
largest muskie. Chet continues 
to hunt and fish, and again 
bagged his duck limit this fall. 
Chet was disappointed not to 
down a goose on his goose hunt 
outing in the Rosendale area 
this year. He suggests he was 
even more disappointed at the 
difficulty he had moving for 
three days after kneeling in the 
goose blind on a cold autumn 
day.

Chet’s community involve­
ments have included being on 
the Board of Directors of the 
YMCA. He served as Secretary 
- Treasurer and later President, 
of the Appleton Memorial 
Hospital staff in 1960. He has 
served as a member of the 
Community Chest and the 
Outagamie County Hospital 
Commission. He has been a 
member of the Chamber of 
Commerce, as well as a 35 year 
member of the Kiwanis Club. 
He has served on the 
Commission for Under­
privileged Children in this 
organization.

Chet, by invitation, is listed 
in the books America’s Dental 
Leaders, Who’s Who in

American Dentistry, Per­
sonalities of the West and 
Midwest and Who’s Who in the 
Midwest.

Let us all take a moment to 
celebrate the professional 
career of Dr. Chet Persch­
bacher.
" He is a most remarkable 

individual whose life has re­
flected his commitments. His 
boundless energy, understand­
ing and caring for people, as 
well as, his quick wit and de­
lightful humor are a source of 
inspiration for so many who 
have known him. Here indeed is 
someone who has left an 
indelible mark.’’

Douglas A. Krueger, D.D.S. 
Todd L. Needham, D.D.S.

FRIENDS
“I wish to express my 

appreciation to dentistry, my 
colleagues, friends, and 
patients throughout the world. 
These people have made 
dentistry an interesting career 
for 61 years. From blacksmith^ 
helper to President of 
Worldwide International 
College of Dentists is a long way 
to go in one generation. Thanks 
to all of you for helping me 
along the way. Helping people 
and my profession was always 
challenging and rewarding fof 
me. Dentistry has graciously 
given me’, by invitation, every 
hour possible, thanks to my 
fellow practitioners, patients,., 
and friends. I could not have 
spent my life with a finer 
gr°UP” Chet
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Nicely Redecorated

TURNER HALL
Fillmore

Choice dates available 
for weddings, etc.
AMPLE PARKING

692-2597
* Class Reunion Special
* Catering Available
* Wood Dance Floor

HAM CARD PARTY
Sunday, March 13 - 8 p.m.

LUNCH SERVED

ST. KILIAN SCHOOL HALL
St. Kilian

US 
SIER

BASKETBALL CLASSIC
Saturday, March 19

KHS GYM — 6 p.m.
Tickets — $1.0u

EIGHT TEAMS DOOR PRIZES

A&K 
RESTAURANT 

Home Cooking 
Carryout Dinners 
Available Daily 

OPEN 9 A.M. TO 10 P.M. 
Closed Mondays 

Hwy. 28 & 144 
Random Lake 

994-4725

THE
Glacier Inn

Hwys. 45 & 28 In Kewaskum
PHONE 626-2711

- Every Tuesday -
SMELT FRY 

All You Can Eat 
) $3.95

SHRIMP PLATE
$3.95

Both dinners include French fries, cole slaw and 
rye bread

AMERAHN
Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum

Friday, March 11 .8:30 p.m.

POLKA STARS
Sponsored by FFA Alumni

Sunday, March 13 - 2 to 6 p.m.

St. Patrick's Day ^
DANCE . „ 

BOB KUETHER.J 
BIG BAND MUSIC 

Sponsored by Kewaskum Lions Club 

Corned Beef and Cabbage
Served from 2 to 6

PHONE 626-4031
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The Scouts that received the “I Live My Faith” awards are, left 
to right: First row - Maureen Leitheiser, Jenny Strobel and 
Heather Amerling. Second row: Jenny Straub, Carrie Stoffel, 
Laura Fleischman and Andrea Bonlender. The Scouts that completed the “Family of God” award from Holy Trinity this year were, 

left to right: Nicole Reindl, Becky Heisdorf, Sarah Bonlender, Jamie Gaffke and Ann Bodden.

Kewaskum Area
Girl Scout News

On Sunday, March 6 the Girl 
Scouts of Kewaskum started 
Girl Scout Week by attending 
the church of their choice.

At 12:30 p.m. a Potluck 
dinner was held at the 
Amerahn. The theme was “It’s 
a Small World.” Each troop 
explained a different phase of 
scouting.

A special award was pre­
sented to Miller’s Furniture 
store for the use of their 
warehouse to store scout 
equipment.

The program closed with 
everyone joining in a candle 
light ceremony.

In honor of Girl Scout week 
the Kewaskum area Girl Scouts 
have a display at the Valley 
Bank, Kewaskum. The art work 
has been judged, and the 
winners are:

Daisy — Tammy Gundrum, 
Brooke Zanow, Melissa Finch.

Brownie — Elizabeth 
Wenzel, Kim Junk and Heather 
Gruhle, Ryanne Reseburg and 
Julie Kieth.

Junior — Kelly Schneider, 
Kari Chapman, Kara Palmer.

Cadette — Sarah Brath, Julie 
Morgan, Cassie Romans.

Senior — Denise Bergdorf.
Please stop in and see our 

exhibit before bank closing 
Friday, March 12.

Thank you to our judges, 
Joan Albers, Vonda Poling, and 
Sandi Hottenroth, and to the 
Valley Bank for allowing us 
space to set up.

SCHOOL 
MENUS
HOLY TRINITY

Monday, March 14 — Hot 
dog or cheddar dog,bun, French 
fries, carrot coins, pear half, 
cake/cream.

Tuesday, March 15 — Tony’s 
pizza, lettuce salad, fresh fruit, 
milk.

Wednesday, March 16 — 
Oven fried chicken, whipped 
potatoes, green beans, dinner 
roll/butter, milk.

Thursday, March 17 — Bar- 
B-Q, nacho chips/cheese sauce, 
corn nibblets, peach half, 
shamrock cookie, milk.

Friday, March 18 — Cheese 
dreams, tuna salad, potatoe 
rounds, applesauce, pineapple 
cup, milk.

KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 
SCHOOLS

Monday, March 14 — Tacos 
in a bowl, (meat, cheese, lettuce 
& taco sauce) buttered rice, wax 
beans, peaches or pears.

Tuesday, March 15 — Pizza

buns, potato rounds, buttered 
corn, cooks choice dessert.

Wednesday, March 16 — 
(Salad Bar - H.S. & M.S.) - 
Mock chicken legs, French 
fries, buttered green beans, 
homemade bread \ butter and 
peanut clusters. (Mexican Salad 
Bar - H.S. & M.S.).

Thursday, March 17 —
Chicken patty on a sesame seed 
bun, curly fries, pork-n-beans 
and choc, cupcake w/mint frost­
ing. (St. Patrick’s Day).

Friday, March 18 — Breaded 
fish on a bun or hot dog, relish­
es and dip, pineapple chunks, 
slice of cheese and sugar 
meltaway cookie.

WASHINGTON COUNTY
NUTRITION PROGRAM

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU 
Meadowcreek Apartment

Complex 
626-8333 

TIME: 9:30 to 1:30

Monday, March 14 — Beef 
stew, parslied boiled potatoes, 
fruited jello, white bread w/- 
butter, fruit cocktail, milk and 
coffee.

Tuesday, March 15 —
Meatballs in Italian sauce, 
spaghetti, green beans, Italian 
bread w/butter, rice pudding, 
milk and coffee.

Thursday, March 17 —
Corned beef, cabbage, boiled 
potatoes in jacket, rye bread 
and butter, shamrock cookie, 
milk and coffee.

Ceramics at 10:00 a.m. every

3rd Tuesday of each month. 
Card playing everyday.

MONDAY, MARCH 14 
Season opens for Boys Golf and 

Boys Tennis at high school
TUESDAY, MARCH IS 

KMS Girls Basketball - Slinger 
here - 3:30 p.m.

WEDNESDAY, MARCH 16 
KHS Music Concert - 7:30 
THURSDAY, MARCH 17 
KMS Girls Basketball at

Pewaukee - 3:30 p.m.

GERI’S 
Beauty Salon 
114 Main St., Kewaskum

Featuring 

Family Hair Styling 
hi Savings & Loan Bldg. 

(Rear Entrance)

PHONE 626-4455

From Tom Kennelly

HYPERTENSION
An Oregon research team 

believes calcium may be the 
key to reducing or preventing 
high blood pressure. “Seven 
studies all suggest that 
calcium has a therapeutic 
effect on hypertension,’’ says ' 
Dr. David McCarron of 
Oregon Health Sciences U. He 
believes that a lack of calcium 
and dairy products |low-fat| in 
the diet are more important in 
causing hypertension than too 
much salt and sodium.

Filling your prescription is 
our most important work

927 Fond du Lac Ave. 
Kewaskum 626-8001

Marcie Haack has joined the 
staff at Family Hair Salon 

To get better acquainted with Marcie, 
she will have an introductory special

$6.00 
Hair Cuts

10% OFF 
Perms

Offer good thru 3-31-88

Family Hair Salon
227 Main St., Kewaskum 626-2650

n? 2ND ANNIVERSARY 
SPECIALS

MARCH 14 - Buy one haircut, get second FREE 
; MARCH 15 - 1O0/o OFF all perms 
• MARCH 16 • FREE skincare demonstration

MARCH 17 - 10% OFF all perms
MARCH 18 -10% OFF all colors and highlighting
MARCH 19 -10% OFF all retail supplies

o'

o

7/o

ANNIVERSARY COUPON
■ Bring in this ad and receive $5.00 OFF our fabulous new skin- !
! care and non-surgical face lift program, or $1.00 OFF each j 
J selected skincare item.

SHEAR HEAVEN HAIR SALON
329 Hwy. V, Kewaskum 626-8087
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MARCH
COMMUNITY
CALENDAR

Coming events will be listed only if 
they are submitted to the Statesman 
and are of area interest. We will be 
happy to list meetings of your organiza­
tion only if they are sent in to us each 
month We can no longer be respon­
sible for keep a running file of your 
meetings for the entire year. Please 
submit your meeting notice for publica­
tion the week before it is to be 
published.

SATURDAY, MARCH 12
1988 Odyssey of the Mind regional 

competition at Morse Middle Sch(X)l, 
84th and Hampton, Milwaukee, from 
8 a.m. to 12 p.m.

SATURDAY, MARCH 12
Farm Fair from 9:30 a.m. to 5 

p.m. at the West Bend Outlet Mall. 
Free focxi samples, recipe flyers, 
door prizes, small animals, farm 
machinery and representatives.

SATURDAY, MARCH 12
The Tenth Annual Spring Arts and 

Crafts Fair sponsored by the Beaver 
Dam Nursery School from 10 a.m. 
to 3 p.m. at the Fellowship Hall. First 
Lutheran Church. 311 W. Mackie 

#St.. Beaver Dam.
SUNDAY, MARCH 13

Ham Card Party. 8 p.m., St. Kilian 
School Hall in St. Kilian.

SUNDAY, MARCH 13
Kewaskum Lions Club St. 

Patrick's Day Dance at the Arnerahn. 
Hwy. 45 North, Kewaskum, from 2 
to 6 p.m., with the Bob Kuether 
Orchestra.

SUNDAY, MARCH 13
Jazzercise Benefit to help the 

MACC Fund fight childhood cancer. 
Local Jazzercise instructors will lead 
participants in easy-to-follow routines 
that provide stretching, toning and 
aerobic exercise, at 2 p.m., Mar­
quette High School. 3401 W. 
Wisconsin Ave., Milwaukee. $5 ad­
mission goes to the MACC Fund.

TUESDAY, MARCH 15
Kettle Moraine Chapter Profes­

sional Secretaries International 
meeting. 6 p.m., at the Riverside. 
I I I N. Main St.. West Bend. Call 
Eugenia Malsack at 644-5741.

SATURDAY, MARCH 19
Kewaskum Indians Booster Club 

Basketball Classic at 6 p.m. in the 
KHS gym.

SUNDAY, MARCH 20
Chili Dinner at Salem United 

Church of Christ, located at 
Washington County Highways H and 
W. from 11 a.m. Io 3 p.m. in the

parish hall. All-you-can-eat chili with 
crackers, cheese, relishes, beverages 
and dessert.

THURSDAY, MARCH 24
M(xlern Woodmen of America 

Camp 2233 is having a Bake Sale, 7 
p.m., Card Party, 7:30 p.m. and 
Recycling Aluminum Cans in con­
junction with a Matching Fund Pro­
ject at the Arnerahn. All proceeds will 
be matched by the Home Office (up 
to $2,000) and will be given to 
Kewaskum River Hill Park to pur­
chase playground equipment.

SATURDAY, MARCH 26
Lunch with the Easter Bunny spon­

sored by the Wayne Girl Scouts at the 
Kohlsville Fire House at 11 a.m., 12 
noon and 1 p.m. For tickets call 
629-9541 or 626-8140.

Any church group or. civic 
organization is invited to submit 
their coming events for listing in 
this column, however, we do ask 
that you keep words to a 
minimum. (We also appreciate 
your advertising these events).

Modern Woodmen 
To Sponsor Bake 
Sale, Card Party

Modern Woodmen of 
America Camp 2233, Kewas­
kum, is having a bake sale, card 
party, and recycling aluminum 
cans in conjunction with a 
Matching Fund Project!

It will be held on Thursday, 
March 24, at the Arnerahn, 
Kewaskum. The bake sale will 
be held at 7:00 p.m. and the 
card party at 7:30 p.m.

Sandwiches and coffee will be 
served. The cost to attend will 
be $2.00 for adults and free of 
charge for children under the 
age of 10.

Bakery donations should be 
brought to Arnerahn Hall 
between 5:45 and 6:30 p.m. on 
March 24. Empty aluminum 
cans for recycling may also be 
brought in that evening. 
Popular card games will be 
played and prizes will be given.

All proceeds from this project 
will be matched by the Home 
Office of Modern Woodmen of 
America up to $2,000. The 
money will be given to the 
Kewaskum Riverview Park to 
purchase playground equip­
ment.

Please lend your support to 
this worthwhile community 
project and join the fun. Every­
one is welcome.

March ETN
Courses

Continuing education courses 
on subjects ranging from real 
estate contracts to horse 
training will be available during 
the month of March to 
Washington County residents 
through the University of 
Wisconsin - Extension’s 
Educational Teleconference 
Network (ETN).

The courses are offered by 
UW-Madison and are held 
statewide, but in Washington 
County, ETN classes meet at 
the Hartford Public Library and 
the University Center in West 
Bend, says Chuck Wise, Area 
Business Agent for UW-Exten- 
sion.

The March ETN classes and 
starting dates are:

Criminal Justice: E511, The 
Violent Juvenile, March 29;

Education: E599, Utilization 
of Related Service Personnel, 
March 21;

Environmental Resources: 
E602, Planning for Small 
Quantity Hazard, Mar. 30; 
E596, At-Grade Systems for 
Certified Soil Testers, Mar. 22;

Government: E520, Con­
ducting the Annual Town 
Meeting, Mar. 24;

Human & Social Services: 
E603, Alzheimer’s Disease, 
Mar. 24;

Law: E527/530/532, 1988 
Real Estate Listing Contract & 
Offers to Purchase, Mar. 18;

Music: E511, Piano Teachers 
Forum on Piano Pedagogy, 
Mar. 15;

Nursing: E566, Pain 
Management, Mar. 10;

Public Relations: E559, 
Direct Mail Fund Raising for 
Non-Profit Organizations, Mar. 
21;

Speech & Organizational 
Communications: E6O7, Effec­
tive Performance Assessment/- 
The Appraisal Interview, Mar. 
22;

Youth Development: E574, 
4-H Horse Leader Training, 
Mar. 23.

For more information, Call 
Wise at the University Center 
Campus, phone 338-5204.

Before putting clothes in 
the washer, button them 
up and turn them inside 
out. Fewer buttons will be 
lost and there will be less 
fading on the right side of 
the qarments.

Legion Post Thanked 
By State Commander

The next meeting of American 
Post 384 will be held on March 
14th at 8:00 p.m.

The local A.F.S. students and 
their host families will be our 
guests for the March 14th meeting. 
All legionnaires are encouraged to 
bring their spouse and/or friends to 
this meeting. We are planning to 
serve pizza and beverages after the 
meeting. Be there for a most infor­
mative and enjoyable meeting.

On March 2nd there was a blood 
drive at Kewaskum High School. 
Post 384’s blood number is 
02389000 — please use it at the 
mobile unit in Kewaskum or at 
West Bend when you donate. The 
use of this computer number will 
assure that the post is credited for 
the blood you give.

With Spring coming on, flags to 
display at home are available at 
Jacobs Barber Shop, McDonald’s 
Tavern and the Village Bootery.

Al Zehren and Wally Giese were 
both hosplitalized recently and both 
are at home now and on the mend.

Commander Clayton Stautz 
received a thank you from State 
Commander Robert C. Weyenberg 
for being a 100 percent post. 1 am 
now a member of Weyenbergs all 
star team. Thanks to all of you who 
helped this become a reality.

CLASSMATES SOUGHT 
FOR UPCOMING REUNION

Classmates are being sought 
for the 40th Anniversary of the 
1948 class of Milwaukee North 
Division High School whose 
reunion will be held in 1988.

For further information, call 
Larry Shesto at (414) 228-8257 
or write at 5692 N. Sunny Point 
Rd., Glendale, WI 53909

Ortin Announces
Candidacy for 59th

David A. Ortin announced his 
Candidacy for State Assembly 
for the 59th District, in Hart­
ford, Wisconsin, on March 9.

Issues include: States lack of 
Obscenity Laws, and Concern of 
runaway property taxes.

He has been a resident of 
Erin, Wisconsin for four (4) 
years. He is married, thirteen 
(13) years, and has three 
children.

BUNNY 
BON AN

St. Joseph's Community Hospital

STRETCH ’N TONE
Stretch ‘N Tone is an 8-week exercise class designed for persons 
interested in improving muscle tone, flexibility and strength. This 
is an upbeat exercise program that encourages participants to exer­
cise to music at their own pace.

DATE: Mondays & Wednesdays 
March 14 - May 4

TIME: 5:30 - 6:30 p.m.

PLACE: Peace United Church of 
Christ - Kewaskum

COST: $25

To Register, Contact 
Lynette Gagnon at 334-5533

GEORGE JOHN SIMONS 
Jan 22. 1919-Feb 29. 1976 

GREGOR F. HEIMERMANN 
Sept 29, 1921 March 3, 1978 

RICHARD P. HALFMANN 
June 10. 1930-March 7. 1986

Flying Our 
Flag In 

Remembering 
Our Veterans

ALOIS J. HERRIGES 
Jan 5, 1896-March 2, 1980 

ARTHUR GROESCHEL 
Aug 17, 1894 March 3, 1974 

CHARLES W. DIEDRICH
July 28. 1892-March 8. 1976

ALEX KUDEK 
Jan 17, 1908-March 10. 1975

"Our goal is to serve everyone as if they were members 
of our own family...with gentleness, privacy and respect." 
Specializing in pre-need arrangements, Title 19, irrevocable 
trusts

FUNERAL HOME
Kewaskum Phone 626-2185

REGISTER AT THESE BUSINESSES BOTH WEEKS!

Name

Address Address

Phone Phone

Name Name

Address Address

Phone Phone Phone

Name Name

Address Address Address Address

Phone Phone Phone

Name Name Name

Address Address Address

Phone Phone Phone

Name

Address AddressAddress

Phone PhonePhone

Name

Address

Phone Phone

Name

AddressAddress Address

PhonePhone Phone

EastertHSi Name

KL HOME & HARDWARE 
985 Fond du Lac Ave.

GLACIER INN 
109 Main St.

BUFFY’S VILLAGE INN 
1526 Fond du Lac Ave.

HERRIGES OJL, INC. 
1245 Fond du Lac Ave.

BARREL HAUS 
204 Main St.

HOMEPLATE DRIVE IN 
1523 Fond du Lac Ave.

CALLAWAY & CO. 
409 Main St.

STROBEL OIL INC. 
Off at KL Home & Hardware

REGAL WARE OUTLET STORE 
1308 Fond du Lac Ave.

VILLAGE BOOTERY 
127 Main St.

LR TROPHY $ SPORTSWEAR 
987 Fond du Lac Ave.

BARTELT INSURANCE AGENCY 
1231 Fond du Lac Ave.

THEE AVENUE 
1139 Fond du Lac Ave.

VALLEY BANK 
1225 Fond du Lac Ave.

AMERAHN 
9480 Hwy 45 North

RICHARD’S KUT & STYLE SHOP 
147 Hwy. 45 North

| Name

| Address

■ Phone

KEWASKUM STATESMAN 
250 Main St.

KEWASKUM FLORAL SHOP 
119 Main St.

JAEGER SEWING MACHINE CENTER 
212 Main St.

WEST BEND SAVINGS & LOAN ASSOC. 
114 Main St.

. I Name

| Address

Phone

| j^Drop

| Name..

| Address

■ Phone

Two Weeks to Register - Drawing March 25
Winners Will Be Notified - ONE WINNER PER FAMILY

■ ^
■ Name

l>2 Name

WIN
OUR

Ham

! SL LK HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING
I 357 Main St.
I Name

Sponsored By

Kewaskum Area Chamber of Commerce
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Name

Phone

Name

Address

Phone

Address

Name

Name

Bier s jewelry
129 Main St.

Name

BEHRING’S MARKET 
1265 Fond du Lac Ave.

Name

Name

Phone

SENTRY FOODS 
927 Fond du Lac Ave.

Address

Address

Phone

Phone

Address

Name

Address

GENERAL STORE ANTIQUE MALL 
1277 Fond du Lac Ave.

Name

Name

Address

Phone

Name

Address

Phone

Name

Address

Phone

HONECK CHEVROLET, INC. 
1242 Fond du Lac Ave.

KEWASKUM FROZEN FOODS 
118 Forest Ave.

MILLER’S FURNITURE 
1313 Fond du Lac Ave.

SHEFOND MOBIL MART 
1149 Fond du Lac Ave.

DR. STEPHEN VAN ESS 
1053 Fond du Lac Ave.

DON'T FORGET TO PATRONIZE OUR OTHER CHAMBER MEMBERS
BADGER PKG. CORP. - Route 2, Kewaskum 

BEECHWOOD CHEESE FACTORY - 1713 Hwy. A, Adell 
BEHNKE-SCHMITZ & ASSOC. - 1051 Fond du Lac Ave. 

BONNIE BELLE MOTEL - 900 Prospect Dr. 
ENGELHARDT & SONS - 1245 Fond du Lac Ave. 

GUST INSURANCE AGENDY - 1040 Fond du Lac Ave. 
HEBERER BROS. CONSTRUCTION - 691 N. Mill Rd.

HON-E-KOR COUNTRY CLUB - Riverview Or. 
KENNELLY PHARMACY - 927 Fond du Lac Ave. 

KOHN’S U.S. SELF/SERVE - 516 Main St. 
LANDMARK INN - 143 Main St. 

McKENNA & KIEFER, Attorneys-at-Law — 114 Main St. 
MILLER FUNERAL HOME - 215 Forest Ave. 

THE NEW SUNBURST SKI AREA - 8355 Prospect Dr.



Obituaries
EDWARD J. CAMPBELL

Mr. Edward J. Campbell, 87, 
of 8812 Townline Rd., Kewas­
kum, passed away on Saturday, 
March 5, at Hartford Care 
Center in Hartford.

He was born on December 12, 
1900, in the Town of Wayne, the 
son of the late Joseph and 
Catherine (Kudek) Campbell. 
On November 4, 1926 he was 
united in marriage to Verle 
Andler. Mr. Campbell was a 
member of the St. Bridget 
Catholic Church, Town of 
Wayne.

Survivors include his wife
Verle, two daughters, Mrs. 
Virginia (Harold) Baum of 
Kewaskum and Mrs. Patricia 
(Carl) Bernhagen of West Bend; 
a brother, Sylvester (Ruth) 
Campbell of Kewaskum; two 
sisters, Mrs. Ruth (Rolland) 
Senn of West Bend, and Mrs. 
Loretta Mathieu of Menomonee 
Falls; three grandchildren and a 
great-grandchild. In addition to 
his parents he was preceded in 
death by a infant son, three 
sisters and two brothers.

Funeral services were held at 
St. Bridget Catholic Church in 
the Town of Wayne at 8:00 p.m. 
on Tuesday, March 8, with 
Father Robert Berghammer 
officiating. Burial was Wednes­
day at Holy Trinity Cemetery, 
Kewaskum. Friends called from 
5.00 p.m. until the time of 
services at the church on Tues­
day. Miller Funeral Home, 
Kewaskum, served the family.

ANTHONY J. VORPAHL
Mr. Anthony J. Vorpahl, 58, 

of Mauston, and formerly of 
Kewaskum, passed away on 
Tuesday, March 8, at Hartford 
Memorial Hospital.

He was born on December 16, 
1929 in Kewaskum, the son of 
John Sr. and Dorothy (Theusch) 
Vorpahl. On May 25, 1973 he 
was united in marriage to 
Louise Saraphin. Mr. Vorpahl 
resided in Mauston since 1973. 
He was a member of the Moose
Club West Bend Lodge 01398, It is with sincere appreciation 
the 40 et8 and the American we wish to express our thanks to
Legion of Mauston.

Survivors include his wife, 
Louise; a step-son, David (Judi) 
Saraphin of Eldridge, Iowa; a 
step-daughter, Mrs. Richard 
(Teresa) Nagle of Wisconsin 
Dells; his mother, Dorothy 
Diedrich of Kewaskum; three 
brothers, Frederick of Marshall, 
Ronald and John Jr. of West 
Bend; three sisters, Mrs. Allen 
(Delores) Kertscher of Camp-

Don Herriges 
Heating

25 YEARS OF SERVICE
• 24 Hour Burner Service
• Gas - Oil Furnaces
• Gas - Oil Boilers
• Woodstoves - Boilers
• Aprilaire Humidifiers 
• Interburners 
• Add-ons

★ ★ ★ ★ ★

96% Tightfist II 
Whirlpool

Gas Furnace
ALL TYPES OF

SHEET METAL WORK
For Free Estimate Call

Donald Herriges
604 Mill Rd., New Fane
PHONE 626-2388

bellsport, Mrs. Floyd (Dorothy) 
Buddenhagen of West Bend, 
and Mrs. Gerald (Theresa Ann) 
Brookman of Milwaukee, and 
three step-grandchildren.

He was preceded in death by 
his father and a sister.

Funeral services will be held 
at Miller Funeral Home, 
Kewaskum, at 7:30 p.m., and at 
Holy Trinity Catholic Church at 
8:00 p.m. on Thursday, March 
10, with Father Robert Berg- 
hammer officiating. Burial with 
military graveside rites will be 
at the parish cemetery at 10:00 
a.m. on Friday. Friends may 
call from 4:00 p.m. until time of 
services at the funeral home on 
Thursday.

IN MEMORY
In memory of Michael Ehnert 

who passed away March 13, 
1987:
A million times I’ve thought of 

you,
And many times I’ve cried.
In life I loved you dearly, 
In death I love you still.
It broke my heart to lose you, 
The day God called you home.
Yet in my heart you hold a 

place,
No one else will ever fill.

Sadly missed by Kerri.

IN MEMORY
To my dearest Michael 

Ehnert, who passed away one 
year ago, March 13, 1987:
Memories always brighten up 

my day.
When things are going wrong 

memories are what I think of.
Whenever they play our song, 

memories are there to look 
back on, to remember times 
we shared.

Memories are what I’m trapped 
in because I know you’re no 
longer there.
I miss you so very much, and 

Love You Always and Forever: 
Wendy.

CARD OF THANKS

relatives, friends and neighbors 
for their expressions of 
sympathy received during the 
recent bereavement, the' death 
of our mother and grandmother, 
Kathryn Naumann. Special 
thanks to Father Jerome Rinzel, 
pallbearers, drivers of cars, 
organist, choir, Christian 
Women, donors of memorials, 
spiritual and floral tributes and 
donors of food, the kind ladies 
who served the lunch, the kind 
and caring staff of St. Joseph’s 
Hospital, Schmidt Funeral 
Home, and each one who 
assisted in anyway. We ask 
God’s blessings on each and 
everyone of you.

The Family of 
Kathryn Naumann

MONUMENTS
★ Uprights and flat
★ Markers of all kinds
★ Completely installed
★ Death date put on
★ Mausoleums

VINCE’S 
MONUMENTS 
1857 Hwy. 67 in Ashford

PHONE 533-8178.

Linda Howe Raises $2,001 In Pledges 
In MS 500’s Fifth Anniversary Ride

Eight of the original "500” riders at their fifth birthday celebration. Lin­
da Howe is pictured in the center.

Linda Howe raised $2,001.50 
in pledges for the 5th anniver­
sary of the Multiple Sclerosis 
500.

This year the ride had its 
headquarters at Lakewoods 
Resort near Cable, WI. Many of 
the 200 plus riders stayed in 
condominiums. Linda’s room 
was in the lodge. Just beautiful, 
is the only way to explain the 
accomodations!

The ride was Feb. 25 - 28. 
After almost no snow last year 
in the beginning of February, 
we were very pleased with the 
shape the newly groomed trails 
were in,” said Linda.

The party times were really 
swinging as Lakewood Resort 
has their own band and 
they were good. R. L. Ryerson 
Corp, was again the sponsor of 
the event. Linda is ready to go 
again next year!!

Milton, Linda’s husband, 
could not attend this year as he 
has a new job. Linda hopes he 
will be along next year.

The group total in pledges 
was $161,000.00. Not bad for 
one weekend of fun!

Linda did not finish the ride 
this year due to MS complica­
tions. She is currently 
undergoing treatment at 
Froedert Hospital in Milwau­
kee. “This does not matter,” 
said Linda. "I’m glad I went 
and maybe with the money 
raised it will help find a cure 
before the next 500.”

Milton and Linda are 
members of the Boltonville 
•Bunch Snowmobile Club.

THANK YOU
I wish to thank my family, 

relatives and friends for their 
phone calls, cards and visits 
while I was in the hospital and 
recuperating at home. Your acts 
of kindness were greatly 
appreciated.

Sylvester Schmidt

FARAGHER

DUNDEE 
SAND & GRAVEL
G. RAMTHUN 533-4549

* Washed Sand
* Crushed Gravel 
* Stone and Lime Chips

Also Gravel and Sand Fill 
For the Best of 

Concrete Materials

The "yellow” group of which Linda Howe took part.

Ask me about Medicare 
Supplement Insurance.
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BECAUSE MEDICARE 
DOESN T COVER EVERYTHING!

"Paid for by friends of 
Patrick J. Faragher, W. Dirk 

Hausmann, Treasurer."

RANDALL Mi
J- gust MM

J 040 Fond du Lac
Ave Kewaskum
Office 6264050

626-4154

AMERICAN FAMILY
AUTO HOME BUSINESS HEALTH LIFE
American Family Mutual Insurance Co

MS-5 Madison, Wis
This product is not connected w<h or endorsed by 
the US Government or the Federal Medicare Pram

WEST BEND MONUMENT CO. 
“Serving Wisconsin Since 1903“

25 E. Washington St. (Hwy. 33), West Bend, WI 53095

RUGENDORF 
\ MEMORIALS/

PHONE 334-3871

WINTER SAVINGS 
Now In Effect

Monuments and Markers to Meet 
All Cemetery Specifications 
GARY KOENINGS & WALLY MILLER
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For Heart Association

Wright Veterinary Service to Participate 
In UW Senior Rotation in Ambulatory Service

Fitness Firm exercisers 
raised over $1,000.00 in a 
“Dance For Heart” event the 
week of February 15th. Pro­
ceeds will help support the 
American Heart Association of 
Wisconsin’s research, 
community programs and 
public and professional educa­
tion. Dance for Heart isx a 
nationwide event that promotes 
the health benefits of aerobic

St. Patrick’s Day Parade, 
At Fond du Lac March 17

KFIZ Radio’s Annual St. 
Patrick’s Day parade is 
scheduled for Thursday, March 
17th at 6:30 p.m. on Main Street 
in Fond du Lac. Again this year 
the parade will be preceded by 
the running of the ‘ * Main Street 
Mile.” Groups, organizations 
....everyone is invited to enter 
the parade. Interested parties 
can get more information by 
calling Diane at KFIZ Radio at 
921-3770 Monday through 
Friday from 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. All 
types of entries are welcome, 
from bands and baton twirlers 
to floats and decorated cars.

In conjunction with the 
parade, KFIZ picks an “Irish 
Man of the Year.” Anyone 
wishing to nominate someone, 
can do so by writing why they 
think their candidate should be 
“Irish Man of the Year” and 
send it to: KFIZ, P.O. Box 
1450, Fond du Lac, WI 54936- 
1450.

Everyone is Irish on St. 
Patrick’s Day and KFIZ proves 
it!

exercise while raising funds to 
tight heart disease and stroke. 
“The enthusiasm the partici­
pants showed was fantastic,” 
said Jacquie Wiedmeyer, the 
event’s volunteer coordinator.

Since Dance for Heart began 
in Wisconsin in 1982 more than 
$18,000 men and women raised 
over $791,000 in nationwide 
events statewide.

Spring to the Zoo 
For the Great Zoo 
Giveaway Weekends

Spring is a perfect time to 
visit the Milwaukee County 
Zoo. There are virtually no 
crowds and during every 
weekend in March the Zoo will 
be giving away a free gift to 
children 15 and under on the 
Great Zoo Give Away 
Weekends.

To claim a free gift, children 
must bring their admission 
receipt to the Aquarium/Reptile 
Building between 10 a.m. and 4 
p.m. every Saturday and 
Sunday during March.

While you’re visiting the Zoo, 
take a closer look at the baby 
animals and new arrivals, 
including Colobus monkies, 
Japanese macaques, mandrills, 
Vampire bats, meerkats, 
Russell’s vipers and Indonesian 
green frogs.

Remember to keep your Zoo 
receipt, it’s necessary to claim 
your free gift.

For more information, please 
contact the Milwaukee County 
Zoo, 414/771-3040.

Wright Veterinary Service, 
S.C. of Campbellsport is one of 
18 veterinary medical practices 
located within a 100 mile 
radius of Madison selected to 
participate in the University of 
Wisconsin - Madison School of 
Veterinary Medicine’s 1987-88 
Senior Rotation in Ambulatory 
Service. This is the second year 
that Wright Veterinary Service, 
S.C. has been invited to partici­
pate in the program. The Senior 
Rotation in Ambulatory Service 
is a course designed to provide 
training and field experience in 
large animal medicine for fourth 
year veterinary medical 
students. During the two week 
rotation students are exposed to 
a wide variety of large animal 
medical problems and

There's a lot more to Great Lakes Windows than good looks. 
• Energy Efficient • Lifetime Warranty • Choice of Colors

EXCLUSIVE “R'CORE 
INSULATION

procedures. One of the major 
advantages of this program is 
the opportunity for area 
practicing veterinarians to 
participate in the training of 
future veterinarians.

Additionally, Dr. David 
Wright of Wright Veterinary 
Service, S.C. is serving as large 
animal chairman on the Wis­
consin Veterinary Medical 
Association program commit­
tee. This committee is respon­
sible for establishing the 
continuing education program 
for the WVMA annual meeting 
held this year in Green Bay next 
October.

Spend your money wisely. Ad­
vertise in the Statesman.

VENTILATION 
LIMIT LOCKS

V THICK INSULATED GLASS 
l^ermeticollv sealed with an 
extra wide dead air space 
which equals the huhesTR' 
tacfor in the industry 

FLEXIBLE FLOATING 
interlock

TILT IN SASHES.

BALANCE COVER
Concooh botance for better looks 
and seals out dust, dirt and drafts.

HIGH securz* 
CAM LOCKS

SEALED CEMENTED JOINTS 
Eliminates potential draft areas.

HEAVY-DUTY 
WEATHERSTRIPPING 

NOTCHED MAIN FRAME 
Engineered for added strength 
andrfotditv____________

SOLD AND HEBERER BROS. Kewaskum 
INSTALLED BY Roger Norm Bill Free Estimates 

626-2598 626-2491 626-2384

‘ DUAL DUROMETER SASH EXTRUSION

Microwave
Courses at MPTC

A variety of short-term 
Microwave Cooking courses will 
be held this spring at Moraine 
Park Technical College, West 
Bend.

*‘Lo-Cal Microwave 
Cooking” will meet Thursday 
nights for four weeks beginning 
March 17. Emphasis is on low 
calorie foods such as chicken, 
fish and beef suitable for 
microwaving. Nutrients, dietary 
habits and exercise conducive to 
weight loss are reviewed. Class 
dates are March 17 to April 14, 
from 7 to 9:40 p.m.; fee, $14.55, 
course *303-419-004.

Three week courses on 
Tuesday or Thursday mornings 
from 10 to 11:50 are:

“Soups and Salads,’’ 
Tuesdays March 15, 22, 29; 
soups from juices, convenience 
foods, cream soups, and 
vegetable, pasta, and 
accompaniment salads. Course 
*303-440-018.

“Nutritious Snacks and 
Appetizers” Thursdays, March 
17, 24, 31; home-from-school 
snacks, make-ahead appetizers. 
Course 303-440-019.

“One Dish Meals” Tuesdays 
April 12, 19, 26; quick meals 
using basic four groups; course 
*303-440-020. Fee for each: 
$8.90.

All classes include hands-on 
preparation, taste-testing and 
evaluation. Sessions meet at the 
Moraine Park Annex, 1702 E. 
Washington, West Bend. 
Advance registration is 
required; call Moraine Park 
334-0909.

Slow Drains?
TRUCKS - SIGNS - CUSTOM STRIPING 
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport 

533-8094

Tired of Mud?

THINK CONCRETE!
BUTCH’S CONSTRUCTION

Sidewalks - Patios - Driveways - Garages 
Basements - Pole Buildings - Barnyards 

- Concrete Sawing -

GERALD (Butch) WINNINGHOFF
8412 Hilltop Lane, Kewaskum

334-3186

Your local master plumber can show you how to end 
slow drains and save money. Now clean every drain in 
your home for a fraction of the cost to rooter just one 
drain. And it's easy to do it yourself with Bio-Clean. 
Other drain products only work in the trap. Bio-Clean

* cleans the whole pipe. It's so effective it has 
J a money-back warranty. So, call your master

plumber for Bio-Clean today!

RON JOHANN PLUMBING & HEATING
M P. If5794

Kewaskum, WI 53040 PHONE 414-334-9481
Hurryl Bring In this ad today and get 50c oft Hurry! Bring in this ad today and got 50c oft
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Moraine Park Students
Win Awards

Mrs. Helen Chinnock (right), scholarship 
chairperson of the West Bend Business and 
Professional Women’s Club, presented the 
club’s annual scholarship to Christine L. 
Buss (left), of Kewaskum.

Christine L. Buss, left, an 
accounting student, and Lynn 
R. Sheldon, a nursing student, 
received the West Bend 
Business and Professional 
Women’s Club scholarships for 
the 1987-88 school year. Both 
students attend the West Bend 
campus of Moraine Park 
Technical College. Christine is a 
graduate of Kewaskum High 
School and resides in

Scout-O-Rama March Star Cablevision Donates 
26 at Grafton To B’9 Brothers/Big Sisters

Scouts from Ozaukee and 
Washington counties will 
gather Saturday, March 26 from 
10 a m. to 5 p.m. at Manchester 
Mall, Highway 57, Grafton, for 
the Bay Lakes Council District 
H’s Scout-O-Rama.

Scout-O-Rama Chairman, 
Dallas Wixom, announces the 
opening ceremony at 10:30 a.m. 
in the atrium, consisting of the 
flag display^ Indian Dancers 
and guest speakers. At various 
times during the day, there will 
be demonstrations in the 
atrium. There will be some 40 
units and displays including a 
“Raingutter Regatta,’’ 
Pinewood Derby entries, 
handicapped awareness and 
dutch oven cooking.

Boy Scout troops and Cub 
Scout packs will be displaying 
various skills and crafts to show 
what they have learned in 
Scouting and the public is 
invited to participate at the 
various booths.

Refreshments will be 
; ibble throughout the day.

JIM SCHAUB
tor the repair /ob that s 

been put off tor too long
PO Box 17/

Kewaskum, Wl 53040

Kewaskum. Lynn is a graduate 
of Nathan Hale High School in 
West Allis and resides in West 
Bend.

The annual scholarships are 
awarded on the basis of 
financial need, school and 
community activities, work 
experience, scholarship and the 
relevancy of goals to a future 
professional career.

Star Cablevision would like to 
thank its customers for helping 
us help Big Brothers/Big 
Sisters in our community.

For a minimum of $10.00 
donated to Big Brothers/Big 
Sisters, Star Cablevision gave a 
FREE connection to anyone 
wanting to add cable service.

The two week fund raiser 
collected over $400.00 for Big 
Brothers/Big Sisters. “The free 
connection is our gift to our 
customers for helping us help 
them,” said Dean Sinclair, 
System Manager.

i_2*wr DON’S
“?1 ELECTRIC
Bft^WCx, Don Scheid, Owner

•Residential
• Commercial

• Farm Wiring
• Industrial Wiring

NEW CONSTRUCTION OR REMODELING 

Qualitv Work - Reasonable Rates 
PHONE 334-7565

Rhone \ 
PROVENENT,

Cast Named for 
UWWC’s ‘Working’

WEST BEND - Thirteen 
women and eight men from five 
communities have been named 
to the cast of “Working,’’ the 
spring musical of Theatre on the 
Hill at the University of Wis­
consin Center — Washington 
County.

“Working’’ opens on 
Thursday, March 10, with a 
traditional Dean’s Night 
performance and continues for 
two weekends: March 11-13 and 
18-20. Performances are at 7:30 
p.m. in the UWWC Union 
theatre.

Tickets cost $5 and with 
senior citizen and student 
admission available for $3. For 
reservations, call UWWC, 338- 
5208.

Director Brad Ford, assistant 
professor of communication and 
theatre arts at UWWC, said the 
play contains adult situations 
and language. He said the play 
has not been censored, in 
keeping with the intention of 
author Studs Terkel to present 
the actual words of America’s 
workers.

Cast members (and the roles 
they play), as announced by 
Ford, are:

CEDARBURG: Lynn Aspen- 
leiter, 1558 Skyline Drive, 
(operator of recorded 
messages); Denise Zarling, 
1381 Western, (hotel switch­
board operator);

JACKSON: Andrea Kern 
(prostitute);

MENOMONEE FALLS: Lori 
Vetrovec, N76 W13811 Lomas 
Lane, (mill worker);

OCONOMOWOC: Stephanie 
Arndt, 539 Summit Ave., 
(receptionist);

WEST BEND: Joelle Albiero, 
(grocery checker); Kathie 
Bardell, 1608 Creek Drive, 
(secretary); Dave Bertelsen, 722 
Hillcrest, (copy boy); Tracy 
Dengel, 613 Vine St., (grocery 
checker, mill work dance 
soloist); Daryl Detrich, (super­
market worker); Tim Dond- 
linger, (gas man, mason singer, 
lieutenant of fire department); 
Jan Ford, 5400 Bauers Drive, 
(editor, mill work singer); Pat 
Gangnon, 5796 Hacker Drive, 
(executive, mason, truck driver, 
retiree); Jaime Jastrab, 409 N. 
9th Ave., (steel worker, sailor, 
copy boy); Sue Keyes, 11495 
Kindt Court, (teacher, mill 
worker); Mark Kohler, 308 N. 
Main, (boss, migrant worker, 
truck driver, fireman); Michelle 
Lukovich, 527 Scenic Drive, 
secretary); Mary McNamara, 
217 S. 8th Ave., (grocery 
checker, waitress); Craig 
Pintens, 460 Idlewood Ave., 
(newsboy); Danielle Rogne, 
8862 Orchard Valley, 
(housewife, telephone 
operator); and Adam Theisen, 
1311 Bobolink Lane, (boxboy, 
tie salesman).

SAVE $$$ NOW & 
The Whole Heating Season

Complete Cleaning and 
Servicing of Burner

On All Oil Furnaces
or Oil Boilers Gas units *50

Includes:
• Vacuuming of furnace or boilers complete
• Servicing burner ft blower units
• Check all safety controls

*60mF w plus parts

SENIOR CITIZENS 
10% discount

• Replace oil filter B air filters (if needed) and nozzle
• Set & Adjust burner with gauges (not by guess work)
• Efficiency test taken after cleaning (at no additional charge)

R & K HEATING wS
CALL RON VOIGT 2032 Scenic Dr., Kewaskum, 692-2881
17 Years Experience Serving Complete Kettle Moraine & Surrounding Areas

‘E’ Stamps Provide Interim 
Solution for New PostageJlates^

J Domestic
We’ve all been short a few 

stamps at one time or another. 
It is frustrating not to have the 
postage on-hand when you need 
to mail something. Now 
multiply this need several 
billion times — the number of 
stamps sold each month 
nationally — and you’ll begin to 
see the Postal Service’s 
problem when a First-Class rate 
change is announced every 
three or four years.

Postal rate setting is a long, 
complex process, that involves 
10 months of consideration by 
the Postal Rate Commission, 
and a final decision by the 
Postal Service Governors. So 
how does the Postal Service 
make sure that stamps with the 
right amount of postage are 
available when you need them 
for correspondence?

Part of the answer is an 
interim nondenominated stamp 
— one that is good for whatever 
amount is decided. The new 
stamp features the letter “E“ 
and a full-color picture of Earth 
from space. It is plainly marked 
for use as domestic postage and 
will be available in sheets of 100 
stamps, booklets of 20 stamps 
and coils of 100, 500 and 3,000 
stamps, says Norman L. Miller, 
Field Division General 
Manager/Postmaster of the 
Milwaukee Division of the U.S. 
Postal Service.

“Customers use several 
billion stamps nationally each 
month, so this situation could

create a big problem for us if we 
didn’t have a two-month supply 
of ‘E’ stamps ready,’’ Miller 
says. “Postage bearing the new 
First-Class denomination will 
begin arriving at Milwaukee 
Division post offices before the 
supply of ‘E’ stamps is exhaust­
ed.”

In addition, Miller also says, 
post offices have ample supplies 
of low-denomination stamps to 
use with 22-cent stamps by 
customers still holding them 
when the rates change.

The selection of the letter 
“E” was easy, Miller explains, 
since this will be the fifth time 
the Postal Service gone through 
the drill of implementing a new 
First-Class rate that it couldn’t 
predict in advance.

The first time was in 1978, 
when postal customers went 
through 4.9 billion “A” stamps 
before the new 15-cent stamps 
were ready.

The “B” stamps and “C” 
stamps went into service after 
1981 rate changes. About 5.5 
billion “B” stamps and 4.3 
billion “C” stamps were used.

The “D” stamp was used 
following a February 1985 rate 
change. Customers used about 
5.8 billion “D” stamps.

The new “E” stamps have 
been stored in a man-made 
cavern cut out of solid limestone 
near Kansas City, MO. The 
Postal Service leases 170,000 
square feet of the 700-acre cave 
for its Philatelic Sales Division’s 
fulfillment branch.

Garages / Garage Doors / Remodeling / Roofing 
Siding / Storm Doors / Storm Windows 

Decks / Concrete
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March 8, 1963

It was “Joe Eberle Night” at the 
Kewaskum Kiwanis club’s meeting 
Monday night as the club paid 
tribute to Joe for the many years he 
has spent raising some of the finest 
beagle hounds in the country and 
for the favorable publicity he and 
his dogs have brought to 
Kewaskum. Joe, who has served as 
president of the Association of 
Beagle Clubs of Wisconsin since 
1929, has been raising prize beagle 
hounds for 55 years. He has won 
national recognition as one of the 
most outstanding figures in this 
field. Joe has judged many beagles 
in many parts of the country 
throughout the years. His latest and 
probably greatest honor was ob­
tained during the past year when he 
was invited to visit the World’s 
Fair in Seattle, Washington by the 
American Kennel Club to judge 
beagles entered at the fair. But Joe 
turned down the offer. Joe is the 
proud possessor of 62 trophies and 
hundreds of ribbons which many of 
his prize beagles won for him.

One ^of the Kewaskum High 
School students will be crowned 
“Dairy Queen” at the fifth annual 
Dairy Day event to be held on 
March 23 at the high school, spon­
sored by the Kewaskum Business 
Association. The girls, represen­
ting each class, are required to live 
on a farm and are selected by the 
FFA of the school. The dairy 
princesses include Diane Vetter. 
Judy Truebenbach, Carol Reindl, 
Rogene Klug. Judy Hohlweck, 
Kathy Hawig, Dianna Krahn and 
Lucille Kirchner.

and wonderment he saw the two big 
black bear on a hill in a nearby 
field.

Mrs. William Wunder, 71, well 
known resident of New Fane, died 
suddenly March 7, of a heart attack 
brought on by shock and excite­
ment caused by a chimney fire at 
the Wunder home.

Orval E. Behnke of Kewaskum 
has been named a member of the 
Million Corps by Equitable Life 
Assurance Society, it was announc­
ed. He has been awarded a plaque 
in recognition of his “outstanding 
production record during 1962.”

If you’ve been thinking of 
Spring, forget it! This area was 
busy Wednesday morning digging 
themselves out of a March 
snowstorm, which fell most of 
Tuesday and continued through the 
night. An estimated eight to nine 
inches of new snow was dumped on 
the ground before it ended Wednes­
day afternoon.

At a meeting of Scenic Moraine 
conference coaches held at North 
Fond du Lac, an all-conference 
basketball team and second team 
were selected. Al Koepke of 
Kewaskum, his team’s leading 
scorer, was selected to the first 
team and Mike Coulter, also of 
Kewaskum, was selected to the se­
cond team. Honorable mention was 
given to Mark Kral of Kewaskum.

A daughter was born to Mr. and 
Mrs. Bernard Murray, Green Bay, 
on February 28. Murray was 
formerly agriculture instructor at 
Kewaskum High School. 
Daughters were also born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Volm, Route 2, 
Kewaskum, on March 1, and to 
Mr. and Mrs. Edward Sieger, 
Route 2, Kewaskum, on March 2.

Lucille Hansen, Alice Koepsel, 
Kathleen Schaefer; Juniors — 
Dolores Backhaus, Annette Beilke, 
Beulah Westerman; Seniors — 
Harold Bartelt, Audrey Koepke, 
Anita Mertz, Margaret Muenk.

Audrey Bruessel, Bernice Kober, 
Alice Backhaus, Gladys 
Holzmann, Gladys Weddig, Earl 
Manthei, John Tessar, Robert 
Faber, Lizzie Lubitz, Barbara 
Schaefer, Loran Backhaus, Lloyd 
Keller, and LaMar Seifert have a 
perfect attendance record for the 
past six weeks in the Primary 
Room of the Grade School.

A beloved woman resident of this 
village, the venerable Mrs. Frances 
Witzig, 82, nee Luis, was called to 
her heavenly reward at ther home 
on March 4. following an illness of 
four weeks with a complication of 
diseases caused by old age.

A daughter was born to Mr. and 
Mrs. Ervin Coulter of near St. 
Kilian at a Milwaukee hospital on 
March 5. A daugher was also born 
to Mr. and Mrs. Wilmer Struebing 
of Route 3, Kewaskum, in St. 
Joseph’s Hospital, West Bend, on 
March 7. A son was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Clarence Weinert of 
Route 2, Kewaskum, on March 7.

75 Years Ago
March 8, 1913

At about 3:30 a.m. Tuesday 
morning, Boltonville village people 
were awakened by the ringing of 
the church bell, to find the school 
house in flames. An attempt was 
made to enter the building, but was 
abandoned on account of the dense

smoke. Nothing was saved and had 
it not been such a quiet night 
nothing would have saved the near­
by buildings. It was thought at one 
time that Mr. Stautz's residence 
would catch fire and all furniture 
was removed, but it was saved by 
the heroic efforts of the townpeo­
ple. J. Kraetsch was the first to see 
the fire and awaken the neighbors. 
It started in the southeast corner of 
the lower department and the origin 
is unknown.

The lion like actions of March, 
which were in evidence Saturday 
and which, according to all rules 
and traditions, means that March 
will depart in a meek manner, were 
further intensified in savagery Sun­
day when the temperature flopped 
to 14 degrees below zero and a real 
blizzard swept over the state. The 
blizzard made its appearance on 
Saturday and raged throughout the 
night.-As a result snow was piled

@ HERRIGES OIL, INC.
1245 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum 

626-2244
• Fuel Oil and Gas Deliveries

• 24 Hour Burner Service
• On-the-Farm Tire Service

• Dayton and Armstrong Tires
• Full Service Garage

• Automatic Car Wash
• LP Gas

into deep drifts. A “cut” on the 
main line of North Western 
railroad one mile from Camp­
bellsport became choked with snow 
Sunday morning and as a result 
traffic between here and Fond du 
Lac was tied up for over five hours.

William Emmer, St. Kilian, last 
week Friday, sold his 70 acre farm 
to Frank Day of West Bend for 
$8,500. On the following day, 
Saturday, Mr. Day sold 50 acres of 
the farm to Phil. Faber for $7,500, 
and the remaining 20 acres to Fred 
Hundertmark for $1,600.

RBC CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The winners at skat played by 

the ABC Senior Citizens at 
Beechwood Hall on Tuesday, 
March 1 were: Ralph Laux, 20- 
2—18 net; Francis Gilboy 
21-4—17 net; Elmer Stange 
15-1 — 14 net; Marvin Martin 
13-2-11 net.

For a number of years now, deer 
have been moving into the southern 
part of the state and now bear seem 
to be following suit. Loran 
Backhaus Sr. of Route 2, Ke­
waskum, reported seeing two black 
bear near h^ewaskum last Sunday 
morning. Loran was picking up 
milk at the Albert Stange farm 
about I Vz miles east of the village 
on Hwy. 28, when to his surprise

50 Years Ago
March 11, 1938

The honor roll was announced at 
Kewaskum High School as follows: 
Freshmen — Mildred Backhaus, 
Eva Buss, Jeanne Strupp; 
Sophomores — Violet Eberle,

On all remaining ’87 new units in stock

Up to $1000
With Purchase of Rustproofing 

Package B at Regular Price

V®

1 Nova 4 Dr.
1 Spectrum 4 Dr.
•% Ton Van

1 Cavalier Station Wagon
1 Celebrity 2 Dr.
1 S-10 Pickup 4x4 Extended Cab

Below Factory Invoice 
On All Remaining ’87 
New Units in Stock

HONECK CHEVROLET
Hwy. 45, Kewaskum Phone 626-2161

Open Weekdays until 8 p.m.; Saturdays until 5 p.m.

SCHWARTZBURG SELLS
i^■■■ ^! (^ ^^-^ 
^■OKsrxEL* ' . “. ' ^^ErSEnzSEESSEF" 

CHEVY TRUCKS '/1

SCHWARTZBURG
HWY. 33 WEST, WEST BEND, Wl

HOURS: Mon., Wed., Fri. ’til 9:00; Saturday ’til 4:00
Phone: 334-3858 Milwaukee: 933-4416
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Board Meetings

Special Public Hearing 
February 29. 1988 
7:00 P M.

The Village Board of Kewaskum, 
Washington County. Wisconsin met for a 
Special Public Hearing in conjunction with 
Southeastern Wisconsin Regional Planning 
Commission in the Council Room of the 
Municipal Building. 204 First Street

In the absence of President Paul Blumer, 
Administrator Daniel S. Schmidt called the 
meeting to order President Paul Blumer ask 
cd to be excused and was absent All other 
Trustee Members were present A quorum 
was present

On a motion by Trustee Charles Boegel, 
seconded by Trustee Mary Krueger and 
unanimously carried by voice vole the Board 
appointed Senior Trustee Howard Laubens 
tein as President Pro-Tem

The meeting was opened with a Moment 
ot Silence and Pledge ot Allegiance.

President Pro Fem Howard laubenstein 
reviewed with all present the purpose of the 
hearing and that is to receive public comment 
on. and reaction to a proposed year 2000 
sanitary sewer service area for the Village 
ol Kewaskum and the environmentally 
significant lands encompassed within this 
area.

An introduction of public officials present 
included Mr. Bruce Rueben and Mr. Joel 
Dietl were present from SEWRPC. Mr. 
Richard Zarling. the Village’s Zoning Ad- 
nnnistrator. Mr Fed Meilahn. a local land 
surveyor. Mr George B. Allmann, Town of 
Kewaskum Chairman. Mr. Peter Albers, the 
Village's Water Pollution Control Depart 
ment Superintendent. Mr August Bilgo. the 
Village's Department ot Public Works 
Superintendent and three area residents were 
also present

Mr Bruce Rueben, the Chief Planner tor 
SEWRPC, then briefed those in attendance 
on the proposed sanitary sewer service area 
lor the Village of Kewaskum. Mr. Rueben 
then answered questions from the floor.

Mr. Meilahn asked how long the sewer 
service area would be in effect? (answer) In 
definitely, but it may be amended as needed 
and also should be reviewed on the average 
of every five years.

Mr Allmann indicated he had no objec­
tions as to the area on the Town's behalf, 
but said he left SEWRPCs protections as to 
population expectations lor the year 2000 
'•/ere high

Mr Zarling asked how much use ot

OFFICIAL NOTICE
AGENDA

There will be a Regular Meeting of the Kewaskum School District Board 
of Education on Monday, March 14, 1988. Said meeting to commence at 7:00 p.m. 
in the commons area at Kewaskum High School.

Anticipated agenda items will include the following:

I. Call to order-President Horner
II. Roll call

III. Pledge of allegiancc-Clerk Schmitt
IV. Approval of agenda; deletions or corrections
V. Student government representation; reports or questions, etc.

VI. Audience to visitors; receiving of delegations

VII. ACTION ITEMS
A. Approval of minutes of past meeting(s)
B. Old Business

1. Lawsuit: Trapp V. District Administrator-Legal fees-Mr. Ankerson
C. New Business

I. Approval of accounts payable and payroll
2. Proclamation: March 13-19 as Middle Level Education Week-Mr. Beimborn
3. Voc/tech education programming-L.V.E.C. Wangerln
4. Computers and library budget requests
5. Request to increase social worker position by 50%
6. Authorization to issue teaching contracts for 1988-89 school year

D. ADMINISTRATIVE RECOMMENDATIONS, REPORTS AND CORRESPONDENCE

1. Budget review: PrincipaIs/buiId 1 ng level
2. Approval for summer JTPA program
3. Appointment of KHS head baseball coaching position-Tom Bartelt
4. Appointment for KMS iniramurals-Rob Charlier-Ang1im
5. Appointment of KHS head football coaching position-Clark Pearson
6. Acceptance of resignation-KMS girls basketball assistant coaching 

position-Dennis Reha
7. Request to attend legal workshop
8. Replacement of water softener at WES-Mr. Boehlke

E. Adjourn to c 1 osed/executive session
1. As per State Statute 118.22(3)-Pr1vate conferences concerning 

possible teacher non-renewais; and
2. As per State Statute 19.85(l)(c) “Considering employment, promotion, 

• compensation or performance evaluation of any public employee over
which the governmental body has jurisdiction or exercises responsibility."
a) KEA, KAP, non-union negotiations

F. Reconvene to Open Session
1. If needed to conclude or announce business conducted in closed session

G. Adjournment

topographical maps was used to establish the 
area * (answer) Those maps are used a lot 
especially for the significant environmental 
corridors.

The Village asked about an approximate 
20 acre parcel bordered by CTH S and E. 
Moraine Drive as to why it wasn't includ­
ed (answer) It was overlooked more than 
likely and can be included as so noted by the 
Village Board in their Resolution

In closing Mr Rueben indicated this plan 
is a requirement of the DNR and is only a 
basic guide for future development

On a motion by Trustee Richard Schmidt, 
seconded by Trustee Kenneth Bonlender to 
close the public hearing. Roll call vote was 
carried by the majority. Roll call vote was 
6 ‘‘Aye,” 0 “Nay,” 1 “Absent.”

Daniel S. Schmidt
Administrator/Clerk

March Monthly Meeting 
February 29, 1988 
8:00 p.m.

The Village Board of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wisconsin met in Mon 
thly Session in the Council Room of the 
Municipal Building, 204 First Street.

In the absence of President Paul Blumer, 
Administrator Daniel S. Schmidt called the 
meeting to order. President Paul Blumer ask­
ed to be excused and was absent AHother 
Trustee Members were present. A quorum 
was present.

On the motion by Trustee Richard 
Schmidt, seconded by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton and unanimously carried by 
voice vote, the Board appointed Senior 
Trustee Howard Laubenstein as President 
Pro Tern.

The meeting was opened with a Moment 
of Silence and Pledge of Allegiance.

On a motion by Trustee Mary Krueger, 
seconded by Trustee Kenneth Bonlender and 
unanimously carried by voice vote, the 
minutes of the February 11 & 15. 1988, 
meetings were approved as printed.

Review and discussion was held on the 
l<>int public hearing which was held prior to 
the Board meeting. Action was taken on 
Resolution No. 88-3 as attached hereto:

Administrator Daniel S. Schmidt review­
ed the tax collection for 1987 and reported 
all went well and collection should be as g»x>d 
or better than last year. Also a few other cor- 
rcspondence was reviewed.

Trustee Thomas McElhatton informed the 
Board that a brief Park & Recreation Com­
mittee Meeting was being scheduled for 
March 14. 1988, at 7:30 p.m.

Trustee Kenneth Bonlender informed the

Board of the Library Board’s recommenda­
tion as to a Part-time High Sch<x)l Student 
Library Aide.

On a motion by Trustee Mary Krueger, 
seconded by Trustee Thomas McElhatton 
and unanimously carried by voice vote, the 
Board authorized the hiring of Deborah 
Dossinger as a Part-time High School Stu­
dent Library Aide at $3.35 per hour.

Trustee Mary Krueger reviewed the Coun­
ty Incineration Committee status and inform­
ed the Board of a meeting scheduled for 
March 3. 1988, at 6:30 p.m. in the West 
Bend Recreation Building.

Discussion was held on the possibility of 
installing the ball diamond lighting as bid 
February 11, 1988 Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton was uncertain as to the number 
of teams that will be using the diamond this 
year and as to any type of agreement that may 
be worked out with the Softball Association. 
He did feel the Village should proceed with 
the installation of the lights at this time.

Trustee Richard Schmidt indicated he felt 
the Village should be assured of some usage 
before spending that kind of money. Also that 
our agreement be in place with the Associa­
tion prior to the expenditure

Trustee Kenneth Bonlender indicated he 
felt the lights are needed now as basically 
did Trustee Charles Boegel.

Trustee Mary Krueger indicated seeing the 
bid price was reasonable and money was 
available she could not see holding up the 
project.

On a motion by Trustee Charles Boegel, 
seconded by Trustee Mary Krueger and car­
ried by the majority voice vote. Trustee 
Richard Schmidt voting against, the Board 
authorized the installation of ball diamond 
lighting as recommended by the Village 
Engineers at the low bid of $27,300.00. The 
Administrator and Village President were 
authorized to sign said contract with the low 
bidder. Statz Electric. Milwaukee. WI

Discussion was held on the possibility of 
rehabilitation work regarding the mercury 
vapor street/security lights in four areas of 
the Village. This would be done as an energy 
savings matter. The Administrator was 
directed to check into the matter as to cost 
and etc. for the March 14, 1988. meeting.

Action was taken on Ordinance No. 88-1 
as attached hereto:

On a motion by Trustee Charles Boegel, 
seconded by Trustee Thomas McElhatton to 
adjourn to closed session under Chapter 
19 85 (I )(e) to deliberate and negotiate the 
purchase and disposition of public lands 
(referring to Kewaskum Industrial Park). 
Roll call vote was 6 "Aye.” 0 “Nay.” I 
"Absent." The motion was carried by the 
majority.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

ORDINANCE NO. 88-1
AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING 

UNDER CHAPTER 14.09
RESTRICTIONS AS TO THE PICKING UP OF 

TIRES FOR DISPOSAL IN THE
VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM, WISCONSIN
THE VILLAGE BOARD OF THE VILLAGE 

OF KEWASKUM DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:
Section 1: Section 14.09 (5)(c) of the 

Village of Kewaskum Municipal Code of Or­
dinances is ’ereby created as follows:

14.09 (5)(c> Restriction of Tire Collection 
No busatessman, resident or non- 
re.ut.ent s place for disposal 
any tire(s). The Village Depart­
ment of Public Works is hereby 
instructed to leave all tires plac­
ed for collection lay.

Section 2: Al) ordinances or parts of or­
dinances contravening the provisions of this 
ordinance are hereby repealed.

Section 3: This ordinance shall take effect 
the day after passage and publication as pro­
vided by law.

PASSED. ADOPTED AND APPROVED 
this 29th day of February, 1988, by the 
Kewaskum Village Board

Howard H. Laubenstein 
Village President Pro-Tem

ATTEST:
Daniel S. Schmidt
Administrator/Clerk

Introduced by Trustee Mary Krueger 
Motion for adoption by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton
Motion for adoption seconded by Trustee 
Kenneth Bonlender
Roll call vote was 6 "Aye,” 0 "Nay.” I 
"Absent.”

RESOLUTION NO. 88-3
ADOPTION OF A SEWER SERVICE AREA 

FOR THE VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM
WHEREAS, the Southeastern Wisconsin 

Regional Planning Commission, working in 
cooperation with the Village of Kewaskum 
has prepared a plan for a year 2000 sanitary 
sewer service area for the Village, including 
recommendations for the protection of en­
vironmentally sensitive lands within, and 
tributary to, the sewer service area; and

WHEREAS, the aforereferenced recom­
mendations are set forth in SEWRPC Com­
munity Assistance Planning Report No. 161. 
Sanitary Sewer Service Area for the Village 
of Kewaskum, Washington County, Wiscon­
sin; and

WHEREAS, the Village Board in a joint 
review with SEWRPC after public hearing 
amend Map 5 to reflect the inclusion of the 
NW approximate 20 acres of Section 3 of 
the Town of Kewaskum to reflect the use of 
CTH S to the west and East Moraine Drive 
to the North; and

WHEREAS, the Village Board concurs 
with the delineated sewer service area, the 
delineations of environmentally sensitive 
lands, and the recommendations set forth in 
SEWRPC Community Assistance Planning 
Report No 161

NOW. THEREFORE. BE IT RESOLV­
ED THAT the Village Board of the Village 
of Kewaskum on the 29th day of February. 
1988. hereby adopts SEW RPC Community 
Assistance Planning Report No. 161 as a 
guide for the provision of sanitary sewer ser­
vice and land use management and zoning 
within the planned sewer service area; and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT the 
Village Administrator transmit a certified

copy of this Resolution to the Southeastern 
Wisconsin Regional Planning Commission.

Howard H. Laubenstein 
Village President Pro-Tem

ATTEST:
Daniel S. Schmidt
Village Administrator/Clerk

Introduced by Trustee Richard Schmidt 
Motion for adoption by Trustee Thomas 
McElhatton
Motion for adoption seconded by Trustee 
Charles Boegel
Roll call vote was 6 "Aye.' 0 "Nay, I 
"Absent.”

Village Board 
Meeting Monday

Public notice is hereby given 
that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wiscon­
sin, Village Board is scheduled 
for Monday evening, March 14, 
1988, at 8:00 p.m. in the Council 
Room, of the Municipal Build­
ing, 204 First Street.

The agendas for meeting are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the 
clerk at the Municipal Build­
ing on Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and 
lobby of the Valley Bank.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

Call the Statesman for all your 
advertising needs.

KEWASKUM SCHOOL DISTRICT

CBT MEETING
March 14, 1988, 2:00 - 4:00 p.m. 

KMS LIBRARY
AGENDA

1. Math and Reading/Language Arts field test results reports
2. Update on Math and Reading/Language Arts committee
3. Review proposed testing schedule, goals, and philosophy
4. Report on possibility of writing samples (George)
5. Passing Standards Workshop Report (Mary Ann)
6. Passing standards for the shelf tests (Mary Ann)
7. Possible policies to be discussed:

a. Use of test results for graduation
b. Use of test results for retention purposes 
c. EEN policy (Diana Glick) 
d. Transfer students policy

8. Future projections
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Dear Editor,

This is the third annual 
Jazzercise benefit for the 
MACC Fund. In past years, we 
raised over $10,000 for child­
hood cancer. Our students come 
from all over the metro area. 
We have classes in Shore wood, 
Mequon, Menomonee Falls, 
Waukesha, Brookfield, 
Greendale, West Allis, Wauwa­
tosa, Racine, Kenosha, and 
Washington, Walworth and 
Dodge Counties.

We usually have several 
hundred people attend. It is a 
great photo event because all 
the instructors dress in various 
costumes to teach the 90-minute 
exercise session and everyone 
has a great time. Radio 
personality Danny Clayton from 
WKTI hosts the event and we 
try hard to get him in the act — 
doing the routines.

The benefit is a wonderful 
way to do something good for 
yourself and to help a good 
cause. The admission fees, 
raffle tickets, and T-shirt sales 
all benefit the MACC Fund. The 
Jazzercise program, started by 
Judi Sheppard Missett, is based 
on sound physiological prin­
ciples of low-impact aerobics.

Thank you for your considera­
tion.

Susan Cattery, 242-4075, 
Mequon Jazzercise

Instructor

Corn Marketing Order 
Referendum Scheduled

State corn growers will vote in 
a March 1-15 referendum, on pro­
posed amendments to raise more 
revenue under the corn marketing 
order, says Secretary Howard C. 
Richards, Department of 
Agriculture, Trade and Consumer 
Protection (DATCP).

The grower-elected Wisconsin 
Corn Promotion Board, Inc. 
(WCPB) that administers the pre­
sent marketing order requested the 
changes.

WCPB proposed the amend­
ments to raise annual revenue from 
$80,000 to $350,000 to support in­
ternational and domestic market 
development programs, and 
allocate more money for corn 
research. If approved, the assess­
ment rate on corn will increase 
from one-tenth cent to one-half cent 
per bushel, and allow the Com­
modity Credit Corporation (CCC) 
to collect assessments on corn 
pledged as security for government 
loans.

Under the proposed amend­
ments, producers would still be 
able to obtain refunds of 
assessments paid, and corn used for 
feed purposes would continue to be 
exempt from assessment.

Assessment revenues have been 
averaging $80,000 annually, since 
the marketing order was instituted 
in 1983, much less than the

$200,(XX) originally anticipated.
Richards decision to scheduled 

the referendum is based on 
testimony received from growers at 
DATCP hearings held around the 
state in December.

DATCP mailed ballots to in­
dividual corn growers before 
March 1. Any producer who either 
sold corn, placed corn under CCC 
loan, or forfeited corn to the CCC 
in 1987 or 1988, will be eligible to 
vote in the referendum. Ballots 
must be returned to DATCP before 
March 15 to be counted.

The amendments will be adopted 
if approved by more than 50 per­
cent of the growers voting in the 
referendum. If growers do not ap­
prove of the amendments, the cur­
rent marketing order will remain in 
effect.

To get copies of the proposed 
amendments or the hearing deci­
sion, contact Will Hughes, DATCP 
economics and market develop­
ment chief, P.O. Box 8911, 
Madison, Wisconsin 53708.

Pesticide Training Is 
Scheduled for County

As part of the overall effort 
to have more Wisconsin farmers 
certified to apply agrichemicals, 
pesticide certification training 
will be held in Washington 
County on March 15.

“Extension offices have been 
providing certification training 
all winter,” says Jo Ann Vogel, 
president of Wisconsin Women 
for Agriculture. “But we think 
one final push before spring 
planting can really draw 
attention to the need for 
certification.”

Farm women’s groups 
throughout the Midwest have 
made a concerted effort to 
increase awareness among 
farmers of the benefits offered 
by certification. “This is our 
major educational program this 
spring,” says Janis Fuerst, 
president of Wisconsin Women 
Involved in Farm Economics 
(WIFE). “The number of 
farmers certified to apply 
agrichemicals has risen sharply 
in the last two years, but many 
thousands of Wisconsin farmers 
still are not certified. Certifica­
tion makes sense from both an 
economic and a safety stand­
point. It’s not difficult and it 
provides farmers with valuable 
informaiton and updates on the 
use and handling of agricultural 
chemicals.”

In Washington County, 
certification training and testing

■Auto Service —

ROGER & DAN’S 
AUTO SERVICE

“Your Complete Auto, Tire & Towing 
Service Station in This Area”

Hwy. 45 South, Kewaskum goOD^YEAR 

626-2888
24 HOUR TOWING SERVICE 4^^O

will be held March 15 at 8:30 
a.m. in the Courthouse. 
Farmers should contact the 
county Extension office at 338- 
4477 for more information.

YOUR TAXES
Elderly, Blind Taxpayers 
Need to Pay Special Attention 
To Tax Standard Deductions

Elderly and blind taxpayers 
seem to be making a common 
error on their 1987 tax returns - 
and it could cost them money.
Internal Revenue 
centers around the

Service
United

States are reporting that a 
higher than usual percentage of 
blind or elderly taxpayers are 
neglecting to claim the full 
amount of their standard 
deduction. As a result, they are 
reporting a tax liability that is 
too high, according to Milwau-
kee District Director L.
Phillips.

On 1987 Federal income 
returns, taxpayers who

M.

tax 
are

blind or who are age 65 or older 
are entitled to claim a larger 
standard deduction than other 
taxpayers. In the past, these 
taxpayers were able to claim 
extra exemptions on the front of 
their tax returns. But, due to 
changes made by the Tax 
Reform Act of 1986, those extra 
exemptions are no longer 
allowed. Instead, these tax­
payers now receive the larger 
standard deduction which is 
claimed on line 33b of form 
1040, line 14d of 1040A, or line 
4 of form 1040EZ.

The IRS has alerted its 
taxpayer assistors to these 
errors and IRS cautions all 
taxpayers to read their tax form 
instructions carefully - to avoid 
paying either too much or too 
little tax.

Taxpayers with questions can 
call the IRS toll-free at 1-800- 
424-1040. In the Milwaukee 
area, the local phone number 
for tax assistance is (414) 271- 
3780.

TOWN OF WAYNE
Town Board Meeting

The monthly Town of Wayne 
board meeting will be held at 
8:00 p.m., Wednesday, March 
16, 1988, at the Town Hall, 6030 
Hwy. H. Items on the agenda 
include:

Outstanding bills to be paid 
and other matters to be brought 
before the board.

A complete agenda can be 
picked up at the clerk’s office.

Local Youth Featured In 
State 4-H Photo Exhibit

The work of three Washing­
ton County 4-H Youth has been 
selected as part of the State 4-H 
Photo Display. The winning 
entries were “Sunset” by Lisa 
Bloom of the Kewaskum 4-H 
Club; “Light Bulb” by Robby 
Beisenstein of Hartford Hands 
of Friendship 4-H Club and 
“Barrel of Laughs” by Becky 
Schwoch of the Badger Boosters 
4-H Club.

Over 250 photos from 49 
counties were entered in this 
years’ State Contest. The 80 
photos that were finally selected 
will be mounted as part of a 
permanent exhibit which will be 
unveiled June 6, 1988 at the 
State 4-H Congress in Madison. 
From there, the 1988 State 4-H 
Photography Exhibit will travel 
to the Wisconsin State Fair in 
West Allis, August 4-14 and 
then to county fairs and other 
4-H events and educational 
programs around the state.

For more information about 
the 1988 4-H Photography 
Exhibit or the 4-H Photography 
project, contact the Washington 
County UW-Extension Office.

SHEEPSHEAD WINNERS
5 handed winner’s on 

Thursday, March 3, were: John 
Propson 66-4—62, 24-2 — 22; 
Frank Krueger 54-7—47, 21- 
5—16; Vivian Bartelt 51-7 — 44, 
17-4-13; Ella Smith 46-7-39, 
10-4 — 6; Alice Giese 41-9 — 32, 
16-5-11.

The next 5 handed will be 
Thursday, March 17th and 
Wednesday, March 23, at 8:00 
p.m. Schmitt’s Never Inn.

catch a
deal on 

new

1988

STARCRAFT VANS
The Cadillac of 

Conversion Vans
STARTING AT

*15,995

Ziegler Co. Honored 
By West Bend Mutual

West Bend Mutual Insurance 
Company recently honored the 
Insurance Department of B.C. 
Ziegler and Company for 
outstanding performance in the 
company’s agency incentive 
program, Partners In 
Excellence.

Partners in Excellence is a 
program which measures eight 
areas of agency performance 
including profit, premium 
volume, underwriting and 
agency management. B.C. 
Ziegler and Company also 
earned membership to the 
President’s Round Table, a 
distinction accorded the ten 
highest-scqring agencies.

Five hundred and twenty 
independent agencies partici­
pated in the program. The 
agencies are located throughout 
Wisconsin, Illinois, Iowa, and 
Minnesota.

CAMPBELLSPORT 
ARROW MASTERS 

Amerahn 
week 8

Amerahn II 17-15, Stoffel 
Spec. Ent. 13-19, Dielectric 
21-11, Ferber’s Archery 15-17, 
Al’s Taxidermy 13-19, Elk Mtn. 
Archery 30-2, Hall Farms 19-13, 
King Pin Lanes 8-24, Amerahn I 
23-9, Ben Franklin Video 8-24, 
Armstrong Repair 14-18, 
Beginnings 11-21.

High Shooter |300| — Floyd 
Rettler 300, Tom Dickmann 295, 
Matt Kissinger 296, Bob 
Kopping 295, Al Werkmirster 
300.

Cadet High Shooter (150) — 
Garett Mielke 103.

From Minor Mishaps To 
Major Collision Damage 
AUTO CRAFT 

Wants To Serve You Better.
Don’t allow minor rust to become a major problem.

GenUna GM Port*

338-0379
We want to be your 

Auto Body Repair Shop

3458 Trap Shoot Lane 
Directly behind Mill Tool 

on U.S. 45 North of W»*t Bend

GM QUALITY 
SBMCf NUTTS PONTIAC 

CADILLAC

"V <2/ * r 338-2235 Metro: 931 -7387
SSX'UvMnAiACfa..................»jwy. p soyth. We?t Bend
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ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE
RATE: $1.50 up to 20 words; over 20 words * add 5c per word

75c billing charge for classified ads not paid in advance

FOR SALE — 1 - 20’ Schoessow 
trailer-type feeder; 1 - 6x18’ 
green-feeder rack. Ph. 626- 
2772, after 5:00 p.m. 3-ll-2p

HELP WANTED — Ex­
perienced waitress. 
McDonald’s Tavern, 215 Main 
St., Kewaskum. 626-2055.3-4-Jt

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Uniroyal. 626- 

‘2888.

APPLIANCE REPAIR — Free 
service call “no trip charge, 
free estimates, refrigerator, 
washer, dryer, etc. One day 
service, save this ad. 
Guaranteed. 334-5361. 10-9-tf

HAVE BUYERS — For country 
or village homes within 3 miles 
of Kewaskum. If you are think­
ing of selling call Ann Enright, 
RE/MAX Realtors 334-7411 or 
692-2607 collect.9-19-tf

WANTED TO BUY $
IMMEDIATE CASH PAID £

for one item or an entire estate. 3 
Wanted - old wood furniture, £ 
ice boxes, trunks, rockers, cup- ~ 
boards, desks, wicker, beds, 
etc. Also quilts, some floor and 5 
table lamps, old Christmas ? 
ornaments, fishing baits, 
decoys, crocks and jugs, picture cl 
frames, postcards, dishes, etc. ■< 
Call Jim and Joan Walter, ^ 
533-8731. 7-22-tf *-----------------------------------  3 

3

FOR SALE — 40 acres, 30 
under cultivation, 7 acres 
woods, 8 acres gravel pit, 
homesites, plus pond-site, a 
hunter’s dream. Call 626-2063. 
______________________ 3-11-lp

HUGE RUMMAGE AND 
COLLECTIBLE SALE 
Bedroom, living room, dining 
room and kitchen sets, chairs of 
all types, desks, dressers, 
chests of drawers, rocker­
recliners, stereos, T.V.s, 
stoves, refrigerators, freezers, 
antiques, loads of glassware, 
too many items to list. We’ve 
got it all at prices you can’t 
afford to miss. Four miles east 
of Lomira on Hwy. 67, four 
miles west of Campbellsport on 
Hwy 67. 1948 Hwy. 67W.
___________________ 3-11-lp-tf

FOR SALE — 1981 Pontiac 
LeMans station wagon. 
Excellent condition, V6, air 
conditioning, cruise, 72,000 
miles. Must see. 692-2675 
evenings. 3-ll-2t

BABYSITTER WANTED — 
Busy mom needs babysitter for1 
2 yr. old girl and 4 month boy on 
Wednesdays, 12:30 - 2:30. 
Other occasional times if 
possible. Call today, 626-4669.

4-3-2p

DFZVIfcY of west bend
ENRIGHT

An Independent Member Broker GLORIA SERWE

HELP WANTED — Farm help, 
full-time, house available. Call 
(414) 898-5523.3-ll-2t

HANDYMAN — Part-time. 
Small jobs preferred. 626-4392 
after 5:00 p.m. 3-11-tf

4^ 2364 W. Washington St.
r^Xi! West Bend

338-5656 355-4600
NEW LISTING 

ATTENTION 
TRUCK DRIVERS

DUPLEX RANCH

CHRIS KUECHLER 
JOEL BARTLEY 
WENDY COULTER 
DAN COULTER 
DENNIS SCHERWINSKI 
MARY K. STEPANIUK 
FRANK SHERIDAN 
SCOTT KUECHLER

692-2607 
626-2880 
334-4488 
677-4001 
338-3296 
338-3296 
677-4088 
533-8648 
921-1342 
644-6754

FOR SALE — Country home. 
Lannon stone two-bedroom* 
home on spacious one acre with 
60 4- mature evergreens and 
maples. Large family room with 
cathedral ceiling. Oil and wood 
heat. 6096 Hwy. 28 west. 626- 
4415.3-4-2t

FOR RENT — Upper, two 
bedroom with stove and 
refrigerator, no pets, no child­
ren. Available April 1st. Call 
626-4530 or 533-4605. 3-4-2p

SNOWMOBILE STORAGE-$5 
per month. Call 533-4754.

3-ll-4t

WANT TO RENT — Apartment 
or efficiency apartment for 
elderly couple June 15th to 
Sept. 15th. 3-ll-2t

HALF MILE FAIR — Antique 
Mall & Flea Market. Open daily 
10-4. Spaces available month, 
week or weekend. Ph. 338-6282. 
7003 Hwy. 144N, West Bend.

3-ll-4t

Earn the money you want with 
AVON. Call AVON for a no 
obligation interview and a free 
gift. To sell or buy call 414-699- 
4722. 3-ll-4t

FOR SALE — Potatoes, red or 
white. Bartoli's 533-4092.

11-20-tf

HELP WANTED — Welders, 
drill press, lathe operators. 
Days only; full, part-time or 
retired .Call 338-0681. 3-11 -2t

HELP WANTED — Waitress 
needed, experience preferred, 
but not necessary. Call 533- 
4135,3-ll-2t

HELP WANTED — Part time 
clerk/salesperson evenings and 
week-ends. Apply at Kennelly 
Pharmacy, 927 Fond du Lac 
Ave., Kewaskum, WI. 3-11-lt

HELP WANTED — Someone to 
mow my lawn, on the south side 
of Kewaskum. 334-2294. 3-ll-3t

WANTED — Swim Instructors 
(WSI) Lifeguards, (Copies of 
certificates for Advanced Life 
Saving , WSI, CPR and First 
Aid are to accompany applica­
tions), Attendants, Department 
of Wastewater Treatment 
Summer Intern Part-time 
employee and Department of 
Public Works Summer 
Part-time employee. The 
Village of Kewaskum is taking 
applications for the above 
Summer Part-time employ­
ment. Applicants should be at 
least 16 years of age by the time 
of employment and qualified for 
the position they are applying 
for. Applications are available 
at the Kewaskum Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street, and 
must be on file by April 8, 1988. 
For further information please 
call 626-8484. 3-11 & 3-25

BICYCLES — Sales and Ser­
vice, 208 North Ave., Kewas­
kum. Wally’s Bike Shop.

TOWN OF ASHFORD
Large mobile home with full basement, 
deck, enclosed porch, sunken living 
room with fireplace on 11 acres with 
river frontage Huge 36 x 24 heated 
garage Unique property Ask for Ann, 
692-2607. K119

A MAINTENANCE FREE duplex ranch 
with separate attached garages, gas 
utilities and basements Living room 
and kitchen/dinette in both with a 3 
bedroom unit and a 2 bedroom unit. A 
real future investment at a negotiable 
price in the $70’s. Call Frank Sheridan 
at 338-5656 K38.

NEW LISTING

NEW LISTING
Spacious duplex on 1 acre. 2 bedrooms 
each unit. Excellent condition with new 
siding. Men will love 3 car garage, 1 
section heated. Let the tenants help 
with payments Ask for Ann, 692-2607.

COUNTRY DUPLEX 
MINT CONDITION

Ideal for owner occupant 3 bedrooms 
each unit on main floor Owners side 
has additional all newly finished 2 
bedrooms plus beautiful family room 
and full bath on lower level which is ex­
posed Patio doors off dining room area 
lead to hew deck Additional remodel­
ing done which is too numerous to men­
tion. (All work done professionally). 
Minutes from town Call Gloria for more 
information and a showing today 
$89,900 626-2880 K32

ONLY $59,900
SPACIOUS country ranch on tree-lined 
1.8 acre parcel near Hwy. H (Farm­
ington) for easy commuting IN­
CLUDES BARN/SHED plus 2 car 
garage. Call Ann Enright, 692-2607 col­
lect K27

HORSE LOVERS DELIGHT. Com­
pletely remodeled home 2 full baths, 
family room & fireplace 34 x 74 barn, 
3 car heated garage, 3 acres of land 
with more available on land contract In 
the $80's. Call Mary K Stepaniuk 
533-8648 K21.

REDUCED $63,900
Vinyl sided country bi-level on 1 acre 
Kitchen has abundance of cabinets. 
Gorgeous view from bow-window in liv­
ing room Dinette patio door leads to 
deck 3 bedrooms Much more! Call 
Ann Enright 692-2607 K19

CHARMING
BRICK CAPE CPD with Kettle Moraine 
State Forest in backyard. An elegant 
home with natural fireplace, formal din­
ing room, 3 spacious bedrooms plus a 
den. Priced to sell quickly. HURRY! 
K33. Call Ann Enright 692-2607.

PRICE REDUCED
TAY ERN 

UREA T INVESTMENT OPPORTUNITY 
Cream City brick tavern with living 
quarters plus 3 bedroom rental unit. 
Spacious bar area, equipment includ­
ed Call Ann Enright 692-2607 K93.

One of a kind country find. Tastefully 
decorated. Tri-level with basement, 
nestled on 15 acres. This investment 
features a 6 stall horse barn encircled 
by fencing and offering trails beyond 
subject property, offering hours of 
riding Featuring a stone fireplace in 
family room, pool room or 4th bedroom, 
master bedroom with bath, also main 
floor laundry. A well designed floor plan 
and at the right price. Call Frank 
Sheridan 338-5656 K28.

FARMINGTON AREA
Custom designed bi-level with 6 inch 
wall construction for low heat costs. 
DREAM kitchen with built-in desk and 
eating island, gigantic family room with 
free standing fireplace Located on 2Vz 
acre country lot. REDUCED TO 
$89,900 Call Ann Enright 692-2607. 
K42.

KEWASKUM
If you are looking for quality plus a 
beautiful location overlooking the river, 
then this is the home for you. Spacious 
all brick ranch. 2 natural fireplaces 
Main floor family room with patio doors 
plus built-in Bar-B-Q pit. Huge rooms, 
rec room lower level 90x130 foot lot. 
Call Gloria Serwe for a showing today. 
626-2880 K88

WANTED — Babysitter, my 
home, for 4 weeks, possible 
live-in, for three children, 6 
years. 2, and 7 months. 
References required. Call 626- 
4741. 3-4-2t 
LOST — Boys brown leather 
wallet last week with money. 
Reward. Ph. 626-2550. 3-11-lp

LOST DOG — New Fane area, 
Collie-Shepherd mix, fawn and 
white. Call 626-4278. 3-ll-2t

FREE PUPPIES! German 
Shepherd mix, 6 weeks old. Call 
334-4650. 3-ll-2p

DUAYNES PAINTING — 15% 
off any estimates, guaranteed 
professional work, free esti- 
mates. Call 923-6997. 2-19-1 It

FOR SALE — Firewood, sea­
soned, cut and split, 100% oak 
or mixed hardwood, $45 a face 
cord, $120 a full cord, also semi 
loads, 8 ft. lengths, 10 to 11 
cords, $60 a cord 692-2289 or 
533-4165. 9-4-tf

WORK WANTED — Lloyd’s 
Home Maintenance. No job too 
small. Repairs, remodeling, 
carpentry, painting, varnishing, 
wallpaper, woodgraining, 
ceramic tile, etc. Lloyd M. 
Ebert. 533-8013. 1-23-tf

Home Construction 
KIRST BUILDERS 

626-4392 after 5:00 p.m.
3-4-tf

9 ACRES

COUNTRY DUPLEX
Located in the beautiful Kettle Moraine 
92 acres Lower level of duplex ex­
tremely well done with 3 bedrooms plus 
family room. Spacious upper unit. 
Possible 3 bedrooms. Laundry area 
Beautiful location. Huge garage. 3 
miles from town. $73,900 Call Gloria 
Serwe 626-2880 K77.

KEWASKUM AREA
PERFECT for the growing family, at an 
affordable price. 3 bedroom ranch plus 
den or 4th bedroom. All spacious 
rooms, huge kitchen, 2 full baths, main 
floor laundry room. Quiet village with 
the Kettle Moraine surrounding you. 
Call Gloria, 626-2880. K51

BRAATZ DRIVE
REASONABLY PRICED!

Need room for your family? You pro­
bably can afford this stately colonial on 
a beautifully landscaped lot near park 
Your kids will love the 4 bedrooms and 
family room with Franklin fireplace 
Nicely decorated with wallpaper, quali­
ty carpet. Patio door leads to spacious 
yard. Call Ann Enright 692-2607. K76

53 ACRES
EAST MORAINE DRIVE 

A STEAL AT $35,000 
If you are looking for a building site, with 
country privacy, yet close to town, call 
today on this beautiful parcel Partially 
wooded. Seller will divide into 2 parcels 
Call Gloria 626-2880. K74.

125 Acre grade A dairy farm. 38x110 
barn with 30x50 attached loafing barn, 
46 stanchions, pipeline milking system. 
3 silos, 54x126 pole shed, other out­
buildings in good condition. Move in 
and start milking. Spacious, remodeled 
farmhouse. $180,000. Call Dan, 
338-3296 for private showing. K82.

VACANT LAND
WESLEY ESTATES - Prestigious subdivision in Town of Farmington Beautiful wooded lots 4 8 
acres • $17,900; 3.03 acres - $21,900, 4 6 acres $22,900 Call, ask for Ann 692-2607. K64 
2 ACRES in Boltonville. Only $6,000 Call Ann Enright 692-2607.
HUNTER S ATTENTION. 25 acres Kewaskum School District Beautiful woods and some lowland, 
plus scenic hillside home building site Call Ann 692-2607. K65
ONLY $14,900. Village of Kewaskum, all level lot next to park All utilities and sidewalks are in 
Buy just the lot or we can draw your plans and build according to your needs Call Dennis 677-4088 
K86
ONLY $7,900: 2 acres in Town of Scott near Boltonville Affordable building site with pretty country 
location. Call Ann. 692-2607. K81
COUNTRY SUBDIVISION: Large 2 + acre lots with fantastic views in Town of Farmington Good 
commuting location ONLY $10,000 each. Call Ann. 692-2607 K71.
1 ACRE BEECHWOOD LOT: Bargain priced at $5,000 Call Gloria. 626-2880 K111
WASHARA COUNTY: Beautiful 10 acre parcel half wooded with pine and red oak Priced to sell 
fast at $9,500 Call Gloria, 626-2880 K72
1 ACRE LOT Alpine Dr.. Town of Auburn Directions Hwy 45 N to Old Bridge Rd., right to Alpine 
$10,000 Call Ann Enright 692-2607 K66

NEED ROOM?
Take a look at this spacious country 4 
bedroom ranch Main floor family room, 
free standing fireplace. 2 full baths. 
Outdoor pool. Minutes from town. 
$64,900. Call Gloria Serwe 626-2880. 
K87.
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WISCONSIN OUTDOORS 
AND 

CONSERVATION NEWS

BURN DEBRIS NOW WHILE 
WILDLIFE RISK IS LOW

Rural landowners and 
farmers should burn debris now 
while the ground is still snow 
covered, advises Earl Meyer, 
Wisconsin Department of 
Natural Resources’ forest fire 
prevention specialist.

“Forest Fire Prevention 
Week is April 17 through 23,” 
said Meyer, ‘‘but the time to 
begin taking fire precautions is 
now. Last Spring 798 wildfires 
burned over 3,000 acres in 
Wisconsin. And 90 percent of 
those fires were caused by 
people.”

Now is the time to burn brush 
piles, debris and woodcuttings, 
suggests Meyer, as there is 
little danger of the fire 
spreading. That won’t be the 
case in several weeks, however, 
when the ground is clear of 
snow and dry vegetation covers 
many areas.

But before you burn any­
thing, check with your local fite 
department or forest ranger 
station to see if a burning 
permit is required. In many 
areas of the state, a burning 
permit is required when the 
ground is not snow covered.

‘‘If you wait until the snow is 
all gone and it’s too dry, you 
may not get a burning permit,” 
added Meyer.

State Park Calendars 
Are Still Available

If you haven’t picked up a 
1988 calendar that caters to all 
your outdoor needs, especially 
events happening in Wiscon­
sin’s state parks and forests, 
now’s the time to hang the 1988 
‘‘Limited Edition — Wisconsin 
State Parks Calendar” on your 
wall.

The calendar is a handy guide 
to unusual outdoor vacations, 
seasonal activities and good 
fun. Each month exquisite color 
photos share the beauty of 
Wisconsin’s state parks and 
forests.

Calendars are available for 
$5.00 at most state forests and 
parks and DNR offices. 
Calendars are also available by 
mail for $6.00. Send your check 
or money order: Calendars,

SEWING MACHINES
Singer Straight Stitch.................$19
Singer Zig-Zag............................. $29
Singer Touch & Sew .................$39
Kenmore Zig-Zag ........................$49
New Home Zig-Zag......................$59
White Zig-Zag................................$69
Pfaff Zig-Zag ................................$79
Open-Arm Machine..................... $49
Necchi Open-Arm........................$69
Elna Open-Arm.............................$79
Singer Open-Arm........................$99
Viking Open-Arm ........................$99
Bernina Reconditioned ..............$99
Cabinets..................................  $19
Desk..........................................  . .$49
Upholstery Machine .................$139
Hem Stitching Machine............$425
Serging Machine........................$299

Commercial and
Industrial Machines............... $250
Tune-Ups ...................................... *15
Parts for most brands All 100% 

Guaranteed! With FREE Operator's 

Instructions.
KEWASKUM

212 Main.............Phone 626-2611

TIME TO REMOVE
ICE FISHING SHELTERS

Ice anglers are reminded that 
the game fish season is now 
closed on most Wisconsin 
waters and ice fishing shelters 
must be removed soon, Depart­
ment of Natural Resources’ 
fisheries regulations specialist 
Hal Schwenn said.

♦ Ice fishing shelters had to 
be removed by March 5 from 
inland waters south of Highway 
64 and from Lake Michigan 
waters (except Green Bay) 
south of Highway 64.

♦ Ice fishing shelters must be 
removed by March 15 from 
inland waters north of Highway 
64, from Lake Michigan north of 
Highway 64, and from Green 
Bay and Lake Superior.

‘‘Anglers can still use 
portable shelters after these 
dates,” noted Schwenn, ‘‘as 
long as they are actually fish­
ing in them. Portable shelters 
must be removed when they’re 
not occupied.”

Schwenn advises anglers to 
check the DNR 1988 Fishing 
Regulations pamphlet for a 
listing of state waters which 
offer year-round game fishing 
angling.

If ice conditions should 
deteriorate rapidly, resulting in 
unsafe conditions, the Depart­
ment has authority to order that 
shelters be removed before 
March 15 on northern waters.

Wisconsin DNR, Bureau of 
Parks and Recreation, P.O. Box 
7921, Madison, WI 53707.

(Note: The opening date for 
the musky fishing season is 
incorrectly noted as May 21 in 
the ‘‘Limited Edition — 
Wisconsin State Parks 
Calendar.” The musky fishing 
season in waters north of U.S. 
Highway 10 opens Saturday, 
May 28).

DOG & CAT GROOMING
Off Hwy. 28 - West
6571 St. Kilian Dr.

Complete grooming with patience 
and perfection Specializing in 

hand scissoring and blow drying.

JOY KUHNKE - 626-2506

ftfawm^J^M^^
o

Offered By

BOB KIRST
Office: 338-0601
Residence: 626-4392

OPEN HOUSE
Sunday, March 13 1 to 3 p.m.

AUCTION COHPAW

H. Jim PAUL- Kewetkum. WI 53040 
(4141)38 3030 628-4318

AMERICAN BEAUTY...outstanding value is what you’ll get on this 
spacious four oedroom home. Have an evening of elegant dining in this 
formal dining room. Tastefully decorated with wallpaper and wood trim. 
Family room for casual entertaining with a patio door. Priced at only 
$69,500. DIR: Main St. to Stark St., North to Moraine Ct.

P REAL ESTATE • AUCTIONS 
APPRAISALS • INDOOR SALES

Aea.tw MIS-Equal Housing Opportunity

u

Overweight Trucking 
Will Be Suspended 
During Spring Thaw

Movement of overweight 
loads on Wisconsin highways is 
banned as of daylight Sunday, 
March 13.

The state Department of 
Transportation has temporarily 
suspended the overweight 
provisions of all trucking 
permits issued on an annual 
basis in order to protect roads 
during the spring thaw.

Thomas Cantwell, chief of 
motor carrier services in the 
Division of Motor Vehicles, said 
the suspension is due to 
unstable conditions of roadway 
subgrades in the springtime, 
when frost is melting and the 
ground is wet.

During the period of suspen­
sion, the DOT may consider 
requests to move loads which 
exceed statutory restrictions on 
a single-trip basis if investiga­
tion finds that the roads will not 
be damaged. Cantwell said 
single-trip permits will not be 
issued to loads that can be 
divided and hauled on more 
than one truck, such as pulp­
wood and raw forest products, 
garbage and refuse, recyclable 
scrap, grain or coal.

Cantwell said single-trip 
permits are valid only for state 
highways, and separate permits 
must be obtained from local 
authorities if county or town 
roads are involved.

The DOT will reinstate the 
overweight permit provision 
when the highway subgrade 
conditions stabilize.

Our nation's first na­
tional monument is Devil's 
Tower, 865 feet high, lo­
cated in the Black Hills re­
gion of Wyoming. It became 
a national monument in 
1906.

Alfalfa
Seed 

&Seed 
Oats

Certified & Standan
WEST BEND

ELEVATOR
334-2337

State of Wisconsin
Circuit Court
Washington County
In Probate

ORDER LIMITING TIME 
FOR FILING CLAIMS 
[ON WAIVER] AND 

DETERMINATION OF 
HEIRSHIP

IN THE MATTER OF THE 
ESTATE OF VIOLA A. PROST, 
Deceased.

File No. 88-WI-44
A petition for administration 

of the estate and determination 
of heirship of Viola A. Prost 
a/k/a Viola Prost, Washington 
County, Wisconsin, post office 
address 201 1st Street, 
Kewaskum, WI 53040, having 
been filed;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. Creditor’s claims must be 

filed on or before May 23, 1988, 
or be barred;

2. Heirship will be 
determined and claims will be 
examined and adjusted on June 
7, 1988, at the Washington 
County Courthouse, in West 
Bend, Wisconsin, at the 
opening of Court or thereafter. 
Dated February 23, 1988

By the Court, 
David L. Dancey 
Circuit Judge

McKENNA & KIEFER 
Attorneys at Law 
114 Main Street 
P.O. Box 550 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

2-26-3t

Most sports fans know the length of a football 
field (120 yards including end zones) but few 
know its width.. .which is 53 and one third yards.

It’s Spring in Real Estate
Selling or Buying...

CALL DOLLY NOW! 626-2236 or 338-6175

CENTURY 21 
ALPHA LTD. 
G^

2311 W. Washington 
West Bend, WI 53095

PUBLIC AUCTION 
Kewaskum, WI

SUNDAY, MARCH 13th, 10:00 a.m.
Inspection after 8:00 a.m.

LOCATION: Hwys 45 or 28 to Kewaskum, east at stop & go lights on Hwy 28. 3 blocks to Cty S 
then north 1% miles to PAUL AUCTION CO Hell

AUCTIONEER'S NOTE: Combined sales of the Ida Ruefenacht Estate. West Bend, the Robert Stahl 
Estate, West Bend; and the personal property of Edward Wagner. West Bend as he has given up 
housekeeping. A nice clean line of household, antiques & collectibles

HOUSEHOLD, ETC.: Seers Harvest Gold side by side ref freezer, Crown HG 30 in gas range: GE ref 
freeter; Admiral 30 in elec range. Maytag auto washer & gas dryer, like new; color console TV 19 
in porteble color TV Er 9 in B6W TV; radios, formica kitchen set w/2 leaves b 4 chairs, chrome kit 
chen set w/4 chairs; 3 cushion sofa, like new; nice love seat sofa; 2 La 2 Boy rocker recliners; easy chairs. 

. Stiffel floor lamp plus other lamps; cocktail ft lamp tables, wall hangings, kneehold writing desk; nice 
i Early American 4 pc maple bedroom set. double bed w/box spring Er mattress, dresser w/mirror. high 

boy Er nite stond; walnut 3 pc. bedroom set, double bed w/box spring 8 mattress, dresser wimirror 
i Er high boy; twin Early American bed w/box spring b mattress; dressers, quality wood card table & 

wood folding chairs, double size card table; folding picnic table. 2 folding cots; utility cabinet. TV trays, 
window fan; small appliances; pots. pans, dishes, glossware. etc. convalescent articles, walker, etc. 
linens & bedding; household, lewn Er garden tools; Craftsman 'Ain socket set. sabre saw w/table 8 
3/8 in drill; B8D hedge trimmer w/100 ft cord; hose 8 reel; Fairbanks platform scale Toro S 200 elec 
start 20 in snowthrower, near new. Simplicity 1021 self propelled rotary mower w/bag. good cond.; 
lawn furniture 8 more

< ANTIQUES A COLLECTIBLES: Nice tilting round oak table w/leaves 8 7 oak chairs, super walnut 
Eastlake dresser w/henkie drawers, burl trim, excellent cond . set of 6 Chippendele shield back dining 

I chairs; nice Mission oak drop front writing desk, 1930's 3 pc. bedroom set; 30 s smoking magazine 
stand. 20's walnut 'A table; Eastlake welll mirror; primitive 3 drawer elec mantle chime clock, brass 
8 iron bridge lemp; nifty folk art sewing reverse pointed on glass Country Home"; hard to find Chandler 
still life pastel; Red Wing 8 other stoneware to 20 gal; copper boiler; old wine press fruit crusher com 
bination unit, ready to use. sausage stuffer. Graniteware; service for 8 rose pattern china, star cut stem 
ware; depression 8 other collectible glasswere and other items

Charbrolled Brats, Hamburgers & Refreshments

State of Wisconsin
Circuit Court
Washington County
In Probate

ORDER SETTING TIME 
TO PROVE WILL AND 

HEIRSHIP AND NOTICE 
TO CREDITORS

IN THE MATTER OF THE 
ESTATE OF ELLA L. ANDRE, 
Deceased.

File No. 88-WI-45
A petition for the probate of 

the Will, and determination of 
heirship, of Ella L. Andre a/k/a 
Ella Andre, Washington 
County, Wisconsin, post office 
address % Samaritan Home, 
531 E. Washington, West Bend, 
WI 53095, having been filed;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. The petition be heard at 

the Washington County Court­
house, in West Bend, Wiscon­
sin, on March 22, 1988, at the 
opening of Court or thereafter;

2. Creditors’ claims must be 
filed on or before May 22, 1988, 
or be barred;

3. All claims will be examined 
and adjusted on June 7, 1988, at 
the opening of Court or there­
after.
Dated February 22, 1988

By the Court, 
J. Tom Merriam 
Circuit Judge

McKENNA & KIEFER 
Attorneys at Law 
114 Main St., 
P.O. Box 550 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

2-26-3t
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Random Lake Claims WIAA Class B Indians Defeated
Regionals by Defeating Campbellsport

In the WIAA Class B 
Regionals, Horicon (7-13) vs. 
Random Lake game played at 
Kewaskum on Friday night, 
March 4, Random Lake tripped 
up Horicon 74-58.

The Campbellsport Cougars 
played Laconia Friday night in 
Class B Regional action at 
Laconia and downed the 
Spartans 71-49.

On Saturday, March 5, at 
Mayville, Random Lake 
outscored Campbellsport 17-8 
in the fourth quarter to pull 
away for a 52-44 victory to claim 
the title in the WIAA Class B 
Mayville Regional. This was the
first time in the school’s history, 
a berth in a boys Class B 
sectional tournament had been 
achieved. It was the best game 
they played all season.

“It was an up-and-down 
game with a lot of surges,” 
commented Cougar Coach 
Roger Turchany. “We had a 
five-point lead in the third 
quarter and they surged and we 
surged. We hit a cold spot in the 
fourth quarter.”

Dave Mason scored 15 points 
to lead Random Lake, while 
Scott Goebel paced Flyway 
Conference champion 
Campbellsport with 13 points.

“We’re disappointed we 
didn’t win, but we’re pleased 
with our season,” Turchany 
said. Campbellsport finished 
18-5.

Random Lake will take a 19-4 
record to the Whitewater 
Sectionals where they will meet 
Whitnail, 21-2, on Thursday 
evening at 6:00 o’clock. In the 
second game which follows

Monmouth Downs Ripon 
In Championship Game

It was a five-point run to close 
out the first half which was a 
key factor in keeping the Ripon 
College men’s basketball team 
from winning its third straight 
Midwest Athletic Conference 
championship. The Redmen 
had won the last two conference 
titles with wins over Monmouth 
in 1986 and Knox in 1987. 
Monmouth last won the 
championship in 1985. This year 
the host Scots tied the game 
34-34 at the half, and used that 
momentum to carry them 
through the second half. The 
Scots outscored the Redmen 49- 
32 in the second half for the 83- 
66 win. The win avenged an 
earlier 82-74 loss to the Redmen 
in Ripon.

Team leader for the Redmen 
was Tyrone Kleinhans of Ke­
waskum, 19 points.

Ripon was first in three point 
goal shooting with 73 (49.7); 
first in free throw shooting with 
225 (76.0); and fourth in field 
goal shooting with 365 (49.9) 
Kewaskum’s Kleinhans was 
sixth in conference individual 
shooting with 216 points (18.0), 
on 75 field goals and 66 free 
throws.

Whitewater will play Wilmot. 
The winners of the Thursday 
evening games will compete for 
the sectional championship 
Saturday night at Whitewater at 
7:30.

Random Lake 52, Campbellsport 44
Random Lake <13-12-10-17—52): Behrens 0-1-0, 

Vorpah) 15 3, Schroeder 4-3 1, McQueen 4-3-0, 
Ix’iaer 0-3 1, Bichler 1-2-2, Mason 7-12 Totals 
17-18 9 FTM 9

Campbellsport (13-10-13-8): Schill 4-0 5, 
Griesemer 2-1-5, Goebel 4 4-0, O'Brien 2 1-4, 
Walsh 1-3 4, Braatz 3-0-2. Totals 16 9-20 FTM 2

Three point goals Schill 2 Goebel

Kewaskum Lakes 
Lose to Twins

The Thiensville-Mequon 
Twins handed the Kewaskum 
Lakes team its sixth straight 
defeat here Sunday night, 133- 
116. The Twins remain tied for 
third place with an 8-5 record 
while Kewaskum is mired in 
fifth place at 3-10.

Thiensville-Mequon led 37-32 
after the first quarter, and they 
widened the lead to 73-59 at the 
half and 104-87 after three 
quarters, before the teams 
played on even terms in the 
fourth quarter.

Dan Doedens led a balanced 
attack for the Twins with 26 
points. Dan Hucke followed 
with 23 points, Andy Doedens 
22, Brian Rindfleisch 21, and 
Jim Endsley 20. Steve Albinger 
had 36 points to lead Kewas­
kum. Andy Hoenecke added 30 
points and Bill Backhaus 24.

Kewaskum plays its final 
game of the season this Satur­
day at Cedarburg. They do have 
a makeup game at Thiensville- 
Mequon but it is uncertain at 
this time if it will be made up.

Kewaskum — Albinger 15, 
2-2, 1; Seefeldt 7, 1-2, 2; 
Thomas 3, 0-0, 1; Backhaus 11, 
2-2, 1; Hoenecke 13, 0-0, 3; 
Huenerbein 2, 0-0, 2. Totals 51, 
5-6, 10.

Thiensville-Mequon — D. 
Doedens 11, 1-2, 3; A. Doedens 
10, 2-3, 2; M. Doedens 1, 0-0, 2; 
Rindfleisch 9, 3-3, 2; Endsley 9, 
0-2, 1; Hucke 9, 2-2, 3; Nieman 
2, 1-2, 0; Eschrich 3, 0-0, 0; 
Kiefer 4, 0-0, 1. Totals 58, 9-14, 
14.
Kew. 32 27 28 29- 116 
Thiens. 37 36 31 29 - 133

LANDO’ LAKES 
BASKETBALL LEAGUE

Cedarburg 10 3
Oconomowoc 10 4
Menomonee Falls 8 5
Thiensville-Mequon 8 5
Kewaskum 3 10
Port Washington 1 13

Results Sunday, March 6 
Menomonee Falls 177, Port 
Washington 157 
Oconomowoc 134, Cedarburg 
122
Thiensville-Mequon 133, Ke­
waskum 116

AL’S 
TAXIDERMY STUDIO 
“Home of Father Nature" 
9383 Old Fond du Lac Rd. 

Kewaskum, Wl 53040 

•Licensed Professional 
•Fish & Gamehead Specialist 
•Archery Supplies 

LICENSES 
FISH ■ $2.75 per inch 

414-626-2073

Game Saturday, March 12 
Kewaskum at Cedarburg

Games Sunday, March 13
Menomonee Falls at Thiens­
ville-Mequon
Oconomowoc at Port Washing­
ton

In Sub-Regional 
By Marshmen

After a strong first quarter 
the Kewaskum boys’ basketball 
team faded losing 69-57 in 
Tuesday’s Class B sub-regional 
game against the Marshmen of 
Horicon.

Kewaskum came out with 
confidence and intensity in the 
first quarter moving to a 13 
point lead. The Indians’ senior 
center Joel Fluery scored 12 
points as the Indians took a 
24-11 first quarter lead.

Horicon’s leader Bruce Finke 
spent much of the second 
quarter on the bench in foul
trouble; however, Horicon 
outscored Kewaskum 16-11 and 
went into halftime with only a 
six point deficit.

The rest of the game was all 
Horicons. Finke got on track 
scoring 17 second half points 
while teammate Eric Miller 
scored all nine of his points in 
the second half. Horicon 
outscored Kewaskum 17-10 in 
the third quarter and 25-14 in 
the fourth as the Marshmen 
went on to win by 12, 69-57.

Dale Schatz, the Indians 
coach later said “we just fell 
apart. When the shots stopped 
falling, we got a little over 
anxious.” Kewaskum shot only 
42% from the field while 
Horicon hit 52% of it’s shots. At 
the line, Kewaskum only sank 
eight of 20 free throws for 40% 
compared to Horicon’s 65%
from the line.

Fleury led 
scoring with

the Indians in 
26 points while

grabbing 12 rebounds and four 
steals. Senior forward Ted 
Anderson also hit double 
figures in scoring and 
rebounding with 11 points and 
10 boards.

Kewaskum ends the season
with a 4-17 record, 1-11 
conference.

Horicon 69. Kewaskum 57 
m (24-9-IO-I4—57): Dean

in

WIAA Girls Pairings
WIAA Girls Pairings

MADISON, Wis <AP) - Here are pair­
ings for the Wisconsin Interscholastic 
Athletic Association girls basketball 
tournament at the University of Wiscon­
sin Field House.

CLASS A 
QUARTERFINALS 
Thursday, March IU

1:05 p m. — Appleton West (18-6) vs 
Portage (23 1)

2 45 p m - Hartland Arrowhead <24-0 
vs New Berlin Eisenhower (23-2)

7 05 p m - Bay Port (2M> vs 
Mukwonago (17 7).

8:45pm Hudson >22 2) vs Monroe 
(22 2»

SEMIFINALS 
Friday. March II 

Class C
9 35 a m — Owen-Withee (24 2) vs

11 15 a m - Elk Mound (24-1) vs Fall 
Creek (24-1).

Class B
2:05 pm — Luxemburg-Casco (25-0) 

vs Monona Grove (23-2).
3:45 p m. — Durand (22-2) vs Horicon 

(21-4).
Class A

7:05 pm - Appleton West-Portage 
winner vs Hartland Arrowhead-New 
Berlin Eisenhower winner

8 45 p m - Bay Port Mukwonago win­
ner vs Hudson Monroe winner

CHAMPIONSHIP GAMES 
Saturday, March 12

11:35a m —ClassC.
1 15p m.--Class B
2:55p m —ClassA

Kettle Moraine Lutheran Girls Lose to 
Winnebago for WISAA Class B Title

Despite two lopsided losses to 
Kettle Moraine Lutheran, of 
Jackson during the regular 
season, Winnebago Lutheran 
Academy’s girls basketball 
team withstood a furious fourth 
quarter rally and hung on for a 
47-46 win over the Chargers to 
capture the Wisconsin In­
dependent Schools Athletic 
Association Class B state 
basketball championship at the 
Milwaukee Arena on Saturday.

The Vikings had a chance to 
put the game away earlier, but 
missed four key free throws 
down the stretch.

Kettle Moraine Lutheran

Holly Krenek with nine points.
The Charger coach is Darwin 

Schramm and Vikings coach is 
Kris Clausnitzer.

Kristin Zimmel is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Zimmel, Kewaskum and 
Tammy Koepke is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Allen Koepke, 
Kewaskum.

could do no better as 
Chargers missed four of 
fourth quarter free throws.

After a 9-9 first quarter

1-0-3.
Gerhartz 3-0-3, Struebing 0-0-2. Baitinger 1-1-1, 
Johnson 3-2-5, Anderson 5-1-3, Fleury 11-44
Totals 23-8-21 FTM 13

Horicon <11-16-17-25—69): Baker 3-7-0, Finke 
10-2 3, Hereid 2-0-3, Zuleger 4-2-3, Haas 0-0-5, 
Piper 2 2-2, Miller 4-1-0, Curry 0-0 2, Breitkruetz 
0 2-0. Hampton 1-11 Totals 26 17-17 FTM: 10

Three-point goals Johnson

MONDAY NIGHT 
MOONLIGHTERS 

Gina Ruplinger Sec./Treas.
3-7-88

Amber Hotel 51-19, King Pin 
47-23, Kewaskum Saloon 37-33, 
Sentry 33-37, Fin-n-Feather 29- 
41, Bartoli’s 29-41, Smith 
Insurance 28-42, M&E 26-41.

Highlights: Cindy Martin 
211, 515; Helen Kertscher 205, 
183, 499; Kathy Rohlinger 184, 
183, 546; Renee Wondra 183, 
506; Bonnie Burmeister 184.

WOMEN’S LITTLE FIVE 
Lighthouse Lanes 

Joan Meilahn, Sec.
3-7-88

Valley View Tool & Die 104 
points; Enright’s Tap 98; Ike’s 
Repair Shoppe 88; John’s 
Country Inn 87; Lehn Catering 
78; Barrel Haus 70.

Highlights: Sharon Peter- 
mann had 518 series.

WILD BIRD SEED SALE
Wings Over Wisconsin

at
AMERAHN

Sat., March 12 - 9 a.m. to 12 noon
$2.00 Per 25* Bag - LIMIT 2 BAGS PER PERSON

the 
five

tie,
WLA exploded to take a 31-18 
halftime lead.

Kettle Moraine Lutheran, 
however, came back in the third 
quarter to trim the lead to 41-37 
thanks to some untimely turn­
overs by the Vikings.

The champion Vikings finish­
ed the season with a 21-5 record 
while Kettle Moraine Lutheran 
fell to 24-3.

The Vikings were led in 
scoring by Messner with *• 13 
points and Bender with 11.

The Chargers were paced by

No Open Gym 
On March 19

PLEASE NOTE: There WILL 
NOT be Open Gym at the Ke­
waskum High School on Satur­
day, March 19, 1988, because of 
the Booster Club Basketball 
Classic.

The final date for Open Gym 
will be March 26, 1988.

Thank you.
Village of Kewaskum 
Park & Recreation Dept.

Name 
Messner 
Weed 
Ta Seeboid 
Gabel 
Berg 
Wiechman 
Bender 
Tr.Seeboid 
Totals

Saturday's game
WLA (47)

fg 
3 
3 
2

2

4
0

16

fga

6 
8
3

13
<)

ft 
7
2

0 
0

0
13

fta 
8
4
3
4 
0
0

a

«p
13

8
6
3
4
2

II
0

47

2

4
<)

i'<
KETTLE MORAINE LUTHERAN (46*

Name 
Krueger 
Rathke 
Koepke 
Just man 
Zimmel 
Zarling 
Krenek 
Winkelmann 
Radloff 
Totals

fK 
0

3
3
2
2

3
0

18

fga 
9
2
8
5
7
3 
5
5
2

46

ft

3 
0 
0
3 
0

2
0

io

rb

6
6

3

3

29

fta
2

o
o 
4
3 
0

IM

tp 
1
5
6 
6

4
9 
I
0

46
Score by Quarters

Winnebago Lutheran Academy 9 22 10
Kettle Moraine Lutheran 9 9 19

Three-point goals: Bender 2.

3

4

2
2

2
0

19

rb
7

0

I 6
! 6
) 2
) 26

6-47
9 46

QUEEN HITS LEAGUE
Kathy Rohlinger Sec./Treas.

3-2-88
Herman’s Constr. 48-27, 

EVerglades 46 Vi-28*4, Dundee 
S & G 44, 31, Sharon’s Beauty 
Salon 42, 33, Laurie’s
39 'A -35 !A, Bauer Spraying 39- 
36, Robbies 39-36, Stoffel 
Specialty 38-37, Newsettes 
37‘A-37’A, Barney’s Bhr 37-38, 
Valley Bank 36-39, Tippel In 
35 ’A -39 *A, Sentry 35 ‘A-39 ‘A, 
T s Lounge 30-45, Johann 
Plumbing 29'A-45'A, Les & 
Arlene’s 23-52.

Highlights: Pat Serwe 218, 
200, 601; Judy Rose 210. 220, 
592; Kathy Rohlinger 233, 580; 
Reenie Heberer 207, 559; Janet 
Serwe 524; Willy Halfmann 205, 
511; Linda Theisen 500.

ANNUAL MEETING 
of the 

Dundee Sportsmen’s Club 
Sunday, March 13 -1:30 p.m.

at the 90’s HALL 
Dundee, Wl 

Movies and Speakers 
Lunch and Refreshments 

Served After 
Everyone Welcome!


