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Week’s Wit
For the man who has every­
thing, buy him a calendar to 
remind him when the payments 
are due.

Single copy 20 cents

Wbrkmens Compensation Claims 
School DistrictCostly to

By (JERKY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

Eugene Bohn, of the Kettle 
Moraine Insurance Agency, told 
the Kewaskum School Board 
that tremendously higher than 
average claims for the District 
have resulted in almost

Christmas
Concert at
Peace Church

The choirs of Peace United 
Church of Christ will be pre­
senting a Christmas Concert on 
Sunday, December 16.

This program, which will 
begin at 3:00 p.m., will feature 
the Children's Choir, Chancel 
Choir and the Churchmen. 
Traditional Christmas songs, 
old favorites, gospel music, as 
well as contemporary Christmas 
music will be performed.

A pot-luck supper at 4:00 
p.m. is being planned by the 
choirs. Anyone interested in 
enjoying good food and fellow­
ship should bring a dish to pass.

There will be no admission 
charge, however, a free will 
offering will be taken. The 
choirs of Peace Church hope to 
see you on Sunday, December 
16, 1984, at 3:00 p.m.

Man Critically Hurt, Brother Killed 
In Separate Accidents on Same Day

A rural Kewaskum man was 
critically injured and his brother 
from Campbellsport was killed 
in a tragic coincidence of 
highway accidents Saturday.

Early Saturday morning, 
Randy J. Zeman, 22, of 2641 
Ridge Road, Kewaskum, suf­
fered massive head injuries 
when the car in which he was a 
passenger left State Highway 
144 near Big Cedar Lake in the 
Town of West Bend and hit a 
tree, according to the Washing­
ton County Sheriff's Depart­
ment.

Only hours later, his brother, 
Daniel E. Zeman, 30, of 130 
Sheboygan St., Campbellsport, 
was killed when his Chevrolet 
Nova rammed into a steel 
bridge on County Trunk Y east 
of Campbellsport and plunged 
to the bank of the Milwaukee 
River below, according to a 
Fond du Lac County Sheriff’s 
spokeswoman.

Randy J. Zeman was listed in 
critical condition Monday night 
in the neuro-intensive care unit

doubling its annual premiums 
for Workmens Compensation 
insurance.

Addressing the board 
Monday night, Bohn stated the 
district’s premium has gone up 
from $11,380 last year to 
$19,513 for the current school 
year, an increase of $8,133.

Using a sheet containing 
claims information for a three- 
year period. Bohn showed the 
board that Kewaskum’s claims 
were 75% higher than average

Garbage, Refuse to 
Be Picked Up Earlier

The Village Board has 
approved the changing of 
disposal locations for garbage 
and refuse. This means a time 
savings of several hours over 
the two days of garbage 
collection. The Public Works 
Department is asking for your 
cooperation in the placement of 
your garbage at the curb earlier 
than normal to accommodate 
the earlier pick up time.

The Public Works Depart­
ment also would like to ask that 
all people place their garbage at 
the curb for pick up on Wed­
nesday and Thursday, Decem­
ber 26 and 27, 1984, and again 
on January 2 and 3, 1985, due to 
the holidays.

of Froedtert Memorial Lutheran 
Hospital, Milwaukee, a hospital 
spokesman said.

Daniel E. Zeman reportedly 
had been out fishing in the early 
morning hours. Authorities said 
they did not reach him with 
news of his brother’s accident 
before the crash.

His car hit the bridge and 
flipped over, landing on its top 
on the river bank. Fond du Lac 
County Coroner Alan Stormo 
said the body was found in the 
car. Zeman died of multiple 
injuries.

The accident, which happen­
ed about a half mile west of U.S. 
Highway 45 in the Town of 
Auburn, probably occurred be­
tween 5 a.m. and 7 a.m., 
Stormo said. Authorities were 
notified at 7:16 a.m.

,, An investigation into the 
cause of the accident was being 
made.

Randy Zeman was trans-’ 
ferred to Froedtert from St. 
Joseph's Community Hospital 
in West Bend by the Flight for

for school districts. The 
modifier point, set by the 
Workmens Compensation 
Board, to calculate the district’s 
premium rate is 1.75, as 
compared to 1.0 for other 
districts, causing Kewaskum’s 
premium to increase by 75%. 
Bohn stressed the increase was 
not set by the insurance 
company. The modifier is set by 
the Workmens Comp Board, 
said Bohn, and that’s what the 
insurance companies are 
required to use.

Comparing the Village of 
Kewaskum to the school dis­
trict, Bohn stated the village’s 
modifier is .85 which means 
their claims are 15% below 
average.

Board member Tom Brigham 
asked if there was a pattern in 
the types of claims and, if so, 
what steps the district could 
take to alleviate this problem. 
Bohn indicated he could see no 
real pattern. Claims came from 
both certified and non-certified 
employees. Some claims were 
very large, while many were 
very small. “I know one thing 
that isn’t being done is the 
pre-employment physicals. 
That would eliminate some 
accidents that are waiting to 
happen,” stated Bohn. The 
physicals would not stop all the 
problems, but it would reduce

[Continued on Page 4]

Life emergency medical heli­
copter.

The Sheriff’s Department 
said Zeman was a passenger in 
a car driven by Sara J. Zeman, 
21, also of 2641 Ridge Road, 
Kewaskum. She told police she 
dozed off while driving north on 
144.

Sara Zeman was treated for 
multiple cuts and bruises and a 
sore neck at St. Joseph’s Com­
munity Hospital. She has re­
turned home from the hospital.

The Zeman brothers are the 
sons of Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Zeman of Campbellsport.

The death of Zeman marks 
the second traffic fatality at the 
same Milwaukee River bridge 
on County Y near 45 this year. 
Another Campbellsport young 
man, Daniel Morgan, died after 
his car hit the bridge shortly 
after midnight on Aug. 11,

Zeman’s death raised the 
Fond du Lac County 1984 traffic 
fatality toll to 16. That figure 
compares to 15 deaths on the 
same day last year.

Annual Christmas Concert 
At Kewaskum High School

Christmas decorations, Santa 
Claus, coffee, punch and 
cookies, an informal at­
mosphere with all styles of. 
Christmas music - these are just 
some of the things that you will 
be able to enjoy on December 
19th. This is the date selected 
by the Kewaskum High School 
Music Department for their 
annual Christmas concert.

Wednesday, Dec. 19th, is 
definitely a date to circle on 
your calendar. Beginning at 
7:30 p.m., the concert band will 
be playing Christmas Music for 
Winds, a medley of traditional 
Christmas carols, Symphonic 
Variations On ‘In Dulci Jubilo’ 
and Christmas Favorites. Put a 
group of singing young ladies 
together and the girls’ chorus is 
there with The Gift, Hark, Now 
O Shepherd, The Alfred Burt 
Carols, and No Golden 
Carriage, No Bright Toy. As the

Farmington 
Town Board
Sets Tax Rate

The Farmington Town Board 
adopted the Town Budget as 
proposed at the Budget Hearing 
held on November 27, 1984.

The 1985 budget provides for 
proposed expenditures of 
$287,136.02 and estimated re­
ceipts and balances of $287,- 
136.02, of which $89,250.00 is to 
be raised by a town tax levy. 
The town tax rate per thousand 
of assessed valuation will be 
$1,205 compared to last year’s 
rate of $2,743.

Lawn Ornament, 
Jeans Taken

It was reported by a Brook­
lane Drive resident that a deer 
fawn lawn ornament was taken 
sometime between 10 p.m. and 
midnight on Friday, Nov. 30, 
from their front lawn. The 
ornament was part of a display 
also containing larger buck and 
doe deer. The same resident 
also reported that a street sign 
on Brooklane Drive was turned 
in the wrong direction.

A local woman also reported 
that twenty pairs of new and 
used children’s and adult jeans 
were taken from their washline 
at 222 Main Street on Monday, 
Nov. 26.

Kewaskum police are also 
investigating an incident which 
occurred Nov. 30 at 9:40 p.m. in 
which a car parked near the 
corner of Main Street and 
Parkview Drive was struck by 
the driver of another vehicle 
who left the scene without 
reporting it.

evening progresses the 
symphonic band will further 
whet your appetite for good 
music with Waltz of the Flowers 
from the Nutcracker Suite, 
Fantasia on a Hymn by 
Pructosius - the beautiful Lo, 
Now a Rose Ere Blooming, A 
Scandanavian Christmas 
Rhapsody and Twas the Night 
Before Christmas, narrated by 
Mitz Nigh. The mixed chorus 
will conclude the concert with 
Hodie, Christus Natus Est, A 
Christmas Lullaby, Jazz Gloria, 
Silent Night, with the German 
verse sung by exchange student 
Martin Seichert. and Joy to the 
World. As a traditional finish, 
The Hallelujah Chorus from the 
Messiah will be sung.

Refreshments will be served 
throughout the evening and 
Santa will be there with treats 
for the little children.

The total gross rate per 
thousand including the State, 
County, Town and School Tax 
levies will be $17.38, but the 
State Tax Credit will reduce this 
to a net rate of $15,438.

Copies of the 1985 Budget 
including Federal Revenue 
Sharing funds, are on file and 
may be examined by contacting 
the Clerk, Joanne Oneska, at 
675-6441.

Election Held 
By Fire Dept.

At their Dec. 6 monthly 
meeting, Kewaskum Fire De­
partment members elected the 
following officers to one-year 
terms for 1985:

Assistant Chief — Don 
Ehnert, re-elected.

First Captain — David 
Zehren, re-elected.

Second Captain — Bob 
Stoltzmann, re-elected.

First Lieutenant — John 
Kudek, re-elected.

Second Lieutenant — Jeff 
Boden, succeeding Mark 
Schaefer, who has moved out of 
the area.

First Aid Captain — Andy 
Pesch, re-elected.

First Aid Lieutenant — Mark 
Herriges, succeeding Tom 
McElhatton.

Secretary — John Lauben- 
stein, succeeding Dick Schmidt, 
who has resigned from the 
department.

Treasurer — Ron Amerling, 
re-elected.

Fire Chief Augie Bilgo, who 
is appointed by the Village 
Board, has one year left of his 
five-year term.

The new officers will take 
over on Jan. 1.
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Bethel Class Begins at Peace United Church of Christ

On December 3 a new two- 
year Bethel Bible Program 
began at Peace United Church 
of Christ in Kewaskum. The 
Bethel Series provides an over­
view of Scripture study, giving 
the student a meaningful base 
from which to pursue more 
in-depth biblical studies. To aid 
in the retention of what the 
student has learned in the study 
of the Bible itself, the Bethel 
Series makes use of a series of 
40 visual aids. These are

Holiday Confessions 
At Holy Trinity

Confessions for the Christ­
mas Holiday have been an­
nounced at Holy Trinity Church 
and St. Bridget as follows:

Holy Trinity — Monday, Dec. 
17, 7:30 to 9:00 p.m.

St. Bridget — Tuesday, Dec. 
18, Penance Service, 7:30 p.m.

Holy Trinity — Wednesday, 
Dec. 19, Penance Service, 7:30 
p.m.; Thursday, Dec. 20, 3:30 
to 5:00 and 7:30 to 9:00 p.m.; 
Friday, Dec. 21, Penance 
Service, 7:30 p.m.; Saturday, 
Dec. 22, 3:30 to 5:00 and 
immediately after the 6:30 p.m. 
Mass.

"In the morning of life, 
work; in the midday, give 
counsel; in the evening, 
pray." Greek Proverb

A Special Last Minute Gift Suggestion...
KEWASKUM CLASS JERSEYS

XNPIRMS

illustrations or posters which 
serve to summarize knowledge 
which the students are learning.

Before the Bethel Series 
began this month at Peace 
Church, both Pastor and Mrs, 
Joiner were required to attend 
an intensified two-week training 
session at the Bethel head­
quarters in Madison, Wiscon­
sin. There, among other things, 
the ministers learned the 
written format which is taught 
to church laypeople who have

Chimney Fire 
At Krueger Farm

The Kewaskum Fire Depart­
ment answered a chimney fire 
call at 8:28 a.m. Sunday, Dec. 9, 
at the Walter and Edna Krueger 
home, 503 Old Bridge Road in 
the Town of Auburn. Twenty 
firemen spent l*/i hours at the 
scene extinguishing the fire. 
There was minor smoke 
damage to the home. No in­
juries were reported.

- School Colors - Natural Body ■ Kelly Imprint
• All Graduating Years 85-89
- Adult sizes S-XL
• 100% Super Hwt. Cotton
• Shirts in Stock and On Sale for

ONLY $9.50 (Name on Back $1.00 Extra)

at
KB LETTERING
409 MAIN ST. Kewaskum

626-8094

SAVE AN ADDITIONAL 10% 
On Any Previously Marked Down Items

NO RETURNS OR EXCHANGES ON SALE ITEMS

Sale On Until 
Most Soft Goods inventory Is Gone

Prices will be marked down on sale items at checkout

SENIOR CITIZENS DISCOUNT 
NOT ALLOWED ON SALE ITEMS 

— ALL SALES FINAL — 
STORE HOURS: Mon. ■ Fri. 8a.m. to 9 p.m., 

Sat. 8 a.m. to 6 p.m., Sun. 8a.m. to 5 p.m.

been carefully selected as the 
teacher-leader trainees within 
the congregation.

On Sunday, December 9, the 
Bethel Class was installed and 
prayerfully committed to the 
Lord as they begin this rigorous 
two-year study. The members 
of the class pictured are:

First row, left-right: Kenneth 
Weyers, Karen Staehler, Mary 
Miller, Nancy Panzer, Sally 
Joiner (teaching assistant).

Candy, Cookie Sale at 
Holy Trinity Church

Holy Trinity Home and 
School Association will be spon­
soring a candy and cookie sale 
on Sat., Dec. 15, after the 6:30 
p.m. Mass and Sun., Dec. 16, 
after all the Masses, 8:00, 9:30 
and 11:00 a.m. Santa will be 
present in the church hall. 
Pictures with Santa will be 
offered after all Masses except 
the 11:00 a.m. Mass on Sunday.

Second row: Pastor Joiner, 
Dr. Greg Ogi, John Hubbell, 
Mitchell Ogi, and L.N. Peter­
son.

(Photo by Sally Joiner)

1277 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum
PHONE 626-2158

REMODELING SALE 
NOWON!

JUST IN TIME FOR CHRISTMAS

CLOSING OUT 
Most Soft Good Items

SAVE 25%
On All

Oshkosh 
Merchandise

Boltonville Fire 
Department Elects

At the annual meeting of the 
Boltonville Fire Department on 
Dec. 7, Joe Enright was re­
elected for his 14th term as 
ChieLDennis Fechter and Steve 
Backhaus were elected to the 
Board of Directors, presently 
consisting of Jim Met hain, Jim 
Peterson, Dick Schneider and 
Darryl Knepprath.

The annual Picnic Committee 
will consist of Kevin Fay, 
Dennis Fechter, Ken Theusch 
and Bon Petermann. Fr
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Experience is a good school, but 
the fees are high.

Kewaskum Statesman
250 Main St., P.O. Box 98 

Kewaskum. Wl 53040
PHONE 626-2620

Published Every Friday 
Postmaster: Send Form 3579 to 
P.O. Box 98, Kewaskum, Wl 
53040 (USPS 294-060). Second 
class postage paid at Kewas­
kum, Wl 53040

William J. Harbeck &
Marcella M. Harbeck 

Publishers
Subscription Rates: 
$9.00 a Year in state 

$11.00 a year out of state 
$15.00 a year foreign

Single copy 20c

SAVE 50%
On All Remaining

Baby Wear 
Purses 

Jewelry - etc.
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e 3 Kewaskum Middle
School to Sponsor 
Toy, Mitten Drive

'I'he Kewaskum Middle 
School Student Council has 
announced their third toy and 
mitten drive.

Last year, according to 
Student Council advisor. Jim 
Borusky, seven families were 
aided by the drive which took 
place just prior to Christmas.

“We need toys, games, and 
mittens that would be suitable 
for children ages 2 through 11,” 
Borusky stated, “and all items 
must be new or in like new 
condition.”

“Last year,” Borusky stated, 
"the donations that you gave us 
were the only gifts that some of 
these families received for 
Christmas.” We are probably 
talking about seven or eight 
chidren - seven or eight that 
would have received no other 
gifts at ail.

Donations should be taken to 
the Kewaskum Middle School 
office prior to Wednesday, Dec. 
19th. The drive is being 
coordinated at the Middle 
School by George Walz, Student 
Council President.

All items will be given to 
those needy families in the 
Kewaskum School District.

FFA to Hold Safety
Demonstration Wed

The Kewaskum FFA will be 
holding its safety demonstration 
at 3:00 p m. on Wednesday, 
Dec. 19. Included in this 
demonstration will be the major 
first aid topics of treating 
injuries.

A short FFA meeting will 
follow immediately after the 
safety demonstrations.

Refreshments will be served 
at the end of the demonstration.

Births
PUSCH — Twin daughters to 

Carol and Dennis Pusch, 3543 
Townhall Road, Kewaskum, on 
December 9.

LICHEL — A son to Lisa and 
William Lichel, 512 Linde Lane, 
Kewaskum, on December 10.

HEISDORF — A son to 
Donna and Michael, 215 Roose­
velt Drive, West Bend, on 
December 8.

WARANIUS — A daughter to 
Sandra and Scott Waranius, 
Fredonia, on December 5.

Tappan, 
AUTOMATIC 

DISHWASHER

56-1014

ABC CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The Beechwood Senior 

Citizens ABC Club results on 
Tuesday afternoon, December 
4, were as follows: Elmer 
Stange, 17-0—17 net; Elmer 
Fabian, 17-1 —16 net; Joe 
Miller, 16-1-15 net.

Marriage Licenses
James P. Gleason, Jr., Ke­

waskum, and Connie J. Thomp­
son, Kewaskum. Wedding Dec. 
15.

Steven A. Baier, Town of 
Ashford, Fond du Lac County 
and Melba J. Fettig, Town of 
Jackson.

Say Merry Christmas. 
Many times, many ways.

Here's a beautiful, floral gift for everyone on your list. Fresh, 
holiday flowers in an elegant, solid copper serving piece. 
Liter, each one will be treasured in so many ways.

Gail or visit our shop to have a Copper Collection Bouquet 
delivered anywhere in the U.S. and Canada.

Send Teleflora s Copper Collection 
Bouquets for Christmas. P H 0 N E

KEWASKUM 
FLORAL

119 Main St., Kewaskum

626-2941

Ideflora
IrkfloM i* J registered service mark of kh tlor.i Inc C IdvHora Inc I9M

61-1124
• Powerful two-level 

wash action
• Dual detergent 

dispenser
• Rinse-aid dispenser
• Removable silverware 

basket
• Ten-year tub and door 

liner warranty

^^I^REBATE

*269

rappan.

on tills LITTON-AIRE GENERATION IT' 
Space-Saving Microwave Oven!

8074
With Built-In Vent 
and Light!
• 1.1 cu. ft. capacity 

with meal-in-one 
cooking rack

• 600 watts
• 10 power levels
• Fits standard

30" vent hood

Space Saver 
Microwave Oven

• Fits under kitchen 
cabinets

• 500 watts nominal 
power output

• Interior oven light
• Ideal for kitchen, 

patio, cottage, boat

*149

56-2473
Family Size 
Microwave Oven
• Tap N Touch 

cooking
• Automatic tempera­

ture probe/hold
• Solid state reliabTtity

Spacer saver size 
15-minute timer

*149
*269

*499
YOUR COST 

AFTER REBATE!

Auto-Touch®
R-9350

Carousel® II 
Microwave Oven
• Carousel II

turns the food so 
you don't have to

• Auto-Touch controls 
provides fingertip 
selection of all 
cooking functions

• Higher Microwave 
Power of 700 watts56-2893

Spacesaver 
Microwave Oven
• Fits conveniently 

above range
• Touch control panel 

with ten cooking 
speeds

• Big 16" wide oven
NOW ONLY

*449

1780
• Meal-in-one cooking
• 700 watts
• Big 1.3 cu ft. 

capacity
• Auto-cook guides 

you to delicious 
meals

*369
*339

R-5200
Compact 
Carousel® II 
Microwave Oven
• Carousel II

turns the food so 
you don't have to

• Slim-Line Exterior 
and 0 6 cu. ft. interior

*179

broils and crisps

*679

R-1800A
Over the Range 
Carousel® II 
Convection 
Microwave Oven
• Carousel’ II 

turns the food so 
you don't have to

• Convection System 
browns, bakes.

OCONOMOWOC
120 N Main St. / 567-4141

WEST BEND
(Formerly Hicken TV & Appliance) 
1325 S Mam St / 338-1144

^peeda
^^fI Appliances & Television

k WAUKESHA
379 W Mam St / 542-4451
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Memories... The Statesman welcomes readers to submit photos for 
the "Memories" feature Photos should show life in 
the olden days in this area. Deliver or mail to The 
Statesman, 250 Main St., Kewaskum, Wl 53040. 
Photos can be picked up again after publication.

This is an oldie but a goodie. It is an old photo of Tiny Terlinden, who was born 
at a very early age, trying out his pipe “out behind the barn.”

School Bd.
[Continued from Page 1] 

them and alert the district to 
applicants with potential 
problems so the district could 
place them in jobs where this 
could be avoided, noted Bohn.

The board thanked Bohn for 
appearing before them and 
indicated it would look into the 
matter to see what corrective 
steps could be taken.

In other action, the board 
discussed the Olympics of the 
Mind program. Brigham told 
the board, his committee and 
the Kewaskum Education 
Association still had not come to 
an agreement on a job descrip­
tion for the program’s coordi­
nator position. He also noted 
that while the job had posted 
within the district and ad­
vertised. no one had applied for 
the job. The board then moved 
to give High School Principal 
Leroy Kopecky the authority to 
go out into the district and talk 
with citizens who might be 
interested in the position and, if 
an applicant is found who will 
take the job as a paying, rather 
than volunteer position, offer 
the same salary of $12.oo an 
hour as set by the Negotiations 
Committee/KEA meetings.

Elementary Principal Tom 
Larsen told the board he and 
Middle School Principal Dennis 
Reha have agreed to coordinate 
the Olympics of the Mind 
kindergarten through high 
school program for this year so 
it gets started. However, if a 
coordinator is hired 'hey would 
like to turn the program over to 
that person.

Board member Neal Weare 
asked for a report on the 
district's computer program. 
His concern was that the high 
school students who are taking 
the computer course for a 
required ’/» credit, are not 
receiving enough hands-on 
time.

Weare wondered whether the 
high school’s computer 
numbers could be supplement­
ed with units from the middle 
school. Reha said the computers 
in his school are in constant use. 
either during a class or by 
students who come in during 
their study halls and free 
periods to work on them.

High School Math and 
Computer instructor Joe Harlow

felt the way the district’s com­
puter program has been set up 
should be reviewed and 
possibly changes made. He felt 
each curriculum, such as 
typing, accounting, etc., should 
have units to work with in areas 
related to that particular course. 
Harlow told the board while he 
could teach programming and 
math skills, he did not feel 
qualified to teach keyboard or 
word processing. “I’m a two- 
finger person, this is something 
that sould be taught in a 
business office or English 
curriculum,’’ commented 
Harlow.

Weare asked Reha to look 
into his request farther and 
report back at the next board 
meeting.

Board member Ralph Horner 
asked for a report on the 
district's competitive bidding 
practices for purchases of

Hoppy 30th Birthday 
DEAN!

Dad, Mom, Laurie, Jennifer, Jody & Jessica

services and supplies. After 
explanations from Business 
Manager Cherna Gorder and 
Buildings Superintendent Fred 
Boehlke, Horner asked Policy 
Committee Chairman Neal 
Weare to look into a policy 
governing the bidding process.

On administrative re­
commendation. the board 
approved transferring Mrs. 
Irene Stradtman from half-time 
Beechwood kindergarten 
teacher to full-time at Kewas­
kum Elementary. Mrs. Lori 
Noegel will be transferred to 
Beechwood kindergarten and 
Chapter I program. The 
Chapter I reading program will 
run during the morning and the 
kindergarten class will be 
switched to an afternoon 
session as of January 1, 1985.

The board then adjourned to 
closed session.

Christmas Concert 
Sunday at KMLHS

The annual Christmas Con­
cert of Kettle Moraine Lutheran 
High School will be held on 
Sunday, Dec. 16, at 2:30 p.m. in 
the high school gymnasium.

Since this is the 10th Anni­
versary Year of Kettle Moraine 
the concert will center around 
the theme: TELLING THE 
NEXT GENERATION - CHRIST 
THE SAVIOR IS BORN!

The concert for this anni­
versary year will feature one 
selection from each Christmas 
Concert given during the past 
ten years at KML. Mrs. Karen 
Pautz (the first choir director at 
KML) will be the guest director 
for the selection which was sung 
by the very first choir of KML in 
1974!

All the Choirs, Brass Choir, 
Band, and Grade School Bands 
of KML will participate.

Kettle Moraine Lutheran 
High School is located southeast 
of Jackson at 3399 Division 
Road. You are cordially invited 
to attend.

Vision is the art of seeing things 
invisible.

Happy 
Birthday 
ROLLY(Jrl

GUESS WHO??

ZZHappy 
Birthday 

BRENT
_____ _____ LOVE — Mom, Dad and Blake

Moraine Chorus
Christmas Concert

Peter Ayer, Associate Pro­
fessor of Music at the Univer­
sity of Wisconsin - Washington 
County, announces the annual 
Moraine Chorus Christmas 
Concert to be held Sunday, 
December 16, at 2:00 p.m. in 
the University Theatre, 400 
University Drive, West Bend.

The program will feature all 
Christmas music and will in­
clude Bach's Cantata #191.

Soloists Marie Marin and 
Shelia Boyung will be ac­
companied on the harpsichord 
by Elizabeth Fisher and Pris­
cilla Hausmann.

The Moraine Chorus is under 
the direction of Peter Ayer. 
There is no admission fee for 
the concert. The general public 
is welcome to come and cele­
brate the holidays with the 
music of the Moraine Area 
Chorus.

The famed Italian opera “I 
Pagliacci” — the story of a 
jealous clown who kills his wife 
— is based on a real-life 
murder.
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PUT SAFETY FIRST WITH TOY PURCHASES

Christmas and children seem 
to go hand-in-hand. Each year 
children anxiously await the 
arrival of Santa Claus and the 
toys he will leave under the tree 
on Christmas Eve. When 
shopping for those toys on your 
Christmas list this year, make 
safety your first consideration.

One way to protect your child 
against an accident is to select 
toys that suit his or her skills 
and abilities. A toy that is safe 
for a 12-year old is obviously not 
safe for a six-year old. Many toy 
manufacturers are helping 
parents choose appropriate toys 
by attaching age recommenda­
tion labels or safety information 
such as, “Not recommended for 
children under three."

Most toys and other articles 
intended for very young child­
ren (under age 3) have to pass a 
test of the U.S. Product Safety 
Commission to insure the toy 
does not have very small parts

or has small parts that can 
easily break off. Children under 
age three are particularly 
vulnerable to injuries and 
deaths from swallowing, in­
haling or choking on small parts 
of toys and other articles in­
tended for their use.

When shopping for toys keep 
these safety tips in mind:

• Select toys without rough or 
sharp edges which could cause 
bodily injury or lacerations in 
the mouth.

• Examine toys for small 
parts which young children 
might swallow or place in their 
ears or noses.

• Make sure that the wiring in 
electrical toys is strong and 
intact — not loose or flimsy. 
Look for the UL (Underwriters 
Laboratory) label on the cord 
and on the toy itself.

• Air rifles, sling shots, 
archery sets and other projectile 
toys can be very dangerous. If

you do buy this type of toy for 
your child, make sure he or she 
uses it only under adult super­
vision .

• Toys with wheels can also 
be dangerous. Each year, there 
are thousands of injuries 
associated with bicycles, skate­
boards, and rollerskates. Be 
sure the bike you purchase has 
reflective tape and lights for 
night use and fits the child’s 
size today, not tomorrow. When 
buying a skateboard, also buy 
protective gear to protect 
against injuries.

In addition to selecting safe 
toys, you should supervise safe 
play by explaining how to use 
each toy properly and safely. 
Older children should be in­
structed how to maintain and 
keep more sophisticated toys 
such as chemestry sets, ice 
skates and toboggans away 
from younger siblings who 
could easily injure themselves.

You should also teach 
younger children to put their 
toys away so that no one trips or 
falls over them. It’s also a good 
idea to periodically examine 
toys for good working order.

If you invest some time in

ELECTROLYSIS
For permanent hair removal.

DUNDEE HAIR 
STYLES UNLIMITED 

Phone 533-4360

these safety steps in the 
selection and maintenance of 
toys, you will have a better 
chance to guiding your child 
through a Merry Christmas and 
a safe new year. More wine is drunk in Italy 

than any other country in 
the world.

Save $75

*4
Glittering 10K gold 
dinner ring set with 
six lovely diamonds.
REGULARLY $349.95

BIER’S JEWELRY
129 Main St., Kewaskum 

Phone626^777 
Limit ohe coupon per item.

For 
Children 
12 And

t IiTiW

Kewaskum

KEWASKUM 
927 Fond du Lac Ave 
(Hwy. 45 South) 
Kewaskum 626-8001
HOURS: 
Mon thru Fri 9am-9pm 
Saturday 9am 5pm 
Sunday 10am-4pm

^ “YOUR ALL-SERVICE PHARMACY"

U>enC OP€N UH<H VOU HMD UI

FREE GIFT 
for each 

child who 
visits Santa

Santa will be at Kennelly Pharmacy 
in Kewaskum on

SATURDAY, DEC. 15 - 10am to4pm 
SUNDAY, DEC. 16 - 12 to 4Pm.
BRING YOUR CHRISTMAS LIST FOR SANTA!

PARENTS! — Bring your cameras and 
take pictures of your child with Santa

Santas Secret 
CHILDRENS GIFT SHOP 

is located in 
KCNNCUY PHARMACY

It’s a special place where children, age 12 and younger, 
can shop for Mom and Dad all by themselves.

THEY CAN EVEN GIFT WRAP!

It’s open every weekend from now to Christmas.
Fri., 5to9 p.m.; Sat., 9a.m. to 5 p.m.; Sun., 10a.m. to 4 p.m.

Gifts are from 50c to $3. Santa’s little helpers are on hand to help 
every boy and girl!

s^AS
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Memories.. The Statesman welcomes readers to submit photos for 
the “Memories” feature. Photos should show life in 
the olden days in this area. Deliver or mail to The 
Statesman, 250 Main St., Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
Photos can be picked up again after publication.

This is an oldie but a goodie. It is an old photo of Tiny Terlinden, who was born 
at a very early age, trying out his pipe “out behind the barn."

School Bd.
[Continued from Page 1] 

them and alert the district to 
applicants with potential 
problems so the district could 
place them in jobs where this 
could be avoided, noted Bohn.

The board thanked Bohn for 
appearing before them and 
indicated it would look into the 
matter to see what corrective 
steps could be taken.

In other action, the board 
discussed the Olympics of the 
Mind program. Brigham told 
the board, his committee and 
the Kewaskum Education 
Association still had not come to 
an agreement on a job descrip­
tion for the program’s coordi­
nator position. He also noted 
that while the job had posted 
within the district and ad­
vertised, no one had applied for 
the job. The board then moved 
to give High School Principal 
Leroy Kopecky the authority to 
go out into the district and talk 
with citizens who might be 
interested in the position and, if 
an applicant is found who will 
take the job as a paying, rather 
than volunteer position, offer 
the same salary of $12.oo an 
hour as set by the Negotiations 
Committee/KEA meetings.

Elementary Principal Tom 
Larsen told the board he and 
Middle School Principal Dennis 
Reha have agreed to coordinate 
the Olympics of the Mind 
kindergarten through high 
school program for this year so 
it gets started. However, if a 
coordinator is hired, they would 
like to turn the program over to 
that person.

Board member Neal Weare 
asked for a report on the 
district’s computer program. 
His concern was that the high 
school students who are taking 
the computer course for a 
required *2 credit, are not 
receiving enough hands-on 
time.

Weare wondered whether the 
high school’s computer 
numbers could be supplement­
ed with units from the middle 
school. Reha said the computers 
in his school are in constant use. 
either during a class or by 
students who come in during 
their study halls and free 
periods to work on them.

High School Math and 
Computer instructor Joe Harlow-

felt the way the district’s com­
puter program has been set up 
should be reviewed and 
possibly changes made. He felt 
each curriculum, such as 
typing, accounting, etc., should 
have units to work with in areas 
related to that particular course. 
Harlow told the board while he 
could teach programming and 
math skills, he did not feel 
qualified to teach keyboard or 
word processing. “I'm a two- 
finger person, this is something 
that sould be taught in a 
business office or English 
curriculum,” commented 
Harlow.

Wrare asked Reha to look 
into his request farther and 
report back at the next board 
meeting.

Board member Ralph Horner 
asked for a report on the 
district’s competitive bidding 
practices for purchases of

services and supplies. After 
explanations from Business 
Manager Cherna Gorder and 
Buildings Superintendent Fred 
Boehlke, Horner asked Policy 
Committee Chairman Neal 
Weare to look into a policy 
governing the bidding process.

On administrative re­
commendation, the board 
approved transferring Mrs. 
Irene Stradtman from half-time 
Beechwood kindergarten 
teacher to full-time at Kewas­
kum Elementary. Mrs. Lori 
Noegel will be transferred to 
Beechwood kindergarten and 
Chapter I program. The 
Chapter I reading program will 
run during the morning and the 
kindergarten class will be 
switched to an afternoon 
session as of January 1, 1985.

The board then adjourned to 
closed session.

Christmas Concert 
Sunday at KMLHS

The annual Christmas Con­
cert of Kettle Moraine Lutheran 
High School will be held on 
Sunday, Dec. 16, at 2:30 p.m. in 
the high school gymnasium.

Since this is the 10th Anni­
versary Year of Kettle Moraine 
the concert will center around 
the theme: TELLING THE 
NEXT GENERATION - CHRIST 
THE SAVIOR IS BORN!

The concert for this anni­
versary year will feature one 
selection from each Christmas 
Concert given during the past 
ten years at KML. Mrs. Karen 
Pautz (the first choir director at 
KML) will be the guest director 
for the selection which was sung 
by the very first choir of KML in 
1974!

All the Choirs, Brass Choir, 
Band, and Grade School Bands 
of KML will participate.

Kettle Moraine Lutheran 
High School is located southeast 
of Jackson at 3399 Division 
Road. You are cordially invited 
to attend.

The famed Italian opera “I 
Pagliacci” — the story of a 
jealous clown who kills his wife 
— is based on a real-life 
murder.

Vision is the art of seeing things 
invisible.

LOVE — Mom, Dad and Blake

Moraine Chorus
Christmas Concert

Peter Ayer. Associate Pro­
fessor of Music at the Univer­
sity of Wisconsin - Washington 
County, announces the annual 
Moraine Chorus Christmas 
Concert to be held Sunday, 
December 16, at 2:00 p.m. in 
the University Theatre. 400 
University Drive, West Bend.

The program will feature all 
Christmas music and will in­
clude Bach’s Cantata #191.

Soloists Marie Marin and 
Shelia Boyung will be ac­
companied on the harpsichord 
by Elizabeth Fisher and Pris­
cilla Hausmann.

The Moraine Chorus is under 
the direction of Peter Ayer. 
There is no admission fee for 
the concert. The general public 
is welcome to come and cele­
brate the holidays with the 
music of the Moraine Area 
Chorus.

Happy 
Birthday 

BRENT
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PUT SAFETY FIRST WITH TOY PURCHASES

Christmas and children seem 
to go hand-in-hand. Each year 
children anxiously await the 
arrival of Santa Claus and the 
toys he will leave under the tree 
on Christmas Eve. When 
shopping for those toys on your 
Christmas list this year, make 
safety your first consideration.

One way to protect your child 
against an accident is to select 
toys that suit his or her skills 
and abilities. A toy that is safe 
for a 12-year old is obviously not 
safe for a six-year old. Many toy 
manufacturers are helping 
parents choose appropriate toys 
by attaching age recommenda­
tion labels or safety information 
such as, ‘‘Not recommended for 
children under three.”

Most toys and other articles 
intended for very young child­
ren (under age 3) have to pass a 
test of the U.S. Product Safety 
Commission to insure the toy 
does not have very small parts

or has small parts that can 
easily break off. Children under 
age three are particularly 
vulnerable to injuries and 
deaths from swallowing, in­
haling or choking on small parts 
of toys and other articles in­
tended for their use.

When shopping for toys keep 
these safety tips in mind:

• Select toys without rough or 
sharp edges which could cause 
bodily injury or lacerations in 
the mouth.

• Examine toys for small 
parts which young children 
might swallow or place in their 
ears or noses.

• Make sure that the wiring in 
electrical toys is strong and 
intact — not loose or flimsy. 
Look for the UL (Underwriters 
Laboratory) label on the cord 
and on the toy itself.

• Air rifles, sling shots, 
archery sets and other projectile 
toys can be very dangerous. If

you do buy this type of toy for 
your child, make sure he or she 
uses it only under adult super­
vision.

• Toys with wheels can also 
be dangerous. Each year, there 
are thousands of injuries 
associated with bicycles, skate­
boards, and rollerskates. Be 
sure the bike you purchase has 
reflective tape and lights for 
night use and fits the child's 
size today, not tomorrow. When 
buying a skateboard, also buy 
protective gear to protect 
against injuries.

In addition to selecting safe 
toys, you should supervise safe 
play by explaining how to use 
each toy properly and safely. 
Older children should be in­
structed how to maintain and 
keep more sophisticated toys 
such as chemestry sets, ice 
skates and toboggans away 
from younger siblings who 
could easily injure themselves.

You should also teach 
younger children to put their 
toys away so that no one trips or 
falls over them. It’s also a good 
idea to periodically examine 
toys for good working order.

If you invest some time in
—

ELECTROLYSIS
For permanent hair removal.

DUNDEE HAIR 
STYLES UNLIMITED

Phone 533-4360

these safety steps in the 
selection and maintenance of 
toys, you will have a better 
chance to guiding your child 
through a Merry Christmas and 
a safe new year. More wine is drunk in Italy 

than any other country in 
the world.

REGULARLY $349.95

129 Main St., Kewaskum

Limit ohe coupon ner item

Save $75

dinner ring set with
six lovely diamonds.

BIER’S JEWELRY
Phone 626-2777

KEWASKUM 
927 Fond du Lac Ave 
(Hwy. 45 South!
Kewaskum 626-8001
HOURS: 
Mon thru Fri 9am 9pm 
Saturday 9am-5pm 
Sunday 10am-4pm

KEnnEUV PHARMACY
^ "YOUR ALL-SERVICE PHARMACY"

UI€ R€ OP€N WHEN VOU N€CD US

I ^OUNCWGJANTA, mPERS0N

Santa will be at Kennelly Pharmacy 
in Kewaskum on

SATURDAY, DEC. 15 - 10amto 4pm 
SUNDAY, DEC. 16 - 12 to4pm.

^M
.0*1

FREE GIFT 
for each 

child who 
visits Santa

BRING YOUR CHRISTMAS LIST FOR SANTA!

PARENTS! — Bring your cameras and 
take pictures of your child with Santa

a
Santa’s Secret 

CHILDREN’S GIFT SHOP 

is located in 
KCNNCUY PHAAMACY

For 
Children 
12 And 
Under

oi
Kewaskum

It’s a special place where children, age 12 and younger, 
can shop for Mom and Dad all by themselves.

THEY CAN EVEN GIFT WRAP!

It’s open every weekend from now to Christmas.
Fri., 5 to 9 p.m.; Sat., 9 a.m. to 5 p.m.; Sun., 10 a.m. to 4 p.m.

Gifts are from 50c to $3. Santa’s little helpers are on hand to help 
every boy and girl!
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With Valley Bancorporation

FFA Members Attend 
National Convention

Robert C. O’Malley, presi­
dent of United Banks of Wis­
consin, Inc., and Gus A. 
Zuehlke, chairman of Valley 
Bancorporation, jointly an­
nounced today that the two 
organizations have entered into 
an agreement in principle call­
ing for the merger of United and 
Valley. Under the agreement, 
which has been approved by 
each organization’s Board of 
Directors, owners of United 
common stock would receive at 
their election and within some 
limitations, either $29.25 per 
share in cash or 1.27 shares of 
Valley common stock for each 
share of United common stock. 
The transaction is subject to 
negotiation of a definitive 
agreement and all requisite 
corporate and regulatory 
approvals.

United, headquartered in 
Madison, Wisconsin, owns 3 
Madison area banks located in 
Madison, Sauk City and Sun

Campus Notes
WHITEWATER - Doreen 

Klug of Kewaskum is among 55 
University of Wisconsin- 
Whitewater students who have 
been selected as national 
outstanding leaders and will 
have their biographies included 
in the 1985 edition of “Who’s 
Who Among Students in 
American Universities and 
Colleges.”

Campus nominating com­
mittees and editors of the 
annual directory have included 
the names of these students 
based on their academic 
achievement, service to the 
community, leadership in extra­
curricular activities, and 
potential for continued success.

They join an elite group of 
students selected from more 
than 1,500 institutions of 
higher learning in all 50 states, 
the District of Columbia, and 
several foreign nations.

Outstanding students have 
been honored in the annual 
directory since it was first 
published in 1934.

Miss Klug, a senior account­
ing major at UW-Whitewater, is 
the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Klug, Route 1, 3291 
Highway D.

<"“SADIE—^
Wk About 
Depressing 
— I’m on the 
133rd Day...

Of My ’ 
14 Day ’ 
Beauty 
Plan.

Get your Insurance in shape for 
the coming season! Fire strikes 
any time but more often in 
winter! Are you adequately 
protected? See us to update 
your coverage!

BARTELT 
Insurance Agency 
120 Main St. 626-2070

Prairie, the United Bank in 
Menomonie and a mortgage 
company. Anchored by United 
Bank, Madison, a $200 million­
asset bank, the holding 
company had September 30, 
1984, assets of $335 million. 
Approximately 85% of United’s 
assets are located in the greater 
Madison area. United currently 
serves its customers through 17 
locations, 15 in the greater 
Madison area and 2 in 
Menomonie.

Valley Bancorporation, Wis­
consin’s fourth-largest bank 
holding company, currently 
serves Wisconsin through 40 
locations with additional 
financial service companies 
engaged in leasing, insurance, 
data processing and trust 
service. As of September 30, 
1984, Valley had total assets of 
$1.1 billion. Valley currently 
has two acquisitions in progress 
the $170 million-asset Janes­
ville based BANCWIS Corp, 
and the $36 million-asset Bank 
of Oregon. After consumation of 
the proposed transactions, 
Valley will have assets of 
approximately $1.7 billion and 
will deliver financial services 
through 64 Wisconsin locations. 
Assets in the greater Madison- 
Janesville market area will 
approximate $500 million. This 
area will be served through 22 
locations.

at

VISIT 
SANTA!

Friday, Dec. 21
Between 4 and 6 p.m.

Volley Bank

To welcome Santa, we will have hot cider and cookies.

EVERYONE IS WELCOME TO STOP BY AND 
ENJOY THE CHRISTMAS SPIRIT!

’Santa will be at the Kewaskum and Allenton Banks.

From November 7 to Novem­
ber 11, Joe Schmitt, Joel Junk, 
Gary Butzlaff, and Patsy 
Panzer, Kewaskum FFA 
Chapter members, attended the 
fifty-seventh annual national 
Future Farmers of America 
convention in Kansas City, 
Missouri.

Leaving Wednesday night 
from Waupun, they arrived in 
Kansas City Thursday morning 
for the first session at the 
Municipal Auditorium. Close to 
23,000 F.F.A. members from all 
over the United States attended 
the convention.

During their stay they heard 
motivational speeches from Pat 
Summerall, Art Linkletter, Bart 
Conner, and Eddie Albert at the 
convention sessions.

The national officers: Ron 
Weneinger - President; Bill 
Caraway - Secretary; Melody 
Lawson - Vice President; Carol 
Irvine - Vice President; Rhonda 
Scheulen - Vice President, and 
Chuck Duggar - Vice President, 
delivered their retiring 
addresses during the conven­
tion.

F.F.A. members witnessed 
the national prepared speaking 
contest, national extemporane­
ous speaking contest, the 
American Farmer ceremony, 
winners of national proficiency 
awards, and winners of national 
chapter and Building Our

American Communities 
(B.O.A.C.) awards.

The delegates visited the Ag 
Hall of Fame. Machinery and 
exhibits from as far back as the 
early 1900s were on display.

A visit to the Harry Truman 
Museum in Independence, 
Missouri was also on the 
agenda. Many of the late Presi­
dent’s articles from his political 
as well as private life were on 
display here. He and his wife’s 
gravesites are also part of the 
museum in its courtyard.

Members were treated to a 
horse show at the American 
Royal in Kemper Arena. During 
intermission, country-western 
singer Mickey Gilley performed 
and put on a very good show.

There also was a career 
conference show. Colleges, the 
armed services, and many agri­

RON BEIMBORN ELECTRONICS
TV • Stereo • Auto 

Satellite Antenna 
Sales and Service 
Rt 1 16 185 Hwy S 

Adell, Wl 53001

Friendly i

Valley Bank
KEWASKUM ALLENTON

MEMBER FDIC AND VALLEY BANCORPORATION

cultural product companies set 
up displays informing F.F.A. 
members of the possible career 
opportunities lying ahead of 
them.

All this kept the members 
rather busy, and they hope to 
bring back some ideas for use 
on the chapter level.

The man who stole the 
Mona Lisa from the Louvre 
Museum in Paris con­
vinced his jury that he had 
done it as an act of pat­
riotism—to return it to 
Italy—and was sentenced 
to just over one year in 
prison.
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OVER THE TOP 
1984 Fund Drive

Exceeds Goal

Thanks to YOU 
Kewaskum

It’s Working — 
The United Way

KEWASKUM 
AREA 

UNITED WAY

...TO VISIT HOMER THE LION AND 
ALL HIS CLUB MEMBERS.

Io subscribe to the Kewaskum 
Statesman, just call 626-2626.

Leitzke, R P H.

SANTA CLA US IS COMING TO WEST BEND SA VINGS
to meet Ho-Ho-Homer the Lion and all of Homer’s special friends. 
Because everyone, especially Santa, knows that Homer’s Club 
Members are good little girls and boys.
Homer has planned a lot of fun and excitement, including a 
photo with Santa, FREE!

So plan en joining Homer and Santa at West Bend Savings.
And. don’t forget to bring your Christmas Wish List along.

POTATO POISONING
All parts of the potato 

plant except its root tubers 
(potatoes) contain the potent 
poison, SOLANINE. How­
ever, the potatoes them­
selves become loaded with 
solanine a few days after 
they begin sprouting. 
Vomiting, diarrhea and fever 
• even death may result. 
Cooking cannot remove the 
solanine - throw away any 
potatoes that begin to sprout 
and have lost their firmness 
or are discolored.

VISIT SANTA AND HOMER
JACKSON OFFICE
2:30pm-4:30pm Monday, December 17

KEWASKUM OFFICE
2:30pm-4:30pm Tuesday, December 18

GERMANTOWN OFFICE
2:30pm-4:30pm Wednesday, December 19

SLINGER OFFICE
2:30pm-4:3Opm Thursday, December 20
MAIN OFFICE
2:30pm-6:00pm Friday, December 21

Merry Christmas 
from I sue

Preventive medicine 
is your best medicine

West Bend Savings
and Loan Association

WEST BEND • GERMANTOWN • JACKSON • SLINGER • KEWASKUM

Kennelly 
Pharmacy

927 Fond du Lac Ave. 
Kewaskum 626-8001
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Mona Anderson

Mona Anderson, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Anderson 
of rural Kewaskum, and Tom 
Herriges, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Raynor Herriges of Kewaskum, 
have been chosen as the 
Kiwanis students of the month 
of December.

Mona was inducted into the 
National Honor Society during 
her junior year. She has been in 
chorus for four years including 
girls’ choir, mixed choir, triple 
trio, swing choir, and honors 
choir. She participated in the 
state Solo Ensemble during her

SCHOOL 
LUNCH 

MENUS

KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 
SCHOOLS

Monday, Dec. 17 — Ham­
burger and cheese on a bun, 
French fries, sweet & dill 
pickles, fried onions and choc, 
brownie.

Tuesday, Dec. 18 — Tacos in 
a bowl (cheese, meat, lettuce, &

Sun. Afternoon 
Mon. & Tues. Eves.

ALL SEATS $1.50

CINEMA I
Fri., Dec. 14 - Thurs., Dec. 20

STARMAN
Eves 7 & 9 Rated PG
Sun. 1, 3, 5, 7 & 9

CINEMA II 
Fri., Dec. 14 - Thurs.. Dec. 20

TOP 
SECRET

Eves 7 & 9 Rated PG
Sun. 1, 3, 5. 7 A 9 
-------- ------ . ■ , . .^

freshman year. She was a 
sophomore member of the 
volleyball team and a junior 
member of German Club. Mona 
was on the Junior Prom Court 
and the 1984 Homecoming 
queen. She was the Badger 
Girls State alternate. This year 
she is a student government 
representative. She was a foot­
ball cheerleader as a freshman, 
a basketball cheerleader as a 
sophomore and senior and a 
wrestling cheerleader as a 
junior. She is listed in Who’s 
Who Among American High

hot sauce) hot buttered rice, 
pumpkin muffin and pears.

Wednesday, Dec. 19 — Hot 
dog- in a bun, raw onions, 
pork-n-beans, slice of cheese, 
carrot sticks and apple crisp. 
(Salad Bar - High School Only).

Thursday, Dec. 20 — Roasted 
chicken, mashed potatoes, 
gravy, buttered corn, home­
made dinner rolls and choc, 
torte with cream.

Friday, Dec. 21 — Cheese & 
sausage pizza at Elem. - pep­
peroni pizza at Mid. & H.S., 
lettuce salad, applesauce and 
chilled peaches.

Each meal served with home­
made bread, butter and milk. 
Menus are subject to change.

HOLY TRINITY
Monday, Dec. 17 — Ham- 

burger/bun w/the works, 
potatoe rounds, fresh fruit, 
cherry pudding cake, milk.

December 19 — Chile, cheese 
slice, dinner roll, pear slices, 
milk.

Wednesday, Dec. 19 —

AMERAHN
Mile N. of Kewaskum on Hwy. 45

FRIDAY, DEC, 14 — 8:30 to 12:30

BOB KUETHER
Sponsored by the Beechwood Fire Dept.

MONDAY, DEC. 17 — 6:30 to ? 
New Merchandise 

AUCTION

Tom Herriges

School Students.
Tom is a four-year member of 

the football team and this year 
was named first team all-con­
ference offensive end. He is 
also a four-year member of the 
basketball team. As a junior, 
Tom was a member of the 
Homecoming court and this 
year was the Homecoming king. 
He was also on the Prom court 
last year. He is a two-year 
member of the Letterman’s 
Club. He is the senior class vice 
president and a member of the 
Academic Decathalon group.

Turkey slice /bun, fluffy rice, 
buttered corn, veggie stix, 
Christmas cookie, milk.

Thursday, Dec. 20 — Hot 
dog/bun, sauerkraut, yellow 
beans, peas, milk.

Friday, Dec. 21 — Fish and 
chips, creamy cole slaw, peach 
cup, milk.

Have a very Merry Christmas 
see you Wednesday, January 2, 
1985.

NUTRITION PROGRAM 
FOR THE ELDERLY MENU

Kewaskum Legion Hall 
1538 Fond du Lac Avenue 
Kewaskum Site Manager 

Dolores Kleinke 626-2420 
For reservation call 

between 10:30 & 1:30
Monday, Dec. 7 — Baked 

Stuffed cabbage rolls, oven 
browned potatoes, buttered wax 
beans, whole wheat bread 
w/butter, fresh apple, milk and 
coffee.

Tuesday, Dec. 18 — Tomato

juice, tenderlion tips w/mush- 
room gravy, buttered egg 
noodles, buttered carrot, broc­
coli, and cauliflower blend, 7 
grain bread w/butter, chocolate 
ice cream, milk and coffee.

Thursday, Dec. 20 — 
Barbequed pork loin, boiled 
potatoes in jackets, buttered 
green cabbage, rye bread 
w/butter, apple pie, milk and 
coffee.

FOND DU LAC COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM

FOR THE ELDERLY
Campbellsport Community 

Center
Monday, Dec. 17 — Meat 

loaf, boiled potatoes, carrots, 
lettuce, rhubarb cobbler.

Tuesday, Dec. 18 — Canned 
pork, rice, squash, stewed 
apples, kolachi.

Wednesday, Dec. 19 — 
Baked spam, escalloped pota­
toes, wax beans, carrot salad, 
apple squares.

Thursday, Dec. 20 — Cream­
ed chicken & noodles, stewed 
carrots, cabbage slaw, cornmeal 
buns, oatmeal cookies.

Friday, Dec. 21 — Macaroni 
& cheese, green beans, devilled 
eggs, tomato juice, fruit & 
cookie.

Coffee, 2% milk, bread, and 
butter are served with meals.

In the Service
Airman Scott G. Rosenthal, 

son of Gordon E. and Patricia E. 
Rosenthal of 5012 Beaver Dam 
Road, West Bend, has 
graduated from the U.S. Air 
Force inventory management 
course at Lowry Air Force Base, 
Colo.

During the course, students 
were taught property account­
ing, customer support, stock

BIG BAND DANCING 
with the 

BOB KUETHER ORCHESTRA 
Sunday, Dec. 16 

at 

MARGHAEL’S HALL
Hwy. 175 North of Fond du Lac

DANCING 2 TO 6 P.M. ADMISSION $3.00
Playing the Tops in Big Band Music — DON’T MISS IT!

HOLIDAY DANCE
1985 European 

Tour Presentation
by

THE BUCHELS with 
JOEY KLASS ORCHESTRA

Friday, Dec. 28
Dance - 8:30 P.M. to 12:30 A.M.

PRESENTATION - 9:30-10:00 P M 

at

AMERAHN
Kewaskum, Wisconsin

ADMISSION $1 50 Advance $2.00 At Door

* DOOR PRIZES * 
Support the Beechwood PTO

control and equipment manage­
ment for a base supply system. 
They also were taught to 
inventory supplies using 
electronic data processing 
machines. The graduates 
earned credits toward an 
associate degree through the 
Community College of the Air 
Force.

He was an honor graduate of 
the course.

Rosenthal is scheduled to 
serve with the 3345th Supply 
Squadron at Chanute Air Force 
Base, Ill.

He is a 1984 graduate of 
Kewaskum High School.

Schwalbach to 
Seek Re-Election

Judge James B. Schwalbach 
announced that he would seek 
re-election to Washington 
County Circuit Court Branch 2 
in the spring election on April 2, 
1985.

In announcing, Judge 
Schwalbach said, “I have been 
privileged to have had the 
opportunity to serve the citizen 
of Washington County as their 
Judge since 1977. I hope that 
my nearly 16 years as a judge 
and trial attorney warrants my 
re-election to another term.”

Judge Schwalbach was 
appointed as Washington 
County District Attorney in 1973 
and elected to a full term in 
1974. While practicing as a 
private attorney in West Bend, 
he was appointed as Washing­
ton County Judge. Branch 1. In 
1978 in1 was elected to a full 
term. Under the court reorgani­
zation’of 1978, Branch 1 of the 
County Court became Washing­
ton County Circuit Court Branch 
2.

Judge Schwalbach resides 
with his wife, Mckay, and their 
son Matthew at 638 Vine Street, 
West Bend.
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Mrs. Sabena Stern, Others Die

Mrs. Walter (Marie S.) Dei, 
74, of Kewaskum, who with her 
husband formerly owned and 
operated the Kewaskum Opera 
House for 26 years, passed 
away Saturday evening, Dec. 8, 
1984, at St. Joseph’s Com­
munity Hospital in West Bend 
where she had been a patient 
for several weeks.

She was born in Harrington, 
Kansas, on September 8, 1910, 
to the late John C. and Anna 
Kimmel Strackbein. On June 
28, 1930, she married Walter A. 
Dei in North Milwaukee, where 
they lived until moving to the 
Kewaskum area 37 years ago.

Mrs. Dei was a member of 
the Washington County Demo­
cratic Party for many years.

Survivors include her hus­
band; two sons, Byron (Lucille) 
of Kewaskum and Donald 
(Barbara) of Racine; 11 grand­
children; five great-grand­
children; two sisters, Mrs. 
Emily Dei of Cedarburg and 
Mrs. Anna Staab of Milwaukee; 
other relatives and friends.

Visitation at Miller’s Funeral 
Home in Kewaskum was after 4 
p.m. Monday. Services were 
held at the funeral home on 
Tuesday at 2 p.m. with Pastor 
Adolf Quast of Our Savior’s 
Lutheran Church in West Bend 
officiating. Burial was in Grace­
land Cemetery, Milwaukee.

HAROLD SCHNOOKIE’ STERN
Harold "Schnookie” Stern, 55, 

of 9266 Forest View Rd., Kewas­
kum, passed away Tuesday 
evening, Dec. 11, 1984, at St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital in 
West Bend where he had been a 
patient for two days.

He was born on October 18, 
1929, in the Town of Kewaskum 
to Carl and Mathilda Marquardt 
Stern. On February 28, 1953, he 
married Shirley Otto. Mr. Stern 
served with the Armed Forces 
during the Korean Conflict from 
1951-1953. He retired as an auto 
mechanic from Honeck Chevrolet 
in Kewaskum, having been 
employed there for 291/* years. 
He was a member of the Robert 
G. Romaine American Legion 
Post #384 and St. Lucas Lutheran 
Church in Kewaskum.

Survivors include his wife; one 
son, Thomas, at home; his

STOP IN AND COMPARE! 
Our Prices Beat the Competition

Paint Sticks 

Dual Pen 
Teat Shield 
Cystorelin 
Oxy Tet 10 
Iron Dextran

Animal Health Care Products 
Available in a Retail Setting

Friendly Professional Staff 
to Assist You

Oxytocin 

Cefa-Dri
Iodine Spray

Roux Syringe

mother, Mrs. Mathilda Stern of 
Kewaskum; one brother, 
Sylvester Stern of West Bend; 
two sisters, Mrs. Elroy (Evelyn) 
Uelmen of West Bend and Mrs. 
Gilbert (Dolores) Petry of 
Menomonee Falls, his mother-in- 
law, Mrs. Frieda Ramthun of 
Kewaskum; other relatives and 
friends.

His father and brother Michael 
preceded him in death.

Services will be held on Thurs­
day evening at 8:00 p.m. at 
Miller’s Funeral Home in Ke­
waskum, with Pastor Paul 
Hoenecke officiating. Burial will 
be Friday at 10:00 a.m. at 
Lutheran Memorial Park 
Cemetery in Kewaskum. Military 
graveside services will be con­
ducted at that time.

Visitation at the funeral home 
will be after 3:30 p.m. Thursday.

MRS. SABENA STERN
Mrs. Sabena J. Stern, 83 of 

475 Meadowbrook Drive, West 
Bend, formerly of Kewaskum, 
passed away Tuesday, Decem­
ber 11, 1984, at St. Mary’s 
Hospital in Milwaukee where 
she had been a patient for one 
week.

She was born on March 26, 
1901, in the Town of Farming­
ton to the late August and 
Louise Bledow Schulz. On 
October 16, 1920, she married 
Henry W. Stern in Silver Creek. 
He passed away on June 10, 
1970.

Mrs. Stern was a former 
employee of Regal Ware Inc. in 
Kewaskum for 18 years and a 
member of the Peace United 
Church of Christ in Kewaskum.

Mrs. Stern is survived by 
three children, one daughter, 
Mrs. Gladys (Marvin) Tackes of 
Kewaskum, two sons, Gerold 
(Donna) of Kewaskum and 
Ralph (Diane) of West Bend; 18 
grandchildren; four great 
grandchildren; three brothers, 
Elmer of Blaine, Washington, 
Wilmer of Cato, Wis. and Harry 
of Manitowoc; two sisters, Mrs. 
Linda Klein of Milwaukee and 
Mrs. Helen Fellenz of Saukville; 
other relatives and friends. Two 
children, one great-great grand­
child and four brothers pre­
ceded her in death.

Retail Convenience with the 
Professional Advantage”

Rhinipig
Rhinitis Protection

Bova Creme 
Calf Feeder

Services will be held at the 
Peace United Church of Christ 
on Friday at 2 p.m. with Rev. 
Darrell Joiner officiating. Burial 
will be in St. Martin’s Union 
Cemetery in Fillmore.

Visitation will be after 3:00 
p.m. Thursday at Miller’s 
Funeral Home in Kewaskum 
and at the church on Friday 
from 12 noon to time of ser­
vices.

ROY W. BACKHAUS
Roy W. Backhaus, 60, of 7670 

Tower Dr., West Bend, former­
ly of Campbellsport, passed 
away Tuesday evening, Decem­
ber 4, at St. Joseph’s Com­
munity Hospital in West Bend 
where he had been a patient for 
three weeks.

He was born in the Town of 
Ashford on August 21, 1924 to 
the late Oscar and Alvina Pitt 
Backhaus. He was engaged in 
farming all of his life. Mr. 
Backhaus never married.

He was a member of the 
Kewaskum Pentecostal Church 
of God.

Survivors include one sister, 
Mrs. Hazel (Edward) Blank of 
West Bend; one niece, Nancy 
Blank; other relatives and 
friends.

Services were conducted at 2 
p.m. at Miller’s Funeral Home 
in Kewaskum on Saturday, 
December 8, with Pastor 
Charles E. Bowman officiating. 
Burial was in Union Cemetery 
at Campbellsport.

Visitation was Friday after 4 
p.m.

DANIEL ZEMAN
Daniel E. Zeman, 30, of 130 

Sheboygan St., Campbellsport, 
died Saturday, Dec 8, 1984, of 
injuries received in a traffic 
accident on County Trunk Y, 
east of Campbellsport.

He was born July 12, 1954, at 
Fond du Lac, the son of Gerald 
and Valarie Hanson Zeman. He 
married Patricia Wilcox on 
March 15, 1975, at Luther 
Memorial Church, Fond du Lac. 
Mr. Zeman was employed by 
Stella Cheese Co. He was a 
member of the National Rifle 
Association.

Survivors include his wife; 
one son, Matthew; three 
brothers, Darrel of Fond du Lac, 
Paul of Sheboygan and Randy of

intellectual
* emotional
* social

Christmas gift offer...
introduction to preschool J

338-3833
Preschool Activity J 

Center, Inc.

Kewaskum; two sisters, Mrs. 
John (Peggy) Beesley of 
Howards Grove and Miss Nancy 
Zeman of Cleveland; and his 
parents of Campbellsport. He 
was preceded in death by one 
brother and his grandparents.

Funeral services for Mr. 
Zeman were held at 10:30 a.m. 
Tuesday at Zacherl Funeral 
Home, Fond du Lac. The Rev. 
Martin Koehler officiated. 
Burial was in Estabrooks 
Cemetery.

Visitation was from 3 to 9 
p.m. Monday at the funeral 
home.

MRS. FLORENCE FOX
Mrs. Florence Fox, 78, 204 

Center St., Eden, died Friday, 
Dec. 7, 1984, in Phoenix, Ariz.

She was born April 23, 1906, 
in Eden, the daughter of 
Charles L. and Mary Sammons 
Hillebrand. She married 
Raymond Fox on Nov. 25, 1925, 
at St. Mary’s Church in Eden. 
He passed away April 30, 1969.

The couple operated a tavern 
in Eden for 30 years. She was a 
member of St. Mary’s Church, 
its Altar Society, Royal Neigh­
bors and the Eden and Camp­
bellsport Senior Citizens.

SHRIMP
LARGE, FANCY, HEADLESS, GULF

Also — Lobster Tails, Scallops, Frog Legs, 
X-tra Jumbo Peeled and Deveined Shrimp, Etc.

LAST SALE THIS YEAR!

Sunday, Dec. 16
10 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.

OL TYME CLEANERS LOT
S. Main St., West Bend (Across from McDonalds)

Survivors include one son, 
James of Fond du Lac; one 
daughter, Mrs. Marie Casetta 
of Phoenix; eight grandchildren 
and six great-grandchildren. 
She was also preceded in death 
by one brother and one sister.

Funeral services were held 
Wednesday at 10 a.m. at the 
Twohig Funeral Home, Camp­
bellsport, and at 10:30 a.m. at 
St. Mary’s Church, Eden. The 
Rev. Walter Gehl officiated. 
Burial was in the church 
cemetery. *

Friends called Tuesday from 
3:30 to 8:30 p.m. at the funeral 
home.

MONUMENTS
* Uprights and Flat 
* Markers of all Kinds
* Completely installed
* Death Date put on
* Mausoleums

VINCE’S 
MONUMENTS

US? Highway « 
In Ashford

Phone 533-8178

Liquamycin LA 200 Sulfa Urea Boluses 50’s
Rumax Magnets Teat Dilators Albon Cefa Lac

WOODVIEW VETERINARY CLINIC
Northpoint Shopping Center

Hwy. 45 N ., West Bend
OPEN N A M TO 5:30 I* M 338-1838
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The following news story was 

written by Sandra Axtman of 
Grafton, a classmate of R. G. 
Edwards, M.D., Kewaskum, 
who is attending classes in 
Creative Writing at Concordia 
College.

There is something lost today 
to families that was often a way 
of life when 1 was growing up. It 
fell under the heading of the 
Bible verse, “Feed my lambs.” 
When I was little it seemed like 
our house was the parade route 
for relatives who had neither 
home nor family. I suppose it 
had a lot to do with the 
depression era that my parents 
grew up in everyone helped 
each other! When my Great- 
Grandmother Fligge died and 
my Dad was fourteen years old, 
he went to live with an older 
sister and her husband. When 
he married my Mother they 
lived with my maternal grand­
mother until I was born. Even 
then the move was only to the 
back cottage on the same city 
lot. People cared about each 
other, to the point that often 
children found themselves
giving up a room so that Uncle 
Joe didn’t have to live on the 
street.

My first live-in relative that I 
can remember was Uncle 
Harold. At six years of age I 
hardly was aware of what the 
circumstances were surround­
ing his untimely arrival. I do 
remember feeling very sorry for 
him — after all he had no one! 
There were whispers about a 
woman, a child, his drinking, 
and instructions not to bother 
him because he was sick! My 
Dad built a room in the attic of 
our Milwaukee bungalow for 
Uncle Harold; it was small and 
in the back of the house. My 
brother and I often tip-toed to 
his room, being careful to avoid 
the floor boards that creaked. 
There we would peek in to see if 
he was still alive! Why would he

GERI’S 
Beauty Salon

114 Main St. - Kewaskum 
FEATURING

Family Hair Styling 
In Savings & Loan Bldg. 

(Rear Entrance)
PHONE 626-4455

Call for an appointment 
PHONE 626-2616

- CLOSED MONDAYS -

*MiiHiiaW(mii»*»W!^

GIFTS WRAPPED FREE

/Open late
NOW ’TIL

1 Christmas

be asleep at 2:00 in the after­
noon? Why did he come home 
so late at night? Why did such a 
strong smell permeate the room 
when he entered? If he was 
sick, why didn’t he have to stay 
in bed like we usually did when 
we were ill? We asked these 
questions often of ourselves, 
but never did we dare question 
him. Finally one day he was 
gone. He eloped with a very 
nice lady and we were, in our 
child like way, relieved. We 
were happy for him because he 
had someone to care about him!

Our next live-in relative was 
Uncle Charlie, although not 
really an uncle. He was my 
great-grandmother’s cousin 
who had lived with her and my 
great-grandfather since the day 
he arrived from Germany. 
Charlie was a small man, stout 
in stature and bald. Old family 
pictures all show him sporting 
the same sullen look. I was 
older when Uncle Charlie joined 
our family, as a result of my 
Grandmother’s death. By then 
we had moved and because of 
his arrival some switching of
rooms was needed and I ex­
changed my large bedroom for a 
much smaller one. But there 
was no complaining because we 
had to do what was necessary, 
afterall Uncle Charlie had no 
one. He was 75 years old, and 
all his possessions could have fit 
into an over sized closet. He had 
a bed, a large radio, and his

230 Main St., Kewaskum

Services Offered:
• MEN’S & WOMEN’S 

HAIRCUTS
• SHAMPOO & SETS
• MEN’S & WOMEN’S PERMS
• HAIRCOLORING
• MANICURES
• CHINA SILK NAILS
• REMOVAL OF UNWANTED 

HAIR (Waxing]

Christmas 
Store Hours

— OPEN —
Mon. - Fri. 8 a.m. - 8 p.m.
Saturday 8 a.m. - 4 p.m.

CLOSING AT 2 P.M.
Monday, Dec. 24

* LAY AWAY *

television set, that had a tiny 
viewing screen.

Uncle Charlie was hard of
hearing and wore a hearing aid. 
My brother and I would mouth 
words in front of him so that he 
would think his batteries were 
wearing down. We would laugh 
to ourselves for succeeding in 
tormenting him. He was always 
a good sport and I think he 
sometimes played at the game 
too. Whispers surrounded 
Uncle Charlie too! His eyes 
were filled with despair. He 
would sit for hours, hands 
folded in his lap, watching and 
waiting. I wondered what he 
thought about; did a man his 
age have dreams? Did he only 
have his memories? Did he 
count for anything in God’s 
plan? There were rumors about 
a girlfriend many years before 
when he was younger; a jilted 
relationship, and years of 
solitude that followed - but he 
remained silent!

Even his death was unevent­
ful. He passed away quietly in 
his sleep. Family members 
went through his meager be­
longings, much of which were 
very outdated and worn. At his 
funeral I shed tears for his
loneliness in this life.

I really believe that because 
my parents cared enough to 
give homes to my homeless 
relatives it has given me an 
awareness and sensitivity of 
older people. It instilled in me a 
need for a family and a need to 
be surrounded by love. Our 
children miss this opportunity 
today because old people are 
only accepted as long as they 
behave themselves and are 
productive. When they fail 
society, they are neatly packed 
away in a nursing home. Uncle 
Charlie and Uncle Harold did

?Mffl i?Wl^
Holiday Sausage Gift Boxes 

Made to Order
SELECT FROM:

• Grand Champion Summer Sausage in 1 lb., 2 lb., 31/2 lb. sizes
• Smoked Breakfast Links
• Smoked Pork Sausage
• Polish Sausage
• Ring Bologna
• Mettwurst 

k • Honey Grove Pure Honey in Decorative Jars
• Cheesy

PACKAGING $2.25

Place Orders Now for the Holidays
Call 626-2710

OR COME IN TO ORDER AT
118 Forest Ave. Kewaskum K ^^^J

have a purpose in my life - they 
taught me to be sensitive and 
not to dispose of feelings for the 
elderly just because they no 
longer function as the young do.

I will always remember a 
story I read about an Indian 
family. It was written that it 
was the custom in a small 
village in India for a family to 
dispose of their parents when 
the “old ones” could no longer 
perform, but became a burden 
to them. The father would put 
the old man or old lady in a 
large wicker basket and carry 
them down to the sea shore and 
there they would wait for the 
sea to carry them off. On one 
such occasion a young boy 
watched tearfully as his ailing 
grandmother was carried away 
in the basket by his father. 
When his father returned, 
empty basket in hand, the boy 
said, “Father, put the basket 
away in a place where I can find 
it.” “Why?” said the father. 
The son replied, “I will need it 
to carry you in for your journey 
to the sea someday.”

KHS STUDENT GOVERNMENT

FOOD DRIVE
Mon., Dec. 3 — Fri., Dec. 21

Drop off boxes will be located at Sentry Foods, Rich's Super 
Savings, KB Lettering, Homeplate, Campbell's Village Inn, 
Kennelly Pharmacy and at the High School.

NOVENA TO ST. JUDE
O holy St. Jude Apostle and 

Martyr, great in virtue and rich 
in miracles, near kinsman of 
Jesus Christ, faithful inter­
cessor of ail who invoke your 
special patronage in time of 
need, to you I have recourse 
from the depth of my heart and 
humbly beg to whom God has 
given such great power to come 
to my assistance.

Help me in my present urgent 
petition. In return, I promise to 
make your name known and 
cause you to be invoked, say 
three Our Fathers, three Hail 
Marys and three Glorias. St. 
Jude pray for us, and all who 
invoke your aid. Amen.

This Novena has never been 
known to fail. This Novena must 
be said for 9 consecutive days, 
and publication must be 
promised.

A.A.R.

Spend your money wisely. Ad­
vertise in the Statesman.

STEINER'S 
OF KEWASKUM | 
AIMfflH
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AGENTORANGE

Vietnam veterans have a 
unique opportunity to take 
advantage of a settlement that 
was announced recently in a 
lawsuit against the manu­
facturers of the herbicide, 
Agent Orange. However, to 
take advantage of this settle­
ment, the veterans must file an 
"Agent Orange Claim Form"

must file within four months of 
the development of the dis­
abilities.

Benefits can be awarded for
disabilities suffered 
veteran and for birth 
believed to be related 
posure. Next of kin can 
death benefits.

by a ' 
defects 
to ex­
file for

with the Court by 
January 2, 1985.

On May 7, 1984, : 
settlement was 
between seven

midnight,

a tentative 
reached 

chemical
companies and attorneys for 
Vietnam veterans. That settle­
ment would create a $180 
million trust fund to benefit 
veterans and their families who 
suffer from the adverse health 
affects of exposure to Agent 
Orange. Veterans who claim 
their health has been affected 
should file the Claim Form.

The Vietnam Veterans of 
America’s legal department has 
prepared a set of instructions to 
assist veterans or their sur­
viving family members in 
completing the Claim Form. 
VVA is distributing both the 
Claim Form and instructions to 
veterans who contact them.

Under the settlement, 
Vietnam veterans must file by 
January 2nd for present and 
past disabilities. For disabilities 
that first appear after January 
2nd, veterans can file but they

Vietnam veterans can receive 
a copy of the claims form 
needed to file under the settle­
ment, plus a booklet explaining 
the litigation and the claims 
form, by contacting their 
County Veterans Service Office. 
If you have any problems 
locating your county office call 
the state VVA director Steve 
Piotrowski at (715) 341-6418 or 
(715) 346-1311.

AMERICAN LUNG ASSOCIATION

CHRISTMAS SEALS FIGHT LUNG DISEASE — Surrounded by some of the 
three billion Christmas Seals distributed nationwide this fall, American 
Lung Association of Wisconsin President David L. Vollmar urged 
Washington County residents to increase their contributions to the 
association’s 1984 campaign to fight lung disease. Vollmar noted that 
although donations for the state Christmas Seal campaign have risen an 
average of eight percent annually for the past six years, deaths from chronic 
lung disease are increasing at a rate of 10 percent a year.

4“*

SEASON S GREETINGS IW

STYLING

PERM WAVING

EYE BROW 
ARCHING

MANICURES

338-0033446 S. Main St.

FOR YOUR
CHRISTMAS LIST

TREES & WREATHS

Balsam — 4 to 12 ft.
Duffel Bag PLAIN

SPECIAL 
PRICES

$3.50
$12.953- %J

I 1

4 0 
4 0 
J 
« 0 
4 0 
4 0 
J 
5

INTRODUCES

Lisa Justman
A Graduate of IBA Beauty 

College of Milwaukee

To Welcome Her to Our Staff, We Are 
Offering You a ...

PERM on% OFFSPECIAL .. ZU /O amp.™.
Perm Offer Good Only With Lisa's 
Appointments thru Dec 22. 1984

Lisa’s Hours: Tues 3-9, Wed 8-5, Thurs. & 
Fri. 8-12 & 4-9, Sat 8-4 30

Courage 
Cards

Help People with Disabilities
Call or write for

FREE Cards Catalog
COURAGE CENTER
3915 Golden Valley Road
Golden Valley. MN 55422 • (612) 588-0811

HAIR CUTS

Family Hair Salon
227 Main St., Kewaskum

(Nolting Building)

626-2650

MAKEUP HAIR COLORING

TOTAL SERVICE SALON

HOURS: Mon. 8-8, TuM.-Fri. 8-9, Sat 7-4:30
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Quality Christmas 
— TREES —

No.
No.
No.

1 
1
1

4
White Pine — 7 to 8 ft. 1
Scotch Pine — 5 to 8 ft.4

DECORATED
— WREATHS —

18” -$6.00
24”-$7.50

36”-$12.00

4

Hwy. 45 South of Kewaskum

OPEN — Weekdays 9 - 8; Weekends 9 - 4

sum mW*®WRSERV GARMM CiXTTX

PHONE 626-4660
C'4»«xi»c»#it><

o 
i
40
4 a
4 o
4 acx»&M

Kewaskum Indians T-Shirt..........
Gold Hooded Zipper Sweatshirts.

(For Under Letter Jackets)

Kewaskum Nylon School Jackets

Gift Certificates

KEWASKUM

W/NAME

! School SOCkS (All Kewaskum Schools). . .

□ Personalized Christmas Stockings

$24.95 
$3.99 
$5.99 
$7.50 
$5.00 -ul? 
$2.99 
$1.50

WE HAVE KEWASKUM LETTER JACKETS IN STOCK
(Boys and Girls Styles)

Letferin
409 Main St. 
Kewaskum 

PHONE 626-8094
HOURS: M-Th 10 - 5:30, Fri. 10 - 8; Sat. 9 - 12
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25 Years Ago
December 11, 1959

A haymaker and its contents 
of about 100 tons of hay were 
destroyed by fire at the John 
Pamperin farm about 1'A miles 
west of Kohlsville early Sunday 
evening. The loss is estimated 
at approximately $5,500. 
Pamperin’s son, Walter, 
operates the farm. The blaze in 
the haymaker, a 50 foot high, 
metal silo type structure, was 
discovered about 4:45 p.m. by 
Ray Pamperin, another son. He 
made an attempt to put out the 
fire with a hand extinguisher 
but the flames had already 
gained too much headway. 
Walter called the Kohlsville and 
Allenton fire departments and 
later the Kewaskum Fire De­
partment was summoned. 
While the hay in the haymaker 
was burning out, firemen con­
centrated their efforts on saving 
the large barn only a few feet 
away and other buildings. They 
kept the barn soaked almost 
constantly and the cold weather 
came to their assistance as ice 
formed on the roof of the barn 
and prevented it from catching 
fire. The barn was saved from 
fire damage, fortunately, and 
only the haymaker was burned 
out and its contents of hay 
destroyed.

Santa Claus will be in Kewas­
kum on December 19 for the 
annual Christmas party for the 
kiddies at the theatre, spon­
sored by the Kewaskum 
Kiwanis Club The theatre 
doors will be open at 1 p.m. and 
Santa has promised that he will 
arrive promptly at 1:30. He will 
be escorted to the theatre on the 
fire truck to meet all the little 
tots and present each and every 
one of them with free popcorn 
and candy. After Santa has had 
time to visit with all the children 
and give them then goodies, 
free movies will be shown at 2 
p.m.

At the December meeting of 
the Kewaskum Fire Depart­
ment, held last Thursday 
evening, all of the present 
officers were re-elected for 
1960. They are: Assistant Chief, 
Armin Oppermann; Foreman, 
Bill Martin; Assistant Foreman, 
Bob Ours; Treasurer, Harry 
Koch, and Secretary, George 
Koerble. Chief Harry Schaefer, 
who is appointed by the village 
board, is serving a five-year 
term in that capacity.

Wedding vows were ex­
changed by Miss Beverly M. 
Ruth, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
William Ruth, Route 2, Camp­
bellsport, and Jerome A. Nigh,

Don Herriges 
Heating

25 YEARS OF SERVICE
• 24 Hour Burner Service
• Gas - Oil Furnaces
• Gas - Oil Boilers
• Woodstove - Boilers 
• Aprllaire Humidifiers 
• Interburners
• Add-ons 
ooooooooooooooo

96% Tightfist II 
Whirlpool

Gas Furnace
ALL TYPES OF

SHEET METAL WORK
For Free Estimate Call

Donald Herriges
604 Mill Rd., New Fane

Ph. 626-2388

son of Mr. and Mrs. Elmer 
Nigh, also of Route 2, Camp­
bellsport, at Holy Trinity 
Church on November 28.

The Rev. Rayner Hausmann 
read the nuptial mass in Holy 
Angels Church, West Bend, on 
November 28, during which 
wedding vows were exchanged 
by Miss Alice E. Krueger, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
William Krueger, and Andrew 
E. “Gene” Gruber, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. John Gruber of Ke­
waskum.

A daughter was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Ralph Schoofs,1 
Hubertus, on Dec. 1. Mr. 
Schoofs is a son of Mrs. Jos. 
Schoofs, Route 2, Kewaskum.

50 Years Ago
December 14, 1934

The following pupils in the 
primary room of the Kewaskum 
Public School were neither 
absent nor tardy the past six 
weeks: David Backus, Rachael 
Brauchle, Marion Ramthun, 
Jerome Stautz, Lloyd Bruessel. 
Helen Bunkelman, James 
Keller, Lois Klukas, Valeria 
Koerble, Betty Krueger, Ray 
Schneider and Doris Mae Stahl. 
These pupils were the winners 
in the Good Conduct Race: Lois 
Vorpahl, Doris Mae Stahl, Lois 
Koch, Marion Ramthun and 
Rachael Brauchle.

Miss Marcella Casper, a 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. S.N. 
Casper of this village, who 
recently graduated from St. 
Joseph’s School of Nursing, 
Milwaukee, was successful in 
passing the examination given 
by the Wisconsin State Board of 
Health. Miss Casper received 
an average of 87.6, which 
ranked highest in her group of 
125 classmates. She now holds 
the certificate of a registered 
nurse and may append R.N. to 
her name. At present Miss 
Casper is employed at St. 
Joseph’s Hospital, Milwaukee.

Rev. Father Barbian of Mil­
waukee has charge of the St. 
Michael’s congregation until a 
different priest has been ap­
pointed by Rev. Archbishop 
Samuel E. Stritch to take the 
place of Father Beyer.

Miss Charlotte Lay, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Otto Lay, and 
Miss Linda Rosenheimer, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Newton Rosenheimer, Kewas­
kum, were given parts in the 
annual Christmas play to be 
given by students of Milwau­
kee-Downer College on Decem­
ber 15. Both of the girls were 
graduated from Kewaskum 
High School and Miss Lay is 
now a junior, while Miss Rosen­
heimer is a sophomore at the 
college.

Word was received here

LOW PRESCRIPTION PRICES
• We fill prescriptions from all physicians
• Patient profiles for insurance & tax records
• Free city delivery
• Prompt courteous service
• Open Mon., Tues., Thurs., Fri., 1-6
• Generic drug program

Kewaskum Professional 
Pharmacy

1040 Fond du Lac Ave. Kewaskum
UPSTAIRS - SISON MEDICAL CLINIC

PHONE 626-4222

Tuesday of the sudden death of 
Arthur T. Barlass, president of 
the Kewaskum Creamery 
Company, which occurred at a 
hospital in Chicago on Tuesday 
morning.

75 Years Ago
December 11, 1909

A chimney fire on Dr. H. 
Driessel’s residence caused a 
great deal of excitement last 
Sunday evening. The chimney 
burned for some time and threw 
out showers of sparks. Luckily 
the neighboring buildings were 
wet, otherwise a bad fire might 
have resulted.

Richard Heinemann sold 80 
acres of land in the New Fane 
area to Fred Haack for $3,000, 
and the latter sold 40 acres to 
his brother Bernard for $1,500.

During the process of 
butchering, Mrs. F. Pietschman 
of Boltonville recently met with 
the misfortune of having the top 
of her index finger completely 
severed. The injured finger is 
again healing nicely.

Two below zero was register­
ed at Beechwood on Wednesday 
morning.

The Athena Society of the 
Kewaskum High School will 
meet Tuesday evening in the 
assembly room. The following 
program will be given: Decla­
mation, Herman Krueger; 
Recitation, Olive Haug; Vocal 
Duet, Viola Hennings and 
Lillian Krahn; Recitation, 
Frieda Gales; Reading, Edna 
Schmidt; Piano Duet, Edna 
Guth and Adela Dahlke; Recita­
tion, Frank Bieck; Reading, 
Belinda Backhaus; Song by the 
Society.

John Bruesewitz of the Town 
of Scott sold his 80 acre farm 
including personal property last 
week to John Naumann for 
$9,700; and August Bruesewitz 
sold his 120 acre farm to Peter 
Fellenz for $8,500. Mr. Bruese­
witz at the same time bought 
the Henry Klumb 120 acre farm 
in Scott.

A baby girl arrived to 
brighten the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. William Lay of Wayne last 
week Thursday evening. A baby 
girl was also born to Mr. and 
Mrs. George Martin of West 
Bend last Sunday.

XYZ CLUB SKAT RESULTS
The XYZ Club Skat results at 

the Legion Hall on Wednesday 
morning, December 5, were as 
follows: Allen Reindl, 20-4—16 
net; Frank Sell, 22-6—16 net; 
Joe Miller, 16-3—13 net; 
Harold Eggert, 12-4—8 net.

American Red Cross to Aid 
African Famine Victims

The American Red Cross has 
sent two fact-finding teams to 
Africa to assess the famine 
caused by one of the con­
tinent’s worst droughts in 100 
years. The team will visit 
Ethiopia and Mauritania, two 
of the countries most severely 
affected by the drought.

The purpose of the team’s 
visit is to obtain first-hand 
knowledge of drought con­
ditions and to raise the Ameri­
can public’s awareness of the 
situation. In January, the 
American Red Cross will launch 
an African Famine Relief 
Campaign to raise a minimum 
of $5 million.

The money will help some of 
the 180 million people in 27 
African countries who are in 
danger of dying of severe 
malnutrition and starvation. 
The countries affected cover an 
area greater than that of the 
United States and part of 
Canada.

The teams —headed by 
volunteer leaders of the 
American Red Cross and 
American Red Cross President 
Richard F. Schubert—will visit 
famine-relief centers and long 
range development projects 
being implemented by local Red 
Cross and Red Crescent 
societies. The local societies are 
being aided by the League of 
Red Cross and Red Crescent 
Societies.

The league coordinates and 
conducts disaster-relief opera­
tions worldwide. It is made up 
of 135 national Red Cross and 
Red Crescent societies of which 
the American Red Cross is one

Professional
DOG & CAT GROOMING 

By Joy Kuhnke

10% OFF till Christmas
626-2506

MEET FLIP
FLIP is the Newest Member on the NMB Team.

With FLIP’S help your NMB agent can quickly 
analyze your financial security needs and design 
a program for today, while illustrating how 
various interest or inflation rates could affect 
your program tomorrow.

There’s no guesswork, no waiting, and the 
entire Estate Planning process can be accom­
plished in the privacy of your home or office.
Call today.

Donald Bunnow, CLU 
Phone: 334-2261 
Milwaukee Agency 
Jerome A. Zanowski, FIC 
General Agent

of the largest.
Anyone wishing to contribute 

to the African Famine can send 
a check to the Red Cross at 18 
E. Washington St., West Bend, 
Wise. 53095 Marked African 
Relief.

Sensenbrenner
Leaves to Study 
Terrorism Abroad

WASHINGTON, D.C - Con­
gressman F. James Sensen­
brenner, Jr. (R-Menomonee 
Falls, WI.), announced that he, 
Congressman Don Edwards (D- 
CA), and Congresswoman Pat 
Schroeder (D-COLO), are 
traveling to Israel, Turkey, and 
Bulgaria on official business 
December 8th through De­
cember 21st.

Sensenbrenner, as a Member 
of the House Judiciary Commit­
tee, is traveling to these 
countries in an effort to 
coordinate legislative activities 
between these nations and the 
U.S. in order to combat in­
ternational terrorism. The U.S. 
Representatives are planning to 
meet with high level govern­
ment officials, journalists, 
lawyers and various community 
leaders in each country.

Sensenbrenner said, “One of 
the major areas of concern for 
discussion will be the con­
nection between drug traffick­
ing and terrorism. In addition, 
the assassination attempt of the 
Pope and its ties to terrorism 
will be discussed.

Illnllnllnilnllnilnllnlil
NATIONAL 
MUTUAL
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BIRTHPLACE OF 
FLAG DAY

LETTERS TO 
THE EDITOR...

Dec. 5, 1984
Editor,
Kewaskum Statesman 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

West Bend Citizens for 
Decency Through Law are spon­
soring their second contest for 
High School students writing 
essays on the HARMFUL EF­
FECTS OF PORNOGRAPHY. 
First prize will be $150 mini­
mum and $270 maximum. 
Second prize will be $100 
minimum and $160 maximum. 
Third prize will be $50 
minimum and $110 maximum.

Students attending a high 
school in Washington County 
are eligible.

Our youth are being 
bombarded every day with 
pornographic immoralities, but 
seldom are they cautioned 
about the bitter consequences 
of getting involved with porno­
graphy and the philosophy of 
“free and easy sex” that it 
promotes and glamorizes in 
living color.

Federal authorities who see 
the harm done by pornography 
tell us that 75% to 90% of the 
obscene material eventually 
gets into the hands of children: 
Doctors, psychologists and 
psychiatrists who treat the 
young victims tell us about the 
harm it inflicts on them 
mentally, emotionally, physical­
ly and morally, besides the sex 
crimes that it incites. This 
information will be available to 
the contestants.

There is a tremendous need 
to inform and caution our young 
people about the harmful 
effects of obscene material, and 
that is the purpose of our 
contest.

Contest rules and an applica­
tion form will also be available 
after December 9 from the

It’s been 100 years since a 
country schoolteacher, Bernard 
Cigrand, first placed an 
American flag in a bottle on his 
desk at Stony Hill School in 
Waubeka in commemoration of 
the birth of the United States 
flag, June 14.

Now, on the eve of the 100th

ASCS Issues
Wheat and Barley
Deficiency Payments

Depressed grain prices will 
create sizeable deficiency pay­
ments for the 212 Washington 
County producers taking part in 
the 1984 Acreage Reduction 
Program. Deficiency payments 
will be $1.00 per bushel for 
wheat and $.26 per bushel for 
barley. Payments were to be 
mailed around December 10th.

The target price for wheat 
wsa $4.38. The average price 
farmers received for the five 
month marketing period (July - 
November) was $3.38, $1.00 
below the target. Each wheat 
producer’s payment will be 
$1.00 X the ASC yield X the 
acres planted.

The target price for barley 
was $2.60. With an average 
price of $2.34 the deficiency 
payment will be the difference, 
that is $.26 per bushel.

Corn deficiency payments are 
expected to be announced in

anniversary of that event, the 
United States Postal Service has 
announced that it will issue a 
stamp commemorating Flag 
Day. The design was unveiled 
Thursday, Dec. 13, at 1 p.m. in 
ceremonies officiated by 
Postmaster General William F. 
Bolger.

March, as this is a later crop. 
Prices currently are well below 
the $3.03 target price.

The 1985 signup is taking 
place now through March 1. 
Target rates and price support 
loan rates remain the same for 
1985. Price support loans are 
limited to participating farmers. 
Reductions of 30% for wheat
and 10% for corn and small 
grains are required.

409 Main Street 
Kewaskum, WI 53040 

PHONE 626-8094
NEW STORE HOURS

Mon. thruThurs. 10 to 5:30
Fri - 10 to 8; Sat. - 9 to Noon

The unveiling was held at the 
Waubeka, WI Firemen’s Hall.

The stamp will officially be 
introduced next year.

The brief ceremony also 
included comments by John 
Hames, president of the 
National Flag Day Foundation 
and an invocation by Rev. David

L. K. Heating 
and

Sheet Metal
Beechwood

EXPERT HEATING 
SERVICE

New - Replacements - Repairs

• (ias or Oil Furnaces
• Wood and Gas or

Wood and Oil Furnaces

• Wood Add-on Stoves

-All Typ<*s Sheet Metal Work- 
FOR FREE ESTIMATES 

Call

LEE KEMPF
Phone 626-4342
If No Answer Call 626-4 902

1674 Springview Dr.
Kewaskum, WI 53040

Jerger of St. Paul’s Community 
Church, Waubeka.

Fredonia Postmaster Willard 
Kuhfuss presided at the 
ceremonies.

CHRISTMAS 
TREES

• Colorado Blue Spruce
• White Spruce
• Norway Pine
• Scotch Pine
• White Pine
• Balsam

WREATHS
Taking orders 

for wreaths
- ALL SIZES AVAILABLE •

— CERAMICS —
Open 9 to 5, seven days a week

Bartoli's Greenhouse
Four miles north of Kewaskum on Hwy. V

PHONE 533-4092

principals’ offices in the high 
schools, or by dialing the 
sponsors: 338-1596.

West Bend Citizens for 
Decency Through Law, Inc. 
R. Chas. Weier

1883
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4-H NEWS

HAPPY GO LUCKY 4 H CLUB
The November meeting of the 

Happy-Go-Lucky 4-H Club was 
called to order by President 
Shelly Petsch. The pledges 
were said and there were no 
birthdays this month. Andy 
Degnitz gave the secretary’s 
report and there was no trea­
surer’s report. Mrs. McKee 
handed out the achievement 
pins. We got one new member.

For a money-making project 
we are selling M&M’s. Any 
member who would like to sell

Pictured left to right are Curtis Arndt, Mrs. Mary Lou McKee and 
Jennifer Degnitz.

or would need more, please 
contact Mrs. McKee. The cost 
is 50c a box. The club is making 
a quilt for our newly adopted 
grandmother. It will consist of 
quilt squares decorated by the 
members.

Elections were held and the 
new officers are as follows: 
President, Colleen Alsberg; 
Vice President, Andy Degnitz; 
Secretary, Susan Marquardt; 
Treasurer, Shelly Petsch, and 
Reporter, Jennifer Degnitz.

Next month we wilt be having 
our Christmas party on the 
18th. We will be meeting our 
new grandmother and parents 
are welcome. Each member 
should bring 6 cookies and a gift 
that would be suitable for either

On September 24, 1984, two 
members, Curtis Arndt and 
Jennifer Degnitz, and Mrs. 
McKee went to the 4-H Dairy 
Promotion Recognition and 
Awards Banquet. Our club was 
one of three Washington 
County clubs honored. We 
received “best dairy promotion 
idea.” We received this award 
for our cheese sale and window 
display. The event was spon­
sored by Associated Milk Pro­
ducers, Inc. (AMPl) Wisconsin 
Milk Marketing Board, and 
University of Wisconsin Exten­
sion (UWEX).

The meeting was adjourned.
Colleen Alsberg, Reporter

Washington 
county, wis.
SHERIFFS Bl DEPARTMENT

Clarence A. Schwartz, Sheriff

Holiday Safety Tips

The holidays are nearing and 
already busy shoppers are 
hustling and bustling to buy 
their holiday gifts. Washington 
County Sheriff Clarence 
Schwartz offers some safety tips 
to help make your holidays 
happy. “The holidays are a 
special time of year, says 
Sheriff Schwartz, “hut they’re 
also a time when people are 
especially vulnerable to 
burglary, theft and other 
crimes.” We can all take part to 
ensure this holiday is a safe one 
by following these safety tips:

1. To make your shopping 
spree a safe one, always 
remember to walk and park in 
well lighted areas. Walk con­
fidently and always be aware of 
people around you. Always lock 
your car doors after entering or 
leaving your car. Have your car 
keys in hand so you don't have 
to linger before entering your 
car. Check the back seat and 
under the car before you get in.

2. Never leave your children 
alone at home, in a car, or in 
any public place. Teach them to

go for help if they get separated 
from you in a shopping mall - 
have them go to the cashier and 
say they are lost.

3. Don’t “flash” your cash. 
Pay with check and credit cards, 
when you can. Don’t leave 
packages on the car seat. Lock 
them out of sight in the trunk.

4. The holidays are also a 
time when we see more home 
burglaries. Don’t display your 
gifts where they can be seen 
from a window or doorway. Be 
extra cautious about locking 
doors and windows when you 
leave the house, even for a few 
minutes.

“If we're all extra cautious 
this holiday season, we can all 
have a safe and more enjoyable 
one,” Sheriff Schwartz con­
cluded.

About 74 percent of the 
weight of an egg is water.

CHILDREN LEARN 
WHAT THEY LIVE

Have you ever wondered why 
two children can respond so 
differently to the same 
situation? Why does one 
student feel good about a test 
score and another feel dis­
couraged about a test score that 
is exactly the same? What 
makes one boy or girl able to 

“respond positively to a reason­
able explanation for not getting 
a date while another boy or girl 
almost crumbles when they 
think of rejection.

What is this thing that can 
have such a great impact in our 
lives? It is called self-concept. 
All of us, including children, 
have a mental picture of our­
selves. We see ourselves as 
short or tall, a leader or a 
follower, a doughnut or a hole. 
This picture we have of our­
selves is our self-concept.

A positive self-concept re­
presents strong self-approval. 
Such people like themselves, 
are self-confident and self- 
assured. People with positive 
self-concepts do not necessarily 
think of themselves as perfect 
or better than others, but are 
satisfied with themselves the 
way they are.

Here are five steps to help 
build your child’s self-concept:

P - Praise yourself, and help 
others to do the same

R - Respect children
A - Accept children •
I - Invest time in children 4 
S - Set reasonable goals 
E - Evaluate your accomplish­

ments realistically
Helping children develop a 

positive self-concept may be 
one of the most difficult tasks of 
parenting or teaching. There is 
no easy, fool-proof formula for 
accomplishing this. It takes a lot 
of time and effort from concern­
ed adults like you. Remember

what each letter of PRAISE 
stands for and that “Children 
Learn What They Live.”

CHILDREN LEARN 
WHAT THEY LIVE

If a child lives with criticism, 
He learns to condemn.

If a child lives with hostility, 
He learns to fight.

If a child lives with ridicule, 
He learns to be shy.

If a child lives with shame. 
He learns to feel guility.

If a child lives with tolerance, 
He learns to be patient.

If a child lives with encourage­
ment,

He learns to appreciate.
If a child lives with fairness, 

He learns justice.
If a child lives with security, 

He learns to have faith.

If a child lives with approval, 
He learns to like himself.

If a child lives with acceptance 
and friendship,

He learns to find love in the 
world.

Dorothy Law Nolte

James Buchanan, the 15th 
President of the United 
States, was the only bachelor 
President, according to World 
Book Encyclopedia.

We have a full line of wedding 
invitations, napkins and napkin 
rings, matches and yes, even the 
thank you cards It’s all here for 
your choosing so stop in soon.

Kewaskum 
Statesman

LUXURY IMPORTS A DOMESTIC

f TOBACCO a CIGARS T

Now 2 Stores For Your 
Shopping Convenience
West Bend Outlet Mall 
New Store Now Open 
30 to 60% Savings!

□ Cookware
□ Coffee Makers
□ Electric Fry Pans
□ Food Processors

□ Corn Poppers
□ Fondue Sets
□ Microwave

Cookware

All Factory Direct
Holiday Hours thru December 22

Sun. 12:00-5:00 PM
Mon , Thurs., Fri. 9:30 AM-8:00 PM
Tues . Wed . Sat. 9:30 AM-6:00 PM

OUTLET STORE
180 ISLAND AVENUE, WEST BEND 

1308 FOND DU L-AC AVENUE, KEWASKUM
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Board Meeting

Regular Meeting 
December 3, 1984 
8:00 P.M.

The Village Board of Kewas­
kum, Washington County, 
Wisconsin, met in regular 
session in the Council Room of 
the Municipal Building, 204 
First Street.

President Gerald F. Stollen- 
werk presided. All Trustee 
Members were present.

On a motion by Trustee David 
Nigh, seconded by Trustee 
Mary Krueger and unanimously 
carried by voice vote, the Board 
approved the minutes of 
November 19 and 26, 1984. (one 
correction was noted for the 
meeting minutes of November 
19, 1984, and that was on the 
roll call vote count on adjourn­
ment).

Robert Staehler, President, 
and Roy Warner, Member, of 
the Kewaskum Sno Chief’s 
Snowmobile Club requested 
permission to use the same 
snowmobile route as was 
approved by the Village Board 
for the 1983/1984 season for 
this coming 1984/1985 season. 
They also requested a review of 
the snowmobile curfew times in 
the Municipal Code. The 
suggested curfew times were 
2:00 a.m. and 6:00 a.m. Trustee 
Howard Laubenstein. Chairman 
of the Protection and Public 
Safety Committee, also recom­
mended for acceptance the 
same snowmobile route and the 
change in curfew times.

On a motion by Trustee Mary 
Krueger, seconded by Trustee 
Thomas McElhatton and unani­
mously carried by voice vote, 
the Board approved the snow­
mobile route as presented by 
Mr. Staehler.

On a motion by Trustee 
Donald Mlodzik, seconded by 
Trustee Paul Blumer and 
unanimously carried by voice 
vote the, the Board directed the 
Administrator to prepare an 
amendment to the ordinance 
reflecting change in the 
snowmobile time for 11:00 p.m. 
to 8:00 a.m., to 2:00 a.m. to 6:00 
a.m. for the December 17, 1984, 
meeting.

Superintendent of Public 
Works, Augie Bilgo, informed 
the Village Board that the water 
projects were progressing well.

Administrator Schmidt re­
viewed briefly the final tax rate 
figures with the Board indi­
cating the net rate is up only 
4.0% and the state tax credit is 
approximately 2.3% higher 
than what was received in 1984. 
The net rate is $20.02 per 
thousand of assessed value.

Administrator Schmidt re­
viewed with the Board some 
brief correspondence and 
passed out the November 30, 
1984, balance sheet for the 
Board to review.

On a motion by Trustee Paul 
Blumer, seconded by Trustee 
Donald Mlodzik and unani­
mously carried by voice vote, 
the Board approved the pay­
ment of bills as recommended 
by the Administrative Commit­
tee. The total of all claims as 
recommended are as follows:
Village Gen. Fund $52,020.20 
Water Dept. Fund 1,890.82 
Sewage Dept. Fund 9,655.11 
TIDFund 37,532.19

A brief discussion was held 
regarding the approval of the 
payment of bills process. The 
Administrator will try to provide 
some additional information for 
those members of the Board not 
serving on the Administrative 
Committee.

Trustee Thomas McElhatton, 
(’hairman of the Park and 
Recreation Committee, 
informed the Board that the 
°pen gym winter recreation 
program would be similar to 
those in the past and that a 
news article would appear in the 
Kewaskum Statesman soon.

Trustee Howard Laubenstein, 
the Board Representative of the 
Plan Commission, reported on 
the Commission meeting of 
November 27, 1984. Trustee 
Laubenstein reported that a 
Public Hearing would be held 
on December 17, 1984, on the 
Plan Commission’s recom­
mendation regarding the Con­
ditional Use Permit of Gregory 
Ogi for a veterinary clinic.

Trustee Mary Krueger, the 
Board Representative of the 
Library Board, reported that the 
Library would be closed De- 
cember 24 and 31, 1984, be­
cause of the holidays.

. RESOLUTION NO. 84-12
BE IT RESOLVED, by the 

Village Board of the Village of 
Kewaskum, Washington 
County, Wisconsin, that the 
Village President and Village 
Administrator/Clerk are not 
authorized to sign the Landfill 
Closure Agreement as request­
ed by the Department of 
Natural Resources.

BE IT FURTHER RE­
SOLVED, that the Village Board 
is desirous of maintaining the 
Village’s Landfill site for an 
extended number of years for 
the community's best interest.

Dated this 3rd day of De­
cember, 1984.
Introduced by Trustee Paul 

Blumer
Motion for adoption by Trustee 

Howard Laubenstein
Motion for adoption seconded 

by Trustee Mary Krueger
Roll call vote w’as 7 “Aye,” 0 

"Nay,” 0 "Absent.” 
On a motion by Trustee David 

Nigh, seconded by Trustee 
Howard Laubenstein and unani­
mously carried by voice vote, 
the Board authorized the ad-
vertising for bids on the 
Municipal Building 1985 
project. The bid date to be the 
last week in January, 1985.

On a motion by Trustee Mary 
Krueger, seconded by Trustee 
Paul Blumer and unanimously 
carried by voice vote, the Board 
approved the nomination of 
Pollworkers as presented by 
both the Republican and 
Democratic Parties for the years 
of 1985 and 1986.

On a motin by Trustee David 
Nigh, seconded by Trustee 
Howard Laubenstein and unani-

CARPET CLEANING SPECIAL

15% Discount on 2 Rooms or more!
AVERAGE SIZE RESIDENCE ONLY. LIMITED TIME

HERES WHAT OUR CUSTOMERS ARE SAYING
Won t hesitate to recommend you to anyone ■ 
Thanks for a super /ob ■ 4 very good /ob O 
looks great will recommend youi seivice to my 

friends HVarpeting looked terrific | Very 
pleased Vou do nice work "

mously carried by voice vote, 
the Board approved the 
changing of the location of the 
Village’s garbage and refuse for 
the balance of 1984.

After an intensive discussion 
and review of the three quotes 
received, and they are as 
follows:
Kannenberg, Kieckhafer & 

Company, West Bend, W1
$3,625.00 

Virchow, Krause & Company, 
Madison, Wl 4,300.00 

Conley, McDonald, Sprague & 
Company, Milwaukee, WI

4,800.00
Resolution #84-16 was 

introduced and acted on as 
follows:

RESOLUTION NO. 84 -16
BE IT RESOLVED, by the 

Village Board of the Village of 
Kewaskum, Washington 
County, Wisconsin, that the 
firm of Virchow, Krause & Co., 
Certified Public Accountants of 
Madison, Wisconsin, be retain­
ed and are hereby authorized to 
audit the records of all depart­
ments of the Village of Kewas­
kum for the fiscal year ending 
December 31, 1984.

Dated this 3rd day of Decem­
ber, 1984.
Introduced by Trustee David

Nigh
Motion for adoption by Trustee 

Howard Laubenstein
Motion for adoption seconded 

by Trustee Donald Mlodzik 
Roll call vote was 5 "Aye,” 2 

"Nay,” 0 "Absent.”
Note: Trustee Mary Krueger 
and Trustee Thomas Mc­
Elhatton voting "Nay.”

President Gerald F. Stollen- 
werk read a brief statement to 
the Board and Press as follows:

I will not be seeking re­
election in April. I am making 
the announcement now to pro­
vide sufficient time for the 
current Board Members to 
consider running for the Village 
Presidency. I have been Presi­
dent for 5 years. It has been a 
very rewarding experience and 
have no regrets. However, now

•^mWPFW^FR^ 
QUALITY

• ALUMINUM SIDING
• Soffit Systems and Custom Trim
• Seamless Aluminum Gutters
• Doors — Windows
• Insulation

HEBERER BROS. Construction
Kewaskum, WI

ROGER 626-2598 NORM 626-2491 BILL 626-2384

Free Estimates 
• Fully Insured

CARPETS UPHOLSTERY 
CLEARING SERVICE

FREE ESTIMATES
DIAL 338-0783 V

CALL ANYTIME
RELIABILITY IN 
PROFESSIONAL 

CLEANING

■ I RUCK MOUNTED MOBILE PLANT
■ PROFESSIONAL DEEP STFAM EXTRACTION
■ QUALITY PROFESSIONAL PERSONAL CARE
■ FREE PRESPOTTING
■ MOST FURNITURE MOVED
■ IIBERS BRUSHED AND SET
■ COASTERS UNDER FURNITURE
■ ARPET PROTECTOR AVAILABLE
■ DEPENDABLE
■ I AST DRYING
■ GENTLE TO ALL FIBERS
■ WE GET THE SOIL

I feel it is someone else’s turn. 
The Village of Kewaskum is 
"alive and well.” We have an 
effective and dedicated 
Administrator and Department 
Heads working harmoniously 
for the good of Kewaskum. 
Also, we are in good financial 
position.

Motion was made by Trustee 
Paul Blumer, seconded by 
Trustee Mary Krueger to ad­
journ to closed session under 
Chapter 19.85 (1) (c) of the 
Statutes to discuss employ­
ment, promotion, compensa­
tion, employee negotiations and 
performance data of village 
employees over which the 
governmental body has juris­
diction. Roll call vote was 7 
"Aye,” 0 "Nay,” 0 "Absent.” 
The motion was passed unani­
mously.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

Farmer’s Tax Guides 
Available in County

The "Farmer’s Tax Guides” 
are now available from the 
Washington County UW-Ex- 
tension Office.

This annual publication, 
printed by the Internal Revenue 
Service, provides information 
that is helpful to tax payers in 
preparing their farm income tax 
returns. The information is not 
just for those individuals who 
fill out their own forms, but to 
help with providing information 
necessary for your tax con­
sultant to prepare your tax 
report accurately.

Copies are available free if 
picked up at the Washington 
County UW-Extension Office at 
515 E. Washington Street in 
West Bend. Persons wishing to 
receive a copy through the mail 
should send 85c for postage to 
the Washington County UW- 
Extension Office, P. O. Box 537, 
West Bend, Wis. 53095.

MEMBER ASSOC OE WIS 
CARPET CLEANERS

Support Asked for 
Badger Camp ‘Cards 
For Camp’ Campaign

Wisconsin Badger Camp 
announces its 11th annual 
“Cards for Camp” campaign.

Individuals are asked to 
support this campaign by 
sending a Christmas card along 
with a donation to Badger 
Camp. In turn the card will be 
used in arts n’ crafts, the 
envelope to start the first camp­
fire of the season, and the 
donation to send needy handi­
capped individuals to camp in 
1985. Contributions are asked to 
send just one card with their 
donation as that will provide 
enough cards for the crafts 
program.

Last year’s campaign raised 
$1754 which in turn sponsored 9 
campers.

Badger Camp is a non-profit 
educational and recreational 
facility for mentally and physi­
cally disabled individuals ages 
3-93. Clientele are accepted 
regardless of the severity of 
their disability or their inability 
to pay. Activities at camp 
include fishing, swimming, 
camping and much more.

Please send your cards and 
donation to Wisconsin Badger 
Camp, Box 210, Platteville, WI 
53818.

anuadune
OUAllTY ■ WATt* >MMIOVfMtN'BpROm>Cie

FULLY AUTOMATIC 
WATER 

CONDITIONERS

JOHANN 
HEATING & PLUMBING 

334-9481
MP No 5483 

SHOWROOM HOURS 
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SOt. 8 to Noon 
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Private Wells Tested for
Chemicals and Pesticides

Fifteen months into a state 
program to assess groundwater 
quality by sampling private well 
water, the Department of 
Natural Resources reports that 
138 of 836 wells tested show 
signs of organic chemicals and 
47 of 499 sampled wells have 
detectable amounts of pesti­
cides.

Approximately 20 of the 
pesticide-contaminated wells 
and 39 of the wells contami­
nated with Volatile Organic 
Chemicals (VOCs) contain 
water which is unfit for human 
consumption, said Robert Krill, 
director of the Bureau of Water 
Supply.

Krill emphasized that these 
test results did not typify well 
water quality statewide. “We 
couldn’t sample all wells, so we 
started by testing wells which 
were most susceptible to con­
tamination — wells which were 
close to known pollution 
sources, wells near industrial 
developments and areas where 
sandy soil would let pollutants 
rapidly percolate to shallow 
water tables,’’ he said.

Private well sampling is just 
one part of Wisconsin’s ground­
water assessment program. 
Bruce Baker, director of DNR’s 
Bureau of Water Resources 
Management explained how the 
agency is using legislated funds 
to learn about groundwater 
conditions in the state.

“In passing an innovative 
groundwater law last session, 
state legislators directed DNR 
to study how human activities 
affect our fragile groundwater 
resource," he said.

“Monitoring will help us 
understand this underground 
resource,’’ Baker continued. 
Testing public and private 
water supplies will help us 
understand . the nature and 
extend to groundwater contami­
nation and the public health 
threat.

*‘We’ll also investigate 
whether environmental moni­
tor ng requirements at sewage 
treatment plants, industrial 
sites and landfills give us early 
warning of potential ground­
water contamination. We want 
to evaluate if treatment systems 
sufficiently protect groundwater 
purity," he added.

“Finally, we need to examine 
current management practices 
to determine if they really 
protect groundwater as well as 
we think they should,” Baker 
concluded. “For instance, we 
want to know if people who use 
pesticides according to the 
manufacturer’s directions in­
advertantly threaten ground­
water quality,” he added.

“Generally Wisconsin’s 
drinking water quality is very 
good, Krill said. “Most chemi­
cally-contaminated wells are 
clustered in small, isolated 
spots where poor landfills, old 
underground petroleum tanks 
or spills are leaking con­
taminants,” Krill added.

As private well testing con­
tinues, state environmental and 
health officials are honing pro­
cedures for protecting public 
health.

Homeowners are notified 
when any chemical or pesticide 
is detected, Krill continued,

even when small levels of 
contaminants don’t threaten 
drinking water quality. DNR 
intends to seek funds to regular­
ly sample any well showing 
traces of chemicals or pesti­
cides.

'Phis January, the State starts 
a well compensation program to 
help private well owners bear 
the costs of repairing or re­
placing contaminated wells. 
The costs of bottled water, 
hook-up to community water 
supplies, water treatment or 
well replacement can be partial­
ly reimbursed. Demand for the 
program may outstrip the 
available $500,000 funds, Krill 
said, in which case, state funds 
would be divided among all 
applicants.

The initial phase of the 
groundwater program to test all 
municipal wells and 1,200 
private wells for VOCs will end 
next August. Concurrently, a 
similar program will test 700 
private and public water 
supplies for pesticides. Next 
fall, DNR will combine all 
monitoring results in a report 
which comprehensively assess­
es groundwater quality in 
Wisconsin.

Pesticides were detected in 
13 of the 38 counties in which 
private water supplies were 
tested. The counties where 
pesticides were detected were: 
Dane, Dunn, Iowa, Marathon, 
Monroe, Oneida, Pierce, 
Portage, Richland, St. Croix, 
Sauk, Waukesha and Wau­
shara. Officials pointed out that 
results of recent extensive 
sampling in the Dunn County 
community of Rusk, where 
widespread pesticide contami­
nation has been discovered, 
were included in the general 
report.

VOCs were detected in 23 of 
the 72 counties in which private 
water supplies were tested. The 
counties where VOCs were de­
tected were: Brown, Calumet,

Auto Service ■^■■■■^■■■■■■■■■■mm^
A ROGER & DAN'S A 
w AUTO service

"Your Complete Auto, Tire <& Towing 
Service Station in the Area"

626-2888 r
Hwy. 45 South

V^KEWASKUM 24 H0UR TOEING SERVICE

Lions Club 
Paper Drive 
SATURDAY, DEC. 15

All paper or cardboard must be on 
the curb by 9:00 a.m. tied in 
bundles, packed in boxes or bags. 
No waxed paper or boxes, please. 
This drive is conducted every third 
Saturday of the month.

Money used for local projects.

Columbia, Dane, Eau Claire, 
Fond du Lafe, Grant, La Crosse, 
Lafayette, Manitowoc, 
Marathon, Monroe, Outagamie, 
Polk, Portage, Rock, Shawano, 
St. Croix, Taylor, Walworth, 
Washington, Waukesha and 
Wood.

For more information, contact 
Robert Krill, Bureau of Water 
Supply, (608) 267-7651 or Bruce 
Baker, Bureau of Water 
Resources Management, (608) 
266-8631.

ACP Signup at
ASCS Thru Dec. 21

Cost-sharing requests for the 
1985 ACP (Agricultural Conser­
vation Program) are being 
accepted thru December 21st.

Producers may sign up under 
the annual program or request a 
Long Term Agreement. Usually 
farmers prefer the annual pro­
gram and plan one or two 
practices. Long Term Agree­
ments require a total plan and 
commitment over a 3 to 5 year 
period.

Cost-sharing rates vary from 
40% to 75% of the approved 
costs. The purpose is to en­
courage farmers to install con­
servation practices they would 
not do on their own. Some of the 
high priority practices offered 
are: Stripcropping, Sod Water­
ways, Animal Waste Controls, 
Water Control Structures, Di­
versions, Permanent Cover, 
Minimum Tillage, Windbreaks, 
Tree Planting and Timber 
Cover, Minimum Tillage, Wind­
breaks, Tree Planting and 
Timber Stand Improvement.

At the close of the signup 
announced, the ASC County 
Committee will review all re­
quests filed. Funding will be 
approved to practices of highest 
priority first; that is those with 
the most serious erosion and /or 
pollution problems. A limited 
allocation is available for each 
county.

All requests are taken at the 
Washington County ASCS 
Office in West Bend.

TODAY’S AGRICULTURE
By Jack Trzebiatowski, Washington County Agricultural Agent

PICKING RIGHT SYSTEM KEY TO GOOD FARM RECORDS

It doesn’t matter if you use a 
microcomputer, subscribe to an 
accounting service or slug it out 
with pencil and ledger. If you 
don’t use a well-designed farm 
record system, tax time will be 
a nightmare. So will trying to 
convince a banker that you’re a 
good loan risk.

A good system does not just . 
generate numbers for your tax 
form. It also helps chart your 
financial future, checks your 
progress and points out 
problem areas.

Having so many systems to 
choose from doesn't make 
picking a good one any easier. 
Here are some things to 
consider as you shop for a 
record system. Many of these 
pertain specifically to micro­
computers. Others apply in any 
case.

* Is the vendor reliable and 
readily accessible? Buying soft­
ware isn’t like buying a book. 
You’ll probably want to stop 
back with questions.

* Does the vendor update the 
system to accommodate chang­
ing tax laws? Tax rules change 
often — sometimes drastically. 
For example, some pre-1982 
record systems were rendered 
obsolete when accelerated 
recovery replaced the old de­
preciation system.

* Does the vendor provide 
basic training in using the 
sytem and interpreting the 
results? If you depend solely on 
the instruction book, getting 
your system up to speed might 
take more time than you can 
■afford to spend. And you need

Cabbage is 91 percent water.
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to know what to do with the 
numbers you generate.

* Does the sytem provide a 
mechanism to expand its 
capabilities? Can you name 
your own accounts, add new 
ones? Is there a place to record 
new types of expenses and 
income?

* How does the system mesh 
with your current accounting 
system? Is it set up for cash 
accounting, accrual, or both? 
Single- or double-entry book­
keeping? Can you specify the 
fiscal year? Is it designed for a 
partnership, sole proprietor­
ship, corporation or all three? 
It’s hard enough switching to a 
new record system without 
switching accounting methods 
at the same time. If you suspect 
you’ll be changing your 
financial arrangements in the 
future, flexibility becomes more 
important.

* Are the user instructions 
clear and concise? Are they 
well-indexed? Is there a 
trouble-shooting guide to any 
data-entry errors or incorrect 
commands?

*Does the system write 
checks? It’s handy, though not 
essential. Think how it will 
impress the guys at the feed 
store.

* Is there a printer or other 
backup to save data if the 
computer fails?

* Is the system acceptable to 
your accountant for tax filing?

Before you choose, it's 
important to understand what 
makes up a complete records 
package.
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Was the Christmas tree in the 

trunk of your car obtained 
legally? All trees in Wisconsin 
are owned by someone, whether 
the tree has been sheared and is 
growing in a plantation or 
whether it is growing wild in the 
woods.

If the trees are privately 
owned, whether growing wild or 
in a plantation, see the land­
owner and get written per­
mission to cut, and a bill of sale 
for the trees you purchase.

If the land you are planning to 
cut on is in public ownership, 
you must contact the manager 
of that property and get per­
mission to cut the trees. You 
may in many cases have to pay a 
small fee.

Be certain that the written 
permission or bill of sale has the 
date and quantity of trees to be 
taken.

Under Wisconsin Statutes, 
DNR conservation officers,

Salvation Army’s 
Presence Is Felt 
At Holiday Time

With the holiday season upon 
us, buying presents for family 
and friends is a pleasure for 
those of us who have the means 
of lavish gifts on our loved ones. 
Retail sales are booming and 
the lines in the stores are long 
and getting longer. But amid all 
this buying and giving, there 
are also long lines of people 
waiting to receive the basic 
necessities of life.

For those who can't afford 
balanced meals, warm clothing 
and the rising cost of utilities, 
social service agencies are the 
only answer in time of need.

The Salvation Army has come 
to be associated with assistance 
to needy families.

Salvationists provide 
practical assistance to the poor. 
They shelter the ‘homeless 
giving aid to the alcoholic, 
providing day care centers, 
housing for the elderly, special 
food programs, emergency 
disaster services and summer 
camps for all ages.

Despite all of those ongoing 
services, Christmas remains the 
most demanding time of year 
for the Salvation Army. Last 
year more than four million 
people received seasonal 
assistance from the Army 
nationwide.

The Army's Holiday ministry 
is supported by the famous and 
familiar red kettles seen on 
street corners and in shopping 
malls as well as toy drives for 
children and direct contribu­
tions.

According to Len Holt, 
Director of the Army's state­
wide Service Extension Pro­
gram, “There is a great need 
this year in every community in 
Wisconsin and Upper 
Michigan. We hope to provide 
food baskets and vouchers to 
cover 6,000 families around the 
state. We’ll repair and wrap 
toys for over 3,200 children and 
will conduct visitations to 
shut-ins and hospital patients 
through our League of Mercy 
volunteers. We hope to reach all 
who need our help."

Anyone wishing to donate 
funds can send checks to: 
SALVATION ARMY, 4757 
North 76th Street, Milwaukee, 
Wisconsin 532IX

state traffic officers and county 
and municipal law enforcement 
officers have the authority to 
stop anyone hauling any 
quantity of Christmas trees. It’s 
best to keep your bill of sale or 
written permission to take trees 
readily available, if you cut the 
trees on your own property and 
are transporting them, carry 
your latest property tax bill for 
the property.

If you know the owner of the 
land where you have cut the 
trees and have written per­
mission from that owner, or a 
bill of sale, you shouldn’t have 
any problem in case you are 
stopped.

If you follow all the* rules, you 
and your family will be able to 
enjoy your Christmas tree with 
the same peace of mind that is 
the spirit of Christmas.

Under the law, the minimum 
penalty for timber theft is $100.

Computer Marketing 
Aimed at Children 
This Holiday Season

By Joyce Albrecht 
Extension Home Economist
Are you being programmed 

to buy a computer for your 
children this holiday season? 
Don't let advertisers and your 
children unduly influence you.

Many computer advertise­
ments provide direct messages 
to parents. They prey on the 
notion that parents are respon­
sible for how their children turn 
out. Don't get hooked into the 
message that you're a bad 
parent if you don’t buy a 
computer for your child.

Look at what’s being sold 
besides the product. In 
computer ads, it’s success for 
your child. Some ads overstate 
the importance or necessity of 
products. They imply that if you 
buy a computer, for example, 
you'll get the success that goes 
along with it.

By thinking about ad­
vertising's hidden messages, 
you can avoid making an im­
pulsive purchase. Make rational 
decisions rather than simply 
responding to advertising pres­
sures.

Children are also likely to be 
affected by aggressive 
computer marketing. Viewing 
TV commercials can increase 
kids' attempts to influence their 
parents to buy advertised items.

This often interacts with 
personal experience. Children 
usually want computers be­
cause of favorable experiences

Kitchen and
Bath Cabinets

Homes
► Garages
• Remodeling

• Siding
• Insulation
• Roofing
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Will Design - All Energy Ways to Save 
Berg Farm Equipment Sold and Installed

FULLY INSURED LIFETIME IN THE TRADE
8687 Prospect Dr., Route 3, Kewaskum

with them in school or because 
their friends have them. For 
these reasons, most of the 
pressure to buy computers for 
kids comes from the children 
themselves.

If your children are badgering 
you for a computer, have them 
make an argument for it. Ask 
them why they want one and 
what they’d use it for. If they 
admire a friend’s system, go 
with them to see it and the uses 
their friend makes of it.

Of 20 families studied in New 
York City, only two were using 
their computer for anything 
educational; the rest were 
playing games. To buy a 
computer simply to play games 
is not worth the price. The 
computer should not just be an 
expensive toy for your child, but 
should have other uses within 
the family.

In homes where computers 
are used well, parents use them 
to do some of their own work. 
They’re comfortable with 
computers and serve as role 
models for their children. To 
maximize use of the machine, 
they share it with their children 
and enrich their lives.

Preschoolers can work well 
with a regular keyboard doing 
computer art and letter re­
cognition programs.

Adolescents seriously in­
terested in computer technology 
may join computer clubs and 
create social networks of friends 
who have computers. If your 
child has shown a sustained 
interest in computers, pur­
chasing one for your home may 
be a worthwhile investment, 
even if you personally don’t 
plan to use it.

Children with special 
problems such as dyslexia or 
development delays can also 
benefit from a computer 
purchased specifically for their 
use. However, parents must be 
willing to spend time with them 
on the computer or it may go 
unused.

Some parents worry that 
computer use will isolate their 
kids from others at a time when 
they should be developing 
social skills. Research shows 

.that the amount of time children 
spend using their home 
computers usually replaces time 
spent watching TV.

Having a computer for your 
child can have positive benefits, 
but they’re not nearly as 
dramatic or exciting as the ads 
lead you to believe.

Computers may not only 
positively influence children’s 
academic achievement but may 
also develop future marketable 
skills for some. Such ad­
vantages will only come about if 
parents are involved with their 
children’s computer use. and 
not by virtue of the computer 
itself.
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NOVENA TO ST. JUDE
O holy St. Jude, Apostle and 

Martyr, great in virtue and rich 
in miracles, near kinsman of 
Jesus Christ, faithful interces­
sor of all who invoke your 
special patronage in time of 
need, to you I have recourse 
from the depth of my heart and 
humbly beg to whom God has 
given such great power to come 
to my assistance.

Help me in my present urgent 
petition. In return, I promise to 
make your name known and 
cause you to be invoked, say 
three Our Fathers, three Hail 
Marys and three Glorias. St. 
Jude pray for us, and all who 
invoke your aid. Amen.

This Novena has never been 
known to fail. This Novena must 
be said for 9 consecutive days, 
and publication must be prom­
ised.

B. E. F.

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to thank all our 

relatives, friends and neighbors 
for their many expressions of 
sympathy during the sudden 
death of our dear mother and 
grandmother, BETTY WALZ. A 
special thank you to Rev. 
Joiner, Kewaskum Rescue 
Squad, Kewaskum Police 
Dept., donors of floral and 
memorial tributes, the Meadow 
Creek Family, Miller’s, and to 
anyone who showed their 
respect and helped us in any 
way. It will long be remember­
ed.

Mr. & Mrs. Norman Walz 
and family

Ms. Marian Fritz 
and family

Combine peanut butter with a 
little honey. Makes a great 
sandwich spread for raisin 
bread or peanut muffins.

Rulo Craft
338-0379

COMPLETE AUTO BODY REPAIR
3428 Trap Shoot Lane, Kewaskum

INSURANCE WORK R/V REPAIR & SERVICE
FRAME & UNIBODY ~ HITCHES & WIRING

REPAIR R/V ACCESSORIES
FREE ESTIMATES INSURANCE WORK
PAINTING FREE ESTIMATES

On the Farm 
TIRE SERVICE 

Armstrong 
Tractor Tires 

at a 
LOW PRICE!

Call 626-2244

HERRIGES OIL, INC.

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to thank our 

relatives, friends and neighbors 
for their many expressions of 
kindness during the recent 
death of my beloved wife, and 
our mother, BERNADETTE 
DETTMANN. A very special 
thank you to Fr. M. Darrow, 
donors of food, floral and 
memorial tributes, the staff at 
the Samaritan Home, Miller's 
and to anyone who helped us in 
any way and showed their 
respect. It will long be 
remembered.

Sylvester Dettmann 
and family

THREE
SHEETS

TO THE WIND
Drive drunk in Wisconsin and you can 

lose your license, get fined up to 
$2000 and go to jail Sound tough? 
It is. But if you’re lucky enough to 
be arrested, you're lucky enough 

to be alive

LOADED 
WITH SOBERING 
CONSEQUENCES

Wisconsin's Drunk Driving Law
Published by 

the Wisconsin Department of Transportation and 
the National Highway Traffic Safety Administration
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ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE
RATE: $1.50 up to 20 words; over 20 words, add 5c per word

PUBLIC I NOTICKS

JEANS TAKEN - To the 
person(s) who removed approx. 
20 pairs of jeans off our clothes­
line at 222 Main St., on the eve 
of Monday, Nov. 26, 1984. If 
you need the adult size jeans, 
please keep them, but please 
return the children’s. They 
need them desperately because 
they were all of their school 
pants. Thank You. Mr. and 
Mrs. Panawash. 12-14-lp

OLYMPICS OF THE MIND - 
The Kewaskum School District 
is looking for volunteer coaches 
for the Olympics of the Mind. 
Grades K-12. For further in­
formation please contact Tom 
Larsen at 626-4003 mornings or 
692-9032 afternoons. 12-14-lt

SEWING MACHINES - 
Scratched in shipment, new 
deluxe zig.-zag sewing 
machines. No attachments re­
quired. $78each. Reconditioned 
machines $29 up. Terms avail­
able. Jaeger’s 212 Main St., 
Kewaskum, 626-2611. 12-14-lt

FOR SALE — Ladies down-hill 
ski equipment. Molded boots, 
size 7; 60” Elan skis with 
binders, plus ski poles. Make an 
offer. Phone 626-4888. 12-14-lt

FOR SALE - 17” cuddly CARE 
BEARS, $20.00. Call anytime, 
626-4890.12-14-lp

FOR SALE — G.E. refrigera­
tor, $100. Good running con- 
dition. Ph. 626-2271. 12-14-lp

FOR SALE — Standard manual 
typewriter, $25. Ph. 626-4135.

12-14-2t

FOR SALE — 4 bedroom home 
on Edgewood in Kewaskum on 
no thru street, across from new 
village park. Nice large family 
room, 2 baths, handy utility 
room. attached garage. 
Maintenance free exterior. 
REALTY WORLD, West Grove 
Realty. Call Janice Schmidt, 
626-4184. 7-20-tf

INSULATION - Attics and 
side-walls. Call Blaze Insula­
tion, 692-2110.। । ’ H

WORK WANTED - Lloyd’s 
Home Maintenance. No job too 
small. General handyman. 
Carpentry, cabinets, painting, 
wallpapering, tile, etc. Refer­
ences - reasonable rates. Lloyd 
M. Ebert, phone 626-2014.

1-7-tf

COAL
CHUNK COAL 

$89 ton 
CALL 477-6757

WHEN 
BUYING OR SELLING 

REAL ESTATE 
Contact:

Norb Rohlinger 
REALTY WORLD 

West Grove
Office — 334-5589 
Home — 626-2332

SANTA FOR HIRE - Anytime. 
Christmas Eve, Christmas Day 
or before. Call anytime. Ph. 
626-2471. ll-30-5p

THANK YOU - Empire Mills 
wishes to thank its many 
customers for their patronage. 
Large loads by appointment 
only. Call 921-9509. 12-14-lp

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Multi-Mile. 626- 
2888. 4-4-tf

REAL ESTATE WANTED - 
Have buyers for Kewaskum 
area homes. Call Ann Enright at 
RE/MAX, West Bend, 334-7411 
or 692-2607. 3-16-tf

State of Wisconsin
Circuit Court
Washington County
In Probate

INFORMAL 
ADMINISTRATION: 

ORDER SETTING TIME 
AND NOTICE 

TO CREDITORS
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF BETTY WALZ, 
Deceased.

An Application for Informal 
Administration of the estate of 
Betty Walz, deceased, 
Washington County, Wisconsin 
post office address 1119 Rose­
land Drive, Kewaskum, WI 
53040, having been filed with 
the Probate Registrar;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
All creditor’s claims must be 

filed on or before March 6, 
1985, or be barred.
Dated December 6, 1984

Carol A. Puerling, 
Probate Registrar

O’Meara, Eckert, Pouros 
& Gonring, Attorneys 
P.O. Box 348
West Bend, Wisconsin 53095

12-14-3t

DUNDEE 
Sand & Gravel 
G. Ramthun 533-4549
• Washed Sand
• Crushed Gravel
• Stone and Lime Chips1 
Also Gravel & Sand Fill 

For the Best of 
Concrete Materials

f
C=====»<=====W======W:==

NEW LISTING! Boltonville brick duplex. 3 bedroom units. Low 50’s. 
Call Ann.
REDUCED $60's. You'll never find a better deal! 4 bedroom Colonial 
near park. Family room has fireplace and patio doors leading to large ‘ 
yard. Formal dining room, new hall/kitchen flooring. Call Ann.

GRACIOUS old farmhouse with original parquet floor, French doors and 
large rooms on 1.78 acres. New kitchen with oak cupboards. R-36 
insulation in attic, partially log. $55,900. Call Dan. J
SHAWANO LAKE COTTAGE in A-1 condition. 50 ft. of frontage on « 
south shore, sandy beach, 48 ft. pier, boathouse, garage, 3 bedrooms.

. Seller will trade for property in Kewaskum/West Bend area. Call Ann.

WOODED - Nature lovers paradise close to hiking/snowmobile trails, 
fishing, boating, swimming and hunting only minutes away. Buy with 3 <
acres or up to 12 acres. Room for animals. Custom designed home with 

. many unique features; spiral stairway, cathedral ceiling and fireplace in 
living room, abundance of kitchen cabinets. Every room has a beautiful 
view. Possible seller financing. All offers considered. Take a look Call • 
Ann. J

R6#MBK of west bend 334-7411 I

MLS 205 S 7th Ave /p 0 Box 634/Wesl Bend/Wis./53095 (=1 
t=i=J<=====J<-i^Jti^Jt^^

WANTED TO BUY
IMMEDIATE CASH PAID 

for one item or an entire estate. 
Wanted - old wood furniture, 
ice boxes, trunks, rockers, cup­
boards, desks, wicker, beds, 
etc. Also quilts, some floor and 
table lamps, old Christmas 
ornaments, fishing baits, 
decoys, crocks and jugs, picture 
frames, postcards, dishes, etc. 
Call Jim and Joan Walter, 
533-8731. 7-22-tf

BICYCLES — Sales and Ser­
vice, 208 North Ave., Ke­
waskum. Wally’s Bike Shop.

IN MEMORY
In loving memory of our dear 

mother, mother-in-law and 
grandmother, Johanna 
Rohlinger, who passed away 
eight years ago, Dec. 11, 1976: 
Remembrance is a golden chain 
Death tries to break, but all in 

vain;
To have, to love, and then to 

part,
Is the greatest sorrow of one’s 

heart.
The years may wipe out many 

things,
But this they wipe out never.
The memory of those happy 

days
When we were all together.

Sadly missed by the family.

Something ftir 
Everyone

APPLES
At the Hwy. 28 Bridge 

in Kewaskum

EVERY SATURDAY
9:30 a.m. to noon

Red Delicious, Greening, 
Cortland, McIntosh, Secor, 

Macoun, Red Rome, Fresh Cider 

CHERRY HILL
ORCHARD

Batavia
OPEN DAILY 9:30 to 4:30 

WILLIS LIEPERT 
994-4925

Village Board
Meeting Monday

Public notice is hereby given 
that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wiscon­
sin, Village Board is scheduled 
for Monday evening, Dec. 17, 
1984, at 8:00 p.m. in the Council 
Room of the Municipal Build­
ing, 204 First Street.

The agendas for meeting are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the 
clerk at the Municipal Building 
on Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and 
lobby of the Valley Bank.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator

THANKS TO FIREMEN
Our very special thanks to the 

Kewaskum Fire Department for 
their quick response to our 
chimney fire call on Sunday 
morning, Dec. 9. Your help was 
much appreciated.

Walter and Edna Krueger

The first local union was organized in the US by 
Philadelphia shoemakers in 1792.

Know anyone who would like to buy or sell 
a home in Kewaskum, West Bend, Wis­
consin or America?

Give a call to
DOLLY RAMTHUN

626-2236 or 338-6175

Qntu^
®

FOR SALE BY OWNER

623 Highland Ave., Kewaskum

NO MONEY DOWN
* 2 bedrooms, 2 baths

Aluminum conbination windows
Maintenance free aluminum siding

• Detached 1 car garage with workshop
Inground swimming pool with Redwood deck (needs new liner)
Remodeled barn board living room
Remodeled kitchen with spacious cupboards

* Rec room/bar in basement
Fresh paint throughout interior

* All carpeting freshly shampooed
* Brand new hot water heater

For Sale at Appraised Value - 2 Year Land Contract 
BE MOVED IN BEFORE THE HOLIDAYS

(’all Tom Timblin for Showing at 626-4947 Evenings

TOWN BOARD MEETING 
TOWN OF KEWASKUM

The Kewaskum Town Board 
will meet Mon., Dec. 17, 1984, 
at the Town Hall, 9340 Hwy. 45. 
Kewaskum, 7:30 P.M.

Agenda items include the 
following:

1. DNR agreement to close 
landfill by July 1, 1999.

2. Tompkins Mobile Home 
Park license renewal 1985.

3. Set Town Caucus date 
January 1985.

4. Discuss Insurance 
coverages and agent recom­
mendations.

5. Election Board 1985-86 
selection.

6. Sale of Old Town equip­
ment.

7. Payment of bills.
Barbara Hinz, Town Clerk

TOWN OF WAYNE 
Monthly Town Meeting

The monthly town meeting 
will be held at 8:00 p.m. 
Wednesday, Nov. 14, 1984, at 
the Town Hall, 6108 Wayne 
Center Drive.

The agenda will include 
adoption of an ordinance for 
regulating duties of the con­
stable and other matters to be 
brought before the board.

A complete agenda is avail­
able at the clerk’s residence, 
9115 Woodlawn Dr., Allenton, 
the day of the meeting.

Orville Kern, Clerk

Klug & Klug
2311 W. Washington St 
West Bend, Wl 53095
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Lakes Team Loses 
To Falls Badgers, 
Defending Champs

In a late afternoon game 
played at Menomonee Falls 
North High School Saturday, 
Kewaskum was defeated by the 
Falls Badgers, last year’s “A” 
Division champs and grand 
champions of the Land o’ Lakes 
League, by a score of 141-122.

Kewaskum was missing four 
of its players for the game, 
namely Clark Eichstedt, Mike 
Maney, Brian Larsen and 
Schroeder.

The Badgers jumped out to a 
big lead and coasted the rest of 
the way. Kewaskum did pull to 
within seven points in the 
second half before the Badgers 
pulled away again.

Top scorer was Falls ace Bob 
Wolf, the league’s leading 
scorer last year ahead of Ke­
waskum’s Leon Laatsch, who 
amassed 44 points. Teammate 
Jim Biehle chipped in 25. Best 
for Kewaskum was Laatsch with 
37 points and Bill (ionwa with 
30.

Kewaskum’s next game is 
Sunday, Dec. 16, at Port 
Washington at 7:00 p.m. This is 
a ‘‘must" win for Kewaskum if 
they hope to defend their “B” 
Division title.

Kewaskum — Laatsch 
13-11-3, Nigh 8-0-2, Kern 5-1-6, 
Backhaus 3-0-2, Gonwa 14-2-4, 
Thomas 5-0-3, Carpenter 5-2-3. 
Totals: 53-16-23.

Menomonee Falls Badgers — 
Wolf 20-4-0, J. Gardner 5-1-5, 
B. Gardner 9-0-6, Magedanz 
7-1-2, DeLanv 4-1-3, Riehle 
12-1-3, Kaeske 1-0-0, Marcou 
7-3-5. Totals: 65-11-24.

FTM — Kewaskum 6, Falls 
Badgers 6.

Land o' Lakes 
Basketball League

‘A’ Division
W L

Cedarburg 3 0
Oconomowoc 3 0
Men. Falls Badgers 2 1
Men. Falls Stingers 1 1
Thiensville-Mequon 1 2
‘B’ Division
Port Washington 2 1
Kewaskum 0 2
Sussex 0 2
Hartford 0 3

Results:
Saturday, December 8 — 

Men. Falls Badgers 141, Ke­
waskum 122.

Sunday, December 9 — 
Cedarburg 136, Hartford 117; 
Oconomowoc 150, Thiensville- 
Mequon 105; Port Washington 
130, Sussex 98.

Schedule:
Sunday, December 16 — 

Hartford at Thiensville- 
Mequon; Men. Falls Stingers at 
Men. Falls Badgers; Cedarburg 
at Sussex; Kewaskum at Port 
Washington.

WOMEN’S LITTLE FIVE 
Joan Meilahn, Sec.

12-10-84
Three R’s 70, Enright’s Tap 

60, Cost, Inc. 59, Barrel Haus 
55, Valley View Tool & Die 54, 
Ike’s Repair Shoppe 53, 
Appraisal, Inc. 51, John’s 
Country Inn 50. Lehn Catering 
49, Sentry Food 48, Dave’s 
Repair Shop 46, Shoey’s Brown 
Jug 35.
Highlights: Helen Zuehlke 235- 
552, Shirley Weber 214-553 
series, Fran Rohlinger 216-523 
Pam Jeserig 545, Pat Stoffel 
502.

Helen Zuehlke converted 6- 
7-10 split.

Ski for Dystrophy 
Ski-A-Thon at Slinger

All downhill skiers are invited 
to participate in the Eleventh 
Annual SKI FOR DYSTROPHY 
SKI-A-THON on Sunday, 
January 13th, 1985, at Little 
Switzerland Ski Area in Slinger. 
The SKI-A-THON is open to the 
public and sponsored by the 
Metropolitan Milwaukee Ski 
Council. All proceeds will 
benefit the Muscular Dystrophy 
Association. All SKI-A-THON 
participants will receive dis­
counted lift tickets and will be 
eligible to win exciting prizes. 
Some of this year’s prizes 
include: Walkman-type radios, 
clock radios with telephones, 
television sets, lift tickets and 
much more.

To receive more information 
and your SKI-A-THON sponsor 
form, please call the MDA 
office at 414-453-7600 or pick up 
information at any ski/sporting 
goods store in the metro Mil­
waukee area.

Please join us in this skiing 
extravaganza and help support 
the fight against muscle 
diseases SKI FOR DYSTRO- 
phy on Sunday, January 13th, 
1985, at Little Switzerland Ski 
Area in Slinger.

THURSDAY NIGHT 
HOT SHOTS 

Joan Meilahn, Sec. 
12-6-84

Nichol’s Mini Charter 25-14, 
King Pin Lanes 24-15, Kewas­
kum Saloon 23'2-15'2, Fred 
Beede Ins. Ag. 21H-17H, 
Doyle Construction 18-21, 
Schrauth Builders 16-23, Suzi’s 
Place 14'/«-24,/j, Schraufy’s 
Sharpies 13'2-25'2.

Highlights: Sally Serwe 530, 
Diane Piwoni 519, Jeanne 
Marchant 203-504, Sue Humle- 
ker 501, Georgene Schill 201.

MONDAY NIGHT 
MOONLIGHTERS 
Sandy Serwe, Sec.

Sentry 69-29, Golden Shear 
59-39, Kewaskum Saloon 55-43, 
King Pin 53-45, Rolling S 49-49, 
Community S&L 47-51, Smith 
Insurance 42-56, M&E 
Restaurant 18-80.

Highlights: Kathy Rohlinger 
225, Fritz Wiesner 214, Dolores 
Bergdorf 210.

MONDAY NIGHT UPTOWN 
1st HALF FINAL

Bartoli’s 62, King Pin 61, 
Lentz’s 57, Sentry 55, Fritsche’s 
51, Thelen & Janous 50, 
Straub's 47, Herriges 40.

Highlights: Al Beisbier 225- 
211-585, John Burmeister 208- 
574, Abe Rettler 215-567, Jack 
Benzing 220, Joe Bonlender 
220, Bob Campagna 214, Ralph 
Miller 208.

WEDNESDAY 
MORNINGETTES

Jan & Mush 55-36, Shefond 
Oil 52-39, Bauman’s Dairy 52- 
39, Jalas Tax Service 49-42, 
Bar-N-Annex #1 48-43, King 
Pin 43-48, Bar-N-Annex 02 36- 
55, Fender Benders 29-62.

Highlights: Donna Buczek 
199-546, Sharon Dreher 498, 
Genny Stoffel 497, Cheri 
Staehler 182, Dianna Faul 181.

Public Comments Sought on Improving Trout 
Fishing in 28 Southern Wisconsin Counties

Department of Natural Re­
sources fish managers are 
asking anglers to express their 
views on proposed regulations 
aimed at improving trout fish­
ing in 28 southern Wisconsin 
counties.

According to Larry Claggett, 
trout specialist in DNR’s 
Bureau of Fish Management, 
Madison, heavy fishing 
pressue on southern trout 
streams has created two 
problems:

1) In streams stocked with 
trout, a majority of the fish are 
being caught early in the season 
soon after they’ve been planted. 
The result is not only dissatis­
fied anglers catching un­
desirably small fish, but fewer 
trout to catch during the rest of 
the season or surviving into the 
next year.

2) In heavily-fished streams, 
the number of trout larger than 
15 inches has declined thus 
reducing anglers’ chances of 
catching big fish.

A committee of 10 DNR fish 
managers chaired by Claggett 
has examined these problems in 
recent months and is * recom­
mending some major changes in 
current trout fishing regulations 
to improve angling quality.

“We are proposing that the 
early season now allowed in 
some southern counties be 
retained, but with a catch-and- 
release restriction and use of 
artifical lures or flies only,” 
Claggett said. “For the regular 
trout fishing season, we’re pro­
posing that the bag limit be 
dropped from its current five or 
10 fish to three, and that 
minimum size limits be raised 
from six to nine inches. Finally, 
to build up the number of large 
trout over 15 inches, special 
regulations should be develop­
ed for some southern streams 
that would impose even stricter 
bag and size limits.”

In general, the proposed 
regulations would apply to trout 
waters located south of U.S. 
Interstate Highways 90 and 94 
and State Highways 82 and 23. 
Questions corresponding to the 
proposals will be prepared for 
the spring Conservation Con­
gress hearings in April, 1985. 
Regulation changes voted on at 
those hearings and approved by 
the Natural Resources Board 
would become effective 
January, 1986.

Currently, the statewide trout 
season runs from the first 
Saturday in May until Septem­
ber 30. An early season be­
ginning on January 1 and 
extending to the opening day of 
the regular season operates in 
10 southern counties. Bag limits 
vary slightly by county and 
season.

Lowering the bag limit to 
three trout would save 30 
percent of the stocked fish from 
immediate harvest following 
stocking, as would the nine-inch 
size limit, Claggett said. The 
DNR committee did not recom­
mend doing away with the early 
season because it reduces 
crowds on the opening day of 
the regular season and in­
creases opportunities for trout 
fishing. Some opponents of the 
early season have maintained 
that it is responsible for the 
decline in the number of large 
trout, but Claggett said other 
factors contribute as well, since 
the decline is also occurring in 
southern streams not subject to 
early season fishing.

"More restrictive bag and 
size limits, no bait fishing and 
possibly catch-and-release are 
needed to increase the

availability of fish larger than 15 
inches,” he said. Other states 
famed for their excellent trout 
fishing, such as New York and 
Pennsylvania, have much larger 
percentage of streams subject 
to special regulations like this 
that anglers there support so 
fishing remains high-quality, he 
added.

Wisconsin’s regulations 
governing inland trout fishing 
have changed little in 50 years, 
even though angler pressure 
has risen steadily, especially on 
southern streams close to the 
state's major population 
centers. Bag and size limits 
were adjusted in 1949, 1950 and 
1982. The early season was 
established in some counties in 
1977, with more added in 1982, 
Claggett said southern Wiscon­
sin contains only 16 percent of 
the state’s 9,560 miles of trout 
streams, but they are located 
close to about 60 percent of the 
state’s population.

Hunting Accidents 
Down in Wisconsin

Hunting accidents do take 
their toll in Wisconsin. During 
1984, three persons have been 
killed while small game 
hunting, compared to an 
average of 5.8 during the same 
seasons for the past 20 years, 
Homer Moe, DNR hunter 
education administrator, said.

"During 1983, there were no 
small game hunting fatalities, 
which was the first time since 
the early 1940’s,” Moe said. 
"There are only 17 small game 
season hunting accidents re­
ported so far this year, com­
pared to 34 for the same period 
in 1983.” The importance of 
firearm safety training is 
tragically underscored by the 
fatalities.

Hunting overall ranks as one 
of the safest participant sports 
in the country. Most hunting 
accidents are caused by human 
error and can be prevented.

"An unsafe act...a moment of 
carelessness.. .over-eagerness 
to bag game...a lapse of safety 
awareness — these are all 
killers,” Moe stated. "Every 
time hunters pick up a firearm, 
they should consciously think 
about the responsibility they 
shoulder along with their fire­
arm.”

Responsible and safe gun 
handling hunters can usually be 
spotted. They always treat their 
firearm as if it was loaded. They 
open the action when afield 
among other hunters. They 
always point the muzzle in a 
safe direction. They always 
positively identify their target 
as legal game before shoulder­
ing their gun. And then they 
double-check for a safe back­
stop before they shoot.

"Responsible hunters 
assume that every sound they 
hear in the woods, or movement 
they see in dense brush is 
another person,” Moe said. 
"They don't let excitement and 
uncontrolled emotions take 
over. If they are not positive of 
safety they pass up a shot.”

Responsible hunters:
1. Know where their hunting 

partners are at all times.
2. Establish and stick to safe 

shooting zones.
3. Wear hunter orange 

clothing to be seen and stay 
safe.

4. Consciously practice fire­
arms safety and demand that 
their hunting partners do like­
wise.

Wisconsin hunting accident 
statistics'show that unsafe acts 
by hunting partners are the 
major cause of two-person hunt­
ing accidents. "More than 70 
percent of those accidents in­
volve members of the same 
hunting party,” Moe added.

Some tips for safe and 
successful hunting.

- Choose your hunting 
partners with care. An unsafe 
companion is your greatest 
danger while hunting.

- Plan your hunt for safety as 
well as success. Be sure every 
hunter understands their role 
and their responsibilities.

- Hunt your plan. Every 
participant should do what is 
expected of them and be where 
their partners expect them to 
be. Maintain visual or sound 
contact with partners when 
driving game.

- Set realistic hunting goals. 
Your hunting expectations will 
determine your hunting satis­
factions. Think of hunting as an 
opportunity to hunt for and see 
game, not merely a chance to 
shoot and bag game. Hunt for 
the sake of hunting, not just 
bagging game. Make each hunt 
a memorable experience to have 
with you the rest of your life.

Tips for Deer
Country Driving

If you want to keep from 
becoming one of the statistics in 
deer-car collisions this fall, 
Maynard Stoehr, the Wisconsin 
Department of Transportation’s 
highway safety coordinator, 
offers some deer-avoidance 
techniques that may help you.

According to Stoehr, more 
deer are out in the open along 
highways during this time of 
year, especially at night. “Try 
to time your driving through 
deer country during full day­
light hours. Dusk is a parti­
cularly hard time to see deer so 
it is recommended you keep 
your speed down so you can 
make a sudden stop if neces­
sary,” he said.

"When you see a deer cross 
the road ahead of you and it 
looks like tne trouble is past, 
watch out, because deer often 
travel in groups of two or more. 
Always look for a second deer in 
the area where the first deer 
came from.” Stoehr added.

Stoehr advises motorists to 
stay near the centerline of the 
road as much as is safely 
possible. "This is particularly 
helpful at night for two reasons: 
It keeps some of the intensity of 
the lights out of the deer’s eyes 
and it tends to drive the deer 
back into the woods rather than 
out on the highway. Also, if a 
deer does bolt in front of your 
car you have a fraction of a 
second more time to miss it.”

Part of the problem of deer 
running in front of cars at night 
is due to headlights blinding 
them and frightening them. 
"When you must turn on your 
headlights, put them on bright 
so you can see deer as far away 
as possible,” Stoehr said.

If a deer does jump in front of 
you, there is still one chance, 
Stoehr said. "A deer that cuts 
in front of your car is usually 
running. If it looks as if you are 
going to collide with it, hit the 
brakes and the horn. Deer 
always have a burst of speed 
left and the sound of the horn 
makes them turn on that extra 
shot of speed, which may get 
them out of the way in the last 
millisecond,” he concluded.



Friday, Dec. 14, 1984. Kewaskum Statesman, Page 20Indians Lose 2 Games 
To Hartford and Kiel

By John Harju
On paper it might have 

appeared that the KHS boys 
should have won last Tuesday 
against Hartford, because of a 
definite height advantage. 
However, that wasn’t the case 
as the visiting Orioles used an 
effective full-court defense to 
frustrate Kewaskum into sub­
mission, 70-59.

“We had our share of op­
portunities,” later commented 
KHS coach Perry Koth, “we 
seemed to hurt ourselves.”

This was indeed true as 
Kewaskum, which had trailed 
throughout the game, came 
within four points or less 
numerous times during the 
fourth quarter but couldn’t get 
over the hump.

The Indians did manage to 
finally tie the score at 50-all, but 
Hartford came back with seven 
straight points without Kewas­
kum ever touching the ball.

6’2” Oriole guard Dale 
Claussen (also the tallest Hart­
ford player) led Hartford with 
25 points. Andy Langlois added 
18 as well.

Kewaskum was led by 6’5” 
senior Mike Steinhardt with 15 
points, most of them coming on 
offensive rebounds over the 
smaller Hartford players. Bob 
Yahr was next with 12 while 
Todd Wiedmeyer and Tom 
Herriges had 9 and 8, re­
spectively.

The KHS JVs lost 55-35, 
while the freshmen could do no 
better as they lost, 61-38.
Hart. 18 20 10 22—70
Kew. 13 16 15 15—59

[FG-FT-F] Hartford — 
Toepfer 1-1-4, Klink 0-0-1, 
Theilman 0-0-1, Langlois 8-2-4, 
Schmitz 4-2-3, Key 0-0-0, 
Schaefer 2-2-0, Leair 2-4-1, 
Claussen 6-13-4. Totals 23-24- 
18.

Kewaskum — Ruplinger 1-1- 
5, Herriges 3-2-4, Rohlinger 
1-0-4, Wiedmeyer 3-3-5, Stein­
hardt 7-3-4, Yahr 5-2-4, Harju 
0-0-0, Steger 3-1-0, Ramthun 
0-0-0, Stoffel 0-1-0, Stange 
0-0-0, Murre 0-0-0, Menzel 
0-0-0, Stuck 0-0-0, Theusch 
0-0-0. Totals 23-13-36.

FTM — Kewaskum 7, Hart­
ford 7.

Kiel 57, Kewaskum 46
Pre-season E-W conference 

favorite Kiel defeated the KHS 
boys, 57-46, last Friday night in 
Kiel.

Although it’s still early in the 
season, Friday’s game may 
prove to be a key in deciding the 
E-W conference championship.

Kiel upped its record to 1-1 to 
. stay in the thick of things in the

Indian Girls Whipped 
By Hartford, Whip Kiel

By John Harju
The KHS girls basketball 

team suffered a 55-29 whipping 
from host Hartford last Tues­
day.

"Other than the third 
quarter, I thought we played 
real respectful,” commented 
Indian coach Milt Dickinsen on 
his team’s performance.

The third quarter, which he 
spoke of, was definitely the 
decider as Hartford ballooned a 
nine point half time lead into a 
23 point advantage by out-

EWC race. Kewaskum is also 
1-1, after an opening E-W win 
over Sheboygan Falls, but it 
“would have been nice to win,” 
according to Indian coach Perry 
Koth, noting that a 2-0 record 
going into the New Holstein 
game next week would have 
been a great confidence builder 
for his club.

Kewaskum began the game 
by throwing up 20-footers with 
few falling as the Kiel defense 
kept the Indians away from the 
inside. Kiel, on the other hand, 
ran a patterned offense, taking 
only well disciplined high 
percentage shots. At halftime it 
was 22-19, Kiel.

Kiel opened the second frame 
with a zone defense which kept 
Kewaskum at bay, forcing the 
Indians to take outside shots. 
For the night, Kewaskum shot 
only 25% from the floor, so it 
was pretty logical for Kiel to 
open the second half in a zone. 
In the third quarter Kewaskum 
was outscored 13-6, and from 
then on it was pretty much 
downhill.

“I’m not real pleased with 
the way we played,” said Koth, 
“we took too many bad shots.” 
Koth was, however, pleased 
with his team's defense. “It 
was our best of the year.”

Outside threat Steve Bunge 
led Kiel in scoring with 16 
points. Scott Schroeder followed 
with 14 while 6’4” post man 
Darrel Riesterer powered in 12.

Kewaskum was paced by 
junior Tim Rohlinger with 13 
points while Mike Steinhardt 
popped in 9. Todd Wiedmeyer 
scored all 8 of his points in the 
second half after sitting out the 
first because of a sprained 
ankle. Bob Yahr also had 8.

The Indian JVs (0-2 and 1-3) 
lost to a tough Kiel squad 51-40. 
Mike Coulter scored a season 
high 20 points in the losing 
effort.

The freshmen took home the 
only win for Kewaskum, a 66-33 
thrashing. Joel Fleury pounded 
out 18 points while Noel Stollen- 
werk and Steve Johnson each 
added 13 and 14, respectively.

Kewaskum’s next game will 
be next Friday at New Holstein.
Kew. 8 11 6 21—46 
Kiel 8 14 13 22—57

(FG-FT-F] Kewaskum — 
Ruplinger 3-0-2, Herriges 0-0-2, 
Steinhardt 2-5-5, Rohlinger 
6-1-5, Yahr 2-4-2, Steger 1-0-0, 
Theusch 0-0-2, Wiedmeyer 3- 
2-5. Totals 17-12-23.

Kiel — Schroeder 6-2-3, 
Bunge 7-2-0, Riesterer 4-4-2, 
Lorfeld 1-0-3, Freis 0-2-1, 
Voelker 1-6-1, Klauck 1-1-4, 
Deehr 0-0-1. Totals 19-17-15.

scoring KHS, 17-3 in that 
quarter.

Hartford’s Steffi Schink 
scored 5 of her game high 14 
points in the third quarter to 
lead the 4-0 Orioles to victory.

Lisa Fusek scored 8 of her 
total of 9 points in the first 
quarter, but after that, “we 
shot terrible,” commented 
Dickinsen. On the night, Ke­
waskum made only 10 of 47 
from the field which figures out 
to a dismal 21 %.

Sandy Secor followed Fusek 
in the Kewaskum scoring de­

partment with 7 points. She also 
pulled down 6 rebounds and 
had 2 steals.

The KHS JVs won their 
game, 35-28. “Lisa Schneider 
played her best game of the 
year,” according to coach Keith 
Amundson, scoring 8 points and 
hauling down 8 rebounds.

The freshmen lost their first 
game of the season, 32-12. 
Brenda Theusch led the Indians 
with 6 points.
Kew. 11 8 3 7—29 
Hart. 19 9 17 10—55

(FG-FT-F] Kewaskum — 
Bastian 2-0-2, Fellenz 0-0-0, 
Fusek 4-1-3, Kober 0-2-1, Secor 
1-5-1, Yearling 1-1-2, Frantzen 
1-0-2, Gebheim 0-0-2, Prescott 
0-0-1, Schladweiler 1-0-2. Totals 
10-9-16.

Hartford — Gerkhardt 3-0-2, 
Baertlein 3-2-4, Schink 5-4-1, 
Anderson 2-1-2, Baalke 3-0-0, 
Hanrahan 1-2-2, Kerwein 1-0-2, 
Parisi 0-2-2, Benka 1-0-0, 
Gartzke 2-2-4. Totals 21-13-19.

FTM — Kewaskum 9, Hart­
ford 9.

Kewaskum 57, Kiel 29
Everyone got into the scoring 

act as the KHS girls romped 
over the Kiel Raiders, 57-29, 
last Thursday in Kewaskum.

Kewaskum (now 1-1 and 2-4 
overall) jumped out to a 14-6 
first quarter lead and never 
trailed from them on.

Jodi Yearling and Lisa Fusek 
each scored 6 out of their game 
high 14 and 12 points in the first 
quarter to lead the Kewaskum 
charge.

Chris Frantzen, Michelle 
Gebheim, and Tracy Prescott 
sparked on off-the-bench effort 
which Coach Milt Dickinsen was 
very pleased with.

Frantzen scored 5 points and 
grabbed a game-high 7 re­
bounds while Gebheim and 
Prescott each added 6 points.

Indian Wrestlers Defeated 
By Random Lake and Kiel

By John Harju
The Kewaskum wrestling 

team dropped two matches last 
week, first, at Random Lake on 
Tuesday, 37-23, and then to 
visiting Kiel in their conference 
opener'on Friday, 36-21.

126-pound Bob Callison re­
mained unbeaten with a forfeit 
on Friday and a 16-0 decision on 
Tuesday. 132-pound Rick 
Staehler decisioned both of his 
opponents last week as did 
138-pound Wade Jepsen.

155-pound senior John 
Nowak won both of his matches 
of last week with impressive 
pins.
Random Lake 37, Kewaskum 23 
(all KHS wrestlers listed first]

98 - Steve Kapp was pinned 
by S. Diener, 1:46

105 - Bill Lehmann lost to S. 
Murphy, 6-16

112 - KHS forfeits to Art 
Demerath

119 - Rich Straub was pinned 
by T. Esser, 3:37

126 - Bob Callison beat K. 
Huiras, 16-0

132 - Rick Staehler beat R. 
Carcia, 4-2

138 - Wade Jepsen beat D. 
Hubing, 8-5

145 - Chris Dieringer lost to 
M. Schwab, 6-10

155 - John Nowak pinned R. 
Birenbaum, 3:07

167 - Martin Seichert pinned 
Kevin Kern, 4:22

185 - Jim Lauer was pinned 
by B. Stout, 2:50

Uni. - Jeff Diels was pinned 
by M. Schuessler, 3:27

As a team, the Indians shot 
only 29% from the floor, which 
was good enough to win (Kiel 
made only 6 shots all night), but 
something that "must get 
better,” according to Dickin­
sen.

The Indian JVs (4-2) destroy­
ed their opponents in the pre­
liminary game, 32-8.

“We really played like a 
team,” commented soph coach 
Keith Amundson afterward.

Jenny Hintz led the well 
balanced Kewaskum attack with 
8 points. Terri Schmidt and Lisa 
Schneider each added 6, while 
Laurie Blum and Brenda Vetter 
came away with 5 steals apiece.

After trailing 22-21 at half, 
the KHS freshmen came back to 
outscore their Kiel opponents, 
28-3, in the second half and win, 
50-24.

A strong full-court press em­
ployed by the Indians in the 
second half proved to be the 
reason for the win. “Everyone 
hustled,” according to coach 
Michele Wiedmeyer.

Brenda Oelhafen, Jean 
Klahn, and Kim Kasseckert 
each had 9 points while Debbie 
Felix popped in 8, as well.

Kewaskum's next game is 
Dec. 20th when they host 
Plymouth.

(FG-FT-F) Kewaskum — 
Bastian 1-0-3, Kober 2-0-1, 
Fusek 6-0-3, Secor 2-1-3, 
Yearling 6-2-3, Frantzen 2-1-2, 
Gebheim 3-0-1, Schladweiler 
1-1-3, Prescott 2-2-4. Totals 
25-7-23.

Kiel — Brocker 3-6-0, 
Nicolaus 0-2-0, Polster 0-0-1, 
Mueller 2-0-2, Meyer 0-5-4, 
Gross 0-1-1, Schreiber 1-0-0, 
Gaedtke 0-0-1, Weiskopf 0-3-0, 
Nemecek 0-0-2. Totals 6-17-11.

FTM — Kewaskum 6, Kiel 
14.

Kiel 36, Kewaskum 21
98 - Steve Kapp was pinned 

by S. Bowe, 1:27
105 - KHS forfeits to S. Ruh
112 - Bill Lehmann lost to T. 

Faust, 1-8
119 - Rich Straub lost to S. 

Kirsch, 2-5
126 - Bob Callison won by 

forfeit
132 - Rick Staehler beat G. 

Gutschow, 6-0
138 - Wade Jepsen beat M. 

Prahl, 6-5
145 - Brian Spartz beat M. 

Binversie 20-12
155 - John Nowak pinned E. 

Eick, 3:55
167 - Marty Seichert was 

pinned by T. Liepert, 1:33
185 - Jim Lauer was pinned 

by E. Biese, 5:26
Uni. - Jeff Diels was pinned 

by P. Meyer, 0:34

Wrestling Team to 
Host ‘Kids’s Night’

The Kewaskum Wrestling 
team will be hosting “Kid’s 
Night” as the Indians host New 
Holstein in an Eastern Wiscon­
sin Conference dual meet Fri­
day, Dec. 21.

All pre-school children as 
well as students through eighth 
grade will be admitted free 
when accompanied by a parent 
or guardian.

The Junior Varsity wrestling 
will begin at 6:45 p.m. The 
Varsity starts at 7:30 p.m. All 
action takes place in the KHS 
Fieldhouse.

Beaver Dam to 
Open Gymnastics 
Season Here

By John Harju
Four returning letter winners 

will form the nucleus of rookie 
coach Sue Paul’s 1984 KHS 
gymnastics team.

Paul, who replaces Jane 
Vesper, who resigned her 
teaching and coaching duties 
this past summer, has to 
replace top performers Sandy 
Nigh and Wendy Wilson, both 
of whom graduated last year.

Letter winners Chis Kirchner, 
Renee Kapp and Sheri Batzler, 
all sophomores, and Darlene 
Luedtke, a junior, will be looked 
on to contribute a lot this year, 
according to Paul. A fifth letter 
winner, Shelly Petsch, is cur­
rently sidelined with a medical 
problem.

Kirchner will be an all-around 
competitor as will Batzler, while 
Luedtke will concentrate on the 
vault, floor exercise, and un­
even bars. Kapp will be a 
balance beam, vault, and floor 
exercise expert.

Top varsity prospects in­
clude: senior Terri Voge; 
juniors Lisa Krahn (beam), 
Debbie Schoofs (vault), and 
Mitzi Nigh (vault and unevens); 
sophomores Jackie Voge 
(vault), Kerie Swenson (floor 
and beam) and Dani Rogne 
(floor).

Other squad members in­
clude: juniors Cheryl Kurtz and 
Marie Miller; sophs Lisa Stray. 
Christa Smolinski, Tracy 
Schuster, Lisa Dinesen, and 
freshmen Mary Pesch, Patty 
Padden, Jean Herriges, 
Michelle Picard, Angie Nowak, 
NanciGoeden, Britt Ellis, Linda 
Chochenet, and Carrie Batzler.

The Indians open their season 
Friday against Beaver Dam 
here.

Saturday Open Gym 
To Start Dec. 15

The two Kewaskum High 
School gyms will be open for 
basketball on the following 
dates: December 15; January 5; 
January 26; February 2; 
February 9; February 16; March 
23; March 30.

Time 12:30 p.m. - 3:30 p.m.
Cost 50c per person per day. 

Furnish your own basketball, 
towels and please, nothing of 
value.

Schedules will be handed out 
at the door.

QUEEN HITS LEAGUE 
Kathy Rohlinger, Sec.

12-5-84
Firstar Bank 27-15, Strobel’s 

26-16, Bauer Spraying 23'/j- 
18*/2, Dundee S&G 23‘/2-181/!, 
Everglades 23-19, Baumann 
Bus 23-19, Robbie’s 22-20, King 
Pin 22-20, Laurie’s 21-21, 
Newsettes 21-21, Kathy’s Tap 
19-23, Herman's Const. 19-23, 
Johann Plumbing 18-24, 
O’Brien Bros. 18-24, Les & 
Arlene’s 16-26. Fin-n-Feather 
14-28.

Highlights: Janet Serwe 564- 
201,, Linda Theisen 548-221, 
Helen Kertscher 548-216, 
Rachel Gassner 547-220, Reenie 
Heberer 540.


