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Week’s Wit
The quickest way to get to sleep 
is to pretend it's time to get up.
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Three Write-ins for Village Board Economic Conditions Warrant
Hotly Contested School Board Race Review of TIF Priorities

Expected to Bring Out Heavy Vote
The two winners in the highly 

contested Kewaskum School 
Board race will finally be 
decided in the Spring Election 
next Tuesday, April 6. During 
the past few weeks much dis­
cussion has been centering on 
the School Board election and 
numerous letters to the editor 
have been written (20 of them in 
this week’s issue*.

The candidates are incum­
bent Gerald Secor, who has 
been a member of the School 
Board almost 12 years, Ralph 
Horner, John Spoerl and Joan 
Rosenberger, who won out in 
the primary election held Feb. 
16. Spoerl and Rosenberger are 
newcomers, while Horner lost 
out in his bid for the board in 
the last election. The other 
incumbent, Byron Gessner, who 
was seeking reelection, was

Last year Doctor Ogi, with help from Kewaskum FFA members, immunized over 20(1 
cals and dogs. This year’s clinic can be even more successful, but only with your help!

The annual Kewaskum FFA 
Rabies Clinic will be held 
Tuesday, April 6, from 7-9 p.m. 
in the Agriculture Shop. Local 
residents can have dogs and 
cats immunized for a reduced 
fee of $5.00 per animal Doctor 
Charles Ogi will be on hand to 
administer all injections.

Wisconsin ranks high in 
rabies related cases, a statistic 
that state could do without. If 
everyone pulls together and 
spreads the word about rabies, 
the state can overcome this 
problem.

The Kewaskum FFA is work­
ing within the community to 
help combat this disease. It can 
only be done with the support of

eliminated in the primary.
The heated School Board 

Race is expected to bring out a 
heavy vote throughout the Ke­
waskum School District.

Polls will be open from 9a.m. 
until 8 p.m , giving everyone an 
opportunity to vote. Notices of 
election are published on other 
pages of this issue.

In the Village of Kewaskum 
there are only two candidates 
for the three trustee offices to 
be elected. They are incum­
bents Donald Mlodzik and 
Richard Schmidt. There are also 
three write-in candidates for the 
third trustee position, namely 
Howard Laubenstein, Travis 
Canfield and Mary L. Krueger. 
Other write-in candidates can 
also be voted on. Incumbent 
Raynor Herriges is not seeking

Rabies Clinic April 6

all community members. Make 
plans to attend Tuesday’s Clinic

State to Hold Public Meeting Here 
To Discuss Improvement of Hwy. 28

The State of Wisconsin will 
hold a public informational 
meeting to discuss the improve­
ment of approximately 8 miles 
of Highway 28, between USH 
45, Kewaskum and USH 41, in 
Washington County.

The meeting is scheduled 
from 11:00 a.m. to 10:00 p.m., 
on Tuesday, April 6, at the 
Kewaskum High School.

The Department of Trans­
portation staff members will be

re-election.
Charles F. Miller of Kewas­

kum is unopposed for re­
election as Washington County 
Supervisor of District 10.

In District 9, Harold Wester­
man of the Town of Wayne will 
be opposed by Jane M. Mc­
Elroy.

There are two candidates for 
Court of Appeals Judge of 
District II. They are Richard S. 
Brown and Denis R. Vogel.

Voters will also cast their 
ballots on a referendum 
question: County responsibility 
for acts of sheriff. Shall section 
4 of article VI of the constitution 
be amended to provide that the 
legislature may, be law, permit 
or require counties to be re­
sponsible for the acts of the 
sheriff?

and help clean-up the rabies 
problem in Kewaskum.

available to discuss the project 
design aspects, alternatives 
considered, environmental 
assessment of the work and the 
right-of-way needs of the pro­
ject. The DOT real estate staff 
members will also be available 
to discuss how property is 
acquired for highway projects.

All interested persons are 
invied to attend the meeting, at 
their convenience, and to ex­
press their views on the project.

By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

Tuesday night’s Plan Com­
mission meeting found its mem­
bers agreeing that TIF projects 
must be reviewed and re­
prioritized.

Bleak economic conditions 
have taken their toll on project­
ed construction plans for de­
velopment and reconstruction 
projects which are part of 
Kewaskum’s Tax Incremental 
Finance District. Village Ad­
ministrator Dan Schmidt sug­
gested the commission consider 
hiring Dan Thompson, of Action 
Associates, to do a study to 
re-evaluate projected village 
revenues for 1982. Thompson’s 
fee would be $2,000.00 for 
researching, preparing a report 
and meeting with the com­
mission to discuss his findings.

Schmidt told the commission 
that a study should be made so 
that Kewaskum would not find 
itself in the same predicament 
as some neighboring com­
munities, beginning projects 
only to find out there isn't any 
money to pay for them. A 
projected revenues study would 
give the village some idea as to 
how much money would be 
available for TIF projects. Com­
mission member Charles Miller 
stated, "he's (Thompson) going 
to come up with a whole new set 
of figures and speculate again. 
In other words, we’re going to 
pay him $2,000 to correct his 
projections.” said Miller.

Commission member Jeff 
Rohrer questioned whether this 
study could be done “in­
house.” Schmidt noted “I could 
give you projections and I think 
they would be in the ballpark. 
I’ll do whatever 1 can,” said 
Schmidt.

Fire Causes
Damage at Home

The Kewaskum Fire Depart­
ment answered a call to the 
Ralph Kern residence at 315 
North Ave., Kewaskum, at 7:15 
p.m. Thursday, when a flash 
fire resulted when fumes 
ignited as Ralph was applying 
carpet paste while laying 
linoleum.

Mr. Kern’s use of a home 
extinguisher had the fire under 
control when firemen arrived. 
Kern’s wife, Cordell, ran across 
the street in her stocking feet to 
a neighbor’s house to summon 
the Fire Department, as she 
was unable to get to her kitchen 
phone.

There was about $1,000 
damage to the floor and cup­
boards.

“My feeling is, some kind of 
re-evaluation has to be done” 
said Zoning Administrator 
Richard Zarling. ‘‘I think 
another look has to be taken at 
the projects and possibly re­
prioritize them,” Zarling 
added. Schmidt noted that pro­
jects may be postponed, but 
they cannot be moved up.

Schmidt told the meeting, the 
village may see construction of 
three or four new homes and 
possible development of a new 
subdivision. “If we are to 
consider annexation of the 
proposed subdivision, the 
watermain loop and well on the 
south end of the town must be 
constructed to provide service.”

Village President Gerald 
Stollenwerk told the commis­
sion. “whatever Dan comes up 
with, let’s not disagree with 
him. I am sure if we were to do 
the study we would come up 
with seven different answers 
and not agree with Dan's.

The commission unanimously 
agreed to let Schmidt work on 
the revenue study. Commission 
member Bob Kirst stated, 
“let’s keep the door open, if 
Dan runs into any problems, he 
can come back to us for ap­
proval of getting outside as­
sistance on this study.”

Paul Auction
Hall Burglarized

Items valued at more than 
$10,000, including antique guns 
and music boxes, were stolen 
over the weekend in a burglary 
at the Paul Auction Hall located 
along County Trunk S, l’/t 
miles north of Kewaskum.

Owner of the auction hall, H. 
Jim Paul of Kewaskum, contact­
ed the Fond du Lac County 
Sheriff’s Department at 8:04 
a.m. Sunday to report the 
break-in. He said someone 
entered the structure located in 
the Town of Auburn sometime 
after 6 p.m. Saturday.

Authorities reported that 
entry was gained by breaking 
open a door located on the east 
side of the large building. Many 
of the stolen items, were the 
property of Mr. and Mrs. 
Donald Gitter of Route 1, Camp­
bellsport, authorities said.

Stolen from the auction hall 
were numerous antiques that 
were to have been sold at 
auction, including 20 antique 
guns, two music boxes and 
fancy glassware. Other items 
listed as missing from the hall 
included between $50 and $100 
in quarters, some blankets, a 
pocket watch, bratwurst valued 
at about $13 and some candy 
bars. .
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FOOD

t. ROSENHEIMER
MARKET

STORE HOURS
Mon thru Fri. 8-9. Sat 8-6 

Sun 8:30-5:00
TUESDAY IS SENIOR CITIZENS DAY

Wilson Festival Boneless

SMOKED HAM
WHOLt HALF

thru

U V

MUSHROOMS
Our Family

$169 $lb I
TOMATO 
SOUP

2 ~ 89e | ib I ib I 
& 4 - 95* I fusDA? CHUCK ROAST

PORK HOCKS
BONELESS

BONELESS 
ROLLED

>59'
$]69

CHOICE

Jennie o

'if basting

l TURKEYS' M -J i - 59c

GROUND CHUCK b $1.39
Mild
COLBY CHEESE ib $1.89
Dubuque
BRAUNSCHWEIGER it 59c
Dubuque
WIENERS

POLSKA KIELBASA
Hillshire Slab
BACON
Extra Large

EGGS______

*1.89

ib $1.49

dor 79C

99‘
Our Family Go-Togethers

GRAPE 
JELLY

PEANUT 
BUTTER

Our Family Oil or Water Pak

LIGHT
CHUNK TUNA

77'3*»"

Our Family Meal Makers
TOMATO 
JUICE 
TOMATO 
PASTE

Zurheide

12o* 79c pkg

Sweet Ptat

| FACIAL TISSUE

i HI DRI TOWELS89'

FAMILY 
VEGETABLE

OUR FAMILY

VEGETABLES

PORK & BEANS 
SAUER KRAUT 
FRUIT COCKTAIL
^ NAVEL ORANGES

SWEET 
’N 

JUICY
Crisp Florida
CELERY
Florida Rod Ripe
TOMATOES

5lb
Bag

Bunch

RED RADISHES"
CUCUMBERS

I GREEN PEPPER

4-89

PINEAPPLE
our Family

APPLESAUCE
PANCAKE MIX
PANCAKE SYRUP
Plein or w / Peanuts

M & M's CANDY
Chef Boy or Ooe

PIZZA SAUCE

| COFFEE CREAMER

■?.-.■ 59'

89' 4u

: *1.49
; *1.99

53

$159

:;• 79'

99'

2/99'

Land O' Lakes Spreadables

COUNTRY MORNING 
BLEND
WHIPPED BUHER
BUTTER »«•”-

: ‘1.05 
; *1.95

|COKE or TAB
8 pk 16 or bottles

ICE CREAM

5 qi 
pail

CLIP & SAVE 80c S COUPONS! $1.15

82j69 f YOUR EASTER HAM HERE — L. Rosenheimer Grocery
One Given Away Each Day, Starting Tuesday, April 6

Ihru Saturday. April 10 — (Drawing at noon each day]

Name Phone

■MilL ROSENHEIMER COUPON IMMai^MMB L ROSENHEIMER COUPON HIM

fU^yj p|NT j yW^ ONE

WHIPPING CREAM 8 DOZEN EGGS

IMINO PURCHASE NECESSARY -
!■•■■■ L ROSENHEIMER COUPON■WMBI

|yK^'
p BOX 99c EGG DYE or

NEED NOT BE PRESENT TO WINMMBMMMMMMMai

RECEIVE ALL 
THREE ITEMS

With Thia Coupon and I With This Coupon and
Separate $7 50 Grocery Purchase or More ■Separate SI5 00 Grocery Purchase or Mi

Coupon Expires April 10. 1982 ■ Coupon Expiree April 10, 1982

Our Req Discount Price 
Coupon Savings
You' Price iwith coupon)

Coupon Valid 0.00'00

•COUPON-

SAVE $3.00 
^(Jown^anor

HANDPAWTED FINE STONEMARE

LARGE OVAL PLATTER
FLORAL GARDEN
PATTERN «

1599
300

fi21»
AVAILABLE IN 
YOUR PATTERN CHOICE

VALUABL

Our Req Discount Price

Your Price (with coupon)

Coupon Valid OifnzfX;

W
$$

99c OFF PURCHASE OF 
HIGHER PRICED DYE 

With This Coupon and 
Separate $20.00 Grocery Purchase or M

Coupon Expires April 10, 1982

®E5R£5BpoN$r^""
ore

-------------- —------------------ COUPON-

SAVE $3.00 
^(town\|anor

HAPOWNTED FINE STONEHAM

2 CHILI BOWLS
1599
300

11299

FREE!
With This Coupon and 

Grocery Purchase of $35.00 or More
Coupon Ex; ras April 10, 1982

<3

Designed to complamanl all 
C^ownManor Stonawara Patterns
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Continues Winning

Earlier this month the KHS 
forensics team had received 16 
“ A ” ratings in sub-district com­
petition. Last week Tuesday, 
March 23, the team traveled to 
Plymouth to participate in the 
2nd Eastern Wisconsin Confer­
ence meet. At this meet, 8 KHS 
students received “A” ratings 
and 6 “B" ratings placing the 
team in a tie for 3rd place 
among the seven participating 
schools. Kiel High School 
placed first, followed by New 
Holstein, Kewaskum, Ply­
mouth, Chilton, Sheboygan 
Falls and Two Rivers.

This past Saturday, March 
27, thirteen members of the 
team attended the district meet 
at Brookfield East High School. 
Of these 13, 10 received “A” 
ratings — Tim Indermuehle - 
Prose - “Chesapeke,” Shelly 
Sekas - Prose - “Stone Age vs.

Helsell Named
CF Bike-A-Thon
Chairperson

The Wisconsin Cystic Fi­
brosis Foundation has appoint­
ed the following chairpersons to 
lead annual Bike-A-Thons in 
their respective communities: 
Dennis Helsell, and the Ke­
waskum Jaycees, Kewaskum; 
Joe Klotz, and the Campbell­
sport Jaycees, Campbellsport.

The appointments were made 
by Robert L. Gilpatrick, Presi­
dent of the Wisconsin Chapter, 
who noted that funds raised in 
the event will support research 
and treatment programs of the 
Cystic Fibrosis Foundation.

The principal goal of research 
is to find a cure for cystic 
fibrosis (CF), the number one 
genetic killer of children and 
young adults in the United 
States. Every day, every five 
hours, a child is born with CF 
and every day, every eight 
hours someone died from CF.

The Wisconsin Chapter is one 
of 73 Cystic Fibrosis Foundation . 
Chapters in the country. The 
Foundation’s mission is to find 
the means for the prevention, 
control and effective treatment 
of cystic fibrosis. In addition to 
providing annual research 
grants to study the causes of the 
currently incurable disease, the 
Foundation also supports a

Rock Age,’’ Darla Prost - Prose 
- “I Fall in Love,’’ Mary 
Schmidt - Declamation - “Pen­
ny," Denise Meyer - Declama­
tion - “If Only," Doreen Jacobs 
- Declamation - “Chatty Cathy 
With a Kiss," Beth Strigenz - 
Declamation - “A Teenager’s 
Survival Kit,” Janet Mueller - 4 
Minute Speech - “Child A- 
buse," Brenda Witz - 4 Minute 
Speech - “Neglected and A- 
bused Animals,’’ and Sue 
Fischer - Story Telling - “The 
Emperor’s New Clothes.” ”B" 
ratings were earned by Jenny 
Mueller - 4 Minute Speech - 
“Cults: Following the Leader," 
Jama Jacak - Poetry - "Black 
Selections" and Amy Sekas - 
Poetry - “Creation.”

The 10 students receiving 
"A" ratings will now travel to 
Madison on April 23, to com­
pete in the state meet.

network of 128 CF Centers 
nationally. Two of these are 
located in Wisconsin at Mil­
waukee Children’s Hospital and 
the University of Wisconsin- 
Madison Hospitals. These CF 
Centers specialize in diagnosis 
and medical care for CF 
patients, as well as services for 
CF families.

“We hope to get the full 
participation of many residents 
in the event,” said Gilpatrick. 
“Together with the hundreds of 
other volunteers working on 
similar fund raising events 
throughout Wisconsin, we can 
make a strong impact on the 
fight to conquer cystic fi­
brosis.”

BABIES BAPTIZED 
AT HOLY TRINITY

Recent baptisms at Holy 
Trinity Catholic Church, Ke­
waskum, included Crystal Ann, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Alan 
Kuehl; Rhonda Lillian, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Williams; Danielle Marie, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Wietor; Jeffery Adam, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Jeffery 
Waala; Timothy James, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Gerald Schneider; 
Amy Marie, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Thomas Piwoni.

Ad Director
At Regal

Richard A. Kellow

Regal Ware, Inc. has an­
nounced the appointment of 
Richard A. Kellow as Director 
of Advertising. Kellow will be 
responsible for all corporate and 
consumer advertising, sales 
promotion and public relations 
functions, including develop­
ment of all television and print 
advertisements, sales aids, 
packaging and point-of-pur­
chase materials.

A graduate of the Philadel­
phia College of Art, Kellow has 
over 20 years experience in 
advertising and marketing, 
working most recently as mar­
keting services manager for a 
national equipment manu­
facturer.

A member of the American 
Marketing Association, Kellow 
is involved in community af­
fairs. He is a director of the 
West Bend Area Chamber of 
Commerce, a member of the 
West Bend Safety Commission 
and a member of the University 
Council of the University of 
Wisconsin - Washington 
County. In addition, he is active 
in the Bay Lakes Council of the 
Boy Scouts of America. Kellow 
and his wife, Marilyn, are West 
Bend residents.

Regal Ware, Inc. is a multi­
plant manufacturer of cook­
ware, portable electrics and 
microwave accessories head­
quartered in Kewaskum.

Your carpeting soiling too 
fast? Clean your carpeting with 
Nylac and cut resoiling. Miller’s 
Fine Furniture carries Nylac.

Auxiliary Police
To Conduct Door to
Door Cancer Drive

On Saturday and Sunday, 
April 3 and 4, the Kewaskum 
Auxiliary Police will be going 
from door to door in the Village 
of Kewaskum to assist the 
Washington County Unit of the 
American Cancer Society in its 
annual drive.

The men will be distributing 
information on services avail­
able to patients, families, and 
friends whose lives might be 
affected by cancer. They will 
also afford all of us a chance to 
contribute to do our part to fight 
this disease.

The men are all volunteers 
who are doing this because they 
believe in it. They will be in 
uniform to identify them. Please 
do whatever you can to make 
this a success.

SCHOLARSHIP
AVAILABLE

Due to an oversight, the 
Clifford Rose scholarship was 
not included in the recent listing 
of scholarships available to 
KHS students. The scholarship 
is $300 available to any college 
bound KHS student. Applica­
tions are available April 5. The 
deadline to have them returned 
is April 15.

Rescue Squad Call
Saturday, March 27 — 

Jerome Kneifl, 61, 6215 Hwy. 
28, Route 1, Allenton, removed 
to St. Joseph’s Community 
Hospital, West Bend. He was 
pronounced dead on arrival.

NEW HOURS

On Saturdays from 7:30 to 2:30

Effective April 3 
WE WILL BE OPEN

985 Fond du Lac. Kewntaim 
Phone 6292164

Free Blood Pressure
Clinic Here April 14

A blood pressure screening 
clinic will be held in Kewaskum, 
Wednesday, April 14, from 
11:00 to 12:00 noon at the 
Senior Citizens Center, Kewas­
kum Legion Hall.

This clinic is a service offered 
by the Washington County 
Community Health Nursing 
Service and is provided without 
charge.

Births
SHAW - A daughter to 

Jeffrey and Sharon Shaw, 4350 
Hwy. 28 W, Kewaskum, Wed­
nesday, March 24.

BECK — A daughter, 
Brianne Jane, to Jerry and Jane 
Beck, Route 2, Campbellsport, 
Friday, March 19.

LIBRARY NOTICE
The Kewaskum Public 

Library will open at 3:00 p.m., 
April 9, in observance of Good 
Friday.

Have a Happy Easter!
twwnwwwwvwwww

Geri’s
! BEAUTY SALON

' 114 Main Street
Featuring

Family Hair Styling
In Sayings & Loan "Bldg. 

I Rear Entrance] 
PHONE 626-4455

MWMMMM
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Mrs. Herbert
Backhaus Dies

Mrs. Herbert (Sophia 
“Sally”) W. Backhaus, 65, 
passed away at her residence at 
Long Lake, rural Campbell­
sport, early Monday morning, 
March 29.

She was born on December 4, 
1916 in Milwaukee to the late 
Stanley and Helen Novack 
Smudinski. In September of 
1935 she married Herbert A. 
Backhaus in Milwaukee. She 
was a retired secretary, being 
employed by Regal Ware, Inc., 
Kewaskum, for 18 years and 
also by Kettle Moraine Boys 
School for 5 years. She was a 
member of Our Lady of Angels 
Catholic Church in Armstrong, 
Wisconsin.

Survivors include her hus­
band; three children, Mrs. Ar­
lene (Arnold) Day of West 
Bend, Ronald (Patricia) of Care­
free, Arizona, and Mrs. Carole 
(Ray) Slavik of Campbellsport. 
She is further survived by three 
grandchildren; five sisters, 
Mrs. Paul Jansky of Manitowoc, 
Mrs. David Sauer of Menomo­
nee Falls, Mrs. Eugene Fliss, 
Mrs. Leon Milonzech and Ms. 
Antoinette Zinski, all of Mil­
waukee; two brothers, Anton 
Zinn of Alabama and Stanley 
Zinski of Milwaukee; her 
mother-in-law, Mrs. Selma (Sal­
ly) Backhaus of Kewaskum; 
many other relatives and 
friends.

Visitation at Miller’s Funeral 
Home in Kewaskum was Thurs­
day from 11 a.m. to 1 p.m., 
followed by a Mass of Christian 
Burial at 1:30 p.m. in Holy 
Trinity Catholic Church in Ke-
waskum, with Frs. John T.

for Kewaskum School Board

JOHN H. SPOERL supports:

1.
2.
3.
4.
5.
6.
7.
8.
9.

10.

“Your W Counts”
INVOLVEMENT IS THE ONLY ANSWER

I would appreciate your vote on April 6 1982
Authorized and paid for by John H. Spoerl, 9015 Lake Bernice Dr.. Allenton. Wl 53002

Budde and Wayne Barta of Our 
Lady of Angels Church in Arm­
strong officiating. Burial was in 
the Peace UCC Church Ceme­
tery, Kewaskum.

JEROME KNEIFL
Jerome B. Kneifl, 61, of rural 

Allenton, was pronounced dead 
on arrival at St. Joseph’s Com­
munity Hospital in West Bend 
on Saturday, March 27.

Mr. Kneifl was born on 
October 14, 1920 in Norwalk, 
Wis. to the late Peter and Mary 
Von Ruedon Kneifl. On October 
11, 1944 he married June C. 
Batzler in Milwaukee.

He was a retired Engineer 
Chief E7 in the Navy, serving 
during WW II, and also a 
retired civil service worker as an 
equipment operator at Fort 
Sheridan, Ill. He was a member 
of the WW II Pearl Harbor 
Survivors, Knights of Columbus 
of West Bend, St. Kilian 
Catholic Church in St. Kilian, 
Wis. and their Holy Name 
Society.

Survivors include his wife 
June; one sister, Elizabeth 
(Clarence) Schneider of Mil­
waukee; two sisters-in-law, 
Marie and Dorothy Kneifl;

Certified end Bonded
Ron Yogerst Res 629-9361
(Outskirts of Kohlsville) If no answer, call 626-2319

TWO BEAUTIFULLY FURNISHED CHAPELS 
215 FOREST AVE. DIAL 626 2185

Be***0*
#1 for Cost-Efficient Education

JOHN H. SPOERL

Money spent on education, not administrative frills
Eight-period day, same as the Kewaskum Middle School
Review of functions of the business manager and superintendent of schools for possible duolication
Advanced placement program p
Improved career information and testing
Examination of the effectiveness of the elementary guidance program
Transfer athletic director’s duties to high school principal
Review of extra-curricular program to ensure maximum participation and equitable advisor oav 
Establish procedures to prevent future athletic eligibility problems
Require all faculty members to be fully qualified in subjects they are teaching

many other relatives and 
friends. Two brothers preceded 
him in death.

Visitation for Mr. Kneifl was 
on Monday, at Miller’s Funeral 
Home, Kewaskum, after 4 p.m. 
with a rosary vigil at 8 p.m. 
Monday at the funeral home. 
Services were Tuesday at 10 
a.m. at the funeral home and a 
Mass of Christian Burial was 
read at 10:30 a.m. at St. Kilian 
Catholic Church in St. Kilian, 
with Fr. Raymond Adamski 
officiating. Burial was in the 
church cemetery.

GERTRUDE M. REIMER
Gertrude M. Reimer, nee 

Yearling, 65, of N6189 Hwy. I, 
Town of Fredonia, died Thurs­
day, March 25, at St. Al- 
phonsus’ Hospital, Port 
Washington.

She was born Sept. 16, 1916, 
in Barton and married Edwin 
Reimer in Silver Creek Nov. 12, 
1938. She lived in Washington 
and Ozaukee Counties during 
her lifetime.

Survivors include her hus­
band; three children, Eugene of 
the Town of Fredonia, Lucille 
(Warren) Gerner of Newburg 
and Mrs. Mary Neumann of the

Town of Fredonia; four grand­
children; four sisters, Mrs. 
Anna Faber of Valders, Mrs. 
Rose Marie Holz of West Bend, 
Leona (Thomas) Price of 
Hoffman Estates, ILL. and Mrs. 
Ruth Hanrahan of Fredonia; 
one brother, Gerald (Eileen) 
Yearling of Boltonville; and 
other relatives and friends.

She was predeceased by her 
father, Peter Yearling, Jr., her 
mother Linda Baerber, her step­

OF KEWASKUM

Dependable & Reasonable 

Since 1910

Fine Home Furnishings
LARGEST DISPLAY — DECORATOR SERVICE 

STORE PHONE 626-2184

Funeral Home

mother, Anna Knetzke and one 
brother, Peter Yearling, Jr.

Funeral services were Mon­
day at 2 p.m. at St. Martin’s 
UCC, Fillmore. Rev. David 
Jerger officiated and burial was 
in St. Martin’s Cemetery, Fill­
more.

Visitation at the Myrhum 
Funeral Home, West Bend, was 
Sunday after 4 p.m. and at the 
church on Monday from 11:30 
a.m. until time of services.
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, SOMETHING TO SMILE ABOUT., 
07 FINE CHINA - NOW ON SALE! kO

Pnrndaht 
) JFinr China

Add Charm and Beauty 
to Your Table

at a Price You Gan Afford
t^

Outstanding Features 
Imported Bavarian Porcelain 

Durable High Fired 

Fine Bell-like Tone 

Translucent Body

20-Piece Set in Forever Spring Pattern

^ QQ*perchina stamp 
on our special 
savings plan

Plus Tax with a $3 00 Purchase

We are proud to present Johann Haviland Bavaria Germany Fine Porcelain China An 
elegant handcrafted European china which is recognized throughout the world for its 
superior quality and beautiful design

4 Dinner Plates
4 Cups
4 Saucers
4 Dessert Dishes
4 Bread & Butter Plates

And now, for a limited time only, it can be yours at remarkable savings on a simple con 
venient, lay away plan that will easily fit your weekly budget

You may expand your china collection with matching service and accessory pieces Starting 
April 12, each week a different item will be featured at special coupon savings Every item in 
the Johann Haviland china line is earned in open stock, so you can replace or add to your set 
long after the promotion has ended

Here's how the plan works With each $3 00 purchase, you are entitled to buy one china 
saver stamp for 99‘; a $6 00 purchase entitles you to buy two stamps, etc. Once you have 
filled your saver certificate with 35 stamps, you may redeem it for a beautifully gift boxed 
20piece service for four in your choice of Blue Garland or Forever Spring pattern. The total 
cost of your set on this plan is only $34.65

FOOD STORES

SENTRY

The Old World elegance of Johann Haviland china let it add grace and charm to your next 
dining occasion

'''^**'^Mh|l«»»*Wes,

^^
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Campus Day in
County to Be 
Held in Evening

Do you work during the day? 
Have you found it impossible to 
attend Campus Day in previous 
years because it was held only 
during the day? Then this is the 
year to attend Campus Day.

Campus Day is an annual 
event sponsored by the Ozaukee 
and Washington County, 
UWEX Offices. A wide variety 
of stimulating courses are of­
fered.

This year, six classes will be 
held on the evening of April 13. 
The courses being offered 
include:

Quick Camp Cookery — This 
workshop/demonstration will 
cover nutrition and food pre­
paration for outdoor cookery, 
including the use of freeze- 
dried foods for individuals 
and/or group campsite cooking. 
There will be audience partici­
pation and food samples. The 
class will be taught by Julie Ann 
Lickteig, Registered Dietician 
from Cardinal Stritch College.
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Vote for

a mm
Kewaskum School Board

and get discerning district-wide represen­
tation in school matters and a conscien­
tious effort to get the most for our school 
dollar.

Authorized and paid tor by Joan Rbsenberger. 
210 River Drive. Fredonia. W1 53021

Richard W. Schmidt

*

Stress and Techniques of 
('oping — Stress identification 
and management. Inventory of 
life changes and their stress. 
Assessment of wellness. Pre-
ventive measures as well as 
training in effective techniques 
of managing stress. This 
evening session will be taught 
by Asuncion Miteria Austria, 
PH D., Psychology Department 
at Cardinal Stritch College.

Maintaining Plants in Your 
Yard — Many homeowners are 
concerned about properly 
selecting, planting and main­
taining the plants in their yards. 
This course is designed to help 
you keep your trees, shrubs and 
lawn in healthy condition. Class 
will be instructed by Dan 
Wilson, Horticulture/Resource 
Agent at UWEX, Washington 
County.

Traditional Images of Women 
— Throughout history, 
women’s role has been that of 
an object and has been in­
fluenced by society, religion, 
psychology and science. 
Awareness of these influences 
is vital for breaking free from 
those determiners of our
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indentity. Instructor: Linde 
Plagman, PH.D., English 
Department at Cardinal Stritch 
College.

Coping’with Death and Taxes 
— What happens if a person 
dies without a will? What 
provisions should be included in 
a will? These answers plus 
information on inheritance and 
estate taxes, combined with 
basic estate planning will be 
discussed by Attorney Elaine 
Shanebrook.

Music in Early American 
Colonial Culture — This class 
will cover musical usuage of the 
colonies of the American 
Eastern sea-board, beginning 
with the Pilgrims, Puritans, 
Southern Colonies and into the 
Revolutionary Period. In­
structor for the class is Sister 
Noreen Zehnpfenning, Asst. 
Prof in the Music Dept, at 
Cardinal Stritch College.

Registration for any of the 
above classes is $2.50 and must 
be made prior to April 2. The 
session will be held from 7:00 to 
9:00 p.m. Registration forms 
are available from the U.W. 
Exter&ion Office, Court House 
Annex 11 or by calling 338-4 4 79; 
644-5204 or 342-2929.

Cancer Society
Skate-A-Thon April 15

The American Cancer Society 
SKATE-A-THON, sponsored by 
the Washington County Unit, 
will be held Thursday, April 15, 
at Shorty’s Artistic Roller Rink, 
2107 Highway 143, West Bend. 
The event will begin at 8:30 
a.m. and end at 4:30 p.m.

Prizes, including T-shirts, 
albums, duffel bags, radios and 
tickets to Brewers games and 
Mariott’s Great America, will 
be awarded to skaters earning 
$50 or more for the cause. The 
grand prize to the top money 
raiser will be a pair of Speed 
Skates with 265 boot, laser plate 
and blazer wheels.

For information call 334-5533 
or 783-6201. Skaters of all ages 
are needed.

KHS German Club
Expresses Thanks

The Kewaskum High School 
German Club wishes to thank 
all those who attended our 
Fruehlingfest ’82 on March 21.

A special thanks to these 
businesses who donated door 
prizes: Sentry, Regal Ware, 
Rosenheimer’s, Kettle Moraine 
Electric, First Step Factory 
Shoe Outlet. Just A Bit Crafty, 
Homer’s Barber Shop, Jacob’s 
Barber Shop, and Steiner 
Electric. Kewaskum Floral 
again deserves a thank you for 
lending us its beautiful arrange­
ments.
!>OO4>WX>J>VA>O4A>W^W-a0
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1 TRAVIS CANFIELD :
Write-in candidate for J

I VILLAGE TRUSTEE |
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U Travis Canfield. 202 Forest Ave., Kewaskum, Wl 53040 4
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Kewaskum Village Trustee

YOUR VOTE IS APPRECIATED

\uthorized and paid tor by Richard W. Schmidt. 
012 Highland Avenue. Kewaskum. Wl 53010

: HOWARD H. LAUBENSTEIN : 
5 has announced his candidacy for j 

|^ VILLAGE TRUSTEE x?
as a write-in candidate E«

• *
Jm --------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 4

Your vote will be appreciated p? 
in the April 6th election

* ---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

$K Thank You!

I Howard H. Laubenstein X s
4 Write In AND Mark Ballot
4 \uthorized and paid tor by Howard II Laubenstein. *
?‘‘755 Prospect Dr., Kewaskum. Wl 53010 $
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KEWASKUM

Mon. Thru Fri. • 7 a 
Saturday • 7 a.m. to 
Sunday - 8 a m. to 6

.m 
6 I 
P

i to 9 p m. 
p m.
.m.

The Only Fresh In-Store 
Bakery In Town

— TUESDAY IS SENIOR CITIZENS DAY —

Monday and Tuesday
April 5 and 6

STORE
HOURS DOUBLE

4 GREAT WAY 
TO SAVE MONEY!

(Expired coupons not honored. Refunds 
cannot be more than the purchase price. 
'Phis offer does not apply to the following: 
Milk* Free Merchandise Coupons* Cig­
arettes*. Because of market conditions, 
we re also limited to one Coffee Coupon (1 
instant, 1 ground) per family.

M
£ Fresh

10c 40c $1.00
plus plus
10c 40c

plus 
$1.00

NO
20c 80c $2.00

LIMIT!
IX STOKE SPECIALS

5 lbs.
or more

| GROUND BEEF
Sunday

lb.

P
R

D 
U

D 
A

R

R 
O 
Z 
E 
N

BANANAS

L 5»

Fresh Grade A
Large EGGS

Banquet
CHICKEN

AM
SPECIAL!

Glazed
CRULLERS

69’

: s2.28
Thurs., Fri., Sat. 

April 1-2-3

OPEN 7’00 A.M.
Monday thru Saturday_______
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Charities Report

This year as in the past the 
charities for the Township of 
Auburn was conducted along 
with the taxes. The total collect­
ed was $566.00 — The Heart 
Fund, $145.00; The Red Cross, 
$116.00; The Cancer Society, 
$157.00, and the Arthritis and 
Rheumatism. $148.00 The cost 
of the envelopes was $23.10.

The Chairmen for the 
charities, Mrs. Orville Mathieu, 
Mrs. Wm. Marchant, Mrs. 
Elmer Krueger, and Mrs. Ralph 
Strassburg wish to thank all the 
donors who gave so generously 
and Elmer Krueger for again 
helping with the envelopes.

School Menus

KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 
SCHOOLS

Monday, April 5 — Ham­
burger on a bun, cheese, 
French fries, sweet & dill 
pickles, cookie and peaches.

Tuesday. April 6 — Spaghetti 
and meat sauce, green beans, 
French bread and apple crisp.

Wednesday, April 7 
EASTER VACATION BEGINS.

Menus are subject to change.
Each meal served with bread, 

butter and milk.

HOLY TRINITY
Monday, April 5 — Pizza,

lettuce salad, peach, flying 
sauer.

Tuesday. April 6 — Turkey/- 
rice, green beans, fruit slice, 
pumpkin square.

Wednesday. April 7 — Meat­
balls w/gravy, mashed po­
tatoes, corn.

Thursday, April 8 & Friday, 
April 9 NO SCHOOL

Milk served with each meal.

KEWASKUM MEAL SITE
FOR THE ELDERLY MENU

Kewaskum Legion Hall
1538 Fond du Lac Avenue
Kewaskum Site Manager

Dolores Kleinke 626-2420
Monday. April 5 — Tomato 

rice soup, baked hamburger.

apricot jello salad, bun & 
butter, ice cream cup. milk & 
coffee.

Tuesday, April 6 — *2 
cornish hen w/gravy, mashed 
potatoes, buttered beets, cran- 
berry juice, rolls, cookie, milk & 
coffee.

Thursday, April 8 — Meat 
loaf, parsley buttered rice, 
chunky vegetable soup, pear 
half, roll, cupcake, milk & 
coffee.

Ceramics every third 'Tues­
day.

Easter party Monday, April

Anniversary party, 'Thursday, 
May 20.

Junior Women to Hold 
Pre-School Story Hour

By popular request, a six- 
week spring session of pre. 
school story hour has been 
scheduled by the Kewaskum 
Junior Woman’s Club. Story 
hour will be held at the public 
library in Kewaskum. Groups 
will meet on Wednesday 
mornings at 9; 15 a.m. or 10:30 
a.m., beginning April 7.

Children will be involved in 
finger plays, songs and stories.

L. K. Heating 
and 

Sheet Metal
Beechwood

EXPERT HEATING SERVICE 
New - Replacements - Repairs

* Gas or Oil Furnaces

* Wood and Gas or 
Wood and Oil Furnaces

* Wood Add-on Stoves

-All Types Sheet Metal Work- 
FOR FREE ESTIMATES 

CALL

LEE KEMPF 
Phone 626-4342 
(If No Answer Call 626-4902] 

1674 Springview Dr. 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040

VOTERS’ STATEMENT

We, concerned residents of the Kewaskum School District, urge every 
registered voter to cast their ballot on April 6, 1982. We urge you to 
consider each candidate carefully in regard to his or her commitment to the 
education of our children.

Though all of us would like to see our taxes lowered, we feel cuts should be made in areas 
least affecting the learning and growing process of our children. Once programs and services 
are cut, it is very unlikely that they would be restored at a later date.

With our vote on April 6, we intend to choose JOAN ROSENBERGER 
and GERALD SECOR, who will place the education of our children first. 
Above all, we intend to VOTE and urge everyone in our district to join with 
us to keep a school system of which we ail can be proud.

J&J AUTO 
TOPICS

COST LESS PER MILE
The oil filter is the most 

important accessory of your 
automobile's engine. It 
keeps dust, dirt and sludge 
from getting into the crank­
case oil. thereby allowing 
smooth lubrication of bear­
ings and cylinder walls. 
Without this protection the 
accumulated grit in the oil 
would be acting like sand­
paper, wearing into the im­
portant metal and life of your 
car.

Even the best of filters 
become clogged with impur­
ities after four or five thou­
sand miles and should be 
changed. J&J AUTO SER­
VICE specializes in checking 
this important part of the 
automobile, and would like 
to be of service to you. The 
drive over to 450 E. Main for 
these important auto ser­
vices will keep your mile-to- 
mile travel cost lower than 
you ever experienced before. 
We may look like just anoth­
er filling station, but let us 
prove that we can do a lot 
more for you.

PHONE 626-2311

Thomas E. Albrecht 
Mary Carol Albrecht 
Peter F. Ayer 
Carol W. Ayer 
Mr. & Mrs. Bud Asch 
Nancy Brodzeller 
Harvey Brodzeller 
Marien Boettcher 
James H. Boettcher 
Vaughn Brown 
Eva Brown 
Wayne Bohlmann 
Elizabeth Bobb 
Carol Berdiac 
Caroline Berdiac 
Bev Balon 
Carolyn Beimborn 
Ronald Beimborn 
Diane Buchel 
Gerald Buchel 
Hilda Becker 
Norman Beyer 
Karen Butzke 
David Butzke 
L. Mitzie Bartelt 
T. Bartelt 
Carole M. Connor 
Dennis Connor 
Peni Clark 
Mary C. Castro 
Karol Canfield 
Laneille Dieringer 
James Dieringer 
Nancy Degnitz 
Marjorie Degnitz 
Merlin W. Degnitz. 
Judy Degnitz 
Dorena Donath 
Rosealyn Degnitz 
Roger Degnitz 
Lou Dettmann 
Norbert Dettmann 
E. Draifering 
Joan Dean 
Kathleen Donath 
Ann Enright 
Ken Fellenz 
Barb Guenthner 
Michael Guenthner 
Dale Glander

Bill Garrison 
Pam Goble 
Irene Gnacinski 
Leroy Gnacinski 
Byron W. Gessner 
Janet Gildersleeve 
Freddy Gildersleeve 
Barb Hinz 
Glen Hinz 
John Hazlewood 
Carol Hazelwood 
Leah Hartmann 
Susan Heisdorf 
James Heisdorf 
Mary Irwen 
Timothy Indermuehle 
Bruce A. Jackson 
Mary Ann Jackson 
Joan Johnson 
Harold Johnson 
Mary Jaromin 
Ellen Kesting 
Janet Kuechler 
Pat Krueger 
Nancy Kawczynski 
Joan Koerner 
Gary J. Kawczynski 
Marjorie Krahn 
Gaylord Krahn 
Russell Kempf 
Betty Kempf 
Bev Kelln 
David Kelln 
Shirley Koepke 
Carol Kongslien 
Duane Kongslien 
Jerry Krezman 
Barb Krezman 
Jerry Koth 
Rosalyn Kiefer 
Marie Lemke 
Janet Landvatter 
Kenneth Leitheiser 
Mrs. Kenneth Leitheiser 
Ric Leitheiser 
Marilyn Loomis 
Kathy Lauer 
Terry Lauer 
Joanne Lieske 
Everett Lieske

Mr. and Mrs. Robert Medley 
Nancy Malvick 
Deb Meyer 
Gilbert Meyer 
Loretta Meyer 
Jackie Mueller 
Joyce Melichar 
Donna McDonald 
Pat Miller 
Joan Meilahn 
Geri Marquardt 
Mary Marquardt 
Bill McCarty 
Minerva Martin 
Janine Matenaer 
Edward J. Miller 
Sharon Miller 
Mary Ellen McElhatton 
John D. McElhatton 
Shawn McElhatton 
Cheri McElhatton 
Margaret McFadden 
Joe F. Melzer 
Theresa A. Melzer 
Dale Matthies 
Karen Matthies 
Jennifer Neville 
Mary Neckuty 
Dixie Neldner 
Ken Neldner 
Scott Nigh 
Nancy Panzer 
Myrt Phillips 
Pam Pintor 
Barb Peterson 
Michael Paul 
Sheryl Rinzel 
Leona Reysen 
Clarence Reigle 
Mrs. Clarence Reigle 
Tim Remer 
Mary Remer 
Lisa Rodenkirch 
Craig Rosenthal 
Andy Rosenberger
Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Seideman 
John Schmitt 
Ruth Schmitt
Mr. and Mrs. Daniel J. Stoffel 
Darlene D. Stern

Isadore Stahl
Eleanore Stahl 
Fred Schmidt 
Ron Schurrer 
Jim Schiller 
Mary T. Schiller 
Curt Scheunemann 
Betty Scheunemann 
Pat Stollenwerk 
Gerald Stollenwerk 
Robert Sparks 
Dr. C. V. Sison 
Mrs. Aurora Sison 
Debbie Schlice 
Dick Schlice 
Shirley Schlice 
Judy Steiner 
Carl Steiner 
Joyce Schmidt 
Ralph Schmidt 
Mrs. Ray Staehler 
Kathleen M. Sese 
Joan Schmidt 
Leon Schmidt 
Joan M. H. Stoffel 
Isabelle Straub
Mr. and Mrs. Richard Taylor 
Richard Theusch 
Marcia Theusch 
Pat Tews 
Ed Tews 
Brian Thompson 
Mary Pat Thompson 
Mary Tessar 
John Tessar 
Debbie Timblin
Tom Timblin
Sharon Westerman 
Wendy Weirs 
Ken Weirs 
Norman Walz 
Richard Yahr 
Curt Yahr
Bonnie Yahr 
Don Zimdars 
Terrie Zimdars 
Robert Zarling 
Charlene Zarling 
Margaret ZeLren

( oncerned ( ilizvns of thr 
Huth A. Schmitt lie.iMirer
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Memories... The Statesman welcomes readers to submit photos 
•or the “Memories" feature. Photos should show 
life in the olden days in this area Deliver or mail to 
The Statesman, 250 Main St., Kewaskum, Wl 
53040 Photos can be picked up again after 
publication

This photo was taken at the old Kewaskum North Side Park Hall on Aug. 20. 1911. The land 
is now occupied by the Regal Ware. Inc. warehouse. The only persons identified in the 
picture, standing in the hack row. are: fourth from left. Nora Heppe; sixth from left. Mabel 
Koch; fifth from right. Ida Koerble. (Photo submitted by Audrey (Kochi Jaraczewski)

Rabbit Raising for
Beginners Workshop

Rabbit raising for beginners 
will be the topic of a workshop 
on Wednesday, April 7, at 7:45 
p.m. at the University Wiscon­
sin-Extension meeting room, 
515 East Washington Street in 
West Bend. It is intended 
especially for 4-H members and 
parents in the rabbit project. 
However, anyone that is in­
terested in getting the basics on

mee

965 Fond du Lac, Kewaskum 
Phone 626-2164

HUKE carpenter^ apron 
with 3 GOT Cedar Closet Panels!
See us for details on having your own genuine 
cedar closet with easy-to-install G&K 100% 
Aromatic Cedar Closet Panels! And get a FREE 
CARPENTER’S APRON from G&K when you buy 
three or more panels. Hurry, limited time offer!

rabbit raising is invited.
Stan Hahn, the county 4-H 

rabbit project leader and 
several members will start the 
program by demonstrations 
with several breeds of rabbits. 
At 8:30, Professor John Skinner 
U.W. Small Animal Specialist, 
will be on the program by way 
of the Education Telephone 
Network (ETN). He will be 
discussing basic rabbit manage­
ment including nutrition, breed­
ing, equipment, and housing. 
Participants will also be able to

ask questions.
Rabbit raising is one of the 

more important animal projects 
in Washington County with 
almost 100 members enrolled. 
Raising an animal such as a 
rabbit can teach a youth many 
things. He gets to know the 
needs of regular feeding and 
care. A member also quickly 
learns responsibility in caring 
for animals.

The principals of genetics and 
inheritance can be quickly 
learned with small animals.

Several generations can be ob­
served within a relatively short 
time.

Raising rabbits can be a good
M"" »< " " “M M

<% Spring
I Is Here

J It’s Time to Start Thinking
I About Planting Your Spring Bulbs

f Get an Early Start on Your Garden
j SAVE MONEY

with packaged bulk garden seed

[ There will be SPECIAL SALES on a large 
variety of items throughout the season

। ^SUW WCU.OW
I i^ ^U-fe^^feV MOnCMWl

Hut 15 south of K-uuskum PHONE 626-4660 
_ "i^'. i hi^iimi y jri<>s»:i> n Ksi>Ai

project. It can be a hobby to 
raise the animal as pets or they 
can be used for commerical 
purposes.

■-----------
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Letters.... Letters.... Letters....
To the Editor:

We, the undersigned, support the candidacies of JOHN H. 
SPOERL and RALPH HORNER for the Kewaskum School Board. 
These gentlemen believe that each board member should have a 
strong commitment to a budget based on justified expenses, as 
well as to the achievement of academic excellence.

(’arl Hohlweck - Chairman, Town of Wayne
Orville Kern - Clerk. Town of Wayne
Mark Strobel - Supervisor, Town of Wayne
Raymond Kudek - Treasurer, Town of Wayne
Martha Kudek - Town of Wayne
Leander Herriges - Dairy Farmer, Town of Wayne
Mary Herriges - Town of Wayne
Leonard W. Peter - Daily Farmer, Town of Wayne
Merlin Prost - Chairman, Town of Barton
Dolores Prost - Town of Kewaskum
Willard Prost - Town of Kewaskum
Paul J. Schmitt - Town of Wayne
Rose Marie Beck - Town of Wayne
Leo Beck - Dairy Farmer. Town of Wayne
David L. Beck - Town of Wayne
James D. Oelhafen - Town of Wayne
Carol Oelhafen - Wayne Township
Earl J. Etta - Town of Kewaskum
Dorothy Etta - Town of Kewaskum
Harold Manthei - Town of Auburn
Byron Klein - Town of Kewaskum
Ruth Klein - Town of Kewaskum
Harold Pritzkow - Town of Auburn
lister Kohn - 603 Main St., Kewaskum
Dr. and Mrs. H. L. Rumsey - Kewaskum
R. G. Edwards. M. D. - Kewaskum
Victor Backhaus - Kewaskum
Wilmer Ramthun - Kewaskum
Henry Becker - Retired Carpenter, Kewaskum

To the Editor:
I have heard some complain 

that my campaign for a seat on 
the Kewaskum School Board 
has been a rather negative one.

I do not think so and I 
question those that charge it 
has:

Is it negative to oppose the 
1981-82 raises for the ad­
ministration that ranged from 
11.4% to 14.8%? Is it negative 
to oppose another round of 
administration raises for 1982- 
1983 to the tune of 824,000? Is it 
negative to wonder how that by 
giving these huge raises to 
administration our childrens’ 
education has improved even 
one iota?

If some think this is negative, 
than I am and will continue to 
remain so.

Is it negative to oppose school 
board meetings that are finally 
opened to the public after 10:00 
at night? Is it negative to feel 
that it is wrong for administra­
tors to shout down, belittle, or 
otherwise insult a taxpayer 
expressing his opinion?

If some think this is negative, 
then 1 am and will continue to 
remain so.

Is it negative to sound the 
alarm on what the federal 
budget cuts will ultimately do to 
the property taxpayers? Is it 
negative to say that we can 
provide a quality education for 
our children and also have some 
relief for the taxpayers?

If some think this is negative, 
then I am and will continue to 
remain so.

To those who want some 
positive statements I maintain:

I am the one with the Positive 
attitude when I present the 
statement that we can provide a 
quality education for our child­
ren and at the same time 
provide some relief for the 
taxpayers. It is negativism that 
says we can not have both. It is 
negativism that says that if you 
emphasize quality, your pro­
gram costs will go up. It is 
negativism that say ft‘if you

emphasize cost effectiveness 
and taxpayer relief the quality 
of education will slip. Maybe 
people who think so negatively 
don’t have any idea of what a 
quality education is. Or how to 
achieve it. They think quality 
means spending more and more 
money on more and more 
programs. It is a positive state­
ment to say that quality means 
putting the right programs in 
place, in the right way in the 
first place, and putting them in 
at the right costs. It is a positive 
statement to say that quality 
also means discontinuing any 
programs that are no longer the 
right programs in the right 
place at the right costs.

Quality education is not pro­
vided by spending more and 
more money. Either the quality 
is there or it isn’t. You don’t 
necessarily make it any better 
by spending more money.

Quality education comes from 
a commitment — that of the 
Board to assure that the pro­
grams are the right ones and 
that they are coJrtj^g&jxs* that 
of the administration to imple­
ment the thought and directions 
of the Board and not the 
reverse; that of the teachers to 
do the very best job they can 
with the resources provided; 
that of the parents to support 
the teachers and school system; 
and lastly that of the students 
themselves to cooperate and 
diligently apply themselves.

Ralph Horner

Dear Editor:
Please print the following 

open letter.
Dear Joan Rosenberger:

In your letter to the editor, 
dated March 25, 1982, the 
opening sentence read, “You 
are wrong.’’ I respectfully sub­
mit, it is YOU and your source 
of information that are in error. 
The Advanced Placement Pro- 
gftfm CAN be offered to high

school students without an 
enormous expenditure, but with 
a real benefit of solid educa­
tional advancement.

The Advanced Placement 
Program has been offered here 
in West Bend with no need for 
an increase in the professional 
staff. The cost of additional 
teaching aides (to use your 
words) has been minimal. For 
instance, last year the science 
department had to include an 
additional $1500.00 in the bud­
get to implement the teaching 
of Advanced Placement Biolo­
gy; when divided between the 
two high schools (East and 
West) it amounts to $750.00 per 
school. Seven hundred-fifty dol­
lars for 17 students in each 
school, amounts to roughly 
$45.00 per student. Considering 
the difference in enrollment size 
between Kewaskum High 
School and West High School, 
you may find that only 8 stu­
dents in Kewaskum will take 
Advanced Placement Biology. 
The total expenditure, if such 
were the case, would be 
$360.00. This doesn’t seem to 
be a cost factor that would drive 
the school system into debt. 
Costs outside of the science 
area, in disciplines such as 
English, have been little or 
nothing; the instructor was 
involved in advanced work, and 
the outlay for additional equip­
ment wasn’t necessary.

As to benefit, graduates have 
returned from their first year at 
such schools as Marquette, 
UW-Milwaukee, UW-Madison, 
WSU-Whitewater, WSU-Eau 
Claire, and WSU-Oshkosh, ela­
ted over being able to have 
placed out of basic courses in 
English and math - with credit. 
They felt it was an advantage to 
be able to proceed to higher 
level courses and not receive a 
repetition of concepts covered 
at the high school level. They 
didn’t mind the cost savings 
either.

As to Universities differing in 
the scores they will accept or 
not accept, this is true; they do 
differ. However, on a scale of 
1-5, if you score a 3 or 4 you will 
have an excellent opportunity 
for placement at most Univer­
sities here in Wisconsin. If you 
need additional information 
concerning scores and what 
level of score is accepted at each 
University, Mr. Paul Lupton, 
who is in charge of the Ad­
vanced Placement Program at 
the high schools, would be most 
happy to help you.

Mrs. Rosenberger, your re­
marks (to use your words) are a 
“GROSS EXAGGERATION,’’ 
and a misrepresentation of the 
facts. You would do well to 
examine the excellent potential 
that exists at the high school 
level of professional educators - 
especially your own staff at 
Kewaskum High School. I know 
many of them personally, and 
have worked with them. I find 
them to be dedicated, intelli­
gent professionals that would 
provide Kewaskum youngsters 
with an excellent Advanced 
Placement Program.

Just one final note Mrs. 
Rosenberger, please do your 
homework BEFORE coming to 
school. Thank you.

Sincerely, 
Nevin J. Farley 
Instructor, Advanced 
Placement Biology 
West Bend West 
High School• • • •

Dear Editor:
Before the Kewaskum Dis­

trict voters go to the polls 
Tuesday I would like to set some 
voters straight on my fiscal 
policy. One person told me that 
he was afraid I would add new 
programs if elected. The fact 
that I’m not playing the political 
game of telling people that I’ll 
lower the budget, does not 
mean that I plan to raise the 
budget. I’ve been honestly try­
ing to explain why it will be 
extremely difficult for anyone to 
lower the budget without sacri­
ficing educational quality.

I am a fiscal conservative and 
if elected I will look for places to 
save, but when one has a lean 
piece of meat it is hard to cut fat 
or “frills.’* If elected I’ll be 
happy to talk to all district 
residents and research any 
suggestions made and if 
feasible try to implement them.

Sincerely,
Joan Rosenberger 
210 River Drive 
Fredonia, Wis. 53021

March 28, 1982
An Open Letter to 
Mrs. Rosenberger:

Mrs. Rosenberger, YOU are 
the one who is wrong about the 
Advanced (not “Advance”) 
Placement program; Mr. 
Spoerl, as usual, is correct. The 
misinformation you prom­
ulgated could be attributed to 
mere campaign rhetoric, but I 
fear that students and their 
parents may be misled.

Suffice it to say, Advanced 
Placement does not have to cost 
more money, the vast majority 
of universities including the 
entire University of Wisconsin 
system accept at least part of 
the program, and students may 
receive more than a semester’s 
worth of college credit.

Evidently you misunderstood 
the information Mr. Baldwin, 
your UWWC source of informa­
tion, gave you. If facts elude 
you, fiction should not be 
substituted. Do your homework, 
Mrs. Rosenberger.

Norma Jean Shanebrook 
English Department, 
UW-Oshkosh

To The Editor:
Unemployment rampant! 

Gehl’s close doors for a month! 
Regal Ware has a layoff! 
Weaslers operating at low ebb! 
Milk prices down! Lack of 
employment and underemploy­
ment!

August, 81 - Administrators 
salaries at Kewaskum High 
School raised average of $3500. 
Secor votes for this raise. 
March, 82 - (7 months later) 
administrators salaries at Ke­
waskum High School raised 
again an average of $3500. 
Secor again votes in favor of 
these excessive raises!

In fact, Mr. Secor always 
votes in favor of any and all 
spending.

Mrs. Rosenberger advocates 
more guidance counselors and 
agrees with past spending of 
the board including the “In 
house computer toy for the 
administration” at $75,000 for 
starters.

Guts in the budget are made

by.lil other schools in the area, 
but not Kewaskum!

Has Mr. Secor ever voted 
against any administration 
spending? Never!

1 will cast my vote for Spoerl 
and Horner to bring a little 
fiscal responsibility to the 
board.

Retired Taxpayer, trying to 
hold my head above water.

• • • •

To the Editor:
As a resident of the Kewas­

kum School District, I have been 
most interested in the com­
ments and questions contained 
in the “Letters to the Editor” of 
the Kewaskum Statesman con­
cerning the upcoming School 
Board election. I am patiently 
waiting for Mr. Spoerl to an­
swer the questions asked by 
Gerald Buchel in the States­
man, Friday, Feb. 26, 1982. 
There are many parents and 
students who are confused as to 
which activities Mr. Spoerl 
considers “frills.” We would 
like Mr. Spoerl to be very 
specific in his reply.

I would also like to know why 
Mr. Spoerl was unavailable for 
the Voter’s Forum. When you 
become a candidate, busy as 
your schedule may be, every 
effort should be made to appear 
before the district voters. If Mr. 
Spoerl chooses to stay away 
from a voter forum, then his 
statements should not be print­
ed in newspapers.

Concerning Mr. Spoerl’s 
statements, 1 find it interesting 
that Mr. Spoerl’s written state­
ments are so much more 
eloquent than his spoken state­
ments. When I have observed 
him speaking at various school 
board meetings, I have never 
heard anything close to such 
word combinations as “scho­
lastically advanced,” insures 
the retention,” “ongoing as­
sistance,” “athletic endea­
vors,” and others I find in his 
letters to the editor.

If Mr. Spoerl pays no taxes to 
our schools, I, too, believe 
vengeance is the key motive for 
his candidacy. If Mr. Spoerl had 
been allowed to continue punch­
ing in before he actually began 
working, where would the line 
have been drawn for other 
personnel?

To those of you who support 
Mr. Spoerl, I hope you will 
carefully consider all the facts. 
Is Mr. Spoerl your answer to 
continued quality education or 
are you interested in helping 
him gain revenge? If he gains 
his revenge, how will that help 
our children?

Think carefully before you 
vote!

Ruth Schmitt

March 28, 1982
To the Editor:

As an employer of John H. 
Spoerl, a candidate for the 
Kewaskum School Board, I can 
strongly endorse him.

John is a good employee. He 
has plenty of common sense and 
isn’t afraid to use it. It is typical 
of John that while others are 
attacking him, he continues 
discussing the issues. He is 
responsible and reliable. When., 
an emergency, such as illness, 
arises, John, like a good.

[Continued on next pegs]
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neighbor, is willing to help well 
beyond his usual commitment.

I he Kewaskum School Dis­
trict could only benefit from 
having John H. Spoerl on the 
school board.

Walter Buczek

March 28, 1982
To the Editor:

Voters of the Kewaskum 
School District, knowing whom 
we should elect to the Kewas­
kum School Board April 6 
becomes clear once we ask 
ourselves some questions. Do 
we want tax relief? If so, vote 
for Spoerl and Horner. Do we 
want innovative programs with­
out increased costs? If so, vote 
for Spoerl and Horner. Do we 
feel that a good school district 
can be improved? If so, vote for 
Spoerl and Horner. Do we 
want our representatives to 
display a sense of fairness and 
common decency? If so, vote for 
Spoerl and Horner. Do we want 
people who can think for them­
selves (unlike the incumbent 
who, for as long as we have 
followed the doings of the 
School Board, has not differed 
with the superintendent’s 
position)? If so, vote for Spoerl 
and Horner. Do we want people 
who know the issues, who 
understand the current econo­
mic conditions, and who are 
willing to work for us? If so, 
Spoerl and Horner, numbers 
one and three on the ballot, are 
the candidates who deserve our 
votes. The choice is yours. Vote 
April 6.

Sincerely,
Mr. & Mrs. Robert G. Serwe

March 29, 1982
To the Editor:

As the Kewaskum School 
board election approaches, it is 
clear that the candidates have 
divided themselves into two 
political camps - Joan Rosen­
berger and Gerald Secor, liberal 
spendthrifts and Ralph Horner 
and John Spoerl, fiscal con­
servatives. With today’s econ­
omy, we need people on the 
Board who can make intelligent 
decisions which will hold the 
line on taxes without sacrificing 
educational quality. We plan to 
vote for Ralph Horner and John 
Spoerl on April 6 and encourage 
you to do the same.

Sincerely,
Mr. and Mrs.
Elmer Retzlaff

Kewaskum Statesman 
250 Main Street 
Kewaskum, WI 53040
Dear Editor:

As a fairly recent graduate of 
Kewaskum High School, it is 
with great interest that I am 
following this year’s school 
board elections. It should be 
noted, however, the only source 
of information on the election I 
receive is from the Kewaskum 
Statesman and verbally from 
my family, since I am attending 
college away from the Kewas­
kum area. However, I personal­
ly find the communities re­
actions to a few of the candi­
date’s platforms causing me to 
worry for the students presently 
enrolled at the high school. 
Many people seem to want their 
candidate to make drastic cuts 
in th^schppj pV,dgp|., however,

this would be a large error 
concerning your children’s 
education's and futures.

Attending any university will 
show you quite clearly that the 
students suceeding there, were 
usually the ones that were 
involved in extra-curricular 
activities back in their high 
school years. If not given the 
chance, these students will 
never be able to gain the 
leadership qualities and con­
fidence in themselves these 
activities are capable of giving. 
As noted in a letter to the editor 
in last week’s paper, only 2.8% 
of the school budget is used for 
these extra-curricular activities 
so necessary for a high school 
student. This recently former 
student of KHS is asking the 
community to use their vote in a 
way as not to jeopardize the 
future of my younger brothers 
and sisters, and all Kewaskum 
students.

Sincerely yours,
Andrew Strigenz 
1980 KHS graduate

March 29, 1982
To the Editor:

As I have observed through­
out the past year, the majority 
of the votes on the Kewaskum 
School Board have been 5-2 
with Dr. Charles Ogi and 
Thomas Brigham being the only 
ones concerned with the reck­
less spending of the majority of 
the Board members.

Our economy does not allow 
for wasted spending of tax­
payers’ money (like an in-house 
computer system for adminis­
trators’ convenience). It’s time 
to give these two men some 
support for their proposals. 
Therefore, in order to imple­
ment a conservative approach to 
a quality education, I support 
John Spoerl and Ralph Horner 
for the Kewaskum School 
Board.

Sincerely,
Earl J. Etta

To Editor, 
Kewaskum Statesman,

I just couldn’t help but laugh 
about the statement made by 
Dr. and Mrs. J. D. Connor on 
March 19th, when they made 
the statement that “good 
management doesn’t cost, it 
pays.’’ Let me point out a 
couple things about manage­
ment:

1. First you must have good 
sound management and then 
only will it start paying off.

2. And good management 
doesn’t come cheap, knowing 
from experience in that field 
and these are facts. And the 
class of ’82 complaining about 
good education. This is up to 
each student to get the most out 
of their high school years. I’ve 
seen seniors come in the per­
sonnel office and couldn’t even 
fill out a simple application. 
Just remember class of '82, the 
business world is tough out 
there. Management doesn’t 
play games anymore, manage­
ment does what they want. 
There is no senior going to tell 
them what to do. Just like Mr. 
Spoerl said it well, “why not 
reward our scholastically ad­
vanced student? So the less 
you get out of 4 years of high 
school, the less you can expect. 
Mr. Spoerl had another good 
point “where a student could 
benefit from an eight period

day.’’ Why not let Mr. Spoerl 
and Mr. Horner prove their 
point once.?

Signed,
A Concerned Citizen

Kewaskum Statesman
To the Editor:

As 1 sit here reading the 
March 26 issue of your fine 
paper, I can’t help but to 
comment on some of the state­
ments pertaining to the up­
coming school board election.

I’ve tried to follow the letters 
to the editor section to become 
better acquainted with the is­
sues surrounding this year’s 
election. Most of the letters that 
support Gerald Secor and Joan 
Rosenberger also seem to be­
little John Spoerl and Ralph 
Horner.

As I recall, John Spoerl and 
Ralph Horner face the issues. 
They speak about ways they 
know will help our school sys­
tem as well as give some relief 
to us overburdened taxpayers.

Now, as this campaign draws 
to a close, 1 suppose we will see 
a multitude of signatures who in 
essence are trying to support a 
sinking ship. They could never 
float on their own, so they latch 
onto whatever benefits them 
regardless of the price hard­
working people have to pay.

People of the Kewaskum 
School District; don't be fooled! 
John Spoerl and Ralph Horner 
are the only candidates who can 
give you a platform based on 
the common sense approach to 
budgeting, a true committment 
to education, and give true 
guidance to an administration 
who has lost touch with the 
public sector as is evident with 
their huge salary increase.

My vote will definitely go to 
John Spoerl and Ralph Horner 
on April 6th.

One who would not 
be coerced into 
signing such drivel

Letter to the Editor
As a concerned citizen of a 

community I am proud to live in 
I am disappointed in the 
number of articles of criticism 
rather than compliments. It is 
evident that it is easier to 
criticize than to compliment. I 
feel that a compliment does a lot 
more good and goes a lot 
further than any criticism ever 
does. The only thing a criticism 
does is make an enemy of one 
when what we really need are 
friends. If each and everyone of 
us would look on life with a 
more positive attitude rather 
than a negative one we would 
very possibly not be in the 
economic conditions that we are 
now in. I was proud to see that 
some of our students that we 
are providing an education for 
realized this and took the time 
to write an article and sign it in 
what I interpreted as a Thank 
You. I believe that a good 
education is a likely possibility 
of a better tomorrow.

I hope that every one of us 
will be more thoughtful and be 
willing to give a Thank You for 
jobs well done and for this we 
might see more people willing 
to run for positions on the 
school board as well as village 
and town officials and people 
who are willing to give a little 
more of their personal time to 
make this world a better place 
to live in. God gave each one of 
us a brain to use, to make up 
our own mind so let’s not keep 
telling the next person how he

or she should vote.
1 personally hope I did not 

offend anyone by this letter.
Thank You
Edward J. Miller 
President, Millers Inc.

• • • •

TG THE EDITOR:
My children have completed 

their education in Kewaskum 
and have gone on to experience 
success in college and in their 
individual professional careers 
in education, medicine, law and 
business. The 48-plus years of 
education they received here 
have served them well. They 
were not blessed with unusual 
ability. What they had in Ke­
waskum was a faculty of high 
quality, a staff of intelligent 
administrators, an effective 
school board and a community 
concerned with the future of 
their children. Each of these 
separate entities did their best 
to provide a sound education for 
all students and perhaps most 
importantly, worked together to 
create an atmosphere for learn- 
ing.

In recent years it seems to 
have become popular for some 
board members and some can­
didates for election to the board 
to be more concerned with 
creating issues or dwelling upon 
areas which do nothing to 
promote education. This often 
serves only to cause strong 
feelings of animosity, uneasi­
ness and distrust between the 
above vital groups. The school 
board should not become a 
battleground for personal egos 
or a place to settle vendettas of 
a personal nature. A school 
board member should be able to 
work cooperatively with others 
and have the ability to reach a 
conclusion based on the ulti­
mate benefit to both students 
and community while being 
aware that every facet of edu­
cation cannot be measured by a 
cost in dollars.

The voter doesn't know how 
effective new members will be 
until those members have had 
the opportunity to learn the 
facts and vote their own judge­
ments. I have never had the 
pleasure of working with Mrs. 
Rosenberger, Mr. Horner or 
Mr. Spoerl and know their 
qualifications only from what 
appears in the papers. From 
personal board experience with 
Mr. Secor, I have learned he is 
committed to providing good 
educational opportunities for 
Kewaskum students and is 
knowledgeable about the cost of 
providing this service. 1 also 
believe he is aware of the cost of 
not providing the best we can 
for our children and for the 
children of our friends and 
neighbors.

Although no longer a voting 
resident of the district, I am a 
concerned taxpayer and still 
interested ten year veteran of 
the Kewaskum Community 
School Board. Hopefully all 
eligible residents will consider 
their choices carefully before 
casting their ballots on Tues­
day.

Richard L. Edwards

To the Editor:
The recent PTO Forum was 

well attended by school district 
voters. However, one candi­
date, J|!rv Spoerl,, wap absent

again. A school board candidate 
that cannot get out and meet 
and face the voters certainly 
does not deserve any intelligent 
person's vote. No one is really 
sure whether he is really inter­
ested in education or really 
interested in personal ven­
geance for getting fired from his 
district job several years ago. 
Time and time again local civic 
and KE A groups have invited 
him to meet with them at any 
hour but he has a different 
excuse every time. I for one do 
not want a person unknown to 
me to be handling my tax 
money for the next 3 years.

A concerned 
taxpayer and voter

Editor, The Statesman:
1 wps “shocked, angered, and 

disgusted by the intemperate 
attack’’ on my husband and 
myself by John Spoerl’s “good 
friend and neighbor,” James 
Oelhafen. Mr. Oelhafen, you 
obviously had little grasp of 
what our letter was actually 
saying and are guilty in spades 
of the very tactics of which you 
have accused us. My husband 
will not dignify such chicanery 
with a response, but I feel 
compelled to defend our name 
when so viciously maligned.

First of all Mr. Oelhafen, if 
you will kindly reread our letter, 
you will clearly see that we did 
NOT level “a personal attack” 
nor “pass moral judgement” on 
John Spoerl. I happen to feel 
that a candidate’s personal 
qualifications, as they apply to 
an election, are very much a 
part of his platform, and so 
apparently does Mr. Spoerl. His 
campaign pamphlet listed much 
personal background informa­
tion as part of what he feels are 
his qualifications for office. We 
merely did the same, present­
ing the other side of the coin. 
And in what way you felt we 
passed “moral judgement” on 
Mr. Spoerl, completely escapes 
me. Read our letter again Mr. 
Oelhafen and you will see we 
merely stated facts, facts that 
we feel are important to any 
candidate’s qualifications for 
office. The information we put 
forward is all a matter of public 
record and we were very careful 
to state it accurately. My hus­
band listened to tapes of pre­
vious school board meetings to 
make sure we were not short­
changing Mr. Spoerl with un­
truths.

You go on to say “all (our) 
accusations have been made 
secondhand” because we have 
not talked to Mr. Spoerl. What 
does our talking to him have to 
do with anything. As I said, my 
husband listened to the tapes so 
that information (not accusa­
tion) wasn’t “second-hand.” 
More importantly, we have 
heard Mr. Spoerl speak and wit­
nessed his antics at School 
Board meetings. You can’t get 
more first-hand, Mr. Oelhafen. 
Seems you’re the only one dis­
seminating “accusations sec­
ond-hand.”

If the “people from this 
district believe in fair play and 
thoroughly disapprove of back­
biting,” Mr. Oelhafen, then 
surely these people find your 
ludicrous statement that we 
“look down (our) noses at a man 
who labors for a living” in the 
poorest of taste and completely
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despicable. And believe me, we 
have had many, many calls and 
comments to this effect from 
friends and strangers alike. 
How dare you to presume that 
we would judge any human 
being by what he does for a 
living! Seems to me you are the 
one who feels "any end to 
justify the means" and you are 
the one who “must be des­
perate to resort to such tactics.'' 

Incidentally, Mr. Oelhafen, 
all the quotes in this letter 
belong to you. You have un­
fairly made us a target in an 
election we are not involved in, 
other than as concerned voters. 
You have hurt us very deeply 
with your callous remarks and 
would dignify yourself with an 
apology.

Carole M. Connor
P.S. We don’t like spending 
such a large portion of our 
income on taxes any more than 
the next guy, but feel we must 
keep our priorities straight. Our 
children are our most important 
resource for the future and 
deserve the best education we 
can give them. And, yes, a lot of 
other districts are making cuts, 
but if you read past the head­
lines, you will realize that most 
of the cuts they are making have 
already been made here or else 
don’t apply to our system. 
There are districts in Milwau­
kee that spend over $4,700 per 
pupil per year, so they have lots 
of areas in which to cut. We 
spend $2,623 per pupil per year 
and don't have that luxury.

To The Editor:
For some time Mr. Horner 

has been constantly throwing 
darts at what he indicates to be 
high Administrative salaries of 
our school district.

When reviewing our admini­
strators, Mr. Brenholt, Mr. 
Pearson, Mr. Esser, and Mr. 
Borch, we find the following 
information:

Mr. Brenholt has a Masters 
Degree plus 15 additional post 
graduate credits. This is equal 
to 5*/* years of College Educa­
tion.

Mr. Pearson has a Masters 
Degree plus 35 additional post 
graduate credits. This is equal 
to 6'4 years of college educa­
tion.

Mr. Esser has a Masters 
Degree plus 20 additional post 
graduate credits. This is equal 
to 5’/i years of college educa­
tion.

Mr. Borch has a Masters 
Degree plus 75 additional post 
graduate credits. This is equal 
to 8 years of college education.

Along with their many years 
of schooling we cannot over look 
their years of experience. For 
example Mr. Esser has 25 years 
teaching and 6 years as an 
administrator and Mr. Pearson 
has 10 years teaching and 11 
years as an administrator.

After looking at the quali­
fications of our Administrators I 
think Mr. Horner should consult 
his Employer. If they permit, 
then find out what his compa­
ny’s professional people with

comparable years of schooling 
and years of experience are 
receiving for a salary. He would 
probably find the salaries of our 
Administrators near and in 
most cases below those of his 
company.

When this situation occurs it 
is always best to judge apples 
with apples, do not compare 
them to something else. I think 
it would be wise if Mr. Horner 
would review his position and 
his salary and compare it to the 
education he has for his posi­
tion; he might find he is 
over paid.

If Mr. Horner is concerned 
with education and the activities 
of the school I feel he should 
have shown his face for the girls 
basketball team "Welcome 
Home" on Sunday, March 14, 
at the school.

So everyone can understand 
my point I would like to com­
pare two students who would 
have graduated in 1981. One 
person selected to get a degree 
in Education Administration 
and the other selected to take a 
production job at Regal Ware 
for average salary.

The estimated cost for a 
college student attending a 
Wisconsin school is $4000 - 
$4500 per year. In order for a 
student to achieve a Bachelors 
Degree in Administration a 
minimum of 4 years is required. 
Should that individual desire a 
Masters Degree additional 
schooling is required. After 
receiving his degree and a 
position additional credits are 
needed to improve his position.

Taking Mr. Pearson’s quali­
fications as an example and 
considering he got his Masters 
Degree in 44 years and his 35 
post graduate credits were got­
ten by taking summer courses 
after taking an Administration 
position.
Cost of Education

at $4000 per year -$18,000 
35 Post Credits

at $85 per year - $ 2,975 
Total Cost $20,975
Assuming he worked

summers and earned
$3000 per summer -$ 9,000 

Total Cost of Ed. $11,975 
After completing his school­

ing which would be about 1985 
he accepted a position for a 
salary of $24,000, and received 
salary increases of 8% annual­
ly-

The classmate which received 
average salary at Regal Ware 
for $8.00 per hour and worked a 
normal year of 2000 hours 
without overtime would get a 
annual salary of $16,000. Let us 
also see that this fellow gets an 
8% annual salary increase.

The big question I have is 
how long must the college 
student work before his gross 
life earnings with his cost of 
education equals that of the 
factory worker. The answer is 
18 years. Do you think this 
would encourage better educa­
tion?

My point as parent, taxpayer 
and not a member of the faculty 
is to encourage better education 
and not discourage it.

Name Withheld

March 30, 1982
TO THE EDITOR:

At the present, the Sheriff is 
the only public officer or em­
ployee in Wisconsin excluded 
from protection against lawsuits 
or judgements arising from his 
official acts. This exclusion is 
caused by a relatively unknown 
134 year old section of the 
Wisconsin Constitution.

A law exists providing cover­
age for Deputy Sheriffs. Be­
cause "Deputy Sheriff" has at 
times been declared to be 
legally the same as "Sheriff,” 
there is a question whether or 
not Deputy Sheriffs have the 
same protection as all other 
public officers and employees. 
To remove this question, both 
the 1979-80 and 1981-82 Legis­
latures have approved a change 
in the Constitution. Their action 
must now be ratified through 
the referendum appearing on 
the April 6th ballot.

We believe all employees 
should be provided the same 
protection. In addition, we be­
lieve a citizen with a legitimate 
claim against a Sheriff or Depu­
ty Sheriff should have a means 
of recovering damages in those 
instances where a Sheriff or 
Deputy Sheriff has limited as­
sets from which to satisfy a 
judgement. A "Yes” vote on 
the April 6th referendum will 
guarantee both. It will be a vote 
for equal treatment.

Sincerely,
Washington County 

’ Deputy Sheriff’s 
Association

NOTICE OF 
REFERENDUM ELECTION 

April 6, 1982
STATE OF WISCONSIN) 

) ss.
Elections Board )

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN, that at an election to be held 
in the several towns, wards, villages and election districts of 
the State of Wisconsin, on the first Tuesday of April, A.D., 
1982, being the Sixth day of said month, the foliowing 
amendment to the Constitution of the State of Wisconsin, 
having been approved by two successive legislatures, will be 
submitted to a vote of the people pursuant to law:
1981 Assembly Joint Resolution 7

Deposited May 20. 1981
Published May 23, 1981

ENROLLED JOINT RESOLUTION IS
To amend section 4 of article VI of the constitution, relating 

to county responsibility for the acts of sheriff (2nd 
consideration).

Whereas, the 1979 legislature in regular session proposed an 
amendment to the constitution by 1979 Assembly Joint 
Resolution 99 (Enrolled Joint Resolution 38) and agreed to it 
by a majority of the members elected to each of the 2 houses, 
which amendment reads as follows:
SECTION : 1 Section 4 of article VI of the constitution is 
amended to read:
(Article VI) Section 4 (I) Sheriffs, coroners, register

registers of deeds, distncTattorneys, and all other elected 
county dfficiers except judicial officers and chief 
executive officers, shall be chosen by the electors of the 
respective counties once in every two-2 years

(2) The offices of coroner and surveyor in counties having a 
population of 500,000 or more are abolished. Counties not 
having a population of 500,000 shall have the option of 
retaining the elective office of coroner or instituting a 
medical examiner system. Two or more counties may 
institute a joint medical examiner system

(3) Sheriffs shall hold no other office, Uwy Sheriffs may be 
required by law to renew their security from time to time, 
and in default of giving such new security their office shall 
be deemed vacant, but Iha county shall novar bo made 
responsible for the acts of the sheriff

Village 
Hair 

Stylists 
Iwii Dune s 

Jwut) Snap

227 Main St. 
Kewaskum

Services Offered:
• Shampoo & sets
• Hair cuts
• Permanent waving
• Hair coloring
• Men’s & Women’s 

Hair styling
Open Daily 8 30 to 5 00

Evenings by Appointment" 
Walk ins welcome
PHONE 626-2616

(4) The governor may remove any elected county officer 
mentioned in this section manUanea. giving to aueh the 
officer a copy of the charges against him and an oppor­
tunityof being heard in his defense

(5) All vacancies in the officgi of sheriff, coroner, register of 
deeds pr district attorney shall be filled by appointments 
aad Uw The person appointed to fill a vacancy shall hold 
office onTyior the unexpired portion of the term to which 
he shall ba appointed and until hie a successor shall be 
elected and qualified.

Now, therefore, be it resolved by the assembly, the senate 
concurring, That the foregoing amendment to the constitu­
tion is agreed to by the 1981 legislature; and, be it further

Resolved. That the foregoing amendment be submitted to 
a vote of the people at the election to be held on the first 
Tuesday of April, 1982: and, be it further

Resolved. That the question concerning ratification of the 
foregoing amendment be stated on the ballot as follows:

• CfipnlY responsibility, for, arts Of ShtrUL Shall section 4 
of article VI of the constitution he amended to provide that 
the legislature may. by law, permit or require counties to be 
responsible for the acts of the sheriff?”

EXPLANATION
Article VI, section 4 of the Wisconsin Constitution now 

provides that the county shall never be mande responsible 
for the acts of sheriff This provision has been construed by 
the supreme court to mean that the county may not be made 
financially responsible for damages suffered by wrongful 
acts of the sheriff.

A no vote would not change this provision
A yes vote would amend this provision of the Wisconsin 

Constitution to enable the legislature to either permit or 
require counties to assume financial responsibility for 
damages suffered by wrongful acts of the sheriff.

I, Gerald J Ferwerda, Executive Secretary of the State 
Elections Board, DO HEREBY CERTIFY, that the fore­
going proposed Referendum known as 1981 Assembly Joint 
Resolution 7, 1981 Enrolled Joint Resolution 15 has been 
compared by me with the published copy of said resolution 
and the same is a true copy thereof
GIVEN under my hand and the official seal of the County 
of Washington, in the City of West Bend, this 22nd day of 
February, A D., 1982

George F. Nehrbass 
County Clerk

OFFICIAL REFERENDUM BALLOT
NOTICE TO ELECTORS: THIS BALLOT MAY BE INVALID UNLESS 
INITIALED BY 2 ELECTION OFFICIALS SERVING AS BALLOT CLERKS. 
IF CAST AS AN ABSENTEE BALLOT, THE BALLOT MUST BEAR THE 
INITIALS OF THE MUNICIPAL CLERK.

If you desire to vote on any question, place a cross (X) in the square 
beneath the question after "yes" if in favor of the question, or place 
a cross (X) in the square after "no" if opposed to the question.

County responsibility for acts of sheriff. Shall section 4 of article VI 
of the constitution be amended to provide that the;legislature may. 
by law, permit require counties to be responsible for the acts of the 
sheriff’

NO
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BALLOT NOTICE

OF APRIL ELECTION 
April 6, 1982

OFFICE OF WASHINGTON COUNTY CLERK
TO THE ELECTORS OF WASHINGTON COUNTY:

Notice is hereby given of a spring election to be held in the 
several wards in the County of Washington, on the 6th day of 
April, 19*2. at which the officers named below shall be 
chosen The names of the candidates for each office to be 
voted for, whose nominations have been certified to or filed in 
this office, are given under the title of office (and under the 
appropriate party or other designation, each in its proper 
column, together with the questions submitted to a vote in 
the sample ballot below )

INFORMATION TO ELECTORS
Upon entering the polling place, an elector shall give his or 

her name and address before being permitted to vote Where 
ballots are distributed to electors, the initials of two ballot 
clerks must appear on the ballot Upon being permitted to 
vote, the elector shall retire alone to a voting booth or 
machine and cast his or her ballot An election official may 
inform the elector of the proper manner for casting a vote, 
but the official may not in any manner advise or indicate for 
whom to vote

At a nonpartisan election, the elector shall place a cross in 
the square at the right of or depress the button or lever next to 
the candidate s name for each office for whom he or she 
intends to vote, or insert or write in the name of his or her 
choice for a candidate.

On referenda questions, the elector shall make a cross in 
the square at the right of or depress the button or lever next to 
the answer which ne or she intends to give.

The vote should not be cast in any other manner If the 
electors spoils a ballot, he or she shall return it to an election 
official who shall issue another ballot in its place, but not 
more than three ballots shall be issued to any one elector. If 
the ballot has not been initialed by two ballot clerks or is 
defective in any other way, the elector shall return it to the 
election official, who shall issue a proper ballot in its place, 
Not more than five minutes' time shall be allowed inside a 
voting booth or machine. Unofficial ballots or a memoran­
dum to assist the elector in marking his or her ballot may be 
taken into the booth and copied. The sample ballot shall not 
be shown to anyone so as to reveal how the ballot is marked.

After the official paper ballot is marked, it shall be folded 
so the inside marks do not show, but so that the printed 
indorsements and ballot clerks' initials on the outside do 
show. After casting his or her ballot, the elector shall leave 
the machine or booth, and where paper ballots are used, give 
his or her name to the inspector in charge of the ballot box, 
hand the inspector his or her folded ballot to be placed in the 
ballot box, deposit any unused ballots in the blank ballot box, 
and shall leave the polling place promptly.

An elector may be assisted by two election officials of 
different political parties in casting his or her vote if the 
elector declares to the presiding official that he or she is 
unable to read, has difficulty reading, writing or under­
standing English, or that due to physical disability is unable 
to cast nis or her ballot Alternatively, an elector making 
such declaration may have another elector of the county 
assist in marking the ballot or operating a voting machine. 
The presiding official may administer an oath to a person 
making such declaration.

The following is a facsimile of the official ballot:

George F. Nehrbass
County Clerk

VOLUNTEERS
WANTED

VOLUNTEERS you can get 
involved in many valuable 
ways. Volunteer work is a great 
way to gain skills and ex­
perience to put on your resume 
for that job that isn’t available 
now. If you have lots of time on 
your hands right now, volun­
teering is a great way to share 
your interest and time in a 
meaningful and appreciated 
way. Following is a list of 
opportunities for volunteer 
services in Washington County. 
If you would like to volunteer for 
one of these services contact the 
person listed below.

• The West Bend Red Cross 
would like to find transportation 
drivers to drive the West Bend 
Red Cross vehicle. Red Cross

OFFICIAL BALLOT
For Judicial & County Supervisor Offices

NOTICE TO ELECTORS. THIS BALLOT MAY BE INVALID UNLESS 
INITIALED BY 2 ELECTION OFFICIALS SERVING AS BALLOT CLERKS 
IF CAST AS AN ABSENTEE BALLOT, THE BALLOT MUST BEAR THE 
INITIALS OF THE MUNICIPAL CLERK

To vote for a person whose name is printed on the ballot, mark a 
cross (X) in the square at the RIGHT of the name of the person for 
whom you desire to vote. To vote for a person whose name is not 
printed on the ballot, write the name in the blank space provided for 
the purpose.

District 
No. Wards Candidates

1 1 k 2, C. of West Bend.................................Leo A. Groh
Marvin J. Juech

2 3, 4 & 14, C. of West Bend................Charles O'Meara
Herbert J. Tennies

3 6, 7 4 21. C. of West Bend....................Paul Henke, Sr.
4 8, 9 & 10, C. of West Bend................. .  Donald R. Bohn
5 5, 11 & 12, C. of West Bend...............  Fern L. Hembel
6 13 & 15, C. of West Bend

3, T. of Trenton...................................Arthur G. Degnitz
7 16, 17 & 18, C. of West Bend............... Sharon J. Jach

Raymond P. Keppler
8 19 & 20, C. of West Bend

1, T. of West Bend................................... Harold F Ryan
Mary Frances Eckert

9 1 it 2, T. of Wayne-
2, T. of Kewaskum
3, T. of Farmington...........................Jane M McElroy

Harold Westerman
10 1, 2 & 3, V. of Kewaskum

1, T. of Kewaskum...............................Charles F. Miller
11 1 & 2, T. of Farmington

2, T. of Trenton..................................Norbert Dettmann
12 1, 2, 3, 4, 5 li 6, T. of Addison............John G. German
13 1, 2, 3. & 4, T. of Barton

2, T. of West Bend...............................Peter Gonnering
14 3, 4, 5, 6 li 7, T. of West Bend............Orrin J. Peters
15 1, 4 li 5. T. of Trenton

1, V. of Newburg.................................................................
16 1 It 2, V. of Slinger

Court of Vote for One

RICHARD S. BROWN.........................................................................

DENIS R. VOGEL.................................................................................

COUNTY OFFICERS

County Supervisor, District 10 Vote for One

4 , T. of Hartford
3 4 4, C. of Hartford............................Jerome P. Faust

Oscar W Deutsch
17 1. 4, 5, 6, 7 4 8, T. of Polk..................... Willard Heppe
18 1, 2, 3, 4, 6 4 7, T. of Jackson ... Reuben J. Schmahl 
19 2 4 3, T. of Polk

1 4 2, V. of Jackson
5, T. of Jackson........................................... Earl Kruepke

Joseph J. Walter
20 11,12.13,14,15.16,17 4

18, C. of Hartford......................George H. Frank
21 1. 2, 7, 8, 9, 10, 19. 20 4

21, C. of Hartford......................James H. Beatty
22 1, 2 4 3. T. of Hartford

5 4 6, C. of Hartford...................................John A. Frey
Haiold A. Boyd 

23 1, 2 4 3, T. of Erin
5, T. of Hartford....................................... Hugo Schwulst

24 1, 2, 3. 4 4 5. T. of Richfield
4, T. of Erin..................................................Adolph Lofy

25 6, 7, 8 4 9, T. of Richfield..........Calvin R. Schneider
26 10, 11, 12. 13 4 14, T of Richfield..........John B Kohl
27 1, T. of Germantown

1,2 4 3, V. of Germantown
15, T. of Richfield................................Helmuth F Prahl

28 4, 5 4 6, V. of Germantown ............Gilbert A. Arnold
29 7, 8 4 9, V. of Germantown

Ward 286, Aldermanic District 15.
C. of Milwaukee................... Kenneth F. Miller

30 * 10. 11 4 12. V. of Germantown ..Clarence M Roskopf

orientation is provided. Drivers 
are needed Monday thru Friday 
from 8:00 to 5:00 and simply 
need to hold a current driver’s 
license. Contact Mrs. Jackie 
Wicklund at 334-5687.

• The Samaritan Home is 
looking for volunteer pets for a 
new pet therapy program for 
communication with elderly 
residents at the home. Any well 
behaved and friendly farm 
animals or pets would qualify. 
The pets are needed Wednes­
days from 1:00 - 3:00 p.m. and 
the owner need not be present 
at the sessions. Have your 
owner call Lori Long at 338- 
4500.

* Sandy is 23 and lives in a 
foster home in Kewaskum. She 
would really like to meet and 
get to know another woman to 
share her recreational time 
with. Sandy could really benefit 
from a friendship in which she 
could share talks about personal 
grooming, interests and 
feelings. If you would like to 
know more about a 1 to 1 
relationship as a volunteer, 
contact Sue Moser at the Citizen 
Advocacy Program at 334-3384.

This column is a service cf the 
Organization for Professional 
Exchange Now (O.P.E.N.) 
Volunteer Committee. Non-pro­
fit agencies that would like an 
item in this column can contact 
Susan Moser, Volunteer Com­
mittee Chairperson, 551 Silver- 
brook Drive, West Bend, Wis­
consin 53095, or call 334-3384.

CHARLES F. MILLER........................................................................ George F. Nehrbass 
County Clerk

A 
to

leftover baked pota-
can be rebaked by

dipping in water and
placing in a 350 degree 
oven for about 20 minutes.

A squirrel may scrounge as much as twenty bushels of 
nuts and roots and seeds and put them in a number 
of caches scattered around his territory. However, 
squirrels have terrible memories and are often un­
able to find even a tenth of these caches later on.

Vote for

JOHN H. SPOERL
Kewaskum School Board

April 6,1982

♦ Ah'Ih ri/od uid paid for by f url llohlweck. 8630 Fairview Dr., Allenton. Wl 53002
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Campus Notes

Certificates of commendation 
are being mailed to about 1,100 
students at the University of 
Wisconsin-Stevens Point who 
earned high academic grade­
points during the fall semester 
that ended in December.

Chancellor Philip R. Marshall 
said students with gradepoints 
from 3.90 (B plus) to 4.0 
(straight A) are designated as 
scholars of highest honor. High 
honor citations are going to 
students with gradepoints from 
3.75 to 3.89, and honor citations 
will go to students with grade­
point averages from 3.5 to 3.74.

One hundred and thirty-six 
students in the highest honor 
category have received straight 
A averages.

Following is the list of honor 
students from this community:

Bonnie Ladwig, 8434 Wesley 
Ct., Kewaskum, honors; Nancy 
Janous, 261 Railroad St., Camp­
bellsport, honors; Jean Koch, 
Rt. 1, Box 250, Campbellsport, 
honors; Michael Krueger, Rt. 2, 
Campbellsport, honors; Marga­
ret Lang, 206 N. Fond du Lac 
Ave., Campbellsport, highest 
honors.

• * * *

Mary Ryan, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert E. Ryan, 
Littleton, Colorado, formerly of 
Kewaskum, has been named to 
the Dean’s List for academic 
excellence for the fall semester, 
1981, at Mount Mary College, 
Milwaukee. A grade point aver­
age of at least 3.6 on a scale of 
4.0 is required for this honor.

Ms. Ryan is a senior with 
double majors in general busi­
ness and integrated home eco­
nomics.

* « * *

There have been 1,457 stu­
dents named to the Honors List 
for the fall semester at the 
University of Wisconsin-Eau 
Claire, announced Dr. Larry 
Schnack, UW-EC acting vice 
chancellor.

To be eligible for the honor, a 
student must receive at least a 
3.5 gradepoint average (where 
4.0 equals A) for 12 credits or 
more of college credit courses.

There were 544 seniors, 319 
juniors, 312 sophomores, and

BH^MKMMHP

8healths VJ?
L TipJ ^He

from Tom “

Loltzko, R.P.H.

WATER FOR HEADACHE
Drinking water can eliminate 
a headache in 9 out of 10 
youngsters, according to Dr. 
Ray LaForest, pediatrician at 
Scarborough Hospital. He 
attributes 90% of the head­
aces in school children to de­
hydration. “A youngster can 
lose as much as a quart of 
water during an active gym 
period.” In his studies on 
200 children, most head­
aches disappeared after 
drinking water. Both chil­
dren and adults can benefit 
from the natural cure for * 
headaches — water.

p^j Kennelly 
f Pharmacy
927 Fond du Lac Ave.

K^#um . * * * * S?§-8WJ „ *

282 freshmen who qualified for 
the honor.

UW-EC Honors List students 
from this area include John 
Harvey Dettmann, junior, from 
9388 Bolton Drive, Kewaskum.

• • • *
University of Wisconsin-Osh­

kosh officials have announced 
the names of undergraduate 
students named to the Dean’s 
List and Honor Roll for the 
1981-82 fall semester which 
ended January 22. .

To qualify for the honor roll a 
student must be taking not less 
than 12 credits and have a grade 
point average of 3.3 and above, 
based upon 4.0 being a perfect 
or straight “A” average.

UW-Oshkosh students from 
Kewaskum on the honor roll 
and Dean’s list are:

Sandra L. Beisbier, 1212 
Roseland Dr. (Dean’s List — 
Straight “A”); Donna M. Eh- 
nert, 1323 Roseland Dr.; Janet 
A. Matenaer, 2050 Hwy. 28 
(Dean’s List — Straight “A”);

Flea Market
Sunday, April 4 

THE CANTERBURY JNN
Hwy. 45 North to Hwy. F, East 3 Mlles

First Sunday of Each Month
10:00 a.m. to4:00p.m.

PHONE 1-668-6566 FOR RESERVATIONS

LIVE MUSIC
at the

AmmAHn
Hwy. 45 North • Kewaskum

Wednesday, April 7

^een X>^c
FRIENDS

8:00- 12:00 No ID's Required
SPONSORED BY KEWASKUM FFA ALUMNI

Thursday, April 8
SOFTBALL BENEFIT DANCE

FRIENDS
8:30- 12:30 ID’s Required

Friday, April 9
BIG BROTHERS/BIG SISTERS BENEFIT DANCE

ROCKET 88
FREE BEER 8:00-9:00 DANCE 8:30 -12:30

Saturday, April 10

Spring Dance
featuring

IDA RED
FREE BEER 8:00 - 9:00 DANCE 8:30 -12:00

Advance $1.00 At Door $2.00

Sunday, April 11
Ashford Sportsmen’s

Easter Dance'

RILL TRULL
Recording Orchestra

o 8:30 to 12:30
’ Advance $1.00 At Door $1.50

I A A A A ^fe AAA^V

David P Sieger, 2193 Valley Alfred, Lord Tennyson wrote a
View Dr.; Sheryl L. Squier, 1305 6,000-word epic poem when he
Roseland Dr. w“ onl* 12 *ear o,d

All You Can Eat-
Serving From 5 p.m. to 9 p.m.

Wed.-"Smelt”.......................$3.25
Thurs.--“Chicken & Ribs” ... $3.95
Fri.-“Seafood Buffet”..........$5.25
Sun.--“Lasagna/Spaghetti” . $4.95

Our Sunday Smorgasbord 
All You Can Eat-Serving 11:30 to 3:00 

Only ’5“ per person

—Saturday Night—
Cornish Hens.........................$5.95
Prime Rib.................................$7.95

Serving from 5 p.m. to 9 p.m.

The Canterbury Inn
(formerly Nonn's Resort)

Overlooking Beautiful Kettle Moraine Lake

Phone 533-4117 for Reservations
Directions: Hwy. E 1 mile W of Dundee, or 3 miles E of Waucousta

You Are Always Welcome at

The Amber Hotel
139 West Main St. Campbellsport

Serving Noon Luncheons Daily 11:00 to 2:00 
Dinners at 4:00 p.m.; Serving Saturdays at 4:00 

and Serving Sundays from 12:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m.

CLOSED GOOD FRIDAY 
Until 4:00 

CLOSED EASTER SUNDAY

SMELT FRY and 
SHRIMP BOIL 

Every Wednesday Family style
Includes: French Fries, Potato Salad, Cole Slaw, and Rye Rolls. 

Served During Noon and Evening Hours

Last Smelt Fry — April 7

DAILY SPECIALS 
Monday - Tenderloin Tips and Noodles 
Tues. Night - Prime Rib Plate 
Thursday - French Fried Lobster Chunks 

and Prime Rib Plate 
Friday - Fish Fry w/Haddock or Lake 

Perch, Also Poorman’s Lobster 
Saturday - Barbecued Ribs and Prime Rib 
Sunday - Roast Chicken w/Dressing 

and Prime Rib

RESERVATIONS ACCEPTED 
everyday except Friday evenings , 

CALL 533-8816
Banquets Accepted

Your Hosts. . . Dale and Lois '
aL.....  ar 4 J?
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March 28,1952

Paul Backhaus, 73, well 
known fanner of the Town of 
Kewaskum, residing on Route 
2, one mile east of the village, 
was killed almost instantly 
March 22, in a car-truck 
collision on Highway 28, one- 
half mile east of Kewaskum. 
His wife, the former Minnie 
Klein, survives along with one 
daughter, Florence (Mrs. 
Albert Stange).

The Village of Kewaskum, 
although much smaller than 
most cities visited by pre­
sidential candidates, was host 
to its second Republican 
candidate for president on 
Wednesday, when Harold E. 
Stassen, former governor of 
Minnesota, and president of the 
University of Pennsylvania 
visited our little city.

Peace Lutheran Church in 
Milwaukee was the setting 
Saturday for rites uniting in 
marriage Miss Lucille Scheerer 
and Byron R. Dei, Seaman First 
Class, Kewaskum.

Augie Bilgo, guard on Ke­
waskum’s title winning team, 
copped third highest scoring 
honors in the northern Lakes 
basketball league during the 
season just closed.

Daughters were born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Merlin Prost, Route 2, 
Kewaskum, March 23, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Peter Jansen, West 
Bend, March 22. Mrs. Jansen is 
the former Evelyn Weddig of 
Kewaskum. A son was born to 
Mr. and Mrs. Lyle Belger, 
Route 1, Adell, March 14.

SOQJeo/isjlgo
April 8,1932

Wednesday evening, the 
farm residence together with all 
household furniture and 
personal belongings of Mr. and 
Mrs. Albert Kuehl of the Town 
of Wayne, three miles south­
west of St. Kilian was complete­
ly destroyed by fire. The fire 
started while Mrs. Kuehl was 
filling a gasoline lantern, and in 
some manner the gasoline 
ignited and rapidly spread. 
Mrs. Kuehl was very severely 
burned about the hands and 
back, that she was not fatally 
burned is a mystery. In the 
room at the time of the fire were 
here three children, her sister, 
and her mother. All had to flee 
for safety. Mr. Kuehl was busy 
in the barn doing the evening 
chores. The loss is estimated at 
#6,000, partially covered by 
insurance.

The following students in the 
Kewaskum primary room had 
perfect attendance the past 
month: Harriet Backhaus, 
Patricia Brauchle, Laverne 
Terlinden, Evelyn Weddig, 
Robert Brauchle, Homer 
Schaub, Allen Bruessel, George

Hart and Willard Manthei.
The local Forensic Contest 

will be held at the high school 
on April 13. The participants 
include: Wilmer Klahn, Lester 
Bartel, Earl Kohler, William 
Harbeck, Gladys Schleif, 
Lorraine Habeck, Retha Jane 
Rosenheimer, Ione Schmidt, 
Beulah Schaub, Florence 
Westerman, Ruth Heppe, 
Evelyn Schaefer, Charlotte Lay, 
Celesta Backhaus, and William 
Martin.

Now that the ice is gone and 
the weather is warming up, 
some of the local fishermen 
have had very high fever. One 
day last week John Andrae, Jr., 
while spearing in the river near 
John Staehler’s place, speared 
a carp that weighed 27 pounds. 
This is the largest carp speared 
in this community. Roman 
Smith, a few weeks ago, spear­
ed one that weighed 23 pounds.

The farm house of John 
Aupperle, formerly known as 
the George Aupperle place, 
Town of Scott, was destroyed by 
fire on Thursday afternoon.

T^yeo^Mgo
March 30,1907

Last Sunday afternoon a fire 
broke out in the J. W. Schaefer 
residence on Main Street which 
threatened the destruction of 
the building for awhile. The fire 
started in a clothes closet and 
all of the family’s clothes were 
burned. How the fire started in 
the closet is not known.

The ice on the mill pond went 
out last Sunday. This is the first 
time in years that the river and 
mill pond have been entirely 
free from ice at this time of the American Family Mutual Insurance Co. 

Madison, Wis

On Thursday, Wenzel Peter 
of the Town of Wayne pur­
chased the forty acre farm in the 
above town, known as the Byrne 
farm from L. Rosenheimer; 
consideration $3,500.

Christ Rothenberger sold his 
farm near Wayne to George 
Kippenhan for $850 last week 
Friday.

Rosenheimer and Day bought 
the homestead and land sold by 
John Koelsch near St. Mi­
chaels; consideration $5,500.

Some 500,000 immigrants come 
to this country every year.

I mag 
save you 

money 
on auto 

insurance?*
Richard C.

Gust wH 
156 N. M AIN E^Hm 
WEST BEND F^TEW 

of Ph 338 1313 Kra^Bfl 
Kes Ph 533 8454 ■ «T^HB 

Call and compare! 
We’re driving down 

the cost of insurance.

AMERICAN FAMILY
• r\j*iUF»AfsjCE:

MITO HOME BUStHESS HEALTH UfE *

Boat Registration 
Renewals Sent Out 

a
The Department of Natural 

Resources’ License Section has 
mailed boat registration re­
newals to 155,000 boat owners 
whose registrations expire this 
March 31.

While the boating season 
may seem a long way off with 
the lakes and rivers frozen over 
at the present time, it does 
creep up in a hurry, and you are 
urged to act promptly in re­
newing your boat registration. 
That way you’ll be all set to go 
when the ice breaks up and the 
open water beckons.

Any boat owner whose regis­

Holy Trinity Church 
KEWASKUM 

SERVINGS AT 
9:30 a.m. and 11:30a.m.

For Tickets: Call any club 
member or Cindy 

at 626 4311

Kewaskum Junior 
Woman’s Club 

8th Annual

Easter Bunny
BRUNCH

Saturday, April 3

Hem & Turkey
Moshed Potatoes, Dressing,

tration expires this March 31 
who did not receive a renewal 
notice is asked to contact: 
License Section, Department of 
Natural Resources, Box 7921, 
Madison 53707-7921. Tele­
phone: (608)266-2107.

Fresno, California is the 
“raisin center" of the 
United States.
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The Meats Team was awarded a trophy for their second place finish out of 12 teams.
Pictured, left to right, back row • Tim Westerman (fifth individual], Mr. Rizzardi, advisor.
Mike Gindt; Bottom row - Scott Amerling (third individual], Mike Arndt.

Mil’c Marketing
Meeting in County

Dairy farmers and many 
others closely involved with the 
dairy industry are concerned 
about the future of milk prices 
and the dairy economy.

Interested persons will have 
an opportunity to become up­
dated on the situation at a 
special Milk Marketing Meeting 
that will be held on Thursday, 
April 1, from 8:30 p.m. to 10:00 
p.m. The meeting will be held 
in' the basement meeting room 
of the Washington County UW- 
Extenstion Office, located in 
Court House Annex, West 
Bend.

The program will be present­
ed over the Educational Tele­
phone Network (ETN) system. 
Professor Robert Cropp, Dairy 
Marketing Specialist at the 
University of Wisconsin- 
Platteville, will be leading the 
discussion and providing in­
formation and update on the 
current milk marketing situa-

The annual Fox Valley 
Technical Institute Judging 
Competition proved to be a 
good warm-up for Kewaskum

SENIOR CITIZENS PLAN 
TRIP TO FT. ATKINSON

The Senior Citizens of

FFA teams. Twenty-two FFA 
members represented Kewas­
kum is seven different areas.

Teams and members include: 
Dairy Cattle - Mike Schulz, 
Roger Batzler, Jim Herriges; 
Meat Animals - John Herriges, 
Mike Zuehlke, Dave Kunh;

Ke-
waskum are planning a trip to 
Ft. Atkinson to the Fireside 
Theater for lunch and a play on 
Thursday, May 6. There are 
openings to the public as the - 
coach is not filled.

Reservations must be in as 
soon as possible. Phone 626- 
4079 for information.

Meats - Mike Arndt, 
Amerling, Mike Gindt, 
Westerman; Crops -
Nowak, Jon Etta, Brian

Scott 
Tim

John 
Rup-

linger, John Schmitt; Dairy 
Products - John Swanson, Dan 
Mueller, Poultry and Eggs - 
Pierce Lewis, Mike Ehnert, 
Harvey Barber; Mechanics - 
Kevin Belger, Mark Steger, 
DuWayne Schacht.

The Meats team placed 2nd 
in the contest behind a strong 
Green Bay East team. Tim 
Westerman placed fifth in­
dividually and Scott Amerling

placed third individually for the 
team.

Two other individual stand­
outs include Dave Kurth placing 
seventh in Meat Animals and 
DuWayne Schacht placing ninth 
in Farm Mechanics. The teams 
travel to Madison in early April 
for state competition.

tion.
There is no registration 

charge for the program, but we 
would encourage anyone in­
terested in attending to contact 
the Washington County UW- 
Extension Office at 338-4477, 
644-5204 or 342-2929 so that we 
may have an idea as to how 
many people are planning to 
participate to allow arrange­
ments to be made for space and 
handout materials.

Septic Tank Cleaning
• Percolation Tests
• Septic Systems 

Installed and Repaired!!

Ellie’s Sanitation Service
Elton Kirchner, 626-4848

18 Yrs. Experience 
i—■■ uf ■

Letterin
409 Mam St. 
Kewaskum 

626-8094

• IMPRINTED SPORTSWEAR 
for your Team or Organization

• TRUCK & SIGN LETTERING
* CUSTOM PINSTRIPING 

By - KAREN -

317 N. Railroad St. 
Campbellsport 

533-8094

S>Q
H
O
M
E /
S // R/ E

M 
O 
D 
E
L

QUALITY Free Estimates 
• Fully Insured

• ALUMINUM SIDING
• Soffit Systems and Custom Trim

• Seamless Aluminum Gutters
• Doors — Windows

• Insulation

HEBERER BROS. Construction

HOURS: Tues. & Thurs. 10 to 5, Mon., Wed. & Fri.
Evenings 7 to 9, Sat. 10 to 2

N
G

Kewaskum, Wl
Roger 626-2598 Norm 626-2491------ ft ^------ ft I Bill 626-2384

LOW PRESCRIPTION PRICES

DUNDEE 
Sand & Gravel 
Q. Ramthun Ph. 533*4549
Washed Sand, Crushed 

Gravel, Stone and 
Lime Chips 
Also Gravel 

and Sand Fill.
FOR THE BEST OF 

CONCRETE MATERIALS

GRAIN 
HAULING

to the 
PORT OF MILWAUKEE 

and the
Illinois River 

Markets
* Reasonable Rates

• Volume Discounts
• Dependable Friendly 

Service
GIVE US A CALL!

OELHAFEN 
TRUCKING 

T—OrHurfe. KMM1

S^X^lf
^^CRAFTSMEN^^

SIDING CO
^^

WEST BEND 336-3323
JACKSON 677-4114

33 years in business 
Free estimates 
Excellent work 
Member of West Bend C. of C. 
200 satisfied customers

in Kewaskum area 
We are dealing 
Our workmen are local

THE SUPER MARKET 
OF AUTO REPAIRS 

Goeden Auto Body
Complete Auto Body Repairs 

and Painting Professionally Done

INSURANCE ESTIMATES AND REPAIRS
OUR SPECIALTY

Automotive - Tune-ups - Exhaust - Brakes 
Tires - Anti Freeze - Texaco Products 

ALL DONE TO YOUR SATISFACTION 
24 HOU* TOWING

Hwy. 28 E. of Kewaskum in St. Michaels
334-2789

TRY OUR PERSONALIZED SERVICE

We Fill Prescriptions from ALL Physicians
• Free City Delivery
• Patient Profiles for Insurance and Tax Records
• Prompt Courteous Service
• OPEN Monday, Tuesday, Thursday, Friday, 1-6
• Generic Drug Program

Kewaskum Professional 
Pharmacy

1040 Fond du Lac Ave. Kewaskum PHONE 626-4222

Upstairs — Sison Medical Clinic
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their

manager for the

hoard <d GROW M \RK

payments

Those FS Seed Corn Tags Mean Money to Local FFA’s

will have a unique opportunity to add to their treasuries this year.
sponsored by the FS Supplies Division of GROWMARK. Inc. For 
Irotn a hag of FS seed corn and returned Io a local FS service 
nts to a local 1 FA chapter. Wisconsin Association FFA president, 
accepts one of these tags from (). Glenn Webb, chairman of the

Musicale at
Cedar Lake Home My Neighbors

lily clipped

Don't be surprised if you get 
visit in the near future from a 

youth clad in a blue and gold 
I F \ jacket inquiring about the 
analysis tags on those FS seed 
corn sacks you just received. 
1 »r th.it youth, those tags mean 
cold, hard cash

Local FFA chapters will have 
a good opportunity to add to

this
thanks to a unique program 
being sponsored by the FS Seed 
Division. For each analysis tag 
obtained from an FS seed corn 
bag and returned to a local FS 
service company, 50 cents will 
be given to a local FFA chapter.

According to Frank Unger, 
seed marketing services

FS Seed
Division, there are several ways 
the-tags can be redeemed.

"The best way is to rip off the 
top half of the tag and give it 
directly to someone from a local

Get relief from

Proceeds from the Cedar 
Lake Home Campus' 25th an­
niversary musicale, "The Life 
of the Man of Man," will be 
used towards the purchase of a 
van equipped with a wheelchair 
lift. Campus superintendent L. 
C. Riesch stated recently.

The 8-passenger van will be 
utilized for residents and com­
munity members. The "Cedar 
Van." as it will be named by the 
Resident Council, will be ideal 
for transporting small groups of 
residents to medical appoint­
ments and a variety of off 
campus activities including 
shopping outings.

The "Life of the Man of 
Man," to be presented in the 
West Bend High School Audi­
torium April 29 and May 1, is an 
all new musicale which depicts 
life from birth through the 
"golden years." The 200 plus 
persons involved in the pre­
sentation will provide the 
audience with a fun filled 
exceptional learning experience 
as the joys, sadnesses and 
successes of living life’ are 
portrayed.

•• r «

"Your mother and I are just 
stepping out for a quiet walk 
in the raging storm."

Roger & Dan's
Auto Service, Inc

GOODREAU

Multi-Mile 
Tires

SAVE MONEY AND ENERGY!

Kewaskum

HUD

A%x4 $

CAN PAY
FOR THEMSELVES

IN SAVINGS

F FA chapter. You can also give 
the tag to your local FS service 
company and tell them who you 
want the redemption to go to, 
hut we prefer the first method. 
We ll redeem them both ways,

"FS and FFA have had a long 
association. This is one way we 
can aid a fine organization like 
FFA in helping shape tomor­
row's farm leaders."

The program will run through 
July 15. 1982. Money will be 
returned to the local FFA 
chapters soon after that.

WATER
HEATERS

£h

Auto 
Craft

338-0379
ELECTRIC

^Meadow 
Creek* 

APARTMENTS
Great Living for Less!

the monthly grind Housing for the Elderly

FINANCED BY:

Wise. Housing Finance Authority
RENTAL ASSISTANCE BY:

U.S. Dept, of Housing 
& Urban Development

Low Cost Rentals for Low & Moderate Income 
Senior & Handicapped Citizens

Rentals based upon your adjusted income.
Includes stove, refrigerator, drapes, carpeting, heat and water, 

in one low cost monthly rental, plus utility allowance Equal Housing 
Elevator to all floors. Opportunity

CALL NOW TO SEE IF YOU QUALIFY.
Collect 1-414-887-1701

Interviews Now Being Held
APARTMENTS AVAILABLE SOON

SINGLE PARENT HOUSING - HOUSING FOR FAMILIES 
( all Collect to See If You Qualify 1-414-887-1701

GAS
Double density insulation and a new, energy effi­
cient design that saves you money. Energy Saver 
Plus water heaters deliver more hot water at a 
lower cost compared to conventional water 
heaters of the same size. Good reasons why you 
should be saving your energy dollars with Energy 
Saver Plus!

INSTALL AN ENERGY SAVING 
WATER HEATER NOW!

Save an fuel easts!

JOHANN 
Plumbing & Heating, Inc 

PHONE 334-9481
STORE HOURS

Mon I burs 8to5. Fri 8 to 8. Sat. 8 to 12 Noon

Kev.askum. Wl
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REHEARSE FOR CONCERT — Chelli Dreher of 
Kewaskum and Stephen Skinner of Sun Prairie, members of 
Orchitis dance company at the University of Wisconsin- 
Whitewater. rehearsed for the troupe's annual concert which 
will be presented April 5. 6. and 7 at 8 p.m. in Barnett 
Theatre of the campus Center of The Arts. The program is 
under the direction of Professor Mercedes Fernandez of the 
theatre dance faculty. Chelli a junior majoring in theatre 
education and minoring in dance education and performance, 
is the dan .liter of Al and Charleen Barutha. 1510 Brooklane 
Dr.. Kewaskum. She was a member of the 15181 Orehesis 
company and also has taken tap dancing lessons fron. 
Professor Ollie Ray of the UW Whitewater health, physical 
education, ami recreation faculty.

(Photo by Peter Abraham I

Environmental Fish 
Workshop at Dundee

Whether the topic is water 
pollution, aquatic critters or 
worm dunking for lunkers, 
teachers can learn about “Fish 
From the Bottom Up," at an 
environmental education work­
shop held on two successive 
Saturdays this spring.

On Saturday, April 24, parti­
cipants will take a day-long look 
at stream and lake fish at the 
Northern Kettle Moraine Ice 
Age Center located a half mile 
west of Dundee on Highway 67. 
Starting with an overview of 
DNR’s fish management pro­
gram for inland waters, (he 
class will move bankside where 
environmental educators will 
show you how to use streams 
and lakes to, literally, get your 
students “into" aquatic 
ecology. You’ll wade into 
Nichols Creek and Lake Ellen 
(near Cascade) to get first hand 
experience in conducting 
ecological research. The session 
runs 8:30 a.m. until 5:00 p.m.

On Saturday, May 1, you’ll 
regroup at the big fishin’ hole to 
the east — Lake Michigan. 
Starting at the Great Lakes 
Research Facility, 600 E. 
Greenfield Avenue, Milwaukee, 
yob'll be introduced to Great 
Lakes ecology and tour this 
research center. You’ll learn 
that fish aren’t the only com­
petitors on the big lake; sport 
anglers and commercial fishers 
both vie for Lake Michigan's 
bountiful harvest of fish. Final­
ly, you'll learn how to tie water 
ecology, pollution threats and 
fish together for classroom pre­
sentations. The session runs 
from 9:00 a.m. until 5:00 p.m.

Attendants must register for 
the course by April 9. Enroll­
ment is limited to 30 people. 
The course may be taken for 
upiversity undergraduate 
credit, graduate credit or 
audited through UW-Green Bay 
or U W-Whitewater. For 
registration and information, 
contact Dr. Dennis Yockers. 
Wisconsin Department of 
Natural Resources, Box 7921, 
Madison, WI 53707. Phone: 
(608)266-0870.
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Today’s Medicine
WHAT YOU SHOULD KNOW ABOUT RABIES 

By Charles J. Ogi D.V.M.
Although rubies seldom results in human fatalities in the 

United States, it remains a potentially dangerous public health 
problem. Each year more than 20,000 Americans undergo rabies 
treatment as a result of exposure to potentially rabid animals.

Rabies is a usually fatal disease that can affect all warm 
blooded animals, including humans. Rabies virus is transmitted 
from animals to humans through the saliva of a rabid animal. 
Wild animals make poor pets and are a potential rabies threat to 
their owners and others. Rabies is caused by a virus that attacks 
the central nervous system, and if the disease is not prevented, 
causes the death of its victim. Therefore, every pet owner should 
take the responsibility in helping to prevent rabies outbreaks.

If you or anyone in your family has been bitten, try to have the 
animal detained, and thoroughly wash the wound with soap and 
water. Give first aid as to any puncture wound. Call your 
physician immediately, and report the bite to your veterinarian. 
Don’t kill the animal or allow it to be euthanized unless so 
advised by public health authorities or a veterinarian. Don’t let 
■the animal stray or give it away. It must be available for 
observation, (’heck with your veterinarian to see if your animal 
has a current rabies vaccination. If the rabies vaccination is .not 
current, consult your veterinarian about having your animal 
vaccinated for rabies.

Remember, the main thrust of rabies control is prevention. Be 
certain your animals are vaccinated and that these vaccinations
are up to date.

Donald Herriges 
Heating

Furnace Cleaning Boiler Repairs
Heating Specialist

604 Mill Road, Route 1
Kewaskum — Ph. 626-2386

SINGER 
WHITE 
BERNINA 
VIKING 
NECCHI-ELNA
PFAFF—RICCAR 
NEW HOME
New open arm $119
New zig-zag $69
Sales - Service All Makes

RaULT SEWING MACHINES 

starting at $29

We have a feed program 
to raise your heavy chicks

Purina

BROILER CHOW

PURINA 
CHOWS

JAEGERS-KEWASKUM
212 Main - Phone 626-2611

“SPECIAL”
1975 MERCURY MONARCH 

2-dr., 6-cyl., automatic 

ONLY 66,000 MILES

HONECK 
CHEVROLET, INC. 

"4 Dealer You Can Trust"
Hwy. 45 Kewaskum

PHONE 626-2161

FREE
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Association Announces Scholarships
The Washington County 

Mental Health Association will 
be granting two (2) $300 
scholarships this year, to 
individuals who are pursuing or 
who will be pursuing a career in 
the field of mental health.

The need for qualified, well 
trained individuals in the field 
of mental health continues to 
exist. A mental health career 
demands special persons with 
exceptional skills. If you know

Wayne Crusaders
4-H Club

The March' meeting of the 
Wayne Crusaders 4-H Club was 
called to order March 2, 1982 at 
7:32 p.m at the Kohlsville 
fireshouse by president Jill 
Etta. The pledges were led by 
Brenda Oelhafen and Shelly 
Lloyd.

The secretary’s report was 
read and approved as read. The 
treasurer's report was also read 
and approved as read.

Boll call for next month is to 
make a poster no larger than 14 
x 22 for the poster contest 
entitled 4-H Pathways to the 
Future.

The refreshment committee 
will be the Kuphal, Lisko and 
Kuhaupt families.

There will be a bakesale 
paperdrive April 3, Saturday, at 
the Kohlsville firehouse. The 
paperdrive will Lt held from 
9:00 a.m. - 11:00 a.m. The 
bakesale will be from 9:00 a.m. 
- 1:00 p.m.

Richie Lloyd and Denise 
Anderson will be in charge of 
the paperdrive. Mona Ander­
son. Chris Schulz, Diane Schulz 
and Brenda Oelhafen will be 
working from 9:00 a.m. - 11:00 
a.in. at the bakesale. Shelly 
Lloyd, Missy Schuppel, Lori 
Schlosser, and Nancy Schlosser 
will be working from 11:00 a.m. 
- 1:00 p.m. at the bake sale.

Each family not bringing a 
baked item will pay $2.00. The 
meeting was adjourned at 8:54 
p.m

Club Reporter, 
Beverly Schulz

of anyone who plans on pur­
suing such a career in 1982, 
please encourage them to apply 
for our scholarships.

Any high school senior or 
adult interested in entering 
some phase of mental health 
work will be eligible. Social 
work, work with the mentally 
handicapped or emotionally 
disturbed, psychological work, 
psychiatric nursing, and work in 
the area of learning disabilities 
are a few examples of mental 
health occupations. Aptitude for 
your chosen work should be 
demonstrated, and Washington 
County residency is required.

Applications must be re­
ceived by April 15 by Washing­
ton County Mental Health 
Association Scholarship Com­
mittee. Scholarship recipients 
will be notified of the results by 
mail during the week of April 
19, 1982.

To apply, simply contact your 
guidance counselor at your high 
school, or contact any of the 
persons listed below:

Mr. Dale Thomas, Scholar­
ship Chairman, The Threshold, 
Inc,, West Bend, Wl 53095.

Mrs. Beverly Johnson, 
Slinger High School, Slinger, 
Wl 53086.

Ms. Pat Schaff, Washington 
High School. Germantown, W! 
53072.

Mr. Wayne Hammond. Hart­
ford High School. Hartford. Wl 
53027.

Mr. Dave Wietor, Kewaskum 
Hi h School, Kewaskum, Wl 
53040.

Mr. Donald Zerfas, Moraine 
Park Technical Institute,' 2151 
N. Main St., West Bend. Wl 
53095.

ELECTROLUX /
KIRBY f
HOOVER 1
EUREKA 1
ROYAL
Sates & Service

All Makes B
New Rebuilt y
J?!T $19 V

JAEGER'S

KEWASKUM
212 Main - Phone 262-2611

LP-D GAS, INC.
Route 3, Campbellsport

• LOCALLY OWNED
• PROPANE GAS
• NO TANK RENTAL
• 24 HOUR BURNER SERVICE 

“WhereTo Buy It"

PHONE 533-4322

Campbellsport Home 
Improvement- 
Mastic Sidings—T-lok Solid Vinyl, 

Vinylized Aluminum, Vinylized Steel, 
High R Insulation, 50 Year Warranty!!

VINYL is FINAL-Roofing, Gutters, 
Storm Windows, Doors, Awnings, Shutters!’.

Fully Insured • FREE Estimates

ANDY STOFFEL-Phone 533-4211
Campbellsport, Wl 53010

Congressional Redistricting
Accepted by Sensenbrenner

WASHINGTON, D. C. - Mar. 
2$ — U. S. Rep. F. James 
Sensenbrenner, Jr. today an­
nounced his acceptance of the 
( ongressional redistricting plan 
signed into law by Governor 
Dreyfus last week. He issued 
the following statement:

"I am very pleased the 
Governor finally has approved a 
('ongressional redistricting 
plan. It has been a long and 
difficult process which has been 
hard on everyone involved.

“As for the changes the new 
plan makes in my district, which 
I believe are fair and reason­
able, I understand the necessity 
of them because of the popula­
tion shifts in the Milwaukee 
area and I accept them. How­
ever, I do regret the loss of the 
communities of Brown Deer, 
Glendale, Shorewood, Wau­
kesha, New Berlin, Muskego, 
and Big Bend. I have had the 
honor and pleasure of repre­

senting the people of these 
communities since 1979, and 
have enjoyed serving them and 
working with them.

"I particularly regret the loss 
of Shorewood, where I have 
lived since 1955 and which I 
have represented in the Legis­
lature or Congress continuously 
since 1969. However, I am 
hopeful the special relation­
ships 1 have with many people 
in Shorewood will continue

nonetheless.
“However. I feel it is my duty 

to continue serving the new 
Ninth District, the large 
majority of which I have served 
for over three years. To do so, I 
intend to move my residence, 
now in Shore wood, to a new 
location within the new 
boundaries of the district. This 
cannot happen immediately, 
however, for my wife, Cheryl, 
and our infant son, Jimmy, are 
not yet able to travel and join 
me in finding a new home. We 
will do this as soon as possible, 
and hope everyone understands 
the reason for the delay.”

ir

ROGER STREAN 
AGGREGATES

• WASHED SAND & STONE
• CRUSHED ROCK
• ROAD GRAVEL
• LIME CHIPS

Pick-up or Delivery

Happy Hollow Road
Off Hwy 45 — Waucousta

HERRIGES OIL 
INC.

PHONE 626-2244 
1245 Fond du Lac Ave. 

Kewaskum

TLeet

PERENNIAL
AMERICA’S YEAR ’ROUND 
BELTED RADIAL.

P185/B0R-JJ_ 5J2j«__U92_
P195/75R-14 54.00 2.23
P205/75R-14 55.7? 2*’*
P2I5/75R-14 58.36 2.*’’
P205/75R-15 57.63 2.46
P215/75R-15 ; 60.49 2.6?
P225/75R-15 I 62.39 2.79
P235/75R-15 , 66U1 2.95

All Tires Include 
Mounting & Balancing

STOP IN AND SEE 
OUR SERVICE DEPT. 
FOR QUALITY BRAKE, 
SHOCK, EXHAUST AND 
TUNE-UP WORK.

SERVICE SPECIALS
COUPONS EXPIRE 5 31 82

LUBRICATION SPECIAL
25% Cash Discount

On the Purchase of
1. Chassis Lubrication
2. Oil Change
3. Oil Filter Change

Expires 5/31182 Please Present This Coupon 
HONECK CHEVROLET, INC. KEWASKUM, Wl

FRONT END ALIGNMENT

25% Cash Discount
Includes the Following

Adjust Caster and Chamber, Adjust 
Toe In, Check Steering Linkage, 
Inspect Tires and Shocks.
Expires 5/31 /82 Please Present This Coupon
HONECK CHEVROLET. INC. KEW ASKUM. Wl

"exhaust SYSTEM SPECIaT"
25% Cash Discount

On the Following

1. Muffler Replacement
2. Exhaust Pipe Replacement
3. Tail Pipe Replacement

Expires 5/31/82 Please Present This Coupon
HONECK CHEVROLET. INC. KEW ASKUM. W l

BRAKE JOB SPECIAL
25% Cash Discount

Replace Lininas, Turn Drums, Inspect 
or Rebuild Wheel Cylinders
Expires 5/31/82 Please Present This Coupon
HONECK CHEVROLET. INC. KEWASKUM. Wl

TRANSMISSION SERVICE

25% Cash Discount
Change Fluid, Replace Filter
Clean Oil Pan & Replace Gasket

Expires 5/31182 Please Present This Coupon
HONECK CHEVROLET. INC. KEWASKUM. Wl

TUNE-UP SPECIAL

25% Cash Discount
On the Following

Spark Plugs, Points and Condenser 
Air and Gas Filters or

ANY MISC. ITEMS TO MAKE YOUR
CAR PERFORM BETTER and

Labor
Expires 5/31/82 Pleas*-Present Tins Coupon
HONECK CHEVROLET. INC. KEWASKUM, Wl

SHOCK SPECIAL

25% Cash Discount
Regular or Heavy Duty

2 or 4 Shocks
INSTA LLATION EXTRA!!

Expires 5/31/82 Please Present This Coupon
HONECK CHEVROLET, INC. KEWASKUM, Wl

HONECK
CHEVROUT, INC.

"A DEALER YOU CAN TRUST'

Hwy. 45 Kewaskum 626-2181
Mon., Wed., Fri., 8-9. Tues & Thurs., 8-5:30, Sat 8-5



Page 20, Friday, April 2, 1982Farmington Brownie Troop No. 40 
Visits Children at Threshold

RECYCLED MATERIALS 
— A Way to Save Energy —

By Recycling Committee 
Kewaskum Jr. Woman’s Club

This winter 8 brownies from 
Troop No. 40 from Farmington 
went with their leaders to the 
Threshold in West Bend. They 
visited the children enrolled in 
the Pre-school program and 
presented them with animals 
and little toys they made them­
selves. The girls really enjoyed 
watching the children play with

IIIHIIIII5

President John Tyler had 15 children.

_<"nfeE Mbs' 
®£7 driving

the toys.
They were also given a tour of 

the building, and were able to 
see the “living experience 
classroom” that looks like a real 
apartment and also see where 
the people work at the Thres­
hold.

It was truely a caring and 
sharing experience for the girls.

Over the years the Kewas­
kum Recycling Center has re­
cycled % ton of alumi­
num. We take in mostly alumi­
num cans, TV trays, foil and 
occasionally some aluminum 
siding scraps. All our aluminum 
io sorted, to weed out any steel 
cans, and placed in large clear 
plastic bags. It is then trucked 
to West Bend where Reynolds 
Alumunum Co. operates a mo­
bile collection site. There the 
alumunum is weighed and we 
are paid 23 cents per pound. 
From this point on I will be 
telling how Reynolds Aluminum 
handles the aluminum. The 
process is basically the same for 
all the major companies.

The Reynolds mobile collec­
tion truck takes its load of 
aluminum to the recycling plant 
in Milwaukee. At the recycling 
plant the metal passes through 
a magnetic separator to elimi­
nate any stray steel cans. It then 
moves to a shredder where the 
aluminum is reduced to popcorn 
-size chips to remove moisture 
and reduce its volume. Now the 
chips are transported to a 
smelting plant.

At the smelting plant the 
chips are fed into specially 
designed furnaces to be melted. 
During the melting process, the 
furnace burns off any coatings • 
on the can chips and other 
foreign matter and turns the 
chips to molten metal. The 
aluminum is then tapped from 
the furnace and poured into 
large crucibles for transport into 
the fabricating plant. The mol­
ten metal is poured into produc­
tion furnaces and cast into sheet 
ingots. These ingots are rolled 
into sheet for manufacture into 
new aluminum products.

Recycled metal targeted for 
new aluminum cans is rolled 
into a continuous coil sheet for 
transfer to an aluminum can 
plant. Reynolds, using a unique

SECRETARIES DAY 
TO BE OBSERVED

Plans for the local observance 
of Secretaries Day, April 20, 
1982 are underway. The 
banquet will be held at the West 
Bend Motor Inn at 6:30 p.m. 
Anybody interested may call 
Isabelle at 33*4-9461 or 334-5722 
for reservations. There will be 
more information later.

draw and iron process, then 
produces new cans just like 
those which were brought to our 
center-only this time at a sig­
nificant energy and materials 
savings.

By recycling aluminum over 
and over, 95*» of the energy 
required to make it originally is 
saved each time it is recycled 
with no loss in quality.

Recycling aluminum is one 
way we can all help during this 
energy crisis. Remeber 95% of 
the energy is saved by using 
recycled aluminum over raw 
materials. Please next time you 
are tempted to throw away that 
aluminum can, think twice and 
then Recycle It.

Jown of Auburn
ANNUAL MEETING

Saturday, April 10, 1982 
2:00 p.m.

LOCATION: Town Hall, Jet. Hwys. 67 and 45

CAMILLA BUTZKE, 
Town Clerk, Town of Auburn 
R. 2, Campbellsport, Wl 53010

Notice of

Annual Town Meeting

TOWN OF KEWASKUM 
Wednesday, April 7, 1982

8:00 p.m.
Valley Bank, Kewaskum, Wl

AGENDA:
I Discussion new mobile home ordinance 
2 Salary increases. Town Board, labors

Barbara Hinz, Town Clerk 
Town of Kewaskum

FOND DU LAC COUNTY
NUTRITION PROGRAM

FOR THE ELDERLY 
Campbellsport

Community Center

Monday, April 5 — Liver and 
onions, potatoe salad, green 
beans, lettuce, spice cake.

Tuesday, April 6 — Roast 
beef/gravy, boiled potatoes, 
carrots, cabbage slaw, kokchi.

Wednesday, April 7 — Polish 
sausage, mashed potatoes, 
peas, sauerkraut, tapioca 
pudding.

Thursday, April 8 — Fish n’ 
batter, French fries, wax beans, 
fruited jello, apple cake.

Friday, April 9 — Fried cod, 
baked potato, creamed spinach, 
lettuce, purple plums, cookie.

Coffee, milk, butter, and 
bread are served with meals.

ANNUAL MEETING 
Town of Wayne

The annual meeting for the Town of. 
Wayne will be held at 8:00 P.M., Tuesday, 
April 13, 1982, at Bernard Strobel’s Hall, 
Wayne, Wisconsin.
Items on the agenda include:

Salaries of Town Officers for the next 
term of office

Wage schedule for town employees 
Creation of a Town Land Use Plan
Other matters brought up at the meeting

ORVILLE KERN, Clerk 
TOWN OF WAYNE

To the Court of Appeals — District II
• 6 Years — Civil Trial Experience
• 2 Years — Assistant District Attorney - Racine County
• 4 Years — Judge - Court of Appeals — 1700 Cases Decided

KEEP EXPERIENCE WORKING FOR YOU
Authorized and paid for by the Citizens for the Re-election of Judge Brown
228 Eldorado Drive, Racine, Wl 53402, Alan Clack, Treasurer
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Urgent Appeal for 
Useable Materials

(Goodwill Industries, Milwau­
kee Area, Inc. is making an 
urgent appeal to the public for 
donations of useable materials.

“Our collection of materials 
has dropped steadily since De­
cember,” said Dennis Kolacin- 
ski, Director of Operations for 
the rehabilitation agency. “We 
attribute the problem to the 
severe weather,” he said.

Clothing and household items 
that are collected are processed 
at the Milwaukee rehabilitation 
center, providing job opportu­
nities for the disabled.

“If our donated goods pro­
gram does not improve in the 
very near future, it could mean 
the lay-off of disabled work­
ers,” said Kolacinski. “We 
have tried different avenues in 
search of these goods, and are 
running into many stumbling 
blocks, he said. “We need

these materials if we are to keep 
our people on the job.”

Goodwill Industries, located 
on the northwest side of Mil­
waukee works with almost 500 
disabled persons each day, pro­
viding skill training, day ser­
vices and sheltered work oppor­
tunities to handicapped mem­
bers of the community.

For the location of your 
nearest Contributrailer or drop 
box, contact Goodwill at 353- 
6400, All contributions are tax 
deductible.

In the Service
Air Force Airman 1st Class 

Judith L. Sarauer, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bernard Sarauer 
Sr. of Route 2, Campbellsport, 
joined with other service 
members from the Army, Air 
Force, Navy and Marine Corps 
and the Panama National Guard 
for exercise Kindle Liberty in 
Panama.

Kindle Liberty was designed 
to evaluate the deployment of 
U.S. Readiness Command and

U.S. Atlantic Forces Command 
forces to Panama.

The exercise is consistent 
with the provisions of the 1977 
Panama Canal treaties which 
provide for the combined de­
fense of the canal by U.S. and 
Panamanian forces, according 
to U.S. military spokesmen.

Sarauer is a fire protection

specialist with the 24th Civil 
Engineering Squadron at 
Howard Air Force Base, 
Panama.

She is a 1978 graduate of 
Campbellsport High School.

Your young child may be able to 
hold onto a drinking glass better 
if you place two tight rubber 
bands around the glass an inch 
or so apart. This makes it easier 
for little hands to hold.

Public Informational Meeting 
On Highway 28

April 6, 1982
The Stale of Wisconsin Department of Transportation will 
hold a Public Informational Meeting to discuss the 
improvement of approximately 8 miles of Highway 28, 
between USH 41 and USH 45. in Washington County. The 
meeting is scheduled from 11:00 A.M. • 10:00 P.M. on 
April 6. 1982. at the Kewaskum High School. DOT 
engineering staff members will be available to discuss the 
project design aspects, alternatives considered, environ­
mental assessment of the work, and the right-of-way 
needs of the project. DOT real estate staff members will 
also he available to discuss how property is acquired for 
highway projects.
This public meeting is an integral part of the Depart­
ment's development efforts for this project. All interested 
persons are invited to attend the meeting, at their 
convenience, and to express their views on the project.

Facsimile Ballot Notice of Village Election 
Village of Kewaskum, Wisconsin

April 6,1982
Notice is hereby given of a village election to be held in and for the Village of 

Kewaskum, Washington County, Wisconsin, on the sixth day of April, 1982, at which 
the officers named below shall be chosen.

INFORMATION TO ELECTORS
The following instructions are given for the information and guidance of electors:
(a) Upon entering the polling place, an elector shall give his name and address before 

receiving the ballot from the ballot clerk. The initials of 2 ballot clerks must appear on 
the ballot. Upon receiving the ballot, the elector shall retire alone to a voting booth and 
mark his ballot. A ballot clerk may inform the elector of the proper manner for marking 
a ballot, but he shall not in any manner advise or indicate for whom to vote.

(b) To vote for a person whose name is printed on the ballot, make a cross (X) or mark 
in the square after the name of the person for whom you desire to vote. To vote for a 
person whose name is not printed on the ballot, write the name in the blank space 
provided for the purpose.

(c) The ballot should not be marked in any other manner. If the elector spoils a ballot, 
he shall return it to an election official who shall issue another in its place, but not more 
than 3 ballots shall be issued to any one elector. Not more than 5 minutes’ time shall be 
allowed to mark the ballot. Unofficial ballots or a memorandum to assist the elector in 
marking his ballot may be taken into the booth and copied. The sample ballot shall not 
be shown to anyone so as to reveal how the ballot is marked.

(d) After the official ballot is marked, it shall be folded so the inside marks do not 
show but so the printed indorsements and ballot clerks’ initials on the Outside do show. 
After folding the ballot, the elector shall leave the booth, give his name to the inspector 
in charge of the ballot box, hand him the ballot to be placed in the ballot box, and leave 
the polling place promptly.

(el An elector may be assisted by 2 election officials of different political parties in 
marking the ballot if he declares to the presiding official that he is unable to read or that 
due to physical disability he is unable to mark his ballot. If an elector declares that he is 
visually handicapped, he may have anyone assist him in marking his ballot. The 
presiding official may administer an oath as to a person’s disability.

(fl Any qualified elector who is absent, or expects to be absent from the village in 
which he is a qualified elector, or who, because of sickness or physical disability cannot 
appear at the polling place on election day, may vote at such election by means of an 
absent voter's ballot to be secured upon application to the Village Clerk, not more than 
sixty days and no less than three days, or by personal application, not later than the 
close of office hours on the day prior to such election.

(gl The following is a sample of the official ballot:

NOTICE OF ELECTION 
Town of Kewaskum 
Tuesday, April 6, 1982

9:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m.

Labor Center Hall, Kewaskum, Wl

Barbara Hinz, 
Town Clerk

SAMPLE

Official Village Ballot
NOTICE TO ELECTORS: This ballot is invalid unless initialed by 2 
election officials serving as ballot clerks. If cast as an absentee ballot, 
the ballot must bear the initials of the municipal clerk.

To vote for a person whose name is printed on the ballot, make a 
cross (X) in the square after the name of the person for whom you desire 
to vote. To vote for a person whose name is not printed on the ballot, 
write his name in the blank space provided for that purpose.

Town of Auburn
Notice of Location of Polls 

and Hours of Voting

Spring Election
Tuesday, April 6,1982

Location of Polls: Town Hall, Jet. Hwys. 67 
and 45.

Hours Polls Open: 9:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m.

CAMILLA BUTZKE, 
Town Clerk, Town of Auburn 
R. 2, Campbellsport, Wl 53010

TRUSTEES (two year terms)

Richard W. Schmidt.

Donald Mlodzik

Vote for throe

POLLING PLACES AND HOURS

Notice is hereby given that the election will be held in the Municipal Building and that 
the polls will be open at 9:00 o’clock a.m. and close at 8:00 o’clock p.m.

WILLIAM S. MARTIN, VILLAGE CLERK
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ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE

RATE: $1.50 up to 20 words; over 20 words, add 5c per word

RUMMAGE SALE - Saturday, 
April 3 from 9:00 to 4:00 at 102 
Main St., Kewaskum. Clothes, 
ladies and some men’s glass­
ware, dishes, some antiques.

3-26-2d

TREE TRIMMING and REMO­
VAL — Also stump removal. 
Over 20 years experience. 
Reasonable. Tom Clark, former 
owner of Clark’s Tree Service. 
Ph. 626-2513.. 4-2-tf

WORK WANTED - 19-year- 
old male seeking farm work or 
odd jobs. Call Don at 626-4274 
anytime. 4-2-lt

FOR RENT - Allenton - 2 bed., 
carpeted, stove, refrig., dis­
posal, air cond., large storage, 
laundry. Close to park, gro­
ceries. Quiet, secure. $275. 
629-5476 or 626-4770. 4-2-tf

FOR SALE — 20 in. Roger 
DeCoster BMX bike. Ready to 
race. Less then 1 year old. $260 
or offer. Call Trev, 626-2374. 
______________________ 4-2-lt

FOR SALE — Gehl 450 running 
gear. Excellent condition. Ph. 
626-4640.4-2-2p

FOR SALE — 59 Acre farm near 
Beechwood with woods, work 
land, creek with approved pond 
site. House in the process of 
remodeling. $130,000. Will 
consider trade or low interest 
land contract. Ph. 338-0937.
______________________ 4-2-3t

SERVICES OFFERED - New 
Fane Repair. Auto and truck, 
welding and body, lawn and 
garden equipment, chain saws. 
Ph. 626-4249.4-2-4p

WANTED — Swim Instructors, 
Life Guards, Attendants, 
General Recreation, Village 
Maintenance, Wastewater 
Treatment Intern & Softball 
Umpire. The Village of Ke­
waskum is taking applications 
for the above summer part-time 
employment. Applicants should 
be at least 16 years of age by the 
time of employment and 
qualified for the position they’re 
applying for. Applications are 
available at the Village of 
Kewaskum Municipal Building, 
204 First Street and must be on 
file by April 23, 1982. You may 
call for further information by 
calling 626-4060. 4-2-2t

FOR SALE — Seed oats, 98% 
germination. Cleaned into your 
bags. Moews seed corn. Ph. 
626-2872. 1502 Old Bridge Rd.

3-12-3p

LOCAL RESTAURANT - On a 
Main St. Spacious dining with 
bar, ample parking. Cadi for 
details. Marth Realty. $295,000. 
338-1821.3-19-4t

INCOME TAXES - For smaU 
businesses and individuals. 
Steve Kjer, CPA. Ph. 338-3608. 

3-12-5t

WORK WANTED - Lloyd's 
Home Maintenance. No job too 
small. General handyman. 
Carpentry, cabinets, painting, 
wallpapering, tile, etc. Refer­
ences - reasonable rates. Lloyd 
M. Ebert, phone 626-2014.

________________2-19-$p

HOME FOR SALE - 1175 Park 
View Drive, Kewaskum, WI. 
Ideal location-across from park 
and scenic area. Within walking 
distance of churches, schools, 
post office and shopping areas. 
Will fulfill needs for average 
family. Priced in mid $40’s. 
Contact: 414-626-4601 anytime 
or p.m. 414-626-2604 or 414- 
626-2245. 3-26-4t

FOR RENT — Large sleeping 
room with kitchen and laundry 
privileges for middle aged or 
retired gentleman. Phone 626- 
8036.3-26-2tp

FOR RENT — Three bedroom 
private home in Kewaskum. 
Available immediately. $425 
month. Security deposit. Ph. 
338-2181.1-15-tf

FOR SALE - 1970 Interna­
tional 3/4 ton pick-up. Depend - 
able. $550. Ph. 629-5965.3-26-Jt

FOR SALE - BMX Proam 
Team Columbia dirt bike. 
Yellow five spoke mags, blue 
frame, chrome handle bars. 
Used one summer. Asking $75 
or best offer. For more infor­
mation call 626-4832. Ask for 
Tim.3-26-It

FOR SALE — Metal truck cap. 
Customized with intercom. Best 
offer. Ph. 629-5965. 3-26- It

APPLES — McIntosh, Red 
Delicious, Cortland. Also cider. 
Erwin Merkel, 2606 Hwy. 28, 
about 10 miles east of Ke­
waskum. Ph. 994-4129. 3-26-5t

FOR SALE — 1967 Pontiac 
Catalina 400. AM-FM stereo. 
$500. Good condition. Call after 
6:00 p.m. 533-4730. 3-26-2t

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Multi-Mile. 626- 
2888. 4-4-tf

INSULATION — Attics and 
side-walls. Call Blaze Insula- 
tion, 626-8007.1-11-tf

LEN LUTERBACH CONTRAC­
TOR — Mason, cement, trench­
ing and bulldozing. Quality 
work at competitive prices. 
Your authorized dealer of the 
world famous Hallmark in- 
ground swimming pools. For 
free estimate, call 477-6757 
collect.  9-14-tf

PUBLIC NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given 

that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wiscon­
sin, Village Board is scheduled 
for Monday evening, Apr. 5, 
1982, at 8:00 p.m. in the Council 
Room of the Municipal Build­
ing, 204 First Street.

The agendas for meeting are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the 
clerk at the Municipal Building 
on Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and in 
the lobby of the Valley Bank.

William Martin, Clerk

NOTICE OF OPPORTUNITY
TO REQUEST A 

PUBLIC HEARING
ON THE DESIGN ASPECTS

OF THE
PROPOSED IMPROVEMENT 

OF STATETRUNK 
HIGHWAY 28

BETWEEN USH 41 and USH 45 
WASHINGTON COUNTY

All interested persons are ad­
vised of an opportunity to 
request a public hearing by the 
Wisconsin Department of 
Transportation to consider the 
detailed design aspects of the 
proposed improvement of State 
Trunk Highway 28, between US 
Highway 41 and US Highway 
45, in Washington County. The 
proposed improvement consists 
of regarding the existing road­
way on its present alignment, 
constructing a new base and 
recycling the bituminous pave­
ment.
Federal-aid highway funds may 
be used as part of the financing 
of the proposed improvement, 
and accordingly an opportunity 
is being afforded to all interest­
ed persons to request that a 
public hearing be held.
An informational meeting will 
be held from 11:00 AM - 10:00 
PM on April 6, 1982 at the 
Kewaskum High School. Dis­
trict staff members will be 
available to discuss the project, 
environmental assessment, 
property acquisition matters 
and project scheduling.
Information concerning the 
proposed improvement is also 

available at the Department’s 
District Office in Waukesha, 
(phone 548-5958).
An environmental assessment 
of the proposal’s impacts and 
effects has been prepared and 
filed according to the State and 
National Environmental Policy 
Acts. This document indicates 
that no significant environmen­
tal impacts are anticipated to 
occur as a result of this im­
provement. Copies of this docu­
ment are available for inspec­
tion and copying at the follow­
ing locations:
District No. 2 Office
Wisconsin Dept, of Transporta­

tion
310 South West Avenue 
Waukesha, WI 53186 
Bureau of Environmental

Analysis and Review 
Wisconsin Dept, of Transporta­

tion
4802 Sheboygan Avenue, 

Room 951
P.O. Box 7916
Madison, WI 53707
Comments regarding the en­
vironmental impacts and effects 
of the proposed improvements 
are invited to be submitted to 
the Department of Transporta­
tion by May 3, 1982. Mail to 
Mary O’Brien, Deputy Director 
of the Bureau of Environmental 
Analysis and Review, at the 
previously named address.
It is not anticipated that the 
relocation of persons, business­
es or farms will occur as a result 
of the proposed improvement.
Any person interested in or 
affected by the proposed im­
provement may request that a 
formal hearing be held by 
submitting a written request to 
the Department’s Waukesha 
District Office. However, before 
making such a request, persons 
are encouraged to contact the 
District Office for the purpose of 
expressing their views and dis­
cussing with the staff those 
aspects of the proposal that 
concern them. If a hearing is 
held, it will consider the detail-
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ed design aspects of the pro­
posed improvement; the social, 
economic, and environmental 
impacts and effects of the 
proposed improvement; and 
whether the improvement is or 
is not in the public interest and 
consistent with the goals and 
objectives of area planning.
A request for a public hearing 
may be made by submitting a 
written request to the Depart­
ment’s Waukesha District 
Office on or before May 3, 1982. 
In the event that such a request 
is received, notice of the time 

- and place of the public hearing 
will be published at a later date.

STATE OF WISCONSIN 
DEPARTMENT OF 
TRANSPORTATION 
DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS 
AND TRANSPORTATION 
FACILITIES
H. L. Fiedler 
Administrator

THANK FIREMEN
We wish to express our 

thanks to the Kewaskum Fire 
Department for their hurried 
response and service in answer­
ing our fire call last Thursday 
evening. Your help was much 
appreciated.

Ralph and Cordell Kern

RE^MKK 
of west bend

CS^f 334-7411

OPEN SUNDAY 2-4

1012 Edgewood Dr.
FIRST TIME OPEN is this quality 
constructed 3 bedroom home with 
all oak woodwork, Franklin fire­
place and barn boards and beams. 
Mid $70's. Take Hwy. 45 to 
Clinton, west to Brooklane, right 
to Edgewood, left to sign.

NEW LISTING: Large 4 bedroom older home in small community. Newer 
siding, new roof. Very little heat loss! On 1.5 acres. Upper $30’s. Call 
Dan, 338-3296.
NEW LISTING: Village conveniences with a country view. 3-4 bedroom 
ranch with formal dining room and partially finished rec room. 1Vi car 
garage and blacktop driveway. Low $50’s. Call Ann, 692-2607.
REDUCED: Owner anxious to sell this lovely 3 bedroom home with 
sunken living room and natural fireplace. Mid $60 s. Call Dan, 338-3296. 
REDUCED: 9Vi% assumable mortgage, monthly payments only $571 
including taxes and insurance. 3 bedroom Cape Cod with lake access. 
Call Ann, 892-2607.
NEW LISTING: Century Farm) A very picturesque farm with about 60 I 
acres of very fertile work land. Home is in very sound condition with ' 
some remodeling & updating yet to be done. Outbuildings in good 
repair. Under $200,000. Call Dan, 338-3296. i
ENJOY country living In this extensively remodeled partial log home. j 
Exposed log walls and barn beams in this kitchen. Barn with new roof. 1 
On 30 acres. $90’s. Call Wendy, 338-3296.
SELLER WILL CONSIDER ANY OFFER: Low interest financing 
available on this 4-5 bedroom remodeled home. 3 car detached garage, * 
blacktop driveway. Low $50’s. Call Ann, 692-2607. <
UNIQUE log home partially remodeled, new wiring, windows and roof. ( 
Living room offers stately 2 story fieldstone fireplace. On 2.5 acres with 
several outbuildings. REDUCED $50’s. Call Ann, 692-2607. (
POOL Included with this beautifully landscaped country raised ranch. , 
Offers handy kitchen, 3 bedrooms, woodburning stove and more. Mid 
$50's. Call Ann, 692-2607. (
15 ACRE MINI-FARM with LAND CONTRACT available. Large country 
kitchen, 2 full baths, 4 bedrooms. Barn and outbuildings. Close to West 
Bend. $80's. Call Ann, 692-2607.

WE HAVE MANY VACANT LAND PARCELS AVAILABLE

MLSHmm.me urtina u»vKt

205 S. 7th Ave. / P. O. Box 634 / West Bend / WI / 53095

LIQUOR LICENSE 
APPLICATION

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
I hereby certify that the 

following applicant has applied 
to the Village Board of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wash­
ington County, Wisconsin, for a 
Combination Class “B” Fer­
mented Malt Beverage and 
Intoxicating Liquor License for 
the period commencing April 6, 
1982, and ending June 30, 1982.

Robert Joseph Holub, Jr., 
1310 Riverview Drive 
(formerly John and Dee’s). 
Mr. Holub is presently re­
siding at 519 Misty Meadows 
Blvd., Hartford, Wis.
The above application will be 

heard and considered at a 
public hearing to be held in the 
Council Room of the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street, in the 
Village of Kewaskum on the 5th 
day of April, 1982, at 8:00 
o’clock P.M. All interested 
persons will be given an op­
portunity to be heard.

William S. Martin, Clerk

“Many have been heard to 
say that spring is in the air. 
Now, if it would only land, 
no one would provide any op­
position.”

821 Memorial Dr.
ENJOY entertaining in the huge 
rec room with bar and fireplace of 
this immaculate 3 bedroom ranch. 
Nicely landscaped, redwood deck. 
Low $50's. Take Hwy. 45 to Hwy. 
H, west to Memorial, south.



Friday. April2. i»s2, Page23 Nehm Wins Gehl Ag Day Contest Immunization

Gehl Company President John Kamps {far left) presents overall Ag Day essay winner 
Monica Nehm, Slinger FFA, with the top trophy. County winners from left to right include: 
Nehm. West Bend; Tony Wagner, Slinger; June Schwendimann, Hartford; Mary Feller, Iron 
Ridge; DuWayne Schacht, Kewaskum. Barbara Schulz, Allenton, was absent when the 
photograph was taken.

Clinics Set
Immunization clinics offered 

by the Washington County 
Community Health Nursing 
Service continue to be held 
twice monthly in West Bend.

April clinics are;
April 6 - 2:00 to 5:00 p.m.
April 27 - 9:00 to 11:00 a.m.
The clinics will be held in the 

Community Health Nursing 
Service office at 515 East 
Washington Street, West Bend.

All recommended immuniza­
tions are available to children 
and adults and are provided 
free of charge. There is a $1.00 
charge for the T.B. skin test for 
those age 16 and over.

For further information call: 
Community Health Nursing 
Service, 338-4462 or 644-5204, 
Mrs. Delores P. Harder, R.N., 
Director.

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to thank our many 

relatives, friends, and neigh­
bors for their kindness during 
the recent death of our dear 
husband, father, grandfather 
and great-grandfather, Joseph 
Bodden. A special thanks to Fr. 
Morgan, Fr. Kemmer, and 
Augustenian priests and 
brothers, and Fr. Charles 
Bodden, donors of memorial

(West Bend) — Monica 
Nehm, West Bend, took top 
honors over 50 other Washing­
ton County Future Farmers of 
America members in an essay 
writing contest sponsored by 
Gehl Company in recognition of 
Agriculture Day, March 18.

Contestants wrote on the 
1982 Ag Day theme, “Agri­
culture: It's Your Heartbeat, 
America." University of Wis­
consin - Washington County 
English instructor Carol Coak­
ley and area dairy farmers 
Curtis and Betty Scheunemann 
judged the FFA essays, select­
ing two winners from each of 
the county’s three FFA chap­
ters.

Gehl Company President 
John Kamps awarded $100 
savings bonds to the three first 
place chapter winners: Monica 
Nehm - Slinger FFA, DuWayne 
Schacht - Kewaskum FFA, and 
Mary Feller - Hartford FFA. 
Kamps also presented $50 sav­
ings bonds to the second place 
winners: Tony Wagner - Slinger 
FFA, Barbara Schulz - Kewas­
kum FFA, and June Schwendi­
mann - Hartford FFA.

Monica Nehm of the Slinger 
FFA chapter was awarded the 
top overall trophy from Gehl 
Company for her essay entry.

Miss Nehm’s winning essay:
“WHY AGRICULTURE CAN 

BE CALLED THE
HEARTBEAT OF AMERICA’’

By Monica Nehm 
Slinger FFA

Few people listen to, or even 
think about their own heartbeat. 
An involuntary muscle, the

A NOTE OF THANKS

I would like to thank all the 
doctors, nurses and Pastors 
Lindau and Robinson, while I 
was a patient at St. Luke’s 
Hospital, Milwaukee, and St. 
Joseph’s Hospital, West Bend. 
Thanks also to my family, 
relatives and friends for their 
prayers, visits, phone calls, 
cards, gifts, flowers, and their 
concern while in the hospital 
and convalescing at home.

These kindnesses were surely 
appreciated.

Wilbur F. Kleinke

heart seems to keep us going 
without ever receiving any 
assistance from us. Agriculture, 
the heartbeat of America, is not 
an involuntary muscle, and yet 
Agriculture keeps us going. The 
time has come to put a stetho­
scope to the heart of the matter 
and discover just how important 
Agriculture is to America.

Less than five percent of the 
population currently feeds the 
remaining ninety-five percent. 
A decreasing minority is faced 
with feeding an increasing 
majority, and they are doing it 
with food to spare! This is one 
of the greatest accomplish­
ments of our modern tech­
nological society, and yet 
people unsympathetically cry, 
“Food is for people, not 
profit!" when food prices are 
driven higher. Agriculture in­
volves more than farming, yet 
farming and food production are 
the core of the industry. It must 
be realized that farming is not 
an easy job, no matter how you 
look at it. All businesses are 
faced with the variables of 
supply and demand. Farming is 
an equation with multiple 
variables: supply, demand, 
climate, insects, disease, and 
the all-encumbering and still 
uncontrollable weather. Next 
time vou eat a bowl of cereal.

605 Possible MONTHLY PAYMENTS LOWER THAN RENT. Call to see ; 
if you qualify for 13’/*% or interest credit Farmers Home adm. loan. 3 or I 
4 bedrooms with nice family room. Excellent for a family with ( 
youngsters. I
143 One party without a JOB? Earn good income! Run a motel! J 
beautiful living quarters

1M^ REALTY WORLD®
Schulz Realty Corp, j

2375 W. Washington - West Bend |

It8'®!?,®________ S

appreciate the fact that some­
one was willing to tackle those 
variables and provide food and 
fiber for 230 million hungry 
Americans.

Taking the pulse of American 
Agriculture, one finds it beating 
strongly. Following the artery of 
production back to the farm, 
one finds dedicated and hearty 
individuals who recognize Agri­
culture for what it is. Enroute 
from farm to factory one finds 
men and women in occupations 
ranging from vocational agricul­
ture teachers to veterinarians, 
and from milk haulers to 
mechanics. Together, they are 
the lifeblood of American Agri­
culture. The Arabs may pump 
their oil from wells deep in the 
sand, but in the heart of 
America is the golden pro­
duction of Agriculture.

Agriculture runs so fluidly 
that few people appreciate the 
long hours of physical labor put 
into making certain that 
Americans have the best, most 
nutritious food possible. When 
a crisis strikes, hampering the 
fluidity as surely as a heart 
attack stops the flow of blood, 
people are forced to recognize 
once more that Agriculture is 
not an involuntary muscle, 
steadily sending output down 
the artery of production. A

heart attack can cripple a body 
as a crisis in Agriculture can 
cripple America. If the pulse of 
Agriculture ever falters, don’t 
deny it assistance. Remember, 
America, it’s your heartbeat.

and floral tributes, food and the 
ladies who served it, organist, 
singers, pallbearers, traffic 
officers and the Twohig Funeral 
home.

Family of Joseph Bodden
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Indian Track Teams Split With 
Plymouth, Drubbed by Hartford

Holy Trinity A 
Team Places 2nd
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With some of the basketball 
girls not ready yet after the 
state tournament, the Kewas­
kum girls track team still got the 
1982 indoor season off to a good 
start Tuesday by defeating Ply­
mouth here, 61-47. On the other 
hand the boys, although they 
had some individual successes, 
were downed by the Panthers, 
74-44,

New girls head coach Jane 
Vesper, a former assistant 
coach, has 12 letter winners 
back. They are: Seniors — 
Jackie Mueller (hurdles), Barb 
Matenaer (high jump), Amy 
Nigh (hurdles and long jump), 
Vicki Reif (distances), Jill 
Yearling (high jump), Jenny 
Zemlicka (weights); juniors — 
Erika Follman (distances), and 
Cathy Schlice (sprints); sophs 
— Wendy Wilson (middle dis­
tances) and Holly Kempf 
(weights).

Helping considerably in the 
victory over Plyhiouth were 
Holly Kempf, who was a double 
winner, plus Wendy Wilson and 
Karen Volm, who posted per­
sonal indoor bests. Kempf took 
the 45 meter dash in 6.65 and 
the shot put with a 34- I3/* for 
her best effort yet. Volm was 
first in the 200 meter dash with 
a 31.25 and Wilson, only a 
sophomore, won the 400 meter 
run with a 1:06.7.

The boys won six of 14 events 
with letter winners Wayne 
Boudreau and Brian Johnson 
taking four of them. Boudreau 
took both the 1600 and 3200 
meter runs, the former in a 
good time of 5:02.9 for the first 
meet. Johnson won both hurdle 
events, the lows in 6.84 and the 
highs in 7.05.

Stuart Stautz won the pole 
vault and Monty Shaw started 
his prep career with a fine 
2:19.4 in the 800.

The very young boys teams 
has just four returning letter- 
men among the 35 candidates 
out. They are Wayne Boudreau, 
the only senior letterman, who 
runs the 1600 and 3200 meter 
races, and juniors Mark Roden- 
kirch (400 and relay), Brian 
Johnson (hurdles) and Stuart 
Stautz (pole vault and sprints).

PREP TRACK — GIRLS
KEWASKUM 61, PLYMOUTH 47
Shot Put — I. Kempf. K, 34-1%; 2. Schwon- 

tow. P. 33 6%; 3 Kuphal. K 28 5%
High Jump — 1. Matanaar K, 4-10; 2. Volk. K, 

4-6; 3 Schmida. P. 4-4.
long Jump — 1. Geiger P, 14-3%; 2. Paul. K, 

13 11%; 3. A Nigh. K. 13 10.
45m hurdlot — I. Conrad P. 7 94; 2. A. Nigh, 

K. 8 3; 3. Muallar. K 8 4
45m doth — 1. Kempt K, 6.65. 2. Gaigar P 

6 9; 3 Skelton. P. 6 9+ .
1600 mater* — 1 Kattelic. P. 5.43; 2. Klein. K

In' another indoor meet 
Thursday here, the Hartford 
High track teams won impres­
sively over the Indian teams. 
The Orioles took the girls end of 
the meet by a 63-37 margin and 
scored a one-sided 87-31 win in 
the boys events, even with some 
of their regular sprinters and 
distance runners not partici­
pating.

Kewaskum managed just 
three first places, two from ace 
senior Boudreau, who won the 
1600 meter run (5:08:2) and the 
3200 meter race (11:20.8). 
Freshman Monty Shaw again 
won the 800 in 2:19, just .6 of a 
second ahead of two Hartford 
runners. Mark Durian had a 
personal best of IL’ in the pole 
vault.

For the girls, the Indians’ 
Linda Larsen started out her 
first meet with a double win in 
the 200 and 400, and was part of 
the victorious 16 lap relay, 
winning because the Oriole 
quartet was disqualified.

Holly Kempf’s 34’ in the shot 
was a highlight for Kewaskum 
as was Wendy Wilson’s 800 
meter win.
Hartford 63. Kawatkum 37

Shot Put 1. Kempf K 34'4; 2. Ruefanar H 30 
9%. 3 Algiers 29 9'/..

High Jump I. Nicolaus H and Schmidt H lie 4- 
10: 3 Motenaer K 4-8

long Jump 1. Bauer H 15-2, 2. Sonn H 14 
10%: 3 Schmidt H 14-5%.

45m Hurdles I Schmidt H 7-6; 2. Sonn H 7.7; 
3 Nigh K 8 3

45m Dash 1 Benko H 6 5; 2 Nicolaus H 6.6; 3. 
Gotten H 6 6 plus.

1600 Meters I. Kelly H 6:07.6. 2. Follmonn K 
6 08 I 3 Schmidt K 6:24.4

8 lap Relay I Hartford (Gossan. Schmidt, 
Sonn Benko) I 58 4, 2 Hart. 2:04 2

400 Meters I. larsen K 1:06 2. 2. Rassebo H 
1 13 13 Horan H > 09 8

800 Meteis I Wilson K 2:44 8. 2. Wahl H 
2 48 2. 3. Parisi H 2 51 4

200 Meters. I. larsen K 30.2; 2. Olson H 30.5- 
plus; 3 Secor K 30 5 plus

3200 Meters I Klein K 13 26 4; 2. Jo Holsey H 
13 39 5 3 Ji Halsey H 13 41 0.

16 lap relay I. Kew (Larsen, Follman, Nigh 
Wilson) 4 39 9 Hartford DQed
•®Y»
Hartford 87. Kewaskum 31

Shot Put I Messig H 43 5. 2. Krueger H 40 %; 
3 Brumfield H 39 10%.

H gh lump 4 Pollich H 5 10; 2 Kossens H 5 8;
3 Leitner H 5-4 

long Jump I leow H 21 11%; 2. Polich H 19

In Conference
Friday, March 19, ended the 

league season for the Holy 
Trinity School Wildcats at the 
annual All-Star Game, held 
here at the Kewaskum High 
School.

St. Matthew’s Campbell­
sport, league champions, were 
thwarted in seeking an un­
blemished season when the 
All-Stars, headed by the scoring 
of Holy Trinity’s Tim Rohlinger

Oconomowoc Dumps 
Lakes Team in Finale

with 21 points and
Theusch’s 6 points

Ron 
and

C.C.L.T. (Consolidated Congre­
gations of Lomira and Theresa) 
Kevin Reuter’s 12 points, out­
lasted St. Matthew’s, 47-39. 
Bob Sippel of St. Matthew’s 
was high for the league champs 
with 23 points.

Holy Trinity’s A team finish­
ed second in the conference this 
season, led by a strong inside 
combination of Tim Rohlinger, 
averaging 24 points per game, 
and Ron Theusch with 12 
points, followed by Tim 
Bingen’s 7 point average, Jesse 
Mueller 9 points. Jay Karoses 2 
points, and 6th grader Greg 
Dean with a 6 point average.

Though these statistics are 
impressive for a few, it is the 
strong team oriented play of all 
players that make the op­
portunities, the unsung heroes 
as they are called who work 
hard at both ends of the court 
and at practice. Among these 
are Jeff Sevick, Randy Gindt, 
Bill Nigh and Todd Boegel. It 
was this hard work and sacrifice 
that made the team successful.

The other 
the Kettle 
Basketball 
Matthew’s.

teams making up 
Moraine Catholic 
League are St. 
Campbellsport;

8 lap relay — I. Kewaskum (Socor. Nigh 
Poul. Volm) 2 04 7 ; 2 Ply 2 08 4

400 motor* — I. Wilton. K. I 06.7; 2 
Brinkman. P, 1:09.6; 3. Fenner. P. 1:10

800 meters

113. Morcelowsky H 1810.
Pole Vault 1. Smityman H 

H t2 0; 3 Durian KUO
45m Highs: I. leow H 6.7 

InfaltH 7 I.

12-6. 2. Thompson

2 Johnson 6 8; 3

Johnson 6 5 3. In
fait H 6.5

45m Dash I Smityman H 5 9: 2 Kotina H 6 C 
3 Peters H 6.0.

1600 Meters- I. Boudreau K 5:08.2; 2 Strobe 
H 5:11 1:3 JandreKS 19

8 lap Relay: 1. Hartford (Peters Hattori Ir 
fait. Smityman) 1 48.2. 2 Kew I 49 7

400 Meter* 1. Haganttein H 59 2
Rodenkirch K 60 3 3 Reich H 63 8 

800 Meter* 1. Shaw K 2 19 0 2 Becki

2

H

200 Meiers 1 Korina H 26 7: 2 Geiger H 27 0.
3 Staulz K 27 6

3200 Meters: 1 Boudreau K 11 20 8 2 fundic
K 11 44.7. 3. Standish K 11 56 5

16
4 08

Katfelic P. 2:34.7; 2.
Follmonn. K, 2 40 6; 3. Steinke. P. 2 41 2

200 meter* — I. Volm. K. 31.25. 2. Weed 
monn P. 32.0; 3 Daul*, K. 32.2

3200 meter* — 1. Schmidt. K. 13:45 8; 2. Reif. 
K. 14:18 4: 3. Jensen. P. 17:29.2.

16 lop relay — I. Plymouth (no name* given) 
no time lilted

BOYS
PYMOUTH 74. KEWASKUM 44
Shot Put Farmanich,

Triebentee. P. 39 8%; 3. Peterman. K. 39 6%.
High Jump — I. Richart*, P. 5-4; 2. Schultz. P, 

5-2; 3 Follmonn K. 5 0.
long Jump — 1. Hau. P. 18-8%: 2. Schultz. P, 

16 6%. 3. Halle. P. 16 2%
Pole Vault — 1. Stout* K. 11-0: 2 M Durian

K. 10-6; 3 Halle. P. 9 6.
45 m highs — 1. Johnson, K, 7.05; 2

Baumgartner. P. 7.2: 3. Schultl, P. 8 6
45 m lows — 1. Johnson. K. 6.B4; 2. Baumgart 

nor. P. 6.9; 3. Miller. K, 7.7,
45 m dosh

1600 meters

1. Formonlch. P. 5.87;
I. Sekeret. K. 6 2+.
I. Boudreau, K. 5 02.9,

2.

2.
Hain •moan, P, 5:04.6; 3. Hau, P. 5:06.7.

• lap relay — I. Ply (Raster Triebontoo. 
Mueller. Helmer) 1:46.7; 2. Kew. 1:49,7.

400 meter* — 1. Hau. P. 58 5. 2. Rodenkirch 
K. 59.4; 3 Kloinhant P. 59 7.

800 meter* — 1. Show K, 2:19.4; 2. Baeck. P.
2 23 2 3. LaBilloit. P. 2.27.3.

200 meters Trioban tea. P, 26.51; 2.

3200 meters - 1. Boudreau. K. 11:31.3; 2. 
Standish, K. 11:419; 3. Jondre. K, 11:42.

16 lop relay — 1. Plymouth. 3:54.01, 
(Heitmann, Boeck Klemhons Formankh); 2.

lap Relay I Hartford 4 05 2. 2. Kewotkum

QUEEN HITS LEAGUE 
Ellen Koehn, Sec.

Schroeder 207, Carol Dornbrook 
204.

Indv. High Series: Mary 
Stutzman 544, Rockie Feuer- 
hammer 534, Judy Rose 533.

W L
Bauer Spraying 59 25
Baumann’s Bus 53 31
Dundee S. & G. 52 '/» 31'/,
Everglades 51 33
Johann Plbg. 45'/, 38'/,
Herman’s 43 41
Robbie’s 42 42
Charles 42 42
Laurie’s 40 44
Newsettes 39'/, 44'/,
Artie’s Market 39 45
Regal Ware 36*4 47'/,
Strobel’s 36 48
Hensen’s 36 48
Fin-n-Feather 31 53
First State Bank 26 58

Indv. High Game: Mary
Stutzman 214, Loretta

Holy Trinity, Newburg; St. 
Mary’s West Bend, and the 
Consolidated Congregations of 
Lomira and Theresa (C.C.L.T.>.

The Holy Trinity A team and 
Coach and League Commis­
sioner Oscar Knoeck would like 
to thank the Holy Name Society 
of Holy Trinity for their 
financial support, especially the 
new warmups, all parents who 
took time as drivers and 
monitors, Dick Heisdorf, Jerry 
Gosa and Tom Timblin for 
officiating our home games, and 
Dennis Reha and Roy Esser for 
their cooperation and use of 
Middle School and High School 
facilities. Without all this 
support our program would not 
be the success it is.

The Holy Trinity B team 
showed a lot of desire and 
sportsmanship throughout the 
season. With the desire these 
kids have, they should have a 
great future ahead of them­
selves. The team consisted of 
Charlie Walls, Allen Theusch, 
Bobby Castro, Doug Geidel, 
Mike Johann, Pat Murre, Russ 
Volm, Jason Boegel and three 
all-stars, Noel Stollenwerk, Joe 
Klahn and Mike Struebing.

The Kewaskum Lakes basket­
ball teams pulled down the 
curtain on their 1981-82 Lakes 
season, as the Oconomowoc 
Lakes handed them their eighth 
straight defeat at St. John’s 
Military Academy, Delafield, 
Tuesday night, 144-106, as Tom 
Checki poured in 38 points. 
With the victory Oconomowoc 
clinches third place in the Lakes 
‘A’ Division with a 9-4 record 
with a makeup game at Slinger 
left Wednesday night, the final 
Lakes game of the year. Slinger 
needed a victory in that game to 
tie Hartford for first place in the 
’B’ Division. The loss drops 
Kewaskum to a 2-13 record and 
a share of the *B” cellar with 
Mayville.

Hot shooting, a blistering fast 
break, and strong rebounding 
carried Oconomowoc to their 
romp over Kewaskum. Actually 
Kewaskum stayed pretty close 
in the first half, but a big third 
quarter put the game away for 
Coony.

Oconomowoc led 30-26 at the 
quarter and increased their lead 
to 64-50 at the half as Checki 
had 20 first-half points. Leon 
Laatsch countered with 22 
points in the first half for 
Kewaskum. Then came the 
disastrous third quarter as O- 
conomowoc rolled up 47 points, 
to Kewaskum’s 24. Checki had 
12 and John Sibley had 10 in the 
quarter for Oconomowoc. This 
made the score 111-74, Ocono­
mowoc. The teams played fairly 
even in the fourth quarter with 
Oconomowoc having a 33-32 
edge. Mike Ferris had eight 
points in the quarter for Coony, 
while Laatsch led Kewaskum 
with 10.

Seven players scored in 
double figures for Oconomo­
woc. Besides Checki, Sibley had 
22 points, Dave Nelson had 18, 
and Keith Sindberg 17. Leon 
Laatsch again led Kewaskum 
with 37 points. John Slesar had 
15 points, Bill Backhaus had 14,

Lakes Team Loses, 
Wins by Forfeit 
In Tourney Games

WEDNESDAY 
MORNINGETTES

Serwe’s Tap 
Bar-N-Annex 
King Pin 
Marie’s Bty. Shop

' Baumann’s Dairy 
Gregg’s Tap 
Cal's Bender 
Don’s Rad. Ser.

W 
59 
47'/, 
47 
46*/, 
43 
42 
41 
22

Ind. High Series: 
Wuebben 531, Donna

' L
28 
39'/, 
40
40*/, 
44
45
46
65

Corey 
LaShay

513, Cordell Enright 497.
Ind. High Game: Corey 

Wuebben 233, Donna LaShay 
186, Cordell Enright 185.

and Brian Larsen and 
heiser each had 12.

Oconomowoc made 
free throws for 76.9 
while Kewaskum was 
for 66.7 percent.

ictWASKUM

' laattch

Slesor 
Bockhous 
Gonwa 
Rohlinger 
Smucker

Totals 
KEWASKUM

ft
9
2 0

Ric Leit-

10 of 13 
percent, 
16 of 24

OCONOMOWOC

Duncon 5

6 
3
3

*
2 
0 
0
2 
0

3

o
0

45 16 13

Nelson 
Check.

Sibley 
S Sindberg 
Steger 
K. Sindberg 
Total*

9
I9

ft 
0 
0 
0 
0

2

8
67

0
0 
5

10
26 24 24 32—106

OCONOMOWOC 30 34 47 33
FTM — Kowatkum 8. Oconomowoc 3.

RESULTS
Tuesday, March 23 — Ocon­

omowoc 144, Kewaskum 106.
Wednesday, March 24 — 

Oconomowoc 105, Slinger 104.
The Menomonee Falls Bad­

gers are the champions *of the 
A Division and also the grand 

champions with a 13-1 record. 
The Menomonee Falls Stingers 
take second place in the ‘A’ 
Division with all-3 record.

Hartford is the champion of 
the ‘B’ Division with a 9-6
record. Slinger takes second 
place in the ‘B’ Division with
8-7 record.

LAND O' LAKES 
BASKETBALL LEAGUE

A DIV.
Falls Badgers 
Falls Stingers 
Ocon 
Cedarburg 
T Maquon

FINAL 
W 
13

10

5

STANDINGS

3

6

• DIV. 
Hartford 
Slinger 
Port Wash. 
Sussex 
Kewaskum 
Mayville

a

8 
6

2
2

The Kewaskum Lakes basket­
ball team was clobbered by 
Kugle’s Keg of Reedsville, 
117-76, in their opening game of 
the Howards Grove Athletic 
Club tournament Saturday, be­
hind a balanced scoring attack 
led by Joe Mauel’s 21 points. 
Kewaskum then moved into the 
tournament’s consolation brac­
ket and won by forfeit over the 
Swan Club of De Pere Sunday 
night as the latter team failed to 
show up for the 7.00 p.m. game. 
There was no word as to what 
had happened to the Swan Club 
team.

Kewaskum was up against a 
team loaded with players from 
UW-Green Bay, UW-Stevens 
Point, and Ripon College in 
their opening game on Satur­
day. Kugle’s figures to be one 
of the stronger teams in the 
tourney. Kewaskum was both 
outnumbered and outsized as 
Kugle’s came with a 12-man 
squad, with a number of players 
between 6-foot-5 and 6-foot-7.

Kugle’s jumped to a 26-15 
first quarter lead behind balan­
ced scoring. Leon Laatsch had 
eight for Kewaskum. They in­
creased their lead to 53-30 at 
the half as Mauel got seven in 
the second quarter. The lead 
went to 83-48 after three quar­
ters as Kugle’s again got balan­
ced scoring in the third quarter. 
John Slesar had seven for Ke­
waskum. It was 34-28 Kugle’s 
in the final quarter as Cam 
Curtin got six for Kugle’s. Bill 
Backhaus countered with 10 in 
the quarter for Kewaskum.

Besides Mauel, Cam Curtin 
had 18 points for Kugle’s and 
Casey Zakowski and Pete Zuik­
er each had 14. Bill Backhaus 
led Kewaskum with 19 points, 
while Leon Laatsch added 16 
points and John Slesar 11.

Kugle’s didn’t need free 
throws in this game as they shot 
only four, making one, for 25.0 
percent. Kewaskum was 14 of 
20 for 70.0 percent.

Kewaskum now moves into 
the consolation bracket semi­
finals and will play their next 
game Saturday at 3:30 p.m. 
They will play the winner of the 

fgame between Mautink’s of 
o Oostburg and Fireball Arcade of 
* Oshkosh, which was played 
i Tuesday at 7:00 p.m. If Ke- 
। waskum wins their game on 
’Saturday, they would be in the 
2 consolation championship game 

a, Sunday at 6:45 p.m.
KUGLE S KEG 
REEDSVILLE

Prochnow 
Mauel 
Zakowski 
Weigman 
Radtke 
Curtin 
Ritchie 
Pogel 
Ranks 
Zuiker

Kugle 
Totals
KUGLE SKEG
KEWASKUM

FTM —
Kewaskum 6.

6

9
13
13

*8 
1

10

fl 
0 2

KEWASKUM

lootsch

5

6

0 
0
0 
0

0.0
5

5

0 
0 
0 
0 
0

2 
3 
0

0
2
0

17

Slesar 
Backhaus 
Gonwa 
Wodsedalek 
Smucker 
Miller

Totals
27

Kuglat Keg of

»9 
5 
3

9
2

0 
3

31

ft 
6
3

2

0 
0

14

3
2

0 
0

0

Reedsville 3,

BASEBALL TEAM TO 
PRACTICE SATURDAY

The Kewaskum baseball 
team will have a practice at the 
baseball diamond on Saturday, 
April 3, at 11:00.

Kewaskum will have only one 
team this year and the team will 
be managed by Tom Bartelt.

Anyone interested in playing 
should try to make it to practice 
on Saturday.


