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Week’s Wit
If it's true that today’s young 
men want to stand up and be 
heard, then why are so many of 
them getting married?
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Grand Opening Now on at New MaralhOD SgM Hoard Meeting
Shop-Rite Foods Store Here Trims little from 191213 lodges

Ribbon cutting at the new Shop-Rite Food Store grand opening on Tuesday. Left to right — 
Mike Palmer, Vice President of northern division of Pick & Save Food Stores; Tim Reimer, 
manager of the Kewaskum store and Gerald Stollenwerk, Village President, cutting the 
ribbon. Statesman Photo

The Kewaskum Shop-Rite 
Food Store at 927 Fond du Lac 
Ave. opened their doors for 
business on Tuesday morning, 
December 1, with ribbon cut­
ting ceremonies at 9:00 o’clock. 
The new store is located on 
Hwy. 45, next to the new 
Kennelly Pharmacy in the Ke­
waskum Mall. Gerald Stollen­
werk, Village President, had the 
honor of cutting the ribbon.

The spacious, brand new 
12,500 sq. ft. store features a 
complete self-service meat de­
partment, self-service produce, 
complete dairy and extensive 
frozen food section. Another 
attraction is the “In-Store” 
bakery with quality fresh bakery

Municipal Building Remodeling Program Favored
By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

After reviewing all the re­
pairs and their costs to return 
the Municipal Building to near 
normal condition, Don Mlodzik, 
Public Works Committee Chair­
man, said he was definitely for 
the proposed remodeling pro­
gram.

“Forget about the repair 
program and get into re­
modeling, the $30,000 for re­
pairs is just a stop-gap mea­
sure.” In the long run the 
village will be saving money by

daily to insure the best in 
freshness and good taste. You 
will find Roundy’s and Old Time 
products for greater savings 
in the canned goods line along 
with other brand name products 
and a complete line of Generic 
products to save you even more 
money.

According to Norman 
Mieritz, advertising manager of 
Roundy’sz the store has a 
number of feature energy 
saving devices including heat 
reclamation service and com­
puter controlled lighting and 
electrical systems.

The store employs thirty part- 
time and full-time employees.

remodeling rather than repair­
ing. Mlodzik and the members 
of his committee all agreed that 
suggested municipal repairs 
were just the tip of the iceberg 
and after the most urgent items 
had been taken care of you 
would still end up with a 
patched-up building with the 
same problems which had 
originally caused the needed 
repairs.

Paul Blumer said, if nothing 
else were done, he was in favor 
of remodeling the roofs to give 
them adequate drainage pitch.

Tim Reimer will manage the 
Kewaskum store. He and his 
wife and three sons, twins, 
Scottie and Kenny, 5^2 years 
and Mark, 8 months, are 
moving this week from their 
Burlington home to an apart­
ment on Hwy. S.

Mike Palmer of Appleton is 
vice president of northern di­
vision of Pick & Save Food 
stores.

Every Tuesday senior citizens 
will receive a 5% discount.

Store hours are Monday thru 
Friday, 7:00 a.m. to 9:00 p.m.; 
Saturday, 7:00 a.m. to 6:00 
p.m., and Sunday, 8:00 a.m. to 
6:00 p.m.

He noted this would solve the 
entire issue as far as roof leaks 
throughout the entire building. 
Simply repairing the existing 
leaky roof would not correct the 
situation and you would end up 
with still further repairs in a 
short time.

Another point made by 
Mlodzik was the fact the village 
has outgrown the building. “If 
you remodel for just general 
repairs, then in a few years we 
will have to completely re­
model.” When the building was

[Continued on Page 2]

By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

Not sleet nor snow could sway 
the school board from its ap­
pointed duties or at least that’s 
the way it seemed. The meeting 
which started at 8:00 p.m. 
Monday evening, finally ad­
journed at approximately 1:30 
a.m. Tuesday. As President 
John Tessar said when discus­
sion of dropping school board 
member salaries came up, 
“we’re sure not in it for the 
money, our $700.00 a year 
comes out to about 25c an hour. 
I don’t know how many people 
would want to work for that kind 
of pay.”

Although the board had not 
planned to do so, all thirty items 
on the budget recommendation 
list were discussed and some 
were acted upon.

Items 1 and 2, regarding 
discontinuing physical educa­
tion were dropped since it is still 
required by law.

Item 3, elimination of school 
board salaries, will be brought 
up at the annual meeting. 
Tessar felt this was a decision 
which had to be made by the 
taxpayers and could not be 
voted on by the board itself.

Item 4 saw the board un­
animously vote to drop girls’

Preliminary Subdivision Design
Plans Heard by Plan Commission

By GERRY MUELLER 
Statesman Staff Writer

On the recommendation of 
the Village Board, James Reigle 
and Dr. Charles Ogi came 
before the Plan Commission to 
explain their ideas for possible 
construction of a 207 unit sub­
division on 80 acres on their 
jointly owned land located west 
of Kewaskum.

Reigle reviewed the general 
concept and layout of the pro­
ject noting, “nothing is cast in 
concrete,” as far as actual 
architectural plans. He felt 
newspaper coverage of their 
plan was premature since the 
drawing presented was their 
consultant’s recommendation of 
how to develop the land of its 
best potential insofar as contour 
and setting were concerned.

Reigle was questioned by the 
Commission regarding various 
aspects of this plan. Charles 
Miller asked who would own the 
units. Reigle noted it was not 
their intention to build apart­
ment houses, but units which 
would be individually owned. 
Miller asked if the men planned 
on developing the whole project

golf, and saving of $1,272. It 
was felt participation was too 
low to warrant keeping it.

Item 5, cross country, was 
also cut by the board. Several 
people felt participation was 
adequate, especially by the 
girls, to maintain the program. 
Mrs. Hubbell said, “I think it’s 
a real shame to drop CC when 
Mr. Drexler is working virtually 
1/2 price coaching both boys 
and girls.”

Board member Gerald Secor 
said he didn’t think the board 
should cut out so much extra 
curricular, stating “you won’t 

* have anything to offer the kids, 
and some come to school only 
for that.” He felt sports was at 
least an incentive to get some 
would-be drop-outs to stay in 
school.

Item 6, dropping two sports 
for both boys and girls, was 
covered by the cutting of golf, 
cross country and Dr. Ogi 
suggested reduction in the 
number of conference baseball 
games down to 18 in line with 
other schools.

Item 7 - eliminate elementary 
school counseling. Tessar said, 
“last year the board had the 
perfect opportunity to eliminate 
it when Mr. Mitchell retired and 
we didn’t do it.” Dave Wietor,

[Continued on Page 2)

at once. Reigle said no, 
probably just a few of the 
multiple units at first. “Before 
we attract anybody we’ll have to 
put in the pond.” Development 
of a 13 to 14 foot deep pond in 
the unbuildable floodplain area 
is planned for the open area. 
The DNR, however, has not 
been contacted regarding 
permits and regulations as yet. 
Jeff Rohrer aked what type of 
restrictions would be in effect as 
far as other people using this 
area. Reigle commented this 
was one of the items which 
would have to be worked out 
with the village.

Zoning Administrator 
Richard Zarling noted he felt 
comfortable with the general 
concept, but the main concern 
of the plan commission was the 
health and safety of the resi­
dents. He felt there would be 
several technical problems as 
far as zoning restrictions were 
concerned. “There is no way 
this can go up as one project. 
The only way I can see it coming 
at all is as a ‘conditional use’ 
basis.” Zarling noted that each

(Continued on Page 2)
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high school counselor, was 
asked about the counseling. He 
stated, “if you’re asking if the 
program is as effective as it 
could be, 1 would say not, 
because of the case load. De­
partment of Public Instruction 
recommendations are 400 stu­
dents to 1 counselor, we’re 
working on a 1,000 to 1 ration. 
We’d like to run parent groups, 
too, but we don’t have the 
time.” Dr. Ogi’s motion was 
defeated.

Ogi stated, “we’ve come up 
with several reductions and 
very few dollar cuts.” To this 
point and approximately three 
hours of discussion, the board 
had cut approximately $2,800.

Item 8 - eliminate business 
manager’s position. Tom Brig­
ham’s motion was defeated. 
Tessar stated, “do we feel that 
the superintendent doesn’t 
have enough work?" “We’re 
working with a 4 '/i -million 
dollar budget, we’re putting a 
lot of responsibility on one 
individual.” Tessar asked Brig­
ham how many UWWC had on 
its staff. He commented a Dean, 
Accountant and Bookkeeper for 
600 students. Tessar comment­
ed and Mr. Brigham expects 
Mr. Brenholt to be super­
intendent and business 
manager for over 2,000 stu­
dents. Superintendent Brenholt 
noted that his and Bob Borch’s 
job descriptions and business 
administration background 
were similar, however, since 
establishment of the business 
manager position Brenholt has 
been able to get more involved 
in the academic end of running 
the school district. Brenholt 
said, “when the board asks 
questions like this, where do 
you think all the reports come 
from?” Brenholt noted if he had 
to resume* business responsi­
bilities also, “there are more 
things than you can handle and 
not all things will be done as 
well as they should be.”

Other items which either died 
for lack for a second to a motion 
or were voted down included, 
suggestions to eliminate 1 
secretarial and 1 aide positions, 
closing of Beechwood School, 
reduction of business manager,

Super Special
for Your

Holiday
JOHNSON

Entertaining
CHEESE SPREADS J

(^0,s $1.99 "‘ ^

superintendent and assistant 
high school principal contract 
days, changing to shorter school 
periods, reduction of credit 
requirements, elimination of 
reading specialist, elementary 
art and music teachers and 
assistant high school principal, 
transfer of one KES aide to 
Farmington, elimination of 
separate athletic director’s pay, 
elimination of gifted and talent­
ed program and parochial 
busing.

Suggestions which were 
tabled for further discussion 
included private or contract 
bussing in remote areas, review 
outside school program costs, 
moving district offices, review­
ing DPI special education re­
port, review all aspects of 
busing costs, and all-day 
kindergarten.

The board voted to cut 20 
days from the high school and 
10 days from the middle school 
counselors schedule, and to 
drop one wrestling coach.

Subdivision
[Continued from Page 1]

group of homes fell into a 
different zoning regulation. As 
an example, Zarling said the 
individual homes would not 
meet R-l zoning, “if you sell 
individual lots, you’ll need 
bigger lots.” Another item for 
consideration is sidewalks to 
eliminate busing. Still another 
question was maintenance of 
roads. Reigle said there are 
approximately 800 to 900 feet of 
public and 2,400 feet of private 
roads. Maintenance and plow­
ing of the private sections 
probably would be contracted 
out to a private business.

Commission member Bob 
Kirst was not satisfied with 
entrance and exit to the sub­
division. He said, “I’m looking 
at two entrances to get in and 
out. There could be a jam-up if 
any type of emergency evacu­
ation was called for. Two other 
roads feed into Bel-Ric sub­
division. You’ve got about 25% 
of the village in a given 80-acre 
area.” (The 25% figure is 
arrived at through the village’s

present dwelling count of 804. 
Adding another 207 units would
increase Kewaskum’s size by 
approximately 25%).

Reigle asked if the commis­
sion would recommend an­
nexation so that village sewer 
and water could be extended to 
the subdivision. The general 
feeling expressed by commis­
sion members was that the idea 
of the subdivision was good, 
however, no formal recom­
mendation could be made until 
a plat and actual specific blue­
prints were presented. The 
commission suggested Reigle 
and Ogi obtain the necessary 
zoning and subdivision plan­
ning books and use them in 
developing their formal plans 
for presentation. Annexation 
will be considered when formal 
blueprints are presented to the 
commission.

Remodeling
[Continued from Page 1]

first constructed, Kewaskum’s 
population was around 1,300, 
now its up to 2,500. The Police 
Department has grown in size 
and needs as well as the library

which has been working in 
overcrowded conditions for 
some time.

Several items in the complete 
remodeling program would in­
clude redesigning the roof 
areas, addition of a new two- 
stall garage (which would allow 
present garage space to be 
turned into offices and storage 
areas), remodeling and moving 
of present toilet facilities to 
accomodate handicapped and 
provide needed space to expand 
library area to double its pre­
sent size and update the present 
heating system to handle ex­
panded areas and new addition 
with the possibility of convert­
ing from oil to natural gas.

Dick Schmidt recommended 
the Village Administrator Dan 
Schmidt have several firms 
come in and review the build­
ing, “tell them what we would 
like, present our suggestions 
and get theirs.” Jeff Rohrer 
asked Dan Schmidt how much 
this inspection would cost. He 
felt there shouldn’t be much if 
any cost at all since several 
architectural firms had present­
ed the preliminary blueprints at

no cost. Schmidt noted these 
companies are looking for work 
and he received inquiries from 
as far away as Madison.

Schmidt was asked what kind 
of price tag was put on the 
complete remodeling program. 
He said between $300,000 and 
$400,000, however, from plans 
already submitted he felt the 
$300,000 end was more realis­
tic.

Mlodzik told Schmidt to go 
ahead and set up meetings with 
the various firms. After suf­
ficient data is received. Mlodzik 
suggested the committee hold 
individual meetings with these 
firms after the first of the year. 
After reviewing the different 
presentations his committee 
would then be in a better 
position to make its recom­
mendations to the full Village 
board.

CHIMNEY FIRE
Kewaskum firemen were call­

ed out about 4:55 p.m. last 
Wednesday to snuff out a 
chimney fire at the Larry 
Bunkelman residence at 4584 
Hwy. H west of Kewaskum.

We also have a variety of cheese 
and do make cheese plates

Order Your
CHRISTMAS HAM

Early 

626-2444
BEHRINGS 

MEAT MARKET 
1265 Fond du Lac Ave, Kewaskum



Preis to Retire From Regal; Replaced by Peterson Kewaskum Statesman, Friday, Dec. 4, 1981, Page 3

Kim T. Peterson

Regal Ware, Inc. has an­
nounced that Bert W. Preis, 
currently Field Sales Director 
for the Kewaskum housewares 
manufacturer, will retire ef­
fective March 31, 1982. Preis 
joined Regal in 1959 and served 
as assistant sales manager and 
sales manager in the premium 
and old retail tea and coffee 
divisions until named to his 
present position in 1966.

Credited with starting the 
Regal college recruiting/sales 
training program in 1970, Preis 
has also been active in a variety

Rescue Squad Calls

of community activities includ­
ing United Way where he is 
presently serving as Co-Chair­
man of the 1981 Drive and the 
Kewaskum Kiwanis Turkey 
Shoot that has raised thousands 
of dollars for community pro­
jects.

Preis will be replaced by Kim 
T. Peterson, currently Regional 
Sales Manager for the South­
eastern states, presently based 
in Atlanta. Peterson will be 
responsible for selection, train­
ing and day-to-day contact with 
Regal’s international sales

Births

force. A sixteen year Regal 
veteran of sales and field 
management, Peterson worked 
the New York City-New Jersey 
territory before transferring to 
Atlanta in 1972.

A graduate of Ohio State 
University, Peterson will join 
the corporate office staff 
January 1, 1981. A Kewaskum 
native, he will be moving to the 
area in the near future with his 
wife, Mary Ann, and two child­
ren.

Regal Ware, Inc. is a multi­
plant manufacturer of cook­
ware, portable electrics and 
microwave accessories head­
quartered in Kewaskum.

KHS English Teacher 

Attends Conference

On Composition

Ms. Barbara York, a Kewas­
kum English teacher, recently 
attended a conference on com­
position at the University of 
Wisconsin - Milwaukee. UW- 
Milwaukee, in cooperation with 
the Joint Planning Council of 
the Milwaukee Public and 
Private Schools, sponsored the 
invitational conference on com­
position. Forty-four school dis­
tricts were represented and 148 
teachers participated in the 
conference. The theme of the 
conference, “The Workshop 
Method of Teaching Writing” 
was planned as a response to 
one of the pressing needs of 
public education today - teach­
ing students how to write more 
effectively.

Arnold Chandler, represent­
ing the Department of Public 

.Instruction, spoke at the lunch­
eon and stressed the need for 
improving composition skills 
statewide.

Registrants participated in 
small groups where experi­
enced leaders guided them 
through the Workshop Method 
in Teaching Writing. The first 
principle of the workshop in­
volved students learning by 
performing the process or writ­
ing rather than by studying 
precepts or projects. The 
second principle involved stu­
dents doing their best in a 
stimulating, sympathetic and

supportive atmosphere.
The basic workshop method 

provides teachers and students 
working jointly through the 
stages of the writing process 
and respond to each others 
work. The teacher is freed to 
spend more time facilitating the 
students’ efforts and less time 
documenting student failures. 
Recently this method has gain­
ed wide support because of the 
consistent success reported by 
teachers using it.

New Fane Pastor 
To Conduct Tour
To Egypt, Israel

Have you ever dreamed of 
visiting the Holy Land? Has it 
been your desire to walk the 
places where your Lord Jesus 
walked? If so, you can make this 
dream a reality. Pastor Lindau, 
pastor of St. John Lutheran 
Church, New Fane, will be 
conducting a tour to Egypt and 
Israel February 8-18. On this 
tour, we will visit Cairo, Egypt, 
as well as Bethlehem, Nazareth, 
the Sea of Galilee, and all the 
sites in the area of Jerusalem.

If you are interested in ac­
companying us on this tour, 
there will be a get-together on 
Monday, December 7, at 7:00 
p.m. at the St. John school, 670 
Hwy. S - just a quarter mile 
north of New Fane.

If you have any questions, 
contact Pastor Lindau at 626- 
2309.

Sunday, Nov. 29 — Louis 
Seefeldt, 91, 518 Keller St., 
Kewaskum, taken to St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital, 
West Bend, following a fall at 
his home.

Monday, Nov. 30 — Melinda 
Jung, 82, 5337 Hwy. 28W, R. 1, 
Allenton, taken to St. Joseph’s 
Community Hospital from her 
home following a fall.

CURRERI — A son to 
Anthony and Shirley Curreri, 
3907 Hi Mount Rd., Kewaskum, 
Monday, Nov. 30.

KLEMP — A son to Rick and 
Rande Klemp, R. 2, No. 229A, 
Campbellsport, Friday, Nov. 
20.

Give a gift subscription to the 
Kewaskum Statesman.

118 Forest Ave Kewaskum

Hear Ye - 

Hear Ye!

Grand Champion Summer Sausage in 1 lb., 2 lb., 31/2 lb. sizes
• Smoked Breakfast Links
• Smoked Pork Sausage
• Polish Sausage
• Ring Bologna
• Mettwurst

• Honey Grove Pure Honey in Decorative Jars
• Gouda Cheese

Place Orders Now for the Holidays
Call 626-2710

OR COME IN TO ORDER AT

Holiday Sausage Gift Boxes 
Made to Order

SELECT FROM:

PACKAGING $2.25



Memories... The Statesman welcomes readers to submit photos 
for the "Memories" feature. Photos should show 
life in the olden days in this area. Deliver or mail to 
The Statesman, 250 Main St., Kewaskum, WI 
53040. Photos can be picked up again after 
publication.
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This photo, taken about 1916, shows an early street taken at Elmore, Wis. Where the heck 
is Elmore? Near Lake Bernice. Where the heck is Lake Bernice? A few miles northwest of 
Kewaskum. (Photo submitted by Isabelle Muckerheide)

OBITUARIES
DONALD SPERGER

Donald David Sperger, 51, of 
355 Pleasant Hill Ave., Lomira, 
died Tuesday, Nov. 24, at his 
home.

He was born Sept. 24, 1930, 
in the Town of LeRoy, a son of 
Ruben and Vida Indermuehle 
Sperger. He married Shirley 
Weiland at St. Kilian on Aug. 
21, 1954.

Mr. Sperger farmed and was 
employed by Lipke Lumber of 
Lomira since 1969.

Survivors include his wife; a 
daughter, Mrs. Richard 
(Kathleen) Hass of Fond du 
Lac; a son, John at home; a 
granddaughter; his father of 
LeRoy; a brother, Cortland of 
Waupun; and four sisters, Mrs. 
Henrietta Gremminger of Ke­
waskum, Mrs. Ramona Werner 
and Mrs. Ruby Stromme!, both 
of West Bend, and Mrs. 
Ermanelda Franke of LeRoy. A 
son and his mother preceded 
him in death.

Funeral services were held at 
7:30 p.m. Friday at St. Mary's 
(’atholic Church, Lomira. The 
Rev. Joseph Safiejko officiated 
and burial took place in the 
parish cemetery.

Friends of Mr. Sperger called 
from 4 to 7 p.m. Friday at 
Kietzer Funeral Home, Lomira.
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NORMAN SCHRAUTH
Norman C. Schrauth, 76, of 

Route 1, Campbellsport, died 
Monday, Nov. 23, at Mercy 
Medical Center, Oshkosh.

He was born Oct. 2, 1905, in 
the Town of Auburn, a son of 
the late Anton and Magdalene 
Bach Schrauth. He married 
Evelyn Thill on Oct. 29, 1935, at 
St. Martin’s Catholic Church, 
Ashford.

The couple farmed in the 
Town of Ashford until retiring. 
He was a member of St. 
Martin’s Church in Ashford and 
Holy Name Society.

Survivors include a son, 
Norman A. of Route 1, Camp­
bellsport; two daughters, Mrs. 
Alfred (Delores) Kohlmann of 
Route 1, Mount Calvary, and 
Mrs. Louis (Darlene) Krueger 
of Route 1, Campbellsport; 14 
grandchildren; and a brother 
Syl of Route 2, Campbellsport.

Also surviving are three 
sisters, Mrs. Irma Tank of

LOW PRESCRIPTION PRICES
• We Fill Prescriptions from ALL Physicians
• Free City Delivery

• Patient Profiles for Insurance and Tax Records
• Prompt Courteous Service
• OPEN Monday, Tuesday, Thursday, Friday, 1-6

• Generic Drug Program

Kewaskum Professional 
Pharmacy

1040 Fond du Lac Ave. Kewaskum PHONE 626-4222 

Upstairs — Sison Medical Clinic

SUPER DISCOUNT

A washable, scrubbable, beautiful collec­
tion of wallcoverings perfect for any decor, 

f lurry in while this offer lasts!

626-2164

on the Sanitas Prints

985 Fond du Lac

Waupun, Mrs. Art (Marge) 
Manthey of Campbellsport and 
Mrs. Ted (Frances) Rohlinger of 
Kewaskum. He was preceded in 
death by his wife on April 27, 
1975, and by a daughter, three 

•brothers and a sister.
Funeral services were held at 

10 a.m. Friday at Twohig 
Funeral Home, Campbellsport, 
and at 10:30 a.m. at St. Mar­
tin’s Church, Ashford. The Rev. 
George Etzel officiated and 
burial was in the parish 
cemetery.

Friends of Mr. Schrauth 
called after 3 p.m. Thursday at 
the funeral home.

MICHAEL HALL
Michael J. Hall, 100, of 237 

E. First St., Fond du Lac, died 
Tuesday morning, Nov. 24, at 
St. Agnes Hospital there.

He was born Nov. 6, 1881, in 
the Town of Ashford, a son of 
William and Mary Hess Hall. 
He married Evelyn Thelen on

Jan. 16, 1912, at St. Martin’s 
Church, Ashford, and she pre­
ceded him in death on June 16, 
1963.

Mr. Hall farmed in the Town 
of Ashford until moving to Fond 
du Lac in 1931. He was a 
member of St. Mary’s Catholic 
Church, Fond du Lac.

He is survived by one 
daughter, Ms. Elisabeth (Betty) 
Schmidt of Fond du Lac; one 
grandson and four great- 
grandsons. In addition to his 
wife, he was preceded in death 
by one son, one brother and two 
sisters.

Funeral services were held at 
10:30 a.m. Saturday at Twohig- 
Wimberger Funeral Home, 
Fond du Lac. The Rev. John 
Simon officiated and burial was 
in St. Martin’s Cemetery, Ash­
ford.

Visitation was from 4 to 9 
p.m. Friday at the funeral 
home.

AUDITIONS SET FOR
UWWC’S WEST SIDE STORY

The University of Wisconsin 
Center-Washington County an­
nounces auditions for WEST 
SIDE STORY December 7, 8, 9 
at 6:00 p.m. Everyone must be 
at the Theatre On The Hill at six 
o’clock. Come prepared to sing, 
dance and act. Rehearsals will 
start on January 6. They will 
run from 6:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m. 
Monday thru Thursday and 
some weekends. The show will 
be performed on March 17, 18, 
19, 20, 21, 25, 26, 27 and 28.

If you have any questions see 
Professor Barnhart or call 338- 
5222.

Scotch Pine

Wreaths
TAKING ORDERS FOR WREATHS NOW 

All Sizes Available

Open Daily 9:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m.

Bartoli's Greenhouse I
Located 4 miles North of Kewaskum 1 

on Highway “V” j
PHONE 533-4092 I

KHS Swing Choir to 

Entertain Jr. Women

The Kewaskum High School 
Swing Choir, under the di­
rection of Dave Bertelsen, will 
be featured at the next meeting 
of the Kewaskum Junior 
Woman’s Club, Thursday, De­
cember 10. This program, 
which begins at 8:00 p.m., will 
be followed by refreshments 
and a regular business meeting.

Club members who are 
participating in the cookie ex­
change should bring 25 half 
dozen packs of cookies. 
Members are also reminded to 
bring a craft or baked gift for 
exchange. Any young women of 
the area interested in sharing in 
the season’s holiday cheer are 
invited to attend. Please call 
626-8067 for more information 
or a ride.

Village 
Hair 

^ Stylists 
formerly Oiane s

Beauty Shop 

227 Main St. 
Kewaskum

Services Offered:
• Shampoo & sets
• Haircuts
• Permanent waving
• Hair coloring
• Men’s & Women’s

Hair styling
Open Daily 8 30 to 5:00

Evenings by Appointment!’ 
Walk-ins welcome.

PHONE 626-2616

Christmas
Trees

Balsam
White Pine



FOOD STORES

FRESH

1 Lb

BORDEN

•cf cw am
50z

Dean's REGULAR OR DIET ASSORTED FLAVORS

REGULAR. DRIP OR ELECTRIC PERK 2 Lb
Doz Folger's Coffee

FLORIDA INDIAN RIVER

12 0/
I Cans

WHOLE 
FRYERS

12 Or 
Can

6 50z
Can

FRENCH ONION 
OR SKINNY

1 Lb. 
Carton

12 17 0? 
Cans

Prices 
(*ood Thru 
Dec. 6, 1981

GOLDEN 
BANANAS

Crestwood Bakery 
Holiday Specials..

SENTRY

Brownie

Jolly Good 
Soda. . . .
CASE OF 24

IN OIL OR WATER SENTRY
Chunk 
Tuna.........................

Holiday Values In 
Frozen Foods!

JIFFY

Corn Muffin

MINUTE MAID

Frozen
Orange Juice

YELLOW OR WHITE SENTRY
Popcorn......................
FIRESIDE
Snack
Crackers ...................

From Our 
Dairy Dept..

Green Giant 
Vegetables................
SENTRY REAL

Chocolate Chips. . . .
WHITE OR YELLOW SENTRY

Facial Tissue.............

WITH SAUSAGE OR WITH 
HAMBURGER TOTINO'S FROZEN

Pizza...............

TURKEY 8 GRAVY, SALISBURY STEAK, 
TURKEY CROQUETTES OR MOSTACCIOLI

On Cor a a
Frozen Entrees ■ • ■

y WHITE 
GRAPEFRUIT

ARMOUR 

HOT 
DOGS

VANILLA, CHOCOLATE, BUTTERSCOTCH 
SWIRL, VANILLA STRAWBERRY SWIRL, 
VANILLA CHOCOLATE SWIRL, NEW YORK 
VANILLA OR CHOCOLATE MARSHMALLOW SWIRL 

Borien«~. & M^'

Shop Sentry All During The 
Holiday Season For The Finest In Quality!

ASSORTED FLAVORS 
SENTRY OR DEAN'S 

Cottage 
CheeseCREME FILLED

Chocolate o
Donuts . .^ (kJ

HOMOGENIZED 

MILK

r ICELANDIC

FROZEN 
HADDOCK

Fine Holiday 
Grocery Values!

REGULAR CUT GREEN BEANS, KITCHEN CUT 
GREEN BEANS, FRENCH STYLE GREEN BEANS, 
CREAM STYLE CORN, WHOLE KERNEL CORN. 
NIBLETS CORN OR SWEET PEAS

HILLSHIRE FARM
/REGULAROR BEEF

SMOKED &^ |
SAUSAGE
KIELBASA OR
POLISH
SAUSAGE ✓

K Cocktail 
©Buns . . .

Items Available 
Dec. I thru Dec. S. 1981

SENTRY

From Our 
Produce Shop...

IIOU» SALE
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Grand Opening of Shop-Rite Food Store

Left to right — Isabelle Muckerheide, Rita Etta and an unidentified 
lady were some of the first shoppers at the grand opening of the new 
Shop-Rite Food Store in the Kewaskum Mall Tuesday morning.

Mr. and Mrs. Ludwig Roecker.

Mrs. Clifford M. Rose in the foreground and Russ Oelhafen.

A view of the isle leading to the frozen food section.
Statesman Photos

The Pink Panther Is Pretty, 
But Not Too Smart...

Do You Really Know 
The COST of Fiberglass 
Batt Insulation??

Steve Liegl and children.

The time to relax is when you 
don't have time for it.

SINGER
WNfTE 
BERNINA
VIKING
NECCNI ELNA
PfAFF RICCAR
NEW HOME

New open orm
New zig-zag

$119 
169

large selection of new and 
REBUILT SEWING MACHINES 

starling at $29
JAEGER'S-KEWASKUM 
Hwy 45 - Phone 626 2611

THE SUPER MARKET 
OF AUTO REPAIRS 

Goeden Auto Body 
Complete Auto Body Repairs 

and Painting Professionally Done 
INSURANCE ESTIMATES AND REPAIRS 

OUR SPECIALTY 
Automotive - Tune-ups - Exhaust - Brakes 

Tires - Anti Freeze - Texaco Products 
ALL DONE TO YOUR SATISFACTION 

24 HOUR TOWING
Hwy, 28 E. of Kewaskum in St. Michaels

334-2759
TRY OUR PERSONALIZED SERVICE
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R-19
38 BAGS

s18000
38 BAGS

s27000
38 BAGS

s30000
26 6" ROLLS

s31225
288 BAGS

s1296

R-30
56 BAGS

$28000
56 BAGS

s36800
56 BAGS

s39800 s47520
396 BAGS

s1782

R-38 
_______

70 BAGS

s38500
70 BAGS

s50000
70 BAGS 

s54000
3812" ROLLS

s72960
576 BAGS

s2592

R-50
100 BAGS

s50000
100 BAGS

s65500
100 BAGS

s69500 s79500
684 BAGS

s3078
FIBERGLASS 4 ZONOLITE PRICES BASED ON 10/1141 Pl RCHASES. 

PRICES BASED ON 1200 SO FT.
PRICES DO NOT INCLUDE TAX OR BLOWER REN TAL

* WE DO NOT SELL ZONOLITE OR FIBERGLASS!!

STRIKE A BLOW FOR YOUR BUDGET!!
FREE Estimates even for the Do lt Yourselfer HUGE Savings Over Fiberglass Batt 
We Can Install Cellulose For LESS Than You Can Buy Fiberglass Batt Insulation!!

Where Is The U.L. Label and Check Caution On Fiberglass Batts-
CAUTION Insulation of fiberglass batts may cause temporary irritation Wear long sleeved, loose 
fitting clothing gloves and eye protection when handling and applying material Wash work clothes 
separately and rinse out washer A disposable mask designed for nuisance type duty is advisable when 
high dust levels are encounleted

All In Stock Light Fixtures Until Dec. 31,1981 EAO/ C 
For Every Room In Your Home-c.sh s carry.. OU /O Uli

Farmers Stray Voltage Problems?? We Can Help!!
• Residential • Industrial • Farming

Now, Is Thp Bps! Time To Call For Any Electrical Service''

KETTLE MORAINE ELECTRIC
1261 Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum, Wl-Phone 626-2093 

STORE HOURS Mon Thurs. 10 to 5; Fri. 10 to 8; Sat. 9 to 12.



' 25 Years Ago

December 7, 1956
After serving 22 years and 7

months as postmaster of Ke­
waskum, Frank Heppe has an­
nounced he will retire under 
optional retirement on Decem­
ber 21. This is the longest 
period of time any postmaster 
has served Kewaskum. He has 
been eligible for retirement 
since 1950. Appointed May 26, 
1934, Frank served under three 
presidents — Roosevelt, Tru­
man and Eisenhower. The 
Kewaskum post office advanced < 
from third to first class during 
his years of service.

A tax rate of $22.50 per 
$1,000 of assessed valuation had 
been adopted by the village 
board for 1956. This is an 
increase of $2.50 per thousand 
over the 1955 tax rate of $20.00 
per thousand. The big reason 
for the $2.50 increase is the 
school taxes which are $2.12 
higher than last year.

The three farms owned by 
Mrs. Otto Ramthun, Jr., in an 
near Kewaskum have been sold 
in recent transactions. The farm 
on which Mrs. Ramthun and 
family reside near the east 
village limits has been pur- t 
chased by her brother-in-law, 
Wilmer Ramthun of Route 1, 
Kewaskum. One other farm, 
located about a half mile east of 
the village on Hwy. 28, has 
been sold to Mr. and Mrs. 
Elwyn Ebert of Route 1, Ke­
waskum. Mrs. Ebert is a sister- 
in-law of Mrs. Ramthun. The 
third Ramthun farm located on 
Route 1, Kewaskum, about a 
mile north of the village, was

sold to Reuben Laubenstein of 
West Bend.

The 1956 corn yield results 
produced a new high for voca­
tional agricultural students 
projects at Kewaskum High 
School, it was announced this 
week by O. E. Behnke, voca­
tional agriculture instructor. 
Bob Becker, son of William 
Becker, Route 2, Kewaskum, 
was on top of a total of 65 yield 
test plots with an average yield 
of 131.4 bushels per acre.

A daughter was born to Mr. insurance. The congregation 
and Mrs. Daniel Rodenkirch,
Route 2, Kewaskum, November 
28, and a son was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Vincent Weier, Route 
2, Kewaskum, November 29.

50 Years Ago

December 4, 1931
Fire of unknown origin 

destroyed the Catholic Church, 
an old landmark at St. Bridgets, 
about three miles west of Ke­
waskum, last Friday afternoon. 
At noon, John Kuechler, jani­
tor, had been at the church to 
ring the Angelus, and saw no 
sign of fire. A half hour after he 
left, John Reinders, a nearby ! 
farmer and member of the '

congregation, noticed smoke 
pouring out of the building on 
top of the roof. Upon the arrival 
of the local fire department the ^ 
fire had already gained such | 
headway that hopes of saving | 
the building from total destruc- ’ 
tion were futile. In a little over ( 
an hour all that was left were 
the four stone walls; none of the 
interior furnishings could be 
saved. The loss is estimated 
between $25,000 and $30,000, 
which is partly covered by

was started in about the year 
1848, by a small group of 
families, and was one of the 
first to be organized in the 
county. The present church 40 x 
90 feet, was built of quary stone 
m 1868.

Philip Volm Sr., a well known 
resident of the Town of Kewas­
kum, died suddenly at his home 
on November 29. He was mar­
ried to the former Anna Vogel 
who together with the following 
children survive: Alvin, Philip 
Jr., Ewald, Amalia and Aloysi­
us. He was preceded in death 
by two children Charles and 
Marie.

A daughter was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Norbert Gatzke on 
November 29.

GOOD
NEWS

IRA's will be available soon at Valley Bank
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Marriage Licenses
75 Years Ago

December 1, 1906
The marriage of Louis Dorns 

of Kewaskum, and Miss Emma 
Krause, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Herman Krause of the 
Town of Barton, was solem­
nized at West Bend last Tues­
day.

Nic Theusch of St. Michaels ’ 
had a narrow escape from being 
pulled into a corn shredder last 
Thursday morning while 
working with a machine on 
Bruesser’s farm. His coat 
caught in the machinery and he 
had nearly all of his clothes torn 
from his body, but luckily he 
escaped with but slight injuries 
to his right arm. ,

On Tuesday occurred the , 
marriage of Christian Wis- 
kirchen, and Miss Emma Fel­
lenz, youngest daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Joseph Fellenz of St. 
Michaels.

A baby boy was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. William Rauch of St. 
Kilian last Saturday.

Bruce Allan Boettcher, Ke­
waskum, and Tracine Lee 
Fellenz, Kewaskum; wedding 
Nov. 28.

John M. Narducci, Kewas­
kum, and Sherry Lynne Wil­
liams, Kewaskum; no wedding 
date set.

If you're the lucky owner 
of a cast iron pot or dutch 
oven, don't throw it out. . . 
use it! The available iron 
in food can increase up to 
400 percent when iron cook­
ware is used. Cleaning it will 
be good exercise as well.

DUNDEE 
Sand & Gravel 
G. Ramthun Ph. 533-4549 
Washed Sand, Crushed 

Gravel, Stone and 
Lime Chips 
Also Gravel 

and Sand Fill.
FOR THE BEST OF . 

CONCRETE MATERIALS

That’s right! As of January 1st, 1982, IRA’s are coining to Valley 
Bank. Where else can you provide for the future and defer your taxes 
at the same time, PLUS receive the STRONG, HELPFUL, and 
FRIENDLY service that the Valley Banks provide?

ONLY AT VALLEY BANK. THAT’S WHERE

BULOVA
Come in today and see 
the brand new Bulova 
Quartz watches. 
Accurate, virtually 
maintenance-free and 
superbly styled. Quartz 
technology perfected 
by Bulova. Masters of 
dependable time for 
over 100 years.

BIER’S 
JEWELRY

129 Main St.
626-2777

IT'S BULOVA WATCH TIME

KEWASKUM ALLENTON
MIMMO IOC ANO VALID •ANCO»OOA1lON

STRONG, HELPFUL FRIENDLY 
VALLEY BANK

Don’t forget to ask about our TAX FREE INTEREST 
on our All Savers Certificate.



Cub Scout Cake Decorating Contest Held Page 8, Kewaskum Statesman, Friday, Dec. 4, 1981

Cub Scout Pack 3744 held 
their cake decorating contest on 
Saturday, October 31. The boys 
decorated prebaked and frosted 
cakes. The ideas for decorating 
the cakes varied from haunted 
houses to cub scouts, and from 
drums to Brewers.

The creations were judged by 
Betty Fleury, Theresa Stoffel 
and Arnie Stommel. A special 
thanks to these people for their 
time.

Stommel also gave a dem­
onstration on cake decorating. 
He donated his “T-Shirt” cake, 
decorated with the Universal 
Scout Emblem, for the auction.

Winners of the contest were 
8-year-old Kevin Ramthun; 9- 
year-old Eric Giese and 10-year- 
old Doug Geidel. All the boys 
did a great job and it was a close 
contest. They all deserve a pat 
on the back for a job well done.

James Wilhelmi and Glenn Kirst hard at work.
L. to R. Jeff Kissinger, Michael Kocher and Curtis Ammel 
working on their original cake decorating ideas.

The November pack meeting 
was held Monday, November 23 
at 7:00 p.m. at the Kewaskum 
Middle School. Den 2 had the 
opening and closing flag 
ceremony. Den 1 gave a skit on 
fire safety. Mess kits and 
canteens were handed out to the 
new boys.

Badges were awarded as 
follows: Bobcat - James Gilder­
sleeve and Steve Liegl Jr. j Wolf 
- Michael Kocher; Bear - James 
Kudek along with one gold and 
one silver arrow; Webelos - 
Doug Geidel, Charlie Walls, 
Donnie Nelson and James 
Kudek received their Forester 
Activity Badge.

Mr. Gildersleeve showed 
slides taken at the September 
campout and Mauthe Lake hike. 
There were also slides from our 
recent roller skating party.

Our next pack meeting will be 
Monday, December 21. This 
will be our annual Christmas

Kim Marx and Kevin Ramthun concentrating on the details.
The judges, Therese Stoffel, Betty Fleury and Arnie 
Stommel, had a tough decision to make.

party. Gifts will be exchanged 
and treats enjoyed.

WOW TRI COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU
Kewaskum Legion Hall 

1538 Fond du Lac Avenue 
Kewaskum Site Director

Dolores Kleinke 626-2420
Monday, Dec. 7 — Swedish 

meat balls, whipped potatoes & 
gravy, buttered spinach, French 
bread, strawberry sundae, milk 
& coffee.

Tuesday, Dec. 8 — Braised 
turkey thighs, rice, buttered 
mixed vegetables, salad with 
1000 Isle dressing, dinner rolls, 
fresh orange, milk & coffee.

Thursday, Dec. 10 — Pine­
applejuice, escalloped ham and 
potatoes, whole beets, whole 
wheat bread, apple pie, milk & 
coffee.

Coming Events - Christmas 
Party, Monday, Dec. 21.

Douglas Geidel, James Gildersleeve and Craig Kulas. 
[Craigs frosting looks good].

The dictionary is the only 
place where success comes 
before work.

ELECTROLUX 
KIRBY 
HOOVER 
EUREKA 
ROYAL
Electric Brooms 
Hand Vacuums 
Upright 
Tonks, Canetea 
REBUILT UNIB 
START AT SIB

Jaeger’s kewaskum
Hwy 45 626-2611

^ Craft & Bake Sale
® SAT., DEC. 5
' Peace Church — Kewaskum

Crafts Sold — 2 to 4 p.m.
Dessert & Coffee — 2 to 4 p.m.

Bake Sale — 3 p.m.
FEATURING GIFT ITEMS 

FROM FOREIGN COUNTRIES
Sponsored by Women's Guild
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James Gildersleeve, Kim Marx, Ryan Ramthun and Craig 
Kulas.

The decision of the judges: 8-year-old Kevin Ramthun, 
9-year-old Eric Giese and 10-year-old Douglas Geidel.

— OTHER WINNERS —

Michael Kocher, Brian Dobke, Brett Rauch, Brian Leitheiser 
and James Wilhelmi.

Little Whistler

Homemakers Meet
The Little Whistlers met at 

the home of Debbie Backhaus 
on Tuesday evening, November 
17, for their November meeting.

Members who attended the 
state convention at LaCrosse 
and Fall Council at Kewaskum, 
gave a short report and sum­
mary of each. The club is proud 
to announce that one of their 
members, Pat Hafermann, has 
been elected as Kewaskum’s 
center chairman. Congratula­
tions Pat!

An election for president and 
secretary was held and the 
results will be announced at the 
Christmas Party which will be 
held at Dick’s Pizzaria, West 
Bend, on December 11.

The project of the month on 
physical fitness included a 
demonstration by Sheri Lynn, of 
Sheri Lynn School of Dance and 
three of her Sherifa dancers. 
Sheri discussed the benefits of 
the Belidi Dance and Arobics, 
as they pertain to physical 
fitness. She was very infor­
mative and enjoyed by all.

Following the project, the 
annual auction was held. Many 
beautiful and delicious items 
were brought to be included in 
the sale. This is the club’s fund 
raiser for the year.

The evening came to a close 
with the exchanging of names 
for secret pals for the upcoming 
year.

Lois Thull 
Vice-President

Curtis Ammel, Jeff Kissinger, Glenn Kirst and Phillip 
Lettow.

^

List Drop Off Points
For ‘Toys for Tots’ Here

The Toys for Tots program is 
an annual toy-collecting drive 
spearheaded by Marine reserv­
ists located in more than 180 
cities throughout the United 
States. The toys are given to 
less fortunate children in Wash­
ington County at Christmas 
time. Were it not for this 
program, these children would 
have a pretty bleak Christmas. .

Local businesses and organi­
zations joining the Washington 
County Marines in the cam­
paign are: American Legion, 
Jaycees and others.

Marines have placed collec­
tion barrels throughout the 
village. Drop off points in 
Kewaskum are Minz, A & W, 
Valley Bank, West Bend 
Savings & Loan - Kewaskum 
Office, Rosenheimer’s, Sentry 
and American Legion Club­
house. They look forward to 
your donations of new, un­
wrapped toys for the drive.

Donations will be accepted 
until December 14.

For further information 
contact 626-4149 or 626-2910. 
VWWWWWMMARAAMW

Geri’s
[ BEAUTY SALON ]

114 Main Street
Featuring

; Family Hair Styling
In Savings & Loan Bldg. j 

i |Rear Entrance)
1 PHONE 626-4455

! You Are Always Welcome at

. The Amber Hotel
139 West Main St. Campbellsport

PHONE 533-8816 
k Serving Noon Luncheons Daily 11:00 to 2:00

Dinners at 4:00 p.m.; Serving Saturdays at 4:00 
and Serving Sundays from 12:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m.

; — WE WILL BE CLOSED —
For Private Christmas Parties

I
 Dec. 8 and Dec. 19 — Evenings Only

DAILY SPECIALS
Monday - Tenderloin Tips and Noodles 
Tues. Night - Prime Rib Plate 

j Wed. Night - Barbecued Ribs 
- Thursday - French Fried Lobster Chunks 

and Prime Rib Plate 
b Friday - Fish Fry w/Haddock or Lake 

Perch, Also Poorman’s Lobster
Saturday - Barbecued Ribs and Prime Rib 

u Sunday - Roast Chicken/Dressing

Now Serving

PRIME RIB
On Thursday, Saturday and Sunday

RESERVATIONS ACCEPTED 
everyday except Friday evenings 

CALL 533-8816
" Banquets Accepted

Your Hosts. . . Dale and Lois

Not Everyone Was As Lucky 
As “Side Pork” In Bagging 

The Elusive Buck...

But, Everybody Can Be Lucky At The 
Boar’s Nest!! Redeem Your Unused 
1981 Deer Tag For A Drink Of Your 

Choice Anytime Before Jan. 1st, 1982!!

Get Ready For Coming Events ... Watch 
For The December Issue Of The Buyers & 

Sellers Advertising Guide, Dec. 8th, 19811!

BOAR’S NEST
Scenic Hwy. 45 & Sunset Drive!!

Phone 533-8822 For Reservations’!
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Roll for First Quarter Announced

Scott Buchel

The Kewaskum Community Anthony Ruplinger
High School Honor Roll for the 
first quarter of the 1981-82

Yvonne Ruplinger 
Bradley Schmidt 
Nancy Schulz

school year is as follows: Shelly Sekas
Doreen SeseHonor Roll - 3.001 to 4.000 Robert Sieger

♦• 4.000 Patricia Smucker
♦ 3.500 or above Bonnie Spaeth

Cindy Staehler *
SENIORS Jacquelyn Stoffel •

Kevin Ader
SMven Straub 
Pamela Stray •

Debra Allmann Carole Swenson *
Gall Backhaus Tami Timblin
Marjean Backhaus Ernest Verhunce
Sue Bade Christine Voigt •
Ken Bauer Jean Weinand
Pamela Beesten Dale Wodsedalek
Laura Belsbler Jill Yearling • *
Kevin Belger Jennifer Zemlicka • •
Joann Blum 
Bruce Brendemlhl

Sheryl Zimdars •

JUNIORS
Kevin Chesak 
Tracey Coulter 
David Czoschke 
Jon Davis 
Jane Degnitz 
Julie Dettmann 
Monica Dieringer 
JoAnn Dreher 
Cynthia Flasch 
LuAnn Flom 
Brenda Fuller 
Randy Gau 
Jeffrey Geidel 
David Goeden 
Donald Goeden 
Carla Guenthner 
Matthew Hanrahan 
William Heberer 
Jane Herriges 
Dawn Hlavaty 
Kim Katzenberger 
Gary Kempf 
Sandra Kirchner 
Karl Klrmse 
Melissa Koch 
Duane Krahn 
Kim Krajenka 
Karen Kudek 
Colleen Kumrow 
Debra Kurth 
Karolyn Kutz 
Jayne Laatsch 
Melinda Lamp 
Brian Larsen 
Julie Larson 
Mark Larson 
Julie Lauters 
Carol Lehmann 
Richard Leitheiser 
Gina Luedtke

• a

*

•

• a

• a
•

a a
a

a 
a

a
•

Anthony Alsberg 
Denise Anderson 
Paul Anderson 
Jackie Bartelt 
Robert Beck 
Jacqueline Beisbier 
Joan Beisbier 
Cory Beyer 
Shelley Bieniek 
Donald Bottleman 
Mark Brenholt 
Cheryl Burkhalter 
Daniel Butzke 
Brian Crass 
Jill Darmody 
Lynn Dreher 
Heidi Edgar 
Rachell Ellefson 
Heide Flasch 
Erika Follmann 
Nadine Gau 
Sherry Gavin 
Lynn Geldreich 
Daniel Gerhartz 
Dawn Hammes 
Brenda Harter 
Jandelyn Hazlewood 
Pamela Heberer 
Debbie Hintze 
Lori Hoch
Pamela Hoepner 
Mary Jo Hupfer 
Cheryl Jaeger 
Annette Jandre 
David Jones 
Brenda Kempf 
Deborah Kertscher 
Jaculin Klrmse 
Andrew Kougl 
David Kudek 
Marea Kuphal 
Linda Larsen 
Dean Larson 
Lori Lloyd 
Jacky Loof 
Lori Luebke 
Annette Luedtke 
Trisha Mayer 
Connie Nigh 
Joy Pamperin 
Mary Paul
Valerie Plaum 

. Curtis Prescott
Daniel Prunty 
Kathy Reader 
Mark Rodenkirch 
Regina Ruplinger 
LuAnn Schickert 
Catherine Schlice 
Heidi Schlieter

Laura Martin 
Barbara Matenaer 
Mary McKee 
Jeanne Melzer 
Donna Menzel 
Patrick Miller 
Jackie Mueller 
Jenny Mueller 
Julie Neitzel 
Amy Nigh 
Scott Nigh 
Laura Pamperin 
Kathy Pesch 
Darla Prost 
Diann Prunty 
Vicki Reif
Michele Rodenklrch 
Dori Rogne 
Andy Rosenberger 
Craig Rosenthal

a

a a
a

Sunday, Dec. 6-8-12

White J»ie
. FREE BEER 7-8

HITCHING POST
Kohlsville

Donald Herriges 
Heating

Furnace Cleaning • Boiler Repairs

Heating Specialist

604 Mill Road, Route 1 

Kewaskum — Ph. 626*2388

Carol Schmidt 
Jan Schmidt 
Jeff Schmidt 
Mary Schmidt 
Renee Schneider 
Michael Schulz 
Patrice Seefeldt 
Brenda Serwe 
Colleen Shaw 
Brian Skrentny 
Cheryl Spaeth 
Rick Standish 
Laurie Steiner 
Mary Straub 
Shelly Strobel 
Kevin Thull 
Amy Vetter 
Karen Volm 
Joan Wanke 
Brenda Weisser 
Gretchen Wenzel 
Karl Zarllng

SOPHOMORES
Vince Aman 
Brian Arndt 
Anne Baron 
Debra Becker 
Jody Bieniek 
James Braun 
Dennfs Butz 
Glenn Classey 
Gregg Classey 
Bradley Dieringer 
Denise Donnick 
Jeff Elsenmann 
Amy Grahl 
Denise Gruber 
James Hanrahan 
Christopher Harlow 
Richard Heberer 
Kenneth Heisdorf 
Theresa Heller 
Donna Hlavaty 
Tracy Howell 
Stephen Hubbell 
Jama Jacak 
Doreen Jacobs 
Barbara Jandre 
Joan Jung 
Holly Kempf 
Peggy Kempf
Michael Kirchner 
Brian Kober 
Julie Koepke 
Pamela Krahn 
Robin Krahn 
Brian Kumrow 
Steven Kuphal 
Susan Lemke 
Jennifer Lightner 
Nancy McChaln 
Elizabeth McCurdy 
Danny Menzel 
Douglas Miller 
Daniel Mueller 
Diane Mueller 
Sandra Nigh 
Jim Nordquist 
David Pesch 
Rose Ann Peterson 
Sharon Phillips 
Chris Picard 
Kelly Prescott 
Mary Reader 
Paul Reilly 
Jeffrey Scannell

Randall Igel 
David Jandre 
Kimberly Johnson 
Troy Kuphal 
Sharon Land 
Debra Lavey 
Paul McFadden 
John Mertzlg 
Denise Meyer 
Janet Mueller 
Mark Muench 
Michelle Paul 
Mark Rosenthal 
Brian Ruplinger 
Julie Sauter 
Sandra Secor 
Monty Shaw 
Rick Steiner 
Michael Steinhardt 
Melissa Verhunce 
Michael Vetter 
Pamela Weisser 
Richard Wesenberg 
Jeffrey Wiedmeyer 
Brenda Witz 
David Zettler

Suzanne Schmitt 
Leean Schneider 
Amy Sekas 
Mary Sieger 
Tammie Soik 
Sharon Spaeth 
Jeffrey Squier 
Debbie Staehler 
Beth Strigenz 
Janel Struebing 
Chris Ven Haus 
Kirkland Vogt 
Donna Vorpahl 
John Weiss 
Michael Wiedmeyer 
Wendy Wilson

FRESHMEN

Mona Anderson 
Lori Batzler 
Michelle Beesten 
Daniel Bingen 
Tracy Buchel 
Gary Butzlaff 
Amber Charland 
Connie Coulter 
Jessie Dienberg 
Christopher Dieringer 
Jon Etta 
Chris Frantzen 
Michael Geldreich 
John Gundrum 
Edward Ham 
John Harju 
Kristine Heberer 
Glen Hupfer

STAPLE

SAVE OVER 
\wy

health 
TIP

985 Fond du Lac Ave.
626-2164

ROGER STREAN 
aggregates

• WASHED SAND A STONE
• CRUSHED ROCK
• ROAD GRAVEL
•LIME CHIPS

Pick-up or Delivery

Happy Hollow Road
Off Hwy. 45 — Waucousta . 

533-8207 or 533 4259 
___;________ - -___

from Tom
Leitzke, R.P.H

626-4947

Timblin Solar
• Free estimates ind 

Energy Audit
• 64% Total Rebate

SEE OUR DISPLAY MODEL 
AT 1117 EDGEWOOD DR.

CITRUS FRUITS
Citrus fruits are well »i 

known as great sources of 
vitamin C, but when eating 
them, don’t eat the skins, J 
Oranges, lemons, grapefruit, 
etc. are sprayed with pesti­
cides and chemicals on the 
trees. It is difficult to remove 
these chemicals even with 
thorough washing. So, enjoy 
the fruit and juice, but avoid 
the peels.

to KEfinEUV 
nr PHAnmacv 

102 Mm SI KMMM UM001

Flea Market 1
Sunday, Dec. 6

* NONN’S RESORT
Hwy. 45 North to Hwy. F, East 3 Miles T

First Sunday of Each Month
10:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. 

PHONE 1-668-6566 FOR RESERVATIONS J
BS»63»»«3»3CX»KXXX3O£XX»»X3CX»O^^

WallTex.,

CLEANING SERVICE 
Professional Deep Steam* Extraction 
No Soap Residue, Fast Drying 

Safe & Gentle for all fibers 
Ask about our
Carpet Protection Treatment
FtiEE ESTIMATES
RESIDENTIAL - COMMERCIAL 
CALE ANYTIME 
3384)783

SUE
3O%off*
on all Patterns from 

Wall Tex Collections

Syl s ^H^ &Uphotetery denning Service
985 Fond du Lac Ave.

626 2164



WASHINGTON COUNTY’S 
SOLID WASTE DILEMMA

[Final Article in a Series]
By Dan A. Wilson, Horticulture/Resource Agent

RECYCLING SOLID WASTE
We have become a very 

wasteful society. Washington 
County residents generate 
approximately 1,000 pounds of 
waste per person each year!

Included in this figure is 
commercial and industrial solid 
waste which we don’t personal­
ly throw out, but as consumers 
of disposable products we are 
responsible for the waste 
generated.

Actually, we produce more 
than three pounds of waste per 
person each day but some waste 
is reused or recycled. However, 
the quantity of waste going into 
landfills could be greatly re­
duced if more effort went into 
recycling the valuable portions 
of waste.

It seems that there is no 
“best” way to recycle. Most 
federal, state and some county 
activity has generally been 
directed toward large facilities 
that separate waste mechanical­
ly. In contrast, smaller com­
munities have been encouraged 
to develop a source separation 
(separation of waste at home)
system. Source separation is 
often the least expensive and 
best since in general, the more 
complex systems have been less 
successful.

Source separation would re­
quire the person who generates 
the waste to be responsible for 
sorting recyclable material. 
When accumulated in large

[ APPLES 1 
r at the (

Hwy. 28 Bridge [
J in Kewaskum j

Every Saturday (
j 9:30 - Noon 5

Spartan, Secor, 
1 McIntosh, Cortland, Snows r 

Delicious, Macoun 
Fresh Cider

I CHERRY HILL
[ FRUITFARM
J Batavia I
| Open Daily 9:30 - 4:30
J WILLIS LIEPERT 994-4925 ) 
^ »^-« fcXtK^OXU^U XHX ItX'U^O^ •-^4

Driving 
less?

Find out if you qualify 
for our special rates for 
low mileage drivers. Call 
and compare today!

We’re driving down 
the cost of

Richard C 
Gust

156 N. MAIN 
WEST BEND 

Of. Ph. 338-1313 
Res. Ph. 533-8454

AMERICANFAMILY 
^■AKKiikJMdMMUB^B^H ft 
AUTO HOME BUSINESS HEALTH LIFE

American Family Mutual Insurance Co 
Madison, Wis.

enough quantities, paper, card­
board, aluminum, glass, tin and 
other recyclables can be sold to 
industry for reuse.

Even now, without required 
source separation, waste can be 
sorted and conveniently re­
cycled. By reducing the amount 
of solid waste disposed of in 
landfills, the expected life of 
existing and/or any new land­
fills can be greatly increased.

Here’s a short list of nearby 
centers where you can recycle 
the portion of your waste which

OF KEWASKUM 
frimrHriiiiJtmiiHTiBiMiiiii 11 mirnrf

And she's got to get out of that nice comfy bed 
to answer it. Too bad! If she had an extension phone in 
the bedroom, she not only wouldn't have to get out of 
bed, she wouldn't even have to open her eyes.

If it always seems that the phone is ringing in a 
room you're not in, maybe you should be thinking 
about adding extensions. General Telephone 
offers them in a wide range of styles and colors. And

each and every phone is backed by all our years of 
experience.

Extension phones are a convenience you deserve 
and they're not expensive. Just a few dollars per month 
and think of all the I eg work they'll save you. No rush­
ing. No running. No jumping out of bed.

You can't be two places at once. But your 
phone can.

GTE EXTENSION PHONES

Her phone is ringing. 
Unfortunately it’s ringing in the kitchen.

can be recovered:
Lynn’s Waste Paper 

Company, Inc., 121 Island St., 
West Bend - receives most 
recyclables.

Municipal Garage, 251 
Municipal Drive, West Bend - 
receives oil between 7:00 and 
3:00 Monday thru Friday.

Kewaskum Lions Club picks 
up paper from curbs in Kewas­
kum the 3rd Saturday of every 
month.

Kewaskum Junior Woman’s 
Club - receives most recyclables 
on 3rd Saturday of every month 
from 9:00 - 12:00 noon, located 
approximately 3 blocks north of 
stoplight on Hwy 45 in Kewas­
kum.

Germantown Women’s Club - 
receives most recyclables, lo­
cated in Washington Square 
Shopping Center, every 3rd 
Saturday from 9:00 - 1:00.
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Holiday Hotline

The Holiday Season is one of 
the most lonely times of the 
year. Especially affected are the 
elderly, the poor, young 
singles, the widowed and 
divorced.

The Underground Switch­
board is here to meet those 
needs. Switchboard is a 24

r
xjjijjujaiijja^ixiiJ^ixiiM^i^J'iii^iu

Christmas Store Hours 
s5 BEGINNING MONDAY, DECEMBER? t

3 t
Monday - Thursday — 8:00 to 8:00

I Friday — 8:00 to 9:00 {

* Saturday — 8:00 to 4:00 |

! FREE GIFT WRAPPING!’ t
; Closing at 4 p.m. Christmas Eve E

: STEINER'S

hour, 7 day a week crisis 
intervention hotline. The 
volunteers will be available all 
through the Holiday Season to 
help with any concerns that the 
community may have.

The Holiday Hotline Number 
is: 271-3123.

Anything scarce is valuable; 
praise, for example.

. W.\ . Z* »' ’ » t » ft t f » ) J > i )' i' ^»
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Letters to the Editor
To the Editor
Kewaskum Statesman:

The old adage that history 
tends to repeat itself proved 
quite true at the November 30th 
meeting of the Kewaskum 
School Board that dealt with 
proposed budget cuts for 1982- 

* 1983.
When I left at midnight, I had 

the feeling that I had been 
watching a summer rerun on 
television. Just as it was last 
year, two board members quite 
consistently either offered or 
voted for budget cuts, while the 
other members, a lot like the 
proverbial ostrich that chooses 
to bury its head in the sand so 
that he can’t see danger 
coming, apparently could not 
see any compelling reasons for 
making substantive reductions 
in the budget.

When the 1981-1982 budget 
was discussed, economic con­
ditions dictated the need for 
budget cuts to at least hold the 
line on property taxes. Evident­
ly these members could not see 
the need. Now that we are 
looking at the 1982-1983 
budget, economic conditions 
have not improved since last 
year and, in fact, threaten to 
become even worse.

If this is not a compelling 
reason in itself to make sub­
stantive reductions in the 
budget, the “ostriches” should 
take their heads out the sand 
and acknowledge that the 
federal budget cuts that were 
enacted are going to greatly 
reduce federal grants to state 
and local governments. These 
grants represent only 14.2% of 
the federal budget, but they 
were the target of a full one 
third of the budget cuts. Funds 

' for these grants have been 
slashed by 14% for fiscal 1982- 
25% after inflation - and, if the 
Administration had its way, 
they would be further reduced 
by another 12%.

Even excluding this 12%, by 
1983 revenue dependency on 
Washington will have dropped a 
whopping 28% from its peak in 
1978. Localities will be forced to 
pick up this slack and a good 
portion of this will be in the 
form of increased property 
taxes. Therefore, we taxpayers 
are faced with a double threat; 
that of our reduced ability to 
pay property taxes because of 
the economic conditions we are 
in and also the very real threat 
of these property taxes sky­
rocketing.

To the two members that by 
their votes show their concern 
for these facts; thank you and 
keep up the good work! To the

other members that appear, by 
their votes, to be unconcerned 
by these facts; please re­
examine your positions. It is 
still not too late to make the 
necessary budget reduction that 
these times and conditions 
dictate.

Ralph Horner
o o o o o

Letter to the Editor:
I am very disappointed at the 

school board.
By reading the papers, it 

seems that most of the business 
is conducted in secret sessions, 
both before and after the 
regular meeting.

Then they come out of secret 
session and everything is cook­
ed and dried, and there is no 
discussion at the open session.

Why does Mr. Tessar want 
everything so hidden from the 
public—the Taxpayer?

Several months ago the tax­
payer had to wait til almost 10 
p.m. before the regular meeting 
was held. That’s a poor time to 
hold a public meeting. Many 
left and went home in disgust.

We are told in the news that 
Mr. Brenholt received a 2 year 
extension on his contract. What 
was the big rush? When he 
already had 1 ‘/a years to go on 
his present contract?

Also I did not hear the 
financial consideration of his 
new contract. As far as that 
goes what is his total salary, 
including fringe benefits on the 
last year of his old contract?

I understand they are not 
going to tell the taxpayers, 
which board members suggest­
ed which cuts, that were pre­

“SPECIAL”
1977 AMC GREMLIN 

2-dr., 6 cyl., 3 speed, manual transmission 

VERY CLEAN 

11OM.(K 
CHEVROLET, INC. 

"4 Dealer You Can Trust" 
Hwy. 45 Kewaskum 

PHONE 626-2161

sented in secret at the last 
meeting.

Mr. Tessar says that the last 
time this was done people were 
upset, because some members 
suggested too many cuts, and 
one (Mr. Tessar) suggested 
none.

I certainly did not hear any 
taxpayer object to too many 
cuts. But I did hear them object 
to his “no cut” stance.

Finally, as one letter to the 
editor stated, “Get off the backs 
of Beechwood and Mr. Esser.”

The public can see that these 
two items are only to distract 
the public from the need for 
legitimate cuts.

Do not think you can “bam­
boozle” the public* We turned 
out the vote in the last election 
and we will do it again!

Signed,
Aroused and Alert 
Taxpayer and Grandparent 

o o o o o

2011 Woodlawn Ave., 
West Bend, WI 53095 
Nov. 25, 1981

Editor
Statesman,
250 Main St.,
Kewaskum, Wis. 53040

In California “a teen-ager 
allegedly bragged about killing 
his 14-year-old former girl­
friend and showed off her 
corpse to more than a dozen 
high school classmates,” 
according to the November 25 
issue of the Milwaukee Sen­
tinel. The body was clad only in 
a tank top and white socks.

His friends showed no re­
morse, threw rocks at her body, 
and did not report the murder to 
police, according to the news­
paper.

A sheriff’s sergeant, who 
worked on the case, said he

“had never seen a group of 
people act so callous about 
death in my 15 years of police 
work. What the hell has hap- 
pended to these kids?”

According to psychiatrists, 
doctors, police, prosecutors and 
judges the flood of pornography 
in the last 20 years is at least 
one contributing cause of anti­
social attitudes and conduct 
among impressionable youth.

Pornography shows no con­
cern for human life, true love, 
compassion or responsibility. It 
depicts girls and women as 
nothing more than sex ma­
chines or objects, to be used by 
any male at any time and any 
place. Pictures and stories tell 
of many kinds of sexual vio­
lence, ranging from sadism to 
rape and even murder. Police 
records and court cases testify 
that sexual assaults and 
murders have been incited by 
modern pornography.

Promiscuous sexual attitudes 
and conduct are portrayed to 
our young people every day by 
way of television, movies, rock 
music, obscene books and 
magazines and chauvenistic 
peers. Yet, we adults ignore it 
all and hope against hope that 
our children won’t be in­
fluenced.

We try to keep the kids out of 
trouble with entertainment and 
other activities, but the sex 
crimes and moral corruption 
continue to increase. Every 
family is being victimized to 
some extent — in one way or 
another — indirectly if not 
directly.

There is a crying need for the

enactment and enforcement of 
tough obscenity laws. Can we 
expect sex crimes and moral 
corruption to cease if we don’t 
ask local officials and our Wis­
consin legislators to ban 
obscene material in porno out­
lets — to ban displays of 
obscene magazines to minors in 
the stores where we shop — to 
ban the obscenities on conven­
tional television and cable-
vision?

As Henry Burke said: “All 
that is required for the triumph 
of evil is that good men (and 
women) do nothing.”

WHAT ARE YOU DOING 
ABOUT IT?

R. Charles Weier

Roger & Dan’s
Auto Service, Inc.

good/Zem

Multi-Mile 
Tires

HERRIGESOIL 
INC.

PHONE 626-2244 
1245 Fond du Lac Ave.

Kewaskum

POLYESTER

RADIAL G/T
70 SERIES

PERENNIAL
H 
(4 
oj

Pi J
AMERICA’S YEAR 'ROUND 
BELTED RADIAL.

P185/80R-13 5Q.95 1.92
P195/75R-14 54.09 2.23
P205/75R-14 55.77 2.34
P215/75R-14 58.36 2.49
P205/75R-15 57.63 2.46
P215/75R-15 ’ 60.49 2.62
P225/75R-15 • 62.39 2.79
P235/75R-15 66.11 2.95

All Tires Include 
Mounting & Balancing

STOP IN AND SEE 
OUR SERVICE DEPT. 
FOR QUALITY BRAKE, 
SHOCK,EXHAUST AND 
TUNE-UP WORK.

4 WHEEL RVT

Check Our Prices 
and Compare Road 
Hazard Warranty

891 Fond du Lac Ave. 
KEWASKUM 

626-2888
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Board Meeting

Mid-Monthly Meeting 
November 16, 1981 
8:00 P.M.

The Village Board of Kewas­
kum, Washington County, Wis­
consin, met in mid-monthly 
session in the Council Room of 
the Municipal Building, 204 
First Street.

President Gerald Stollenwerk 
presided. Trustee Herriges had 
asked to be excused and was 
absent. All other Trustee Mem­
bers were present.

The minutes of the meeting of 
November 2, 1981, were ap­
proved as printed upon motion 
by Trustee D. Nigh, seconded 
by Trustee P. Blumer. Voice 
vote was unanimous.

James D. Reigle, Charles Ogi 
and William Nelson of Nelson 
and Associates presented to the 
Board preliminary plans for a 
207 unit housing development 
on land owned by Reigle and 
Ogi west of Bel-Ric Acres and 
south of Highway “H” West 
(80 acres).

RESOLUTION NO. 81-9
RESOLVED, by the Village 

Board that wards in the VIL­
LAGE of KEWASKUM shall be 
combined as follows:

Wards 1, 2, and 3
FURTHER RESOLVED, that 

the combined wards shall use 
common ballot boxes and bal­
lots and that separate returns 
shall not be maintained for the 
combined wards at any election, 
but separate ballot boxes and 
ballots shall be maintained for

LENNOX
Heating Systems 
Sales & Service 

from the
Comfort Specialists
JOHANN, INC.

Plumbing • Heating
Air Conditioning

2450 Hwy. 28 E., Kewaskum
Phone 334-9481

J&J AUTO 
TOPICS

WEIGHTED TRUNKS
We’ve seen rear auto 

trunks loaded with cement 
blocks for improved traction 
on ice and snow. This does 
improve traction on rear 
wheels but it is offset by poor 
steering control. It reduces 

, the value of your shock 
absorbers, too. It can be 
dangerous causing skids 
during turns. Your car is 
designed so the appropriate 
weight on each wheel gives 
you the safest and most 
efficient balance.

And when you drive in at J 
& J AUTO SERVICE at 450 
E. Main, you will notice the 
appropriate electronic gear 
for turning engines, equip­
ment for brake service and 
the other tools for servicing 
all American cars and most 
foreign ones. Drive over 
today or phone for an ap­
pointment. You’ll like the 
way we treat your car.

PHONE 626-2311

each separate ballot required 
under Section 5.58 to 5.64.

Dated this 16th day of No­
vember, 1981.
Introduced by Trustee Jeffery 
Rohrer
Motion for adoption by Trustee 
Paul Blumer
Motion for adoption seconded 
by Trustee Richard Schmidt 
Roll call vote - 6 “Aye”, 0 
“Nay”

Trustee J. Rohrer, Chairman 
of the Recreation Committee, 
reported that a winter recrea­
tion program had been de­
veloped and that the cost for the 
use of the facilities at the school 
would be shared on a 5-50 basis 
with the School District and the 
village. Trustee Rohrer also 
reported that the contemplated 
added improvements to the 
Kiwanis Park in 1982 was 
estimated at $8,056.00.

Administrator Schmidt re­
viewed with the Board the 
proposed budget for 1982. The 
public hearing on the budget 
was scheduled for 8:00 p.m. on 
December 7, 1981, upon motion 
by Trustee D. Mlodzik, second-

charges ’til season of use, or 13.9% annual 
percentage rate financing for two years. It’s 
your choice. See us now for all the details.

ed by Trustee D. Nigh. Voice 
vote was unanimous.

The Board authorized the 
transfer of $10,000.00 from the 
restricted fund savings account 
to the Fire Department Outlay 
Account in order to provide 
sufficient funds to cover the cost 
of the new Fire Department 
truck chassis. Motion by 
Trustee R. Schmidt, seconded 
by Trustee D. Mlodzik. Roll call 
vote was unanimous.

The Board reviewed a pre­
liminary plan for the possible 
repair and remodeling of the 
Municipal Building. No action 
was taken.

Motion was made by Trustee 
D. Nigh and seconded by 
Trustee J. Rohrer that the 
Board adjourn to closed session 
under (’hapter 19.85 (1) (e) of 
the Statutes to discuss em­
ployee compensation and per­
formance data of village em­
ployees over which the govern­
mental body has jurisdiction. 
Roll call vote was unanimous.

William S. Martin, 
Commissioner

PRICE
ROLLBACK'
IN DECEMBER

Plus Waiver or 13.9% APR Financing

Forget any reasons you may have for not 
buying a big new 2-wheel drive tractor right 
now. Massey-Ferguson has rolled back prices 
to us in December by 15%...on every new 
Massey 2000 Series tractor on our lot. This 
means some of the biggest savings we ve 
ever been able to offer...to you!
Don’t wait. Come in and buy now, because 
these savings apply only to new equipment 
purchased in December — just in time for 
year-end tax credits, too.

Choice of financing
If you buy now and qualify for financing 
through Massey-Ferguson, we’ll make your 
deal even sweeter, with a waiver of finance

Waiver dates:
Tractors, implements, 

industrial machines.......... March 1, 1982
Hay tools...................................May 1, 1982
Grain combines............ . August 1, 1982 
Com/bean combines .... September 1, 1982

Used equipment savings too.
Waiver of finance charges and 13.9% financing 
options are also available to qualified buyers 
through MF on used machinery and equip­
ment on our lot.

Hurry! These price rollback savings 
are good only during December 1981

MF
Massey Ferguson

Now more than ever, Massey makes sense.

KO HU BROS.
Farm Service, Inc.

626-2707

School Menus
KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 

SCHOOLS
Monday, Dec. 7 — B-B-Q on 

a bun, applesauce, buttered 
corn, banana muffin and fruit 
cocktail.

Tuesday, Dec. 8 — Hot dog in 
a bun, pickle relish, raw onions, 
tater tots, pork-n-beans, & 
choc, chip brownie.

Wednesday, Dec. 9 — Ham­
burger, cheese on a bun, 
French fries, raw onions, sweet 
& dill pickles, cookie & pine­
apple.

Thursday, Dec. 10 — 
Turkey-chow mein over rice, 
lettuce salad, dinner roll and 
pudding with cream.

Friday, Dec. 11 — Fish, 
cheese on a bun, cabbage salad, 
relishes, juice & sweet roll.

Menus are subject to change.
Each meal served with bread.

butter and/or margarine and
milk.

HOLY TRINITY
Monday, Dec. 7 — Pork & 

noodles, peas, peach, dinner 
roll, rice krisipie bar.

Tuesday, Dec. 8 — Im­
maculate Conception - No 
School.

Wednesday, Dec. 9 — Turkey 
sandwich, corn, fruit slices, 
berry crunch.

Thursday, Dec. 10 — Pizza, 
green beans, lettuce salad, 
cupcake.

Friday, Dec. 11 — Fish & 
chips, cole slaw, vegetable 
stixs.

Milk served at each meal.

Why is it the wrong num­
ber of a telephone is never 
busy when you call?
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REMODELING 

432 E. WASHINGTON ST.
ALL CLASSIFIED ADS CASH IN ADVANCE

RATE: $1.50 up to 20 words; over 20 words, add 5c per word

WEST BEND, WIS.
Sealed bids will be received 

at the Washington County

CHILD CARE - In my home. 
Playmates, references, reason- 
able. Ph. 626-4012. 12-4-2p

COAT TAKEN - Ladies White 
3/« length London Fog coat, size 
14, at Holzmann-Bliefnick 
wedding dance at Amerahn on 
Saturday, Oct. 31. A similar 
London Fog coat was left in its 
place. Please cal) 626-2626 if 
you mistakenly took the coat.
_____________________ 12-4-2t

FOR SALE - 1962 Chevrolet 
sedan. Reasonable. Ph. 626- 
4678.12-4-lt

FOR RENT — Two bedroom 
upper apartment in Kewaskum. 
No pets. Security deposit. Ph. 
626-2998, ask for Bill. 12-4-2p

CHRISTMAS SALE - Handi­
craft items and Avon. 10% off 
Avon. Now on until Dec. 21, 11 
a.m. to 5 p.m. 8630 Sandy 
Ridge Rd., Kewaskum. Hwy. 45 
south to first side road on left 
(Sandy Ridge Rd.) Third house 
on road. 12-4-3p

SANTA CLAUS - For Hire, 
Christmas Eve and Christmas 
Day. Ph. 626-2471. Call any­
time. 12-4-3t

POTATOES FOR SALE - Bar­
toli’s Greenhouse. Phone 533- 
4092. 10-30-9t

BABYSITTING - Will do 
babysitting in my country 
home. Children any age. Phone 
629-9422 anytime. 12-4-2p

CHILD CARE - Done in my 
home, fond of infants. Ph. 
626-4231. 11-13-tf

FOR RENT — One bedroom 
lower apartment in Campbell­
sport. $160 includes heat. Ph. 
477-6757. ll-27-2t

INSULATION - Attics and 
side-walls. Call Blaze Insula- 
tion, 626-8007.1-11-tf

State of Wisconsin 
Washington County 
Circuit Court
Probate Branch

ORDER LIMITING TIME 
FOR FILING CLAIMS

ION WAIVER]
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF PETER M. 
YEARLING, Deceased.

A petition for administration 
of the estate and determination 
of heirship of Peter M. Yearling 
a/k/a Peter Yearling and as 
Peter Yearling, Jr., Washington 
County, Wisconsin, post office 
address 109 Main Street, Ke­
waskum, WI 53040, having 
been filed;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. Creditor’s claims must be 

filed on or before February 17, 
1982, or be barred;

2. Claims will be examined 
and adjusted on February 23, 
1982 at the Washington County 
Courthouse, in West Bend, 
Wisconsin, at the opening of 
Court or thereafter.
Dated November 17, 1981

By the Court, 
Richard T. Becker 
Circuit Judge

McKenna & Kiefer 
Attorneys at Law 
114 Main Street, P.O. Box 550 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

Courthouse, West Bend, Wis­
consin until 9:00 a.m. De­
cember 22, 1981 for alterations 
to Washington County Court­
house, Annex I and Annex II, in 
accordance with bidding docu­
ments prepared by the Zim­
merman Design Group, 7707 
Harwood Avenue, Milwaukee, 
WI 53213. Separate bids will be 
received for:

1. General Construction Work
2. Plumbing Work
3. Heating and Ventilating 
Work
4. Electrical Work
Bidding documents will be 

available from the Architect’s 
office and at the office of the 
County Clerk, Washington 
County Courthouse, 432 E. 
Washington Street, West Bend, 
WI after November 30, 1981 or 
may be viewed after that date at 
the following locations:

Milwaukee: F.W. Dodge
Corporation Builder’s Exchange

Madison: F.W. Dodge
Corporation Mechanical Ex­
change

Fond du Lac: Builder’s 
Exchange

Menasha: Fox Valley Build­
er’s Exchange

Green Bay: Northeastern 
Wisconsin Builder’s Exchange

A deposit of thirty-five dollars 
($35.00) or receipt of an AGC or 
AMC deposit card is required 
for each set of plans and 
specifications which will- be 
refunded if same are returned 
undamaged, within ten (10) 
days after date of bid opening.

The Owner reserves the right 
to reject any or all bids and to 
waive any irregularities in any 
bid or to accept any bid which 
will be to the best interest of the 
Owner.

LIQUOR LICENSE 
APPLICATION

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
I hereby certify that the 

following applicant has applied 
to the Village Board of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wash­
ington County, Wisconsin, for a 
Combination Class “B” Fer­
mented Malt Beverage and 
Intoxicating Liquor License for 
the period commencing Decem­
ber 8, 1981, and ending June 
30, 1982.

William A. Edwards, 1139 
Fond du Lac Avenue and the 
adjoining premises at 100 
Clinton Street.
The above application will be 

heard and considered at a 
public hearing to be held in the 
Council Room of the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street, in the 
Village of Kewaskum on the 7th 
day of December 1981, at 8:00 
o’clock P.M.

William S. Martin, Clerk

PUBLIC NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given 

that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wiscon­
sin, Village Board is scheduled 
for Monday evening, Dec. 7, 
1981, at 8:00 p.m. in the Council 
Room, of the Municipal Build­
ing, 204 First Street.

The agendas for meeting are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the 
clerk at the Municipal Building 
on Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and in 
the lobby of the Valley Bank.

William Martin, Clerk

CARD OF THANKS
We would like to express our 

heartfelt thanks to all our 
relatives, friends and neigh­
bors, during our recent ber- 
eveament, the death of my 
beloved husband and our dear 
father, grandfather, great­
grandfather and father-in-law, 
WILMER PROST. A very 
special thank you to Rev. 
Joiner, pallbearers, the 
Kewaskum Rescue Squad, 
American Legion’s honor 
guard, firing squad and bugler, 
West Bend Barracks I, donors 
of memorial and floral tributes, 
food, ladies who served the 
food, custodian, sexton, traffic 
officer, Miller’s, and to all who 
showed their respect and 
helped us in any way.

Mrs. Viola Prost and family

ANNOUNCE COUNTY BLOOD 
PRESSURE PROGRAM

The Washington County High 
Blood Pressure Control Pro­
gram free blood pressure 
screening for the month of 
December is as follows:

December 5 — Hartford Hos­
pital, 1032 E. Summer St. (Main 
Lobby), Hartford from 11:00 
a.m. to 1:00 p.m.

December 12 — West Bend 
Fire Department, 320 N. 7th 
Avenue, West Bend from 1:00 
to 4:00 p.m.

SAVE!!! Select your furniture 
at Miller’s in Kewaskum. Lar­
gest selection, high quality at 
most reasonable prices. Open 
daily until 5:30, Monday and 
Friday to 9:00 p.m. Free de­
pendable delivery.

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Multi-Mile. 626- 
2888.4-4-tf

LEN LUTERBACH CONTRAC­
TOR — Mason, cement, trench­
ing and bulldozing. Quality 
work at competitive prices. 
Your authorized dealer of the 
world famous Hallmark in- 
ground swimming pools. For 
free estimate, call 477-6757 
collect. 9-14-tf

Kitchen carpeting can be re­
stored to original brightness in 
15 minutes with Nylac. No 
machine needed. Miller’s Fine 
Furniture recommends Nylac 
for nylon carpets.

The most long-lived animals is 
the giant tortoise of the Gala­
pagos Islands. Specimens have 
been estimated to be as old as 
190 years.

Kewaskum’s 
Beautiful SI
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Moraine 
Condominiums
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of west bend

334-7411
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NEW LISTING: Land contract available on this newly 
remodeled 3 bedroom older home in Kewaskum. Generous 
sized rooms, large lot. $59,900. Call Ann Enright, 692-2607. 
FINANCING AVAILABLE on this 4 bedroom Colonial with 
natural fireplace and carpeting throughout. REDUCED to 
$68,900. Cail Ann Enright, 692-2607.
IMMACULATE 3 bedroom ranch on nicely landscaped lot. 
Huge rec room with fireplace. Low $50’s. Call Wendy 
Coulter, 338-3296.
LAND CONTRACT on this elegant Victorian suitable for 
home or office, 4 bedrooms, 2 baths. $80,000. Call Ann 
Enright, 692-2607.
LAND CONTRACT ^a^Sble fcn tth4 bedroom older home. 
Lots of possibilities^SBfoOOrCaWDan Coulter, 338-3296.
PRICE REDUCED on this Handyman Special in the 
country; 3 bedrooms, 2’4 car heated garage. Low $40’s. 
Call Ann Enright, 692-2607.
RENT with OPTION: Nicely remodeled older home with 5 
bedrooms. Financing available. Call Ann Enright, 692-2607. 
WE DO HAVE many beautiful homes in the West Bend 
area!
CALL about our VACANT LAND listings.

745 Main St. - Kewaskum

OPEN EVERY SUNDAY 2-4WE BUILD!!
Wausau Homes 
Envelope Homes 
Solar Greenhouses 
Remodeling 
Financing Available

better living!

KEWASKUM 
REALTY 

338-8500

411 Main St. 
Kewaskum 205 S. 7th Ave./P.O. Box 634/West Bend/Wis./53095

MLS^MULT^tf UtTWfl St^VICt (QUAL HOUtSMG OFFOWTWTV

• 133/4% Land contract to credit qualified 

buyer

• Over 1300 sq. ft. of luxurious living

• 2-car heated underground parking

REALTY WORLD.
West Grove Realty Inc.

548 S. Main Street
West Bend, Wisconsin 53095

334-5589
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Slinger Beats 
Kewaskum in 
Lakes Opener

The Kewaskum Land o’ Lakes 
basketball team, weakened by 
the loss of three starters from 
last year, was drubbed by 
Slinger here Sunday night, 117- 
88, in the season’s opener for 
both teams. Clark Eichstedt, 
Tom Edwards and Chris 
Schroeder all have not returned 
from last year’s team.

Kewaskum played well in the 
first half and held the lead for a 
good part of it. They led 25-23 
after the 1st quarter. In the 2nd 
half, however, Slinger’s full 
court press and aggressive play 
began to take its toll. They led 
45-40 at the half. They expand­
ed their lead 80-66 after 3 
quarters and poured it on in the 
fourth quarter with 37 points to 
win by 29.

Slinger’s balanced attack was 
led by Greg Jonas with 27 
points, including 21 in the 2nd 
half. Bob Mertz added 16 
points, Jack Held 15, Larry 
Gundrum 14 and Ray Schreiter 
13.

Leon Laatsch scored a game 
high of 34 points for Kewas­
kum, however, their next high 
scorers were John Slesar and 
Jim Rohlinger with 12 points 
each.

Kewaskum hosts Hartford 
this Saturday at 7:30 p.m.

Lakes scores: Menomonee 
Falls Badgers 107, Menomonee 
Falls Stingers 102; Cedarburg 
122, Oconomowoc 116, Sussex 
102, Mayville 85; Slinger 117, 
Kewaskum 88; Hartford vs. 
Port Washington, unavailable 
at press time.

Thursday Adult

Basketball League

Results Nov. 19 - Timblin’s 
Solar 58, Kewaskum Saloon 56; 
Mark Tessar was high scorer for 
Timblin’s with 15 points, Leon 
Laatsch for the Saloon with 20. 
Three R’s 81, Randy’s 70; Don 
Gruber was high for Three R’s 
with 20, Kevin Darmody for 
Randy’s with 23. Bartelt’s and 
Westie’s, no game. Amerahn 
bye.

9:00 - 3-5; bye 7 
1-14-7:00 - 3-1;

9:00 - 4-2; bye 5 
1-21-7:00 - 2-1;

9:00 - 5-6; bye - 3 
1-28-7:00 - 6-3;

9:00 - 5-4; bye - 1 
2-4-7:00 - 1-7;

9:00 - 4-3; bye - 6 
2-11-7:00 - 5-7;

9:00 - 6-1; bye - 4 
2-18-7:00 - 1-5;

8:00 - 6-7;

8:00 - 7-4;

8:00 - 7-2;

8:00 - 2-5;

8:00 - 3-2;

8:00 - 4-6;
9:00 - 7-3; bye - 7-3

2-25-7:00 - 6-2; 8:00 - 5-3;
9:00 - 1-4; bye - 7

3-4-7^00 - 7-6; 8:00 - 1-3;
9:00 - 4-2; bye - 5

3-11-7:00 - 1-2; 8:00 - 4-7;
9:00 - 6-5; bye - 3.

3-18-Playoffs.

Kettle Riders to
Sponsor Snowmobile
Safety Course

The New Fane Kettle Riders 
Snowmobile Club will hold its 
annual snowmobile safety 
course on December 5 and 12 at 
the New Fane Sportsmen’s 
Club, located on Hwy. “G” and 
Auburn-Ashford Road. Classes 
will run from 1:00 to 5:00 p.m.

For further information or to 
enroll your child, call Glen or 
Gerry Mueller at 626-4406 
before December 3.

Strobel’s 22 14
Everglades 21 15
Robbie’s 18 18
Johann Plbg. 18 18
Charles 18 18
Herman’s 17 19
Laurie’s 17 19
Hensen’s 16 20
Fin-n-Feather 15 21
Artie’s Market 15 21
Regal Ware 14 22
Newsettes 13 23
First State Bank 12 24

STANDINGS

Timblin’s Solar 
Three R’s 
Bartelt’s Ins. 
Westie’s 
Amerahn 
Randy’s 
Kewaskum Saloon

Games Dec. 3 —

L
0 
0
0 
0
0
1
1

7:00 - Three
R’s vs. Bartelt’s; 8:00 - Randy’s 
vs. Kewaskum Saloon; 9:00 - 
Westie’s vs. Amerahn; Timblin 
Solar bye.

1.
2.
3.

SCHEDULE
Amerahn
Bartelt’s Insurance
Kewaskum Saloon

4. Randy’s
5. Three R’s
6. Timblin Solar
7. Westie’s

11-19-7:00-2-7; 8:00-3-6;
9:00 - 4-5; bye - 1

12-3-7:00 - 5-2; 8:00 - 4-3;
9:00 - 7-1; bye - 6

12-10-7:00-1-6; 8:00-7-5;
9:00 - 2-3; bye - 4

12-7-7:00 - 5-1; 8:00 - 3-7;
9:00 - 6-4; bye 2

1-7-7:00 - 2-6; 8:00 - 4-1;

WEDNESDAY 
MORNINGETTES

QUEEN HITS LEAGUE
Ellen Breitzman, Sec.

Indv. High Game: Shirley 
Robinson 238, Janet Serwe 236, 
Willy Halfmann 206.

Indv. High Series: Janet 
Serwe 578, Shirley Robinson 
536, Karen Grahl 533.

SUNGER

J Held 
Ko Held 
Ri Held 
Gundrum 
Nehm 
Wolf 
Mertz 

Jonas 
Schreiter

•b

2
3
7

13
3

ft 
3 
0 
I
0

2

3 
0 
0 
0
5 
I 
3 
I
6

Totals

SlINGa 
KEWASKUM

49 19 19

KEWASKUM

Lootsch 
Do. Gruber 
Slesar 
lockbout 
Rohlinger 
M. lessor 
Smucker 
Steinhardt 
Stout] 
S. lessor 
Do. Gruber 
Miller 

Totals

*9 
17
3
6 
2

0
0
0
I
2
I

42

ft 
0 
2 
0 
0
2 
0 
0 
0 
0 
0 
0 
0

5 
5
3 
0
s 
0
2 
I 
2 
0 
I 
0

HM - Slinger 7, Kewaskum 2.

23 22 3S 37-117
25 15 26 22- 88

312 Deer Bagged

By County Hunters

During the nine-day deer 
season that ended Sunday, 
hunters in Washington County 
bagged at least 312 deer, ac­
cording to Armin Schwengel, a 
State Department of Natural 
Resources wildlife manager.

That is down from the kill 
during the last two years be­
cause of changed hunting rules 
for the county, he said. This 
year hunters north of State 60 
were allowed to shoot only 
bucks, unless they held a hunt­
er s choice permit. County 
hunters south of State 60 were 
allowed to shoot either a buck or 
a doe in a five-day season that 
ended Wednesday. In previous 
years, hunters here were allow­
ed to kill either a buck or doe 
during the first four days of the 
season.

About 360 deer were bagged 
>n Washington County in 1980. 
The 1979 toll was 310.

Baumann’s Bus 
Bauer Spraying 
Dundee S & G

w L
26 13
23 Vi 15*/2
22 17
21 18
20 19
19'/2 19'/2

17 22
. 7 32

Serwe’s Tap 
Marie’s Bty. Shop 
King Pin 
Bauman’s Dairy 
Cal’s Bender ] 
Bar-N-Annex 
Gregg’s Tap 
Don’s Radiator Ser.

High Indv. Series: Mary Ann 
Jurgensmier 591, Donna 
LaShay 539, Janet Serwe 516.

High Indv. Game: Mary Ann 
Jurgensmier 251, Cordell 
Enright 197, Janet Serwe 195.

NO BASKETBALL AT 
KHS GYM ON SATURDAY

The Kewaskum High School 
gym will be closed for basket­
ball on Saturday, December 5, 
due to a wrestling match.

WATER SOFTENERS
SALES & SERVICE

334-9481
FREE ESTIMATES

JOHANN, INC.
PLUMBING • HEATING • AIR CONDITIONING 

2450 Hwy. 28 E., Kewaskum, Wl

VOTING BY ABSENTEE BALLOT
Any qualified voter, unable to get to the polling place on 

election day. may ask to vote by absentee ballot. A qualified 
voter is one who is a U.S. citizen, will be 18 years of age or 
older on election day, and who has resided in the ward or 
aldermanic district where voting is desired to be accomp­
lished for at least 10 days prior to the election. If the voter 
resides in a municipality which requires voter registration, 
then registration is also a requisite for the voter who is 
qualified in other respects.

To obtain an absentee ballot, contact the clerk in the city, 
village or town in which you reside by mail or telephone, or in 
person, and request an application form. After properly 
completing and returning the application to the municipal 
clerk, an absentee ballot will be sent to you along with a 
postage pre paid return envelope, or given to you if the 
application is submitted to the clerk in person The deadline 
for receipt of the application by the municipal clerk is 5:00 
p m on the Friday before election day in the case of 
applications mailed to the municipal clerk and 5:00 p.m on 
the day before the election in thecase of applications made in 
the clerk’s office.

With one exception, the voter who wants to cast an 
absentee ballot must make a separate application before 
each election. Voters indefinitely confined to their home or 
care facility because of illness, age or disability need not file 
an application before each election; a special statement on 
the application form can be completed asking that an 
absentee ballot be automatically mailed to them before each 
election if they fail to make and return the ballots sent to 
them in an election, they must complete another application 
later on

Absentee ballots can be voted at home anytime after they 
arrived in the mail. They can also be voted ri^ht in the clerk s 
office if submitting the application in person If returning the 
ballots by mail, the affidavit-certificate must be properly 
completed and witnessed by two persons If returning the 
ballots in person, the affidavit-certificate must be properly 
completedand subscribed and sworn to by the clerk or the 
denutv clerk who are authorized to administer oaths In 
either case the marked, sealed ballot must be in the hands of 
the issuing'municipal clerk on or before election day Any 
absentee ballot received at the polling place after the polls 
close or received in incomplete or improper form cannot be 
counted

George F. Nehrbass, County Clerk 
Washington County

NOTICE
TOWN OF AUBURN

SNOW PLOWING
Private Driveways or Private Roads 

$15.00 each time

Call Before9:00 A.M.

533-4912
BY ORDERS OF 
TOWN BOARD

PUBLIC NOTICE

Public notice is hereby given by the Village of Kewaskum, 
Wisconsin, that a copy of the Federal General Revenue 
Sharing Expenditure Report for the year ended December 
31, 1980, is on file in the office of the Commissioner at the 
Municipal Building, 204 First Street, and is available for 
public inspection at any time during regular business hours.
Dated this 24th day of November 1981

Village of Kewaskum 
William S. Martin 

12-4-lt Commissioner

NOTICE 
PUBLIC HEARING

Notice is hereby given that the Village Board of the Village 
of Kewaskum, Washington County, Wisconsin, will conduct 
a public hearing at 8:00 P.M. Monday evening,December 
21, 1981, in the Council Room of the Municipal Building, 
204 First Street. The public hearing will be on SE WRPC’s 
suggested changes to the Village of Kewaskum Zoning 
Ordinance and Subdivision and Platting Ordinance for 
continued eligibility in the National Flood Insurance 
Program. These suggested amendments to the Village 
Ordinances have been recommended by the Village of 
Kewaskum Plan Commission.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
12-4-2t Administrator
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Indians Edge West Bend East, Edged 
By West Bend West in Barn-Burners

Wrestlers 1-1 
In Double Dual

The Kewaskum Indians boys 
and girls teams did all right for 
themselves in their non-con- 
ference series with the West 
Bend teams, winning two of the 
three games, all of them close, 
exciting contests. The Indians 
are now 3-1 in pre-season play.

The Indian girls started it out 
with a double overtime, 69-62 
victory over the West Bend East 
girls here (details reported last 
week). Then last Tuesday the 
Indian boys varsity edged West 
Bend East by one point, 63-62, 
in a thrilling, see-saw battle. 
But on Monday night here, the 
West Bend West Spartans 
finally defeated the Indian boys 
by four points, 89-85, in another 
barn-burner before a howling 
crowd, in which Kewaskum tied 
the score late in the game only 
to lose out in the end.

The sizzler with the East Suns 
was a real nip-and-tuck battle 
that was close all the way. After 
the Suns took a 16-12 advantage 
at the quarter, the Indians came 
back to outscore them 20-14 in 
the second to take a 32-30 lead 
at halftime. Each team scored 
15 points in the third period as 
Kewaskum retained its 2-point 
lead. In the torrid last quarter 
East outpointed the Indians 
17-16 to come within one point 
as Kewaskum came away with a 
narrow 63-62 win.

It was a real good ball game

and team effort by the Indians. 
The victory avenged a beating 
the Suns handed Kewaskum a 
year ago. Both coaches were 
pleased with the play of their 
teams.

Center Dale Wodsedalek 
stood out individually for the 
winners, although he wasn’t 
feeling' well. He scored 23 
points, grabbed up a number of

81-62. The Indians were behind 
68-60 but East outscored them 
13-2 in the last three minutes. 
Sixty fouls were called in the 
game and Kewaskum was down 
to its last five players. Dennis 
Butz paced Kewaskum with 16 
points, Jeff Squier 13 and Jim 
Hanrahan 10. Rod Gross scored
28 for the Suns, including 
15 free throws.

rebounds, blocked some shots kewaskum 
and made several key steals for
a super effort. He was up w°d**doiek 

against one of the better big Larson 

men around in Jeff Seefeldt. ^heiser 
Big Wod scored 12 of Kewas- Amdt 
kum’s 20 points in the second Dona,h
quarter. Totals

14 of

’9 
10

ft
3

Meet at Fondy

6
5
5 
0 
0

2 
2 
0 
0

2

3
3

0

27

WB EAST 
* 9
Michels 
Seefeldt 
Lyons 
Schaetz 
2eeb 
Nelson 
Maney 
Bohn 
Totals

8

2
2

2

Following their lead in the FTM — Kewaskum 5; East 2.
f x 1 J KEWASKUM 12 20first quarter, East led onceEAST l6 H

26

Competing in a double dual 
wrestling meet at St. Mary’s 
Springs, Fond du Lac, last 
Wednesday evening, Camp­
bellsport recorded two lopsided 
wins, while Kewaskum went 
1-1, Grafton 1-1, and St. Mary’s 
0-2.

The Cougars defeated St. 
Mary’s Ledgers 54-8 after best­
ing Grafton 52-8. State Meet 
veterans Dean Flitter (105), Tim 
Grahl (126) and Mark West- 
meier (119) all recorded two 
victories.

Kewaskum, although having 
10 18'to forfeit at two weights, beat

2 
0
2 
0 
0

3 
2
3 
0 
3

15

GRAFTON 34. KEWASKUM 30
98 — Bob Callison lo*t to Joe Herr 2-14
105 — Dave Kudek won by forfeit

112 — Rut* Katzenberger won by forfeit
119 — Kirk Vogt lo*t to Jeff Thai* 5-10
126 — Wayne Boudreau pinned Steve Ter 

ronova 3:28
132 — Don Goeden pinned Todd Goebel 2:51
138 — Tim Londevatter last to Richard Rieck 2-

13 ' "
145 _ KHS forfeit* to Bob Rieck #
155 — Stuart Stoutz wo» pinned by Don Ver leg 

3:29
167 — KHS forfeit* to John Wishnie
185 — KHS forfeit* to Al Bould
Uni._ Scott Durion pinned Dave Schmidt :52

Scott Klein Is

Wrestler of Week

more briefly in the third period, 
43-42, on a Tony Michels bucket 
but Dan Dean’s swisher put the 
Indians right back into the lead. 
They built up a comfortable 
9-point, 54-45 lead but the Suns 
again cut the deficit to one 
point. Brian Larsen’s free 
throws turned out to be the 
winning points with 13 seconds 
left.

Larsen wound up with 14 
points and Ric Leitheiser 10. 
The plays of Ric and Mike 
Heisdorf drew praise from 
Coach Jim Westphal. Seefeldt 
led the Suns with 20 points and 
Michels had 15.

The Suns won the JV game,

In Monday night’s

16 — 63
17 — 62 

high

Girls Beat Sheboygan Falls
And New Holstein; Now 4-0

By Cathy Schlice
On Tuesday, Nov. 24, the 

Kewaskum girls varsity basket­
ball team won their third game 
in a row and more important 
won their first conference game 
over Sheboygan Falls, but not 
without a fight. The final score 
did not show how close the 
game really was, ending 36-28.

After one quarter they trailed 
by 2 points, after 2 quarters 3 
points and after the third 
quarter by 4 points, and then 
staged their comeback. In the 
second half the Indians put on a 
full court press but it was not 
effective until the fourth period 
when Kewaskum forced many 
turnovers by the Falcons. The 
Indians outscored the Falcons 
15-3 in the final quarter.

Jill Yearling scored 9 of them 
and Linda Larsen made her only 
points of the game, scoring the 
other 6.

Much like last Friday’s game 
against West Bend East, the 
game was decided at the free 
throw line with Kewaskum 
again dominating, hitting 12 of 
18 for 72%, while the Falcons 
only hitting 2 of 10 for 20%. 
There was not a big difference 
in field goals with Falls hitting 
13 and the Indians were one 
back with 12.

The Indians were led by 
Yearling and Brenda Fuller with 
19 and 7 points respectively. 
Yearling and Larsen also each 
hauled in 10 rebounds apiece.

The J Vs and frosh were also 
victorious, 41-36, and 34-30, 
respectively.

The Kewaskum girls basket­
ball team kept their record 
perfect Tuesday by downing 
New Holstein, 57-43, here.

They accomplished this with­
out their coach, Mr. Soerens, 
who was hospitalized earlier 
Tuesday morning and kept 
overnight. So JV coach Milt 
Dickerson filled in and did a 
great job as head coach.

The Indians scored the first 
bucket and were never behind 
the rest of the game. They 
mixed their game up by 
switching around between man- 
to-man and zone pressing to 
mix up the Huskies. At the half 
Kewaskum led 30-19. New Hol­
stein then rallied in the second 
half but never came to within 
more than 6 points of the 
Indians.

Kewaskum was led by Larsen 
with 19 points and yanked in 21 
rebounds. Michele Rodenkirch 
and Yearling also each contri­
buted 14 points apiece.

Kewaskum’s record is now a 
perfect 4-0 overall and 2-0 in 
conference.

The J Vs were also victorious 
by a score of 32-26. They were 
led by HoUy Kempf, who was 
battling an illness, with 9 
points. Lisa Matenaer and Julie 
Koepke each contributed 8 
points. Their record is now 2-0 
in conference and 3-1 overall.

Coach Amundson’s frosh lost 
and are now 1-1.

KEWASKUM — Fuller 15-2 Burkhalter 0-0-0, 
Rodenkirch 10-3. Yearling 7-5-4. Larsen 3-0-2, 
Matenoer O2I Totals — 12 12 12 FTM — 6

SHEBOYGAN FALLS — Hetzel 1-0 1 Parent 2- 
0-3 Wield 0 10 Mischock 3 0-0 Nett 0-0-3, 
Burlow 1-0-1 Billman O-1 ■ 1. Genke 4-0-4, Dentin

KEWASKUM
NEW HOLSTEIN

16 14 15
6 13 14

2 0 2 T<iol* 
KEWASKUM 
S FALLS

x 15 FTM — 8.
10 6 5 15 — 36

scoring contest in which West 
Bend West nudged the Indians, 
89-85, the Spartans led by just 
two points with 25 seconds left, 
83-81. West center John 
Sauer’s tip-in made it 85-81. 
Leitheiser sank two free throws 
to make it 85-83. Bill Albrecht 
countered with two free throws­
and it was 87-83. Wodsedalek’s 
long jumper closed it to 87-85 
but Mike Fleischman’s pair of 
free throws after drawing a 
desperation foul, brought the 
final score to 89-85 West.

Very instrumental in West’s 
win was hot 55 per cent shoot­
ing from the floor, 73 per cent 
from the free throw line and a 
whole lot of hustle on fast 
breaks. Sparking the winners 
were Albrecht with 27 points 
and Steve Albinger with 23. The 
Spartans led all the way but the 
Indians tied it up at one point 
near the end.

Wodsedalek, 6-5 Indian left 
hander, led both teams with 33 
points. He was hot from the

St. Mary’s 36-27 with some pins 
by Russ Katzenberger (112), 
Kirk Vogt (119), Don Goeden 
(132) and Stuart Stautz (155).

There were just eight bouts in 
the Kewaskum-Grafton match. 
The Indians won three, all by 
falls, but lost 34-30 when Stautz 
was pinned after leading in his 
bout.

Goeden had a pair of pins for 
the Indians. Wayne Boudreau, 
Katzenberger and Scott Durian 
all went 2-0. Dave Goeden won 
his first bout at 145 but did not 
wrestle in the second match 
because of illness.

Lettermen returning for Ke­
waskum are: Dave Goeden, 145, 
who went 12-7 last year; Don 
Goeden, 132, 12-9 last year; 
Wayne Boudreau, 126, 12-12 
last year; Stuart Stautz, 155, 
11-11 last year; Scott Durian, 
185, who has moved up from 
185 to unlimited; junior Russ 
Katzenberger and sophs Steve 
Seitz and Kirk Vogt.

Former Kewaskum High 
School wrestler Scott Klein was 
named Wrestler of the Week at 
UW-Stevens Point after the 
team participated in its first 
tournament of the season.

Klein, a freshman, won his 
first two matches as a collegian, 
the first over a wrestler from a 
state college in Michigan, 9-3, 
and the second over a man from 
UW-Stout, 18-2. Klein later 
dropped an 8-4 decision to the 
eventual winner in the 118- 
pound weight class.

A son of Mr. and Mrs. Donald 
Klein, Scott was invited to the 
coach’s house for a spaghetti 
dinner for winning the honor of 
being wrestler of the week.

Sno Chiefs Schedule
Safety Course Here

KEWASKUM 36, ST. MARY S SPRINGS 27 
98 — Bob Callison lost to Chris Henry 6-0 
105 — Dave Kudek was pinned by Brad

floor but cold from the free Schmoiesky 3 33
a —Russ Katzenberger pinned Terry Potokathrow line with 15 baskets in 20 - 

attempts but only 3 out of 9 free 
throws. A few more free tosses 
made could have won it for the 
Indians. Twenty-four of his 
points were in the second half.

A weakness in defense in the 
early going put Kewaskum 
behind and West’s better free 
throw shooting made the 
difference. The Indians gave 
away some easy baskets, partly 
because of the Spartans’ tre­
mendous hustle. Larsen con­
tributed 16 Indian points and 
Leitheiser 17.

The J Vs also lost to the West 
sophs by three points, 55-52, 
Butz, Squier and Gerhartz all 
scored 11 points for Kewaskum.

The Indians now have off

3:11
119— Kirk Vogt pinned Mark Marchello 1 52

126 — Wayne Boudreau dec. Jeff Yockey 5 4
132— Don Goeden pinned Rich Laudolff 3:32
138 — Tim Landvatter was pinned by Phil

Armstrong 1 30
.145 — Dave Goeden dec. Tom Draxler 9-4

155 — Stuart Stautz pinned Craig Schaefer 
1:10

167 — KHS forfeits to Dan Hauer
185 — KHS forfeits to Pete Blatz
Uni. — Scott Durian wins by forfeit.

A snowmobile safety course 
sponsored by the Kewaskum 
Sno Chiefs will be held at the 
Legion Club House, Kewas­
kum, Saturday, December 5 and 
Saturday, 12 from 8:30 a.m. to 
12:30 p.m.

This course is for 12-year-olds 
and older. Adults are welcome. 
Youths must have this course 
and pass it in order to receive a 
license to drive alone.

If there is snow on the 
afternoon of December 12, the 
road test will be held that 
afternoon.

Call 626-4503 or 338-8417 to 
register. All students must 
register to be accepted for the 
course.

until Dec. 11 when they 
the conference season at
Holstein.
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NO SPORTSMEN’S CLUB 
MEETING IN DECEMBER

The Kettle Moraine Sports­
men’s Association of Kewas- 

10^43 kum will not hold a meeting in
kewaskum — Birkhoit«r 1-0-3, Rodenkirch 5 December. The annual meeting

12 7 6 13 — 28 16 FT Mined 7

4-o Fuller i o-x Schiic. 2-ao, Yearling 5 4^ b held January 
lor*en 7 5 1, Matenoer 10-3, Perkin* 0-0 2. J
Total* — 22 13-16. FT Misted 9 1982.

new hoistein — Ausloo* 3-0-0, Muldoon 3- Free rabbit lunch and 
0-1. Eiring 6-0-1, Burg 5-5-4, Bartram 0-2-4,, , . , .. .
Wilber*cheid 0-2 5, Fletch 0-0 1. Total* — 17 9. freshmentS following

12,

re- 
the

meeting.

Bring Your Venison Trimmings 
to

Kewaskum Frozen Foods
Popular Venison Sausages

• Summer Sausage
• Ring Bologna

• Wieners
• Brats

99?
(Includes Pork)

Phone 626-2710


