
^luauvu, nu, jj<Ud
^^^■—>-

sis s^st^^^ 8 ^f

ik ew a s k u m Mat isman)
|^ “(Gateway to the Kettle Moraine State Forest” J

Week’s Wit
Today’s canners put two or 
three peaches, pears or plums 
into a can and charge you for 
the price of the whole orchard.
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AFS Students Arrive for School Year Kewaskum Schools to

Lek Mahasakhunyong

Begin Classes Tuesday

The Kewaskum AFS Club*is 
pleased to announce the arrival 
of our two foreign students for 
the 1980-81 school year. Lek 
Mahasakhunyong, who is stay­
ing with the Leland Schaub 
family, Route 2, Kewaskum, is 
from Bangkok. Thailand. Isa 
Koch, who is staying with the 
Ronald Landvatter family, 8428 
Hwy. M, Fredonia, is from 
Tirol. Austria.

Lek is eighteen years old and 
will be a senior at KCHS. She 
has an older brother and two 
older sisters in Bangkok. Bang­
kok is a city of about four million 
people, most of whom are 
Buddhists. They have three 
seasons, summer, rainy and 
cool. Kewaskum will be quite a 
change from what she is accus-

Kewaskum Historical Society 
To Host Regional Convention

The Kewaskum Historical 
Society will host tKe 1980 South­
eastern Regional Convention of 
the Wisconsin Council for Local 
History on Saturday, September 
6. Activities begin with registra­
tion in the Hon-E-Kor Golf 
Clubhouse, River View Drive, 
Kewaskum.

Welcoming remarks will be 
made by Gerald Stollenwerk, 
Kewaskum Village President, 
and Daniel Schmidt, President 
of the Kewaskum Historical 
Society and Chairman of the 
Southeastern Region of the 
Wisconsin Council for Local 
History, will give a brief history 
of the Kewaskum Historical 
Society.

Schmidt will then chair a 
business meeting featuring a 
report from each society in the 
region.

A discussion of current issues 
and problems facing local 
societies will be led by Shelton 
Stromquist, Executive Se­
cretary of the Wisconsin Coun­
cil for Local History and the 
Coordinator of the Office of

tomed to.
Lek enjoys sports and being 

active in school activities. She 
feels the experience will help 
her be a better person and 
possibly help her develop her 
country.

Isa lives in a town of about six 
thousand people and she has an 
older brother and sister and a 
younger sister. Her mother and 
father own and run a hotel and 
enjoy music. She will be nine­
teen in January. Isa plays the 
clarinet and has had voice 
lessons. She also skis and 
enjoys sailing. Isa has had the 
opportunity to live with a family 
in England. She is interested in 
the United States and feels the 
best way to learn about a 
country is to live in it. Isa’s

Local History of the State 
Historical Society.

George Miller, Chairman of 
the UCLH, will speak on recent 
developments in the Wisconsin 
Council.

Following a noon luncheon at 
the Hon-E-Kor Golf Clubhouse, 
George Miller will present the 
Regional Chairman’s Certificate 
to Daniel Schmidt.

A narrated slide show on 
recent projects of the Kewas­
kum Historical Society and a 
tour of the Kewaskum Museum 
will end the day’s activities. The 
museum’s displays include a 
blacksmith shop, carpenter 
shop, post office, school room, 
general store, firehouse with a 
hand pumper, and portions of a 
Wisconsin cheese factory.

Reservations must be made 
by August 30 by writing to: 
Daniel Schmidt, 1314 Stark 
Street, Post Office Box 394, 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin 53040.

The cost for the day’s activi­
ties is $5. Checks should be 
made payable to the Kewaskum 
Historical Society.

Isa Koch

family is Roman Catholic. She 
will also be a senior at KCHS.

This type of exchange pro­
gram between countries is 
meant to be a learning ex­
perience for both the students 
from abroad and all of us in the 
Kewaskum area. Both these 
girls are anxious to tell you 
about their countries and their 
families. They will be available 
to speak to groups after January 
1.

If you would be interested in 
being an exchange student or a 
host family for a future student, 
contact a member of the AFS 
committee or the High School 
AFS advisor for further infor­
mation.

The adult AFS chapter is 
always looking for people to 
help organize this program, and 
if you would like additional 
information call Mrs. Ruth 
Schmitt, our chapter president 
at 338-6964.

Turkey Shoot
Set for Sept. 21

Kiwanis Club of Kewaskum 
has announced that its 28th 
Annual Turkey Shoot will be 
held on September 21. This 
famous Autumn event will be 
held at the Bar-N Dude Ranch, 
6 miles northeast of Kewaskum 
on County Trunk GGG, the 
beautiful Kettle Moraine Drive.

There will be many special 
events, including trout fishing, 
trap shooting, archery, and 
games for children, along with 
hot and cold beverages and 
food.

Those who purchase advance, 
sale tickets will receive four 
shots for $1.75. Tickets pur­
chased on the grounds will be 
four shots for $2.25. Advance 
sale tickets may be purchased 
by mailing your check payable 
to Kiwanis Club of Kewaskum, 
P. O. Box 68, Kewaskum, 
Wisconsin 53040.

All schools in the Kewaskum 
District will begin classes on 
Tuesday, September 2.

Time schedules will remain 
the same as last year. Middle 
School and High School classes 
will begin at 7:45, elementary 
classes at 9:05.

Students who ride busses 
should have received notices of 
the time and place of pick up. 
Anyone who has not received 
this notification should call the 
Johnson Bus Co. garage at 
626-4414. Other questions con­
cerning busing should be di­
rected to the same place or to 
the school district offices at 
626-2160.

Students should come to 
school the first day with re­
quired fees and money for 
lunches. Lunch prices this year 
will be 95c for a daily ticket for 
all students or $3.75 for a 5-day 
ticket for Elementary School

Laurel Wilson to Compete 
In Miss Teen USA Pageant

Laurel Wilson
Laurel Wilson, 18, a 1980 

graduate of Kewaskum High 
School, and daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawrence Wilson of 
8527 Wescott Road, Kewas­
kum, was selected to compete in 
the 1980 Miss Teen USA 
Pageant being held at the Hyatt 
Regency in Milwaukee this 
weekend, Aug. 29-31.

The pageant is the official 
statewide finals for the Miss 
Teen USA Pageant to be held in 
Albuquerque, New Mexico, in 
November, 1980. Miss Wilson 
represents the Kewaskum and 
West Bend areas. She is spon­
sored by Johann Plumbing & 
Heating, Inc., Allen Hron 
Jeweler^ Don Frederick Por­
trait Studio, West Bend Eleva­
tor, and Barton Sport Shop.

students and $4.00 for Middle 
School and High School stu­
dents. If you have questions on 
other fees, call the school your 
child will be attending.

September 2 will be a full day 
of school.

Classes at Holy Trinity 
Catholic School will also be 
resumed on Tuesday, Septem­
ber 2.

Teachers for the coming year 
are: Miss Mary Pitsch, tirade 8; 
Miss Nancy Weston, Grade 7; 
Mrs. Lorna Stopper, Grade 6; 
Mrs. Grace Theusch, Principal, 
Grade 5; Mrs. Judy Wagner, 
Grade 4; Mrs. Diane Grem- 
minger. Grade 3; Mrs. Irma 
Reindl and Mrs. Mary Metz, 
Grade 2 and Mrs. JoAnne 
Schacht, Grade 1. Mrs. Ione 
Herriges is a substitute teacher.

Classes at St. Lucas Lutheran 
School will also start on Tues­
day.

Contestants from all over the 
state will be competing for the 
title. All contestants are be­
tween 14-18 and must have as 
least a “B” average in school. 
They are requested to partici­
pate in the Volunteer Service 
Program of the Miss Teen USA 
Pageant. Through this program 
many young ladies are becom­
ing involved in community 
activities by contributing at 
least 12 hours of time to some 
worthwhile charity or civic 
work.

Laurel's hobbies include 
running (she was co-captain of 
the high school girl’s track team 
and a four year member), 
swimming, waterskiing, tennis, 
reading and baseball.
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Memories... The Statesman welcomes readers to submit photos 
for the "Memories” feature. Photos should show 
life in the olden days in this area Deliver or mail to 
The Statesman, 250 Main St., Kewaskum, Wl 
53040. Photos can be picked up again after 
publication.

Here is the New Fane baseball team of 1934.
Kneeling [left to right] — Sylvester [Pat] Klein, Leander Fellenz, Fritz Kleinke, 

Leonard Theusch, Bill Kempf.
Standing [left to right] — Lester Ehnert, John Kempf, Gregor Theusch, Edmund 

Rinzel, Richard Braun, Manager, Art Krause, Earl Bremser, Lawrence Theusch. 
Raymond Uelmen. ,

(Photo submitted by Mrs. William (Myrtle) Fabian of Milwaukee)

Blood Bank
Here Sept. 9

The Milwaukee Blood Mobile 
unit will be at the Kewaskum 
High School (old gym) on 
Tuesday, Sept. 9, from 1:30 to 
6:30 p.m. All past donors will be 
sent post cards and new donors 
are encoraged to walk in any­
time at their convenience. In 
past years the no-appointment 
method has worked well with 
little or no waiting for the 
donors.

The Blood Center is frequent­
ly asked how many people must 
donate to provide blood for a 
particular patient. The answer 
is always the same — patients 
in any of the hospitals served by 
the Milwaukee Blood Center 
(including West Bend) are 
eligible to receive as much 
blood as needed. There is no fee 
for the gift of blood itself. Only 
a processing fee is charged to 
cover the costs of drawing the 
blood, testing it to ensure the 
patient's safety and distributing 
blood and blood components to 
the hospitals. The fee is usually 
covered by health insurance.

There are no rules or re­
strictions on who can receive 
blood. As long as enough 
people donate, patients will 
receive all the blood they need. 
At this particular time there is

an extreme shortage at the 
center and then TV media has 
been requesting past donors to 
come in at this time. Sept. 9 will 
provide the time for Kewaskum 
area residents to do their'part.

If you are in good physical 
condition and between the ages 
of 18 and 66 years, you can 
donate every 10 weeks but not 
more than five times in 12 
consecutive months. If you are 
17 you are also eligible to 
donate but you must have a 
consent form signed by a parent 
or guardian. These forms will 
be available at the school prior 
to Sept. 9.

BLOOD IS A TRUE GIFT 
FROM THE HEART!

Tornado Alert
The fire siren will be sounded 

on Thursday, Sept. 4, at 10:30 
a.m. to acquaint residents wjth 
the tornado or other disaster 
signal. It will be sounded at a 
steady pitch for three minutes.

In the event of a tornado or 
other impending disaster take 
precautionary measures.

The alerts will be held 
throughout the year on the first 
Thursday of the month.

Some bad apples in the barrel 
give a little more zip to the 
cider.

William “Billy” Marchant
Dies of Accident Injuries

William “Billy” John Mar­
chant, 20, of Maple Drive, 
Route 2, Campbellsport, died 
Saturday night, Aug. 23, at 
Milwaukee County General 
Hospital, Milwaukee, due to 
injuries received in a two- 
vehicle traffic accident July 18 
at the intersection of County 
Trunks B and K just west of 
Eden. Marchant’s pickup truck 
was struck by a van at the 
intersection at 1:10 p.m. July 18 
and rolled over several times.

He was born Sept. 4, 1959, at 
Fond du Lac.

He was a graduate of Camp­
bellsport High School in 1977 
and at the time of his death he 
was employed by the Fritz 
Transport of Campbellsport.

He was a member of the 
United Church of Christ and the 
Campbellsport Area Jaycees.

Survivors include his parents, 
William and Alice (Kippenhan) 
Marchant of Campbellsport; six 
sisters, Carole (Walter) Ferber 
of Campbellsport, Sharon 
(Joseph) Entringerof St. Cloud, 
Wis., Nancy (David) Dreher of 
Campbellsport, Jeanne Mar­
chant of Campbellsport and 
Susie and Judith, both at home; 
maternal grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Harvey Kippenhan of 
Campbellsport and paternal 
grandmother, Mrs. Rose Mar­
chant of Campbellsport, and 
other relatives and friends.

Memorial services were at 
the United Church of Christ,

Campbellsport, on Tuesday at 8 
p.m. Rev. Carl Jensen officiated 
and private burial was at 10 
a.m. Wednesday at Union 
Cemetery, Campbellsport.

There was no visitation, but 
expressions of sympathy were 
asked to be made to the family 
after the memorial services at 
the church.

Memorials to the Campbell­
sport United Church of Christ or 
the Campbellsport Jaycee 
Chapter would be appreciated.

FIREMEN’S MEETING
The regular monthly meeting 

of the Kewaskum Fire Depart­
ment will be held at the fire 
station at 7:30 p.m. Thursday, 
Sept. 4.

4 DINNER NAPKINS

THIS WEEK S FEATURED ITEM

s1.00 off

TOWARD THE PURCHASE OF THIS WEEK’S FEATURED ITEM

4 DINNER NAPKINS
Our Reg. Discount Price ... $4 99
Coupon Savings .................... 1 00
Your Price (with coupon) $3.99

Can running be useful 
therapy for emotional ill­
ness? Dr. Thaddeus Kostru- 
bala of San Diego started a 
group of his psychiatric pa­
tients running one hour three 
times a week. Changes in the 
patients were remarkable: 
fewer symptoms of depres­
sion; a schizophrenic patient 
could be taken off medica­
tion, etc. Smoking and drink­
ing were reduced or stopped 
• unhealthy relationships im­
proved .

OF KEWASKUM

Dependable & Reasonable 
Since 1910

Fine Home Furnishings
LARGEST DISPLAY — DECORATOR SERVICE 

STORE PHONE 626-2184

Funeral Home

COUPON GOOO THRU 9/30/80

TWO BEAUTIFULLY FURNISHED CHAPELS
215 FOREST AVE. DIAL 626 2185 L. ROSENHEIMER 

GROCERY
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Death of Mrs.
Meisenheimer, 
Christina Fell

Mrs. Harold (Helen) Meisen­
heimer, 76, of 113 Prospect 
Ave., Kewaskum, passed away 
Saturday, August 23 at the 
Samaritan Home in West Bend 
where she had been a resident 
for two months.

Mrs. Meisenheimer was born 
July 4, 1904 in the Town of 
Auburn to the late Emil and 
Hannah Moldenhauer Ramel. 
On November 7, 1931 she 
married Harold Meisenheimer 
in St. Lucas Church, Kewas­
kum.

Survivors include her hus­
band; one son, Donald (Janet) 
of West Bend; one daughter, 
Darlene (Jerome) Klein of Ro­
chester, Minnesota; seven 
grandchildren; three great­
grandchildren; two sisters, 
Mrs. Elsie Klumb and Mrs. 
Gertrude Kral, both of Kewas-
kum; other relatives and 
friends.

Two sisters and one brother 
preceded her in death.

Visitation at Miller’s Funeral 
Home, Kewaskum, was after 4 
p.m. Monday, and on Tuesday 
at St. Lucas Lutheran Church 
from 12 noon to 2 p.m., when 
services were conducted with 
Pastor Paul Hoenecke officia­
ting. Burial was in Lutheran 
Memorial Park, Kewaskum.

CHRISTINA FELL
Christina Fell, nee Schrauf- 

nagel, 75, of Route 2, Kewas­
kum, died Monday. August 25. 
at St. Joseph’s Community 
Hospital, West Bend.

She was born November 26, 
1904, in the Town of LeRoy, and 
married John P. Fell on October 
4, 1927, at St. Andrew’s 
Church, LeRoy. He passed a- 
way February 26, 1978.

They lived in the Town of 
Ashford until 1967 when they 
moved to Kewaskum.

She was a member of the 
Christian Mother's of St. Mar­
tin’s Parish, Ashford, and the 
Apostolate of Suffering.

Survivors include three sons, 
Joseph (Ardell) of Kewaskum, 
Frank (Arlene) of Campbell­
sport and Jake (Jenny) of West

Bend; two daughters, Angeline 
(Richard) Westerman of West 
Bend and Christine (James) 
Ruplinger of Campbellsport; 14 
grandchildren; one brother, Al­
phonse of Waukesha, and other 
relatives and friends.

She was preceded in death by 
one grandchild; seven brothers 
and six sisters.

Funeral services were Wed­
nesday at 11:30 a.m. at St. 
Martin’s Church, Ashford. Rev. 
George Etzel officiated and 
burial was in St. Martin’s Cem­
etery.

Visitation at the Twohig Fu­
neral Home, Campbellsport, 
was Tuesday after 4 p.m.

Area Men Among 
National Guard 
Members Honored

Citizen-soldiers of the Na­
tional Guards and Reserve units 
in Wisconsin were honored on 
August 23, by the Milwaukee
Journal in ceremonies at 
WTMJ-TV, Milwaukee.

The awards program, now in 
its 17th year, paid tribute to 
some 90 men and women who 
are active members of the 
Wisconsin Army National 
Guard, Wisconsin Air National 
Guard, U.S. Army Reserve, 
U.S. Marine Corps Reserve, 
U.S. Naval Reserve, U.S. Air 
Force Reserve, and U.S. Coast 
Guard Reserve.

Beginning in 1964, the 
Journal Company, in coopera­
tion with the Fifth U.S. Army 
then located in Chicago, Ill., 
presented awards to members 
of the Army National Guard and 
Army Reserve in Wisconsin. 
When the 10-year anniversary 
of the program was observed, it 
was decided to expand the 
program to include all of the 
Reserve Components in Wis­
consin.

To be considered for the gold 
medallion award. Guardsmen 
and Reservists must rate high in 
leadership ability, military 
bearing and citizenship quali­
ties.

Main speaker for this year’s 
ceremony was General John W. 
Vessey, Jr., Vice Chief of the 
Army.

General Vessey also present­
ed the awards to each awardee.

He was assisted by Richard 
Leonard, vice president and 
editor of the Milwaukee Journal 
who was master of ceremonies.

Also taking part in the cere­
mony was a color guard and 
band from the 84th Division, 
U.S. Army Reserve.

The ceremony was video 
taped for broadcast over 
WTMJ-TV, Saturday, August 
30. 1980 at 12:30 p.m. Arrange­
ments are being made with 
other Wisconsin TV stations 
outside the Milwaukee area to 
rebroadcast the program at 
later dates. Watch local listings 
for dates and times.

Guard members honored in­
cluded Sgt. Richard W. Lieven, 
Kewaskum (Air National 
Guard), and Staff Sgt. Richard 
P. Ganser, Campbellsport 
(Army National Guards).

Kewaskum, Other 
Adult Educators 
Nominees for Award

Adult Educators from West 
Bend. Kewaskum and Lomira 
have been nominated to receive 
Moraine Park Technical In­
stitute's Outstanding Adult 
Educator Award. The MPTI 
award was established last year 
to recognize the service and 
dedicated efforts of the parttime 
community service instructors. 
There are nearly 1,000 parttime 
instructors throughout the 
MPTI District.

Winners in the seven Vo- 
cational/Technical/instruction- 
al divisions will be selected by a 
committee of community ser­
vice personnel. Their selection 
will be based on material col­
lected from four sources: nomi­
nation forms from students,

»•••■•■•■•■•■•■•■•■•■•!
Stop Here 

for
FINE FURNITURE 

at
Reasonable Prices
BERRES 

FURNITURE
Hwy, 44 East
West Bend 

■•■•■•■•■•■•■•■•■•■•■•a

center supervisor evaluation, 
and information related to the 
educational and professional 
background of each nominee.

The nominees and their 
teaching are: Mitchell Geb- 
heim, Susan Reschke (Business 
Education); Ray Engelking, 
Ellen Gehrke, Alice Ridolfi, 
Mary Jo Horstman (General 
Education); LaVerne Doll, 
Robin Jasinski, Barbara Shaw, 
Anne Anderson, Suzanne 
Schumacher, Arnold Stommel, 
Leona Clark, Sandra Zahn 
(Home Economics); and Leroy 
Bohn (Safety Education).

The announcement of the 
final selection for the Adult 
Educator will take place at the 
Community Service fall in-ser­
vice meeting held in mid­
October at the MPTI Campus in 
Fond du Lac.

The electric dishwasher is get­
ting more popular every day. 
Researchers find that most hus­
bands would rather buy one 
than be one.

KEMEUV 
PHARfflACY 
^)Your All-Service Pharmacy

102 Main St, Kewaskum—:—Ph. 626-8001

cJVatuTeJWade,

Births
GILDERSLEEVE — A son, 

David Michael, to Freddy and 
Janet Gildersleeve, 451 Lazy 
Lane, Kewaskum, Monday, 
Aug. 11.

WENNINGER — A son to 
Bruce and Caroline Wenninger 
of Kewaskum Friday, Aug. 8.

WELSH — A daughter, Sara 
Jane, to Mr. and Mrs. Robert J. 
Welsh, Route 2, Campbellsport, 
Sunday, Aug. 10.

O’LAUGHLIN — A son, 
Timothy Shawn, to Shawn and 
Gale O’Laughlin, Route 1, 
Campbellsport, Friday, Aug. 
22.

HOLZ — A son, Robert 
William, to Otto and Sharon 
Holz, Campbellsport, Monday, 
Aug. 18.

LOEHR — A son, Clayton 
David, to Greg and Lori Loehr, 
Route 3, Campbellsport, Tues­
day, Aug. 19.

Geri’s
’ BEAUTY SALON

114 Main Street 
Featuring 

; Family Hair Styling 
In Savings & Loan Bldg, 

i |Rear Entrance]
PHONE 626 4455 

MWWMMWMWWMMM

EARLY*^
APPLES 

at the 
Hwy. 28 Bridge 
in Kewaskum

EVERY SATURDAY
9:30-Noon 

ATTENDANT AT APPLE 
BARN AT ALL TIMES

CHERRY HILL
FRUIT FARM

Batavia
WILLIS LIEPERT 

321 Spring St.-Random Lake 
994-4925

HEADQUARTERS FOR

BULOVA .
CARAVELLE

The affordable quality watch... from $29.95

We have a superb selec­
tion of Bulova Caravelle 
watches. All with jewel­
lever movements. All 
magnificently styled. 
Come and see that fine 
watches don't have to 
be expensive.

His: Neatly tailored in chrome 
and stainless steel. With silver 
dial $29 95
Hers: Goidtone with silver 
satin or gilt dial. $44 95

BIER’S JEWELRY
129 Main Street Kewaskum, WI 53040

PHONE 626-2777

GREATER VITAMIN VALUE

^VITAMIN SALE"'
VITAMIN

& C500 mg 
' ----

2^*99^ -59

Sup»> Sport" 

STRESS 
COMPLEX 
WITH IRON

2.99

WMMV MAO* 1
CHEWABLEr-^-w 
»£. fa

1.69
B-1

100 mg
1.99

WATER SOLUBILIZED 

VITAMIN

Si
^^ 400 I.U.

'* rersuat

3.99

NATURAL !
ZINC 
30 mg 
1.97 '

GARLIC 
OIL ?^s

1.97

B-12
500 mcg

399
B COMPLEX 

^ *"*" C 300 -u

» 2.99

DIET 
POTENCY Mui • : I . AM k | M M'PA.

2.99

timeoaelease

BALANCED JHk

B-50
3.99 -*

I Nir RA £ VITAMIN F 

HAND & BODY 
LOTION 

k169

NEW
VITAMIN 1 1 v TAMINC
IINOIU 1 .000 m,

Now Now
$4 97 12 **

NATURAL 
DOLOMITE

197 J

Prices Effective Thru

September 13th!!
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Chamber of
Commerce Elects

At the August 18 meeting of 
the Kewaskum Area Chamber 
of Commerce held at 12:30 p.m. 
at the Savings & Loan meeting 
room, new officers were elected 
as follows: President, Leroy 
Bier; Vice President, Tom 
Bartelt; Secretary-Treasurer, 
Charlene Barutha.

Committee chairpeople pick­
ed were: tourism, Ken Weddig; 
Retail, Judy Klein; Community 
Betterment, Bob Kirst; Mem­
bership, Wayne Remmel.

A discussion was held on the 
proposed parking lot behind 
Glacier Inn to Regal Outlet.

It was reported that cable­
vision is about six months to a 
year behind in West Bend and 
wouldn’t be viewed until late in 
1982 in Kewaskum.

Much discussion was held on 
the businesses that are closing 
and leaving the Kewaskum 
area, the same problem that 
surrounding areas are having 
with the sagging economy and 
no real good solution available.

Some positive and negative 
aspects of the proposed elderly 
housing project between Brook­
lane Dr. and Roseland Dr. were 
discussed.

A lengthy discussion was 
held on how more active partici­
pation could be gotten out of 
more of the members of the 
chamber.

A discussion was held on 
Krazy Daze. It was felt that 
more businesses should get 
together and do projects. In­
stead of having three, four or 
five businesses having a band 
the chamber could organize and 
have only one band and change 
off over the years.

The next scheduled meeting 
is Sept. 15.

4-H Club News
KEWASKUM 4-'ERS

The Kewaskum 4-H’ers went 
on a canoe trip one week ago 
Monday, August 18. We started 
at New Prospect and canoed to 
Mauthe Lake. Then we had a 
picnic and canoed back.

Krazy Daze was a big suc­
cess. We’d like to thank all the 
kids and parents who donated 
food and games. Special thanks 
to all who stopped to buy.

REMINDER
Next 4-H meeting will be held 

Sept. 11, Thursday night.
Record books need to be
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turned in on or before Sept. 11 if 
you want to join again next 
year

You need to hand in all points 
at the meeting.

Reporter, Mark Brodzeller

Two cannibals were lunching 
together, when one made a face 
and declared, “I just don’t like 
my mother-in-law.” The other 
shrugged and replied, “So all 
right, just eat the noodles.”

Our 2% "fear 
Money Market 

Certificate pays 10.00 °/o 
for an annual yield of 

10.669°/o.
(What does your bank pay?)

$100 is all you need to get a healthy return. You can have the Interest 
compounded until the certificate reaches maturity or you can receive a 
monthly, quarterly or semi-annual interest check.

Effective August 21 thru September 3

County Republican
Brat Fry Sept. 6

The Washington County Re­
publican Organization has an­
nounced that its Annual Brat 
Fry will be held Saturday, 
September 6, at Ridge Run 
Park, Scenic Road West, West 
Bend, beginning at 4:00 p.m.

U. S. Senate candidates, 
along with Congressional, State 
Senate and Assembly Repre­
sentatives, and Washington 
County officials will be on hand 
for the event.

Tickets for the Brat Fry are 
$2.75, if purchased in advance, 
and $3.00 at the door. For ticket 
information call 334-4236, 
644-5728, 677-2303 or 673-4909.

Our Six Month Money Market 
Certificate pays 10.500% 

for an annual yield of 10.930%.
With a minimum of $10,000, you can have the advantage of high interest 
rates and the convenience of a short term commitment.

Effective August 28 thru September 3

Whether long term or short term, money market certificates are 
the smart way to invest your savings dollars.
Call or come in to your nearest 
Valley Bank.

Kewaskum Statesman 
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Kewaskum, WI 53040 
Phone 626-2626 
USPS 294-060 
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On August 17, about 110 

descendants of the 49 families 
of (iottlieb and Augusta Freidel 
Eisentraut of Germany as­
sembled at the Boltonville Fire 
Department Hall in Boltonville 
for the noon potluck dinner.

The committee for the tenth 
biennial reunion consisted of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerome Stautz, 
Mr. and Mrs. James Klug, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ervin Saueressig, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Loren Quaas.

Attending the reunion were 
people from throughout Wis­
consin.

Ervin Saueressig led the 
group in prayer before a potluck 
meal was served. During the 
meal. Shelly Sekas entertained 
with musical selections on her 
accordian. Jerome Stautz was 
master of ceremonies.

The program began with 
introductions of families at­
tending the reunion. Prizes 
were given to the grandmother 
with the most grandchildren, 
Mrs. Myrtle Titel, Batavia, 19 
grandchildren; to the lady with 
the most rings, Mrs. Marie 
Held, Cascade. The most re­
cently married couple were 
David and Kris Rosenthal. The 
longest married couple were

Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Stautz, 
Kewaskum, 56 years. The 
oldest woman in attendance 
was Lilly Schneider, Batavia, 86 
years, and the oldest man was 
Art Vorpagel, 80, of Plymouth. 
The youngest baby in attend­
ance was Michael McCoy, 1 
year. The one who traveled the 
farthest distance was Bob 
Schneider, Ridgeland, Wis., 
270 miles.

Commendation was given to 
Mr. and Mrs. Claude Held for 
compiling and printing the sup­
plements to the family tree.

Entertainment consisted of 
vocal musical selection by 
Ralph, Stewart and Bob 
Schneider. Several games of 
Bingo were then enjoyed by all.

The committee for the next 
reunion in 1982 will consist of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Schneider, 
Milwaukee; Mr. and Mrs. El­
wood Eisentraut, Waupaca; Mr. 
and Mrs. Roger Eisentraut, 
Sheboygan Falls; Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruce Burns, Sheboygan Falls.

Trail Happening
Will Be Held at
Cedar Lake Home

with a slide presentation on 
birds. Following this, each 
participant may choose three of 
five one hour study walks being 
offered. These walks, led by 
community environmentalists, 
are: Woodland Plants; Prairie 
Flowers; Trees and Shrubs; 
Rocks; and Environmental 
Awareness.

The Cedar Lake Home 
Campus includes 90 acres of 
hardwood forest plus a Wiscon­
sin prairie.

Registration deadline is Sep­
tember 1. A two dollar donation 
includes lunch. For more infor­
mation, contact the Cedar Lake 
Home Campus, 5595 Hwy. Z, 
West Bend.

the past eight years. For the 
past two years Volkert has 
helped with the Great Lakes 
Beached Bird Survey at Long 
Point Bird Observatory in Port
Rowan, Canada.

The course is 
UW-Washington 
the Washington

sponsored by 
County and 
County UW-

Course on Birds

Rescue Squad Calls
Tuesday, Aug. 19 — Elmer 

Ruplinger, 59, R. 2, Campbell­
sport, taken to St. Joseph's 
Community Hospital, West 
Bend, from his residence in the 
Town of Wayne with fainting 
spells following a farm accident.

Wednesday, Aug. 20 — Mike 
Pettit, 18, 1528 Fond du Lac 
Ave., Kewaskum, taken to St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital 
from his residence with illness.

Saturday, Aug. 23 — Nancy 
A. Feltes, 35. 5237 N. 35th St., 
Milwaukee, removed to St. 
Joseph's Community Hospital 
from Denny's Arco, Hwys. 41 
and 28, with injuries suffered in 
an auto accident.

Monday, Aug. 25 — Heather 
J. Mars, 112-year-old daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Dale Mars, R.

A day nature study program, 
offered for adult leaders of 
youth groups and people in­
terested in environmental edu­
cation, will be held on the Cedar 
Lake Home Campus, Saturday, 
September 13, from 8:30 a.m. to 
2:15 p.m.

The Trail Happening is being 
sponsored by the Campus’ 
Forest, Trail and Prairie Com­
mittee, a volunteer group com­
prised of environmentally in­
terested persons from the great­
er community.

According to the committee, 
the “Happening” is being of­
fered to acquaint community 
members with the trails and 
nature areas of the Cedar Lake 
Home Campus as well as to give 
participants a better under­
standing of how the campus 
may be utilized as a learning 
source.

At 8:30 a.m., the day opens

Offered at UWWC
A birding course titled 

“Ornithology: A Study of Wis­
consin Birds” will be offered 
during September and October.

The course has six lectures on 
a variety of topics including bird 
migration, nesting of birds, bird 
behavior, evolution of bird 
species, bird ecology and intro­
duction to field identification. 
Along with the lectures, three 
field trips will travel to birding 
hotspots in the area.

Bill Volkert. President, Fond 
du Lac County Audubon Society 
will be the course instructor. 
Volket has been birdwatching 
and involved in field surveys for

Extension office. It will be held 
on six consecutive Tuesday 
evenings from 7:00 to 9:00 p.m. 
starting September 9, in 
UWWC’s main building. Field 
trips are scheduled for Saturday 
mornings, September 20, 27 
and October 4. Course in­
struction is $25 per person or 
$35 per couple.

For pre-registration informa­
tion please contact Carol Coak­
ley, Publication Information Of­
fices, UWWC, 400 University 
Drive. West Bend (338-1161) or 
Dan Wilson. Resource Agent, 
UW-Extension, P.O. Box 537, 
West Bend. (338-4480, 644- 
5204, 342-2929). Registration 
closes September 2, 1980.

MARRIAGE BANNS
Marriage banns have been

announced in the Holy Trinity 
church bulletin for Raymond 
Reindl and Susan Nigh, and 
Kenneth Kaehne and Janis 
Karoses.

KEWASKUM

Campus Notes
Scott Wulff of Kewaskum is 

among 220 undergraduate stu­
dents at the University of Wis­
consin-Madison currently com­
pleting work-learn experiences 
as part of the College of Agri­
cultural and Life Sciences 
(CALS) Coordinative Internship 
399 Program.

Wulff, a senior student ma­
joring in Ag Economics, is an 
intern at FmHA, Portage, Wl, 
Farmers Home Administration, 
where James Axness, County 
Supervisor, is the cooperating 
field supervisor.

The program allows students 
to earn degree credits toward 
their major by gaining practical 
career-related work experience 
in a wide variety of agricultural 
and food-related businesses, 
industries, farms and resource- 
related organizations, according 
to Dick Martin, internship pro­
gram coordinator.

“Each student’s fieldwork 
experience is observed and 
evaluated by both the on-the- 
job supervisor and a faculty 
instructor,” Martin explains. 
“Students find learning both 
enjoyable and relevant under 
these supervised, work-learn 
situations. Many even get per­
manent job offers.”

More than 1,700 student 
work-learn programs have been 
developed since the program 
began seven years ago.

PROFESSIONAL PHARMACY
Located on Upper Floor of Sison Medical Bldg. Give your home 

our best.

3, Kewaskum, taken to the 
hospital from Kewaskum High 
School with illness.

Tuesday. Aug. 26 — Clarence 
W. Kocher, 74, 4404 Badger 
Rd. Kewaskum, taken to St. 
Joseph's Community Hospital 
from his residence with injuries 
suffered in a fall.

IF EQUITABLE 
LIFE INSURANCE 

WERE A
CANDY BAR, 

IT WOULD STILL 
COSTA NICKEL.
For example, in 1967. the 

annual premium fora $25,000 
whole life policy on a 35 year 
old man would com you 
$.570.50

Authorized Sales, 
Service & Parts for

• John Deere, Simplicity, 
Ariens Lawn & Garden 

Equipment
• Lawn Boy Mowers 

Green Machine Line 
Trimmers

• Pioneer Chain Saws
• Homelite Chain Saws
• John Deere Chain Saws
• John Deere & Arctic Cat 

Snowmobiles and Clothing
• Evinrude Outboards
• A.M.F. Crestliner, Blue 

Fin & Smoker-Craft Boats
• Shore-land'r, Sportsman, 

Snowbird & Durco Trailers

Free Local Delivery Service

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC

PHONE 626-4222

Bartoli’s Greenhouse
Highway "V", Campbellsport

HOURS:
Monday-Tuesday-Thursday-Friday — 1:00-6:00

SWEET CORN
For the Freezer is Ready Now 

Call in for Special Prices 
on 10 Doz. or More

TOMATOES
POTATOES
SALAD POTATOES

bu. $4.00
101b. $1.49
10 lb. $1.00

Today you'd pay only $ >11.50. 
So it’s no wonder your

Equitable Agent is 
the last holdout 
against 
inflation.

ORV BEHNKE
RON SCHMITZ

626-2155

THE LAST HOLDOUT 
AGAINST INFLATION.

H. Laubenstein 
and Son, Inc.

Sales & Parts Store 
Just Off of Hwy. 45 N. 

Next to Dave’s Music Center 
Ph. 334-0774 West Bend

LAUBENSTEIN 
SERVICE CENTER 
8755 Prospect Drive 

Kewaskum 
Ph 626 2553

Green Seedless GRAPES lb. 79c

HOME GROWN CANTALOUPE 
BEANS and PICKLES

FRESH FRUITS and VEGETABLES

PHONE 533-4092
Open 7 Days a Week! I

OPEN LABOR DAY
Hours: 9 a.m. to 8 p.m., Mon. thru Fri.

9 a.m. to 5 p.m., Sat. and Sun.

Reynolds 
Aluminum

Vinyl-Tuf Siding
Vinyl-Tuf siding offers the best 

features of two long-lasting ma­
terials, aluminum and vinyl. When 
you're talking about siding and you 
ask us to give you our best, we re 
both talking about Vinyl-Tuf siding, 
Reynolds Aluminum’s finest.

Vinyl-Tuf siding is rich, deeply 
embossed with a wood grain pat­
tern, then coated with protective, 
wear-resistant vinyl. You can tell 
it's top quality when you see it and 
feel it. See us today, or call to get a 
free estimate, without obligation.

REYNOLDS 
for ^Utr building inndiHf* in 

ALUMINUM

40 Year
Warranty 

on Material
and Labor

Heberer Bros. Const.
Kewaskum

Roger: 626-2598 
Norm: 626-2491 
Bill: 626-2384



SENTRY Prices Elective 
Aug 25 Through 

Mon Sept 1. 1980

SLICED BACON
B ^119

■ 1 Lb{MH* ■
FOOD STORES

DEAN'S LEANCALIFORNIA SEEDLESS DEAN b LtAN

GRAPES 1% MILK

79 *441I Gallon

From Our Deli
FRESH PORK OR BEEF

JOHNSONVILLE 
BRATWURST 

»17?

FRESH

GROUND 
BEEF

5 Lb. Bag 
RED 

SALAD POTATOES 

99
VANILLA FUDGE. MINT CHOCOLATE CHIP. 

GOLDEN VANILLA. VANILLA, DUTCH 
CHOCOLATE. STRAWBERRIES N CREAM BLACK 

SWEET CHERRY OR BLACK WALNUT

BORDEN OLD FASHIONED
ICE CREAM

SENTRY
POTATO CHIPS
>WC

OSCAR MAYER

WIENERS
REGULAR OR CHEESE

saver’s coupon

I SAVE 

21* 
- 4

ON ANY 3 LB BAG

Fresh
AppleS With Coupon

FROZEN COASTAL

LEMONADE

saver’s coupon m^

SAVE

29*

12 PACK CHOCOLATE OR VANILLA

Borden $470
Ice Cream ^th coupon 

Sandwiches

saver’s coupon
C TWO 8 BOZ PKGS BRAIDS

knotsor NIBBLERS 

Keebler ButterSAVE

31* Flavored F^l19
Pretzels With Coupon

saver’s coupon m^
sourcream’bonion'ornacho

SAVE

19*
0

Doritos
Tortilla 80*
ChipS With Coupon

saver’s coupon

SAVE

31*
0

16 OZ CAN FROZEN

Snow Crop 
Orange ’ |
Juice With Coupon

saver’s coupon ■
7 5OZ BOTTLE FROZEN 

^X MINUTE MAID

SAVE

11*
Pure 
Lemon 
Juice With Coupon

saver's coupon
10 75OZ PKG FROZEN

SAVE Sara JLee
Pound
Cake

♦ -|30
With Coupon

10 Oz 
Box

2 ° RQ* cans
FROZEN

SENTRY WHIPPED TOPPING

, 3 EXCITING PATTERNS - CASUAL ELEGANCE

W STONEWARE
Make A Great Gift!

DINNER PLATE 
SALAD PLATE 
CEREAl BOWL 
CUP 
SAUCER 79*^ V Each

Purchase a 40 Piece Setting For Only *31.60

saver’s coupon

SAVE

2 LB CANREG AOC OR
ELECTRIC PERK

Maxwell

Coffee With Coupon

saver’s coupon

SAVE

33"
52 Q

16 OZ JAR

Coffee Mate
Non Dairy $^30

Creamer With Coupon

saver’s coupon

SAVE

15*

15 OZ PKG

Wheats $136
Cereal with coupon

ALL BEEF FRANKS _

J := \M43
saver’s coupon

TWO16OZ JARS AUNT NELLIE S

saver’s coupon m^
24 32 OZ JAR REFRIGERATED 
w I MAOMtn QPFAR OR

SAVE

21*
SWEET SOUR

Claussen 
Pickles 98*

With Coupon

I o vmm s«nn >n^ sw«"«« Z ’•

SAVE

27*
0

German 
Potato 
Salad

ri 99*
With Coupon

saver’s coupon
WITH |
THESE I

SUPER SAVER! 
COUPONS *

saver’s coupon

SAVE

12*
Total *1”
Cereal With Coupon

saver’s coupon

SAVE

19*
0

10 OZ PKG ALMOND PEANUT. 
COCONUT. CINNAMON OR 
HONEY E» OAT 

Nature Valley 
Granola $ ^ 20 
Bars Wrth coupon

saver’s coupon

SAVE

19*

6 PACK 1 50Z PKGS

Sun Maid 
Seedless 90 
Raisins With Coupon

SAVE

29*

14 OZ PKG KISSES Er 
MINIATURES

Hershey's $n
Candy “

With Coupon

saver’s coupon

saver’s coupon

SAVE

39*
0

24 CT PKG

Pampers Extra
Absorbent ♦2»o

Diapers With Coupon

saver’s coupon
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Extension Agents
Tour Area Farms

A number of agricultural 
enterprises were visited this 
past week by members of the 
Fond du Lac County Agriculture 
and Extension Education Com­
mittee during their annual tour. 
The purpose is to see programs 
and activities Extension Agents 
are conducting to help county 
people.

On the Walter Gatzke farm, 
Campbellsport, the Committee 
learned about the importance of 
bees, the production of crops 
and the production of honey. 
The Gatzkes have a beautiful 
bee farm with over two hundred 
colonies. He pointed out the 
problems and concerns of bee­
keepers in raising bees which 
can help Extension Agents in 
developing educational pro­
grams.

The Committee also visited 
the Sam Gudex, Jr. and Son 
farm, south of Campbellsport. 
Here they saw his remodeled 
barn, storage, manure handling 
system, farm shop and learned 
about his father-son partnership 
they have developed, and also a 
new heat exchange system of 
heating hot water by using the 
heat from milk as it is being 
cooled.

At the Bernard Sheridan farm 
the group saw ten calves pro­
duced by the embroyo trans­
plant method from one cow. 
This is a new technique of 
extending the genetics of cows 
rather quickly.

On the Ray and Bernard 
Halbur farm the Committee saw 
the result of minimum tillage, 
dairy beef, calf housing, con­
tour strips and a milk house 
heat exchanger.

In addition the Committee 
viewed changes in land use in 
the county such as subdivisions 
and crop production practices.

On the tour were Erwin 
Jonas. George Haase, Charles 
Birschbach. Jr., and H. A. 
Reinecke, Fond du Lac Agri­
cultural Agent.

Awarded Degree at
UW-Stevens Point

More than 200 bachelor's and 
master's degrees were con­
ferred August 1 at commence­
ment ceremonies marking the 
end of the University of Wis­
consin-Stevens Point's 73rd an­
nual summer session.

Former Acting Gov. Martin 
Schreiber told the class that it 
has reason to be optimistic 
about the future. Americans 
have the capabilities and spirit 
to maintain their democracy, he 
explained.

Schreiber had just returned 
from a trip to Peru where he had 
accompanied First Lady Rosa­
lynn Carter to the inauguration 
of that country’s new president. 
Peru has recently gone from a 
military dictatorship to a demo­
cratic government thanks to the 
spirit of the Peruvian people, 
the former governor explained. 
Though they aren't as poor as 
Peruvians, Schreiber said 
Americans' affluence isn't a 
detarrent to their determination 
of maintaining their freedom 
and system of self government.

Class members who received 
degrees from UW-SP Chan­
cellor Philip Marshall included 
Kerry Zielieke, 221 Forest St., 
Campbellsport. Bachelor of Sci­
ence, Communicative Disor­
ders.

LETTERS 
TO THE 

EDITOR

Route 2, Box 15B1 
Campbellsport, W1 53010 
August 25, 1980

Kewaskum Statesman 
250 Main St.
Kewaskum, W1 53040
To the Editor:

Recently completed, the 2nd 
Annual Kewaskum Area Closed 
Tennis Tournament was an 
enjoyable event for all those 
who played, and especially so 
for those who won!

Many people aided in the 
running of the tournament, but 
it no doubt would not have been 
held, were it not for the 
generosity of the Kiwanis Club 
of Kewaskum for the majority of 
the funding, and the Village of 
Kewaskum for the use of the 
courts and additional financial 
help.

Thanks to both organizations, 
to those who helped out, and to 
those who signed up and play­
ed. We look forward to a larger, 
better tournament (and better 
weatherl next year.

Respectfully, 
Bill Meeh, 
Tournament Director

Conservation
Meeting Held

To assure that on-going con­
servation practices are provid­
ing effective solutions to soil 
and water problems in Wash­
ington County, the Agricultural 
Conservation Program develop­
ment group met on August 14, 
at the ASCS office in West Bend 
to review the practices to be 
offered for 1981.

In reviewing the practices, 
the group considered public 
benefits, the need to halt soil 
and water loss, and the need to 
reduce agricultural pollution, 
Ira A. Oelhafen, Chairperson of 
the county ASC committee, 
said.

The ACP provides enduring 
solutions to soil and water 
conservation and agriculture re­
lated pollution problems. The

You Are Always Welcome at

AMBER HOTEL 
139 West Main St., 
Campbellsport, 533-8816

Golfer’s Special-Salad Plate 
Wed., Noon-11 a.m. to 2 p.m.

Thursday Night
Chopped Sirloin Plate, Salad, and Choice of Potato, 

ora Reuben Sandwich, French Fries, & Salad.
Serving Weekdays 11:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m.

Monday thru Thursday Evenings 4 to 10 p.m.
Friday and Saturday 4 to 11 p.m.

Sundays 12 noon to 8 p.m. 
Dally Specials!!

Monday—Tenderloin Tips
Tueeday-Roast Pork & Sauerkraut
Wednesday-Barbecued Ribs
Thursday-French Fried Lobster Chunks 
Friday-Pike, Haddock, Poor Man’s Lobster 
Saturday-Barbecued Ribs

Reservations accepted everyday, 
except Friday evenings.

Your hosts Dale and Lois.

program provides both financial 
and technical assistance to 
farmers whose land is affected 
by wind or water erosion, or 
pollution problems.

Oelhafen said the county 
committee encourages farmers 
to correct soil and water conser­
vation problems, and, where 
needed, assists them with cost­
share payments. "Our primary 
concern is saving soil, improv­
ing woodlands, keeping lakes 
and streams free from agricul­
tural pollution, and cleaning up 
farmland after natural dis­
asters," he said.

Farmers participating in the 
ACP are applying such conseri 
vation measures as grass water­
ways, contour strips, forestry, 
etc. Input from other agri-relat- 
ed agencies invited recommend 
the practices most needed.

PACE Scholarship
Winner Announced

The first recipient of the 
annual PACE Scholarship is 
Karen Beimborn. Elaine Shane- 
brook, current PACE President, 
and Maureen Josten, Vice-Pre­
sident and Scholarship Com­
mittee Member, presented the 
check to Ms. Beimborn at a 
recent meeting at the Washing­
ton House. West Bend.

Ms. Beimborn is a student at 
the University of Wisconsin 
Center-Washington County pre­
paring to enter the School of 
Nursing at UW-Milwaukee. Ms. 
Beimborn, who was named to 
the UWWC Deans List with 
highest honors of 4.0, or 
straight A's, is the mother of 
three children, ages 13, 15 and 
17, and the wife of Eugene 
Beimborn. The family resides 
on Terrace Drive in West Bend.

PACE, a West Bend area 
group of professional and 
business women, will give $500 
scholarships yearly to women 
over 25 who are continuing their 
education, either to change 
careers or improve their career 
options. Scholarships are 
awarded on the basis of finan­
cial need, two letters of recom­
mendation. the completed ap­
plication form, and a personal 
interview by the Scholarship 
Committee. The PACE Board of 
Directors selects the recipient.

Members of the 1980 Scholar­
ship Committee were Lee Bohl- 
mann, ‘Maureen Josten and

Mary Howard. Anyone in­
terested in applying for the 1981 
scholarship should contact any 
member of PACE or a member

of the Scholarship Comittee. 
Applications for the 1981 
scholarship should be sub­
mitted by March 1, 1981.

Back to the 3 Rs . . . Plus I’s

This year something new has been added.
Before students return to the 3 R’s, state law 140.05 (16l requires 
that they be immunized against such diseases as measles, rubella, 
polio, diphtheria, tetanus, and pertussis. This la* applies to students 
through grade 12 and those in day care centers beginning with the 
1980-81 school year.
Immunizations and further information are available from your phy­
sician or local public health agency.

Let the I’s Add up to 
Good Health!

Space donated by this publication.

Appearing at

GARY CROSS
Every Tuesday 

8:30 P.M. - 12:30 A.M.

Serving from 12 Noon

Closed Tuesday, Sept. 2

8355 Prospect Rd.
10c BEER

7:00-8:00 P.M.

OPEN LABOR DAY

Specials—Served from 5 to 10 p.m.
Fri.-Fresh Fish Fry and Shrimp in the Basket
Sat. & Sun.-Prime Rib, Porterhouse, and

Steak for Two.

Tues.-Wed.-Thurs. Special’! 
Barbecued or Breaded Pork Chops, 

and Roast Beef Dinner, and 
Denny and Betty’s Special 8 oz. or 5 oz. 

Chopped Sirloin!!

Swiss Steak, Chicken, or Ham Plates- 
Served Sunday from noon til 4

Regular menu served from noon to 10 p.m.

. Fin-n-Feather
t New Prospect
• Phone 533-4135

Dennis & Betty Krueger 
Your Hosts 

For reservations
Call 533-4135
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Dreyfus’ 4.4% Cut in State Spending

The board of directors of the 
Wisconsin Farmers Union has 
assailed Governor Dreyfus’ 
across-the-board, 4.4 percent 
cut in state spending, calling it 
“an irresponsible act that will 
worsen the financial burden of 
Wisconsin property taxpayers 
— particularly of farmers who 
must pay a large share of the 
property taxes in rural school 
districts.”

Issuing a statement on behalf 
of the board, which met at 
Chippewa Falls July 28, WFU 
President Leland Mulder said 
the cut-backs would reduce the 
amount of state aid flowing back 
to local units of government and 
school districts. “Local govern­
ment and school boards which 
have already done a lot of belt 
tightening may be forced to 
increase property taxes to make 
up for the lost state aid,” 
Mulder said. “This is going to 
hit hard on farmers and others 
with already large property tax 
bills,” he added.

In the face of a projected $150 
million state budget deficit, the 
Dreyfus administration ordered 
all state spending, including 
aids to localities, to be reduced 
by 4.4%. The order will mean 
$38.5 million less to school 
districts. $20 million less for 
local governments, $20 million 
less in direct property tax 
credits and millions less for 
counties and VTAE districts.

Mulder said during debate on 
the tax cut bill of 1979, Dreyfus 
pressured legislators into using 
a large part of the budget 
surplus at that time to reduce 
income taxes, which are based 
on the ability to pay. Mulder 
said Dreyfus has also pursed a 
policy of deliberately maintain­
ing a small balance in the state 
treasury.

“Now that the economic re­
cession is decreasing state tax 
collections, the Governor is 
trying to cover up his fiscal 
mismanagement by forcing a 
back door increase in property 
taxes.” Mulder said.

Small Business Tax
Workshop at MPTI

For small business owners 
who are seeking to gain a better 
understanding of federal and 
state taxes, an evening tax 
workshop will be offered at the 
Moraine Park Technical In­
stitute, beginning this fall in 
Fond du Lac, West Bend, and 
Beaver Dam.

Taught by CPA John Moehr, 
the workshop highlights tax 
benefits and obligations con­
nected with a small business 
and emphasizes, employer tax 
responsibilities.

The class begins on Tuesday, 
September 9, in Fond du Lac; 
Tuesday, October 7, in West 
Bend; and Thursday, Septem­
ber 11, in Beaver Dam. The 
class will run for four con­
secutive weeks and is limited to 
25 enrollees at each location. 
The cost is $5.65 per person for 
the four sessions.

Interested persons may re­
serve a space in class in Fond 
du Lac and Beaver Dam by 
calling the respective campuses 
— (414) 922-8611 in Fond du 
Lac; (414) 887-1107 in Beaver 
Dam; and (414) 334-3413 in 
West Bend. In the W'est Bend 
area, registrants may call to 
reserve a space in class but all 
fees must be paid before the 
class starts.

“In a typical conservation 
fashion, (Governor Dreyfus is 
shifting the burden of the 
projected deficit to the property 
taxpayer. The Governor has 
used the large budget surplus of 
1979 to reduce the progressive 
income tax at the expense of the 
hard pressed property owners,” 
Mulder charged.

“This is wrong and a clear 
reversal of the policy of the last 
ten years which has been to 
shift costs away from the 
property tax. I think the tax­
payers of Wisconsin should let 
the Governor know that we 
don’t accept his plan to solve his 
budget deficit at the expense of 
the property taxpayer.”

Mulder also said the Gover­
nor was being hypocritical by 
urging state agencies and local 
officials to cut spending, but 
approving large pay increase for 
top state officials.

“At the same time he was 
cutting tax relief for property 
owners,” Mulder said, “the 
Governor was giving his highly 
paid staff and department 
secretaries salary increase as 
high as 10.2%.”

LIVE MUSIC
^An^eiKlyi

Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum!

Friday, Septembers
ROCKET 88

8:30- 12:30
Sponsored by the Sno-Cougars 

FREE BEER 8:00-9:00

Sunday, September 7
WHITE LIE

9:00-12:30
FREE BEER 8:30 - 9:30

DAI1CE
Friday 

August 29
5

TRIPLE J’S
Country Western and Rock 

8:30-1:00 — Admission $2.00 — Children Under 12 FREE

Saturday, August 30
JUKE BOX JUNKIES

Music from the 50’s and 60 s
8:30-1:00 — No Cover Charge

Evory Tuesday “” Country Western Music (

Sept. 2 — HICKORY WIND
Featuring

BOB CROSS and CHUCK BARTELT I
8 00 p.m. to ? — NO COVER CHARGE (

JOHN and DEE’S 1
1310 Riverview Dr. • Kewaskum

Hall Available for Weddings and Parties *

Phone 626-4747______ '

Includes a Donkey Race!!
Tickets Available At The Campbellsport News, 

West Bend Savings and Loan in Kewaskum, and 3R’s Boltonville

HOLY TRINITY SCHOOL
Monday, Sept. 1 — No School
Tuesday, Sept. 2 — Turkey 

sandwich, green beans, peach­
es, pumpkin square.

W'ednesday, Sept. 3 — Beef 
cubes over rice, corn, carrots, 
dinner roll, cookie.

Thursday, Sept. 4 — Meat­
balls w/gravy, mashed pota­
toes, peas.

Friday, Sept. 5 — Grilled 
cheese, peanut butter sand­
wich, applesauce, pork & 
beans, O’Henry bar.

Each meal will be served with 
a ‘4 pt. of milk.

KEWASKUM 
COMMUNITY SCHOOLS

Monday, Sept 1 — LABOR 
DAY-No School.

Tuesday, Sept. 2 — Ham­
dinger on a bun, slice of cheese, 
French fries, pork-beans, sweet 
& dill pickles, and chocolate 
cake.

Wednesday, Sept. 3 — Tur­
key and gravy over mashed 
potatoes, buttered corn and 
chocolate brownie.

Thursday, Sept. 4 — Wiener 
winks, potatoe chips, apple­
sauce, carrot and celery sticks.

green beans and sliced peaches.
Friday, Sept. 5 — Spaghetti 

and meat sauce, lettuce salad, 
fruit cocktail and chocolate chip 
cookie.

Menus are subject to change.
Each meal served with bread, 

butter and/or margarine and 
milk.

WOW TRI COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU
Kewaskum

American Legion Post 384
Monday, Sept. 1 — Labor 

Day —No Meal Served.
Tuesday. Sept. 2 — Baked 

pork chop, escalloped potatoes, 
buttered mixed vegetables, 
French bread, fresh banana.

Thursday, Sept. 4 — Cube 
steak/brown gravy, oven 
browned potatoes, escalloped 
corn, French bread, chilled

DONKEY BALL

FEATURING THE WORLD FAMOUS 
CROSBY DONKEY BALL DONKEYS 

FROM CHIPPEWA FALLS, WISCONSIN

Sunday, August 31st, at 1 p.m.
at the New Fane Sportsmen’s Club

4 miles north of Kewaskum

Sponsored by New Fane Kettle Riders, Inc..
Advance $2.00, At The Door $2.50

citrus fruit cup.

FOND DU LAC COUNTY
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY
Campbellsport Senior Center 

Campbellsport. WI.
Monday, Sept. 1 — MEAL­

SITE CLOSED-LABOR DAY!
Tuesday, Sept. 2 — Veal 

steaks, boiled potatoes, gravy, 
vegetable medley, cucumber 
salad, bread, butter, frosted 
cake, milk, coffee.

Wednesday, Sept. 3 — Beef 
liver, mashed potatoes, green 
beans, lettuce, bread, butter, 
apple pie, milk, coffee.

Thursday. Sept. 4 — Mealsite 
Closed — FDL County Picnic - 
— Waupun.

Friday. Sept. 5 — Baked fish, 
tater tots, corn on cob, cabbage 
slaw, bread, butter, cantaloupe, 
milk, coffee.
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25 Years Ago
September 2, 1955

During the past week two 
more cases of polio were report­
ed at Kewaskum, bringing the 
total cases to date to 12 here. 
The two new cases since our last 
issue are Gilbert Reindl, Town 
of Kewaskum, who is the third 
member of his family stricken 
with the disease. He is the 
father of Robert, 7, and Mary 
11, who were both stricken 
earlier. The other new case is 
Sandi Weddig, 3, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry Weddig, 
Jr. of this village.

The opening of the Kewas­
kum public schools will be 
postponed from Tuesday, Sep­
tember 6, to Monday, Septem­
ber 12, because of the pre­
valence of polio in the area.

Five young men from Kewas­
kum and the surrounding area 
have enlisted in the United 
States Air Force and left August 
31 to report for service in 
Milwaukee. From there they 
were sent to Lackland Air Force 
Base, Texas. The youths are: 
Harold C. Klein and Norman 
Walz, Kewaskum; Jack Spartz 
and Roger Kumrow, St. 
Michaels, and Ralph Buechel, 
Beechwood.

St. John’s Lutheran Church, 
New Fane, was the scene of the 
wedding of Miss Eleanor Eliza­
beth Odekirk, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Harry Odekirk, Route 
2. Campbellsport, and Martin 
Edmund Haack, Kewaskum, on 
August 27.

A daughter was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Allen Hintz, Camp­
bellsport, on August 28, and a 
son was born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Theodore Schoofs, Route 2, 
Kewaskum, on August 26

tion of Highway 28 will make 
the route follow County Trunk S 
through sections 35, 25 and 26 
in the Town of Auburn. Under 
the new plan it will pass 
through Beechwood and New 
Fane and omit Boltonville and 
Batavia. The present route 
starts at Minnesota Junction 
and passes in a northeasterly 
direction through Mayville and 
Theresa. At Theresa the route 
turns north, duplicating High­
way 41 for a short distance and 
then runs directly east through 
the northern part of townships 
in Washington County.

September 2, 1905
Telephone wires are to be 

placed on the poles of the 
North-Western road between 
Milwaukee and Fond du Lac, to 
be used in cases of emergency 
when the telegraph wires fail to 
work. The telephone can also be 
used for the operation of trains 
by officials who are not familiar 
with the workings of the tele­
graph, when there is no opera­
tor on duty.

A force of railroad carpenters 
have been working here for the 
past two weeks making repairs 
on the cattle yards and platform 
around the depot.

The Washington County Fair 
will be held at West Bend on 
Monday, Tuesday and Wednes­
day, September 18, 19 and 20.

A baby boy was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Joost of Ke­
waskum last Sunday.

Herman Marks, proprietor of 
the New Kewaskum Store, has 
put in a complete stock of 
groceries and will hereafter take 
all kinds of farm produce in 
trade.

"Fish and guests in three days 
are stale." John Lyly

Cedar Lake Home
‘■'The fourth annual Campus 

Fall Festival will be held at the 
Cedar Lake Home on Sunday, 
September 28,” Cedar Lake 
Home Campus foundation Pre­
sident, Charles Hammer an­
nounced.

The special day for com­
munity families to enjoy begins 
at 11:00 a.m. with a ham 
luncheon in the House of Fel­
lowship. A wide variety of 
activities, entertainment and 
sales will run from noon until 
5:00 p.m.

Activities include hay rides to 
the lakefront, carriage rides, 
pony rides, a petting zoo, 
home-talent side shows and 
carnival fun games.

Entertainment consists of a 
resident musicale, band music 
and dance music, antique car 
display, and a bus tour of the 
new contemporary village.

Sales include the ham lunch­
eon from 11 through 2 p.m.; an 
outdoor cafe with ho-made chili 
and snacks; a brat-hamburger 
stand; a craft sale and bake 
sale.

The annual Fall Festival, 
according to Hammer, is spon­
sored by the Campus Founda­
tion to provide families with the 
opportunity to bring young and 
old together to enjoy the beauti­
ful 215 acre campus. Receipts 
are used by the Foundation for 
campus charitable projects.

Marriage Licenses
Jeffrey A. Halfmann, 173 

Mill St., ('ampbellsport, and 
Vicki L. Narges, Route 1, Eden.

Mason J. Luedtke and 
Kathleen A. Schneider, both of 
Route 1, Campbellsport.

Joel E. Miller, 235 Spring St., 
Campbellsport, and Danielle L. 
Rauls, 183 E Third St., Fond du
Lac.

MASONRY romTOMW^

Health Tips Listed 
For New School Year

School days are almost 
here again for millions of 
American youngsters.

With the approach of the 
fall term, the American 
Medical Association re­
minds parents once again 
that there are health and 
safety considerations that are 
important in preparing the 
youngsters for another nine 
months of studies.

A thorough physical ex­
amination is indicated for the 
5 or 6-year-old who is start­
ing school for the first time. 
Your physician will know 
what to do. His or her exam­
ination will cover all aspects 
of your child’s health The 
doctor will check hearing (to 
make certain the child can 
hear the teacher) and vision 
(to make sure he or she can 
see the blackboard). If 
booster immunization shots 
are needed they can be given 
at this time.

School boards in some 
communities require a health

exam for beginning students. 
Some school districts require 
immunizations against infec­
tious diseases. Your doctor 
will know of the require­
ments in your neighborhood.

Most doctors feel that four 
or five health examinations 
during the school years are 
sufficient for healthy chil­
dren. These usually are 
spaced at the start of the first 
year, about the fourth grade, 
about the seventh grade, at 
the ninth or tenth grade, and 
upon graduation A thorough 
examination is important be­
fore the child begins partici­
pation in athletics, and most 
schools require this. More 
frequent exams may be 
needed if the child has a 
health problem that needs 
checking.

In the excitement of the 
first few days of school, the 
smaller child may forget all 
of the safety warnings 
you've been teaching. Each 
parent should make sure the 
child knows how to cross 
streets and intersections en 
route to and from school.’ 
Each child should know that 
crossing guards are there for 
his or her protection and 
obey them. Children should 
know about proper deport 
ment on the school bus. and 
should know the rules of 
bicycle safety.

September. 1980 
Frank Chappell 
Science News Editor 
AMA

August 29, 1930
The Froemming Bros, com­

pleted the work of paving Main 
Street from curb to curb and 
building new sidewalks on the 
west side of the concrete 
bridge, and an 18 foot stretch of 
road extending from the bridge 
out to the east city limits, just 
east of the Holy Trinity ceme­
tery, last Saturday forenoon.

Mr. O. F. Schwartz, manager 
of the Schwartz tavern at St. 
Kilian, has completed arrange­
ments for the Big Carnival 
dance which he will sponsor on 
September 1.

The Fond du Lac County 
Highway Commission will favor 
the re-location of Highway 28 
when a hearing on the proposed 
change is held Sept. 10 at 
Kewaskum. Changing the loca­

DUNDEE 
Sand & Gravel 
G. Ramthun Ph. 533-4549
Washed Sand. Crushed 

Gravel, Stone and 
Lime Chips 
Also Gravel 

and Sand Fill.
FOR THE BEST OF 

CONCRETE MA TERIALS

LU
LU 
DC a
2 
5

CHIMNEYS
TUCK POINTING 
PARAPET WALLS 
CHINKING

Phone Wm. Dreier 
334-4945

WOOD HEAT
COMPLETE LINE OF WOOD STOVES IN STOCK

• Forced Air Add-Ons
• Free Standing Stoves

We Also Install Metal and

• Boiler Add-Ons
• Fireplace Inserts

Masonry Chimneys

ECONOMY SALES
Phone: 533*4857

Location: Hwy. 45 north of Kewaskum, 4*/i miles to Sunset Dr.
STORE HOURS: 1 to 5 daily; 9 to 5 Saturdays or by appointment.

on LADSON

Model 100
ALUMINUM COMBINATION

STORM 
WINDOWS

SPECIAL PRICES 
FROM

AUG. 11 through SEPT. 20

5% OFF
PLUS... 15% Federal Tax Credit

All Windows are Fully 
Weatherstripped for 
All Weather 
Protection.

128 Main, Kewaskum
626-2164

THIS MEANS FUEL SAVINGS YEAR AROUND

SOFT WHITE EARTH-TONE BROWN
NATURAL ALUMINUM
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Women Opens Office at Germantown

Friends for Battered Women 
of Washington County is 
pleased to announce the recent 
opening of their new office in 
Germantown to service the 
people of Germantown and the 
surrounding communities of 
Washington County. Services 
that will be provided by this 
office are: community education 
regarding the problems and 
possible solutions for battered 
women and their families, 
volunteer recruitment to service
the agency in a variety of 
functions, counseling, advocacy 
and referral of battered women.

Our office is located in the 
Century 21 Building, N112- 
W15568 Mequon Road, on the 
corner of Mequon and Pilgrim 
Roads. The telephone number 
is 255-6702. Office hours are 
8:00 a.m.-5:00 p.m. Monday 
through Friday. Evening hours 
can be arranged by appoint­
ment. In addition to the services 
in the Germantown office we 
also provide similar services 
through our West Bend office 
which is located on the second 
floor of St. Joseph's Hospital.

The phone number in West 
Bend is 334-7298. When there is 
no answer at either of these 
numbers, those needing as­
sistance can call The Open Door 
Society 24 hour hot line at these

More 
Gas Heat 

Per 
Dollar!

numbers: Cermantown - toll 
free 933-7300. Hartford - 644- 
6016, and West Bend - 334- 
4636. Follow-up service will be 
provided as quickly as possible.

We have had a great re­
sponse from civic groups re­
garding speaking engagements. 
If there are any organizations 
who have not been contacted 
who would like to schedule a 
presentation on the timely and 
important issue of battered 
women for one of your program
meetings, please call Diana 
Strauss, Coordinator of the 
(iermantown office of Friends 
for Battered Women of Wash­
ington County at 255-6702.

We are presently compiling a 
list of volunteers. If you fee) you 
would be interested in vol­
unteering your time and ser­
vices either now or in the 
future, please call our office. 
There are a variety of ways in 
which your services can be of 
assistance to us.

We are in the process of 
assembling a list of people who 
would be interested in joining a 
support group to discuss their 
problems and various solutions. 
We will schedule the meetings 
at a time and place that is

PAINTING
Interior & Exterior 

Experienced 
Reasonable Rates 
PHONE 626-2481

convenient to those interested 
persons. If the response is great 
enough, we will have female 
groups, male groups and 
couples groups. Any interested 
parties should call Friends for 
Battered Women at either office 
or write: Friends for Battered 
Women, P.O. Box 185, Ger­
mantown, Wisconsin 53022.

It is important to be aware 
that you do not have to ex­
perience a catastrophic situa­
tion before you look for help. If 
you feel that you have been 
abused, you should be aware 
that you are not alone and that 
there are people who care and
can help you.

County Soil 
Conservationist
Is Transferred

Leslie Meadows, Soil Conser­
vationist with the Soil Con­
servation Service, working in 
the West Bend Field Office, was 
promoted and transferred to 
Lancaster. Wisconsin, Field Of­
fice. She has worked in Wash­
ington County for one year in a 
training position and started in

ROGER STREAN
AGGREGATES

• WASHED SAND & STONE
• CRUSHED ROCK
• ROAD GRAVEL
• LIME CHIPS

Pick-up or Delivery

Happy Hollow Road
Off Hwy. 45 — Waucousta 

533-8207 or 533-4259

KAREN and BILL 
BREITZMAN

Phone 533-8094

Lancaster August 25.
Lancaster is located in Grant 

County in the far southwestern 
part of Wisconsin adjacent to 
the Mississippi River where 
Wisconsin, Illinois, Iowa and 
Minnesota meet. Grant is a very 
large rural county, unglaciated 
with steep slopes and deep silty 
soil well suited to terraces and 
contour strip cropping.

Ms. Meadow will continue to 
do basically the same type of 
work in Grant as she has been 
doing in Washington County. 
The work will consist of plann­
ing and installation of manure 
storage facilities, contour strip 
cropping, grassed waterways, 
diversions, erosion control 
structures and terraces. Since 
Washington County is a rapidly 
urbanizing area, Leslie had

503 Fond du Loc Ave. 
Campbellsport, Wl 53010

The Cabinet Shop
Quality Wood or 

Formica Cabinets and Counter Tops

DICK IMMEL

Donald Herriges 
Heating

• Furnace Cleaning

some involvment ‘in solving 
landuse problems associated 
with erosion and sediment con­
trol in subdivisions. All of her 
activities have been directed to 
implement the district goals of 
soil erosion control, improved 
water quality and proper land­
use planning.

Leslie Meadows and her hus­
band, Mike, are both pilots and 
it might just happen that they 
will visit West Bend via airplane 
sometime.

Both the Hawaiian Islands 
and Puerto Rico were pro­
duced by volcanic action.

533-8522 or 
533-8270

Free Estimates

Enjoy heating comfort plus 
maximum efficiency with a 
LENNOX CONSERVATOR tm 
gas furnace.

Custom Pinstriping
317 N. Railroad St., Campbellsport, Wl 53010

• Boiler Repairs

Heating Specialist
HOT MIX ASPHALT PAVING

ROADS-PARKING AREAS-DRIVEWAYS 
FLOORS-FARM YARDS-TENNIS COURTS

RAM
CONSTRUCTION INC.

For FREE Estimates Call Day or Night

921-4816
Address P.O. Box 98, Byron, Wl 53009

604 Mill Road, Route 1 
Kewaskum — Ph. 626-2388

Electronic ignition, heat­
saver flue damper and 
DURACURVE® heat ex­
changer give you more fur­
nace, more heat for your 
money.

Get a free estimate from the 
energy savers at:

JOHANN, INC
•Plumbing • Heating 

• Air Conditioning
Located in St Michaels, 

3 miles east of Kewaskum 
on Hwv. 28

Daily 8-5; Fri. til 9; Sat. 'til 1

Phone 334-9431

CUSTOM ALUMINUM TRIM 
Revere Vinyl-Clad Aluminum Siding 

40 Year Warranty
Mastic - T Lock Vinyl Siding

40 Year Warranty
Doors and Windows 

Mirro-Guard Aluminum Siding 
Soffit & Fascia Systems 

Larson Storm Doors and Windows 
Seamless Aluminum Gutters

Roofing
Insulation — Sidewalls — Attics 

FREE ESTIMATES

Guell & Bertram Siding
Route 2, Campbellsport, Wisconsin 53010

If You Are Planning to Build a New Home, 
Garage, Do Some Remodeling, Roofing, 
Siding, or Farm Construction —

CUT DOWN ON COSTS WITH US 
DOING THE ENTIRE JOB.

We Charge Only for Materials and 
Labor — No Middle Profits

20 YEARS 
EXPERIENCE

FREE 
ESTIMATES

TIM GUELL 
533-4980

JERRY BERTRAM 
626-8095

Gitter Construction
R. 1, Campbellsport 

Phone 533-4941
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Minutes of Village
Board Meeting

Monthly Meeting 
August 18, 1980 
8:00 P.M.

The Village Board of Kewas­
kum, Washington County, Wis­
consin, met in regular monthly 
session in the Council Room of 
the Municipal Building.

President Gerald Stollenwerk 
presided. All Village Trustee 
Members were present.

The minutes of the meetings 
of July 30th, 1980, and of 
August 4, 1980, were approved 
as printed upon motion by 
Trustee Herriges, seconded by 
Trustee Rohrer. Voice vote was 
unanimous.

James D. Reigle, President of 
Regal Ware, Inc., together with 
Ned Sengpiel explained to the 
Village Board Members Regal 
Ware’s proposed plans for an 
estimated two million dollar 
addition to their Kewaskum 
plant and requested that the 
Village Board consider favor­
able approval to two resolutions 
which would allow the issuance 
of industrial revenue bonds to 
finance the project. Richard 
Weiss of the law firm of Foley 
and Lardner explained to the 
Village Board the mechanics of 
industrial revenue bonding.

After the presentation, mo­
tion was made by Trustee 
Rohrer and seconded by 
Trustee D. Nigh that the Board 
suspend with the rules and 
move to 8 (a) and 8 (b) of the 
agenda to consider two pro­
posed resolutions. Voice vote 
was unanimous.

The following resolution was 
introduced by Trustee David 
Nigh.

Resolution No. 80-3

INITIAL RESOLUTION 
RELATING TO 

INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT 
REVENUE BOND FINANCING 

ON BEHALF OF 
REGAL WARE, INC.

WHEREAS, the Village of 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin (the 
“Municipality”) is a municipal 
corporation organized and exist­
ing under and pursuant to the 
laws of the State of Wisconsin 
and is authorized by Section 
66.521 Wisconsin Statutes, as 
amended (hereinafter some­
times referred to as the “Act”), 
to:

(a) issue revenue bonds to fi­
nance ail or any part of the costs 
of the construction, equipping, 
reequipping, acquisition, pur­
chase, installation, recon­
struction, rebuilding, rehabili­
tation, improving, supplement­
ing, replacing, maintaining, re­
pairing, enlarging, extending or 
remodeling of a project which 
qualifies under the Act and the 
improvement of the site there­
for; and

(b) enter into a revenu agree­
ment with an eligible partici­
pant pursuant to which the 
eligible participant agrees to 
cause said project to be con­
structed and to pay the Munici­
pality an amount of funds 
sufficient to provide for the 
prompt payment when due of 
the principal of and interest on 
said revenue bonds: and

WHEREAS, Regal Ware, 
Inc., a Wisconsin corporation 
(the “Eligible Participant”) has 
been considering undertaking a 
project in the Municipality, and 
the Eligible Participant has 
represented to the Muncipality

that it would be an encourage­
ment and inducement for the 
Eligible Participant to proceed 
if the project could be financed 
with revenue bonds; and

WHEREAS, the Eligible 
Participant has represented that 
the intended use of the project 
is for the purpose of manufac­
turing and warehousing of cook­
ware products and that the 
project would consist of a 
building addition and equip­
ment (hereinafter called the 
“Project”); and

WHEREAS, the Eligible 
Participant has estimated that 
the cost of the Project would be 
approximately $1,000,000 but, 
with allowance for modifica­
tions, design changes, and in­
flation could be as high as 
$2,000,000; and

WHEREAS, prior to the date 
of adoption of this Resolution, a 
statement which provides a 
good faith estimate of attorney 
fees which are expected to be 
paid from proceeds of the 
revenue bonds has been filed 
with the Clerk and with the 
Department of Business De­
velopment of the State of Wis­
consin, or its successor; and

WHEREAS, it is in the public 
interest of the Municipality to 
promote, attract, stimulate, re­
habilitate and revitalize com­
merce, industry and manufac­
turing, to promote the better­
ment of the environment and 
the economy of the Municipality 
and to stimulate a large flow of 
private investment funds into 
the Municipality; and

WHEREAS, it is the finding 
and determination of this body 
that the Project is a qualified 
“project” within the meaning 
of the Act and that the Eligible 
Participant is an “eligible 
participant” within the mean­
ing of the Act; and

WHEREAS, it is the finding 
and determination of this body 
that the Municipality would 
derive public benefits from the 
Project and its operation, in­
cluding by way of illustration 
but not limitation the following: 
the provision and retention of 
gainful employment opportuni­
ties for the citizens of the 
Municipality; the stimulation of 

the flow of investment capital 
into the Municipality with re­
sultant beneficial effects on the 
economy in the Municipality; 
and the preservation and en­
hancement of the Muncipality’s 
tax base; and

WHEREAS, it is the finding 
and determination of this body 
that the public interest will be 
served if the Municipality were 
to encourage and induce the 
Eligible Participant to under­
take the Project in the Munici­
pality;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT 
RESOLVED:

1. Subject to the conditions

specified in paragraph 2, the 
Municipality shall pursue and 
consummate a financing having 
the following elements:

(a) The Municipality shall 
issue revenue bonds pursuant 
to the Act at one or more times 
in one or more series in such 
aggregate principal amount not 
in excess of $2,000,000 as the 
Eligible Participant shall re­
quest; providing, however, that 
the actual aggregate principal 
amount shall not be greater 
than the then estimated aggre­
gate cost of providing the 
Project and paying the costs 
incident to the financing thereof 
(said bonds being hereinafter 
called the “Bonds”).

(b) The Bonds shall be limited 
obligations of the Municipality 
payable by the Municipality 
solely out of revenues derived 
from the Eligible Participant or 
otherwise provided for pursuant 
to the terms of the loan or 
similar agreement (hereinafter 
called the “Revenue Agree­
ment”) to be entered into 
between the Municipality and 
the Eligible Participant.

(c) The Revenue Agreement 
shall require the Eligible 
Participant to acquire, construct 
or install the Project and to 
provide the Municipality with 
revenues sufficient to pay when 
due the principal of, premium, 
if any, and interest on the 
Bonds.

(d) The Bonds shall have such 
maturities, interest rates and 
redemption limitations as the

• Eligible Participant and the 
initial Bond purchaser(s) shall 
propose.

2. The issuance of the Bonds 
by the Municipality shall be on 
the following conditions:

(a) The Bonds shall not 
constitute an indebtedness of 
the Municipality within the 
meaning of any State con­
stitutional provision or statutory 
limitation.

(b) The Bonds shall not 
constitute or give rise to a 
pecuniary liability of the 
Municipality or a charge against 
its general credit or taxing 
powers.

(c) The Eligible Participant 
shall be responsible for finding 
a purchaser or purchasers for all 
of the Bonds.

(d) Prior to the issuance of the 
Bonds: (i) the electors of the 
Municipality shall have been 
given the opportunity to petition 
for a referendum on the matter 
of the Bond issue as required by 
the Act; (ii) either no such 
petition shall be timely filed or 
such petition shall have been 
filed and said referendum shall 
have approved the Bond issue; 
and (iii) this body, by further 
resolution, shall have authoriz­
ed and approved the terms of 
the Bonds and the Revenue 
Agreement.

action toward issuance of the 
Bonds for purposes of Section(e) The Bonds shall be issued 

pursuant to the Act, and the 
delivery of the Bonds shall be 
accompanied with the un­
qualified approving legal 
opinion of Messrs. Foley & 
Lardner or such other nationally 
recognized firm of bond at­
torneys as shall be acceptable to 
the Municipality and the 
Eligible Participant.

3. All out-of-pocket costs in 
connection with the issuance 
and sale of the Bonds shall be 
paid either from the proceeds of 
the Bonds or by the Eligible 
Participant.

4. The Clerk shall cause 
notice of adoption of this Re­
solution to be published once in 
Kewaskum Statesman (the 
Municipality’s official news­
paper, for the publication of 
notices pursuant to Chapter 985 
of the Wisconsin Statutes), and 
shall cause evidence of publica­
tion (including a copy of the 
notice as published) indicating 
the date of publication of such 
public notice to be filed with the 
Secretary of Business Develop­
ment of the State of Wisconsin 
or such Secretary’s successor 
within 10 days following publi­
cation of such notice.

5. This Resolution is an 
“initial resolution” within the 
meaning of the Act and official

J&J AUTO
SERVICE
Complete

Automotive Service
TIRES

BATTERIES 
MUFFLERS 

BRAKES
MAJOR & MINOR 
ENGINE REPAIR

IGNITION REPAIR

Front End 
Alignment

450 E. MAIN. KEWASKUM 
PHONE 626-2311

103 of the Internal Revenue 
Code of 1954, as amended, and 
the regulations promulgated 
thereunder.

6. This Resolution shall be 
effective immediately upon its 
passage and approval. Unless 
the Bonds shall have been 
issued prior thereto, the author­
ities and authorizations given 
by this Resolution shall expire 
on the second anniversary date 
of the date of adoption of this 
Resolution or on such later date 
as this body may specify by 
resolution adopted either before 
or after such date.

Motion for the adoption of the 
resolution was made by Trustee 
Raynor Herriges. Motion for the 
adoption of the resolution was 
seconded by Trustee Paul 
Blumer. The resolution was 
unanimously adopted on a roll

Roger & Dan’s 
Auto Service, Inc. 

Multi-Mile* Tires

RADIAL G/T (DI) 
70 SERIES

KKLLV

TIRES

Check Our Prices 
and Compare Road 
Hazard Warranty.

891 FOND DU LAC AVE.
Kewaskum
626-2888
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“Nay.”

The following resolution was 
introduced by Trustee Donald 
Mlodzik.

Resolution No. 80-4

RESOLUTION RELATING 
TO WAIVER OF SECTION 

66.521(ll)(b)l.
IN CONNECTION WITH AN 

INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT 
REVENUE 

BOND FINANCING
ON BEHALF OF 

REGAL WARE. INC.

WHEREAS, this body has 
adopted a resolution entitled 
“Initial Resolution Relating to 
Industrial Development Re­
venue Bond Financing On Be­
half Of Regal Ware, Inc.” (the 
“Initial Resolution”); and

WHEREAS, the Initial Re­
solution provides that upon 
certain conditions the Village of 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin (the 
“Municipality”) shall issue in­
dustrial development revenue 
bonds pursuant to Section 
66.521, Wisconsin Statutes, as 
amended (the “Act”) to finance 
a project in the Municipality to 
be undertaken by Regal Ware, 
Inc., a Wisconsin corporation 
(the “Eligible Participant”); 
and

WHEREAS, the Eligible Par­
ticipant has represented that 
the intended use of the project 
is for the purpose of manufac­
turing and warehousing of cook­
ware products and that the 
project would consist of a 
building addition and equip­
ment (the “Project”); and

WHEREAS, Section (ll)(b)l. 
of the Act contains provisions 
requiring competitive bidding 
for certain construAion con­
tracts and prohibiting discrimi­
nation with regard to the con­
struction and operation of pro­
jects financed under the Act; 
and

WHEREAS, Section (ll)(b)2. 
of the Act empowers the 
governing body of a municipal­
ity to waive the requirements of 
Section (ll)(b)l. with respect to 
a particular project;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT 
RESOLVED:

1. It is the finding and deter­
mination of this body that the 
Municipality will not control 
the design, costs, construction 
or operation of the Project; that 
no public moneys will be ex­
pended for the Project; that the 
Municipality will have no 
beneficial ownership in the 
Project; that the primary reason 
for requiring competitive 
bidding for construction of 
municipal projects is to protect 
the taxpayers against excessive 
expenditures of public funds 
and that such reason, although 
sound as applied to public 
works, is not applicable to the 
Project in which no general 
funds or tax revenues of the 
Municipality will be used or put 
at risk; that it would be more 
efficient and expedient for the 
accomplishment of the public 
purposes of the revenue bond 
issue if the Eligible Participant 
were to have complete control 
over the letting of contracts for 
construction for the Project; and 
that while an anti-discrimina­
tion policy such as that express­
ed in Section (1 l)(b) 1. of the Act 
is supported by this body, 
public policies of that sort 
applied in the context of a bond 
financing are more appropriate­
ly effectuated by contract with 
the Eligible Participant. There­

fore, the Municipality does 
hereby waive the provisions of 
Section (ll)(b)l. of the Act with 
regard to the Project; provided, 
however, that the revenue a- 
greement to be entered into 
between the Eligible Participant 
and the Municipality shall con­
tain anti-discrimination clauses 
satisfactory to the Municipality.

2. The Clerk shall cause the 
foregoing resolution to be 
published together with the 
public notice required by the 
Initial Resolution.

Motion for the adoption of the 
resolution was made by Trustee 
Paul Blumer. Motion of the 
adoption of the resolution was 
seconded by Trustee Raynor 
Herriges. The resolution was 
unanimously adopted on a roll 
call vote of 6 “Aye” and 0 
“Nay.”

A public hearing was held on 
the request of George Minz for 
the rezoning of the parcel of 
land west of Fond du Lac 
Avenue and south of STH “H” 
west (known as the Mlodzik 
parcel at 985 Fond du Lac 
Avenue) from R-l Single Family 
Residence District to B-2 
General Retail and Service Dis­
trict. There were no appear­
ances or objections to the 
requested zoning change. Upon 
motion by Trustee Herriges, 
seconded by Trustee Blumer, 
the hearing was declared 
closed. Voice vote was unani­
mous.

Motion was made by Trustee 
Paul Blumer and seconded by 
Trustee Raynor Herriges to 
suspend with the rules and 
move to 6 (g) and 8 (c) on the 
agenda to consider the request 
of Geroge Minz for the rezoning 
change. Voice vote was unani­
mous.

Trustee Rohrer presented a 
letter from the Plan Commis­
sion recommending that the 
Village Board approve the re­
quest of George Minz to rezone 
the parcel of land at 985 Fond 
du Lac Avenue from R-l to B-2. 
Motion was made by Trustee D. 
Nigh, seconded by Trustee 
Herriges, that the recommend­
ed zoning change from R-l to 
B-2 be approved. Trustee 
Mlodzik abstained from voting 
on the motion. Roll call vote was 
5 “Aye” and 0 “Nay” in favor 
of the zoning change.

Contingent upon receipt of 
preliminary appoval from the 
State of Wisconsin, George 
Minz was granted permission to 
do site preparation at 985 Fond 
du Lac Avenue and to install
footings and foundations to 
grade level only. Motion by 
Trustee Rohrer, seconded by 
Trustee Herriges. Voice vote 
was unanimous.

Supt. Albers reported that he 
is still experiencing problems 
with the screens on the sludge 
conditioner press.

At the request of Supt. Albers, 
motion was made by Trustee 
Blumer that the work period of 

summer help at the waste

NOTICE
Notice is hereby given that the Village Board of the Village 
of Kewaskum, Washington County, Wisconsin, will conduct 
a public hearing at 8:00 P.M. Tuesday evening September 
2. 1980, in the Council Room of the Municipal Building, 204 
First Street. The public hearing will be on the request of 
Mr. Peter Knaup for the rezoning the parcel of property to 
the west of Roseland Drive and to the east of Brooklane, lot 
2 of block 14 in the assessor’s plat in the Village of 
Kewaskum, Washington County. Wisconsin, (known as the 
Kilian Honeck property) from P-1, park district to R-4, 
multiple family residence district. The primary proposed 
use of this parcel is for an Elderly Housing Development. 
The parcel under consideration is approximately 2.62 acres.

Daniel S. Schmidt 
Administrator 

8-22-2t

water treatment plant be ex­
tended to September 19th. The 
motion was seconded by 
Trustee Herriges. Voice vote 
was unanimous.

Supt. Bilgo reported that the 
installation of the storm water 
pipe on Edgewood Road was 
completed and that only some 
clean-up work needs to be done.

The Board reviewed the bud­
get control sheet for the first 
seven months of 1980.

Administrator Schmidt re­
ported on the results on the 
clear water survey recently 
completed by the village and 
also reported that correction 
notices to residents are being 
prepared.

Administrator Schmidt was 
authorized to seek permission 
from the Wisconsin Department 
of Transportation to reduce the 
speed limit on U. S. 45 from the 
area of STH “H” west to the 
south village limits. Motion by 
Trustee Mlodzik, seconded by 
Trustee Herriges. Voice vote 
was unanimous.

Park and Recreation Commit­
tee Chairman Trustee Rohrer 
reported that sealed bids for the 
construction and installation of 
a permanent concrete raft for 
the Kiwanis Park pool will be 
opened at the September 15, 
1980, meeting of the Village 
Board.

Daniel Meilahn was author­
ized to paint the signs setting 
forth the general park rules 
which are to be posted at the 
entrance to the Kiwanis Park 
and at the entrance to River Hill 
Park. Motion by Trustee Her­
riges, seconded by Trustee 
Mlodzik. Voice vote was unani­
mous.

The Village Board decided 
that the children’s flag football 
for this year should be dropped.

A public hearing on the 
request of Peter Knaup for the 
rezonging of Lot 2, Block 14, of 
the Assessor’s Plat (known as 
the Kilian Honeck property) 
from P-1 Park District to R-4 
Multiple Family Residence Dis­
trict was scheduled for Septem­
ber 2, 1980, at 8:00 P.M.

Because of the Labor Day 
holiday, the regular monthly 
Village Board meeting was 
changed from September 1 to 
September 2, 1980, at the usual 
time. Motion by Trustee 
Herriges, seconded by Trustee 
Blumer. Voice vote was unani­
mous.

The establishment of a policy 
on industrial revenue bonding, 
as recommended by Adminis-
trator Schmidt as other com­
munities have done, was ap­
proved upon motion by Trustee 
Mlodzik, seconded by Trustee 
Rohrer. Voice vote was unani­
mous.

Upon motion by Trustee 
Herriges, seconded by Trustee 
Blumer, the Board adjourned to 
closed session under Chapter 
19.85 (c) of the Statutes to 
review the Kewaskum Police 
Association contract proposals

for 1981. Voice vote was unani­
mous.

William S. Martin 
Commissioner

STATE OF WISCONSIN 
DEPARTMENT OF

NATURAL RESOURCES 
Public Notice of Intent to 

Reissue a Wisconsin 
Pollutant Discharge 
Elimination System 

[WPDES] Permit
Public Notice Number: 801-2891 
Permit Number: WI-0000060-3 
Proposed Expiration Date: Sep­
tember 30, 1984
Name and Address of Permit­
tee:
Regal Ware, Inc., 
1675 Reigle Drive, 
Kewaskum, WI 53040 
Public Notice Issued On: Aug­
ust 28, 1980
Current Permit Issued: January 
1, 1978
Current Permit Expires: March 
31, 1980
Name and Address of Facility 
Where Discharge Occurs: 
Regal Ware, Inc., 
201-202 Second Street, 
Kewaskum, WI 53040

Activities or Operations Re­
sulting in /Exisiting discharge:

Regal Ware manufactures 
cookware. An average of .245 
MGD of noncontact cooling 
water from air compressors, 
boilers, hydraulic presses and 
spot welders are discharged 
through outfall 001 to the 
Milwaukee River via storm sew­
er. Outfall 002, which also 
discharges to the Milwaukee 
River via storm sewer, consists 
of overflow from outfall 001. All 
other process and sanitary 
wastes are discharged to the 
Kewaskum sewage treatment 
plant.

Receiving Water: Milwaukee 
River in Washington County.

The Department has tent­
atively decided the WPDES 
permit described above should 
be reissued. Appropriate efflu­
ent limitations and special con­
ditions will be included in the 
permit.

Persons wishing to comment

VOTING BY ABSENTEE BALLOT
Any qualified voter, unable to get to the polling place on 

election day. may ask to vote by absentee ballot A qualified 
voter is one who is a U.S citizen will l>e IS years of age or 
older on election day. and who has resided in the ward or 
aldermanic district where voting is desired to be accomp­
lished for at least 10 days prior to the election If the voter 
resides in a municipality which requires voter registration, 
then registration is also a requisite for the voter who is 
qualified in other respects

To obtain an absentee ballot, contact the clerk in the city, 
village or town in which you reside by mail or telephone, or in 
person, and request an application form After properly 
completing and returning the application to the municipal 
clerk, an absentee ballot will be sent to you along with a 
postage pre paid return envelope, or given to you if the 
application is submitted to the clerk in person The deadline 
for receipt of the application by the municipal clerk is 5:00 
p m on the Friday before election day in the case of 
applications mailed to the municipal clerk, arid 5:00 p.m on 
the day before the election in the case of applications made in 
the clerk’s office

With one exception, the voter who wants to cast an 
absentee ballot must make a separate application before 
each election Voters indefinitely confined to their home or 
care facility because of illness, age or disability need not file 
an application before each election: a special statement on 
the application form can be completed asking that an 
absentee ballot be automatically mailed to them before each 
election, if they fail to make and return the ballots sent to 
them in an election, they must complete another application 
later on

Absentee ballots c an be voted at home anytime after they 
arrived in the mail They can also be voted right in the clerk s 
office if submitting the application in person If returning the 
ballots by mail, the affidavit certificate must be properly 
completed and witnessed by two persons If returning the 
ballots in person, the affidavit-certificate must be properly 
completed and subscribed and sworn to by the clerk or the 
deputy clerk who are authorized to administer oaths In 
either case, the marked, sealed ballot must be in the handsof 
the issuing municipal clerk on or before election day Any 
absentee ballot received at the polling place after the polls 
close or received in incomplete or improper form cannot be 
counted

George F. Nehrbass, County Clerk 
Washington County

on or object to the proposed 
permit, or to request a public 
hearing, are invited to do so in 
writing to the Department of 
Natural Resources, WPDES 
Permit Section, 101 So. Web­
ster St., Box 7921, Madison. 
Wisconsin 53707. Comments as 
received will be made a part of 
that file. A public hearing may 
be held if response to this notice 
indicates significant public in­
terest.

All comments or suggestions 
received from members of the 
public and interested govern­
ment agencies no later than 30 
days from the date of issue of 
this public notice will be used 
along with other information on 
file in making a final decision 
regarding the permit. The U.S. 
Environmental Protection 
Agency shall be allowed up to 
90 days to submit comments or 
objections regarding this per­
mit.

Information on file for this 
permit may be inspected and 
copied at the address above, 
Monday through Friday (except 
holidays), between 9:00 a.m. 
and 3:30 p.m. Information on 
this permit may also be obtain­
ed by calling 608-266-3221 or by 
writing to the Department. 
Reasonable costs will be 
charged for copies of informa­
tion other than the public 
notice.

Please be further advised that 
in the event it is not possible to 
reissue this permit by Septem­
ber 30, 1980, because a public 
hearing must be conducted or 
because of the occurrence of 
other unforeseen events, the 
Department may without 
further public notice modify the 
present permit pursuant to Sec­
tion 147.03(2)(a), Wisconsin 
Statutes, by extending its term 
and the effectiveness of the 
final effluent limitations to no 
later than September 30, 1981. 
During the extension period, 
the reissuance process for the 
new permit will be completed. 
In the event such a modification 
is made, the Department will 
deem that this public notice 
satisfies the notice require­
ments of Section 147.03(2)(b) 
and (c), Wisconsin Statutes.
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RUMMAGE SALE - Sat., Sun. 
& Mon., Aug. 30, 31 & Sept. 1 
from 10:00 to 6:00. School 
clothes, shoes and supplies, qt. 
canning jars, 20 gal. aquarium 
with stand, 25 in. color TV, 
printing calculator, manual 
typewriter, quality family cloth­
ing-cheap, jewelry, glassware, 
decorative items, cosmetics, 
micro-wave utensils, rowing ex­
erciser, and games. Many more 
items too numerous to mention. 
Fire no. 448, New Prospect. Call 
533-4649 for more information.

8-22-lt

FOR RENT — Female renter, 
own room and bath, access to 
kitchen facilities. Ph. 626-2904,
after 5. 8-22-2t

SUBSTITUTE TEACHERS 
wanted for Kewaskum Com­
munity Schools, Kindergarten 
through Grade 12. Cali 626-2166 
for more information. 8-8-4t

KEWASKUM
Modern contemporary, featur­
ing a cathedral ceiling in the 
living room. 3 bedrooms with • 
full bath off the master. Must 
be seen! $67,900.
Large older home with lots of 
living space. Natural fireplace 
in the family room, 4 bedrooms, 
IVi baths, 2 car garage. 100 x 
120 ft. lot. $59,900. REALTY 
WORLD, West-Grove Realty,
Inc. 334-5589. 7-11-tf

FOR SALE 1970 14x65
Liberty 2 bedroom mobile 
home. Includes stove, refrigera­
tor, washer and dryer; also an 
Ashley wood burning stove and 
a 6 x 17 porch addition. Call

HIGHEST PRICES paid for 
copper, brass aluminum, lead 
and batteries. Lynn’s Waste 
raper Co., 121 Island Ave.,
West Bend, Wis. 4-27-tf

RUMMAGE SALE - At 501 
West Main St., Kewaskum, 
Aug. 29 & 30 from 10:00 a.m. to 
8:00 p.m. Clothing and mis-

533-8830. 7-25-tf PUBLIC

cellaneous. 8-29-lt

RUMMAGE SALE - 5-family. 
Sept. 5 & 6. Rain date Sept. 8-9. 
9:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. Clothes, 
toys, furniture, misc. items. 970 
Fond du Lac Ave. (across from 
Trailer Court, Hwy. 45 South).

8-29-2t

WANTED — Two cords fire­
wood, 4x4x8. Ph. 626-4957.

8-29-2p

FOR SALE - Girl’s clothing 2T 
- 3T. Reasonable. Call after
5:00, 626-2481. 8-29-2t

FOR SALE Red Pontiac
potatoes. 900 Dietrich Dr., Ph.
626-4957. 8-29-2p

FOR SALE 1978 Pontiac
Trans Am. Ph. 626-2230, ask for
Jim. 8-29-2t

WANTED — Anyone interested 
in advanced Lifesaving Course 
at the YMCA to share in 
driving, please call 533-4829. 
Course starts Saturday, Sept. 6. 

8-29-lt

FOR RENT — One bedroom 
lower apartment in Campbell­
sport with deposit. No pets. 
Available Sept. 1. Ph. 692-9233.

8-29-tf

BABYSITTER WANTED - 
Tuesdays and Thursdays, 7:00 
p.m. to 10:00 p.m., 15 or over. 
$1.00 per hour. Call 626-4460.

8-29-It

FOR RENT — 2 bedroom side 
by side duplex in Kewaskum. 
Available Oct. 1. $205. Call 
629-9455.8-29-It

SWEET CORN - Pick your 
own, 50c dozen. 533-8557.
_____________________8-29-lt

FOR SALE — Davenport and 
chairs. Call after 5:30, 626- 
2066. 8-29-lt

CHILD CARE - My home. 
Playmate. 626-4012. 8-2231

WILL DO BABYSITTING - 
My home. Monday thru Friday 
near Beechwood. Ph. 626-2572. 

8-22-2t

WILL DO BABYSITTING - In 
my home, days or nights. Ph. 
626-4738.8-8-#

VETERANS - Charming 3- 
bedroom ranch in Kewaskum. 
Dining room has snack bar and 
pass-thru to kitchen giving this 
home a very "open” feeling. 
$54,900. Call FULLPAIL 
REALTY, 338-2334. 8-15-3t

TREE TRIMMING and RE-.
MOVAL Also stump re- (SSEE

[notices

PUBLIC NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given 

that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wiscon­
sin, Village Board is scheduled 
for Tuesday evening, Sept. 2, 
1980, at 8:00 p.m. in the Council 
Room of the Municipal Build­
ing, 204 First Street.

The agendas for meetings are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the 
clerk at the Municipal Building 
on Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the 
Kewaskum Post Office and in 
the lobby of the Valley Bank.

William Martin, Clerk

Immunization

moval. 20 years experience. 
Tom Clark, former owner of 
Clark’s Tree Service. Ph. 626-
2513. 8-1-tf

TREES TRIMMED, Pruned or 
removed. Phone 626-4606 or
334-4862. 8-3-tf

SERVICES OFFERED - Septic 
and holding tanks cleaned. 
Ellie’s Sanitation Service.
Phone 626-4848.

INSULATION

3-9-tf

Attics and
side-walls. Call Blaze Insula-
tion, 626-8007. 1-11-tf

TIRES — There’s always a tire 
sale at Roger & Dan’s Service. 
Goodyear and Multi-Mile. 626-
2888. 4-4-tf

SERVICES OFFERED - Home 
repairs, additions, garages, re­
modeling and painting. Phone
626-4606. 12-28-tf

LEN LUTERBACH CONTRAC­
TOR — Mason, cement, trench­
ing and bulldozing. Quality 
work at competitive prices. 
Your authorized dealer of the 
world famous Hallmark in- 
ground swimming pools. For 
free estimate, call 692-9233
collect. 9-14-tf

State of Wisconsin 
Washington County ( 
Circuit Court
Probate Branch

ORDER LIMITING TIME 
FOR FILING CLAIMS 

{ON WAIVER)
AND DETERMINATION 

OF HEIRSHIP
A petition for administration 

of the estate and determination 
of heirship of Elsie G. Sparks, 
Washington County, Wiscon­
sin, post office address 1425 
Roseland Dr., P.O. Box 382, 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin 53040, 
having been filed;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. Creditor’s claims must be 

filed on or before November 26, 
1980, or be barred;

2. Heirship will be deter­
mined and claims will be exam­
ined and adjusted, at the Wash­
ington County Courthouse, in 
West Bend, Wisconsin, on De­
cember 9, 1980, at the opening 
of Court or thereafter.

Dated August 26, 1980
By the Court, 
James B. Schwalbach 
Circuit Judge.

O’Meara, Eckert & Pouros 
622 Elm St., P.O. Box 348 
West Bend, Wisconsin 53095 

8-29-3t

PUBLIC NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given 

that the Town of Kewaskum 
Plan Commission will meet 
Wednesday, September 3, 
1980, at 7:30 p.m. in the Town 
Hall, 9340 Hwy. 45, Kewaskum.

Daniel Stoffel, Chairman

Soiled areas of your carpet 
can be cleaned without soaking. 
Ask Miller’s of Kewaskum a- 
bout Nylac. Use your carpet an 
hour after cleaning with Nylac.

NOW!
To Serve the People 

of the Kewaskum Area....

Member $100,000 Roundtable Club

DEBBIE WILKE
677-3746

(Collect)

In today’s ever changing market, you need J 
a Realtor you can count on! For ALL your 
Real Estate needs, whether Buying or , 
Selling, Call on DEBBIE WILKE.

• Market Estimate Given on Request
• Current Financing Information ‘

WAUWATOSA
WEST BEND 338-0601 

1221S. MAIN ST. METRO 257-3950 ,
WEST BEND, WI

REALTOR — MLS — EQUAL HOUSING OPPORTUNITY 
* -..  —-.... ^* 1 ** A*- .■■. Jt--=■--■■ M.t- _■ -JI

Realty Company

Clinics Set
Immunization clinics offered 

by the Washington County 
Community Health Nursing 
continue to be held twice 
monthly in West Bend. On the 
first Tuesday of each month the 
clinic hours will be 2:00 to 6:00 
p.m., and on the fourth Tuesday 
of each month the clinic hours 
will be 9:00 to 12:00 noon.

September clinics are:
September 2 - 2:00 to 6:00 

p.m.
September 23 - 9:00 to 12:00 

noon.
The clinics will be held in the 

Community Health Nursing 
Service office at 515 East Wash­
ington Street, West Bend.

All recommended immuniza­
tions are available to children 
and adults and are provided 
free of charge. There is a $1.00 
charge for the T.B. skin test for 
those age 16 and over.

For further Information call: 
Community Health Nursing 
Service, 338-4462 or 644-5204, 
Ext. 4462, Mrs. Delores P. 
Hardner, R.N., Director.

SCHULZ
REAL ESTATE CORP. 

Brokers—Builders 
MONICA SCHULZ, Broker
JAMES SCHULZ, Builder 

2395 W. Washington, West Bond

PHQNE 3W41W

80 ACRE FARM
With pond, large 2-story home, 32x60 metal machine shed, 
60x120 metal barn plus many other outbuildings. Town of 
Farmington. No. 1218.

KRIER R^¥
Paul Bur mas ch B

j& 994-4712
207 Carroll St., Random Lake

994-9418 
Barb Gahan 

334-7503

A PERFECT beginning for newlyweds or easy living for 
retired folks! This lovely 2 bedroom ranch is on a nicely 
landscaped ’/< acre lot in the Kettle Moraine Forest area. 
Upper $40’s.
STARTING UP or slowing down? In either case, your needs 
are limited and so are your means! This 2 bedroom mobile 
home may be just what suits you!
FIX-ME-UP SPECIAL! An excellent buy for the person 
willing to do some work.
KOHLSVILLE: 2 Building sites with Cul-de-sac!
NEW SUBDIVISION: 1 Acre wooded lots NW of West 
Bend.
ACRE lot with plenty of room for pets and children too!
VARIOUS sized parcels available. 1-17 acres each!
ACRE country lot, Town of Farmington.
2 PLUS ACRES available on Hwy. 144.
NORTHERN PROPERTIES: Lake frontage lots near Eagle 
River.

334-7411
DAN COULTER 
WILLIAM J. COULTER 
ANN A. ENRIGHT 
TOM TYRRELL 
WENDY COULTER

338-3296 
285-3944
692-2607 
629-9242
338-3296

^WL^>'« MUI TIPI t LISTING Strict

205 S. 7th Ave./P.O. Box 634/West Bend/Wis./53095



Hikers Beware Kewaskum Statesman, Friday, August 29, 1980, Pat 15

Don’t Get Irritated; Avoid These Plants While Walking in the Woods

Lady-slipper

Poison Sumac

Celandine

Poison Oak Nettle

Any unfilled permits will be 
issued on a first come, first 
served basis for applications 
received after September 10 
through September 30.

Hunters may apply for a 
permit to take one Canada 
goose in any one of two zones 
during one of three time

If you’re planning a walk 
through the woods to enjoy the 
autumn foliage, here's a re­
minder from National Wildlife 
magazine that the familiar 
three-leafed poison ivy vine 
isn't the only irritating plant to 
avoid.

The National Wildlife Federa­
tion's bimonthly publication 
warns hikers to keep their eyes 
open for these other plants that
cause rashes and skin 
tions.

Poison Oak: Similar 
pearance and effect to

irrita-

in ap- 
poison

ivy, this erect shrub of dry, 
sandy coastal woods has three 
leaflets which are distinctively 
lobed.

Poison Sumac: Still another 
relative, this large shrub or 
small tree bears drooping 
clusters of small ivory-colored 
fruits and shouldn’t be confused 
with harmless red-fruited 
sumacs. The poison variety 
prefers a swampy environment.

Celandine: This plant's deep 
vellow flowers invited picking,

but the bright orange juice that 
drips from the broken stems can 
cause an irritating skin inflam­
mation.

Lady-slipper: One of the na­
tion’s most handsome native 
orchids, the regal showy lady­
slipper inhabits northern bogs. 
Handling the plant can result'in 
an affliction resembling poison 
ivy rash. Unfortunately, this 
unpleasant property has not 
kept it from being picked to 
near extinction in some areas.

Nettle: This plant makes 
bare-legged hiking an ordeal, 
for its entire stern and leaves 
bristle with spiny-tipped hollow 
hairs which contain a variety of 
histamines and other proteins. 
Brushing against a nettle 
causes these hairs to penetrate 
the skin where they break off

and release the fluid, 
mediately, the affected

Im- 
area

stings and itches fiercely. The 
sensation lasts only a few 
minutes, and an application of 
juice from the jewelweed 
usually relieves the itching.

Manchineel: One of the most

Applications For
Goose Tag Available

Placement Program 
For Older Workers
In Effect in County

With the Older Workers 
Placement now in effect in 
Washington County employers 
and applicants should feel free 
to contact Wisconsin Job Ser­
vice of West Bend to bring 
these two mighty forces toget­
her.

This program works in ac­
cordance with the Wisconsin 
Bureau of Aging and the De­
partment of Industry, Labor and 
Human Relations. It is federally 
operated to help find meaning­
ful! employment for people fifty 
and over.

JOBS, that’s what it all boils 
down to. Jobs for the elderly 
who want to feel needed and 
can contribute a vast amount of 
experience to society. These 
people are eager to work part 
time or full time jobs.

A member of our staff will be 
available to help you at all 
times. Call 338-1700 or visit us 
at 2275 West Washington Street 
in West Bend, and ask for Jane 
McElroy or Irene Wade.

Employers, the next time you 
have an opening, please con- 
sider some one fifty and over. 
They have established employ­
ment records.

notorious U.S. plants 
small tree of southern 
and the Keys. Its sap 
severe blistering after 
and the crab-apple-like 
extremely poisonous 
eaten.

is this 
Florida 
causes 
contact 
fruit is 
when

“Symptons of external 
poisoning vary with a person’s 
sensitivity and with the species 
of plant,” explains National 
Wildlife. But by recognizing 
potentially hazardous plants, 
hikers can avoid unpleasant 
encounters.

THE SUPER MARKET 
OF AUTO REPAIRS 

Goeden Auto Body 
Complete Auto Body Repairs 

and Painting Professionally Done 
INSURANCE ESTIMATES AND REPAIRS 

OUR SPECIALTY
Automotive - Tune-ups - Exhaust - Brakes 

Tires - Anti Freeze - Texaco Products 
ALL DONE TO YOUR SATISFACTION 

24 HOUR TOWING
Hwy. 28 E. of Kewaskum in St. Michaels

334-2759
TRY OUR PERSONALIZED SERVICE

(loose hunting permit appli­
cations are available now at 
Department of Natural Re­
sources offices and hunting 
license sales outlets throughout 
the state.

Permits will be issued by 
random drawing from applica­
tions received by September 10.

periods. The zones and time 
periods are the Central zone 
from season opening to its 
close, Horicon zone from season 
opening to October 31, and 
Horicon zone from November 1 
to season close.

Applications should list their 
first, second, and third choice in 
order of preference to increase 
their chances of receiving a 
permit.

Exact waterfowl season dates 
were set by the Natural Re­
sources Board at its regular 
meeting on August 20-21. The 
dates will be listed in the 
waterfowl regulations pamphlet 
to be published following the 
Board meeting.

Hunters will be allowed one 
Canada goose for the season in 
the permit zones. In the re­
mainder of the state the limit 
will be one a day and two in 
possession.

A total of 55,300 permits will 
be issued within the three tag 
zones. A harvest quota of 
30,000 Canada geese has been 
set for Wisconsin for this season 
with 25,000 to come from within 
the three tag zones and the 
remaining 5,000 from the re­
mainder of the state.

Last year, a total of 33,000 
Canada geese were taken by 
51,350 hunters within the tag 
zones.

Special
FEEDER CATTLE & STOCK COW AUCTION

HORSE & TACK AUCTION
Saturday, August 30

Midwest-Lomira

ARENA
11:00 
with 
about

Pat O’Brien 
Market Mgr. 
Ph: 477-2073

Jim O'Brien 
Auctioneer 

Ph: 477-6372

9:00 a.m. - Tack followed 
by horses.

Lomira, WIs. 
Ph: 269-4441 

269-4351

head expected.

Jet. Hwys.
ARENA *1

a.m. ■ Feeder cattle 
stock cows sold at 

2:00 p.m. 450-500

41 & 49

WELL PUMPS
SALES & SERVICE

JACUZZI and MYERS

10% OFF
334-9481

A Dealer Yoe Con TrvsfAfter Hours 626-4559

Johann Plumbing & Heating, Inc. Hwy 45 Kewaskum 
Phone 626 216k

HOURS: Mon. • Fri. 9-9 
Sat. 'til 5

Midwest Livestock Auction

SPECIAL
1975 AMC HORNET

Sportabout Station Wagon 
6 cyl. Automatic

A VERY CLEAN CAR

HONECK
CHEVROLET INC
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Grand Prize
Winners in Big 
Fish Contest

Village Sport Shop’s Big Fish 
Contest ended Aug. 25. The 
winners for the final three 
week’s and the grand prize 
winners are as follows:

For the week ending Aug. 11 
the bass category was won by 
Bill Heberer, Kewaskum, who 
brought in a 2 lb. 2 oz. 15V* inch 
fish caught on North Twin Lake.

Dennis Jandre, Kewaskum, 
had the largest Lake Michigan 
fish weighing 20.5 lbs. and 
measuring 37 inches.

Young Richard Thiemer, Ke­
waskum, took both the crappie 

'and bluegill categories with a 6 
oz. 8'4 inch crappie and a 9 oz. 
8 7/8 inch bluegill caught on 
Long Lake.

The week ending Aug. 18 
Elroy Lierman, Kewaskum, 
took the Lake Michigan ca­
tegory with his 22.8 lb. 3714 
inch Chinook.

The bluegill category was 
won by Mike Gnacinski, Adell, 
with a 15 oz. 10*4 inch fish 
caught on Lake Seven.

The final week, the week 
ending Aug. 25, had winners in 
every category except the crap­
pie.

Don Neumann, Kewaskum, 
had a 5.4 lb. 30*4 inch northern 
to win that category. The fish 
was taken from Mauthe Lake.

Bob Kirsch, Campbellsport, 
caught his prize winning bass 
from the Milwaukee River. It 
weighed 1 lb. 9 oz. and mea­
sured 14*4 inches.

Lloyd Herriges, Kewaskum, 
brought in a Chinook that not 
only took the weekly prize but 
also the grand prize. His 28.2 lb 
38'4 inch fish was a real beauty.

Larry Neumann Jr., Camp­
bellsport, caught an 8 oz. 9*4 
inch bluegill from Lake Seven to 
take that category.

Mike Reindl, Kewaskum, 
brought in the winning walleye. 
His 1 lb. 12 oz., 18’4 inch fish 
was caught on Lake Winneba­
go.

The grand prize winners are 
people who have brought in the 
largest fish during the length of 
our contest which ran from 
opening day May 3 until this 
past Monday, Aug. 25.

The largest northern was 
caught by Walter Anderson of 
Menomonee Falls. Anderson 
caught his 20.4 lb. 43 inch fish 
on Lake Kristine in Waushara 
County. It was caught on a 
yellow and orange jig on May 
10. He wins a Berkley Cherry- 
wood Rod.

David Weidner, Kewaskum, 
took the grand prize for large- 
mouth bass. His 4.8 lb. 21 inch 
fish was caught on Mauthe 
Lake. He caught it on a worm 
June 17. His prize is an Olympic 
3260 Spincast Rod.

Lloyd Herriges, Kewaskum, 
brought in the grand prize Lake 
Michigan fish the final week of 
the contest. It weighed 28.2 lbs 
and measured 38'4 inches. He 
won a Dot Une Landing Net.

Allen Wiesner, Kewaskum, 
caught the prize winning wall­
eye. His 7 lb. 29 inch fish was 
taken from Boulder Lake in 
Vilas County. May 4 was his 
lucky day using a jig and 
minnow to catch the fish. A 
Ryobi GX10 Spinning Reel is his 
prize.

Monty Shaw, Kewaskum,

had the largest crappie brought 
in. He caught his 1 lb. 6 oz., 14 
3/8 inch fish July 4 on Legend 
Lake using a beetle spin. Monty 
wins an Adventurer 1499 Tackle 
Box.

Delbert Bingen, West Bend, 
had the largest bluegill. His 1 
lb. 6 oz., 11*4 inch fish was 
caught on Lake Seven July 19. A 
cricket was used for bait. 
Bingen wins a Mariner 2020 
Flex Fillet Knife.

Congratulations to all the 
prize winners. Village Sport 
Shop wants to thank everyone 
who brought in fish. A total of 
113 fish were officially entered 
with many more brought in but 
not qualifying. Sixty-eight 
weekly prizes and six grand 
prizes were given away.

If anyone who had their 
picture taken would like the 
picture, please stop in at the 
store to pick it up. We would 
like to make this contest an 
annual affair. Any comments or 
thoughts on the subject would 
be appreciated.

Indian Girls
Third in Golf
Opener at Port

Girl golfers from Kewaskum 
High opened their 1980 season 
Monday in a quadrangular meet 
at Port Washington.

Minus two varsity regulars, 
Kewaskum was third with 289 
strokes. Port won with 209, led 
by veteran Lisa Kartheiser with 
a 40, which was excellent 
considering the wind coming off 
Lake Michigan. West Bend 
West, which lost four seniors by 
graduation, was last with 327, 
Mayville finished second with 
all five players coming in with 
76 or better, led by Terry Tighe 
with 50.

For the Indians, seniors Joan 
Hanrahan and Sue Harlow led 
with 65 and 68. Cheryl Jaeger 
hit a 77 and Melissa Koch 79.

Tuesday Kewaskum traveled 
to Hartford CC and Wednesday 
they hosted West Bend West at 
Hon-E-Kor.

Kettle Riders Host
Donkey Baseball

The New Fane Kettle Riders 
Snowmobile Club will play host 
to the Fond du Lac County and 
Northern Kettle Moraine Snow­
mobile Associations August 31.

The association’s will “bat­
tle” each other in the Kettle 
Rider’s First Invitational Don­
key Baseball Game at 1:00 p.m. 
at the New Fane Sportsmen’s 
Club, Highway G, four miles 
north of Kewaskum.

An added feature before the 
game will be donkey races, 
including a race between Bob 
Staehler, Chairman of the Gov­
ernor’s Recreation Council, and 
Art Sherren, Executive Secre-' 
tary of the Association of Wis­
consin Snowmobile Clubs.

Food and refreshments will 
be available on the grounds.

West Bend Savings and Loan, 
Kewaskum office, the Camp­
bellsport News and Threee R’s, 
Boltonville, have advance tic­
kets on sale. Cost of the ticke's 
is $2.00 advance, $2,50 at gate, 
preschoolers free. The game is 
open to the public and everyone 
is invited to come and enjoy an 
afternoon of fun and laughs.

Mosquitos Bug 
Clark Eichstedt
In State Open

Clark Eichstedt was the only 
player from Hon-E-Kor Country 
Club to qualify for the State 
Open Golf Tournament which 
opened Monday at Milwaukee 
CC.

Eichstedt, playing in the first 
group in the morning, said the 
pesky mosquitos really bother­
ed his concentration. They were 
very bad and “Ike” couldn’t get 
settled. (The mosquitos are 
especially bad now after all the 
recent wet weather).

Clark didn’t want to use the 
bugs as a excuse, but he ended 
up with an 83. He hit the greens 
and kept putting past the hole 
in the beginning, ending up 
with six straight bogeys.

Eichstedt had posted a 75 at 
Tumblebrook earlier to qualify 
for the event.

MONDAY NIGHT
HORSESHOE LEAGUE

End of Season

B. Gengler 
R. Boegel 36‘4 17'4
C. Struebing
S. Pesch 27 27
C. McElhatton
K. Korth 26*4 27'4
R. Williams
S. Sarauer 25'4 28'4
M. Schaub
D. Pesch 25 29
B. Stoltzmann
S. Ehnert 22'4 31'4
C. Buss
S. Pieper 19 35
J. Rohlinger
N. Boegel 17'4 36'4
B. Rohlinger
S. Waranius 16'4 27'4

B. Rohlinger
S. Waranius 16'4 37*4

WEDNESDAY NITE 
TRAPSHOOTING LEAGUE

W L
Main Bar 13 4
Sentry
Kettle Moraine

13 4

Electric 10'4 6*4
Cue & Brew 10 7
Allenton Meat Mkt. 10 7
Si& Vi’s No. I 9'4 7*4
Oar House 9 7
Dick’s Welcome Inn 9 7
Kaszuba’s 8 9
Uelman Builders 8 9
R.T.Speed Shop 8 9
Mac Tools 7'4 9*4
Serwe Implement 7 10
Village Sport Shop 6 11
Kewaskum Saloon 5*4 11'4
Fin-N-Feather 1 16

25 straight was shot by 
Ganser of Si & Vi’s No. 1.

Dick

RICHARD’S 
Barber Style 

Shop
WILL BE

CLOSED
Sat., Aug. 30

Kettle Moraine Chapter of Ducks 
Unlimited Plans First Banquet

Phe Kettle Moraine Chapter 
of Ducks Unlimited has an­
nounced that its 1st annual 
banquet will be held at Scenic 
View Country Club, on Sept. 11 
at 6 p.m. Chapter Chairman 
Terry LeFever of Slinger feels 
the fund-raising function should 
be marked on the calendar by 
anyone who is interested in the 
future of North America’s 
waterfowl.

“The Ducks Unlimited suc­
cess story,” said LeFever, “is 
really starting to spread around. 
Banquets much like our chapter 
event held throughout the 
country last year contributed 
towards Ducks Unlimited’s 
national fund-raising effort 
which raised $20 million during 
1979 alone. But what’s even 
more important to realize,” said 
LeFever “is that this national 
fund-raising total must increase 
this year if the North American 
waterfowl habitat race is to be 
won.”

DU’s sportsmen/conserva- 
tionists founders discovered 
through surveys conducted 
forty years ago that seventy 
percent of North America’s 
waterfowl production occurs in 
Canada. They figured out back 
in 1937 what holds true today. 
Since Federal duck stamp 
dollars cannot be spent beyond 
U.S. borders, sportsmen funds 
earmarked for waterfowl con­
servation are not getting to the 
places where the great percent­
age of production takes place. 
But through Ducks Unlimited’s 
efforts, over $100 million has 
been raised in the U.S. since 
1937. And 80c out of everyone 
of those dollars has been sent to 
DU (Canada) to reserve some 3 
million acres of prime habitat 
encompassing over 1,700 wet­
land projects.

The only problem in all this is 
that biologists estimate millions 
of additional acre's of habitat 
must be reserved in order to 
stabilize North America's 
waterfowl population. When 
you consider that habitat today 
is diminishing due to agricul­
tural and developmental pres­
sures, and that DU is the only 
nonprofit conservation or­
ganization involved in the 
Canadian waterfowl habitat 
race, you can begin to see the 
significance attached to the 
organization’s fund-raising 
events.

Tickets, which are $35.00

* Annual Fall J

TRAP SHOOTS
• Saturday, August 30 •
• 6:00 to 10:00 p.m. *

5 Sunday, August 31 !
J 10:00 a.m. to ??? e

J SPONSORED BY J
• Campbellsport Sportsmen’s Club J

AT THE

Club House
5 miles west on Hwy 28 to Lake Bernice Dr.

Lunch and Refreshments Available

each, include a one-year DU 
membership and a subscription 
to the organization’s magazine. 
Call Terry LeFever at 644-8513 
for tickets and further details.

HON-E-KORNER
The Women’s Golf Associa­

tion met Aug. 20 with class 
events of low net. A winners 
were Judy Harlow and Nan 
Welch with 37. B Corliss 
Fassbinder with 33. C Shirley 
Lemler 37 and D Laura Mat­
thews 43.

Card winner was Mary Stutz­
man (again).

The Bill Bartelt Memorial 
Tournament was also held on 
Aug. 20, and open to all women 
club members. The 18 hole 
medal play event was won by 
Corliss Fassbinder. Runner up 
was Nan Welch.

CAMPBELLSPORT 
SPORTSMEN’S CLUB 

THURS. MORNING LEAGUE
W L

Kewaskum Saloon 12 2
Regal Ware 12 2
Hon-E-Kor 9 5
Serigraph 5 9
Schmitt’s Never Inn 3 11
Drop Anchors Inn 1 13

25 straight was shot by Dave 
Baumhardt of Regal Ware, Al 
Heberer of Hon-E-Kor and Gary 
Sina of Schmitt’s Never Inn.


