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Kewaskum May Get 
Cable Television

Escapees Who Terrorized Local Teacher, 
Husband, Are Apprehended in Tennessee

W’ork on bringing cable tele­
vision to West Bend is progress­
ing ahead of schedule and there 
is now a good possibility it will 
be coming to Kewaskum as 
well.

Donald Jones, head of River 
Bend Cablevision, Inc., and 
another representative met with 
members of the board of direc­
tors of the Kewaskum Area 
Chamber of Commerce at their 
noon meeting Monday, Jan. 18, 
at which the members unani­
mously favored bringing cable 
TV to the Kewaskum area. Paul 
Behring, president of the 
Chamber of Commerce, attend­
ed the village board meeting the 
same evening to report on the 
chamber’s decision.

West Bend had considered a 
number of different cablevision 
operations before deciding that 
River Bend Cablevision, Inc. 
was best suited for our area. 
River Bend is now in the 
process of attempting to pick up 
Jackson, Slinger and Kewas­
kum as satellite communities 
for the service which has op­
tions that are fantastic.

Superintendent of Kewaskum 
schools. Floyd Brenholt, also

Woodmen Honor Clifford Stautz

Clifford Stautz, Kewaskum, 
was presented with a plaque in 
recognition of his conscientious 
and dedicated community ser­
vice by Kewaskum Modern 
Woodmen of America Camp 
2233 at their Christmas Party 
and Recognition Night Dinner 
held in December.

Stautz is a charter member of 
the Kewaskum Kiwanis Club, 
United Fund. Senior Citizens 
XYZ Club and the Kewaskum 
Historical Society. He is a mem­
ber of the Masonic Lodge and 
served as Master in 1963, also 
the Eastern Star of West Bend 
and was a Worthy Patron of that 
organization. He served on the 
Kewaskum Village Board. Ke­

attended the Chamber meeting 
and was impressed with what 
can be done with cablevision in 
the area of education.

Jones reported that the 
monthly charge for cable TV 
would be in the neighborhood of 
$7.50, along with an initial 
hookup fee which would amount 
to about $10. However, there is 
a possibility the hookup fee is 
waived if homeowners join the 
program when it is initiated into 
the community.

The village would have to 
award the cablevision corpora­
tion a franchise. Some cable 
companies offer the community 
a percentage of their revenues 
for the franchise.

Cable TV would be brought in 
on existing utility poles and 
underground cable.

Jones estimated that about 45 
percent of the homes passed by 
will subscribe for the basic 
service of 27 stations at $7.25 or 
$7.50 per month. Of those who 
subscribe 85-90 percent will pay 
the additional $7.25 per month 
for Home Box Office, a home 
movie service. Jones said in­
terest in cable television is 
“unbelievable.”

waskum School Board, was a 
member of the Kewaskum Vol­
unteer Fire Department and a 
Boy Scout leader. Stautz is a 
member of Peace United 
Church of Christ. Kewaskum, 
and has served as its President. 
He also helped organize the 
Kewaskum site for the WOW 
County Nutrition Program.

He and his wife Elsa have 
three children, Clayton of Ke­
waskum. Jerome of West Bend, 
and Floyd of Madison; ten 
grandchildren and one great­
grandchild. Members of his im­
mediate family and other rela­
tives were also guests of the 
Modern Woodmen at the Labor 
Center.

Area residents who live in the 
vicinity of Kettle Moraine Cor­
rectional Institution near the 
Fond du Lac-Sheboygan county 
line are breathing easier again 
after learning that two men who 
escaped from the penal facility 
and terrorized a rural Cascade 
couple are back behind bars.

Robert Barber and Edward 
Eichmann, both 27, who es­
caped from the institution Jan­
uary 18 by cutting a hole in a 
barbed wire fence were appre­
hended last Friday by author­
ities in Tennessee following 
home robbery at gunpoint and a 
high speed chase. They were 
held in the Franklin County Jail 
in Winchester, Tennessee, 60 
miles west of Chattanooga a- 
waiting a court appearance.

Donald Glick, 34, who is 
employed by Power Products in 
Grafton, and his wife, Diana, 
27, a teacher at the Kewaskum 
Elementary School, returned to

Conference 
Honors Concert 
At High School

This Saturday, February 2, 
Kewaskum High School will 
host the ninth and final All­
Conference Honors Band and 
Choir Concert.

Students in band and choir 
from the Scenic Moraine Con­
ference schools were selected 
by their directors to be a part of 
the honors group. Once selected 
they are involved in two re­
hearsals, last Saturday after­
noon, January 27, and all day 
this Saturday. February 2. All of 
the rehearsal time builds to a 
climax with the concert on Sat­
urday, February 2, beginning at 
7:00 p.m. in the old gym at 
KHS.

The Honors Choir is directed 
by Dr. Anthony Barresi from 
UW-Madison. Albert Asch of 
UWWC in West Bend will 
direct the Honors Band.

There is no charge for the 
concert and everyone is cor­
dially invited to attend what 
promises to be an excellent 
evening’s entertainment.

Letter Policy

r This week the Statesman } 
: received another unsigned j 
J letter to the editor. All letters r 
| to the editor must be signed, : 
| and the name and address of ' 
r the writer must be given. ) 
» The Statesman prefers to | 
| use signed letters, however, r 
J the name of the writer will be • 
| withheld upon request.
C The Statesman welcomes j 
r letters to the editor on issues | 
: of concern to our community. I 
J We ask that the letters be r 
$ legibly written or typed.

their home, located about three 
miles from the Kettle Moraine 
Institution, on January 18, and 
were held at gunpoint by the 
two men believed to be the 
escapees. Their German Shep­
herd dog was shot dead when it 
lunged at one of the intruders.

Their home was ransacked 
and the Glicks tied up. The men

UNDER DOMESTIC EXCHANGE PROGRAM

Debbie Allmann to Attend Colorado
School; Oregon Student Comes Here

Debbie Allmann, daughter of 
George and Sharon Allmann of 
Kewaskum, is this year’s AFS 
student choice to participate in 
the domestic exchange pro­
gram. Debbie, a sophomore at 
KHS. will be leaving in the near 
future to spend this semester in 
Boulder, Colorado, a communi­
ty of some 80,000.

Debbie’s host family is Mr. 
and Mrs. William Linfield and 
their 10 children. Mr. Linfield is 
employed by the Department of 
Commerce and his wife is an 
elementary school teacher.

Debbie will be attending Fair­
view High School in Boulder. 
The school of 2,060 will be quite 
a contrast to good old KHS

Jill Annette Conkey

This semester’s domestic ex­
change student attending KHS 
is Jill Annette Conkey. She 
comes from Monmouth, Ore­
gon, a small town of 5,000 near 
the Oregon coast, located in the 
mountains in western Oregon. 
Jill is used to a relatively 
moderate climate. One of her 
biggest adjustments will be 
getting used to the cold Wis­
consin winter. Jill comes from a 
family of five and her AFS host 
family is Mr. and Mrs. Willard 
Goeden and their children,

took food, clothing and their 
1975 Dodge van, which author­
ities said had not yet been 
located. It was not determined 
how Barber and Eichmann ar­
rived in Tennessee since no 
other vehicle was found.

Glick said law enforcement 
authorities did not try hard

(Continued on Page 3)

which Debbie has grown quite 
familiar with. A full course of 
studies, plus a swimming pool, 
tennis courts and horseback 
riding, should keep Debbie 
quite busy this semester.

The Domestic Exchange Pro­
gram is a part of the American 
Field Service Organization. The 
program is open to all high 
school students and participants 
are screened according to their 
adjustment capability, grades, 
and overall good representation 
of the sponsoring school. Parti­
cipating schools must send a 
student to another participating 
school and also sponsor a stu­
dent from another school in the 
U.S.

Wendi, Candi, Nanci, Dave and 
Don. She is excited about her 
stay with the Goeden family, in 
particular “Willie" Goeden’s 
stock car racing career.

Jill is taking a typical junior 
curriculum at KHS, and so far 
says she enjoys Kewaskum and 
Wisconsin very much.

She is looking forward to 
skiing and hopes to try her hand 
at snowmobiling, a sport totally 
new to her, if the weather 
cooperates.
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# iYOUR SATISFACTION IS ALWAYS FIRST

FOOD

MARKET

hSuw Mon ,hru F,i’8’9, Sot ’^Sundoy 8 301

S-NCE 1874

DAD’S 8 PA 16 oz. Bite.

MOT BEEB 99

STEAK IS
Lb.

Lb.

Lb.

3 lbs. 
or more . *149

Sirloin 
T-Bone 
Porterhouse

$2.39 
$2.89 
$2.99

VEGETABLE SALE

Ground 
Beef

STOKELY
KIDNEY BEANS 
GREEN BEANS 

or CORN

GOLDEN VALLEY

PURPLE PLUMS 

LIBBY CHUNKY PEARS 
LIBBY CHUNKY PEACHES

Hillshire Farm
SMOKED SAUSAGE
Mello Crisp
SLICED BACON

59.
'^ 590
’^ 550

Campbell's Soup

CHICKEN

Miss Mutfet

FROZEN 
RASPBERRIES '^ 89<
New Tombstone Combination
PIZZA 22‘/z oz. size

Mrs Paul’s

FISH FILLETS tw 
FISH STICKS
SNOW CROP 
ORANGE JUICE

$2.59

•,’.:■ 99‘

CUT-UP FRYERS - - 79c ^
Cornish Game Hens “-"• “»-•■>

Oscar Mayer, Reg 

BOLOGNA
Armour Star

5 $1.89 WIENERS
Oscar Mayer

). Thick. Thin 
Regular, 

Thick, Thin

b $1.19 HEW ENGLAND

eo

59c
89c

^ 11.29 

« 11.29 

« 11.29

Peanut Butter Creamy or Chunky

Blue Bonnet Regular 
Margarine

Baker's ^sr Chips 
Chunk Tuna A 
Hart Asparagus

Red Ripe
TOMATOES
Ex. Fancy Golden Delicious

APPLES
Crisp Green
CELERY
Texas Ruby Red

u- 2£ \ GRAPEFRUIT 
Con

Golden Grain

MACARONI

WITH THESE

^On 2 7 or Boxes 
Bee* Noodle

CLIP 
A SAVE

5 lb. 
Jar

PALMOLIVE
LIQUID

^VatMA^U

HAMBURGER 
HELPER

With Ca an Reo
Coupon >1 $1 79

L. Rosenheimer
Coupon Expires Feb 2

Water or 
Oil Pak

Extra
Standard

$3.89
1 ,b R 7rQuarters C

^ 99c 
“7 69c 

’?..“■ 59c

it 33c

3 lb- bag 99c

Bunch 29c

10/99c

WETAKE

in Easy Shopping!
Shopping can be hard work That s why 
we try to make your shopping trip as 
pleasant and easy as possible We re 
proud of our uncluttered aisles full 

shelves, and legible prices It s 
our pledge to you

t®> YOUR SATISFACTION IS ALWAYS FIRST'

ZIPLOC
FREEZER BAGS 

STORAGE BAGS 

SANDWICH BAGS

2^ 89c
2^ 870
50 ct. ee.

Box Ou*'

BATH TISSUE
Northern S 
Assorted 109

4 rolls

90 ^^^^ $1.4913c OFF 
Label

20c OFF 
Label

25c OFF 
Label

20c OFF 
Label

22 oz 
Btl.

GIANT FAB DETERGENT 

DYNAMO LIQUID DETERGENT 

FRESH START DETERGENT 

PINE SOL DISINFECTANT 

FANTASTIK REFILL Cleaner

11.49

Prices In This Ad Good Thru Mon., Feb. 4

On a 2 lb. Can 

BUTTERNUT 
COFFEE 

cX $580 a 
L. Rosenheimer

Coupon Expires Feb. 2 
!■■■ CLIP & SAVE ■■■!

On a 15 or Can

HUNT’S MEXICAN 
MANWICH

With 71e ^
Coupon 83c

L. Rosenheimer
Coupon Expires Fab 2 

■ ■■ CLIP & SAVE ■■■

mb“ 12.64 
V 14.99 

'itr 850 
^ H.69

On a 2Tb. Can 

MAXWELL HOUSE 
COFFEE 
55M ^ 

L. Rosenheimer 
Coupon expires Feu. 2
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Memories... The Statesman welcomes readers to submit photos 
for the "Memories’' feature. Photos should show 
life in the olden days in this area Deliver or mail to 
The Statesman, 250 Main St., Kewaskum, Wl 
53040. Photos can be picked up again after 
publication.

Heppe s Pirates basketball team of Kewaskum, taken in 1922, [Nippy] Martin; middle row - Norton [Mickey] Koerble, 
who played their games in the Kewaskum Opera House. Left to Manager Frank Heppe and Harry Schaefer; top row - Edwin 
right: Bottom row — Raymond [Tommy] Quandt and Elmer [Spatz] Miller and Marvin [Shorty] Schaefer.

Escapees
(Continued from Page 1) 

enough to capture the convicts. 
The Glicks have lived at their 
present address for about two 
years. Their home is located in a 
heavily wooded area.

Since June there have been 
seven escapees from Kettle 
Moraine. Two area legislators, 
chairmen from the Towns of 
Forest and Osceola in Fond du 
Lac County and the Towns of 
Greenbush and Mitchell in She­
boygan County, as well as Glick 
and union employees from Ket­
tle Moraine Institution planned 
to meet this week to discuss 
their concerns about the safety 
of area residents and security 
measures at the institution.

Barber, from Milwaukee, is 
serving a 12-year term for 
armed robbery. Eichmann, a 
Sheboygan native, was sen­
tenced in 1976 to a total of 20 
years for burglary, arson, theft, 
and attempted arson.

Effective Friday, all four tow­
ers at Kettle Moraine were 
being manned 24 hours per day. 
In addition, the perimeter of the 
medium security facility is be­
ing patroled by armed guards in 
a car.

Russell Clar, a shift super­
visor at Kettle Moraine, said 
authorities believe the Glicks’ 
van is somewhere within a three 
county area of where the es­
capees were apprehended in 
Tennessee.

Backhaus Infant

Baptized Jan. 20

The infant daughter of Steve 
and Ann Backhaus, Kewaskum, 
was baptized Sunday, January 
20, at Holy Trinity Church by 
Rev. John C. Budde.

She received the name Tam­
my Ann and her sponsors were 
James Ford Jr. of Eagle, Wis­
consin, and Nancy Ford of 
Campbellsport.

Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. David Backhaus 
of Kewaskum, and maternal

grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
James Ford Sr. of Milwaukee.

Paternal great-grandparents 
are Mrs. Ella Hansen and Mrs. 
Selma Backhaus of Kewaskum 
and Edward Haack of West 
Bend.

A dinner followed baptism at 
the home of the parents for 
sponsors and relatives.

FIREMEN’S MEETING
The regular monthly meeting 

of the Kewaskum Fire Depart­
ment will be held at the fire 
station at 7:30 p.m. next Thurs­
day. February 7.

Rescue Squad Calls
Wednesday, January 23 — 

Bret K. Rauch, 7, 374 First 
Street, Kewaskum, taken to St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital, 
West Bend, from Kewaskum 
Elementary School with a cut on 
the head resulting from a fall on 
the ice.

Friday. January 25 — Kevin 
Gasper, 4. 4897 Susan Lee

Court. West Bend, Town of 
Barton, taken to St. Joseph’s 
Community Hospital When he 
suffered a cut on his head on a 
bathroom door.

Saturday, January 26 - John 
R. Barnum, 11, 6421 N. Elm 
Tree Road, Milwaukee, re­
moved to St. Joseph’s Com­
munity Hospital from Sunburst 
Ski Hill area with an injury to 
his left hand.

For Lessons In

Macrame — Crocheting 
Knitting — Silk Flowers 

Call or Stop at

Just A Bit Crafty
127 Main, Kewaskum 

626 8060
Bucilla Yarns - Stitchery - Rugs

Featuring
“Li’l Twinkle Eyes” 

Drape Dolls
by Joyce/Jane

®7 ̂

All New Skates in Store

ICE SKATES
CLOSE OUT

GIRLS’ 
BOYS’ 
MEN’S

SIZE 2-4 reg. $16.95 NOW $10.17
SIZE 2-4 reg. $22.95 NOW $13.77
SIZE 5-9 reg $24 95 NOW $14.97

OFF USED SKATES

Village Sport Shop
334 Main Street Kewaskum

Phone 626-4541
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UW-Extension Offers

Houseplants Program
On Wednesday, February 13, 

at 7:00 p.m. there will be a two 
hour presentation on house­
plants - their care, propagation, 
and how to use them in your 
home. The instructor will be 
Terry Humfeld, the UW-Exten­
sion Horticulturist from Mil­
waukee.

The program will be held in 
the Washington County UW- 
Extension meeting room in the 
Courthouse Annex II, 515 East 
Washington Street, West Bend. 
There will be a $2.00 regis­
tration fee to cover the cost of 
materials and refreshments. 
Pre-registration is required be­
fore February 6, or call Jim 
Fritz, Interim Resource Agent 
at 338-4480, 644-5204 or 342- 
2929.

Almost everyone has some 
houseplants and similarly al­
most everyone has occasional 
problems with their plants. 
Knowing your plants and their 
individual needs will not only 
help you have healthy, sharp 
looking decorations for your 
home but will also allow you to 
multiply these plants for 
friends.

JAYCEE EMBLEMS — The Kewaskum Jaycees are sporting 
specially-designed membership emblems, thanks to Regal Ware, 
Inc. Shown above receiving the lapel pins from Regal’s Stan 
Woolman [right], are Ron Schmitz (center], Secretary and Richard

Thiemer (left], Treasurer. In the six short years since the 
Kewaskum Jaycees received their charter, the orgaization has 
grown to 50 members. Don Nowak is currently President of the 
organization.

New Owners to Teach
Lessons at Beaver
Dam Music Center

Mr. and Mrs. A. C. Finn 
announce that the lesson por­
tion of Beaver Dam Music 
Center has been purchased by 
Mike Yttri and Janet Voigt, 
henceforth known as “MIJA 
MUSIC.”

They will continue the ac­
cordion instruction in much the 
same manner as it has been and 
will offer guitar and drum 
lessons as well.

Janet has been teaching for 
the Music Center for many

years as well as playing pro­
fessionally.

Mike is well known in this 
area for his professional ap­
pearances and has taught guitar 
for many years in his home town 
of Cedarburg. More information 
can be obtained by calling Mike 
at 377-6829 or by calling Ke­
waskum 626-8112 anytime after 
5:00 p.m. cn Tuesday or Thurs­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Finn wish to 
thank the many friends they 
have known through the many 
years they have been in the 
accordion business and sincere­
ly hope that the same help and 
splendid cooperation will be ex­

tended to Mike and Janet.
Mr. Finn will continue to be 

available at Beaver Dam Music 
Center for sales, service and 
repairs on all accordions.

Carnations will last longer if 
you add a bit of boric acid 
to the water in the vase.

"Chickens are the most use­
ful animal,” wrote little Tommy 
in his essay. "You can eat them 
both before and after they are 
born.”

OF KEWASKUM

Dependable & Reasonable 
Since 1910

Fine Home Furnishings
LARGEST DISPLAY — DECORATOR SERVICE 

STORE PHONE 626-2184

Funeral Home
TWO BEAUTIFULLY FURNISHED CHAPELS 

215 FOREST AVE. DIAL 626 2185

Dennis’ Family Shoes
Phone 626-4332 KEWASKUM

OFF
(Excluding sale items)

pws108 
everything else in stock 
^I'lM^ Women (Leather or Vinyl) 
Boots rO' Children . . . . . ....

.............. % to % OFF
.......................... % OFF

Canadian 
Snow Packs 

$10 OFF!!

Men’s Leather Insulated Boots $10 OFF!! 
Boy’s and Men’s Zipper & Buckle Boots $5 OFF!!

-ALSO-

Snowmobile Boots 
$799 ail genders

Sale applies to in stock items only• ? 
No Special Orders’’
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Hess, Retired Regal Ware Executive, Pass On
Gerhard H. Guttman, 74, of 

962 Birchwood Drive, West 
Bend, died Tuesday, January 
29, at St. Joseph’s Community 
Hospital, West Bend.

He was born August 1, 1905, 
in Milwaukee, and married 
Catherine Tice in Milwaukee on 
September 17, 1927.

After their marriage they 
lived in Waukegan, Illinois, 
came to Kewaskum in 1953, 
where he was a police chief, and 
moved to West Bend in 1961.

He was a retired field rep­
resentative of the Chief of 
Police Association, State of 
Wisconsin.

Survivors include his wife; 
two daughters, Geraldine 
(Richard) Domrath of Green 
Bay, Catherine (Fred) Lord of 
Three Lakes; four grandchil­
dren; one sister, Bernice (How­
ard) Radanke of Milwaukee; 
one brother, Clarence of Mil­
waukee; and other relatives and 
friends.

Funeral services were held 
Thursday at 9:30 a.m. from the 
Techtman-Myrhum Funeral 
Home, West Bend, and at 10 
a.m. at St. Frances Cabrini 
Church, West Bend, for Mass of 
Christian Burial. Burial was in 
Holy Angels Cemetery.

Visitation at the funeral home 
was Wednesday after 4 p.m. 
with a parish vigil at 7 p.m. 
Wednesday.

GEORGE L. HESS

George L. Hess, of 827 Wal­
nut Street, West Bend, died 
Friday, January 25, at Milwau­
kee County General Hospital, at 
the age of 69.

He was born January 10, 1911 
in Sheboygan, where he grew 
up.

He graduated from the Uni­
versity of Wisconsin in 1935 
after which he was employed in 
journalism for a short time. He 
then was employed in the ad­
vertising department at The 
West Bend Company.

During World War II he 
worked for the Cyrus Erie 
Company in a defense type of 
position.

In 1950 he became the ad­
vertising manager at Regal 
Ware, Kewaskum, where he

GEORGE L. HESS

was employed until his retire­
ment in 1976. At the time of his 
retirement, he was the assistant 
to the president, a position he 
had held for nine years.

He was married to Ruth E. 
Dermody at Holy Angels 
Church, West Bend, on June 
12, 1937.

Survivors include his wife; six 
children, Lorelei Rassman of 
West Bend, Richard (Judy) of 
Menomonee Falls, Mary 
(James) Gillingham of Mt. 
Pleasant, Michigan, Dr. George 
Jr. (Jane) of Sheboygan, Ruth 
Ann O’Loughlin of West Bend 
and Robert (Joan) of Wooster, 
Ohio; 13 grandchildren; his 
mother-in-law, Bessie A. Der­
mody of Santa Ana, California, 
and other relatives and friends.

He was preceded in death by 
1 his parents and one sister.

Funeral services were held 
Monday with Mass of Christian 
Burial at Holy Angels Church at 
1 p.m. Burial was in the parish 
cemetery.

There was no visitation.
The Schmidt Funeral Home, 

West Bend, was in charge of 
arrangements.

DONALD GEIDEL
Donald H. Geidel, 27, of 1812 

N. 18th Avenue, West Bend, 
was pronounced dead on arrival 
at St. Joseph’s Community 
Hospital, West Bend, on Tues­
day evening, January 22. His

death was under investigation 
by the Coroner’s Office.

Mr. Geidel was born May 13, 
1952, in Fond du Lac to Byron 
and Ruth Barkow Geidel. On 
June 8, 1974, he married Debra 
Palmer in Holy Angels Church, 
West Bend.

He was an employee of 
Weasler Engineering Company, 
a member of the graduating 
class of 1970 of Campbellsport 
High School, a member of the 
Barton Land o’ Lakes baseball 
team, Amerahn Dartball 
League, Christian Brothers 
Dartball League and also 
bowled in the All Star and 
Friday Night Couples League at 
Weiland’s.

Survivors include his wife; 
one son, Jamie; his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Byron Geidel of 
rural Campbellsport; one broth­
er, Kenneth, of rural Campbell­
sport; two sisters, Mrs. Lois 
(Marvin) Schmidt of rural Ke­
waskum and Mrs. Arlene (Roy) 
Neitzel of rural Mayville; his 
parents-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. 
William Palmer of 260 Silver 
Brook Drive, West Bend; one 
brother-in-law, Mark of West 
Bend; one sister-in-law, Mrs. 
Carol (James) Gessert of Maple 
Grove, Minnesota; other rela­
tives and friends.

Visitation at Miller’s Funeral 
Home, Kewaskum, was after 4 
p.m. Thursday and on Friday at 
Peace United Church of Christ 
in Kewaskum from 12 noon to 
the time of services at 2 p.m. 
with Pastor Darrell Joiner offi­
ciating. Burial was in the church 
cemetery.

Pallbearers were Robert 
Gatzke, Jerry Liebetrau, Brian 
Bastian, Bill Roehr, Gary 
Schmidt and Chuck McClain.

AGNES BEISBIER
Funeral services for Mrs. 

Agnes L. Beisbier, 66, of 337

MINI LIQUOR MART
Yes, We Are Fighting Inflation 

With Everyday Low Prices
Your Dollar Is Always Worth More at

Forest Avenue, Campbellsport,
were held at 10:30 a.m. Tues­
day at Twohig Funeral Home 
and at 11 a.m. at St. Matthew’s 
Church in Campbellsport. The 
Rev. Victor Kemmer officiated.

Visitation for Mrs. Beisbier 
was after 3 p.m. Monday at the 
funeral home. Burial was in the 
parish cemetery.

Mrs. Beisbier died Saturday, 
January 26. 1980, at St. Agnes 
Hospital, Fond du Lac. She was 
born October 25, 1913, in 
Campbellsport, the daughter of 
John and Catherine Becker 
Stoffel. On May 18, 1935, she 
was married to Leander Beis­
bier in Campbellsport.

She was a member of St. 
Matthew’s Church and the 
Christian Mother and Altar 
Society.

Surviving are one brother, 
Frank Stoffel of Fond du Lac, 
and one sister, Mrs. Albert 
(Eleanor) Kulow of Campbell­
sport.

She was preceded in death by 
her husband and one sister.

Leaders Named

For Catholic

Stewardship Appeal
General chairman Norbert J. 

Stefaniak recently named Leo F. 
Schlaefer of West Bend as 
Washington County leader for 
the 1980 Catholic Stewardship 
Appeal.

Schlaefer will coordinate the 
appeal for funds in the 21 
parishes and missions of Wash­
ington County. He has led the 
drive in the county for ten 
years.

Gerald Stoffel is again chair­
man for Holy Trinity parish, 
Kewaskum, and George Han­
rahan for St. Bridget’s Mission, 
Town of Wayne.

The 1980 Catholic Steward-
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ship Appeal will be conducted 
from February 24 to April 1 in 
the ten counties of the Mil­
waukee archdiocese. This an­
nual appeal is the major source 
of revenue for the archdiocese. 
It enables the archdiocese to 
meet its financial commitments 
and helps support a variety of 
agencies, programs and ser­
vices.

In 1980 the Catholic Steward­
ship Appeal raised a record 
$4,082,814 in gifts from 115,026 
donors, surpassing its record 
goal of $4 million. Washington 
County achieved 98.5 percent of 
its goal, with gifts totaling 
$153,636 from 5.052 donors.

Watching his dad change into 
a tux. the little lad said: “Please 
don’t wear that coat with the 
shiny lapels. Whenever you 
wear it. you don’t feel good the 
next day.”

SCHMITT’S NEVER
G^sS

$eCx
5^V
2>

Widmer’s

BRICK

CHEESE
Just
$2.00 per lb..

INN

^

^e

EXTRA SPECIAL FOR FEBRUARY
GUCKENHE1MER Qts. $4.62 plus tax 3/$13.56 plus tax
OLD STYLE 24-12 oz. ret. $5.82 plus tax and deposit
OLD STYLE 12 pack $3.37 plus tax
KINGSBURY 12 pack $2.79 plus tax
OLD STYLE 24-12 oz. flat $6.39 plus tax
Catherine the Great
VODKA Qt. $3.80 plus tax 3/$ll.ll plus tax
COKE TAB FRESCA 8-16 oz. bottles $1.39 plus tax and deposit

COUPON SPECIAL 
Buy Any 2 Cases 

of Beer Get 
1 Free Glass 

of Beer
Good Thru 2-9-80

1j COUPON SPECIAL

SOME Buy Any 3 Bottles
SUPPLIES i
MAY BE ’
LIMITED ’

■ Hi Test
1 Get

1 Free Shot
1[ Good Thru 2-9-80
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Schmidt — Shaw

Mr. and Mrs. Wilmer 
Schmidt of 4350 Hwy. 28 West, 
Kewaskum, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Samuel Shaw, Jr. of 242 East 
Merrill Avenue, Fond du Lac, 
are proud to announce the 
engagement of their children, 
Sharon Ann and Jeffrey Lyn.

Sharon is a 1976 graduate of

Kewaskum High School and is 
self-employed.

Jeff is a 1977 graduate of 
Goodrich High School, Fond du 
Lac. He is a Specialist Fourth 
Class in the United States 
Army, stationed in Germany.

Their wedding date is August 
2, 1980.

Immunization

Clinics Set
Immunization clinics offered 

by the Washington County 
Community Health Nursing 
Service continue to be held 
twice monthly in West Bend. 
On the first Tuesday of each 
month the clinic hours will be 
2:00 to 6:00 p.m., and on the 
fourth Tuesday of each month 
the clinic hours will be 9:00 to 
12:00 noon.

February clinics are: Febru­
ary 5 - 2:00 to 6:00 p.m. Febru­
ary 26 - 9:00 to 12:00 noon.

TWes! FREEGIFJS
We carry

CARLSON CRAFT

INVITATIONS and 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 

NAPKINS 
BRIDAL BOOKS 
ACCESSORIES

WEDDING STATIONERY

Fast Service, Reasonably Priced!

10% OFF
2-1-80 to 3-1-80

Kewaskum Statesman
205 Main St. Phone 626-2626

The clinics will be held in the 
Community Health Nursing 
Service office at 515 East Wash­
ington Street, West Bend.

All recommended immuniza­
tions are available to children 
and adults and are provided 
free of charge. There is a $1.00 
charge for the T.B. skin test for 
those age 16 and over.

For further information call: 
Community Health Nursing 
Service, 338-4462 or 644-5204, 
Ext. 4462, Mrs. Delores P. 
Harder, R.N., Director.

THREE BAPTIZED 
AT HOLY TRINITY

Babies welcomed into the 
community of the faith at Holy 
Trinity Church, Kewaskum, re­
cently included: Rebecca Cath­
erine, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Zachary Stoffel; Corey Michael, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. David 
Amerling; Tammy Ann, daugh­
ter of Mr. and Mrs. Steven 
Backhaus.

Send in your pictures to the 
Statesman. No charge.

Roy-Lehrer
Mr. and Mrs. Lawrence Roy, 

1222 Adams Street. West Bend 
are pleased to announce the 
engagement of their daughter 
Roxanne to Frank F. Lohrer, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Lohrer. 3019 Hwy. H, Kewas­
kum.

Roxanne is a 1979 graduate of 
West Bend East High School 
and is presently employed as a

cosmetologist at Command Per­
formance.

Frank is a 1978 graduate of 
Kewaskum High School and is 
presently employed at Meta­
Mold in Cedarburg. He will be 
attending Fox Valley Tech in 
February.

An early fall wedding of 1981 
is being planned by the couple.

HIGH RATE.
SHORT WAIT.

KEWASKUM
Rate

FLORAL SHOP Invest $10

BRIDAL SHOW
SUNDAY, FEB. 3

%

2:00 p.m.
y

THE AMERAHN
% mile north of Kewaskum 

on Highway 45

11.846%
good from Jan. 31, 1980 thru Feb. 6, 1980 1

10,000 or more for 26 weeks and you'll 
» hiohest rate of interest we're allowedreceive the highest rate of interest we're allowed

to pay on Money Market Certificates.
Whatever the rate at the time you buy, is the 

rate you will be guaranteed for the full 26 weeks.
AISO AVAILABLE

SPECIAL 2V2-YEAR CERTIFICATES
Now Paying 10.40% — 11.11 9% Compounded Annually

Rate good through February 29, 1980
Minimum Deposit only $100.00

Substantial penalty for early withdrawal of Time Deposits

Gowns by
Esther's of Hartford

Free Tickets Available At
KEWASKUM FLORAL

Exhibitors
BIER’S JEWELRY 

MILLER’S FURNITURE 
KEWASKUM STATESMAN 
DON FREDERICK STUDIO

ARNIE’S CAKE SHOPPE 
ALICE’S CAKE SHOPPE 

A & K CATERING 
And Others

^y Valley Bank
MEMBERS FDIC AND VALLEY BANCORPORATION

KEWASKU M/ALLENTON

MANY DOOR PRIZES
'wvmwt-w- RP



IRREGULAR PIECES - IN LIGHT SYRUP

SUNRISE PEARS

' 69* SENTRY
doing our best to bring you

FROM NEGATIVE OR SLIDE

8 "x10" COLOR 
ENLARGEMENT SPECIAL
No Cui Negative# 

ALLOWS 10 WORK 
DAYS FOR RETURN 

No Limit

WELCH'S^ qq
GRAPE ?1W 
JUICE . . . ■ ££

PRICES EFFECTIVE JAN 28 THROUGH SUN FEB 3 1980

$*199X Each

DONALD DUCK NATURAL

ORANGE JUICE

85*
Can

saver’s coupon

FOUR GREAT VALUES FROM

PLANTER S 120z

Cocktail Peanuts ?.n. 10
MILKY WAY, 3 MUSKETEERS OR SNICKERS

Mars Snack Bars .^.$ 189
ASSORTED FLAVORS

BETTY CROCKER

'Potato 
BUDS

■a
SUPER MOIST 
CAKE MIX ..

BETTY CROCKER

MASHED
POTATO
BUDS............

^QC ^
BETTY CROCKER ASSORTED

READY TO ( 
SPREAD 
FROSTINGS ..

$*109
■ 16 5 0z
■ Can

Pkg.

ENRICHED 

GOLD 
MEDAL 
FLOUR 93*Bag

SENTRY

APPLE SAUCE

99*
CONTADINA

TOMATO PASTE
CONTADINA

TOMATO SAUCE
saver’s coupon

SAVE

to LB BAG

Idaho
Russet $ ^ 56
PoiatDeS With Coupon

12 OZ SIZE REGULAR OR PINE

TyDBol 

Bowl 80*
Cleaner With Coupon

SAVE

4 BAH PACK PERSONAL SIZE

SAVESAVE

ASSORTED COLORS NORTHERN

19*

21*
6 pack

Borden
Drumsticks 98*

With Coupon

CONTADINA _ _ .
14 5 0z A4^

Stewed Tomatoes c.an. 4 I
CONTADINA 28Oz

Whole Tomatoes .cr. DU
MINUTE MAID
_ r . 48 0z

Grapefruit Juice ?°ile. I

Bathroom Tissue 4 Rolls 99*
COLORFUL PRINTS 

Gala Towels 
24' OFF LABEL

Jumbo 
Roll 73* 14*

Close Up Toothpaste $1?? ^ ©

Ivory 
Bar 
Soap

69*
With Coupon

*2

SAVE

saver’s coupon

13*
0S-3

SAVE

TWO 6 OZ CANS FROZEN

Snow Crop

Orange F^ 89*

DOWNY

FABRIC SOFTENER

Juice With Coupon

saver’s coupon

39*
©

17 19 0Z PKG FROZEN 
ASSORTED

Sara Lee

Cheese 5160
Cake With Coupon

SAVE

3 LB CAN REG . DRIP OR 
ELECTRIC PERK

saver’s coupon

Hills 
Bros. $897
Coffee With Coupon

S5

SAVE

saver’s coupon

20*
160Z PKG

Trix S') 21
Cereal With Coupon

S-6

SAVE

saver’s coupon

20*

20 OZ PKG

Charms $143
Cereal With Coupon

S-7

SAVE

saver’s coupon

23*
S-8 ©L

24 OZ BOTTLE

Mrs. Butterworth
Syrup $*|22

With Coupon

$949
96 Oz.

■HMM Bottle

SENTRY AUTOMATIC

DISHWASHER DETERGENT

$*125
■ 50 Oz.
■ Pkg

SAVE

saver’s coupon

25*
Ml ^J

TWO 21 OZ CAN§

Comet 2 QQC 
Cleanser

With Coupon

SAVE

saver’s coupon

48 02 JAR WELCH’S

Grape Jam SAVE

saver’s coupon

53*
©S9

SAVE

Or 
Jelly

$^20

With Coupon
13*

*14 0

80 CT. PKG

Glad

Sandwich 46*
Bags With Coupon

SAVE

59*
S22 ^^

18 0Z BOTTLE

Listerine
Mouthwash

With Coupon

saver’s coupon

27*

©*10

SAVE

16OZ BOTTLE

Wishbone
Italian $^10
Dressing With Coupon

saver’s coupon

49*
s-11 0

TWO 12 02 JARS ASSORTED

SAVE

SAVE

saver’s coupon

20 CT PKG

Glad Medium SAVE

saver’s coupon

29*

©
Garbage 
Bags With Coupon 26*

*23 0

48 OZ PKG
PILLSBURY HUNGRY JACK

Buttermilk
Pancake ^ 17

Mix With Coupon

tar

46OZ JAR GENUINE

Heinz
Dill >130

Pickles With Coupon

saver’s coupon

27*
*12 0

SAVE

Heinz
Home Style 2
Gravy For 95*

With Coupon

saver’s coupon

27*
S-13 Q

S15

SAVE

saver’s coupon

27*
S16 Q

SAVE

39*
s-17 Q

10 CT PKG

Glad
Trash $^08

BdgS With Coupon

32 OZ SIZE

Lime- $ ^ 36

A Way with Coupon

SAVE

saver’s coupon

30*
S24

SAVE

64 OZ BOTTLE

Liquid $229

With Coupon

saver’s coupon

29*
*» Q

40 CT PKG REG . SUPER OR 
SUPER PLUS

J"^ 4 4 96
Tampons I

With Coupon

TW015 0Z CANS LASAGNA OR 
SPAGHETTI & MEAT BALLS

Chef
Boy Ar Dee F^$ I19
Favorites with coupon

SAVE

saver’s coupon

49*
S-18

18OZ AEROSOL CAN

Lysol
Disinfectant $2®®
Spray With Coupon

SAVE 

SAVE

saver’s coupon

SAVE

2 LB CAN REG , DRIP OR 
ELECTRIC PERK 

Folger's $579 
Coffee With Coupon
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January Kiwanis Students of the Month

Wendi Goeden Tom Rosenberger

Revised Athletic Code Will

Wendi Goeden, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Willard Goeden 
of rural Kewaskum and gran- 
daughter of Mrs. Leo Goeden 
and Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Ohmann of West Bend, and 
Tom Rosenberger, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Thomas Rosenberger 
of Fredonia, have been chosen 
as Kiwanis students for the 
month of January.

Wendi was inducted into the 
National Honor Society in her 
junior year. She served two 
years as a student council 
representative. She was a mem­
ber and treasurer of the Key 
Club for 2 years. Wendi played 
in the Concert band, Pep band 
and Symphonic band. She was 
on the Sadie Hawkins court and 
prom queen in her junior year. 
Wendi did the make up for all 
the plays and musicals during 
the last four years. She partici-

Lutherans for

Life Plan Banquet

Mrs. Jean Garton, President 
of the National Lutherans for 
Life, will be the featured speak­
er at the organization's Wis­
consin chapter kickoff banquet 
on Saturday, February 16.

Mrs. Garton, a member of the 
Missouri Synod, has been a 
pioneer in the pro-life cause, 
and was voted one of the ten 
most influential Lutherans in 
America in 1978. Wisconsin 
Lutherans for Life, founded in 
1979, is an organization through 
which all Lutherans meet to 
share dialogue and cooperate to 
give a common witness within 
the church and society on their 
concerns for the value and dig­
nity of all human life.

The banquet's social hour will 
begin at 6:00 p.m., at Dietze's 
Alpine Cellar, 800 W. Layton 
Avenue, Milwaukee, with din­
ner being served at 6:45, fol­
lowed by Mrs. Garton’s pro­
gram. The cost for the evening 
is $8.25 per person. Reserva­
tions may be made by sending a 
check and the names and ad­
dresses of all those attending, 
to: Lutherans for Life, 922 E. 
Juneau Avenue, Milwaukee, 
Wisconsin 53202. Tickets and 
nametags may be picked up at 
the banquet. For more informa­
tion. call Jerry Hiller at 1-272- 
8155.

Nylac cleans kitchen carpet­
ing beautifully in 15 minutes. 
Dry in one hour. No machine. 
Ask Miller’s of Kewaskum.

pated in gymnastics for one 
year and cheerleading for three 
years. She worked on the year­
book in her junior year and this 
year is editor. Wendi is entered 
in Who’s Who in American 
High School Students.

Tom has also been involved in 
various productions during the 
last four years including, “Mu-

Terraces-A Conservation Practice
By Leslie Meadows 

County Soil Conservationist
Webster’s Dictionary defines 

terraces as an “open area con­
nected with a house and serving 
as an outdoor living space.” 
But, in the field of soil con­
servation, terraces take on a 
new definition.

Terraces are a conservation 
practice, which when construc­
ted across a slope control ero­
sion by diverting or storing 
surface runoff instead of per­
mitting it to flow uninterrupted 
down the slope. So, in essence, 
terraces break up or shorten the 
slope length and reduce the 
snowballing effect of water run­
off.

In addition to reducing soil 
loss, terraces also protect low­
lands from excess water, pro­
mote better soil stability and 
fertility, they can be easily

“Hurricane
Express” ;
Sat., February 2nd I

APOLLO'S LYRE :
1310 Riverside Dr., Kewaskum .

"I inesf Rock on Stage & Stereo" *

Hall Available for All Occasions •
626 2849 ’ :

sic Man,” “The Mouse That 
Roared,” “The Sound of Mu­
sic,” “My Fair Lady,” “You 
Were Born On a Rotten Day” 
and “Fiddler On the Roof.” He 
participates in Forensics and is 
a member of the Chess Club. 
He sings with the Mixed Chorus 
and is also a yearbook photo­
grapher.

farmed and allow earlier spring 
tillage and finally, with ter­
races, a great deal of nutrients 
and water remain on the fields 
for crops to use. Sediment and 
other pollutants also remain on 
the field and out of the streams.

There is a myth that terraces 
are not workable with today’s 
larger machinery. However, 
landowners with terrace sys­
tems farm them easily since 
they are designed and con­
structed to allow cropping of 
channels and broad-based rid­
ges.

Are you curious enough to 
ask questions? If so, give us a 
call at the U.S. Soil Conser­
vation Service office. The tele­
phone number is 334-3706 or 
write us at 2395 West Wash­
ington Street, West Bend, 
53095. We will be glad to help 
you increase the value of your 
land and your yields.

Be Presented to
By DAN MEILAHN

Statesman Staff Writer
The Kewaskum Board of 

Education was informed by 
High School Principal Clark 
Pearson that a revised athletic 
code proposal will be presented 
to the board later in the year.

Pearson said the committee 
consists of primarily coaches: 
Fran Charland, Mike Theiler, 
Ernest Mitchell, Milt Dickin- 
sen, and Pearson.

Board member Richard 
Theusch suggested the board 
should have some input into the 
proposal. Pearson said it would 
definitely be presented to the 
board for any suggestions or 
changes.

Board president John Tessar 
noted that the board was re­
ceiving complaints about ath­
letes who violate training rules. 
He also said that often people 
wish the board members to be 
the persons reporting violations 
and sign the complaint. Tessar 
felt this was wrong and no one 
but an actual witness should 
sign such a complaint.

Superintendent of Schools 
Floyd Brenholt said some peo­
ple want the board to take 
action without coming forth 
themselves as witnesses. Pear­
son added that if an athlete 
denies a violation and no wit­
nesses come forward, he is “at 
a dead end.”

About legitimate complaints, 
Pearson said, “...we do try and 
investigate to the best of our 
ability.” The board responded 
that was all he could do.

Pearson also reported that a 
committee to establish cheer­
leaders’ rules and regulations 
had been appointed since there 
were no volunteers. The com­
mittee which will meet Febru­
ary 22 consists of: Jean Goeden, 
representing the school board;

School Board
Judy Harlow, representing the 
community; Debbie Bargman, a 
senior cheerleader; Dave Drex­
ler, a track coach; Mary Mc­
Cormick, the cheerleading ad­
visor; and Pearson. A proposal 
for a cheerleading constitution 
should be presented to the 
board for action in late March.

The board adjourned to 
closed session to discuss staff 
evaluations by principals and to 
discuss teacher negotiations.

Births
KNOEBEL - A daughter, 

Kelly Jo to Richard and Cynthia 
Knoebel, 709 Moraine Ct., Ke­
waskum, Monday, January 28, 
at St. Agnes Hospital, Fond du 
Lac.

BUNKELMAN - A son to 
Charles and Cynthia Bunkel- 
man, 1410 Sunset Ridge Road, 
West Bend, Saturday, January 
26. Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Wilmer Bunkel- 
man, Kewaskum.

WARNER — A son to Bret 
and Jennifer Warner, Kewas­
kum, Sunday, January 27.

HOLT — A son to Lark and 
Joyce Lawenz, Kewaskum, 
Monday, January 28.

LOR RIG AN — A son, Patrick 
James, to Mr. and Mrs. Pat 
Lorrigan, 4412 Lakeshore Drive, 
Fond du Lac, Wednesday, Jan­
uary 16. Paternal grandmother 
is Mrs. Marie Lorrigan. rural 
Campbellsport, and maternal 
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
William Timblin, rural Eden.

STAHL — A daughter, Stacie 
Lynn, to Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Stah], 225 Mill Street, Camp­
bellsport, Friday, January 18.
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Leslie H. Ludwig

Spec. 4 Leslie H. Ludwig, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Glenn A. 
Ludwig Sr.. 1139 Midland Ave­
nue, Kewaskum, recently com­
pleted the Primary Leadership 
Course at Fort Riley, Kansas.

The course develops leader­
ship, supervisory and mana­
gerial skills appropriate to shop 
or office environments for sol­
diers who have been selected by 
their commanders as having 
potential to become, or advance 
as, noncommissioned officers.

It is designed to train combat

Apply Now For 

4-H State Music

And Drama Groups
Applications are now avail­

able for the 1980 4-H Congress 
and State Fair Music and Dra­
ma groups. Deadline date to 
apply is March 1.

Each year there is a musical 
group and a drama group de­
veloped with high school age 
youth from all over Wisconsin. 
This year the group from south­
eastern Wisconsin will present 
a play entitled “The Neigh­
bors" by Zona Gale. Helen 
O’Brien, Extension Drama Spe­
cialist will direct the play. There 
will be dress rehearsals in the 
spring and a presentation of the 
play at State 4-H Congress in 
Madison on June 10.

The musical group will be 
under the direction of Dave 
Peterson, Extension Arts music 
drama specialist. They will de­
velop a pop music format with 
choreographed movement along 
the line of todays swing choir 
style. Those selected for the 
musical group will attend a 
rehearsal weekend at Camp 
Upham Woods April 25-27. 
They will then perform at State 
4-H Congress in Madison June 
9-12 and also at State Fair July 
30 to August 4.

The drama group or the 
music group is an excellent 
opportunity for high school age 
members that have participated 
in or are interested in high 
school drama and music ac­
tivities. Selection of members to 
participate is based on past 
experience and the need to have 
a balanced chorus. 4-H mem­
bers interested in applying 
should get the application blank 
from the county 4-H office, Box 
537. West Bend 53095. Phone 
338-4478.

support, combat service support 
and combat arms personnel.

Ludwig is a Military Police­
man with the U.S. Army Re­
training Brigade.

Sergeant Matthew J. Stefan- 
ovic, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Richard Stefanovic of 9139 For­
estview Drive, Kewaskum, has 
reenlisted in the U.S. Air Force 
after being selected for career 
status.

Sergeant Stefanovic, an air­
craft maintenance specialist at 
Langley Air Force Base, Hamp­
ton, Virginia, was approved for 
reenlistment by a board which 
considered character and job 
performance.

♦

St. Bridget’s

KIRMES DANCE 
Sponsored by St. Bridget’s Congregation

Friday, February 1 
8:30 p.m. to 12:30 a.m. 

dt tho

AMERAHN HALL 
KEWASKUM. WIS.

MUSIC BY

JERRY SCHNEIDER’S 
Recording Orchestra

DONATION: $1.00 advance — SI .50 at door

EXCELLENT FOOD & COCKTAILS । 
FRIDAY SPECIAL

Served 5:00 p.m. to 10:00 p.m.

Batter Fried Fish
ALL YOU CAN EAT

$3.25
Includes French Fries, Cole Slaw and Rye Bread 

Also Serving From Our Regular Menu 
RESERVATIONS SUGGESTED

Call 626-2711
Hwys. 45 and 28, Kewaskum

Hotline Operators
The Open Door of Washing­

ton County, Inc. is now accep­
ting applications for volunteer 
Hotline operators. The Hotline 
is a twenty-four hour phone 
service that serves Washington, 
Ozaukee, Milwaukee and Wau­
kesha counties. The training 
program will begin on February 
25, 1980, at 7:00 p.m. at the 
Open Door in West Bend. Vol­
unteers make a four month 
committment and work only 
eight hours per month on two 
shifts of their choosing. Most 
often, the shifts run from 6:00 
p.m. to 10:00 p.m. Monday 
through Friday. In addition, 
a monthly in-service meeting is 
required.

Specifically, the program of­
fers drug education, personal 
growth workshops, crisis inter­
vention training and suicide 
prevention techniques. Volun­
teers will also have an oppor­
tunity to learn more about com­
munity services and to ex­
change thoughts and ideas with 
other individuals who are likely
to have common concerns about 
current social issues.

The Open Door has found 
that some persons volunteer in 
order to gain worthwhile exper­
ience that can enhance a per­
sonal resume or aid college 
studies. Others volunteer be­
cause they have heard that the 
experience is both unique and 
challenging. And still others 
volunteer because they simply 
want to help people.

Whatever the reason, the 
Open Door needs volunteers 
who can do the job, so if you 
have the ability to listen and a 
sincere desire to help people, 
contact Ann Stoffel by calling 
334-4636, 644-6016, 933-7300 or 
675-2354.

Chili Social at

Cedar Lake Home
Members of the resident 

Cedar Lake Home Campus 
Cook's Club will be sponsoring 
their annual Chili “Delight" 
Social on Sunday, February 3, 
from 2-4 p.m. at Fellowship 
House on the campus, 5595 
Hwy Z.

Featured on the menu is 
Chili for 65c a bowl; and ham 
sandwiches, 75c; home made 
apple kuchen, 45c; juice drink, 
15c. A complete tray is $1.90.

The Club’s wide assortment 
of candy for Valentine sweet­
hearts will also be available plus 
a display of resident hand 
crafted items for sale.

The Cook’s Club’s social pro­
ceeds are designated for re­
sident therapy stoves and re­
frigerators in the new 57 bed 
replacement wing scheduled for 
completion late this spring.

Weight Control
Classes at MPTI

The holidays are behind us 
and so is some of the weight we 
gained around Christmas and 
New Years. If you are showing 
the effects of too much holiday 
partying and zippers are begin­
ning to fight back, perhaps it’s 
time to enroll in one of Moraine 
Park Technical Institute’s 
weight control classes.

MPTI is beginning a new 
section of “Weight Control - A 
New Perspective" beginning

Fin-n-Feather
New Prospect 

Phone 533-4135

Specials
Served from 5 to 10 p.m.

Fri.-Fresh Fish Fry 
Sat.—Prime Rib and

Porterhouse
Sun., served from noon til 4
Chicken & Ham Plate 
Regular menu served 

from 12 noon to 10 p.m.
Week night specials coming soon11

Saturday, February 2

LIVE MUSIC 
jAiqeihlyi

Hwy. 45 North of Kewaskum

Friday, February 1
St. Bridget’s Kirmes Dance 

JERRY SCHNEIDER 
Recording Orchestra

DON SCHLiES
Sponsored by New Fane ■ rtsmen’s Club 

ID Cards Reqi

Sunday, February 3
Kewaskum ^ioral
BRIDAL J mow

Thursday, February 21 from 
7-8:50 p.m. Students will learn 
and discuss some of the facts 
and fallacies of weight control, 
how to do a weight analysis and 
take notes on their own habits 
and life styles. They will learn 
about flattering clothing styles, 
low-cal foods and other topics 
pertinent to weight loss. In­
structor Roxanne Piller will 
offer ten weeks of instruction at 
the Decorah Annex in the 
Decorah Shopping Center. Tui­
tion is $7.00, payable in ad­
vance at MPTI, 2151 N. Main 
Street, West Bend. Students 
may call 334-3413 for more 
information. All registrations 
are accepted on a first-come, 
first-served basis.

SAMARITAN RESIDENTS 
TO DINE OUT’ MONTHLY

On Valentine’s Day, Febru­
ary 14, and once a month 
thereafter, the Home’s Chapel 
will be transformed into a cozy 
pleasant restaurant. Samaritan 
Home residents and two guests 
of their choice will enjoy an 
evening of “dining out" at 
Samaritan’s new restaurant.

Presently, the Samaritan’s 
restaurant is unnamed, but a 
contest is underway and resi­
dents and employees can sub­
mit their suggestions. Staff 
from various departments are 
busy planning menus, decor, 
and lining up necessary equip­
ment.

Anyone requesting further 
information can contact the 
restaurant committee chairman 
Sue Seefeldt, or vice chairman, 
Cathy Wittmann, at 338-4500.

Dennis & Betty Krueger
Your Hosts
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Forced Retirement
Is Hazard to Health

Forced retirement from 
the work force merely be­
cause the worker has reached 
a certain age is a serious pub­
lic health problem in the 
United States today.

improvements in the 
provision of medical care, 
higher levels of health edu­
cation, better sanitation, 
and the conquest of the 
severe diseases of childhood 
have brought about drama­
tic increases in the number 
of older persons in our 
population.

But, this potential in­
crease in life expectancy will 
prove of little boon to man­
kind if at an arbitrary age he 
or she is denied the right to 
work and produce. And, re­
gardless of health considera­
tions, if he or she is forced 
into idleness, it is question­
able whether our society can 
survive the financial bur­
den of larger numbers of 
dependents.

It is the position of the 
Amencan Medical Associa­
tion that the nation’s social 
policy for the aging should 
ensure that the older worker 
has the opportunity to con­
tinue in productive employ­
ment as long as he or she 
wishes and is able to main­
tain a reasonable level of 
efficiency.

Many people wish to retire 
in their early 60s and are 
quite happy with this change

f / if « d in ***** •* wu H D IIHTIMAN .

ALSO FEATURING PIN-STRIPING 
317 N. RoHrood St., Compb«llqx>rt, Wl 33010

THE SUPER MARKET 
OF AUTO REPAIRS

Goeden Auto Body
Complete Auto Body Repairs 

and Painting Professionally Done

INSURANCE ESTIMATES AND REPAIRS 
OUR SPECIALTY

Automotive - Tune-Ups - Exhaust - Brakes 
Tires-Anti-Freeze-Texoco Products 
ML DONE TO TOUR SATISFACTION 

24 HOUR TOWING 
Hy. 28 E. of Kewaskum in St. Michaels

334-27S9
Trf Qur Personalized Service 
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in lifestyle. But many others 
want to keep working 
Physicians who treat older 
patients often recognize that 
many physical ailments are a 
result of inactivity and a lack 
of meaningful and produc­
tive status.

Employers who refuse to 
hire after 45 or 55 because of 
commitment to the concept 
of retirement at age 65 and a 
resulting short job tenure for 
older employees are ignoring 
the revolution in aging which 
is taking place. It is not 
unreasonable to expect a 
percentage of those now 45 
or 55 to be potentially valu­
able employees at 70, 75. or 
even 80.

Older workers attendance 
record often is better then 
younger ones. They are less 
prone to change jobs. In 
production jobs, the output 
of older workers up to age 65 
compares favorably with that 
of younger workers. In of­
fice occupations, age-related 
differences are minimal.

There are now laws that 
forbid forced retirement 
prior to age 70, and that pro­
hibit discrimination in hiring 
because of age. But if it is 
necessary to resort to law to 
enforce these provisions, the 
work situation will be very 
unpleasant for the older 
worker.

Your doctor, who is likely 
to work himself well past 
the customary “retirement 
age,” reminds those of you 
who are younger that you 
will render a service to the 
individual and to society by 
evaluating the older persons 
in your work force as indi­
viduals rather than as marks 
on the calendar

January, 1980 
Frank Chappell 
Science News Editor 
AMA

PREVENT
CONDENSATION ON
COLD WINDOW SURFACES

where it will condense.
In shades and drapes made of 

several layers of fabric, put the 
vapor barrier right behind the 
material facing the room. If you 
use it with existing window 
treatments, it needs to be right 
behind them. Any vapor barrier 
needs to be tightly sealed on all 
sides to be effective.

Condensation or frost will 
appear on windows when the 
temperature of the glass falls 
below the dew point. Check for 
this moisture often because it 
can cause major damage to 
frames and sills.

To reduce this problem while 
maintaining a comfortable level 
of humidity in your home, try to 
keep the inner glass from 
getting too cold. Careful instal­
lation of storm windows is one 
way.

But often interior windows 
aren’t well sealed themselves, 
so moist air will leak through 
and condense on the storm 
window. Properly fitted storm 
windows have one-fourth inch 
vents in the frame where the 
storm sash meets the sill to 
allow moisture to dissipate. If 
storm windows don’t have these 
vents, drill them through the 
frames.

If you still get condensation 
between the windows, place a 
teaspoon of silica gel between 
the inner and outer window 
units. Silica gel is a drying 
agent that will soak up moisture 
in the air space. Since it’s 
commonly used for drying flow­
ers look for it in craft stores or 
florists.

Interior windows will often 
ice up when shades or draperies 
are closed. This is because most 
window treatments separate the 
window glass from the room air, 
allowing the glass to cool below 
the dew point temperature. An 
additional interior storm win­
dow will help reduce condensa­
tion behind closed draperies or 
shades.

If sealed insulated window 
treatments are used they need 
to contain a vapor barrier. The 
vapor barrier can be a plastic 
sheet, polyethylene (storm win­
dow plastic) or vinyl. Always 
place it as close to the warm 
side as possible to prevent 
trapping the moisture at » ooint

The best test to a seal is 
whether or not condensation 
occurs. Different homes require 
differing degrees of tightness, 
depending on humidity, air 
circulation, and window type.

Standard First Aid
Offered at MPTI

Moraine Park Technical Insti­
tute, in cooperation with the 
West Bend Chapter of the 
American Red Cross, will offer 
“Standard First Aid and Per­
sonal Safety” beginning Feb­
ruary 13. Lee Bohn, veteran of 
the West Bend Fire Depart­
ment’s rescue squad, will con­
duct the sessions.

Standard First Aid is a basic 
course in the immediate emer­
gency treatment given in case of 
sudden illness or accident. Stu­
dents will receive the Red Cross

Epilepsy is not a disease. It 
does not cause brain damage, 
mental illness, or retardation, 
and it is controllable. Epilepsy 
is a neurological malfunction. 
Seizures result from sudden 
overactivity of the brain cells, 
possibly caused by irritation as 
the result of injury from illness 
or an accident.

Control of seizures is 
possible with the aid of drugs. 
Most epileptics live Ilves 
similar to people with diabetes 
or high blood pressure--con­
sistent medication Is usually 
all that is needed.

Certificate upon satisfactory 
completion of the course. Class­
es will meet on seven Wednes­
days from 7-8:50 p.m. Tuition is 
$5.60 payable in advance at 
MPT1, 2151 N. Maip Street, 
West Bend. Students may call 
334-3413 for more information. 
All registrations are accepted 
on a first-come, first-served
basis.

My Neighbors

“Why, I’d love to have you 
drop over, Don—I want to 
show you my new dress!”

To Order the
Kewaskum Statesman 

Just Call 626-2626

More 

Gas Heat 

Per 

Dollar!

Enjoy heating comfort plus 
maximum efficiency with a 
LENNOX CONSERVATOR tm 
gas furnace.

Electronic ignition, heat- 
saver flue damper and 
DURACURVE® heat ex­
changer give you more fur­
nace, more heat for your 
money.

Get a free estimate from the 
energy savers at:

JOHANN, INC
•Plumbing • Heating

• Air Conditioning 
Located in St Michaels,

3 miles east of Kewaskum 
on Hwy. 28

Daily 8-5; Fri. ’til 9; Sat. ’till

Phone 334-9441
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February 4, 1955
Hansen’s Men’s Wear, 

men’s clothing, shoes and rub­
bers store, located in the Ke­
waskum Theatre building on 
Fond du Lac Avenue, went out 
of business the past week. The 
store had been operated by Mr. 
and Mrs. Edward E. Hansen, 
Kewaskum, the past five years.

St. John’s Lutheran Church, 
West Bend was the scene of a 
wedding ceremony. January 29, 
in which Miss Janet Betty Zaut- 
ner. daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Immanuel H. Zautner, West 
Bend, became the bride of 
Donald Koger Meisenheimer, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Harold 
Meisenheimer, Kewaskum.

Miss Joyce E. Butt, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Gerhard Butt, 
Route 2, Kewaskum, and Don­
ald J. Herriges. son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Math. Herriges, Route 2, 
Kewaskum, were united in mar­
riage on January 22.

Mary and Jack Stellpflug, 
children of the John Stellpflugs, 
and Tommy and Danny Stoffel, 
children of the Gerald Stoffels, 
all of Kewaskum, together with 
their cousins, Joanne and Diane 
Du Pont of Milwaukee, were 
guests on the "Little Ama­
teurs” television program over 
WTMJ-TV Milwaukee on Jan­
uary 27.

Jules "Bubber” Dreher and 
Dennis Bingen, both of Ke­
waskum. were among a group 
of 128 enlisted men who were 
sworn into the armed forces re­
cently at the recruiting station 
in Milwaukee. Both men are 
temporarily stationed at Fort 
Leonard Wood, Missouri.

A son was born to Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Stern. West Bend. 
February 1. Mother and father 
are both former Kewaskum 
residents. She is the former 
Shirley Otto. Mr. Stern is em­
ployed at Honeck Chevrolet.

A son was also born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Jerome Schladweiler, 
Route 1, Kewaskum, on Jan­
uary 31. Daughters were born to 
Mr. and Mrs. Alois Bremser, 
Route 2, Kewaskum, on Febru­
ary 1; to Mr. and Mrs. Wilbert 
Gitter. Route 3, Campbellsport, 
on January 28; and to Mr. and 
Mrs. Roland Flasch, St. Kilian, 
on January 16.

Nails in early America were 
hammered out by hand on 
an anvil.

insurance needs!

AMERICAN FAMILY
INSUFt A NOE

AUTO FIRE HEALTH LIFE
AMERICAN FAMILY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO. 

MADISON, WISCONSIN S37OI

Richard C. Gust
158 N. MAIN ST. 
WEST BENJ> WIS.

, Office Phone 338-1313
Residence Phone 626 2765

50 Years Ago

February 1. 1930
Calendar simplification is ra­

pidly becoming an issue of more 
immediate interest and the 
champions of simplification are 
working for results by 1933, 
which will be the easiest year to 
change the calendar this side of 
1939. In the United States the 
favorite "new calendar” idea 
appears to be that of a year 
divided into 13 months of 28 
days each, with one extra day — 
the 365th — to be known as 
"year day” and not by any 
other name. January first would 
be Sunday and a given date in 
any month would always fall on 
the same day of the week. Most 
holidays would get new dates 
under the new arrangements. 
Washington’s Birthday would 
be celebrated on February 25; 
Lincoln’s Birthday on February 
16; St. Patrick’s Day on March 
20; Decoration Day on June 10; 
Columbus Day on October 5. 
The Fourth of July and Christ­
mas would be unchanged. Eas­
ter would always fall on April 8, 
and Thanksgiving Day would 
always be November 26.

Robert Yoost, well known 
farmer and Washington County 
bridge builder, sold his 80 acre 
farm, located about three miles 
northeast of Kewaskum, to 
John Schmidt, who resides a- 
bout two and a half miles west 
of Kewaskum on Highway 28. 
Possession will be given the 
new owner on or about Feb-

• WEDDING
i INVITATIONS
b PERSONAL SERVICE
• IN YOUR HOME
h Call
• MARILYN EDWARDS
h 533-4430
* CUPID’S
2 TOUCH
• ). 20 % Discount With This Ad

Authorized Sales, 

Service & Parts for

• John Deere, Simplicity, 
Ariens Lawn & Garden 

Equipment
• Lawn Boy Mowers 

Green Machine Line 
Trimmers

• Pioneer Chair. Saws
• Homelite Chain Saws
• John Deere Chain Saws
• John Deere & Arctic Cat 

Snowmobiles and Clothing
• Evinrude Outboards
• A M.F. Crestliner, Blue 

Fin & Smoker-Craft Boats
• Shore-land’r, Sportsman, 

Snowbird & Durco Trailers

H. Laubenstein
and Son, Inc.

Sales & Parts Store 
Just Off of Hwy. 45 N. 

Next to Dave’s Music Center 
Ph. 334-0774 West Bend

LAUBENSTEIN 
SERVICE CENTER 
8755 Prospect Drive 

Kewaskum 
Ph. 626-2553

The county board of super­
visors of Washington County 
adopted an ordinance in its 
session last week prohibiting 
motor boats to be operated on 
lakes, rivers and other bodies of 
water in the county without a 
muffler.

A baby boy was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Joseph Matenaer of 
the Town of Kewaskum, on 
Friday, January 24.

SJ5-3««55Ss5«^-»»»S*»««

75 Years Ago

February 4, 1905
A baby girl was born to Mr. 

and Mrs. August Koepke, Ke­
waskum, on January 31.

A passenger train on the She­
boygan division of the C & NW 
Railway crashed into a caboose

Attention Homeowners ... 

INVENTORY 
REDUCTION

•* SALE — 
10% Off All 
Merchandise

In Stock
Jan. 21 - Feb. 9,1980

Plumbing Fixtures, Dishwashers, Pumps, Wood 
Boilers and Furnaces, Central and Room 

Air Conditioners

JOHANN’S 
PLUMBING & HEATING, INC.

Sales and Service
“Serving West Bend for Over 25 Years”

(LOCATED IN ST. MICHAELS)

334-9481
After Hours Emergency Service: 626-4559

Store Hours: Daily 8:00-5:00; Friday ’til 9:00; Saturday ’til 1:00 
jmmwmrTRBMWNarWMRMMBMWBMDWBRRMBMBWlBNOWnWNBBNBMBMBNaaBWOraMMMBMMMMNRNKmMBi

and several freight cars stand­
ing on the main track at Peebles 
Station near Fond du Lac on 
January 25, demolishing the 
engine and three cars. Among 
the 20 persons who were injured 
was Henry Opgenorth, who had 
his knee slightly injured.

Another cold spell was no­
ticed in St. Kilian when the 
thermometer registered 32 de­
grees below zero on January 26.

Mr. and Mrs. George Ger­
man of St. Kilian celebrated 
their silver wedding anniver­
sary on January 27.

The Chicago Daily Review is 
the only Chicago daily paper 
you can get for $1.00 a year.

Mr. and Mrs. Anton Berres of 
St. Michaels are the happy 
parents of a son born on 
January 21.

The dwelling on the Margaret

Enright homestead, which is 
located about a mile southeast 
of Boltonville, was destroyed by 
fire January 27. the fire origin­
ating from a defective chimney.

Sensenbrenner Has

99% Voting Record
Congressman James Sensen­

brenner had a 99 percent voting 
record in the House last year, 
according to a survey of Con­
gressional voting habits. The 
survey was conducted by Con­
gressional Quarterly magazine.

Among Wisconsin's House 
members, Sensenbrenner’s 
percentage was followed by 
Clement Zablocki (97 percent) 
and Tom Petri (96 percent).

4-7 i
Oi v
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JIM

SENSENBRENNER

Keeping in Touch
One of the most important 

jobs of a Congressman is to 
keep in touch with his or her 
constituents and to provide 
services to those constituents. 
But, it still is amazing for me to 
discover, even after serving in 
Congress for a whole year, that 
many people are still not aware 
of what help my Congressional 
offices can provide or how they 
can get that help. So. this week 
I will discuss some of these 
services and how to contact me 
about them.

I have two offices to serve the 
Ninth District: one in Washing­
ton and one in Brookfield. The 
services provided by each are 
different, so if you know which 
one does what, I can respond to 
your needs more quickly and 
effectively.

The Washington Office. To 
contact me about bills or issues 
before Congress, to request 
information or copies of govern­
ment publications, to arrange 
for tours and information about 
Washington, or to obtain U.S. 
flags that have flown over the 
U.S. Capitol, please contact me 
at 315 Cannon Building, Wash­
ington, D.C. 20515. The phone 
number for this office is Area 
Code 202-225-5101.

The Brookfield Office. To 
seek help for problems you are 
having with federal agencies 
(Social Security, Veterans Ad­
ministration, the IRS, etc.), to 
arrange meetings with or ap­
pearances by me, to seek help 
in obtaining or expediting fed­
eral government grants or 
loans, or to seek information 
concerning appointments to the 
service academies, please con­
tact me at 333 Bishops Way,

Brookfield, Wisconsin 53005. 
The phone number for this
office is Area 
1111.

Frequently, 
hall” meetings

Code 414-784-

I hold “town 
around the dis­

trict to make it easier for you to 
meet me face-to-face and talk 
about the issues or seek help 
with your problems. Notices of 
these meetings are mailed to all 
households in the immediate 
area, so watch for them.

Also, my staff holds office 
hours around the district to 
make it easier for you to seek 
help or information. Notices of 
these sessions are published in 
local newspapers, so watch for 
them.

One last suggestion: when 
writing to me to discuss an issue 
or problem or whatever, please 
print your name, address, and 
Zip code legibly. This helps me 
and my staff to respond better 
to your needs.

VALLEY BANCORPORATION
DECLARES DIVIDEND

Appleton, Wisconsin 
board of directors of 
Bancbrporation, parent

- The 
Valley 

compa-
ny of the Valley Banks, declared 
a regular quarterly dividend of 
$.29 per share, payable March 
7, 1980, to shareholders of 
record as of February 29, 1980.

Valley Bancorporation is a 
financial services company 
which consists of 17 banks with 
27 banking offices, a trust 
company, a leasing company 
and a data processing sub­
sidiary. Valley Bancorporation 
is traded on the over-the-coun­
ter market with the stock sym­
bol VYBN.

Two Legislators Want More 
Security for Kettle Moraine Notice to Superior

(Madison) — State Represen­
tatives Gervase Hephner (D- 
Chilton) and Calvin Potter (D- 
Kohler) advocated that the Di­
vision of Corrections “take im­
mediate action to improve se­
curity at the Kettle Moraine 
Correctional Institute.’’

In a joint statement released 
recently. Potter and Hephner 
criticized the Department of 
Health and Social Services “for 
being lax in taking adequate se­
curity measures at the prison 
facility to protect neighboring 
residents of the area.”

“Last Friday’s prison escape 
by two inmates of the facility" 
the two lawmakers stated, “de­
serve prompt action by state 
officials to remedy the condi­
tions that led to this escape.”

Specifically, Hephner and 
Potter called for additional se­
curity staff to man the four 
guard towers surrounding the 
prison grounds on a round-the- 
clock basis. “More manpower 
and improved safety mechan­
isms should be utilized to better 
secure the facility,” they add­
ed. “Security is one area where 
we cannot cut back because of 
budgetary reasons.”

Hephner said the latest pri­
son break and subsequent ter­
rorizing and robbery of a Town 
of Mitchell couple “also serves 
notice on the Department to 
keep the four staffing houses on 
the grounds of the Kettle Mor­
aine Correctional Institute.”

“These buildings can be used 
to house additional security 
staff” Hephner stated, “and 
will serve as a protective buffer 
between the facility and the

DUNDEE
Sand & Gravel

G. Ramthun Ph. 533-4549
Washed Sand, Crushed 

Gravel, Stone and
Lime Chips 

also, GRAVEL 
and SAND FILL

FOR THE BEST OF 
CONCRETE MATERIALS

surrounding neighborhood.
He said response time to pre­
vent future prison escapes 
would also be improved if 
security personnel were housed 
in the buildings.

“Since June, there have been 
seven escapes from Kettle Mor­
aine,” the lawmakers stated, 
“and that kind of record cannot 
be allowed to continue. Re­
sidents of the area are darn 
scared because of the events of 
last week. We believe the 
Department should take a close 
look at security at the existing 
prison facilities before it con­
templates further the construc­
tion of new ones.”

Potter and Hephner indicated 
that they will be talking with 
Department Secretary Donald 
Percy later this week to request 
additional security measures at 
Kettle Moraine.

Sacred Sing-a-long
At Cedar Lake Home

The Faith Haven Lay School 
invites you to a sacred sing-a­
long fellowship at the Cedar 
Lake Home Campus, 5595 high­
way Z, West Bend. The prog­
ram will be held in the beautiful 
Learning Center on Wednes­
day, February 6, at 7:00 p.m. 
All are welcome. Come to renew 
your spirit and participate in a 
fellowship of sacred music. 
Music will be selected to high­
light the life of Christ, from 
birth through death and resur- 
rectiion. A free offering will be 
taken for furthering Faith Hav­
en’s community activities.
)H###H#HHMH>H*M#4HHHHW###*#***h**<>********** , 

CARPET - UPHOLSTERY
Cleaning Service
Professional 

! Deep Steam* Extraction 
No Soap Residue, Fast Drying 

[ Safe and Gentle for All Fibers 
• Ask About Our 
[ Carpet Protection Treatment 

; [ FREE ESTIMATES 
;! Residential - Commercial 

• Call 338-0783 Anytime

Truck Co. Employees
On Friday. February 29, 1979 

from 5:30 p.m. to 7:30 p.m. 
there will be a secret ballot 
election conducted for the em­
ployees at Superior Trucking 
Company, Inc.

The election will be conduc­
ted to determine whether or not 
the employees desire to be rep­
resented by the International 
Brotherhood of Teamsters, 
Chauffers, Warehousemen and 
Helpers of America. The elec­
tion will be conducted by United 
States Government agents of 
the National Labor Relations 
Board.

Those eligible to vote will be 
all truck drivers employed by 
the employer at its Kewaskum, 
Wisconsin terminal; excluding 
all clerical employees, mana­
gerial employees, guards and 
supervisors as defined in the 
Act.

Cash ^ up to
$100.00

FOR DOWN OR DEAD 
COWS, HORSES, CALVES.

Free p < kup of pigs. 
PHONE COLLECT 
414-233-1010

Collect Calls Accepted 
also on pigs or calves 

of 4 or more.
NELSON FARM 

SERVICE

J&J AUTO H Syl’s Carpet & Upholstery Cleaning Svc. : 
!#♦♦♦♦*♦♦♦♦♦♦*♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦♦****♦*♦♦♦***************************

SERVICE
Complete

Automotive Service home of quality food

Meet The Men of
AUTO CRAFT

TIRES For Your
BATTERIES 
MUFFLERS 

BRAKES

Party, Wedding, or Banquet Needs, 
Please Call Us At 626-8100.

Serving Kewaskum and the Surrounding Area Since 1963

MAJOR & MINOR
ENGINE REPAIR 

IGNITION REPAIR

Front End
Alignment

450 E. MAIN. KEWASKUM 
PHONE 626 2311

KELLY 4^^ 
SPRINGFIELD

KEWASKUM
PROFESSIONAL PHARMACY
Located on Upper Floor of Sison Medical Bldg.

PHONE 626-4222

HOURS:
Monday-Tuesday-Thursday-Friday — 1:00-6:00

Free Local Delivery Service

OPEN TO THE PUBLIC

Dan Berres, Owner 
West Bend

These trained men are dedicated to building a 
business on professional work, fast service and 
friendliness that you,- as a customer, deserve.

This is why we proudly say:

PICK YOUR BODY SHOP BEFORE 
WE MEET BY ACCIDENT

Take Hwy. 45 South 4 miles to Trap Shoot Lane. 
On top of hill behind Mill Tool & Die.

(road to West Bend Sportsmen's Club)

or call 338—0379
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OFFICE HELP — Part-time. 
Miscellaneous, clerical office 
work. Take orders over tele­
phone and work with billing. 
Ability to use a 10-key adding 
machine and type, helpful but 
not necessary; 12:30 to 4:30 
Monday thru Friday. Apply in 
person. Fairmont Foods Com­
pany, 110 First St., Kewaskum. 
An equal opportunity employer. 
______________________2-l-2t

LOST — Child’s pet. St. Mich­
aels. German shepherd-Huskie 
mix, male. Red collar. Ph. 
626-2817. 2-l-2t

FOR RENT — Two bedroom 
lower apartment in Kewaskum. 
Security deposit. Heat and hot 
water included. Available im­
mediately. Ph. 629-5291 or 
626-2146.2-1-2P

WILL DO BABYSITTING - 
Second shift, my home, play­
mates. references. Ph. 626-8062 

2-l-4t

WANT TO BUY — Girl’s size 7, 
flower girl or junior bride, 
dress. Ph. 626-8062. 2-l-4t

FOR SALE — Seasoned oak. 
maple and hickory firewood. 
Ph. 533-4267,2-l-5tp

FOR SALE — 1975 Camaro 350 
V-8 automatic, 30,000 miles, 
excellent shape. Call 626-2688.

____________________ 2-l-2t

FOR SALE — Firewood. Mixed 
hardwood, $35 a face cord. $110 
a full cord. Also accepting 
orders for the summer and fall 
before the prices go up. Ph. 
692-2289. 2-1-tf

MILK ROUTE - Northern 
Washington County area. 
House to house retail delivery of 
well known dairy products. An 
excellent opportunity with low 
investment and above average 
income for the energetic indi­
vidual. Under $40,000 including 
refrigerated delivery trucks and 
accessories. Terms available for 
the qualified buyer. Call for 
confidential interview. Paul 
Auction Co. Kewaskum.

338-3030*626-4318
____________________ 1-18-tf

HELP WANTED - Full or part 
time secretary with good secre­
tarial skills. Shorthand requir­
ed. Campbellsport. 533-8787.

___________________ 1-18-tf

INSULATION — Attics and 
side-walls. Call Blaze Insula­
tion. 626-8007. 1-11-tf

POTATOES - 626-2251 after 
5:30,l-25-4t

WORK WANTED - Repairs, 
remodeling, carpentry, paint­
ing, wallpapering, etc. No job 
too small. Lloyd M. Ebert, call 
626-2014.l-25-8t

WILL DO BABYSITTING - In 
my home, days. Ph. 626-4107. 

l-25-3t

POTATOES — Paul Pamperin. 
Call 629-5267 or 629-5092.

10-26-tf

PRODUCE — Squash and po­
tatoes at Bartoli’s Produce, 
located 4 miles north of Ke­
waskum on Hwy. V. Phone 533- 
1092 n-2-tf

APPLES — McIntosh. Cort­
land, Jonathan, Spartans, Se­
cor, Red & Yellow Delicious, 
fresh apple cider. We have 
moved apple sales to 2606 Hwy. 
28, 1 mile north of Hwy. 144. 
Erwin Merkel, Phone 994-4129. 
_________________ 11-23-tf

TREES TRIMMED, Pruned or 
removed. Phone 626-4606 or 
334-4862.8-3-tf

SERVICES OFFERED - Septic 
and holding tanks cleaned. 
Ellie s Sanitation Service. 
Phone 626-4848.3-9-tf

SERVICES OFFERED - Small 
engines, motorcycle, snowmo­
bile, lawn and garden equip­
ment and outboard repair. 
Ked-Web of Kewaskum. 1204 
Fond du Lac Ave. Phone 626- 
4344.tf

HIGHEST PRICES paid for 
copper, brass aluminum, lead 
and batteries. Lynn’s Waste 
Paper Co., 121 Island Ave., 
West Bend, Wis. 4-27-tf

SERVICES OFFERED - Home 
repairs, additions, garages, re­
modeling and painting. Phone 
626-4606. 12-28-tf

LEN LUTERBACH CONTRAC­
TOR — Mason, cement, trench­
ing and bulldozing. Quality 
work at competitive prices. 
Your authorized dealer of the 
world famous Hallmark in- 
ground swimming pools. For 
free estimate, call 692-9233 
collect. 9-14-tf

THANKS EXPRESSED
We would like to thank those 

who organized, furnished the 
music, gave contributions, or 
helped in any way at our barn 
fire benefit dance. Also to all 
those who attended to make it 
such a success. These acts of 
kindness will always be treas­
ured. A sincere “thank you’’ to 
all of you.

Floyd and Laura Klug

Refrigerator odors can be absorbed by putting a few pieces 
of charcoal in an open glass jar.

□02. Ideal subdivision in Kewaskum. 79x138 ft. lot. Perfect for 
single family home.
507. Handyman special. This older 2-story 4-bedroom home on 
one acre would be ideal for large family or converted to an 
imcome producing duplex. This home does need work. $39,900

REALTY WORLD
West Grove Realty, Inc.

548 So. Main West Bend
334-5589

OPEN HOUSE 
Sunday, Feb. 3 1:30 to 4:00 p.m.

Address: Route 2, Campbellsport 
(Town of Auburn)

Directions: Highway 45 South to Auburn-Ashford 
Dr., left V* mile to Pine Lane, left on Pine Lane to 
address-follow signs and flags.
Newer 3 bedroom ranch on approximately 2 acres. 
Don’t take our word for it, come see this beauty for 
yourself!! $50’s.

Joan Matthews Realty, 
453 West Johnson St. Fond du Lac, Wl

Phone: 923-3900

ORDER LIMITING TIME 
FOR FILING CLAIMS 

(ON WAIVER I
AND DETERMINATION 

OF HEIRSHIP
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF ARTHUR T. 
SCHULTZ. Deceased.

A petition for administration 
of the estate and determination 
of heirship of Arthur T. Schultz 
a/k/a Arthur Schultz. Wash­
ington County. Wisconsin, post 
office address 1253 Roseland 
Drive, Kewaskum. Wisconsin 
53040, having been filed;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. Creditor’s claims must be 

filed on or before April 22. 1980. 
or be barred;

2. Heirship will be deter­
mined and claims will be exam­
ined and adjusted on April 29. 
1980. at the Washington County 
Courthouse, in West Bend, 
Wisconsin at the opening of 
Court or thereafter.
Dated January 22. 1980

By the Court.
James B. Schwalbach, 
Circuit Judge

McKENNA & KIEFER 
Attorneys at Law 
114 Main Street/P.O. Box 550 
Kewaskum. Wisconsin 53040 

l-25-3t

CARD OF THANKS
The family of DONALD H. 

GE1DEL wish to thank all their 
relatives, friends and neighbors 
for their many acts of sympathy 
during the recent death of my 
beloved husband, dear father, 
son, brother and son-in-law. 
Special thanks to Rev. Joiner, 
pallbearers, organist, soloist, 
custodian, Ladies Aid for ser­
ving the luncheon, donors of 
food, floral and memorial tri­
butes, Miller’s, traffic officer 
and to all who helped and 
showed their respect in any 
way.

Mrs. Debra Geidel 
and Jamie

Mr. and Mrs. Byron Geidel 
and family

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Palmer 
and family

PUBLIC NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given 

that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum. Wiscon­
sin. Village Board is scheduled 
for Monday evening, February 
4. 1980, at 8:00 p.m. in the 
Council Room of the Municipal 
Building. 204 First Street.

The agendas for meetings are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the 
clerk at the Municipal Building 
on 'Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the Ke­
waskum Post Office and in the 
lobby of the Valley Bank.

William Martin. Clerk

IN MEMORY
Two years ago. February 5, 

we were parted from a wonder­
ful husband and a great father, 
Dpn Mitchell. He will always be 
remembered with deep love and 
much joy by his wife Mary Kay, 
and children Jennifer. Heather 
and Shannon.
You have gone...

but
thoughts
of you 
linger 
so I can recapture 
past 
serenity 
that we
have passed through
in
our
time alone —
together
...and I feel your presence 
long after you have gone.

THANK YOU
My sincere thanks to all who 

remembered me with cards, 
gifts, flowers, phone calls and 
visits while I was a patient at 
the hospital and convalescing at 
home. These kindnesses were 
appreciated very much. Again, 
thank you.

Bernard Sarauer

THANK YOU
I wish to express my sincere 

appreciation to my relatives and 
friends for the cards, gifts, 
visits and flowers while I was a 
patient at the hospital. Special 
thanks to Dr. Sison, Dr. Castro, 
all the nurses for their kindness 
and Rev. Hoenecke.

Camel Koepke

SCHOOL MENUS
KEWASKUM

COMMUNITY HIGH SCHOOL
Monday. February 4 — Ham­

burger on a bun. French fries, 
sweet & dill pickles, slice of 
cheese and peaches.

Tuesday, February 5 — Wie­
ner winks, potato chips, pork­
beans, carrot and celery sticks 
and pears.

Wednesday, February 6 — 
Turkey and gravy over mashed 
potatoes, cranberries, buttered 
corn and coconut cream pie.

Thursday, February 7 — 
Spaghetti and meat sauce, 
French bread, green beans and 
fruit cocktail.

Friday, February 8 — Fish, 
cheese on a bun, Tater-tots, 
cabbage salad, and peanut but­
ter crunch bar.

Menus are subject to change
Each meal served with bread, 

butter and/or margarine and 
milk.

HOLY TRINITY SCHOOL
Monday, February 4 — Spa­

ghetti w/meat sauce, lettuce 
salad, dinner roll, pear half.

Tuesday, February 5 — Hot 
dog w/bun, sauerkraut, baked 
beans, flying saucer cookie.

Wednesday, February 6 — 
Turkey, mashed potatoes, 
green beans, berry crunch.

Thursday, February 7 — Piz­
za, peas, apple slices, rice 
pudding, cupcake.

Friday, February 8 — Fish, 
French fries, cole slaw, lettuce 
salad.

Each meal served with a */t 
pt. of milk.

Diy

SAVE!!! Select your furnituie 
at Miller’s in Kewaskum. Larg­
est selection, high quality at 
most reasonable prices. Open 
daily until 5:30. Monday and 
Friday to 9:00 p.m. Free de­
pendable delivery.

SCHULZ
REAL ESTATE CORP. 

Brokers—Builder* 
MONICA SCHULZ, Broker 
JAMES SCHULZ, Builder 

2395 W. Wethington, West Bond 

_______ PHQNg 338-8108
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Board Meetings
Mid-Monthly Meeting 
January 21, 1980 
8:00 P.M.

The Village Board of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wash­
ington County, Wisconsin, met 
in mid-monthly session in the 
Council Room of the Municipal 
Building.

President Robert Danielsen 
presided. All Village Trustee 
members were present.

The minutes of the meeting of 
January 7 were approved as 
printed upon motion by Trustee 
Mlodzik, seconded by Trustee 
Stollenwerk. Voice vote was 
unanimous.

Paul Behring appeared be­
fore the Board to inquire what 
the possibilities were for ob­
taining a beer and/or liquor 
license for his proposed shop­
ping area. L. L. Rosenheimer 
was present and spoke in favor 
of granting such a license. 
Appearance opposed to the 
granting of a license' were 
Sylvester Keller. Ellen Coulter 
and Mrs. Geraldine Sengpiel. A 
poll of the Village Board mem­
bers showed that the Board 
members as a whole were of the 
opinion that the village had 
enough beer and liquor outlets 
and that the granting of another 
license at this time was a 
remote possibility.

Mr. Don Woller, engineering 
consultant for the village, led a 
discussion on the results of the 
Permutit sludge conditioning 
pilot plant. Mr. Woller also 
recommended the purchase of a 
conditioned sludge press to be 
used in conjunction with the 
sludge conditioning machine. 
Motion was made by Trustee 
Mlodzik. seconded by Trustee 
Stollenwerk that Mr. Woller be 
and hereby is authorized to 
prepare bid forms and specifi­
cations for the possible pur­
chase of a sludge press. Voice 
vote was unanimous.

Administrator Dan Schmidt 
reported that a reimbursement

0 MACHINIST JOURNEYMAN
4 We era currency seeking an experienced MACHINIST J JOURNEYMAN. You should poeMM a formal accredited 
■ apprenticeehip or equivalent trades training, coupled with 
4 several years experience

If you posaeea these qualifications and desire JOB 
SECURITY, GOOD WAGES and LIBERAL BENEFITS, apply

Contact: Personnel Department 
Monday through Friday 
Phone 826-2121
REGAL WARE. INC. 
KEWASKUM, Wl 53040

An Equal Opportunity Employer

SPECIAL
1978 MALIBU 2-DR. SEDAN

200 cu. in. V-6, automatic, air 
conditioning — 24,000 miles

HONECK
CHEVROLET INC.

“A Dealer You Con Trust"
Hwy 45 Kewaskum HOURS: Mon.. Wed.. Fri. 9-9 
PbSM 626-2161 Tues.. Thurs. 9-6; Sat. 'til 5

claim for funds for the Ke­
waskum Kiwanis Community 
Park Development Project will 
be submitted to the Wisconsin 
Department of Natural Resour­
ces in about a week and that the 
funds should be received by the 
village in about 90 days. The 
amount of the reimbursement 
claim is $113,243.30.

A five year lease in the 
amount of $100.00, between 
Raymond Klein and the Village 
of Kewaskum for the land on 
which the village’s “Welcome 
to Kewaskum’’ sign is located 
on the east side of U.S. High­
way 45 south of the village 
limits, was approved. Motion by 
Trustee Herriges, seconded by 
Trustee Blumer. Voice vote was 
unanimous.

Upon motion by Trustee Her­
riges, seconded by Trustee 
Blumer and duly carried, the 
Board adjourned to closed ses­
sion under Chapter 19.85(e) of 
the Statutes to deliberate the 
possible sale of public property.

William S. Martin, 
Commissioner

WOW TRI COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY MENU
Kewaskum

Monday, February 4 — Salis­
bury Steak with brown gravy, 
whipped potatoes, buttered 
peas, whole wheat bread, fresh 
banana.

Tuesday, February 5 — Chil­
led tomato juice, baked pork 
chop, baked potatoe, Waldorf 
salad, rye bread, brownies with 
powdered sugar.

Thursday, February 7 — 
Bar-B-Que Chicken, oven 
browned potatoes, escalloped 
corn, French bread, chilled pear 
half.

The site is located at the 
American Legion Post 384 club­
house at 1538 Fond du Lac 
Avenue.

Reservations must be made 
one day in advance. To make a 
reservation, call 338-4493 by 2 
p.m.

FOND DU LAC COUNTY 
NUTRITION PROGRAM 

FOR THE ELDERLY

Campbellsport Senior Center 
Campbellsport. Wl.

Monday, February 4 — 
Meat balls with spaghetti, mix­
ed vegetables, lettuce, rolls, 
butter, carrot cake, milk, coffee.

Tuesday, February 5 — Bak­
ed chicken, mashed potatoes, 
harvard beets, waldorf salad, 
bread, butter, rice custard, 
milk, coffee.

Wednesday, February 6 — 
Beef stew with vegetables, but­
tered macaroni, 3 bean salad, 
bulgar bread, butter, cubed 
jello, milk, coffee.

Thursday, February 7 — Sau­
teed liver, German potato salad, 
stewed carrots, lettuce, bread, 
butter, apple pie, milk, coffee.

Friday, February 8 — Tuna 
casserole, green beans, cold 
tomatoes, corn bread, butter, 
vanilla pudding, milk, coffee.

Menu is subject to change. 
Serving of dinners start at 12:00 
for those 60 years of age or 
over. Suggested contribution 
per meal is $1.00 or whatever 
you feel you can afford. Regis­
tration required one day in 
advance by 3:00 p.m. by sign up 
at mealsite or by calling 533- 
8351. or by calling Fond du Lac 
County Courthouse at 921-5600, 
Ext. 30.

This program is open to all 
persons without regard to race, 
color, ethic background or eco­
nomic circumstances. The pro­
ject is funded by monies dis­
persed by the United States 
Congress. State Division on 
Aging. FDL County, and indi­
vidual participant contributions.

To prevent rice, noodles or 
spaghetti from boiling over, 
add a few teaspoons of 
cooking oil to the water.

Roger & Dan’s

Auto Service, Inc.

Your Automotive 
Needs

With Many Years Experience

Major Tune-ups

Brakes and 
Mufflers

• • •• 
ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS 

•••• 
Carburetor Overhauls

SHOCKS, TIRES 
& BATTERIES 

xxxx 

24 Hr. Wrecker 
Service

891 FOND DU LAC AVE.

Kewaskum
626-2888

Area Farmers
Attend AFBF
Meet in Phoenix

More than 110 Wisconsin 
farmers were among the 10,000 
members attending the Ameri­
can Farm Bureau Federation 
annual meeting in Phoenix, 
Arizona January 6-10.

The five-day meeting includ 
ed commodity conferences, an 
address by U.S. Trade Ambass­
ador Reubin Askew and enter­
tainment by comedian Bob 
Hope. The last two days of the 
convention were devoted to 
consideration of resolutions and 
setting Farm Bureau’s policy 
for the year. Wisconsin's dele­
gates to the session were Don­
ald Haldeman, Norwalk, state 
president; Howard D. Poulson, 
Palmyra, state vice president; 
and Wilfred Huenink, Cedar 
Grove, state board member.

“Expanding our markets to 
increase farm income and con­
trolling inflation which is erod­
ing farm income are the challen­
ges facing farmer in the decade 
ahead and received much at­
tention from the delegates,”

AUCTION
Kewaskum, Wl

Sun., Feb. 3 — 11 a.m
Inspection after 9 a.m.
LOCATION: Hwy 45 to Kewaskum, east at stop 
B go lights on Hwy. 28, 4 blocks to Cty "S“, 
then north 1 MILES TO PAUL AUCTION Co.
hall.
REASON FOR SALE: Mr. and Mrs. Bernard 
Wierman, Boltonville, Wi. being 96 years young 
and married over 70 years have taken residence 
in the Samaritan Home at West Bend and will be 
selling their entire household at public auction. 
An extra clean line with choice antique B collec­
tible rtems
HOUSEHOLD B MISC : Philco ref-freezer; GE 
elec. 30 in. range; Sears auto, wash machine; 
Motorola 23 in. color console TV; humidifier; 
Hoover canister vacuum; small kitchen ap­
pliances; porcelain kitchen set; Eady Amer, twin 
beds w/box springs B mattresses; service for 8 
dinnerware B stiverplate; pots, pans, dishes, 
etc.; easy chairs; card tables; linens, beddings, 
towels etc.; lawn furniture; household, lawn B 
garden tools; roll of snow fence; long 8 in. 
leather machinery belt and other items.
ANTIQUES B COLLECTIBLES: Round oak 
table w/5 leaves, claw feet B 6 oak claw foot 
chairs; oak 3 curved glass china cabinet w/claw 
feet; Hoosier cupboard w/glass inserts in doors, 
roll front B porcelain counter; extra wide (50 in.) 
3 section stacking bookcase; oak highboy; oak 3 
drawer dresser; Mission oak 4 shelf stand; brass 
bed, double (cut down); dressers; walnut 1 
drawer stand; pedestals; smoking stand; drum 
table; 1920’s mohair sofa B matching chair; 20’s 
mohair chair B ottoman; 2 cedar chests; oak 
treadle sewing machine; rockers; round oak wall 
mirror; reverse painted table lamp; 20 s floor 
lamps; oil lamp; 20's wall mirror; oil and water­
color framed pictures; old military B other 
books; patchwork quilts; steamer trunk; alligator 
bag; cook books; sterling candle holders; 
silverplate items; stemware; Nippon creamer B 
sugar; Heisey mayonaise; Figural silverplate 
toothpick; Hummel Madonna, full bee; hand 
painted bowls B plates; Red Wing B other 
stoneware; and other items.
CONSIGNED BY: Mr. and Mrs. Reuben Geidel, 
Newburg, sold their farm B retiring to Florida; 
pie safe w/12 pierced tin panels; hand made 
round butternut table; 2 square oak tables 
w/leaves; built-in china cabinet, oak; walnut 
Eastlake sofa for restoration; West Bend Lithia 
wood pony B 7. barrels; 300 lb. floor safe; round 
oak table (cut down to coffee table); old stone 
Indian skinning tool B tomahawk??; old calen­
dars; stoneware to 15 gal..
MODERN ITEMS: Miller 225 amp welder 
w/acces.; 2 like new upright freezers; elec, 
range; elec, clothes dryer; 4 modern captains 
chairs; portable cement mixer w/motor;
Charbroiled brats, hamburgers & refreshments

AUCTION COMPANY

REAL ESTATE • AUCTIONS 
APPRAISALS • INDOOR SALES

H Jim PAUL Kewaskum, Wl 53040 
(414)338-3030 626-4318

Haldeman said.
Jim and Bonnie Jarvis, Wau­

toma. competed in the Outstan­
ding Young farmer contest at 
the convention. They were chos­
en as Wisconsin’s Outstanding 
Young Farmers at the state 
annual meeting last month.

David Ward. Fort Atkinson, 
was the state’s entry in the 
National Discussion Meet. He 
won the state meet last month. 
Both the Discussion Meet and 
the Outstanding Young Farmer 
contest were part of the young 
farmer’s activities held during 
the convention.

Area farmers planning to 
attend the Phoenix convention 
included Mr. and Mrs. Louis 
Beck. Route 1, Campbellsport; 
Mr. and Mrs. John Ebert. 
Campbellsport; Mr. and Mrs. 
Palmer Behm and Eileen and 
Brenda. Route 1, Lomira; Mr. 
and Mrs. Maurice Ehrhardt. 
Route 1. Lomira.

The odds on a coin falling 
heads 50 consecutive times 
are so great that it would 
take a million men tossing 
coins 10 times a minute and 
40 hours a week—and then 
it would happen only once 
every nine centuries!

Sna

‘At

L
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Snake Stickup, Raccoon Drug Bust Rival President’s 

‘Attack Rabbit’ in Bid for 1979 Wildlife Headlines

When President Carter beat 
off an attack by a “killer rabbit’’ 
with a canoe paddle last April, 
he put wildlife on page one of 
the nation’s newspapers.

But the President’s tilt with 
an aggressive, aquatic cotton­
tail may not have been the most 
bizarre incident involving hu­
mans and wildlife last year, 
according to the National Wild­
life Federation. 1979 was a wild 
year for wildlife, the citizens 
conservation group found in its 
annual survey of such happen- 
ings-a year in which the human 
and animal kingdoms traded 
insults, and also exchanged a 
few favors.

Human vandals assaulted 
wildlife, for instance, by drain­
ing or cutting off the water 
supply at two fish hatcheries— 
killing 150.000 trout and salmon 
near Rochester. N.Y. and 
25.0(H) brown trout at Leetown, 
W Va. A school of fish in Lake 
Huron struck back by clogging a 
water intake for an Ontario 
Hydro nuclear reactor, thus 
shutting down the Canadian 
power plant for 40 hours.

A Washington. D.C., physi­
cian beat a Canada goose to 
death with a golf club, allegedly 
after the bird's honking inter­
fered with his putting. But other 
doctors made up for this lapse 
by rendering services to wildlife 
beyond the call of duty.

Soviet surgeons performed a 
successful cataract operation by 
inserting an artificial lens in the 
eye of a seal. When the opera­
tion was over the seal perform­
ed several tricks for the doctors. 
Another Russian surgeon, a- 
board a fishing trawler, suc­
cessfully treated the wounds of 
a dolphin that had been attack­
ed by a blue shark, then 
released the happy marine 
mammal.

For a biack-crested night 
heron whose lower beak had 
snapped in two, a San Francisco 
dentist constructed a new beak

Cartoon by William Coulter

out of the same pink acrylic that 
he uses for human dentures. He 
attached it with tiny wires in a 
six-hour operation and the 
heron is again spearing fish.

It was a year in which man 
discovered new ways to put wild 
critters to work, the NWF 
survey found. The West Ger­
man city of Goppingen put some 
electricity-emitting goldfish into 
its municipal water supply to 
monitor its purity. If the water 
becomes polluted, the six Gnat- 
honemus fish generate less 
current than usual, which sets 
off an alarm at the waterwork’s 
headquarters.

In New York City the Muse­
um of Natural History employed 
thousands of tiny dermestid • 
beetles to dislodge matter from 
the bodies of tiny mammals 
without disturbing their delicate 
skeletal structures. And in Kai­
lua. Hawaii, the U.S. Coast 
Guard revealed that it is now 
training eagle-eyed pigeons to 
search for people lost at sea.

It was again a newsy year for 
snakes. In Los Angeles, Cal., a 
man opened his door to a 
stranger who flashed a knife 
and a snake and threatened to 
turn the reptile loose. The thief 
escaped in the victim's car with 
SUM) in cash and jewelry.

Italian customs agents seized 
a boa named Pedro that an 
American fighter wore into a 
boxing ring to psych his op­
ponent. Australian customs of­
ficers frisked a nervy traveler 
from Bali and impounded five 
pythons that he tried to smug­
gle into their country in his 
underpants and in pouches 
strapped to his legs.

It was also a busy year for 
bees. An estimated 9 million of 
them swarmed in on Flintstone, 
Md., after the tractor-trailer in 
which they were riding over­
turned. Another swarm of bees 
attacked hundreds of school 
girls at a track meet in Vereen- 
iging. South Africa. The bees 
were apparently attracted by 
the girl’s hairspray.

It was a year in which man 
devised some new institutions 
for animals, the NWF survey 
revealed. Bird lovers in the East 
German village of Loburg open­
ed a hospital for storks, a 
threatened species in that coun­
try. In Sri Lanka, an orphanage 
was established for young ele­
phants separated from their 
parents.

In Newport. Cal., a turtle 
named “No. 6 won a turtle 
race and then showed how he 
felt about one of man’s institu­
tions. the racing game, by 
latching onto the upper lip of his 
trainer, who sought to give him 
a congratulatory kiss. It took a 
dose of valium to unfasten his 
grip.

A couple of wildlife records 
were set. In the annual Mayor s 
Frog Hop at Baltimore. MD. an 
entrv named Cindy jumped to a 
height of 3 feet 9 inches, 
outdistancing one Lightfoot 
Louie. In San Antonio, a male 
whooping crane named ('rip 
died at 33 - a record for that 
rare bird in captivity. And 
Andre, the friendly 220-pound 
seal who swims each year from

his winter home in a Boston 
aquarium to his summer home 
at Rockport. ME., set a new 
record for the 160-mile course 
— 65 hours. Not breathtaking, 
to be sure, but 17 hours faster 
than last year’s time.

Finally, it was a year in which 
a raccoon got caught in a drug 
bust. After one burglary in 
which narcotics were taken, a 
Falls Church, VA., physician 
trapped an intruder on a return 
visit to his office and found that 
it was — that’s right — a 
“masked bandit’ ’ with a ringed- 
tail.

After being lured away from 
the hard stuff with peanut 
butter and sardines, the two- 
time offender was set loose in a 
woods several miles away for 
self-rehabilitation.

Winnebago Sturgeon
Spearing Opens Feb. 9

Anglers who take advantage 
of the sturgeon spearing season 
in Lake Winnebago are remin­
ded that the special spearing 
license and tag this year will not 
be sold during the season.

It will be necessary to pur­
chase the sturgeon spearing 
license and tag which sells for 
$5.50 prior to the start of the 
season February 9. The season 
on Lake Winnebago runs 
through March 1.

Anglers coming to Wisconsin 
for the sturgeon spearing sea­
son from out-of-state should 
order their license and tag as 
soon as possible. When order­
ing the sturgeon license and tag 
by mail, send the number from 
your 1980 Wisconsin fishing li­
cense. your name, address and 
personal description (date of 
birth, height, weight and hair 
and eye color), and a money 
order or check for $5.50 to 
License Section, Wisconsin De­
partment of Natural Resources, 
Box 7924, Madison, Wisconsin 
53707.

Only persons 14 years of age 
and older are eligible to spear 
sturgeon in Wisconsin. The 
minimum length for a sturgeon 
speared in Lake Winnebago is 
45 inches. There is no open 
season in Lakes Butte des 
Morts, Poygan, Winneconne 
and connecting waters.

Wisconsin Outdoors 
Report

SOUTHEAST HO AI CO* ARSA
SHfBOYGAN COUNTY DODGE COUNTY 
WASHINGTON COUNTY COLUMBIA COUNTY 
OZAUKEE COUNTY MARQUETTE COUNTY
WAUKESHA COUNTV GR£EN LAKE COUNTV
MILWAUKEE COUNTY FOND OU LAC COUNTY 
WALWORTH COUNTY 
RACINE COUNT* 
KENOSHA COUNTY

Again this week, a lack of 
snow in southern and central 
Wisconsin has resulted in cross­
country skiers and snowmobi- 
lers heading north in search of

19th Annual Fisheree
Campbellsport Sportsmen Club 

-------- Sponsor--------

LONG LAKE on Hwy. 67 at DUNDEE, WIS. fishing

Sun., Feb. 3—6:30a.m.-4 p.m.
CANCELLA TION DA TE FEBRUARY 10

—Grand Prizes—
WALLEYE

Mossburg 500 12 ga 
Down Jacket

—Fish Prizes—

CRAPPIE
Tackle Box
Coleman Lantern

LAS VEGAS TRIP FOR TWO OR $500.00 
30.06 BROWNING AUTO RIFLE 
RECLINER CHAIR
870 REMINGTON DUCKS UNLIMITED 
JIFFY ICE AUGER
RUGER 10/22 AUTO RIFLE

Plus 126 Donated Prizes!!

Hol l unch Served On Lake

Bail Sold On Lake.'!

NORTHERN
Mec. 600 Jr 12 ga. reloader 
8 x 30 Telstar binocular

PERCH
Coleman 7 gal. cooler
G 96 folding knife

Check Pom* Mr Ed’s Resort. West side of Lake, and Holiday Resort. North End of Lake

Skin Divers Demonstration 1 p.m.

good conditions for their sports. 
Fishing, generally, is spotty 
around the state.

Southeast District
Walleye fishing has been fair 

to good in most district waters. 
Some good catches have been 
taken from Crystal Lake in She­
boygan County, Golden Lake in 
Waukesha County. Pike Lake in 
Washington County and Wind 
Lake in Racine County. Some 
nice northern pike are being 
taken from Moose Lake and 
Upper and Lower Nemahbin 
Lakes in Waukesha County, Big 
Cedar Lake in Washington 
County and Browns Lake in 
Racine County.

Crappies and bluegills have 
been biting in most district 
waters with some nice catches 
made on Crooked Lake in She­
boygan County and the Lauder­
dale lakes in Walworth.

Rabbit hunting has been gen­
erally slow.

Ice skating and ice boating 
conditions remain good. How­
ever, ice thickness is still vari­
able and may be extremely 
dangerous on the larger lakes in 
the district.

Fond du Lac County — 
Walleye fishing on Lake Win- 

; nebago is excellent off Wendt’s 
and the Village of Pipe.

Dodge County — Anglers are 
taking walleyes on Beaver Dam 
Lake and panfish, walleyes and 
northern pike on Fox Lake.

BLACKBASS
Sheepskin Mitts

BLUEGILL
Diawa Mini Spin Rod 4 Reel 
Black Sheep Gun Case

BULLHEAD
6 volt flashlight
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Indians Upset Second Place
Grafton With Big 4th Quarter

In a big victory Friday night, 
the Kewaskum Indians upset 
second place Grafton (6-1) on 
their own floor in a one-point 
bam burner, 68-67.

The Indians accomplished the 
feat with a great second half 
comeback in which they over­
came an almost insurmountable 
18-point deficit to squeeze out 
the victory.

The Blackhawks were prob­
ably left in a state of shock after 
the game as to how they let 
their big lead slip away. If they 
had known what a rash of 
turnovers were coming up in the 
last quarter, the Hawks might 
have gone into a stall or not 
gone to their bench so soon. 
They gave one away to the 
inspired Indians with their nu­
merous turnovers. They also 
lost three players on fouls in the 
final period to Kewaskum’s 
one.

Grafton jumped off to a 19-8 
lead in the first quarter and 
increased it to 13 points at 
halftime, 38-25. The lead con­
tinued to mount as the Indians 
were doing little offensively and 
with minutes left in the third 
stanza, four baskets gave the 
Blackhawks an 18-point advan­
tage, 48-30.

Six points by Bob Nigh cut 
the margin to 58-46 as Kewas­
kum slowly began to catch up. 
With one quarter to go the 
Indians outscored Grafton 12-2 
and pulled to within two points, 
60-58 halfway through the per­
iod. Then turnovers and per­
sonal fouls began to plague the 
Hawks.

A pair of free throws by 
Henry Schilter tied the game for 
the first time and two more by 
Tom Kem gave the Indians the 
lead for the first time. Grafton 
sank a bucket but then Schilter 
came right back with two more 
free throws. Reserve Brian Lar­
sen made good on two key free 
throws to give the Indians a 
three point lead but the game 
was not over. John Brewster’s 
jumper cut the lead to one. The 
Indians were called for traveling 
and Grafton got one more last 
second shot that missed and the 
Indians had won a thriller.

The Indians hit on 78 percent 
of their free throws, hitting on 
28 of 36, and this was a deciding 
factor. Schilter, who is fifth in 
conference scoring, wound up 
with 25 points, including 13 of 
14 free throws, and played an 
outstanding game. Kern and 
Nigh added 15 and 13.

This Friday Kewaskum re­
turns to the home court when 
they entertain Germantown. 
Germantown, Mayville, Kewas­
kum and Kettle Moraine are all 
tied for third place with 4-4 
marks.

GRAFTON KEWASKUM
to ft P* fg ft pf

Gumm 8 7 4 K*rn 4 7 4
Komotaann 6 2 9 Nigh 9 3 0
McClonden 4 I 3 Rohlmger 4 0 3
Holler 2 0 2 Brondomihl 0 0 9
lr#wit»f 2 0 3 Schilter 6 13 4
Wilde 1 2 9 Horrige* 0 0 1
Pierron 3 1 9 Lorton 19 1
Jone* 0 0 3
Pietrowiok 0 0 2
Total* 27 13 30 Total* 20 28 18 
GRAFTON 18 18 20 8 — 67
KEWASKUM 8 17 21 22 — 68

Free throw* misted — Kewaskum 8. Grofton

W L
Hartland 8 0
Grafton 6 2
Kewaskum 4 4
Mayville 4 4
Germantown 4 4
Kettle Moraine 4 4
Slinger 2 6
Pewaukee 0 8

Results Friday
Slinger 75, Pewaukee 53
Hartland 87, Mayville 74
Kewaskum 68, Grafton 67
Kettle Moraine 46, German­
town 45

JWs WIN AGAIN, 
FROSH LOSE AGAIN

Showing a strong offense, the 
Kewaskum JV’s won at Grafton 
Friday, 77-68. They had pre­
viously defeated the Black­
hawks at home by one point. 
The Indians jumped off to an 
early lead and were pretty much 
in control. Center Dale Wodse- 
dalek, who has scored 70 points 
in three games, scored 18 at 
Grafton and did a fine job at re­
bounding. Rick Leitheiser 
chipped in 10 points. Kewas­
kum is 5-3 in the Scenic and 7-4 
overall.

The freshmen lost their sixth 
game in seven outings, being 
thrashed 81-18.

Wrestlers Pin

Girls Defeat
Grafton Here

A big third quarter turned the 
tide and the Kewaskum girls 
basketball team defeated Graf­
ton here Thursday, 49-45, to 
avenge an earlier loss.

The win was costly for the 
Indians as sophomore Jill Year­
ling, the team’s leading scorer 
with a 15-16 point average, 
sprained her ankle in the second 
half and will be lost indefinitely.

The Indians started slow but 
tied the score by halftime, 
25-25. In the second half it was 
a different story and the girls 
came up with a tight defense, 
forcing the Blackhawks into 
turnovers. They outscored 
Grafton, 19-8, in the decisive 
third quarter.

Freshman Linda Larsen 
scored 17 of her game high 22 
points in the second half to take 
scoring honors. Diane Bremser 
added 12, 10 of them in the 
second half. Debbie Jansen and 
Laurie Stewert paced Grafton 
with 10 apiece.

Janet Matenaer played well 
defensively.

The Indians, 6-3 in confer­
ence played at Pewaukee Tues­
day.

KEWASKUM — Schmidt 0-0-3. Yearling 1-4-3. 
Bram*ar 4-4-3. Ru*»ell 0-0-4. Matanaar 2-1-4, 
Lor**n 9-4-3. Stoffel 0-0-1, School* 1-2-1. Total* 
— 17 19 22.

GRAFTON — Turow*ki 0-0-2. Janton 9-0-9, 
Schmitz 2-4-9, Siewert 9-0-3. Wood 2-4-4, 
Smetana 1-3-1. Sorcic 2-0-9. Total*— 17-11-25

Thursday Night

Basketball League
Games January 17

Three R’s 76 (high scorer Don 
Gruber 28 points), Bartelt’s 71 
(high scorer Mike Miller 25 
points).

Amerahn 82 (high scorer 
Boettcher 17 points), Hon-E- 
Kor 76 (high scorer Pat Gasser 
22 points).

Coulter’s 99 (high scorer Tom 
Timblin 16 points), Randy’s 44 
(high scorer Randy W’hite 18 
points).

Players of the week — Mike 
Miller, Holbrook, Mike Reindl.

Determination player — 
Clark Pearson.

Games January 24
Amerahn defeated Bartelt’s, 

E & S defeated Coulter’s, Hon- 
E-Kor defeated Randy’s.

Players of the week — Mike 
Coulter, Pat Gasser, Leon 
Laatsch.

Determination player — Leon 
Laatsch.

STANDINGS
W L

E&S 6 0
Coulter’s 5 1
Amerahn 4 2
Hon-E-Kor 3 3
3 R’s 2 4
Randy’s 1 6
Bartelt’s 0 6

Eichstedt All-Tournament

Kewaskum Lakes Team 4th in 
Tough Mt. Calvary Tournament
The Kewaskum Land o’ Lakes 

League team took fourth place 
in the tough, 15-team Mount 
Calvary basketball tournament, 
which was the highest finish in 
recent years by the team. The 
team received a check for $50.

The Golf Shack of Green Bay, 
consisting mainly of former 
UW-Green Bay players, took 
first place in the tourney by 
beating Rocky Rococo’s of Mad­
ison. composed largely of for­
mer University of Wisconsin- 
Madison players, in the cham­
pionship game, 72-60. Rocky’s 
took second place and Menasha 
MAC’S, which defeated Ke­
waskum Sunday, 136-100, 
Claimed third.

Kewaskum, behind Clark 
Eichstedt’s 38 points, advanced 
to Sunday’s final four by nip­
ping Elam’s II of Racine, 80-78, 
Saturday. The week before Ke­
waskum won its opening game,

these high-caliber tournaments 
and the team can be proud to 
have placed this high among 
such good competition. Tom 
Anderson of the Golf Shack was 
chosen the most valuable player 
in the meet.

Kewaskum’s next Land o’ 
Lakescontest is Sunday, Febru­
ary 3, when they host Sussex at 
7:30. The Slinger game post­
poned January 26 because of 
the Mt. Calvary tournament, 
has been re-scheduled for Sat­
urday, March 22. Also the 
Hartford at Kewaskum game on 
March 8 has been moved to 
March 9 due to a conflict with a 
high school boys’ regional tour­
nament.

One on Slinger
Kewaskum’s wrestlers won 

their second match in a row at 
Slinger Thursday night, 31-21.

The Indians got a big win 
from Bob Bastian at 138 over 
Jack Brugger and another at 
145 where Steve Beck pinned 
Brian Krueger before the first 
period ended. The Indians won 
five matches and Slinger four. 
All of the seniors won.

Another important win was 
scored by Jeff Gundrum over 
Nick Maris, where Jeff took a 
12-4 decision.

The Owls got good perfor­
mances from Ted Corey, who 
took a decision at 112 to boost 
his record to 6-0, and Mark 
Simko at 105, who pinned Tony 
Strigenz.

The Indians had a home 
match Tuesday against Random 
Lake and host Germantown 
Thursday.

KEWASKUM

Eichatedt 
Schroeder

13
9

Bockhout
Bi I90 
Timblin

9
3

95-89, over Honey Bucket of Te**or
Menomonee Falls (Falls Sting- 
ers in the Lakes League). Kewodrom

Sunday Kewaskum lost its Mano»bo mac* 
semi-final game to eventual 
tournament champion, the Golf 
Shack, 113-73.

Eichstedt, Kewaskum’s lead­
ing scorer throughout the tour­
ney, was picked for the all-tour-

6

ft 
3
3 
0
2 
0
0 
0
0 
8

2 
2
9
2
2
3
9 
o

21

MENASHA MACS

Miller
Hayek
Glomiki
Wiiniiki
Mud tn er
Fredenberg

Total*

>6
16

8

ft 
2

10 
0
6
2

24

2

2

0

8

33 39 27 41 — 136
FTM — Kewaskum 4. Menasha MAC* 4

KLAM’S II. RACINE

Forri*
Morri*

nament team and was awarded snow
0 
2

ft 
2
0 
0

KEWASKUM
ft

a trophy. Kewaskum was with­
out the services of high scoring 
Ken Loest. who played only part 
of the game with Elam’s II 
because of an injury.

I his was the first time Ke- 
waskum had placed in one of

Sim* 
Thomas 
Bolton 
Scale*

Totals

6

6
0

0 
2 
0

34
Elam * II Roclne 
Kewaikum

10

3

3 
3
0

Eichstedt 
Pong 
Bockhau* 
Mertz 
Schroeder 
Bilgo 
Koepke 
Timblin

Tofali
16
28

21

6
0

0 
0 
0

2 0

0
N

0
0

10

2 
2
2 
0
2 
0
3
2 
0

FTM — Elam* II of Racine 9, Kewaikum 6

Kewaskum 31, Slinger 21
3 — Scott Klein K win* by 

forfeit
105 — Mark Simko S pinned 

Tony Strigenz I 30
112 — Ted Corey S dec Don 

Goeden. 5-2
119 — Tom DuFour S dec. 

Wayne Boudreau 4-3
126 — Darrell Piontek S dec.

Dave Goeden 4-1.
132 — Jeff Gundrum K dec

Nick Marit 12-4
138 — Bob Bastian K dec 

Jock Brugger. 2-0.
145 — Steve Beck K pinned 

Brion Krueger. I 24
155 — Vonce Reif K dec Bob 

Simonson. 8-2.
167 — Mike Pettit K dec

Steve Kreuser 4-0
185 — Andy Strigenz K win* 

by forfeit
Uni ^ Poul Winters S win* by 

forfeit
Scenic Moraine teams draw 

for bout position

KEWASKUM SNO-CHIEFS 
POKER RUN EXTENDED

The Kewaskum Sno-Chiefs 
Poker Run which was to end on 
Sunday, February 3. has been 
extended to February 10. Think 
snow’

Indian Gymnasts
Defeat Markesan

Showing improvement, Ke­
waskum added another victory 
in last Wednesday’s gymnastic 
meet at Markesan, defeating 
their hosts 87.6 to 68.1.

Carrie Dreher took a first in 
the all around competition, first 
in the floor exercise with an 8.3, 
first in vaulting with a 6.9 and 
second in the balance beam 
with a 6.2.

Other Kewaskum places: 
Floor exercise 3, Annette Jan- 
dre 8.1; Balance Beam 1, Patty 
Sieger 7.8; Uneven Parallel 
Bars 2, Kara Weinreich and 
Joan Amerling (tie) 6.6; Vault­
ing 2, Joan Amerling 5.8; and 3, 
Rachel Ellefson 5.7.

In the more difficult routines 
the Indians lost to Markesan 
(which has been in gymnastics 
10 years), 50 to 30.05. Katie 
Lightner was first in vaulting 
with a 6.0 and Annette Jandre 
was third. In floor exercise 
Darcie Schmidt placed in a tie 
for first.

Edwards Scores 18

For Ripon College
The Ripon College Redmen 

swept a pair of close games on 
the road recently. Ripon scored 
a come-from-behind 94-85 vic­
tory over Knox Friday night and 
a 65-63 overtime win at Coe 
Saturday afternoon.

Back-up forward-center Tom 
Edwards, former Kewaskum 
High School player, and a son of 
Richard Edwards, looked good, 
scoring a career-high 18 points 
and hauling down seven re­
bounds in the Knox game.

In the Coe contest. Edwards 
was able to sink a shot that did 
not count as the buzzer had 
already gone off before he 
released it.

Edwards is tied for the Red- 
men's free throw percentage 
lead at 80 percent.

The two wins gave Ripon a 
7-4 record.

QUEEN HITS LEAGUE
Ellen Breitzman

WEDNESDAY
MORNINGETTES

Candis Martinson, Sec.
W L

Serwe’s Tap 40 19
King Pin Lanes 35 25
Behring’s Mkt. 33 27
Herriges Tap 311/2 28'/z
Bar-N-Annex 28‘/z 31'/2
Marie’s Bty. Shop 26 34
Kaszuba’s Palace 25 35
Schmitt’s Nev. Inn 21 39

High Games: Mary Ann
Jurgensmier 212, Pat Baum-
hardt 180, Donna LaShay 180.

High Series: Pat Baumhardt 
522, Mary Ann Jurgensmier 
516, Donna LaShay 497.

W L
Bauer Spraying 42'/2 17>/2
Dundee Sand 39 21
Everglades 36 24
Baumann’s Bus 36 24
Strobel’s 36 24
Charles 34 26
Newsettes 31'/i 28'/2
Johann Plbg. 31 29
Herman’s 30 30
First State Bank 29 31
Arties Mkt. 27'/2 32'/z
Regal Ware 25'/2 34'/2
Laurie’s 24 36
Fin-N-Feather 24 36
Hensen’s 23 37
Gay Nineties 11 49

Individual High Game: Pat 
Buksa 212, Pat Serwe 209, Judy 
Geidel 202.

Individual High Series: Judy 
Geidel 559, Pat Buksa 557, 
Janet Serwe 546.


