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Week’s Wit
One fellow told us that on the 

very day he was born his mother 
went hunting. But the stork got 
away.
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Watch the Kewaskum Area United Sport Shop Opens Here

Enthusiasm ran high on the 
first day of the Fund Drive as 
the campaign organization e- 
rected the 10-foot “thermome­
ter" in front of the Valley Bank. 
The organization volunteers 
have already made their per­
sonal pledges accounting for the

Plan Homecoming Activities at High School
Several activities will be part 

of the 1978 Kewaskum High 
School Homecoming prepara­
tions. Each class will be par­
ticipating in the traditional 
spirit competition and “Pep 
Week.' ’ The events of Pep week 
will include: Monday as Old 
Folks Day; Tuesday, Hats and 
Shorts Day; Wednesday, Fifties 
Day; Thursday, Tootsie Day; 
and Friday, Green - Gold - and 
White Day.

The Slinger Owls will chal­
lenge the Indians in Friday 
night’s game, October 6. Pre­
ceding the game will be the 
annual parade, starting at 6 
p.m. The parade route will 
begin at the high school and 
follow south on Park View Drive

Kewaskum Chapter
Of GOP to Meet

The Kewaskum Chapter of 
the Washington County Repub­
lican organization is holding an 
informational and discussion 
type meeting on Wednesday, 
October 4, at 7:30 p.m. at the 
Valley Bank Community Room.

Pat Rusch, candidate for the 
Sixth District Assembly Seat, 
County Sheriff Clarence 
Schwartz, and a three-member 
panel will speak briefly

Bring a new Republican 
friend. We have a lot to talk 
about. Refreshments after the 
meeting.

Way Funds Grow

$2,175.00 already registered. 
Donations and pledges will be 
recorded weekly on the ther­
mometer.

On hand for the sign-raising 
were (front row, kneeling): Ron 
Johann, Norb Serwe, Fred Mil­

to Main Street, and west on 
Main Street through the down­
town section. The parade will 
then return to the high school.

Saturday, October 7, Sun- 
blind Lion will provide the 
entertainment for the Home- 
coming Dance which will be 
held in the high school gym­
nasium. The dance will be held 
from 8 to 12 p.m., with the 
grand march taking place at 10 
p.m. The King and Queen will 
also be crowned at this time. 
Tickets are $5.00 for couples 
and $3.00 for single admission. 
The 1978 theme is “Time In A 
Bottle.”

This year the Class of 1969 
will be honored with special 
invitations going out to the 
court, varsity football players, 
and varsity cheerleaders of 
Homecoming 1968.

This year’s court includes.

Kewaskum Post
Office Hours

The Kewaskum Post Office 
recently announced a change in 
the post office hours schedule. 
It is as follows:

The lobby is open from 6:00 
a.m. to 5:30 p.m., Monday thru 
Friday, and 6:00 a.m. to 12:00 
noon on Saturday.

The window hours are 8:30 
a.m. to 5:00 p.m. Monday thru 
Friday and 8:30 a.m. to 10:30 
a m. on Saturday.

ler: (standing): Clark Pearson, 
Pearl Thompson, Dr. R. G. Ed­
wards, Sherry Miller, Lem Ro- 
senheimer, Jim Reigle, L. N. 
Peterson, Cliff Stautz, Mark 
Rodenkirch and Wayland Tes- 
sar.

(seniors); John Bemis and Pam 
Kempf; Paul Bremser and Liz 
Ogi; Scott Rohlinger and Jeri 
Buss; Mike Schaub and Yvonne 
Schacht; (juniors); Joel Her- 
riges and Janet Matenaer; Mike 
Pettit and Diane Bremser; Rod 
Schultz and Gayle Staehler; 
(AFS students):Edgardo Car­
ranza and Tami Edgar; Jorge 
Cazal and Pam Vanderwall.

Chairing the various com­
mittees for the festivities are 
the following seniors: Chelli 
Dreher, float; Scott Reif, Bonnie 
Boden, and Janine Rochwite, 
decorations; Cindy Haack, pa­
rade; Yvonne Schacht and Mike 
Schaub, tickets; Janine Roch­
wite, refreshments; Sharon A- 
merling, Pep Week; cheerlead­
ers, assembly; Jeri Buss, down­
town decorations and publicity; 
Jeanne Becker, Royalty and 
Grand March; Janine Rochwite, 
photography; Shawn McElhat- 
ton, alumni committee. The 
advisor for the senior class is 
Larry Ammel.

NAMED SALES PERSON OF 
YEAR BY GOURMET FOODS

Gourmet Foods, Inc., of St. 
Paul, Minnesota, one of the 
largest specialty food distribu­
tors in the nation, has named 
Roger Vandenbeusque of 1502 
Fond du Lac Avenue, Kewas­
kum, as their “Sales Person of 
the Year” for 1978.

Jerry and Patricia Geidel of 
Kewaskum have purchased the 
former Village Store and living 
quarters from Karl and Ann 
Fee, owners, and are opening a 
sport shop in the building.

Jerry and his partner, Roger 
Groeschel, are opening the 
Village Sport Shop at 334 Main 
Street on Friday evening, Sep­
tember 29.

The store will handle pri­
marily hunting and fishing e- 
quipment. Guns, ammunition, 
bows and some camping and 
fishing supplies will be avail­
able this fall. In the spring, the 
store will have a complete line 
of fishing equipment as well as 
tennis rackets, baseball and 
softball supplies, etc.

Roger, an experienced gun­
smith, will do service work at 
the store. He has 15 years 
experience in that field, having 
done service work at his home. 
Jerry is a custom rod builder.

School Board Accepts Gasoline Bid
By TAMI EDGAR 

Statesman Staff Writer
Monday night’s meeting had 

the School Board looking at the 
bids for gasoline again. The 
question was whether the mo­
tion had been to accept the 
Strobel bid, or a motion which 
indicated the low bid. This 
motion resulted from a change 
made at the September 19 
meeting at which time the 
Shefond bid was rescinded be­
cause of a misunderstanding on 
what the bid included.

A motion was then made to 
rescind the motion of Septem­
ber 19 to accept the low bid and 
to accept the bid of Strobel Oil 
Co. gasoline for 1978-79. The 
vote went with five members in 
favor and Gessner and Theusch 
voting “no.”

The bus committee will as­
sess the problem and report to 
the board involving the pick up 
at a babysitter’s home.

The board also discussed the 
question of cheerleaders partic­
ipation in a sport during the 
same season. No action was 
taken on the matter.

The board approved having 
all complaints of violations of 
training rules in the athletic 
code be submitted in writing, 
signed, time and place of vio­
lation being reported. Also ap­
proved was the fall auditing of 
student enrollment.

The first reading of Policy # 
5113.2 - Attendance - Full-time 
Students was defined as fol­
lows: 1. High school students 
must be scheduled for at least 
three and one-half units per 
year. College credits being tak­
en and school supervised work 
experience programs may be 
used toward fulfillment of the 
minimum program. 2. Middle 
School students must be sched­
uled for at least 4-'/a units per 
year. 3. Elementary schools 
must be scheduled for the full 
day program, kindergarten stu­
dents for 1 day. 4. EEN 
students may have less than a

He has built all his own rods 
and others for friends the past 
several years.

Tentative hours will be Mon­
day and Friday, 9-9; Wednes­
day and Thursday, 9-6, and 
Saturday, 8-5. Closed Tuesday 
and Sunday.

Jerry and Roger hope to 
supply the community’s sport­
ing goods needs and will be 
open to suggestions from the 
public.

Karl and Ann Fee, former 
owners of the Village Store, 
have moved to New Fane on 
Mill Road where they will con­
tinue their antique business in 
their home. The Fees purchased 
the store in 1975 from Charles 
Miller, who conducted and elec­
tric and photography business 
for many years until his re­
tirement.

The new owners invite the 
public to stop in and visit them 
in their new business venture.

minimum program if M-Team 
prescribed.

The CETA project application 
for the continuation of a cus­
todial and library aide position 
was approved by the board.

The long term disability pro­
gram was discussed but no 
action was taken. A letter is 
requested from companies ma­
king proposals indicating cov­
erage and will be retroactive to 
October 1, 1978. The board will 
review this issue at the October 
16 meeting.

Policy H 3326.1 on check sig­
natures was read and approved 
by the board. It indicates who is 
authorized to sign specific 
checks.

Parents planning to move to 
the district have asked to have 
their children enroll in Ke­
waskum schools now. The board 
accepted the requests based on 
tuition requirements as stated 
in the Wisconsin Statute, un­
derstanding that tuition will be 
charged if residence is not es­
tablished as required by the 
statute.

Receive Degrees 
At UW-Oshkosh

Bachelor’s degrees in busi­
ness administration, education 
and letters and science have 
been awarded to 126 seniors at 
the close of the University of 
Wisconsin-Oshkosh summer 
session.

According to their home com­
munity of residence, these stu­
dents and the degrees they re­
ceived are: Glenn O. Eichstedt, 
803 Memorial Dr., Kewaskum, 
Education - Bachelor of Science 
in Secondary; Richard Edward 
Zarling Jr., 524 Keller St., Ke­
waskum, Letters and Science - 
Bachelor of Science in Art; 
Christine Marie Anders, Route 
1, Campbellsport, Letters and 
Science - Bachelor of Science.
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Regal Announces Promotions in Sales Departments

Richard E. Mehring Jeffrey A. Reigle

Tornado Alert
The fire siren will be sounded 

on Thursday, Oct. 5, at 10 a m. 
to acquaint residents with the 
tornado or other disaster signal. 
It will be sounded at a steady 
pitch for three to five minutes.

In the event of a tornado or 
other impending disaster, take 
precautionary measures.

Kewaskum does not sound an 
all-clear siren. Please listen to 
your weather radio station for 
any information.

The alerts will be held on the 
first Thursday of each month 
during the tornado season.

This will be the last tornado 
alert until next spring.

John C. Evans

Regal Ware, Inc. has an­
nounced several promotions in 
its corporate Sales Department 
at Kewaskum.

John C. Evans has been 
named Director of Housewares 
Sales. In this newly created 
position he will be responsible 
for the development and ad­
ministration of marketing pro­
grams for the Military, Export 
and Direct Mail Divisions, in 
addition to the complete Retail 
Sales area where he has served 
for the past two years as the 
Director of Retail Sales.

A native of West Bend and a 
graduate of the University of 
Wisconsin - Madison, Evans 
joined Regal’s field sales force 
in 1964 and was assigned the 
Iowa territory later that year. In 
1969 he was assigned to the 
New England territory where he 
was named Regional Sales 
Manager in 1972. He received 
Regal's highest sales award 
when he was named Regal Man 
of the Year in 1972.

Evans and his wife have two 
children and live at Cedar Lake.

Richard E. Mehring has been 
promoted to Director of Export, 
Military and Direct Mail Divi­
sions and will be responsible for 
all marketing programs for 
those classes of trade.

Mehring came to Regal in 
1962 as a Sales Correspondent 
in the Premium Division and

was promoted to Sales Manager 
of the Chain Store Division in 
1970. He is a graduate of Mar­
quette University and served 
two years in the U.S. Army. He 
has been active in parish ac­
tivities at St. Frances Cabrini, 
West Bend, where he presently 
serves on the school board and 
is a former Parish Council 
President. Mehring has also 
been active in the International 
Brotherhood of Magicians for 25 
years.

Mehring is a native of Port 
Washington and he, his wife, 
and their four children live in 
West Bend.

Jeffrey A. Reigle has been 
appointed Sales Manager of the 
Chain Store Division, succeed­
ing Dick Mehring.

Reigle, 1973 graduate of Car­
roll College - Waukesha, en­
tered Regal’s sales training 
program and later served as a 
Sales Correspondent. He con­
tinued his field sales training in 
Texas and subsequently was 
assigned the Florida Sales Ter­
ritory. In September of 1977 he 
returned to Regal’s headquar­
ters where he assisted in the 
Production Control Department 
until the present time.

Reigle, his wife, and son 
make their home in West Bend.

Further realignment of duties 
in the Sales Department in­
cludes Edward C. Backhaus as

Sales Manager - Export
Direct Mail Division and

and 
Ed-

ward A. Christie will concen-

trate on the Military markets as 
Sales Manager.

Veterinary Services 
LARGE & SMALL ANIMALS 

WOODVIEW 
VETERINARY CLINIC 

Dra. Bushard & Thornborrow 
North Point Shopping Center 

Hwy. 45 N. of West Bend 
PHONE 338-1838

a SPECIAL 
^MOHAWK 
W CARPET.

One
Week Only

Mohawk

wf-tbeu

Village Sport Shop
SALE

Save Up to 20%
334 Main Street Kewaskum

(FORMERLY VILLAGE STORE)

OPEN THIS WEEKEND
Friday — 6:00 p.m. to 9:00 p.m.

Saturday — 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.
Regular Hours Will Be 

Announced Next Week

GUNSMITH SERVICE

Guns — Ammunition — Hunting Supplies 

Archery Equipment — Fishing Supplies 

Hunting & Fishing Licenses

Phone 626-4541

On Quality Mohawk Carpeting

Once a Year Mohawk Sell-O-Rama

OCTOBER 2nd THRU OCTOBER 9th

OF KEWASKUM
Expert Installation and Sales Assistance

DEPENDABLE and REASONABLE SINCE 1910
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Heisdorf - Ray

The marriage vows of Debra 
Heisdorf and David Ray were 
blessed during a 4:00 p.m. 
ceremony at Holy Trinity Cath­
olic Church, Kewaskum, on 
Friday, July 7.

Parents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. John Heisdorf of Ke­
waskum, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Ray of Davenport, Iowa.

The maid of honor was Susan 
Butschlick, sister of the bride, 
and the bridesmaids were 
Jeanne Knoeck and Theresa 
Heisdorf, also sisters of the 
bride.

Mark Ray attended his broth­
er as best man with Ken 
Biertzer of West Bend, brother- 
in-law of the bride, and Mark 
Benes of Davenport, a friend of 
the groom, serving as grooms­
men.

Krissy Heisdorf and Randy 
Romaine, niece and nephew of 
the bride, were the flower girl 
and ringbearer.

Ushering duties were shared 
by Jim Heisdorf, brother of the 
bride, and Terry Kling, cousin 
of the groom.

A reception and dance was 
held at the KC Hall at West 
Bend following the ceremony.

The bride is a graduate of 
Kewaskum High School. The 
groom graduated from Daven­
port West High School, and also 
attended St. Ambrose College 
in Davenport studying engi­
neering. He is employed as a 
machinist at the Rock Island 
Arsenal in Illinois.

The couple spent their honey­
moon in the Wisconsin Dells 
area and managed to get in a 
race at Sun Prairie, where the 
groom drives his father-in-law’s 
No. 1 race car.

The newlyweds reside in 
Davenport, Iowa, where the Ray 
family has a shop, building and 
selling race cars and parts.

Hey, 
Homer Club 

Members

ENTER THE HOMER'S CLUB 
FIRE PREVENTION WEEK 

POSTER CONTEST

Births
CANFIELD — A daughter to 

Travis and Karol Canfield, Ke­
waskum, Wednesday, Septem­
ber 20.

RE1NDL — A daughter to 
Richard and Rose Reindl, Ke­
waskum, Wednesday, Septem­
ber 20.

WINN1NGHOFF - A daugh­
ter to Gerald and Beverly Win- 
ninghoff, Kewaskum, Thurs­
day, September 21.

GRUHLE — A son to William 
and Nancy Gruhle, Kewaskum, 
Thursday, September 21.

GRUBER — A daughter to 
David and Cynthia Gruber, Ke­
waskum, Saturday, September 
23.

BUNKELMAN - A daughter 
to Charles and Cynthia Bun- 
kelman, 1410 Sunset Ridge 
Drive, West Bend, Saturday, 
September 23.

Marriage Licenses
Steven Dale Backhaus, Ke­

waskum, and Thelma Ann Ford, 
Campbellsport; wedding Sep­
tember 23.

Gordon Lee Darmody, Allen­
ton, and Julie Veronica Thull, 
Milwaukee; wedding October 7.

Mark Anthony Fichtner, 
West Bend, and Anna Lohrer, 
Kewaskum; wedding Septem­
ber 30.

HAVE YOUR BLOOD
PRESSURE CHECKED

Blood pressure readings will 
again be held at the Legion 
Clubhouse, Kewaskum, on 
Wednesday, October 4, from 
11:00 a.m. to 12:30 p.m.

This health service is spon­
sored by the Washington Coun­
ty Nurses and is held every two 
months. There is no charge and 
everyone is welcome to have 
their blood pressure checked.

HOMER SAYS:
Read these
Fire Prevention Rules

• Don't play with matches

• Don't overload electrical 
outlets

• Check for frayed or worn 
out electrical cords

• Don't leave gasoline cans 
or oily rags in your base­
ment or garage

• After cooking with charcoal 
put out the coals

• At Christmas time keep 
your tree watered and 
don't leave lights on too 
long

• KNOW your Fire Depart­
ment phone number

• Have at least one working 
fire extinguisher in your 
home

• Practice family fire drills 
in your home

• If there should be a fire in 
your home remember to 
"Stoy Low and Go"

RULES
1. Participants must belong to Homer's Club. If 

you aren't a member ask your Mom or Dad to 
open your Homer's Club Savings Account for 
$10.00 or more, get your FREE "T" shirt and 
become eligible for the contest.

2. There are four categories of participants: 
Group No. 1 — Ages 2-5 
Group No. 2 — Ages 6-8 
Group No. 3 — Ages 9-11 
Group No. 4—Ages 12-13

3. From the list of Fire Safety Rules choose a rule 
and illustrate it on your poster

4. Regulation poster paper can be obtained at any 
West Bend Savings office. You can use crayons, 
markers or any drawing material you wish

5. Print your name, address and age on the back 
of your poster.

6. Each Homer Club member is limited to one entry
7. Deadline for submission of your poster is 

October 13, 1978.

8. All posters can be used by West Bend Savings 
and may be displayed in the Association's office

JUDGING
Judging will be based on neatness, originality and 
composition

PRIZES
5 PRIZES will be awarded in EACH CATEGORY

1st Prize — $15.00
2nd Prize — $10.00
3rd Prize — $5.00
Two Honorable Mentions — $1.00

APPLES FOR SALE
At the Bridge in Kewaskum

ON HWY. 28

Every Saturday 9:30 a.m. til Noon
McIntosh, Cortland, Macoun, Wealthy

FRESH CIDER

CHERRY HILL FARM
Batavia Ph. 994-4579 or 994-4925

KEWASKUM

RAVINGS OFFICE OF WEST BEND 
SA VINOS & LOAN ASSOCIATION

114 Main Street 
KEWASKUM, WIS. 53040 

414 - 626-2186

’• V#’<i WW.’.WW// WVAW«W/«WWW\W^J^<f^//f^jF//lfff/f/jfff/ f/j
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Plan Activities
President Mary Gutjahr cal­

led the September meeting of 
the Kewaskum Juniors to order. 
New officers for the year also 
include Karen Keller, Vice 
President; Joan Stoffel, Recor­
ding Secretary; Ann Fee, Cor­
responding Secretary, and Ros 
Kiefer, Treasurer.

Various committee reports 
were given and once again the 
Juniors will sponsor a child in 
Oklahoma through the Christian 
Children's Fund (a family help 
program). Betty Crocker cou­
pons will be collected for South­
ern Colony and monthly visits to 
the Beechwood Rest Home are 
planned. The club also was 
given approval by the Village 
Board to progress with plans for 
a natural walkway and nature 
trail in the new Kewaskum 
Park.

Important dates to remember 
are a Membership Tea on Octo­
ber 25, at 7:30 p.m. at Mem­
bership Chairman Cindy Knoe- 
bel’s home. Call 626-4311 for 
further information. A special 
outing to Porter’s of Racine is 
being planned for the club for 
Tuesday, October 24.

The most important date is, 
of course, October 17. A style 
show, “Fashionable Reflec­
tions,’’ will be sponsored by 
theKewaskum Juniors featuring 
the latest in clothing fashions 
from Jeanne’s Country Casuals 
in West Bend and the latest in 
footwear fashion from Dennis’ 
Shoe Store in Kewaskum. Of 
special interest to all in atten­
dance will also be the grand 
prize of a handmade quilt—in 
addition to the other lovely door 
prizes. Remember that’s Tues­
day, October 17, at 8:00 p.m. 
at the Kewaskum High School 
gym. Bring a friend. Tickets are 
$2.25 in advance and $2.75 at 
the door and are available from 
any Kewaskum Junior, at 
Jeanne’s and at Dennis’ Shoe 
Store.

A book is a success 
when people who haven’t 
read it pretend that they 
have.

from
John Boroy, R P H

Stress is a normal, even 
healthy part of living. But we 
may get so keyed up by work 
or worry that we can’t relax 
and let down. We then may 
need to work off our tensions 
with enjoyable physical acti­
vity, or talk out our troubles 
with a sympathetic friend, 
doctor, or religious adviser. To 
avoid tension-producing 
worry, be Involved in more 
than one activity-this avoids 
deep disappointment In any 
one area. Being involved in 
worthwhile activities with 
other people helps to defeat 
feelings of depression or 
isolation with our own pro­
blems.

At Kewaskum

It appears that many box­
holders did not receive the fall 
catalog of classes that was sent 
out by the MPTI district. Ke­
waskum High School is the 
center for MPTI classes in this 
area and will offer any course 
that ten or more persons in the 
area indicate interest in.

Classes have been started in 
woods, upholstery, women’s 
survey courses, positive think­
ing and ceramics. Diet delight 
started Monday night, Septem­
ber 18, and has room for a few 
more. Chair canning, crewel 
embroidery, furniture refinish­
ing, knitting, rosemaling, rug 
hooking, tax preparation, typ­
ing, welding, auto engine and 
body work, antique apprecia­
tion, cake decorating and bev­
erage host classes will start as 
soon as the 10th person signs 
up.

Call the Kewaskum High 
School at 626-2166 for more 
information.

"You fire 
Number 

One 
With Me!"

RE-ELECT 
H

Your Full Time
Assemblyman

Hephner’s Reasons Why! “FARMERS”

1. Delivered a long-needed 
veterinary college for 
Wisconsin.

2. Authored the law that allows 
farmers to receive indemnity 
payments when an unknown 
disease strikes their herds.

3. Supported the State Budget 
that will remove the personal 
property tax on cattle by 1981; 
removed the tax on baler twine 
and meat wrapping paper.

4. Helped farmers who ship milk, 
by opposing unreasonable 
standards for their buildings.

5. Kept the Farmland Preservation 
Program in the State Budget 
to help ALL the farmers.

HEPHNER truly knows 
the farmers problems. 
He farms, and owns his 
great-grandfather’s farm 
where he resides.

Harvest Luncheon
About 35 members and 

guests attended the Harvest 
Luncheon of the Kewaskum 
Woman’s Club held Saturday, 
September 23, at the Peace 
Church. Before the luncheon, 
members participated in a silent 
auction at which a variety of 
baked goods, homemade pre­
serves, handmade and other 
articles were sold.

Mrs. Lloyd Etta was chair­
man of the luncheon committee. 
(Kher members were Mrs. Don­
ald Wendt, Mrs. Ray Schaefer, 
Mrs. Roy Swanson, Mrs. Wil­
mer Falk and Mrs. L.N. Peter­
son.

Door prizes were won by Mrs. 
Jan Rosenthal, Mrs. Ronald 
Schmitz and Mrs. Roland Heb- 
erer.

Card prizes were awarded to 
Mrs. Charles Miller, Mrs. Wil­
lard Gruhle and Mrs. Myrtle 
Johnson.

The October meeting will be a 
joint meeting with the Kewas­
kum Junior Woman’s Club on 
Thursday, October 12, at 7:30

Hephner Says,

Re-Elect Hephner |
State Assembly 6th District

Auth Paid for By: Citizens for Hephner. Lloyd Greqorie, New Holstein. Wis

p.m. at the Peace Church. 
Steven Greene of West Bend 
will be the speaker on the topic 
of energy resources. Separate 
business meetings will be held 
after the program.

KHS Chapter Enters
FFA Judging Contest

Kewaskum High School Fu­
ture Farmers of America Chap­
ter has entered the Mid-Amer­
ica FFA Judging Contests to be 
held on October 7 at the World 
Dairy Expo in Madison, Wis­
consin .

Team members will have a 
chance to watch milking class 
competitions in the Central 
National Holstein and Milking 
Shorthorn Shows. Also on the 
Saturday schedule at Expo are 
selection of the Supreme Cham­
pion Female of the show, a 
Milking Shorthorn show and a 
tractor pull.

World Dairy Expo, an Inter­
national Trade Show for Dairy

KEWASKUM STATESMAN 
250 Main St. Ph. 626-2626

Published Every Friday 
Entered as Second Class 
Matter at the Post Office.

Kewaskum, Wisconsin 53040 
William J. Harbeck & 
Marcella M. Harbeck

Publishers
Subscription Rates: 

$6.00 Per Year in State 
$7.00 Per Year Out of State

Single Copy 15c

Friday, Sept. 29, 1978

Fanners, runs from October 4 
through 8 at the Exposition 
Center in Madison. Dairy e- 
quipment exhibits are open 
from 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. A 
detailed program may be ob­
tained from World Dairy Expo, 
1707 South Park Street, Madi­
son, Wisconsin 53713.
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Lyle Manthei, Kewaskum, died 
Monday, September 28.

i 25 Years Ago 5
October 2, 1953

Appointment of Gerhard 
Guttman, 48, a resident of 
Waukegan, Illinois, as chief of 
police for the Village of Ke­
waskum was announced this 
week by the village board.

On September 10, the Village 
•f Kewaskum, filed a complaint 
with the Public Service Com­
mission of Wisconsin under 
section 195.28 statutes, that the 
grade crossing of track of the 
Chicago and North Western 
Railway Company, of Second 
Street in the village is dan­
gerous and requires additional 
protection.

Miss Shirley Pals, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Louis Pals, 
Kewaskum, left September 27 
for Omaha, Nebraska, to enroll 
in airline personnel training in 
the division of Electronic Radio 
Television Institute, Inc.

A daughter was born to Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert Wesenberg, 
Route 3, Campbellsport, on 
September 25. Sons were born 
to Mr. and Mrs. John McEl- 
hatton, Kewaskum; Mr. and 
Mrs. Elroy Hron, Kewaskum; 
and Mr. and Mrs. Albert Thie- 
sen, Route 1, Kewaskum, all on 
Sunday, September 27.

Wedding vows were ex­

changed by: Lucille R. Roh- 
linger, daughter of the Clarence 
Rohlingers, Route 1, Campbell­
sport, and Sylvester S. Bassil, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Joseph 
Bassil, Route 3, Campbellpsort; 
Patricia Ann Netko, daughter of 
the Arthur A. Netkos, Eden, 
and Raymond Joseph Schuh, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Mathias H. 
Schuh, Long Lake, Route 3, 
Campbellsport; and Beverly 
Anne Wuenne, daughter of 
Mrs. Ervin Wuenne, Milwau­
kee, and Kenneth Leo Sarauer, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Sarauer, Route 3, Kewaskum.

Cpl. Walter Gatzke, Jr., son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Walter Gatzke, 
Campbellsport, is now stationed 
at Otaru, Japan.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Hoffman, 
Kewaskum, have announced 
the engagement of their daugh­
ter, Dorothy Marie, to Pvt. 
Alton Lee Westover, son of 
Mrs. Rachel Westover, Gordon, 
Nebraska.

Lehman Peter Rosenheimer, 
72, prominent Kewaskum mer­
chant for over 50 years, died at 
his home Friday, September 25.

Mrs. Robert Ramel, 72, nee 
Mathilda Backhaus, of the 
Town of Auburn, died Monday, 
September 28.

Mrs. William Groeschel, 84, 
nee Emily Mueller, of Bolton- 
ville passed away on Friday, 
September 25.

Mrs. Leo Kaehne, 42, of

! 50 Years Ago
»

September 29, 1928

The village board last week 
took an option on a strip of land 
upon which the water tower for 
the city waterworks will be 
erected. The strip of land, 100 x 
260 feet in dimension, will be 
purchased from August Bilgo, 
Jr., and is located east of the 
Kewaskum Aluminum factory 
and a little ways north of the 
high school building.

Glenway Wescott, well 
known author, formerly of Ke­
waskum, has completed his 
latest story, ‘‘Good Bye Wis­
consin.” The book is a collec­
tion of remarkably fine short 
stories by a young American 
writer whose promise indicates 
that he has scarcely scratched 
the surface of his potentialities.

By special order of the Wis­
consin Conservation Commis­
sion, the hunting season on 
rabbits in 16 counties of Wis­
consin, including Washington 
County, will not open until the 
first of November.

Mrs. Herman Schaefer, nee 
Malinda Guth, died on Wed­
nesday, September 26, of peri- 
tonites following a Caesarian 
operation.

The marriage of Miss Golda

Seefeld, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Edward Seefeld of Beech­
wood, and Charles Schemmel, 
son of Mrs. Augusta Schemmel 
of Batavia, took place on Satur­
day evening in Beechwood.

Ray Krahn of Beechwood had 
a silo filling bee on Friday. 
Henry Fick of New Fane is 
filling his silo the modern 
way—with a 5 H.P. electric 
motor on a 16-inch Gehl cutter 
and has plenty of power.

The Kewaskum Hardware 
and Electric Company has re­
vised the barn of Charles Gar- 
bisch with galvanized conduit 
and new wire and is installing a 
hot water heating system, com­
plete plumbing system with 
automatic pumps and also • 
Pascoe oil burner for Charles 
Garbisch's new heating system.

‘Pet Fair’ at
Westfair Mall

The Washington County Hu­
mane Society and the Holy Hill 
Dog Club, in conjunction with 
‘‘Pet Responsibility Week,” are 
presenting their first "PET 
FAIR” at Westfair Mall, West

Bend.
Animals will be brought from 

the society’s shelter, located at 
3650 Hwy. 60 in Slinger to the 
mall for display. The animals 
displayed will be changed at 
intervals.

Members of the Holy Hill 
Dog Club will be present 
throughout the fair, not only to 
demonstrate how quickly these 
animals will respond to basic 
training, when properly taught, 
but to answer any training 
problems you may have with 
your pet.

Free literature will be avail­
able on request, as well as 
applications and information for 
interested parties about joining 
the dog club or humane society.

Spectators may register at the 
pet fair for door prizes. There 
will be 10 door prizes given at 
the completion of the event: 5 
cases of Mighty Dog beef and 5 
cases of Friskies Buffet. Winner 
need not be present at the time 
of the drawing.

The fair will be in progress on 
Friday, September 29, from 
2:00 p .m. until closing and from 
9:30 a.m. to 5:30 p m. on 
Saturday, September 30.

Phone: KewaskumvruteBu^TUES. • WED. • TMURS • FRI. • SAT. ONLY!
THE . 
SIGN 
FOR 1 
VALUES

SAVING
am=BS?l

CENTERS t!

Kennelly Pharmacy 102 Main Street 
KEWASKUM, WIS

JOHNSONS 
BABY SHAMPOO 

20c OH Lab*

a
ON SALE THRU SEPT 30

PALMOLIVE 
SOAP

'Atvmul 
K»u<h

159
FOR

MARCAL 
FACIAL TISSUES 

200 Count

GLASS PLUS 
With Trigger 

Sprayer

99c
ir 
i

UMe

SKIPPY 
PEANUT BUTTER 

18 oc «IW
LYSOL 

12 oz. SPRAY 

1 39

PADS

69e
VICKS 

FORMULA 44
VICKS 

FORMULA 44-0

HVEI 
THERMOMETER

79*
J

S9‘

LADIES PERSONAL ■
TOUCH RAZOR ■

BY SCHICK *
2 49 Value ■

159 I

BKkk COWON
PERSONAL TOUCH 
REFILL BLADES 4 s

1 69 Value

99c
J cnteBWO'COWON ■ 
■ wl LIP QUENCHER ■ 
■ ■* LIPSTICKS ■ 
■ A Chapstick |

1 L Assorted Shades 29. J r a >».- | ,

'BW^CMpji1* S
PHISOOERM 

SKIN CLEANSER

2 99 Value

l59
ISteSBySSSSJ

NEO-SYNEPHRINE 
1/2% SPRAY

WHITE RAIN 
NAIR SPRAT 0

Phone 626-2164334-4044 or 334-9611

$10 Cash Rebate
on Fiberglas ceilings!
Flexible Fiberglas ceiling panels are easy to install 
because they bend to fit snug spaces. They're 
durable because they won't warp, sag or discolor 
like some other brands. 5-year limited warranty. 
CASH-REBATE TERMS; A minimum $50 purchase of 
Owens-Coming Fiberglas Ceiling Panels qualifies. 
Only one $10 rebate per family. Only one rebate 
per purchase
You get your cash rebate directly from Owens- 
Corning Fiberglas. Purchases must be made 
between September 1 and November 30,1978. 
Rebate claims must be postmarked no later than 
December 31,1978 and must be dccompanied 
with proof-of purchase and this coupon verified 
by the participating dealer.

YOUR NAME

ADDRESS _______ ----------------STATE ZIP _

CLUING PURCHASE $------------------------PATTERN
SQ FT___________

DEALER NAME

ADDRESS

City -STATE

I 
I
I

DEALER VERIFICATION______________________________

You muit present th,, coupon to deal., to be ebg.ble to, rebate

Ssnd thi$ rebate CICNn COudoh and rwrvM l. _

Available at MINZ
"mr?eg o cf Oxo in West Bend &■ Kewaskum



SAVE

SENTRY MO67
FRESHFRESH

SAVE
PORK STEAKGROUND BEEF

99’ *1”
FRESH EXTRA LEAN

With Coupon
WEAVER SLICED

CHICKEN ROLL
FRESH

99*
HILLSHIRE FARM SMOKED

SAVE

BOSTON BUTT

OSCAR MAYER

SLICED BOLOGNA
$«|19

two 14 5OZ 

Contadina

Stewed
Tomatoes

26 OZ PKG 
FROZEN

Sal uto 

Deep Dish 
Pizza

S 50 Vitad At Saury Through Ort J 19/8
Umrt One Pm ArMi Cash Value 1 20

With Coupon
48 Vila al S«iiry TNough Oct 3 1918 

bant One Pm MUI Cask Value 1 20'

Spo |
With Coupon I

£85*’
With Coupon I

16OZ BOX 
asboriEO .

Quaker

100% Natural 7R^ I
With Coupon I

3 54 Vahdat Sentry Ttaou^l Oct 3 19/8 ■ 
bum Ont hf Add! Cash Vaka 1 2D I

1lB CAN
REGULAR OR ELECTRIC PERK I
Sanka .

Decaffeinated $289«
Coffee With Coupon!
, 49 VaM at Sarny ThuuBr Del 3 1911

rozen ■
BOSTON CREME. LEMON I

i O(ONU1 BANANAON ■
CHOCOLATE I

Peppendge Farm 90*
Layer Cake with Coupon]

, 51 Valdai Sentry Thruq^ (kt 3, 1918 ■
Unwt One An ArtUr Caak Value 1 A) J

RICH N CHIPS COCONUT |
CHOCOLATE DROPS |

OR CHOCOLATE FUDGE

Keebier QC0 I
Cookies ®? I

With Coupon I

15 18 OZ PKG 
OATMEAL OR FUDGE CHIP

Quaker

SAVE
69'0

I SAVE
115'

3 LB BAG

McIntosh 

Apples

6 PACK

Borden 

Heath Bars

98*
With Coupon

With Coupon

21B CAN REG .
DRIPOR PERK O LECTRIC

Butter Nut
Coffee

16 OZ PKG ASSORTED

Merkt’s
I Cheese 

Spread

S 52 Valel al Steihy heiuqk Del 3. 111k -
Umi One Re. A<Ml Calk Value 1 20 I

FOUR 602 CANS

Contadina 

Tomato 
Paste

With Coupon
* *1 For I

GROUND BEEF

1119

FROZEN GRADE A

COD Ducks

89*

THESE COUPONS 
ARE WORTH

SAVE
24'0

GROUND ROUND

$159
____________ ' ■__________ Lb.

PORK ROAST

8109

8 0z 
Pkg

SAUSAGE OR KIELBASA
$159

I Lb.

12 Oz 
Pkg.

CANS

S 55 ve«« Sown "•'"*' ^t 1 WB

Cookie Mix
With Coupon

S 53 Vataf At Sentry Through Oct 3 19/8 
limit Ono Pm AzMl Cash Value I 20*
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was a hoax, then why are there 
not more white bulldogs in

in 
the 
the

northern Wisconsin today?
In a number of bars 

northern Wisconsin hangs 
Jackalope, a cross between

© 1978 Dr. Walker D. Wyman
University of Wisconsin - River Falls

“The Dingbat” reputedly snatches bullets from the air in deer 
season and drinks gasoline out of parked cars.

(Illustration by Helen B. Wyman)

MYTHICAL CREATURES 
OF WISCONSIN

Wisconsin Folklore

4

Rhinelander’s famous Hodag. (illustrated by Helen B. WymviL

Editor's Note: This article is 
one of a series of 15 on 
“Wisconsin Folklore” being 
presented by the Statesman in 
cooperation with University of 
Wisconsin Extension. The ar­
ticles are the bulk of the reading 
material in a course which may 
be taken for undergraduate or 
graduate University credit. For 
more information about this 
course, contact: Dr. Lorin R. 
Robinson, director; “Wisconsin 
Newspaper Classroom;” De­
partment of Journalism; Uni­
versity of Wisconsin — River 
Falls(54022).

Among the best known myth­
ical animals in Wisconsin were 
those reported by the lumber­
jacks, miners, and their roman-
tic followers. Bed-cats were de- question remains: If the Hodag
scendants of the original bed­
bugs that once infested the mi­
ners' cabins in Wisconsin, 
Michigan and Minnesota. 
When the mines were deserted, 
they attached themselves to 
bob-cats, grew fur to stay alive 
in the wintertime, and learned 
to run the woods with their 
hosts. Trappers occasionally 
caught them, noticed that they 
looked like bob-cats except they 
had more legs. There was a 
lively market for their pelts in 
Superior and Hurley where 
women, intrigued by both the 
name of Bed-cat and the 
warmth of the fur, used the 
pelts to trim their nightgowns.

The most famous mythical 
creature in Wisconsin is the 
Hodag, a prehistoric creature 
resembling a dinosaur with the 
body of an ox and the tail of an 
alligator. Along its back were 
sharply pointed spines. Gene 
Shepard of Rhinelander cap-

tured one at the turn of the cen­
tury, using white bulldogs as 
bait, and exhibited it at county 
fairs. The Milwaukee Journal 
reported on this amazing news 
event and it is said that the 
Smithsonian Institution was in­
terested in this creature.

Unfortunately, a fire destroy­
ed the creature so the scientific 
world was not able to prove the 
Hodag’s authenticity. Hodags 
were reported in Minnesota 
logging camps in the same 
period, but these may have 
been a sub-species. A replica of 
the Hodag may be purchased in 
Rhinelander today (made in 
Japan!) and a statute to this 
noble creature stands in front of 
the Rhinelander Museum. One

antelope and the jackrabbit, and 
many a fight has occurred over 
the issue of its authenticity. 
This creature was first reported 
in 1829 in Wyoming, but it has 
moved eastward as well as 
westward over the years. A 
statute stands in its memory in 
Douglas, Wyoming. Mounted 
Jackalopes are available in both 
Tioga, Pennsylvania, and Hong 
Kong. The Douglas Chamber of 
Commerce issues a non-resi­
dent hunting license for Jack­
alope hunting which authorizes 
shooting between midnight and 
2 a.m. on June 31. The taking of 
two-tailed Jackalopes is prohib­
ited. Jackalope milk is also sold, 
claiming to be richer “in Vita­
min P than beer or water-

melon,” and is to be kept away 
from office girls and waitresses.

The Splinter cat that once 
frequented the pineries looked 
like a porcupine “with its spines 
running the wrong way.” Its 
head was shaped like a maul; it 
had the hind legs of a jackrabbit 
that enabled it to jump over logs 
and streams, and a body the 
size of a six-week old calf. But it 
had one great weakness—it had 
a sweet tooth that caused it to 
seek honey wherever it could be 
found.

If the bees had hidden their 
honey inside a tree—out of reach 
of the Splinter Cat—it went 
raving mad, climbed into a 
nearby tree and then sprang 
against the bee tree with all its 
might. Its head was a battering 
ram that often shattered the 
tree into a million pieces. Then 
the animal ate its fill. Since it 
roamed only during thunder­
storms, lumberjacks often said 
as they listened to the thunder, 
“The Splinter Cats are sure out 
tonight.” Why did they dis-

appear? It is believed that the 
honey bees migrated out of the 
pineries into the hardwood for­
ests, and that the Splinter Cats 
simply dashed their brains out 
against these large trees. Is that 
why there are so many fallen 
and shattered trees in the 
Wisconsin forests today?

Among the Chippewa Indians 
there is a legend about a giant 
cannibal, the Windigo, that 
once roamed the forest sending 
out thunderbolts from its twis­
ted jaws and hungering for 
human flesh. It is believed that 
some Indians who had to eat 
human flesh to survive the long 
winters also became Windi- 
goes. Mothers quieted their 
Children by saying, “Hush, or 
the Windigo will get you.” 
Trappers and fishermen in the 
Great Lakes still say, when they 
see strange tracks in remote 
areas, “the Windigo has been 
here.”

Mermaids and Sirens
These lovely creatures have 

been reported ever since lonely 
men first went out to sea. They 
have the bust and facial fea­
tures of beautiful women and 
the lower body of a fish, and 
usually inhabit rocky islands 
where they lure men into the 
great unknown. Columbus saw 
one in the West Indies. Henry

Hudson’s sailors saw one on the 
river that bears his name. Cap­
tain John Smith saw one grace­
fully swimming along in the 
Caribbean Sea.

The only mermaid in the 
Great Lakes region was repor­
ted by a French fur trader in 
1812. While in camp on the 
north shore of Lake Superior, he 
saw a strange sight—a merman. 
It had the body of a child seven 
or eight years of age, with a 
handsome face, brown skin, and 
wooly hair that he associated

For Wonderful Springtime 
Comfort, The Year Around

NOW- IHTETTTHERM Electric 
HOT WATER HEAT AND 
AIR CONDITIONING 
WITHOUT PLUMBING

WATER AND ANTI-FREEZE SEAL­
ED-IN PERMANENTLY...NE VER 
NEEDS REFILLING. INSTALLED 
PERMANENTLY FOR ENTIRE 
HOMES. APARTMENTS. ETC.
HEALTHIEST- Circulating hot 
water gives you the kind of controll­
ed all-over warmth many doctors 
choose for their own homes, as wall 
as prescribe for their allergic pa­
tients, without the contamination and 
“I*; Patched air that other methods 
of heating give, and without dust or 
dirt blowing around.
SAFEST- piece your filmiest 
^“P*5 nflht over the heater without 
^’••ghtest danger. More important, 
children and pets can't be burned. 
ECONOMICAL- You get bal­
anced. steady warmth even when 
current is turned off. After thermostat 

° •'•cfrlcelement, circulating 
hot water continue' to circulate heat 
for comfortable warmth.

JOHANN, INC.
• Plumbing • Heating

• Air Conditioning 
Sales & Service

Located in St. Michaels, 3 miles 
•ast of Kewaskum on Hwy 28 
Daily 8 5: Fri til 9: Sat til 1

PHONE 
W’Mtl
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BIKE SHOP
Sales & Service

Kewaskum

Phone Collect Oshkosh 233-1010

NELSON FARM
SERVICE

114 Main Street

The Jackaiope was first reported in Wyoming in 1829, but quickly 
moved both east and west. (Illustration by Helen B. Wyman)

626-2781 AFTER 6:00 P M
“Ride a Bike — Stay in Shape”

WALLY’S

Ingredien

Come All
to

See The

Cars and Trucks

SATFRI

SAT. TILL 5

Phene 626-2161

>1 DEALER YOU CAM TRUST"Kewaskum Store Only

128 MAIN ST. 
626-2164

^KEWASKUM
FROZEN FOODS

118 Forest Ave. 626-2710
SPECIALIZING IN CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING, 

PROCESSING AND QUALITY HO MADE SAUSAGES 
Call For Appointment

Big Bologna & Olive Loaf

$1.49 lb
Also Available at

with the black race. He ran for 
his gun but was prevented from 
shooting by the Indian woman 
who was in the party. She called 
the creature, “God of the Water 
and Lakes.’’

BEHRING'S MARKET
Kewaskum 626-2444

Sasquatch and Other 
Apelike Creatures

Throughout history there 
have been reports of ape-like 
creatures that seemed to be a 
missing link in the evolution of 
man or apes. The most con­
vincing evidence that has been 
found are the numerous foot­
prints scattered all the way from 
British Columbia to Northern 
California. Wisconsin has also 
had its own ape-man. Deer 
hunters near Fremont reported 
such a sighting in 1969. Resi­
dents of the Weyerhauser area 
in northern Wisconsin hear 
from time to time the “whist­
ling screams” of a nocturnal 
creature whom they affection­
ately call “The Screecher.”

Summary
These examples of American 

mythical creatures are quite 
different from many of the dra­
gons and werewolf types that 
frequented Europe. Most of the 
American creatures are lovable; 
a few are ferocious but never 
hurt anybody. Most of them 
have been born of the need to 
explain something, and in so 
doing, make a tall tale of it.

The Sasquatch is in a differ­
ent category than the Hodag 
and the Goofus Bird, for its 
identity is believed by many 
people who constantly seek 
evidence of its existence, while 
the Hodag will always be a good 
tall tale about the “lumber- 
woods.”

TOP CASH - GLOVES 
FOR DISABLED OR DEAD 

COWS OR HORSES

Good news!

SAVE 
25%

More walls for less 
money with genuine

Wall-Tex" Wallcovering
You’ll save on Wall-Tex* styles 
and patterns for every room. So 
tome in for a first-rate deal on 
scrubbable, strippoble easy-to- 
hong it-yourself Wall-Tex Wall­
coverings But hurry, our 
sale ends October 15.

Off suggested retail price 
excluding Anniversary Collection

THURS

Come One

Honeck Chevrolet

1979 CHEVROLET

SEPT. 28-29-30
OPEN 9-9

BEAUTY SALON

FREE REFRESHMENTS

Featuring 
Helene Curtis UNIPERMS 

In Savings & Loan Bldg.

HONECK CT
Hwy 45 Kewaskum
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The Kewaskum Fire Department hosted the second annual 
Semi-Quad men's water fight tournament in the village park on 
Sunday, September 17. Ten teams competed in the tournament, 
namely Campbellsport I and II, Batavia, Boitonville, Fillmore, 
Kohisville, Allenton, Newburg, Cedarburg and Kewaskum. 
Campbellsport I won the first place trophy with Cedarburg 2nd, 
Kohisville 3rd and Kewaskum 4th.

Third place Kohisville team.

First place Campbellsport 1 team with Fire chief Joe Thelen. 
Kewaskum chief Augie Bilgo presents the trophy.

Second place Cedarburg team.

The Kewaskum team in action, left to right: Mark Schaefer, Bob 
Stoltzmann, Ron Sarauer, Kelly Rauch and Tom McElhatton.

(Morris Belger photos)
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Kewaskum firemen battling the spinning drum.

The 1928 Seagraves 1000 gallons per minute pumper used for the 
water fights, owned by Glenn Hinz of rural Kewaskum.

Starter Bob Staehler.

J&J AUTO
SERVICE 
Complete 

Automotive Service 
TIRES

BATTERIES 
MUFFLERS 

BRAKES 
MAJOR & MINOR 
ENGINE REPAIR 

IGNITION REPAIR

Front End
Alignment

450E. MAIN. KEWASKUM
PHONE 626-2311

Announcer Don Ehnert.

Chief B>lgo with the “pause that refreshes.”

NOTICE! !
PLEASE FILL OUT CARI) AND DROP OFF AT OUR 
OFFICE OR MAIL TO THE KEWASKUM STATESMAN, 
P.O. BOX 98, KEWASKUM, Wl 53040.
THIS IS REQUIRED TO UP-DATE OUR RECORDS AS PER 
POSTAL REGULATIONS:

Name

Address: Number Street Name

P.O. Box If Applies 
P.O. Box *_----------------------------------------

City Zip Code

Thank You For Your Cooperation.

The Kewaskum Statesman
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V

Regal Names Dramel to New Position

William F. Dramel
Regal Ware, Inc. has named 

William F. Dramel as Product 
Director for the Startler Burglar 
Alarm, in support of the house­
wares company’s diversification

4-H Leaders
Honored for
Service to Youth

The Washington County 4-H 
Leaders Association honored 
several 4-H leaders for their 
service to youth. Mrs. Art 
Terlinden of Allenton was pre­
sented with an award of the 
Emerald Clover for 25 years of 
4-H Leadership. Alvin Beder 
and Mrs. Wolfred Powell of 
Hartford received a diamond 
clover pin for 20 years of 
leadership.

Leaders who had served 15 
years received a pearl clover. 
These included Bob Cross and 
Delores Scheunemann of West 
Bend, Ruth Kern of Allenton, 
John Klesper of Slinger, Rose­
mary Schmitt of Hartford and 
Mrs. Urban Ziemer of Cedar -

Thi 
WIGWAM 

NALL 
Kewaskum 
W2«1

FRIDAY. SEPT 29

SUN BUND
LION

9-1
Adm. 
$250

DON 
PEACHEY

And his Orch.
HOLLYWOOD

Resort
St. Cloud

FRI. OCT. 6
* TOPS IN GOOD TIME 

MUSIC . . . ANO 
YOU'LL LOVE ITI

Darlene Rauh of West Bend, 
Bonnie Schmidt, Lois Schmidt

into the totally new field of 
home security.

This newly created position 
gives Dramel the specific as­
signment of developing the 
marketing and advertising pro­
grams for the alarm and direc­
ting its distribution. He will 
assist all classes of trade in es­
tablishing the Regal name in 
the home security field.

A graduate of Kent State U- 
niversity, Kent, Ohio, and a 
U.S. Army veteran, Dramel 
joined Regal’s Sales Force in 
1963 and received the compa­
ny’s highest sales award in 1968 
when he was named Man of the 
Year. He was named South­
western Regional Sales Mana­
ger and worked out of Dallas, 
Texas, until he came to Ke­
waskum in 1969 as Director of 
the Direct sales division, a 
position he held until this ap­
pointment.

Dramel, his wife and daugh­
ter make their home in West 
Bend.

and Eldon Wulff of Kewaskum.
A 5 year Silver Clover pin was 

presented to Mrs. Sandy Dep­
ies, Ewan Glass, Cheryl Grosso, 
David Hein, Mrs. Hilbert Kert- 
scher, Kathleen Kohlwey, Rob­
ert Kurth, Norvin Lehman, 
Mrs. Nathan Nigh, Mrs. Allen 
Schulz, Mrs. Sandy Semler, 
Mrs. Barbara Shaw, Stanley 
Shaw, Betty Vollrath, Mrs. 
Joseph Werner, Mrs. Jerome 
Wertz, Mrs. Edward Wolf, 
Mrs. Bonnie Yahr and Gordon 
Wilhelmi.

At their annual meeting and 
banquet, new directors were 
elected for 2 year terms. One 
adult and one youth leader is 
elected from each area. Those 
elected from the Kewas­
kum/Wayne area were Joyce 
Harvancik and Billie Jo Clark; 
from the West Bend area, Mrs. 
Jerry Prochnow and Lori Will- 
komm; the Hartford/Slinger ar­
ea, Sue Schmidt and Laurie 
Krantz, and from the German­
town/Jackson area, Mary Lynn 
Prost and Tim Indermuehle. 
The Board of Directors will elect 
officers and appoint committees 
for conducting 4-H activities for 
the coming year.

Dixie Hesler, State Youth

bers on many of their 4-H 
activities right at home. Al­
though there are many oppor­
tunities for 4-H activities away 
from the home, there should 
also be many opportunities pro­
vided by the family for 4-H 
activities in the home.

Ite Old 1i^n^

^/7
“Curves can often add up

burg.
For 10 years of leadership the 

gold clover award was presen­
ted to Delbert Boehlke of Ce­
darburg, Mr. and Mrs. Emil 
Desterhoft of Germantown, 
Mrs. Laverne Doll and Mrs.

Development Specialist, ad­
dressed the group with the 
theme “Family 4- 4-H = Fun 
and Learning.” She pointed our 
many ways in which parents 
and others in the family can 
work together with 4-H mem­

Rock-n-Roll

DANCE
Prologue

Celebrating Their 1st Birthday

Hitching Post — Kohlsville

SUNDAY, OCT. 1
8:00—1:30

$1.00 ADMISSION

FREE BEER

BARN DANCE
William Thull Farm No.3

Forestview Road
V4 Mile South of Hwy. 28 

St. Michaels, Wl

FRIDAY, OCT. 6
8:30 — 12:30

Music by the

Bill Thull
Recording Orchestra

LIVE RADIO BROADCAST
WTKM - Hartford

Send in your pictures to the „
Statesman. No charge. to triangles.

[glacier INN I
’ Iff MAIN ST. KEWASKUM |

| Starting October 1 A 

• OPEN SUNDAYS I 
. Serving 3:30 p.m. -10:00 p.m. I I Tues. - Sat. Open 4:00 p.m. | 
| Serving 5:00 p.m. -10:00 p.m. | 

| SPECIALS |
(WED-THURS. FRIDAY ’

Bar-B-Q Lake Perch I
I Spareribs Baby Walleye A
| sat. - SUN. Rainbow Trout ।
I Prime Rib Haddock T

V Also Serving a Complete Menu | 
| Of Fine Food Daily a

(Family Style Dinners Available ’
For Parties or Banquets |

| For Reservations Call 626-2711 A

I CLOSED MONDAYS A
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Kewaskum High School wel­

comes nine new faculty mem­
bers this year. Here is a brief 
look at each.

Miss Linda Bullette, a grad­
uate of KHS, has returned to 
take over the Spanish depart­
ment. She is the advisor of 
Spanish Club and also helps in 
the AFS Club. Miss Bullette 
graduated from Marquette Uni­
versity where she taught while 
attending school. She is also an 
undergraduate of UW-White- 
water. She likes to read in her 
free time and also enjoys run­
ning.

Mr. Kevin Chambers is a 
graduate of the University of 
Wisconsin in Green Bay. His 
majors include English and 
journalism, the areas he is 
presently teaching at KHS. He 
enjoys all sports and was a 
member of the Green Bay 
Rugby Club for four years. He 
will also be the assistant wrest­
ling coach.

Mrs. Judy Jacak, being from 
Allenton, is familiar with the 
Kewaskum area. She teaches 
English, which she majored in 
at the University of Wisconsin 
in Madison. Her teaching ex­
perience includes six years at 
Mayville High School. She en­
joys reading biking, cooking 
and playing the piano.

Mrs. Bonnie Klitzkie, a re- 
vious substitute at KHS, L . ow 
a part time teacher of the typing 
and business classes. She also 
taught four years at Clinton, 
Wisconsin, and two years at 
Kickapoo Viola. Her hobbies 
include reading and crocheting.

Miss Mary Lawson, native of 
Chatfield, Minnesota, is the 
new physical education teacher. 
This is her first year teaching 
after interning at Germantown 
Washington High School. She is 
a graduate of UW-LaCrosse 
where she played tennis and 
badminton for four years. She 
coaches volleyball and track and 
in her free time she enjoys 
biking, cross country skiing, 
running and tennis.

Mr. Dave Rizzardi is the new 
agriculture, welding and power 
mechanics teacher. He interned 
at Mishicot High School after

graduating from UW-Madison 
where he majored in Agricul­
tural Education. Mr. Rizzardi is 
also FFA Advisor. He enjoys 
various athletics and was a 
member of the Manitowoc 
Chiefs soccer team.

Miss Joanne Vogt is quite 
familiar with the Kewaskum 
area because she is a graduate 
from Slinger High School pres­
ently living in Allenton. She 
graduated from UW-Whitewa- 
ter, this being her first teaching 
job after interning at Menomo­
nee Falls North. The classes she 
teaches are clerical office prac­
tice, shorthand and typing II. 
Miss Vogt is also FBLA Advi­
sor.

Miss Susan Schreier is the 
new sophomore English and

College Prep, and Com. Teach­
er. She is a graduate from the 
UW-Madison where she ma­
jored in English. She interned 
at Marquette Middle School in 
Madison and also taught three 
years at Wild Rose, Wisconsin. 
Miss Schreier is also the advisor 
of the forensics club. In her free 
time she enjoys refinishing old 
furniture, skiing and plants.

Miss Jill Jirus teaches art 
both at KHS and Kewaskum 
Elementary School. Her classes 
consist of Art I at the high 
school and the upper grades of 
the elementary school. Miss 
Jirus is a graduate from Beloit 
College and she interned in 
England for three months. In 
her spare time she likes to 
travel.

Boss-To pretty, young ap- 
plicant--so you want a job? 
Had any experience?

Applicant-Oh, some very 
wonderful ones!

Walk, dance, bicycle, play 
handball, exercise regularly. 
Use your legs to help your 
heart. Ask your doctor for 
advice on what kind of exercise 
program is right for you.

WIGWAM
Kewaskum. Wis.

Fabulous!!

Phone 
626-2901

All You Can Eat 
SMORGASBORD 
featuring

King Crab, Broiled Sirloin, 
Bar B Q Ribs, Baby Beef Liver 
Fried Chicken, Baked Ham, 
Walleyed Pike, Fresh Shrimp, 
With All the Trimmings.

SUNDAY NOON
10:30 — 1:30

$3.95

Serving from 4:30 p.m.

MON.-WED.-THURS 
$4.95

FRL-SAT.-SUN.

$5.95

CLOSED TUESDAY

154 W. MAIN ST , CAMPBELLSPORT, Wl

EVERY THURSDAY NIGHT ! ! !
PAT’S SPECIAL WILL BE . . .

SAUERBRATEN, SERVED WITH 
BRAISED RED CABBAGE 
AND POTATO DUMPLINGS

PORK SHANKS & SAUERKRAUT 
W/WHIPPED POTATOES OR 
POTATO DUMPLINGS

325

295

NEW. TUESDAY SPECIAL!! 
(ALL YOU CAN EAT)

SPAGHETTI AND MEATBALLS, 
ITALIAN DINNER SALAD & 
GARLIC BREAD FOR JUST . . . 295
AND With Pat's Compliments . . .

A GLASS OF CHIANTI WINE.

PHONE 533-4021

Don’t Forget — Call For Take-Outs

DINNERS SERVED — 5 to 10 p.m.

«BWOW««X3«3»3W«3«XXXX3»X^’<^^

LIVE MUSIC
Every Saturday Night

AT

Weinreich’s Recreation
FILLMORE

9:00 — 1:00

Sat., Sept. 30 — The Mountaineers
\ Sat., Oct. 7 — Bill Sackett Trio

NEVER A COVER OR ADMISSION CHARGE 
AT WEINREICH’S IN FILLMORE

»»W«»»i»S3^»»%%^%3S3S»3L3»3KX»^^

SUNDAY BUFFET
SUNDAY, OCTOBER 1, 1978

Our Sunday Buffet Featuring: Turkey Ala King in 
a Potato Basket, Baked Stuffed Pork Chops, Roast 
Round of Beef Au Jus, Plus Our Salad Bar and lea 
Cream for

I Wednesday Specials
WEDNESDAY NOON, OCTOBER 4

Corned Beef and Cabbage Special.
Includes: Buttered Carrots, Irish Potato, Roll, and 

g Beverage for '

2.95
WEDNESDAY EVENING, OCTOBER 4
Prime Rib Special.
Includes: Lazy Susan, Soup, Salad, Potato, Bread 

£ and Beverage for

5.25
OCTOBER MUSIC SCHEDULE —
October 6 & 7
October 13 & 14
October 20 & 21
October 27 & 28

Two Hits and a Miss-
Evergreen
Doug Anscheutz
Northerly Winds

cwaetoT
owMnnr cum

LIVE ORGAN
DINNER MUSIC

Hwy. 67 Just One Mile 
E. of Hwy. 41, Lomira 
Phone 269-4331

NOON TiL 2 P.M. 
and 5 P.M. TIL 8 P.M.

Vjty/>>xz>>^oy>*4^
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Carol Proeber
Delegate to 4-H
Dairy Conference

Carol Proeber of Washington 
County will represent Wiscon­
sin as a delegate to the 24th 
annual National 4-H Dairy Con­
ference October 4-6 in Madison, 
according to Hob Stodola, 
Washington County 4-H and 
Youth Agent.

Carol, 5036 Hwy. I), West 
Bend, is a member of the Good 
Luck 4-H club.

Former U.S. Olympic star 
Jesse Owens will address the 
175 delegates and 30 leaders on 
opening night for the second 
year in a row.

Crawford County 4-H agent 
Ken Johnson and 4-H leaders 
Mr and Mrs. Joie Skarda will

represent Wisconsin 4-H lea­
ders at the conference.

Delegates are selected to 
attend the conference for their 
activities in 4-H dairy projects 
and are awarded expense paid 
trips to the conference by state 
dairy industry and breed or­
ganizations.

During the conference dele­
gates will meet with dairy and 
breed scientists and industry 
representatives to discuss dairy 
management and marketing 
and learn about careers in the 
dairy industry.

The event gives the dairy 
industry a chance to meet with 
future dairy leaders and offer 
4-H youth the chance to develop 
initiative and competence in 
their own special interests in 
the dairy field, according to 
University of Wisconsin-Exten- 
sion youth development special-

ist Norman Everson.
Delegates will also tour the 

World Dairy Expo and visit 
nearby dairy operations.

The conference is sponsored 
by the dairy industry, the 
National 4-H Council, the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture and 
cooperating state extension ser­
vices.

Campus Notes
Geralyn Thull of Kewaskum 

has enrolled as a freshman at 
Viterbo College, La Crosse.

This year’s orientation for 
Viterbo freshmen includes au­
ditions for Viterbo Concert 
Choir and Chamber Singers, a 
movie, a welcome picnic, and

various orientation seminars 
through which students can be­
come acquainted with other 
freshmen and learn more about 
the Viterbo College community.

Viterbo is a four-year, co­
educational Christian, liberal 
arts college located in La 
Crosse, Wisconsin. Present en­
rollment at the college is 950.

CARPET - UPHOLSTERY
Cleaning Service
Professional
Deep Steam* Extraction
No Soap Residue, Fast Drying 
Safe and Gentle for All Fibers 
Ask About Our
Carpet Protection Treatment

FREE ESTIMATES 
Residential - Commercial

Call 338-0783 Anytime

Syl’s Carpet & Upholstery Cleaning Svc. j 
' ^^r^^^^^^^^^^o^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^4^^

SERVICE

INSULATE NOW
and SAVE!
KETTLE MORAINE INSULATION

For side walls and attics 
of New and Old Homes

I

GUAHANTEED SATISFACTION
•CARPET* VINYL 

• DRAPERIES • WALLPAPER

K‘R CARPET SERVICE INC.
"the complete store

2HMAINST HWASWM 626 2181

FRESH FRUITS 
and VEGETABLES

Onions — 3 lbs. 57c
McIntosh Apples — 3 lbs. 39c

Tomatoes — 5 lb. $1.00
$4.50 bu.

Home Grown Canteloupe

PUMPKINS

APPLES

PICK YOUR OWN TOMATOES
$2.50 bu.

BRING YOUR OWN CONTAINERS

Bartoli's Produce
Open Monday thru Friday 8:39 a m. 8:30 p.m. 

Saturday ft Sunday 8:30 a m. 5:90 p.m.

Located 4 miles North of Kewaskum 
on Highway "V"

PHONE 533-409 2

WE DO NOT USE 
ANY SULPHATES 

OR SALTS

• WE MAKE OUR OWN 
INSULATION AND OUR 
PLANT IS ALWAYS OPEN 
FOR YOUR INSPECTION

• OUR PLANT IS UNDER 
REGULAR U.L.
INSPECTION

• YOU CAN DEPEND ON 
OUR NUMBER ONE 
INSULATION

WELL DO IT FOR 
YOU OR DO n 

YOURSELF WITH 
OUR EQUIPMENT

'If you're too cold in the winter ... or too hot in the 
summertime ... let us insu/ate your home!"

Be Sure The Insulation 
You Put In Your Home

UNDERWRITERS LABORATORIES INC.®
CLASSIFIED

LOOSE FILL MATERIAL

Contents Not Over 30 Lbs.

FIRE HAZARD CLASSIFICATION 
(Based on 100 for Untreated Red Oak)

Flame Spread 
Fuel Contributed 
Smoke Developed

2.4 PCF DENSITY
25 
0
10

See U.L. Classified Building Materials Directory

LISTED

WHY 
TAKE

CHANCE

90 DAYS SAME AS CASH

Kettle Moraine Electric
1261 Fond du Lac Ave. • Kewaskum

FORA FREE ESTIMATE CALL: 626-2093
OPEN Monday and Friday until 9; Others 8-5:30



Kewaskum Statesman, Friday, Sept. 29, 1978, Page 15Otto Kofler, 
Louis Koenig 
Called in Death

Otto F. Kofler, 72, of 126 
North Avenue, Kewaskum, died 
Friday, September 22, at Sc. 
Joseph’s Community Hospital, 
West Bend.

He was horn February 2, 
1906, in Austria and married 
Adina Glasel in Dubuque, Iowa, 
November 13, 1936. After their 
marriage they lived in Milwau­
kee, in Silver Creek for 20 
years, and in Kewaskum for the 
past nine years.

He was orchard manager for 
Apple Lane in Belgium, Wis.

Survivors include his wife; 
two children, James (Vivian) of 
Milwaukee and Carol (Darwin) 
Frank of West Bend; six grand­
children; three sisters, Grace 
(Raymond) Truttchel of Oak­
field, Mrs. Elsie Lickington of 
Kelso, Ore. and Olga (Frank) 
Geadeke of Milwaukee; three 
brothers, Ernest (Dorothy) of 
Sun City, Ariz., Walter (Betty) 
of Watertown and William, and 
other relatives and friends.

Funeral services were Mon­
day at 2 p.m. at the Techtman- 
Myrhum Funeral Home, West 
Bend. Pastor William Lauter­
bach officiated and burial was in 
Washington County Memorial 
Park.

LOUIS C KOENIG
Louis C. Koenig, of First 

Street. Waubeka, died Satur­
day. September 23, at his 
residence, at the age of 85.

He was born January 3, 1893, 
in Little Rock. Arkansas. On 
August 30. 1912, he married 
Ola Strean in St. James. Minn­
esota. After their marriage they 
moved to the Kewaskum area 
where they took up farming. 
After his retirement they moved 
to their present home.

Survivors include his wife; six 
children. Mildred Johnson of 
Las Alamos, N.M., Marvin 
(Delores) of West Bend. Ruth 
(Sylvester) Campbell of Kewas­
kum. lone (Frank) Herriges of 
West Bend, Doris (Joe) Lhotka 
of Burlington, Wis., Louis 
(Lucy) of Wittenberg. Wis.; 30

Sales & Service
John Deere

Tractors, Riders, Snowmobiles 
Arctic Cat 

Snowmobiles & Accessories
Lawn Boy Mowers 
Jacobsen Mowers
Toro Mowers & Nylon Line 
Trimmers

Spirit Outboard Motors 
Blue Fin Fishing Boats 
Heavy Hauler Trailers 
Homelite Chainsaws 
Atlas Lawn Mowers 
Green Machine Weedeaters 
Ariens Tractors & Riders 
Ariens Rear & Front Tine
Tillers

STORE HOURS
Mon. & Fri. till 9 p.m.

Tues. Wed. Thurs. till 5 p.m.
Sat. till 3; Closed Sun. 

SHOP HOURS
8 to 5 Daily, Closed Sat.

Laubenstein |

Rt. 3, Kewaskum 
Phone 626-2553

grandchildren; 15 great-grand­
children, and other relatives 
and friends.

One son, Walter, preceded 
him in death.

He was a member of King­
dom Hall of Jehovah’s Wit­
nesses.

1 uneral services were held 
Monday at 7:30 p.m. at the 
Techtman-Myrhum Funeral 
Home, West Bend. Mr. Ronald 
Ziegler of Burlington officiated 
and burial was in Newark

Cemetery, West Bend.
Visitation at the funeral home 

was Monday after 2 p.m.

FIREMEN TO MEET
The regular monthly meeting 

of the Kewaskum Fire Depart­
ment will be held at the fire 
station at 7:30 p.m. Thursday, 
October 5. 317 N. Railrood St., Campbellsport, Wl 53010

KAREN ond BILL 
BREITZMAN

Phone 533-8094
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KEWASKUM’S AFS STUDENTS

Jorge Cazal Edgardo Carranzo

Jorge Cazal, AFS exchange 
student from Paraguay, South 
America, is staying with the 
Richard Schilter family, Mid­
land Drive, Allenton. He is 
attending Kewaskum High 
School with his American broth­
er, Henry, who is currently a 
junior. He likes to be called by 
his nickname "Koki.”

Jorge is from Asuncion, the 
capital of Paraguay. Asuncion 
has about 500,000 people and 
he says the* buildings are not as 
large as Milwaukee’s. Tem­
peratures range from 35 de­
grees F to 100 degrees F. They 
get very little snow. Paraguay 
shares borders with Brazil, Ar­
gentine and Boliva.

Jorge is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Pedro Cazal and has one 
brother, Francisco. His father 
works in a soap factory and his 
mother is a housewife.

In Paraguay, Jorge attends 
the ColegionNacional de la Cap­
ital, an all boys school with 
3,600 students. School starts in 
March and runs until November 
which is their winter. The 
school day starts at 7:00 a.m. 
and ends at 11:30 a m. Jorge 
said the difference in schools 
was a big surprise. Here the 
students go from classroom to 
classroom but in his country the 
teachers change rooms.

I'he majority of the people are 
mestizo. The government is 
Democratic with their President 
being General Alfredo Stroes- 
ner. They must be 18 to vote 
and to acquire a driver's li­
cense. The official language is 
Spanish and people also speak 
English and Guarani, an Indian 
language. The money unit is 
Guarani; (126guarani = $1.00).

.Asuncion manufactures shoes 
textiles, and has a Coca-Cola 
plant In rural areas they raise 

•cows, horses, pigs, and grow 
watermelon, oranges, manda­
rins and bananas.

Paraguay has professional 
basketball, soccer and volley­

ball teams. Jorge enjoys bas­
ketball and volleyball the most.

For recreational pleasure he 
likes fishing a large fish called 
the Surubi. He likes to read best 
sellers and go to movies, which 
include many American films. 
He collects stamps and likes to 
listen to music. His favorite 
American groups are Kansas 
and Boston, also a famous 
Paraguayan group called “Af­
termad's'' which have appeared 
in concerts and TV in the United 
States.

Two favorite dances in their 
country are the Paraguay Polka, 
which is similar to our polka, 
and the Guarania, a slow dance. 
Discotheques are popular with 

the young people. He likes 
playing his guitar and Para­
guayan harp.

Hamburgers and pizza are his 
favorite American foods. His 
native food favorites are chipa- 
guazu (corn pudding) and sopa 
paraguaya.

On his return to Paraguay, he 
will attend college to study civil 
engineering.

AFS student, Edgardo Car­
ranzo from El Salvador, is 
staying with his American fam­
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Norbert Dett- 
mann of Bolton Drive, Kewas­
kum. Edgardo is attending Ke­
waskum High School with host 
brother John, a senior, and 
Julie, a freshman.

El Salvador, Central Ameri­
ca, borders with Honduras, 
Guatemala, and the Pacific 
Ocean temperature ranges from 
77 degrees F to 90 degrees F. It 
has many lakes and mountains 
but due to the temperature 
Edgardo has never seen snow. 
The population of El Salvador is 
larger than Milwaukee.

Edgardo s home town is San 
Vincente where he lives with his 
mother. Juana, and sisters Elsa 
and Griselda. His mother owns 
a store in which she sells food, 
vegetables, clothes and medi­

cine.
Edgardo attends a Technical 

Institute in San Salvador (the 
capital) at which time he lives 
with his aunt and uncle. Schools 
consist of six years of elemen­
tary education and three years 
of high school. After Edgardo 
returns to El Salvador, he will 
attend a college to study elec­
trical engineering. Their winter 
from February to October is also 
their school year. The day starts 
at 7:00 a.m. and ends at 3:00 
p.m. He said the school’s are 
similar except that in his coun­
try there aren’t any study halls.

President Romero leads the 
Democratic government of El 
Salvador. The monetary unit of 
the country is a colon; (2.50 
colons = $1.00). The majority 
of the people are mestizo. The 
United States and Japan have 
built industries in El Salvador. 
Textiles, shoes and Coca-Cola 
are manufactured.

The rural areas raise cows, 
cucumbers, watermelon, pump­
kin, fruit trees, balsum, coconut 
and medicinal trees. Pine trees 
are grown only in large cities in 
the wealthy areas. He said you 
can start driving at any age, but 
there isn’t much need for a car.

El Salvador has basketball 
and futbol (soccer) as the coun­
tries professional sports. Ed­
gardo enjoys soccer, swimming, 
baseball, track and running.

In his spare time he likes to 
collect stamps, read science 
fiction, fish, hunt, camp and 
enjoys music. The Country’s 
famous musical group is Her- 
manos Flores. (Flower Broth­
ers). He speaks Spanish, Eng­
lish and Japanese.

He said that every house in 
San Salvador has cats and dogs 
but his favorite is the horse.

Edgardo would like to go to 
Japan and study electrical engi­
neering. He also wishes to 
return to the United States 
some day.

Our “Sure-to-Bloom" bulbs 
have just arrived from Holland. 
Tulips, Hyacinths, Daffodils, and many others.

Four Pound Bag 
BONE MEAL 99«

WITH $5.00 PURCHASE OF BULBS!

FLOWER EE^U^' ^JiaWe. 
OWED ^Arrangements f 
Powers and *

Available-

Your
Lown &

Year 'Round
Gorden Center

Schute's Greenhouse

Garden Center
Highway 45 South „ 

KEWASKUM ^h* ^^^a
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KEWASKUM COMMUNITY 

SCHOOLS
Menus for week of October 

2-6:
Monday — Foot long hot 

dogs on a bun, pickles, apple­
sauce, cheese sticks, pineapple 
chunks and cupcake.

Tuesday — Meat loaf, baked 
potatoes, buttered peas, peanut 
butter and cake.

Wednesday — Hot turkey on 
a bun, sweet potatoes, cran­
berries, peanut butter and 
pears.

Thursday — Grilled cheese

sandwich, chicken noodle soup, 
fish crackers, peanut butter, 
relishes, fruit cocktail and a 
brownie.

Friday — Fish on a bun, 
cheese, potato rounds, peaches 
and cookie.

Each meal served with bread, 
butter and/or margarine and 
mi'k.

Menus are subject to change.
HOLY TRINITY SCHOOL

Menus for week of October 
2-6.

Monday — Beef casserole, 
buttered peas, carrot coins, 
bread and butter, ice cream 
cup and milk.

Tuesday — Hot beet sand­
wich, yellow beans, red beets, 
cake with cream and milk.

Wednesday — Meatballs 
with gravy, whipped potatoes, 
corn, peaches, muffin with but­
ter cubes and milk.

Thursday — Pizza burger, 
cheese slice, potato stixs, finger 
food, pear halves and milk.

Friday — Battered fish, 
French fries, cabbage salad, 
apple slices, jello and milk.

WAYNE CRUSADERS 
4 H CLUB NEWS

Our meeting was brought to 
order September 5 by President 
Darwin Schulz. October 3 is 
Parents’ Night. The time is 7:45 
p.m. All new members are wel­
come. We meet in the Wayne 
Elementary School gym. All 
members are to bring an article 
from the fair for display.

On Wednesday, October 25,

we are having a Halloween 
party from 7:30 to 9:00 p.m. 
You are to wear a costume.

We are having a paper drive 
October 21-28. The truck will be 
parked in the Wayne Elemen­
tary School parking lot.

The refreshment committee 
for next month is the Schmidt, 
Garman and Miklas families.

Reporter, Shelly Sekas

Meet the Men of

AUTO CRAFT

Dan Berres. Owner Tom Walters Lynn Voigt Mere Dalton Ralph SeafeM
West Bend West Bend Campbellsport West Bend Kewaskum

1 [ These trained men are dedicated to building a business on professional work, 
’; fast service and friendliness that you as our customer deserve.

This is why we proudly say:
PICK YOUR BODY SHOP BEFORE WE MEET BY ACCIDENT

Take Hwy 45 south of Kewaskum four mile* to Trap Shoot Lana.
(rood to West Bend Sportsmen's Club) 

or call 338-0379
^+++++++—**—+——+**——***++++—+—*——++—+————+*—***'*—<

More Gas Heat
Per ja_

GOOD-YEAR For More Good Years 
In Your Car

Dollar! I

RAIN TIRE
SUN TIRE 
ONE TIRE

The
super-efficient

LENNOX

gas furnace.

Electronic ignition and Heatsaver flue 
damper make this the most efficient gas 
furnace yet. Exclusive DURACURVE” heat 
exchanger provides extra quiet, extra de­
pendable operation. Built for lasting com­
fort.

LENNOX DURAGLASS® II

Prolongs Service Life
This special glass coating adds years to heat 
exchanger life. Protects against moisture and 
corrosion. Gives you an added dimension of 
efficiency.

Don't Settle for Less! Call for a free home 
estimate:

JOHANN, INC.
• Plumbing • Heating • Air Conditioning

SALES AND SERVICE
Phone 334-9481

Located in St Michaels. 3 miles 
east of Kewaskum on Hwy 28

Daily 8 5, Fri. 'til 9; Sat. 'til 1

your

BANK AM [RICARD
weteome

ER7814 
FR78 14 
GR78 14
HR78 14
FR78 15
GR78 15
HR78 15

Timm ha O"**^ I IVinilV Belted Radial
Amazing All-Traction (read!
Hi,n- < .ill the traction you're likely Io need on atmovl any road, in almost 
•mi weather As a rain tire Tiempo has a well-grooved tread designed io resist 
hvdroplantng As a tire for slick pavement, Tiempo gives you 10,00(1 hard­
working tread edges lor traction As a sun tire. Tiempo gives you handling 
that s Inn. plus the stamina of steel belts and radial construction gives a divi­
dend in gas saving economy There * even n scuff bar to help keep whitewall* 
white Tiempo It's a lot of tire for the money1

156 SO 
$61 50 
$65 00 
$69 00 
*63 50 
*66 50 
♦71 50

p195'75R14 
P7O5 75R14 
P.'T 75R14 
P225 75R14 
P205 75R15 
P. 15 75R15 
P225 75R15 
P235/75R15 LR78 151*77 00

RAIN CHECK if we sen out of your sue we will issue you a ram check assuring future delivery at the advertised price

We Also Have Multi-Mile Snow Tires at Fleet Prices 

ROGER & DAN’S AUTO SERVICE, INC.
PHONE 626-2888 KEWASKUM, WI.

Winterize NOW With .. .

BLAZE INSULATION
Before the rush begins, toke 
advantage of our Low Over­
head and Low Costs!!

• Featuring Nu-Wool
UL class 1
FIRE RETARDENT

For Free Estimates on 
Attics and Sidewalls

CALL:
KIM RODENKIRCH

Phone 626-8007 
Kewaskum, WI 53040
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WMV ADS
TOWN OF SCOTT RUMMAGE 
SALE — Saturday, Sept. 30, 
Beechwood Fire Hall, one day 
only, 8-5. 9-22-27

RUMMAGE SALE - Sept. 28 
& 29, 9:00-4.00 at 813 Pleasant- 
wood, Kewaskum. Clothes-in- 
fants to adults, ski sweaters, 
dishes and miscellaneous.

IMMEDIATE HELP WANTED 
— Full or part time. Hours are 
very flexible. Wulff’s Landsca­
ping. Phone 626-4820 9-29-2tp 
FOR RENT — One bedroom 
upstairs apartment available 
Oct. 1. Adults only, no pets. 
Phone 626-2473.______ 9-29-Up
FOR RENT — Store in Camp­
bellsport with air conditioning. 
Phone 692-9233._______ 9-29-It
FOR SALE — 20 acres standing 
corn for silage, also Gehl blower 
with pipes. Phone 533-8048.

9-29-It
FOR SALE — Apples. McIntosh 
and other varieties. Allen 
Schoofs, 1*4 miles west of Ke­
waskum on Hwy. 28. Phone 
626-2531. During the week after 
three, weekends all day. 9-29-2t
FOR SALE - '73 Dodge Cor­
net, 318 station wagon, $1,500. 
Phone 626-4088. 9-29-2t
FOR SALE — 60 ft. used Palco 
wood hand hewn beams, 4” x 
6". Phone 626-2992. 9-29-ltp
FOR SALE — 3 bedroom home 
on Third Street in Kewaskum, 
immediate occupancy. Call 626- 
2392 or 626-2030. $49,900.

9-29-It
FOR SALE — 3 men's snow­
mobile suits, sizes medium, 
large and extra large. Phone 
626-4357 weekends only 9-29-2t
FOR SALE - 1973 Nova Cus­
tom Hatchback, very clean. 
Phone 626-4515 or 334-4668.

9-29-2t
WILL DO BABYSITTING - In 
my home in Kewaskum. Day 
shift . Phone 626-4162 9-29-4t

353. Two-story, nicely re­
modeled older home in Camp 
bellsport. 3 bedrooms, 1*4 
baths, large kitchen, family 
room, 4-car garage, quiet 
street with large lot. Low, 
low taxes. $43,500.
375. Brand new ranch home. 
Three bedrooms, large coun­
try kitchen, 12 X 20 living 
room, well insulated, eco­
nomical gas heat. Make an 
offer today and choose your 
own carpeting Qualifies for 
state V.A. $49,900.

377. Two story duplex. 3 
bedrooms, living room, kit­
chen and bath upstairs. The 
vast improvements make this 
home like new again. Low 
taxes Great starter home; 
tenants can help with pay­
ments. Located in Kewas­
kum. $58,900,
356. Approximately 3 acres 
with building site. Restful 
view! Kewaskum School Dis­
trict $12,000

WEST GROVE REALTY. INC.
548 So. Main, West Bend

334-5589

BY OWNER - Kewaskum. 
Beautiful spacious two bedroom 
ranch home on large lot. Upper 
40 s. Call 626-2350 9-15-lt
WORK WANTED - General 
handyman. No job too small. 
Repairs, remodeling, carpentry, 
tile, paint, wallpaper, etc. Lloyd 
M. Ebert, Phone 626-2014.

9-8-4t

HELP WANTED - Part-time 
secretary for general office 
work. Some bookkeeping know­
ledge necessary. Phone 626- 
2432. 9-22-lt

HELP WANTED - Full or part 
time. Apply in person at Kettle 
Moraine Electric. 1261 Fond du 
Lac Ave., Kewaskum. 9-1-tf

HELP WANTED - Mechanic. 
Must have tools. West Bend El­
evator, Co. Trk. D & 45. Phone 
334-5877 9-22-2t
HELP WANTED - Full or part 
time. A & W Restaurant. Apply 
in person. 9-22-tf
FOR SALE — Potatoes and 
apples. Paul Pamperin, Phone 
629-5267 or 629-5092. 8-25-tf

FLITTERS
CARPET CLEANING 

-Free Estimates-
Roger Flitter Ph. 533-4954 

SERVICES OFFERED - Small 
engines, motorcycle, snowmo­
bile, lawn and garden equip­
ment and outboard repair. 
Ked-Web of Kewaskum. 1204 
Fond du Lac Ave. Phone 626- 
4344. tf

FOR SALE — 100 acre farm 
with house and buildings in 
Town of Farmington, Wash­
ington County. Can be split 40 
acres and buildings and 60 
acres of land. By sealed bids to 
be received at Valley Bank not 
later than Oct. 20, 1978. Seller 
reserves right to accept or reject 
all offers. For further informa­
tion. call 626-2171 Monday thru 
Friday, 9 a.m. to 5 p.m.

Valley Bank
Personal Representative 
Willard Liepert, Estate

9-22-2t

Here’s a unique property! Originally used as a cheese 
factory. Living quarters above consist of 3 bedrooms, living 
room, kitchen and full bath. The lower level has loads of 
space for whatever you have in mind. There’s also a 1 car 
garage. Many extras included. Three miles north of ( amp 
bellsport............... ......................................................... 524 000

THE Keppler Agency1Nc
2311 W. Washington 
West Bend, WI

BUY and SELL with
BOWE A WENINGER 

REALTY, INC.
West Bend 334-7841 !

NORBERT ROHLINGER BROKER SALES PHONE 626 2332 ! [

ACTION ¥- SATISFACTION ।
MAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAAMWMMA^^M^mAMV^A *

LEN LUTERBACH CONTRAC­
TOR — Mason, cement, car­
pentry, trenching and bulldo­
zing. Quality work at competi­
tive prices. Your authorized 
dealer of the world famous Hall­
mark in-ground swimming 
pools. For free estimate, call 
338-3305 or 692-9233 collect.

9-8-tf

HIGHEST PRICES paid for old 
newspapers, copper, brass, a- 
luminum, lead and batteries. 
Lynn’s Waste Paper Co., 121 
Island Ave., West Bend, Wis. tf

PUBLIC NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given 

that the next meeting of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wiscon­
sin, Village Board is scheduled 
for Monday evening, October 2, 
1978, at 8:00 P.M. in the 
Council Room of the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street.

The agendas for meetings are 
prepared as of Wednesday noon 
preceding the meeting and are 
available at the office of the 
clerk at the Municipal Building 
on Thursday preceding the 
meeting.

Copies of the agenda are also 
posted in the lobby of the Ke­
waskum Post Office and in the 
lobby of the Valley Bank.

William Martin, Clerk

CARD OF THANKS
We sincerely wish to thank all 

of our friends, relatives and 
neighbors for the many kind­
nesses shown to us throughout 
his illness and in our recent 
bereavement, the loss of our 
beloved husband and father, 
JEROME SCHMIDT. We es­
pecially wish to thank the Rev. 
Wm. Stuebs, doctors and staff 
at Plymouth Hospital, the La­
dies Aid Society of Trinity Lu­
theran Church, Dundee, the 
organist, the pallbearers, the 
Wittkopp Funeral Service and 
those who sent food, flowers or 
memorials.

Mrs. Jerome Schmidt 
Kurt and LuAnn

SCHULZ
REAL ESTATE CORP. 

Brokers —Builder* 
MONICA SCHULZ, Broker

JAMES SCHULZ, Builder 
2395 W Washington, West Bend

PHONE 335-6106

338-2118
533-8893

COZY little SALT BOX on a country road just minutes from 
town. This easy-to-live in home offers a large living room, 
family room with Ben Franklin, 3-4 bedrooms plus a first floor 
laundry. This charming home is situated on over 1 acre of 
Kettle Moraine land. Mid $ 40’s.

THE NATL RAL INSTINCT is to own a home of your own, and 
if superior construction is your bag, this is it! The convenient 
kitchen affords everything a homemaker longs for, 3 good 
sized bedrooms—ample closet space. In quiet subdivision, 
close to shopping. Mid $ 40’s.

WE DO HAVE listings in other areas, call for information.
WE HAVE many different building plans to choose from. 
W hy not sit down with HFK Builders and work out your new 
home.

334-7411
141 N MAIN ST./WEST BEND/WI /53095 

DAN QQUITER___FORREST FRANK

State of Wisconsin 
Washington County 
Circuit Court 
Probate Branch

ORDER LIMITING TIME 
FOR FILING CLAIMS 

(ON WAIVER I
AND DETERMINATION 

OF HEIRSHIP
IN THE MATTER OF THE 

ESTATE OF ALVINA WES­
TERMAN, Deceased.

A petition for administration 
of the estate and determination 
of heirship of Alvina Wester­
man, Washington County, Wis­
consin, post office address 608 
Main Street, Kewaskum, Wis­
consin 53040, having been filed;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. Creditor’s claims must be 

filed on or before December 12, 
1978, or be barred;

2. Heirship will be deter­
mined and claims will be exam­
ined and adjusted on December 
19, 1978, at the Washington 
County Courthouse, in West 
Bend, Wisconsin at the opening 
of Court or thereafter.
Dated September 12, 1978

By the Court, 
James B. Schwalbach 
Circuit Judge

McKENNA & KIEFER 
Attorney
114 Main Street
P. O. Box 550
Kewaskum, Wisconsin 53040

CARD OF THANKS
We sincerely wish to thank 

our relatives and friends for 
their kindness shown us during 
our recent bereavement, the 
death of our dear wife and 
mother, JUDITH SEEFELDT. 
Special thanks to Pastor Hoen- 
ecke, organist, singers, pall­
bearers, drivers, Ladies Aid 
who served, donors of floral and 
memorial tributes, ambulance 
attendants, Miller's Funeral 
Home, traffic officer, custodian, 
all who showed their repect and 
helped us in any way.

Merlin Seefeldt and Family

State of Wisconsin 
Washington County 
Circuit Court 
Probate Branch

INFORMAL 
ADMINISTRATION

ORDER SETTING TIME AND
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

IN THE MATTER OF THE 
ESTATE OF MELVIN 
SCHAUB, Deceased.

An application for Informal 
Administration of the Estate of 
Melvin Schaub, Washington 
County, Wisconsin, post office 
address 348 Third Street, Ke­
waskum, Wisconsin 53040, hav­
ing been filed with the Probate 
Registrar;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
All creditors’ claims must be 

filed on or before December 18, 
1978, or be barred;
Dated September 18, 1978

Lucille A. Prohaska 
Probate Registrar

SCHLOEMER, SCHLAEFER, 
ALDERSON, HICKMANN, 
SEEFELDT & SPELLA, S.C.
Attorneys
Corner Sixth and Hickory
West Bend, Wisconsin 53095

9-22-3t

Your best 
new home 

opportunity.

Welcome Home.
KEWASKUM

REALTY
Free Catalog

338-8500
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Regal Announces Realignment in General Services Areas

Michael B. Kardos
Michael B. Kardos will as­

sume the new position of Direc­
tor of Distribution and Custo­
mer Services. In this position he 
will continue to be responsible 
for all traffic, warehousing, and 
materials handling. In addition, 
he will oversee activities for 
corporate salvage and customer 
service operations. Since join­
ing Regal in 1968, Kardos had 
previously served as Office 
Manager and Director of Pur­
chasing. A native of Perth 
Amboy. New Jersey, and a 
World War II veteran, Kardos is 
a graduate of Ohio University 
and he and his family live in 
Kewaskum.

Cyril "Cy” Wietor
Named to the new position of 

Traffic and Fleet Manager was 
Cyril ”Cy” Wietor. He will be 
responsible for supervising all 
traffic scheduling and the ac­
tivity of the Regal transport 
fleet. A veteran of over 30 years 
at Regal. Wietor most recently 
served as Shipping Department 
Foreman. Active in a variety of 
community activities, he is a 
former Kewaskum Trustee and 
served as Village President for 
four years. He is also a member 
of the Regal 30 Year Club and a 
Grand Knight of the Knights of 
Columbus. A World War II 
Navy Veteran, Wietor is also a 
member of the local American 
Legion Post. Wietor and his 
wife make their home in Ke­
waskum.

Tired of scrubbing carpeting? 
Clean it with Nylac quickly and 
easily. No machine needed. 
Miller’s Fine Furniture carries 
Nylac

Regal Ware, Inc. has announ­
ced a realignment of respon­
sibilities in the company’s gen­
eral services areas.

William Sengpiel
In a related move, William 

Sengpiel has been named Traf­
fic Relations and Export Super­
visor. In this new post he will 
work closely with freight car­
riers implementing the distri­
bution of the company's pro­
ducts. A graduate of Lakeland 
College. Sengpiel has been with 
Regal for nine years serving 
most recently as Order Proces­
sing and Customer Service
Manager. He lives in rural Ke­
waskum.

Carol Heller
As part of this same rea­

lignment. Carol Heller has been 
promoted to the position of Con­
sumer Services Supervisor. In 
this position, she will supervise 
the processing of all consumer 
correspondence received by the 
company. A Kewaskum native, 
Mrs. Heller has held several 
secretarial and clerical positions 
in her 10 year Regal career.

THE SUPER MARKET 
OF AUTO REPAIRS 

Goeden Auto Body 
Complete Auto Body Repairs 

and Painting Professionally Done 

INSURANCE ESTIMATES AND REPAIRS 
OUR SPECIALTY

Automotive - Tune-Ups Exhaust - Brakes 
Tires - Anti-Freeze - Texaco Products 

ALL DONE TO YOUR SATISFACTION 
24 HOUR TOWING

Hy 28 E. of Kewaskum in St Michaels 
334-2754

Try Our Personalized Service

John Tessar
John Tessar was recently 

named to the new position of 
Administrative Services Mana­
ger and will be in charge of the 
Order Processing Department 
in addition to his office manage­
ment responsibilities. Tessar 
has held a variety of positions in 
his over 25 years with Regal, 
most recently serving as Office 
Manager. A current member of 
the Kewaskum School Board
and a Kewaskum resident, he is 
also a U.S. Army Veteran and a 
member of the Robert G. Ro­
maine American Legion Post 
No. 384.

REAL ESTATE SCHOOL
Become a licensed real es­
tate broker or salesperson. 
Start Now! Visit class free in 
Fond du Lac at YMCA, 
Wed.. Oct. 4 or Oct. 11 at 
6:30 p.m. Also daily classes 
in Milwaukee.
Also salesperson's home 
study course.

WISCONSIN SCHOOL OF 
REAL ESTATE 

720 N. 3rd Street 
Milwaukee — 414-271-8754

SPECIALS 
on 

MINERAL 
FEEDERS 

$47.95
WEST BEND ELEVATOR 
Hwy. 45 & D or Downtown 

Office 334-2337 
Warehouse 334-5877

Shirley Stern has been pro­
moted to Order Department 
Supervisor. In her new position, 
Mrs. Stern will supervise order 
processing activity in the Ke­
waskum corporate office. A 
resident of St. Michaels, she 
has worked in the Order De­
partment since beginning her 
Regal career nearly eleven 
years ago.

PAPER ROUTES AVAILABLE

■

The Fond du Lac Reporter has 3 carrier routes available for 
their daily newspaper at the beginning of October. Any boy 
or girl, 12 years of age or older, who is interested in earning 
their own money and managing their own small business, 
contact Mr. Peterson at the Reporter by calling toll free 
1-800-242-9760 or by writing P.O. Box 630, Fond du Lac, WI. 
54935.

REAL ESTATE AUCTION

360 HWY. "S” NEW FANE, WI.
REASON FOR SALE: Mrs. Milton Ehnert has decided to 
give up housekeeping and will be selling her real estate and 
personal property at public auction on October 28, 1978. 
Personal will start at 11:00 a.m. and the real estate will be 
offered at 2:00 p.m.

New Fane is a small rural community located 3 miles 
northeast of Kewaskum. This well maintained property has a 
large kitchen with cabinets, formal dining room, living room, 
bedroom and a 'A bath on the first floor and 3 large bedrooms 
with a full bath on the second floor. Lots of closets and 
storage space throughout and a */i bath in the full basement. 
2*2 car detached garage. Lot is nicely landscaped with 
mature trees.

TERMS OF REAL ESTATE: 10 per cent down on the day of 
sale and the balance in cash at closing to be held on or before 
November 28, 1978. All financial obligations must be 
arranged BEFORE sale date. For further information call:

PAUL
Real Estate & Auction Co.

320 First St., Kewaskum, Wi. 53040
338-3030 626-4318

MODERN WOODMEN TO 
HOLD ‘GAME NIGHT'

The Modern Woodmen of 
America Camp 2233 is holding a 
"Game Night" on Friday, Sep­
tember 29, at 8:00 p.m. at the 
Labor Center Hall in Kewas­
kum.

All members of this Camp 
and their families are invited to 
come and join the fun. Lunch 
and refreshments will be fur­
nished by the Camp, free of 
charge, and there will be games 
for all ages.

Reservations can be made by 
September 28 by phoning 533- 
8500 or 626-2438.

■■MmMMaaMHHMMBHHHMHMmHMaHBMMMWMMMM

DUNDEE
Sand & Gravel

G.Ramthun Ph. 533-4549
Washed Sand, Crushed 

Gravel, Stone and 
Lime Chips 

also, GRAVEL 
and SAND FILL

FOR THE BEST OF
CONCRETE MATERIALS
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Win Hartford Cross Country Invite

Heather Schleiter, 
Julie Larson Take

Indians Jump Off to 14-0 Lead
Over Grafton’s Champs But Lose

The way the schedule was set 
up, Kewaskum had to face 
probably the two best teams in 
the conference in their first two 
games and after losing to 
Germantown the week before, 
the Indians were defeated again 
by Grafton here Friday night, 
.'», 14

However, the surprising In­
dians stunned Grafton with two 
quick scores in the first quarter 
to take a 14-0 lead over the 
Blackhawks, defending Scenic 
Moraine champions, and run- 
nerup in last year’s Class A 
state playoffs. Grafton and Ger­
mantown, both undefeated, will 
clash this Saturday afternoon at 
Grafton in a game that could 
very well decide the conference 
championship.

Kewaskum’s 14-0 lead was 
fun while it lasted, the only 
problem was it didn’t last long. 
It took the Indians just two 
possessions to score the game’s 
first two touchdowns, but the 
Blackhawks then scored the 
final four touchdowns for the 
win.

Rod Schultz got the Indians 
started right off when he re­
turned the opening kickoff from 
his own 15-yard line almost to 
midfield for gcx)d position. After 
three plays, an offside penalty 
gave Kewaskum a first down. 
Two plays later quarterback Joe 
Herriges broke loose on a 
30-yard option play to give the 
Indians a first down on Graf­
ton's five. A two-yard loss, 
penalty and incomplete pass left 
Kewaskum with fourth down 
and 12. On a flea-flicker play 
Herriges handed off to Paul 
Bremser, who in turn handed 
off to Schultz, who found Scott 
Brendemihl in the end zone for 
the TD. A catch by Schultz was 
good for the two point conver­
sion, 8-0.

Kewaskum’s defense held 
Grafton for two downs and then 
the offense got going again. 
Fullback Mike Pettit went off 
tackle, broke two or three 
tackles, and got into the clear on 
a GO-yard run for the second 
score, 14-0.

Grafton finally got their wish­
bone started for their first 
touchdown in the second quar­
ter on a 60-yard drive with 
fullback John Brewster going in 
for the score. The defense held 
the Indians and later in the 
same quarter the Blackhawks 
got their second touchdown, 
again on a Brewster run. Both 
kicks for extra points failed and 
it was 14-12 Kewaskum at half­
time.

The Indians lost a key player 
at halftime. Guard and line­
backer John Bemis was suffer­
ing from double vision and at­
tendants of the local rescue 
squad suggested he discontinue 
playing for the night. Bemis, 
who had an outstanding first 
half, was sorely missed as 
Grafton’s two platooning began 
to wear the Indians down.

In the third quarter Grafton 
began a long 84-yard, 17-play 
scoring drive which consumed 
much time and on the second 
play of the last quarter, quar­
terback Greg Merchen scored 
from the four-yard line. Then he 
hit Paul Schlect for the two- 
point conversion to give the 
Hawks the lead for the first

time, 20-14.
Kewaskum went to a shotgun 

offense the rest of the way but it 
backfired. One of the snaps 
went over quarterback Herri­
ges’ head and Jeff Kotes re­
covered for Grafton on the 
Indians’ 22. Following a 15-yard 
penalty, three plays later John 
Lieven got free for a 26-yard 
score around end.

This Friday the Indians hit 
the road to Kettle Moraine for a 
contest between two winless 
teams.

G«AFT0»< 0 12 0 14 - 26
KEWASKUM 14 0 0 0 - 14

TD: K - Scott Brendmibl 12 yd po»* 
from Schultz; Herriges to Schultz for 
2 pt conversion; Mike Pettit 60 yd 
run; run for extra pts. no good G - 
John Brewster S yd. run, kick no 
good. Brewster 3 yd. run, kick no 
good. Greg Merchen 4 yd.. Merchen 
to Schlect for 2 pts.; John Lieven 26 
yd. run, kick no good

KEW GRA
First downs— 9 16
Yards gained rushing — 191 308
Yards gained passing — 39 23
Total yards — 230 331
Passes: attempted — 7-15-2 3-7-0
Punts — 3 2
Penalties — 25 100
Fumbles: lost — 2 I

SCENIC MORAINE 
STANDINGS

W L
Germantown 2 0
Grafton 2 0
Pewaukee 2 0
Hartland 1 1
Mayville 1 1
Kewaskum 0 2
Slinger 0 2
Kettle Moraine 0 2

Results Last Weekend
Grafton 26, Kewaskum 14
Germantown 21, Hartland 6
Pewaukee 13, Slinger 12
Mayville 22, Kettle Moraine 14

Indian Girls Beat
Owls, Cardinals in
Volleyball; Now 5-0

The Kewaskum girls’ volley­
ball team was still unbeaten 
after winning over Slinger here 
last Tuesday, 15-6, 15-2, 12-15.

After winning the first two 
games, Coach Mary Lawson 
took the starters out for the 
third one, the only game the 
Indian girls lost.

The coach had three seniors 
and three juniors in th^starting 
lineup: Denise Menzel, Pam 
Kempf, Tami Edgar, Diane 
Bremser, Tracey Schleif and 
Janet Matenaer. Bremser play­
ed very well.

Kewaskum’s JV’s won all 
three games but Slinger’s 
freshmen took two games to 
KHS’ one.

Playing at Mayville Thursday 
the Kewaskum varsity won 
again, 15-0, 15-0, 15-5.

The Cardinals had trouble 
returning serves against KHS. 
The first two games went fast 
and reserves finished the third.

The win gives the Indian girls 
a 3-0 Scenic record and 5-0 
overall.

The JV’s also won all three 
games.

On Monday Kewaskum tra­
veled to North Fond du Lac and 
Tuesday they hosted Kettle 
Moraine for Parents’ Night.

In the Hartford Invitational 
cross country meet held last 
Tuesday afternoon at Hartford 
Country Club, the Kewaskum 
girls and the Fond du Lac boys 
won the championship trophies.

Slinger’s Cathy Branta took 
top individual honors among 
about 90 girls. Her 13:44 time 
for two miles was far out in 
front. Barb Wilson led the 
Kewaskum girls with a third 
place and Laurie Wilson’s 7th 
place also was a strong factor, 
followed by Julann Zemlicka's 
10th, Mary Kougl 13th, Sherry 
Squier 14th and Laura Asch 
29th.

In the boys’ meet Kewaskum 
placed 10th. Dick Kleinmann’s 
36th was best for the Indian.

Medals were awarded to the 
top 10 and area schools were 
well represented there.

HARTFORD INVITATIONAL
GIRLS — 1. Kewaskum 52; 2. WB 

West 64. 3. Slinger BO, 4. Custer 169;
5 Hamilton Sussex 181; 6 WB East 
185; 7. Hartford 188, 8 Watertown 
209. 9. Whitefish Bay 218; 10. 
Waupun 250. II. Tosa East 251; 12.
Beaver Dam 270.

Girl Golfers Beat Brookfield Central’s
State Champions and West Bend West

In a triangular meet held at 
Hon-E-Kor here Thursday un­
der wet conditions, the Ke­
waskum High School girls’ golf 
team came in with a fine 212 
winning total.

West Bend West came in 
second with 227, largely as a 
result of Linda Schuetz' 50, and 
steady scoring by their other 
three golfers. Brookfield Cen­
tral, last year’s state champions 
in golf, were third with 243.

Girls Lose to
Mayville and
Ripon in Tennis

In a Scenic Moraine Con­
ference meet last Tuesday, a 
strong Mayville girls’ tennis 
team defeated Kewaskum, 6-1, 
as the Indians managed to win 
just one match.

Mayville is led by Lott Matt, a 
foreign exchange student from 
Switzerland. She shut out the 
Indians’ Sue Russell 6-0, 6-0.

Kewaskum is still looking for 
their first win in Scenic play.

SINGLES — No. I Sue Russell lost 
to Lott Mott 0-6, 0-6; No 2 Brenda 
Monthei lost to Annette Kelray 2-6, 
0 6. No 3 Lori Strobel lost to Sandy 
Lutzi 5-7, 1-6; No. 4 Carrie 
Stollenwerk lost to Sue Nitschke 1-6. 
0 6.

DOUBLES — No. 1 Sherry Bilgo- 
Chris Staebler lost to Vollmer 
Haufee 3 6. 1-6. No 2 Debbie 
Schlice-Jockie Londvetter won over 
Steemacher-Streblow 6-4, 6-1; No. 3 
Jackie Herriges-Bonnie Prost lost to 
Bubolz-Taael 3-6. 2-6.

On Monday the Indian girls 
were defeated by Ripon in non­
conference play, 4-3.

SINGLES - Sue Russell won over 
Algor 8-3. Brenda Monthei won over 
McDaniel 9 7; Iori Strobel lost to 
Hayes 6 8. Corrie Stollenwerk lost to 
Sullivan 0 8

DOUBLES Debbie Schlice and 
Jockie landvetter lost to Algor- 
McDoniel 18 Les Zwick Thill won 
over Sullivan Cose 8 6 Bonnie Prost 
Jockie Herriges lost to Kimbol-Hayes 
: 8

JV. TENNIS
Ripon 2. Kewaskum 3
SINGLES Julie Dettmnn won 

over Katror 8 2. Lori Schaub lost to 
Conrod 6 8 Chris Voight over Clark 
8 $

DOURl ES Debb e Allmon ond 
Shoron Amerling lost to Katsor 
Conrad 5 8 Coleen Kumrow Wilson 
won over Clark Hogemon 8 5

INDIVIDUALS — 1. Cothv Branta 
Slinger. 13:44; 2. Greta Bielke WBE, 
14:18; 3. Barb Bilson. Kew , 14:32; 4. 
Libby Engeleiter WBW 14:47; 5. 
Mory Hetebrueg. WBW. 14:50; 6. 
VonDerVellen H, 15 06. 7 Laurie 
Wilson, Kew ; 8. Angie Kranz. Sl­
inger 9. T. Keekinen, Sussex; 10. 
Julann Zemlicko. Kew

l
HARTFORD INVITATIONAL
CROSS COUNTRY BOYS
1. Fond du Lac 48 pts.; 2. Whitefish 

Bay S8, 3. Tosa East 72; 4.. Harford 
108; 5. Watertown 109; 6. WB East 
154; 7. Beaver Dam 177; 8. Waupun 
243; 9 Milw. Custer 283; 10. Ke 
woskum 289: 11. WB West 299.

INDIVIDUALS 1. Mike Kahn. Bay. 
15:11: 2. John Gorske, F. 15:33; 3. 
Todd Hausmann, WBE. 15.45; 4 P. 
McGinn, Tosa, 15:52; 5. Dan Linehon, 
Bay. 15:54, 6. Matt Higgins, Wat ; 7. 
Ron Rost, F. 8. Greg Schumacher. 
Hartford; 9. Todd Beck. BD(a second 
behind Greg); 10. Mike Richmond. F.

Best West finishes by Dave Whelan 
38th; Tim Roecker 44th; For East, 
John Pfotenhauer 23rd; Ray 
Hilsmann 37th; Tom Rosenthal 43d; 
For Hartford. Dennis Berg 12th. Doug 
Debroux 27th; Steve Maliy 30th. Paul 
Danner 31st. Kewaskum's best was 
Dick Kleinmann 36th.

GIRLS Kewaskum, after the 
Wilsons, had high places from: 10. 
Julann Zemlicko 10th; Mary Kougl 
13th, Sherry Squietf 19th and Laura 
Asch 29th. West's top five, besides 
Hetebrueg and Engeleiter. were 
Goll Gruendemann 16th. Joi 
Kieckhafer 18th, Amt Amy Hofmaier 
21st, and close behind was Tami 
lanzen 24th Owls' Jill Raffay was 
11th and Judy Boehm 28th

Jody Ryder was low for the 
Lancers with 48.

The winning Kewaskum team 
was paced by Bobbi Schmidt, 
who took medalist honors with 
45. Other scores were Denise 
Dean 52, Yvonne Schacht 53, 
Joan Hanrahan 63, and Sue 
Harlow 66.

In a meet on Tuesday of last 
week, played on the back nine 
at Mee Kwon course at Me­
quon, the Indian girls lost by 
just three strokes to a strong 
Homestead team.

The Highlanders had a score 
of 199 to Kewaskum’s 202. 
Mayville rounded out the 
3-team meet in third place with 
215.

Bobbi Schmidt shared med­
alist honors with Jean Roselli of 
Homestead. Both had 47's.

The KHS girls brought their 
record to 7-2-1.

WEDNESDAY 
MORNINGETTES 
KING PIN LANES

Sept. 20, 1978
W L

Behring’s Meat Mkt. 8 1
No Names! 6 3
Serwe’sTap 5 4
Everglades 4 5
Herriges Tap 4 5
King Pin Lanes 4 5
Kaszubas Palace 3 6
Coast To Coast 2 7

Individual high games: Don­
na LaShay 224; Mary Ann Jur- 
gensmier 203; JoAnn Galligan 
196.

Individual high series: Donna 
LaShay 551; Mary Ann Jur- 
gensmier 538; Sylvia Eide 538; 
Paula Kutz 507.

FIRST MEETING TO BE 
HELD BY SNOCHIEFS

The Kewaskum Sno-Chiefs 
will hold their first snowmobile 
meeting on Sunday, October 1, 
at 8 p.m. at Amerahn Hall. 
Anyone interested in joining the 
club is welcome to attend.

Firsts in Judo
The West Bend Judo Club 

participated in the 1978 Wis­
consin Junior Judo Champion­
ships this past weekend held at 
the Capitol Court Center in Mil­
waukee.

Heather Schleiter of Kewas­
kum captured an undisputed 
first place in the girls' 9 and 
under lightweight class. The 
girls’ 10-13 division saw Julie 
Larson, also of Kewaskum, win 
first place and Lynn Roethke 
won a first in the girls’ 14-17 
year old class.

The boys' division saw Jay­
son Schleiter compete in the 9 
and under class where he won 
third place. David Schleiter 
fought in the 10-13 year class, 
winning third place. Both are 
from Kewaskum. Scott Schalk 
won fifth place in the heavy­
weight class of the same age 
group.

Kris Puestow competed in his 
first tournament and won sec­
ond place in the young men's 
18-20 year old division.

It was announced by Judo 
instructor Jon Sanfilippo that all 
first thru third place winners 
are now eligible to compete in 
the 1978 National A.A.U. Judo 
Junior Championships which 
will be held Saturday, October 
7, in Houston, Texas.

QUEEN HITS LEAGUE 
Ellen Breitzman, Sec.

W L
Gay Nineties 7 2
Dundee Sand. Gra. 6 3
Bauer Spraying 6 3
Baumanns Bus 6 3
Fin-n-Feather 6 3
Johann Plumbing 5*2 3*2
Strobel’s 5 4
Charles 5 4
Regal Ware 5 4
Herman’s 5 4
Hensen’s 4 5
Everglades 3 l/t 5 */»
Newsettes 3 6
Laurie's 3 6
Artie's Market 1 8
Just Pat’s 1 8

Individual high game: Ernie 
Hammen 223, Joyce Schultz 
223, Delores Krueger 215, San­
dy Pieper 202.

Individual high series: Joyce 
Schultz 560, Janet Serwe 527, 
Ernie Hammen 521.
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