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Week’s Wit
A friend of ours attended a 

wedding last weekend and is 
afraid he said the wrong thing •■ 
he said “I do.’’
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Firemen’s
All is in readiness for the 

annual Kewaskum Firemen and 
Rescue Squad fund-raising pic­
nic to be held in the village park 
on Saturday evening, July 8, 
and Sunday, July 9. This year’s 
parade and picnic will be bigger 
than ever.

On Saturday night there will 
be live music in the beer 
garden by the best in country 
rock, featuring Ida Red from 
7:30 to 11:30 p.m. All of the 
rides, games, refreshment and 
food stands will be in opera­
tion.

A highlight of the picnic will 
be another excellent parade at 
12 noon sharp which will start 
off the festivities on Sunday. 
The parade will feature 10 
bands, drum and bugle corps 
and drill teams, including St. 
Josaphat Basilicans Baton and 
Drum Corps of Milwaukee, 
Conntinental Youth Band of 
Milwaukee, Mariners of Port 
Washington Drill Team, Vil­
lage Greens Drill Team of 
Greendale, Janesville Fife and 
Drum Corps, Hartford City 
Band, Old Mapleton Circus 
Band of Oconomowoc, All- 
American Holiday Baton 
Group of Menomonee Falls,

Roadside Test for Intoxication Went 
Into Effect July 1 in Wisconsin

Effective July 1, motorists 
who are stopped by local and 
state traffic officers may be 
asked to submit to a roadside 
test for intoxication if the officer 
has reason to believe the mo­
torist may be operating his ve­
hicle while under the influence 
of intoxicants, it was empha­
sized by Randall Fleming of the 
Washington County Sheriff’s 
Department, who also serves as 
Washington County Highway 
Safety Coordinator.

“Use of the PBT (preliminary 
breath test) device is allowed 
under the stronger implied con­
sent laws passed by the 1977 
legislature and signed by Act­
ing Governor Martin J. Schrei­
ber,” Flemming explained.

Hawk Promoted
By Regal Ware

Regal Ware, Inc. has pro 
moted Robert E. Hawk to the 
position of Assistant Sales Man 
ager of the Direct Sales Divi 
sion, according to an announce 
ment made by Ronald O 
Reigle, Executive Vice Presi­
dent. In this capacity, Hawk will 
be working with House-to- 
House Installment and Special­
ty accounts throughout the U- 
nited States and Canada.

A graduate of Oklahoma 
State University, Hawk joined 
Regal in January and resides in 
West Bend.

Picnic This
Tripoli Motor Corps of Mil­
waukee and Kewaskum High 
School Band.

Other units will include 
beautiful floats, baton twirlers 
majorettes, children’s special­
ties, visiting firemen and 
equipment, Legionaires, com­
ic entries, orchestras, ancient 
cars, riding horses, clubs, or­
ganizations and more.

The parade will form on the 
high school campus and adja­
cent streets, from where it will 
proceed to the park. All par­
ticipants should be present to 
line up no later than 11:30 
a.m. Persons wishing to enter 
the parade should contact Bob 
Staehler, parade chairman. 
Theme for this year’s parade 
will be “Wisconsin’s Chang­
ing Seasons.” Businessmen, 
industries and organizations 
are urged to enter a float. 
Prizes will be awarded for the 
best floats and kiddies’ spec­
ialties (groups).

Immediately following the 
parade there will be exhibi­
tions by drum and bugle corps 
in the park. There will be con­
tinuous music throughout the 
afternoon and evening. In the 
beer garden music will be by

“The PBT is about the size of 
a pocket calculator, and it is 
designed to obtain a breath test 
reading at the roadside,” he 
added.

“If the PBT shows a blood 
alcohol level of 0.1 per cent or 
higher, an arrest may be made 
and the suspect taken to the 
nearest police station equipped 
with a ‘breathalyzer’ for a more 
precise test which will be ad- 
n issible in court as proof of in­
toxication,” he continued.

The Governor’s Office of 
Highway Safety has funded 
purchase of 1,000 prearrest 
screening devices, at a cost of 
$270 each. About 300 are in the

(Continued on Page 2)

Robert E. Hawk

Weekend
Syl Groeschel from 2:00 to 
6:00 and Danny Darren and 
the Drifting Playboys, Wis­
consin’s King of Country and 
Bluegrass from 7:30 to 11:30. 
On the bandstand in the even­
ing, Bob Kuether’s band will 
appear from 7:00-11:00 p.m.

The popular water fight will 
be held at 6:30 p.m. Sunday 
with neighboring fire depart­
ments competing.

Advance tickets are also on 
sale for $800 in cash prizes and 
93 merchandise prizes.

See you in Kewaskum on 
July 8 and 9.

Receives UW
Scholarship

Carol L. Ehnert, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Ehnert, 1323 
Roseland Drive, Kewaskum, is 
among 42 high school and six 
university students named re­
cipients of merit scholarships 
from the University of Wis­
consin-Green Bay this spring. 
She received a leadership and 
academic excellence scholar­
ship.

The awards, which total 
$15,000, include 40 from the 
Leadership and Academic Ex­
cellence Scholarship fund, eight 
music merit and two science 
merit scholarships. Each award 
is for $300, and two Wisconsin 
young people earned grants in 
more than one category.

Carol will be attending UW- 
Green Bay this fall where she 
will be majoring in biology. She 
is a 1978 graduate of Kewaskum 
High School.

Receive Degrees 
At UW-Milwaukee

The following students from 
this area were May, 1978, 
degree candidates at the Uni­
versity of Wisconsin-Milwaukee;

School of Business Adminis­
tration, Bachelor of Business 
Administration - Stanley Miske, 
5990 Wayne Center, Allenton, 
and Ann Wolf, Route 1, Hwy. 
DW, Allenton.

School of Education, Bachelor 
of Science - Suzanne Fritz, 6375 
Hilltop Drive, Allenton.

OPEN HOUSE FOR 
95TH BIRTHDAY

An open house will be held in 
honor of the 95th birthday of 
Caroline Bohn at the Boltonville 
Firehouse in Boltonville on Sun­
day, July 9, from 2;00 to 4:00 
p.m.

All friends and relatives are 
cordially invited to attend.

Name Officer
In Charge at
Post Office

Charles Corrao, who was su­
perintendent of postal opera­
tions at the West Bend Post 
Office, has been named officer 
in charge of the Kewaskum Post 
Office. A postmaster to succeed 
Harry E. Koch, who retired 
June 30, will be appointed by 
the Regional Postmaster Gen­
eral in three or four months.

Corrao states that because of 
the growth of the community, it 
would be very helpful if the 
people would incorporate the 
post office box number with the 
address in mailing letters, etc.

Awarded Scholarship

Anne Marie Strancke, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Strancke, was recently 
awarded a scholarship through 
the Women's Auxiliary to the 
National Association of Plumb­
ing-Heating-Cooling Contrac­
tors. Applications were received 
from all fifty states.

The award was presented at 
their annual national convention 
held in Las Vegas, Nevada, to 
which Anne was invited to 
receive the award. Anne is a 
1978 graduate of Kewaskum 
High School and will be attend­
ing the University of Minnesota 
in the fall.

Notice to Krazy 
Daze Advertisers

Ads for the annual Krazy 
Daze event in Kewaskum, to be 
held Tuesday, July 25, will run 
in the July 21 issue of the 
Statesman. Because of the extra 
work involved, merchants are 
asked to cooperate by having 
their advertising copy in by 
Friday, July 14.

More details on the Krazy 
Daze promotion will follow.

Mrs. Wayland
Tessar, Leo
Rohlinger Die

Mrs. Adeline (Wayland) Tes­
sar, 51, of Kewaskum, passed 
away Monday, July 3, at St. 
Joseph's Community Hospital, 
West Bend, where she had been 
a patient for three days.

She was born January 17, 
1927, in Chilton, Wis. to the late 
Magnus and Amelia Meissner 
Zac ho. On November 7, 1948, 
she married Wayland D. Tessar 
in Trinity Lutheran Church, 
Dundee.

Survivors include her hus­
band; two sons, Daniel (Candi) 
of Wisconsin Rapids and Jay at 
home; one sister, Mrs. Francis 
(Esther) Lauer of Fond du Lac; 
her mother-in-law, Mrs. Jack 
Tessar of Kewaskum; other 
relatives and friends.

Visitation at Miller's Funeral 
Home, Kewaskum, was after 4 
p.m. Tuesday and at the Peace 
United Church of Christ Wed­
nesday from 12 noon to 2 p.m. 
when services were conducted 
by Pastor Darrell Joiner. Burial 
was in the church cemetery. 
Memorials appreciated.

LEO ROHLINGER
Leo J. Rohlinger, 73, a former 

resident of Kewaskum for many 
years, passed away at the Hope 
Nursing Home in Lomira, Fri­
day, June 30.

Rohlinger was born June 18, 
1905, in Lomira, to the late 
Matthew and Kathryn Braun 
Rohlinger. On November 27, 
1928, he married Johanna Hall 
in St. Martin’s Catholic Church 
in Ashford. She passed away 
December 11, 1976.

He was a retired oil dealer. 
He was a member of Holy 
Trinity Church in Kewaskum 
and their Holy Name Society.

Survivors include three 
daughters, Rita (Robert) Ren­
ner of West Bend, Mary (David) 
Ours of Campbellsport and 
Shirley (Ronald) Sarauer of Ke­
waskum; three sons: Gregor 
(Beverly), Alois (Janet) and 
Norbert (Darlene), all of Ke­
waskum; also by 21 grand­
children; six sisters, Mrs. Stella 
Dutscheck of Milwaukee, Mrs. 
Lee Brown of Hartford, Mrs. 
Joseph Moser of West Bend, 
Mrs. Regina Newmeyer of 
Mayville, Mrs. Frank Stoffel of 
Campbellsport and Mrs. Ed­
ward Wenziaff of West Bend; 
other relatives and friends. One 
son, one grandchild and one 
brother also preceded him in 
death.

Visitation at Miller’s Funeral 
Home, Kewaskum was after 3 
p.m. Sunday with rosary vigil at 
8:30 p.m. Sunday. Services 
were held Monday, July 3, at 10 
a.m. from Miller’s and at 10:30 
a.m. at Holy Trinity Church, 
with Rev. John T. Budde offi­
ciating. Burial was in the new 
Holy Trinity Cemetery.

(Continued on Page 4).
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field now, ready for use starting 
July 1. As the remaining de­
vices are received, they will be 
delivered to police agencies 
whose personnel have been 
trained in their utilization.

In recent weeks the chemical 
test section of the State Patrol 
has conducted training sessions 
in Ashland, Fennimore, Fond 
du Lac, Green Bay, LaCrosse, 
Madison, Menomonie, Milwau­
kee, Rice Lake, Wausau and 
Whitewater.

Similar sessions will be con­
ducted in coming weeks at Fond 
du Lac, Green Bay, Madison, 
Milwaukee and Waukesha. One 
officer from each police agency 
participating is certified as an 
instructor to train his fellow 
officers in the use of both the 
PBT devices and the more so­
phisticated breathalyzer 
machines.

“Officers are not going to 
harass motorists, but they are 
going to be on the alert for those 
drivers who by various actions 
mark themselves as targets for 
enforcement attention,” Flem­
ming stressed.

“That motorist who is spotted 
weaving across centerlines, 
coming to a ‘rolling’ instead of 
complete stop at STOP signs, 
driving recklessly, exceeding 
speed limits or attempting to 
elude an officer can expect to be 
singled out for special attention, 
he declared.

Wisconsin has become the 
15th state to authorize use of 
pre-arrest screening devices, 
according to the National High­
way Traffic Safety Administra­
tion.

Such states in the midwest 
include Indiana, Minnesota, 
Nebraska, North Dakota and 
South Dakota.

“Under Wisconsin’s new law 
a motorist may refuse to take 
the preliminary pre-screening 
breath test if he or she agrees to 
take a quantitative test at the 
nearest police station of breath, 
blood or urine,” Flemming 
said.

Penalties for refusing to sub­
mit to either of the tests are:
• First refusal within 5 years -

6 months driver license revo­
cation, with reinstatement after 
3 months if the person success­
fully completes rehabilitation 
and/or a group dynamics traffic 
safety school.
• Second and subsequent re­

fusal within 5 years - 1 year 
revocation, with reinstatement 
after 6 months if rehabilitation 
or traffic school has been taken.

“Under Wisconsin’s old law, 
the person refusing to submit to 
a test for intoxication faced 
suspension of license for 60 
days,” Flemming explained.

“After July 1 this year, such 
refusal will result in a 6 month 
revocation,” he added.

“There’s a big difference be­
tween ‘suspension’ and ‘revo­
cation’,” he continued.

After a person has been sus­
pended, he or she may be re­
instated upon filing a $10 rein­
statement fee with the state 
department of transportation 
and may be required to meet
with a driver improvement an-

alyst.
When revoked, a person has 

to start the entire driver li­
censing process all over again - 
taking the written, vision and 
road tests; paying a $25 rein­
statement fee; paying $2 exam 
fees; and providing proof of fu­
ture financial responsibility. In 
addition, he or she may be re­
quired to meet with a driver 
improvement analyst.

“Penalties for conviction on 
the charge of operating a ve­
hicle while intoxicated also have 
been increased,” it was pointed 
out by the local highway safety 
coordinator.

Conviction penalties are, 
starting July 1:
• On first OWI conviction in 5 

years, a $100 to $500 forfeiture 
and 90 day to 6 month revo­
cation of driving privileges. On 
successful completion of safety 
school and/or rehabilitation, all 
but the first $100 of the for­
feiture and the license revo-
cation may be waived.

COKE, TAB, 
FRESCA

8 Pk.
16 oz. Btls

Plus tax 
deposit

□

from

John Boroy, R P H

Don’t 
Miss 
These 
Savings!

The irritating juice from 
poison ivy, poison oak. and 
poison sumac puts hundreds 
in the hospital every sum­
mer, and sends thousands 
more to doctors to get re­
lief from pain and itching. 
Symptoms include swelling 
and inflammation, also blis­
ters. As soon as possible, 
wash exposed areas several 
times with soap and warm 
water, ('alamine lotion may 
give some relief. Identify 
the irritating leases in an 
cncs clopedia so that contact 
with them can be avoided.

• On second OWI conviction 
in 5 years, a $250 to $1,000 fine, 
5 days to 6 months in the 
County jail, and a 1 year revo­
cation of license. On successful 
completion of safety school 
and/or rehabilitation, all but 
the first $250 fine, all or part of 
the jail sentence, and the last 9 
months of license revocation 
may be waived.
9 On third OWI conviction 

within 5 years, the guilty drunk 
driver can be fined $500 to 
$2,000 and sentenced to jail for 
30 days to as long as one year. 
In such cases, safety school 
and/or rehabilitation may not 
be in lieu of any part of either 
fine or imprisonment.

“These are tough laws, but 
they are needed and they will be 
enforced to remove the abusive 
drinker who drives from the 
public roadways,” Flemming 
concluded.

Send in your pictures to the
Statesman. No charge.

In the Service
ATWATER, Calif. - Senior 

Airman Roger H. Beusch, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Gerald M. 
Beusch of 372 W. Ninth St., 
Fond du Lac, has been named 
Outstanding Airman of the 
Month at Castle AFB, Calif.

A personal affairs specialist, 
Airman Beusch was selected for 
professional skill, duty perfor­
mance and exemplary conduct. 
He is assigned to the 93rd 
Combat Support Group, a part 
of the Strategic Air Command.

The airman, a 1973 graduate 
of L. P. Goodrich High School, 
attended Merced (Calif.) Col­
lege. His wife, Joan, is the 
daughter of Frederick Glass of 
Route 2, Campbellsport.

Rosenheimer’s
Grocery

LuLul

CANE 
SUGAR

10 lb 
Bag

JU/TADD 
tove 

by ANN CROWLEY
ALL IN AN EGG

APPLESAUCE
Bush’s With Bacon

“J 49c
BAKED REAMS IS 59c

ELBERTA PEACHES 
GRAPEFRUIT JUICE
PEANUT BUTTER
ORANGE DRINK
Hungry Jack i60xe*v*ngs'

MASHED POTATOES
Whitney

PINK SALMON
Campbell's 

TOMATO 
SOUP 

5-1^ 
STRAWBERRY PRESERVES
CURTISS

SHARP ^' CHEESE

Pr<e^ In This Ad Good Thru Mon July 10

Al I ConcentratedALL Detergent

Al | Dishwasher 
ALL Detergent

flAME Gentle Dish UWL Detergent

Kraft

AMERICAN “;.V CHEESE 7« $1.21

^ 930
$2.23 
$1.59

Ranch Pride. 
Shred

Super Smooth, 
Creamy or Chunky

3 e.” $1

28 oi
Mid

“.".' 49c 
$1.19 t l»b*ipoon flout

MACARONI SHELLS
Red Dart

GREEN ASPARAGUS
5 l^ $1 
'^' 570 
”7.°,' $1.09 '

Sausage, Cheese 

JOHNS 
PIZZA

13c Off 
Label

30c Off 
Label

Smackers 
New Pack’

Your
Choice'

40 oz 
Pkg

1 lb 
Pkg MIRACLE WHIP

^ $1.29
12 oi Oft jMg oVp

■a; $1.33

Pkg

BRISHWJW

r $3.79
*U $1.79
V 79c

POTATO 
CHIPS 

93'
Malted Milk Balls A A URY 

or Bridge M.m URRVI

/
Pleosmor, Miniature

Marsh­
mallows

Store Hours
Mon. thru Fri. 8 a.m. to 9 p. m.

Saturdays 8 a. m. to 6 p. m.
Sundays 9 a. m. to 1 p. m.

Birdseye, Non Dairy 

COOL 
WHIP

69' 55
White Cloud, Assorted Tints

Bathroom
Tissue

PRES70 TRASH BAGS
■I SANDWICH BAGS 

DANDRUFF SHAMPOO 
ALKA SELTZER ‘%Sr

4 roll
Mu

Ziploc 
RmMl.bl.

del

'^ 990 
5^ 570 
V $1.69 
^' 800

. 11 resh Produce... A Summer Treat That Can't Be Beat!

Seedless GRAPES

Bing CHERRIES

CANTALOUPE »*«

69c lb.

69c lb.

59c each

White POTATOES ’<>'■> Bag $1.79
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Cedar Lake Home Gets Totem Pole County Board Passes New 
Land Division Amendments

The Cedar Lake Home Cam­
pus now has a unique addition 
for its Learning Center - a ten 
foot high, hand carved totem 
pole.

The Program-Education 
Committee, composed of com­
munity members, has been ac­
tive in planning the Learning 
Center and its program. The 
committee selected a totem pole 
as an art object to help remind 
us of our Native American heri­
tage.

Don Stettler, Campus Edu­
cation Coordinator, says the to­
tem pole is in keeping with the 
uniqueness of the Learning 
Center’s program in stimulating 
thought and feelings of rever­
ence.

Leo Smith III, Fountain City, 
Wis., is one of a handful of 
wood and stone artisans. His 
original totem pole design for 
Cedar Lake Home captures the 
spirit of the Potawatomi Tribe 
who were native to this area. 
The style in totem poles seen in

The first circus was established in 1769 by an ex-cavalry 
sergeant in Lambeth, London. No admission was charged, 
but a collection was taken after each performance.

of Kewaskum

Funeral Home

Fine Home Furnishings
LARGEST DISPLAY — DECORATOR SERVICE 

STORE PHONE 626-2184

TWO BEAUTIFULLY FURNISHED CHAPELS 

815 FOREST AVE. DIAL 626-2185

Dependable & Reasonable 
Since 1910

MODERN BRIDE MAGAZINE
(on newstands now)

WEDDING STATIONERY

the FREE GIFT COUPON off as advertized in

KEWASKUM STATESMAN
205 Main St. Phone 626-2626

the Pacific Northwest are widely 
copied and would not be in 
keeping with our area.

Important to this totem pole 
design is that it takes animal life 
native to the area into consid­
eration. Leo Smith III chose 
three species signifying the 
waters (fish), the earth (turtle), 
and the sky (bittern). The totem 
pole also has cattails to sym­
bolize the earth, clouds to illus­
trate the sky, and waves to show 
water. Not only do these sym­
bolize the three strata of human 
experience, but more specifi­
cally, they are closely linked 
with the waterways and wet­
lands, upon which the Potawa­
tomi counted on for subsis­
tence.

The ten foot high totem pole 
is carved out of cedar wood 
which is native to our area. Tra­
ditionally, Indians thought of 
cedar as sacred wood and would 
use the smoke from it to purify 
their bodies.

Washington County's new 
land division amendments are a 
step in the right direction, but 
they won’t make the county’s 
water clean, according to two 
County Board members.

To approach that goal, other 
agricultural and urban nonpoint 
pollution must be controlled. 
Nonpoint pollution is the runoff 
from farm, construction and 
urban land uses.

The land division amend­
ments, passed unanimously by 
the Washington County Board 
on June 13, are aimed at re­
ducing runoff from construction 
sites, where 10 to 100 times 
more soil per acre may be lost 
than from farm fields. But since 
far more farming than con­
struction takes place in the 
county, agriculture accounts for 
approximately 50-55 per cent of 
the sediment pollution, accord­
ing to Southeastern Wisconsin 
Regional Planning Commission 
figures.

Supervisors Reuben Schmahl 
’ and John Kohl say voluntary 

programs to control farm land 
runoff should be given a chance 
in the county. If the programs 
fail, the two agree that regu­
lation will be necessary, and 
that the county, not the state or 
federal government, should 
make the rules.

Schmahl, County Board 
chairman from Jackson, said in 
an interview that all county 
residents must realize that wa­
ter quality problems are every­
one’s problems and everyone 
has to help solve them.

Concerning agriculture he 
said, “I’d like to see efforts 
made for voluntary controls. If 
we don’t make the effort now, 
it’s going to be legislated.”

John Kohl, supervisor from 
Richfield, also favors voluntary 
agricultural programs, but be­
lieves regulation will come e- 
ventually. He would like the 
county to make those rules. “It 
works better if control is local. 
We know our people and their 
problems better (than the state 
or federal government does).”

Neither Kohl nor Schmahl 
thinks the county should have to 
budget funds to reach the 
federal goal of fishable, swim­
mable water by 1983. This year 
the state will contribute $3600 
in matching funds to the county, 
but that may barely cover the

Tildes I
We carry

CARLSON CRAFT

and will honor

cost of improving one barnyard, 
said Schmahl.

Since 1976 the Washington 
County Project (WCP) has stu­
died erosion and sediment prob­
lems in the county to determine 
pollution sources, possible so­
lutions and ways to carry out 
needed changes. University of 
Wisconsin-M adison, UW- 
Extension and the State Board 
of Soil and Water Conservation 
Districts sponsor the project, 
with funding from the Environ­
mental Protection Agency.

Federal regulations require 
each state to develop “208 
plans” for controlling nonpoint 
pollution. Public review meet­
ings are going on around the 
state and should be completed 
by Nov. 1. It is not known 
whether the programs will be 
voluntary, regulatory or a com­
bination of the two.

Fred Madison, WCP director, 
says that for the most part tra­
ditional conservation farming 
methods do a good job of 
reducing farmland sediment. 
These methods include contour 
plowing, strip cropping, grass 
waterways, reduced tillage, di­
version channels and wind 
breaks.

In addition to the subdivision

118 Forewt Av*. — 684-8718 
BEHIND MILLER’S

Support Your Local Firemen 7

Attend
Kewaskum Firemen’s Picnic /

Huge Parade at 12 Noon

(CLOSED SUNDAY, JULY 9
[BEHRING’S MARKE
I) AT THE STOP & GO LIGHT

erosion amendments, the WCP 
drafted an ordinance that would 
require farmers to use any of 
these or other methods, if 
necessary, to keep average soil 
loss of any farming unit to three 
tons per acre. The proposed or­
dinance has been reviewed by 
the Soil and Water Conserva­
tion District supervisors, but no 
action has been taken.

Schmahl and Kohl say that 
subdivision amendments just 
passed will help conserve soil 
and water resources in unin­
corporated areas of Washington 
County.

The Washington County Pro­
ject is working with incorpora­
ted areas to adopt similar ordi­
nances, Madison says. The 
Village of Germantown is in the 
process of adoption. The Town 
of Jackson already has such an 
ordinance.

“We’re moving ahead as fast 
as we can,” said Kohl about the 
county’s nonpoint pollution con­
trol efforts. “We’re doing ev­
erything we can. The sub­
division ordinances will be a 
great help.
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HERMAN PANZER, SR
Herman S. Panzer, Sr., 72, of 

Route 1, Kewaskum, passed 
away at the Samaritan Home in 
West Bend on Tuesday, July 4.

He was born October 11, 
1905, in Knellsville, Wis. to the 
late Herman and Emilie Rosner 
Panzer. On June 18, 1927, he 
married Vera Koepke in Ke­
waskum.

He resided in the Kewaskum 
area most of his life, where he 
was engaged in farming until 
the time of his retirement. He 
was a member of Peace United 
Church of Christ, Kewaskum, 
was a long time member of the 
Boltonville Fire Department 
and the Boltonville Sportsmen’s 
Club.

Survivors include his wife; 
five sons, Alvin (Janet), Eugene 
(Anne), Herman (Nancy), all of 
Kewaskum, Ronald (Sally) of 
Allenton and Daniel (Diane) of 
Silver Creek. He is further sur­
vived by 17 grandchildren; 
three great-grandchildren; 
nieces and nephews; one bro­
ther-in-law, Camel (Angeline) 
Koepke; other relatives and 
friends.

Visitation at Miller’s Funeral 
Home, Kewaskum, will be 
Thursday from 4 to 8 p.m. when 
services will be conducted by 
Pastor Darrell Joiner at the 
funeral home. Burial will be in 
the church cemetery.

Memorials may be given to 
the Peace United Church of 
Christ in Kewaskum.
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I FRESH FRUITS 

I and VEGETABLES 

j Bartoli's Produce I
Open Monday thru Friday 8:30 a.m. 8:30 p.m. 

Saturday & Sunday 8:30 a.m. 5:00 p.m.
| Located 4 miles North of Kewaskum I 

on Highway “V" 
phone 533-4092 
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MRS. IRENE KLUG

Mrs. Irene Klug, nee Ram- 
thun, 76, of New Fane, passed 
away Wednesday, June 28, at 
St. Joseph’s Hospital in Mil­
waukee where she had been a 
patient for approximately one 
month.

Mrs. Klug was bom May 12, 
1902, in the Town of Kewaskum 
to the late August and Augusta 
Kaniess Ramthun. On Sept. 9, 
1922, she married Alfred Klug 
in St. Lucas Church in Ke­
waskum. He passed away on 
Dec. 6, 1961.

She was a charter member of 
the Ladies’ Aid of St. John’s 
Lutheran Church, New Fane.

Survivors include nieces, 
nephews, one brother-in-law 
and three sisters-in-law, other 
relatives and friends. Two bro­
thers preceded her in death.

Visitation at Miller’s Funeral 
Home, Kewaskum, was after 4 
p.m. Friday and at St. John’s 
Lutheran Church in New Fane 
Saturday, July 1, from 12 noon 
to the time of services at 2 p.m. 
with Pastor Robert Wilcken of 
the Town of Scott officiating. 
Burial was in the church ceme­
tery.

EDWIN F. BREUER
Edwin F. Breuer, of 6088 

Hwy. D, Kohlsville, died Wed­
nesday, June 28, at St. Joseph’s 
Community Hospital, West 
Bend, at the age of 76.

He was born Dec. 27, 1901, in 
Theresa, and at an early age 
moved to St. Lawrence.

After his marriage to Eliza­
beth Schuh at St. Anthony on 
June 23, 1931, they continued 
farming at St. Lawrence until 
1948 when they moved to their

present farm.
Survivors include his wife; 

three children, Anna (Edward) 
Klumpyan, Edna (John) Steger, 
both of Kohlsville and Herbert 
(Carol) of West Bend; eight 
grandchildren; four brothers, 
Frank (Louise) of Hartford; 
Peter, Theodore (Rose), both of 
St. Lawrence and Hubert (Car­
rie) of Linksville, Wis.; two 
sisters, Lorraine (Ted) Her­
mann of Hartford and Esther 
Breuer of Milwaukee, and other * 
relatives and friends.

Four brothers and two sisters 
predeceased.

He was a member of St. 
Anthony’s Men’s Society of St. 
Anthony’s Church.

Funeral services were Satur­
day at 10:15 a.m. at the Schmidt 
Funeral Home, West Bend and 
at 11 a.m. at St. Anthony’s 
Church. Father John Peifer 
officiated and burial was in the 
parish cemetery.

Visitation at the funeral home 
was after 3 p.m. on Friday with 
prayer vigil at 8 p.m. on Friday.

LEONARD WANGERIN
Leonard H. Wangerin, 96, of 

West Bend, died Tuesday, June 
27, at the Samaritan Home, 
West Bend.

He was born Oct. 1, 1881, in 
La Crosse, Wis., and in 1904 he 
married Minnie Hinke in Mer­
rill, Wis. She passed away in 
1972.

He married Emma Simon in 
1943 in Port Washington. She 
passed away in 1973.

He farmed in Merrill and the 
Town of Kewaskum and moved 
to West Bend after his retire­
ment.

Survivors include four child­
ren; Evelyn (Paul) Garbe of Port 
Washington, Lenora (Gerald) 
Brinkley of Lauderdale by the 
Sea, Fla., Floyd (Lenora) of

Sheboygan and Melvin (Gean- 
ette) of Merrill; eight grand­
children; eight great-grand­
children; and other relatives 
and friends.

Three brothers and one sister 
predeceased.

Funeral services were at 8 
p.m. Friday at the Techtman- 
Myrhum Funeral Home, West 
Bend. Rev. L. L. Pautz offi­
ciated and burial was in Merrill 
Memorial Park, Merrill.

Visitation at the funeral home 
was after 4 p.m. on Friday.

ANDREW RITGER
Andrew Ritger, 76, formerly 

of 5245 Sunset Drive, Kewas­
kum, died Wednesday, June 28, 
at the Samaritan Home, West 
Bend.

He was born April 19, 1902, 
in Allenton, and married Ella 
Roos. She passed away July 3, 
1973.

Survivors include one daugh­
ter, Gertrude Rauch, of Kewas­
kum; one grandchild; one sister 
Pauline (Joseph) Kulfuerdt, 
Kewaskum; nieces, nephews 
and other relatives and friends.

Funeral services were Sat­
urday at 9:15 a.m. from the 
Techtman-Myrhum Funeral 
home, West Bend, and at 10 
a.m. at Sacred Heart Church, 
Allenton. Rev. Florian Mac of­
ficiated and burial was in the 
parish cemetery.

Visitation at the funeral home 
was Friday after 4 p.m.

"He who serves his coun­
try well has no need of 
ancestors." Voltaire
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$7 00 Per Year Out of State
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NNA
Association - Founded 1885

Tired of messy carpet scrub­
bing with machines? Clean your 
carpet quickly and easily with 
Nylac. No machine. See Miller’s 
Fine Furniture for Nylac.

Of Local Interest
In touring the north on our 

way to Eagle River to celebrate 
the Fourth of July weekend we 
felt like we lost six months 
somewhere along the line when 
we walked into — of all things -- 
a New Year’s Eve party at the 
Holiday Inn in Rhinelander 
Saturday night — celebrating 
1978W.

At Mike G’s Ke-Was-Kum 
Inn in Antigo we were informed 
that we were the 50th and 51st 
persons from the Kewaskum 
area who registered there for 
the weekend in Mike’s “little 
black book.’’

SAVING FOR A RAINY DAY?

INSURED BY AN AGENCY 
OF THE FEDERAL GOVERNMENT ♦ Government regulations require a sub­

stantial interest penalty if Certificates 
are withdrawn before maturity.

SERVICE
IUUHTIEI SATISFACTION

• CARPET* VINYL
• DRAPERIES • WALLPAPER

K*R CARPET SERVICE INC.
“ihc complete *lore

IH MUN It inmil 1212111

;ewaskum

Ravings
mo

OFFICE OF WEST BENO
SAVINGS & LOAN ASSOCIATION

Kewaskum — Phone (>26-2186



Save ’7.40 with these budget stretching coupons!
DECORATOR, WHITE 

OR ASSORTED

Scot Towels
. Jumbo Roll

9-LIVES 
ASSORTED FLAVORS

Cat Food

Sentry Savings Coupon
SAVE
23*

lS

Sentry Savings Coupon

SAVE 
ir

ON ONE SIX PACK

Roni01 C 4 C
Ice Cream Ban 31

With Coupon

ON ONE 12 02 BAG 
REG OR KING SIZE

Fritos
Com Chips

With Coupon

Sentry Savings Coupon
SAVE 
75c

ON ONE 2 LB CAN REG 
ELECTRIC PERK OR A DC

Maxwell House a ^ q 5
Coffee □

With Coupon
S 21 v*> •’$•'!'» in»^> juv 11 un 

Um Ona Pai AMI Cart Vaba 1 2D'

Sentry Savings Coupon
SAVE 
10

ON ONE 11 OZ BOX POST

Cocoa Pebbles Or
Fruity Pebbles 90*

With Coupon
S 25 V*d ■( Sanity Tfvou^i JUy 11 19/1

FRESH CENTER CUT LOIN

PORK CHOPS
FRESH COUNTRY STYLE

SPARERIBS
Sentry Savings Coupon

Sentry Savings Coupon
SAVE 
40

ON ONE 1 LB CAN 
REG OR ELECTRIC PERK

Sanka Decaffeinated
Coffee $O

With Coupon •

Sentry Savings Coupon

ON ONE 15 02 BOTTLE LOTION

Head ft Shoulders
Shampoo $221

With Coupon
S 24 Vert el Sandy TleoMi Jitf 11 11H

Unai One Pei AM) Cart Veka I 20'

•1"
FRESH LOIN END

PORK ROAST

ICELANDIC

FROZEN HADDOCK

•1”
FRESH PORK

CHOP SUEY

OSCAR MAYER

BRAUNSCHWEIGER 
or 

SANDWICH SPREAD 

*59^

ON ONE 7OZ FAMILY SIZE
TUBE WITH FREE BRUSH

Colgate $4 05
Toothpaste »

With Coupon
S-27 Vert at Sandy thalli My 11 1911

Unai Ona Pai AMI Cart Vaka I 2D'

Sentry Savings Coupon
SAVE
22

ON ONE 14 OZ JAR

Ragu J°e EC 0
Sauce 33

With Coupon

S 31 Vrtaa Sandy RraaJiMr 11. UK 
Unai Ona Pai AMl Cart Vaba I 2D1

Sentry Savings Coupon
SAVE
30

ON ONE 64 02 BOTTLE 
IAUNDRY DETERGENT

Pu™ $189
Lqud ।

With Coupon
S 33 Vert ■ Sandy TbeMiJrt*11 UH 

Unai Ona Pai Mrt Cart Vrt» I »

Sentry Savings Coupon
SAVE

£

ON ONE 9 502 PKG 
HOME STYLE

Sara Lee
Poind Cake

With Coupon
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‘Peanuts’ 4-H Club News
RIVERSIDE 4 H

Our June meeting was 
brought to order by President 
Debra Fry on the 7th. Since 
June is Dairy Month we an­
swered roll call by naming our 
favorite dairy product. Most 
popular - ice cream.

The following members of our 
club will be taking part in 
“Anything Goes,” at the Coun­
ty Fair: Captain, Jeff Matter; 
Debra Fry, Doug Fry, Rick 
Standish. The substitutes are 
Randy Standish, Lynda Fry, 
Dan Schiefelbein and Tim Stan­
dish.

Our club will also be making a 
booth. Several members have

volunteered to be on the com­
mittee. Several titles were men­
tioned during the discussion. 
We will leave it up to the com­
mittee to decide.

The Fair books were handed 
out by Doug Fry. Mrs. Roden, 
our leader, handed out demon­
stration booklets.

After the meeting, we had a 
demonstration on baking oat­
meal cookies by Colleen Shaw. 
After the demonstration we all 
got a treat of a glass of milk and 
oatmeal cookies. Colleen did a 
good job. It being Dairy Month, 
we all enjoyed the treat.

Our next meeting will be July 
5 at 7:00 p.m.

Club Reporter 
Tim Standish

Annual

The
WIGWAM 

HALL 
Kewaskum 

82^ 2901

FRIDAY, JULY 7 
Rock With

PUNCH 
50* DRINKS 

FREE BEER 7:30 to 9:00

Kewaskum Fire Dept. 8 Rescue Squad

Peanuts was named by resi­
dents at Friendship House on 
the Cedar Lake Home Campus, 
in honor of President Carter. 
Peanuts, a toy poodle, is the

mascot for the home and travels 
from household to household 
making friends and bringing 
joy. “I just love him,” says 
Nina Wiedow,

Tom’s Country Inn
Highway 45, 5 Mi. North of Kewaskum

NEW HOURS

Starting June 26
MON. Closed
TUES. Open at 7:00 p.m. - Peanut Night 
WED. Closed
THURS. Open at 7:00 p.m. - Ladies Night
FRI. Open at 5:00 p.m.
SAT. Open at 1:00 p.m.
SUN. Open at 1:00 p.m. Close at 11:00 p.m.
Open all holidays at 7:00 p.m.

CLOSED JULY 9th FOR THE PICNIC

LIVE MUSIC
o Friday, July 14

o GLEN MOLDENHAUER BAND o
9:00-1:00- °

o Saturday, July 15
" UNCLE OZZIE

9:00-1:00
< ► sponsored by
] [ NEW FANE KETTLE RIDER S SNOWMOBILE CLUB

Friday, July 28

BILL SACKETT BAND
<> 9:00-1:00
O ________________________ __
O

J; Large Hall Available for All Occasions

B THEAMERAHN

t‘/i mile north of Kewaskum on Hwy. 45

PICNIC ;
I SATURDAY NIGHT & SUNDAY | 

| JULY 8-9 I 
I VILLAGE PARK IN KEWASKUM |
I Huge Parade at 12:00 Noon Sunday | 

| Featuring A 

| 10 BANDS; DRUM & BUGLE CORPS A 
! AND DRILL TEAMS J 

f Prizes Awarded for Best Floats & Kiddie Entries (Groups) f 
| - UVE ENTERTAINMENT - . | 

| SATURDAY NIGHT 7:30-11:30 In the Beer Garden | 

a The BEST in Country Rock , 
’ Featuring IDA RED I 
I SUNDAY - In the Beer Garden: I 

I SYL GROESCHEL 2:00-6:00 | 
| DANNY DARREN and the Drifting Playboys I 
| 7:30 - 11:30 J 
f Wisconsin’s King of Country Bluegrass I 
| ON THE BANDSTAND A 
| BOB KUETHER ORCHESTRA ! 

' Sunday Evening 7:00 -11:00 I 
I WATER FIGHTS AT 6:30 P.M. SUNDAY | 

| Rides - Games - Entertainment | 

| Bratwurst - Hamburgers - Refreshments |
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Campus Notes
Students who visited the 

University of Wisconsin-Madi­
son recently to begin registra­
tion for studies starting with the 
opening of the fall semester 
classes Sept. 5 included Mary 
R. Ciha, 9429 Mullen Drive, 
Allenton. She is a 1978 graduate 
of Kewaskum High School.

Dr. Kurt H. Buerger, Lake­
land College (Sheboygan) Dean, 
has released the names of 74 
students which appear on the 
Dean’s List for the second se­
mester. All have been fulltime 
students enrolled in at least four 
courses who have earned the 
minimum equivalent of two A’s

^}!2^$
w 

1978
L State Fair j

Reserved 
Grandstand 
Entertainment
Thurs., Aug. 10 
Andy Gibb 
2:00 PM-$3&$4 
7:30 PM-$3 & $4

Fri., Aug. 11
The Pat & Debbie
Boone Show 
2:00 PM-$2 & $3 
7:30 PM-$3 & $4

Sat., Aug. 12 
The Johnny Cash 
Show

p 6:00PM-$3&$4
k 8 30 PM-$3&$4

Sun., Aug. 13 
To Be Announced
7:30 PM

Mon., Aug 14
k The Osmonds 
B 2:00PM-$3&$4

7:30 PM-$3 & $4
Tues., Aug 15 
The Osmonds 
2:00 PM-$3 & $4 
7:30 PM-$3 & $4
Wed , Aug. 16 
To Be Announced 
2:00 PM 
7:30 PM
Thurs . Aug 17 
Kenny Rogers & 
Dottie West
6:00 PM-$3 & $4 
8:30 PM—$3 & $4
Fri., Aug 18 
Tanya Welk 
2:00 PM-$2 
(All Seats) 
Bob Hope 
7:30 PM-$3 & $4 
One Show Only

Sat, Aug. 19
The Sylvers & The 
Spinners
7:30 PM —$3 & $4

Sun., Aug 20
Drum & Bugle Corps
7:30 PM-$3
(All Seats)

Stars for remaining 
dates will be announced 
as soon as possible.

Tickets available at Park, 
all Ticketron outlets or 
mail. Order: Tickets, 
Wisconsin State Fair, 
State Fair Park, Dept. W, 

Milwaukee, Wl 53214
Include 50^ for 

handling. See you 
at the Fair.

and two B’s.
Area students who attained 

the distinction are: Kewaskum - 
Thomas Degnitz, senior and 
Marjorie Schoofs, sophomore; 
Campbellsport - Roxane Bar- 
telt, senior.

An area student is among 
students of the University of 
Wisconsin-Madison who have 
won honors recognition for out­
standing work in their studies. 
The student is: Terri Lynn Ber- 
telsen, 503 County Highway H, 
Kewaskum, Music Education.

George Rupp, Dean for Aca- 
dememic Affairs at the Univer­
sity of Wisconsin-Green Bay, 
has announced the UWGB aca­
demic honors list for the spring 
semester.

Among collegians earning re­
cognition is Susan M. Leider, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Marvin Leider, Route 2, Box 
120A2, Campbellsport. The 
scholastic honors are awarded 
to those students earning be­
tween 3.25 and 4.0 with 4.0 in­
dicating a straight “A” aver­
age.

Susan had a 3.80 average.

Three Kewaskum residents

The WIGWAM
Kewaskum
626-2901

WE RE ATIT AGAIN! 
SMORGASBORD 

EVERY SUNDAY 
10:30a.m. to2:00p.m.

Three entrees and our famous salad bar. We welcome 
group parties.
The price is right....................................................... O •

We are again serving our great 
Smorgasbord EVERY DAY starting at 4:30

Featuring King Crab, Barbequed Ribs, Broiled Sirloin Steak, 
Chicken, Walleye Pike, Baked Ham, Roast Beef, Baby Beef 
Liver and Onions, etc. with salad bar, including Fresh Shrimp.

ALL YOU CAN EATI 2.95
MONDAY, WEDNESDAY AND THURSDAY.................. $4.95
FRIDAY.....................................................................................$5.95
SATURDAY AND SUNDAY............................................... $6.95

OPEN 4:30 - CLOSED TUESDAYS

MUSIC FOR THE MONTH OF JULY —
JULY 7 & 8 ... 
JULY 14 & 15
JULY 21 & 22
JULY 28 & 29

NOON TiL 2 P.M. 

and 5 P.M. 'TIL 8 P.M.

Hwy. 67 Just One Mile 
E. of Hwy. 41, Lomira 
Phone 269-4331

were among the approximately 
2,626 University of Wisconsin- 
Whitewater students who a- 
chieved academic honors during 
second semester of the 1977-78 
school year.

Of the total, about 437 re­
ceived grades of straight “A” 
for a 4.0 average. Another 827 
had grade point averages of 
from 3.5 to 3.99 and also were 
accorded first honors. Second 
honors, for grade point aver­
ages of from 3.0 to 3.49 went to 
about 1,362. To earn honors, a 
student must carry at least 12 
credits with no grade below C.

First Honors - Randall L. 
Schmidt, 1350 Kewaskum St. 
Second Honors - Pamela K. 
Brenholt, 1016 Hillside Dr. and 
Sharon D. Schoofs, 302 Third 
St.

chers payable. A closed session 
will be held following the meet­
ing to discuss a personnel 
question.

Curriculum Items
On Board Agenda

The Kewaskum Board of Ed­
ucation will meet Monday, July 
10, 1978. The meeting will 
begin at 8 p.m. and will be held 
in the district administration 
offices.

Agenda items will include 
staffing questions left for 1978- 
79, two curriculum reports and 
acting on them, curriculum 
writing, and payroll and vou-

JORDANS’ 
in kewaskum

PHONE 626 4618
Open 11:00 Monday-Friday
Saturday and Sunday 10:00
Cocktail Hours 4 to 6 p.m.

Sunday thru Friday
Will be Closed Monday 'til 4 p.m.
Except Holidays and Rain Days 

HALL AVAILABLE FOR ALL OCCASIONS

JORDAN'S MONDAY NIGHT SPECIALS
7 P.M. -2 A.M.

PITCHER SHOTS
OF BEER (except call)
•1.00 25*

SUNDAY BUFFET
SUNDAY, JULY 9th

Our Sunday Buffet Featuring: Chicken Leg with 
Apple Almond Dressing, Barbecue Beef Ribs, Pork 
Tenderloin, with Our Famous Sunday Salad Bar and 
Dessert for

Wednesday Specials
WEDNESDAY NOON, JULY 12th

Beef Stroganoff Over Noodles. 
Includes; A Baked Apple, Ho-Made Muffin, and 
Beverage for

WEDNESDAY EVENING, JULY 12th
Ho-Made Potato Pancake and Wurst.

Includes: Apple Sauce, and Bavarian Torte for

3.95
Two Hits and A Miss
Doug Anscheutz 
Northerly Winds 
Doug Anscheutz

Open Monday's at 4:00 p.m.
Serving from 4:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m

CBM SLOT
LIVE ORGAN

DINNER MUSIC
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HONOR ROLL FOURTH QUARTER & SECOND SEMESTER 1977-78 SCHOOL YEAR ** 4.000 * 3.500 or above

SENIORS
FOURTH
QUARTER

SECOND 
SEMESTER

Acker, Robin X x Dreher, Randall
Asch, Carol X * x * Edgar, Tamala
Backhaus, Christine X Enright, Brian
Bade, David X x Gruber, Dorothy
Baumhardt, Jeanne X x Gust, Robin
Beisbier, Cheryl X * x * Haack, Cynthia
Beisbier, Patricia X * x * Jeske, Brian
Belger, Diane X * x * Jeske, Julie
Bodden, Mark X * x Johann, Debbie
Boden, Richard X ** x ** Kempf, Shelby
Ciha, Mary X x Kirchner, Mark
Coulter, Jacqueline X * x * Kleinmann, Richard
Coulter, Jennifer X * x * Kober, Barbara
Ehnert, Carol X * x * Koug1, Mary
Enright, Thomas x Kreuser, Jeanne
Fech ter, David X Kumrow, Kenneth
Garman, Dale X x Lawrenz, Lori
Gavin, Karen X x Matter, Jeffery
Grandin, Kathleen X * x * Menzel, Denise
Jaeger, Allan X * x * Merwin, Brian
Kardos, Marybeth X x * Milewski, Jean
Key, Victoria X * x * Miske, Karen
Kopping, Richard x Neitzel, Robin
Krueger, Kim x Otto , Laura
Lamp, Karen X * x * Perez, Antonio
Laubenstein, Barbara X x Reif, Scott
Lohrer, Frank X * x ** Scannell, Kelly
Markielewski , Brian X * x * Schaub, Michael
Matenaer, Joseph X * x * Schickert, Randy
Matenaer, Mark X * x Schladweiler, Jeffrey
Meyer, Susan X x Seefeldt, Steven
Nigh, Christine X ** x ** Sieger, David
Onuma, Kumiko X * x* Steger, Mark
Perkins, Timothy X x Steinert, Janet
Proeber , Carol X ** x Swanson, Joseph
Reindl, Theresa X ** x ** Thill, Jean
Ruplinger, Francis X x Vanderwall, Pamela
Ryan, Mary X * Wilkens, Dennis
Sauer, Kathleen X * x * Yearling, Julie
Scannell , Jean X * x Yogerst, Jane
Schaub, Jennifer X * x * Zwick, Leslie
Schladweiler, Elizabeth x * X
Schmid t, Dan X * x * SOPHOMORES
Schneider, Steven X * x *
Schoedel , Susan X Amerling, Joan
Schoofs, David X * x * Assch, Laura
Secor, Robert X ** x ** Batzler, Kathryn
Sieger , Renee X * x * Bremser, Diane
Steinhardt, Bruce X Czoschke, John
Stollenwerk, Lynnette X * x * Davis, Timothy
Strancke, Anne X * x * DeWane, Patrick
Strobel, Joanne X * x * Domasky, Mark
Swanson, Carrie X * x * Ehnert, Donna
Theisen, Nancy X Etta, Terry
Thull, Geralyn X * x * Foerster, Sherry
Turriago, Andriana X x Garman, Anne
VanAssche, Suzette X x Giese, Cary
VoIm, Kevin x Gilford, Renee
Wagner, Karen X * x Goeden, Wendy
Westerman, Larry X * x * Herriges, Joel
Wilson, Clifford X Jeske, Jeannine
Wulff , Kevin X x * Kern, Thomas

Kreuser, Jeffrey
JUNIORS Kumrow, Sheri

Laatsch, Eugene
Amerling, Sharon X x Lamp, Laureen
Becker, Jeanne X x * Manthei, Kim
Beisbier, Sandra X * x * Marquardt, Carol
Binder, Cindy X * x * Marx, Lori
Boden, Bonnie X x Matenaer, Janet
Bremser, Paul X * x * Melzer, John
Buss, Jeri X ** x a* Mlodzik, Gary
Collins, Pauline X x Nigh, Robert
Crass, Steve X * x Petermann, Jeffrey
Dean, David X * x * Peterson, Timothy
Dean, Denise X * x * Pettit, Michael
Deluisa, Phillip X Ritchie, Sandra
Det tmann. John X x Roehdanz, Lee
Domasky, Scott X ** x ** Rosenberger, Tom
Dominguez, Raymund x x * Schilter, Henry

FOURTH SECOND FOURTH SECOND
QUARTER SEMESTER QUARTER SEMESTER

x Schleif, Tracey x
x * x * Schmidt, Barbara x x *
x Schmidt, Roberta x
x x j Schultz, Todd x * x *
x x * Stefanovic, Richard x x
x * x Steger, Jeff x
x Steinhardt, Jeff x x
x * x * Stoffel, Nicole x x
x x Strancke, Charles x x
x x Strigenz, Andrew x x *
x x Subat, David x ** x *
x * x * Wilson, Laurel x ** x **
x Yearling, Jacqueline x ** x **
x x
x x * FRESHMEN
x * x *
x Amerling, Steven x x
x x * Bader, Darla x x
x x Beyer, Jeweleen x x
x * x * Bottleman, Christine x * x *
x x Brenholt, Mary x * x *
x x Brenner, Brian x x *
x * x * Bunkelmann, Julie x
x * x * Burg, Ann x *
x Butzke, Kelly x * x *

x Dreher, Brian x * x *
x ** x ** Dreher, Carrie x
x ** x * Etta, Jill x x
x x Gau, Robin x x

x Geldreich, James x
x x Giese, Cynthia x
x x Hanrahan, Joan x x
x * x Harlow, Sue x x
x Howell, Rick x x
x * x * Jung, Vernon x x
x * x * Kempf, Perry x * x *
x * x * Klein, Scott x
x Klug, Doreen x ** x **
x ** x ** Krueger, Mindy x x
x x Landvatter, Rhonda x x
x * x * Lehnerz, Jeff x ** x **
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Lemke, Laurie x * x **
Manthei, Brenda x x
Muench, Scott x x *

x x Muench, Steven x ** x *
x x Naumann, Robin x x
x * x * Neitzel, Dennise x x
x* x; * Nigh, Karen x* x *
x * x* Nigh,Teresa x* x*
x * x Petermann, Jill x
x x Prunty, Debra x x
x x Ritger, JuJie x
x x * Schlice, Debbie x * x *
x Scott, Ken x ** x **
x * x * Sieger, Patricia x * x *
x x Sopinski, Robert x x

x Spaeth, Tammy x * x *
x Strigenz, Anthony x x

x Yahr, Steven x x
x ** x ** Zemlicka, Julann x ** x *

x 
x x “It’s proper to go steady on
x x the highway, but don’t hug the

car ahead.
X ■ ■ ■ - .
x * x i
X X
X * X **

X X *
X * X *

X X

X
X X *

X X

X
X X
X

X X

X X
X X

^""OLE CROW"^
1uSr ANIMAL

1 SERVICE
* CASH or GLOVES

For Dead and 
Down Stock

>IAL TOLL FREE 
-800-242-0389 
-800-242-0343

mpt 3 Hour Service

P TO 6c A LB. 
e Korsak over 900 lb*, 
a* market allows.

E

Pro 

u 
for liv



West Bend Company Honors Three Employees for 25 Years of Service

SECOND 
EMESTER

x 
x *

X *

X

X
X

X
X
X *

X *

_x **
X **

X
X

X
X *

X *
X *

X

Harold Backhaus

X

X

X

X

X

X

X
X *

X **

X
X

The West Bend Company has honored three employees for 
their 25 years of service to the company.

Harold A. Backhaus, Kewaskum, Robert J. Scheurman, 
Kewaskum, and Ivan T: ^^ son, St. Cloud, started with West 
Bend June 1, 1953.

Backhaus first worked as a production operator. In 1954 he 
became a semi-auto sanding machine operator. He later worked 
with an auto buffing machine. Since 1970 Backhaus has held the 
job of hi-lite sunray machine set-up and operation.

He and his wife, Frieda, have eight children, Jim, Gary, 
Ronald, Geralyn, John, Darlene, Linda and Scott.

Scheurman has held a number of jobs with the company, 
handler, auto sanding, heavy draw press operation and as a 
working foreman in returned goods checking. He later worked in 
the Industrial Engineering Department for nine years. In 1974 
he returned to heavy draw press operation.

Thompson's first 12 years with the company were spent 
working with polishing machines. In 1965 he moved to the

Maintenance Department as an electrician. He is presently 
classified as a “master electrician" with the company.

Thompson is married to the former June Zautcke.

Hair Shaping Class Scheduled at MPTI
FOND DU LAC — The 

Hair Shaping course at 
Moraine Park Technical In­
stitute (MPTI) is designed to 
update hair dressers in the 
latest trends of hair shaping 
and styling, including the 
proper use of the blow dryer 
and various curling irons by 
demonstration and acts of 
participation.

A variety of hair design 
techniques, such as combing,

pivot rollers, pm curls, hair 
pins, braiding and other 
methods will be discussed 
and demonstrated One class 
is devoted primarily to more 
advanced color techniques.

The course will begin Mon­
day, July 17, at the Fond du 
Lac campus and will run for 
six Mondays from 6:30-9:10 
p.m. Cost is $6 50

For pre-registration, call 
MPTI, 922-8611, ext. 212.

Geri’s
BEAUTY SALON

114 Main Street

Featuring
Helene Curtis UNIPERMS

In Savings & Loan Bldg. 
(Rear Entrance) 

PHONE 626 4455

X **

X **

X

X
X

X
X

X * 

X **

X *

X 
X *

X
X 

X *
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Rescue Squad Calls
Wednesday, July 28 - Call 

was received to home of Ed 
Breuer, 76, 6088 Hwy. D, West 
Bend. Patient was transported 
to St. Joseph’s Community 
Hospital, West Bend, by Kohls- 
ville Fire Department.

Thursday, June 29 - William
F. Krueger, 89, Route 2, Camp- . Kewaskum High School and is a
bellsport, removed to St. Jo­
seph’s Community Hospital 
from 1114 Auburn & Ashford 
Rd., Fond du Lac County, with 
illness.

Tuesday night, July 4 - 
Patricia Langacker, 41, and 
Harold Langacker, 54, 60 W. 
Follett, Fond du Lac, removed 
to St. Agnes Hospital, Fond du 
Lac, from Hwy. 45 and Auburn 
and Ashford Rd. with injuries 
suffered in an auto accident.

Wednesday, July 5 - Eugene 
A. Beitsch, 52, Route 3, Camp­
bellsport, removed to St. Jo­
seph’s Community Hospital 
from Honeck Chevrolet, Ke­
waskum, with injuries suffered 
when a tire blew.

Sales & Service

Richard C. Gust

PUPPYLAND
ANNOUNCES

to

GARDEN

For Wonderful Springtime 
Comfort, The Yem Around

Rt. 3, Kewaskum 
Phone 626-2553

156 N. MAIN ST. 
WEST BEND, WIS.

Office Phone 338-1313 
Residence Phone 626-2765

and is an Air Traffic 
N.M.

AMEmCANFAMILY
AMtRICAN FAMILY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO.

Sticking with someone 
through thick and thin is 
the plight of a husband 
with a wife on a reducing 
diet.

Better call your American Family 
Man. He has the

for all your family's insurance 
needs.

AUTO • HOME • CONTENYS 
HEALTH • LIFE

Controller at Holloman AFB,

• Featuring Nu-Wool
UL Approved Mutual

slipping up on your 
INSURANCE 

RESPONSIBILITIES?

RESPONSE/ABILITY

LAWN

CHANGE OF NAME

Puppyland Animal Care Center, Inc. has 
changed their name to Puppyland Humane 
Society, Inc. We wanted to be this for a 
long time, because we gave our all to the 
animals for 31 years with the help of all our 
dear friends, whom we thank very much. It 
is much appreciated. We also have dogs,
pups and cats for adoption. Call or come 
Hwy. D, 3456 north of West Bend.

Puppyland Humane
Society, Inc

Schoofs - Steinhardt
Mr. and Mrs. Allen Schoofs, 

Route 2, Kewaskum, are proud 
to announce the engagement of 
their daughter, Mary, to Mark 
Steinhardt, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Dave Domasky, Route 1, Ke­
waskum.

Mary is a 1977 graduate of

Butler-Butz
Mr. and Mrs. Lewell C. Butler of Mesilla Park, N.M., 

are proud to announce the engagement of their 
daughter, Betty Jean, to Sgt Richard L Butz, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Butz of 1325 Parkview Dr., Ke­
waskum.

Betty is a 1972 graduate of Las Cruces High School 
and a 1978 graduate of New Mexico State University.

Richard is a 1973 graduate of Kewaskum High School

KAREN BREITZMAN 
Phan* 533-8094

WALLY’S
BIKE SHOP

Sales & Service

Kewaskum

John Deere 
Tractors, Riders, Snowmobiles 

Arctic Cat 
Snowmobiles & Accessories 

Lawn Boy Mowers 
Jacobsen Mowers
Toro Mowers & Nylon Line 
Trimmers

Spirit Outboard Motors 
Blue Fin Fishing Boats 
Heavy Hauler Trailers 
Homelite Chainsaws 
Atlas Lawn Mowers 
Green Machine Weedeaters 
Ariens Tractors & Riders 
Ariens Rear & Front Tine
Tillers

STORE HOURS 
Mon. & Fri. till 9 p.m. 

Tues. Wed. Thurs. till 5 p.m. 
Sat. till 3; Closed Sun.

SHOP HOURS 
8 to 5 Daily, Closed Sat.

student at Fond du Lac MPT1 in 
Cosmetology.

Mark is a 1978 graduate of 
Fond du Lac MPTI in Mechan­
ical Design and is employed at 
Wacker Corp, of Hartford.

Future plans are being made 
by the couple.

ELECTION NOTICE
VOTING BY ABSENTEE BALLOT

NOW- INTERTHERM Electric 
HOT WATER HEAT AND 
AIR CONDITIONING 
WITHOUT PLUMBING

WATER AND ANTI-FREEZE SEAL­
ED-IN PERMANENTLY...NEVER 
NEEDS REFILLING. INSTALLED 
PERMANENTLY FOR ENTIRE 
HOMES. APARTMENTS, ETC.
HEALTHIEST— Circulating hot 
water gives you the kind of controll­
ed alf-over warmth many doctors 
choose for their own homes, as well 
as prescribe for their allergic pa­
tients, without the contamination and 
dry, parched air that other methods 
of heating give, and without dust or 
dirt blowing around.
SAFEST— Place your filmiest 
drapes right over the heater without 
the slightest danger. More important, 
children and pets can't be burned.
ECONOMICAL— Ycu get bal­
anced, steady warmth even when 
current Is turned off. After thermostai 
turns off electric element, circulating 
hot water continue- to circulate hear 
for comfortable warmth.

JOHANN, INC.
• Plumbing • Heating

• Air Conditioning
Sales A Service

Located in St. Michaels, 3 miles 
cost of Kewaskum on Hwy 28 
Deily 8-5: Fri "til 9; Set. 'ti 1

PHONE 
334-9411

Spring Into Action With 
BLAZE INSULATION

Birth
STERN - A son to Mr. and 

Mrs. David Stern, Fillmore, 
, Monday, July 3. "Friendship’s the wine of 

life." Edward Young

TRUCKS • BOATS - STOCK CARS - SIGNS

317 N. Railroad St. 
Campbellsport, Wl

626 2781 AFTER 
Ride a Bike — I

I 6:00 P. M. 
Stay in Shape

Any qualified voter, unable to get to the polling place on election day, 
may ask to vote by absentee ballot. A qualified voter Is one who is a 
U. S. citizen, will be 18 years of age or older on election day, and who 
has resided in the ward or aldermanic district where voting In desired 
to be accomplished for at least 10 days prior to the election. If the 
voter resides in a municipality which requires voter registration, then 
registration is also a requisite for the voter who is qualified in other 
respects.

To obtain an absentee ballot, contact the clerk In the city, village or 
town in which you reside by mail or telephone, or In person, and 
request an application form. After properly completing and returning 
the application to the municipal clerk, an absentee ballot will be sent 
to you along with a postage pre-paid return envelope or given to you if 
the application is submitted to the clerk in person. The deadline for 
receipt of the application by the municipal clerk is 5:00 p.m. on the 
day before the election if applying in person, or 5:00 p.m. on the 
Friday before the election if applying by mail.

Absentee ballots can be marked at home anytime after they arrive in 
the mail. They can also be marked right in the clerk's office If 
submitting the application in person. If returning the ballots by mail, 
the affidavit-certificate must be properly completed and witnessed by 
two persons. If returning the ballots in person, the affidavit-certi­
ficate must be properly completed and subscribed and sworn to by 
the clerk or the deputy clerk who are authorized to administer oaths. 
In either case the marked, sealed ballot must be in the hands of the 
issuing municipal clerk on or before election day. Any absentee ballot 
received at the polling place after the polls close or received In 
incomplete or improper form cannot be counted.

GEORGE F NEHRBASS, COUNTY CLERK 
WASHINGTON COUNTY

Before the rush begins, take 
advantage of our Low Over­
head and Low Costs!!

Class 1 Insulation
For Free Estimates on 
Attics and Sidewalls

CALL:
KIM RODENKIRCH 

Phone 626-8007 
Kewaskum, Wl 53040
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the flag re-

be flown on 
and days in

concept.
The flags will 

special occasions 
Kettle Heights.

Each color of

Residents Now Have Flag

West Bend

I

Pet Mctntm. 
Slinger

presents a part of the residents 
life on campus. According to 
Ken Jahncke, the green and 
white theme of the flag rep­
resents the Cedar Lake Home 
colors. The white background 
stands for purity, the red for 
courage, hardiness, heart and 
volunteer services, and the 
yellow cross, which is the most 
luminous color of the spectrum 
reminds viewers to live as 
Christians. The key on the flag 
is shown as a welcome to their 
new home and the beauty of the 
Kettle Moraine area is repre­
sented by the trees on the flag.

The flag was designed to 
welcome people to a Christian 
friendly home among nature’s 
beauty of trees, and signifies 
pure living with courage, hardi­
ness and volunteer service of 
love to one another.

There are 45 residents in 
Kettle Heights.

Kettle Heights, the indepen­
dent living community for re­
tirees on the Cedar Lake Home 
Campus, now has a village flag.

The flag was designed by 
Ken and Harriet Jahncke, the 
embroidery was done by Norma 
Bergmann and the sewing by 
Alice Kaun, all of whom reside

in Kettle Heights.
Residents of Kettle Heights 

approved the design and pre­
sented it to the Campus Resi­
dent Council who passed the

Veterinary Services 
LARGE & SMALL ANIMALS 

WOODVIEW 
VETERINARY CLINIC

Dr*. Basha rd & Thornborrow 
North Point Shopping Center 

Hwy. 45 N. of West Bend 
_______Phone 33* 1838_______

J&J AUTO
SERVICE

Complete 
Automotive Service 

Tires 
Batteries 
Mufflers 
Brakes 

Major & Minor 
Engine Repair 

Ignition Repair

Front End 
Alignment

450 E MAIN. KEWASKUM 
PHONE 626 2311

Meet the Men of

AUTO CRAFT

Dan Berres. Owner. 
West Bend West Bend

Lynn Vorgt 
Campbellsport

These trained men are dedicated to building a business on professional work 
fast service and friendliness that you as our customer deserve.
This is why we proudly say:

PICK YOUR BODY SHOP BEFORE WE MEET BY ACCIDENT
Take Hwy 45 south of Kewaskum four miles to Trap Shoot Lane.

(road to West Bend Sportsmen's Club) 
or call 338-0379

ft————+——+—*—+**•——****—*+——**—**————**

W 7

Marriage Licenses
Randall J. Bartelt, Route 1,

Campbellsport, and Shirley 
Martinson, Campbellsport.

Gary Leo Sina, Route 
^Campbellsport, and Joy

3, 
0.

Green, 265 Gertrude Ave., 
Fond du Lac.

Shawn T. Laughlin, 151 
Cleveland St., North Fond du 
Lac, and Gale M. Barter, Route 
1, Campbellsport.

HOT MIX ASPHALT PAVING
ROADS PARKING AREAS DRIVEWAYS

FLOORS FARM YARDS TENNIS COURTS

RAM
CONSTRUCTION INC.

For FREE Estimates Call Day or Nite
021-4810

Address P.O. Box 98 Byron, Wise 53009

/trust honeck\
AND

CHEVROLET

1978 Ford ’4 ton pickup, 
Ranger, 6 cylinder, 3 
speed, 7,000 miles.

USED CARS USED TRUCKS
1977 Chevrolet Chev­
ette. 2 door, 4 cylinder, 
4 speed.
1976 AMC Pacer 2 door, 
6 cylinder, automatic, 
16,000 miles.

1977 Chevrolet Subur­
ban, 3 seat, 350 V8, 
automatic, 10,000 miles.

1975 Chevrolet Impala 4 
door, 350 V8, automatic, 
air conditioning, 49,000 
miles.

1975 Chevrolet Impala 4 
door, 350 V8, automatic, 
air conditioning, 46,000 
miles.

1974 Chevrolet Caprice 
6 passenger station wag­
on, 350 V8, automatic 
transmission, 57,000 miles

1974 Chevrolet Chevelle 
Sport Coupe, 350 V8, 3 
speed transmission, 
26,000 miles.

1974 Chevrolet Corvette 
Sting Ray, 350 V8 
automatic, AM-FM, 
50,000 miles.

1973 Chevrolet Nova 2 
door, 350 V8, automatic 
transmission, 57,000 
miles.

1973 Chevrolet Impala 
convertible, 350 V8, 
automatic, 60,000 miles.
1974 Oida Wagon, 3 
seat, 350 V8, automatic, 
AM FM stereo, 42,000 
miles.
1973 Chevrolet Chevelle 
Laguna coupe, 350 V8, 3 
speed on floor, 51,000 
miles.
1973 Chevrolet Impale 4 
door, 350 V8, automatic, 
52,000 miles.

1977 Chevrolet % ton 
pickup 350 V8, 4 speed, 
14,000 miles.

1977 Chevrolet ’A ton 
pickup, 305 V8, 
automatic, 11,000 miles.

1976 Chevrolet 1 ton cab 
and chassis, 350 V8, 4 
speed, 62,000 miles.

1976 Chevrolet Blazer.
350 V8, automatic trans­
mission. 48.000 miles.

1975 Chevrolet van % 
ton, 350 V8. automatic, 
48,000 miles.

1975 GMC % ton 4x4 
pickup, with cap, 350 V8, 
automatic.

1975 Chevrolet % ton 
4x4 pickup with plow, 
350 V8, 4 speed, 19,000 
miles.

1974 Chevrolet % ton 
pickup, camper special, 
464 V8, automatic, 56,000 
miles.

1974 Chevrolet Subur­
ban, 350 V8, automatic, 2 
seat, back doors.

1974 Chevrolet ’A ton 
pickup, 350 V 8, 
automatic, 36,000 miles.

1974 Chevrolet
Camino 350 
automatic, Estate 
26,000 miles.
1974 Chevrolet

El 
V8 ,

Pack,

1973 Chevrolet Monte 
Carlo 350 V8, automatic, 
46,000 miles.

154” CA, 350 V8, 4 speed 
2 speed rear axle.

C6C,

ri. 9-9; Sat. til 5
Can Trust

I ■ II—



Page 12
Kewaskum Statesman

Friday, July 7, 1978
Gehl Company Provides Booklets to County Fifth Graders

A total of 2,000 environ­
mental booklets were provided 
by the Gehl Company recently 
to all the fifth grade students in 
Washington County.

problems through local conser­
vation districts whose boun­
daries are usually the same as 
the county. So today there are 
nearly 3,000 local districts in the

Standing left to right facing 
the picture are: Robert Rey­
nolds - Fifth grade teacher, 
Slinger Elementary School. 
Frank Vlasek - Slinger High

vation District, Slinger High 
School. Seated are fifth grade 
members of Mr. Reynolds class 
reviewing SCSA environmental 
educational booklets.

Goodwill Reaches
Goal After Fire Loss

Goodwill Industries, Milwau­
kee Area, Inc. has made up the 
loss sustained by a warehouse 
fire last July. Roger Matthews, 
Executive Director of the re­
habilitation agency announced 
today, that the goal of 250,000 
pounds of clothing has been 
reached. This amount is in ad­
dition to the normal monthly 
collection of about 700,000 
pounds.

“We are most grateful for the 
support and concern of our 
neighbors and friends. None of 
our programs were curtailed nor 
lay-offs made during this per­
iod. To continue our vocational 
training programs for the han­
dicapped, we need to maintain 
donations at a steady level. We 
urge our contributors to re­
member Goodwill in the 
month’s ahead,” Matthews 
said.

Goodwill is located at 6055 
North 91st St., and has two 
retail stores, at the North 91st 
Street location, and at 3305 
West Forest Home Avenue.

This year’s booklet is en­
titled, “America’s Conservation 
District, the Idea that worked!” 
They are published by the Soil 
Conservation Society of Amer­
ica and distributed to the 
schools by the Washington 
County Soil and Water Con­
servation District Junior Board.

The booklet explains how the 
dust storms in the 1930’s spur­
red the nation to action to pass 
the first soil conservation leg­
islation in 1935 establishing the 
Soil Conservation Service. It 
tells how the SCS works directly 
with landowners on erosion

U. S., Puerto Rico and the 
Virgin Islands.

Titles of some of the booklets 
distributed through the Gehl 
Company in past years were 
“Food and the Land,” “Plants, 
How They Improve Our En­
vironment.” “Working Toge­
ther for a Livable Land” and 
“The Earth, Our Home in 
Space.”

School Vo Ag teacher. Jerry 
Krenz - Gehl Company, West 
Bend. Tim Anderson - Wash­
ington County Soil and Water 
Conservation District Techni­
cian. Dan Ritger - Member 
Junior Board, Washington 
County Soil and Water Conser­
vation District, Slinger High 
School. Jim Vogt - Member 
Junior Board, Washington 
County Soil and Water Conser-

WELDING SERVICES

Roger & Dan’s
Auto Service, Inc.

Your Automotive 
Needs 

With
Many Years Experience

Major Tune-ups 
— O — 

Brakes & 
Mufflers 

•»♦ * 
ELECTRICAL SYSTEMS

Carburetor Overhauls 
□ □

SHOCKS, TIRES 
& BATTERIES 

X X X X
24 Hr. Wrecker 

Service
«91 FOND DC LAC AVE.

Kewaskum
626-2888

master charge

The Weld Shop

Bill Gruss
Phone 626-4771

Old Bridge Road, 2 miles north of Kewaskum on G

CARPET - UPHOLSTERY
Cleaning Service
Professional
Deep Steam* Extraction 
No Soap Residue, Fast Drying 
Safe and Gentle for All Fibers 
Ask About Our 
( arpet Protection Treatment

FREE ESTIMATES 
Residential - Commercial

Call 338-0783 Anytime

!:
::

0
REPLACES ANY BRAND OF 
CENTRAL AIR CONDITIONER

CUTOPERATinG COSTS 
ujith fl new

Lower Electric Bills — The Carrier Round One 
II was designed for energy conservation. Big 
coil, efficient compressor and fan.

Syl’s Carpet & Upholstery Cleaning Svc.
Greater Quiet — One of the quietest units 
Carrier has ever made.

THE SUPER MARKET 
OF AUTO REPAIRS 

Goeden Auto Body 
Complete Auto Body Repairs 

and Painting Professionally Done

INSURANCE ESTIMATES AND REPAIRS 
OUR SPECIALTY

Automotive - Tune-Ups - Exhaust - Brakes 
Tires Anti-Freeze - Texaco Products 

ALL DONE TO YOUR SATISFACTION 
24 HOUR TOWING

Hy. 28 E. of Kewaskum in St. Michaels 
334-2759

Try Our Personalized Service

It works with what you’ve got — Adapts easily 
to various sized coils and duct systems.

More Reliable — Built extra-tough for years of 
trouble-free operation.

THE ROUND ONE II IS MORE EFFICIENT 
THAN ANY AIR CONDITIONER YOU MIGHT 
HAVE PURCHASED EIGHT OR TEN YEARS 
AGO! A

Let us show you why. Call today for free 
estimate.

Johann, Inc.
Plumbing • Heating • Air Conditioning

■ SALES AND SERVICE ■
PHONE 

334 9481

Located tn St. Michaels, 3 miles east 
of Kewaskum on Hwy. 28 

Daily 8-5; Fri. 'til 9, Sat. 'til 1

■.WAV-'



Summer Home
Economist Named

Diane Marie Haen of Kau­
kauna, Wis., has been named 
U.W. Extension Summer Home 
Economist. She began her re­
sponsibilities in the home e- 
conomics program on June 1 in 
Washington County.

Diane is a graduate of U.W. 
Stevens Point in 1978. During 
the summer of 1975 and 1976, 
she worked as a Summer Pro­
gram Assistant for youth in the 
Expanded Food Nutrition Ed­
ucational Program in the Out­
agamie County Extension Of­
fice. She did her student teach­
ing at Neil Armstrong High 
School, Neenah,, Wis.

While working as summer 
home economist, her jobs will 
be in assisting and answering 
consumer questions and in-

volvement in 4-H activities, 
food preservation workshops, 
weight control programs, and 
general home economics pro­
jects.

Takes Summer Job
John Wheeler, a student at 

the University of Arkansas, 
Pine Bluff, is working with the 
Soil Conservation Service as a 
student trainee in the West

Bend field office this summer.
John is assisting Don Kurer 

and Ivan Kumrow to plan and 
install soil and water conserva­
tion practices in Washington 
County. He will be returning to 
college in the fall to complete
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his formal education.

Give a gift subscription to 
the Statesman.

THE ORJGINAL 
PLASTIC COVER 

Ua^
CARRY-HOME’ 

COYERSLI
Used by Millions of

Home Owners. Farmery 
Campers Boaters and Gardeners'

LAKKT MUMt
Coverall

Look lor the Bright Yellow Package 

Take This Ad To Your Dealer 
To Be Sure

You Get The Right Product

128 MAIN ST. 
626^2164

School District of Kewaskum
Kewaskum, Wisconsin 53040

NOTICE OF BUDGET HEARING /
Notice is hereby given to the Qualified electors of the School 
District of Kewaskum that the budget hearing will be held in the 
Multi-Purpose Room of Kewaskum Hiqh School on the 24th dav of 
July, 1978, at 8 P.M. o’clock.

SUMMARY BUDGET - 1977-78
Fund 100 (General Fund)

RECEIPTS

REVENUE-Local Sources 
REVENUE-State Sources 
REVENUE-Federal Sources 
NO J-RE VENUE Receipts

Actual Budget
1976-77 1977-78

1,887,133.21 1,774,120.00
1,266,211.11 1,407,000.00

15,250.07 Fund 200
377.00 350.00

Actual 
1977-78 thru 
Mav 31 
1,746,600.62 
1,391,999.97 
Fund 200

2,803.67

Proposed 
1978-79

1,829,R81.00 
1,615,627.00 
Fund 200

l,6no.on

Current Loans
3,168,971.39 3,181,470.00 3,141,404.26

54^,000.00
3,447,108.nn

5on,nno.nn
3,686,404.26 3,947,108.on

ADMINISTRATION 
INSTRUCTION 
HEALTH SERVICES 
PUPIL TRANSPORTATION 
OPERATION OF PLANT 
MAINTENANCE OF PLANT 
FIXED CHARGES 
TRANSFERS TO OTHER DISTRICTS 
DEBT SERVICE (Fund 100) 
CAPITAL OUTLAY(2200) 
CAPITAL OUTLAY(2300) 
COMMUNITY SERVICES 
NET DISBURSEMENTS (Federal Prq. 
TRANSFERS TO OTHER FUNDS

EXPENDITURES 
70,615.40 89,860.00

1,745,861.91 1,964,265.00
199.46 350.00

244,368.04 275,850.00
273,406.61 298,455.00
84,617.93 72,140.00

402,798.99 451,600.00
764.00 800.00

315,908.79 1,500.00
40,004.82 -----
22,921.27 26,650.00

29.97 -----
) 7,578.79

80,698.93
1,515,799.94

413.44
248,873.72
254,628.70
75,713.01

328,622.58
2,333.42
5,783.39

12,624.29

179,173. on 
2,521,182.nn

133.nn 
3n5,800.00 
311,421.nn 
74,n22.nn 

In other 
categories

3.000.00 
2,095.00

28,625.00

21,657.00
TOTAL
CURRENT LOANS

3,209,075.98 3,181,470.00 2,525,491.42
545,000.00

3,447,108.00
500,000.00

RECEIPTS
TRANSFER FROM FUND 100 
EXPENDITURES

REVENUE - Local Sources 
FROM DEBT SERVICE SAVINGS 
EXPENDITURES

RECEIPTS
Payments
Aids
Other

FUND 200 (SPECIAL PROJECTS)

FUND 300(DEBT SERVICE)

FUND 500(FOOD SERVICES)

99,000.00
50,000.00
1,000.00

3,070,491.42

21,382.09

12,513.48

311,905.54

320,477.95

98,012.52
59,633.31

3,947,108.00

26,998.00
21,657.00
48,655.00

324,633.00
10,516.00

335,149.00

100,400.00
69,240.00

500.00

EXPENDITURES
Wages, Fringe Benefits 
Food
Other Supplies 
Mi seel laneous

RECEIPTS

70,000. 00 
75,000.00 
4,000.00 
1,000.00

FUND 600 (STUDENT ACTIVITIES) 
55,000.00

73,181.38
66,850.15

3,360.31
2,448.64

52,897.57

•

78,850.00
80,000.00
7,oon.no 
4,290.00

4 5, oon. 00

EXPENDITURES 55,000.00 49,201.42 45,000.00
DETAI LED COPIES OF THE BUDGET ARE AVAILABLE TN THE DISTRICT 
ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICE AT 1450 SCHOOL STREET, KEWASKUM, WI. 
DETAILED BUDGETS WILL BE MM ILD TO EVERYONE ON THE NEWSLETTER 
MAILING LIST AND WILL BE AVAILABLE AT THE BUDGET HEARING AND 
ANNUAL MEETING.

Dated this 29th day of June, 1978

/ /fames D. Oelhafen, Clerk 
School District of Kewaskum
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WANTED: Small home in Vil­
lage of Kewaskum -- Call Coul­
ter Realty at 334-7411. 7-7-lt

WANTED - Housekeeper in 
Kewaskum, Monday thru Fri­
day, 10:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. 
Phone 626-4313, if no answer

SERVICES OFFERED - Pere 
tests - septic systems installed - 
swimming pools - field tilling. 
Schwartz Trenching. Phone Ar­
nold Kutz 334-5004 or Gary

FOR SALE - House at 1603 
Fond du Lac Ave., Kewaskum. 
Must be razed. Purchaser must 
furnish own liability insurance. 
Make an offer in writing to Wil­
liam Martin, Clerk, Village of 
Kewaskum, 204 First St. 4-14-tf

CARI) OF THANKS

call 626-2374. 7-7-tf

FOR RENT - Lower one bed­
room apartment, 1349 Kewas­
kum St. $110.00 per month. $50 
security. No pets. 626-2608 7-7tf

FOR SALE - Farmall A tractor 
with two row cultivator and 
wheel weights. Call 626-4661.

7-71t

FOR SALE - Kewaskum 3 bed­
room ranch with 114 baths, first 
floor utility room, air, paneled 
basement, 2-car attached ga­
rage. Appointment only. Phone
626-4494 7-7tf

FOR SALE - Late strawberries, 
picked or pick your own. Bring 
your own containers. Open daily 
for the next two weeks. 
Schmitt’s Berry Farm, 14 mile 
west of Elmore. Phone 533-
8419. 6-30-2t
FOR SALE -’72 Ford van; 
60,000 miles, needs some body 
work. $1295. Ph. 626-4496.

6-30-2t

FOR SALE - 1977 Chrysler New 
Yorker Brougham, 2-door hard­
top, 12,000 miles, loaded. 
$6,295. Ph. 626-2374.^6-23-2t

HELP WANTED - 15-year-old 
boy willing to learn the res­
taurant trade. Apply in person 
at the Wigwam, Kewaskum.

6-23-tf
FOR RENT - 2 bedroom apart­
ment in village ofCampbell- 
sport. $150. No pets. Security 
deposit. Garage. 629-5816
FOR RENT - One bedroom 
upper apartment. Includes 
heat, water and electric. Single 
person only. No pets. $160 
month plus security deposit.
Phone 626-4597 6-23-tf

FOR RENT - Lovely 2 bedroom 
apartment in Kewaskum. Shag 
carpet throughout with appli­
ances. $170 plus security de- 
oosit. Ph. 626-4735. 8-12-tf

HELP WANTED - Waitresses, 
and/or cooks helper; experience 
preferred. Apply in person at 
the Wigwam, Kewaskum. 4-14-t

FLITTERS 
CARPET CLEANING 

-Free Estimates- 
Roger Flitter Ph. 533-4954

OFFICE OR STORAGE SPACE 
Available in Kewaskum. Phone 
Kewaskum Savings, 626-2186 tf

RENTAL - Fold down campers. 
Greg’s Trailer Rental, Hwy. 67 - 
one mile east of Lomira. Open 
daily after 2:00 p.m. - 7 days a 
week. Phone 269-4478 5-26-tf

LEN LUTERBACH CONTRAC­
TOR - Mason, cement, car­
pentry, trenching and bulldoz­
ing. Quality work at competitive 
prices. For free estimate, call 
338-3305 or 692-9*233 collect tf

SCHULZ 
REAL ESTATE CORP. 
Broker* — Builder* 

MONICA SCHULZ. Broker 
JAMES SCHULZ. BuNder 

2NS «L Washington, Wool Bond 
Rhone MB-10B

Schwartz 994-4535

HIGHEST PRICES paid for old 
newspapers, copper, brass, a- 
luminum, lead and batteries. 
Lynn’s Waste Paper Co., 121 
Island Ave., West Bend, Wis. tf

SERVICES OFFERED - Small 
engines, motorcycle, snowmo­
bile, lawn and garden equip­
ment and outboard repair. 
Ked-Web of Kewaskum. 1204 
Fond du Lac Ave. Phone 626-
4344.

FRIENDLY HOME Toy Parties 
now in our 23rd year is ex­
panding and has openings for 
managers and dealers. Party 
Plan experience helpful. Guar­
anteed toys and gifts. No cash 
investment - No service charge 
to customers - No collecting/ 
delivering. Car/Phone neces­
sary. Call collect/Carol Day.

NOTE OF THANKS
My sincere thanks to my 

family, relatives and friends for 
visits, gifts, flowers and cards 
while I was a patient at St. 
Joseph’s Hospital. Special 
thanks to Fathers Pesch and 
Budde for their visits. Thank 
you all.

We wish to thank all our 
relatives, friends and neighbors 
for their kind expression of 
sympathy during the recent 
death of our dear*’ brother, 
brother-in-law and uncle, 
RAYMOND ZEIMET. Special 
thanks to Father John Budde, 
donors of masses and floral 
pieces, Robert G. Romaine Post 
No. 384, emergency room staff 
at St. Joseph’s Hospital, or­
ganist, choir, traffic officer, 
donor of car, Miller’s, and to all 
who showed their respect in any 

• way.
Mr. & Mrs. Walter Schneider 

and family

respect in any way. It was 
greatly appreciated.

Sisters-in-law
Brother-in-law
Mr. & Mrs. Ruben Schultz 

and family

Oscar Boegel
518-489-8395. 7-75p

SHEBOYGAN CO.

338. LARGE COUNTRY HOME, featuring family room on the first floor, 
also living room, kitchen and Vi bath. Upstairs has 3 bedrooms and full 
bath. Large detached garage Situated on 1 plus acres, only $41,500.00.

APPROX. 4 ACRES with building site. Nice View! Kewaskum school 
district. $14,000.00.

CAMPBELLSPORT

353. STATELY OLDER HOME on a quiet street. Located in Campbell­
sport. Seller transferred, house Is being remodeled and could be 
finished by buyer. A great opportunity for the handyman! 3 bedrooms, 
1% bath, 4-car garage. $37,900 00

KEWASKUM
330. WHITEWOOD ESTATES SUBDIVISION. Ranch, 1-year new, 2.76 
acres. 3 bedrooms, fireplace, built in range, oven, dishwasher, etc. 
Exposed basement, patio door, 2% car garage. $69,900.00.

WEST-GROVE REALTY 
548 South Main, West Bend 

334-5589

FOR SALE

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to thank all our

relatives, friends and neighbors 
for their kind expression of 
sympathy during the illness and 
recent death of IRENE KLUG. 
Special thanks to Pastor Robert 
Wilcken, organist, donors of 
food, floral and memorial tri­
butes, to the women who served 
the food, custodian, Miller’s, 
and to all who showed their

PUBLIC NOTICE
Public notice is hereby given 

that a petition has been filed 
with the Village Board of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Wash­
ington County, Wisconsin, for 
the rezoning of a part of Lot 8, 
Block 37, Assessor’s Plat of the 
Village of Kewaskum, (approx­
imately 5.26 acres) from Dis­
trict P-1 to District zoned R-2.

Notice is further given that a 
public hearing on the above said 
petition will be held on the 19th 
day of July, 1978, at 8:00 P.M. 
in the Council Room of the 
Municipal Building, 204 First 
Street.

William Martin, Clerk

BUY and SELL with
BOWE A WENINGER 

REALTY, INC.
West Bend 334-7841

NORBERT ROHLINGER BROKER-SALES PHONE 626-2332

ACTION SATISFACTION

^Uza 3n^ ^wask«m

LUSH, wooded setting with lake access. $12,900.
THRIVING PIZZA BUSINESS

ARE YOU a Veteran and do you know what your benefits are? 
Did you know that you can buy a home without a downpay­
ment? Call me for an explanation of the technical aspects of 
financing a home.

NEEDED: Cozy 2 bedroom home in Kewaskum or Camp­
bellsport area.

HERE’S PREMIUM QUALITY---designed for lazy living in 
this ranch home near Campbellsport. The carpeting is in but 
the price stays the same. Step-saving kitchen with lovely 
dinette, 3 bedrooms plus bath. Rangehood fan and rough 
grading included. All on a 1 acre lot in the country. $48,500.

115. "Golden” opportunity to continue this well- 
established PIZZA restaurant in the fast growing communi­
ty of Kewaskum. Ideal for family operation or a beginning 
for the enterprising college student. Present owner wiN 
teach.
A small investment of $15,900 for potential big
return. Cail for details and demonstration.

Schulz a
REALTY CORP.

338-6106
2396 W. Washington.West Bend, Wis.

BUILD your home amid the lovely trees on this choice Jot. 
$17,900.

5 ACRE non-percable hunting retreat in Outagamie County. 
$2,000.

We have many different building sites, or will build on your 
lot. We have many different building plans to choose from. 
Let’s sit down with HFK, Ltd. and work out your new home.

Dan coulter 

334-7411 
1<41 NORTH MAIN STREET 

WEST BENO, 53085 
HOME PHONE 33B-3286
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BEER LICENSE 
APPLICATION
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

I hereby certify that L. Ro- 
senheimer, Inc., Richard A. 
Bechler, Agent, 1277 Fond du 
Lac Avenue, have made appli­
cation to the Village Board of 
the Village of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wiscon­
sin, for a Class “A” Fermented 
Malt Beverage License for the 
period commencing July 19, 
1978, and ending June 30, 1979.

The above application will be 
heard and considered at a 
public hearing to be held in the 
Council Room of the Municipal 
Building, 204 First Street, in the 
Village of Kewaskum on the 
17th day of July, 1978, at 8:00 
P.M. in the evening.

William Martin, Clerk

NOTICE OF MEETING 
OF BOARD OF REVIEW
STATE OF WISCONSIN,) 
Washington County, ) ss. 
Village of Kewaskum j

Public Notice is Hereby Given 
That the Board of Review for 
the said Village of Kewaskum 
will meet in the Council Room of 
the Municipal Building on the 
10th day of July 1978, at 10:00 
o'clock in the forenoon, for the 
purpose of reviewing and ex­
amining the assessment roll of 
real and personal property in 
said Village, and all sworn 
statements and valuations of 
real and personal property 
therein, and of correcting all 
errors in said roll, whether in 
description of property or other­
wise, and to perform such other 
duties imposed by law.

Dated June 30, 1978
William S. Martin, Clerk

TOWN OF WAYNE 
BOARD OF REVIEW

Public notice is hereby given 
that the Board of Review for the 
Town of Wayne will be held in 
the Town Hall, 6108 Wayne 
Center Dr., on Monday, July 
10, 1978 from 10:00 A.M. to 
Noon and 1:00 P.M. to 4:00 
P.M. and from 7:00 P.M. to 
8:00 P.M.

Dated this 30th day of 
June.

Orville Kern, Clerk

Both the giraffe and the camel 
can close their nostrils at will.

Honeck Chevrolet
KIWASKUM

State of Wisconsin 
Washington County Court 
Probate Branch

INFORMAL 
ADMINISTRATION:

ORDER SETTING TIME AND 
NOTICE TO CREDITORS

IN THE MATTER OF THE 
ESTATE OF ARNOLD A. 
BUTZKE, Deceased.

An application for Informal 
Administration of the estate of 
Arnold A. Butzke, Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Wiscon­
sin, post office address 511 
Keller Street, having been filed 
with the Probate Registrar;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
All creditors’ claims must be 

filed on or before September 15, 
1978, or be barred;
Dated June 15, 1978

Lucille A. Prohaska 
Probate Registrar 

Ralph R. Zauner 
Attorney/Personal Rep. 
2500 N. Mayfair Road, Suite 220 
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53226

WMM^^^^^WWM

DUNDEE 
Sand & Gravel 
G. ^crnthum Ph. 533-4549 

Washed Sand, Crushed 
Gravel, Stone and 

Limo Chips 
also, GRAVEL . 

and SAND FILL
FOR THE BEST OF 

CONCRETE MATERIALS
^^WWWWWWV*Ae

NOTICE! ! 
WASHINGTON COUNTY 
Postponed Real Estate Taxes are 

DUE JULY 31, 1978 
Payment may be made at the Courthouse 

or mailed to: 
Leo P. Scholtz, County Treasurer 

P.O. Box 518, West Bend, Wl 53095 
Delinquent tax interest rate is 1% per month, 

retroactive to January 1 of the tax year

■ ^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^^ (̂

BOARD OF REVIEW

TOWN OF AUBURN

Notice is hereby given that the Board of Review of the Town 
of Auburn, Fond du Lac County, Wisconsin, will convene at 
the Town Hall, Jet. 45 & 67 between the hours of 10:00 a.m. 
and 4 00 p.m. on Monday, July 24, 1978 for the purpose of 
hearing any taxpayer objecting to his assessment.

J Im^w^m***^*************************************  ̂>

NOTICE OF BOARD OF REVIEW
STATE OF WISCONSIN )
WASHINGTON COUNTY ) ss.
TOWN OF KEWASKUM )

Public notice is hereby given that the BOARD OF REVIEW 
for the Town of Kewaskum will be held at the Town Garage, 
9340 Highway 45, Kewaskum, Wisconsin, on Monday, July 10, 
1978, from 9:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m., adjourning one hour for 
lunch. (Other hours can be arranged by calling the Town Clerk 
for an appointment prior to July 10).

DATED THIS 26th day of June, 1978.

6-30-2t

MPTI Compiling
Speaker’s Bureau

Moraine Park Technical In­
stitute has an interesting story 
to tell--innovative programs, u- 
nique teaching techniques, and 
pace-setting educational exper­
iences.

Moraine Park is presently 
compiling a Speaker’s Bureau 
to offer the presentation of 
interesting, innovative pro­
grams by the administration 
and staff of MPTI, with no 
charge to any organization, 
association, or group within the 
district.

All programs will be within 
the 20-30 minute range, many 
presented with visual aids for a 
more vivid view of the capa-
bilities of MPTI.

Plan ahead for a program 
designed to familiarize groups 
with the concept and benefits of 
life-long vocational education.

MPTI welcomes the opportu-

TOP CASH - GLOVES 
FOR DISABLED OR DEAD 

COWS OR HORSES
Phone Collect Oshkosh 233-1010

NELSON FARM 
SERVICE

Camilla Butzke
Town Clerk

Barbara Hinz, Town Clerk 
(626-2550)

nity to provide a professionally 
done program. Speaker's Bu­
reau brochures will be mailed to 
area groups during the sum­
mer. Call Angela Otts, Public 
Information Manager, for fur­
ther information at (414) 922- 
8611, Ext. 402, or write Public

Information, MPTI, 235 North 
National Avenue, Fond du Lac, 
WI 54935.

HELP WANTED
California 

Canners & Growers 
has immediate opening’s for 

day and night shift. 
Workers needed until October 1. 

Free bus transportation.
EARN EXTRA MONEY FOR CHRISTMAS OR VACATIONS. 

GOOD WAGES AND WORKING CONDITIONS.

Apply in Person or Call 1-269-4511
10 MILES SOUTH OF FOND DU LAC ON HWY. 41 

An Equal Opportunity Employer.

California 
Canners & Growers 

Lomira, Wis.

AUCTION
Real Estate, Household & Antiques

Kewaskum, Wi.

Sat., July 8 — 11 a.m.
LOCATION: 517 E. Main St. (Hwy. 28), Kewaskum, Wi 
REASON FOR SALE: Miss Bertha Buss has given up 
housekeeping and has taken residence in a nursing home. 
Her home and personal property will be sold at public 
auction.
HOUSEHOLD: Westinghouse refrigerator; Westing­
house electric range; Speed Queen wringer washer; New 
Milcor wood burning space heater; Westinghouse 
dehumidifier; Roll-a way bed; pots, pans, dishes, 
glassware, tableware, etc.; Black and white T.V.; bed­
ding, towels, etc.; household, lawn and garden tools; 
fruit jars; wash tubs; firewood; hand mower and other 
items.
ANTIQUES & ETC.: Oak ice box w/pressed carving in 
doors, a dandy; 1920's 3 pc. living room set, sofa and Mr. 
and Mrs. chairs; round oak table w/5 leaves; cherry drop 
leaf table; butternut wardrobe; Victorian dresser w/mir- 
ror, candle stands and hankie drawers; unusual oak 
cabinet w/gargoyle head; oak high boy w/mirror; 3 old 
wood beds; 1920's dresser w/mirror; wood kitchen table 
w/4 chairs; 3 oak rockers; library table; pine jelly cup­
board, console model Victrola w/records; pressed back 
rocker; set of 6 pressed back, cane seat chairs; misc. 
tables and chairs; treadle sewing machine; Dome top 
trunk; Bentwood stool; w^lL coffee grinder; quilting 
frame; kerosene lamps; Sad iron and trivet; pictures and 
frames; depression glass including Dogwood pink pitcher 
and 6 tumblers, Mayfair decanter and others; pattern 
glass; nippon; carnival; ladies gold watch; gold rings; 
Brownie 2A camera in original box; fancy work; crocks; 
wood burning kitchen range; 3 burner kerosene range; 
and other items.
REAL ESTATE: 3 bedroom home with large kitchen, din­
ing room, living room and full bath. Lot has beautiful 
mature trees and loads of flower gardens. INVESTORS 
TAKE NOTE: This property is zoned R 3 which allows 2 
family living.
TERMS ON REAL ESTATE: 10 per cent down on the 
day of sale and the balance in cash at closing to be held 
on or before August 8, 1978. All financial obligations 
must be arranged BEFORE sale date.

Lunch on Grounds
PAUL

Real Estate & Auction Co.
320 First St., Kewaskum, WI 53040 

338 3 030 626 4318
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Tv 5PORT5
Vetter, Glacier Inn.
TH URS. MORNING LEAGUE

W L
Regal Ware 5 1
Serigraph 4 2

Schmidt s 3 3
King Pin 0 6

Top shooters are Tom 
Thompson 24.6 (148 birds out of 
150); Gary Reigle 23.5; and Bob 
Wietor 23.0.

Too Many Errors 
As Indians Lose
To Hartland, 8-2

It was a case of too many 
errors as the Kewaskum Indians 
were defeated at Hartland 
Thursday evening, 8-2.

Four runs in the fourth inn­
ing, all of them unearned, were 
enough to spell Kewaskum’s 
doom. Pitcher Al Jaeger got the 
first two batters out and should 
have had the third on a routine 
fly ball. But the center fielder 
dropped the ball, after which 
four runs crossed the plate. A 
big hit of the inning was a 
double by winning pitcher Pat 
Pomeranz. Several other errors 
resulted in Hartland scores.

Pomeranz worked the first 
four innings for Arrowhead 
before being replaced. He al­
lowed one run in the first frame 
on a walk to Jaeger, who stole 
second, took third on an infield 
out and scored on a passed ball.

John Bemis drove in the 
Indians’ other run with a single 
in the seventh. He was then out 
attempting to steal second. Ke­
waskum’s only hits besides 
Bemis’ single were one baggers 
by Mark Strigenz, Ross Kraut- 
kramer and Henry Schilter.

Jaeger also pitched only four 
innings. Left hander Scott Reif 
finished the game and gave up 
one hit and one run in the last 
two innings.

KETTLE MORAINE GIRLS 
TRAVELING LEAGUE

Standings June 28 
Junior League

W L
Boltonville 6 0
Campbellsport II 5 1
Kewaskum I 4 2
Glenbeulah 3 2
Cascade 3 2
Campbellsport I 3 3
Kewaskum II 3 3
Batavia 2 3
Long Lake . 2 4
Beechwood 2 4
Adell 1 4
Parnell 0 6

Junior games June 28 - Ke­
waskum 7, Adell4; Beechwood 
11, Batavia 1; Boltonville 15, 
Campbellsport I 0; Campbell­
sport II 13, Cascade 1; Glen­
beulah 17, Parnell 3. June 26 - 
Boltonville 15, Cascade 0.

SENIOR LEAGUE

W L
Kewaskum I 5 1
Boltonville 5 1
Beechwood 5 1
Parnell 4 2
Long Lake ♦ 2
Cascade 3 2
Adell 2 3
Batavia 2 3
Kewaskum II 2 4
Glenbeulah 1 4
Campbellsport I 1 5
Campbellsport II 0 6

In a squeaker, Kewaskum I 
senior team edged Long Lake, 
scoring 4 runs on 3 hits in the 
bottom of the 7th.

Senior games June 28 - Adell 
13, Kewaskum II 6; Beech­
wood 9, Batavia 6; Boltonville 
24, Campbellsport I 0; Cascade 
17, Campbellsport II 4; Parnell 
10, Glenbeulah 8; Kewaskum I

5, Long Lake 4. June 26 
Beechwood 8, Campbellsport II 
3, Cascade 12, Boltonville 11.

Games July 12 (junior and 
senior), junior games 6:30 p.m., 
senior games 7:30 - Campbell­
sport II at Adell, Batavia at 
Glenbeulah, Beechwood at Ke­
waskum I, Kewaskum II at 
Boltonville, Parnell at Camp­
bellsport I, Cascade at Long 
Lake.

Games Saturday, July 8, 
(young girls Kettle Moraine 
Traveling League) - Batavia at 
Boltonville, Cascade at Long 
Lake, Beechwood at Kewaskum 
(2 p.m.).

TUESDAY NIGHT SOFTBALL 
LEAGUE OF KEWASKUM

Results of June 27
Three R's 5, Amerahn 3; 

Jim’s Northside 9, Serwe’s 4; 
Badger Packaging 8, Savings 
and Loan 2; Thiemer’s Tap 16, 
Hitching Post 1 (5 innings).

STANDINGS
W L

Jim’s Northside 5 1
Thiemer’s 5 1
Three R’s 5 1
Amerahn 3 3
Badger Pkg. 3 3
Hitching Post 2 4
Serwe’s 1 5
W.B. Savings & Loan 0 6

KEWASKUM WOMEN’S 
HORSESHOE LEAGUE

W L
Carrie Struebing
Sheri Pesch 18 6
Barb Gengler
Elaine Poos 17 7
Beverly Rohlinger
Jeaneen Kudek 14*/2 9‘A
Shirley Ehnert
Bonnie Stoltzmann 14'/2 9‘A
Sandy Bonlender 
Shirley Sarauer 13 11
Joan Struebing
Diane Rindt 9 15
Sandy Pieper
Chris Buss 9 15
Janet Rohlinger 
Nancy Boegel 8 16
Verla Bilgo 
Kris Korth 5 19

CAMPBELLSPORT
SPORTSMEN’S CLUB 

MONDAY NIGHT 
TRAPSHOOTING LEAGUE

June 26 
STANDINGS

W L
Serwe’s II 9 0
Glacier Inn 7 2
The Barn 6 3
Dins Mobil 5 4
B’s Hive 4 5
Dundee S & G 3 6
Serwe’s I 3 6
Flitter’s Enter. 3 6
Bohlman's Bar 3 6
Half Shots 2 7

Top league shooters are Den­
nis Petermann, 24.1; Bruce 
Survis, 23.3; and Pauline Dreh- 
mel, 23.1.

50 straight were shot by 
Pauline Drehmel, Glacier Inn 
and Dennis Petermann, Serwe’s 
II.

25 straight was shot by Jim

Goeden Wins Feature Race at Kaukauna

Area Racing News By Ken Knou

Willie Goeden of Kewaskum 
won the 20-lap late model stock 
car feature race Thursday night 
at the Wisconsin International 
Raceway in Kaukauna. Goeden

is shown here carrying the 
checkered flag after winning the 
race on the half-mile paved 
oval.

(Gary Vercauteren photo)

Tuesday night area race dri­
vers went up to Leo’s Speedway 
in Oshkosh. Mike Melius of 
Random Lake had a good even­
ing. He was 9th fast qualifier, 
finished 3rd in his heat and then 
came on the finish 4th in the 25 
lap feature. Willie Goeden of St. 
Michaels turned in 10th fast 
time and then finished 3rd in 
the feature.

Wednesday night at Fire­
men’s Park in Cedarburg, Mike 
Melius did the best job of area 
drivers on hand. He was 4th in 
time, finished 3rd in his heat, 
and then came on to finish 5th 
in the 25 lap feature on this ‘/j 
mile dirt track. John Reiser of 
Allenton was 8th in time, 3rd in 
his heat and then finished 13th 
in the feature.

Thursday night at Wisconsin 
International Raceway in Kau­
kauna, Willie Goeden turned in

Your Area Dealer for — Also Sales A Service For

EVINRUDE&SPIRITOUTBOARPS

SEA HAWK 16’ P Polished bow rails and corner castings, running lights, color- 
coordinated painted hull, vinyl floor and upholstery. It has mechanical 
steering, side console and motor well. The 16’ has three swivel seast and live- 
bait well with pump. _ _

Blue Fin
BOATS OF DISTINCTION

LAWN

GARDEN

his best performance on this 
track. He started out by turning 
5th fast time and then winning 
the 6 lap fast dash. He then 
topped that off by winning his 
first feature on this */2 mile 
paved track. Goeden took the 
lead on the 9th lap and in­
creased his lead until the end of 
the 20 lap Feature. Tony Strupp 
of Slinger also had a good night. 
Tony turned 2nd quick time, 
was 5th in the fast dash and 
then finished 4th in the feature.

Saturday’s all day rain forced 
cancellation of the Late Model 
and Sportsmen’s races at the 
Hales Corners Speedway in 
Franklin. The scheduled “Fire­
cracker 50’’ for Late Models will 
be run next Saturday.

Willie Goeden and Scott 
Weiss both toured up to Es­
canaba Speedway in Escanaba,

Michigan for the scheduled twin 
“Firecracker 50’s” for late 
models. Rain also interferred 
with that race but not before 
Goeden turned in 4th fast time, 
won the trophy dash, and then 
was declared the winner of the 
rain shortened first 50 lap 
feature. Goeden took the lead 
on lap 17 and the race was 
halted on lap 22. The second 50 
lapper was completely washed 
out. Weiss also found this 3/8 
mile asphalt track to his liking. 
He finished 2nd in his heat 
which qualified him for the fea­
ture. He then finished 8th in the 
shortened feature. The entire 
program will be rerun next Sat­
urday.

The scheduled late model 
races for Sunday night at Sling­
er Speedway were rained out 
and run on Monday night.

Route 2, Kewaskum, Wis 
Phone 626-2553 
Mon. and F r.

8 a.m. to 9 p.m. 
Sat. 8 a.m. to 3 p.m. 

Closed Sundays


