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Ordinance Setting New Wastewater Village, School
Charges Passed by Village Board

By Ruth Held
An ordinance that sets new 

wastewater treatment charg­
es for the Village of Kewas 
kum was passed by members 
of the village board Monday 
n'ght. The new rates go into 
effect April 1 and will be re­
flected on the water bills 
rendered for the quarter end­
ing June 30.

The revised ordinance sets 
forth service charges that 
meet with annroval of the 
Environmental Pro ection A- 
gency (EPA) in order for the 
village to qualify for reim­
bursement grants on expan­
sions made to the village 
wastewater treatment plant 
:n 1972.

The EPA ruled that all u- 
sers must pay their way eq­
uitably. The sewage rates in 
force now are not equitable 
by EPA standards.

Residential users will be 
charged on water usage at 
the rate of 79 cents per 1,000 
gallons per quarter. Under 
existing rates, each house­
hold pays a flat quarterly 
charge of $14 regardless of 
how much water is used. It 
will mean lower bills for ma­
ny households.

Commercial users will also 
pay according to water usage. 
Presently they are charged a 
flat fee of $35 or $21 per 
quarter depending unon the 
size of the water meter, 
which in turn depended on 
the size of the establishment

Industrial users will be 
billed on the recorded vol­
umes of flow determined 
from the control manhole 
measuring device, required 
Under the new ordinance, 
plus surcharges on concentra­
tions of bio-chemical oxygen 
demand (b.o.d.) and suspend­
ed solids, greater than 250 
milligrams per liter.

The b.o.d. surcharge will 
be at the rate of 10 cents per 
pound on the excess. Sus­
pended solids surcharge will 
be at the rate of 6 cents per 
pound on the excess The new 
rates will mean industries 
will get a boost in their bills.

The revised ordinance also 
states that no surface or sub­
surface water flowing from 
roof, yard or sump nump will 
be allowed to enter sanitary 
sewers. Such water must be 
drained on to lawns. Cooling 
waters and other non-pollut­
ing waters are also not per­
mitted to enter sanitary sew­
ers.

Village residents will be so 
notified and given 90 days 
from April 1 to correct any 
such violations. •

The new rates and related 
ordinance were prepared at 
village request by Dr. Ray­
mond Kipp, professor of civil 
engineering at Marquette Un­
iversity. He Worked with 
EPA to meet its require­
ments.

In other business. Peter Al­
bers, superintendent of the 
wastewater treatment plant 
was given permission to at­
tend two one-week seminars 
at Madison sponsored by the 
University of Wisconsin Col­
lege of Engineering and the

Department of Natural Re­
sources. He said he is especi­
ally interested in going be­
cause much of the seminar 
will deal with chemical treat­
ment and he has not attended 
a seminar in four years. 
Cost to the village will be 
$20 per week for a dormitory 
foorn pl Ui meals and mileage.

Mrs. Robert 
Bartelt Sr. Dies

Mrs. Robert Bartelt Sr., nee 
Ida Bartelt, 92, a resident of 
the Town of Auburn, Fond du 
Lac County, most of her life, 
passed away early Friday, 
March 22, at Care Center 
East, Fond du Lac, where 
she had been a resident for 
the past three years.

She was born May 24, 1881, 
in the Town of Auburn, a 
daughter of the late August 
G. and Bertha Beilke Bartelt. 
She was married to Robert 
Bartelt at St. John’s Luther­
an Church, New Fane, Oct. 
13, 1903, and the couple 
farmed north of Kewaskum 
for many years. Her husband 
preceded her in death on 
Aug. 17, 1963.

Mrs Bartelt was a mem­
ber of St. Lucas Lutheran 
Church, Kewaskum.

Survivors include three 
daughters, Bertha (Edwin) 
Paskey, West Bend, Mrs. I- 
rene Prost, Kewaskum, and 
Elenore (Elmer) Schultz, 
West Bend; one son, Robert 
A. (Doris) Bartelt on the 
homestead, R. 2, Kewaskum; 
six grandchildren, five great­
grandchildren, other relatives 
and friends.

Visitation was at Miller’s 
Funeral Home, Kewaskum, 
after 3 p. m. Sunday. Com­
plete funeral services were 
held at 8 p. m. Sunday at the 
funeral home. Pastor Paul 
Hoenecke officiated and in­
terment was in St. Lucas Ce­
metery.

KC’s COMMUNION AT 
ST. MICHAELS SUNDAY

The March Fifth Sunday 
Corporate Communion and 
breakfast of West Bend 
Council 1964, Knights of Col­
umbus, will be held at St. 
Michael’s Parish, R. 1, Ke­
waskum, at the 8 a. m. Mass 
on March 30.

Guest speakers will be Dr. 
Parnell Donahue, M.D., or­
ganizer of the Pro-Life Mo­
vement in Hartford, and Den­
nis Murphy, a teacher at St. 
Kilian’s school in Hartford. 
Murphy is chairman of the 
Hartford Chapter of Wiscon­
sin Citizens for Concerned 
Life (WCCL). The main con­
cern of WCCL is to inform 
the public on all aspects of 
the Pro-Life Movement in­
cluding euthanasia, infanta- 
cide. experimentation on fe- 
tusrs and abortion.

Members are reminded that 
the ladies are invited to par- 
ticipate in the Fifth Sunday 
. ।‘ glam.

Board Members 
To Be Elected

Next Tuesday. April 2, is 
Spring Election Day. Polls in 
the Village of Kewaskum and 
eight townshins or parts of 
townships in the Kewaskum 
School District will be open 
from 9 a. m to 8 p. m.

Four candidates, including 
three incumbents will be af­
ter three vacancies on the 
village board. Incumbents are 
Raynor Herriges, Gregor 
Nigh and Elmer Yoost. Rich­
ard Zarling is the challenger. 
Herriges will be out for his 
fifth two-year term, Nigh out 
for his third two-year term, 
and Yoost seeking his fifth 
two-year term. This will be 
Zarling’s second attempt at 
election as he ran in 1972.

Clara J. Trapp, Richard L 
Edwards, Richard Theusch 
and Thomas W. Gundrum 
will compete for two posi­
tions on the board of educa­
tion for Kewaskum Commun­
ity Schools Joint District No. 
2. These four captured the 
most votes among six candi­
dates in a school board prim- 

' ary election March 5. Mrs. 
Trapp is a first time candi­
date. Edwards has been on 
the board for 10 years. 
Theusch was a board member 
from 1970 to 1973 but did 
not seek re-election last year. 
Gundrum, who now serves as 
board chairman, will* be after 
his second three-year term.

On the county supervisor 
ballot, Charles F. Miller of 
Kewaskum will be unopposed 
for re-election.

On the judicial ballot, Jus­
tice of the Supreme Court 
Horace W. Wilkie will be op­
posed by Raymond C John­
son. These two won out in the 
recent primary.

Three referendum ques­
tions will also be voted on in 
Tuesday’s election.

Memorial 
Services for 
Capt. Fickler

Memorial services for Capt. 
E. James Fickler, USMC, 
of Kewaskum, who has been 
officially presumed to have 
died in the Vietnam war, will 
be held at 2 p. m. Saturday, 
March 30, at Peace United 
Church of Christ in Kewas­
kum. Rev. Daniel Schowalter 
will officiate at the services.

Capt. Fickler, whose plane 
went down while on a night 
mission in Vietnam Jan. 17, 
1969. was born in West Bend 
May 4, 1943. He graduated 
from Kewaskum High School 
in 1961, Wisconsin State Uni- 
versity-Stevens Point in 1965 
and received his wings in A 
pril, 1967. He left for Viet­
nam a year later.

Survivors include his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Edwin 
Fickler, Kewaskum, two sis­
ters, Mrs. Nancy (Larry) 
Wickert, West Bend, and 
Mrs. Colleen (Steve) Brad­
ford, Downers Grove, Ill., and 
a brother, Gary, Kewaskum.

Capt Fickler was a mem 
her of Sigma Phi Epsilon Fra­
ternity.

Kiwanis Club 
Donates $77,000 
For Park Site

By Ruth Held
It is now official that the 

Kewaskum Kiwanis Club will 
donate $77,000 to the Village 
of Kewaskum for some 35 a- 
cres of land to be used as a 
park site here.

Voting by ballot, the club 
membership approved the do­
nation after the Kewaskum 
Kiwanis Foundation Board 
earlier this month went on 
record to recommend to the 
club that the donation be 
made. Ballats distributed two 
weeks before were tallied at 
the weekly Kiwanis meeting 
last week.

The foundation is made up 
of Kiwanis members but is a 
separate entity formed to be 
in charge of these funds and 
has its own officers. Funds 
were raised from live turkey 
shoots the club sponsored be­
ginning in 1952. When live 
turkey shoots were outlawed 
several years ago, the club 
went to using balloons as 
targets on the firing lanes.

A Kiwanis Foundation 
spokesman said that its board 
will meet to draft a commun­
ication to the village board 
stating that the money will 
be available when needed. 
The village voted last Decem­
ber to take an option on ap­
proximately 34 acres of land 
for park purposes at $2,200 
per acre. The option is with 
Mrs. Viola Snoerl on land at 
the southwest limits.

The village is also seeking 
funds through the state Out­
door Recreation Act Prog­
ram (ORAP-200) toward 
park costs.

9 KHS Students 
Receive A’s in 
Forensics Meet

Nine Kewaskum Commun­
ity High School students re­
ceived A ratings at the Graf-* 
ton sub-district forensics 
meet. These nine will go to 
the district meet Saturday, 
March 30, from where win­
ners go to state.

The nine» included: Kris 
Meilahn and Patty Gundrum, 
oratory; Debbie Strigenz, sig­
nificant speech; Joanne Gar­
men and Vivian Schacht, 
prose; Rick Edwards and 
Connie Sieger, public ad­
dress; Cheryl Wilkens and 
Joanne LaFleur, declamation.

Coach Rick Fahrenkrug’s 
Kewaskum team has had a 
successful season, capturing 
the Scenic Moraine title al- 
long with the Kettle Moraine.

There were six schools at 
the Grafton meet, namely 
Grafton, Kewaskum, White­
fish Bay, Shorewood, West 
Bend West and Port Wash­
ington. The district meet will 
include all schools in the Mil­
waukee area.

BIRTH
SCHMIDT—A daughter to 

Richard and Patricia Schmidt 
Kewaskum, Monday, March 
18.

Cancer Drive 
To Open; Name 
Local Committee

Every year during April, 
about 2.000,000 volunteers of 
the American Cancer Socie­
ty ring doorbells and ask the 
American people to dig down 
and give to help defeat can­
cer.

“This year ACS budgeted 
more than $79 million, of 
which over $62 million went 
for research, education, ser­
vice and rehabilitation,” de­
clared John C. Hubbell, resi­
dential chairman of the Ke­
waskum Committee today 
announcing the opening of 
the ACS annual educational 
and fund-raising Crusade. Be­
sides direct contributions the 
Society also receives support 
from legacies.

“Research which is making 
gains against cancer will re­
ceive about 30 cents of each 
dollar or about $24 million,” 
he noted.

“Informing people about 
cancer’s Seven Warning Sig 
nals and urging regular 
health checkups to discover 
cancer at its earliest and 
most curable stage are at the 
heart of our public educa­
tion program and received a- 
bout 18 cents of each dollar 
or $14 million,” Hubbell said.

Patient and community 
services such as the Reach to 
Recovery program for wo­
men who have had breast 
surgery or teaching people 
who’ve lost their voices after 
throat cancer surgery how to 
speak again will receive 
more than $15 5 million or 
about 19 cents of each dollar 

(Cancer is the leading 
cause of death among women 
aged 30 to 54 Therefore the 
Washington County Cancer 
Society will have a free 
breast and uterne cancer ed­
ucation program on Tuesday. 
April 23, at 8 n. m. at the 
West Bend West High School, 
Room 235 The sneaker will 
be Dr. I. H Bae, gynecologist 
and obstrican).

Nearly 11 cents of each 
dollar or about $8.6 million 
will be devoted to profession­
al education. These programs 
provide nhysicians, dentists, 
nurses and other mescal per­
sonnel with the latest inform­
ation on diagnosis and treat­
ment of cancer.

Fund raising will take 11 
cents of each dollar or $8 9 
nvllion; management of the 
Soc’ety’s affairs takes 10 
cents or $7 9 million.

“Together we can win the 
war against cancer,” declar­
ed Hubbell. “We want to 
wipe out cancer ’n your life­
time Join us by being alert 
to cancer’s warning signals 
and by having a neriodic 
health checkup. Then help o- 
thers w’th a check or cash.”

Eugene Bohn, Mrs. Robert 
Schlamer and Gerald Stollen- 
werk are helping in promot­
ing the American Cancer So­
ciety drive through the Ke­
waskum community.

“Few things are apt to 
increase your leisure time 
more than being punctual.”



Kewaskum Statesman
Friday, March 29, 197*

Regal Ware Cited
For Savings Plan

In honor of attaining over 50- 
per cent participation in the 
federal government’s payroll 
savings plan, Regal Ware, 
Inc. of- Kewaskum was 
presented with the 
Minuteman Flag Award

“Business is like a wheel* 
harrow—if you don’t push it, 
it won’t go.”

Phone: 626-2520 Kewaskum

Fridays-5 p. m. - Seafood
Saturdays - 5 p. m. - Menu 
Sundays - Hon-E-Kor Chicken

Family Style -11 a. m. to 2 p. m.
Closed Tuesday

Closed Sunday Nights

According to William J. 
Tullar, Milwaukee office, 
Department of the Treasury, 
the company enrolled 51 per 
cent of its approximately 988 
employees in the payroll 
savings plan.

The payroll savings plan 
involves investing payday 
allotments in U.S. Savings 
Bonds.

HONOR JANE SCHMIDT AT 
MISCELLANEOUS SHOWER

On Saturday afternoon, 
March 9, Miss Jane Schmidt 
of Kewaskum was guest of 
honor at a surprise miscellan­
eous bridal shower, held at 
the home of Mrs. LeRoy 
Schmidt. The shower was gi­
ven by Miss Joyce Schmidt, 
Miss Jan Peter,, Mrs. Jerome 
Hanrahan, Mrs. John Zalew­
ski and Mrs. LeRoy Schmidt. 
Jane received a corsage and 
many beautiful gifts.

Miss Schmidt will become 
the bride of Gerald Rettler 
•>f West Bend on April 6.

Shampoo & Wax
EOUR OWN FLOOR WITH

Hoover Scrubber 
and Shampooer 

MINZ SUPPLY
Kewaskum 626-2164

SNO-CHIEFS TO HOLD 
land owners social

The Kewaskum Sno-Chiefs 
Snowmobile Club is sponsor­
ing an appreciation social at 
Amerahn, Kewaskum, on Sa­
turday. March 30, for all land 
and property owners who

ANTIQUES WANTED

Old Wood Ice Boxes, Duck Decoys, 
Tin & Cast Iron Toys, War Souvenirs, 
Cistern Pumps, Advertising Items, 
Etc.

Write or Call

“THE SALT BOX HOUSE”
RANDOM LAKE, WIS. 53075

Phone 692-2649

were kind enough to allow 
members to travel on their 
property while snowmobiling 
this cast winter. A buffet 
supper will be served from 
7:30 to 9 p. m. Live music 
and refreshments will follow.

Get $1 back
Live Music

FRIDAY, MARCH 29 
“The Windrifts”

FRIDAY, April 5 
Private Party 

9:00 TO 1:00

BRAT FRY - 50c
Every Tuesday Night 

Starting at 6 p. m.

AMERAHN
’/a mile north of Kewaskum on Hwy. 45

during 
The Jockey 
Return Of 
The Dollar

Offer
March 29 to 

April 27,1974

Limit: 
$2 per family.

New Greenhouse 

NOW OPEN 
VISITORS WELCOME 

Packet & Bulk Garden Seeds

FOR RENT! Lawn Spreaders and Rollers 
ROSE BUSHES—Standard and Climbers 

ALL FLOWER and VEGETABLE PLANTS

Onion Sets and Plants (order eerly)

SEED POTATOES, HANGING BASKETS 
and GARDEN MUMS

Bartoli Prodiace
4 miles North of Kewaskum on Hwy. V

Phone 533-4092 OPEN DAILY
L.

Mail Jockey the empty wrapper 
from a 3-pack, or 3 single packs 
of Jockey” Classic briefs or Jockey 
Power-Knit® T-shirts, plus the sales 
slip—and Jockey will mail you 
back SI. Limit: $2 per family.

( lassie brief 100% combed cotton no gap 
front, heat resistant waistband.
M........................................$5.00

Power-Knit” T-shirt longer wearing 
combed cotton, Seamfree® collar.
s. M.L, XL .................................................$5.75

For details look for our
Jockey" Brand Underwear Display. 

Rosenheimer
DEPT. STORE
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LENDVED-SCHULTZ 
ENGAGEMENT TOLD

Mr. ahd Mrs. George Lend- 
Ved, R. i, Kewaskum, are 
pleased to announce the en­
gagement of their daughter, 
Nancy Jean, to Lee Marvin 
Schultz, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Leonard Schultz, also of R. 1, 
Kewaskum.

The bride-to-be will be a 
1975 graduate of Kewaskum 
High School. She is employ-

ed as a dietary aide at St. 
Joseph’s Hospital. West Bend

Her fiance is a 1973 gradu­
ate of Kewaskum High 
School and is currently serv­
ing in the Armed Forces.

SAVE ! ! ! Select your 
furniture at Miller’s in Ke­
waskum. Largest selection, 
high quality at most reason­
able prices. Open daily until 
5:30. Monday and Friday to 
9 p. m. Free dependable de­
livery.

DO-IT- 
YOURSELF HEYS

■fl complete tervice dealer'I.
U N >20 MAIN L

OFFICE' 
PRODUCTS 

D 

KEWASKUM I 

c
Office Supplies, Copiers, Fur- 
niture. Typewriters, Adders, 
Calculators.
n SALES - SERVICE _

Does your 
fertilizer go wild 
and then quit?

Has il happened to you—first your grass grows faster than 
you can cut it. and then it practically quits growing’’ Then 
spread Golf Brand Lawnfood with th. Nature’s Ratio form­
ula. The elements in Golf Brand are precisely blended for a 
steady, long term feeding. No sudden starts and stops. So 
you don't have to mow or fertilize as often You'll like the 
way Golf Brand works in your lawn, or Northrup King will 
refund your money.

With Equipment & Tools for
• Plumbing 
•Heating 
• Air

g^R Conditioning
• Water

Conditioning

Remodel & live 
in comfort. New 
home cost is high.

z^zam afe

Honeck Chevrolet
KEWASKUM

Friendly 
Features

SCHLAEFER 
OPTOMETRIST 

MATH ANTHONY
PHONE 533-8426 

Offic# Hours: 9-12 1-5
Wed. & Fri. Evenings 7-9 

Closed Thursday 
CAMPBELLSPORT, WIS.

Regular $18 35

Green Grass 
Sale Price

$8.95
•40 lb h.^f

LAUBENSTEIN

FREE ESTIMATES

DO-IT-YOURSELF WITH 
OUR EXPERT ADVICE OR 
LET US DO IT FOR YOU

Johann

LAWN & GARDEN MART
KIWMKUM PHONS 624-2553

Plumbing & Heating, Inc.
Home Improvement Center

PHONE *334-9481
Located in St. Michaels, 3 milei
East of Kewaskum on Hwy. 28. 1 

fours: Mon.-Thurs.- 8 o.m. to 5:30 p J 
Fri. 8 a.m.-9 p-m-; Sot. 8 a.m.-5 p.m

by MINZ_SUPPLY

One of the 
“HWI FRIENDLY ONES”
Kenneth “Kenny” Weddig 

Manager 
- Paneling Specialist

No auto accidents 
or more than one 
minor violation 
in past three years
15/30/10 Liability;
$1000 Med Pay; 15/30 UM. 
To qualify; all drivers 30-69; 
no accidents or more than one 
minor violation past 3 years; 
drive 3 miles or less to work; 
under 7500 miles per year; 
no business use.

We deviate up to 

25% 
from bureau rates

BARTELT INSURANCE
call 626-2401

HERITAGE^ INSURANCE
SHEBOYGAN WISCONSIN 53081

1450 Parkview. Dr., Kewaskum

MONEY FAX
There was a time when 

we tried to live within our 
income, now-a-days it’s 
hard just trying to live 
within the bounds of our 
credit . . .

As the old saying goes, 
“The rich always get rich­
er, but now the poor are 
getting credit cards . . .

Ben Franklin said, “A 
fool and his money are soon 
parted, “but now it seems 
to happen to all of us . . .

It may be true thatwe’ve 
never had it so good, but 
neither have we had it tak­
en away so fast . . .

With everything chang 
mg today, the cost of living 
is still the same - every 
penny you have (and then 
some!) . . .

“You know that room 
that never seems to look 
right no matter what color 
you paint it? Why not pa­
nel it?” asks “HWI FRIEN­
DLY ONE” Kenneth Wed­
dig. “You’ll find you can 
make a terrific change for 
the better With paneling 
from MINZ SUPPLY CO. 
for far less than you’d sus­
pect. (Paneling to fit every 
job and prices to fit every 
budget)” . . .

Caravelle® 
by Bulova.

SPECIAL OF THE WEEK

t?6^3.?^ other the gift you'd love to get. A Caravelle by Bulova. 
« Prec*sion-jeweled watch with built-in quality. Lots

? dash f°r little cash. A great gift solution for mutual celebra- 
nons. Like Christmas and anniversaries. Or just because you care 
Caravelle by Bulova. Expensive watches at inexpensive prices

BIER'S JEWELRY
KEWASKUM

MAR. 29 TO APR. 6 
DISCONTINUED 12x12 & 

2x4 CEILING TILE 
LIMITED QUANTITIES 

12c SQUARE FOOT

KEWASKUM 
128 Main St. 

626-2164
WEST BEND 

Hwy. 45 South 
334-9611

Fea . . . IFe Can Arrange for Music

We Handle Every Detail
Our chapel organ is ready 

to enrich any service . . . just 
tell us what you want.

FUNERAL HOME
KEWASKUM

DEPENDABLE & REASONABLE
SINCE 1910

PHONE 626-2185

THE SAFE PLACE
for your valuables

A BOX IN OUR VAULT
LIMITHD SUPPLY STILL AVAILABLE

SAFE DEPOSIT

W Malley Bank
■ KEWASKUM/ALLENTON

MEMBER FDIC - VALLEY BANCORPORATION
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Senior Citizens
Have Been Active

The XYZ Club (Senior 
Citizens of Kewaskum) has 
been an active group lately.

March 13 the club had Ro­
nald Reigle as guest speaker. 
He gave them some interest­
ing and informative news 
facts about our government.

Thursday evening, March 14, 
the members were guests of 
the Kewaskum Junior Wom­
an’s Club, enjoying the prog­
ram and lunch. Thank you, 
ladies. March 18 a busload of 
Senior Citizens attended the 
Sports Show at the Milwau­
kee Arena.

Wouldn’t you like to help 
make Easter favors from col­
ored egg cartons? Bring your 
“old” scissors to club, which 
has the glue and suppies. You 
can make some shut-ins trays 
a little brighter on Easter

Day.
The club meets each Wed­

nesday, 9 to 12, at the Legion 
clubhouse. Bring a sandwich 
and your coffee cup. Coffee 
and cake furnished. ’

It’s not too late to enter 
the state-wide writing cont­
est, some history or a poem. 
Deadline on this is April 1.

Do you have recines for a- 
ny of these? Grandma’s ap- 
felkuchen? Mother’s tiesen 
dativs? Belle Mere’s coquilles

Koenings Memorial Co.
208 Island Avenue 

West Bend, Wis.
(Hy. 33 Wash. St. to Island Ave.)

Serving This Area Since 1903.
SEE WHAT YOU BUY!

100 monuments and markers indoors 
CHECK AND SEE WHAT PRICES INCLUDE! 

Hundreds of Satisfied Customers 
Open Daily 9-5; Mon. and Fri. til 9; Sat. 9M 
Sundays March, April, May, June Open 1 -4 

PHONE COLLECT 334-3871 Gary Koenings, Prop.

PLAVEC SALES
Good Cooking and Heating Stoves

Freezers — Refrigerators — Stoves — Dryers 
Washers — Kitchen Sets — Couches and Chairs 

Bedroom Sets — Car Ramps

STORE HOURS: Mon., Wed, and Fri. 6 P.M. to 9 P.M. 
Saturday and Sunday Noon to 6:00 P.M.

357 Main Street — KEWASKUM 
Call after 6:00 P.M. — 626-4525

SURE, TRI-STATE
Homes Are Beautifuls
RI IT more important, they're Quality built 

1 9 for a lifetime of home living satisfactii

■i > easy tor any nome builder to skimp on 
quality. Not Tri-State. We're building a solid 
reputation and growing family of satisfied 
home owners, and we know quality 
construction is what's behind it. Before you 
make that important home buying or building 
decision, be sure to see a Tri-State . . . 
beautifully built ... for a lifetime.

35
Floor Plan Choices

St. Jacques or Qia’s Carnitas’ 
We have many’ethnic groups 
in Wisconsin and the State 
Historical Society of Wiscon­
sin is planning to publish a 
cookbook as part of bicenten­
nial observance in 1976 If 
you have some favorite reci­
pe handed down from grand­
ma to mother to you, could 
you share it, along with a 
story or any history ab­
out the recipe or food cust­
oms, etc. in your family?

Please bring them to club or 
send them to Mrs. Merv 
Thompson, R. 2, Kewaskum. 
She will see that, they are 
submitted. The deadline is A- 
pril 25, 1974 so Mrs Thomp­
son would like them by April 
20 or before. Wouldn’t it be 
nice to have your name and 
recipe chosen for this histor­
ical book? You never know 
until you try. Anyone in Wis­
consin may enter.

Facsimile Ballot Notice of Village Election 

Village of Kewaskum, Wisconsin
Notice is hereby given of village election to be held in and for the Village 

of Kewaskum, Washington County, Wisconsin, on the 2nd of April, 1974, at 
which the officers named below shall be chosen.

INFORMATION TO ELECTORS

The following instructions are given for the information and guidance of 
electors;

(a) Upon entering the polling place, an elector shall give his name and 
address before receiving the ballot from the ballot clerk. The initials of 2 
ballot clerks must appear on the ballot. Upon receiving the ballot, the elector 
shall retire alone to a voting booth and mark his ballot. A ballot clerk may 
inform the elector of the proper manner for marking a ballot, but he shall not 
in any manner advise or indicate for whom to vote.

(b) To vcte for a person whose name is printed on the ballot, make a 
cross (X) or mark in the square after the name of the person for whom you 
desire to vote. To vote for a person whose name is not printed on the ballot, 
write the name in the blank space provided for the purpose.

(c) The ballot should not be marked in any other manner. If the elector 
spoils a ballot, he shall return it to an election official who shall issue another 
in its place, but not more than 3 ballots shall be issued to any one elector. 
Not more than 5 minutes’ time shall be allowed to mark the ballot. Unofficial 
ballots or a memorandum to assist the elector in marking his ballot may be 
taken into the booth and copied. The sample ballot shall not be shown to any­
one so as to reveal how the ballot it marked.

(d) After the official ballot is marked, it shall be folded so the inside 
marks do not show but so the printed indorsements and ballot clerks’ initials 
on the outside do show. After folding the ballot, the elector shall leave the 
booth, give his name to the inspector in charge of the ballot box, hand him 
the ballot to be placed in the ballot box, and leave the polling place promptly.

(e) An elector may be assisted by 2 election officials of different political 
parties in marking the ballot if he declares to the presiding official that he is 
unable to read or that due to physical disability he is unable to mark his 
ballot. If an elector declares that he is visually handicapped, he may have 
anyone assist him in marking his ballot. The presiding official may administer 
an oath as to a person’s disability.

(f) Any qualified elector who is absent, or expects to be absent from the 
village in which he is a qualified elector, or who, because of sickness or phy­
sical disability cannot appear at the polling place on election day, may vote 
at such election by means of an absent voter’s ballot to be secured upon ap­
plication to the Village Clerk, not more than sixty days and no less than 
three days, or by personal application, not later than the close of office hours 
on the dry prior to such election.

(g) The following is a sample of the official ballot:

2,3,4 and 5
Bed Room Models

FEATURES:--------------------- ----------- - ----------------- - -----------------
Beautiful Cathedral Ceilings • Double Glass, Insulated Windows • Hot Water 
Heat, Choice of Fuels • Highest Quality Materials • Drywall Construction 
for Your Decorating Versatility • 2 x 8 Floor Joists, 2 x 6 Roof Rafters • De 
livery to Your Foundation in Weeks (about 6). Not Months. Erection in Days 
Factory Built to Strict Quality Standards and Control • Approved by All Conven 
tional Lending Institutions, also FHA, VA and FMHA.

Sample

Official Village Ballot
To vote for a person whose name is printed on the ballot, make a 

cross (X) in the square after the name of the person for whom you 
desire to vote. To vote for a person whose name is not printed on the 
ballot, write his name in the blank space provided for that purpose.

TRUSTEES (two year terms) Vote for three

YOU’RE INVITED TO VISIT OUR MODEL HOME

WEST BEND HOMES
2542 Wallace Lake Rd. 

West Bend, Wis. 

334-7610

Raynor Herriges _______________
Gregor A. Nigh _______________
Elmer Yoost _______________
Richard E. Zarling

POLLING PLACES AND HOURS

Notice is hereby given that the election will be held in the fire Station of 
the Municipal Building and that the polls will be open at 9:00 o’clock a. m 
and close at 8:00 o’clock p. m.

WILLIAM S. MARTIN, VILLAGE CLERK



Shown above: W. M. Dalton lead crystal featuring 5 stems to satisfy every home serving need: goblet, wine, champagne/ 
sherbet, parfait/sour, cordial, plus 13 oz. and 10 oz. tumblers.

FREE! Your choice in French 
imported Lead Crystal!
STEMWARE: The simplicity of the W. M. Dalton pattern 
accentuates the sparkling, clear qualities of this 24% lead 
crystal stem ware featuring elegantly flaired bowls and deeply 
carved hexagonal stems.
TUMBLERS: Serve your guests with the very finest-gleaming, 
finely blown, W. M. Dalton 24% lead crystal tumblers; 13 oz. 
and 10 oz. sizes. Crafted by French artisans with an exclusive 
process, the tumblers come in the highly desirable, deep, 
diamond-faceted pattern.
All pieces reflect the luxurious splendor that only true lead 
crystal can add to dining pleasure. If you ping the rim of this 
exquisite crystal with your finger, you are greeted with the 
brilliant chime of a delicate bell.

HERE'S HOW YOU GET YOURS:

1. Open an Insured Savings Account for $50 or more 
or add $50 to an existing savings account and get 
your first two pieces of this imported French leaded 
crystal stemware FREE.

2. Get additional 2 piece sets for only $3.50 when you 
add $25 to your account.

'^SAFETyV^

SAVINGS

INSURED

W6^

KEWASKUM SAVINGS OFFICE 

of

WEST BEND SAVINGS
114 Main St, Kewaskum - Phone 626-2186



SENTRY Come Shop Sentry 5 

Kitchen Cupboard Savings/

Lb.

LOIN end
CENTER CUT

c

c2-Lb.
Bag

ORE IDA FROZEN

later Tots

DEAN'S OR SENTRY

Skim Milk
Half

Gallon

, Your meqls perk right up when you serve Sentry pork. Pork is ever so versa­
tile with countless ways to liven up the many meals you must prepare. 

It’s a big family pleaser and another real value from Sentry.

Rib Porkchops Pork
Hoast

Lb
SENTRY 
VALUE 
PRICE!

K
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askum statesm
an 
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CENTER CUT 

loin Pork Chops 

93'
FROZEN

Stewing Chickens

49' 58
COUNTRY STYLE 

Spareribs 

75
SWIFT SELF BASTING

Turkey Breast 
$1O»

Lb.

Crestwood Bakery! 

Orange loaf Forte 
S|50

Fiesta Coffee Cake
S|07

KWIK MAKE REGULAR OR BUTTERMILK FROZEN

Pancake Batter . . .
CREME STICK

Dutch Cookies . . . .

I6-Oz.
Carton

I l-Oz. 
Pkg.

59c

59c

Sentry s Garden Fresh Produce!
Now you can have all the freshness and quality of a countryside produce 
market supply by shopping at Sentry. Do stop in today. You’ll be glad 
you did!

FRESH FRESH

McIntosh Apples Sweet Corn

3S1 »49'
1 CHICKEN OF THE SEA

BETTY CROCKER TUNA HELPER Tuna
8-Oz. Pkg. Noodle & Cream, 
Noodle & Cheese, Macaroni 
Newburg, Creamy Rice 57-

6.5-Oz. 
Can 53c

DEW DROP

Cut Asparagus . . . ^49c

3 PAK SAUSAGE OR CHEESE

gn 3

BLUEBERRY

John’s Frozen Pizza I | E^o Frozen Waffles

99c i SENTRY 
VALUE 
PRICE! 59c

25c OFF LABEL

a. Wisk Detergent
S -$140
MMb Bottle I

?*

-B
*1
e GO
-S’
N 7

2
k
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ORDINANCE NO. 74-1 
The Village Board of the Vil­
lage of Kewaskum does or­
dain as follows:

SECTION 1. Repeals ordi­
nance number 71 3 in its en­
tirety and hereby recreates 
an ORDINANCE TO REGU­
LATE. RESTRICT, AND LI­
MIT, IN THE INTEREST 
OF THE PUBLIC HEALTH 
AND SAFETY, THE DE­
POSIT OR DISCHARGE OF 
CERTAIN SUBSTANCES IN­
TO ANY SANITARY SEWER 
NOW MAINTAINED AND/ 
OR OWNED BY OR WHICH 
MAY BECOME THE PROP 
ERTY OF THE VILLAGE OF 
KEWASKUM WISCONSIN

SECTION II. DEFINI­
TIONS

1. Sanitary Sewer is a sew 
er intended intended to re­
ceive domestic sewage and 
industrial waste, except that 
of the tyne exnressly prohi­
bited by this ordinance, with­
out the admixture of sur 
face water and storm water.

. 2. Domestic Sewage is that 
liquid waste from bath rooms, 
toilet rooms, kitchens and 
home laundries.

3. Industrial Wastes are 
the liquid wastes, other than 
domestic sewage, resulting 
from processes or operations 
employed in industrial and 
commercial establishments.

4. “B.OJ) ” (Denoting Bi­
ochemical Oxygen Demand) 
shall mean the quantity of 
oxygen utilized in the bio­
chemical oxidation of organic 
matter under standard labor­
atory procedure in 5 days at 
20° C., expressed in milli­
grams per liter.

5. “Properly Shredded 
Garbage” shall mean the 
wastes from the prepara­
tion, cooking, and dispensing 
of food that have been shred- 
ed to such degree that all 
particles will be carried free­
ly under the flow conditions 
normally prevailing in sani­
tary sewers, with no particle 
greater than % inch in any 
dimension.

8. “Suspended Solids” 
shall mean solids that either 
float on the surface of, or are 
in suspension in water, sew­
age, or other liquids; and 
which are removable by lab­
oratory filtering as specified 
in the latest edition of the 
Standard Methods for the 
Examination of Water and 
Wastewater, published by the 
American Public Health As­
sociation.

7. “pH” shall mean the lo­
garithm of the reciprocal of 
the concentration of hydro­
gen ions in grams per liter 
of solution. A stabilized pH 
will be considered as a pH 
which does not change be­
yond the specified limits 
when the waste is subjected 
to aeration. A pH value indi­
cates the degree of acidity or 
alkalinity.

8. Celar is the "true color” 
due to the substances in solu­
tion expressed in wave 
lengths of light.

9. Person is any individual, 
firm, comoany, association, 
corporation or institution.

19. Village is the Village of 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin.

11. Receiving Stream is that 
body of water, stream or wa­
ter course receiving the dis­
charge waters from the 
wastewater treatment plant 
or formed by the waters dis­
charged from the wastewater 
treatment plant.

12. Approving Authority 
shall be the Village Engineer.

SECTION III USAGE 
OF MUNICIPAL SANITARY 
SEWERS

1. No person shall dis­
charge or deposit any of the 
following waste materials in­
to any Village sewer:

(a) Any liquid or vapo

having a temperature 
higher than 160° F
(b) Any water or waste 
which contains a concen­
tration greater than 100 
mg/Iiter of fat, oil. or 
grease, exclusive of soap 
(c) Any flammable or ex­
plosive liquid, solid or 
gas, including, but not li­
mited to gasoline, ben­
zene, naphtha, and fuel 
oil.
(d) Any garbage that has 
not been properly shred­

ded. V
(e) Any ashes, cinders, 
sand, mud, straw, shav­
ings, metal, glass, rags, 
feathers, tar, plastics, 
wood, paunch manure, or 
other solids or viscous 
substance capable of caus­
ing obstruction to the 
flow in sewers or other 
interference with the pro­
per operation of the 
wastewater treatment 
works.
(f) Any waters or wastes 
having a stabilized pH 
lower than 5.5 or higher 
than 9.0, or having any 
other corrosive property 
capable of causing dam­
age or hazard to struc­
tures, equipment, and per­
sonnel of the wastewater 
treatment works.
(g) Any waters or wastes 
having a Biochemical Ox­
ygen Demand in excess of 
2000 mg/liter.
(h) Any waters or wastes 
containing more than 2000 
mg/liter of suspended so­
lids.
(i) Any waters or wastes 
having an objectionable 
color which is not remov­
able in the existing waste­
water treatment plant pro­
cesses.
(j) Any waters or wastes 
containing a toxic or poi- 
sonous substance or any 
other materials in suffi­
cient quantity to injure or 
interfere with any waste­
water treatment process, 
or constitute a hazard to 
humans or animals, or 
create any hazard in the 
receiving stream at the 
waste water treatment
plant. '
The following materials 
are listed as toxic and ha­
zardous substances along 
with the limits.

Concentration, 
mg/liter

Aldrin 0.0005
Arsenic 0.05
Beryllium 0.1
Boron 1.0
Cadmium 0.05
Chromium 0.1
Cobalt 2.0
Copper 0.1
Cyanide 0.025
Dieldrin 0.0005
Fluoride 2.0
Heptachlor 0.0005
Lead 0.1
Manganese 0.1
Mercury 0.0025
Nickel 0 2
Phenols 0.05
Polychlorinated
Biphenyls 0.0005
Selenium 0.05
Sulfate 10.0
Sulfide 1.0
Sulfite 2.0
Thallium 0.05
Zinc 0.1
(k) Any waters or wastes 
containing suspended so­
lids of such character and 
quantity that unusual at­
tention or expense is re­
quired to handle such ma­
terials at the normal 
wastewater treatment 
plant.
(1) Any noxious or mal­
odorous gas or substance 
capable of creating a pub­
lic nuisance.

2 No surface or subsur­

face water flowing from sur­
face drains, roof drains, yard 
drains, foundation drains, 
etc., shall be permitted to en­
ter the sanitary sewers. Cool­
ing waters and other nonpol­
luting waters are also not 
permitted to enter the sanita­
ry sewers.

3 . The Approving Author­
ity, without limitation by 
other sections of this ordi­
nance, may authorize any 
person to discharge industri­
al waste of unusual strength 
or character into the sewers 
of the Village under approv­
ed conditions or pretreat­
ment. Unusual strength or 
character refers to those 
wastes which may exceed the 
limits set in Section III, par­
agraph 1, but which may be 
amendable to pretreatment 
or which, in the opinion of 
the' Approving Authority, will 
not interfere with the treat­
ment of the wastewater or 
constitute a hazard to humans 
or animals or to the receiving 
stream. The Approving‘Au­
thority may prohibit entry of 
particular industrial wastes 
into the sanitary sewer when­
ever such action is necessary 
to prevent damage to the 
system or to determine the 
effects of such wastes on the 
sewage system. Pretreatment 
of wastes may be required by 
the Approving Authority to 
meet the limits imposed in 
Section III, (1) or to a degree 
which will make the waste 
amenable to treatment in the 
village’s STP.

SECTION IV: STRUC­
TURES REQUIRED

1. Storage Tanks: In or­
der to equalize flows over a 
24-hour period, each person 
discharging a waste into the 
Village’s sanitary sewers hav­
ing a volume in excess of 
500,000 gallons in any one 
day, shall construct and 

.maintain at his own expense 
a suitable storage tank. Said 
tank shall have a capacity of 
at least 80% of the normal 
volume of one 24-hour pro­
duction period of waste and 
whose outlet to the sewer is 
controlled by a water works 
type rate controller, or other 
approved device, the setting 
of which shall be directed by 
the Approving Authority.

2. Any person discharging 
industrial wastes into Village 
Sanitary sewers shall con­
struct a suitable control man­
hold, downstream from any 
pretreatment, storage, or oth­
er approved works, to facili­
tate observation, measure­
ments and sampling of' all 
wastes including domestic 
sewage, from the industry. 
The control manhole shall be 
constructed at a suitable and 
satisfactory location and built 
in a manner approved by the 
Aporoving Authority.

Where a storage tank is 
not required, the control 
manhole shall be equipped 
with a permanent type vol­
ume measuring device such 
as a nozzle, or other suitable 
device, with a recorder as 
may be approved by the 
Approving - Authority. The 
manhole shall be installed at 
the expense of the person 
discharging the wastes and 
shall be maintained by the 
Village so as to be safe, ac­
cessible and in proper opera­
ting condition at all times.

3. Plans for the construe- ‘ 
tion of said storage tank, con­
trol manhole, and controlling 
devices shall be approved by 
the Approving Authority pri­
or to the beginniny of con­
struction.

SECTION V: PERMITS
Any person desiring to de­

posit or discharge any indus­
trial waste into the sanitary 
sewers shall make annlica- 
tion for the disposal of indus­

trial waste to the Approving 
Authority. The Annroving 
Authority shall approve such 
applications only when evi­
dence is submitted by the ap­
plicant that the discharge in­
to the sanitary sewer will 
comply with all of the regu­
lations of this ordinance.

SECTION VT: OUTSIDE 
CONNECTIONS

Any person owning or con­
trolling prem;ses located be­
yond the corporate limits of 
the Village of Kewaskum and 
desiring to install a nlumbing 
system for the nurnose of 
discharging domestic sewage 
and/or industrial waste into 
the san’tary sewers of the 
Village of Kewaskum must 
obtain permission from the 
Village Board. If permission 
is granted, the user must 
comply with all of the re­
quirements of this ordinance 
and will be required to pay a 
permit fee of $100.00. Each 
service connected must in­
clude a meter, approved by 
the Approving Authority, 
for purpose of flow measure­
ment. In addition to the quar­
terly fees determined accord­
ing to the rates set forth in 
this ordinance, a surcharge of 
25% will be assessed on each 
quarterly statement.

SECTION VII: POWERS 
AND AUTHORITY FOR 
INSPECTION

The Approving Authority 
and other duly authorized 
employees of the Village, 
bearing proper credentials 
and identification, shall be 
permitted to enter upon all 
properties for the purpose 
of inspection, observation, 
measurement, sampling, and 
testing, in accordance with 
the provisions of this ordi­
nance.

SECTION VIII: WASTE- 
WATER TREATMENT 
CHARGES

1. Residential Users
All persons discharging 

wastewater into the Village 
sanitary sewer system shall 
be rendered a quarterly bill 
determined from the volume 
of flow. The rate will be

Kfwisk'im Statesman 
Friday, March 29, 1974 

$0 79 per thousand gallons. 
The volume of flow used in 
computing the charges shall 
be based upon metered water 
consumption as shown in the 
records of meter readings 
maintained in the Village 
Water Department.

2. Commercial and Indus­
trial Users

All commercial units and 
industrial users discharging 
wastewater into the Village 
sanitary sewer system shall 
be rendered a quarterly bill 
determined from:

(a) Volume of flow as 
determined by metered 
water consumption as 
shown in the records of 
meter reading maintained 
in the Village Water De­
partment or from record­
ed volumes of flow deter- 

< mined from the control 
manhole measuring device 
required under Section IV 
of this ordinance, at the 
rate of $0.79 per thousand 
gallons, plus
(b) For all wastewater 
discharged into the sani­
tary sewer system which 
contains a concentration 
of B.O.D greater than 
250 mg/liter, a surcharge 
of $0.10 per pound of 
B.O.D. on this excess, 
plus
(c) For all wastewater 
discharged into the sani­
tary sewer system which 
contains a concentration 
of suspended solids great­
er than 250 mg/liter, a 
surcharge of $0.06 per 
pound of suspended solids 
on this excess.
(d) The total cost for 
each industrial discharge 
shall be computed from 
the quarterly analyses as 
follows:

Continued on Page 9

Radio-TV-Sound
SALES & SERVICE

Frank J. Felix
Ph. 626-2841 Kewaskum

ATLAS 
ARMSTRONG 
ASTROSTAR 
GOODYEAR

Price Quotes Include:
Installation, Balancing and F.E.T.

Honeck Chevrolet Inc.
Phone 626-2161

Highway 45 Kewaskum, Wis.
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where

Cu total charge per quarter, $

~ volume of wastewater discharged during quarter 
gallons

Service

vol " cost on volume basis, $ per 1000 gallons

CBOD = ^-t-OH B9D basis* $ Per lb. of BOD in excess 
of 250 mg/liter

^SS ~ OT) SS‘basis, $ per lb. of SS in excess of 
250 mg/liter

24 HOUR EMERGRNCY 
A WRECKER SERVICE 

■■■■■■ a
COMPLETE AUTOMOTIVE 

SERVICE
With Many Years Experience 

EEBaB
YOUR TIRE CENTER 

Firestone J.T.W.
Pennsylvania 

■ ■■■
Hwy. 45 South 

Phone 626-2888 
KIWASKUM

BOD = concentration of BOD of industrial wastewater 
during quarter as determined by quarterIv 
analysis, mg/liter

SS - concentration of SS of industrial wastewater 
during quarter as determined bv quarterly 
analysis, mg/liter

(e) An annual audit as 
applicable to the waste- 
water treatment plant; of 
all revenues and costs, to 
include, but not be limited 
to, construction, amortiza­
tion, operation and main­
tenance. shall be required 
by the Village Commis­
sioner. If the cost-revenue 
pattern changes, the char­
ges to all users shall be 
adjusted.

SECTION IX: DETER­
MINING OF CHARACTER 
AND CONCENTRATION OF 
WASTES

1. The Approving Authority 
or an assistant designated by 
it shall make a quarterly de­
termination of the character, 
concentration and quantity of 
writes d’scharged.

2. The location and design 
of sampling sites should be 
approved by the Approving 
Authority.

3. Samples shall be col­
lected in such a manner as to 
be satisfactory to the Appro­
ving Authority or the assis­
tant designated. The labora­
tory methods used in the ex­
amination of said wastewat­
ers shall be those set forth in 
the latest edition of the 
Standard Methods for the 
Examination of Water and 
Wastewater, published by 
the American Public Health 
Association.

4. The determination of 
the character, concentration 
and quantity of the industrial 
wastes by the Approving Au­
thority, or his authorized as­
sistants, shall be bind’ng as a 
basis for charges. Industries 
desiring to have another sam­
ple taken other than at regu­
lar intervals may request the 
Approving Authority to take 
such samples, at the expense 
of the industry making such 
’•equest.

5. Costs incident to samp­
ling and analyzing of wastes 
that are applicable to sur­
charges shall be paid by the 
Village.

SECTION X:" BILLING
1. Bills will be sent with 

the water bill through the 
United States mail notifying 
all persons of the amount and 
date due. Failure to receive 
notice is not an excuse for 
non-payment of bills.

2. Bills are rendered every 
three (3) months, and are 
mailed on the tenth (10th) of 
the month following the 
quarter.

3. Persons not having paid 
their bills by the 25th of the

^#< « , .i t «>»»>««»> »»»^VW/

month following the quarter, 
that being the due date, will’ 
be delinquent. A 10% penal­
ty is added to all sewage bills 
that are not paid by the due 
date, the water connection 
serving the premises will be 
turned off without further 
notice if the bill is not paid 

। on or before the last day of 
the month following the 
quarter and will not be turn­
ed on again until said bill is 
paid.

4. Bills are payable at 
the office of the Village Com­
missioner.

5. In case a person dis­
charging wastes into the Vil­
lage sanitary sewer system 
does not procure his water 
supply from the Village of 
Kewaskum and becomes de­
linquent in his payment of 
the aforesaid surcharge, his 
connection with the Village 
sewer system will be severed 
and will only be reconnected 
at his expense.

• 6. The sewerage service 
charges as levied pursuant to 
this ordinance shall be a lien 
upon the property served 
pursuant to section 66.069 
and 66.076 (7) Wisconsin 
Statutes, and shall be collect­
ed in the manner therein pro­
vided.

7. The funds received from 
sewerage service charges 
shall be deposited at regular 
intervals in a depository to 
be designated by the Village 
Board. Said funds shall be a- 
vailable for the payment of 
the cost of construction, cost 
and expenses of management, 
maintenance, depreciation 
and repair of the sewerage 
treatment plant, and to pro­
vide funds for the retirement 
of bonds as they mature, and 
interest thereon.

8. The amount received 
from the collection of the 
charges authorized by the or­
dinance shall be credited to 
a sanitary sewerage system. 
When appropriate by the Vil­
lage Board, the credits to said 
account shall be available for 
the payment of the require­
ments for operation, main­
tenance, and repairs of the 
sewerage system. Any sur­
plus in said account shall be 
available for the payment of 
principal and interest of 
bonds issued and outstanding 
or which may be issued, to 
provide funds for said sewer­
age system, or part thereof 
and all of a part of the ex­
penses for additions and im­
provements and other neces­
sary disbursements or in- 
/*'«**# f * 4 # I V • * i • « il*»A«44l»

debtedness, and the Village 
Board may by resolution 
pledge such surplus or any 
part thereof for any such pur­
pose.

SECTION XI: PROTEC­
TION FROM DAMAGES

It shall be considered a 
misdemeanor to maliciously, 
willfully, or negligently 
break, damage, destroy, unco­
ver, deface or tamper with 
any equipment or materials 
belonging to the Village of 
Kewaskum used for the pur­
pose of making tests or exam­
inations and left upon the 

* premises of a person dischar­
ging wastes into the sewers.

SECTION XII. DISCHAR­
GES CAUSING DAMAGES 
AND PENALTY PROVIS­
IONS

1. Any damages which occur 
at the wastewater treatment 
plant or to the receiving wa­
ters downstream of the 
wastewater treatment plant 
which are caused by an acci- 

' dental discharge from an in­
dustry and which must be re­
paired or corrected by the 
Village are the liability of 
that industry. The Village 
Commissioner will assess all 
costs, for such repair and cor­
rections, in time and* mater­
ials, to the industry responsi­
ble for the accidental dis­
charge. A fine of $100.00 for 
each day that the accidental 
discharge occurs will be as­
sessed in addition to the costs 
for repair and correction.

2. Any person who shall 
violate any provisions of this 
ordinance other than the pro­
visions of paragraph 1, Sec­
tion XII above shall, upon 
conviction of such violation, 
bo subject to a penalty, which 
shall be as follows:

(a) First Offense—Penal­
ty. Any person who shall 
violate any provision of 
this ordinance other than 
paragraph 1, Section XII 
above shall, upon convic­
tion thereof, forfeit not 
more than $100.00 togeth- 

• er with the costs of prose­
cution and in default of 
payment of such forfeit­
ure apd costs of prosecu­
tion shall be imprisoned 
in the county jail until 
said forfeiture and costs 
are paid, but not exceed­
ing 30 days.
(b) Second Offense—Pen­
alty. Any person found 
guilty of violating any 
provision of this ordinance 
other than paragraph 1. 
Section XII above who

shall previously have been 
convicted of a violation 
of the same provision 
shall upon conviction 
thereof, forfeit not less 
than $10.00 nor more than 
$100.00 for each such of­
fense, together with the 
costs of prosecution and 
in default of payment of 
such forfeiture and costs 
shall be imprisoned in the 
county jail until said for­
feiture and costs of pro­
secution are paid, but not 
to exceed 3 months.
’c) Each violation and 
each day a violation con­
tinues or occurs shall con­
stitute a separate offense. 
Nothing in this ordinance 
shall preclude the Village 
from maintaining any ap­
propriate action to prev­
ent or remove a violation 
of any provision contained 

* in this ordinance.
3. Execution against Defen­

dant’s Property
Whenever any person fails 

to pay any forfeiture and 
costs of prosecution upon the 
order of the court for viola­
tion of this ordinance the 
court may, in lieu of ordering 
imnrisonment of the defend­
ant, or after the defendant 
has been released from cus­
tody, issue an execution a- 
gainst the property of the de­
fendant for said forfeiture 
and costs.

SECTION XIII: REPEAL­
ING CLAUSE

All ordinances or parts of 
ordinances in conflict with 
this ordinance are hereby re­
pealed. If any section, para­
graph, sub-division, clause, or 
provision of this ordinance 
shall be adjudged invalid, 
such adjudication shall apply 
only to such section, para­
graph, subdivision, clause or 
provision so adjudged, and 
the remainder of this ordin­
ance shall be deemed valid 
and effective.

SECTION XIV: EFFEC­
TIVE DATE

This ordinance shall take 
effect and be in full force 
from and after the 1st day of 
April, 1974.

Passed and approved this 
25th day of March, 1974

Charles F. Miller 
Village President 

ATTEST:
William Martin
Village Commissioner 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
Roger W McKenna 
Village Attorney

When dandelions start multiplying your grass starts retreat­
ing But you can stop ’em As soon as dandelion plants appear 
tn your yard, spread Northrup King's Golf Brand Triple 
T^ ? " J1'11 ‘J1? <Un<Wion•in >°“f y«rd “nd several other 
weeds besides It II also fertilize your lawn Triple Tonic is 
both a tough weed killer and a gentle lawn food And it 
comes with a money back guarantee

LAUBENSTEIN 
LAWN & GARDEN MART

KBWAUCUM PHON! gM-lM

$ave I 
on auto 
insurance
Washington County - Not City

son 60
^f ^V IB MO)

15/30/10 Liability;
$1000 Med Pay; 15/30 UM. 
To qualify; all drivers 30-69; 
no accidents or more than one 
minor violation past 3 years; 
drive 3 miles or less to work; 
under 7500 miles per year; 
no business use.

A. H. 
SEEFELDT 
INC.
call 626-2921 
Kewaskum

A A HERITAGE insurance
SHEBOYGAN WISCONSIN 63081

p 4 / r i /; * f 1 1
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WOMAN WANTED—Tn kit­
chen, 3 hours over noon 
hour, 5 days a week. Apply 
in person. Village Inn, Ke-
waskum. 3-29-2

WANTED—High school girl 
to babysit. Must be 16. 
3:15 to 9:30, Tues., Wed. 
and Fri. Phone 626-4413.

HIGHEST PRICES paid for 
old newspapers, copper, 
brass, aluminum, lead and 
batteries. Lynn’s Waste Pa­
per Co., 121 Island Ave., 
West Bend, Wis.

FOR SALE — Large onion 
sets, .35 per lb; vegetable 
seeds, complete selection 
now in stock. Laubenstein 
Lawn A Garden Mart, Ke- 
waskum. Ph. 626-2553. tf

FOR SALE—’68 % ton Chev.
V-8, Camper Shell. Phone
626-4215. 3-29-2

FOR SALE—’72 El Camino, 
power steering, power 
brakes, good condition. 
Call after 4 p. m. at 334- 
4911 or after 6 p. m. at
626-4525. 3-29-tf

HELP WANTED—Waitress­
es, dishwasher, bus boys
Apply in person at the Wig-
warn. 3 22-tf

WORK WANTED — Male, 
full or part time, custodian 
or general work, inside or 
outside. Phone 626-4468 
after 5 o’clock. 3-22-2p 

HELP WANTED — Anply in 
person at A A W. No phone
calls. 3-22-tf

WILL BUY Lionel or Amer­
ican Flyer trains. Any con­
dition. Phone 338-6467. 

3-15-4

WEDDING INVITATIONS— 
Many styles to choose from. 
Come in and look at our 
huge selection of samples. 
Prices start at $10.95 per 
100 Also thank you notes, 
napkins, etc. Free gift with 
each order. Kewaskum 
Statesman. 626-2626.

State of Wisconsin 
Washington County Court 
PROBATE BRANCH
ORDER SETTING TIME TO 
PROVE WILL AND HEIR­
SHIP AND NOTICE TO 
CREDITORS.

IN THE MATTER OF THE 
ESTATE OF JEROME H. 
SCHILLER a/k/a JEROME 
SCHILLER, Deceased.

A petition for the probate 
of the Will, and determina­
tion of heirship, of Jerome 
Schiller, Washington County, 
Wisconsin, post office ad­
dress 1209 Park View Drive, 
Kewaskum Wisconsin 53040, 
having been filed;

IT IS ORDERED THAT:
1. The petition be heard at 

the Washington County 
Courthouse, in West Bend, 
Wisconsin, on April 9, 1974, 
at the opening of Court or 
thereafter;

2. All creditors’ claims 
must be filed on or before 
June 11, 1974, or be barred.

Dated March 11, 1974
By the Court,

/s/ J. Tom Merriam 
County Judge. 

McKENNA LAW OFFICE 
Attorney 
114 Main Street 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin 53040

Menus for week of April 
1 - 5:

Monday — Barbecued beef 
on a bun, tater tots, pineap­
ple crisp, bread, butter and 
chocolate milk (FHA Club is 
sponsoring chocolate milk).

Tuesday — Mock chicken 
legs, potatoes and gravy, 
cranberry sauce, radishes, 
brownies, bread, butter and 
milk.

Wednesday — Baked ham 
on a sesame bun, tri-taters, 
Creamed peas, jello with fruit

Friday — NO SCHOOL 
(Teacher’s Convention).

Week of April 8 - 12 — NO 
SCHOOL (Easter Vacation). 
Menus are subject to change.

Optometrist’s office—Site for sore 
eyes.

REAL ESTATE SCHOOL

iBowe&Weninger 
Realty, Inc.

bread, butter, peanut 
and milk.

butter

Thursday — Turkey on a
bun, green and yellow beans
buttered, orange juice, pump­
kin muffins, fruit sauce - 
pears, bread, butter and 
milk.

SERVICES OFFERED 
Painting and varnishing. 
Reasonable. Mrs John Fell 
Kewaskum. Ph. 626-2578. 

3-8-3p

CARD OF THANKS
Our most sincere thanks to 

all our relatives and friends 
for their kindness during the 
time of illness and after the 
death of our dear mother, 
mother-in-law, grandmother 
and great-grandmother, Ida 
Bartelt. Special thanks to 
Rev. Hoenecke, the nurses, 
donors of floral and memorial

SERVICES OFFERED - 
Screen repair, glass, vanity

tributes, 
Home,

Miller’s Funeral
sexton and all who

and door mirrors 
size. Skybird Pa:nt 
phone 626 4081, 
kum.

cut to 
& Glass 
Kewas-

3 8-8

showed respect.
The Family 
Ida Bartelt

of

CHAIN SIAWS SHARPENED 
Laubenstein Lawn & Gar-- 
den Mart, R. 2, Kewaskum.,

Housework 
is easier 

with
f Oufi.^
| SOFT WATER 1

U You’ll find that you / 
J can clean kitchens I 
u and baths in a frac- U 

tion of the time.
^ Eliminates dulling ft

hard water film .. . 
helps keep every­
thing cleaner longer. 
Saves on soaps and 
cleaners.

ASK THE HUM WHO CAKES! 
SAV-

^fe
MAH!

524 S. Main St 
West Bend Ph. 334-3056
In the Kewaskum Area 

Contact
DICK ELLIS - 626-4761

LAUBENSTEIN
LAWN * GARDEN MART 

Kewaskum
Phone 626-2553

Wp am now vnur author­
ized Jacobson Salos A Ser­
vice dealer also wo can 
service vour S'mnbcify e- 
quioment. as we are Ke­
waskum’s only authorized 
Briggs A Stratton A Te­
cumseh dealer.

Other lines we sell and 
service are- John Deere. 
Lawn Boy. Toro, Snapner. 
Arlens, Parker Sweepers, 
D’sston Grass Shears, Pio­
neer A Poulan Chain Saws. 
Homelite Lawn Equipment, 
Tecumseh.

We can also sunnlv parts 
for your Craftsman en­
gines. Universal lawn mow­
er blades. V-belts, oils and 
sparkplugs.

Complete lawn and gar­
den rental service.

Bulk grass seed, Golf 
Brand fertilizer, sheep and 
cow manure, peat moss and 
black dirt Northrup King, 
vegetable seeds and Punch- 
N Grow seeds.

“Service Built Our 
Business”

BECOME A LICENSED 
BROKER OR SALESMAN- 
HOME STUDY COURSE 
ALSO CLASSES IN FOND 
DU LAC. APPROVED FOR 
VETERANS BENEFITS.

WISCONSIN SCHOOL OF 
REAL ESTATE

161 W. WIS. AVE., 
MILWAUKEE

List With .the Leader

Dan Coulter
Area Representative

R. 3, Campbellsport

TOP CASH for 
DISABLED or DEAD 
COWS and HORSES

Better Type 
$20 and Up

391. Elegant 3 bedroom all 
brick ranch home on a 
large lovely lot with at­
tached 2 car garage in an 
excellent location. This 
spacious home, is of the 
finest quality through­
out. Large carpeted kit- 
chen/dining area, with 
built-in china cabinet, 
electric range, new re­

frigerator. Beautiful large 
carpeted living room, 
huge family room with 
patio doors, 2 ceramic 
tile baths, loads of clos­
et space, and huge rec 
room with built-in bar 
and back bar, new pool 
table. We’re sure this is 
the home you have been 
waiting for. Priced at on 
ly $39,500.00

Home 626-4592

Office 336-0661

KEWASKUM REALTY

KEWASKUM LOT 
95 x 150 on Braatz Dr.

TAVERN
Downtown Theresa, on Hwy 
175 Good location, large 
bar, living quarters down 
and rental unit up Could be 
used for other business also 
What do you need? Only 
$29,500.

KEWASKUM
3 bed mom ranch on a 34 acre 
lot, /cw w||l aim sepf?! sys­
tem, Virrft^i Amg rym & 
hal^Par^wood rloorf^n the 
bedrooms, and a 1 car garage. 
Mid 20’s.

5 BEDROOMS
This home has all the extras 
you’ve been looking for. fire­
place, April-Aire humidifier, 
electronic air cleaner, dispos­
al, dishwasher, range hood, 
2% baths, water softener, au- i 
tomatic garage door opener, 
underground gas tank and a 
2 car garage. This beautiful­
ly decorated home is located 
near West Bend. Mid 50’s.

KEWASKUM
Bel-Ric Dr., planned 3 bed­
room ranch, family room, full 
basement, .! car garage. Buy­
er’s choice of colors. Under 
$25,000.00.

COUNTRY LOTS
2 miles NW of West Bend. 
Good building sites. Choice 
of 2. Pick yours now for 
spring building.

WEST BEND LOTS 
2 fully improved city lots 
zoned for 2 family.

TOWN LINE RD.
5 miles northwest of West 
Bend, 39 acres of woodland 
and springs. Sell firewood as 
a sideline. Priced reasonable.

When buying or selling 
call

KEWASKUM 
REALTY

Bob Kirst, Realtor 
333 Main St., Kewaskum 

626-4392

FAST 
No charge

REMOVAL 
for dead Calves

or Pigs picked up at same 
time. _ tNELSON

313 3 Large wooded lots 
wth all improvements, 
in Kewaskum; ready for 
your dream home. Priced 
from $6,900.

Farm Service
Phone Collect 

OSHKOSH 233-1010

OFFICE: 131 Main St. 
KEWASKUM Ph. 626-4757 
P. Albinger, Broker Sales 334-9163 
MIKE WALSH SALES Ph. 6264757

Full Time Realtors & Appraisers

"CASH" PLUS BUCKSKIN 
WHEN BOSSIE THE COW GL0VES 

; is dead, down or disabled. Live horses & ponies 
DON'T GIVE YOUR DEADSTOCK [3-4clb.J 

CALL AWAY, SELL THEM TO US. :: "Ole Craw" dial toll free { VI UW 1-800-242-0389
ANIMAL SERVICE Prompt 3 Hour Service

ft USED(HRS
SPECIAL

3 — ’73 Impala 4 Drs. 
Air Conditioned-Low Milcage

’73 Caprice Sport Sedan, 
Air Condition, 
Low Mileage

’72 Buick LeSabre 4-Dr., 
Very Clean, 
Low Mileage

*72 Chev. Impala 6 Pass.
Sta. Wagon V8 Automa­
tic, Fall Power

'72 Chev. Impala 4 Dr., Power 
Steering & Brakes, 
Vinyl Roof, 31,000 Mi.

’72

’73

’71

’71

’71

'70

’70

’69

Impala 4 Door, 
Low Mileage

-USED
Chev. 
Big 6
Chev.

Fleetside % Ton 
• 4 Speed
% Ton Pickup.

6 Cyl. - 4 Sp. Low Mi.

Chev. % Ton Pickup 
V8 - Low Miles

Impala 4 Dr. Full Pow­
er Excellent Condition

Caprice Sport Sedan. 
Low Mileage

Chev. Townsman Sta. 
Wagon, Automatic
Plymouth Roadrunner 
Sport Coupe, V8-Auto. 
Very Clean - Sporty

2—’69 Chev. Bel Air 4 Drs. 
V8 Automatic

’68 Impala Cpe., Like new
’67 Malibu Sport Cpe.

V8 - Automatic

TRUCKS—
’70 Ford ’/a Ton - 6 Cyl. 

21,000 Miles

’69 Chev. ¥2 Ton Pickup 
V8 - 3 Sp.

PLUS MANY OTHER PICKUPS AND LARGER TRUCKS

HONECK 
Chevrolet, Inc. 

KEWASKUM Phone 626-2161
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Hall-Oppermann trucker for the West Bend El­
evator.

Tn the field events the In­
dians’ Mike Koepke took fifth 
in the shot with a heave of

BOY SCOUT PANCAKE 
SUPPER ON SATURDAY

Plans are finalized for the 
annual Boy Scout Pancake 
Supper to be held Saturday. 
March 30, from 4:30-7:30 p. 
m. at the Kewaskum High 
School Cafeteria.

Advance tickets on sale from 
Kewaskum Boy Scouts are 
$1.50 for adults and $1 00 for 
children under 12 In addi­
tion to all the pancakes you 
can eat, apple sauce, assorted 
pies, coffee and milk will be 
included in the ticket price. 
Extra charcoal broiled brat- 
wurst will be available for a 
quarter.

Tickets remaining will be 
sold at the door..

A Nov. 9 wedding is being 
planned by Miss Joan Hall 
and Dennis Oppermann. Par­
ents of the couple are Mr. 
and Mrs. Leo G. Hall, R 3, 
Campbellsport, and Mr. and 
Mrs Wilson Oppermann, R. 
2, Campbellsport.

The bride-elect is a 1971 
graduate of Campbellsport 
High School and is employed 
by the West Bend Co. Mr. 
Oppermann is a 1968 gradu­
ate of Kewaskum High 
School and is employed as a

Indians 4th in 
Scenic Indoor 
Track Meet

Kewaskum finished fourth 
in the Scenic Moraine split 
indoor track meet. The field 
events were held Wednesday 
afternoon at Hartland and the 
running events Friday after­
noon at Grafton.

Five records fell as Ger­
mantown successfully defen­
ded its indoor title with 61% 
points. Finishing second was 
Grafton with 42.5 points, 
followed by Hartland 39, Ke­
waskum 30, Slinger 25, May­
ville 12 and Pewaukee and 
Kettle Moraine (tie) 7.

Records were set by Ger­
mantown in the 220 and mile 
relay, Slinger in the pole 
vault, Grafton in the shot 
put and 880 relay.

Kewaskum, which had sco­
red only one point in field e- 
vents, did well in the run- 
mng portion of the meet and 
gained enough points to take 
fourth overall, trailing only 
the three Class A schools in 
the conference.

44-2 In the high jump Ke­
waskum’s Gary Fickler, de­
fending outdoor champ, fail­
ed at 5 9. In the long jump 
Kewaskum’s Scott Rammer 
was nosed out for fifth.

In the running events the 
Indians’ sophomore and juni­
or dominated squad did well. 
Randy Backhaus won the two 
mile and placed second in 
the mile. Soph John Marino 
took second in the 220, third 
in the 40 yard dash and help­
ed to get a fourth in the 880 
relay. Another soph. Dennis

Bremser, was also on the re­
lay squad and took second in 
the 880 run. He went hard 
right to the finish line and 
fell as he hit the tape, with 
2:10.1, just .8 of a second be­
hind the winner, Chris Can­
ter of Germantown, who 
went to state last year. Koep­
ke got a fourth in both hur­
dle events, besides his fifth in 
the shot on Wednesday.

“You usually pay the most 
for the things you get for 
nothing.”

om

WATKINS 
Quality Products 
MASON SHOES 

WM. J. COULTER 
179 Mill Street 

Campbellsport Ph. 533-8554

Don't let this

NEW 
HOME 
COSTS 

TOO 
STEEP?

REMODEL YOUR PRESENT 
HOME TO ENJOY NEW 

HOME COMFORTS
Is the cost of a new home just about out of your 
reach? Relax. You can enjoy the comforts and 
conveniences of a new home simply by remodel­
ing your present home. Think of it, a new bath­
room and new kitchen as good as and even bet­
ter than that in most new homes. A new and more 
efficient heating and cooling system of the finest 
quality. And all at a tremendous saving over 
new home cost. At the same time you increase 
the value of your property more than the cost of 
the installations.

LAUBENSTEIN 
Lawn & Garden Mart

KEWASKUM PHONE n«-tU>

It s the toughest, meanest grass around. C rabgrass spreads 
last and can literally "take over" your enure lawn in a single 
season; killing all of your nice, beautiful grass

Don I wait! Rescue your lawn right away with Northrup 
King Crabgrass Killer -ihe safe killer h eliminates crab­
grass, yet it won't harm the good grasses in your lawn And 
Northrup King Crabgrass Killer is also a healthy fertilizer 
(You could say it punishes the evil and rewards the good.)

Regular #15.95

Green Grass 
Sale Price

$13.95
140 lb bag I

53095

plus these

There's opportunity at Amity to earn good 
pay while enjoying unusually pleasant and 
clean working conditions, 
generous fringe benefits:

• Attractive wage schedule
Complete life and health
insurance protection including 
major medical
10 paid holidays
Liberal paid vacation plan 
Modern retirement plan

Visit our Personnel
Office in the
Carillon Tower.

Open 7 to 4 Monday 
through Friday or call

us for an appointment.
338-6601

LEATHER PRODUCTS CO.
WEST BEND, WIS.

DO IT YOURSELF OR LET US DO IT

('ome in and see

^g HOME IMPROVEMENT CENTER
AUTHORIZED DEALER

Johann
N

Kewaskum

r
Hwy 28

PLUMBING & HEATING, INC.
Hone Improvement Center

PHONE 334-9481
Located in St. Michaels, 3 miles 
East of Kewaskum on Hwy. 28.

Hour*: Mon -Thur*.- 8 a m to 5:30 p.m.
Fri. 8 a m -9 p-m- Sat. 8 a m.-5 p m
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Will Hold Lunch
With Easter Bunny

Several enthusiastic spring 
projects are being undertak­
en by the Kewaskum Junior 
Woman’s Club.

Lunch with the Easter
Bunny 
April
High 
11:30,

will be held Saturday, 
6 at the Kewaskum 
School Cafeteria at 
for children 8 years

old and younger. The Easter 
Bunny will be there along 
with Snoopy, a dragon, Rag­
gedy Ann, a clown, a lion. 
A limited number of tickets 
are being sold for $1.00 by 
club members.

A Bicycle Safety Clinic, in

GRAND OPENING

TOM'S PLACE
KEWASKUM

(Formerly the Opera House)

NEWLY REMODELED

co-operation with the Kewas­
kum Police Department, is 
being planned It will be held 
April 9 and 10 at the Kewas­
kum High School. The first 
session will include instruc­
tions and a film, and the sec­
ond will include a written 
and skill test. Safety awards 
will be given to those who 
qualify. Rain date, April 11.

Pre-school Story Hour will 
begin April 25 and continue 
each Thursday through May 
30 at 10 a. m., at the Kewas­
kum Public Library.

On Tuesday, March 26, 
club members hosted a Vot­
ers Candidate Forum with the 
League of Women Voters of 
Washington County. The pro­
gram began at 7 p. m. in the 
multi-purpose room of the 
Kewaskum High School.

In cooperation with the 
Kewaskum Woman’s Club, 
the Juniors sponsored the He­
len Mears Art Contest for 8th 
grade students. Winning en­
tries are being sent to the 
district for further competi­
tion Information on art scho­
larships for high school stu­
dents being given by the Gen­
eral Federation of Women’s 
Clubs, has been made avail, 
able to the guidance depart­
ment. Interested art students 
are urged to apply.

A Woodsy Owl Poster Con­
test for 3rd and 4th grade 
students will be conducted 
April 15-19 by the Conserva­
tion Department. Winners 
will be presented with aw­
ards at the May 9 meeting.

Three club members will 
attend the 6th District Con­
vention on Tuesday, April 23, 
at Ripon. Guest speaker will

^ WEST BEND
^?>\U^. THEATRE _

WED. THRU SAT.
MAR. 27 - 30 

Evenings at 7:00 & 9:00

be Mary McBride, a writer 
for Phyllis Diller. Delegates 
from the Kewaskum Juniors 
will be: Kathy Ramthun, Cin­
dy Knoebel and Karen Kel­
ler.

Nominations for officers 
for the 1974-1976 term were 
announced They are: Bonnie 
Koepke and Ann Enright,

Notice of Election .
For Members of the District Board of Kewaskum Commu­
nity Schools, Jt. School District No. 2 of the Village of 
Kewaskum, Towns of Kewaskum, Barton, Farmington 
and Wayne, County of Washington, State of Wisconsin, 
Towns of Ashford and Auburn, County of Fond du Lac, 
State of Wisconsin, Towns of Mitchell and Scott, County 
of Sheboygan, State of Wisconsin,

April 2, 1974
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a School District Board elec­

tion will be held in each village or town lying wholly or partially 
within said School District on April 2nd, 1974, for the purpose of 
electing two (2) members to the School Board of said district for 
terms of three (3) years as set out in the ballot hereinafter pro­
vided.

NOTICE IS FURTHER GIVEN that the electors of said School 
District will vote at said election ait the place and hours at which 
each is entitled to vote at a town or village election.

NOTICE IS FURTHER GIVEN that the place and hours of vot­
ing for each village or town within said School District is as fol­
lows:

Vice President; Mary Gut- 
jahr and Jan O’Keefe, Recor­
ding Secretary: Jan Hart­
mann and Liz Nigh, Corres­
ponding Secretary; and Judy 
Geidel and Pat Redig, Treas­
urer.

FRIDAY, MARCH 29
Music By

“Justy and the Keybenders”
8:30 - 12:30

FREE BEER 8:30 - H:30
NO ADMISSION

WIGWAM
KEWASKUM

PHONE .26-2941

We Invite You
To Come

Our Newly Remodeled
Dining Rooms

OFF THE MENU
Stuffed Cornish Hen .... $3.95
Lobster Tails 

Rib Eye.......
4.95
5.95

Different Specials Nightly
Includes Our

SERVING FROM

Famous Complete 

4:00 P. M. WED.

Salad Bar

THRU SUN.

"Pete'n* Tillie’
........AN about love and marriage! ■—

A Universal Picture ■ technicolor* Panavtsion* ^

SUN. THRU TUES.
MAR. 31 - APR. 2

Sun. 1:00 4:00, 6:30, 9:00
Mon. & Tues. 7:00 & 9:30

THE NUMBER ONE BOOK 
OF THE YEAR!

NOW-THE SUSPENSE 
FILM OF THE YEAR!

MZtanemannsM

John Woolf mm
A UNIVERSAL RELEASE IKK],,— 

TECHNICOLOR® IW*l^g

VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM
Place—Municipal Building, Kewaskum, Wis.
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:00 P. M.
TOWN OF KEWASKUM
Place—Union Center Hall, Kewaskum, Wis.
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:00 P. M.
TOWN OF BARTON
Place—Town Hall of Town of Barton
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:00 P. M.
TOWN OF FAHMiNGTON
Place—Turner Hall in Fillmore, Wis.
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:CO P. M.
TOWN OF WAYNE
Place—Strobel’s Hall in Wayne, Wis.
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:00 P. M.
TOWN OF ASHFORD
Place—Town Hall, Corner of 67 & BB
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:00 P. M.
TOWN OF AUBURN
Place—Town Hall, Intersection Hwy. 45 and 67
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:00 P. M.
TOWN OF MITCHELL
Place—Town Hall in Parnell, Wis.
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:00 P. M.
TOWN OF SCOTT
Place—Town Hall on Highway A 
Time—9:00 A. M. to 8:00 P. M.

OFFICIAL SCHOOL BALLOT
Place an (X) in the box following the name of the candidate for whom you 

wish to vote.
If you wish to vote for any qualified elector of the school district, whose 

name does not appear on the printed ballot, you may do so by writing his or her 
name in the blank space provided on the ballot.

SCHOOL BOARD MEMBER - 3 year term Vote for two

Clara J. Trapp
Richard L. Edwards
Richard Theusch
Thomas W. Gundrum

LIVE MUSIC
Every Fri. & Sat. Evening 

8:00 TO 1:M 

On Our New Oak Dance Floor
FRI., MAR. 29 — TWO HITS AND A MISS
SAT., MAR. 30 — TONY BERRES
FRI., APR. 5 — BEL AIRS
SAT., APR. 6 — BEL AIRS

Dated this 11th day of March, 1974.
James D. Oelhafen
School District Clerk


