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Village Tax Rate of $31.34 Per
Thousand Adopted; Down $4.58

By Ruth Held
A 1974 budget calling for 

a tax rate of $31.34 per 
$1,000 of assessed valuation, 
which is $4.58 lower than 
the 1973 rate, was adopted 
by the village board Monday 
night.

Contributing factors to the 
lower rate are an Increase 
of $1.9 million in the assessed 
valuation; a drop, of $15,201 
in the levy for school district 
taxes; and a higher state tax 
credit. The tax credit a- 
mounts to $6.19 compared 
with $4.41 in 1973.

The budget totals $1,044,- 
984.20, just $10,494 over last 
year, and calls for a tax levy 
of $737,772. Broken down, 
state taxes amount to $5,874 
(up $458); county taxes 
$102,618 (down $1,418); 
school district $416,405 
(down $15,201); vocational 
school $32,428 (up $5,408); 
and local taxes $180,646 (up 
$31,875).

The budget was adopted at 
a regular board session which 
followed a public hearing/ 
There were no comments of 
any kind from the dozen or 
so village residents who at­
tended.

Village taxpayers must pay 
their taxes in full or if they 
choose may make the first 
payment of a split payment 
plan, on or before Feb. 28, 
1974.

In other action, the board 
authorized purchase of a new 
truck chassis, dump box and 
hoist from Honeck Chevrolet, 
Kewaskum, at a cost of $8,- 
349.20, on recommendation 
of Raynor Herriges, chair-

Outstanding Teens 
Chosen at KHS

Linda Secor, Reed Roden- 
kirch, Allen Schmidt, Rich­
ard Loof, and Debbie Stri- 
genz have been chosen as Ke­
waskum’s Outstanding Teens 
for 1973.

Selection of these students 
is made according to acade­
mic excellence, leadership in 
school, community and school 
service, sports, and extra­
curricular activities. These 
students will now compete 
for the title of Wisconsin’s 
Outstanding Teen-ager. They 
are eligible for one of ten re­
gional scholarships of $500, 
and the national winner will 
receive a $1,000 college 
scholarship.

Christmas Party
For Children Dec. 15

The Kiwanis Christmas 
party for children will be 
held Saturday, Dec. 15, 
starting at 9:30 a. m. and 
continuing until 11:00 at 
the senior high school gym. 
It is open to all area child­
ren up to 10 years.

The program will include 
a magician show, group 
singing and the highlight 
will be a visit from Santa. 
Treats will be given out.

man of the equipment com­
mittee. The bid was low a- 
mong five opened on Nov. 
5. The cost of the chassis is 
$6,610.20; the box and hoist 
$1,739.

It was agreed to purchase 
a tax collection surety bond 
covering village officials re­
quired by the county and co­
vering only the county’s tax 
share, from J. P. and Asso­
ciates of Milwaukee, pend­
ing approval of the surety 
corporation by the county 
treasurer. Commissioner Wil­
liam Martin said the village 
has been buying the surety 
bond in the past from anoth­
er surety corporation at the 
rate of $1.80 per $1,000 of 
tax money. He said J. P. and 
Associates offer a bond at 
the rate of 90 cents per 
$1,000.

Dec. 19 was set for the 
deadline to receive bids for 
a snow plow. A tavern li­
cense was approved for 
Lloyd Keller at 1257 Fond 
du Lac Ave. It was formerly 
held by his mother, Mrs. Al­
thea Keller. Approval fol­
lowed a public hearing on 
the matter. There were no 
objections.

A bartender’s license was 
granted to Miss Karen Fel- 
lenz, 218 First St.

Melzer, Panzer Presented Kiwanis 
Conservation, Dairy Farmer Awards

Robert Melzer, R. 1, Al­
lenton, and Alvin Panzer, R. 
2, Kewaskum, were present­
ed the 1973 Conservation 
Farmer and Dairy Farmer 
Awards, respectively, by the 
Kewaskum Kiwanis Club, at 
the Hon-E-Kor Monday night, 
Nov. 26.

Jim Hanson, president of 
the Kiwanis, asked that Mrs. 
Panzer and Mrs. Melzer ac­
cept the awards for their hus­
bands, because he knows how 
influential the wife must be 
in the over-all farming oper­
ation.

Roy Esser, chairman of Ki­
wanis Farm-City Week arid 
in charge of the program, 
pointed out that the farmer 
and the city person are de­
pendent on one another and 
that no one is self-sufficient 
any more. He said that the 
farmer is a true environ­
mentalist by conserving soil 
and water and being efficient 
in the production of crop 
and dairy products.

Don Kurer, Soil Conserva­
tion Service, helped Roy ex­
plain the farm activities 
which led to the awards.

Robert Melzer, his wife Ja­
net and five children live on 
a 288 acre dairy farm near 
St. Kilian, in the northwest­
ern part of Washington Coun­
ty. Bob’s great-grandparents 
moved on the farm in 1883 
and Bob is a life-time resi­
dent there. His father, Joe 
Melzer, helps operate the 
farm and they are milking 
fifty-five good Holstein cows.

the Melzers became coop­
erators with the Washington

Board Approves 
Materials for 
Wayne Addition

At the school board meet­
ing held Monday, Nov. 26, 
the board approved the use 
of vinyl asbestos tiling and 
block wall materials at the 
Wayne addition. They also 
approved payment of build­
ing fund invoices amounting 
to $43,393.24.

Regular session actions in­
cluded approval of minutes 
of the previous meeting and 
payment of general fund in­
voices and payroll in the a- 
mount of $63,106.35, as well 
as holding the first reading 
of Policy No. 3542.42 to in­
clude the price of student 
extra milk at 2c, rather than 
5c as the policy presently 
reads.

Byron Gessner volunteered 
as the delegate to the WASB 
Convention with Gerald Se­
cor serving as an alternate 
Tom Gundrum and Dr. Ogi 
volunteered to serve on the 
bargaining committee for ne­
gotiating with the KEA and 
Richard Edwards will serve 
as the alternate.

Because the second regular 
meeting of the board would 
fall on Dec. 31 this month, 
it was decided to waive that 
meeting, subject to call if it 
is required, and hold only 
the meeting scheduled for 
Dec. 17.

County Soil and Water Con­
servation District on May 12, 
1971 and promptly developed 
a conservation plan for the 
farm. Since plans were deve­
loped, sixty-eight acres of 
contour strip cropping has 
been laid out on the hilly 
drumlin topography of the 
farm with many more acres 
planned for the future. Nine­
ty-six acres of conservation 
crop rotations are being fol­
lowed along with some mini­
mum tillage.

A fish and wildlife pond 
was constructed in Decem­
ber of 1972 and Bob con­
templates planting trees there 
in the spring of 1974. In ad­
dition twenty-four acres of 
wetland are being managed 
for wildlife habitat.

Alvin Panzer, his wife Ja­
net, their two boys and two 
girls live on a 218 acre farm 
north of Kewaskum. He 
rents 100 additional acres. Al 
and his married son, Bob, op­
erate the farm together and 
milk 77 Holstein cows of 
which one half are registered. 
They belong to the Washing­
ton County and the National 
Holstein Breeders Associa­
tion. Alvin has been with the 
DHIA testing since 1957 and 
now has a herd average of 
14,000 pounds of milk and 
565 pounds of butter fat.

Most of their farm land is 
gently sloping and flat on 
which a long hay crop rota­
tion is followed. Straight 
strips across the general slope 
is practiced on the steeper 
land.

Board Options 34 Acres 
Of Land for Village Park

WiU Not Light 
Decorations
Until Dec. 20

By Ruth Held
Kewaskum will have 

lighted Christmas decorations 
on its business streets this 
year but for a shorter period 
than in other years, in keep­
ing with President Nixon’s 
request to conserve energies.

Following a discussion by 
village trustees Monday 
night, it was agreed to have 
them lighted from Dec. 20 
through Jan. 2. In previous 
years, decorations were ligh­
ted in the first week of De­
cember.

In connection with the cri­
sis, Trustee Dan Schmidt 
urged the department heads 
to ask the cooperation of all 
municipal workers in cutting 
down on gas and fuel oil us­
age as much as possible. He 
urged “more walking and 
less idling of motors.”

Drs. Sison to 
Discontinue in 
Campbellsnort

The shortage of medical 
doctors has again made itself 
evident in the Village of 
Campbellsport.

The village board learned 
Monday night that Camp­
bellsport will soon be with­
out the service of its only 
two doctors, Cesar and Aur­
ora Sison. The doctors have 
decided to discontinue servi­
ces to that village and con­
centrate their efforts in Ke­
waskum only. The Sisons re­
side in Kewaskum also

The Sisons recently had 
cut their service to the Vil­
lage of Campbellsport to one 
day a week. The exact date 
that doctors services will end 
in the village was not releas­
ed.

Mary Schowalter 
Wins DAR Award

Each year an outstanding 
senior girl is chosen to re­
ceive the DAR Good Citizen’s 
Award. The entire senior 
class votes to select several 
girls, and the high school fa­
culty makes the final selec­
tion.

The following qualifica­
tions to an outstanding de­
gree are considered in the 
selection: dependability, ser­
vice, leadership and patrio­
tism.

Miss Mary Schowalter, 
daughter of Rev. and Mrs. 
Dan Schowalter, was selected 
this year. She will receive a 
pin, a National Certificate, 
and is welcome to enter the 
state Good Citizen contest.

By Ruth Held
Members of the Village 

Board voted Monday night to 
take a 12-month option on 
approximately 34 acres of 
land for park purposes at 
$2,200 per acre.

The parcel of land at the 
southwest village limits is 
owned by Mrs. Viola Spoerl 
of 1136 Fond du Lac Ave. 
The option was signed by her 
and village officials during 
the meeting. Mrs. Spoerl 
was given a check for $3,000 
for the option which will ap­
ply toward the purchase 
price if the option is exer­
cised.

The gross purchase price 
is to be determined from a 
land survey which would be 
made after the option is ex­
ercised. If the parcel is ex­
actly 34 acres, the purchase 
price would be $74,800. The 
parcel of land was annexed 
to the village in August.

During the option period, 
Mr. and Mrs. Spoerl will 
have the right to continue to 
use the land for agricultural 
purposes.

Board members have been 
considering purchase of land 
for park purposes for several 
years and three sites were 
considered. The Spoerl land 
was one of them. The village 
is seeking funds through the 
state Outdoor Recreation Act 
Program (ORAP-200) toward 
purchase of land for a park 
which would be suitable for 
an outdoor swimming pool 
and other recreational facili­
ties.

The first requirement by 
the state was that the village 
have a comprehensive park 
plan and it called upon the 
Department of Natural Re­
sources (DNR) to develop 
one. Village officials formal­
ly adopted such a park plan 
in September.

Adoption of the plan paved 
the way for the village to 
become eligible to partici­
pate in the federally spon­
sored Land and Water 
(LAWCON) program and the 
state-sponsored ORAP-200. 
Both of these are administer­
ed by the DNR.

The DNR has made a visu­
al survey of the Spoerl prop­
erty and has indicated that, 
by its standards, a tract of 
this type would be accept­
able. However, the village 
must now get final approval 
of the DNR. Therefore, it 
was necessary to take a 12- 
month option.

Since most of Kewaskum’s 
recent home development has 
been in the southwest sector, 
the DNR recreation plan re­
commends that a community 
park be developed there; 
that a minimum of 15 acres 
be devoted to the purpose 
and that the site be capable 
of offering a wide variety of 
recreational opportunities.

When it comes to cost per 
mile of operation, is there 
any vehicle more expensive 
than a supermarket shop­
ping cart?



Kewaskum Statesman
Friday, December 7, 1S7JLithias Nip 

Lakes Team
Kewaskum went down to 

its 2nd defeat in the B Divi­
sion of the Lakes League 
here Sunday night when they 
were edged out by West 
Bend, 116-110.

The Lithias got their fast 
break rolling effectively in 
the early stages to notch the 
victory. West Bend outpoint­
ed Kewaskum in the first 3 
quarters and led by 20 points 
It wasn’t until the final per­
iod that the taller Kewaskum 
team was able to outscore the 
Lithias by a wide margin, 36- 
22, and come within r points 
of catching them. West Bend 
led at the quarter, 30-25, at 
the half, 64-48, and at the 3rd 
quarter, 94-74.

Dennis Pieper and Dale 
Smith of the losers were high 
scorers with 35 and 31 points 
respectively. Kewaskum was 
without Glenn Eichstedt, who 
scored 33 points in the open­
er with Slinger the week be­
fore. Mike Howard popped in 
31 points and Tim Zettel 24 
to pace the Lithias.

This Saturday night Kew­
askum plays at Port Wash­
ington.

EXTRA
Worry will make almost 

anyone thin—except the 
people who worry because 
they are fat. “Easy credit is what makes 

people uneasy later.”

Don't Miss 
CHRISTMAS 

OPEN HOUSE
Sunday, December 9 * 10 to 5
Free Coffee and Cookies! Door Prizes! 

Free Gift to Visitors!

Jaeger’s Floral 6- Gift Shop
Phone 533-8022 or 533-4724 137 East Main

WEST BENO KEWASKUM '
ft f •« ft f

Rondort s 5 5 Pearson 2 2 1
Owen 4 2 2 Smith 12 7 5
Hermsen 2 0 $ Backhaus 8 0 4
Howard 13 5 2 Westphal 0 0 0
Zettel 12 0 3 Carr 1 1 3
Carrier 6 0 5 Wietor 1 0 2
Meiera 5 0 1 Chevis 4 1 2
Gmbetti 2 0 1 Pieper 13 V 1
Young 3 0 0 Fhihber 4 0 4
Klein o 0 0 45 20 22

52 12 24
West Bend 
Kewaskum

30 34 ‘30 22-
25 23 26 36-

-116
-no

JOIN CHRISTMAS CLUB 
NOW FOR 1974

WE PAY INTEREST ON COMPLETED ACCOUNTS

"^ Malley Bank

Kewaskum - Allenton
Member FDIC — Valley Baneorporation

L Rosenheimer's

VACUUM 
CLEANERS 
|10 AND UP!

Popular Brands on Display

• ELECTROLUX
• KIRBY

• HOOVER
Electric Brooms
Hand Vacuums 

Uprights - Tanks - Canisters

JAEGER
SERVICE CENTER 

Kewaskum — 828-2611

How do you describe a

BaLooa ^ 
diamond 
coated?
In a word...exquisite!

$AVE!
on homeowners 
insurance

In Kewaskum

s57 PER YR
FOR
$50 DEO

Frame home; $25,000 on home; 
$2500 on garage; $12,500 
on contents; $5000 additional 
living expense; $25,000 family 
liability; $500 med pay for 
others; broad form

A.H. 
SEEFELDT 
INC.
call 626-2921 
Kewaskum

▲▲ HURITAOa INSURANCE 
” 8»<MOYBAN WISCONSIN 53081

What better time than Christmas to 
match the sparkle in her eyes 

... with a Bulova Diamond Watch. 
A dazzling treasure that any 

woman would be proud to own, thrilled to wear. 
We'd be delighted to show you our 

extensive collection.

A. Four diamonds in a lovely tonneau shaped case. 23 jewels.
B. Four diamonds in a leaf setting of 14K solid gold. 23 jewels.
C. Six diamonds set off mesh braceleted baguette. 17 jewels.
0. Twenty-eight diamonds in an oval 14K case. 23 jewels.

BIER’S JEWELRY
KEWASKUM STORE HOURS

MON. • SAT. 8 a. m. - 9 p. m. — SUN. 9 a. m. - 1 p. m.

MINNESOTA 17 OZ. CAN

Valley Peas 4 for $1.00
—

GREEN GIANT 17 OZ. CAN

Cream Style Corn 4 for $1.00
------------------ --------------

GREEN GIANT - FRENCH STYLE 16 OZ. CAN

Green Beans 4 for $1.00
FIRESIDE 11 OZ. BOX

Snack, Party Crackers 3 for $1.00
SINGLE PACK

Northern Towels 3 for $1.00
TRU VALU 11 OZ. BOX

Potato Chips 2 for $1.00
HORMEL - REG. OR HOT 15 OZ. CAN

Chili with Beans 53c
SOLO WITH HOLDERS

Cozy Cups 19c
50 Ct Refills 57c

170 CT. PACKAGE

Q Tips 68c
COCK O’ WALK 29 OZ. CAN

Peaches 2 for 85c
DURKEE 14 OZ. PACKAGE

Coconut 59c
LIPTON 2 PK. BOX

Onion Soup Mix 44c
JOHNSON’S 48 OZ. BOTTLE

Step Saver $1.69
BANQUET ASSORTED 8 OZ. PACK

Pot Pies 4 for $1.00
BANQUET ASSORTED 5 OZ. EACH

Cookin’ Bag 4 for $1.00
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First Quarter
Clark A. Pearson, principal 

of Kewaskum Community 
High School, announced the 
first quarter honor roll re­
cently.

SENIORS — Vicki Akin, 
Daniel Asch, Mary Backhaus, 
Sandra Bauer, Terry Baum- 
hardt, Matthew Berg, Robin 
Bier, Gayle Binder, Jane 
Binder, Mary Bonenfant, Ste­
ven Brendemihl, Jane Butz- 
ke, Luann Czaja, Linda De­
vine, Faye Ebersold, Caroline 
Fellenz, Gary Fickler, John 
Fischer, Debra Franzen, 
Eileen Hansen, Patricia Hau- 
sner, Ann Herriges, Patty 
Holzmann, Jill Honeck, 
Christy Jadro, Lucy Jaycox, 
Dale Jung, Jeanne Karl, Lo­
is Klahn, Eugene Kopping, 
Betty Krause, Debra Krue­
ger, Jane Krueger, Marilyn 
Lamp, Bruce Markielewski, 
Sandra Marquardt, Kristine 
Meilahn, Kathy Meyer, Lin­
da Miller Steven Miske, Ro- 
gene Mohr, Mike Moser, Ju- 
laine Nigh, Greg Ogi, Lynne 
Perkins, Brian Petermann, 
Dale Prost, Janet Relndl, Cin­
dy Rodenkirch, Reed Roden- 
kirch, Patricia Roe, Debbie 
Roehrdanz, Darlene Schacht, 
Pamela Schall, Mary Schlad- 
weiler, LuAnn Schmidt, Ma 
ry Schmidt, Thomas Schoofs, 
Mary Schowalter, Linda Se­
cor, Jonathon Sieger, Mark

Steinhardt, Tim Stoffel, Deb­
bie Strigenz, John Theisen, 
Jane Thull, Rickie Vetter, 
Joel Vogt, Jeanine Volm. Su­
san Wendel, Sandra Wilkens, 
Jane Zehren.

JUNIORS — Kathy Baum- 
hardt, Julaine Bier, Monica 
Bohn, Pamela Brenholt, Joy 
Broecker, Michael Buss. 
James Butts, Ralph Butz, 
James Ciha, Clifford Clark, 
Nancy Darmody, Thomas De- 
gnitz, Robert Devine, Linda 
Dreher, Greg Ebert, Jane Eg­
gert, Rita Graff, Pattie Gund­
rum, Colleen Jones, Lynn 
Kempf, Michael Koepke, 
Randy Koepke, Scott Ko th, 
Jeanne LaMarche, Jeanne 
Marx, Patrick McCambridge, 
Mary Lynne McNamara. 
Wendy Omodt, Alan Opper­
mann, Grace Raether, Can­
dice Reysen, Mike Rinzel, 
Dawn Schall, Denise Sch­
midt, Shirley Schmidt, Dale 
Secor, Mark Sieger, Chris­
tine Staehler, Paul Gerard 
Stoffel, Douglas Strack, Mich­
ael Strigenz, Amy Theusch, 
Marian Uelmen, Theresa 
Weaver, Kip Weiss, Cheryl 
Wilkens, Julie Zarling.

SOPHOMORES — Wanda

Akin, David Ayer, Susan 
Bohn, Verna Bowman, Con-
stance 
mody, 
tricia 
wards, 
vonne

Brugman, Peggy Dar- 
Brenda Dehling, Pa- 
Dreher, Thomas Ed- 
Beverly Ehnert, Y- 

Fellenz, Todd Gar-

Raymond Reindl, Thomas 
Ryan, Bonnie Schmidt, Bar­
bara Schowalter, Anne Theu- 
sch. Barbara Thill, Ann Hed-
dig, Randall White, 
Wulff, Kurt Zarling.

Scott
will present 
program on 
Dec. 23, at 
enjoy an

their Christmas 
Sunday evening, 
7:30. Come and 

old fashioned

^ I 'complete service dealer' I — 
n 120 MAIN 

OFFICE 
PRODUCTS

D 
KEWASKUM I 

C

Office Supplies, Copiers, Fur­
niture, Typewriters, Adders, 
Calculators.
_ SALES - SERVICE —
3 626-4641 S

this Christmas
Give her something 

she's always 
wanted!

with
"Built-in Peace 

of Mind"
where each machine re­
ceives tender loving care.

NEW BERNINA
Stretch stitch, zig-zag, 

open arm.
ON SALE
*292

STORE HOURS:
Daily 10 a.m. to 9 p.m. 

'til Christmas
Sat. 10-5; Closed Sun.

KEWASKUM 
Phone 626-2611

bisch, Gayla Herriges, Nancy 
Horning, John Kem, Mary 
Klein, Bonnie Lendved, Ste­
phanie Matenaer, Janet Mil­
ler, Rosemary Mueller, Carol 
Muench, Nathalie Nigh, Joan 
Rosenberger, Pam Scannell, 
Susan Schladweiler. Amy 
Schmidt, Marjorie Schoofs, 
Susan Schulz, Connie Sieger, 
Mark Smucker, Amy Stoffel, 
Diane Strack, Linda Vogt, 
Patti Voigt, Maxine Wagner, 
Russell Wilson, Jill Zarling, 
Joy Zarling.

FRESHMEN — James Bin­
der, Rebecca Brehm, Paul 
Brenholt, Joan Bruessel, Ger­
ald Butz, Roseann Czaja, 
Laura Dei, Linda Dei, Rick 
Dreher, Steven Edgar, Grace 
Flynn, Kathy Gnacinski, 
John Granat, Randall Hirsig, 
Daniel Hlavaty, Lori Koepke, 
Joanne LaFleur, Paul Leh- 
nerz, Kevin Neese, Sue Nigh, 
Gay Olson, Gail Paulus, Mi­
chael Perkins, Jean Petri,

SUNDAY SCHOOL TO
PRESENT PROGRAM

The Sunday School of the 
First United Methodist 
Church of Campbellsport

Christmas pageant, “The Sto­
ry of Christmas." Visitors 
are most welcome.

SIGN in a pawnshop: “Hock it to 
me, baby.”

Sampson's Red Barn Store
Your Christmas Headquarters

Our Selection Includes -
8 Track AM-FM Players — Tape Recorders 
Radios — Watches — Tools — Glassware 

Clocks — Electric Appliances — Makeup Mirror 
Mist Styling Combs — Clothing for the family 

Toys — Christmas Decorations

Christmas Trees

CHRISTMAS SHOPPING HOURS: 
Weekdays — 4:30 P.M. to 9:00 P.M. 
Saturday — 10:00 AJA to 9:00 P.M. 

Sunday — 1:30 PM to 5:00 PM

Balsam, Spruce, Scotch, Norway and White Pine

Christmas Wreaths $2 up
Sizes 10 in. to 60 in.

HOURS: Monday thru Friday 9:00 AJA. to 8:00 PJA. 
Saturday and Sunday 9:00 AJA. to 6:00 P.M.

Bartoll's Produce
4 miles north of Kewaskum on Co. Trk. V

Phone 533-4092

FINE

FURNITURE

OF KEWASKUM

For Practical Gifts

5 Pc.
SAMSONITE SETS

From $39.95

OPFN MONDAYS THROUGH FRIDAYS
8 A. M. TO 9 P. M. TO DEC. 22ND

FREE DEPENDABLE DELIVERY

«k«

STARTING DEC. 19 
DaUy — 10:00 A. M. to 9:00 P. M.

• miles west of Campbellsport on "Y" Ph. 921-9499

We aim to Please Our Customers

Arlin & Eunice Sampson

Friendly 
Features

by MINZ SUPPLY

One of the

“HWI FRIENDLY ONES”
KENNETH "KENNY" WEDDIG — MANAGER

TV - THOTS
Early to bed and early to 

rise may be a sure sign that 
you’re fed up with televi­
sion . . .

Know why they call them 
the late - late movies on 
TV? Because the stars are 
usually the late Wallace 
Beery, the late Ronald Col­
man, the late Clark Gable, 
etc. . .

"Women and Children First’ was always
steadfast rule until the advent of TV and the 
Sunday Sports programs . . .

With some TV shows, I don’t know which 
show, or us for watching it . . .

a gallant and 
Saturday and

is sillier—the

The good thing about TV movies is, if you don’t under 
stand the plots, you get to see them again and again and 
again . . . ____

“The good thing about doing business with the ‘HWI 
FRIENDLY ONES’ at MINZ SUPPLY is that we want to 
see the same customers again and again," says Manage* 
Kenny Weddig. "That’s why we specialize in friendly, 
courteous service and reasonable prices, always

SPECIAL OF THE WEEK
DEC. 7 TO DEC. 15 

GERBER SHELF HANGERS 
FOR EXTRA STORAGE SPACE 

GARAGE, ATTIC, BARN, ANYWHERE
REG. .99 NOW .69

ipply Incori

KEWASKUM 
Behind the Bank 

626-2164

WEST BEND 
Hwy. 45 South 

. 334-9611
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Attend Seminar
Dr. H. L. Rumsey and wife 

Mary, Kewaskum, attended 
an office management semin­
ar at Lake Delton on Satur­
day and Sunday, Dec. 1 and 
2

The 2-day meeting, spon- 
sorec by the Wisconsin Chir­
opractic Association (WCA) 
featured Dr. Eugene Buett­
ner, D C. of Colorado Springs 
A leading nationally known 
lecturer, Dr. Buettner main­
tains a chiropractic clinic in 
Colorado Springs.

Dr. G. A. Emholtz, presi­
dent, River Falls, stated, 
“members of our profession 
are constantly striving to of­
fer the finest health care to 
their patients and by attend­
ing seminars of this type, 
we can offer better care and 
service to our patients.”

More than 200 doctors, 
chiropractic assistants, wives 
and families were in atten­
dance at the weekend con­
ference.

ANNE EDWARDS DOING 
STUDENT TEACHING

Bullette Cited
For Safe Driving

Sergeant Erwin G. Bullette 
of Kewaskum was among 46 
state troopers and 11 motor 
vehicle inspectors who earn­
ed safe driving awards, Col. 
Lewie V. Versnik, director of 
the division of motor vehic­
les’ bureau of enforcement 
announced today.

Bullette received an award 
for having accumulated 17 
years of driving without a 
preventable accident.

The awards are presented 
on behalf of the National 
Safety Council and the bur­
eau of enforcement for each 
full year of driving without 
a preventable accident. Vers­
nik said.

The 57 winners achieved a 
combined total of 362 years 
of accident-free driving.

MPTI ON FIELD TRIP 
TO FAIRMONT FOODS

Moraine Park’s food manu­
facturing technology prog­
ram was the recipient of an 
unexpected gift during a re­
cent student field trip to 
Fairmont Foods in Kewas­
kum. At the conclusion of the 
tour Carl Freehauf, plant ma­
nager. presented the school 
with a flow diversion valve 
which the company had re­
cently taken out of service. 
The device is used as the 
heart of today’s modern high 
temperature pasteurization 
Until this time, the Moraine 
Park Technical Institute pro­
gram had not had a “FDV” 
for student use, because of 
the prohibitivly high cost.

It’s taken football less 
than a hundred years to learn 
all those names to call the 
referee.

FREE

CHRISTMAS PARTY FOR 
CLUB MEMBERS’PARENTS

The Kewaskum AFS, 
Spanish and German clubs 
are cordially inviting the par­
ents of all members of these 
clubs to a Christmas party. 
It will be held on Wednes­
day, Dec. 12, at 7:30 p. m. in 
the multi-purpose room 
(room 251). Hope to see you 
there.

LIONS CLUB SOLD 
OUT OF LIGHT BULBS

The Kewaskum Lions Club 
light bulb sale had such suc­
cess that they sold all their 
bulbs. More light bulbs will 
be in in two weeks. Those 
who did not get any will be 
contacted on Saturday, Dec. 
15. Or contact a Lion to 
make sure you get some.

P|AM MITCHELL HAS PART 
IN COLLEGE PRODUCTION

Pam Mitchell, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Mitchell 
of Kewaskum, has a part in 
Edgewood College’s fall pro­
duction, “Trojan Women,’’ 
being presented this week 

, (Dec. 5-9) She is a junior at
Edgewood in Madison

NINA WULFF MEMBER 
OF WIND ENSEMBLE

Nina Wulff, Ripon College 
freshman from Kewaskum, is 
a member of the Ripon Col­
lege Symphonic Wind En­
semble. Miss Wulff is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Eldon Wulff, R. 2.

The things we do tomor­
row help us to live through 
today.

Anne 
College 
kum, is 
teaching

Edwards, a Rinon 
senior from Kewas- 

presently student 
third grade in the

Ripon Public School system
Student teaching is one of 

the requirements for teacher 
certification upon graduation 
from Ripon College.

The student teacher ob­
serves, takes nart in actual 
instruction of the students, 
and participates in a weekly 
seminar devoted to discussion 
and appraisal of the teaching 
experience with their Ripon 
College instructor

Anne, a Speech-Education 
major, is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Richard Edwards. 
331 Forest Ave.

Ambulance Calls
Wednesday, Dec. 5, 12:39 

P m.—Terry Krueger, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Krue­
ger, R. 2, Kewaskum, re­
moved from Kewaskum Com­
munity High School to St. 
Joseph’s Community Hospi­
tal, West Bend.

SAVE GAS!
DO YOUR CHRISTMAS 

SHOPPING AT

THE OLDE 
HOUSE

‘CROWN

BLANKET

m an

LOOM” 100% POLYESTER

by FRUIT of the LOOM!

72” x 90”

Deposit

S300 or more

Insured Savings Account
and get your
Limited to

We pay

authorized

on every

one
FREE blanket.

for each customer

the

by

highest savings rates

the
of

U. S. Government

account. Save now

ANTIQUE AND
GIFT SHOP

and earn more!

Handicraft Items 
Village Bath Products 

Woodenware 
Pewter 

Wrought Iron 
1974 Calendar Towels 

and many other 
Gift Items

LOCATED AT

Kewaskum Savings Office
1523 Fond du Lac Ave. 

Kewaskum, Wis. 
Phone 626-4219

Daily 9:30-5:30
Friday Until 9 

Sunday 1:30-5:30

j 

t

Of

West Bend Savings and Loan Association
114 Main St., Kewaskum Phone 626-2186

a ■—>■—•



Regal Announces 
Four Promotions

Four promotions in their 
Finance and Production De­
partments were announced 
recently by Regal Ware, Inc.

Allen C. Koepke, R 2, Ke­
waskum, was appointed to 
Manager of Inventory Ac­
counting and Labor Report­
ing in the Finance Depart­
ment. A 1968 accounting 
graduate of the University 
of Wisconsin - Madison, Koe­
pke has worked in various 
capacities in the Accounting, 
Data Processing and Produc­
tion Departments since join 
ing Regal five years ago. In 
his new position, he will be 
responsible for supervising 
the accounting control of in­
ventories and labor reporting 
at all Regal Ware locations.

Dick Hartwig, 401 Main 
St., Kewaskum, was named 
Production Control Supervi - 
sor. He will be responsible 
for directing and coordinat­
ing all Kewaskum produc­
tion control activities, includ­
ing schedules, finished goods 
system and supervising the 
nine individuals involved.

Dick joined Regal Ware in 
November of 1969 and has 
worked as scheduler, produc­
tion controller and most re­
cently, as coordinator and 
assistant to the Production 
Control Supervisor. He is a 
graduate of Marquette Uni­
versity with a B.S. degree in 
Marketing and Industrial 
Management.

Vine Nigh, 332 Third St., 
Kewaskum, was promoted to 
the position of Production 
Coordinator. This assignment, 
involves development of ex­
tended schedules for all pro­
duction departments and as­
sistance to the Production 
Control Supervisor. Since 
joining Regal in 1952, Vine 
has held several positions of 
responsibility in manufactur­
ing. including most phases of 
production control during the 
past seven years.

Paul Christensen was as­
signed to the position of Pro­
duction Scheduler “A” after 
completing a six-month su­
pervisory training program. 
Paul joined Regal Ware in 
February, 1973, after receiv­
ing a B.S. degree from Car­
roll College.

Woman’s Club to
Meet Saturday

“A Gallery of Portraits,” a 
program about Women of the 
Bible, will be presented by 
Mrs Lewis D Brown of 
West Bend to members of 
the Kewaskum Woman’s 
Club at 2 p. m. Saturday in 
the lounge of Peace Church, 
Kewaskum.

She will appear in various 
headdresses to represent the 
various women she will por­
tray. Her presentation will 
tell each one’s background 
and history through story 
and dramatization. Mrs. 
Brown’s program is original, 
gleaned from material she 
used in a study of these wo­
men.

She is a dramatist, both in 
the realm of acting and 
teaching Guests are welcome 
to attend.

Members are reminded 
that money and tickets for 
the recent bazaar are to be 
returned at the meeting, 
and prizes will be awarded 
during the afternoon

Award Local 4-H 
Club Certificate

The Happy Go Lucky, 4-H 
Club. Kcwaskurn has boon 
awarded a Certificate of 
Commendation in the na­
tional Summer Action ’73 
competition sponsored by 
Manpower. Inc

Summer Action ’73 is a 
competition to stimulate 
community betterment 
through creat've action by 
young people 105 cash a- 
wards and 100 Certificates 
of Commendation were pre­
sented to the individuals or 
groups who conducted the 
most significant community 
service projects

The 4-H Club received 
their certificate for conduct­
ing several community bet­
terment programs.

Manpower, Inc., largest in­
ternational temporary ser­
vice firm, will sponsor the 
Summer Action competition 
again in 1974 Contest rules 
and entry blanks are avail 
able by writing Manpower, 
Inc., Summer Action ’74. 
5301 North Ironwood Road. 
Milwaukee, 53217.
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Serving

Fish Fry Every Friday Night 

Chicken, Shrimp, Frog Legs 
Chili & Sandwiches at All Times

SERVING FROM 5:00 TO 11:00

Facilities Available for Parties Up to 50

Bill and Betty’s 

COUNTRY SQUIRE 
LAKE BERNICE, R. 3, CAMPBELLSPORT

Phone 1-533-4471

- , WEST BEND
'>V^^* i THC ATR E

WED. THRU TUES.
Dec. 5 thru 11

Evening's 7-00 & 9:15 
Sunday 1:00 - 3:15 - 5:00 

7:15 - 9:15

it was
STORY" than came 

"SUMMER OF‘42"BUT... 
TH YOU SEE

A film 
all parents should see 
—and a MUST for 

young people over .- 
RATED (R) ’ '

MHT
starring

RICHARD THOMAS THE WALTONS

“Oh, steward, I have a 
complaint to make. A sailor 
peeked into my cabin last 
night!’’

“Well, what do you expect 
second class—the captain?”

CHRISTMAS

MMCE
DOH PERCHEY
K- «e/4MMoto/Zbe

HUILSBURG
TUES. DEC. 25
WED. NOV. 21

with BARBARA HERSHEY 
BRUCE DAVISON and CATHY BURNS

WIGWAM
KEWASKUM

PHONE 626-2901

Monday thru Saturday 
SERVING FROM. 5:00 P. M. 

OPEN ALL DAY SUNDAY 
Featuring

King Crab - Sirloin - Lobster - 
Shrimp - Chicken 

AH You Can Eat 
Sun.-- Mon. - Tues. - $5.95

WED. - THUR. - FRI. - SAT. — $1.00 MORE

OPEN EVERY DAY 
11:30 NOON BUFFET

Live Music
FRIDAY, DEC. 7 

“Bill Sackett”
FRIDAY. DEC. 14 

“Mountaineers”
9:00 TO 1:00

BRAT FRY - 50c
Every T.uesday Night

Starting at 6 p. m.

AMERAHN
% mile north on Hwy. 45 

NO ADMISSION

Phone: 626-2520 Kewaskum

Wednesdays-5 p.m.-Rib Night
Thursdays - 5 p. m. - Smorgasbord
Fridays - 5 p. m. - Seafood
Saturdays - 5 p. m. - Menu
Sundays - Hon-E-Kor Chicken

Family Style-11a.m. to 2 p.m.
Closed Tuesday

Closed Sunday Nights
■ i.JL



15 g

I

DEAN'S "LEAN"

1% EOW FAT MILK
Gallon 
Carton

FROZEN

ON-COR ENTREES
2-Lb. Pkg. Sliced Turkey, 

Salisbury Steak, Veil 
Parmigiana, Boot Chop Suoy, 
Mostaccioli with Meat Balls

$129
IIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIMIIIIIIIIIIHM

SENTRY 
VALUE 
PRICE!

WHITE. YELLOW A DEVILS FOOD

SENTRY CAKE MIXES

— 3 9®
NESTLE UNSWEETENED

BAH CHOCOLATE

* 39*
A t Sentry, You ’ll Find Values 
Galore Throughout the Store!

YOUR CHOICE

MORTON FROZEN DINNERS
CHICKEN, 

SALISBURY STEAK. 
& TURKEY

SENTRY 
VALUE 
PRICE!

19'
FOR LAUNDRY

► chub im«T
,♦<#♦•*#*»##/#« 

! 50c OFF : 
: LABEL :

hiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiwiiiiiiiiiiiiiyiiM

,$Q7O

SENTRY
vid^ii

3 *

© I a a n 
2 c® u 
2 3 
M« - a

GROUND FRESH MANY TIMES DAILY!

Fresh Ground BeefJ SENTRY 
VALUE 
PRICE!

Sliced Beef Liver
79*

Lb.

FRESH

Pork Steak

‘95*
BOSTON BUTT

Pork Roast

85*
Sentry s U.S, Choice LamFFor a Change of Pace!
Plan a special meal this week and serve juicy, succulent lamb! The nicest 
selection of U.S. Choice Lamb is on sale now at Sentry. It’s simple great.

U.S. CHOICE LAMB

Rib Chops
U.S. CHOICE LAMB U.S. CHOICE

Loin Chops Leg-O-Lamb

Lb.
Whole 

Or 
Rump Half

Lb.

U.S. Choice Lamb Shoulder Roast

U.S. Choice Lamb Shoulder Chops

SNAP-E-TOM WYLER'S

Tomato Drink Onion Soup Mix
2 2J)< 4-43c
MOOR-RING FROZEN

Onion Rings

u> 89c

u 98c 1

SWISS MISS

Cocoa Mix
2-Lb.
Pkg.

PET DEEP DISH

^69c Frozen Pie Shells *»£49c

Sentry’s Garden Fresh Produce!
Delight your family with the marvelous fresh goodness of Sentry’s deli­
cious fruits and vegetables. The variety awaiting your consideration is 
superb. They’re so nice with that peak of perfection flavor and glow 
sparkling in every item! Stop in at Sentry and see what we mean!

FLORIDA INDIAN RIVER

White Seedless Grapefruit
SENTRY 
VALUE 
PRICE! 10 88*

EASY TO PEEL

Juicy Tangerines
FRESH CRUNCHY

Crisp Cucumbers

Dozen ^^

Each *1 Q

3 K 
2. <» 
ft

Sa 
a 
S -

2 3

0

l-Lb
Loaf

STUFFED MANZANILLA

SENTRY OLIVES
Ol/Fashion ^Qc

Glass

Each

SHORTENING

FUIFFO
3-Lb. 
Can

SJ27

FISHER

CASHEW HALVES

■e 89c

Oven Fresh Crestwood Bakery!

Praline loaf Torte Caraway Rye Bread
43c

CALIFORNIA CEDAR

FIREPLACE LOGS
SENTRY'S

ILLUSTRATED WORLD 
ENCYCLOPEDIA 

Offer Ends
Sat., Dec. 8, 1973

SENTRY 
VALUE 
PRICE!
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To 25 Year Club
Irene Brandenburg, 1161 

North 8th Ave., West Bend; 
Elmer Ebert, 1208 Stark St., 
Kewaskum; and Mary Gil­
lard, 521 Forest St., Camp­
bellsport, have become the 
latest Regal Ware, Inc., em­
ployees to join the company’s 
“25 Year Club.” All three 
began their employment on 
September 27, 1948.

Irene Brandenburg
Irene Brandenburg started 

her career at Regal as a 
Wrapper and Packer. After 
three years, she transferred 
to the Electric Assembly De­
partment, where she is an 
Electric Assembler. In her 
spare time, Irene enjoys 
camping, fishing and travel­
ing. She and her husband Al­
vin have one daughter, Mad­
eline, who is married and 
lives in Hartford.

Elmer Ebert began his ca­
reer with Regal in the Buff­
ing Department and during 
the 25 years has advanced to 
the position of Working Fore­
man. He is a veteran of 
World War II. Elmer’s favo­
rite spare-time activities in­
clude ice fishing and deer 
hunting. He and his wife, 
Virginia, who also works at 
^^pal. have two children —

SCHLAEFER 
OPTOMETRIST 

MATH ANTHONY
PHONE 533-8426 

Office Hour*: 9-11 1-5
Wed. A Frl. Evenings 7-9 

Closed Thursday 
CAMPBELLSPORT, Wit.

Holiday Shoes
for the family

Sandals
for those Holiday Parties 
WNMMMiraraMMM 

Winter Boots
for the family

20% iff

All Clothes
IT THE CZROVSEL

PAUL’S
Shoe Corner

Elmer Ebert

Mike, 19; and Sandra, 12.
Mary Gillard began her 

career at Regal Ware in the 
Wash and Clean Department. 
She later transferred to the 
Finish Department, where 
she is a Cover Welder. Ma­
ry’s favorite pastimes include 
camping and traveling. She 
and her husband, Chester, 
have two married sons — Al­
bert and Jim, who both live 
in the Kettle Moraine area.

As a token of gratitude 
for their contribution to Re­
gal Ware during the past 25 
years, each was presented 
with a specially engraved 
wristwatch.

UW ACCEPTS $250 GIFT 
FROM VALLEY BANK

A gift of $250 from the 
Valley Bank of Kewaskum 
was among $11,490,060.10 in 
gifts and grants accepted by 
the University of Wisconsin 
system Board of Regents at 
its meeting on the Madison 
campus of the university 
system.

The gift is for a Farm and 
Industry Short Course Scho­
larship at Wisconsin’s Uni­
versity ot Madison.

Shampoo & Wax
YOUR OWN FLOOR WITH

Hoover Scrubber 

and Shampooer 

MINZ SUPPLY
Kewaskum 626-2164

Service

24 HOUR EMERGENCY 
A WRECKER SERVICE

■B ■■ M •

COMPLETE AUTOMOTIVE
SERVICE 

With Many Years Experience 
■ MB ■■ ® 

YOUR TIRE CENTER
Firestone J.T.W

Pennsylvania 
a ■■ • 

Hwy. 45 South

Phone 626-2888
KEWASKUM

Fire Dept, to
Sponsor Drive
For Dystrophy

The Kewaskum Fire De­
partment will sponsor their 
5th annual canister campaign 
for Muscular Dystrophy it 
was announced today by Oay 
Barczewski, Milwaukee Pres- 
sident, Milwaukee Area 
Chapter Muscular Dystrophy 
Associations of America, Inc.

Fife Chief Armin Opper­
mann will serve as chairman 
and he will be assisted by 
members of the Kewaskum 
Fire Deparment in placing 
the familiar Jerry Lewis 
hourglass canisters in busin­
ess places.

Since 1954 helping in the 
fight against muscular dys­
trophy has been one of the 
Fire Fighters’ favorite proj­
ects. Fire Fighters have help­
ed raise funds, served as 
chapter officers and helped 
provide recreation for mus­
shop in Milwaukee and Uni- 
cular dystrophy patients on 
the national, state and local 
levels.

uscular dystrophy is a chro- • 
nic disease which gradually 
destroys the coluntary mus­
cles of th ebody. It is found 
in all parts of the world. Ap­
proximately two-thirds of the 
known victims are children. 
The exact cause of the disease 
is not yet known. There is no 
cure.

Muscular Dystrophy Asso­
ciations of America, Inc., a 
non-profit organization, con­
ducts its annual campaign to 
raise funds for services to lo­
cal uatients suffering with

Honeck Chevrolet
KEWASKUM

Ready 
to help 
you...

with your everyday in­
surance needs. For auto, 
fire, life insurance call 
today.

Richard C. Gust
1129 Midland Ave.
KEWASKUM, WIS.

Phone 626-2765

AMERICA hi m4ILY
/UTO FIRE FAITH LIFE ®

muscular dystrophy and al­
lied neuromuscular diseases, 
as well as for itts extensive 
research program.

The Muscular Dysptophy 
Clinics at the Curative Work- 
versity Hospitals in Madison 
are two of the 122 M D. Clin­
ics located in the United 
States.

Kewaskum is in the Mil­
waukee Areo Chapter, which 
has seven counties to serve. 
The chapter is one of over 
285 in the United States that 
provide wheelchairs, braces, 
other. orthapedic appliances, 
physical therapy and educa­
tional and recreational prog­
rams for muscular dystrophy 
patients.

In the past 16 years the 
Milwaukee Area Chapter has 
spent $309,022 to help local 
MD patients with orthopedic 
equipment, free clinic exam­
inations and consultations, 
physical therapy and recrea­
tion, especially summer, 
camp.

Milwaukee area patients 
are able to attend a special 
free summer camp designed 
around their specific needs 
and limitations. Southeastern 
Wisconsin high school stud­
ents volunteer as attendants 
to enable MD. patients to go 
ewimming, horseback riding, 
canoeing and any outdoor ac­
tivity possible at summer 
camp.

Used Sewing Machines Sale

6 Singer-Touch ’n Sow’s. . . . . . . ’49 and up 
1972 Singer (Zig-Zag) from Italy.. *49 
1973 Singer (Zig-Zag) model 257.. *66 
Singer - Made in Japan no. 223 . .’99 
1972 Kenmore Zig-Zag. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . *49
White Zig-Zag. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . *59
Necchi open-arm Zig-Zag. . . . . . . . . . . *99
Elna open arm Zig-Zag & cams... *79
Viking open arm Zig-Zag & cams.. *179
Pfaff Zig-Zag and cabinet. . . . . . . . . . . *89
7 Used cabinets and desks from ... *10 
8 Older Sewing Machines from . . . *15

111 Machines h uUv (luaranteed 

JAEGER
SEWING MACHINE SALES

& SERVICE SPECIALIST CENTER
Theatre Building-Hy 45, KEWASKUM - 626-2611 

Store Hours Doily 10 a m.-9 p m until Christmas 
Saturday 1 0-5; Sunday Closed

Mental Health 
Association
Needs Volunteers

The Washington County 
Mental Health Association 
has shown sunnort and con­
cern for two important niece® 
of mental health legislation— 
the Unified Board for Wash 
ington County (Public Law 
51.42 states that the county 
must adont a uniFed mental 
health, mental retardation, 
alcoholism and drug abuse 
board which will be respon­
sible for the direction of all 
public services and their im­
plementation) and Education 
for Students with Exception­
al Needs (Chapter 89 of the 
laws of 1973 relates to the 
mandatory education for chil­
dren with exceptional educa­
tional needs). Both of these 
laws will have a definite and 
continued effect upon the re­
sidents of Washington Coun­
ty. The association needs vo­
lunteers to work on commit­
tees during the next year to 
make sure that the rights and 
needs of the county citizens 
are protected and satisfied as 
these two laws are implemen­
ted in the county
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Will there be 
enough electricity 

this winter 
in southeastern 

Wisconsin?
You should understand the difference in the electric 
supply situation between southeastern Wisconsin and 
some other parts of the nation. On the East Coast, for 
example, electricity is made mostly from oil, which is 
in short supply. On the Gulf Coast, electricity is made 
mostly from natural gas or with oil when gas is not 
available. Both of these are in short supply. In the 
Pacific Northwest electricity is made by hydro-electric 
plants and that area has suffered an unusual shortage 
of rainfall.

About fifty-eight percent of the electricity Wisconsin 
Electric will make this winter will come from coal. 
Although coal is not in critical supply at this time, its 
availability may become limited in the future because 
of unduly restrictive mining legislation, unrealistic air 
quality criteria, and increased requirements as indus­
tries and other utilities convert from oil and gas to coal. 
Most of the coal we will need this winter is already 
on our docks.

More than thirty-five percent of the electricity for 
this winter will come from our Point Beach Nuclear 
Plant More than a winter's supply of nuclear fuel is 
already in the reactors. Wisconsin Electric's thirty-five 
percent nuclear generation is well ahead of the national 
average ... only four percent of the electricity made 
nationally is from nuclear energy.

Less than two percent of the electricity we will make 
this winter will come from oil. Much of this small per­
centage of oil we do use is to assure safe burning of 
coal in our boilers. Our boilers must be kept hot at 
night to pick up the morning electrical load At night, 
we reduce the flow of powdered coal into our boilers. 
Burning could become erratic and delayed firing could 
result in an explosion. So we inject oil to keep the coal 
burning uniformly at the reduced flow If necessary 
uses of electricity could be transferred from day time 
to late at night, we could keep the fires going with coal 
and further reduce our oil burn. We will also use oil 
this winter in emergency turbines, if necessary.

A small percentage of natural gas is also used in

peaking plants and for the downtown Milwaukee steam 
heating system About three percent of the electricity 
we will supply this winter will come from hydro-electric 
plants in northern Wisconsin and the Upper Peninsula 
of Michigan. Ground water levels in these watersheds 
are normal.

The purpose of this message is to provide you with 
facts concerning our present situation Many very sin­
cere people have expressed their worry to us. Many 
people are confused. Wisconsin Electric anticipates 
no blackouts or brownouts this winter. We do not 
expect that workers will be sent home from their jobs 
because of a shortage of electricity to run machines 
in their plants.

It is not our purpose, however, to detract from the 
energy conservation program We believe that it is 
wrong to waste energy And, we intend to assist other 
utilities whose fuels are in poorer supply to the best 
of our ability Every kilowatt-hour of energy that our 
customers save this winter will save some basic fuel 
which will increase our ability to assist our neighboring 
utilities who are in a more unfortunate position and to 
increase the availability of these fuels for our system 
in the months to come

Of course, ice storms this winter, or automobiles 
crashing into poles, and even a breakdown of one of 
our generators is possible But other than for unfore­
seeable accidents such as these, or governmental 
action such as national rationing, we expect to be able 
to meet this area’s electric needs.

If Wisconsin Electric is in better position than utilities 
in other parts of the nation, it did not come about by 
accident. Planning and commitments made in the 
1960's placed us in this favorable position. The long 
court fights in obtaining license approval for Point 
Beach Nuclear Plant will really be won by our cus­
tomers this winter. Planning and commitments now 
must be made to meet your necessary electrical needs 
in the late 1970's and 1980’s.

Wisconsin Electric POWER COMPANY

For ideas on the wise use of electricity, contact our Customer Advisors.
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Elmer Ebert, 1208 Stark St., 
Kewaskum; and Mary Gil­
lard, 521 Forest St., Camp­
bellsport, have become the 
latest Regal Ware, Inc., em­
ployees to join the company’s 
“25 Year Club.” All three 
began their employment on 
September 27, 1948.

Irene Brandenburg
Irene Brandenburg started 

her career at Regal as a 
Wrapper and Packer. After 
three years, she transferred 
to the Electric Assembly De­
partment, where she is an 
Electric Assembler. In her 
spare time, Irene enjoys 
camping, fishing and travel­
ing. She and her husband Al­
vin have one daughter, Mad­
eline, who is married and 
lives in Hartford.

Elmer Ebert began his ca­
reer with Regal in the Buff­
ing Department and during 
the 25 years has advanced to 
the position of Working Fore­
man. He is a veteran of 
World War II. Elmer’s favo­
rite spare-time activities in­
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hunting. He and his wife, 
Virginia, who also works at 
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Mary Gillard began her 

career at Regal Ware in the 
Wash and Clean Department. 
She later transferred to the 
Finish Department, where 
she is a Cover Welder. Ma­
ry’s favorite pastimes include 
camping and traveling. She 
and her husband, Chester, 
have two married sons — Al­
bert and Jim, who both live 
in the Kettle Moraine area.

As a token of gratitude 
for their contribution to Re­
gal Ware during the past 25 
years, each was presented 
with a specially engraved 
wristwatch.

UW ACCEPTS $250 GIFT 
FROM VALLEY BANK

A gift of $250 from the 
Valley Bank of Kewaskum 
was among $11,490,060.10 in 
gifts and grants accepted by 
the University of Wisconsin 
system Board of Regents at 
its meeting on the Madison 
campus of the university 
system.

The gift is for a Farm and 
Industry Short Course Scho­
larship at Wisconsin’s Uni­
versity ot Madison.

Shampoo & Wax
YOUR OWN FLOOR WITH

Hoover Scrubber

and Shampooer

MINZ SUPPLY

for those Holiday Parties

for the family

PHONE 533-8426 
Office Hours: M2 1-3 

Wed. A Frl. Evenings 7*9 
Closed Thursday 

CAMPBELLSPORT, Wit. Kewaskum 626-2164

ANTHONY

Service

24 HOUR EMERGENCY 
A WRECKER SERVICE

with your everyday in­
surance needs. For auto, 
fire, life insurance call 
today.

COMPLETE AUTOMOTIVE 
SERVICE 

With Many Years Experience

YOUR TIRE CENTER
Firestone J.T.W

Pennsylvania

Hwy. 45 South

Phone 626-2888
KEWASKUM

Fire Dept, to
Sponsor Drive
For Dystrophy

The Kewaskum Fire De­
partment will sponsor their 
5th annual canister campaign 
for Muscular Dystrophy it 
was announced today by Oay 
Barczewski, Milwaukee Pres- 
sident, Milwaukee Area 
Chapter Muscular Dystrophy 
Associations of America, Inc.

Fife Chief Armin Opper­
mann will serve as chairman 
and he will be assisted by 
members of the Kewaskum 
Fire Deparment in placing 
the familiar Jerry Lewis 
hourglass canisters in busin­
ess places.

Since 1954 helping in the 
fight against muscular dys­
trophy has been one of the 
Fire Fighters’ favorite proj­
ects. Fire Fighters have help­
ed raise funds, served as 
chapter officers and helped 
provide recreation for mus­
shop in Milwaukee and Uni- 
cular dystrophy patients on 
the national, state and local 
levels.

uscular dystrophy is a chro- • 
nic disease which gradually 
destroys the coluntary mus­
cles of th ebody. It is found 
in all parts of the world. Ap­
proximately two-thirds of the 
known victims are children. 
The exact cause of the disease 
is not yet known. There is no 
cure.

Muscular Dystrophy Asso­
ciations of America, Inc., a 
non-profit organization, con­
ducts its annual campaign to 
raise funds for services to lo­
cal uatients suffering with

KEVS

fJl/Y4,V
^ EWM Ci EV
Honeck Chevrolet

KEWASKUM

Richard C. Gust
1129 Midland Ave.
KEWASKUM, WIS.

Phono 626-2765

AMERICAN FAMILY

muscular dystrophy and al­
lied neuromuscular diseases, 
as well as for itts extensive 
research program.

The Muscular Dysptophy 
Clinics at the Curative Work- 
versity Hospitals in Madison 
are two of the 122 MD. Clin­
ics located in the United 
States.

Kewaskum is in the Mil­
waukee Areo Chapter, which 
has seven counties to serve. 
The chapter is one of over 
285 in the United States that 
provide wheelchairs, braces, 
other . orthapedic appliances, 
physical therapy and educa­
tional and recreational prog­
rams for muscular dystrophy 
patients.

In the past 16 years the 
Milwaukee Area Chapter has 
spent $309,022 to help local 
MD patients with orthopedic 
equipment, free clinic exam­
inations and consultations, 
physical therapy and recrea­
tion, especially summer, 
camp.

Milwaukee area patients 
are able to attend a special 
free summer camp designed 
around their specific needs 
and limitations. Southeastern 
Wisconsin high school stud­
ents volunteer as attendants 
to enable M.D. patients to go 
ewimming, horseback riding, 
canoeing and any outdoor ac­
tivity possible at summer 
camp.

Used Sewing Machines Sale

6 Singer-Touch ’n Sow’s. . . . . . . *49 and up 
1972 Singer (Zig-Zag) from Italy.. *49 
1973 Singer (Zig-Zag) model 257.. *66 
Singer - Made in Japan nn. 223 . .*99 
1972 Kenmore Zig-Zag. . . . . . . . . . . . . . *49
White Zig-Zag. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . *59
Necchi open-arm Zig-Zag. . . . . . . . . . *99
Elna open arm Zig-Zag & cams... *79
Viking open arm Zig-Zag & cams.. *179
Pfaff Zig-Zag and cabinet. . . . . . . . . . *89
7 Used cabinets and desks from ... *10 
8 Older Sewing Machines from . . . *15

. ill Machines liillv(Guaranteed

JAEGER
SEWING MACHINE SALES

& SERVICE SPECIALIST CENTER
Theatre Building-Hy 45, KEWASKUM - 626-2611 

Store Hours, Daily 1 0 a m -9 p m until Christmas 
Saturday 10-5; Sunday Closed

Mental Health 
Association
Needs Volunteers

The Washington County 
Mental Health Association 
has shown sonnort and con­
cern for two important nieces 
of mental health legislation— 
the Unified Board for Wash 
ington County (Public Law 
51.42 states that the county 
must adopt a unif’ed mental 
health, mental retardation, 
alcoholism and drug abuse 
board wh’ch will be respon­
sible for the direction of all 
public services and their im­
plementation') and Education 
for Students with Exception­
al Needs (Chapter 89 of the 
laws of 1973 relates to the 
mandatory education for chil­
dren with exceptional educa­
tional needs). Both of these 
laws will have a definite and 
continued effect upon the re­
sidents of Washington Coun­
ty. The association needs vo­
lunteers to work on commit­
tees during the next year to 
make sure that the rights and 
needs of the county citizens 
are protected and satisfied as 
these two laws are implemen­
ted in the county
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Will there be 
enough electricity 

this winter 
in southeastern 

Wisconsin?
You should understand the difference in the electric 
supply situation between southeastern Wisconsin and 
some other parts of the nation On the East Coast, for 
example, electricity is made mostly from oil, which is 
in short supply. On the Gulf Coast, electricity is made 
mostly from natural gas or with oil when gas is not 
available. Both of these are in short supply In the 
Pacific Northwest electricity is made by hydro-electric 
plants and that area has suffered an unusual shortage 
of rainfall.

About fifty-eight percent of the electricity Wisconsin 
Electric will make this winter will come from coal. 
Although coal is not in critical supply at this time, its 
availability may become limited in the future because 
of unduly restrictive mining legislation, unrealistic air 
quality criteria, and increased requirements as indus­
tries and other utilities convert from oil and gas to coal. 
Most of the coal we will need this winter is already 
on our docks.

More than thirty-five percent of the electricity for 
this winter will come from our Point Beach Nuclear 
Plant. More than a winter’s supply of nuclear fuel is 
already in the reactors. Wisconsin Electric's thirty-five 
percent nuclear generation is well ahead of the national 
average .. only four percent of the electricity made 
nationally is from nuclear energy.

Less than two percent of the electricity we will make 
this winter will come from oil. Much of this small per­
centage of oil we do use is to assure safe burning of 
coal in our boilers. Our boilers must be kept hot at 
night to pick up the morning electrical load. At night, 
we reduce the flow of powdered coal into our boilers. 
Burning could become erratic and delayed firing could 
result in an explosion So we inject oil to keep the coal 
burning uniformly at the reduced flow If necessary 
uses of electricity could be transferred from day time 
to late at night, we could keep the fires going with coal 
and further reduce our oil burn. We will also use oil 
this winter in emergency turbines, if necessary.

A small percentage of natural gas is also used in

peaking plants and for the downtown Milwaukee steam 
heating system. About three percent of the electricity 
we will supply this winter will come from hydro-electric 
plants in northern Wisconsin and the Upper Peninsula 
of Michigan. Ground water levels in these watersheds 
are normal.

The purpose of this message is to provide you with 
facts concerning our present situation Many very sin­
cere people have expressed their worry to us, Many 
people are confused. Wisconsin Electric anticipates 
no bJackouts or brownouts this winter. We do not 
expect that workers will be sent home from their jobs 
because of a shortage of electricity to run machines 
in their plants.

It is not our purpose, however, to detract from the 
energy conservation program We believe that it is 
wrong to waste energy. And, we intend to assist other 
utilities whose fuels are in poorer supply to the best 
of our ability Every kilowatt-hour of energy that our 
customers save this winter will save some basic fuel 
which will increase our ability to assist our neighboring 
utilities who are in a more unfortunate position and to 
increase the availability of these fuels for our system 
in the months to come.

Of course, ice storms this winter, or automobiles 
crashing into poles, and even a breakdown of one of 
our generators is possible But other than for unfore­
seeable accidents such as these, or governmental 
action such as national rationing, we expect to be able 
to meet this area's electric needs.

If Wisconsin Electric is in better position than utilities 
in other parts of the nation, it did not come about by 
accident. Planning and commitments made in the 
1960's placed us in this favorable position. The long 
court fights in obtaining license approval for Point 
Beach Nuclear Plant will really be won by our cus­
tomers this winter. Planning and commitments now 
must be made to meet your necessary electrical needs 
in the late 1970's and 1980’s.

Wisconsin Electric power company

For ideas on the wise use of electricity, contact our Customer Advisors.

^•- .^.. v,,^^*^.^^.','^^^
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WANTED TO BUY—Used 

electric train. Allen Reindl, 
R. 2, Kewaskum. Phone 
626-2041. ________*P

HELP WANTED—Part-time 
janitor. Wigwam. Apply in 
person. Preferably retired 
man.12-7-2

BASEMENT SALE
Crafts, crocheted items, 

dishes, glassware, kettles, 
toys, baby car seat, walker, 
training chair, violet flower 
stand. December 8-9, 9 a. 
m. to 9 p. m. at 331 2nd St. 
Kewaskum.H

FOR SALE
Cosco metal high chair, $8
Small round table, $5
Diaphram pipe compressor 

spray gun & 25 ft. of hose, 
$15

2 log chains, $10 each
Shallow well jet pump, 

$40
Shallow well piston pump, 

$25
Pontoon boat with trailer 

& 35 h.p. motor, $1,000
Baby bed, 6 yr. size, $5
2 end tables, $5 each
Lighted Santa in sleigh 

with 2 reindeer, $20
Used gas stove, $5

Can be seen at
FRANK’S SPORT SHOP 

New Prospect 
between 9 and 5 and 

evenings by appointment
Call 533-4526 It

CHAIN SAWS SHARPENED 
Laubenstein Lawn & Gar­
den Mart, R. 2, Kewaskum.

HIGHEST PRICES paid for 
old newspapers, copper, 
brass, aluminum, lead and 
batteries. Lynn’s Waste Pa­
per Co., 121 Island Ave., 

, West Bend, Wis.

HELP WANTED—No exper­
ience necessary. L. Rosen - 
heimer Malt & Grain Co., 
1421 Fond du Lac Ave. 
Phone 626-2280. , 11-23-tf

SNO-THROS — Ariens or 
John Deere, new and used. 
Laubenstein’s. Ph. 626- 
2553. 16tf

FOR SALE—Schick electric 
mist hair setter, like new, 
$14. Phone 626-2623 after 

5:00. ll-30-2p

3 bedroom ranch in Ke­
waskum, full bath, full base­
ment, 1 car garage, family 
room, on a nice lot. Sale price 
under $25,000.

3 bedroom ranch with 
Spanish frqnt, full bath with 
vanity, carpeting in the liv­
ing room, hardwood flooring 
in bedrooms, and tile in the 
kitchen/dinette and bath. 
All this on a large Kewas­
kum lot for the sale price of 
$25,975.

4 bedroom 2 story in the 
City of West Bend, 1% baths, 
kitchen/dinette combination, 
laundry on first floor, cozy 
living room, and full base­
ment, 2 car garage, on a large 
double wide lot. Sale priced 
in the mid 20’s.

COUNTRY LOTS
4 country lots available in 

the Town of Barton. Get 
ready for the spring building 
season by buying your lot 
now. Sale priced at $3,800 
and $4,300.

CITY LOTS
90 x 153 in West Bend, 

zoned 2 family.
90 x 127 in West Bend 

zoned 2 family.
Have Buyers for Farms

THANK YOU
Heartfelt thanks to all 

my relatives and friends for 
their thoughtfulness in re­
membering me with cards, 
gifts, flowers and visits while 
at the hospital and convales- 
cinb at home. Special thanks 
to Dr. and Mrs. Edwards and 
Father John Budde. These 
kind acts will long be re­
membered.

Wally Schneider

THANK YOU
My sincere thanks to all 

my friends and relatives for 
their kind remembrances of 
gifts, flowers and visits 
while I was a patient at St. 
Agnes Hospital and conval­
escing at home. Special 
thanks to Rev. Hoenecke for 
his consoling words and 
prayers.

Mrs. Byron Klein

FOLLMANN WINS AT 
FEEDER PIG SHOW

Kewaskum Statesman 
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FOR RENT — Chain saws. 
Laubenstein’s. Ph. 626-2553

ACCORDION LESSONS — 
Advanced and beginners at 
the Labor Center, Kewas­
kum, every Thursday from 
4 to 9 p. m. Stop in or call 
collect. Beaver Dam Music 

Center, 485-4780^ 11-2-tf

SPINET-CONSOLE PIANO— 
May be purchased by small 
monthly payments, may be 
seen locally, write Manager 
P. O. Box 276 Shelbyville, 
Indiana 46176. ll-9-4p

When buying or selling 
call

KEWASKUM REALTY
Bob Kirst, Realtor 

333 Main St., Kewaskum 
626-4392

List With the Leader

DAN COULTER
Area Representative 

R. 3, Campbellsport

Home 626-4592

Office 336-9691

The second state-wide Fee­
der Pig Show was recently 
held at the Fond du Lac 
County fair grounds at Fond 
du Lac. Forty-four pens of 
eight feeder pigs each were 
exhibited at the show.

Winners in the various 
classes include Reinhard Foll- 
mann, R. 2. Kewaskum, who 
took a 3rd place and a 7th 
place in the light weight 
class (weight range 40 to 40.- 
12 pounds).

Ed Chancellor. R. 1. Mt. 
Horeb, exhibited the grand 
champion pen of feeder pigs. 
The reserve champion pen 
was exhibited by Bernard 
Moss, R. 4, Beaver Dam.

Births
VETTER—A daughter, Lea 

Lynn, to Dennis and Jean­
ette Vetter, R. 3, Ashland, 
Tuesday, Nov. 20. She was a 
former teacher in the Kewas­
kum school system and he 
taught at Fond du Lac.

BRUCKERT—A daughter 
to Robert and Jocelyn Bruc- 
kert, 1607 Fond du Lac Aye., 
Kewaskum, Monday, Dec. 3.

GROSS—A son to Leroy 
and Judy Gross, 4600 Arte­
sian Road, Fond du Lac,' Sat­
urday, Nov. 17. Grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Gross, Town of Auburn, and 
Mrs. Lorraine Fellenz, St. 
Michaels.

Bowe 6* Weninger Realty, Inc.

A fatal accident happens 
once in a lifetime.
r  —— ■■ । »

S2.00-FREE
CASH for DISABLED, 

DOWN or DEAD COWS 
and Horses. 

Top Price, Fast RemovaL

Better Cows & Hones - alive 
$15 and np.

Better Cows & Horses, alive 
$15 and up.

NELSON 
Farm Service 

Phone Collect 
OSHKOSH 233-1910

School Menus
Menus for week of Dec. 

10 - 14.
MONDAY—Mock chicken 

leg, potatoes and gravy, cran­
berry sauce, buttered wax 
beans, peaches, bread, butter 
and milk.

TUESDAY — Beef ravioli 
in meat sauce, french bread, 
lettuce salad - choice of dres­
sings, dessert - cook’s choice, 
bread, butter ?nd milk.

WEDNESDAY — Barbecue 
on a bun, french fries, marsh­
mallow fruit delight, bread, 
butter, peanut butter and 
milk.

THURSDAY — Beef stew - 
using fresh vegetables (pota­
toes, carrots, celery), spiced 
apple rings, jello with fruit, 
bread, butter, jelly and milk.

FRIDAY—Tuna salad, po­
tato chips, sliced cheese, 
orange and grapefruit juice, 
chicken salad, purple plums, 
bread, butter, peanut butter, 
jelly and milk.

Menus are subject to 
change.

Home for large family, mo­
dern kitchen, family room 
with fireplace. Extra large 2- 
car garage. Good size lot, in 
Kewaskum. $29,900.

3 bedroom year round home 
and cottage on Long Lake.
313 3 Large wooded lots with 

all improvements, in Ke­
waskum; ready for your 
dream home. Priced from 
$6,900.

252 Just north of Kewaskum, 
SW corner of Ashford-Au­
burn Dr. and Hwy. 45. 2.9 
acres, 2 springs, excellent 
pond possibilities. Many 
trees planted. $5,900.

318 3 bedroom cottage with 
Long Lake access on large 
wooded lot; modern.
$17,900.

Business opportunity at Long 
Lake, available now.

OFFICE: 131 Main St., KEWASKUM Phone 626-4757
Paul Albinger, Broker Sales, Phone 334-9163 

MIKE WALSH Sales — Phone 626-4757

Full Time Realtors and Appraisers

0K USED[RRS
SPECIAL

’73 Plymouth Duster Coupe, Small V8, 3-Speed, 
4900 Actual Miles

REAL ESTATE SCHOOL!

BECOME A LICENSED 
REAL ESTATE BROKER 
OR SALESMAN! START 
NOW! EASY. HOME STU­
DY COURSE. APPROVED 
FOR VETERANS BENE­
FITS ALSO CLASSES IN 
FOND DU LAC. ALSO 
DAILY CLASSES IN MIL­
WAUKEE.
WISCONSIN SCHOOL OF 

REAL ESTATE
161 W. WIS. AVE., 

MILWAUKEE

—USED CAR

PRODUCTION WORK
ASSEMBLY AND MACHINE SHOP

Positions available which offer good 
wages and fringe benefits 

to qualified personnel. Some 
commensurate experience desirable.
Interested individuals should call or 

visit the Employment Office in Hartford 
any weekday between 8 a. m. and 5 p. m.

CHRYSLER
OUTBOARD CORP.

Hartford, Wisconsin 53027 
Phono 673 2200

AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER

* 73 Caprice Sport Sedan, 
Air Condition, 
Low Mileage

* 73 Chev. Caprice 4 Dr. Hard­
top, Air-Cond., Fully 
Equipped Demonstrator, 
8800 miles

* 73 Chev. Impala 4 Dr., Po­
wer Steering & Brakes, 
7200 Miles, Demo.

’72 Impala 4 Door, 
Low Mileage

* 72 Chev. Impala 4 Dr., Power 
Steering & Brakes, 
Vinyl Roof, 34,000 Mi.

* 72 Chevelle Sport Coupe V8, 
3 Speed Stick, Very Clean

2—*72 Chev. Impala 6 Pass. 
Sta. Wagons, V8 Automa­
tic, Full Power

’71 Nova Coupe
V8 - 3 Speed

*71 Chevelle Malibu 4 Dr., 
6 Cyl. Automatic, 
14,000 Miles

’70 Caprice Sport Sedan. 
Low Mileage

’70 Chev. Townsman Sta. 
Wagon, Automatic

2—*69 Chev. Bel Air 4 Drs., 
V8 Automatic

—USED TRUCKS
* 73 Chev. % Ton Pickup V8, 

4 Speed, Heavy Duty E- 
quipment, 15,000 Miles

* 72 Chev. 60 Series 366 V8, 
5 Speed, 20 FL Flatbed

* 69 Chev. 60 Series 366 V8, 
5 Speed, 2 Speed, 152** 
Cab-Axle

’69 Chev. % Ton Pickup 
V8, 4 Sp., Low Mileage

’69 Chev. 2-Ton, 
Platform & Hoist

’67 Chev 2 Ton, Tilt Cab, 
14 Ft. Grain Body & 
Hoist

PLUS MANY OTHER PICKUPS AND LARGER TRUCKS

HONECK 
Chevrolet, Inc. 

KEWASKUM Phone 626-2161
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William J. Harbeck & 
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Publishers
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du Lac, Random Lake, Ply­
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Elsewhere in Wisconsin $4.50 
Per Year

Outside of Wisconsin $5.00 
Per Year

Single Copy 10c
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SAVE ! ? ! Select your 
furniture at Miller’s in Ke­
waskum. Largest selection, 
high quality at most reason­
able prices. Open daily until 
5’30. Monday and Friday to 
9 p. m Free dependable de- 
I'very.

MINUTES OF VILLAGE 
BOARD MEETING

Adjourned' Meeting 
July 9, 1973 
7:30 P. M.

The Village Board of Ke­
waskum, Washington County, 
Wisconsin, met in adjourned 
session in the Council Room 
of the Municipal Building.

President Miller presided. 
Trustee Nigh was absent. 
Trustees Herriges, Yoost, 
Schmidt. Strack and Kral 
were present.

Approval of the minutes of 
the previous meeting was dis­
pensed with upon motion by

Trustee Kral, seconded by 
Trustee Strack and unani­
mously carried.

Sealed bids for the 1973 
Street Paving Program were 
opened and publicly read by 
engineering consultant For­
rest Robinson. The bids were 
tabulated as follows:

Scott Construction, Inc., 
Lake Delton, $2.34 per sq. 
yd. for a total bid of $39,- 
780.00.
Payne & Dolan, Waukesha, 
$2 14 per sq. yd. for a to­
tal bid of $36,380.00.

Engineering consultant 
Forrest Robinson recommen­
ded that the village accept 
the proposal of the low bid­
der, Payne and Dolan.

Motion was made by Trus­
tee Herriges and seconded by 
Trustee Schmidt that the pro­
posal of Payne and Dolan for 
the 1973 paving program 
shall be accepted.

Roll Call Vote — 6 “aye” 
0 “naye”

The Board Members a- 
greed that the owners of the 
Z and R Subdivision had sub­
stantially complied with the 
Village Board resolution of 
March 5, 1963. and has com­
pleted the installation of sew­
er and water utilities. Motion 
was therefore made by Trus­
tee Herriges and seconded by 
Trustee Yoost that the final 
plat of the Z and R Subdivi­
sion shall be released for re­
cording.

Roll Call Vote — 6 “aye” 
0 “naye”

The Village Board ruled 
that the preliminary plat of 
the Z and R Subdivision was

Radio-TV-Sound
SALES & SERVICE

Frank J. Felix
Ph. 626-2841 Kewaskum

submitted prior to the adop­
tion of the new Platting and 
Subdivision Ordinance and 
therefore the provisions of 
the new ordinance do not ap­
ply to this particular plat ev­
en though the subdividers did 
comply with many of the pro­
visions.

Motion was made by Trus­
tee Strack, seconded by Trus­
tee Schmidt that because the 
Z and R Subdivision Plat was 
submitted prior to the adop­
tion of the new Subdivision 
and Platting Ordinance, the 
provision for the payment of 
the fee per lot for park and 
recreation area does not ap­
ply.

Roll Call Vote — 6 “aye”
0 “naye”

The application of Jan Ro­
senthal for a building permit 
for the construction of a one 
family home on Lot 5, Block 
2, Z and R Subdivision was 
approved upon motion by 
Trustee Herriges, seconded 
by Trustee Yoost and unani­
mously carried.

The application of Hollis­
ter DeMotts for a building 
permit for the construction 
of a one family home on Lot 
3, Block 2, Z and R Subdivi­
sion was approved upon mo­
tion by Trustee Schmidt, se­
conded by Trustee Strack 
and unanimously carried.

WATKINS
Quality Products 
MASON SHOES

WM. J. COULTER
179 Mill Street

Campbellsport Ph. 533-8554

O-IT-YOURSELFI
Home Improvement

WE HAVE THE PRODUCTS & TOOLS YOU NEED FOR

The President and Com­
missioner were authorized to 
sign the waste water treat­
ment survey report as pre­
pared by Superintendent Al­
bers and the consulting firm 
of Robinson, Welch and As­
sociates. Motion by Trustee 
Yoost, seconded by Trustee 
Herriges and unanimously 
carried.

The Wisconsin Department 
of Natural Resources were 
authorized to install a gaug­
ing station on the east bank 
of the Milwaukee River just 
south of the Village Park 
Dam. Motion by Trustee 
Yoost, seconded by Trustee 
Herriges and unanimously 
carried.

The administration com­
mittee was authorized to ne­
gotiate an option for the pos­
sible purchase of Lot 6. 
Block 29 of the Assessor’s 
Plat, of the Village of Kewas­
kum. Motion by Trustee 
Strack, seconded by Trustee 
Kral and unanimously car­
ried.

Upon motion by Trustee

24 Hour BURNER SERVICE 
Complete HEATING Installation 

WARM AIR — HYDRONIC (water)

Air Conditioning 
Your MOBIL Distributor 

SHEFOND OIL CO.. INC. & 
LP-D GAS, INC.

WAUCOUSTA R. 3, CAMPBILLSPORT PH. 533 4322
NORMAN HEBERER, KEWASKUM PH. 626-2491

Herriges, seconded by Trus 
tee Yoost and duly carried, 
the Board adjourned subject 
to call by the President.

William Martin, 
Commissioner

NOTICE TO 
VETERANS

At their next regular 
meeting on Monday, Dec 10, 
at 8 p. m., the Robert G. Ro­
maine Post 384, American 
Legion, Kewaskum, will have 
the Washington County Ser­
vice Officer at the meeting 
to inform of the benefits you 
are entitled to and to answer 
any questions you may have.

All veterans are welcome 
even if you are not a mem­
ber of any veterans’ organi­
zation.

Come and see your buddies 
on Monday, Dec. 10, at 8 p. 
m. at the Legion clubhouse 
in Kewaskum.

SURE, TRI-STATE
Homes Are Beautiful:

|T more important, they're Quality built 
I3^J I } for a lifetime of home living satisfaction.

It's easy for any home builder to skimp on 
quality. Not Tri-State. We're building a solid 
reputation and growing family of satisfied 
home owners, and we know quality 
construction is what's behind it. Before you 
make that important home buying or building 
decision, be sure to see a Tri-State . . . 
beautifully built . . . for a lifetime.

35
Floor Plan Choices 

2,3,4 and 5 
Bed Room Models

FEATURES:
Beautiful Cathedral Ceilings • Double-Glass, Insulated Windows • Hot Water 
Heat, Choice of Fuels • Highest Quality Materials • Drywall Construction 
for Your Decorating Versatility • 2x8 Floor Joists, 2x6 Roof Rafters • De­
livery to Your Foundation in Weeks (about 6), Not Months. Erection in Days 
Factory Built to Strict Quality Standards and Control • Approved by All Conven­
tional Lending Institutions, also FHA, VA and FMHA. 

YOU’RE INVITED TO VISIT OUR MODEL HOME

WEST BEND HOMES 
2542 Wallace Lake Rd. 

West Bend, Wis. 

334-7610

IK
■ PLUMBING
■ HEATING
■ AIR 

CONDITIONING
■ WATER CONDITIONING

PLUS:
- ELECTRICAL GOODS
. PAINTED GALVANIZED 

ROOF DRAINAGE
" PRODUCTS
- FREE PLANALOG 

PRODUCT GUIDE

YOU CAN DO IT YOURSELF
WITH OUR EXPERT ADVICE (FREE)

OR LET US DO IT FOR YOU
Why buy a new home at high cost? Remodel and repair. 
Then you'll enjoy comforts and luxuries of a new home 
without buying one. Improve your property to increase 
its value. You will get a better price when you sell. 
It's easy to be a Do-It-Yourselfer. We have the products 
and tools you need . . . and Free expert advice.

FREE ESTIMATES

AUTHORIZED DEALER
J Home Improvement Center

COME IN AND SEE Johann's
N

Kewaskum

Hwy 28

Home Improvement Center
PHONE 334-9481

Located in St. Michaels, 3 mile* 
East of Kewaskum on Hwy. 28.

Hour*: Mon.-Thur*.- 8 a m. to 5 30 p m 
Fn 8 a m.-9 p-m-, Sat. 8 a m -5 p m.
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Mayville Beats 
Indians, 52-38, on 
Strong Defense

The Indians got started 
much too late and lost their 
opening conference game at 
Mayville Friday night to the 
rival Cardinals, 52-38, before 
a noisy crowd. It was the 3rd 
straight win for the unbeaten 
Cardinals and Kewaskum is 
now 1-3.

The game was taped by ra­
dio station WBKV in West 
Bend and rebroadcast Satur­
day morning to area fans.

An all-junior lineup started 
for Kewaskum which makes 
the future look bright for the 
Indians, who probably are a 
year away.

Mayville doubled Kewas­
kum’s score in each of the 
first 3 quarters, outpointing 
them 12-6 in the first period, 
15-8 in the 2nd (making it 
27-14 at halftime), and 14-7 
in the third stanza. The Car­
dinals were on top by 20 
points going into the final pe­
riod when the Indians spurt­
ed to outscore Mayville in 
the final quarter, 17-11, and 
cut the margin of victory to 
14 points. Kewaskum’s rally 
in the last period had May­
ville worried and they went 
into a ball possession stall to 
ward off the Indians’ threat.

Kewaskum’s spurt came af­
ter Mayville’s tough defense 
had already put the game out 
of reach. The Cardinals had 
the best defense in the conf­
erence last year and they 
seem to have taken over 
where they left off last seas­
on. Their man-to-man press 
defense kept Kewaskum from 
getting on the scoreboard un­
til there was less than 3 min­
utes left in the first quarter. 
The Cardinals jumped off to 
an 8-0 lead and the Indians 
couldn’t get rolling.

The Cardinals played a de­
liberate offensive game and 
got the job done. The Indians 
turned over the ball freq­
uently, especially attempting 
to lob the ball over the Car­
dinals’ heads.

Stealing the show was 
Mayville’s sharpshooter and 
leading scorer, Lud Wurtz, 
who had a banner night with 
23 points. Fischer was next 
with 12. Leading the Indians 
was Scott Koth with 15 and 
Don Gruber was next with 9.

A big 21-point 3rd quarter 
led the JV’s to an easy 56-35 
victory over Mayville. Jim 
Bilgo had 11 points and Tom 
Edwards 10.

In other opening Scenic 
games defending co-champ­
ions Germantown and Graf­
ton both won. Germantown 
dumped Slinger 55-43, 
and Grafton downed Kettle 
Moraine, 70-51. In the other 
tilt Pewaukee won over Ar­
rowhead in overtime, 59-57.

This Friday the Indians 
jump out of the frying pan 
into the fire when they host 
the big, defending co-champ­
ion Germantown team, which 
is picked as a favorite to re­
peat.

MAYVILLE KEWASKUM 
fg fl f fg ft f

Wurtz ♦ $ J Koth 5 5 3
FWcMr 4 4 0 Koepke 3 1 4
Hotprlcti 12 4 Gruber 4 1 1
SMC* S 0 ’ Koepke, R 1 2 2
Schintfert 1 0 5 Kleinman I 0 2
Panha 10 2 Timblin 0 2 5
Yountbeck 2 1 3 Petri 0 0 1

Stoffel 0 1 0
TOTALS 13 12 1*

TOTALS 20 12 10
KEWASKUM 4 0 7 17 30
MAYVILLE 12 1$ 14 11' 52
STM Kewaskum 7. Mayvilla *

when a woman meets a 
man who looks her straight 
in the eye, she’d better do 
something about her figure.

Iridian Matmen 
Defeat Slinger, 
Fifth at Kiel

In their opening wrestling 
matches at Slinger Thursday, 
the Kewaskum Indians made 
a clean sweep of it by defeat­
ing the Owls at the varsity, 
JV and freshmen levels.

The varsity won 27-20 but 
Slinger was ahead until the 
last three bouts. Then Glen 
Luedtke, in his first varsity 
bout, Doug Wilson and Dale 
Secor all won to give the In­
dians their victory. The JV’s 
won, 31-25 and the frosh won 
easily, 48-15.

Soph Russ Wilson and sen­
ior Al Schmidt got pins for 
the Indian varsity. The Owls’ 
leading wrestler, Mike Gehr­
ing, pinned Mike Donath in a 
thrilling match.

Kewaskum traveled to Kiel 
Saturday for an invitational 
meet. Denmark High a- 
massed 108% points to run 
away from the 8-team field 
with 6 champions and 2 sec­
onds. Sheboygan South took 
2nd with 72 points, followed 
by Kiel 56%, Appleton East 
47%, Kewaskum 35, Oost­
burg 32%, West Bend West 
32 and Howards Grove 16.

The Indians had 1 champi­
on in Al Schmidt in the un­
limited division. He pinned 
each of his 3 opponents and

now has 4 straight wins. He 
has not been scored on in 
any of these matches. Kewas­
kum also had 2 third place
finishers in 
and Secor at 
son and Bob 
ed fourths.

Donath at 185 
105. Doug Wil- 
Gundrum gain-

The Indians were at home 
to Cedar Grove Tuesday, 
Thursday they hosted Hart­
land, Saturday they go to the 
Horicon Invitational, and 
next Thursday they travel to 
Pewaukee.

KEWASKUM 27 SLINGER 24
94 Rum Wilton K pinned Monney 1:41

105 Dale Secpr K dec. Vodgt 10-0
112 Jeff Panzer K and Paul Moser S drew

22
119 Gary Unertl S dec. Bob Gundrum 7-2
126 Doug Wilson K dec. Gary Lemke 4-0
132 Glen Luedtk K dec. Mike Schmidt 5-0
134 Al Sqtweltzer S dec. Dan Braun 7 5
145 Mark Nothem S dec. Bruce 

Markielewski 11-4
155 Gary Schmidt K dec. Gary Schwai 6-1
167 Mark Wilhelm! S dec. Vern Ludwig 5-4
145 Mike Gehring S. pinned Mike Donath

5:30
Uni. Al Schmidt K pinned Mark Friess 3:30 

JV KEWASKUM 31, SLINGER 25
94 Ritger S dec. Marks 5-3

105 Kleinman K won by forfeit
112 Pepp S. pinned Dei 5:14
119 Degnltz K and Strupp 2-2
126 Kruger K dec Arnold 1-0
132 Ayer K and Kapal drew 2-2
134 Schneider K pinned Friess 3:00
145 Marino K dec. Galbalth 19-9
155 Baier S won by forfeit
167 Nigh K won by forfeit
145 Sonnenberg S pinned Bergdorf 5:34 
Uni. Edgar K dec. Brugger 2-0

FROSH KEW. 44, SLINGER 1S
44 Rupllnger K pinned Keener. 1:50
94 Boylan K by forfeit

105 Braun K dec. Baler 10-1
112 Pankow K dec. Schulteis 6-4
119 Strobel K pinned Schaefer 1:11
126 Holtz by forfeit
132 Gray S. dec. Herriges 7-2
134 Bemis K by forfeit
145 M. Herriges by forfeit
155 Stollenwerk K by forfeit
173 Cornell S pinned Lemke 3:20 
Uni. Straus S pinned Leintz 1:09

Eichstedt Starter 
At St. Norbert’s 
Averaging 12.5

Former Kewaskum High 
School star, Clark Eichstedt, 
is a regular starter on the St. 
Norbert’s College basketball 
team at De Pere this season. 
Clark made the squad in his 
freshman year.

Eichstedt scored 25 points 
in the Green Knights first 
two games on 9 field goals 
and 7 free throws for an av­
erage of 12.5 points per 
game. St. Norbert’s, now 2-0, 
defeated Carthage College, 
87-79, and Northland College, 
85-77, in the first two con­
tests.

The Green Knights start­
ing lineup includes John Sat­
tler, senior, a 6-9 center; 
Clark Eichstedt, junior, 6-4, 
and Paul Schramka, sopho-
more, 6-3, forwards; 
Kunz, senior, 6-2, and 
comer Chuck Albers, 
guards.

Jeff' 
new- 

6-3,

Sattler is from Schofield 
D.C. Everest, Eichstedt from 
Kewaskum, Schramka from 
Milwaukee Marquette, Kunz 
from Beloit Catholic, and Al­
bers from De Pere Pennings. 
Other members of the squad 
are Dan Heim, 6-4, Mayville, 
soph; Mike Jaskulski, 5-11, 
Milwaukee Pio Nono, soph;

Kerry Kennedy, 6-3, Beloit 
Catholic, sophomore; Kim 
Pierce, 5-11, Menomonee 
Falls North, soph; Gary Roz- 
marynoski. Two Rivers 
Washington, soph; Mike Tho­
mas, 6-2, Arlington Heights, 
Ill., senior; Greg Weisse, Osh­
kosh Lourdes, 5-11, soph.

Following their first 2
wins, 
faced 
their 
week.

3 straight road games 
the Green Knights on 
busy schedule this 
Tuesday, Dec. 4, they

took on UW-Oshkosh. Thurs­
day, Dec. 6, Loyola of Chica­
go, and Saturday, Dec. 8, 
they meet Milton College.

Besides making 9 out of 16 
field goal attempts and 7 of 
10 free throws, Eichstedt 
grabbed 9 rebounds in the 
first 2 games.

HON-E-KOR CHRISTMAS 
PARTY ON SATURDAY

The Hon-E-Kor Christmas 
party will be held Saturday, 
Dec. 8. A prime rib dinner
at $12.75 a couple 
served preceded by a 
cocktail hour from 
7:00. Hors d* oeuvers

will be 
70 cent 
6:00 to 
will be

served and door prizes given. 
Dancing will follow the din­
ner.


