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County Assessors 
Competent at Job

Nearly one-half of tie assessors 
in Washington county have been 
taking the assessment for more 
than five years and are trained in 
appraising rural real estate.

Joseph Klinka, West Bend; Wil­
liam Krause, Cedarburg; Ed. Meli­
us, Jackson; Alois Neuburg, Allen­
ton; Andrew Noller, Colgate, and 
Franklin Scharrer, West Bend, 
each has had five or more years of 
experience in appraising rural real 
estate as well as gathering data 
for the Department of Agriculture.

Other assessors who make annual 
calls on Washington county far­
mers to evaluate real estate and 
collect agricutural data are: Robert 
Cleary, Hartford; Arnold Hawig, 
Campbellsport; George Hiller, Sr., 
West Bend; Raymond Horst, Sr., 
Hartford; John Muckerheide, Ke­
waskum; Harold Schmit. German­
town. and Andrew Vogelsang, West 
Bend.

Many long time trends in agri­
culture have been mapped out by 
using the data furnished by the lo­
cal township assessors for the past 
42 years. Washington county as­
sessors counted 2 per cent fewer 
cows on farms in 1958 than in 1957 
when they made their annual farm 
statistics enumeration for the Wis­
consin Crop Reporting Service. Re­
cords show that last year milk pro­
duction per cow had increased 5 
percent in the county.

Although, the primary job of the 
assessor is to gather real estate in­
formation for tax purposes, they 
are also required by law to collect 
agricultural data for the Wiscon­
sin Department, of Agriculture. 
State and federal laws prohibit 
making individual farm statistics 
reports available to the public. In­
dividual figures are kept confiden­
tial and only totals are published.

------------ks-----------
FRED SCHLEIFS TAKE IN

FLORIDA JUNGLE GARDENS

During a recent visit to the “Sun 
(’<>ast" of Florida, Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Schleif of Kewaskum enjoyed 
seeing Sarasota Jungle Gardens on 
June 30. The victor* mingled with 
flamingos and other exotic wildfowl 
roaming uncaged amid some of Flo­
rida's finest scenery. During their 
trip the visitors walked through 
jungle trails bordered by huge 
Royal Palms, saw hundreds of dif- 
ferent tropical plants, and watched 
)>ees actually make honey.

The Schlcifs were to Florida with 
their son-in-law and daughter. Mr. 
and Mrs. Arnold Fellenz if West 
Bond.

——— ks------------ 
J/SGT. ROBERT OKRASSA

AND FAMILY MOVE HERE

S Sgt. Robert Okrassa of the U.S. 
Marine Corps and wife and family 
of San Diego, Calif, have rented 
the upper apartment of the Ixmis 
Martin home just south of the vil­
lage limits. S/Sgt. Okrassa has a 
30-lay leave after which he will re­
port for 15 months duty in Okinawa. 
Mrs. Okrassa is the former Shirley 
Keller, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
I^roy Keller. Sr. of Kewaa^um.

------------ks———
BIRTHS

BRUESSEL—A daughter to Mr. 
and Mrs Jacob Brueoael. Kewas­
kum, Sunday, July 5.

Rev. Donald Koehn to 
Leave Wayne Church

The Rev. Donald Koehn, who has 
served as pastor of Salem E and R 
church at Wayne since his ordina­
tion in 1953, has acceptel a call to 
serve as pastor of the Calvary Me­
morial Evangelical and Reformed 
church at 4515 N. Lovers Igine rd. 
in Milwaukee. He will assume his 
pastorate in September.

The Rev. Mr. Koehn will succeed 
the Rev. Carroll J. Olin who left in 
April to assume the pastorate of St. 
Paul's Church of Christ at Sheboy­
gan. The Rev. Koehn is a graduate 
ot Mission House seminary.

------------ks------------

Tent City at the County 
Fair to Have Many Items

Tent City at the Washington 
County Fair in 1959 will feature 
many items, some new at d some 
old. according to Maurice J. Hov­
land, Washington county agricul­
tural agent. According to Hovland 
there will Im* a vety fine array <>f 
people who will exhibit the’r pro­
ducts for sale at the Washington 
County Fair. These exhibits are 
made possible through Washington 
county businessmen to show the 
public what is new in any particu­
lar field.

The fair gets underway on July 
23 which is opening day. On July 
24 the judging will begin and con­
tinue through July 25 and 26. Hov­
land encourages all p< ople of 
Washington county to visit the 
county fair at least once. He re­
minds again that their is no entry 
fee, no parking charge, and no 
charge to see any of the entertain­
ment on the band stand.

You may come anytime you like 
and stay as long as you like to vi­
sit the 1959 Washington County 
Fair.

.__—xn——-_ 
BROCKMAN INFANT

BAPTIZED SUNDAY

The little son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Brockman, Kewaskum, was 
baptized Sunday afternoon at Holy 

[Trinity church by the Rev. J. Bud- 
jde. He received the name Timothy 
Anthony and his sponsors were An­
thony Vorpahl of here and Mrs. 
Elmer Footland of West Allis.

Guests entertained for the occa­
sion wore Mr. and Mrs. William 
Brockman of Barton and grand­
sons. Ricky and Rusty, Mr. and Mrs. 
Allen Kertscher and son. Mr. and 
Mrs. John Vorpahl and sons. An­
thony and John of Kewaskum; Mr. 
and Mrs. Elmer Footland and fam­
ily of West Allis.

------- ks----- —— 
REPORT YOUR NEWS

If you have visitors or visit, go 
on a trip, leave on a vacation, a 
birth, an operation, a wed ling, a 
death, a fire, an accident, move, buy 
or sell property, a baptism, wedding 
anniversary, birthday party, family 
reunion, leave from service, stub 
your toe on an empty beer can. or 
any other news, report it to us. 
We’ll print It. If your news is le ft 
cut, remember, we have no way of 
knowing unless von tell ua. Call 28.

— k> ■-..—
• MARRIAGE LICENSES

JUNE >0—Delmar F. Kempf, R. 
1. Adell, and Darlia M Kudek, R, 2. 
Kewaskum; wedding July 11,

Rites Held for 
Math. M. Kies

Math. M. Kies. 68, R. 3. West 
Bend, died Monday, June 29, at 
Veterans’ hospital at Wood. The 
Kies family formerly resided in Ke. 
waskum.

Born Aug. 10, 1891, at 'Random 
Lake he grew up there ana learned 
the cheesemaking trade, which 
he followed before moving to Ke- 
waskum and later to West Bend, 
where he did factory work until re­
tiring in 1942. He married Clara 
Fellenz at St. Matthias chinch In 
the town of Auburn on Nov. 4. 
1919.

Surviving are his wif *, three 
daughters and two sons, nine 
grandchildren, a sister and a bro­
ther.

Funeral services were held nt St 
Mary’s church. Barton, last Thurs­
day, the Rev. Raynor Hausman of­
ficiating. Burial was In St. Mary's 
cemetery, Random latke.

------------ka------------

Annual School Meeting
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN 

THAT THE ANNUAL MEETING 
<)F' THE Kewaskum Community 
I nion High School District Joint 
No. 2 of the Village of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Kewaskum, 
Parton, Earmington, and Wayne 
Townships, Washington County. 
Wisjonsin, Ashford, Auburn Town­
ships. Fond <iu Nic County. Wis­
consin, will be held at the Kewas­
kum Community High School Audi­
torium on Monday the twentieth 
day of July, 1959 at 8:60 o’clock 
p. m.

Clifford C. Stautz, Clerk 
Dated July 10, 1959

7-16-2 
- ———ks-----  -—-

TEACHER RETURNS FROM 
TWO WEEK LAKE CRUISE

Firemen-Legion 
Picnic in Village

This Week End
RESCUE 8 DEMONSTRATION, 

PARADE, ENTERTAINMENT
ACTS, WATER FIGHTS TO 

HIGHLIGHT EVENT

All arrangements have been com­
pleted to make this year's Kewas­
kum picnic sponsored by the fire 
department and American Ix'gion 
post one of the finest in years. The 
event will be held this Saturday 
evening and Sunday, July '.1-12 in 
the village' park.

A new’ feature in the Une of en­
tertainment will l>e a Rescue* 8 
demonstration Saturday evening by 
tie crack Milwaukee Metropolitan 

I Target Area Fire Rescue* Service 
at 7 o'clock. This promise's to be a 
worthwhile demonstration < veryone 
should see. Throughout the* re- 
mainder of the* evening music will 
be provided by Ix s Schneide r's or­
chestra.

Sunday’s highlights will Im* a co­
lorful parade*, entertainment acts 
and water fights. The parade* at 
12:30 p. m. will feature' bands, 
floats, children's specialities, visit­
ing fire-men and Legionnaires, or­
ganizations, groups, ami many oth­
er entrants. Prize's will be awardeel 
to the best floats and children's 
specialities. All businessmen are 
urged to enter floats in the parade 
and it Is expected to have* more of 
them in the line of march than ev­
er before. All those who will enter 
floats are asked to contact Marvin 
Martin or Harry Koch.

First class free* entertainment 
acts have* been engaged for Sun­
day afternoon and evening featur­
ing stars of radio, stage* and tele­
vision. They Include* Jark Rand, 
M. (’. ane! Juggler, who has appear­
ed on the stage* and TV; Variu 
Bros., harmonica artists, who tour­
ed the country for one* year with 
Heirace Heidt's orchestra and also 
performed on TV and radio; Pe yton 
^ Raye, acrobatic dance* act, pup­
pet show and a dog show with 
rommernnian dogs.

There* will Is* water fights at 7 
p. m. between Boltonvllle and Ran- 
dom latke and Barton and Camp- 
hellsj>ort. The winners of the first 
two fights will meet for the cham­
pionship.

The rides for the kiddies, con­
cession. refreshment and amuse­
ment stands will be* In continuous 
operation Saturday night and all 
day Sunday. The Kewaskum pic­
nic's famous bratwurst and ham­
burgers. the best anywhere around, 
will again be served.

A variety of fun. games, rides 
and • ntertainmenf has been arron- 
i*< el sei make- it a must to nM- nd tbe 
Fin-men-Ix-gion picnic this week 

e nd. Have fun and yum yum In 
Kewaskum.

-----ks——-—

Our Police Chief Says

Additional parking space has 
been provided at the- village park 
nt the south end of the nark on 
River Vl»-w drive. It Is convenient­
ly located right next to the park. 
The former largo hollow there has 
been filleel in a,n»l made into a fine 
parking lot. Persona attending the 
picnic thia week end are invited to 
take advantage of the additional 
parking facilities.

Beatrix Larson, former kinder­
garten teacher In the Kewaskum 
public schools, recently returned 
from a two week cruise aboard the 
S. S. North American. She left Mil­
waukee on Sunday evening. May 31, 
and returned home again on Sun­
day, June It. Places of Interest that 
she visited Were Muskegon, Mack­
inac Island, Sarnia, Detroit, Nia­
gara Falls, Montreal, Toronto, Og­
densburg. Buffalo and Erle.

The ship entered the Welland Ca­
nal at Port Colburn. Due to heavy 
freight traffic it took over 30 hours 
tn go through the canal on the way 
but coming back took only 9 hours 
and 10 minutes. It went past tin* 
Thousand Islands and up the St. 
Ixiwrence river ne far ns Ogde ns­
burg. New York. There because of 
difficulty In the locks the passen­
gers h ft the ship and went by 
chartered bus to Eisenhower and 
S’n< |] I/nk nnd on to Montreal.

Miss Hirson reports that there 
was lots of delicious food served, 
dancing and other entertainment as 
w<-ll as beautiful scenery nnd sunny 
weather which made the trip lots 
of fun.

SPORTSMEN TO MEET

The Kittle Moraine Sportsmen's 
association of Kewaskum will 
inert at Heisler’s tavern on Tues­
day, July H, at 8:15 p. m. Lunch 
will te served. Members an- asked 
to attend.

Edith Meyer Bride
Of Lawrence Fuller

Miss Edith \, Meyer, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. George H. Meyer, IL 
-> ( ainpbellsport, became the bride 
of Lawrence Fuller, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Monroe Strade, Campbellsport, 
st a 10 o'clock nuptial service read 
by the Rev. L. J. Garlty in St. 
Matthias church, town of Auburn, 
on Saturday morning. June 27. Del­
phiniums and daisies decorated the 
altar for the ceremony, for which 
music and singing was provided by 
the Sisters of st. Joseph’s ion vent 
Campbellsport.

The bride chose a starchi d nylon 
sheer gown with bouffant skirt and 
pointed basque, with which she 
wore a Spanish lace mantilla. Her 
bouquet was fashioned of daisies, 
orchids and ivy. Mrs. Dale Michels, 
a friend, attended the brid-* ns ma­
tron of honor, while Karen Meyer, 
niece of th<* bride, Mrs. Andrew 
Janous. a friend, und UiVerne Stra­
de, sister of the bridegroom, were 
bridesmaids. All of the attendants 
won* whit,- nylon embroidered 
sheer waltz length dresses with 
pink and blue sashes and large 
straw hats. They carried bouquets 
of pink roses nnd daisies with le­
mon leaves adding a colorful touch.

Raymond Strade was hist man 
for his brother, while Phillip Ketter, 
nephew of the bride, Andrew Jan- 
ous, a friend, an I Ray Serwe, al­
so a friend, served ns gr< omsmen. 
Ushers were John Meyer and James 
Strade.

Dinner was served to 40 guests at 
St. Matthew’s church parlors, 
Campbellsport nnd a reception and 
dance -were held tor 206 guests at 
Forest Lake resort.

Following a wedding trip to Nia­
gara Phils nnd other points of in- 
terest in the East, the newlyweds 
will bo nt homo July 10 tn Camp- 
beHsport. Both sre graduates of 
Campbellsport High school. The 
bride Is employed as n bookkeeper 
nt the L. Rosenhelmer store in Ke­
waskum while Mr. Fuller Is em­
ployed nt the Stelln Che se Co., 
Campbellsport.

------------ka------------

Hospital News

Earl "Pat" Dreher, Kewaskum, 
submitted to nn operation Monday 
nt St. Joseph’s hospital, West Bend.

Mrs. Elroy Butzke, Kewaskum, 
underwent an operation nt St. Jo- 
seph's hospital Monday.

Stan Poriibcnn. Ix>ng lake, sub­
mitted to an operation at St. Jo­
seph’s hospital M< nday.

Mrs. Veronica Raubunas, Forest 
Hike resort, is a patient at St. 
Joseph's hospital.

————k#----------—
CYO PICNIC RESCHEDULED

The Holy Trinity parish CYO 
picnic, postponed recently Because 
of rain , has been scheduled for 
Wednesday, July 15

Tonight’s Bonus 

$190.00
SEE AD ON LAST PAGE



Pure 2 KEWASKUM STATESMAN FRIDAY, JULY 10, 1959

25 Years Ago
The Kewaskum Statesman 

July 6, 1984
The Rev. Aloysius Fellenz, one of 

Holy Trinity parish’s own sons, ce­
lebrated his first solemn high mass 
at the church. Fr. Fellenz was el­
evated to the priesthood by the 
Most Rev. Archbishop Samuel A. 
Stritch, D. D. at St. John's Cathed­
ral, Milwaukee, Saturday. Fr. Fel­
lenz is a son of John Fellenz and I 
was born at Kewaskum Oct. 6. 
1906.

Edwin Morgenroth of Kewaskum, 
member of Phi Delta Kappa honor­
ary educational society, is among 
30 members of University of South- 
ern California scholastic honorary 
societies honored at a special an­
nual scholarship day program held 
on the U.S.C. campus.

Three men were arrested and one 
of the largest alcohol distilleries ev­
er uncovered in Fond du Lac 
county was seized when 7 federal 
agents invaded an abandoned farm । 
3 miles north of Dundee. The dis­
trict in which the still was seized 
was one of the "wettest” in eastern 
Wisconsin during prohibition days. 
Stills were found In the vicinity of 
Dundee frequently and on one oc­
casion alleged distillers engaged a 
federal agent in a gun battle. I Jine 
Maloney, veteran of more than a' 
score of raidp In the county, led the 
raiders. The barn is located just off 
Hwy. 67 at the north end of L«ng 
lake. The feds found 78,000 gallons 
of mash in 10 vats of 7.SOO gallons 
capacity each and 7,000 gallons of 
alcohol.

Fred Weddlg left for Milwaukee 
where he will be employed In the 
Lulck milk plant.

The S. N. Casper family moved 
from the Wm. Backus residence on 
West Water st. to their tavern on 
Main st.

Mrs. Addle Van Blnrcom left for 
the Pacific coast going by way of ■

the Canadian Rockies and return­
ing through Salt Lake City. She 
will make a stay in Chehalis, Wash, 
where her 3 sisters reside, one of 
whom she has not seen since the 
Centennial In St. Louis in 1908, an­
other for 23 years and the other 
here 6 years ago. She was accom­
panied as far as Seattle by Anna 
McLaughlin of West Bend.

July 3. 1909
Burglars were around the pigeon 

house of Ben Mertes last week and 
unless the guilty parties settle, pro­
secution will follow.

Charles Weddlg. the mason, com­
menced building the foundation for 
A. A. Persehbacher's new ware­
house at the rear of his black­

smith ehop.
The Swiss Military Band and 

Gruelli Glee club of Milwaukee 
have full sheet posters out for an 
excursion which they will run to 
the North Side park.

Considerable excitement prevailed 
when a team of horses belonging to 
Louis Backhaus of the town of Ke­
waskum went through Main st. at 
breakneck speed, having gotten a- 

Iway from Backhaus' son about 2 
I miles east of the village.

John and Andrew Pick Jr. of 
West Bend sold a 5-passenger Ca­
dillac auto to Adolph Rosenheimer.

------------ks------------
Even the most powerful vacuum 

cleaner motor won't pull in lint and 
dirt If the bag is too full.

SLOW DOWN, JOE!
You've forgotten your Travelers Checks. Re­

member, you can cash them just like a green­

back and if lost or stolen you'll get a prompt 

refund. The cost is low, only $1.00 per $100.

Sixty Wisconsin lakes, mostly injtheoe fish will grow rapidly because 

southern Wisconsin, had severe: of the lack of

winterkills of fish this past winter 
because of a lack of oxygen due to 
the heavy ice and snow cover. In 
many cares the winterkill is simply 
a thinning operation, giving re­
maining fish more food and space 
to grow faster. I^kes with severe ।

competition.
—ku ——

Addition of vitamin C to the ra­
tion of a laying hen may cut down 
the number of thin-shelled eggs in 
summer.

Wnere were you over the week
winterkills will l e restocked and sud? That’s news. Call 28

“The Most Trusted Name in Diamonds”

Roundy’s Better Foods

Red Bell Market

You Get Free Gifts With
Vacuum Packed, Drip or Reg.
ROUNDY COFFEE lb.

Coupons in Every Pound

Bank of Kewaskum
Kewaskum/ Wisconsin

Member Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

Twin Pack Roundy 
POTATO CHIPS

BURGESS! 
Portable 

Radio 
BATTERIES

COMPLETE 
FOR ALL

STOCK 
SETS

Burckhardt Electric

Farmers
Don’t Give Your 

Dead or Disabled
Cows or Horses Away

WE PAY
Straub’s Mink

Ranch
R. 1, CAMPBELLSPORT 
PHONE LENNOX 3-3841

GROCERY SPECIALS
6 OZ. TIN

IGA Frozen Lemonade 6 for 59c
2 LB. LOAF

Silver Buckle Process Cheese Spread 59c
32 OZ. GLASS

IGA Fancy Tomato Juice

Kool Aid 10 for 39c
GIANT SIZE

IGA Powdered Detergent
16 OZ. TIN

Royalty Crushed or Sliced Pineapple 19c

Marx l.G.A. Store
Kewaskum, Wis.

Roundy *7 q
POTATO SALAD 52oz.can > VC

Roundy Frozen 
MEAT PIES 5for $1.00

TURKEY — CHICKEN — BEEF

Roundy 0 3^
SALTED CRACKERS 1 lb. pkg. ^ D C

Old Time 1Q
FACIAL TISSUE 2 box, 400 count •> V C

FRESH FRUIT and VEGETABLES

ICE - CHARCOAL - PICNIC SUPPLIES

Roundy 
BARBECUE SAUCE 16 oz. bottles 29c

BONUS NITE EVERY FRIDAY NITE

Large I1 2 Pound 
WHITE BREAD

Rosenheimer’s
For Quality and Service Since 1874 ’?!
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YELLOW BUTTER CAKE

As delicate as the first daffo­
dils of the season, is this gold­
en Yellow Butter Cake with its 
Creamy Butter Frosting.

Yellow Butter Cake is simple 
to make too. As simple as the 
conventional method of mixing 
a cake. First cream the butter
and sugar thoroughly, then add 
the eggs. Finally, alternately, 
add the sifted dry ingredients 
and liquid. Pour the batter into 
two buttered and floured pans 
and bake. As easy as that and 
just delicious to eat.

Plain Butter Frosting is won­
derful with this cake, but if 
you're of an adventurous spirit, 
you might like to vary it. Lem­
on Butter Frosting is simply de­
licious with Yellow Butter Cake 
and Orange Butter Frosting is 
equally good. You might even 
accentuate it more with grated 
lemon or orange peeling around 
the edges of the cake.

Yellow Butter Cake 
H cup butter 
1% cups sugar 
3 eggs
2 cups sifted cake flour
2 teaspoons baking powder 
% cup milk 
% teaspoon salt
1 teaspoon vanilla

Cream butter. Add sugar and 
mix well. Add eggs one at a

NOTICE OF MEETING OF 
BOARD OF REVIEW

STATE OF WISCONSIN )
WASHINGTON COUNTY ) ss.
TOWN OF KEWASKUM )

PUBLIC NOTICE IS HEREBY
That the Boatd ot Review for the
said Town ot Kewaskum will meet 
at the Town Clerk s office on the 
13th day of July, 1959, at 10:00 j 
o'clock In the forenoon, for the pur­
pose of reviewing and examining 
the assessment roll of real end per­
sonal property in said Town, and 
all sworn statements and valua­
tions of real and personal property

Barton Dairy
Ted J. Schoofs, Prop.

KEWASKUM PHONE 1«1-R

time, beating well after each ad­
dition. Sift flour with salt and
baking powder and add alter­
nately with the milk. Add vanil­
la. Pour into two buttered and 
floured 8-inch round cake pans 
and bake in a preheated 375* 
oven for 25 minutes.

Butter Frosting 
H cup butter
1 1-lb. package confectioners' 

sugar, sifted
1 egg
1 teaspoon vanilla 
% teaspoon salt
1 tablespoon milk or cream

Cream the butter. Add % of 
the sifted confectioners’ sugar. 
Cream thoroughly. Add salt, 
milk or cream, and vanilla and 
blend. Add egg and beat until 
smooth. Add rest of confection­
ers’ sugar and beat until smooth 
and fluffy. If frosting is desired 
a little thinner, more milk or 
cream may be added.

Lemon Butter Frosting
Omit vanilla. Blend in 2 table­

spoons lemon juice in place of 
milk or cream. Add grated rind 
of 1 lemon.

Orange Butter Frosting
Omit vanilla. Add 1 table­

spoon orange juice in place of 
milk or cream. Blend in grated 
rind of orange.

therein, and of correcting all er­
rors in said roll, whether in des­
cription of property or otherwise, 
and to perforin such other duties 
imposed by law.

A. H. Seefeldt, Town Clerk

Iqueen QUALITY

Salad Dressing qt.49c
queen quality

Potato Chips 
full lb. 49c

GIANT size

Liquid Joy 57c
FROZEN SLICED

Strawberries
10 oz. 6 for $1.00

TRU VALU

Vegetable Oil qt. 49c
MILLER’S HOME STYLE

Kosher Dill Gherkins
Vi gal. 59c

KOCH’S
Phone 14

IN THE SERVICE
DREHERS LEAVE

AJ/C and Mrs. Charles Dreher 
left last week for Roswell, N. Ml, 

• where he Is stationed. Following 
their wedding June 20 and honey­
moon, the Drehers spent several 
days with their folks in Kewas­
kum ami Beechwood, Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Dreher and Mr. and Mrs. Reu- 
ben Vetter until the expiration of1 
hls leave.

RETURNS TO CAMP
Pfc. Calvin Cudnohoske, son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Edward Cudnohoske. 
iR. 1, Kewaskum (Beechwood), left 
by plane last week from Mitchell 
Field in Milwaukee for Georgia. 
1’fc. Cudnohoske returned to Fort 
Benning after spending a two week 
leave at home.

Jhe new Kiwanis International Building 101 East Erie Street 
in Chicago. The general office staff of Kiwanis International and 
its youth organizations moved into this modern glass, marble and 
structural metal building on Friday, March 20, 1959. From here, 
the servicing of all 4600 U.S., Canadian and Hawaiian clubs is 
now handled.

ADDRESS GIVEN
Following is the address of Ron 

Packhaus. son of Mr. and Mrs. Her­
bert Baekhaus, Kewaskum, who Is 
in training with the U. S. Navy at 
Great Lakes, Ill,; Ron Baekhaus. 
S.R., 5 3 3-60-97, Co. 205, Great 
Lakes Training Center, Great Likes 
111.

Electric

OLLIE’S
TEXACO SERVICE

Washing 
Polishing
Greasing

PHONE 33-R 
KEWASKUM, WIS.

GeneralElectric Appliances-Radio-Television 
ZENITH Radio and Television 

Monarch Ranies-Constellation Freezers
Appliance Repairs - Refrigeration Service 

Electrical Service 

"Kewaskum’s Appliance Center”
PHONE 114

SLEEP 
AWAY 

TENSION

ON THE 
ENGLANDER 

TENSION • EASE"

MATTRESS $79/S

NOTICE OF BUDGET HEARINgI
School District Jt. 2 

Kewaskum, Wisconsin
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that ft public hearing on the bud­

get for the school year 1959-60 of Kewaskum Community Union 
High School District Joint No. 2 of the Village of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Kewaskum, Barton, Farmington and Wayne 
Townships, Washington County, Wisconsin, Ashford, Auburn 
Townships, Fond du Lie County, Wisconsin, beginning July 1, 1959 
and ending June 30, 1960, will be held at the time and place of the 
annual meeting of .said District, to-wlt: Monday. July 20. 1959 at 
7:00 I'. M. at the Kewaskum Community High School, Kewaskum. 
Wisconsin.

MATCHING TENSION EASE 
FOUNDATION $79.75

Also available in innerspring

Let Us Help 
You 

With Your 
Sleeping 

and 
Home Furnishing 

Problems

and Wayne Townships, Washington County, Ashford

NOTICE IS FURTHER GIVEN that such budget In detail Is
available for public Inspection at the office of the Su •■ t mt- ibh nt
of Schools, Kewaskum, Wisconsin.

The following Is a summary of said budget: subject to final audit:

Budget Actual Budget
Item of Expense 1958-59 Expenditure * Proposal

General Control ............................... I 5.780.00 $ 5,867.68 $ 6.180.00
Instruction ......................................... 91,225.00 90,780.8>| 102,700.00
Auxiliary Agencies ......................... 100.00 92.Oo 100.00
Transportation ................................... 19.9OO.OO 16.312,50 19.800.00
Operation ........................................... 17,410.00 17,621.56 18.710.00
Maintenance ....................................... 3,100,00 8,810.15 1,625.00
Capital Outlay ................................... 10,900,00 4,737.1 1 18,500.00
Debt Service .......................................
Other ................................................... 13,800.00 1 3,250.23

10,183.00
13.750 00

TOTAL ....................................... 1102,515 00 1157,472.10 $194,817.00

Anticipated revenues.-

County, State, & Federal Aids ,. $ 21,045.00 1 23,5*45.58 $ 23,940.00
Tuition A Rental ..................... 14,000.00 15,860.78 14,823 00
Other ............................................... 1.50 0.00 3.437.91 41,909 10

Proposed Tax Ix-vy 
for Operating Purposes ................ 125,970.00 135,970.00
Tax Ix-vy for Debt Service .......... 50,8 2 9 50 19,859.24
Total Tax I^evy ................................. 176,799.50 185,829.24
Indebtedness Bonds Payable .... 1571.358.00

('Ll FFORD C. ST A I T
Clerk of Kewaskum Community Union I Ugh School
District Joint N< . 2 of the Village of Kewaskum,
Washington County Kewaskum , Barton, Farmington

OPEN MONDAY AND 
FRIDAY TO 9 P. M.

Auburn Townships, Fond du law County. Wisconsin 

7-10-2
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Local News Items
—Mr. and Mrs. Helmuth Kohl 

and dpughv rs . turned homo Tues­
day from a 11-day vacation trip on 
which the$ •.•sited the following 
Macts of Interest: Sault Ste. Ma­
rie. Straits of Mackinac, Niagara 
f all* Ottawa. Canada. St. hiw- 
cnee Seaway an 1 the New Eng­

land states. Whll • In Ottawa they 
had on opportunity to see Queen 
Elizabeth and Prince Philip of Eng­
land. who were there to participate 
in the Dominican Day festivities 
July 1. The queen and prince 
passed through only several rods a- 
way from the Kohls.

—Banns of marriage were an­
nounced in the Holy Trinity church 
I ulletin Sunday for I zander Herri-

(blinding a week's vacation at rong 
l ike and visiting local relatives.

—Mr. and Mrs. Norman Hoegel 
and daughter of Chicago spent the 
week end with their respective par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Oscar Hoegel 
and Mr. and Mrs. A. M. Staehler.

—Mr. and Mrs. Walter Schneider 
and (laughters of Milwaukee spent 
the holiday week end with Mrs. 
Tillie Zeimet and sons.

--Mr. and Mrs. Norbert Hecker of 
Milwaukee spent the week end in 
the village.

— Mike Rafenstein of Milwaukee 
vlflted Sunday at the Jxmls Heisler 
I ome.

—Mr. and Mrs. Don McLeon and 
son Terry of Minneapolis, Minn, 
spent the week end with Mrs. Mc­
Lean's mother, Mrs. Julius Dreher.

—Mr. and Mrs. Edward Weddlg, 
daughter Mary and son Edward vi- 
•died over the Fourth with their 
son fx»on and wife and son Andy

WAY OUT ...
. . . THAT'S JUST WHERE WE’VE GONE TO GIVE YOU THE 
BEST 15 CU. FT. FREEZER DEAL IN TOWN. IT’S AN ALL­
FEATURE CORONADO ROYAL DELUXE FOR ONLY $199.95. 
EASY TERMS TO SUIT YOUR BUDGET. GAMBLES ORDERED 
35 TRAINLOADS OF THESE FINE FREEZERS—NOT STRIPP­
ED DOWN OR DISCONTINUED MODELS — BUT ALL NEW 
FOR YOU! COME IN — SEE THIS AMAZING FREEZER NOW!

Gambles Dealer-Kewaskum

at ^.ukie, Ill.
—'Mias Janet Dreher, daughter of 

tnc Ed. Drehers is spending the 
week with Mr. and Mrs. Edward 
Dreher Jr. and son at Madison.

—Dr. and Mrs. Charles Ogi and 
family returned home after spend­
ing a vacation with relatives in 
Ohio. They were accompanied home 
ly Jimmy Ogi, who will spend the 
summer vacation here.

— Mr. and Mrs. Arvin Mei win and 
family are spending the week at 
kbt otsford

—/ number of local persons at- 
ienH"H church services a.' Peace 
..uth in church at Wautoma Sun- 
<biy. here the Rev. Gerhaid Kan- 
iess, formerly of Kewaskum is the 
new uastor.

— Mrs. Den Gregorius and daugh­
ter Ruth Mary of Los Angeles, 
i ullf. are spending a month’s vaca- 
tlon with Mrs. Gregorius’ sister, 
Miss Louise Martin, and Mrs. Mary

Schultz and other relatives. At 
preseat they are also visiting rela- 
i:\es in the northern part of the 
state. Mrs. Gregorius and daughter 
arrived by auto to surprise their 
re ativi s.

—Yes It’s Miller’s at Kewaskum 
for quality home furnishings at 
most reasonable prices. Open daily 
unjtll 6, Fridays until 9 p. m. Free 
deliveries. tf

—-------ks----- ——
At least 35 species or subspecies 

of poisonous snakes are known in 
the United States. Bites are esti­
mated at 3.0(H) a year, but the death 
rate is low—10 to 20 a yea:. It is 
pointed out, however, that the haz­
ards may increase as camping and 
other outdoor activities become ’

General Machine Welding 
and Repair Work

Rotary Power Lawn Mowers and All Other 
Types of Power and Hand Lawn Mowers 

Sharpened and Reconditioned

Remmel Mfg. Co.
Louis L. Bath Kewaskum

more popular.
------------ ks------------

When you water the lawn, soak It 
thoroughly. Frequent light sprink­
lings do more harm than good. The 
grass needs to send roots deep into 
the soil.

------------ks-------- —
To kill wasps around the home 

use a chlordane spray on their 
nest.

Math. Schlaefer 

Optometrist
EYES TESTED GLASSES FITTED

CAMPBELLSPORT, WIS.

ges j id Mary Marx.
- Misses Mary Ann Kaualauskas

of Kenosha and Barbara Rasmus­
sen of South Bond. Ind. spent the 
week end with the Henry Rosen- 
telmer family. Miss Thelma Ro- 
fonhelmer returned to South Bend 
with Miss Rasmussen to spend 
this week.

— Mr. and Mrs. John Gorin and 
grandson of Bark Ridge, 111. are

SCHILL ELECTRIC 
SPORT SHOP

BUY AN EXTRA KEY

Schill Electric & 
Sport Shop 

CAMPBELLSPORT. WIS

GE — MOTOROLA 
Radio A Television 

>A
HOTPOINT 

Household Appliance# 
MEYER'S WATER SYSTEMS 

SPORTING GOODS 

SCHWINN BIKES 

evinrude 
OUTBOARD MOTORS

Take a tip from the experts ... in 
their own words . . . and from on- 
the-record facts and figures: More 
than ever, Chevrolet gives you more 
than any other of the leading low- 
priced three! More room to relax in, 
for instance. A sampling of official 
dimensions reported to A.M-A.* 
makes this clear. Chevy front seat 
hip room, for one thing, is up to 
5.9 inches wider than comparable 
cars. And Chevy even offers more 
front seat head room than all but 
one of the AigA-priced cars!

Best Brakes Not only bigger, 
but built with bonded linings for up 
to 66% longer life. Jus* ‘ nrove 
what's what, Chevy v ped 
both of the “other . .n a

NASCARt-conducted test of re­
peated stops from highway speeds. 

Best Style It’s the only car of 
the leading low-priced 3 that’s un­
mistakably modern in every line. 
“In its price class,” says POPULAR 
SCIENCE magazine, “a new high 
in daring styling.”

Best Engine Every motor mag­
azine has given Chevrolet’s stand­
ard and Corvette V8’s unstinted 
praise. As SPORTS CARS ILLUS­
TRATED puts it: ". . . surely the 
most wonderfully responsive engine 
available today at any price.”

Best Ride motor trend 
magazine calls Chevy “. . . the 
smoothest, most quiet, softest rid­
ing car in its price class.” You’ll be

able to tell this yourself instantly, 
once you take the wheel.

Best Economy No doubt about 
this: two Chevrolet 6’s won their 
class in the famous Mobilgas Econ­
omy Run, got the best mileage of 
any full-size car, 22.38 miles per 
gallon—with Powerglide.

Best Trade-In Check in any 
N A D A t Guide Book. Chevy used 
car prices last year averaged up to 
$128 higher than comparable mod­
els of the “other two.”
•Automobile Sfanufarturert Association 
fNational Association for Stock Car Advance­
ment and Research 

t National 
Antomobila 
Dealert 
Association

STAR CRAFT 
ALUMINUM BOATS

• al>o »
f BOAT TRAILERS

DON SKLENER, MGR.

ALOIS BERG, SERVICEMAN 
cam pbei .import TEL <111

Vis!! your loca’ .. red Chevrolet dealer and see how much more Chevy has to offer!

HONECK CHEVROLET
Kewaskum Phone 111
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WILL ENTERTAIN AT PICNIC HERE SUNDAY

Jack Rand, star of stage and tel­
evision. will act as master of cere­
monies and do juggling acts at

The Varju Bros., (above) harmo­
nica artists, who toured the country 
for one year with Horace Heidt's 
famous band, and also performed 
on TV and radio, will also entertain 
at the picnic. Other performers in- I

New Prospect
Mrs. Ethel Statner of Milwaukee 

and Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Hilgen of 
of Bock Lake were weekend visit­
ors of Mr. and Mrs. Frank Kloster- 
mann.

Mrs.. Amanda Schultz of Mil­
waukee, Mr. and Mrs. Walter Bau­
man of New Fane and Mrs. Leo’ 
Uelmen of Campbellsport called on 
Mr. and Mrs. Jos. P. Uelmen Fri­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Leo Bowen and 
Mrs. Alex Ulrich of Plymouth vi­
sited Mr. and Mrs. Frank Bowen 
Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Geo. H. Meyer had 
as their guests Sunday P. M. Mr. 
and Mrs. John Moyer and family
Mr and Mrs. Leo J. Ketter and fa­

the Kewaskum Firemen-1 xgion 
picnic Sunday afternoon and even­
ing.

elude Peyton & Raye, with an ac­
robatic dance act, puppet show and 
dog show with Pommeranian dogs. 
All of the entertainment acts are 
FREE, as are the admission and 
parking.

mily, Mr. and Mrs. lAwrence Fuller 
of Campbellsport.

Jean and George Tennessen of 
Milwaukee and Joanne Ketter of 
Campbellsport visited their grand­
parents. Mr. and Mrs. Geo. H. Mey­
er the past week.

Miss Virginia Trapp Is attending 
summer school at Madisorr.

This Is not the record walleye but 
it is probably the best to date, this 
year. Daniel Faber, Green Lake, 
caught the fish In the Princeton ar­
ea of the Fox River. It weighed 
13*1* pounds and was 13 to 14 years 
old. Fisheries Manager Richard 
Harris says the walleye's record Is 
authentic as it was thoroughly 
checked.

----------- k»———
Wear something white at night, 

to help drivers * e you.

' 4-H Club NewsI

AUBURN 4-H CLUB

The Auburn 4-H club held its 
monthly meeting at the home of Di­
ane Schaefer on July 2 with 10 
members present. It was called to 
order by President Barbara Nigh. 
After the pledge to our flag, roll 
call was taken by Secretary Carole 
Ann Erdmann and approved as 

{read. Our treasurer, Margie Kirsch, 
] being absent, we had no report. 

| We have a float planned for en- 
(try in the parade this Sunday, Ju­
ly 12, at Kewaskum.

A food and nutrition meeting was 
held at the home of leader Mrs. 
Willard Gruhle on July 2. The 
project girls had to make the din­
ner and set the table correctly and 
invited the mother and leaders to 
the 12 o'clock dinner and served 
them under the guidance of their 
leader.

MADE
HEYS

^^xr^ #£?
Honeck Chevrolet

KEWASKUM

for COMPLETE • <=<»•»«•■'•"’ 
HOME FOOD STORAGE i

You’ll enjoy the convenience of complete 
food storage — everything at your finger­
tips — when you have a Home Freezer and 
a Combination Refrigerator-Freezer.

You eat better for less, too — pack your 
freezer with plenty of meats, fruits and 
vegetables when prices are lowest — for 
later use when you conveniently transfer

them to the Refrigerator-Freezer. A Re- 
frigerator-Freezer holds an ample supply 
of fresh and frozen foods for day-to-day 
use . .. saves shopping time ... saves trips.

Enjoy complete . . . convenient home 
food storage. Invest in a Horne Freezer 
or a Combination Refrigerator Freezer. 
See your dealer or us.

WISCONSIN ELECTRIC POWER COMPANY
THE MODERN HOME IS ALL-ELECTRIC 

FOR CONVINIINCI • CL«ANLIN«»» • C OM F QR T . ^r <*ONp j^Y ^ B A F B T V

There was a demonstration by 
Hilly Gruhle on 'Introducing 
Guests'' and aksT one by Diane 
Schaefer on “Entertaining and Be­
ing a Guest.”

We are planning a booth for the 
Fond du laic county fair Aug. 12-

iUSEO [HRS
CHEVROLETS

'58 CHEV. STA. WGN. 2 DR.
'57 CHEV. 2-DR.
'56 CHEV. 2-DR.
’56 CHEV. 4-DR.
1—’54 CHEV. DDR.
'52 CHEV. DDR.
’51 CHEV. 2-DR.
'50 CHEV. 2-DR.

USED TRUCKS
’55 CHEV. 2-TON
’53 CHEV. 2-TON 2-SPEED
’49 STUDE 34 TON PICKUP
1949 FORD 2-TON
•48 CHEV. PANEL TRUCK

Honeck Chevrolet
OPEN 7 A. M. TO 9 P. M. DAILY 

KEWASKUM PHONE 111

16.
Recreation was followed by the 

l-H pledge. A delicious lunch was 
prepared by Mrs. Reuben Schaef- 
er. assisted by Donna and Diane 
Schaefer.

Reporter, Sharon Wesenberg

OTHERS
'57 MERCURY SPT. CPE 
'56 FORD 2-DR.
'54 FORD 2-DR.
'54 PONTIAC 4-DR.
'53 DODGE 2-DR.
’52 FORD 2-DR.
'52 WILLY STA. WGN.
1952 DODGE 2 DOOR 
'51 FORD 4-DR.
'50 BUICK 4-DR 
'48 OLDS CONVERT.

'54 CHEV. 2-TON 2-SPEED
’53 FORD SEDAN DELIVERY
•53 FORD 34 TON PICKUP
1953 CHEV. i/2 T UTILITY BODY 
'50 FORD PANEL TRUCK 
46 CHEV 2-TON
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Want Ads
HELP WANTED—Reliable -woman 

capable of handling small child­
ren needed for occasional evening 
and week end ’iaby sitting. Write
Box i<>6. Kewaskum. 7-10-1

FOR RENT — Boltonville Welding 
and Repair Shop. Vacant Aug. 15. 
Lawrence Staebler, R. I, Kewas­
kum. Telephone Waubeka MYrtle 
2-3740. 7-10-tf

MINNOWS AND WORMS — Rea­
sonable. Riverview service in 
New Fane (formerly New Fane 
cheese factory). Open 7:So a. m. 
to 9 p. rn. seven days a week. 
Max Lund. R. 1, Kewask im. Ph. 
nns. 7-10-1

Be sportsmanlike every time you i 
drive.

NEW WAY TO PREPARE 
KID’S SUMMER LUNCH

The kiddies will be thrilled with this attractive summertime 
teach served on the back porch. Sharp Cheddar cheese combined 
with hot dogs are the basis for the tasty sandwich spread.

When the kiddies arc busy | 4 cup granulated sugar 
Mi cup brown sugar 
2 tablespoons orange juice 
1 tablespoon grated orange rind

playing outdoors in the summer­
time. a nutritious easy lunch 
served on the back porch is most 
appropriate With an attractive 
lunch built around hot dogs and 
cheese toasties, orange chip 
cookies, and plenty of frothy, 
cold milk, they'll eagerly scam­
per in from play.

Since cheese is a universal 
favorite and hot dogs are a 
child's delight, the combination 
of the two in a sandwich spread 
is bound to draw enthusiastic 
squeals

, Besides being good in nil kinds 
of sandwiches, cheese shows its 
versatility as an appetite teaser, 
a nourishing main dish, a dinner 
finale, and a between - meal 
snack And it's so convenient to 
krep plenty of cheese on hand 
for use from morning to mid- 
inight
J Cold milk is the logical bever­
age choice for the children's 
lunch. At least four glasses of 
milk a day are recommended 
for a child to build and maintain 
Ikis body in a healthy condition 
(The calcium contained in milk 
til especially needed for little 
‘tots' bones and teeth.

The adequate amount of butter 
used in the orange chip cookies 
of the lunch shown here is the 
'Ingredient that especially cn 
irichea them and gives a pleasing 
flavor Because of its natural 
(flavor and natural vitamins, but 
(ter is unmatched for cooking and 
lor use as a table spread.

ORANGE CHIP COOKIES 
8 do*. cookies

375* 19-12 minatc*
,1 ««» bolter

FOR SALE—20 feet of corn silage.
Kenneth Kaschner, R. 2, Camp­
bellsport. Phone Kewaskum 73F4.

7-10-2p

FOR SALE 
IN KEWASKUM

Save $1,500. Very sharp two- 
bedroom ranch home with full base­
ment, tile bath, automatic oil heat,
outdoor fireplace and one-car gar-
age. Price was $11,500 reduced to 
$10,000 for quick sale.

Luxurious 3-bedroom all brick 
colonial home with attached garage 
on Western ave. Home is almost 
new and very exceptional inside 
and out. Many extras such as nat­
ural fireplace, built-in oven and 
range, carpeting, 1^ bath and ma­
ny others. Priced at only $28,800.

BOWE & WENINGER 
Allenton, Wis.

Ph. MArket 9-3155 or 9-2328
7-10-tf

1 egg
2% cups sifted Hour
H teaspoon salt 
1» teaspoon soda 
2 ounces semi-swert chocolate, 

grated
Cream butter, granulated sug­

ar. and brown sugar Add orange 
juice, orange rind, and egg and 
mix well. Sift the Hour, soda, and 
salt together Add to the orange 
mixture. Then blend in the 
grated chocolate. Shape into 
three rolls about 1 Vs inches in 
diameter. Wrap in waxed paper, 
and store tn the refrigerator 
overnight or until thoroughly 
chilled. When ready to bake, 
slice thinly and place on an un- 
greased cookie sheet Bake at 
375 for 10-12 minutes or until 
browned

HOT DOG AND CHEESE 
TOASTIES

2 cup* spread
% pound sharp Cheddar checs* 
H pound hot dogs, cooked 
4 cup catsup

i 1 egg
1 tablespoon pickle rehab
2 teaspoon* prepared mustard

Put cheese and hot dogs 
through a food grinder, using a 
medium coarse blade Mix with 
catsup and cook over very low 
heat until the cheese melts Add 
the beaten egg and cook 2 min­
utes more. Remove from heat, 
add relish and mustard. Spread 
on buttered toasted buns and 
serve at once or spread on buns 
and broil for 2 3 minutes Top 
with a little more grated cheese.

FOR SALE 

Two-story 8-room house, 443 First 
st., Hartford, Wis.

Sealed bids will be received at 
I Public Welfare D-pt., Court House, 
| West Bend until 10:00 a. rn. Wed- 
inesday, July 29, 1959.

Official hid forms and full informa­
tion available at Welfare Dept.

Open for inspection 3-5 p m. and 
6-8 p. rn., Wednesday, July 15, 
1959.

7-10-3t

FOR RENT—Three-room upper a- 
partnient, with bath. Mr*. Anna 
Martin, Kewaskum. 6-12-tf

TRAVEL 
Accident Insurance

ONE DAY UP TO ISO DAYS 
EXTRA PROTECTION WHEN

FACING THOSE EXTRA 
HAZARDS 

COVERS WORLD-WIDE 
24 HOURS A DAY 

ALL ACTIVITY 
Except: Suicide, War, Professional 
Sports & Private Plane Travel 

Ask About Low-Cost, All Risk, I 
Travel Baggage Coverage 

See Me Now—No Obligation.

Marvin A. Martin
KEWASKUM, WIS.

Is this the 
financial “mess” the 

Democrat Party 
inherited ?

Republicans Leave 16 Million Dollars 
Surplus to Democrats

During the recent campaign and ever since, 
the Democrats have repeatedly stated that 
the Republican Party has left the State 
of Wisconsin in a “mess” financially.

Well, now the truth is known.

Last week, it was revealed that as of June 
30, 1969, responsible Republican govern - 
ment has left Wisconsin a surplus of 16

million dollars — with all bills paid and 
without increased income taxes.
Now that the Republican Party is turning 
over this surplus to the Democrat Party 
— we have one question to ask:
Will the Democrat Party be able to 
report the same — a 16 million dollar 
surplus — come the end of its term in 
office withouHnci^^

AirTHOROBD AHO P*m FOR H ***»««• Laa^tefew Cm«m«b CaMMMltM. M**l S Tw<w CWhwm naMmfe Wlnaata

PAINTING A DECORATING

Residential or commercial. 
Interior or exterior.
Experts at new or old work. 
Decorating help given freely.
All the latest wallpaper sample 
books on request in your home 
or business.
Free estimates.
JACK W. MOTT & CO., INC.

Painting Contractors
Call Campbellsport 

LEnnox 3-3296

FOR SALE—New and used bikes. 
Bikes repaired and painted. Also 
carry a good line of parts and 
accessories. Kewaskum’s bike 
headquarters, Wally's Bike Shop,

Insured Household Auction
Saturday, July 11 -- 2:00 p. m.

OWNER—NELSON SCHULTZ, 684 FAIR ST., WEST BEND. WIS.

Frigidaire refrigerator, kitchen table, 4 chairs; bed with spring and 
mattress, dressers, chest, chair, cabinet, 2 rugs, 9x12; pillows, straw 
rugs, 2 card tables, cedar chest, rocker, antique tied, trunk, table, 
meat saw, electric fan, lawn bench, lawn sprinkler, metal folding 
chair, sprinkling can, sprayer, sausage grinder, grindstone, 2 lawn 
mowers, spinning wheel, 50-ft. garden hose, extension cord, 3 rolls 
insulation, step ladder, small wagon, kitchen clock, pictures, lamps, 
end tattles, dishes, and many more small articles too numerous to 
mention.

NELSON SCHULTZ, OWNER
COL LESTER DREHER, Auctioneer

Kewaskum, Wis. Telephone 237-W.

North ave. Ph. Kewaskum 374. 4,3

FOR SALE—Two car garage. Call 
237W. Lester Dreher, Kewaskum.

CESSPOOL PUMPING—Cleaning,
odorless. treasonably priced. 
Tom’s Welding Shop, County 
Trunk H, 1|£ miles east of Hwy. 
45. Phone West Bend FE 4-5289

BRIDES-TO-BE — Come in and 
look over our large variety and 
complete selection of fine raised 
lettering, sparkling white. Ivory 
and gold embossed wedding in­
vitations, reception and dinner 
cards, also printed napkins and 
thank you notes at the States- 
mas office.
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Babe Ruth League Team, 
Defeats Lomira, 16-6

DONATIONS FROM BUSINESS 
MEN FOR EQUIPMENT 

BADLY NEEDED

After being rained out in 2 or 3 
games and having another called 
after 5 innings before the contest 
was completed, Kewaskum’s entry 
in the Babe Ruth baseball league 
finally got a game in last Wednes­
day evening when they trimmed Lo­
mira there, 16-6. Roger Yeadeke 
was the hitting star with a grand 
slam home run accounting for 4 
runs. Dave Oppermann and Allen 
Koepke did the pitching for the 
winners with Bob Ewert behind the 
plate.

The Babe Ruth league is com­
posed of boys between the ages of 
13 and 15. The Kewaskum team is 
under the capable management of 
“Fritz” Kral, who reports that he 
has a scrappy team and urges fans 
to take an interest in the ball play­
ers and come out and see them per­
form. Fritz also asks the business­
men to support his team as spon­
sors are wanted for donations for 
badly needed equipment such as

FOREST LAKE RESORT 
Hall Available Free

for
WEDDING DANCES, PARTIES, 
BOWLING BANQUETS AND 

OTHER AFFAIRS

Chicken & Sandwiches 
SERVED DAILY UNTIL 

MIDNIGHT
PHONE LE 3-2634

Kewaskum'1
SPECIAL WEDNESDAY

DATE NIGHT
98c PER COUPLE

DON’T FORGET—Every Friday 
Night is Family Night.—Children 
admitted FREE if with parents

TONIGHT FRIDAY, JULY 10
The Hemingway Hot Kind 

of Adventure!
AUDIE MURPHY 
EDDIE ALBERT 

PATRICIA OWENS

“The Gun Runners”
Plus Two Cartoons

THREE STOOGES Comedy

SAT. A SUN., JULY 11 A 12

NO SHOW
ATTEND THE ANNUAL KE­
WASKUM FIREMEN A LEGION 
PICNIC AT THE KEWASKUM 
PARK!

WED. A FRI., JULY 15 A 17
A Storm Raged Within Them 

ANNA MAGNANI 
ANTHONY FRANCIOSA 

ANTHONY QUINN 
in Hol Wallis’ Production 

“Wild Is the Wind” 
Vista Vision

ADDED—Cartoon

bats, balls, etc.
In one other start Kewaskum 

and Oakfield played but the game 
had to be called after 5 innings be­
cause of In’orference with the soft­
ball games scheduled here that 
night. The local boys were ahead, 
6-3, at the time and this contest 
will be completed at a later date.

On Wednesday night of this 
week Kewaskum was scheduled to 
play at Oakfield. Next Wednesday. 
July 15, at play at Campbellsport at 
6:30 p. m. and on Saturday. July is. 
Eden play here.

-— ks---------- -
RAINBOW TEAM HOSTS 

BEECHWOOD ON SUNDAY

After drawing a bye in the sche­
dule last Sunday, the Kewaskum 
Rainbow league team will return to 
action this Sunday afternoon, July 
12, when they play host to Beech­
wood. Other games are Boltonville 
at Cascade, Newburg at Batavia 
and Barton bye.

--------- --KS———-
Weeds rcb garden crops of light, 

moisture an<l plant food. The best 
way to get rid of them is to pull or 
hoe. «

Hall Available
FREE

For All 
WEDDING DANCES, PARTIES 

AND OTHER FUNCTIONS 
Make Reservations Early 

NONN’S
KETTLE MORAINE RESORT 

(Formerly Round Lake)
R. 3, CAMPBELLSPORT 

PHONE LE 3-3162

We Close at 6:00 
Sunday Evenings

WHILE DAYLIGHT SAVING 
TIME IS IN EFFECT

KEWASKUM 
OPERA HOUSE 

Tavern & Ballroom 
We Cater to Weddings 

HALL FREE
FOR ALL 

WEDDING DANCES

DEI'S 
Delicatessen

BAKED HAM 
POTATO SALAD 

ROLLS 
OPEN EVENINGS 

AND ALL DAY SUNDAY

Complete Line of Groceries 
and Lunch Meats

Kewaskum Opera 
House Building

• LITTLE LEAGUE
No Little League baseball results 

this week. The teams’ reporter, 
Doti Hron, is gone on a three-week 
vacation. Could a substitute report 
the games until Doti returns?

NOTICE OF MEETING OF 
BOARD OF REVIEW

STATE OF WISCONSIN ) 
WASHINGTON COUNTY. ) as. 
VILLAGE OF KEWASKUM )

PUBLIC NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN That the Board of Review 
for the said Village of K< waskum 
will meet in the Council Room of 
the Municipal Building on the 13th 
day of July 1959, at 10:00 o’clock in 
the forenoon, for the purpose of 
reviewing and examining the as- 
sessment roll of real and personal 
1 roperty in said Village, and all 
sworn statements and valuations of

FORESTER'S 
RANCHER BAR

CHAMPION ELECTRIC 
FENCER

OPERATES IN RAIN, BRUSH 
OR WEEDS 

FORESTER’S SALES • SERVICE 
PARMACK FENCERS 

$13.75 AND UP

S. HWY. 45 PHONE
WEST BEND FE 4-9952

ANNUAL

Kewaskum Firemen & Legion

PICNIC VILLAGE PARK

Kewaskum

Saturday Evening |||| V 11 4G 
and Sunday JUL T lr|£

RESCUE 8 DEMONSTRATION by M.M.T.A.
Fire Rescue Service at 7 P. M. Saturday 

Also Music by LES SCHNEIDER'S Orchestra

Parade at 12:30 p. m. Sunday
BANDS - FLOATS - CHILDREN'S SPECIALTIES - PRIZES 

Entertainment Sunday Afternoon & Evening 
JACK RAND, M. C. and Juggler

VARJU BROS., Harmonicas With a Twist 
PEYTON & RAYE, Acrobatics, Dogs, Puppets 

Stars of Radio, Stage and TV

WATER FIGHTS at 7 p. m. Sunday

Rides - Concessions - Refreshments - Bratwurst - Hamburgers

ual and personal property therin, 
and of correcting all errors tn said 
roll, whether in description of prop­
erty or otherwise, and to perform 
such other duties imposed by law.

Dated July 1, 1959.

Driving privileges in Wisconsin 
were revoked or suspended for >,6» 
persons during the first five month* 
of this year, the motor ve/ucle de­
partment reports.

———ks
William S. Martin, Commissioner^ Call 28 with your news.

ANNUAL PICNIC
SPONSORED BY HOLY NAME SOCIETY 

ST. KILIAN
Parish Park

Sunday, July 20
Afternoon and Evening

AMUSEMENTS GAMES

Hamburgers Bratwurst
Refreshments

COME — HAVE A GOOD TIME

Everyone Welcome
AMPuE PARKING SPACE 

ON THE CHURCH GROUNDS

Fresh Cooked Shrimp
For quantity orders phone day tn advance 

W E COOK DAILY

Frank KIRCHER Tavern
BARTON FE <-4141
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Softball
TUESDAY 

PITCH
The first half

NIGHT EASY 
LEAGUE
of the split season

ended with Tuesday night's games 
and wound up in a three-way tie 
for first place between the Bank, 
Regal and YoMen, each with a re­
cord of 4 wins and 1 loss.

These three teams will play off 
next Tuesday night for the first 
half championship and these play­
offs will replace the regular league 
games that evening. In the first 
contest at 7:30 the Bank will face 
the YoMen with Regal drawing a 
bye. Regal will then meet the wln-

Miller’s ...............................
Steve & Mary's ...............
Beechwood .......................
Campbellsport ................. 

------------k,.
STATE OF WISCONSIN 
WASHINGTON COUNTY

IN PROBATE

2
2
6

COURT

ner
tilt

of the first game in the second 
of the night, which will decide

the championship. The second half 
schedule of games will get under 
way on the following Tuesday, ^Ju-

IN THE MATTER OF THE ES­
TATE OF FRANCES ZIMMER­
MAN, also known as FRANCES 
ZIMMERMANN, Deceased.

On the application of the execu­
tor of the estate of Frances Zim­
merman, also known as Frances 
Zimmermann, deceased, late of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Washington 
County, Wisconsin, for the allow­
ance and adjustment of her ac­
count, for the allowance of debts 
or claims paid without filing, for 
the determination of who are the 
heirs of the deceased, for the deter­
mination of the inheritance tax,

ment of Taxation and every in­
terested person whose post office 
address is known or can with rea­
sonable diligence be ascertained, at 
least twenty days before the hear­
ing or proceeding.

Dated June 23rd, 1959.
By the Court, 

Lucille K. Francke 
Register of Probate 

Schloemer, Stoltz & Meniam, 
Attorneys 

Corner of Sixth & Hickory 
West Bend, Wisconsin.

6-26-3

STATE OF WISCONSIN 
WASHINGTON COUNTY COURT

IN PROBATE
IN THE MATTER OF THE ES­

TATE OF CATHERINE CAMP. 
BELL, Deceased.

On the application of the execu­

tor of the estate of Catherine 
Campbell, deceased, late of the town 
of Wayne, Washington County, I 
Wisconsin, for the allowance and 
adjustment of her account, for the 
allowance of debts or claims paid 
without filing, for the determina­
tion of who are the heirs of the de­
ceased, for the determination of the 
Inheritance tax, for the assign­
ment of the residue of the estate, 
and the adjudication of the ter­
mination of joint tenancy or life 
estate, if any,

IT IS ORDERED: ,
That the application be heard and 

determined at a term of the Court, 
to be held in and for the County of 
Washington, at the Court House, 
In the City of West Bend, on the 
21st day of July, 1959, at the open­
ing of Court on that day, or as

soon thereafter as the matter can 
be heard;

That notice thereof be given by 
publication of this Order for three 
consecutive weeks, once In each 
week, in Kewaskum Statesman, 
and by mailing a copy of this Or­
der to the Public Administrator of 
this County, the Wisconsin Depart­
ment of Taxation and every Inter­
ested person whose post office ad­
dress is known or can with reason­
able diligence be ascertained, at 
least twenty days before the hear­
ing or proceeding.

Dated June 16, 1959.
By ths Court, 

Lucille K. Francke 
Register in Probate 

O'MEARA & O’MEARA, Attorneys 
West Bend, Wisconsin

DRIVE CAREFULLY

ly 21.
In last 

Firemen, 
included 
StaehhT, 
walloped 1

Tuesday's
•with a hit

games 
barrage

3 home runs by

the 
that 
Bob

for 
the 
the 
life

the assignment of the residue 
estate, and the adjudication 
termination of joint tenancy 
estate, If any.

of 
of 
or

Add Zest to Vegetables 
with Flavored Butter

Weddlg and Harbeck, 
the Lutheran church, 13-

IT IS ORDERED: t
That the application be heard

2; the YoMen nosed out the Bank, 
6-5. to hand them their first upset 
of the season and gain a first place 
tie, and Regal shaded the FFA, 5- 
3, to also share the lead.

STANDINGS

and determined at a 
Court, to be held In 
County of Washington. 
House, In the City of

term of the 
and for the 
at the Court 
West Bend,

Won
Bank
Regal

Lost ।

1
1
3

Firemen
Lutheran

FRIDAY NIGHT FAST
PITCH

Scon e July 
Campbellsport 
Miller's 3.

(lames July

3
LEAGUE
-Steve * Mary's

0; Beechwood
«, 
6.

10—7:00, CampbellH-
port Miller's. 0:00. Steve &
Mary's vs. Beechwood.

STANDINGS 
Won Lost

Stellpflug’s
Finer Meats

Since 1879
Phone 167

Picnic Pac

Franks
2 lb. Bag

Don’t Forget
To Attend the

FIREMEN-LEGION
PICNIC

Stellpflug’s
Finer Meats

Since 1879
Phone 167

on the 21st day of July, 1959, at the 
opening of Court on that day, or as 
soon thereafter as the matter can 
be heard;

That notice thereof be given by 
publication of this Order for three 
consecutive weeks, once In each 
week, in Kewaskum Statesman, 
and by mailing a copy of this Or­
der to the Public Administrator of 
this County, the Wisconsin Depart-

Auburn Refrigeration 
Sales & Service

Ph.

JOS. GRUBER
R. 2. CAMPBELLSPORT 

Camp. LE 3-3965 or Kew. 222-J

Each Friday
The KEWASKUM HOTEL
IS GIVING TO TWO OF ITS
PATRONS BIG SEAFOOD
PLATE LUNCH FREE. NAMES 
WILL BE SELECTED EACH 
FRIDAY NIGHT IN CONJUNC­
TION WITH KEWASKUM BO­
NUS NIGHT.

Registration All 
Week Long

Bonus Night 

Special 
THRU PRIZES 

Every Friday Night
LAST FRIDAY’S WINNERS:

SMOKEY KELLER 
Kewaskum

ESTHER KIBBEL
R. 1. Allenton

JOHN SCHUPPEL, SR.
R. 2. Kewaskum

Winner Need Not Be Present

Heisler’s
Tavern

KEWASKUM

Butter alone goes with vege­
tables just as salt goes with pep­
per, but when the butter is lightly 
flavored with other ingredients, 
it’s an even better taste treat. 
Flavored butters give a lift to 
everyday vegetables which makes 
eating them a new, exciting ad­
venture. •

There is a variety of ingredients 
that can be added to butter to 
make its combination with vege­
tables different and especially 
interesting. For green beans and 
other green vegetables, chopped 
salted almonds and a small 
amount of lemon Juice are added 
to % cup of butter. Beets are

good with an orange butter con­
taining both orange juice and 
grated orange rind. Mint butter 
flavoring, made with melted but­
ter and chopped fresh mint 
leaves, makes either peas or car­
rots alone taste light and spring­
like as well as the combination 
peas-carrots dish.

These are only a few sugges­
tions for the use of butter and 
other flavorings. The ingenious 
cook can add many others that 
will make vegetables a real meal­
time treat.

FLAVORED BUTTERS FOR 
VEGETABLES

MINT: To %• cup melted butter, 
add 1 tablespoon chopped fresh 
mint leaves. Serve on peas, car­
rots, or a combination of the 
two.

ORANGE: To % cup melted but­
ter, add 3 tablespoons orange 
juice and 1 tablespoon grated 
orange rind. Simmer for a few 
minutes over low heat and 
serve hot over beets.

ALMOND: To % cup melted but­
ter, add 2 tablespoons chopped 
salted almonds and 1. table­
spoon lemon Juice. Serve with 
green beans, Brussel sprouts or 
broccoli.

Kewaskum Bonus Night
Shop in Kewaskum

THE NAME SELECTED LAST FRIDAY NIGHT FOR THE REGULAR BONUS WAS

LEO ZEHREN, R. 3, CAMPBELLSPORT
HE WAS NOT PRESENT AND RECEIVED A $5.00 BONUS 

NAMES SELECTED FOR THE TWO SURPRISE BONUSES WERE: 
$10.00—REUBEN SCHULTZ, R. 1, KEWASKUM (NOT PRESENT) 

$6.00— EDWARD DORN, R. 2, KEWASKUM (PRESENT)

THIS FRIDAY’S BONUS: $100.00 IN CASH
PLUS SURPRISE BONUSES

RULES: Every Friday night between 7:30 and 8:30 p. m. the business men of
Kewaskum will give away 
ness listed as sponsors at the 
awarded each week.
It must be clearly understood

a $25.00 cash bonus to someone if he is in any of the 43 places of busi-
exact time your name is read. If not present

that either a man or his wife must be present
the property of any of the sponsors in order to be eligible.
If you are not present when your name is called off, the bonus is increased

a $5.00 bonus will be

in person inside or on

to $50->75-|100, for
each week the bonus continues. The name will be published sack week whether you are a big win­
ner or not. The amount of the bonus for each week will also be published. A special committee will
draw the names from Kewaskum and surrounding communities each week.

THE FOLLOWING KEWASKUM MERCHANTS ARE PARTICIPATING IN BONUS EVENTS
BANK OF KEWASKUM
BIG GENE'S TAP 
BRANDT’S BARBER SHOP 
BUCZEK'S TAP 
BURCKHARDT ELECTRIC 
CORNER DRUG STORE

KEWASKUM 
KEWASKUM 
KEWASKUM 
WALTER J.

FLORAL SHOP 
FROZEN FOODS 
THEATER 
KOEHN A SON,

JEWELERS
KOCH'S STORE

DEI'S TAVERN. DELICATESSENKOHN BROS. FARM SERVICE
DR. R. G. EDWARDS 
FAIR VARIETY STORE 
GAMBLES STORE 
WIGWAM DRIVE-IN 
HEISLER'S TAVERN 
HOMER’S BARBER SHOP 
HONECK CHEVROLET 
KATHRYN'S BEAUTY SHOP 
KELLER’S TAP

LENA ROGERS SHELL SERVICE

OLLIE’S TEXACO SERVICE 
OURS DRY CLEANING 
MYRON PERSCHBACHER 
H. RAMTHUN & SON 

HARDWARE 
REPUBLICAN HOTEL 
ROSENHEIMER STORE A 

I FEED MILL
MARX IGA 
MILLER ELECTRIC A

MILLER STUDIO 
MILLER'S FURNITURE 
JIMMY MILLER'S TAVERN 
OR. F. E. NOLTING 
DR. CHARLES OGI, VET.

H. L. RUMSEY, CHIROPRACTOR 
SCHAEFER SINCLAIR SERVICE 
SCHNEIDER S TAVERN 
SPORTSMAN INN 
STELLPFLUG’S MARKET 
WITTMAN'S BARBER SHOP 
YOOST MEAT MARKET


