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Marxes Observe
Golden Wedding

Mr. and Mrs. Jolin Marx, will 
known residents of Kewaskum, ob­
served their golden wedding anni­
versary on Tuesday, June 12, with 
a mass of thanksgiving commem­
orating their anniversary at 9 a. m. 
in Holy Trinity church. Dinner was 
served to members of the immedi­
ate family and brothers and sisters 
of the couple at the Republican 
Hotel at 12i:3O p. m.

This Sunday, June 17, the occa-i 
sion will be celebrated with a re­
ception for relative® and friends 
from 2 p. m. on at the Marx resi­
dence on Prospect ave. Mr. and 
Mrs. Marx invite all their friends 
from Kewaskum and vicinity to 
attend the reception.

Mr. Marx and the former Augusta 
Schmidt were married on June -12, 
1906 by the late Rev. Phillip J. 
Vogt in Holy Trinity church, Ke­
waskum. They spent all of their 
fifty years of married life in Ke­
waskum. Mr. Marx has been in the 
grocery store business here for the 
past 45 years and is still active in 
the business now owned and opera­
ted by his son Harold.

Three of the couple’s attendants 
at their wedding 50 years ago at­
tended the anniversary celebration. 
They are Mrs. Nicholas Stoffel, 
Miss Edna Schmidt and Miss Helen 
Schoofs, all of Kewaskum. The 
other attendant, Ren Marx, oldest 
brother of Mr. Marx, passed away 
four years ago.

Mr. and Mrs. Marx are the par­
ents of four children, namely Syl­
vester of Milwaukee, Kathryn (Mrs. 
Carl Malischke) of Wauwatosa, 
and Harold and Ralph of Kewas­
kum. The celebrants have ten 
grandchildren.

Mr. Marx has five sisters and 
three brothers living. They are Nic. 
Marx. Helen Marx. I.eo Marx, Mrs. 
Nicholas Stoffel, Miss Priscilla 
Marx. Mrs. Ralph Kastenhote, Miss 
Sylvia Marx and J. J. Marx. Mrs. 
Marx has one sister. Miss Edna 
Schmidt, and one brother, Ted 
Schmidt.

The honored couple received ma­
ny lovely congratulatory cards, 
gifts and flowers in commemora­
tion • f ti e happy event.

----------------ks------—-------
ANNUAL SCHOOL MEETING

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN 
THAT THE ANNUAL MEETING 
OF THE Kewaskum Community 
Union High School District Joint 
No. 2 of the Village of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Kewaskum, 
Parton, Farmington, and Wayne 
Townships, Washington County, 
Wisconsin, Ashford. Auburn Town- 
ships, Fond du lac County, Wis­
consin, will be held at the Kewas­
kum Community High School Au­
ditorium on Monday, the twenty­
fifth day of June, 1956, at 8:00 
o’clock p. m.

Clifford C. Stautz. Clerk 
Dated June 15, 1956.

6-15-2t
—--------------- O——-

BIRTHS
MOREN ZIEN—A son to Mr. and 

Mrs. Earl Morenzien, Kewaskum, 
Wednesday, June 6.

BETNE—A daughter to Mr. and 
Mrs. Erwin Heine, Hartford. Mon­
day, June 4. Mrs. Reine is the for­
mer Lorraine Theusch of Kewas- 
ku.n.

Firemen Win $51 
In Badger Tourney
Members of the Kewaskum fire 

department walked off with a lot 
of prize money at the annual two 
day Badger Firemen’s tournament 
and picinic at Thiensville Saturday 
and Sunday when they collected a 
total of $51 in awards.

The local firemen won fourth 
place in the four man hose layout, 
second in the relay bucket event 
and fourth in the relay hose con­
test Saturday evening in the Thien­
sville park. Firemen who partici­
pated included Henry Weddig, 
Chuckie Dreher, Bill Harbeck, 
Wayne Remmel, Leroy Keller, Jr., 
Rob Staehler, Ollie Staehler, Jr., 
Augie Bi Igo and Armin Opper­
mann. Chief Harry Schaefer served 
as one of the timers in the con­
test.

The surprise win came in the 
four man hose layout. Local fire­
men had never taken part in this 
event nor practiced it and still 
placed fourth. Dreher, Remmel, Kel­
ler and Rob Staehler decided on the 
spur of the moment to enter this 
event.

A number of Kewaskum firemen 
also marched in the Badger Fire­
men's parade Sunday noon. Un­
fortunately not enough firemen 
showed up for the parade and so 
the local department failed to place 
in the money. Only eight numbers 
took part and prizes were paid on­
ly to those departments with 12 or 
more men. Cedarburg copped top 
honors in the parade and West 
Bend and Slinger tied for second.

The weather was ideal and the 
63rd annual event was a fine suc­
cess.

-- -----------------R>---------—

GLEN BACKHAUS TO
SERVE AS TUTOR AT 

MICHIGAN SEMINARY

Glenway P. Backhaus, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. William C. Backhaus, 
1023 Cherry st., West Bend, former 
residents of the town of Kewaskum, 
graduated from Thiensville Theolo­
gical seminary on Wednesday, 
June 6, and has been called to 
serve as tutor at Michigan Luther­
an seminary, Saginaw. Mich.

Backhaus attended Northwestern 
Prep school and college at Water­
town where he received his bache­
lor’s degree prior to entering the 
Thiensville seminary. In the fall of 
1954 he was called to serve as vicar 
for Pastor Koenig at Sault St. Ma­
rie, Mich, and also established a 
new mission congregation at Sault 
St. Marie, Canada. In fall of 1955 
he returned to finish his training 
at the seminary.

——— — ks —----- —-
HOLZMANN INFANT

BAPTIZED SUNDAY

Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Holzmann, 
Kewaskum, had their baby baptized 
Sunday afternoon, June 10, at 2:30 
p. m. at their home by the Kev. 
Gerhard Kaniess. She received the 
name Patricia Ann and sponsors 
were Mrs. Raymond Broecker and 
Herbert Schwlchtenberg.

————o---------- —
NOTICE OF CHANGE IN HOURS

Effective on Saturday, June 16. 
Ours Dry Cleaners will be closed on 
Saturday afternoons. They will be 
open from 7 a. m. to 1:30 P. m. on 
Saturdays, however.

Summer Recrea­
tion Program 
Begins Monday

REGISTRATION FOR SWIMMING 
INSTRUCTION JUNE 1819; 
LESSONS BEGIN JUNE 20

The summer recreation program 
will again include swimming in­
struction this summer. There will 
be beginning and intermediate 
swimming. Kewaskum children will 
be transported to the West Bend 
pool where instruction in swim­
ming will be given.

Registration for swimming will 
Im* at the high school recreation 
grounds on Monday and Tuesday, 
June 18 and 19. Swimming lessons 
will begin on Wednesday, June 20, 
and end on July 13. Beginning 
swimmers must be at the school at 
9:00 a. m. Intermediate swimmers 
must be at the school at 10:0o a. m.

Children eligible for swimming 
instruction must be six years of 
age or older.

The recreation program for All 
children of school age starts on 
Monday, June 17, and the re are ma­
ny activities to participate in. A 
more detailed announcement on the 
recreation program and schedule* 
will be made in our ne xt issue.

- ———j{. _ .----------

Klugs Celebrate 
25th Anniversary

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Klug enter­
tained about 175 relative's and 
friends at a reception in honor of 
their 25th wedding anniversary, nt 
Fore st I-ike resort Sunday even­
ing, June* 3.

Musical entertainment was fur­
nished by Andrea Justman of Oak­
field, R. R., a couslsn of Mrs. Klug, 
and at 11 o’clock a buffet lunche on 
was served.

Table decorations included a huge* 
four tier wedding cake which was 
baked and beautifully decorated 
with white roses and silver trim­
mings by a cousin of Mr.Klug, Mrs, 
Edward Garbisch, of Batavia. 
Floral decorations wore baskets of 
lilacs, tulips and mums and mum 
plants.

The honorees were* the* recipients 
of many beautiful gifts and cards, 
also gifts of cash.

Among the group entertained 
were relatives and friends from 
Sheboygan, Cedar Grove, West Al­
lis and Fond du Lac.

The* actual date of the anniver­
sary is June 17. It was observed 
two weeks in advance because of 
their son Floyd, who was home on 
leave before being transferred to 
Norfolk, Virginia. 

-------  —KS----------- —*
HOSPITAL NEWS

Word was received from Mrs. 
George Hansen of Cataract, Wis. 
that Mr. Hansen Is critically ill at 
St. Mary’s hospital in Sparta.. 
The Hansen family moved to Cats, 
ract from Kewaskum a short time 
ago.

—K>—
BAKE SALE AT NEW FANE

A bake sale will be held Satur­
day, June 16, at 2:30 p. m. at St. 
John’s Parish hall, New Done, giv­
en by the St. John’s Ladies Guild.

------------- Z»R fl—-------------
Four to $ p. m. are the most dan­

gerous hours of the day to drive.

Foerster Attending' 
Badger Boys State
Norman Foerster, Kewaskum 

Community High school junior, is 
one of 73'5 junior boys from Wis­
consin high schools attending the 
state American Legion’s 1956 Bad­
ger Boys State June 9-16 at Ripon 
college. Norman is sponsored by the 
Kewaskum Kiwanis club and Le­
gion post.

Boys State, an American Legion 
sponsored event, brings boys, sel­
ected by their school faculties, to 
Ripon to form and operate a myth­
ical “4Mh State*.” Upon arrival, 
boys art* separatee! into two myth­
ical partie®, “Nationalist” and 
“Federalist,” and from here* com­
mence to form city, county and 
state governments. Boys campaign 
for the various offices, and upon 
election, proceed to handle the du­
ties and functions of the various of­
fices.

Climax of the eight-day event 
was held Thursday evening, June* 
14, when the newly elected gover­
nor was inaugurated. The* oath of 
office' was administered by Justice 
George R. Currie of the Wisconsin 
supreme court, who formally in- 
stalled other state* officers as well 
as Boys State* supreme court mem­
bers. Lt. Gov, Warren P. Knowles 
also attended.

The program is conducted by a 
staff of American Ilegionnaires 
and others, who donate* their time. 
They act as advisors and adminis­
trators. Many public officials of 
the state lecture and conduct cour­
ses during Boys State.

FINAL HIGH SCHOOL HONOR 
ROLL FOR YEAR ANNOUNCED

The final honor roll for the school 
year which ended June 1, 1956, at 
Kewaskum Community High school, 
was announced this week as fol­
lows:

FRESHMEN — Nanay Fickkr, 
Cynthia Landmann, Marita Nohr, 
Pam Nolting, Judy Rahn, Alice 
Schwind, Aidwin Set feldt, Jonathan 
Weber, David Zuehlke.

SOPHOMORES — Carol Miller, 
Richard Pierce.

JUNIORS — Audrey Amerllng, 
Norman Foerst* r, Kenneth Meilahn, 
Russe ll Pillar, Paul Schaub, Sue 
Weddig. Harvey Weigand.

SENIORS—Calvin Schaub, Judy 
Weddig. 

—— iw-—.---------- 
OFFICERS ELECTED AT

HOLY NAME BREAKFAST

Following the 8 a. m. mass on 
Sunday a break fast-meet! ng of the 
Holy Name society of Holy Trinity 
parish was he ld In the church hall 
after the monthly communion of the 
members. Election of officers for 
the corning year took place as fol­
lows: President, John Battaglia; 
vice-president, Ernest Mitchell; 
treasurer, Wayne Remmel, and 
secretary, Francis Gllboy.

. ------ — - * *---- - _
MIKE SCHLADWEILERS

MOVE TO PENNSYLVANIA

Mr. and Mrs. Mike Schladweiler 
and daughter have moved from 
their home in Roseland Heights to 
Carlisle', Pennsylvania, to make 
their home. The Schladweller home 
has been sold to Mr. and Mrs. Wal­
ter Giese* and family. Mr. Schlad- 
weller was employed as a mechanic 
at Honeck Chevrolet

Cyclist Critically 
Hurt in Accident

Donald Kluinb, 28, of R. 3, West 
Bend, suffered a basal skull frac­
ture and broke n leg and was still 
unconscious on Wvdne sduy of this 
week at St. Joseph’s hospital, West 
Bend, as the result of a motorcycle­
auto collision last Thursday morn­
ing.

Klumb, who is employed in the 
machinery dt partment at L. Ro- 
senheimer in Kewaskum, was °n 
bls way to work when his motor­
cycle was struck by a car driven 
by Wilmer Schmidt, 22, of R. 2, Ke. 
waskum. Schmidt was arrested for 
not having a driver’s license* and on 
a charge that was held open until 
Klumb’® condition could better be 
determined.
’The mishap occurred at 6:15 a. 

m. Thursday one-half mile north of 
Kohlsville on County Trunk W. 
Klumb’s motorcycle was coming 
out of a side* road from the east 
and turning north on W whe n it 
was hit by Schmidt’s southbound 
vehicle.

Although Klumb was critically 
injured, hope* is still being held out 
for his recovery. His motorcycle 
was demolished.

----------------AM  —■
PAUL LANDMANN ELECTED 

PRESIDENT OF UW CLUB

Paul C. Lindmann, 20, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul N. Uindmann of 
Kewaskum, was elected president 
of the International Club of tne 
University of Wisconsin recently.

The young man is the* first Am- 
erican born student to be elected 
president of the club since its 
founding on the university campus 
in 1903. A total of 230 students re­
presenting most of tlie- countries 
of the world make* up the member­
ship of the* club this year.

Along with the position of presi­
dent of the club, Landmann will oc­
cupy a post on the Student Union 
Directorate of the unive rsity, a po­
sition that accompanies the office 
of Inte rnational club'presidency.

--------------- k* —— — -
TWO KEWASKUM MEN, TWO 

OTHERS ENLIST IN NAVY

The* local navy recruiting office 
announced last week that four mon 
from Washington county enlisted 
in the navy. They will take their 
basic training at the- U. S. Naval 
Training Station at Great Lakes, 
111.

The* enlistee's are?: Raymond J. 
Herrlgcs, son of Mr. and Mrs. Mat- 
the*w Ibrriges, R. 2, Kewaskum; 
Geralel R. Ye arling, s< n of Mr. and 
Mrs. Peter Yearling, R. 1, Kewas­
kum; Ronald W. Hug, seen of Mr. 
and Mrs. John Hug, R. 3, Hartford, 
and DavieJ Wagne r son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Peter Wagner, Hartford

—————as—------— -

JOHN RODENS HONORED 
ON FORTIETH WEDDING

Mr. and Mrs. John A. Roden of 
Rural Route*, Kewaskum, were hon­
oreel gue*sts at a jsirty. held at St. 
Michae ls hall. St. Michae ls, Sunday 
evening June 10, in honor of their 
40th wedding anniversary.

Relatives, neighbors and friends 
came from Forestville, Milwaukee, 
Allenton, Nabob, West Bend, Bar­
ton, Cascade*, Campbellsport, Ke­
waskum and St. Michaela to bestow 
best wishes and congratulations.
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Let’s Al Go To Our Local Shew

GROCERY SPECIALS

IGA Salad Dressing

IGA Old Fashioned Peanut Butter

IGA Frozen Lemonade
4 ^Z CA'»

4 for 99c

Philadelphia Cream Cheese 2 for 25c

IGA Evaporated Milk 3 for 37c

Marx I.G.A. Store
Kewaskum. wu.

Phh Hr: 
r*.:> m - - 
1 B^.>OxgU£

TH WtCHl SbOiA0> 
^.Tta WL> fW* tUk5V’’W 

FUNK J. FELM 
Rank TV Serik*

E > .E

" E ® •» • E •* * M . w

From S6.95 io $69.95

Burckhardt Electric
$5.00 don n-$5.00per month

Red Hot, Red Bell Specials
For Hot Weather and Picnics

Potato Salad

Salmon

Dill Pickles

Salad Dressing

Catsup

19c

39c

39c
lx or 90—LES

2 for 49c
•2 or PKC

Macaroni or Spaghetti 17c

Charcoal 
5 or 10 lb. bags 
C-4PCCAL STARTER

Paper 
Cups 
Plates 

Napkins
FRESH 

Fruits and 
Vegetables 
FROZEN 
FOODS

L. ROSENHEIMER STORE 
Kewaskum, Wis.
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STATE OF WISCONSIN 
WASHINGTON COUNTY COUKT

NOTICE OF HEARING 
ON PETITION TO PARTITION 

REAL ESTATE
IN THE MATTER OF THE ES­

TATE OF JOHN KRAL, Deceased.
Notice is herby given that at a 

term of eaid court to be held on 
Tuesday, the 10th day of July, 1956, 
at 10 o’clock in the forenoon of said 
day at the Courthouse, in the City 
of West Bend, in said county, there 
will be heard and considered:

The application of Alfred Kral 
for a partition or sale of the fol­
lowing described real estate situat­
ed in the County of Washington, 
State of Wisconsin, to-wit: 
A part of the South east quarter 
of the North west quarter Section 
No. Nine (J), Township No. Twelve 
(13) North, of range No. Nineteen 
(19) East bounded and described 
as follows;—commencing at a point 
Three hundred feet southwesterly 
from the Northwest corner of a 
parcel of land which was deeded to 
John Rosenheimer Adm. of the es­
tate of L. Rosenheimer deceased 
and recorded in Vol. 46 of Deeds on 
page 534 said point being in a di­
rect line with the North Une of 
said John Rosenheimer Adm. of 
the estate of L. Rosenheimer de­
ceased tract; and thence running 
in a south easterly direction two 
hundred fourteen feet and ten in­
ches along the entire west lineof 
the land owned by Katie Klein and 
recorded In Reg. Office of Wash. 
Co. Wis. in Vol. 63 of Deeds on page 
555, and along the entire direction 
One hundred seventy seven feet a- 
long the North line of the land 
owned by M&A Rosenheimer, 
thence running in a Northerly di- 
rectien One hunderd fifty feet and 
ten inches along the East llm> of the 
land owned by Wm.Staege Jr. and 
thence running in a Northeasterly 
direction One hundred feet to the 
place of beginning, together with a 
street sixty feet wide along the en­
tire North line of the land herein 
conveyed and from the East end 
thereof to the Fond du Uc road, 
Excepting there from land as 
deeded in Vol. 127 of Deeds on page 
53, being Document No. 173861. 
Further excepting therefrom land 
as deeded in Vol. 163 of Deeds on 
page 537, being Document No. 
20014€.

Dated June 13, 195€.
By the Court, 

MILTON L MEISTER 
County Judge.

K. Wm Haebig, Attorney 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin

UND O’ LAKES STANDINGS

Won Lost
West Bend ............................ 4 £
Plymouth ................................. 4 1
Kewaskum ........................\. 3 1

Cedarburg ................................. 3 2
Saukville ................................... 3 2
Mequon ................................... 3 2
Port Washington ............... 3 2
Grafton ..................................... 2 3
Germantown ............................. 0 6
Newburg ................................. 0 5

Score last Thursday—Kewaskum
17, Newburg 14.

Scores Sunday — West Bend 3,] Milwaukee 
Saukville 2; Port 7, Germantown ;
1; Grafton 4, Plymouth 3; Mequon j

" ' . 11 . ■ i1 i 'i ' ■■■■■■

7, Cedarburg 6.

Games this Thursday night—Ger­
mantown at Kewaskum, Port at 
Plymouth.

Games Sunday—West Bend at 

Mequon, Saukville at Newburg, 

Grafton at Cedarburg.

A total of |M63 tn cash premiums 
will be awarded this year in the 
butter and cheese competition at 
the Wisconsin State Fair. Premium 
books outlining the contest are now 
available and may be secured by 
writing the Wisconsin State Fair, 

14, Wisconsin. 
------- KS-------- —

WE SELL SCRATCH PADS.

Let u* do your 
job printing for you.

-- ----------------------------_AA—Jr. ............ —

Let’s all go to our lodal ihow- 
boost Kewaskum. * s *

NOTICE OF BUDGET HEARING
JOINT SCHOOL DISTRICT NO. 2

KEWASKUM^ WISCONSIN

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that a public hearing on the bud­
get for the school year 1956-57 ot Kewaskum Community Union 
High School District Joint No. 2 of the Village of Kewaskum, 
Washington County, Kewaskum, liarton, Farmington and Wayne 
Townships, Washington County, Wisconsin, Ashford, Auburn 
Townships, Fond du Lie County, Wisconsin beginning July 1, 1956 
and ending June 30, 1957, will be held at the time and place of 
the annual meeting of said District, to-wit: Monday, June 25, 1956 
at 7:00 P. M. at the -Kewaskum Community High School Audi­
torium, Kewaskum, Wisconsin.

NOTICE IS FURTHER GIVEN that such budget in detail is 
available for public inspection at the office of the Superintendent 
of Schools, Kewaskum, Wisconsin.

The following is a summary of said budget:

Item of Expense

General Control ..................................... 
Instruction ............................................. 
Auxiliary Agencies ............................  
Community Services .......................  
Transportation ....................................
Operation .................................................. 
Maintenance ........................................
Capital Outlay ..................................... 
Debt Service .........................................  
Other ..........................................................

TOTAL .........................................

Anticipated Revenues:

County, State •& Federal Aids .. •.
Tuition & Rental ........................
Other ..................................................

Proposed Tax I>evy ............................  
Indebtedness Bonds Payable...........

Budget
1956

Actual 
Expenditures

Budget 
proposal

$ 5,288.78 $ 4,920.96 3 5,200.00
63,002.37 60,216.00 68,200.00

280.00 1,151.08 7,075.00
350.00 291.28 350JH

16,500.00 15,940.00 16,200.00
8,485.00 9,144.84 13,800.0#
1,550.00 2,084.85 3,200.00
5,700.00 3,097.65 10,000.00

7,557.50 10,109.61 5,300.00
108,713.65 106,956.27 129,326.00

15,305.50 18,168.97 16,9'5.00
7,200.00 7,303.07 8,000.00
1,500.00 1,182.98 8,500.00

85,000.00
125,000.00

95,000.00

CUFFORD C. STAUTZ
CLERK of Kewaskum Community Union High Sshool 
District Joint No. 2 of the Village of Kewaskum, Wash­
ington County, Kewaskum, Barton, Farmington and 
Wayne Townships, Washington County, Wisconsin, Ash­
ford, Auburn Townships, Fond du I Ac County, Wisconsin

Every Morning He Will Be Glad 
You Gave Him A New ...

There’s no type of beard that the Remington 60 De luxe 
won’t shave smoother, closer, faster than any other 

shaving instrument. It’s an unbeatable combination of shaving 
power that zips through the toughest beards with never 

a sign of discomfort to tender skin. Come in and get a
60 De Luxe today. Take it home and let him use it 

for 14 days. If he isn’t completely satisfied, return it and 
get your money back....................... • • $29-50

Less trade 8.50
(Bring it in after Father’s Day) $21.00

Model 652, only $15.00
WITH TRADE

$5.00 down - $5.00 per month
WE ALSO HAVE A COMPLETE LINE OF 

SUNBEAM & SCHICK SHAVERS

Burckhardt Electric

Now It’s Time to Buy Outdoor Furniture

Sturdy aluminum folding arm chair
Lloyd all steel spring 

5^-95 base chair only $9.95

Hammocks from $5.95 and up

All hardwood deck chairs only $4.95

The place to buy it is

All steel
Glider only $27.50

Contoured reclining
Chase only $24,^

ON HI-WAY 45 KEWASKUM

Washington County’s Leading And Foremost Furniture Store
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waskum and Mary Ann Breit of St. 
Michaels.

—The following from Kewaskum 
attended the golden wedding of 
Mr. and Mrs. Emil Kruse in Mil­
waukee Saturday night: Mrs. Ed. 

Strachota, Alex and Elmer Klug,

Koerble, Oscar Koerble, Mr. and 
Mrs. August Koch and family and 
Mr. and Mrs. Harry Koch and 
daughter. Mrs. Kruse is a native of 
Kewaskum.

—A week ago Mrs. Lorina Pe- 
termann entertained relatives and!

oAround The Town
— Mr. and Mrs. Fred Windris, 

Mrs. Aleda Limomn and children of 
Sebeka, Minn, arc visiting‘relatives 
in this vicinity.

— Miss Ruth M. Manthei of MH- 
waukec, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur Manthei of Kewaskum is 
vacationing in Ia# Vegas, Nevada, 
we are informed on a postcard 
received from Miss Manthei this 
Week from KI Rancho Vegas, Am­
erica's finest western hotel.

—Rosie Klein, accompanied by 
friends from Oshkosh, spent the 
week end In tie northern part of 
the state and also attended the 
wedding of a friend.

— Mr. ami Mrs. George Caspers 
and family and Helmut and Horst 
Holstein of Milwaukee visited Mrs. 
Lorina I’etvrmann and family last 
Sumtay.

Mrs. Meta Koch, Mr. and Mrs. Geo.’friends in honor of the graduation

For Prompt Electrical Service 
and Repairs

Phone Kewaskum 114 

^tof^a- Electric, Inc.

of her children, Ronald and Rachel, | OU 
from high school. Ronald will leave 

for Fort Leonard Wood, Mo. this 

week end to begin six months of 
military training in the army. Ra­

chel is employed in ti^ office at Re­

gal Ware, Inc.

R POLICE CHIEF SAYS:

Nobody wants to be the driver
of a car that strikes down a pedes-
trian, especially a little child, yet 
every time you exceed speed limits 
on city streets you are running the 
risk of doing just that.

Ray’s Radio and Television Sales - Service
(FORMERLY DON'S SALES & SERVICE)

LOCATED ON KEWASKUM HILL

RCA Radio and Television Sets
। Electrical Appliances

RADIO AND TELEVISION REPAIRS 

APPLIANCE REPAIRS 

PROMPT, COURTEOUS SERVICE

PHONES: STORE 61F21; HOME 159W

RAY ZEIMET, PROP.

1 Head for die Thrills!
— Sheldon Kresge of Philadelphia, 

Pa. spent the week end with Har­
vey Otto. The two were buddies 
while serving in the armed forces.

— Ye#, It’s Miller'# at Kewaskum 
f#r quality home furnishings at 
most reasonable prices. Open daily 
until * 7*\iuays until a d m. Free 
deliveries. tf

- Mr. am! Mrs, Fred Miller and 
daughters left on an extended va­
cation trip through the western 
states.

—The monthly social faceting of 
the Indies* Altar society of Holy 
Trinity church was held Tuesday 
evening with Mmes. A. Resch, H. 
Petri ami H, Ramel as hostesses.

—Banns of marriage have Immu 
announced in Holy trinity church 
for John Floyd Bauer of Campbell­
sport and Mary Jane Hron of Ke- 
wnakum and Merlin Dreher of Ke-

Enjoy the Blazing GO and 
Breath-Taking Styling of

America’s New Sweetheart!
Point this peppery go-getter in any direction — 
and you’re heading for thrills! When you wheel 
this muscular new Pontiac onto any road, you 
takeover—and know it! You’ll feel the tingling 
satisfaction of easy command as never before.

A whole flock of new adventures awaits you 
in the driver’s seat —your first of many

admiring glances, your first steep hill, your 
first brisk overtake, your first sharp curve at 
cruising speed. And not just the first time, 
for Pontiac's kind of brilliance will never cease 
to thrill you!

Ask us for a demonstration ride. Put 
Pontiac's all-new, 227-h.p. Strato-Streak V-8 
through its paces; see how smoothly the newest 
Hydra-Matic, Strato-Flight*, delivers all this 
tremendous power!

Come in for the most revealing 10 minutes 
in motoring—soon!

For •summer slump”, is a bright, 
fresh wardrobe! When Lu wea­
ther 'gets you down”, perk up 
your spirits by perking up sour 
clothes with our expert cleaning 
service.
It's an economical way to keep 
yotir clot In's for every occasion 
shap new and becoming.

OURS
%t 125 W^^^tWMRUM

CLEANERS
'MARTINIZ/HG

IS HH0M THMPKyaUHING*

THE CAR SAYS GO AND THE PRICE WON'T STOP YOU!

u^^

An extra-cost option.

A QINItAL MOTOIS MASTUPItCI • FAItLY MlCfO ANO FAItLY SOLD

'1r^

BAUER PONTIAC
Campbellsport, Wisconsin
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Kewaskum Theatre 
Picture Previews

I enjoy flying model airplanes or 
I kites.

| On May 21, a 15 year old West 
Bend youth narrowly escaped elec- 
trocution when the model gasoline 
plane he wan flying struck one of

।he escaped death by electrocution ATTEND STATE HIGHWAY 
Strodthoff says that the charge
could very easily have been a fatal 
one. He says, “Parents may very 
well save the lives of their child-

CONFERENCE AT PORTAGE

FRIDAY, JUNE 15 
“THE NAKED DAWN”

the company'® high voltage wires. Idel planes
ren by insisting: that they fly mo-

or kites only in areas
Electricity was transmitted to the I where electric power lines are not? 
youth through a wire he was using | present”

I
 Walter Wesenberg of Kewaskum, 
with other Washington county

I highway department members and
workers, attended the three day 
summer road conference of mem-

Starring ARTHUR KENNEDY as 
a notorious "South of the Border" 
desperado on the rampage—some­
times generous and jovial, some­
times hard and cruel. BETTA ST. 
JOHN co-stars as the Mexican girl 
who grows to love him. Action 
packed technicolor western thriller. ’

to control the model plane. The 
youth was knocked to the ground 
and suffered first and second de­
gree burns to his right hand and 
the bottoms of both feet. The ef- 
fect of the charge was so great 
that it actually burned the socks 
off both feet of the youngster.

He saia tnat the hobby of flying 
kites and model airplanes can be 
enjoyed safely only if four impor­
tant safety rules are strictly ad­
hered to: 1. Keep kites away 
from electric wires and television 
antennas. 2. Use dry cotton string.

hers of the 
missioners

state highway
and committee

com­
ment-

berg at the Rolfs hotel at Portage
on June 6 to 8. Members of the

highway department also attended 
the meeting of the Madison Dis­
trict No. 1 at Juneau Tuesday.

—-------------Ka— ■ ■... ..

Wisconsin’s strawberry crop this 
year is expected to be larger than 
the one harvested last year but 

total production in the “late spring" 

states may be smaller, according to 

the Federal-State Crop Reporting 
Service for Wisconsin.

SAT. & SUN., JUNE 16-17 
“TO HELL AND BACK”

Fortunately, the lad is now re
covering from his frightening ex­
perience but he is lucky indeed that

NOT 
kites 
poles

metal. 3. Never use motal on 
or kite tails. 4. Never climb 
at any time.

•-- -------- KS------ --

Only the man who was there 
could star in this never-to-be-for­
gotten picture—AUDIE MURPHY— 
America’s most decorated, most fa­
mous hero of World War 11. The 
actual account of his life—From a 
poor farm youngster to the flam­
ing battle fields of Europe. This is 
a picture of the same class as 
those award winners of several 
years ago, “Sergeant 'York" and 
“All’s Quiet on the Western Front.” 
If you liked them, this picture is a 
must for you.

---- - -----------------  
ACCIDENT EMPHASIZES

NEED FOR MODEL PLANE 
AND KITE FLYING SAFETY

G E. Appliances—Radto and Television
Norge Appliances

Monarch Electric Ranges
Hamilton Beach—Sunbeam

Dormeyer—Apex

Remmel Mfg. Co 
Open For Welding, Repair 

And Machine Work
We ALSO REPAIR LAWN MOWERS 

EXPERT MECHANICAL WORK IS GUARANTEED 
BRING IN YOUR WORK EARLY SO IT WILL

BE READY WHEN YOU NEED IT

PROFITS SMALL — BUSINESS GREAT 
THAT’S THE WAY WE OPERATE

F. N. Bohn
EXCAVATING & GRADING SERVICE

According to G. P. Strodthoff, 
Wisconsin Electric Power Compa­
ny manager at West Bend, a near- 
tragic accident which occurred re­
cently at West Bend provides an 
object lesson which may save the 
lives of youngsters in this area who

Kewaskum 114 Jack Jadro, Manager
Filling and Top Soil

PHONE 63F4 KEWASKUM, WIS.

Math. Schlaefer
OPTOMETRIST

Eyes Tested and Glasses Htted
Campbellsport. Wis.

SCHILL ELECTRIC
SPORT SHOP

Schill Electric & 
Sport Shop

CAMPBELLSPORT, WIS

HOTPOINT
Household Appliances

GE — MOTOROLA 
Radio & Television 

MEYER’S WATER SYSTEMS 

SCHWINN BIKES 
SPORTING GOODS 

EVINRU’DE 
OUTBOARD MOTORS 

STAR CRAFT 
ALUMINUM BOATS 

also 
BOAT TRAILERS 

Don Sklener, Mgr. 
AJoi® Berg, Serviceman

CAMPBELLSPORT TEL. 4111

Model 3804 — 1-ton, 10814" box

Take your pick of today’s 
most modern Pickups!

Model 3104 - '/a-ton, 781'8" box♦

Model 3204 - Va-ton, 90" box

They’re the champs of the lightweight class, 
loaded with the kind of features that pay off in 
fast-working efficiency on any job!

Under the hood you’ve got Chevy’s famous 
Thriftmaster 6 engine, the work-horse of the 
industry! Or, optional at extra cost, an ultra 
short-stroke V8. You get Ball-Gear Steering, High- 
Level ventilation, concealed Safety Steps and 
Work Styling! You get a grain-tight tailgate, flat- 
ledged side panels and a low platform for easy 
loading! Stop by for details on today’s best 
Pickup buy!

New Chevrolet
Task*Force Pickups!

CHEVROLET

Model 3604 — ^-ton, 90" box Cameo Carrier — sharpest Pickup on the road!

HONECK CHEVROLET
Kewaskum WLAD 1661 Phone 111
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Want Ads
Phone Theresa 74F2. 6-8-tf

WANTED—We need used cars. 
Bring yours In for an appraisal. 
We buy, sell or trade. Call Ke-
waskum 5.

ceased dated February 11th, 1946 
be admitted to probate, ' and that 
Letters Testamentary be granted, 
and for determination and adjudi­
cation of heirship;

IT IS ORDERED:

commencing on the 26th day of 
June, 1956, at the opening of Court 
on that day or as soon thereafter
as said petition can be heard;

That the time within which 
ditors of the deceased shall

cre-
pre-

By the Court, 
MILTON L. MEISTER, 
County Judge

Schloemer, Stolts & Merriam Attys. 
Corner Sixth & Hickory, 
West Bend, Wisconsin.

WANTED—Reliable party to as­
sume payments of #16 per month 
on clean 1950 Ford. Call Kewas-
kum 5

FOR SALE—IJve or dressed eprin-1 
ger roosters. #1.00 live, #1.25* 
dressed. Harold Bonlender, East I 
Water st., on K. A. Honeck farm, •
Kewaskum. 6-15-2t

HELP WANTED -Grocery depart­
ment, full or part time, male or 
female. Insurance program, good 
working conditions.. Apply L Ro- 
senhelmer office. It

FOR SALE—Porter hay carrier 
with 70 feet track and rope. Wm.
Stagy, Kewaskum.

LYDIA
FOR SALE

LEONARD HOME

on Fond du Iac Ave. 
in Kewaskum

Home has i rooms, 1 bedroom, 
kitchen, dining room, living room 
und wash room down; 3 bedrooms, 
large bathroom 2nd floor. All hard­
wood finish and hardwood floors. 
Full basement. Large garage with 
2 4-room apartments in upper.
Large lot, 105 
ft. deep. This 
separate. This 
so Is garage.

ft. frontage and 230 
property can be sold 
home is now vacant, 
Can be seen by ap-

pointment only. Call Kewaskum 24 
or West Bend Fe 4-7090. Harry 
Maaske, broker. It

FOR RENT House at

HUGE SALE — Price* slashed! 
NEW and used pianos, organs, 
accordions. Write for list. Hooper 
Music Studios, Manitowoc. 5-25-4t

That said petition be heard, at a 
term of Court at the Court House 
in the City of West Bend, County 
of Washington, State of Wisconsin,

sent claims against such estate for 
examination and allowance is here­
by fixed and limited up to and in­
cluding the 4th day of September

WIN PRIZES IN LOCAL 
THEATRE QUIZ PROGRAM

GOSLINGS
White Chinese. All sizes. Good 
weeders. Delicious roast goose in 
fall. Not too fatty. R. C. Weler, R.
2, Kewaskum. Wis. Phone Allenton

REAL ESTATE

13F22. 5-18 til 8-1

5-bedroom home, all modern, 
hardwood flooring throughout, 
new furnace, bath, full basement, 
2 car garage. This house is fairly

1956;
That 

ceased 
by the

all claims against the de- 
be examined and adjusted 
Court on the 6th day of

^^iT’oFFERElT'TT?^^ very well built, has 1 acre of 

digging and water lines. Sep-,digging and water
tic tanks installed, 
priced. Call Lawrence 
at Kewaskum.

Reasonably
Galabinske

5-11-stp

land or more 
an ideal spot 
at the price

can 
for

of

be had. 
a large 
#10,000.

Here is 
family, 

5 miles
from Campbellsport.

PORCH RAILINGS—Beautify your 
home old or new with ornamental 
railings. Also genuine redwood 
Zephyr awnings, aluminum fiber­
glass, canvas and roll up awn­
ings. Free estimates, no obllga-

2-family home in the 
another good deal at #9,500.

3-bedroom home, oil 
on first floor, garage, 
tion. $9,800.

4-bedroom home at

country,

heat, 
nice

Lake

tions. Mayville Welding
corner Dayton
Mayville 28W.

and Grove
Ind's., 

sts.,
5-18-tf

COL’KT

IN PROBATE
IN THE MATTER OF

TATE OF 
also known 
Deceased.

A petition

M.
’ THE ES- 
THEUSCH,

as ANNA TH KUSCH.

having been filed, re­
presenting that Anna M. Theuach,
late of the 
Washington 
died testate,

Kilian.' I<ast Will

Village of Kewaskum, 
County. Wisconsin, 

and praying that the 
and Testament of de-

FOR FINE DIAMONDS

EXPERT WATCH REPAIRING
see

Walter J. Koehn & Son
Jewelers
TWO STORES

WEST BEND KEWASKUM

WISN-TV "““'
THURSDAYS

9 to 10 p. m.
SPONSORED BY

the Best of the Better Beers

01b (jW*
J Eager b e e i

bath 
loca-

Ber-
nice, 
first 
lawn 
rent,

all modern kitchen, bath on 
floor, attached garage,, nice

November, 1956, at the opening of 
Court on that day, or as soon there­
after as the matter can be heard;

That notice thereof be given by 
publication of this Order for three 
consecutive weeks, once in each 
week, in Kewaskum Statesman, the 
first publiation to be within fifteen 
days from the date hereof; and by 
mailing a copy of this Order to ev­
ery Interested person whose post 
office address is known or can with 
reasonable diligence be ascertained, 
at least twenty days before the 
hearing or proceeding.

Dated May 28th, 1956.

Prize winners in the quiz pro­
gram conducted between shows at 
the Kewaskum theatre last Friday 
night were as follows:

Children—1. Fishing outfit, Billy 
Koenen; 2. Trick squirt gun, Leroy 
Schultz.

Students — 1. Wallet, question
missed; 2. Lighter, Harvey 
thun, Jr.

Adults—1. Regal Utensil, 
Opgenorth; 2. Turtle car

Ham-

Dave 
wax,

question missed.
Grand prize of $5.00—Norbert 

Roh linger.
Questions missed will be carried 

over to the second quiz program 
this Friday night at the theatre.

.—--- KM— -—" ■

Advertise It In the Statesman.

for children to 
only 15,700.

play. Why pay
Owner will fi-

nance.
3-bedroom home, located on

South St. in Kewaskum. Oil heat, 
110 ft. lot, just 4 years new. Only 
#8,500. Possession immediately.

2-bedroom 
oil heat, bath 
fine location 
to trade this 
farm within 
waskum.

home in Kewaskum, 
on first floor, garage, 
at $6,500. Would like 
nice little house on a

6 to 8 miles of Ke-

30 acre farm right next to St. 
Martin school and church, house 
has all modern conveniences.

90 acre farm just north of St. 
Kilian church and school. Here is 
some top notch dairy land. 4-bed­
room home, all conveniences. Finer 
location cannot be had.

120 acres Town of Byron, top- 
notch.

80 acre farm near Campbellsport, 
3-bedroom home nearly new. Here 
is a real country home. Oak interi­
or trim throughout, this modern 
kitchen is just as nice as the^
come, 
barn, 
milk.
finer

oil heat, 100 ft. center drive 
steel equipment, grade A 
No hills, blacktop hwy.,

location cannot
you Intend to look

be 
over

sO acre farm, right close

had. If 
this fine 
to town,

be SURE to bring the wife to ace 
the house.

We have some very good buys 
on some very good farms. Low 
down imyments.

3 fine tavern 
rented.

JOHN
Phone 3451

buys; one can be

Campbellsport

Auction - Executor’s Sale
Real Estate, Home and Household Goods

LOCATED EAST VILLAGE KEWASKUM, WIS.

AT ENTRANCE TO CITY PARK

Sat. June 16 12:30 p.m
BAD WEATHER DATE SUNDAY, JUNE 17—SAME HOUR

REAL
Seven room RED

ESTATE
BRICK

casters, kitchen table
HOME chairs, two double beds,

including bath, living room, dining 
room, kitchen, one bedroom with 
large closet down; two bedrooms 
with large closets and storage sbace 
up; full basement, Timken oil heat 

I 
recently installed, new electric hot 
water heater, soft water, single car 
garage, ample garden space, nice 
shade trees, beautiful well built 
home, with spacious rooms and not 
at all over-built, will suit any one, 
TERMS: #2,000.00 at time of sale, 
1ml. on delivery of legal papers.

spring mattress, dresser

and four 
one inner 
with mir-

ror, chest of drawers, table radio, 
set dishes service for 12, cooking 
utensils, some new, electric clock, 
garden tools, lawn mower, hose. 
Look for complete details in offer­
ing last weeks papers.

Edison 
graph 
cords;

ANTIQUES
talking machine phono- 

with about 50 cylinder re- 
one of Edisons first made

HOUSEHOLD GOODS
Monarch electric range, 8 ft. G. E. 
refrigerator, new modern limed sol­
id oak wood breakfast set - exten­
sion table and four chairs, 17 in. 
Cab. Capehart T.V. set with aerial, 
new G.E. vacuum cleaner with at-

machines, six drawer spool thread 
cabinet, rocker, robe, stereoscope 
viewer with slides scenes, lamp 
vases, glassware, etc. Terms: cash. 
Bad weather date Sunday June 17th
same hour. clean

tachments, dining room table 
six chairs, 2-pc. over stuffed 
lor suite, restful over stuffed 
rocker. Iron Home safe, the

and
par- 
easy 
kind

every one wants, comb, guaranteed.
modern double 
bench, Speed 
little service.

bed and vanity with
Queen washer, 
twin wash tubs

saw
on

COME, and COME early, 
noon selling.

ANNA THEUSCH 
OWNERS

offering, 
all after­

ESTATE,

Mrs. Helen Volm 
Ph. West Bend 4-2902, 
Hd. Theusch,
Ph. Kewaskum 114F13
EXECUTORS.

ARTHUR QUADE, Auctioneer 
I WEST BEND

CHOOSE THE DEALER - THEN THE CAR
LOOK AT THESE USED CAR BARGAINS

1955 CHEV. 2DR. 
DEL-RAY COUPE

1954 KAISER 4DR.
1949 NASH 4-DR.

USED
1950 CHEV. 2-TON 

W/HOIST & BOOT
1949 FORD 2-TON 

W/HOIST & BODY

1951
1949
1948

CHEV. 4-DR.
HUDSON 4DR.
BUICK 4-DR.

1955
1954
1953
1949

CHEV. 4-DR.
FORD 4-DR. 
PACKARD 4-DR. 
KAISER

TRUCKS AT SENSATIONAL SAVINGS
1952
1951
1951
1949

CHEVROLET 1*4 TON
STUDE. 1*2 TON

CHEV. । 2 TON PICKUP
FORD 2-TON

2-SPEED W/HOIST

1954
1953
1952
1948

CHEV. 
CHEV. 
CHEV. 
CHEV.

K TON PICK-UP 
2-TON
2-TON TRUCK
1‘/1 TON

Honeck Chevrolet
Kewaskum, Wisconsin

Let’s All Go To Our Local Show - Boost Kewaskum
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STATE OF WISCONSIN 
WASHINGTON COUNTY COURT

IN PROBATE
IN THE MATTER OF THE ES­

TATE OF ANTHONY P. SCHAEF­
FER, Deceased.

A petition having been filed, re­
presenting that Anthony P. Schaef­
fer, late of the Village of Kewas­
kum, Washington County, Wis­
consin, died testate, and praying 
that the Last Will and Testament 
of deceased dated October 16, 1954 
be admitted to probate, and that 
Letters Testamentary be granted, 
and for determination and adjudi­
cation of heirship;

IT IS ORDERED:
That said petition be heard, at a 

term of Court at theCourt House in 
the City of West Bend, County of

A petition for probate or ad­
ministration of the estate of Louis 
F. Bunkelman, deceased, late of the 
Village of Kewaskum, Washington 
County, Wisconsin, and for deter­
mination and adjudication of heir-

LIQUOR LICENSE APPLICATION

Washington, 
commencing 
July, 1956, at 
on that day

State of Wisconsin, 
on the 10th day of 
the opening of Court 
or as soon thereafter

as said petition can be heard;
That the time within which cre­

ditors of the deceased shall pre­
sent claims against such estate for 
examination and allowance is here­
by fixed and limited up to and in-
eluding 
1956;

That 
ceased 
by the

the 16th day of October,

all claims against the de- 
be examined and adjusted 
Court on the 18th day of

December, 
Court on 
thereafter 
heard;

1956, at the opening of 
that day, or as soon
as the matter can be

That notice 
publication of

thereof be given by 
this Order for three

consecutive weeks, 
week, in Kewaskum
first 
teen

publication to 
days from tht

once in eacn 
Statesman, the 
be within fif- 
date hereof;

der
by mailing a copy of this Or- 
to every interested person

whose post office address is known 
or can with reasonable diligence be 
ascertained, at least twenty days 
before th^ hearing or proceeding.

Dated June 12, 1956.
By the Court, 

MILTON Ta MEISTER 
County Judge.

K. Wm. Haebig, Attorney 
Kewaskum, Wisconsin

6-15-3t

COURT

IN PROBATE
IN THE MATTER OF THE ES­

TATE OF LOUIS F. RUNKEL- 
MAN, Deceased.

KEWASKUM
OPERA HOUSE
Tavern & Ballroom

We Cater to Weddings

HALL FREE 
for all 

WEDDING DANCES

DEI’S
DELICATESSEN

BAKED HAM
POTATOSALAD

ROLLS
OPEN EVENINGS 

A\’D ALL DAY SUNDAY 
CompleteLine of Groceries 

and Lunch Meats

Kewaskum Opera 
House Building

ship, having been filed, 

IT IS ORDERED: 

That the time within
creditors of said deceased 
sent claims against such

which all 
shall pre­
estate for

Notice is hereby given that Math. 
H. Herriges has made application 
for Class “B” Combination Liquor 
and Fermented Malt Beverage Li­
cense in the Town of Kewaskum 
for the period from July 1, 1956 
and ending June 39, 1957, at the lo­
cation described as South Side of

examination and allowance is 
hereby fixed and limited up to and 
including the 16th day of October, 
1956;

That proofs of heirship lie taken 
and all claims and demands a- 
gainst the said deceased be exam­
ined and adjusted by the Court on 
the 18th day of December, 1956, at 
the opening of the Court on that 
day, or as soon thereafter as the 
matter can be heard;

That notice thereof be given by 
publication of this Order for three 
consecutive weeks, once in each 
week, in Kewaskum Statesman, the 
first publication to be within fif­
teen days from the date hereof; and 
by mailing a copy of this Order to

Highway 28, St. Michaels, 
N. E. % of Section 13, T12 R

Said 
upon 
Board

application 
at a meeting 
to be held

will be 
of the 

in the

in the 
19E.
acted 
Town 
Town

Clerk’s office on Monday, June Is, 
1956 at 8:00 p. m.

A. H. Seefeldt, Town Clerk

CAMPO
Theatre

FRI. AND SAT.
JUNE

Show Time
ANNE

15 & 16
7:00 and 9:00 
BAXTER

every interested person 
office address is known 
reasonable diligence 
tained, at least twenty’

whose post 
or ean with 
be ascer- 
days before

JEFF CHANDLER
RORY CALHOUN

the hearing cr proceeding.
Dated June 12, 1956.

By the Court, 
MILTON L. MEISTER 

County Judge.
K. Wm. Haebig, Attorney
Kewaskum, Wisconsin

“The Spoilers"
SUN.-MON.-TUES.

JUNE
Show Time

JANE
ROCK

17-18-19
7:00 and 9:00
WYMAN

HUDSON

6-15-31
All that Heaven Allows

STARTING

JUNE 15th

It’s FAHN’S
KETTLE MORAINE LAKE RESORT

FOR

Delicious Fish Fry on Friday

JOE & FLORENCE FAHN

KEWASKUM LEGION-FIREMEN PICNIC

AMATEUR SHOW
SATURDAY EVENING, JULY 7

7:00 P. M.
VILLAGE PARK

Amateur individuals and groups from this 
area are welcome to enter. Prizes awarded 
winners. Entries must be in by midnight on 
Saturday, June 30. Mail entries to Harry E. 
Koch, Kewaskum, now.

ENTRY BLANK

Adlress

Type Of Act

Number In Group

—SEE FIELD'S FURNITURE 

MART AT WEST BEND BEFORE 
YOU BUY YOUR FURNITURE, 
RUGS AND HOUSEHOLD APPLI­
ANCES. YOU CAN BUY FOK 
LESS AT FI EIJI’S. WHY PAY 
MORE? FIELDS FURNITURE 
MART, WEST BEND, WIS., TEL. 
9*8. OPEN FRIDAY EVENINGS. 
OTHER EVENINGS BY AP­
POINTMENT. FREE DELIVERY.

Reservations Accepted
FOR WEDDING DANCES

RECEPTIONS AND

ORGANIZATION FUNCTIONS

Kettle Moraine Resort
(Formerly Round Lake)

R. 3, CAMPBELLSPORT PH. 3162

Farewell

Party

Sat., June 16
Sportsmen’s

Inn
KEWASKUM

FREE LUNCH

marriage L^tNM

Kewaskum, and Joyce Utwd? H, L 
Hartford; wedding June 16,.

y r—£'i»CU*

N. Port Washington Rtf. 
(My. 141 and 12) 

15 Milos North off Milvoukeo

PRESENTS

SOUTH 
PACIFIC

JUNE 15-24
Winner of the Pulitzer Prize 

and Critics’ Circle Award

Music by

OSCAR

RICHARD RODGERS

HAMMERSTEIN
Book by

’AR HAMMERSTEIN 2d 
an<l JOSHUA LOGAN

Adapted from
MES H. MICHENER’S

Pulitzer Winning-

BROADWAY CAST 
ON STAGE — IN PERSON 

FULL ORCHESTRA
Ticket Prices: Tue., Wed., Thur., 

and Sun. - 3.00, 2.50, 2.00
Fri. and Sat. - 3.50, 8.00, 2.50
Thur. Mat. - 2.00; under 18 - 100
Coupon Books - Ten #3,00 tickets 

for only $27.00 - save 10%

(All prices Include Fed. Tax)
SEND TICKET ORDERS NOW TO 
MELODY CIRCUS THEATRE
Room 611-P, 536 W. Wisconsin Ave 
Milwaukee, Wisconsin 
or PHONE Hopkins 1- 6970

Season Subscriptions still available 
for SOPTH PACIFIC and 12 other 
Broadway Musicals this summer— 
phone or write for full information.

STARTING

JUNE 8th

s SCHUH’S
Long Lake Resort

FOR

Delicious Fish Fry on Friday

Chicken on Saturday
TY AND MARIE SCHUH

Wedding Dance
Saturday, June 16

IN HONOR OF
VIRGINIA ROSE AND MARVIN FOX

Music by Ron Harvey's Orchestra

F A HN’^ Settle Moraine
* rlHl’ O Lake Resort

SUNDAY, JUNE 17
THE LIVLIEST BAND IN POLKA LAND

The Jolly Polka Dots
YANKOVIC STYLE

EVERYBODY LN VIT E D

m
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Chevs Outlast Newburg 
In Long Slugfest 17-14, 
3rd Win in Four Starts

LONG LAKE TEAM PLAYS' 
NIGHT EXHIBITION HERE 
SUNDAY, CEDARBURG HERE 
THURSDAY NIGHT

Join the Gold Rush of ’56

Yes, We Mean Discovering

The New 1956 Ford

In a game of runs, hits and er­
rors that lasted about three hours 
here laat Thursday night the K< - 
waskum Chevs ended up on the Jong 
end of a 17-14 score with Newburg. 
The victory in the wide open con­
test wan the Chevrolets' third in 
four starts and places them in sec­
ond place rigid behind the two 
leaders, West Bend and Plymouth, 
tied for first.

Tills was Kewaskum’s first night 
game of the season. The start of 
the fame was delayed by a light 
failure and it was close to 9 p. m.

LONG LAKE PLAYS NIGHT 
GAME HERE SUNDAY

The M-ng Lake has* ball team 
(former Armstrong) of the Kock 
III ver league will play a night 
exhibition game under the lights 
here Sunday against the Kewas- 
kum Chevrolets of the Mikes 
loop. Hamc time is 8 p. m. The 
Long Mike nine has a number 
of Campbellsport players in their 
lineup. This is the first game 
ever scheduled by the Chevs on 
a Sunday night and It Is hoped 
that a fine crowd will attend. 
Where can you find a better place 
to spend a Sunday night? Beat 
the heat, come to the ball park 
and relax.

In Performance, Economy, Safety Is Like Finding

GOLD
" Our Deal Can’t Be Beat”

before the slugfest got under way. 
The lights on some of the standards 
failed to burn and the electric com­
pany laid to lw called In for repairs. 
Then a long, drawn out tilt fol­
lowed and it was around midnight 
before it was over.

Each team scored most of their 
runs in two big innings. Kewas­
kum's two explosive frames were 
the first, in which the team scored 
6 rans. and the fourth, when the 
Chevs put on their biggest scoring 
binge of the camimtgn with s runs. 
Newburg counted 5 runs In the 
third ami 6 In the sixth.

Each b am blasted out 11 hits and 
the Chevrolets were chalked up 
with three errors and Newburg 
with five. Three pitchers worked 
for the winners. Pong Wlerman 
started on the mound and was cre- 
dited with the win. Hut after a hard 
game against Port Sunday and with 
only four days rest, he weakened 
and was followed on the hill by 
‘Hefty’* Rackham* and Killy Hon- 
eck. Casper and l>a\e Mertzlg, Ke­
waskum High school pitcher, shared 
Wie mound chores for the losers. 
Wlerman ami Mertzlg were the reg­
ular high school pitchers this spring 
but Thursday they were on enemy 
sides.

Augie Bllgo paced the Chevs in 
victory with J hits In 3 trips to the 
plate, one of them a long home 
run. John Tessar and Bob lurcher 
also accounted for two blngles n- 
plece, Heteburg was the batting 
star for Newburg with 3 for M. one 
of them a triple.

On Thursday night of this week 
Kewaskum entertained German­
town and next Thursday night the 
team will play Its third Mikes 
irame at home in a row when Ce­
darburg comes to town. Cedarburg 
Is In 4th place, right behind the 
Chevs. On Sunday night. Juno 17, 
the M'ng Mike team of the Kock 
River league will play an exhibi­
tion here.

- — ■— as — ■ —

Call 28 with your news.

Tt pays to advertise.

3 Salesmen to Serve You. Stop in Today or Call No. 5 and We Will Be 

Happy to Come Out to See You.
Open every evening until 9:00 p. m.

0 K Used Cars
PRICED TO SELL

1956 Chevrolet Bel-Air 4-dr. Save 1000.
205 II. I*. V-S engine, radio, heater, white wall 
tires, K-X-Eye glass, spotlight, etc., 4897 miles, 
new car warranty

1954 Chevrolet 210 4-dr. Sedan 1195.
Powerglide trans., heater, dir. signals, etc. 
one owner, In perfect condition

1952 Buick Super Riviera 2-dr. 1095.
Heater, radio, dynaflow trans., etc., one owner 
has very low mileage

1952 Chevrolet Styleline Deluxe 2-dr. 695. 
Heater, radio, dir. signals, etc., See this green 
one owner beauty at once

1949 Buick Super Sedanette 295.
Has heater, radio, spotlight, etc.

MANY MORE TO CHOOSE FROM 00.00 UP 

SEE OCR FINE SELECTION OF USED TRUCKS 

Open Every Evening TH 9 E-Z Terms

Schill Motor, Inc. 
Campbellsport Phone 4111 

BUICK - CHEVROLET SALES A SERVICE

LKewaskum j
SECOND BIG MOVIE QUIZ SHOW 
FRIDAY, JUNE 15, BETWEEN SHOWS 

Valuable prizes, easy questions.

children
1. Swim Fins - $2.00 ,
2. Swim Mask - $1 •>

PRIZE LIST 
STUDENTS

1. Paper Mate Pen 1.50 & Wallet 2.00
2. Beach Ball - $1.00

ADULTS
Regal Utensil - $5.95

2. Aerosol Bomb $1.50, Turtle Car Wax $2.00

GRAND PRIZE - $580 CASH

Friday, June 15, 7-9 p. m.
TECHNICOLOR WESTERN

"The Naked Dawn”
STARRING ARTHUR KENNEDY. BETTA ST. JOHN

$1.00 ADMITS YOUR ENTIRE FAMILY FRIDAY

Sat. & Sun., June 16-17, 7 & 9p. m.
NO MATINEE

^ "To Hell and Back”
STARRING AUDIE MURPHY A MARSHALL THOMSON

Let’s All Go To Our Local Show


